UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

	:	
In re	: Chapter 11	
	:	
ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., ¹	: Case No. 20-30608 (J	CW)
	:	
Debtors.	: (Jointly Administered	1)
	:	

ELEVENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS CO-COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024

Name of Applicant:	Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.
Authorized to Provide Professional Services	Debtors
to:	
Date of Retention:	Order entered June 19, 2020, effective as of June 18, 2020
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	October 1, 2023 through and including January 31, 2024
Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$96,176.00
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$ 861.71
Total amount of compensation and expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary	\$97,037.71
This is an monthlyX_ interim	final application.
This is the eleventh interim fee application file	ed by Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.



Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 2 of 111

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re : Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,² : Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

Debtors. : (Jointly Administered)

ELEVENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS CO-COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024

Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A. ("RCD" or "Applicant") submits this Eleventh Interim Application (the "Application") for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professional Services Rendered as Co-Counsel to the Debtors in the above-captioned cases for the period from October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024 (the "Interim Period") pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), and this Court's Administrative Order under 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the "Fee Procedure Order") entered July 15, 2020 (Docket No. 171).

By this Application, RCD hereby moves this Court for an order awarding it reasonable compensation for the Interim Period for professional legal services rendered to the Debtors in the amount of \$96,176.00 and reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$861.71 for a total of \$97,037.71. In support of this Application, RCD states as follows:

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

I. <u>BACKGROUND</u>

- 1. On June 18, 2020 (the "Filing Date"), the Debtors filed voluntary petitions for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 2. The Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2).
- 3. On June 25, 2020 an Order Authorizing Joint Administration of Related Chapter 11 Cases (Docket No. 114) was entered authorizing the joint administration of the two debtor cases.
- 4. The Debtors are operating their businesses and managing their affairs as debtors-in-possession pursuant to Sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in the Debtors' cases.
- 5. On June 18, 2020, the Debtors filed their Application to Employ Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A. as Bankruptcy Counsel for Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession as of the Petition Date (the "Retention Application") (Docket No. 22).
- 6. On June 19, 2020, the Bankruptcy Court entered an Order Approving Employment of Rayburn, Cooper & Durham, P.A. as Bankruptcy Counsel for Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession as of the Petition Date (Docket No. 72) in the Chapter 11 cases.
- 7. On July 7, 2020, the Court entered an order appointing an Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants ("ACC") (Docket No. 147). On October 13, 2020, the Court entered an order appointing Joseph W. Grier, III as the Future Asbestos Claimants' Representative (the "FCR") (Docket No. 387).
- 8. On and after June 18, 2020, RCD has rendered services and incurred reasonable expenses on behalf of the Debtors.
- 9. Pursuant to the Fee Procedure Order, professionals may request monthly compensation and reimbursement. Such requests are to be served on certain identified interested parties for review. If no objection to a professional's request is received within

fourteen (14) days of such request, the Debtors are authorized to pay 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested. The Fee Procedure Order also requires each retained professional to file, approximately every four months, an application for interim Court approval and allowance pursuant to section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code of 100% of the compensation and reimbursement expenses for the prior four months.

II. COMPENSATION RECEIVED DURING INTERIM PERIOD

10. All services for which RCD seeks compensation were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors. During the Interim Period, RCD has received monthly payments pursuant to the Fee Procedure Order as follows:

Date of	Period Covered by	Requested	Re	quested	Payment*
Request 11/30/23	Request October 1-31, 2023	Fees \$ 20,126.00	<u>Ex</u> \$	kpenses 20.76	Received* \$ 18,134.16
1/2/24	November 1-30, 2023	\$ 18,192.00	\$	25.70	\$ 16,398.50
1/30/24	December 1-31, 2023	\$ 18,471.50	\$	51.40	None to date
3/1/24	January 1-31, 2024	\$ 39,386.50	\$	763.85	None to date
TOTAL	October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024	\$ 96,176.00	\$	861.71	

^{*}Fees to be paid at 90% and Expenses at 100% pursuant to Fee Procedure Order

RCD's monthly fee requests were served upon certain interested parties for review as directed by the Fee Procedure Order. As of the date of this Application, no interested party has objected to any of RCD's monthly fee requests that has not been resolved between the parties.

11. There is no agreement or understanding between RCD and any other person, other than the members and associates of RCD, for the sharing of compensation to be received for services rendered in these cases.

III. SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED BY RCD

- 12. Attached hereto as Exhibits A-1 through A-4 are detailed descriptions of the services performed and expenses incurred by Applicant from June 1, 2023 through September 30, 2023. In summary, Applicant expended 199.60 hours in rendering necessary legal services involving this Chapter 11 proceeding for the period October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024. The fees total \$96,176.00 for the period October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024 (consisting of \$20,126.00 for the month of October 2023; \$18,192.00 for the month of November 2023; \$18,471.50 for the month of December 2023 and \$39,386.50 for the month of January, 2024). Applicant further incurred costs in regard to this proceeding in the amount of \$861.71 for the period from October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024 (consisting of \$20.76 for the month of October 2023, \$25.70 for the month of November 2023; \$51.40 for the month of December 2023 and \$763.85 for the month of January, 2024). On Exhibit B, RCD has categorized its time by the project categories recommended by the Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals (the "Compensation Guidelines") referenced in Rule 2016 of the Rules of Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Western District of North Carolina (the "Local Rules"). On Exhibit C, RCD has itemized the costs and expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors that were billed during the Interim Period.
- 13. RCD believes that its billing rates for the Interim Period for these cases, which reflect RCD's customary billing rates for the years 2023 and 2024, should be deemed "reasonable billing rates" for purposes of this Court's determination of the "reasonableness" of the fees for services rendered.
- 14. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit D</u> is a summary of this Applicant's prior fee applications.
- 15. A summary of the professionals/paraprofessionals that have rendered services to the Debtors, which includes each professional's or paraprofessional's title, hourly rate, total number of hours billed and the fees billed, is attached hereto as Exhibit E.

- 16. Attached as <u>Exhibit F</u> is a background summary of each professional included in this Application.
- 17. Attached hereto as Exhibits A-1 through A-4 are RCD's detailed invoices for the Interim Period which show on a daily basis the professionals recording time for these cases, how much time was charged for each professional and a description of the services rendered. Whenever in the attached time records, more than one RCD professional is involved or the RCD professionals show interaction with other professionals for the Debtors, each of the RCD professionals are performing distinct tasks for the Debtors and/or work to effectively and efficiently represent the Debtors. Services are provided for each month of the Interim Period and are divided by category of the task performed. To the extent that charges for services rendered or expenses incurred relate to the Interim Period but were not processed prior to the preparation of, or otherwise included in, this Application, RCD reserves the right to request additional compensation for such services and reimbursement of such expenses in future applications.
- 18. RCD believes that the services it provided to the Debtors during this Interim Period were necessary to the administration of and beneficial to the Debtors' estates. RCD further believes that the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the task addressed.

IV. DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED DURING INTERIM PERIOD

- 19. As counsel to the Debtors, RCD has assisted the Debtors with a variety of matters in the Debtors' bankruptcy cases, as set forth in the summary description below and in greater detail on Exhibits A-1 through A-4.
- 20. RCD grouped its services using the eight categories set forth below in accordance with the recommendation of the Compensation Guidelines. RCD attempted to place the services provided in the category that best related to such services. Because some services may overlap categories, services pertaining to one category may in fact be included in another category. The services provided are generally described below by category.

A. Asset Transactions

21. RCD did not provide significant services in this category during the Interim Period.

B. <u>Case Administration and Business Operations</u>

- 22. During the Interim Period, RCD provided legal advice and services on numerous case administration issues and general matters affecting the Debtors, including, without limitation the following:
 - (a) RCD represented the Debtors at all scheduled hearings before the Bankruptcy Court.
 - (b) RCD assisted Jones Day and the Debtors in preparing and reviewing monthly operating reports that were filed during the Interim Period, as well as preparing and filing the Quarterly Fee Statements when due, as well as Rule 2015.3 reporting.
 - (c) RCD assisted the Debtors in responding to various post-petition procedural issues, including communicating with the Bankruptcy Administrator's office and Clerk's office to satisfy various post-petition requirements, and responding to various other inquiries.
 - (d) RCD assisted the Debtors to develop a positive working relationship with the ACC's professionals, the FCR and his professionals, and other parties in interest in these cases. Whenever possible, disputes have been resolved consensually without the need for judicial intervention.
 - (e) RCD assisted the Debtors in other administrative tasks, including preparing agendas for hearings, preparing notices related to omnibus hearings for 2024, and coordination of notice and service of all motions.
 - (f) RCD assisted Jones Day and the Debtors in analyzing potential options for the next steps in these Chapter 11 Cases and participated in various meetings with co-counsel and other case parties re: same.
 - (g) RCD assisted the Debtors and Jones Day in analysis of matters and developments in other proceedings potentially impacting strategic options for these cases, and corresponded with co-counsel and client representatives regarding these developments.
 - (h) RCD generally advised the Debtors and co-counsel regarding various aspects of local practice and procedure.

C. Fee Proceedings

23. RCD's services provided during the Interim Period under this category include the preparation of monthly compensation statements for RCD for the months of September, October, November and December 2023, as well as preparing RCD's tenth interim fee application for the period from the June 1, 2023 through September 30, 2023. RCD also assisted in the coordination and filing of other interim fee applications for the Debtors' professionals, preparation of orders approving the interim fee applications, review of parties' fee requests, and review of supplemental affidavits as needed. RCD assisted in coordination and circulation of other Debtor professionals' monthly compensation statements as well as assisting other case professionals with questions on fee and engagement procedures. RCD assisted Jones Day in analyzing and advising the Debtors regarding questions on professional engagement issues and filing of Ordinary Course Professionals reports.

D. <u>Financing and Relief from Stay Proceedings</u>

24. RCD did not provide significant services in this category during the Interim Period

E. Litigation

25. RCD assisted co-counsel in addressing matters related to certain litigation brought derivatively by the ACC, including analyzing discovery propounded on the Debtors in those proceedings and assisting in preparation of responses. RCD assisted co-counsel in addressing issues related to production of estimation-related discovery, including assisting in drafting motions to dismiss certain appeals filed by matching claimants as moot. RCD assisted co-counsel in analyzing and responding to an amicus brief filed by certain claimants in the Purdue Pharma appeal pending before the United States Supreme Court, and preparing a notice of filing of such amicus briefs for filing in this Court. RCD assisted co-counsel in analyzing and formulating options in response to this Court's opinions denying motions to dismiss filed by the ACC and clients of Maune Raichle and the Debtors' denying motion to withdraw derivative standing from the ACC. RCD also assisted co-counsel in preparing responses to motions for certification of direct appeal of the dismissal opinion to the Fourth Circuit, as well

as preparing motions to defer briefing on motions for leave to appeal the dismissal opinion in the District Court.

F. <u>Plan and Disclosure</u>

26. RCD did not provide significant services in this category during the Interim Period.

G. Claim Administration

27. RCD reviewed certain correspondence to claimants' counsel regarding attempts to resolve potential claim objections based on duplication, withdrawal, dismissal and other bases.

H. Miscellaneous Assistance or Other

- 28. This category is to be used for services that do not otherwise fall into the categories described above and was not used during the Interim Period.
- 29. As noted above, during the Interim Period, RCD provided services to facilitate the Debtors' discharge of their administrative duties as debtors in possession and to maximize value of the estates for the benefit of creditors, stakeholders and other parties in interest. In addition to the services provided above, RCD responded to numerous inquiries of parties in interest regarding the status of the case. RCD believes that all of these services have helped to ensure the efficient administration of these cases and compliance with the requirements of the Bankruptcy Code. Further, RCD represents to the Court that it has voluntarily reduced its billings and therefore its application for compensation for the Interim Period by approximately \$121.00 to arrive at its request for fees for the Interim Period. Certain billing entries RCD has voluntarily written off are shown on Exhibits A-1 through A-4 as no-charge entries, while the majority of such non-charged billing entries are not shown on Exhibits A-1 through A-4.

V. DESCRIPTION OF DISBURSEMENTS AND EXPENSES INCURRED DURING THE INTERIM PERIOD

- 30. It is RCD's policy with respect to expenses to charge its clients in all areas of practice for expenses incurred in connection with each client's case. The customary expenses charged to clients include, among other things, filing and court fees, regular and express mail charges, special or hand delivery charges, photocopying charges, travel expenses, expenses for "working meals," computerized research charges, and transcription costs.
- 31. RCD requests reimbursement for its actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Interim Period in the amount of \$861.71. A detailed breakdown of such expenses is provided in RCD's invoices attached hereto as Exhibits A-1 through A-4. The expenses RCD incurred in the rendition of professional services were necessary and reasonable under the circumstances to serve the needs of the Debtors.

VI. LEGAL STANDARD

32. This Application is submitted under the standards set forth in a number of decisions of the United States Supreme Court and the Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals; Hensley v. Eckerhart, 461 U.S. 424 (1983); Blum v. Stenson, 465 U.S. 886 (1984); Pennsylvania v. Delaware Valley Cit. Council, 107 S.C. 3078 (1987); Lilly v. Harris-Teeter Supermarket, 842 F.2^d 1496 (4th Cir. 1988); Daly v. Hill, 790 F.2^d 1071 (4th Cir. 1986); and Barber v. Kimbrell's, Inc., 577 F.2^d 216, 226 n. 28 (4th Cir. 1978), cert. denied, 439 U.S. 934 (1979) which adopted the standards of Johnson v. Ga. Highway Express, Inc., 488 F.2^d 714, 717-19 (5th Cir. 1974). Under the rule of Barber, these standards include the time and labor expended; the novelty and difficulty of the questions raised; the skill required to perform properly the legal services rendered; the attorney's opportunity costs in handling the case; the customary fee for like work; the attorney's expectations at the outset of the case; the time limitations imposed by the client or circumstances; the amount in controversy and the results obtained; the experience, reputation and ability of the attorney; the undesirability of the case within the legal community in which the case arose; the nature and length of the professional relationship between attorney and client; and attorneys' fees in similar cases. Under these

standards, the compensation and rates requested herein are reasonable for services rendered by the Applicant in this case.

VII. NOTICE

33. Notice of this motion has been provided to: (a) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator for the Western District of North Carolina; (b) counsel to the ACC; (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc.; (d) the FCR and his counsel; and (e) the other parties on the Service List established by the Case Management Order. RCD submits that, in light of the nature of the relief requested, no other or further notice need be provided.

VIII. CONCLUSION

34. Based on the foregoing, RCD makes this Application for an allowance of interim compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement for actual costs and expenses incurred in the performance of legal services as counsel to the Debtors in connection with these proceedings.

WHEREFORE, RCD respectfully requests that (a) RCD be allowed (i) interim compensation of \$96,176.00 as reasonable, actual and necessary professional services rendered by it on behalf of the Debtors during the Interim Period and (ii) interim reimbursement of expenses incurred during the Interim Period of \$861.71 as reasonable, actual and necessary; (b) the Debtors be authorized and directed to pay to RCD the amount of \$97,037.71, which is equal to the sum of 100% of RCD's allowed interim compensation and 100% of RCD's allowed expense reimbursement for the Interim Period less all previous payments received pursuant to the Fee Procedures Order; and (c) such other relief as is just and proper.

This the 11th day of March, 2024.

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

By: /s/ John R. Miller, Jr.
John R. Miller, Jr.
N.C. State Bar No. 28689
1200 Carillion, 227 West Trade Street
Charlotte, NC 28202
(704) 334-0891

Co- Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 13 of 111

EXHIBIT A-1

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 14 of 111

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
1200 CARILLON, 227 WEST TRADE STREET
CHARLOTTE, NORTH CAROLINA 28202-1675
TELEPHONE: (704)334-0891
FAX: (704) 377-1897

MONTHLY COMPENSATION STATEMENT

TO: See **Notice Parties**, attached

FROM: Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

DATE: November 30, 2023

RE: Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al.

Case No. 20-30608 (Jointly Administered)

United States Bankruptcy Court

Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A. ("RC&D") hereby submits this Monthly Compensation Statement for compensation and reimbursement as Counsel for Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al. (the "Debtors"), for the period of **October 1, 2023 through October 31, 2023**. During this period, RC&D incurred total fees in the amount of \$20,126.00 which amount is billed at its usual and customary hourly rates and actual and necessary out-of-pocket disbursements of \$20.76 for a total of \$20,146.76. Pursuant to the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the "Administrative Order") entered on July 15, 2020 in these cases, retained professionals may request ninety (90%) percent of their fees and one hundred (100%) of their expenses at this time. Accordingly, RC&D request payment from the Debtor of \$18,134.16 calculated as follows:

Attached hereto and incorporated as part of this Monthly Compensation Statement are RC&D's billing sheets for the period of October 1, 2023 through October 31, 2023.

<u>Cumulative Holdback Analysis</u>: October 1, 2023 through October 31, 2023: \$2,012.60

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 15 of 111

Professional Summary of Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

October 1, 2023 through October 31, 2023

<u>NAME</u>	HOURS	\underline{RATE}	<u>AMOUNT</u>
C. Richard Rayburn, Jr. (SH)	3.90	\$795.00	\$ 3,100.50
John R. Miller, Jr. (SH)	25.20	\$495.00	\$ 12,474.00
Ross R. Fulton (SH)	.70	\$425.00	\$ 297.50
Matthew L. Tomsic (SH)	4.90	\$350.00	\$ 1,715.00
Ashley B. Oldfield (A)	.80	\$295.00	\$ 236.00
Rachel E. Brinson (A)	3.90	\$295.00	\$ 1,150.50
Tiffany N. Lindsay (P)	4.50	\$235.00	\$ 1,057.50
Julia L. Robinson (P)	.50	\$190.00	\$ <u>95.00</u>
			\$ 20,126.00

COSTS AND EXPENSES to date for October 1, 2023 – October 31, 2023:

Lexis	\$ 4.26
Pacer	\$ 16.50
	\$ 20.76

Categories	Billable Hours	Billable Amount
Case Admin.	30.20	\$ 14,197.50
Claims Admin	.20	\$ 47.00
Fee Proceedings	6.50	\$ 2,489.00
Litigation	6.70	\$ 2,996.50
Plan/Disclosure	.80	\$ 396.00
		\$ 20,126.00

NOTICE PARTIES (via electronic mail)

U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator

Attn: Shelley K. Abel

feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov

Aldrich Pump LLC Murray Boiler LLC Attn: Allan Tananbaum atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Counsel to the Debtors

Brad B. Erens, Esq.
Mark A. Cody, Esq.
Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq.
Jones Day
bberens@jonesday.com
macody@jonesday.com
ccahow@jonesday.com

Trane Technologies Company LLC Trane U.S. Inc.

Philip D. Amoa
Anthony Bartell, Esq.
Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq.
Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq.
McCarter & English, LLP
pamoa@mccarter.com
abartell@mccarter.com
ppavlick@mccarter.com
gmascitti@mccarter.com

Stacy C. Cordes, Esq. Cordes Law, PLLC stacy@cordes-law.com

Asbestos Claimants Committee

Kevin Maclay kmaclay@capdale.com

Todd Phillips tphillips@capdale.com

Natalie Ramsey NRamsey@rc.com

Davis Wright

<u>DWright@rc.com</u>

Future Claimants Representative

Jonathan Guy
Debra Felder
Orrick Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP
jguy@orrick.com
dfelder@orrick.com

A. Cotten Wright
Grier, Wright, Martinez, PA
cwright@grierlaw.com

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 17 of 111

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200

Charlotte, NC 28202-1672

Telephone (704) 334-0891 Fax (704) 377-1897 FEDERAL I.D. #: 56-1597966

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC c/o Allan Tananbaum, Chief Legal Officer atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

Re: ASB-12739487

Balance Forward \$47,472.53

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount			
CASE ADM/F	CASE ADM/BUS OP:						
10/02/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence regarding MSR's, removal order, month comp requests, other admin issues	0.30	148.50			
10/02/23	MLT	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review monthly status reports	0.20	70.00			
10/02/23	MLT	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review proposed order	0.20	70.00			
10/02/23	TNL	B210 A110 - Business operations - Manage Data/Files Prepping and filing Aldrich MOR for August 2023 in 20-30608; prepping and filing Murray MOR for August 2023 in 20-30609; forwarding filed copies to KCC for service; ;circulating filed copies	0.40	94.00			
10/03/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mails from co-counsel regarding responses and report	0.30	238.50			
10/03/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call with co-counsel	0.70	556.50			
10/03/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review WIP report					

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		and status list and participate in WIP call	1.00	495.00
10/03/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call	0.80	280.00
10/04/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mails from and to co-counsel regarding filing	0.10	79.50
10/04/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Analysis of recent developments potentially impacting case and correspondence with R. Rayburn regarding same	0.10	49.50
10/04/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review and analysis of recent developments potentially impacting case	0.60	297.00
10/04/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Analysis of question from Jeff O. and return call	0.20	99.00
10/05/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Jeff O. regarding upcoming hearing and other matters	0.10	49.50
10/05/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to Jones Day counsel regarding recent pleadings	0.10	49.50
10/05/23	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Brief research on potential upcoming case issue	0.20	99.00

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
10/09/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review recent developments potentially impacting case	0.40	198.00
10/11/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Phillip P. regarding upcoming hearing	0.10	49.50
10/12/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case; correspondence with co-counsel and client reps regarding same	0.70	346.50
10/12/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Telephone conference with case party regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case and office conference with R. Rayburn regarding same	0.50	247.50
10/12/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Brad K. regarding recent developments potentially impacting case	0.10	49.50
10/13/23	ABO	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) E-mail to J. Miller regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case	0.30	88.50
10/13/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Participate in WIP call	0.60	297.00
10/13/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration -		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Communicate (in firm) E-mail from A. Oldfield regarding upcoming matters potentially impacting case	0.10	49.50
10/13/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS in 20-30608 for DI 1967; forwarding filed copy to KCC	0.20	47.00
10/13/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS in 20-30608 for DI 1968; prepping and filing COS in 20-30609 for DI 109; forwarding filed copies to KCC	0.30	70.50
10/16/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS in 20-30608 for DI 1963; forwarding filed copy to KCC	0.20	47.00
10/17/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call with co-counsel	0.70	556.50
10/17/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend WIP call	0.80	396.00
10/17/23	MLT	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Attend WIP	0.90	315.00
10/19/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to client reps and co-counsel regarding recent developments potentially impacting	0.30	148.50
10/19/23	TNL	Case B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS for DI 1969; forwarding filed copy to KCC	0.20	47.00

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
10/20/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence with T. Lindsay regarding upcoming hearing	0.10	49.50
10/23/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mails from and to co-counsel regarding memo	0.50	397.50
10/23/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence with case parties regarding October omnibus hearing and upcoming issues; e-mail chambers regarding same	0.40	198.00
10/23/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review notes on recent developments and call with Brad E. regarding same	0.40	198.00
10/23/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review pleadings in matter potentially impacting case	0.60	297.00
10/23/23	REB	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Legal research regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case; e-mail J. Miller and R. Rayburn regarding same; draft memo regarding legal research	1.70	501.50
10/24/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call with co-counsel	0.70	556.50
10/24/23	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Correspondence with T. Lindsay regarding October omnibus, draft notice of cancellation and		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		coordinate filing and service	0.20	99.00
10/24/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review pleadings in matter potentially impacting case and correspondence to Brad E. regarding same	0.50	247.50
10/24/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding upcoming strategic case issues	0.20	99.00
10/24/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with co-counsel regarding recent hearing	0.10	49.50
10/24/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review WIP report and participate in WIP call	1.00	495.00
10/24/23	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research regarding upcoming strategic decisions in case	0.40	198.00
10/24/23	REB	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Legal research regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case; memo regarding legal research and e-mail same to J. Miller nad R. Rayburn	2.20	649.00
10/25/23	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research on upcoming case issues and correspondence to R. Brinson regarding same	1.00	495.00
10/25/23	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Continue review of pleadings in matter potentially		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		impacting case	0.40	198.00
10/26/23	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research on upcoming case issues	1.10	544.50
10/26/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Amanda J. regarding month-end filings	0.10	49.50
		regarding month end rirings	0.10	13.00
10/26/23	MLT	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review WIP, task list	0.30	105.00
10/27/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Multiple correspondence regarding 2024		
		omnibus hearings	0.10	49.50
10/27/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with T. Lindsay regarding month-end filings	0.10	49.50
10/27/23	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research regarding potential upcoming matter and correspondence to R. Rayburn regarding same	0.10	49.50
		Legaluling Same	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	
10/27/23	MLT	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review MORs	0.30	105.00
10/30/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review briefs and opinions; e-mails co-counsel regarding same	0.60	477.00
				.
10/30/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Telephone conference with Brad E. regarding possible filing; office conference with R.		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Rayburn regarding same; analysis of issues related to same and various office conferences; telephone conferences regarding same	1.20	594.00
10/30/23	JRM	B110 A103 - Case administration - Draft/revise Draft notice of filing of amicus briefs; finalize and coordinate filing and service	0.80	396.00
10/30/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding potential upcoming issues impacting case	0.20	99.00
10/30/23	MLT	B110 A104 - Case administration ~ Review/analyze Review MSRs for filing	0.20	70.00
10/30/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing monthly operating report for Aldrich for September 2023 in 20-30608; prepping and filing monthly operating report for Murray for September 2023 in 20-30609; forwarding to KCC for service;	0. 50	117 50
10/31/23	CRR	Circulating filed copies B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze WIP call with	0.50	117.50 238.50
10/31/23	JLR	Co-counsel B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files File quarterly fee statements for Aldrich Pump and Murray Boiler; e-mail to P. Romero regarding service; submit payment to court	0.30	57.00
10/31/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration -		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding quarterly fees, review proposed quarterly fee statements, coordinate filing and payment	0.40	198.00
10/31/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review Bestwall notice of filing amicus briefs and circulate to co-counsel and client reps	0.10	49.50
10/31/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review notes on pending research issues in preparation for WIP call; review WIP report and participate in WIP call	0.70	346.50
10/31/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call	0.50	175.00
10/31/23	MLT	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review WIP report	0.20	70.00
		Total for CASE ADM/BUS OP:	30.20	\$14,197.50
CLAIMS ADM	IIN:			
10/02/23	TNL	B310 A110 - Claims administration and objections - Manage data/files Uploading proposed order granting seventh removal motion; circulating confirmation	0.20	47.00
		Total for CLAIMS ADMIN:	0.20	\$47.00

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
10/02/23	MLT	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review August fee statements	0.40	140.00
10/04/23	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Prepare RCD monthly compensation request for September 2023 and correspondence with Amanda J. regarding same	0.50	247.50
10/05/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Brief review of fee apps	0.10	49.50
10/06/23	JRM	B160 A105 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence from T. Lindsay regarding interim fee apps and respond	0.10	49.50
10/10/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Prepping and filing ninth supplemental declaration of KLG; forward filed copy to M. Tomsic and J. Miller; forwarding to KCC for service	0.30	70.50
10/11/23	TNL	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Drafting RCD monthly compensation statement for September 2023; forward to J. Miller for review	0.50	117.50
10/11/23	TNL	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Draft RCD tenth interim fee application, NOPH and proposed order; forwarding to J. Miller for review	1.00	235.00
10/12/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		applications - Review/analyze Brief review LAS fee statements	0.10	49.50
10/24/23	TNL	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Revisions to RCD tenth fee application, exhibits and proposed order; forwarding to J. Miller for review	0.50	117.50
10/26/23	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Drafting RCD 10th interim fee application	1.20	594.00
10/27/23	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Review and revise monthly comp request for September 2023, office conference with T. Lindsay regarding same and review final for circulation	0.20	99.00
10/27/23	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Continue drafting RCD interim comp request	1.00	495.00
10/30/23	MLT	B130 A104 - Asset disposition - Review/analyze Review monthly fee statements	0.50	175.00
10/31/23	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Telephone conference with Rob C. regarding Verus order	0.10	49.50
		Total for FEE PROCEEDINGS:	6.50	\$2,489.00

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
10/02/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence regarding Verus production	0.10	49.50
10/03/23	JRM	B190 A108 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other external) Review removal order and coordinate service	0.10	49.50
10/03/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Morgan H. regarding estimation evidence issues	0.10	49.50
10/03/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review trust discovery-related draft pleading	0.20	99.00
10/03/23	MLT	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail correspondence regarding case issues	0.10	35.00
10/04/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and comment on further revised estimation related pleading; multiple correspondence and review edits on same	0.20	99.00
10/04/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		motions) - Review/analyze Review NDA priv log transmittal letter	0.10	49.50
10/09/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Analysis of estimation discovery issues and correspondence to co-counsel		
		regarding same	0.60	297.00
10/10/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research		
		regarding case issues	0.30	105.00
10/12/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mail Michael E. and Morgan H. regarding estimation		
		discovery issues	0.20	99.00
10/12/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Analysis of upcoming litigation issues	0.50	247.50
10/13/23	RRF	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review memorandum in support of motion to	0.20	85.00
		dismiss appeal	0.20	85.00
10/23/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and comment on draft memo in support of motion to dismiss matching claimants' appeal	0.40	198.00
10/24/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		motions) - Review/analyze Review draft of potential appellate pleading	0.20	99.00
10/24/23	TNL	B190 A110 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Manage data/files Prepping and filing notice of cancellation of October 26th hearing; forward filed copy to KCC for service	0.20	47.00
10/27/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review Purdue amicus brief as filed and brief telephone conference with Jeff E. regarding same	0.30	148.50
10/27/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review dismissal issue	0.10	49.50
10/27/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review proposed revised sampling protocol	0.20	99.00
10/30/23	ABO	B190 A103 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Draft/revise Update citations for notice of filing regarding amicus briefs	0.50	147.50
10/30/23	JLR	B190 A110 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Manage data/files File notice of filing regarding brief for Amicus Curiae	0.20	38.00
10/30/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters		

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		(excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review amicus briefing in support of Purdue	0.50	247.50
10/31/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Multiple correspondence regarding draft motions in matching claimants appeals and review updated drafts	0.90	445.50
10/31/23	RRF	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review revised memorandum in support of motion to dismiss appeals	0.30	127.50
10/31/23	RRF	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mails with M. Hirst regarding local rule and standing order requirements for memorandum in support of motion to dismiss appeal	0.20	85.00
		Total for LITIGATION:	6.70	\$2,996.50
PLAN/DISCL	OSURE:			
10/25/23	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research on plan issue and correspondence to Brad E. regarding same	0.80	396.00
		Total for PLAN/DISCLOSURE:	0.80	\$396.00

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

			Total fees	44.40	\$20,126.00
	Costs Adva	nced			Amount
10/04/23		er LEXIS - Compute or this billing pe	-		4.26
10/10/23		er PACER - Compute cess Charges:	erized Court		16.50
		Tot	cal costs advan	ced	\$20.76
		Total current fe	ees/costs advan	ced	\$20,146.76
		Pleas	se pay this amo	unt	\$67,619.29
q		Wours	Ra+4	Amou	ın+

Summary	Hours	Rate	Amount
(IDD)	2 00	795.00	3,100.50
CRR	3.90		,
JRM	25.20	495.00	12,474.00
RRF	0.70	425.00	297.50
MLT	4.90	350.00	1,715.00
ABO	0.80	295.00	236.00
REB	3.90	295.00	1,150.50
TNL	4.50	235.00	1,057.50
JLR	0.50	190.00	95.00

Trust E	Balance	Forward	\$257.08
Current	Trust	Balance	\$257.08

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 33 of 111 Page 17

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

11/02/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49291

Re: ASB-12739487

Payment is due upon receipt of invoice

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 34 of 111

EXHIBIT A-2

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 35 of 111

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
1200 CARILLON, 227 WEST TRADE STREET
CHARLOTTE, NORTH CAROLINA 28202-1675
TELEPHONE: (704)334-0891
FAX: (704) 377-1897

MONTHLY COMPENSATION STATEMENT

TO: See **Notice Parties**, attached

FROM: Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

DATE: January 2, 2024

RE: Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al.

Case No. 20-30608 (Jointly Administered)

United States Bankruptcy Court

Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A. ("RC&D") hereby submits this Monthly Compensation Statement for compensation and reimbursement as Counsel for Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al. (the "Debtors"), for the period of **November 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023**. During this period, RC&D incurred total fees in the amount of \$18,192.00 which amount is billed at its usual and customary hourly rates and actual and necessary out-of-pocket disbursements of \$25.70 for a total of \$18,217.70. Pursuant to the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the "Administrative Order") entered on July 15, 2020 in these cases, retained professionals may request ninety (90%) percent of their fees and one hundred (100%) of their expenses at this time. Accordingly, RC&D request payment from the Debtor of \$16,398.50 calculated as follows:

Attached hereto and incorporated as part of this Monthly Compensation Statement are RC&D's billing sheets for the period of November 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023.

<u>Cumulative Holdback Analysis</u>: October 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023: \$3,831.80

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 36 of 111

Professional Summary of Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

November 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023

<u>NAME</u>	HOURS	\underline{RATE}	<u>AMOUNT</u>
C. Richard Rayburn, Jr. (SH)	2.70	\$795.00	\$ 2,146.50
John R. Miller, Jr. (SH)	23.90	\$495.00	\$ 11,830.50
Ross R. Fulton (SH)	.70	\$425.00	\$ 297.50
Matthew L. Tomsic (SH)	7.50	\$350.00	\$ 2,625.00
Tiffany N. Lindsay (P)	5.50	\$235.00	\$ <u>1,292.50</u>
			\$ 18,192.00

COSTS AND EXPENSES to date for November 1, 2023 – November 30, 2023:

Pacer		\$ <u>25.70</u> \$ 25.70
Categories	Billable Hours	Billable Amount
Case Admin. Claims Admin	18.10 .30	\$ 8,762.50 \$ 148.50
Fee Proceedings	7.90	\$ 2,849.50
Litigation	14.00	\$ <u>6,431.50</u>
		\$ 18,192.00

NOTICE PARTIES (via electronic mail)

U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator

Attn: Shelley K. Abel

feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov

Aldrich Pump LLC Murray Boiler LLC Attn: Allan Tananbaum atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Counsel to the Debtors

Brad B. Erens, Esq.
Mark A. Cody, Esq.
Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq.
Jones Day
bberens@jonesday.com
macody@jonesday.com
ccahow@jonesday.com

Trane Technologies Company LLC Trane U.S. Inc.

Philip D. Amoa
Anthony Bartell, Esq.
Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq.
Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq.
McCarter & English, LLP
pamoa@mccarter.com
abartell@mccarter.com
ppavlick@mccarter.com
gmascitti@mccarter.com

Stacy C. Cordes, Esq. Cordes Law, PLLC stacy@cordes-law.com

Asbestos Claimants Committee

Kevin Maclay kmaclay@capdale.com

Todd Phillips tphillips@capdale.com

Natalie Ramsey NRamsey@rc.com

Davis Wright

<u>DWright@rc.com</u>

Future Claimants Representative

Jonathan Guy
Debra Felder
Orrick Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP
jguy@orrick.com
dfelder@orrick.com

A. Cotten Wright
Grier, Wright, Martinez, PA
cwright@grierlaw.com

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main

Document Page 38 of 111 RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200 Charlotte, NC 28202-1672

Telephone (704) 334-0891 Fax (704) 377-1897 FEDERAL I.D. #: 56-1597966

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC c/o Allan Tananbaum, Chief Legal Officer atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

Re: ASB-12739487

Balance Forward \$33,796.21

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
CASE ADM/E	US OP:			
11/01/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case	0.20	99.00
11/02/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review notes and call Brad E. regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case; office conference with R. Rayburn regarding same	0.50	247.50
11/06/23	CRR	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review e-mails regarding recent issue potentially impacting case	0.30	238.50
11/06/23	TLIM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review notice of filing	0.40	140.00
11/07/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review articles on recent developments potentially impacting case	0.20	99.00
11/07/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS in 20-30608 for DI 1980; forward filed copy to KCC	0.20	47.00

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
11/07/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS in 20-30609 for DI 111; prepping and filing COS for DI 1983-1984 in 20-30608; forwarding filed copies to KCC	0.40	94.00
11/08/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Analysis of recent developments potentially impacting case and correspondence with Brad E. regarding same	1.20	594.00
11/08/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Morgan H. and Michael E. regarding Verus issues	0.20	99.00
11/09/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Michael E. regarding estimation issue	0.20	99.00
11/09/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS in 20-30608 for DI 1982; forwarding filed copy to KCC	0.20	47.00
11/09/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Prepping nad filing OCP report; forwarding filed copy to KCC for service; circulating filed copy	0.20	47.00
11/10/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mail correspondence	0.60	210.00
11/10/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing notice of supplemental authority; forwarding filed copy to		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		KCC for service; circulating filed copy	0.20	47.00
11/13/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review analysis of issues potentially impacting case	0.50	247.50
11/14/23	CRR	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review e-mails from co-counsel in preparation for WIP call	0.50	397.50
11/14/23	CRR	B120 A107 - Asset analysis and recovery - Communicate (other coutside counsel) WIP call co-counsel	1.00	795.00
11/14/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review updated WIP report and task list and participate in WIP call	1.60	792.00
11/14/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Continue review and analysis of recent developments potentially impacting case	0.70	346.50
11/14/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call	1.10	385.00
11/15/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Multiple correspondence with T. Lindsay regarding COS	0.10	49.50
11/15/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to co-counsel regarding recent development and further analysis regarding same	0.40	198.00
		<u>.</u>		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
11/15/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS for DI 1985-1986 in 20-30608; prepping and filing COS for DI 1993 in 20-30608; prepping and filing COS for DI 1997-2005 in 20-30608; prepping and filing COS for DI 112 in 20-30609; forward filed copies to KCC	0.50	117.50
11/16/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding various outstanding and upcoming issues	0.50	247.50
11/16/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence with Brad E. regarding Nov. omnibus hearing and status of sampling discussions	0.20	99.00
11/16/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS for DI 2006 in 20-30608; forwarding filed copy to KCC	0.20	47.00
11/17/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Telephone conference with Brad E. regarding upcoming issues potentially impacting case	0.30	148.50
11/20/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with ACC, FCR, NDA counsel and S. Abel regarding cancellation of November omnibus	0.20	99.00
11/21/23	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) E-mails with Anya H. and Ursula H.		33.00

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		regarding November omnibus hearing; draft cancellation notice	0.30	148.50
11/21/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing notice of cancellation of November 30th hearing; circulating filed copy; forward to KCC for service	0.30	70.50
			0.30	70.50
11/28/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review WIP e-mail and call with		
		co-counsel	0.60	477.00
11/28/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review updated WIP and task list and attend WIP call	1.20	594.00
				551.55
11/28/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call	0.90	315.00
11/29/23	CRR	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review e-mails regarding sampling agreement and restructuring litigation related document	0.30	238.50
11/30/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Patrick L. regarding Aldrich MOR's and review		
		<pre>draft MSR's; coordinate filing and service, review as-filed</pre>	0.50	247.50
11/30/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Analysis of upcoming issues potentially impacting case	1.20	594.00
		Total for CASE ADM/BUS OP:	18.10	\$8,762.50
		·		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
CLAIMS ADM	IIN:			
11/02/23	JRM	B310 A104 - Claims administration and objections - Review/analyze Review Weitz letter regarding POC's and brief review of exhibits	0.30	148.50
		Total for CLAIMS ADMIN:	0.30	\$148.50
FEE PROCEI	EDINGS:			
11/01/23	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Prepare RCD compensation request for October 2023	0.30	148.50
11/06/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review draft revised Verus order and correspondence regarding same	0.10	49.50
11/07/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review RCD 10th interim fee app	0.10	49.50
11/09/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Brief review as-filed OCP report	0.10	49.50
11/09/23	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence regarding RCD and other interim fee apps	0.20	99.00
11/09/23	MLT	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review fee app	1.00	350.00
11/09/23	TNI.	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Prepping and filing RCD tenth fee app, KLG tenth fee app, BW tenth fee app, Claro ninth fee app, AP tenth fee app, JD tenth fee app and EWH fee app; forwarding filed copies to KCC; circulating filed copies	1.00	235.00
11/09/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Revising NOPH for fee apps; prepping and filing NOPH; forwarding filed copy to KCC; circulating filed copy	0.40	94.00
11/10/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review and comment draft RCD comp request for October 2023	0.20	99.00
11/10/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Brief review Caplin fee requests	0.10	49.50
11/13/23	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mail Rob C. regarding Verus order	0.10	49.50
11/16/23	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Amanda J. regarding Verus question and review fee request; telephone conference with Amanda J. regarding same	0.40	198.00
11/16/23	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Revise RCD monthly comp request for October 2023 and e-mail Amanda J. and T. Lindsay regarding same	0.40	198.00

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	አ ተ ተ ፣ •	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
11/17/02	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration -	nours	Allount
11/17/23	URM	Communicate (in firm)		
		Correspondence with M. Tomsic		
		regarding fee app question	0.10	49.50
11/20/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Brief review ACC professional fee		
		statement	0.10	49.50
11/27/23	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review RCD interim fee order and multiple correspondence with T. Lindsay,		
		Amanda J. regarding other professional fee orders	0.30	148.50
11/27/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files	;	
		Prepping and uploading proposed order granting RCD tenth fee app and proposed order granting JD		
		tenth fee app	0.30	70.50
11/28/23	JRM	B160 A105 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence to T. Lindsay regarding Alix fee order and		
		service of JD and RCD orders	0.20	99.00
11/28/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review EWH, Claro, KLG, BW fee		
		orders and coordinate upload	0.20	99.00
11/28/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Prepping and uploading proposed order granting AP tenth fee app; forward confirmation to M. Tomsic		
		and J. Miller	0.20	47.00

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
11/28/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Downloading entered order granting RCD tenth fee app; downloading entered order granting JD tenth fee app; forward filed copies to KCC for service; circulating filed copies	0.20	47.00
11/28/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Prepping and uploading proposed order granting Claro ninth fee app; prepping and uploading proposed order granting EWH tenth fee app; prepping and uploading proposed order granting KLG tenth fee app; forward confirmation to J. Miller and M. Tomsic	0.50	117.50
11/28/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Prepping and uploading proposed order granting BW tenth fee app; forward confirmation to J. Miller and M. Tomsic	0.20	47.00
11/29/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Brief review of ACC professional fee request	0.10	49.50
11/29/23	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Amanda J. regarding RCD October compensation request	0.10	49.50
11/30/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review final draft RCD monthly comp request for October 2023	0.10	49.50

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
11/30/23	MLT	B160 A108 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other external) Circulated fee statements	0.40	140.00
11/30/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Downloading entered order granting Claro ninth fee app; downloading entered order granting EWH tenth, KLG tenth and BW tenth fee apps; forwarding filed copies to KCC for service; circulating filed copies	0.30	70.50
11/30/23	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Finalizing RCD monthly compensation statement for October 2023; compiling and forwarding to M.	0.00	47.00
		Tomsic	0.20	47.00
		Total for FEE PROCEEDINGS:	7.90	\$2,849.50
LITIGATION	ı.			
11/01/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Brief review motions to dismiss matching claimant anonymity appeals and multiple correspondence regarding same	0.10	49.50
11/01/23	RRF	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mails with M. Hirst regarding filing motions to dismiss appeals	, 0.10	42.50
11/01/23	RRF	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		motions) - Review/analyze Review final motions and memorandums in support of dismissing appeals	0.20	85.00
11/01/23	RRF	Bi90 Al08 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other external) File motions to dismiss appeals and memorandums in support	0.20	85.00
11/06/23	JRM	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence from R. Rayburn regarding recent development potentially impacting case	0.10	49.50
11/07/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Office conference with R. Fulton and correspondence to co-counsel regarding possible filing; call with Brad E. regarding same	0.60	297.00
11/09/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Analysis of dismissal related issues and telephone conference with Brad E. regarding same	0.20	99.00
11/09/23	JRM	B190 A103 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Draft/revise Draft potential pleading related to dismissal issues and correspondence with client and co-counsel regarding same	0.80	396.00
11/10/23	JRM	B190 A108 - Other contested matters		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		<pre>(excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other external) Finalize notice of supplemental authority and coordinate filing and service; correspondence with Amanda J. regarding same; review as-filed</pre>	0.60	297.00
11/10/23	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review draft notice of supplemental authority	0.10	35.00
11/13/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and analysis of restructuring adversaries discovery requests	1.90	940.50
11/13/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence regarding matching claimant appeal and dismissal and brief review form stipulations	0.20	99.00
11/13/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	1.10	385.00
11/13/23	RRF	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review proposed dismissals of appeals	0.10	42.50
11/14/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR
Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		correspondence regarding matching claimants appeals	0.30	148.50
11/14/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.70	245.00
11/14/23	RRF	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mails with counsel regarding stipulation of dismissal of appeals	0.10	42.50
11/15/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to co-counsel and clients regarding discovery matter	0.10	49.50
11/17/23	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review discovery requests from ACC in APs	0.50	175.00
11/20/23	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review discovery requests from ACC	0.60	210.00
11/21/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Telephone conference with Brad K. regarding restructuring adversary discovery issues	0.10	49.50
11/21/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		motions) - Review/analyze Review analysis of recent relevant case	0.10	49.50
11/21/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review draft of potential restructuring litigation related document	0.30	148.50
11/21/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Morgan H. regarding Verus discovery	0.10	49.50
11/27/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review draft discovery related document and other issues related to restructuring adversaries; correspondence with Dave T. regarding same	2.00	990.00
11/27/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Morgan H. regarding estimation discovery issues	0.10	49.50
11/28/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review estimation related proposed document and correspondence with co-counsel regarding same	0.90	445.50
11/28/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review		

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		revised proposed restructuring adversary related document	0.30	148.50
11/29/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding claims file sample issues	0.10	49.50
11/29/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Morgan H. regarding estimation discovery issues	0.10	49.50
11/29/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review further proposed revisions to restructuring adversary related document and multiple comments, correspondence with Dave T. regarding same	0.70	346.50
11/30/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple further correspondence regarding estimation discovery issues	0.40	198.00
11/30/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Greg M. regarding restructuring adversary discovery deadlines	0.10	49.50
11/30/23	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection		

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 53 of 111

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

12/06/23

\$257.08

\$257.08

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

Re: ASB-12739487

	Atty	Services Rendered		н	ours	Amount
		motions) - Review/a ACC discovery	nnalyze Rev		0.10	35.00
		Tota	al for LITI	GATION: 1	4.00	\$6,431.50
			Total	fees 4	0.30	\$18,192.00
	Costs	Advanced				Amount
11/30/23	11/30/23 E124 - Other PACER - Computerized Court Records Access Charges:					25.70
			Total cost	s advanced		\$25.70
		Total current	fees/cost	s advanced		\$18,217.70
		PJ	lease pay t	his amount		\$52,013.91
s	ummary	Hours	Ra	te	Amour	ıt
C	RR	2.70	795.	00 2	,146.5	50
	RM	23.90	495.		,830.5	
R	RF	0.70	425.		297.5	
М	LT	7.50	350.		,625.0	
T	NL	5.50	235.	00 1	,292.5	50

Trust Balance Forward,

Current Trust Balance

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 54 of 111

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

12/06/23

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49465

Re: ASB-12739487

Payment is due upon receipt of invoice

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 55 of 111

EXHIBIT A-3

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 56 of 111

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
1200 CARILLON, 227 WEST TRADE STREET
CHARLOTTE, NORTH CAROLINA 28202-1675
TELEPHONE: (704)334-0891
FAX: (704) 377-1897

MONTHLY COMPENSATION STATEMENT

TO: See **Notice Parties**, attached

FROM: Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

DATE: January 30, 2024

RE: Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al.

Case No. 20-30608 (Jointly Administered)

United States Bankruptcy Court

Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A. ("RC&D") hereby submits this Monthly Compensation Statement for compensation and reimbursement as Counsel for Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al. (the "Debtors"), for the period of **December 1, 2023 through December 31, 2023**. During this period, RC&D incurred total fees in the amount of \$18,471.50 which amount is billed at its usual and customary hourly rates and actual and necessary out-of-pocket disbursements of \$51.40 for a total of \$18,522.90. Pursuant to the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the "Administrative Order") entered on July 15, 2020 in these cases, retained professionals may request ninety (90%) percent of their fees and one hundred (100%) of their expenses at this time. Accordingly, RC&D request payment from the Debtor of \$16,675.75 calculated as follows:

Attached hereto and incorporated as part of this Monthly Compensation Statement are RC&D's billing sheets for the period of December 1, 2023 through December 31, 2023.

<u>Cumulative Holdback Analysis</u>: October 1, 2023 through December 31, 2023: \$5,678.95.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 57 of 111

Professional Summary of Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

December 1, 2023 through December 31, 2023

NAME	HOURS	<u>RATE</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
C. Richard Rayburn, Jr. (SH	7.80	\$795.00	\$ 6,201.00
John R. Miller, Jr. (SH)	15.50	\$495.00	\$ 7,672.50
Matthew L. Tomsic (SH)	12.60	\$350.00	\$ 4,410.00
Tiffany N. Lindsay (P)	.80	\$235.00	\$ <u>188.00</u>
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •			\$ 18 471 50

COSTS AND EXPENSES to date for December 1, 2023 – December 31, 2023:

Pacer		\$ <u>51.40</u> \$ 51.40
Categories	Billable Hours	Billable Amount
Case Admin.	19.00	\$ 10,235.00
Fee Proceedings	.80	\$ 396.00
Financing/Relief	.60	\$ 253.50
Litigation	16.30	\$ <u>7,587.00</u>

\$ 18,471.50

NOTICE PARTIES (via electronic mail)

Natalie Ramsey
NRamsey@rc.com

DWright@rc.com

Davis Wright

U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator

Attn: Shelley K. Abel

feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov

Aldrich Pump LLC Murray Boiler LLC Attn: Allan Tananbaum

atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Future Claimants Representative

Jonathan Guy Debra Felder

Orrick Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP

jguy@orrick.com dfelder@orrick.com

Counsel to the Debtors

Brad B. Erens, Esq.
Mark A. Cody, Esq.
Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq.
Jones Day
bberens@jonesday.com
macody@jonesday.com
ccahow@jonesday.com

A. Cotten Wright
Grier, Wright, Martinez, PA
cwright@grierlaw.com

Trane Technologies Company LLC Trane U.S. Inc.

Philip D. Amoa
Anthony Bartell, Esq.
Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq.
Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq.
McCarter & English, LLP
pamoa@mccarter.com
abartell@mccarter.com
ppavlick@mccarter.com
gmascitti@mccarter.com

Stacy C. Cordes, Esq. Cordes Law, PLLC stacy@cordes-law.com

Asbestos Claimants Committee

Kevin Maclay kmaclay@capdale.com

Todd Phillips tphillips@capdale.com

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 59 of 111 RAYBURN COOPER & BURHAM, P.A.

227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200 Charlotte, NC 28202-1672

Telephone (704) 334-0891 Fax (704) 377-1897 FEDERAL I.D. #: 56-1597966

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC c/o Allan Tananbaum, Chief Legal Officer atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

Re: ASB-12739487

Balance Forward \$38,364.46

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount		
CASE ADM/E	CASE ADM/BUS OF:					
12/01/23	CRR	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Conference call with co-counsel	1.00	795.00		
12/01/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Participate in call with client reps and co-counsel regarding open issues and next steps in case	1.00	495.00		
12/04/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Monitor developments potentially impacting case and analysis of same; office conferences with R. Rayburn, M. Tomsic regarding same	0.90	445.50		
12/04/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) E-mail M. Tomsic regarding draft proposed order	0.10	49.50		
12/05/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review WIP e-mail and WIP call with co-counsel	0.90	715.50		
12/05/23	CRR	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) E-mails regarding WIP call	0.20	159.00		
12/05/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm)				

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Correspondence with T. Lindsay regarding COS's	0.10	49.50
12/05/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review updated WIP report and task list and participate in WIP call, follow up correspondence to Amanda J. regarding same	1.20	594.00
12/05/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review analysis of recent developments potentially impacting case	0.20	99.00
12/05/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Correspondence with R. Rayburn regarding strategic options for case, begin review prior research regarding same	0.30	148.50
12/05/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Participated in WIP call	0.50	175.00
12/06/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding research issue for strategic options and review and analysis of same	0.50	247.50
12/06/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Stacy C. regarding December omnibus	0.10	49.50
12/07/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding recent developments potentially impacting case	0.10	49.50

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
12/07/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to Brad E. regarding WIP call	0.10	49.50
12/08/23	CRR	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze WIP call with co-counsel	0.50	397.50
12/12/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call with co-counsel	0.70	556.50
12/12/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review WIP report and participate in WIP call	0.90	445.50
12/12/23	MLT	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Attended WIP	0.80	280.00
12/12/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS for DI 2019-2023 in 20-30608; prepping and filing COS for DI 116 in 20-30609; forwarding filed copies to KCC	0.30	70.50
12/14/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with M. Tomsic and Brad E. regarding upcoming hearing issues	0.10	49.50
12/14/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS for DI 2030; forwarding filed copy to KCC	0.20	47.00
12/15/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call with counsel	0.30	238.50

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
12/15/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Conference call with co-counsel regarding strategy and possible		
		options	0.80	636.00
12/15/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Attend WIP call with client reps and co-counsel	0.40	198.00
12/15/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Participate in call with client reps and co-counsel	0.90	445.50
12/18/23	MLT	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) E-mail A. Johnson regarding MSRs, fee		
		statements	0.10	35.00
12/19/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call with co-counsel	0.30	238.50
12/19/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Attend WIF call with co-counsel	0.30	148.50
12/19/23	MLT	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Participated in WIP call	0.40	140.00
12/20/23	MLT	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Draft, review, respond to e-mails regarding December omnibus	0.60	210.00
		gararing recuiser omitted	0.50	First UNIV & VV
12/21/23	MLT	B110 A108 - Case administration ~ Communicate (Other external) Draft e-mail to court regarding status conference	0.20	70.00
12/22/23	MLT	B110 A103 - Case administration -		

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Draft/revise Draft notice of agenda	0.40	140.00
12/26/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence regarding December omnibus	0.20	99.00
12/26/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review draft order on sampling and review proposed correspondence to ACC/FCR regarding same; multiple further		
		correspondence regarding same	0.30	148.50
12/26/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review, circulated, filed agenda	0.50	175.00
12/26/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Corresponded regarding hearing details	0.10	35.00
12/27/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review recent analysis of decision potentially impacting case	0.10	49.50
12/27/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence with R. Rayburn regarding upcoming issues impacting case	0.10	49.50
12/27/23	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mails with co-counsel and R.		
12/27/23	JRM	Rayburn regarding appeal issue B110 A106 - Case administration - Communicate (with client) Correspondence with clients	0.20	99.00

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		regarding omnibus hearing	0.10	49.50
12/28/23	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding opinions	0.50	397.50
12/28/23	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Attend status conference for December omnibus	0.80	396.00
12/28/23	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding hearing and upcoming issues impacting case; multiple correspondence with co-counsel regarding same	0.40	198.00
12/28/23	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and uploading proposed claims file sample order; forward entered order to KCC for service	0.30	70.50
		Total for CASE ADM/BUS OP:	19.00	\$10,235.00
FEE PROCEE	DINGS:			
12/04/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Prepare RCD monthly comp request for November 2023	0.40	198.00
12/06/23	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review November 2023 invoice and send to Amanda J.	0.10	49.50
12/14/23	jrm	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Brief		

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount	
		review Verus statements and forward to Michael E. and Morgan H.	0.20	99.00	
12/18/23	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze			
		Review draft RCD monthly comp request for November 2023	0.10	49.50	
		Total for FEE PROCEEDINGS:	0.80	\$396.00	
FINANCING/	RELIEF	':			
12/06/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Correspondence with M. Tomsic regarding proposed order and review			
		draft of same	0.20	99.00	
12/07/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence			
		regarding proposed order	0.10	49.50	
12/26/23	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review correspondence regarding			
		sampling order	0.30	105.00	
		Total for FINANCING/RELIEF:	0.60	\$253.50	
LITIGATION:					
12/01/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.50	175.00	
12/04/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters			

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		(excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Christina C. regarding discovery responses	0.10	49.50
12/04/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	1.40	490.00
12/05/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.50	175.00
12/06/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	1.90	665.00
12/06/23	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Analysis of issues for proposed order	0.50	175.00
12/06/23	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review draft proposed order	0.10	35.00
12/07/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Michael E. regarding sample issues	0.10	49.50
12/13/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence		

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
	•	from Natalie R. regarding PIQ issue	0.10	49.50
12/14/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence from Natalie R. regarding sampling protocol	0.10	4 9.50
12/15/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding estimation discovery	0.10	49.50
12/18/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to Dave T., Brad E. regarding restructuring adversary discovery	0.10	49.50
12/27/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.40	140.00
12/28/23	CRR	B190 A109 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Appear for/attend Appearance at virtual hearing	0.50	397.50
12/28/23	CRR	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review order on dismissal and revocation of derivative standing and e-mails regarding same	2.10	1,669.50
12/28/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other		

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		outside counsel) Correspondence from Michael E. to Natalie R. regarding PIQ resolution process	0.10	49.50
12/28/23	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review sampling order and coordinate submission to court	0.50	247.50
12/28/23	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and analysis of dismissal opinion and derivative standing opinion; office conferences with R. Rayburn, M. Tomsic regarding same; telephone conferences with Brad E. regarding same	2.80	1,386.00
12/28/23	JRM	B190 A109 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Appear for/attend Telephone conference with client reps, co-counsel regarding opinions, analysis and options	0.50	247.50
12/28/23	MLT	B190 A109 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Appear for/attend Attended Teams omnibus hearing	0.80	280.00
12/28/23	MLT	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Meeting with J. Miller regarding opinions	0.30	105.00
12/29/23	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Call from Brad E. regarding appeal issue and multiple		

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		correspondence with M. Tomsic, Brad E. regarding same	0.40	198.00
12/29/23	JRM	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence from R. Rayburn		
		regarding appeal issue	0.10	49.50
12/29/23	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research		
		regarding appeal issue	0.50	175.00
12/29/23	міл	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review various e-mails regarding sampling order, case issues, J. Whitley opinions	0.60	210.00
12/29/23	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review,		
		analyzed J. Whitley opinions issued	1.20	420.00
		Total for LITIGATION:	16.30	\$7,587.00
		Total fees	36.70	\$18,471.50
	Costs	Advanced		Amount
12/12/23		- Other PACER - Computerized Court ds Access Charges:		51.40

01/04/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49573

Re: ASB-12739487

advanced \$51.40	Total costs
advanced \$18,522.90	Total current fees/costs
s amount \$56,887.36	Please pay thi

Summary	Hours	Rate	Amount
CRR	7.80	795.00	6,201.00
JRM	15.50	495.00	7,672.50
MLT	12.60	350.00	4,410.00
TNL	0.80	235.00	188.00

Trust Balance	Forward	\$257.08
Current Trust	Balance	\$257.08

Payment is due upon receipt of invoice

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 71 of 111

EXHIBIT A-4

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 72 of 111

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
1200 CARILLON, 227 WEST TRADE STREET
CHARLOTTE, NORTH CAROLINA 28202-1675
TELEPHONE: (704)334-0891
FAX: (704) 377-1897

MONTHLY COMPENSATION STATEMENT

TO: See **Notice Parties**, attached

FROM: Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

DATE: March 1, 2024

RE: Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al.

Case No. 20-30608 (Jointly Administered)

United States Bankruptcy Court

Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A. ("RC&D") hereby submits this Monthly Compensation Statement for compensation and reimbursement as Counsel for Aldrich Pump LLC, et. al. (the "Debtors"), for the period of **January 1, 2024 through January 31, 2024**. During this period, RC&D incurred total fees in the amount of \$39,386.50 which amount is billed at its usual and customary hourly rates and actual and necessary out-of-pocket disbursements of \$763.85 for a total of \$40,150.35. Pursuant to the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the "Administrative Order") entered on July 15, 2020 in these cases, retained professionals may request ninety (90%) percent of their fees and one hundred (100%) of their expenses at this time. Accordingly, RC&D request payment from the Debtor of \$36,211.70 calculated as follows:

Attached hereto and incorporated as part of this Monthly Compensation Statement are RC&D's billing sheets for the period of January 1, 2024 through January 31, 2024.

<u>Cumulative Holdback Analysis</u>: October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024: \$9,617.60.

Professional Summary of Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.

January 1, 2024 through January 31, 2024

<u>NAME</u>	HOURS	<u>RATE</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
C. Richard Rayburn, Jr. (SH) 8.90	\$795.00	\$ 7,075.50
John R. Miller, Jr. (SH)	45.00	\$525.00	\$ 23,625.00
G. Kirk Hardymon (SH)	3.40	\$440.00	\$ 1,496.00
Ross R. Fulton (SH)	.70	\$440.00	\$ 308.00
Matthew L. Tomsic (SH)	13.80	\$375.00	\$ 5,175.00
Ashley B. Oldfield (A)	1.80	\$335.00	\$ 603.00
Tiffany N. Lindsay (P)	4.60	\$240.00	\$ <u>1,104.00</u>
			\$ 39,386.50

COSTS AND EXPENSES to date for January 1, 2023 – January 31, 2024:

Hearing Transcript (12-28-23 Hearing)	\$ 133.75
Lexis	\$ 26.70
Pacer	\$ 3.40
Filing Fee	\$ 300.00
Filing Fee	\$ <u>300.00</u>
	\$ 763.85

Categories	Billable Hours	Billable Amount
Case Admin.	32.60	\$ 17,294.50
Claims Admin.	1.30	\$ 487.50
Fee Proceedings	2.40	\$ 970.50
Litigation	41.90	\$ <u>20,634.00</u>
_		\$ 39,386.50

NOTICE PARTIES (via electronic mail)

U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator

Attn: Shelley K. Abel

feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov

Aldrich Pump LLC Murray Boiler LLC Attn: Allan Tananbaum atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Counsel to the Debtors

Brad B. Erens, Esq.
Mark A. Cody, Esq.
Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq.
Jones Day
bberens@jonesday.com
macody@jonesday.com
ccahow@jonesday.com

Trane Technologies Company LLC Trane U.S. Inc.

Philip D. Amoa
Anthony Bartell, Esq.
Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq.
Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq.
McCarter & English, LLP
pamoa@mccarter.com
abartell@mccarter.com
ppavlick@mccarter.com
gmascitti@mccarter.com

Stacy C. Cordes, Esq. Cordes Law, PLLC stacy@cordes-law.com

Asbestos Claimants Committee

Kevin Maclay kmaclay@capdale.com

Todd Phillips tphillips@capdale.com

Natalie Ramsey NRamsey@rc.com

Davis Wright

<u>DWright@rc.com</u>

Future Claimants Representative

Jonathan Guy Debra Felder Orrick Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP jguy@orrick.com dfelder@orrick.com

A. Cotten Wright
Grier, Wright, Martinez, PA
cwright@grierlaw.com

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main

Document Page 75 of 111 RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200

Charlotte, NC 28202-1672

Telephone (704) 334-0891 Fax (704) 377-1897 FEDERAL I.D. #: 56-1597966

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC c/o Allan Tananbaum, Chief Legal Officer atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

Re: ASB-12739487

Balance Forward

\$38,753.20

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
CASE ADM/E	US OP:			
01/02/24	jrm	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Correspondence regarding November MOR's, review, coordinate filing and service	0.10	52 .50
01/02/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review Aldrich 12/28/23 hearing transcript and circulate	0.30	157.50
01/02/24	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Review November MOR drafts, multiple correspondence regarding questions and comments on same; review final revised and coordinate filing and service of same	0.70	367.50
01/02/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review prior court order regarding settlement proceeds and correspondence with Mark C., Amanda J. regarding same	0.30	157.50
01/02/24	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mail correspondence regarding MORs	0.30	112.50
01/02/24	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		filing MOR for Aldrich in 20-30608; prepping and filing MOR for Murray in 20-30609; forward filed copies to KCC for service; circulating filed copies	0.50	120.00
01/03/24	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Conference call with co-counsel and clients regarding recent developments	1.00	795.00
01/03/24	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Participate in call with clients and co-counsel regarding case options and next steps; office conference with R. Rayburn regarding same / follow up	1.20	630.00
01/03/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to clients and co-counsel regarding upcoming issues impacting case	0.10	52.50
01/04/24	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding strategic options for upcoming case issues	0.50	262.50
01/04/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Telephone conference with Brad E. regarding upcoming hearing and possible filings; review Court calendar and respond regarding same	0.30	157.50
01/05/24	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Conference call with co-counsel and review order	1.10	874.50

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/05/24	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Participate in call with co-counsel and clients and multiple correspondence follow up with Brad E. regarding same	1.40	735.00
01/05/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Further correspondence with Brad E. regarding February hearing and appeal issues	0.20	105.00
01/08/24	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Draft e-mail to Court regarding special setting for appeal issues hearing and January omnibus and correspondence with Anya H. regarding same	0.70	367.50
01/08/24	JRM	B110 A103 - Case administration - Draft/revise Draft notice of cancellation of January 25th hearing	0.10	52.50
01/08/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review analysis relevant to options for case	0.20	105.00
01/09/24	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call with co-counsel	0.70	556.50
01/09/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Brad E. regarding 2/9 hearing	0.10	52.50
01/09/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Analysis of issues potentially impacting case	0.30	157.50

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/09/24	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Prepare for and attend WIP call with co-counsel and e-mail follow up information to Brad E. regarding same	1.20	630.00
01/09/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Brad E. regarding ACC proposal for briefing direct certification	0.10	52.50
01/09/24	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Participated in WIP call	0.80	300.00
01/10/24	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) E-mails with T. Lindsay regarding hearing cancellation notice	0.20	105.00
01/10/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Continued analysis of upcoming issues potentially impacting case	0.20	105.00
01/10/24	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS for DI 2045 in 20-30608; prepping and filing COS for DI 2048 in 20-30608; prepping and filing COS for DI 2051 in 20-30608; prepping and filing COS for DI 118 in 20-30609; forwarding filed copies to KCC	0.40	96.00
01/11/24	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing notice of cancellation of January 25, 2024 hearing; circulating filed copy; forwarding		
		to KCC for service	0.30	72.00

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/12/24	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Multiple correspondence regarding filing and service of notice of cancellation	0.10	52 .50
01/16/24	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Prepare for WIP call and WIP call with co-counsel	0.60	477.00
01/16/24	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review updated WIP report and participate in WIP call	0.80	420.00
01/16/24	MLT	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review WIP report	0.20	75.00
01/16/24	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Participated in WIP call	0.50	187.50
01/17/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mails between J. Miller and M. Cody regarding resolution of issue through filing Pro Hac Vice motions in District Court	0.10	44.00
01/17/24	GKH	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail between J. Miller and T. Lindsay regarding preparation of Pro Hac Vice motions	0.10	44.00
01/17/24	GKH	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mails between K. Godin and T. Lindsay regarding District Court forms and payment of fees	0.10	44.00

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/17/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mail co-counsel and clients regarding recent development potentially impacting case	0.10	52.50
01/17/24	TNL	B190 A110 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Manage data/files Drafting Pro Hac motion for Mark Cody and Amanda Johnson for 24-CV-00042; Pro Hacs to J. Miller for review	0.50	120.00
01/18/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review M. Tomsic analysis of recent developments potentially impacting case and correspondence with M. Tomsic regarding same; correspondence to clients and co-counsel regarding same	0.30	157.50
01/18/24	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence with T. Lindsay regarding upcoming hearing	0.10	52.50
01/18/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review draft Pro Hac motions for Johnson and Cody	0.10	52.50
01/19/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Debbie F. regarding hearing on certification requests	0.10	52.50
01/19/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Amanda J. regarding 2015.3 reports	0.10	52.50
01/22/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mails between M. Cody and J. Miller regarding deadline for Pro Hac Vice motions and status of drafts	0.10	44.00
01/22/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Correspondence with Amanda J. regarding 2015.3 report; review same and coordinate filing and service	0.30	157.50
01/22/24	JRM	B110 A103 - Case administration - Draft/revise Correspondence with Mark C. regarding Pro Hac applications for District Court and revise drafts	0.10	5 2.50
01/22/24	JRM	B110 A106 - Case administration - Communicate (with client) Correspondence from Robb S. regarding omnibus hearing dates, investigate and respond	0.20	105.00
01/22/24	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing 2015.3 report; forwarding filed copy to KCC for service; circulating filed copy	0.30	72.00
01/22/24	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing COS for DI 2066; forwarding filed copy to KCC	0.20	48.00
01/23/24	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call memo and WIP call co-counsel	0.80	636.00

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/23/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mail from T. Lindsay to M. Cody with draft copies of pro hac vice motion and affidavit	0.10	44.00
01/23/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Exchange e-mails with M. Cody, J. Miller and K. Godin regarding execution of pro hac vice motions	0.20	88.00
01/23/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mails from A. Johnson and M. Cody regarding approval of pro hac vice motions and affidavits	0.10	44.00
01/23/24	GKH	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail from J. Miller regarding filing and deadline	0.10	44.00
01/23/24	GKH	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Conference with T. Lindsay regarding review of pro hac vice motions; review draft motions approved by Ms. Johnson and M. Cody; conference with J. Miller and T. Lindsay regarding requirement of consultation with opposing counsel	0.30	132.00
01/23/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mail from J. Miller to T. Waldrep, J. Lanik and C. Rogers requesting consent for pro hac vice motions	0.10	44.00

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/23/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence regarding Pro Hac applications for District Court	0.20	105.00
01/23/24	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding developments potentially impacting case	0.20	105.00
01/23/24	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Review supplemental JD disclosure and coordinate service and filing	0.10	52.50
01/23/24	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review WIP report and participate in WIP call with co-counsel; office conference with R. Rayburn regarding same; follow up with Brad E. regarding same; draft correspondence to co-counsel regarding same	1.80	945.00
01/23/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) E-mail opposing counsel regarding consent to Pro Hacs	0.10	52.50
01/23/24	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call	0.60	225.00
01/23/24	TNL	B110 A110 - Case administration - Manage data/files Prepping and filing Erens fourth supplemental declaration; forwarding filed copy to KCC for service; circulating filed copy	0.30	72.00

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/24/24	GKH	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Exchange e-mail with J. Miller regarding seeking consent to Pro Hac motion	0.10	44.00
01/24/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mails between J. Miller and C. Rogers regarding consent to motion	0.10	44.00
01/24/24	GKH	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Exchange e-mails with T. Lindsay regarding approval to file Pro Hac Vice motions	0.10	44.00
01/24/24	GKH	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review confirmation from Court that Pro Hac Vice motions have been filed and e-mails between T. Lindsay, M. Cody and A. Johnson regarding same	0.20	88.00
01/24/24	GKH	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Exchange e-mails with J. Miller regarding service of orders	0.10	44.00
01/24/24	JRM	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review analysis of recent developments potentially impacting case	0.10	52.50
01/24/24	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) E-mail K. Hardymon regarding Pro Hacs and e-mail Tom W. regarding same	0.20	105.00
01/26/24	CRR	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		counsel) Prepare for WIP call and WIP call with clients and co-counsel	0.80	636.00
01/26/24	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Participate in WIP call with client reps and co-counsel	0.70	367.50
01/26/24	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research and send		
01/29/24	JRM	requested information to Allan T. B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Amanda J. regarding various	0.30	157.50
01/29/24	MLT	administrative issues B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mail	0.10	52.50
		correspondence	0.20	75.00
01/30/24	CRR	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review e-mail from client regarding WIP; prepare for WIP call and WIP call co-counsel	0.90	715.50
01/30/24	JRM	B110 A109 - Case administration - Appear for/attend Review updated WIP report and participate in WIP call	1.00	525.00
01/30/24	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Review draft MRS's for December 2023 and coordinate filing and service	0.30	157.50
01/30/24	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research on upcoming case		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		issues	0.30	157.50
01/30/24	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review collective RCD comments to response to direct certification motions	0.10	37.50
01/30/24	MLT	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) WIP call	0.70	262.50
01/30/24	TNL	B210 A110 - Business operations - Manage Data/Files Prepping and filing MOR for Aldrich in 20-30608; prepping and filing MOR for Murray in 20-30609; forwarding filed copies to KCC for service; circulating filed copies	0.30	72.00
01/31/24	CRR	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze E-mails co-counsel and clients regarding hearing and objection; review filings	0.40	318.00
01/31/24	GKH	B110 A104 - Case administration - Review/analyze Review order granting Pro Hac Vice motions for M. Cody and A. Johnson	0.10	44.00
01/31/24	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence with T. Lindsay, R. Fulton regarding Pro Hac orders and compliance issues, to Mark C. and Amanda J. regarding same	0.30	157.50
01/31/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding quarterly fee payment, coordinate filing and payment of quarterly		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount			
		fees	0.20	105.00			
01/31/24	JRM	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with M. Tomsic regarding upcoming case issues	0.10	52.50			
01/31/24	JRM	B110 A107 - Case administration - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence to client reps and co-counsel regarding hearing logistics	0.10	52 .50			
		realizing rogretures	0.10	32.50			
01/31/24	JRM	B110 A102 - Case administration - Research Research for upcoming issues in case	0.90	472.50			
01/31/24	JRM	B110 A108 - Case administration - Communicate (Other external) Review quarterly fee statements and coordinate filing and service	0.40	210.00			
01/31/24	MLT	B110 A105 - Case administration - Communicate (in firm) Meeting with J. Miller regarding case issues	0.10	37.50			
01/31/24	TNL	B210 A110 - Business operations - Manage Data/Files Forwarding quarterly fee statement for					
		Aldrich & Murray to KCC for service	0.10	24.00			
		Total for CASE ADM/BUS OP:	32.60	\$17,294.50			
CLAIMS ADM	CLAIMS ADMIN:						
01/12/24	MLT	B310 A104 - Claims administration and objections - Review/analyze Analyzed stipulation regarding					
		amended claims, other options	1.30	487.50			
		Total for CLAIMS ADMIN:	1.30	\$487.50			

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount			
FEE PROCEEDINGS:							
01/02/24	jrm	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence regarding RCD monthly comp request for November 2023, review final draft	0.30	157.50			
01/02/24	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Brief review ACC professional fee requests	0.10	52.50			
01/02/24	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Begin preparing RCD monthly comp request for December 2023	0.20	105.00			
01/02/24	MLT	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Prepared, circulated fee statements	0.40	150.00			
01/02/24	TNL	B160 A110 - Fee/employment applications - Manage data/files Finalizing RCD monthly compensation statement for November 2023; compiling exhibit; forwarding to M. Tomsic for circulation	0.20	48.00			
01/03/24	JRM	B160 A103 - Fee/employment applications - Draft/revise Continue preparation of RCD monthly comp request for December 2023	0.20	105.00			
01/04/24	TNL	B170 A103 - Fee/employment objections - Draft/revise Drafting RCD monthly compensation statement for December 2023; forwarding to					

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		J. Miller for review	0.50	120.00
01/09/24	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review ACC professional fee requests	0.10	52.50
01/26/24	JRM	B160 A104 - Fee/employment applications - Review/analyze Review draft RCD monthly comp request for December 2024	0.10	52.50
01/29/24	JRM	B160 A107 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding RCD December comp request	0.10	52.50
01/30/24	MLT	B160 A108 - Fee/employment applications - Communicate (other external) Circulated fee statements	0.20	75.00
		Total for FEE PROCEEDINGS:	2.40	\$970.50
LITIGATION	:			
01/02/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review multiple analyses of dismissal opinion and correspondence regarding same	0.30	157.50
01/02/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review draft estimation-related motion	0.20	105.00
01/03/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) -		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Review/analyze Review Dave T. memorandum on appeal question	0.20	105.00
01/03/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding appeal issue and correspondence with Brad E. regarding same; multiple correspondence among Brad E., C. Thompson, Jonathan R. regarding same	0.40	210.00
01/03/24	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.30	112.50
01/03/24	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review, analyzed order regarding dismissal	1.20	450.00
01/04/24	ABO	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review of order denying motions to dismiss case	1.60	536.00
01/05/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review analysis of dismissal opinion and correspondence with Brad E. regarding same	0.30	157.50
01/05/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review DC order on Manville trust discovery; review procedural issues from prior trust discovery litigation and correspondence with Morgan H. regarding same	0.90	472.50
01/05/24	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.30	112.50
01/08/24	JRM	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Rayburn regarding upcoming hearing and appeal issues	0.10	52.50
01/08/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Brad E. regarding timing of hearing on appeal issues	0.10	52.50
01/09/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail from J. Miller regarding approval for filing motions; conference with M. Elvington regarding same	0.10	44.00
01/09/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) -		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Amanda J. regarding issues relating to dismissal opinion, analysis of same	0.30	157.50
01/10/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding briefing certification motions	0.10	52.50
01/11/24	ABO	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Read brief regarding interlocutory appeal	0.20	67.00
01/11/24	CRR	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review motions for leave and for certification	0.30	238.50
01/11/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and analysis of Semian notice of appeal, motion for leave to appeal, motion for direct cert and circulate to clients and co-counsel; multiple correspondence regarding same	1.60	840.00
01/11/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and circulate ACC notice of appeal of dismissal opinion	0.10	52.50

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/11/24	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.60	225.00
01/12/24	CRR	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review certification motion	0.20	159.00
01/12/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail from J. Miller regarding appeal	0.10	44.00
01/12/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding appeal question and analysis of same	0.30	157.50
01/12/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review ACC dismissal appeal docket and correspondence with clients and co-counsel regarding same	0.30	157.50
01/12/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review ACC motion for leave to appeal and memo in support	1.30	682.50

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/16/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) E-mail from J. Miller regarding filing motions in District Court; conference with J. Miller regarding same	0.20	88.00
01/16/24	GKH	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review e-mails between J. Miller and C. Smith regarding revisions to draft	0.10	44.00
01/16/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail from J. Miller regarding status of approvals and filing	0.10	44.00
01/16/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review motion to defer briefing in ACC dismissal appeal and multiple correspondence to coordinate party review and approval and filing issues	1.10	577.50
01/17/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail from J. Miller regarding notices referencing Local Rule 83.1; review local rules; conference with J. Miller regarding same	0.30	132.00
		83.1; review local rules; conference with J. Miller	0.30	132.0

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/17/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mails between J. Miller, K. Godin and M. Elvington regarding filing joint motions to defer	0.10	44.00
01/17/24	GKH	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review confirmations from Court that joint motions to defer were properly filed	0.10	44.00
01/17/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mail from M. Elvington with filed copies of motions to defer and e-mail from J. Miller to counsel circulating same	0.10	44.00
01/17/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Glenn T. regarding agreed motion suspending briefing in dismissal appeal	0.10	52.50
01/17/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review agreed motion for Maune clients suspending briefing on dismissal appeal and multiple correspondence regarding same, coordinate filing;		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		review as-filed and circulate to co-counsel and opposing counsel	0.90	472.50
01/17/24	JRM	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Correspondence to K. Hardymon regarding District Court requirements for out of state attorneys; office conference regarding same and e-mail Mark C. regarding same	0.60	315.00
01/17/24	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review, analyzed appeal pleadings regarding dismissal opinion	2.30	862.50
01/18/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Correspondence regarding ACC request for certification and review same; review notice of deficient filing	1.10	577.50
01/22/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Morgan H. regarding Manville matching claimant nonresponse, order, transfer, etc.	0.10	52.50
01/22/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Multiple		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		correspondence regarding issues related to responses to restructuring adversary rogs, review same; review further revised draft	0.60	315.00
01/22/24	JRM	B190 A109 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Appear for/attend Participate in call with co-counsel and client reps regarding restructuring adversary discovery responses; brief office conference with R. Rayburn regarding same	1.30	682 .50
01/22/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Begin review of draft responses to restructuring adversary requests for production	0.40	210.00
01/23/24	GKH	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Review e-mails from J. Miller regarding appeal issues	0.10	44.00
01/23/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review draft responses to request for production of documents in restructuring adversaries and e-mail comments to Dave T.	1.30	682.50
01/24/24	GKH	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) -		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		Review/analyze Review orders granting appellants and appellees to defer briefing; review e-mail from J. Miller to counsel transmitting orders	0.10	44.00
01/24/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Call with Rob C. regarding record on appeal for dismissal appeal; correspondence with co-counsel and Rob C. regarding same	1.10	577.50
01/24/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Review and circulate orders granting motion to defer briefing in dismissal appeals	0.10	52.50
01/24/24	TNL	B190 A110 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Manage data/files Prepping and filing Pro Hac in 24-00042 for Mark Cody; prepping and filing Pro Hac 24-00042 for Amanda Johnson; paying Pro Hac Fees; circulating filed copies	0.30	72.00
01/25/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence with Morgan H. regarding record on appeal issues	0.50	262.50

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/25/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Correspondence from Dave T. regarding final discovery responses and review same	0.90	472.50
01/26/24	CRR	B190 A103 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Draft/revise Review and revise objection	0.80	636.00
01/26/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and comment on draft response to requests for certification to Fourth Circuit; analysis of issues related to arguments in draft	1.80	945.00
01/26/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and circulate as-filed R. 8009(f) motion, designations of record on appeal	0.50	262.50
01/29/24	CRR	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review and comment on draft and e-mail regarding same	0.80	636.00
01/29/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Correspondence regarding dismissal record on appeal and		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		additions, deadlines, etc.	0.10	52.50
01/29/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Further review and analysis, finalize comments on, response to requests for cert of direct appeal on dismissal order; synthesize R. Rayburn and M. Tomsic comments; multiple correspondence regarding same	3.00	1,575.00
01/29/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review docket entry in Cogburn anonymity appeal and correspondence with Morgan H. regarding same	0.20	105.00
01/29/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review issues related to record on appeal	0.20	105.00
01/29/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review proposed order on R. 8009(f) motion and correspondence with Morgan H. regarding same	0.10	52 .50
01/29/24	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Review, edit response to motions for direct certification	1.80	675.00
01/29/24	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested		

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
		matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review, analyzed motions for direct certification	1.20	450.00 °
01/30/24	CRR	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review objection and e-mails regarding same	0.50	397.50
01/30/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review revised response to ACC/Maune certification requests and office conference with R. Rayburn regarding same; correspondence with T. Lindsay regarding same	0.60	315.00
01/30/24	JRM	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Office conference with R. Fulton regarding record on appeal	0.30	157.50
01/30/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Calls, e-mail to Rob Cox and Tom W. regarding record on appeal extension	0.50	262.50
01/30/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Begin review revised affirmative discovery in restructuring adversaries	0.50	262.50

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/30/24	MLT	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review Maune, ACC appeal pleadings regarding motion to dismiss	0.40	150.00
01/30/24	MLT	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Legal research regarding case issues	0.30	112.50
01/30/24	RRF	B190 A105 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (in firm) Conference with J. Miller regarding extension of time for counter-designations	0.20	88.00
01/31/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Review revised response to certification requests	0.20	105.00
01/31/24	JRM	B190 A107 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other outside counsel) Multiple correspondence with Rob C. and Morgan H., R. Fulton regarding deferral of filing counter-designations on dismissal appeal	0.50	262.50
01/31/24	JRM	B190 A104 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Review/analyze Continue review of revised discovery in restructuring adversaries	0.30	157.50

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Atty	Services Rendered	Hours	Amount
01/31/24	JRM	B190 A108 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Communicate (other external) Review final version of response to certification and coordinate filing and service and e-mail Dave T. regarding same	0.60	315.00
01/31/24	RRF	B190 A103 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Draft/revise Draft motion to extend time to file counter	0.00	313.00
		designations	0.40	176.00
01/31/24	RRF	B190 A102 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Research Review rules of bankruptcy procedure for motion to extend time	0.10	44.00
01/31/24	TNL	B190 A110 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Manage data/files Downloading Pro Hac order for Mark Cody and Amanda Johnson; circulating entered order	0.30	72.00
01/31/24	TNL	B190 A110 - Other contested matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions) - Manage data/files Prepping and filing objection to motions to certify; forwarding to KCC for service; circulating filed copy	0.40	96.00
		Total for LITIGATION:	41.90	\$20,634.00

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

	Total fees	78.20	\$39,386.50
,			
	Costs Advanced		Amount
01/02/24	E115 - Deposition transcripts Janice Russell Transcripts: Transcript of hearing held on 12/28/23		133.75
01/04/24	E124 - Other LEXIS - Computerized Legal Research for this billing period:		26.70
01/17/24	E124 - Other PACER - Computerized Court Records Access Charges:		3.40
01/24/24	E112 - Court fees North Carolina Western District Court: Filing Fee / Pro Hac for Mark Cody		300.00
01/24/24	E112 - Court fees North Carolina Western District Court: Filing Fee / Pro Hac for Amanda Johnson		300.00
	Total costs advance	ed	\$763.85
	Total current fees/costs advance	ed	\$40,150.35
	Please pay this amour	nt	\$78,903.55

Summary	Hours	Rate	Amount
CRR	8.90	795.00	7,075.50
JRM	45.00	525.00	23,625.00
GKH	3.40	440.00	1,496.00
RRF	0.70	440.00	308.00
MLT	13.80	375.00	5,175.00
ABO	1.80	335.00	603.00
TNL	4.60	240.00	1,104.00

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 105 of 111 Page 31

RAYBURN COOPER & DURHAM, P.A.

02/06/24

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Our file number 5832-004/JRM/JMR Invoice number 49718

Re: ASB-12739487

Trust Balance Forward \$257.08

Current Trust Balance \$257.08

Payment is due upon receipt of invoice

EXHIBIT B

October 1, 2023 – January 31, 2024

CUMULATIVE COMPENSATION SUMMARY BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category	Total Hours For The Period	Total Hours From The Petition Date	Total Fees For The Period	Total Fees From The Petition Date
Asset Transactions	0.00	8.90	\$ 0.00	\$ 3,680.00
Case Administration/Bus. Op.	99.90	1,595.50	\$ 50,489.50	\$742,553.50
Claims Admin.	1.80	88.70	\$ 683.00	\$ 39,508.50
Fee Proc.	17.60	235.80	\$ 6,705.00	\$ 80,608.50
Financing/Relief	0.60	7.00	\$ 253.50	\$ 3,007.00
Litigation	78.90	2,170.70	\$ 37,649.00	\$ 981,514.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.80	128.70	\$ 396.00	\$ 56,379.00
Total	199.60	4,235.30	\$96,176.00	\$1,907,250.50

EXHIBIT C CUMULATIVE EXPENSE SUMMARY

Expense Category	l Expenses the Period	otal Expenses the Petition Date
In-house duplicating	\$ 0.00	\$ 852.73
Computer Research – Lexis	\$ 30.96	\$ 3,822.48
Telephone – Conference Calls	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00
Working Meals	\$ 0.00	\$ 25,337.79
U.S. Bankruptcy Court Fees	\$ 600.00	\$ 9,244.96
Transcripts	\$ 133.75	\$ 16,839.46
PACER – Computerized Court Access Records	\$ 97.00	\$ 4,702.00
Courier Fee	\$ 0.00	\$ 16.00
Postage	\$ 0.00	\$ 23.40
Total	\$ 861.71	\$ 60,838.82

EXHIBIT D SUMMARY OF PRIOR FEE APPLICATIONS

Application <u>Date</u>	Period <u>Covered</u>	Fees <u>Requested/Allowed</u>	Expenses Requested/Allowed
11/9/20	June 17, 2020 – September 30, 2020	\$250,348.50	\$10,811.84
3/12/21	October 1, 2020 – January 31, 2021	\$203,090.00	\$ 2,490.98
7/9/21	February 1, 2021 – May 31, 2021	\$234,858.00	\$ 6,063.44
11/9/21	June 1, 2021 – September 30, 2021	\$123,181.50	\$ 674.70
3/11/22	October 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022	\$127,889.00	\$ 6,938.62
7/11/22	February 1, 2022 – May 31, 2022	\$259,207.00	\$ 7,334.90
11/9/22	June 1, 2022 – September 30, 2022	\$136,384.00	\$ 4,422.50
3/13/23	October 1, 2022 – January 31, 2023	\$136,646.50	\$ 6,155.24
7/10/23	February 1, 2023 – May 31, 2023	\$202,976.50	\$ 4,746.96
11/9/23	June 1, 2023 – September 30, 2023	\$136,494.50	\$10,362.48

EXHIBIT E

PROFESSIONALS/PARAPROFESSIONALS INCLUDED IN THIS APPLICATION

October 1, 2023 – January 31, 2024

Name	Title	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Amount
C. Richard Rayburn, Jr. (CRR)	Partner	795.00	14.40	\$ 11.448.00
C. Richard Rayburn, Jr. (CRR)	Partner	795.00	8.90	\$ 7,075.50
John R. Miller, Jr. (JRM)	Partner	495.00	64.60	\$ 31,977.00
John R. Miller, Jr. (JRM)	Partner	525.00	45.00	\$ 23,625.00
G. Kirk Hardymon (GKH)	Partner	440.00	3.40	\$ 1,496.00
Ross R. Fulton (RRF)	Partner	425.00	1.40	\$ 595.00
Ross R. Fulton (RRF)	Partner	440.00	.70	\$ 308.00
Matthew L. Tomsic (MLT)	Partner	350.00	25.00	\$ 8,750.00
Matthew L. Tomsic (MLT)	Partner	375.00	13.80	\$ 5,175.00
Ashley B. Oldfield (ABO)	Associate	295.00	.8	\$ 236.00
Ashley B. Oldfield (ABO)	Associate	335.00	1.80	\$ 603.00
Rachel E. Brinson (REB)	Associate	295.00	3.9	\$ 1,150.50
Tiffany N. Lindsay (TNL)	Paralegal	235.00	10.80	\$ 2,538.00
Tiffany N. Lindsay (TNL)	Paralegal	240.00	4.60	\$ 1,104.00
Julia L. Robinson (JLR)	Paralegal	190.00	.50	\$ 95.00
TOTAL			199.60	\$ 96,176.00

EXHIBIT F

BACKGROUND SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONALS

- C. RICHARD RAYBURN, JR., born Columbia, Tennessee, March 27, 1947; admitted to bar, 1974, North Carolina, U. S. Tax Court; U. S. District Court, Western and Middle Districts of North Carolina and U. S. Court of Appeals, Fourth Circuit. Education: University of Tennessee (B. S., with honors, 1969); Duke University (J. D. 1974). Omicron Delta Kappa; Order of the Coif; Sigma Pi Sigma; Phi Delta Phi. Research and Managing Editor, Duke Law Journal, 1973-1974. Member: Mecklenburg County, North Carolina (Member, Bankruptcy Section Council, 1993-1996) and American Bar Associations; The North Carolina State Bar. Practice Areas: Banking Law; Finance; Corporate Law, Securities, Mergers and Acquisitions, Business Bankruptcy Law. Email: rrayburn@rcdlaw.net
- JOHN R. MILLER, JR., born Hampton, Virginia, December 22, 1975. Admitted to bar, 2002, North Carolina, U. S. District Court, Western District of North Carolina. Education: University of Virginia (B.A., 1997); Wake Forest University School of Law (J.D., 2002). Member, 1999-2002 and Chief Justice, 2001-2002, Phi Alpha Delta. Author, "Does E-Commerce Spell the End of Geography-Based Trademark Analysis?" 2002 Wake Forest Intell. Prop. L.J. 8, Posted May 10, 2002. Member: Mecklenburg County, North Carolina and American Bar Associations; North Carolina State Bar. Practice Areas: Bankruptcy, Business Workouts, Financial Restructures, Commercial Law, Commercial Real Estate. Email: jmiller@rcdlaw.net
- G. KIRKLAND HARDYMON, born Charlotte, North Carolina, April 7, 1964; Admitted to bar, 1992, North Carolina and U.S. District Court, Western and Middle Districts of North Carolina and U.S. Court of Appeals, 4th Circuit. Education: Appalachian State University (B.S., 1986); Wake Forest University (J.D., Cum Laude, 1992). Member, Wake Forest Law Review, 1990-1992, Law Clerk to the Honorable Frank W. Bullock, Jr., Chief Judge, U.S. District Court, Middle District of North Carolina, 1992-1993. Member: Mecklenburg County, North Carolina and American Bar Association; North Carolina State Bar, William Bobbitt American Inn of Courts. Practice Areas: General Civil Litigation, Complex Business Litigation, Business Ownership Issues or Disputes. Email: khardymon@rcdlaw.net
- ROSS R. FULTON, born Portland, Maine, May 21, 1978. Admitted to bar, 2003, North Carolina and U.S. District Court, Western, Eastern and Middle Districts of North Carolina, U.S. Court of Appeals 4th Circuit. Education: State University of New York, College at Genesco (B.A., Dean's List, 2000); College of William and Mary Law School (J.D., 2003), Member, William & Mary Moot Court Team, 2002-2003. Member: Mecklenburg County, North Carolina and American Bar Associations; North Carolina State Bar; American Inn of Court. Practice Areas: General Civil Litigation, Complex Business Litigation. Email: rfulton@rcdlaw.net
- MATTHEW L. TOMSIC, born Greenville, N.C., January 23, 1987. Admitted to bar, 2017, North Carolina, U.S. District Court, Western District of North Carolina. Education: University of North Carolina at Chapel Hill (B.A. 2009); University of North Carolina School of Law (J.D. 2017). Member: Mecklenburg County, North Carolina, and American Bar Associations. North

Case 20-30608 Doc 2129 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 12:39:42 Desc Main Document Page 111 of 111

Carolina State Bar. Practice Areas: Bankruptcy, Business Law, Civil Litigation, Commercial Law. Email: mtomsic@rcdlaw.net

RACHEL E. BRINSON, born Charlotte, NC, November 24, 1994. Admitted to bar, 2020, North Carolina. Education: University of North Carolina at Chapel Hill (B.A., with distinction, 2017, J.D., 2020); Member, North Carolina Banking Institute Journal, 2018-2020, Managing Editor, 2019-2020. Judicial Intern to the Honorable Lucy N. Inman, North Carolina Court of Appeals. Member: Mecklenburg County Bar Association, North Carolina State Bar, and American Bar Association. Practice Areas: Bankruptcy, Business Law, Civil Litigation. Email: rbrinson@rcdlaw.net

ASHLEY B. OLDFIELD, born Venice, Florida, May 7, 1984. Admitted to bar, 2020, North Carolina. Education: Johnson University (B.S., Summa Cum Laude, 2005); Wake Forest University School of Law (J.D., High Honors, Order of the Coif, 2020). Member, Wake Forest Law Review, 2018-2020. Author: Pereira v. Sessions: *The Supreme Court's Call for Common Sense*, 55 Wake Forest L. Rev. 415 (2020). Member: Mecklenburg County and North Carolina Bar Associations. North Carolina State Bar. Practice Areas: Bankruptcy, Business Law, and Civil Litigation. Email: aoldfield@rcdlaw.net