Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 10:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 1 01 100 Docket #2134 Date Filed: 3/11/2024

### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., 1

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

SUMMARY OF ELEVENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF JONES DAY FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024

Name of Applicant: Jones Day

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: The above-captioned Debtors and Debtors in

Possession

Date of Order Approving Retention: June 19, 2020 (as of the Petition Date),

and amended on August 18, 2020

Petition Date: June 18, 2020

Period for which compensation and

reimbursement are sought:

October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024

Amount of Compensation sought as actual,

reasonable, and necessary:

\$2,928,040.00

Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as

actual, reasonable, and necessary:

\$5,433.80

Total Compensation Approved by Interim

Fee Order to Date:

\$33,065,030.95

Total Expenses Approved by Interim

Fee Order to Date:

\$242,890.75

Total Allowed Compensation Paid to Date: \$33,065,030.95

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.



Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 2 of 188

Total Allowed Expenses Paid to Date: \$242,890.75

Compensation Already Paid Pursuant to a \$978,649.80

Monthly Fee Statement But Not Yet Allowed:

Expenses Already Paid Pursuant to a Monthly \$5,418.90

Fee Statement But Not Yet Allowed:

This is a(n): X interim final application

Prior Monthly Fee Statements Submitted:

<b>Date Submitted</b>	Month Covered	Fees	Expenses
November 30, 2023	October 1, 2023 – October 31, 2023	\$577,227.50	\$2,963.40
January 2, 2024	November 1, 2023 – November 30, 2023	\$542,820.00	\$2,455.40
January 30, 2024	December 1, 2023 – December 31, 2023	\$554,545.00	\$0.00
March 1, 2024	January 1, 2024 – January 31, 2023	\$1,253,447.50	\$15.00

To date, no objections have been received to any prior monthly fee statements. The objection deadline relating to the Forty-Third Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period from January 1, 2024 Through January 31, 2024 has not yet passed.

### SUMMARY OF HOURS AND COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL<sup>2</sup>

Name of Professional	Position - Bar Year	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
R E BLAKE	PARTNER – 2011	\$1,300.00	1.50	\$1,950.00
C CAHOW	PARTNER – 2014	\$1,150.00	2.40	\$2,760.00
C CAHOW	PARTNER – 2014	\$1,275.00	13.10	\$16,702.50
M A CODY	PARTNER – 1996	\$1,475.00	318.60	\$469,935.00
M A CODY	PARTNER – 1996	\$1,575.00	139.00	\$218,925.00
M C CORCORAN	PARTNER – 2004	\$1,050.00	9.50	\$9,975.00
M C CORCORAN	PARTNER – 2004	\$1,150.00	1.50	\$1,725.00
B B ERENS	PARTNER – 1991	\$1,500.00	141.40	\$212,100.00
B B ERENS	PARTNER – 1991	\$1,625.00	104.00	\$169,000.00
N J FRANCISCO	PARTNER – 1999	\$1,600.00	0.30	\$480.00
G M GORDON	PARTNER – 1980	\$1,800.00	2.00	\$3,600.00
G M GORDON	PARTNER – 1980	\$2,000.00	2.80	\$5,600.00
M R HIRST	PARTNER – 2001	\$1,275.00	155.80	\$198,645.00
M R HIRST	PARTNER – 2001	\$1,375.00	47.70	\$65,587.50
J M JONES	PARTNER – 1986	\$1,600.00	1.20	\$1,920.00
J M JONES	PARTNER – 1986	\$1,750.00	0.50	\$875.00
T B LEWIS	PARTNER – 1987	\$1,350.00	48.60	\$65,610.00
T B LEWIS	PARTNER – 1987	\$1,450.00	14.90	\$21,605.00
C K MARSHALL	PARTNER – 2001	\$1,325.00	20.90	\$27,692.50
C K MARSHALL	PARTNER – 2001	\$1,450.00	22.00	\$31,900.00
J L PANZA	PARTNER – 2007	\$1,300.00	3.00	\$3,900.00
M R SEIDEN	OF COUNSEL – 1992	\$1,375.00	6.80	\$9,350.00
M R SEIDEN	OF COUNSEL – 1992	\$1,450.00	1.90	\$2,755.00
D S TORBORG	PARTNER – 1998	\$1,300.00	47.70	\$62,010.00
D S TORBORG	PARTNER – 1998	\$1,400.00	79.20	\$110,880.00
A ANDERSON	ASSOCIATE – 2020	\$700.00	24.00	\$16,800.00
C K CAHOW	ASSOCIATE – 2014	\$1,150.00	54.20	\$62,330.00
E M DOWLING	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$625.00	49.50	\$30,937.50
E M DOWLING	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$725.00	52.30	\$37,917.50
J GALE	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$625.00	46.80	\$29,250.00
J GALE	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$725.00	67.80	\$49,155.00
R HART	ASSOCIATE – 2021	\$700.00	57.20	\$40,040.00
R HART	ASSOCIATE – 2021	\$825.00	0.40	\$330.00
R H HOWELL	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$725.00	7.30	\$5,292.50

-

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Certain billing rates were increased in the ordinary course of Jones Day's business on January 1, 2024. Where applicable, professionals whose rates increased are listed twice in this chart – once with the applicable billing rate in effect for October through December 2023 and once with the new billing rate effective as of January 1, 2024.

Name of Professional	Position - Bar Year	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
A P JOHNSON	ASSOCIATE – 2018	\$800.00	262.50	\$210,000.00
A P JOHNSON	ASSOCIATE – 2018	\$925.00	212.20	\$196,285.00
J E LEITNER	ASSOCIATE – 2023	\$675.00	35.00	\$23,625.00
P LOMBARDI	ASSOCIATE – 2020	\$700.00	126.30	\$88,410.00
P LOMBARDI	ASSOCIATE – 2020	\$850.00	146.60	\$124,610.00
C P REDMOND	ASSOCIATE – 2019	\$850.00	0.40	\$340.00
C P REDMOND	ASSOCIATE – 2019	\$975.00	74.50	\$72,637.50
D C VILLALBA	ASSOCIATE – 2019	\$750.00	42.50	\$31,875.00
D C VILLALBA	ASSOCIATE – 2019	\$875.00	83.60	\$73,150.00
B J WIERENGA	ASSOCIATE – 2018	\$850.00	36.10	\$30,685.00
A R VILLAR	SR STAFF ATTORNEY – 2009	\$675.00	6.00	\$4,050.00
L C FISCHER	STAFF ATTORNEY – 1996	\$625.00	49.30	\$30,812.50
J B MAYS	PARALEGAL	\$425.00	7.30	\$3,102.50
C L SMITH	PARALEGAL	\$475.00	49.10	\$23,322.50
C L SMITH	PARALEGAL	\$525.00	32.50	\$17,062.50
L JOSEPH.	LEGAL SUPPORT	\$375.00	2.30	\$862.50
E PRATT	LEGAL SUPPORT	\$375.00	23.60	\$8,850.00
K A LOUIS	LIBRARIAN	\$250.00	3.30	\$825.00
TOTAL			2,738.90	\$2,928,040.00

# BLENDED RATE OF PROFESSIONALS – TOTAL

Professionals	Blended Rate	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Compensation</b>
Partners	\$1,446.48	1,177.60	\$1,703,377.50
Of Counsel	\$1,391.38	8.70	\$12,105.00
Associates	\$814.72	1,379.20	\$1,123,670.00
Staff Attorney	\$630.42	55.30	\$34,862.50
Paralegals & Legal Support	\$457.45	118.10	\$54,025.00
TOTAL	\$1,069.06	2,738.90	\$2,928,040.00

### **COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY**

Project Category	Total Hours	<b>Total Fees</b>
Case Administration and Business Operations	155.90	\$185,832.50
Creditor Inquiries	0.00	\$0.00
Meetings	0.00	\$0.00
Automatic Stay	1.90	\$2,397.50
Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	0.00	\$0.00
Use, Sale, Lease of Assets	0.00	\$0.00
Claims Administration	204.00	\$248,100.00
Court Hearings	16.20	\$20,447.50
General Corporate and Real Estate	76.80	\$101,765.00
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator Reporting	33.80	\$32,545.00
Tax Advice	0.00	\$0.00
Non-Working Travel	0.00	\$0.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	1,110.80	\$1,200,402.50
Asbestos Matters	857.60	\$928,010.00
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	196.10	\$153,895.00
Fee Application Preparation	85.80	\$54,645.00
TOTAL	2,738.90	\$2,928,040.00

# **EXPENSE SUMMARY**

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	<b>Total Expenses</b>
Printing	N/A	\$2,249.32
Travel – Air Fare	N/A	\$1,600.05
Travel – Food and Beverage Expenses	N/A	\$31.50
Travel – Hotel Charges	N/A	\$1,104.29
United Parcel Service Charges	N/A	\$448.64
TOTAL		\$5,433.80

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

-	
ln.	**
111	10

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., 1

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

# ELEVENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF JONES DAY FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024

Jones Day, counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (the "Debtors"), makes its eleventh interim application (the "Application") for allowance of compensation of \$2,928,040.00, and reimbursement of expenses of \$5,433.80 for the period from October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024 (the "Compensation Period") in accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals, dated July 15, 2020 [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order").

In support of this Application, Jones Day respectfully represents as follows:

#### Overview

- 1. Jones Day attorneys and paraprofessionals expended a total of 2,738.90 hours during the Compensation Period for which compensation is requested.
- 2. During the Compensation Period, Jones Day did not receive any payments or promises of payment from any source other than the Debtors for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with the matters covered by this Application.

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 9 of 188

No agreement or understanding exists between Jones Day or any third person for the sharing of compensation, except as allowed by section 504(b) of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code") and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules") with respect to the sharing of compensation between and among partners of Jones Day.

- Application are: (a) a schedule identifying all Jones Day professionals and paraprofessionals who have performed services in these chapter 11 cases during the Compensation Period, the capacities in which each individual is employed by Jones Day, the hourly billing rate charged by Jones Day for the services performed by each such individual, the aggregate number of hours expended in these cases during the Compensation Period for each professional and paraprofessional, the total fees billed therefor, and the year in which each professional was first licensed to practice law; (b) a summary of services by billing category for services rendered by Jones Day during the Compensation Period; and (c) a schedule summarizing, by category, the actual and necessary disbursements that Jones Day incurred during the Compensation Period in connection with the performance of professional services for the Debtors and for which it seeks reimbursement.
- 4. Attached hereto collectively as <u>Exhibit A</u> are Jones Day's itemized monthly time records for professionals and paraprofessionals performing services for the Debtors during the Compensation Period and Jones Day's itemized records detailing expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors during the Compensation Period.
- 5. This Application complies with sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Interim Compensation Order, the *Guidelines for Compensation*

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 10 of 188

and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals issued by this Court (the "Compensation Guidelines"), and the Rules of Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Western District of North Carolina (the "Local Rules").

#### **Background**

- 6. On June 18, 2020 (the "Petition Date"), the Debtors commenced their reorganization cases (the "Chapter 11 Cases") by filing voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. These Chapter 11 Cases have been consolidated for procedural purposes only and are being administered jointly. The Debtors are authorized to continue to manage their property and operate their businesses as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 7. On the Petition Date, the Debtors filed the <u>Ex Parte Application of</u> the Debtors for an Order Authorizing Them to Retain and Employ Jones Day as Counsel as of the Petition Date [Dkt. 20] (the "Retention Application"), by which the Debtors sought authority to retain and employ Jones Day as their counsel in the Chapter 11 Cases. On June 19, 2020, the Court entered an order [Dkt. 71] (the "Original Retention Order") authorizing the retention of Jones Day as the Debtors' counsel as of the Petition Date.
- 8. On July 7, 2020, the Court entered an order [Dkt. 147] appointing the official committee of asbestos personal injury claimants (the "Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee") in these Chapter 11 Cases. On October 14, 2020, the Court entered an order [Dkt. 389] appointing Joseph W. Grier, III as legal representative for future asbestos claimants in these Chapter 11 Cases (the "FCR").
- 9. The Debtors and the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee agreed to an amendment to the Original Retention Order to reserve certain rights of the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee. On August 18, 2020, the Court entered the amended retention order

agreed upon by the Debtors and the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee [Dkt. 264] (the "Jones Day Retention Order"), which superseded the Original Retention Order.

#### **Jurisdiction**

10. This Court has jurisdiction to consider this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b). Venue for this matter is proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1409.

#### **Summary of Services**

- appropriate to the administration of the Debtors' Chapter 11 Cases, as described in detail below.

  These services were in the best interests of the Debtors and other parties in interest.

  The compensation requested is commensurate with the complexity and nature of the issues and tasks involved.
- 12. All of the services for which compensation is requested hereunder were rendered at the request of and solely on behalf of the Debtors, and not on behalf of any other entity.

#### **Progress of the Chapter 11 Cases to Date**

- Day, have worked diligently to administer and advance these cases. The Debtors' achievements to date in these cases include, among others:
  - drafting and preparing an opposition to the Request of the Official
     Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants for Certification of
     Direct Appeal to the Court of Appeals of Order Denying Committee's
     Motion to Dismiss [Dkt. 1756] (the "Committee Certification Request");
  - drafting and preparing an opposition to the Request for Certification of Direct Appeal to the Court of Appeals of Order Denying Mr. Robert Semian and Forty-Six Other MRHFM Plaintiffs' Motion to Dismiss
     [Dkt. 2061] (the "Maune Certification Request");

- reviewing the *Brief of "Texas Two-Step" Victims as Amici Curiae in Support of Petitioner* filed on September 27, 2023 in the United States Supreme Court appeal captioned <u>Harrington v. Purdue Pharma, L.P.</u>, *et al.*, No. 23-124 (U.S. 2023) (the "<u>Purdue Pharma Appeal</u>") and preparing a responsive amicus brief along with the debtor in the <u>Bestwall case (In re Bestwall LLC</u>, No. 17-31795 (LTB) (Bankr. W.D.N.C.), which brief was submitted to the United States Supreme Court on October 27, 2023 and notice of such filing provided to this Court on October 30, 2023 [Dkt. 1983];
- preparing for and participating in mediation pursuant to the *Order Establishing Mediation Protocol* [Dkt. 1608] and the *Supplemental Order Further Establishing Mediation Protocol* [Dkt. 1726] (together, the "Mediation Orders");
- responding to multiple disputes and appeals before multiple courts related to compliance with subpoenas served pursuant to the *Order Granting Motion of the Debtors for an Order Authorizing the Debtors to Issue Subpoenas on Asbestos Trusts and Paddock Enterprises, LLC* [Dkt. 1240] (the "Trust Discovery Order"), which were brought by various asbestos trusts and related parties;
- comprehensive research and analysis as to plan confirmation issues for the resolution of the Chapter 11 Cases;
- addressing various issues in three adversary proceedings filed by the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee, consisting of: (a) a complaint filed on behalf of the bankruptcy estates against the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates alleging that the prepetition corporate restructurings that created the Debtors (the "Corporate Restructuring") was an intentional and constructive fraudulent transfer [Adv. No. 22-03028, Adv. Dkt. 1] (the "Fraudulent Transfer Proceeding"); (b) a complaint on behalf of the bankruptcy estates alleging that individual officers and directors of the Debtors and officers, directors, and employees of other members of the Debtors' corporate family breached their fiduciary duties in connection with the Corporate Restructuring and the filing of these Chapter 11 Cases [Adv. No. 22-03029, Adv. Dkt. 1] (the "Fiduciary Duty Proceeding") and: (c) a complaint seeking entry of an order substantively consolidating the Debtors' estates with certain non-debtor entities or, in the alternative, reallocating the asbestos liabilities of the Debtors to certain non-debtor entities [Adv. No. 21-03029, Adv. No. 1] (the "Substantive Consolidation Proceeding," and together with the Fraudulent Transfer Proceeding and the Fiduciary Duty Proceeding, the "Adversary Proceedings");
- addressing various discovery matters in the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding;

- continuing preparations for an estimation proceeding as authorized by the Court's order authorizing estimation [Dkt. 1127];
- conducting various research and analysis and drafting documents and memoranda concerning matters related to claims administration;
- preparing and providing quarterly and monthly reports on the Debtors' operations in compliance with the Debtors' reporting obligations [Aldrich Dkts. 1967, 1984, 1985, 2030, 2051, 2090; 2091 Murray Dkts. 109, 111, 112, 116, 118, 120, 121];
- meetings with the FCR and his counsel regarding the Chapter 11 Cases;
- conducting various research and analysis and drafting documents, memoranda, and pleadings relevant to potential case strategies that could move these Chapter 11 Cases towards an ultimate resolution; and
- engaging in various other discussions with the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee, the Debtors' advisors, the FCR, the Debtors' insurers, and other parties in interest regarding various matters relating to the Chapter 11 Cases.

#### **Prior Monthly Fee Statements**

14. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day has submitted the following monthly fee statements (collectively, the "Prior Monthly Fee Statements") to the Debtors for the four months comprising the Compensation Period, each of which is incorporated herein by reference in its entirety:<sup>2</sup>

Date Submitted	Period Covered	Requested Fees	Requested Expenses	Payment Received	Amount Outstanding
November 30, 2023	October 1, 2023 – October 31, 2023	\$577,227.50	\$2,963.40	\$493,075.30	\$87,115.60
January 2, 2024	November 1, 2023  - November 30, 2023	\$542,820.00	\$2,455.40	\$490,993.40	\$54,282.00
January 30, 2024	December 1, 2023  – December 31, 2023	\$554,545.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$554,545.00

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Copies of the Prior Monthly Fee Statements are attached hereto collectively as <u>Exhibit A</u>.

Date	Period Covered	Requested	Requested	Payment	Amount
Submitted		Fees	Expenses	Received	Outstanding
March 1, 2024	January 1, 2024 – January 31, 2024	\$1,253,447.50	\$15.00	\$0.00	\$1,253,462.50

15. In total, Jones Day has submitted the Prior Monthly Fee Statements during the Compensation Period for total fees of \$2,928,040.00 and total expenses of \$5,433.80. As of the date of this Application, no party has objected to any of Jones Day's Prior Monthly Fee Statements.<sup>3</sup>

#### **Compensation by Project Category**

The following is a summary of the activities performed by Jones Day professionals and paraprofessionals during the Compensation Period, organized by project billing category.<sup>4</sup>

# 16. Case Administration and Business Operations — 155.90 hours — \$185,832.50

In light of the size and complexity of the Debtors' bankruptcy cases, daily case administration matters necessarily required attention from Jones Day during the Compensation Period. These services included the following:

maintaining a detailed work in process report (the "WIP Report") that is
distributed to the Debtors and other professionals to track the progress of
motions, applications, and other matters relating to these cases. The WIP
Report assists the Debtors in assigning tasks and responsibilities,
coordinating activities, tracking deadlines, reporting progress, and
avoiding duplication of effort among the Debtors and their professionals;

The objection deadline relating to the Forty-Third Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period from January 1, 2024 Through January 31, 2024 has not yet passed.

The summary set forth below is qualified in its entirety by reference to the time and service detail attached to each Prior Monthly Fee Statement. Project billing categories for which no time was charged during the Compensation Period are not listed below. In addition, because the time charged to the Automatic Stay category (1.90 hours) was *de minimis*, it is not summarized below.

- participating in regular conference calls and video meetings with the Debtors' management and other professionals to discuss and review key case developments, pending motions and applications, compliance with the requirements of chapter 11, and other work in process as identified in the WIP Report;
- maintaining case management tools, including maintenance of a case calendar and docket to monitor filings and related litigation deadlines;
- reviewing and coordinating administrative filings; and
- communicating with parties in interest regarding the Chapter 11 Cases.

Jones Day believes that it has adopted appropriate procedures for the effective and efficient administration of these cases that have resulted, and will continue to result, in cost savings inuring to the direct benefit of the Debtors and their estates and creditors.

#### 17. Claims Administration — 204.00 hours — \$248,100.00

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day assisted with various matters involving claims for and against the Debtors. In particular, Jones Day devoted time to:

- analyzing issues related to incomplete, deficient, or otherwise noncompliant PIQs;
- communicating with the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee and counsel to claimants regarding incomplete, deficient, or otherwise noncompliant PIQs;
- analyzing issues related to proofs of claim, including analysis of incomplete or incorrect proofs of claim, claim withdrawals, and settled and satisfied claims; and communicating with counsel to claimants regarding same; and
- analyzing procedures related to omnibus objections to proofs of claim.

#### 18. Court Hearings — 16.20 hours — \$20,447.50

Jones Day's activities during the Compensation Period included preparation for and participation in multiple hearings before this Court on a variety of matters described elsewhere in this Application. In particular, Jones Day devoted time to:

• the hearing held on December 28, 2023 regarding: (a) the Motion of the Future Claimants Representative for an Order to Establish a Protocol for Determining a Representative Sample of Resolved Claims for Purposes of Discovery and Use in the Estimation Proceeding [Dkt. 1342].

#### 19. General Corporate/Real Estate — 76.80 hours — \$101,765.00

Jones Day professionals assisted the Debtors with various corporate tasks during the Compensation Period, including the following:

- reviewing and preparing responses to an audit letter;
- communicating with the Debtors and the Debtors' advisors regarding insurance issues;
- conducting periodic discussions with the Debtors' insurers as to the status of the Chapter 11 Cases and various potential events that may occur during the cases;
- attending board meetings of the Debtors and reviewing board meeting minutes; and
- providing advice and assistance to the Debtors in connection with certain corporate matters, including researching issues related to corporate governance, disclosure requirements, and preparing corporate documents.

#### 20. Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator Reporting – 33.80 hours

#### -\$32,545.00

Jones Day professionals prepared monthly status reports and quarterly fee statements for both Aldrich and Murray. These reports keep the Court up to date on the financial affairs of the Debtors and comply with the Debtors' reporting obligations as debtors-in-possession. In addition, Jones Day assisted with the preparation of the *Periodic Report Regarding Value, Operations, and Profitability of Entities in Which the Estates of Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Hold a Substantial or Controlling Interest* [Dkt. 2079] that the Debtors are required to file pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2015.3.

#### 21. Litigation and Adversary Proceedings — 1,110.80 hours —

#### \$1,200,402.50

Jones Day professionals devoted substantial time during the Compensation Period to various litigation-related tasks. These services included the following:

- drafting the Debtors' Objection to Requests of the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants and the Claimants of Maune Raichle for Certification for Direct Appeal of Order Denying Motions to Dismiss
   [Dkt. 2092] filed in opposition to the Committee Certification Request and the Maune Certification Request;
- analyzing the *Brief of "Texas Two-Step" Victims as Amici Curiae in Support of Petitioner* filed in the Purdue Pharma Appeal and, along with the debtor in Bestwall, drafting a responsive amicus brief;
- addressing discovery matters in the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding, including: (a) reviewing and analyzing the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee's discovery requests and related correspondence in the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding; (b) preparing discovery requests to serve on the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee's in the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding; (c) communicating with the other defendants in the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding regarding discovery requests, correspondence, and related issues; (d) preparing responses and objections to the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee's discovery requests in the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding; (e) collecting and reviewing documents potentially to be produced in response to the discovery requests in the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding; and (f) preparing other discovery materials related to the Substantive Consolidation Proceeding;
- responding to inquires from the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee regarding privilege issues in the Adversary Proceedings;
- communicating internally and with the Debtors regarding discovery plans related to the Adversary Proceedings; and
- researching issues in anticipation of potential future litigation activities in the Chapter 11 Cases.

#### 22. Asbestos Matters — 857.60 hours — \$928,010.00

Jones Day professionals devoted substantial time during the Compensation Period to addressing various asbestos-related matters, including the following:

- engaging in various discovery matters and developing plans for discovery related to estimation of the Debtors' asbestos liabilities, including issues related to document production and privilege;
- engaging in various estimation-related discovery involving asbestos trusts;
- participating in litigation and appeals filed in multiple courts by various asbestos trusts and other related parties regarding compliance with subpoenas served in accordance with the Trust Discovery Order, which involved filing multiple motions and responses, attending hearings, conducting extensive research, and participating in multiple meet and confers;
- communicating with the Current Asbestos Claimants' Committee regarding various estimation-related discovery matters, including issues related to sampling and privilege;
- preparing for and communicating with co-counsel and mediators regarding mediation;
- reviewing PIQ submissions and submitted proofs of claim, and communicating with counsel to asbestos claimants regarding such submissions;
- conferring with the Debtors' professionals to coordinate the PIQ process;
   and
- communicating with Bates White, LLC, the Debtors' asbestos consultant, regarding the status of asbestos matters and various analyses.

#### 23. Professional Retention and Fee Issues — 196.10 hours — \$153,895.00

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day professionals devoted time to assisting the Debtors in various professional retention and fee issues, including:

- reviewing and analyzing invoices, monthly fee statements, and interim fee applications of all professionals retained in the Chapter 11 Cases;
- reviewing reports and analyzing invoices of ordinary course professionals;
- reviewing disclosures of retained professionals;
- preparing the Fourth Supplemental Disclosure of Brad B. Erens in Support of the Ex Parte Application of the Debtors for an Order Authorizing them to Retain and Employ Jones Day as Counsel as of the Petition Date [Dkt. 2083];

- preparing a quarterly ordinary course professional report; and
- communicating with the Debtors' other professionals regarding the interim fee application process and reviewing the interim fee applications of the Debtors' professionals.

#### 24. Fee Application Preparation — 85.80 hours — \$54,645.00

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day devoted time to (a) reviewing its invoices for September 23, October 2023, November 2023, and December 2023 for privilege and to ensure compliance with the Local Rules and the Compensation Guidelines; (b) drafting the related Prior Monthly Fee Statements to accompany these monthly invoices; and (c) preparing the *Tenth Interim Application of Jones Day for Allowance of Compensation for Services*Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors for the Period From June 1, 2023 Through September 30, 2023 [Dkt. 2003], which was approved by the Court on November 28, 2023 [Dkt. 2017].

#### 25. Bankruptcy Write-Offs — \$262.50

This category reflects all amounts that Jones Day has voluntarily determined not to charge the Debtors as assessed by Jones Day in reviewing invoices, consistent with its own internal policies and to comply with the "reasonableness" requirements of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code.

#### **Expenses Incurred by Jones Day**

26. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code authorizes "reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses" incurred by professionals employed in a chapter 11 case. Accordingly, Jones Day seeks reimbursement for expenses ("Expenses") incurred in rendering services to the Debtors during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$5,433.80. Itemized records detailing the Expenses incurred during the Compensation Period are attached to the Prior Monthly Fee Statements.

- 27. Jones Day maintains the following policies with respect to Expenses:
- No amortization of the cost of any investment, equipment, or capital outlay is included in the expenses. In addition, for those items or services that Jones Day purchased from or contracted with a third party (such as outside copy services), Jones Day seeks reimbursement only for the exact amount billed to Jones Day by the third party vendor and paid by Jones Day to the third party vendor.
- Jones Day generally does not charge for ordinary photocopying performed by lawyers, paraprofessionals, and assistants. With respect to large photocopying jobs necessitating the use of Jones Day's specialized duplication staff and equipment, such photocopying was charged at 10 cents per page. To the extent practicable, Jones Day utilizes less expensive outside copying services.
- Meals charged to the Debtors either are associated with (a) out-of-town travel; (b) meetings at Jones Day with the Debtors and other professionals; or (c) attorneys working late on urgent matters concerning the Debtors.
- Charges for airline and train travel include the cost of each coach-class airline or train ticket purchased in connection with the provision of services to the Debtors, plus, for each airline or train ticket issued by the travel service regularly used by Jones Day, a \$40 transaction fee to cover travel service expenses.
- The time pressures associated with the services rendered by Jones Day at times require Jones Day's professionals and paraprofessionals to devote substantial amounts of time during the evenings and on weekends. Jones Day may charge for secretarial and other staff overtime expense that is directly associated with such after-hours work and is necessary given the circumstances of the case. Jones Day does not consider such expenses to be part of its ongoing overhead expenses because they are special incremental expenses arising from the specific services being provided to the Debtors. Nevertheless, no such charges are included in this Application.

#### Conclusion

28. The fees and expenses requested herein by Jones Day are billed in accordance with its existing billing rates and procedures in effect during the Compensation Period. Such fees are reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in comparable nonbankruptcy cases in a competitive national legal market.

Jones Day's fees and expenses, therefore, should be approved on an interim basis pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Interim Compensation Order, and applicable Bankruptcy Rules and Local Rules.

#### Notice

29. This Application has been served in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order on the Notice Parties, as defined therein. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, a notice of opportunity for hearing on this Application in accordance with Local Rule 9013-1(e)(7) has been served on the Notice Parties and all parties that have filed a notice of appearance with the Clerk of this Court and requested such notice. Jones Day submits that, in light of the nature of the relief requested, no other or further notice need be provided.

#### **No Prior Request**

30. No prior request for the relief sought in this Application has been made to this or any other court.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

WHEREFORE, Jones Day respectfully requests that, pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Interim Compensation Order, and applicable Bankruptcy Rules and Local Rules, the Court (a) enter an order substantially in the form attached hereto as <a href="Exhibit B">Exhibit B</a> granting the relief requested herein and (b) grant such other and further relief to Jones Day as the Court may deem just and proper.

Dated: March 11, 2024

Chicago, Illinois

Respectfully submitted,

#### /s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864)
Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871)
Amanda P. Johnson (IL Bar No. 6329873)
JONES DAY
110 North Wacker Drive
Chicago, Illinois 60606
Telephone: (312) 782-3939

Facsimile: (312) 782-8585
E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com
macody@jonesday.com

amandajohnson @jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

-and-

Gregory M. Gordon (TX Bar No. 08435300) JONES DAY 2727 N. Harwood Street

Dallas, Texas 75201

Telephone: (214) 220-3939

Facsimile: (214) 969-5100

E-mail: gmgordon@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 23 of 188

# EXHIBIT A

**Prior Monthly Fee Statements** 

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

# FORTIETH MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Fortieth Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From October 1, 2023 Through October 31, 2023 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

#### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period
 October 1, 2023 through October 31, 2023 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

#### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$577,227.50
Total Expenses	\$2,963.40
TOTAL	\$580,190.90

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$522,468.15 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

#### **Billing Adjustments**

4. Consistent with its own internal policies and to comply with the "reasonableness" requirements of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, Jones Day has reviewed its monthly service descriptions and expense detail and has determined that certain fees should not be charged to the Debtors. In particular, Jones Day has voluntarily determined that \$262.50 in fees will not be charged to the Debtors. This Monthly Fee Statement reflects this adjustment.

#### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

5. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036 (Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc., (I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103 (Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter & English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019 (Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC,

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 26 of 188

1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 6. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than December 14, 2023 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 7. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 27 of 188

8. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Dated: November 30, 2023 Chicago, Illinois Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606
Telephone: (312) 782-3939
Facsimile: (312) 782-8585
E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com
macody@jonesday.com

ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 28 of 188

# **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800

Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

October 31, 2023 161866 Invoice: 231307514

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through October 31, 2023:

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	37.30	43,155.00
Claims Administration	35.70	50,775.00
General Corporate and Real Estate	18.60	25,582.50
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator		
Reporting	8.70	7,755.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	219.40	252,470.00
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	66.30	44,415.00
Fee Application Preparation	13.90	7,992.50
Asbestos Matters	141.80	145,082.50
Total Fees	541.70 USD	577,227.50
Total Billed Disbursements	USD _	2,963.40 **
TOTAL	USD _	580,190.90

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 30 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 2

October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

### Disbursement & Charges Summary

Travel - Air Fare	1,585.05
Travel - Food and Beverage Expenses	31.50
Travel - Hotel Charges	1,104.29
United Parcel Service Charges	242.56

USD 2,963.40 \*\*

Page: 3 October 31, 2023

Invoice: 231307514

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – October 31, 2023

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
M A Cody	Partner	1996	105.10	1,475.00	155,022.50
M C Corcoran	Partner	2004	2.00	1,050.00	2,100.00
B B Erens	Partner	1991	50.30	1,500.00	75,450.00
N J Francisco	Partner	1999	0.30	1,600.00	480.00
G M Gordon	Partner	1980	0.80	1,800.00	1,440.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	54.90	1,275.00	69,997.50
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	19.20	1,350.00	25,920.00
C K Marshall	Partner	2001	18.80	1,325.00	24,910.00
D S Torborg	Partner	1998	6.20	1,300.00	8,060.00
Total			257.60		363,380.00
M R Seiden	Of Counsel	1992 _	2.90	1,375.00	3,987.50
Total			2.90		3,987.50
A Anderson	Associate	2021	20.30	700.00	14,210.00
C K Cahow	Associate	2014	23.60	1,150.00	27,140.00
E M Dowling	Associate	2022	1.50	625.00	937.50
J L Gale	Associate	2022	2.60	625.00	1,625.00
R Hart	Associate	2021	34.50	700.00	24,150.00
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	68.30	800.00	54,640.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2021	5.10	700.00	3,570.00
D C Villalba	Associate	2019	10.70	750.00	8,025.00
B J Wierenga	Associate	2018	36.10	850.00	30,685.00
Total			202.70		164,982.50
A R Villar	Sr Staff Attorney	2009	6.00	675.00	4,050.00
Total			6.00		4,050.00
L C Fischer	Staff Attorney	1996 _	49.30	625.00	30,812.50
Total			49.30		30,812.50
C L Smith	Paralegal	_	15.70	475.00	7,457.50
Total			15.70		7,457.50
L Joseph	Project Assistant		2.30	375.00	862.50
Total			2.30		862.50
E Pratt	Project Manager		5.80	375.00	2,175.00
Total		_	5.80		2,175.00
Total		_	542.30	USD	577,707.50

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 32 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 4

October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 33 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 5

October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

### Fee Detail

i ce Detaii			
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Case Administration an	nd Business Operations		
10/01/23 Review and rev	B B Erens ise task list.	0.20	300.00
10/01/23 Review work in	A P Johnson process report (.2); review calendar of key	0.30 dates and deadlines (.1).	240.00
10/02/23 Revise task list	A P Johnson (.2); discuss same with Erens (.1).	0.30	240.00
10/02/23 Review and dist	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/03/23 Attend work in	C K Cahow process call with internal team and advisors	0.80	920.00
10/03/23 Review work in in process matt	M A Cody a process report and related task list (.8); tele ers (.8).	1.60 phone conference with advi	2,360.00 sors regarding work
10/03/23 Attend work in	M C Corcoran process call with advisors.	0.80	840.00
10/03/23 Prepare for adv	B B Erens isor work in process call (.10); attend call re	0.90 garding same (.80).	1,350.00
10/03/23 Revise task list advisors (.8).	A P Johnson (.3); revise work in process report (.3); attended.	1.40 d work in process call with i	1,120.00 nternal team and
10/03/23 Participate in w	T B Lewis ork in process call with advisors.	0.80	1,080.00
10/03/23 Review and dist system with san	C L Smith tribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed docente (.10).	0.20 cuments and update electror	95.00 nic file management
10/03/23 Attend work in	D S Torborg process call with advisors.	0.80	1,040.00
10/04/23 Review and dist	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/05/23 Review and dist system with san	C L Smith tribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed docente (.10).	0.20 cuments and update electror	95.00 nic file management
10/06/23 Draft calendar	J L Gale of key dates and deadlines.	0.30	187.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 34 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 6 October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/09/23 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/10/23 Revise work in	A P Johnson process report (.1); revise task list (.3).	0.40	320.00
10/10/23 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/11/23 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/12/23 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/13/23 Attend work in same (.40).	C K Cahow process call with company, internal to	1.00 eam and advisors (.70); address fol	1,150.00 low up related to
10/13/23 Telephone con	M A Cody ference with client and advisors regard	0.80 ling work in process matters.	1,180.00
10/13/23 Prepare for clie	B B Erens ent work in process call (.20); attend ca	0.90 all regarding same (.70).	1,350.00
10/13/23 Draft calendar	J L Gale of key dates and deadlines.	0.30	187.50
10/13/23 Prepare for (.30	M R Hirst  O) and attend (.70) work in process call	1.00 l with client.	1,275.00
10/13/23 Attend work in	A P Johnson process call with client and advisors.	0.60	480.00
10/13/23 Participate in w	T B Lewis ork in process call with client.	0.60	810.00
10/13/23 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/13/23 Attend client w	D S Torborg ork in process call.	0.50	650.00
10/16/23 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/17/23 Attend work in	C K Cahow process call with internal team and ad	0.80 dvisors.	920.00
10/17/23 Telephone con materials (.5).	M A Cody ference with advisors regarding work i	1.40 in process matters (.9); review task	2,065.00 list and related

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 35 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DE	11	
161866 Aldrich Pump LL	.C and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 7 October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/17/23 Attend wor	M C Corcoran rk in process call with advisors.	0.90	945.00
10/17/23 Attend adv	B B Erens isor work in process call.	0.80	1,200.00
10/17/23 Revise task	A P Johnson list (.3); revise work in process report (.2); atte	1.40 end work in process call	1,120.00 with advisors (.9).
10/17/23 Participate	T B Lewis in work in process call with advisors.	0.90	1,215.00
	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed do same (.10).	0.20 locuments and update el	95.00 lectronic file management
10/18/23 Review and	C L Smith I distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/19/23 Review and	M A Cody I revise work in process report.	0.50	737.50
10/19/23 Review and	C L Smith d distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/20/23 Update cale	J L Gale endar of key dates and deadlines.	0.10	62.50
10/20/23 Review and	C L Smith d distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/23/23 Review and	C L Smith d distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
10/24/23 Attend wor	C K Cahow rk in process call with internal team and adviso	0.70 prs.	805.00
	M A Cody d revise work in process report (.5); review task work in process matters (.8).	1.60 k list (.3); telephone con	2,360.00 ference with advisors
10/24/23 Attend adv	B B Erens isor work in process call.	0.80	1,200.00
10/24/23 Prepare for	M R Hirst (.30) and attend (.70) work in process call wit	1.00 h advisors.	1,275.00
10/24/23 Revise task	A P Johnson list (.4); revise work in process report (.1); atte	1.30 end work in process call	1,040.00 with advisors (.8).
10/24/23 Participate	T B Lewis in work in process call with advisors.	0.80	1,080.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 36 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866		ge: 8
Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC	October 31, 2 Invoice: 23130	2023
Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours Am	ount
10/24/23 M R Seiden Attend work in process call with advisors.	0.70 90	52.50
10/24/23 C L Smith Review and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently fit system with same (.10).		95.00 ent
10/24/23 D S Torborg Prepare for (.1) and attend (.7) work in process calls	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	40.00
10/25/23 B B Erens Telephone call with Smith regarding case administrate		50.00
10/25/23 C L Smith Review and distribute docket (.10); communications coordinate matters relating to same (.10).		37.50 30);
10/26/23 C L Smith Review and distribute docket.	0.10	<b>1</b> 7.50
10/27/23 J L Gale Revise calendar of key dates and deadlines.	0.20	25.00
10/30/23 C L Smith Review and distribute docket (.10); update electronic		00.00
10/31/23 C K Cahow Attend work in process call with internal team and ac		60.00
10/31/23 M A Cody Telephone conference with advisors regarding work process report and related task list (1.2).		07.50
10/31/23 B B Erens Attend advisor work in process call.	0.50 75	50.00
10/31/23 A P Johnson Revise task list (.5); revise work in process report (.4)		40.00
10/31/23 T B Lewis Participate in work in process call with advisors.	0.50 67	75.00
10/31/23 C L Smith Review and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently fit system with same (.10).		95.00 ent
10/31/23 D S Torborg Attend work in process call with advisors.	0.40 52	20.00
Matter Total	37.30 USD 43,15	55.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 37 of 188 JONES DAY

161866	<b>J</b> 0 1 1 = 0 = 1		Page: 9
	and Murray Boiler LLC		October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/01/23 Review issues	B B Erens regarding PIQ compliance.	0.30	450.00
	M A Cody Iasiano and claimants' counsel regarding P compliance (1.3).	1.50 TQ compliance (.2); review de	2,212.50 ocuments and materials
10/03/23 Review and an same (.2).	M A Cody aalyze PIQ responses and related complian	2.30 ace reports (2.1); emails with 1	3,392.50 Masiano regarding
10/04/23 Review PIQ st	M A Cody ubmissions and related materials (2.2); ema	2.50 ails with Masiano regarding sa	3,687.50 ame (.3).
correspondenc	M A Cody nference with Masiano regarding PIQ com- ce (.3); review submissions in response to I regarding claims issues (.2).		
10/05/23 Review claims	A P Johnson register (.2); discuss claims issues with Co	0.40 ody (.2).	320.00
10/06/23 Review and an	M A Cody nalyze PIQ compliance reports and related	1.10 correspondence.	1,622.50
10/09/23 Emails with Jo PIQ complian	M A Cody phnson and Masiano regarding claims issue ce issues (.8).	1.00 es (.2); review memorandum a	1,475.00 and research regarding
10/09/23 Draft emails to	A P Johnson o Miller, Cody, Masiano regarding claims is	0.20 ssues.	160.00
	M A Cody on, Miller, Masiano emails regarding PIQ on the regarding same (.70).	0.80 compliance and claims issues	1,180.00 (.10); review
10/10/23 Draft emails to	A P Johnson o Miller, Cody, Masiano regarding PIQ con	0.10 mpliance and claims matters.	80.00
10/11/23 Review emails submissions (	M A Cody related to PIQ compliance and claims issu	0.80 ues (.3); review related corresp	1,180.00 pondence and
conference wit	M A Cody nference with Johnson and Miller regarding th Johnson regarding claims processing an th same (.8); review correspondence and fi	nd related issues (.2); review K	CC retention filings in
10/12/23 Discuss claims	A P Johnson and PIQ compliance with Cody, Miller.	0.60	480.00
10/13/23 Review and an	M A Cody nalyze correspondence related to claims iss	1.30 sues and PIQ compliance (.8);	1,917.50; emails with Masiano

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 38 of 188 JONES DAY

	JONES D.	AY		
161866			0-4-1	Page: 10
Aldrich Pump Ll	LC and Murray Boiler LLC			per 31, 2023 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
regarding	same (.2); review updated claims register in co	nnection with same (.3).		
	M A Cody apdated claims register related to withdrawal of regarding claim withdrawals (.5); emails with M			2,655.00 and related
	M A Cody orrespondence and materials regarding PIQ co in connection with same (.8).	2.00 mpliance and claims issu	nes (1.2); review	2,950.00 additional
10/19/23 Review coregarding	M A Cody prrespondence and materials related to PIQ co same (.1).	0.90 mpliance and claims issu	ues (.8); emails v	1,327.50 with Masiano
10/23/23 Review co	M A Cody prrespondence and related materials regarding	1.20 PIQ compliance and clai	ims issues.	1,770.00
	M A Cody nails and background materials regarding claim we with Masiano regarding claims objections (.5		iance (.8); telep	1,917.50 hone
10/26/23 Review cla	M A Cody aims issues and related matters (.7); emails with	0.90 n Masiano regarding sam	ne (.2).	1,327.50
10/27/23 Review co	M A Cody orrespondence and related materials regarding	1.80 claims issues and PIQ co	ompliance.	2,655.00
	A P Johnson laims and PIQ compliance with Masiano (.2); raiano and Miller regarding same (.3).	0.90 review materials related t	o same (.4); rev	720.00 riew emails
10/28/23 Review m regarding	A P Johnson aterials related to claims and PIQ compliance same (.2).	0.30 (.1); review emails from	Masiano and M	240.00 Tiller
	M A Cody and revise letter regarding claims issues and PIQ review filings and materials related to same (1)		s with Masiano	7,080.00 regarding
	M A Cody and revise letter regarding claims issues and PIQ analyze matters concerning same (.5); review of als (.5).			
10/31/23 Review cla	A P Johnson aims register.	0.30		240.00
	Matter Total	35.70	USD	50,775.00
General Corporato	e and Real Estate			

10/04/23 0.50 T B Lewis Participate in call with Tananbaum and Smith regarding corporate matters. 675.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 39 of 188

JONES DAY

	JONES DE	11		
161866				Page: 11 ber 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice	:: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
10/06/23 Participate in	T B Lewis n call with Tananbaum regarding corporate m	0.50 natters.		675.00
10/08/23 Review and 1	T B Lewis revise materials concerning corporate matters	4.00 s.		5,400.00
10/09/23 Participate in	T B Lewis a call regarding qualified settlement fund mat	0.10 etters.		135.00
10/25/23 Prepare for b	B B Erens poard meeting.	0.20		300.00
10/26/23 Participate in concerning s	T B Lewis a call with Tananbaum and Smith regarding came (0.8).	1.30 corporate matters (0.5).	; review and rev	1,755.00 vise materials
10/27/23 Review agen- board meetin	M A Cody da in advance of Aldrich and Murray joint bo ng (1.0).	1.30 pard meeting (.3); atter	nd Aldrich and I	1,917.50 Murray joint
10/27/23 Prepare for b	B B Erens poard meeting (.20); attend Aldrich and Murr	1.20 ray joint board meeting	g (1.00).	1,800.00
10/27/23 Attend Aldri matters (1.9)	T B Lewis ch and Murray joint board meeting (1.0); rev	2.90 iew and revise materia	ls regarding cor	3,915.00 eporate
10/30/23 Review and 1	M A Cody revise minutes from Aldrich and Murray join	0.80 t board meeting.		1,180.00
with Tananb analysis of sa	T B Lewis t minutes for October 27, 2023 Aldrich and I aum regarding materials for Aldrich and 200 ame (0.5); communicate with Waller regarding concerning same (0.8); participate in call with	Park joint board meet g corporate matters, in	ing, including r cluding review	eview and and analysis
10/31/23 Participate in	T B Lewis a Aldrich and 200 Park joint board meeting a	1.00 nd Murray and Climat	eLabs joint boa	1,350.00 and meeting.
	Matter Total	18.60	USD	25,582.50
Schedules/SOFA/B	ankruptcy Administrator Reporting			
10/02/23 Review mon	M A Cody thly status reports (.4); emails with Lombard	0.50 i, Johnson regarding sa	ume (.1).	737.50
10/02/23 Review mon regarding sar	A P Johnson thly status reports (.1); review precedent relatine (.1).	0.30 ted to same (.1); emails	s with Lombard	240.00 li, Cody
10/02/23	P Lombardi thly status reports (.8); draft emails to Cody,	0.90  Johnson and Tomsic (	concerning sam	630.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 40 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 12 October 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours **Amount** 10/24/23 A P Johnson 160.00 0.20 Review monthly status reports (.1); draft emails to Cody, Clarrey, Hakim regarding same (.1). 1.00 1,475.00 10/27/23 Review and revise drafts of monthly status reports (.8); telephone conference with Lombardi regarding comments to same (.2). 10/27/23 0.90 A P Johnson 720.00 Review monthly status reports (.3); analyze precedent related to same (.2); draft email to Lombardi regarding same (.1); review emails from Lombardi, Hakim, Cody regarding same (.2); discuss same with Lombardi (.1). 10/27/23 P Lombardi 2.10 1,470.00 Review monthly status reports (1.0); analyze matters concerning monthly status reports (.3); discuss same with Johnson (.1); draft email to Cody and Tomsic concerning same (.2); draft emails to AlixPartners requesting information concerning same (.2); discuss revisions to monthly status reports with Cody (.2); discuss proposed revisions with Johnson (.1). 10/28/23 A P Johnson 0.40320.00 Review monthly status reports (.2); review emails from Lombardi, Hakim regarding same (.2). 10/30/23 M A Cody 442.50 Review monthly status reports for filing (.2); emails with Lombardi regarding same (.1). 10/30/23 A P Johnson 400.00 Review monthly status reports (.3); draft emails to Hakim, Lombardi, Tomsic regarding same (.2). 10/30/23 P Lombardi 0.80 560.00 Review monthly status reports for filing (.6); draft email to Cody concerning same (.1); draft email to Tomsic concerning same (.1). 10/31/23 A P Johnson 0.40 320.00 Review quarterly fee statements (.2); draft emails to Lombardi regarding same (.2). 10/31/23 P Lombardi 0.40 280.00 Review quarterly fee statements in preparation for filing (.2); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1); draft emails to Tomsic and Miller concerning same (.1). Matter Total 8.70 **USD** 7,755.00 Litigation and Adversary Proceedings 10/01/23 A P Johnson 0.20 160.00 Review materials regarding potential litigation matter. 10/02/23 B B Erens 1.30 1,950.00 Review draft materials regarding potential litigation matter (.30); telephone call with Johnson regarding potential litigation matter (.20); prepare for calls with client regarding same (.30); telephone calls with Evert regarding same (.50). 10/02/23 A P Johnson 0.50 400.00

Call with Erens regarding potential litigation matter (.2); draft email to Evert regarding same (.1); review order granting motion to extend removal period (.1); draft emails to Smith, Lindsay regarding same (.1).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 41 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JUNESDAT		
161866				Page: 13 October 31, 2023
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231307514
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/02/2		C L Smith granting motion for extension of removal perioding same (.10).	0.20 od for submission to Co	95.00 ourt (.10); emails with
10/03/2		M A Cody alyze precedent in connection with amicus brief	1.10 ef in Purdue Supreme C	1,622.50 ourt case.
10/03/2		A P Johnson Evert regarding potential litigation matter.	0.10	80.00
10/04/2		M A Cody alyze precedent in connection with amicus brief	1.80 ef in Purdue Supreme C	2,655.00 court case.
10/04/2	Telephone call	B B Erens with Cahow regarding amicus brief in Purdue cam regarding same (.20).	0.40 Supreme Court case (.2	600.00 20); follow up emails
10/05/2	Call with Turtz	C K Cahow z, Evert, Erens regarding amicus brief in Purdu ly regarding same (.40); review and analyze ma		
10/05/2	Telephone con Supreme Court	M A Cody iference with Turtz, Tananbaum, Evert, Cahov t case (.5); follow up call with Cahow and Erend briefs regarding same (3.4).		
10/05/2	Attend call with	B B Erens h client regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supre egarding same (.50); call with Cody and Cahow ling same (.20).		
10/05/2		N J Francisco ll with internal team regarding amicus brief in l	0.30 Purdue Supreme Court	480.00 case.
10/05/2		G M Gordon ference with Erens regarding amicus brief in F	0.10 Purdue Supreme Court o	180.00 case.
10/05/2		A P Johnson als regarding potential litigation matter (.2); rev	0.80 iew comments from Ev	640.00 vert regarding same (.6).
10/05/2		C L Smith nic file management system with materials in c t case.	0.30 connection with amicus	142.50 brief in Purdue
10/06/2	Review and ana	C K Cahow alyze materials regarding amicus brief in Purduscuss same with Johnson (.10).	3.30 ne Supreme Court case 2	3,795.00 and draft summary of
10/06/2		M A Cody g and precedent in connection with amicus bri	2.60 ef in Purdue Supreme C	3,835.00 Court case.
10/06/2		B B Erens	0.50	750.00

Emails with Evert regarding potential litigation matter (.20); diligence regarding amicus brief in Purdue

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 42 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 14 October 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours **Amount** Supreme Court case (.30). 10/06/23 1.80 1,440.00 A P Johnson Discuss amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case with Cahow (.1); discuss same with Villalba (.3); review precedent related to same (1.4). 10/06/23 D C Villalba 2.40 1,800.00 Review amicus brief filed in Purdue Supreme Court case (0.9); draft outline for Aldrich amicus brief (1.2); discuss same with Johnson (0.3). 10/07/23 2.40 1,920.00 A P Johnson Review outline from Villalba regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.8); research precedent related to same (1.6). 2.20 10/07/23 D C Villalba 1,650.00 Draft outline for amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/08/23 C K Cahow 1.80 2,070.00 Draft outline for amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/08/23 A P Johnson 2.20 Review outline from Villalba regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.3); analyze precedent related to same (1.5); draft summary of same (.4). 0.50 10/09/23 C K Cahow 575.00 Call with Erens regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.10); call with Johnson regarding same (.40). 10/09/23 2.80 4,130.00 Review and analyze case law and memoranda in connection with amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/09/23 3.70 B B Erens 5,550.00 Review materials from Evert regarding potential litigation matter (.20); review issues regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.20); review outline regarding same (3.20); discuss same with Johnson (.10). 10/09/23 9,680.00 A P Johnson Draft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (7.8); discuss outline for same with Erens (.1); research precedent related to same (3.7); discuss same with Cahow (.3); review email from Villalba regarding same (.2).10/09/23 D C Villalba 2.00 1,500.00 Review amicus brief filed in Purdue Supreme Court case (0.6); review materials relating to same (1.0); draft summary of same (0.4). 10/10/23 C K Cahow 4.50 5,175.00 Draft and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 3.10 10/10/23 M A Cody 4,572.50 Review and analyze memoranda and case law in connection with amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 625.00

Draft and revise materials regarding potential litigation matter (.80); discuss same with Johnson (.20).

1.00

10/10/23

E M Dowling

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 43 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 15 October 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours **Amount** 10/10/23 B B Erens 300.00 0.20 Telephone call with Johnson regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/10/23 9.50 7,600.00 A P Johnson Draft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (4.8); review same (.9); research precedent related to same (2.2); discuss same with Erens (.2); review materials regarding potential litigation matter (.3); revise same (.2); review comments from Evert regarding same (.4); draft emails to Erens, Evert, Tananbaum regarding same (.3); discuss same with Dowling (.2). 10/10/23 C K Marshall 795.00 0.60 Call with internal team regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.3); analyze issues regarding amicus brief (.3). 0.30 10/10/23 D C Villalba 225.00 Research related to amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/11/23 C K Cahow 0.30345.00 Call with Erens regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/11/23 M A Cody 5.30 7,817.50 Review and revise drafts of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.2); review related briefs and precedent (2.8); call with Erens regarding amicus brief (.2); diligence regarding same (1.1). 10/11/23 6,300.00 B B Erens Telephone call with Cahow regarding issues concerning amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.30); review Johnson outline regarding same (.20); review and revise amicus brief (2.60); telephone call with Cody regarding same (.20); diligence regarding same (.20); telephone call with Marshall regarding same (.30); emails with internal team regarding same (.40). 10/11/23 0.80 640.00 A P Johnson Revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.3); review same (.5). 0.30 397.50 10/11/23 C K Marshall Call with Erens regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.20); email to Wierenga regarding amicus brief (.10). 10/11/23 2.40 2,040.00 B J Wierenga Communicate with Marshall regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.10); draft and revise same (2.30). 920.00 10/12/23 C K Cahow 0.80Communications with Erens regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.30); call with Cody regarding same (.50). 10/12/23 7,670.00 M A Cody 5.20 Review and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.8); review precedent and related materials in connection with same (2.7); telephone conference with Erens regarding same (.1); telephone conference with Cahow regarding same (.4); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.2). 10/12/23 0.50 750.00

Telephone call with Cody regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.20); telephone calls with Cahow regarding same (.30).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 44 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOINEDE	111	
161866	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 16 October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514
Munch Fump 1	LLC and Murray Bollet LLC		111VOICE. 23130/314
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	C K Marshall ond with internal team regarding amicus brief ir to amicus brief (.40).	1.10 n Purdue Supreme Court case	1,457.50 e (.70); review materials
10/12/23 Review o	B J Wierenga draft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court cas	0.70 se.	595.00
	M A Cody and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Cou ad Wierenga regarding same (.3); review and ana		
	B B Erens a Cody, Marshall, Wierenga regarding amicus br d, Wierenga regarding same (.8).	1.00 rief in Purdue Supreme Court	1,500.00 t case (.2); call with
10/13/23 Discuss	J L Gale potential litigation matter with Johnson (0.2); re	1.60 esearch regarding same (1.4).	1,000.00
	C K Marshall drafts and related materials for amicus brief in and Wierenga regarding same (.3); call with Erens		
10/13/23 Review 2	D S Torborg amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case.	0.50	650.00
	B J Wierenga ate in call with Cody, Erens, Marshall regarding ate in call with Marshall, Erens regarding same (		
10/14/23 Draft an	B J Wierenga d revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court	6.70 case.	5,695.00
10/15/23 Draft an	B J Wierenga d revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court	5.30 case.	4,505.00
	M A Cody and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Cou phone conferences with Erens regarding same (		4,867.50 pinions and precedent
(.30); tele call with	B B Erens drafts of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court ephone calls with Cahow regarding same (.30); Evert regarding same (.20); diligence regarding garding amicus brief (.30); consider issues regard	draft email to client regarding potential litigation matter (.5	g same (.40); telephone
	A P Johnson micus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.4); ew email from Villalba regarding same (.2); ema		
10/16/23	C K Marshall	3.70	4,902.50

Edit draft of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (3.40); emails with internal team regarding same (.30).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 45 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 17 October 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours **Amount** 10/16/23 D C Villalba 0.60 450.00 Draft comments to amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.40); emails with internal team regarding same (.20). 10/16/23 B J Wierenga 4.20 3,570.00 Draft and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (3.0); research regarding same (1.0); correspond with Marshall regarding same (.2). 10/17/23 C K Cahow 0.50 575.00 Call with company, internal team and advisors regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/17/23 3.70 M A Cody 5,457.50 Telephone conference with Turtz, Tananbaum, Sands, Cahow, Erens, Marshall, Wierenga and Evert regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.5); review and revise drafts of amicus brief (1.4); review and analyze opinions and precedent regarding same (1.8). 10/17/23 B B Erens 1.60 2,400.00 Prepare for call regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.30); attend call with client, advisors and internal team regarding same (.50); follow up regarding same (.20); telephone call with Evans regarding potential litigation matter (.40); emails with internal team regarding amicus brief (.40). 10/17/23 A P Johnson 0.80 640.00 Review amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 2.50 10/17/23 C K Marshall 3,312.50 Prepare for (.3) and participate in (.5) call with client, advisors and internal team regarding draft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case; revise draft of amicus brief (1.7). 3.90 10/17/23 B J Wierenga 3,315.00 Participate in call with client, advisors and internal team regarding draft of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.5); draft and revise same (3.4). 10/18/23 C K Cahow 1.70 1,955.00 Review and analyze matters concerning amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.90); emails with internal team regarding same (.30); call with Cody regarding same (.50). 10/18/23 M A Cody 3.70 5,457.50 Review and revise drafts of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.1); emails with Erens, Cahow, Wierenga and Marshall regarding same (.3); telephone conference with Cahow regarding same (.5); review and analyze opinions and briefs regarding same (1.8). 10/18/23 B B Erens 2.00 3,000.00 Review amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case and related materials (.90); emails with internal team regarding same (.30); telephone call with Evert regarding same (.20); telephone call with Guy regarding same (.60).10/18/23 C K Marshall 2.40 3,180.00 Revise draft of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (2.1); emails with internal team regarding same (.3).

Draft and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.8); emails with internal team regarding same (.3).

1.10

935.00

10/18/23

B J Wierenga

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 46 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 18 October 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 10/19/23 C K Cahow 1.20 1,380.00 Prepare for (.30) and attend (.60) call with company, internal team and advisors regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case; call with Cody regarding same (.30). 10/19/23 M A Cody 4.30 6,342.50 Review and revise draft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.1); telephone conference with Tananbaum, Sands, Erens, Cahow, Evert, Hirst regarding comments to same (.6); telephone conference with Erens regarding same (.2); telephone conference with Cahow regarding same (.3); review precedent and briefs regarding same (2.1). 10/19/23 0.50 E M Dowling 312.50 Research concerning potential litigation matter. B B Erens 10/19/23 1.50 2,250.00 Review amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case and related materials (.70); call with Cody regarding same (.20); attend call with client, internal team and advisors regarding same (.60). 10/19/23 1.00 1,275.00 M R Hirst Prepare for (.4) and attend (.6) call with client, advisors and internal team regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/19/23 C K Marshall 0.30 397.50 Call with client regarding draft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.20); call with Wierenga regarding draft amicus brief (.10). 10/19/23 935.00 B J Wierenga 1.10 Draft and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.00); call with Marshall regarding same (.10). 10/20/23 M A Cody 2,507.50 Review and analyze Purdue Supreme Court case amicus briefs and related materials (1.7). 10/20/23 B B Erens 1.10 1,650.00 Telephone call with Gordon and Guy regarding amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.50); telephone call with Marshall regarding same (.20); review background regarding same (.40). 10/20/23 0.20 170.00 B I Wierenga Revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 10/21/23 B J Wierenga 1.10 935.00 Draft and revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case. 4.40 10/23/23 6,490.00 M A Cody Review amicus briefs filed in Purdue Supreme Court case and related materials (3.1); review drafts of Aldrich amicus brief and comments to same (1.3). 5,400.00 10/23/23 B B Erens 3.60 Review revisions to amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.40); telephone calls with Marshall regarding same (.30); review filed amicus briefs regarding same (1.20); telephone call with Evert regarding potential litigation matter (.30); prepare regarding same (.20); emails with internal team regarding amicus brief (.50); telephone call with client regarding same (.20); telephone call with Miller regarding potential

10/23/23 A P Johnson 0.60 480.00 Review materials from precedent case raising related issues.

litigation matter (.50).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 47 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Aldrich Pump I	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 19 October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/23/23 Edit drai same (.60	C K Marshall ft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (3 0).	1.40 80); communications with in	1,855.00 nternal team regarding
10/23/23 Revise at (.2).	B J Wierenga micus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.6); o	0.80 communications with intern	680.00 al team regarding same
	M A Cody and revise draft of amicus brief in Purdue Supre- led amicus briefs in connection with same (1.1).		3,687.50 comments to same (.3);
10/24/23 Revise an	B B Erens micus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case.	0.50	750.00
10/24/23 Edit draf	C K Marshall ft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case.	0.60	795.00
10/24/23 Draft an	B J Wierenga d revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court	1.00 case.	850.00
10/25/23 Review of with same	M A Cody drafts of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court ne (1.8).	4.10 case (2.3); review filed amic	6,047.50 us briefs in connection
10/25/23 Draft an (.20).	B B Erens d revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court	1.20 case (1.00); emails with Gor	1,800.00 don regarding same
10/25/23 Review 2	G M Gordon and respond to email from Erens regarding amic	0.20 cus brief in Purdue Supreme	360.00 e Court case.
10/25/23 Edit draf	C K Marshall ft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.9	1.10 90); call with Wierenga regar	1,457.50 rding edits to same (.20).
10/25/23 Review o	D S Torborg draft amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case	0.50 e.	650.00
10/25/23 Review 2	A R Villar and comment on amicus brief in Purdue Supren	4.00 ne Court case.	2,700.00
10/25/23 Draft an (.2).	B J Wierenga d revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court	2.30 case (2.1); call with Marshal	1,955.00 l regarding edits to same
10/26/23 Review o	M A Cody drafts of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court	0.50 case.	737.50
10/26/23 Revise an	B B Erens micus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case (.20);	1.20 emails with internal team re	1,800.00 egarding same (1.00).
10/26/23 Draft cer	L Joseph rtificate of service and certificate of compliance	1.00 for amicus brief in Purdue S	375.00 Supreme Court case.

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 48 of 188

JONES DAY

161866	JOINES DAT	-		Page: 20
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC			ober 31, 2023 e: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
10/26/23 Edit draft a	C K Marshall micus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case.	0.90		1,192.50
10/26/23 Revise amic	A R Villar cus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case.	1.00		675.00
10/26/23 Draft and r	B J Wierenga revise amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case	<b>2.1</b> 0 e.		1,785.00
10/27/23 Review ami	A P Johnson icus briefs filed in Purdue Supreme Court case.	0.30		240.00
same (.20);	L Joseph d e-file amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court ca prepare and file same with Supreme Court clerk internal team regarding filing and service matter	(.30); coordinate ser		
10/27/23 Coordinate regarding sa	A R Villar filing and service of amicus brief in Purdue Supame (.20).	1.00 reme Court case (.80	)); emails with i	675.00 internal team
10/27/23 Correspond	B J Wierenga d with internal team regarding filing and service o	0.20 of amicus brief in Pu	ırdue Supreme	170.00 Court case.
10/28/23 Review mar	A P Johnson terials regarding potential litigation matter (1.3); a	2.40 analyze precedent re	lated to same (	1,920.00 1.1).
10/30/23 Review not	M A Cody ice of filing of amicus brief in Purdue Supreme C	0.20 Court case.		295.00
10/30/23 Emails with	B B Erens n internal team regarding amicus briefing in Purd	1.00 ue Supreme Court c	ase.	1,500.00
10/30/23 Review am: (.2).	A P Johnson icus briefs filed in Purdue Supreme Court case (A	0.80 6); revise notice of f	iling of Aldrich	640.00 a amicus brief
	Matter Total	219.40	USD	252,470.00
Professional Reten	tion/Fee Issues			
10/02/23 Review Eve	A P Johnson ert Weathersby Houff's August monthly stateme	0.50 nt.		400.00
10/02/23 Update elec	C L Smith ctronic file management system with monthly sta	0.10 stements.		47.50
10/03/23 Update elec	C L Smith ctronic file management system with monthly sta	0.10 tements.		47.50
10/04/23 Review LA	A P Johnson S interim fee application (.2); review emails from	0.30 Lombardi regardinş	g same (.1).	240.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 49 of 188 JONES DAY

	JONES	SDAY	
161866	110 1M P 7 110		Page: 21 October 31, 2023
Aldrich Pur	np LLC and Murray Boiler LLC	Ir	rvoice: 231307514
Date of Servi	ice Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
ema	P Lombardi iew order approving Robinson Cole interim fe il to Johnson concerning withdrawal of LAS in fessionals report (.3).		
10/05/23 Rev (.3).	A P Johnson iew Hamilton Stephens' June monthly statemen	0.40 ent (.1); review Robinson Cole's June n	320.00 monthly statement
10/05/23 Rev	D C Villalba iew monthly statements submitted by retained	0.80 professionals.	600.00
10/06/23 Rev	A P Johnson iew September monthly statements for Future	0.30 Claimants' Representative's profession	240.00 nals.
10/09/23 Rev	L C Fischer iew and analyze conflict inquiry reports in conf	6.00 nection with Jones Day supplemental	3,750.00 disclosure.
10/10/23 Rev	L C Fischer iew and analyze conflict inquiry reports in conf	6.50 nection with Jones Day supplemental	4,062.50 disclosure.
10/10/23 Rev	J L Gale iew recently submitted Asbestos Committee's p	0.10 professional's monthly statements.	62.50
10/11/23 Rev	L C Fischer iew and analyze conflict inquiry reports in conf	5.00 nection with Jones Day supplemental	3,125.00 disclosure.
10/11/23 Dra (.2).	A P Johnson ft emails to Bonito and Cumbo regarding inter	0.40 rim fee applications (.2); review preced	320.00 lent related to same
10/12/23 Rev	D C Villalba iew monthly statements submitted by profession	0.60 onals.	450.00
10/16/23 Rev	L C Fischer iew and analyze conflict inquiry reports in conf	4.80 nection with Jones Day supplemental	3,000.00 disclosure.
10/17/23 Dra (.1).	A P Johnson ft emails to Pratt, Bowen regarding ordinary co	0.20 ourse professional (.1); review materia	160.00 ls regarding same
10/18/23 Dra	A P Johnson ft email to Pratt regarding ordinary course pro	0.40 fessional (.1); review materials regardi	320.00 ng same (.3).
	D C Villalba nmunicate with Johnson regarding professiona supplemental disclosure (0.1).	0.20 al fee issues (0.1); draft email to Fische	150.00 er regarding Jones
10/20/23 Dra	L C Fischer ft and revise schedule for Jones Day suppleme	4.50 ental disclosure.	2,812.50
10/23/23 Dra	L C Fischer ft and revise Jones Day supplemental disclosur	5.00 re (3.0); review and analyze additional	3,125.00 conflict inquiry

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 50 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JUNESD	AI	
161866			Page: 22
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
reports relation	ng to same (2.0).		
10/23/23 Review Bates statement (.4)	A P Johnson White's September monthly statement (.7)	1.10 ); review Rayburn Cooper's So	880.00 eptember monthly
	L C Fischer vise schedule for Jones Day supplemental on nection with same (1.0).	6.00 disclosure (5.0); review and ar	3,750.00 nalyze conflict inquiry
10/24/23 Draft email to	A P Johnson  Steele regarding monthly statements.	0.20	160.00
	L C Fischer rise schedule for Jones Day supplemental dennection with same (2.00); emails with Villane (.30).		
	A P Johnson nt payments with Bartalone and Villalba (.4 naterials related to same (1.1).	1.70 ); draft emails to Villalba, Bar	1,360.00 rtalone regarding same
	D C Villalba Fischer regarding Jones Day supplemental of fessional fee issues (0.4); emails with Johns ne (0.2).		
reports in cor	L C Fischer rise schedule for Jones Day supplemental disnection with same (1.00); emails with interegarding schedule for supplemental disclo	rnal team regarding same (.50	
	A P Johnson Partners monthly statement (.2); submit san er, Canup regarding monthly statements (.2)		480.00 emails to Cumbo,
10/27/23 Review mater	A P Johnson rials regarding recent payments.	0.40	320.00
10/29/23 Review Bates	A P Johnson White's September monthly statement.	0.20	160.00
10/30/23 Review Asber	M A Cody stos Committee's professionals' fee issues.	0.50	737.50
review Evert (.2); review K	A P Johnson rials regarding recent payments (2.1); draft Weathersby Houff's September monthly statement (2.2). Bowen regarding same (.1).	tatement (.5); discuss same wi	ith Masiano and Canup
10/30/23	D C Villalba	0.50	375.00
Review mont	hly statements submitted by professionals	(311) emails with Johnson Re	artalone regarding came

Review monthly statements submitted by professionals (.30); emails with Johnson, Bartalone regarding same

(.20).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 51 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JONES D	AY	
161866			Page: 23 October 31, 2023
Aldrich Pu	mp LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231307514
Date of Serv	rice Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	A P Johnson view materials regarding recent payments (1.4); review ently filed Asbestos Committee's professionals' interi		1,600.00 nals report (.1); review
10/31/23 Up	C L Smith date electronic file management system with monthly	0.10 y statements.	47.50
	Matter Total	66.30	USD 44,415.00
Fee Applica	ation Preparation		
10/02/23 Re	A P Johnson view August monthly statement (.3); draft email to Sn	0.40 nith regarding same (.1).	320.00
	C L Smith aft Jones Day August monthly statement (.10); emails ice parties (.10); review and revise September invoice		
10/03/23 Res	C L Smith view and revise September invoice for privilege and c	3.10 compliance.	1,472.50
	C L Smith nails with Fresenko regarding September invoice mate vilege and compliance (1.80).	1.90 ters (.10); review and revise	902.50 September invoice for
10/05/23 Co	C L Smith mmunications with Fresenko regarding September in	0.10 voice.	47.50
	C L Smith mmunications with Fresenko regarding September in vilege and compliance (1.80).	1.90 voice (.10); review and revi	902.50 se September invoice for
10/16/23 Re	C L Smith view and revise September invoice for privilege and c	0.70 compliance.	332.50
10/17/23 Res	C L Smith view and revise September invoice for privilege and c	1.00 compliance.	475.00
10/18/23 Re	C L Smith view September invoice and forward same to Erens.	0.20	95.00
10/20/23 Rev	B B Erens view September invoice for privilege and compliance	0.50	750.00
	C L Smith I with Erens regarding comments to September invo oice (.10).	0.50 ice (.20); review and revise	237.50 same (.20); review revised
	A P Johnson view September monthly statement (.3); emails with S erim fee application (.5); draft emails to Villalba, Erns		960.00 eview materials related to

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 52 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT	L		
161866				Page: 24 er 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice:	231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
10/30/23 Draft Septemb parties (.10).	C L Smith eer monthly statement (.10); emails with Johns	0.30 son regarding same (	(.10); submit sam	142.50 te to notice
	A P Johnson als related to interim fee application (.8); draft with Villalba (.2).	1.10 t emails to Villalba, F	Ernst regarding s	880.00 ame (.1);
	Matter Total	13.90	USD	7,992.50
Asbestos Matters				
10/01/23 Communicate research (0.3).	M R Hirst with Erens, Cahow regarding PIQ research ((	0.50 0.2); review and follo	ow up regarding	637.50 PIQ
	B B Erens h internal team regarding status and planning PIQs (.80); emails with internal team regardin		regarding estima	1,950.00 tion
10/02/23 Telephone con	G M Gordon ference with internal team regarding status an	0.20 nd planning.		360.00
10/02/23 Attend call with	M R Hirst h internal team regarding status and planning	0.80		1,020.00
with internal te	M R Hirst with internal team and Bates White regarding cam regarding same and next steps (0.4); complege issues (0.3); analyze privilege issues (0.5).	municate with intern		
10/02/23 Attend call with	T B Lewis h internal team regarding status and planning	0.20		270.00
10/02/23 Emails with Ca	C L Smith show regarding precedent relating to PIQ ma	0.10 .tters.		47.50
10/02/23 Attend call with	D S Torborg h internal team regarding status and planning	0.10		130.00
10/03/23 Research regard (.2).	A Anderson ding PIQ issues (4.3); communications with I	4.50 Pratt regarding estim	ation discovery p	3,150.00 planning
	C K Cahow h Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff t n Masiano, Evert, Erens, Hirst regarding same			
10/03/23 Telephone con	M A Cody ference with Evert, Cahow, Erens, Masiano a	0.80 and Hirst regarding o	estimation discov	1,180.00 very.
10/03/23 Attend call with	B B Erens h Evert, Cahow, Cody, Hirst, Masiano regard	1.60 ling estimation disco	very (.70); prepa	2,400.00 re for Bates

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 53 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 25 October 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514 Hours Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Amount White call regarding estimation discovery (.20); attend call regarding same (.70). 10/03/23 5.70 3,990.00 R Hart Review materials relating to estimation matters (5.5); communicate with Pratt regarding estimation discovery planning (.2). 10/03/23 4.80 6,120.00 M R Hirst Attend call with Bates White regarding estimation discovery (0.7); attend estimation work in process call (0.9); attend call regarding estimation discovery with Cody, Cahow, Erens, Masiano (0.7); review trust discovery summaries (0.8); draft memo regarding next steps concerning estimation discovery (0.7); review status report for Manville trust discovery dispute proceeding (0.4); review status of anonymity appeals (0.3); communicate with client regarding same (0.3). 10/03/23 480.00 A P Johnson Attend estimation discovery call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams. 10/03/23 75.00 Communicate with Hart and Anderson regarding estimation discovery planning. 10/03/23 M R Seiden 0.70 962.50 Attend call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams regarding estimation discovery. 3.70 2,590.00 10/04/23 A Anderson Communicate with Pratt and Hart regarding estimation discovery document review protocol and privilege log matters (.7); research regarding PIQ issues (3.0). 10/04/23 3.60 2,520.00 R Hart Review materials relating to estimation matters (2.5); communicate with Hirst regarding trust discovery productions and status of anonymity appeals (.4); communications with Anderson and Pratt regarding estimation discovery document review and privilege log matters (.7). 10/04/23 M R Hirst 1,275.00 Finalize status report for Manville trust discovery dispute proceeding (0.4); communicate with Hart regarding trust discovery productions, anonymity appeals (0.4); review status of anonymity appeals (0.2). 10/04/23 A P Johnson 0.50 400.00 Review email from Hirst regarding trust discovery (.2); review status report for Manville trust discovery dispute proceeding (.3). 10/04/23 1.30 487.50 Communicate with Hart and Anderson regarding privilege log and document review protocol relating to estimation discovery (.7); draft search term list (.6). 10/04/23 C L Smith 0.50Research and update electronic file management system with precedent regarding PIQ matters (.40); email to internal team regarding same (.10). 10/04/23 1,430.00 D S Torborg 1.10 Revise status report for Manville trust discovery dispute proceeding (.90); prepare same for filing and file same (.20).

10/05/23 1,800.00 B B Erens 1.20 Emails with Hirst regarding estimation discovery issues (.20); prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters (.20); attend call regarding same (.80).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 54 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 26 October 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 10/05/23 M R Hirst 2.20 2,805.00 Prepare for (.20) and attend (.80) call with client regarding asbestos matters; communicate with Evert regarding estimation discovery matters (0.2); communicate with Erens regarding same (0.2); review research related to PIQ matters (0.3); revise draft response to insurance questions (0.3); review and respond to questions regarding estimation discovery document review (0.2). 10/05/23 E Pratt 0.60 225.00 Draft materials relating to review of documents in connection with estimation discovery (.3); communicate with Hart and Anderson regarding same (.1); communicate with vendor to schedule meeting concerning estimation discovery document review (.2). 10/06/23 A Anderson 1.50 1,050.00 Revise summary of research regarding PIQ issues (1.3); communicate with Pratt and Hart regarding estimation discovery document review matters (.2). 10/06/23 2.70 1,890.00 R Hart Research issues related to anonymity appeals (2.5); communicate with Pratt, Anderson regarding estimation discovery document review (.2). 10/06/23 M R Hirst 0.50 637.50 Review and revise summary of research regarding PIQ issues (0.3); communicate with internal team regarding PIQ issues (0.2). 10/06/23 E Pratt 1.40 525.00 Draft materials relating to review of documents in connection with estimation discovery (1.2); communicate with Hart and Anderson regarding same (.2). 10/09/23 A Anderson 4.30 Attend call with Masiano, Wright, Hirst, Hart regarding estimation discovery document review matters (1.5); draft estimation discovery document review protocol (2.8). 10/09/23 B B Erens 0.60 900.00 Attend call with internal team regarding status and planning (.40); communicate with Hirst regarding estimation discovery matters (.20). 10/09/23 G M Gordon 0.20 360.00 Attend call with internal team regarding status and planning. 10/09/23 4.90 3,430.00 R Hart Attend call with Masiano, Wright, Hirst, Anderson related to estimation discovery document review (1.5); review materials regarding estimation matters (1.9); research issues related to anonymity appeals (1.5). 10/09/23 M R Hirst 3.70 4,717.50 Attend call with internal team regarding status and planning (0.8); call with Evert regarding estimation status issues (1.0); call with Masiano, Wright, Hart, Anderson regarding estimation discovery document review issues (1.4); prepare for estimation discovery document review call (0.3); call with Erens regarding estimation discovery matters (0.2). 10/09/23 T B Lewis 0.20 270.00 Participate in call with internal team regarding status and planning.

0.40

550.00

Attend call with internal team regarding status and planning.

M R Seiden

10/09/23

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 55 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866	<b>y</b> • • -		Page: 27
Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC		October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/09/23 Communicat forward same	C L Smith tions with Erens regarding precedent orde e (.20).	0.30 er relating to estimation discov	142.50 rery (.10); research and
regarding sar	A Anderson ions to estimation discovery document reme (1.0); attend meeting concerning estimation discovery responses (.5).		
	B B Erens with Evert and Hirst regarding estimation of 70); call with client regarding same (.30); c		
10/10/23 Attend meets appeals (4.2)	R Hart ing concerning estimation discovery document.	5.20 ment review (1.0); research iss	3,640.00 ues regarding anonymity
(0.8); review	M R Hirst s White call regarding estimation (0.8); dra status of estimation discovery document s imation discovery (0.4).		
10/10/23 Attend call w	A P Johnson vith Cumbo, Erens, Cahow and Masiano r	0.40 regarding estimation discovery	320.00
10/10/23 Attend meet	M R Seiden ing concerning estimation discovery documents	0.60 ment review.	825.00
10/11/23 Draft motion	R Hart as to dismiss anonymity appeals.	6.80	4,760.00
estimation di	M R Hirst to Verus counsel regarding meet and confuscovery document review issues (0.7); pre with Evert regarding estimation claims s	epare for call concerning insura	
10/11/23 Prepare mate regarding sar	E Pratt erials relating to review of documents in erine (.2).	0.80 stimation discovery (.6); comm	300.00 nunicate with vendor
	B B Erens t call regarding asbestos matters (.50); atte 50); prepare regarding same (.20); review p		
10/12/23 Draft and ed	R Hart it motions to dismiss anonymity appeals.	2.10	1,470.00
issues and ca	M R Hirst (0.5) and attend (0.5) call with Evert, Eren (se status; finalize email to Verus counsel to property appeals (1.5); review precedent of	regarding trust production (0.4	; revise draft motions

to dismiss anonymity appeals (1.5); review precedent order relating to estimation discovery (0.2).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 56 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES D	AI	
161866	IC IM D'I IIC		Page: 28 October 31, 2023
Alarich Pump I	LC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/13/23 Review d	B B Erens levelopments in precedent case concerning insu	0.20 parance matters.	300.00
	M R Hirst Tananbaum regarding asbestos matters (0.2); r nmunicate with internal team regarding estimat		
10/16/23 Attend o	B B Erens call with internal team regarding status and plan	0.30 aning.	450.00
10/16/23 Telephor	G M Gordon ne conference with internal team regarding statt	0.10 us and planning.	180.00
estimatio internal t	M R Hirst nicate with McCarter & English team regarding on discovery (0.3); review precedent order relative team regarding estimation status (0.2); prepare for g status and planning.	ng to estimation discovery	(0.3); communicate with
10/16/23 Participa	T B Lewis te in call with internal team regarding status and	0.10 d planning.	135.00
10/16/23 Attend ca	M R Seiden all with internal team regarding status and next	0.50 steps.	687.50
10/16/23 Attend ca	D S Torborg all with internal team regarding status and next	0.20 steps.	260.00
10/17/23 Review p	R Hart privileged documents in connection with estima	0.40 ation discovery.	280.00
	M R Hirst stimation work in process call (0.7); review pro- licate with internal team regarding estimation di		1,530.00 mple order (0.2);
	E Pratt nicate with vendor regarding matters concerning to database for estimation discovery document r		
10/18/23 Telephor (.20).	B B Erens ne call with Hirst regarding estimation claims sa	0.40 ample issues (.20); review p	600.00 recedent regarding same
10/18/23 Revise m	R Hart notions to dismiss anonymity appeals.	0.30	210.00
dismiss a	M R Hirst emo regarding estimation claims sample order prononymity appeals (0.3); communicate with Ere ith Smith regarding same (0.1).		
10/18/23	C L Smith	0.10	47.50

Review Hirst email regarding precedent estimation claims sample order and forward same.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 57 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES DA	11	
161866			Page: 29 October 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/19/23 Communica	A Anderson ate with estimation discovery document review	0.50 w team regarding documer	350.00 at review.
10/19/23 Attend clier	B B Erens nt call regarding asbestos matters.	1.00	1,500.00
10/19/23 Draft and re	R Hart evise motions to dismiss anonymity appeals.	2.00	1,400.00
	M R Hirst with McCarter & English team regarding estin on discovery document review issues (0.7); cor		
communica	E Pratt ate with vendor regarding matters concerning to with vendor regarding database relating to ording same (.2).		
10/20/23 Review pred	M A Cody cedent hearing transcript regarding estimation	0.80 discovery issues and relate	1,180.00 ed matters.
counsel con	M R Hirst munications regarding estimation claims samp accrning trust productions (0.1); communicate te with internal team regarding insurance que	with Bates White regarding	
10/22/23 Review estin	M R Hirst mation discovery document review issues.	0.40	510.00
from Asbes	M R Hirst ate with internal team regarding estimation cla tos Committee counsel regarding same (0.2); uests (0.2); review status of estimation discov	communicate with internal	
10/24/23 Attend call	C K Cahow with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Hou	0.40 ff teams regarding estimati	460.00 ion matters.
	B B Erens with Bates White and Evert Weathersby team nigle, Evert and Hirst regarding estimation di		1,500.00 tters (.50); attend call
attend call v	M R Hirst (0.3) and attend (0.5) call with Bates White ar with Erens, McGonigle, Evert regarding estimelated issues (0.5).	-	0 0
	A P Johnson with Bates White and Evert Weathersby team com hearing in precedent case regarding estim		720.00 tters (.4); review
*	B B Erens meetings with client regarding asbestos matter	1.20 ers (.20); attend call with M	1,800.00 IcGonigle, Hirst, Evert

and Roten regarding estimation discovery (1.00).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 58 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOINED DI	L I	
161866			Page: 30 October 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231307514
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
same (0.3); rev	M R Hirst th Roten, McGonigle, Evert, Erens regarding iew follow up regarding same (0.3); revise of with Anderson regarding same (0.2).		
10/25/23 Review transcr	A P Johnson ript from hearing in precedent case regarding	0.20 ag estimation discovery.	160.00
10/26/23 Attend call wit	B B Erens h client regarding asbestos matters (.90); pr	1.10 reparation with Evert rega	1,650.00 rding same (.20).
document revi	M R Hirst 0) and attend (.90) call with client regarding ew issues (1.2); revise motions to dismiss as g estimation discovery issues (0.3).		
10/27/23 Draft and revis	A Anderson se motions to dismiss anonymity appeals.	2.10	1,470.00
	M R Hirst tion discovery document review issues (0.8) seals (0.9); review estimation claims sample		2,677.50 motions for dismissal of
10/27/23 Review propos	A P Johnson sed estimation claims sample order.	0.30	240.00
10/29/23 Review motion discovery issue	M R Hirst as to dismiss anonymity appeals (0.4); comes (0.4).	0.80 municate with internal tear	1,020.00 m regarding estimation
	A Anderson s to dismiss anonymity appeals.	0.50	350.00
matching clain	M R Hirst notions to dismiss anonymity appeals (1.6); nants meet and confer list concerning trust regarding status of estimation discovery (0.5)	discovery and assess same	
10/31/23 Attend estimat	C K Cahow cion discovery call with Bates White and Ev	0.30 vert Weathersby Houff tea	345.00 ms.
10/31/23 Attend call wit	M C Corcoran h Bates White and Evert Weathersby team	0.30 s regarding estimation disc	315.00 covery.
10/31/23 Attend estimat same (.20).	B B Erens cion discovery call with Bates White and Ev	0.50 vert Weathersby Houff tea	750.00 ms (.30); prepare for
	R Hart h internal team related to estimation discovery matters (0.2)	0.80 very (0.6); review correspo	560.00 ndence related to

matching claimants trust discovery matters (0.2).

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 59 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 31

October 31, 2023 Invoice: 231307514

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

10/31/23 M R Hirst 4.50 5,737.50

Attend conference call with Bates White team and Evert Weathersby team regarding estimation discovery (0.3); prepare for same (0.2); attend estimation work in process call (0.5); conference call with internal team regarding estimation discovery and next steps (0.6); analyze matters concerning estimation discovery issues (0.9); draft email to Verus counsel regarding meet and confer concerning trust discovery (0.6); revise and finalize motions to dismiss anonymity appeals (1.2); communicate with internal team regarding estimation discovery (0.2).

10/31/23 A P Johnson 0.30 240.00

Attend estimation discovery call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams.

10/31/23 P Lombardi 0.30 210.00

Review issues and materials relating to estimation matters.

10/31/23 D S Torborg 1.30 1,690.00

Research concerning matters relating to Manville trust discovery dispute proceeding.

Matter Total 141.80 USD 145,082.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 60 of 188 JONES DAY

Invoice: 231307514

161866 Page: 32 October 31, 2023

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Disbursement Detail

Date	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Location	Amount	Total
Case Administration and	d Business Operations			
TRAVEL - AIR FARE				
10/19/23	A P Johnson o Charlotte, NC to attend July 14, 2023 hearing.	CHI	569.80	
10/19/23 Airfare - Travel to	A P Johnson Washington D.C. to attend July 25, 2023 mediation.	CHI	486.55	
10/19/23 Airfare - Travel to	A P Johnson o Charlotte, NC to attend August 9, 2023 hearing.	CHI	267.55	
10/19/23 Airfare - Travel to	A P Johnson o Charlotte, NC to attend August 9, 2023 hearing.	CHI	261.15	
Travel - Air Fare Subtota	al			1,585.05
TRAVEL - FOOD AND	BEVERAGE EXPENSES			
10/19/23 Meals Other - Att	A P Johnson tend July 25, 2023 mediation in Washington D.C.	CHI	31.50	
Travel - Food and Bever	age Expenses Subtotal			31.50
TRAVEL - HOTEL CH	ARGES			
10/19/23 Lodging - Travel	A P Johnson to Charlotte, NC to attend July 14, 2023 hearing.	CHI	390.70	
10/19/23 Lodging - Travel	A P Johnson to Washington D.C. to attend July 25, 2023 mediation.	CHI	370.03	
10/19/23 Lodging - Travel	A P Johnson to Charlotte, NC to attend August 9, 2023 hearing.	CHI	343.56	
Travel - Hotel Charges S	Subtotal			1,104.29
UNITED PARCEL SER	RVICE CHARGES			
10/04/23 Ship To: Clare M	M A Cody . Masiano.	CHI	3.38	
10/04/23 Ship To: Clare M	M A Cody I. Masiano.	CHI	28.52	
10/26/23 Ship To: Kevin C	L Joseph Maclay, Caplin and Drysdale, Chartered.	WAS	15.09	
10/26/23 Ship To: Elizabet	L Joseph h Prelogar, Solicitor General U.S. D.O.J.	WAS	15.09	
10/26/23 Ship To: Paul D.	L Joseph Clement, Clement & Murphy, PLLC.	WAS	19.21	
10/26/23 Ship To: Roy T. I	L Joseph Englert Jr., Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP.	WAS	15.09	
10/26/23 Ship To: John Ch	L Joseph ristopher Sho, White & Case LLP.	WAS	15.09	
10/26/23 Ship To: Mara A.	L Joseph Leventhal, Joseph Hage Aaronson LLC.	WAS	15.09	

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 61 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866 Page: 33
October 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231307514

Date 10/26/23	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name L Joseph	Location WAS	Amount 15.09	Total
Ship To:	Michael Sague, Quinn, Eisenberg & Baum LLP.			
10/26/23	L Joseph	WAS	14.17	
Ship To:	Brian Thomas Edmunds, Office of the Attorney General.			
10/26/23	L Joseph	WAS	15.09	
Ship To:	Gregory George, Garr, Latham & Watkins LLP.			
10/26/23	L Joseph	WAS	16.54	
Ship To:	Joshua Patashnik, California Department of Justice.			
10/27/23	L Joseph	WAS	20.01	
Ship To:	Joseph Cecere, Cecere, PC.			
10/27/23	L Joseph	WAS	15.09	
Ship To:	Pratik Arvind Shah, Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP.			
10/31/23	L Joseph	WAS	20.01	
Ship To:	Joseph Cecere, Cecere, PC.			
United Parcel Se	rvice Charges Subtotal			242.56
Matter T	otal		USD	2,963.40

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

### FORTY-FIRST MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2023

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Forty-First Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From November 1, 2023 Through November 30, 2023 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

#### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

1. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period November 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

#### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$542,820.00
Total Expenses	\$2,455.40
TOTAL	\$545,275.40

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 63 of 188

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$490,993.40 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

#### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

4. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036 (Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc., (I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103 (Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter & English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019 (Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC, 1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 64 of 188

Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than January 16, 2024 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 6. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.
- 7. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 65 of 188

Dated: January 2, 2024

Chicago, Illinois

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585 E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com

macody@jonesday.com ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 66 of 188

#### **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

#### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800 Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

November 30, 2023 161866 Invoice: 231308293

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through November 30, 2023:

	<u>Hours</u>		<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	31.30		34,380.00
Claims Administration	50.80		67,630.00
General Corporate and Real Estate	28.90		40,167.50
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator			
Reporting	5.30		4,675.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	121.60		147,135.00
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	73.10		60,365.00
Fee Application Preparation	38.60		28,605.00
Asbestos Matters	146.90		159,862.50
Total Fees	496.50	USD	542,820.00
Total Billed Disbursements		USD	2,455.40
TOTAL		USD	545,275.40

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 68 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 2 November 30, 2023

Invoice: 231308293

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Disbursement & Charges Summary

Printing Charges 2,249.32 United Parcel Service Charges 206.08

USD 2,455.40

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 69 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 3 November 30, 2023

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – November 30, 2023

Invoice: 231308293

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
R E Blake	Partner	2011	1.50	1,300.00	1,950.00
M A Cody	Partner	1996	104.10	1,475.00	153,547.50
M C Corcoran	Partner	2004	4.00	1,050.00	4,200.00
B B Erens	Partner	1991	47.80	1,500.00	71,700.00
G M Gordon	Partner	1980	0.80	1,800.00	1,440.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	53.70	1,275.00	68,467.50
J M Jones	Partner	1986	0.80	1,600.00	1,280.00
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	23.00	1,350.00	31,050.00
C K Marshall	Partner	2001	1.00	1,325.00	1,325.00
D S Torborg	Partner	1998	29.10	1,300.00	37,830.00
Total			265.80		372,790.00
M R Seiden	Of Counsel	1992 _	3.90	1,375.00	5,362.50
Total			3.90		5,362.50
A Anderson	Associate	2021	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
C K Cahow	Associate	2014	16.10	1,150.00	18,515.00
E M Dowling	Associate	2022	21.70	625.00	13,562.50
J L Gale	Associate	2022	3.90	625.00	2,437.50
R Hart	Associate	2021	11.30	700.00	7,910.00
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	85.20	800.00	68,160.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2021	29.90	700.00	20,930.00
D C Villalba	Associate	2019	22.80	750.00	17,100.00
Total			192.90		150,015.00
C L Smith	Paralegal	_	19.40	475.00	9,215.00
Total			19.40		9,215.00
E Pratt	Project Manager	_	14.50	375.00	5,437.50
Total			14.50		5,437.50
Total			496.50	USD	542,820.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 70 of 188 JONES DAY

Invoice: 231308293

161866 Page: 4 November 30, 2023

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Fee Detail

Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Case Administrat	tion and Business Operations		
11/01/23 Review as	C L Smith nd distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
	C L Smith and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ith same (.10).	0.20 documents and update electro	95.00 onic file management
11/03/23 Update ca	J L Gale alendar of key dates and deadlines (0.4).	0.40	250.00
	C L Smith and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ith same (.10).	0.20 documents and update electro	95.00 onic file management
11/06/23 Review as	C L Smith nd distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/07/23 Review ta	A P Johnson ask list (.2); review service list (.3); revise same	0.70 (.2).	560.00
11/07/23 Review as	C L Smith nd distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/08/23 Review as	C L Smith nd distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/09/23 Review as	C L Smith nd distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/10/23 Draft upo	J L Gale dated calendar of key dates and deadlines (0.6).	0.60	375.00
11/10/23 Review ca	A P Johnson alendar of key dates and deadlines (.2).	0.20	160.00
	C L Smith and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ith same (.10).	0.20 documents and update electro	95.00 onic file management
	C L Smith and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ith same (.10).	0.20 documents and update electro	95.00 onic file management
11/14/23 Attend w	C K Cahow ork in process call with internal team and advis	1.00 sors.	1,150.00
	M A Cody york in process report and updated task list (1.1 process matters (1.1).	2.20 ); telephone conference with a	3,245.00 advisors regarding

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 71 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT		
161866			Page: 5 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/14/23 Attend work in	M C Corcoran process call with advisors (1.0).	1.00	1,050.00
11/14/23 Prepare for advergarding same	B B Erens visor work in process call (.30); attend call regard (.20).	1.50 arding same (1.0); teleph	2,250.00 one call with Cahow
11/14/23 Review task lis advisors (1.0).	A P Johnson t (.2); revise same (.4); revise work in process t	1.90 eport (.3); attend work i	1,520.00 n process call with
11/14/23 Participate in v	T B Lewis work in process call with advisors (1.0).	1.00	1,350.00
11/14/23 Attend work in	M R Seiden process call with advisors (0.7).	0.70	962.50
11/14/23 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/14/23 Attend work in	D S Torborg process call with advisors (1.0).	1.00	1,300.00
11/15/23 Review case ad	C K Cahow ministration matters (.40); communications w	0.70 ith Smith regarding sam	805.00 e (.30).
11/15/23 Review and org	B B Erens ganize upcoming tasks (.60); emails with Gord	0.80 on regarding same (.20).	1,200.00
11/15/23 Review and res	G M Gordon spond to email from Erens regarding upcomin	0.20 g tasks.	360.00
11/15/23 Revise task list	A P Johnson (.2); revise calendar of key dates and deadlines	0.30 s (.1).	240.00
system with sar communication	C L Smith stribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed docume (.10); update electronic file management syns with internal team regarding same (.20); commatters (.20); follow up call with Cahow regarding same (.20);	stem with case materials mmunications with Caho	s (1.00); ow regarding case
11/16/23 Review case ad	C K Cahow ministration matters (.40); call with Smith rega	0.50 arding same (.10).	575.00
	C L Smith stribute docket (.10); call with Cahow regarding with internal team regarding same (.10).	0.30 g case administration ma	142.50 atters (.10);
11/17/23 Update calenda	J L Gale ar of key dates and deadlines (0.6).	0.60	375.00
11/17/23 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	47.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 72 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	L	
161866	1M D 7 H 0		Page: 6 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/24/23 Draft updated	J L Gale calendar of key dates and deadlines (0.3).	0.30	187.50
11/24/23 Review calend	A P Johnson ar of key dates and deadlines (.3).	0.30	240.00
11/27/23 Review upcom	M A Cody ning tasks and related matters (.5).	0.50	737.50
	B B Erens ecoming work in process call (.90); telephone iew and revise task list regarding same (.40).	1.50 call with Lombardi regard	2,250.00 ding tasks regarding
11/27/23 Review task lis	A P Johnson st (.2); revise same (.3); draft emails to Erens,	0.60 Hirst regarding same (.1)	480.00
11/27/23 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/28/23 Attend work in	C K Cahow n process call with internal team and advisors	1.00	1,150.00
	M A Cody ed task list in advance of work in process call is in process matters (.9); review work in proc		3,245.00 e with advisors
11/28/23 Prepare for ad	B B Erens visor work in process call (.40); attend call re	1.20 garding same (.80).	1,800.00
11/28/23 Review task lis advisors (.9).	A P Johnson st (.2); revise same (.6); revise work in process	2.00 s report (.3); attend work	1,600.00 in process call with
11/28/23 Participate in	T B Lewis work in process call with advisors.	1.00	1,350.00
11/28/23 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/29/23 Address case a	C K Cahow administration matters.	0.20	230.00
11/29/23 Revise task list	A P Johnson (.2); revise work in process report (.2).	0.40	320.00
11/29/23 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	47.50
11/30/23 Prepare for cli	B B Erens ent call regarding case status (.50); communic	0.70 cations with Johnson rega	1,050.00 arding same (.20).
11/30/23 Discuss status	A P Johnson of case with Erens (.2).	0.20	160.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 73 of 188 JONES DAY

161866	JOINES BILL		Page: 7
	and Murray Boiler LLC		November 30, 2023 Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/30/23 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	47.50
	Matter Total	31.30	USD 34,380.00
Claims Administration	1		
	M A Cody rise drafts of letter regarding claims issues (1.6); aund materials regarding same (1.1); review mate g same (.1).		
11/01/23 Review emails	A P Johnson from Masiano regarding claims issues (.2).	0.20	160.00
	M A Cody rise correspondence regarding claims issues and n connection with same (1.2).	2.30 PIQ compliance	3,392.50 (1.1); review related exhibits
11/03/23 Review corresp and related ma	M A Cody condence regarding claims issues and PIQ computerials (1.1).	1.80 diance (.7); review	2,655.00 w PIQ compliance reports
11/03/23 Review emails related to same	A P Johnson from Masiano, Miller regarding PIQ compliance (.6).	1.10 e and claims issue	880.00 es (.5); analyze summary
11/04/23 Review emails related to same	A P Johnson from Masiano, Miller regarding PIQ compliance (.2).	0.40 e and claims issue	320.00 es (.2); analyze summary
11/06/23 Review PIQ co	M A Cody ompliance reports and related correspondence (1	1.20	1,770.00
11/06/23 Telephone con materials (.5).	M A Cody ference with Lombardi regarding claims issues a	0.60 and materials rela	885.00 string to same (.1); review
11/07/23 Review corresp	M A Cody condence and materials related to claims issues a	1.80 .nd PIQ complia	2,655.00 nce (1.8).
	M A Cody ference with Sands regarding claims issues (.4); (.1); review materials in connection with same (		1,770.00 rence with Lombardi
11/07/23 Discuss claims	P Lombardi matters with Cody (.1); review materials concern	0.20 ning same (.1).	140.00
	M A Cody alyze PIQ compliance reports and related corresding PIQ order and compliance (2.3).	3.40 pondence (1.1);	5,015.00 review transcripts and related

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 74 of 188 JONES DAY

		JONES DAY		
161866				Page: 8 November 30, 2023
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of	<i>Service</i>	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/09/2	Review PIQ co	M A Cody impliance reports and related correspondence (2.5); nt and transcripts related to claims issues and PIQ		6,047.50 ano regarding same (.3);
11/09/2		A P Johnson from Masiano regarding PIQ compliance and claim	0.20 as issues.	160.00
11/10/2	Review and ana	M A Cody alyze correspondence related to PIQ compliance an (.5); review emails from Masiano regarding claims in		5,015.00 (2.6); review claims
11/10/2		M A Cody ise draft correspondence to claimant regarding clai (.2).	0.70 ms issue (.5); emai	1,032.50 ls with Lombardi
11/10/2		A P Johnson summary from Miller (.4).	0.40	320.00
11/10/2		P Lombardi matters (1.2); emails regarding same with Cody (.2)	1.40	980.00
11/13/2	Emails with cla	M A Cody imants and Masiano regarding PIQ compliance and mpliance reports and related correspondence (2.6).		4,277.50 ls (.3); review and
11/14/2		M A Cody alyze claims issues and PIQ compliance and related	1.20 correspondence (	1,770.00 1.2).
11/14/2		M A Cody ls relating to claims matters (.3); communications v	0.60 vith Lombardi reg	885.00 arding same (.3).
11/14/2		P Lombardi matters (.6); discuss same with Cody (.3).	0.90	630.00
11/15/2		M A Cody alyze claims and PIQ submissions (1.4); emails with	1.70 Masiano regardin	2,507.50 g same (.3).
11/15/2		M A Cody ise email to claimant regarding claims matters (.5);	0.80 communications v	1,180.00 with Lombardi regarding
11/15/2		P Lombardi matters (.6); discuss same with Cody (.3); draft ema	1.10 ail to Sands concer	770.00 rning same (.2).
11/16/2		M A Cody asiano regarding PIQ compliance and claims issues (.5).	0.80 (.3); review and ar	1,180.00 nalyze PIQ responses
11/17/2		M A Cody asiano regarding claims issues (.3); review PIQ com	1.10 pliance reports (.8	1,622.50
11/17/2		A P Johnson d claims register.	0.20	160.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 75 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOINE	O DITI	
161866			Page: 9 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pum	p LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	e Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/20/23 Revie same	M A Cody w correspondence regarding PIQ compliance (.2).	1.40 ee and claims issues (1.2); emails v	2,065.00 with Masiano regarding
11/21/23 Email	M A Cody ls regarding PIQ compliance issues and clain	0.80 n withdrawals (.8).	1,180.00
11/24/23 Revie	A P Johnson w claims register.	0.30	240.00
	M A Cody w and analyze correspondence related to class Qs (1.1).	1.90 ims issues and PIQ responses (.8	2,802.50 8); review materials relating
11/27/23 Revie	A P Johnson w claims register (.3); review emails from Mi	0.40 ller, Masiano regarding same (.1)	320.00
	M A Cody w materials and address claims issues (.7); di d to claim objections (.7).	1.50 scuss claims matters with Lomba	2,212.50 ardi (.1); review precedent
11/28/23 Discu	P Lombardi ass claims matters with Cody (.1); draft email	0.20 to Sands concerning same (.1).	140.00
	M A Cody w correspondence regarding PIQ complianc liscuss claims matters with Lombardi (.1).	0.70 ee (.3); emails with Masiano and J	1,032.50 ohnson regarding same
	A P Johnson we emails from Cody, Masiano regarding correspondence (.3); discuss same with Masiano (.		640.00 mpliance (.3); review
	P Lombardi w email from Sands concerning claims matte draft email to Sands concerning same (.1).	1.70 ers (.1); discuss claims matters wi	1,190.00 th Cody (.1); analyze same
11/30/23 Revie	M A Cody w claims correspondence and PIQ complian	1.10 ace report.	1,622.50
	A P Johnson we emails from Cody, Masiano regarding corns ss same with Masiano, Cody (.2).	0.50 respondence concerning claims a	400.00 and PIQ compliance (.3);
	Matter Total	50.80	USD 67,630.00
General Corpo	orate and Real Estate		
	T B Lewis are draft minutes for recent board meetings (orate matters (0.4).	4.70 4.3); participate in call with Tana	6,345.00 nbaum regarding
11/08/23	T B Lewis	1.50	2,025.00

Participate in call with Tananbaum and Smith regarding corporate matters (0.5); review and revise materials

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 76 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866	<b>J</b> 02. <b>2</b> 02			Page: 10
Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC			per 30, 2023 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
concerning s	ame (1.0).			
11/09/23 Review and a corporate ma	T B Lewis revise materials concerning corporate matter (0.5).	1.00 ers (0.5); participate in call	with Tananba	1,350.00 um regarding
11/10/23 Revise mater	T B Lewis regarding corporate matters.	4.00		5,400.00
11/14/23 Telephone co	M A Cody conference with Lewis regarding corporate (6).	3.10 issues (.5); review and analy	yze materials i	4,572.50 n connection
11/14/23 Participate in	T B Lewis a call with Cody regarding corporate matter	0.50 rs (.5).		675.00
11/16/23 Review mate	M A Cody rials related to corporate issues.	1.80		2,655.00
11/20/23 Review emai	M A Cody l regarding corporate disclosure (.1); analyz	0.60 ze issues regarding same (.5	5).	885.00
11/20/23 Review emai	B B Erens l from client regarding corporate disclosure	0.30 e.		450.00
-	T B Lewis a call with Tananbaum, Vales, Zafari, Molin accerning same (0.5).	1.00 n and Smith regarding corp	oorate matters	1,350.00 (0.5); revise
	M A Cody revise corporate disclosure (1.1); emails wit connection with same (1.6).	3.00 th Erens and Lewis regardi	ng same (.3); 1	4,425.00 review
11/21/23 Emails with	B B Erens Cody, Lewis regarding corporate disclosure	0.30 e matters.		450.00
	T B Lewis revise materials regarding corporate matter Erens, Cody regarding same (.30).	4.30 s (2.10); review and revise	corporate disc	5,805.00 losure (1.90);
11/27/23 Finalize and	T B Lewis circulate materials regarding corporate materials	2.80 tters (0.8); review and organ	nize same (2.0	<b>3,</b> 780.00
	Matter Total	28.90	USD	40,167.50
Schedules/SOFA/B	ankruptcy Administrator Reporting			
11/27/23 Review Septe	A P Johnson ember monthly status reports (.2); draft em	0.30 nails to Lombardi, Clarrey,	Hakim regard	240.00 ing same (.1).
	M A Cody Lombardi regarding monthly status reports nsider related issues (.3).	0.50 s (.1); telephone conference	e with Johnson	737.50 n regarding

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 77 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 11 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 11/29/23 A P Johnson 1.10 880.00 Review October monthly status reports (.3); draft emails to Lombardi, Clarrey, Hakim regarding same (.1); discuss same with Lombardi, Cody (.2); review emails from Lombardi regarding same (.3); draft emails to Lombardi regarding same (.2). 11/29/23 P Lombardi 1,260.00 1.80 Review October monthly status reports (.7); draft email to Clarrey and Hakim regarding revisions to monthly status reports (.2); review correspondence concerning monthly status reports (.2); analyze potential revision to same (.3); draft emails to Johnson concerning same (.2); draft emails to Miller and Tomsic concerning same (.2). 11/30/23 M A Cody 0.50 737.50 Review October monthly status reports for filing (.4); meet with Johnson regarding same (.1). 11/30/23 0.50 400.00 A P Johnson Review October monthly status reports (.2); meet with Cody regarding same (.1); review emails from Miller, Clarrey, Lombardi regarding same (.2). 11/30/23 P Lombardi 0.60 420.00 Draft email to Clarrey and Hakim regarding revision to Murray monthly status report (.1); review revised status reports (.3); draft emails to Cody and Johnson concerning same (.1); draft email to Miller and Tomsic concerning same (.1). **Matter Total** 5.30 **USD** 4,675.00 Litigation and Adversary Proceedings 11/06/23 0.30 345.00 Communicate with internal team regarding potential next steps relating to dismissal matters. 11/06/23 0.80 1,180.00 M A Cody Review District Court opinion in Bestwall concerning motion for leave to appeal dismissal order (.8). 11/06/23 1.00 1,500.00 B B Erens Review District Court opinion in Bestwall on motion for leave to appeal dismissal order (.50); telephone call with client regarding same (.30); emails with Gordon regarding same (.20). 11/06/23 M R Hirst 0.20255.00 Review District Court opinion in Bestwall on motion for leave to appeal dismissal order (0.2). 11/07/23 C K Cahow 345.00 Review District Court opinion in Bestwall on motion for leave to appeal dismissal order and correspondence with company regarding same. 11/07/23 A P Johnson 0.80 640.00 Review District Court opinion in Bestwall on motion for leave to appeal dismissal order (.6); review emails from Tananbaum, Erens, Miller regarding same (.2). 11/07/23 390.00 D S Torborg

Review District Court opinion in Bestwall on motion for leave to appeal dismissal order.

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 78 of 188

JONES DAY

	JOINES DAT		
161866			Page: 12 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/08/23 Review District	M A Cody t Court opinion in Bestwall on motion for lear	0.80 ve to appeal dismissal o	1,180.00 order (.8).
	M R Hirst of supplemental authority concerning District ssal order (0.2).	0.20 Court opinion in Besty	255.00 wall on motion for leave
	A P Johnson of supplemental authority concerning Bestwal order (.3); review emails from Miller regardi		400.00 a on motion for leave to
	B B Erens als regarding substantive consolidation proceed rs (.10); conference call with advisor and Gor		
11/10/23 Telephone con Erens regarding	G M Gordon ference with Erens regarding appellate issues g same (.30).	0.40 (.10); telephone confere	720.00 ences with advisor and
11/10/23 Review Asbesto	M R Hirst os Committee discovery requests in derivative	0.20 litigation adversary pro	255.00 occeedings.
	A P Johnson of supplemental authority concerning Bestwal order (.1); revise same (.2); review materials		560.00 n on motion for leave to
11/11/23 Review discove	D S Torborg ery served by the Asbestos Committee in the c	0.30 derivative litigation adve	390.00 ersary proceedings (.3).
11/13/23 Review precede	M A Cody ent opinions and materials relating to dismissa	0.80 Il matters.	1,180.00
	M R Hirst os Committee discovery served in the derivati with internal team regarding Asbestos Commi		
	A P Johnson Il District Court opinion on motion for leave missal matters (.4).	0.70 to appeal dismissal ord	560.00 er (.3); review precedent
11/13/23 Review draft at	D S Torborg Firmative discovery requests to be served in st	0.40 ubstantive consolidation	520.00 n proceeding (.4).
11/14/23 Telephone call	B B Erens with Marshall regarding appellate issues (.20);	0.50 telephone calls with cli	750.00 ient regarding same (.30).
11/14/23 Call with Erens	C K Marshall regarding appellate matters (.20); research re	0.50 garding same (.30).	662.50
	C L Smith nic file management system with Asbestos Co sary proceedings.	0.10 mmittee discovery requ	47.50 nests served in derivative

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 79 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 13 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 0.90 11/15/23 C K Cahow 1,035.00 Review and analyze discovery requests served in derivative litigation adversary proceedings. 1.60 11/15/23 M A Cody 2,360.00 Review and analyze discovery requests from precedent cases in connection with derivative litigation proceedings discovery (.8); review memoranda and filings regarding same (.8). 11/15/23 M R Hirst 892.50 Review of discovery served by Asbestos Committee in derivative litigation adversary proceedings. 880.00 11/15/23 A P Johnson 1.10 Review precedent related to dismissal matters (.9); discuss same with Dowling (.1); draft email to Dowling regarding same (.1). 11/16/23 5,900.00 4.00 M A Cody Telephone conference with Erens regarding derivative litigation proceedings discovery issues (.2); review and analyze discovery requests (1.5); review substantive consolidation pleadings in connection with same (2.3).11/16/23 E M Dowling 1.80 1,125.00 Discuss precedent concerning dismissal matters with Johnson (.2); draft analysis concerning same (1.3); draft email to Johnson regarding analysis (.3). 11/16/23 B B Erens 3.80 5,700.00 Review Asbestos Committee discovery requests served in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.60); telephone call with Torborg regarding same (.30); telephone call with Hirst regarding same (.20); emails with internal team regarding agenda for upcoming call concerning same (.40); revise agenda (.30); telephone call with Cody regarding same (.20); emails with Torborg regarding issues relating to same (.40); review (.20) and respond (.20) to Hirst email regarding discovery issues. 11/16/23 M R Hirst 0.80 1,020.00 Review and analyze Asbestos Committee discovery requests served in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (0.2); call with Erens regarding same (0.2); review and revise draft agenda for upcoming call concerning Asbestos Committee discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (0.2); emails with Erens regarding discovery issues (0.2). 11/16/23 A P Johnson 1.20 960.00 Review precedent related to dismissal matters (.5); discuss same with Lombardi (.2); discuss same with Dowling (.2); review email from Dowling regarding same (.3). 11/16/23 P Lombardi 2.30 1,610.00 Discuss precedent concerning dismissal matters with Johnson (.2); research precedent concerning dismissal matters (2.1). 11/16/23 D S Torborg 5.60 7,280.00 Review discovery requests served by the Asbestos Committee in the derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.7); discuss same with Erens (.3); draft and revise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (3.6). 11/17/23 1,950.00 R E Blake 1.50

Participate in call with client, internal team and advisors regarding discovery requests in derivative litigation

adversary proceedings (1.00); communications with Seiden and Torborg regarding same (.50).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 80 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 14 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 11/17/23 C K Cahow 1.20 1,380.00 Attend call with client, internal team and Evert Weathersby Houff team regarding discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.0); prepare for same (.20). 8,997.50 11/17/23 M A Cody 6.10 Review draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.8); review Asbestos Committee derivative litigation proceedings discovery requests (.8); review and analyze substantive consolidation pleadings and related materials (3.2); telephone conference with internal team, client and advisors regarding responses to Asbestos Committee derivative litigation proceedings discovery requests (1.0); review issues list and agenda to prepare for same (.3). 11/17/23 1.90 2,850.00 B B Erens Prepare for call regarding responses to Asbestos Committee derivative litigation proceedings discovery requests (.50); attend telephone conference with internal team, client and advisors regarding same (1.00); review materials regarding same (.40). 11/17/23 M R Hirst 2.30 2,932.50 Attend telephone conference with internal team, client and advisors regarding responses to Asbestos Committee derivative litigation proceedings discovery requests (1.0); review discovery requests (1.3). 11/17/23 A P Johnson 480.00 Review precedent related to dismissal matters (.4); review email from Dowling regarding same (.2). 11/17/23 P Lombardi 3.10 2,170.00 Review precedent concerning dismissal matters (2.8); draft memorandum concerning same (.3). 1.10 11/17/23 1,512.50 M R Seiden Attend call with client, internal team and advisors regarding responses to Asbestos Committee discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (0.7); communications with Blake, Torborg regarding same (0.4). 11/17/23 D S Torborg 3.90 5,070.00 Review Asbestos Committee discovery requests in the derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.1); prepare materials regarding same for call with client (1.4); discuss same with Seiden and Blake (.4); attend call with client, internal team and advisors regarding responses to discovery requests (1.0). 11/20/23 M A Cody 1.10 1,622.50 Review Asbestos Committee discovery requests served in derivative litigation proceedings and related materials. 11/20/23 M R Hirst 1.90 2,422.50 Analyze discovery requests served in derivative litigation adversary proceedings and related materials. 11/20/23 P Lombardi 4.60 3,220.00 Draft memorandum concerning dismissal matters. 11/20/23 C K Marshall 0.50 662.50 Communications with internal team regarding appellate matters. 1.90 11/20/23 2,470.00 D S Torborg Draft and revise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding. 0.20 300.00 11/21/23 B B Erens

Review email from Torborg regarding affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 81 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 15 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount consolidation proceeding. 11/21/23 1.00 1,275.00 M R Hirst Communicate with internal team regarding derivative litigation adversary proceedings discovery (0.3); review same (0.2); review draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (0.5).11/21/23 A P Johnson 3.80 3,040.00 Review materials regarding dismissal matters (.6); research precedent related to same (2.3); review email from Dowling regarding same (.2); review summary from Lombardi regarding same (.7). 2.90 2,030.00 11/21/23 P Lombardi Revise memorandum concerning dismissal matters (2.7); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.2). 11/21/23 4.20 5,460.00 D S Torborg Draft and revise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (4.0); draft email to Erens regarding same (.2). 11/22/23 M A Cody 4.10 6,047.50 Review draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding and related materials (1.3); review precedent related to dismissal matters (2.8). 11/22/23 B B Erens 0.80 1,200.00 Review draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding. 11/22/23 M R Hirst 1.60 2,040.00 Review and comment on draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (0.7); review Asbestos Committee discovery requests relating to same (0.6); communicate with internal team regarding draft affirmative discovery requests (0.3). 11/27/23 2.60 3,835.00 M A Cody Review and revise drafts of affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (1.8); review comments to same (.8). 11/27/23 B B Erens 2.80 4,200.00 Prepare for call with Torborg regarding substantive consolidation proceeding and related discovery matters (.50); communications with internal team regarding same (.40); call with Torborg regarding same (.60); emails with internal team regarding substantive consolidation proceeding (.60); review issues regarding same (.30); emails with internal team and McGonigle regarding same (.20); telephone call with McGonigle regarding same (.20). 11/27/23 A P Johnson 1.70 1,360.00 Review materials regarding dismissal matters (.4); research precedent related to same (1.0); review summary from Lombardi regarding same (.3). 3,510.00 11/27/23 2.70 D S Torborg Review comments to draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding and revise same (2.1); discuss substantive consolidation proceeding and associated discovery issues with Erens (.6). 11/28/23 1.10 1,622.50

Review comments to draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.8); review precedent concerning dismissal matters (.3).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 82 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 16 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 11/28/23 1.30 910.00 Review discovery requests served by Asbestos Committee in derivative litigation adversary proceedings. 0.60 765.00 11/28/23 M R Hirst Communicate with Torborg regarding derivative litigation adversary proceedings (0.2); review and revise draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (0.4). 11/28/23 P Lombardi 210.00 Review email from Hirst regarding Asbestos Committee discovery requests in derivative litigation proceedings (.1); review discovery requests (.2). 11/28/23 5,330.00 D S Torborg 4.10 Draft and revise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (3.7); discuss responses to Asbestos Committee discovery requests in substantive consolidation proceeding with Hirst (.2); review same (.2). 11/29/23 0.50 737.50 M A Cody Review emails and comments regarding discovery issues related to substantive consolidation proceeding. 11/29/23 M A Cody 1.80 2,655.00 Review briefing and commentary regarding Purdue Supreme Court case. 11/29/23 B B Erens 1.30 1,950.00 Attend call with internal team and Mascitti regarding derivative litigation proceeding discovery (.50); emails with internal team regarding same (.40); communications with Marshall regarding potential appellate matters (.20); review emails regarding revised affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.20). 11/29/23 M R Hirst 2,167.50 Attend call with Erens, Mascitti, Torborg regarding derivative litigation proceeding discovery (0.6); review derivative litigation proceeding discovery (0.4); revise draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (0.5); call with Torborg regarding status of derivative litigation (0.2). D S Torborg 11/29/23 2.00 2,600.00 Prepare for (.3) and attend (.5) call with Mascitti, Erens, Hirst and Wallen regarding discovery in derivative litigation adversary proceedings; review and revise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.9); draft email to client regarding status of discovery in adversary proceedings (.1); call with Hirst regarding status of derivative litigation (.2). 11/30/23 1.50 A Anderson Attend call with Torborg, Hart, Hirst, Dowling and Lombardi regarding responses to Asbestos Committee discovery requests served in derivative litigation proceedings (.5); review discovery requests (1.0). 11/30/23 M A Cody 1.30 1,917.50 Review and analyze briefing in Purdue Supreme Court case. M A Cody 2.80 4,130.00 Review materials regarding dismissal appeal matters (2.3); diligence regarding same and related planning matters (.5). 11/30/23 E M Dowling 1.20 750.00

Attend call with internal team regarding responses to Asbestos Committee discovery requests served in derivative litigation proceedings (.5); review discovery requests (.7).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 83 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOINED DI	<b>1</b> 1	
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 17 November 30, 2023 Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/30/23 Review issues	B B Erens s regarding substantive consolidation procee	0.30 ding (.30).	450.00
11/30/23 Review mater	B B Erens rials concerning dismissal appeal matters (.80	0.80	1,200.00
	R Hart ith Torborg, Anderson, Hirst, Dowling and iscovery requests served in derivative litigation		
	M R Hirst ith Torborg, Hart, Anderson, Dowling and iscovery requests served in derivative litigation		
	P Lombardi ith Torborg, Hart, Hirst, Dowling and Ande uests served in derivative litigation proceedi		
	D S Torborg 5) and attend (.5) call with Hirst, Hart, And Committee discovery requests served in deriv		
	Matter Total	121.60	USD 147,135.00
Professional Retention	on/Fee Issues		
interim fee ap	A P Johnson rials regarding recent payments (.3); review replications (.2); review ordinary course profegarding same (.1).		
11/01/23 Review ordin	P Lombardi ary course professionals report (1.9); draft e	2.10 mail to Johnson concern	1,470.00 ming revisions to same (.2).
11/02/23 Review ordin	A P Johnson eary course professionals report (.2); review p	1.30 precedent related to sam	1,040.00 te (1.1).
Representativ	A P Johnson stos Committee's professionals' September r ve September monthly statement (.2); review ratt regarding ordinary course professional in	ordinary course profess	sionals report (.4); review
	M A Cody ary course professionals report (.5); review of professionals (1.1).	1.90 order in connection with	2,802.50 a same (.3); review monthly
11/06/23 Review and r with Johnson	J L Gale evise Debtor's professionals' interim fee app 1 (0.2).	1.60 blications (1.4); discuss (	1,000.00 Claro interim fee application
11/06/23	A P Johnson	3.60	2,880.00

Review email from Pratt regarding ordinary course professional invoices (.4); draft emails to Bowen,

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 84 of 188

JONES DAY

161866

Page: 18

November 30, 2023

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Invoice: 231308293

Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name

Date of Service

Tananbaum regarding same (.3); review ordinary course professionals report (.5); revise same (.2); review precedent related to same (.6); draft email to Canup regarding interim fee application (.1); review precedent related to same (.5); review AlixPartners' interim fee application (.4); review Claro's interim fee application (.4); discuss same with Gale (.2).

Hours

Amount

11/06/23 P Lombardi 1.20 840.00 Review email from Bowen concerning updates to ordinary course professionals report (.1); revise ordinary

course professionals report (.1); review same (.7); discuss revisions to report with Johnson (.1); prepare ordinary course professionals report for filing (.1); draft email to Cody concerning same (.1).

11/07/23 J L Gale 0.40 250.00 Review Debtor's professionals' interim fee applications (0.4).

11/07/23 A P Johnson 1.90 1,520.00

Review K&L Gates' interim fee application (.6); draft email to Tomsic regarding interim fee applications (.1); review Asbestos Committee's professionals' interim fee applications (.8); review Ankura monthly statement (.2); draft emails to Pratt, Bowen regarding ordinary course professional payments (.2).

11/08/23 A P Johnson 1.90 1,520.00

Provious Rates Whitely interim for application (8) draft amails to Willelba. Abaroni recording same (1):

Review Bates White's interim fee application (.8); draft emails to Villalba, Aharoni regarding same (.1); review ordinary course professionals report (.2); review Evert Weathersby Houff's interim fee application (.6); draft emails to Canup, Villalba regarding same (.2).

11/08/23 P Lombardi 0.30 210.00 Review ordinary course professionals report for filing (.2); draft email to Tomsic forwarding same for filing

11/08/23 D C Villalba 2.90 2,175.00 Review monthly statements submitted by professionals.

11/08/23 D C Villalba 0.90 675.00

Review Bates White interim fee application (.40); emails with Johnson regarding same (.10); review Evert Weathersby Houff interim fee application (.30); emails with Johnson regarding same (.10).

11/09/23 M A Cody 0.80 1,180.00 Review monthly statements submitted by professionals (.5); emails with Johnson regarding interim fee

Review monthly statements submitted by professionals (.5); emails with Johnson regarding interim fee applications (.3).

11/09/23 A P Johnson 2.50 2,000.00

Review ordinary course professionals report (.1); draft email to Bowen regarding same (.2); review Bates White's interim fee application (.4); revise Evert Weathersby Houff's interim fee application (.3); review same (.5); review Rayburn Cooper Durham's interim fee application (.6); draft emails to Cody, Canup, Villalba, Tomsic regarding same (.4).

11/09/23 D C Villalba 0.40 300.00 Review Debtors' professionals' interim fee applications (0.4).

11/10/23 M A Cody 0.80 1,180.00 Review and analyze professional interim fee applications and related monthly statements (.8).

11/10/23 A P Johnson 2.30 1,840.00

Review interim fee applications for Debtors' professionals (.3); review email from Tomsic regarding same (.2); review Jones Day supplemental disclosure (.4); draft email to Villalba regarding same (.4); review chart summarizing recent payments to professionals (.5); review Caplin's August and September monthly

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 85 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 19 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount statements (.3); review FTI's October monthly statement (.2). 11/10/23 D C Villalba 1.70 1,275.00 Review monthly statements submitted by professionals (1.30); emails with Johnson regarding Jones Day supplemental disclosure (.40). 0.30 240.00 11/11/23 A P Johnson Review Asbestos Committee's professional's recently submitted monthly statement (.3). 11/13/23 M A Cody 1.40 2,065.00 Review professionals' interim fee applications and related monthly statements. 11/13/23 A P Johnson 1.80 1,440.00 Review Jones Day supplemental disclosure (.6); analyze materials related to same (.7); review Ankura's October monthly statement (.2); discuss professional fee issues with Villalba (.3). 11/13/23 P Lombardi 910.00 Review professionals' interim fee applications (.7); draft summary concerning same (.6). 11/13/23 D C Villalba 1.30 975.00 Revise Jones Day supplemental disclosure (0.8); communicate with Johnson regarding professional fee issues (0.3); review monthly statements of professionals (0.2). 11/14/23 1.90 A P Johnson 1,520.00 Review emails from Tananbaum, Erens regarding outstanding payments (.2); review chart of amounts owed pursuant to interim fee applications (.2); review materials related to same (.7); review Future Claimants' Representative's recently submitted monthly statements (.2); review Verus' monthly statement (.3); discuss same with Villalba (.1); review emails from Villalba, Erens, Cody regarding same (.2). 11/14/23 770.00 P Lombardi Review professionals' interim fee applications (.4); draft summary concerning same (.7). 11/14/23 D C Villalba 3.20 2,400.00 Review monthly statements of professionals (2.5); communicate with Johnson, Cody and Erens regarding issues related to same (0.2); draft chart analyzing fee issues (0.5). 11/15/23 450.00 B B Erens 0.30Emails with Johnson, Vaccaro regarding payment matters (.10); discuss same with Johnson (.10); review Verus monthly statement (.10). 11/15/23 A P Johnson 2.20 1,760.00 Review emails from Erens, Vaccaro regarding outstanding payments (.2); discuss same with Erens (.1); draft emails to Erens, Villalba, Bartalone regarding same (.3); review Verus' monthly statement (.2); review chart of amounts owed pursuant to interim fee applications (1.1); review materials related to same (.3). 2,325.00 11/15/23 D C Villalba 3.10 Revise Jones Day supplemental disclosure (0.2); review monthly statements of professionals (2.1); update chart regarding same (0.7); communicate with Johnson regarding same (0.1). 11/16/23 A P Johnson 0.60 480.00 Review Verus' monthly statement (.3); draft email to Miller regarding same (.2); discuss same with Miller (.1). 3.30 11/17/23 A P Johnson

Draft emails to Tomsic, Villalba, Bartalone regarding recent payments (.3); draft chart of recent payments

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Page 86 of 188 Document

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 20 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount (.4); review materials related to same (1.3); discuss same with Villalba, Cody (.4); review emails from Villalba regarding same (.3); review Verus' monthly statement (.3); draft emails to Wright regarding same (.1); discuss same with Wright, Cody (.2). 11/18/23 A P Johnson 1.60 1,280.00 Review recently submitted monthly statements (.8); review chart summarizing same (.5); draft email to Bowen, Cody regarding same (.3). 11/20/23 A P Johnson 1.20 960.00 Review recently submitted monthly statements (.5); discuss same with Villalba (.1); review chart summarizing same (.4); draft emails to Bowen, Thompson regarding same (.2). 11/20/23 D C Villalba 0.60 450.00 Call with Johnson regarding recently submitted monthly statements (.10); review chart regarding same (.40); email Johnson regarding same (.10). 11/22/23 P Lombardi 0.30210.00 Review orders granting interim fee applications (.1); update tracking chart concerning same (.1); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1). 11/27/23 M A Cody 0.20 295.00 Telephone conference with Johnson regarding professional fee issues. 11/27/23 A P Johnson 0.50 400.00 Review Verus October monthly statement (.1); discuss same with Davis and Cody (.1); draft emails to Canup, Steele, Cumbo, Fern regarding interim fee applications (.3). 11/28/23 A P Johnson 4.40 3,520.00 Review interim fee application orders for submission to Court (.4); draft emails to Miller regarding same (.1); review summary of recent payments (1.2); revise same (.5); review interim fee applications (1.6); review email from Bowen regarding same (.2); draft emails to Villalba, Bartalone regarding same (.4). 11/28/23 P Lombardi 0.70 490.00 Review orders granting interim fee applications (.4); revise tracking chart relating to same (.2); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1). 11/28/23 D C Villalba 300.00 Review professional fee issues (0.3); communicate with Johnson regarding same (0.1). 11/29/23 A P Johnson Review summary of recent payments (.8); review interim fee applications (2.0); review chart summarizing same (.9); draft emails to Bowen regarding same (.2); review Caplin's October monthly statement (.3); draft emails to Wright regarding Verus monthly statement (.2); discuss same with Cody (.1); emails with Lombardi regarding orders approving interim fee applications (.1). 11/29/23 P Lombardi 210.00 Review orders approving interim fee applications (.2); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1). 0.20 300.00 11/30/23 B B Erens Communications with Johnson regarding outstanding fee issues. 11/30/23 3.30 2,640.00 A P Johnson

Review interim fee applications and related orders (1.2); review chart summarizing same (.3); discuss outstanding fee issues with Erens (.2); review Rayburn Cooper Durham monthly statement (.4); review

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 87 of 188 JONES DAY

161866		<b>,</b> 02 ( <b>=</b> 0		Page: 21 November 30, 2023
Aldrich 1	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of S	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
		by Houff monthly statement (.5); revi regarding same (.2); review Gilbert m		ment (.3); draft emails to
	Review orders a	P Lombardi approving interim fee applications (.4) cerning same (.1).	0.70 ; revise tracking chart concern	490.00 ing same (.2); draft email
11/30/23		C L Smith ic file management system with profe	0.10 essional monthly statement.	47.50
		Matter Total	73.10	USD 60,365.00
Fee Appl	lication Prepar	ration		
11/02/23		C L Smith ise October invoice for privilege and o	5.60 compliance.	2,660.00
11/03/23		A P Johnson Is related to Jones Day interim fee app	3.50 blication (2.1); review interim f	2,800.00 fee application (1.4).
11/03/23		C L Smith as with Fresenko regarding October in	0.10 nvoice matters.	47.50
11/05/23		D C Villalba y interim fee application (2.0); review	2.90 same (0.6); draft email to John	2,175.00 ason regarding same (0.3).
		A P Johnson Day interim fee application (.4); analyze ng same (.2).	1.40 e materials related to same (.8)	1,120.00 ; review email from
11/08/23		M A Cody ise Jones Day interim fee application (	1.90 (1.8); attend meeting with Villa	2,802.50 alba regarding same (.1).
	Revise Jones D	A P Johnson ay interim fee application (3.4); analyza regarding same (.4).	5.90 e materials related to same (1.3	4,720.00 3); review same (.8); draft
	Communication	C L Smith as with Fresenko regarding October in smpliance (1.60).	1.70 avoice (.10); review and revise	807.50 October invoice for
	Review Jones D regarding same	D C Villalba Day interim fee application (.70); emails (.10); discuss same with Johnson (.10) Dody regarding same (.10).		
11/09/23		M A Cody Oay interim fee application (.8); comm	0.90 unicate with Villalba regarding	1,327.50 g same (.1).
		A P Johnson Day interim fee application (1.1); analyzing same (.1).	2.70 ze materials related to same (1	2,160.00 .5); communicate with

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 88 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT			
161866			Noveml	Page: 22 per 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice	: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
	C L Smith vise October invoice for privilege and compliance ications with Fresenko regarding same (.10).	1.20 ce (1.00); emails w	ith Fresenko re	570.00 egarding same
	D C Villalba Day interim application (0.2); revise same (1.0); c with Johnson regarding same (0.1).	1.40 communicate with	ı Cody regardin	1,050.00 ag same (0.1);
11/10/23 Review and rev	C L Smith vise October invoice for privilege and compliance	1.90 ce.		902.50
11/15/23 Review Octobe	B B Erens er invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.40		600.00
11/15/23 Review and rev	C L Smith vise October invoice for privilege and compliance	0.60 ce.		285.00
	C L Smith rens regarding October 2023 invoice matters (.10 Erens regarding same (.10).	0.20 0); review Erens c	omments to in	95.00 voice and
	C L Smith Erens regarding October invoice (.10); emails w ns with Fresenko regarding comments to Octob			
	A P Johnson Day interim fee application (.3); review order relating same (.2); review October monthly statemen			
	C L Smith see October monthly statement (.10); emails with ding comments to October invoice (.10).	0.30 Johnson regardin	g same (.10); d	142.50 raft email to
11/28/23 Review Octobe	A P Johnson er monthly statement (.2); draft emails to Smith	0.30 regarding same (.1	1).	240.00
11/28/23 Review revised (.10).	C L Smith October invoice (.10); revise monthly statemen	0.30 t (.10); emails with	h Johnson rega	142.50 rding same
11/30/23 Submit Octobe	C L Smith er monthly statement to notice parties.	0.10		47.50
	Matter Total	38.60	USD	28,605.00
Asbestos Matters				
11/01/23 Communicate	A Anderson with Pratt and Hart regarding estimation discove	0.50 ery document rev	iew.	350.00
11/01/23 Communicate	R Hart with Pratt and Anderson regarding estimation di	0.50 iscovery documer	nt review.	350.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 89 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOIN	ES DAI	
161866		]	Page: 23 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pum	np LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	ce Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	e Hours	Amount
	M R Hirst se motions to dismiss anonymity appeals (1 iss anonymity appeals (0.3); review estimati		2,550.00 n regarding motions to
11/01/23 Com	E Pratt nmunicate with Hart and Anderson regardin	0.60 ng estimation discovery document revi	225.00 ew.
11/02/23 Tele <sub>1</sub>	M A Cody phone conference with Tananbaum regardi	1.50 ing asbestos issues (.3); review material	2,212.50 s related to same (1.2).
	B B Erens nd client call regarding asbestos matters (1.0 rding same (.5).	2.50 0); follow up regarding same (1.0); telep	3,750.00 phone call with Miller
11/02/23 Com	R Hart nmunicate with Pratt regarding estimation d	0.20 liscovery document review.	140.00
corre regar	M R Hirst nd conference call with Tananbaum regardi espondence to Verus counsel regarding mee rding meet and confer list (0.2); communical ment review status (0.3); review estimation	et and confer list (0.3); communicate wate with internal team regarding estimate	vith Bates White tion discovery
11/02/23 Rev	A P Johnson iew motions to dismiss anonymity appeals.	0.50	400.00
11/02/23 Prep	T B Lewis pare for call with internal team regarding est	0.50 imation discovery, including review of	675.00 related materials.
with	E Pratt vare documents for review in connection with Hart regarding estimation discovery documents (.2).		• •
11/03/23 Revi	E M Dowling ew and analyze documents in connection w	1.20 with estimation discovery.	750.00
up it	B B Erens gence regarding asbestos matters (1.3); researems from call with Miller concerning same nation discovery (.50).		
	R Hart ew and analyze documents in connection w rding estimation discovery document produ		1,680.00 unicate with Hirst
same	M R Hirst nd call with Lewis, Erens and Evert regardi e and estimation discovery document review ament production relating to estimation disc	wissues (0.9); communicate with Hart:	
11/03/23	T B Lewis	0.50	675.00

Participate in call with Erens, Hirst and Evert regarding estimation discovery matters.

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 90 of 188

JONES DAY

	JOI LO DI	* 1	
161866 Aldrich Pump LI	LC and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 24 November 30, 2023 Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/04/23 Review an	R Hart d analyze documents in connection with estim	1.20 ation discovery.	840.00
11/05/23 Review an	R Hart d analyze documents in connection with estim	1.70 ation discovery.	1,190.00
11/06/23 Prepare fo	B B Erens or mediation call (.20).	0.20	300.00
11/06/23 Review an	R Hart d analyze documents in connection with estim	0.60 ation discovery.	420.00
11/06/23 Revise dra regarding o	M R Hirst ft client memo regarding estimation discovery draft client memo (0.3); communicate with Bat discovery (0.2); review estimation discovery st	2.60 (1.4); communicate with	is of matching claimants
connection regarding s	E Pratt cate with vendor regarding review of document with estimation discovery (.9); prepare documents for production (.4); further prepare documents for production review of document production (.7); prepared	nents for production (.4) uction (.3); communicate	); communicate with vendor e with vendor regarding
(.30); telep recent dev	B B Erens or mediation call (.20); attend call regarding same shone call with client regarding same (.30); teleptelopments (.30); emails with client regarding same sbestos matters (.30).	phone call with Miller re	garding filings relating to
	M R Hirst ft client memo regarding estimation discovery t memo (0.2).	0.50 (0.3); communicate with	637.50 n internal team regarding
11/08/23 Review do	E M Dowling cument review protocol in connection with re-	0.50 sponding to estimation of	312.50 discovery.
	B B Erens e call with Evert regarding asbestos matters (.80 lient regarding same (.20).	1.20 0); review precedent rega	1,800.00 arding same (.20); telephone
11/08/23 Communic	M R Hirst cate with Verus counsel regarding estimation d	0.40 liscovery matters (0.2); re	510.00 eview same (0.2).
11/09/23 Review an	E M Dowling d analyze documents in connection with respo	0.80 onding to estimation disc	500.00 covery requests.
team regar	M R Hirst ft correspondence regarding estimation discovery ding estimation discovery status issues (0.3); colating to estimation discovery (0.2).		
11/10/23	E M Dowling	2.30	1,437.50

Review and analyze documents in connection with responding to estimation discovery requests.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 91 of 188 JONES DAY

	JONES DAT		
161866			Page: 25 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/10/23 Review Hirst	B B Erens memo regarding estimation discovery issues (1.2)	1.20	1,800.00
11/10/23 Telephone cal	B B Erens l with Cody regarding asbestos matters (.30); foll	0.80 ow up regarding s	1,200.00 ame (.50).
	M R Hirst regarding estimation discovery status and related mation discovery status and related issues (0.6).	1.50 issues (0.9); comm	1,912.50 nunicate with internal team
11/13/23 Review and ar	E M Dowling nalyze documents in connection with responding	1.70 to estimation disc	1,062.50 covery requests.
11/13/23 Prepare for ca	B B Erens Ill with internal team regarding status and plannin	0.90 ng (.40); attend call	1,350.00 regarding same (.50).
11/13/23 Call with Hirs	B B Erens t and Evert regarding estimation discovery issues	0.50 s.	750.00
11/13/23 Telephone cal	B B Erens l with Evert regarding asbestos matters.	0.80	1,200.00
11/13/23 Telephone co	G M Gordon nference with internal team regarding status and	0.20 planning.	360.00
11/13/23 Correspond w	R Hart regarding estimation discovery.	0.30	210.00
11/13/23 Attend call wi	M R Hirst th internal team regarding status and planning.	1.00	1,275.00
estimation dis	M R Hirst as regarding estimation discovery matters (0.2); category (0.5); review estimation discovery issues (onts (0.3); communicate with internal team, client	1.0); review comm	unication from anonymity
11/13/23 Review emails	A P Johnson s from Aharoni, Erens regarding trust discovery (	0.20	160.00
11/13/23 Communicate	J M Jones with Hirst regarding estimation discovery and re	0.30 elated matters.	480.00
11/13/23 Participate in	T B Lewis call with internal team regarding status and plann	0.20	270.00
	E Pratt ation discovery document production for client re (.3); further prepare same (.4); communicate with		
11/13/23 Attend call wi	M R Seiden th internal team regarding status and planning.	0.40	550.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 92 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT		
161866	IM D'I IIC		Page: 26 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/13/23 Attend call with	D S Torborg h internal team regarding status and planning (.3).	0.30	390.00
	C K Cahow White and Evert Weathersby Houff regarding esti- call with Masiano regarding estimation discovery r		1,955.00 matters (1.10); prepare
11/14/23 Attend estimat	M C Corcoran ion discovery call with internal team, Bates White a	1.10 and Evert Weather	1,155.00 rsby Houff teams (1.1).
11/14/23 Review and ana	E M Dowling alyze documents in connection with responding to	1.20 estimation discove	750.00 ery requests.
11/14/23 Attend call with	B B Erens h Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams	1.00 regarding estimation	1,500.00 on discovery (1.00).
11/14/23 Correspond wi	R Hart th Pratt regarding estimation discovery.	0.30	210.00
(0.5); attend est dismissal of an	M R Hirst h Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams timation work in process call (0.7); communicate w onymity appeals (0.2); review anonymity appeal dis ling estimation discovery status (0.3); review docum overy (0.5).	vith Rayburn Coop smissal motions (0.	er team regarding  1); draft correspondence
11/14/23 Review motion	A P Johnson as to dismiss anonymity appeals (.4); review emails	0.60 from Hirst related	480.00 to same (.2).
11/14/23 Attend estimat	A P Johnson ion discovery call with Bates White and Evert Wea	1.00 hthersby Houff tear	800.00 ms.
11/14/23 Prepare docum regarding same	E Pratt nents for production in connection with estimation (.3).	1.70 discovery (1.4); co	637.50 orrespond with Hart
11/14/23 Attend call with	M R Seiden h Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams	0.80 regarding estimation	1,100.00 on discovery (0.8).
11/14/23 Research matte	D S Torborg ers concerning Manville trust subpoena proceeding	0.50 pending in Distric	650.00 et of Columbia (.5).
11/15/23 Review and and	E M Dowling alyze documents in connection with responding to	1.40 estimation discove	875.00 ery requests.
11/15/23 Prepare for clie	B B Erens ent calls regarding asbestos matters (.30); telephone	0.50 e calls with client re	750.00 egarding same (.20).
11/15/23 Communicate	R Hart with Pratt regarding estimation discovery.	0.10	70.00
11/15/23 Communicate	M R Hirst with internal team regarding estimation discovery o	0.50 questions.	637.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 93 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAY		
161866			Page: 27 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	E Pratt nents for review in connection with responding t with Hart regarding same (.1).	1.80 o estimation discove	675.00 ery requests (1.7);
11/16/23 Emails with Ta	M A Cody ananbaum regarding asbestos issues (.2); review t	1.00 related materials in c	1,475.00 onnection with same (.8).
11/16/23 Review and an	E M Dowling alyze documents in connection with responding	1.70 to estimation discov	1,062.50 rery requests.
11/16/23 Telephone call	B B Erens with Evert and client regarding asbestos matters	0.80 s (.30); calls with clie	1,200.00 nt regarding same (.50).
connection wit	M R Hirst ence call with client regarding asbestos matters (6th estimation discovery (0.7); communications were to client regarding estimation discovery (0.4)	ith client regarding s	
11/16/23 Prepare docum (.1).	E Pratt nent production relating to estimation discovery	0.30 for client review (.2)	112.50 ; transmit same to client
11/17/23 Review and an	E M Dowling alyze documents in connection with responding	2.20 to estimation discov	1,375.00 very requests.
11/17/23 Telephone call	B B Erens with Miller regarding asbestos matters.	0.40	600.00
11/17/23 Plan and prepa	M R Hirst are for next steps concerning estimation discover	0.50 y.	637.50
	M A Cody als related to asbestos matters (2.5); review and a icate with Hirst regarding same (.1).	3.90 nalyze summary of s	5,752.50 same and related materials
11/20/23 Review and an	E M Dowling alyze documents in connection with responding	1.50 to estimation discov	937.50 yery requests.
11/20/23 Emails with in	B B Erens ternal team regarding materials concerning estim	0.20 ation matters.	300.00
11/20/23 Correspond wi	R Hart ith Pratt regarding estimation discovery.	0.10	70.00
Tananbaum an	M R Hirst tents for production in connection with estimation and Sands regarding estimation discovery matters timation (0.9); communicate with Cody regarding	(0.7); plan and prepa	are for next steps
11/21/23 Review and an	C K Cahow alyze matters concerning PIQ compliance and p	1.10 otential next steps.	1,265.00
11/21/23 Review and an	M A Cody alyze materials related to asbestos issues (1.3).	1.30	1,917.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 94 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES DA	11	
161866			Page: 28 November 30, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/21/23 Review and an	E M Dowling nalyze documents in connection with response	2.00 onding to estimation discover	1,250.00 y requests.
regarding estin	M R Hirst ments for production in connection with es mation status (0.7); prepare for client call reding estimation issues (0.2).		
11/22/23 Review and ar	E M Dowling nalyze documents in connection with response	1.20 onding to estimation discover	750.00 y requests.
11/22/23 Review memo	B B Erens os concerning next steps relating to estimati	2.00 ion.	3,000.00
connection with (0.3); community	M R Hirst with internal team regarding trust discoverith estimation discovery (1.0); finalize client nicate with internal team regarding same (0 trance matters (0.2).	t memo regarding status of es	stimation discovery
	C K Cahow nalyze PIQ compliance matters and potention order relating to estimation discovery (.40); c		
11/27/23 Communicate	M A Cody e with Erens regarding asbestos matter (.5).	0.50	737.50
	B B Erens Il with client regarding asbestos matters (.20 o mediators regarding status (.20); telephon		
11/27/23 Review mater	B B Erens ials from Bates White regarding status of ea	0.20 stimation (.20).	300.00
11/27/23 Correspond w	R Hart with Pratt regarding estimation discovery.	0.70	490.00
	M R Hirst ments for production in connection with es us of document review, next steps (0.3); rev		
	E Pratt e with Hirst regarding estimation discovery communicate with Hart regarding estimate		712.50); prepare documents
11/27/23 Attend call wi	M R Seiden ith internal team regarding status and plann	0.90 ing.	1,237.50
11/28/23 Review and a	C K Cahow nalyze precedent relating to PIQ compliance	1.20 re matters and potential next	1,380.00 steps (1.00); call with

Erens regarding same (.20).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 95 of 188

**IONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 29 November 30, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 231308293 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 11/28/23 C K Cahow 0.90 1,035.00 Call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams regarding estimation discovery matters (.60); follow up call with Masiano regarding same (.10); call with Erens regarding PIQ compliance matters and potential next steps (.20). 11/28/23 M C Corcoran 1.90 1,995.00 Attend estimation discovery call with internal team and advisors (1.0); attend estimation work in process call (0.9).11/28/23 0.50 312.50 E M Dowling Review and analyze documents in connection with responding to estimation discovery requests. 11/28/23 B B Erens 300.00 Telephone calls with Cahow regarding PIQ compliance matters and potential next steps. 11/28/23 B B Erens 2,250.00 Prepare for Bates White call regarding estimation discovery (.30); attend call regarding same (1.0); diligence regarding asbestos matters (.20). 11/28/23 R Hart 0.60 420.00 Correspond with Pratt regarding estimation discovery. 11/28/23 M R Hirst 4.80 6,120.00 Attend Bates White call regarding estimation discovery (1.0); attend estimation work in process call (0.8); review issues concerning estimation discovery and privilege (1.2); review correspondence from Asbestos Committee regarding estimation discovery (0.3); review documents for production in connection with estimation discovery (1.2); correspond with Pratt regarding document production (0.3). 11/28/23 960.00 A P Johnson Attend estimation discovery call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams (1.0); review materials in preparation for same (.2). 712.50 1.90 11/28/23 E Pratt Communicate with Hart regarding estimation discovery (.6); prepare document production for review (.9); emails with Hirst regarding same (.3); draft email to Hart, Anderson, Masiano and Wright regarding same (.10).11/28/23 C L Smith 2.20 1,045.00 Emails with Cahow regarding PIQ compliance matters and potential next steps (.10); review materials relating to same (.10); draft and revise materials concerning PIQ compliance matters (2.00). 11/28/23 D S Torborg 0.90 1,170.00 Prepare for (.1) and attend (.8) estimation work in process call. 11/29/23 2.60 3,835.00 M A Cody Review materials regarding asbestos matters (1.6); call with Erens regarding same (.2); consider related open issues (.5); emails with Tananbaum regarding same (.3). 0.50 11/29/23 E M Dowling 312.50 Review and analyze documents in connection with responding to estimation discovery requests. 1.50 2,250.00 11/29/23 B B Erens

Telephone call with client regarding asbestos matters (.60); prepare regarding same (.20); prepare for call

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 96 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JOINES D		
161866				Page: 30 November 30, 2023
Aldrich F	ump LLC and Murray Boiler I	TC		Invoice: 231308293
Date of Se	rvice Timekeeper/Fee Ear	ner Name	Hours	Amount
	rith advisors and client regarding asbellephone call with Cody regarding sa		; telephone call with Evert re	egarding same (.20);
	B B Erens eview email from Hirst regarding est egarding same (.20).	imation discovery	0.60 order matters (.40); commun	900.00 nications with Hirst
r	M R Hirst Call with Evert regarding estimation s eview precedent relating to same (0.5 egarding privilege documents concer-	); communicate wi	ith Erens regarding same (0.2	2); draft protocol
11/29/23 F	J M Jones eview materials regarding estimation	discovery order (.	0.50 30); prepare memo to Hirst	800.00 regarding same (.20).
	C L Smith  Praft and revise materials relating to I egarding same (.10).	PIQ compliance m	0.70 natters (.60); draft email to Ca	332.50 ahow, Johnson
11/30/23 F	C K Cahow eview and analyze precedent regardi	ng PIQ complianc	1.70 e matters.	1,955.00
11/30/23	M A Cody Conference with Erens regarding asbe	estos matters (.8).	0.80	1,180.00
r r	B B Erens elephone call with client regarding stelating to same (.80); telephone call we garding the same (.20); emails with clanning and preparation for meetings	vith McGonigle reg client regarding sch	garding same (.40); telephone	e call with Johnson
11/30/23 F	B B Erens eview drafts of estimation discovery	order (.20).	0.20	300.00
11/30/23	M R Hirst attend conference call with Tananbau	ım regarding estim	2.70 aation (1.2); review estimation	3,442.50 a discovery issues (1.5).

146.90

USD

159,862.50

Matter Total

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 97 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 31 November 30, 2023

Invoice: 231308293

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Disbursement Detail

Date	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Location	Amount	Total
Case Administration an	d Business Operations			
PRINTING CHARGES				
10/27/23	A R Villar	WAS	1,124.66	
Service copies of	amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
10/31/23	A R Villar	WAS	1,124.66	
Service copies of	amicus brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
Printing Charges Subto	tal			2,249.32
UNITED PARCEL SEI	RVICE CHARGES			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	22.80	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	22.80	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	22.80	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	23.41	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	26.14	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	23.41	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	22.80	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	22.80	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
11/01/23	L Joseph	WAS	19.12	
Service of amicus	s brief in Purdue Supreme Court case			
United Parcel Service C	harges Subtotal			206.08
Matter Total			USD	2,455.40

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

### FORTY-SECOND MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM DECEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2023

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Forty-Second Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From December 1, 2023 Through December 31, 2023 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

#### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period
 December 1, 2023 through December 31, 2023 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

#### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$554,545.00
Total Expenses	\$0.00
TOTAL	\$554,545.00

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$499,090.50 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

#### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

4. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036 (Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc., (I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103 (Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter & English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019 (Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC, 1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 100 of 188

Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than February 13, 2024 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 6. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.
- 7. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Dated: January 30, 2024

Chicago, Illinois

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585 E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com

macody@jonesday.com ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 102 of 188

#### **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

#### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800 Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

December 31, 2023 161866 Invoice: 241300366

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through December 31, 2023:

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	40.40	48,987.50
Automatic Stay	1.90	2,397.50
Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	0.00	0.00
Claims Administration	83.10	89,387.50
Court Hearings	7.90	10,550.00
General Corporate and Real Estate	0.70	945.00
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator		
Reporting	3.90	2,930.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	111.40	114,360.00
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	33.70	26,867.50
Fee Application Preparation	13.60	7,135.00
Asbestos Matters	251.70	250,985.00
Total Fees	548.30 USD	554,545.00
TOTAL	USD	554,545.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 104 of 188 **JONES DAY**

Page: 2 December 31, 2023

Invoice: 241300366

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – December 31, 2023

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
C K Cahow	Partner	2014	2.40	1,150.00	2,760.00
M A Cody	Partner	1996	109.40	1,475.00	161,365.00
M C Corcoran	Partner	2004	3.50	1,050.00	3,675.00
B B Erens	Partner	1991	43.30	1,500.00	64,950.00
G M Gordon	Partner	1980	0.40	1,800.00	720.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	47.20	1,275.00	60,180.00
J M Jones	Partner	1986	0.40	1,600.00	640.00
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	6.40	1,350.00	8,640.00
C K Marshall	Partner	2001	1.10	1,325.00	1,457.50
D S Torborg	Partner	1998 _	12.40	1,300.00	16,120.00
Total			226.50		320,507.50
A Anderson	Associate	2021	1.70	700.00	1,190.00
C K Cahow	Associate	2014	14.50	1,150.00	16,675.00
E M Dowling	Associate	2022	26.30	625.00	16,437.50
J L Gale	Associate	2022	40.30	625.00	25,187.50
R Hart	Associate	2021	11.40	700.00	7,980.00
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	109.60	800.00	87,680.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2021	91.30	700.00	63,910.00
C P Redmond	Associate	2019	0.40	850.00	340.00
D C Villalba	Associate	2019 _	9.00	750.00	6,750.00
Total			304.50		226,150.00
C L Smith	Paralegal	_	14.00	475.00	6,650.00
Total			14.00		6,650.00
E Pratt	Project Manager	_	3.30	375.00	1,237.50
Total			3.30		1,237.50
Total			548.30	USD	554,545.00

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 105 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 3

December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

	Fee Detail		
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Case Administration a	and Business Operations		
12/01/23 Attend work is matters (1.0).	C K Cahow n process call with company, internal team and adv	2.00 visors (1.0); address case administ	2,300.00 tration
12/01/23 Telephone conconnection wi	M A Cody nference with client and advisors regarding work in th same (.5).	1.60 n process matters (1.1); review iss	2,360.00 ues list in
12/01/23 Prepare for cli	B B Erens ent work in process call (.20); attend call regarding	1.20 same (1.00).	1,800.00
12/01/23 Attend client v	M R Hirst work in process call.	0.90	1,147.50
12/01/23 Attend work is	A P Johnson n process call with client and advisors (1.0); revise	1.20 work in process report (.2).	960.00
12/01/23 Participate in v	T B Lewis work in process call with client and advisors.	1.00	1,350.00
12/01/23 Review and di system with sa	C L Smith stribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed documer time (.10).	0.20 nts and update electronic file man	95.00 nagement
12/01/23 Attend work is	D S Torborg n process call with client.	1.00	1,300.00
12/02/23 Update calend	J L Gale ar of key dates and deadlines.	0.60	375.00
12/02/23 Review calend	A P Johnson ar of key dates and deadlines.	0.20	160.00
12/04/23 Review task lis	A P Johnson st (.2); revise same (.1).	0.30	240.00
12/04/23 Review and di	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	47.50
12/05/23 Prepare for (.2 Lewis regardin	C K Cahow (20) and attend (.80) work in process call with internal same (.40).	1.40 nal team and advisors; follow up o	1,610.00 call with
	M A Cody list and work in process report (.8); review related th advisors regarding work in process matters (.8).	2.10 notes on ongoing projects (.5); to	3,097.50 elephone
12/05/23	B B Erens	1.40	2,100.00

Prepare for work in process call with advisors (.60); conference with Johnson regarding same (.20); attend work in process call with advisors (.60).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 106 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866

Page: 4

Aldrich Pump LLO	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 4 December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/05/23 Revise task	A P Johnson list (.3); revise work in process report (.2); disc	0.70 cuss same with Erens (.2).	560.00
12/05/23 Participate i from same	T B Lewis n work in process call with advisors (0.8); par (0.4).	1.20 ticipate in call with Cahow	1,620.00 regarding follow up
12/05/23 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
12/05/23 Attend work	D S Torborg k in process call with advisors.	0.50	650.00
12/06/23 Review and	B B Erens organize upcoming tasks.	0.40	600.00
12/06/23 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
12/07/23 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
12/08/23 Attend wor	C K Cahow k in process call with company, internal team	0.50 and advisors.	575.00
12/08/23 Telephone o	M A Cody conference with client and advisors regarding	0.50 work in process matters.	737.50
12/08/23 Attend clier	B B Erens at work in process call.	0.50	750.00
12/08/23 Update cale	J L Gale ndar of key dates and deadlines.	0.40	250.00
12/08/23 Prepare for	M R Hirst (.30) and attend (.50) client work in process of	0.80 all.	1,020.00
12/08/23 Revise work	A P Johnson as in process report (.2); attend work in process	0.70 s call with client and advise	560.00 ors (.5).
12/08/23 Participate	T B Lewis in work in process call with client and advisor	0.50	675.00
12/08/23 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
12/11/23 Prepare for	B B Erens work in process call with advisors.	0.40	600.00
12/11/23	C L Smith	0.10	47.50

Review and distribute docket.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 107 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	L	
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 5 December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/12/23 Attend work	C K Cahow x in process call with internal team and adviso	0.70	805.00
12/12/23 Review worl in process m	M A Cody k in process report and related task list (1.3); t natters (.8).	2.10 elephone conference wi	3,097.50 th advisors regarding work
12/12/23 Prepare for	B B Erens work in process call (.20); attend work in proc	1.00 tess call with advisors (.8	1,500.00 30).
12/12/23 Revise task l	A P Johnson list (.5); revise work in process report (.3); atte	1.60 nd work in process call	1,280.00 with advisors (.8).
12/12/23 Participate in	T B Lewis n work in process call advisors.	0.80	1,080.00
12/12/23 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
12/12/23 Attend work	D S Torborg s in process call with advisors.	0.50	650.00
12/13/23 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	47.50
12/15/23 Attend work	C K Cahow x in process call with company, internal team a	0.40 and advisors.	460.00
12/15/23 Telephone c preparation	M A Cody conference with client and advisors regarding of for call (.7).	1.10 work in process matters	1,622.50 (.4); review materials in
12/15/23 Prepare for o	B B Erens client work in process call (.40); attend call reg	0.80 garding same (.40).	1,200.00
12/15/23 Update caler	J L Gale ndar of key dates and deadlines.	0.60	375.00
12/15/23 Prepare for	M R Hirst (.30) and attend (.40) client work in process ca	0.70 all.	892.50
12/15/23 Attend work	A P Johnson x in process call with client and advisors.	0.40	320.00
12/15/23 Prepare for	T B Lewis (.40) and participate in (.40) client work in pro	0.80 ocess call.	1,080.00
12/15/23 Attend clien	D S Torborg at work in process call.	0.40	520.00
12/19/23 Attend work	C K Cahow x in process call with internal team and adviso	1.10 rs (.40); address follow t	1,265.00 ap related to same (.70).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 108 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT			
161866				Page: 6 per 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice:	241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
-	M A Cody nference with advisors regarding work in process rork in process report. (.7).	1.60 matters (.4); rev	iew open issues a	2,360.00 and task list
12/19/23 Revise task lis	A P Johnson t (.4); revise work in process report (.2); attend wo	0.90 rk in process ca	all with advisors (	720.00 (.3).
12/19/23 Participate in	T B Lewis work in process call with advisors.	0.40		540.00
12/19/23 Attend work i	D S Torborg n process call with advisors.	0.40		520.00
12/20/23 Communicate	C K Cahow with internal team regarding case administration r	0.20 matters.		230.00
12/22/23 Update calend	J L Gale lar of key dates and deadlines.	0.50		312.50
12/22/23 Review calend	A P Johnson lar of key dates and deadlines.	0.20		160.00
12/29/23 Update calend	J L Gale lar of key dates and deadlines.	0.20		125.00
	Matter Total	40.40	USD	48,987.50
Automatic Stay				
12/06/23 Review propo	M A Cody sed order denying stay relief and related emails.	0.20		295.00
12/28/23 Review lift sta	A P Johnson y motion filed in Bestwall.	0.60		480.00
12/29/23 Review and ar	M A Cody nalyze motion for stay relief and related correspond	1.10 dence filed in B	estwall.	1,622.50
	Matter Total	1.90	USD	2,397.50
Claims Administratio	n			
12/01/23 Review and ar regarding sam	M A Cody nalyze PIQ compliance reports and related corresp e (.3).	1.40 ondence (1.1);	emails with Masi	2,065.00 ano
12/01/23 Review PIQ c	A P Johnson ompliance report.	0.20		160.00
12/04/23 Review and ar	M A Cody nalyze PIQ compliance reports and related corresp	2.90 ondence (1.8);	review omnibus	4,277.50 claims

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 109 of 188 JONES DAY

		JONES DAY		
161866				Page: 7
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	objection proce	edures and related materials (1.1).		
12/04/2		A P Johnson as claims objection procedures (.4); review precede	1.90 ent related to same	1,520.00 (1.5).
12/05/2		M A Cody and correspondence regarding PIQ compliance an orts (.8).	1.30 d claim withdrawal	1,917.50 issues (.5); review PIQ
12/05/2		E M Dowling orward to Johnson precedent relating to omnibus	0.30 claims objection pr	187.50 ocedures.
12/05/2	Review precede	A P Johnson ent related to omnibus claims objection procedure rom Masiano, Johnson regarding same (.1).	2.10 s (.8); review summ	1,680.00 nary of same (1.2);
12/06/2	Review correspondent	M A Cody ondence and PIQ compliance reports (1.1); emails cedent omnibus claims objection procedures (.8).	2.20 s with Masiano rega	3,245.00 arding same (.3); review
12/06/2		A P Johnson ent related to omnibus claims objection procedure	2.30 s (1.6); review sum	1,840.00 mary of same (.7).
12/07/2	Review and ana Gale regarding	M A Cody lyze omnibus claims objection procedures and rel omnibus claims objections (.3); communications v e regarding PIQ compliance and claim withdrawal	with Johnson regard	
12/07/2		J L Gale us claims objection procedures with Cody (0.2); re	0.50 eview procedures re	312.50 lating to same (0.3).
12/07/2	Analyze precede	A P Johnson ent related to omnibus claims objection procedure ith Gale, Cody (.2); draft email to Cody, Gale rega		3,840.00 mary of same (1.5);
12/08/2	Review omnibu claims register t	M A Cody as claims objection procedures precedent (2.7); review correspondence and PIQ comprrespondence (.3).		
12/08/2		A P Johnson ent related to omnibus claims objection procedure egister (.3).	2.10 es (1.3); review sum	1,680.00 nmary of same (.5);
12/11/2	Review and ana	M A Cody lyze correspondence regarding PIQ compliance a (.2); review and analyze precedent for omnibus cl		
12/11/2		J L Gale ent related to omnibus claims objection procedure	4.20 s (3.1); review stand	2,625.00 ding orders related to

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 110 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JONES DAY		
161866	1 M D. 'l I I C		Page: 8 December 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/11/23 Analyze preced	A P Johnson lent related to omnibus claims objection proce	0.90 edures (.4); review sun	720.00 nmary of same (.5).
12/12/23 Review corresp (.2).	M A Cody condence and compliance reports regarding P	1.30 IQs (1.1); emails with	1,917.50 Masiano regarding same
12/12/23 Review precede	J L Gale ent related to omnibus claims objection proce	5.80 dures (2.4); draft sum	3,625.00 mary of same (3.4).
12/12/23 Analyze preced	A P Johnson lent related to omnibus claims objection proce	1.90 edures (1.1); review G	1,520.00 ale summary of same (.8).
	M A Cody condence regarding PIQ compliance issues (1. transcripts and other materials regarding appr		
12/13/23 Analyze preced	A P Johnson lent related to omnibus claims objection proce	1.70 edures (.6); review Ga	1,360.00 le summary of same (1.1).
	M A Cody alyze transcripts and materials related to PIQ adding PIQ compliance and bar date issues (.3).		2,950.00 with Masiano and
12/14/23 Analyze preced	A P Johnson lent related to omnibus claims objection proce	1.40 edures (1.2); review G	1,120.00 ale summary of same (.2).
concerning san	P Lombardi ant concerning claims matters (.2); discuss san ne (.2); review response and materials from Sa ne (.3); prepare materials concerning same (.2)	nds regarding same (.2	2); emails with Cody
12/15/23 Analyze preced	A P Johnson lent related to omnibus claims objection proce	1.10 edures (.8); review clai	880.00 ms register (.3).
12/18/23 Review corresp	M A Cody condence and reports related to PIQ complian	0.80 ace and claims issues.	1,180.00
12/18/23 Review emails regarding same	A P Johnson from Miller, Masiano regarding PIQ compliar (.1).	0.40 ace and claims issues (	320.00 .3); draft email to Masiano
	M A Cody ons with Johnson regarding claims withdrawals are and claim withdrawals (.7); review and analy		
12/19/23 Discuss omnib	J L Gale ous claims objection procedures precedent with	0.80 h Johnson (0.5); review	500.00 v precedent (0.3).
12/19/23 Review emails	A P Johnson from Miller, Masiano regarding PIQ compliar analyze precedent related to omnibus claims	3.10 ace and claims withdra	2,480.00 awals (.2); discuss same

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 111 of 188

**IONES DAY** 161866 Page: 9 December 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300366 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount Gale (.5); draft summary of same (.4); review same (.6). 12/20/23 M A Cody 3.40 5,015.00 Telephone conference with Ellman regarding bar date matters (.3); review pleadings and other materials regarding general bar date (2.3); review emails and documents regarding claims reconciliation (.8). J L Gale 12/20/23 2.90 1,812.50 Draft summary regarding omnibus claims objection procedures (2.3); review precedent relating to same 2,240.00 12/20/23 A P Johnson 2.80 Analyze precedent related to omnibus claims objection procedures (2.1); review summary from Gale regarding same (.3); revise same (.4). 12/21/23 1.00 M A Cody 1,475.00 Telephone conference with Johnson regarding claims reconciliation issues (.1); attend meeting with Erens regarding same (.2); review correspondence and claims reports regarding claim withdrawal issues (.7). 12/21/23 B B Erens 0.20300.00 Attend meeting with Cody regarding status of claims reconciliation. 12/21/23 A P Johnson 1.10 880.00 Analyze precedent related to omnibus claims objection procedures (.8); review summary from Gale regarding same (.3). 1,770.00 12/22/23 1.20 M A Cody Review omnibus claims objection procedures precedent and related materials. 250.00 12/22/23 J L Gale Revise summary regarding precedent omnibus claims objection procedures. 1.00 12/22/23 A P Johnson 800.00 Analyze precedent related to omnibus claims objection procedures (.4); review summary from Gale regarding same (.2); discuss same with Masiano, Miller (.2); draft emails to Miller, Masiano regarding same (.2).12/27/23 M A Cody 2.30 3,392.50 Review and analyze precedent regarding claims and omnibus claims objections (1.8); review emails and correspondence regarding same (.5). 12/28/23 M A Cody 0.70 1,032.50 Emails with Masiano regarding claims issues (.2); review related materials and consider options relating to same (.5). 12/29/23 0.50 737.50 M A Cody Review emails related to claim withdrawals. **Matter Total** 83.10 **USD** 89,387.50

#### **Court Hearings**

12/20/23 A P Johnson 0.20 160.00

Review emails from Court, Remov. Tomois, Guy recording December 2023 empilyes bearing.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 112 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JOINEDDITI			
161866				Page: 10 per 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice:	241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
	B B Erens syburn Cooper team regarding agenda for Dec nibus hearing (.50).	0.70 ember omnibus hea	aring (.20); prep	1,050.00 are for
12/26/23 Communicate	M R Hirst with internal team regarding December omnib	0.20 ous hearing.		255.00
12/27/23 Attend call with prepare for hea	B B Erens h internal team, client and advisors regarding I aring (1.20).	1.70 December omnibus	hearing prepara	2,550.00 ation (.50);
12/27/23 Attend call with	M R Hirst h Erens, Tananbaum, Evert to prepare for De	0.50 cember 28, 2023 h	earing.	637.50
12/27/23 Review agenda	A P Johnson for December omnibus hearing.	0.10		80.00
12/28/23 Attend hearing	C K Cahow	0.60		690.00
12/28/23 Attend hearing	M A Cody	0.50		737.50
12/28/23 Prepare for hea same (.50).	B B Erens aring (.30); attend hearing (.50); follow up discu	1.30 ussions with interna	ıl team and clier	1,950.00 nt regarding
12/28/23 Prepare for (0.5) hearing (0.6).	M R Hirst 5) and attend (0.5) hearing; attend call with clie	1.60 ent and internal tear	n regarding out	2,040.00 come of
12/28/23 Attend hearing	A P Johnson	0.50		400.00
	Matter Total	7.90	USD	10,550.00
General Corporate and	l Real Estate			
12/13/23 Communicate same.	T B Lewis with Smith and Tananbaum regarding corpora	0.50 te matters, includin	g review and ar	675.00 alysis of
12/19/23 Participate in c	T B Lewis all with US Bank regarding qualified settlemen	0.20 at fund status.		270.00
	Matter Total	0.70	USD	945.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 113 of 188 JONES DAY

		JONES DA	ΛΥ	
161866				Page: 11
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/01/2		A P Johnson r monthly status reports (.3); review prece	0.60 dent related to same (.3).	480.00
12/19/2		A P Johnson Clarrey, Hakim regarding November mont 2).	0.30 thly status reports (.1); rev	240.00 iew November monthly
12/27/2		A P Johnson om Hakim regarding November monthly	0.20 status reports (.1); draft e	160.00 mail to Tomsic regarding
12/29/2	Review Novem	A P Johnson ber monthly status reports (.5); draft emai , Cody regarding same (.2).	0.90 ls to Lombardi regarding	720.00 same (.2); review emails
12/29/2	Review Novem	P Lombardi ber monthly status reports (.6); emails with reports relating to same (.4).	1.20 h Johnson regarding same	840.00 (.2); analyze prior
12/30/2	Draft email to 0	P Lombardi Cody and Johnson regarding November m ing same (.3); draft email to Clarrey, Haki		
	1	(10),	in, and Johnson Concerni	ig same (.2).
	1	Matter Total	3.90	USD 2,930.00
Litigati	on and Adversa	Matter Total		
<b>Litigati</b> : 12/01/2	<b>on and Adversa</b> 23 Review briefing	Matter Total  ry Proceedings  M A Cody in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.8); emarelated materials regarding substantive cor	3.90 3.80 il to Johnson regarding sa	USD 2,930.00  5,605.00 me (.1); review hearing
C	on and Adversa  Review briefing transcripts and regarding same  23  Communicate v	Matter Total  ry Proceedings  M A Cody in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.8); emarelated materials regarding substantive cor	3.90  3.80 il to Johnson regarding sansolidation litigation (1.8);  0.90	USD 2,930.00  5,605.00 me (.1); review hearing email with Erens  562.50
12/01/2	on and Adversa  Review briefing transcripts and regarding same  Communicate verquests (.20); respectively.	Matter Total  ry Proceedings  M A Cody in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.8); emarclated materials regarding substantive cor (.1).  E M Dowling with Lombardi regarding responses to substantive contact the suprementation of	3.90  3.80 il to Johnson regarding sansolidation litigation (1.8);  0.90 stantive consolidation pro	USD 2,930.00  5,605.00 me (.1); review hearing email with Erens  562.50 ceeding discovery
12/01/2	on and Adversa  Review briefing transcripts and regarding same  Communicate verquests (.20); results with His substantive con	my Proceedings  M A Cody gin Purdue Supreme Court case (1.8); emainerelated materials regarding substantive con (.1).  E M Dowling with Lombardi regarding responses to subserview requests (.70).  B B Erens erst regarding derivative litigation discovery	3.90  3.80 il to Johnson regarding sansolidation litigation (1.8);  0.90 stantive consolidation pro  0.50 requests (.30); emails with	USD 2,930.00  5,605.00 me (.1); review hearing email with Erens  562.50 ceeding discovery
12/01/2 12/01/2 12/01/2	on and Adversa Review briefing transcripts and regarding same Communicate verquests (.20); re Emails with His substantive con Communicate verquests (.23 Communicate verquests (.23 Review material	Matter Total  ry Proceedings  M A Cody in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.8); emarelated materials regarding substantive cor (.1).  E M Dowling with Lombardi regarding responses to subseview requests (.70).  B B Erens rst regarding derivative litigation discovery solidation proceeding discovery (.20).  M R Hirst	3.80 il to Johnson regarding sa assolidation litigation (1.8);  0.90 stantive consolidation pro  0.50 requests (.30); emails with  0.20 iscovery requests.  1.40	5,605.00 me (.1); review hearing email with Erens  562.50 ceeding discovery  750.00 h internal team regarding  255.00  1,120.00
12/01/2 12/01/2 12/01/2	on and Adversa  Review briefing transcripts and regarding same  Communicate varequests (.20); r  Emails with His substantive con  Communicate varequests (.23)  Review material emails with Cod	ry Proceedings  M A Cody in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.8); emained and in Pu	3.90  3.80 il to Johnson regarding sansolidation litigation (1.8);  0.90 stantive consolidation pro  0.50 requests (.30); emails with  0.20 iscovery requests.  1.40 briefing in Purdue Suprer	5,605.00 me (.1); review hearing email with Erens  562.50 ceeding discovery  750.00 h internal team regarding  255.00  1,120.00 me Court case (1.0);

Emails with Hart regarding precedent relating to responses to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery (.10); research regarding same (.10).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 114 of 188 JONES DAY

		JUNES DAT	[	
161866		and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 12 December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366
Munch	rump LLC a	and Murray Boller LLC		111voice. 241300300
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/02/2		B B Erens ding substantive consolidation issues.	0.70	1,050.00
12/04/2	Monitor oral ar	M A Cody rgument in Purdue Supreme Court case (1.7); rze issues relating to same (.8).	2.70 ; telephone conference v	3,982.50 with Johnson regarding
12/04/2	Draft and revis	E M Dowling e responses to substantive consolidation pro am regarding same (0.2).	2.00 sceeding discovery reque	1,250.00 sts (1.8); communicate
12/04/2		B B Erens regarding substantive consolidation proceed	0.60 discovery.	900.00
12/04/2	Review corresp discovery (0.1);	M R Hirst condence from Asbestos Committee regarding recovery requests (0.3).		
12/04/2		A P Johnson e Supreme Court case oral argument (1.3); su	2.40 ummarize same (.9); disc	1,920.00 uss same with Cody (.2).
12/04/2		P Lombardi ative consolidation proceeding discovery requ	0.70 uests (.5); review precede	490.00 ent concerning same (.2).
12/05/2	Draft and revis	E M Dowling e responses to substantive consolidation pro Lombardi regarding same (0.2).	1.00 ceeding discovery reque	625.00 sts (0.8); communicate
12/05/2		B B Erens	0.50	750.00
12/05/2	Review precede	P Lombardi ent concerning substantive consolidation pro communications with Dowling, Hirst regardin		3,010.00 sts (1.1); draft responses
12/06/2		A P Johnson als relating to dismissal matters.	0.30	240.00
12/06/2	Draft response	P Lombardi s to the substantive consolidation proceeding meeting regarding same (.3).	3.70 g discovery requests (3.4)	2,590.00 ); draft outline in
12/07/2		A Anderson with Hirst, Torborg, Hart, and Dowling rega	0.50 rding substantive consol	350.00 idation proceeding
12/07/2	Draft and revis	E M Dowling e responses to substantive consolidation pro egarding same (0.7).	1.40 occeeding discovery (0.7);	875.00 attend meeting with
40/05/		D.D.E.	2.20	200.00

Emails with Hirst regarding derivative litigation discovery issues.

B B Erens

12/07/23

0.20

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 115 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 13 December 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300366 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 12/07/23 R Hart 420.00 0.60 Attend meeting with internal team regarding responses to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery 12/07/23 M R Hirst 1.00 1,275.00 Attend meeting with internal team regarding responses to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery requests (0.5); review responses (0.3); emails with Erens regarding derivative litigation discovery matters (0.2).12/07/23 P Lombardi 2,380.00 3.40 Call with Hirst, Torborg, Anderson, Hart, and Dowling concerning substantive consolidation proceeding discovery responses (.4); draft responses (1.7); review and revise same (1.3). 12/07/23 0.901,170.00 D S Torborg Prepare for (.4) and attend (.5) call with Hirst, Anderson, Hart, Dowling, and Lombardi regarding responses to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery. 12/08/23 B B Erens 1.10 1,650.00 Telephone call with Torborg regarding affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.30); prepare for same (.20); review materials regarding litigation issues (.60). 12/08/23 0.80 1,020.00 Call with Kutrow regarding document collection issues relating to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery. 12/08/23 D S Torborg 1.10 1,430.00 Discuss affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding with Erens (.3); draft and revise same (.8). 12/11/23 375.00 E M Dowling Draft and revise responses to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery. 12/11/23 B B Erens 0.40 600.00 Review materials from Marshall regarding litigation matters. 12/11/23 P Lombardi 3.90 2,730.00 Draft responses to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery requests (3.6); draft email to Lewis concerning same (.2); review emails from Lewis concerning same (.1). 12/12/23 B B Erens 0.80 1,200.00 Telephone call with Marshall regarding litigation issues (.20); review materials from Marshall regarding same (.30); conference with Hirst regarding litigation matters (.30). 12/12/23 T B Lewis 0.50 675.00 Communications with Lombardi regarding responses to substantive consolidation proceeding discovery (.30); review and analysis of requests (.20). 0.40 280.00 12/12/23 P Lombardi Call with Lewis concerning substantive consolidation proceeding discovery requests (.2); review related documents (.2).

12/12/23 Call with Erens regarding litigation issues (.20); research and forward materials to Erens regarding same

0.40

C K Marshall

530.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 116 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866	<b>y</b> = 1= = 1		Page: 14
Aldrich Pu	np LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366
Date of Serv	ice Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
(.20	).		
12/14/23 Dra	P Lombardi ft responses to substantive consolidation proceeding	3.90 discovery requests.	2,730.00
12/15/23 Dra	P Lombardi ft responses to substantive consolidation proceeding	3.50 discovery requests (3.1); revi	2,450.00 se same (.4).
12/18/23 Rev	M A Cody iew and analyze research and precedent related to dis	1.20 emissal matters.	1,770.00
	E M Dowling ft and revise responses to substantive consolidation parding same (0.3).	2.80 proceeding discovery (2.5); co	1,750.00 ommunicate with Hirst
12/18/23 Tel	B B Erens ephone call with Marshall regarding appellate issues.	0.20	300.00
rev	M R Hirst nmunicate with internal team regarding substantive co ew Asbestos Committee responses to affirmative disc ceeding (0.2).		
	P Lombardi iew precedent concerning draft responses to substant conses (3.1).	3.80 tive consolidation proceeding	2,660.00 g discovery (.7); draft
12/18/23 Cal	C K Marshall with Erens regarding appellate issues.	0.20	265.00
	D S Torborg iew responses from the Asbestos Committee to affire solidation proceeding.	1.40 mative discovery served in Di	1,820.00 BMP in substantive
	A Anderson nmunicate with Hirst, Hart, Torborg, Lombardi, and solidation proceeding discovery.	0.50 Dowling regarding responses	350.00 s to substantive
	E M Dowling ft and revise responses to substantive consolidation paregarding same (0.5).	3.30 proceeding discovery (2.8); co	2,062.50 onfer with internal
12/19/23 Att	R Hart end call with internal team regarding responses to sub	0.40 ostantive consolidation proces	280.00 eding discovery.
12/19/23 Att	M R Hirst end meeting with internal team regarding responses to	0.40 o substantive consolidation p	510.00 roceeding discovery.
pro	P Lombardi with Hirst, Torborg, Anderson, Hart and Dowling occeding discovery (.4); draft affirmative discovery required (2.4)		

proceeding (2.4).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 117 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JUNEST	JAI	
161866				Page: 15 December 31, 2023
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/19/2	Attend call with	D S Torborg n Hirst, Hart, Anderson, Hart, and Lom roceeding discovery (.4).	0.40 abardi regarding responses to	520.00 substantive
12/20/2		B B Erens tive consolidation materials from Torbo (.20).	0.70 org (.50); telephone calls with	1,050.00 internal team regarding
12/21/2		M A Cody llyze certiorari petitions and related mat	3.20 terials in Bestwall.	4,720.00
12/21/2		E M Dowling e responses to substantive consolidation	1.60 n proceeding discovery (1.50)	1,000.00; discuss same with
12/21/2		B B Erens ri petitions in Bestwall.	0.30	450.00
12/21/2		P Lombardi ses to substantive consolidation procee	0.30 ding discovery (.2); discuss sa	210.00 ame with Dowling (.1).
12/22/2		B B Erens ri petitions in Bestwall.	0.50	750.00
12/26/2		E M Dowling e responses to substantive consolidation	1.30 n proceeding discovery.	812.50
12/27/2		A P Johnson of stay order in Bestwall (.3); research p	0.80 precedent related to dismissal	640.00 matters (.5).
12/28/2		C K Cahow al opinion (1.20); call with company, in (.50).	1.70 ternal team and Evert Weathe	1,955.00 ersby Houff team
12/28/2	Review and and related pleading	M A Cody alyze opinions regarding dismissal and d gs and precedent (2.8); telephone confer a client and advisors regarding opinions	rence with Erens regarding of	
12/28/2		E M Dowling alyze opinion denying dismissal (.5); dra covery (1.4).	1.90 ft and revise responses to sub	1,187.50 ostantive consolidation
12/28/2	Review opinion	B B Erens as on dismissal and derivative standing (epare for client call regarding same (.50)).		
12/28/2	Communicate v	M R Hirst with internal team regarding derivative lerivative standing (0.7); attend call with		

(0.5).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 118 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOIN	LS DAI	
161866			Page: 16 December 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump	o LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Nam	e Hours	Amount
(.3); re	A P Johnson w dismissal opinion (2.2); discuss same we eview opinion regarding derivative standitusors regarding same (.5).		
12/28/23 Review	P Lombardi w opinions regarding dismissal and deriva	1.30 ative standing.	910.00
	C K Marshall d call with Erens regarding opinion on di to Redmond regarding potential certifica		
12/28/23 Analyz same (	C P Redmond ze opinion regarding dismissal (.30); email (.10).	0.40 ils with Marshall regarding poten	340.00 atial certification motion for
	D S Torborg w opinions denying motions to dismiss as Erens regarding same (.2).	2.00 nd to withdraw derivative standing	2,600.00 ng (1.8); communications
12/29/23 Comm	C K Cahow nunicate with Erens and Marshall regardi	0.30 ng dismissal opinion matters.	345.00
	M A Cody w and analyze precedent related to dismis ssal and motion to withdraw derivative st		
with N	B B Erens s with Marshall regarding certification scl Marshall and Cahow regarding dismissal of ling same and related matters (.20); draft	opinion matters (.30); telephone	conference with Ramsey
12/29/23 Email	C K Marshall with Erens regarding potential motion to	0.10 certify dismissal opinion.	132.50
12/29/23 Review	D S Torborg w opinion denying motions to dismiss.	1.70	2,210.00
12/30/23 Review	A P Johnson w emails from Cahow and Erens regardir	0.20 g dismissal opinion.	160.00
	Matter Total	111.40	USD 114,360.00
Professional R	Retention/Fee Issues		
outsta	A P Johnson w interim fee applications and related ord nding professionals fees (.7); review ema- /illalba (.1); draft email to Cody regarding	il from Bartalone regarding recer	

 $\begin{array}{ccc} 12/01/23 & C\ L\ Smith & 0.10 \\ & \ Update\ electronic\ file\ management\ system\ with\ monthly\ statements. \end{array}$ 

47.50

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 119 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 17 December 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300366 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 12/02/23 A P Johnson 160.00 0.20 Review emails from FTI and Hamilton Stephens regarding outstanding amounts. 0.90 12/04/23 A P Johnson 720.00 Review summary of recent payments (.7); review emails from Villalba and Bartalone regarding same (.2). 0.20 12/06/23 A P Johnson 160.00 Review Anderson Kill's November monthly statement. D C Villalba 300.00 12/06/23 0.40 Review monthly statements from professionals. 12/07/23 A P Johnson 0.80 640.00 Review Orrick's November monthly statement (.2); review FTI interim fee application (.6). 12/08/23 A P Johnson 1,360.00 Review chart of outstanding amounts owed pursuant to interim fee applications (1.1); review interim fee orders related to same (.6). 12/11/23 A P Johnson 7.50 6,000.00 Review chart of outstanding amounts owed pursuant to interim fee applications (1.6); revise same (.8); review interim fee orders related to same (.2); draft emails to Bowen regarding same (.3); review emails from FTI, Hamilton Stephens regarding same (.3); review Future Claimants' Representative November monthly statement (.2); review Grier Wright Martinez November monthly statement (.2); draft reconciliation chart of amounts owed pursuant to 2023 monthly statements (2.1); review monthly statements related to same (1.8). 12/12/23 A P Johnson 4.70 3,760.00 Review reconciliation chart of amounts owed pursuant to 2023 monthly statements (2.2); review monthly statements related to same (2.1); review emails from Bowen regarding same (.2); draft emails to FTI and Hamilton Stephens regarding same (.2). 12/13/23 A P Johnson 4.20 3,360.00 Revise reconciliation chart of amounts owed pursuant to 2023 monthly statements (1.9); analyze same (1.2); review monthly statements related to same (.6); review emails from Bowen regarding same (.1); draft emails to Bowen regarding same (.2); review Claro September monthly statement (.2). 12/14/23 1,520.00 A P Johnson Review Verus September monthly statement (.3); review Verus October monthly statement (.4); review reconciliation chart of amounts owed pursuant to 2023 monthly statements (.9); review monthly statements related to same (.3). 12/15/23 A P Johnson 0.40 320.00 Review Verus September monthly statement (.1); review Verus October monthly statement (.2); draft emails to Villalba regarding same (.1). 2.90 12/18/23 A P Johnson 2,320.00 Review reconciliation chart of amounts owed pursuant to 2023 monthly statements (1.6); revise same (.2); review monthly statements related to same (.5); discuss same with Bartalone (.2); draft emails to Tomsic, Steele regarding monthly statements (.2); review emails from Miller, Thompson regarding same (.2). 12/19/23 480.00 A P Johnson 0.60

Review reconciliation chart of amounts owed pursuant to 2023 monthly statements (.4); draft email to

Bowen regarding amounts outstanding (.2).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 120 of 188

	JONES D	AY	
161866	J		Page: 18 December 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	A P Johnson ails from Wright, Thompson regarding recentrating same (.1); review Claro's monthly state		480.00 nails from Cumbo and
12/21/23 Review ema	A P Johnson ails from Bowen regarding recent payments	0.40 (.2); review FTI November	320.00 er monthly statement (.2).
12/21/23 Review mo	D C Villalba nthly statements from professionals.	0.80	600.00
	A P Johnson  ails from Bowen regarding recent payments atements (.3); draft emails to Miller, Thomps	` '	U 1
	A P Johnson rt of amounts outstanding pursuant to mon eview Ankura's monthly statement (.2).	0.50 thly statements (.2); draft of	400.00 email to Ankura regarding
	A P Johnson es White's November monthly statement (.7 (.9); review Verus monthly statements (.3).	1.90 7); review Winston Strawn	1,520.00 's May-June monthly
	Matter Total	33.70	USD 26,867.50
Fee Application Pro	eparation		
12/01/23 Review Oct	A P Johnson tober monthly statement.	0.20	160.00
12/01/23 Review and same (.10).	C L Smith revise November invoice for privilege and	4.20 compliance (4.10); emails	1,995.00 with Fresenko regarding
12/02/23 Review and	C L Smith revise November invoice for privilege and	1.80 compliance.	855.00
12/04/23 Review and	C L Smith revise November invoice for privilege and	1.20 compliance.	570.00
12/05/23 Review and	C L Smith revise November invoice for privilege and	1.60 compliance.	760.00
12/06/23 Review and	C L Smith revise November invoice for privilege and	2.40 compliance.	1,140.00
10/11/00		0.40	400.00

0.40

0.50

190.00

750.00

12/11/23

12/13/23

C L Smith

B B Erens

Review and revise November invoice for privilege and compliance.

Review and revise November invoice for privilege and compliance.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 121 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JOI LO DI			
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC			Page: 19 er 31, 2023 241300366
				_,
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
team regarding	C L Smith ons with Fresenko regarding November invo g same (.30); further revise November invo ns with Fresenko regarding same (.10); dra	ice for privilege and co	mpliance (.30);	475.00 h internal
12/19/23 Review Novem	A P Johnson nber monthly statement.	0.30		240.00
	Matter Total	13.60	USD	7,135.00
Asbestos Matters				
12/01/23 Communicate relating to sam	C K Cahow with Johnson regarding PIQ compliance is e (.1).	0.30 ssues (.2); call with Smit	th regarding mat	345.00 erials
12/01/23 Review docum	E M Dowling tents for responsiveness to estimation disco	0.50 overy.		312.50
12/01/23 Review estimat (0.3).	M R Hirst tion discovery issues (1.6); communicate w	1.90 ith client regarding esti	mation discover	2,422.50 y issues
12/01/23 Review preced	A P Johnson ent related to PIQ compliance issues (1.1);	1.30 discuss same with Cah	ow (.2).	1,040.00
12/01/23 Call with Caho	C L Smith ow regarding materials relating to PIQ com	0.10 pliance matters.		47.50
12/03/23 Review materia	B B Erens als regarding estimation discovery issues (.5	0.70 50); communicate with	Hirst regarding	1,050.00 same (.20).
12/03/23 Communicate	M R Hirst with Erens regarding estimation discovery	0.20 issues.		255.00
12/04/23 Call with Ever	C K Cahow t regarding estimation discovery matters.	0.50		575.00
diligence regar	B B Erens I with internal team regarding status and pl ding asbestos matters and potential next st ient call regarding estimation discovery doc	eps (.90); telephone cal	ls with client reg	arding same
12/04/23 Telephone con	G M Gordon aference with internal team regarding status	0.20 s and planning.		360.00
12/04/23 Review estimate	R Hart tion case management order and ESI prote	0.20 ocol.		140.00
	M R Hirst h internal team regarding status and plannies (0.7); review follow up regarding same (0.7);		all regarding esti	2,805.00 mation

discovery issues (0.7); review follow up regarding same (0.6).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 122 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOINES DI	. 1 1	
161866	LC and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 20 December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366
Marien Fump Li	EC and Murray Boller LEC		111VOICE. 241300300
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/04/23 Participate	T B Lewis e in call with internal team regarding developm	0.30 tents and planning.	405.00
12/04/23 Attend cal	D S Torborg ll with internal team regarding status and plann	0.30 ning.	390.00
12/05/23 Address n	C K Cahow natters related to estimation discovery.	1.00	1,150.00
potential r	M A Cody eeting with Lombardi and Johnson regarding re next steps (.4); review notes in advance of same from precedent cases regarding asbestos matte	e (.3); review materials rega	
12/05/23 Attend est	M C Corcoran timation discovery planning call (0.6); attend es	1.30 stimation work in process of	1,365.00 call (0.7).
12/05/23 Review do	E M Dowling ocuments for responsiveness to estimation disc	0.30 covery.	187.50
Bates Whi	B B Erens e call with Evert regarding case updates (.20); to ite call (.50); telephone call with Jones regarding regarding same (.20); attend call regarding PIQ	g estimation discovery mat	
	M R Hirst tes White call (0.6); attend estimation work in the matters (0.4); review estimation discovery iss		3,060.00 all regarding PIQ
with Cody	A P Johnson timation discovery call with Bates White and E and Lombardi regarding research relating to a relating to same (1.9).		
12/05/23 Call with 1	J M Jones Erens regarding estimation discovery matters.	0.40	640.00
	P Lombardi eeting with Cody and Johnson concerning asbe concerning same (.9).	1.30 estos matters and potential	910.00 next steps (.4); review
12/06/23 Review an	M A Cody ad analyze materials and precedent regarding as	2.30 sbestos matters and potenti	3,392.50 al next steps.
	B B Erens Evert Weathersby Houff team and mediator (1 same (.30).	1.30 .00); follow up with Evert	1,950.00 Weathersby Houff team
claim file	M R Hirst cate with internal team regarding estimation cludiscovery issues (1.4); review production of donal team regarding production of documents (0.4)	cuments in estimation disc	

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 123 of 188 JONES DAY

		JONES DAT		
161866	D II.C			Page: 21 December 31, 2023
Aldrich	Pump LLC as	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/06/2	Review precede	A P Johnson nt regarding asbestos matters and potential next sow (.2); review materials related to same (.6).	1.60 steps (.8); discuss es	1,280.00 timation discovery
12/07/2		C K Cahow a regarding estimation discovery matters.	0.40	460.00
12/07/2		M A Cody lyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potent (1.3).	4.50 ial next steps (3.2);	6,637.50 review precedent
12/07/2	Telephone call of for client call re	B B Erens with Gale regarding memo relating to asbestos magarding asbestos matters (.30); attend call regardination issues (.40).		
12/07/2		J L Gale as with Erens regarding memo concerning asbesto 0.2).	0.50 os matters and pote	312.50 ntial next steps (0.3);
12/07/2		M R Hirst client and advisors regarding asbestos matters ar	1.00 nd potential next ste	1,275.00 eps.
12/07/2		P Lombardi nt relating to asbestos matters and potential next	0.30 steps.	210.00
12/07/2		D C Villalba Cahow regarding PIQ compliance issues (0.2); re	0.90 esearch regarding sa	675.00 ame (0.7).
12/08/2		M R Hirst on discovery document review issues (1.2); comm	1.40 nunications with int	1,785.00 ternal team regarding
12/08/2	Review precede	A P Johnson nt relating to asbestos matters and potential next ils related to claims sampling from Ramsey and Ed to same (.3).		
12/08/2		P Lombardi nt relating to asbestos matters and potential next	3.30 steps (2.9); draft an	2,310.00 alysis concerning same
12/11/2		E M Dowling lyze documents for responsiveness to estimation	2.00 discovery.	1,250.00
12/11/2		J L Gale andum regarding asbestos matters and potential n	0.20 next steps.	125.00
12/11/2		R Hart ents for responsiveness to estimation discovery.	0.50	350.00
12/11/2	Review of docu	M R Hirst ments for potential production in estimation disc	1.80 covery (1.5); commu	2,295.00 unicate with client

regarding document production issues (0.3).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 124 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JONES DAT		
161866				Page: 22 December 31, 2023
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of .	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/11/2		A P Johnson dent relating to asbestos matters and potential nex	0.80 t steps (.6); revise s	640.00 summary related to same
12/12/2		M A Cody lyze materials related to asbestos issues and poten	2.10 tial next steps.	3,097.50
12/12/2		M C Corcoran on work in process call.	0.80	840.00
12/12/2		E M Dowling ents for responsiveness to estimation discovery.	2.60	1,625.00
12/12/2		J L Gale ent regarding asbestos issues and potential next ste	1.10 eps.	687.50
12/12/2	Attend estimati communicate w	M R Hirst on work in process call (0.8); review documents for the client regarding document production issues (ation discovery document review issues (0.2).		
12/12/2		P Lombardi ent relating to asbestos matters and potential next	5.90 steps (4.1); draft su	4,130.00 mmary concerning same
12/13/2		M A Cody ls regarding asbestos issues and related matters.	1.80	2,655.00
12/13/2		E M Dowling ents for responsiveness to estimation discovery.	3.80	2,375.00
12/13/2		B B Erens with client regarding asbestos matters and potentia	0.70 al next steps (.40); <sub>1</sub>	1,050.00 prepare regarding same
12/13/2		J L Gale andum regarding asbestos issues and potential nex	1.50 at steps.	937.50
12/13/2	Communicate v	M R Hirst with Bates White regarding trust discovery issue (0 arding claims sampling (0.1); review status regardin		
12/13/2		A P Johnson ent relating to asbestos matters and potential next	0.60 steps.	480.00
12/13/2		P Lombardi ent concerning asbestos matters and potential next	5.60 steps (3.2); draft so	3,920.00 ummary concerning
12/14/2	Attend call with	C K Cahow n Erens, Masiano, Hirst, Tananbaum regarding ast e with Erens regarding preparation for same (.50);		

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 125 of 188 **JONES DAY**

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC  Date of Service  Timekeeper/Fee Farner Name  Hours  Amount  12/14/23  M A Cody  Review memoranda and precedent regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (3.8); review materials regarding same (1.3).  12/14/23  B B Leens  1.70  2.550.00  Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.0); attend call regarding same (8.0); call with Client regarding status of case (2.0).  12/14/23  J L Gale  Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.0); attend call regarding same (7.1).  12/14/23  R Hart  0.30  210.00  Emails with Pratt regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.1); review memorandum regarding same (7.1).  12/14/23  M R Hirst  Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23  A P Johnson  Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with internal team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with manumacinate vith Trane team regarding cistimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding document production (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Internal team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Internal team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Internal team regarding estimation discovery documents for production (0.2); communicate with Internal team regarding estimation discovery documents for production (0.2); communicate with Internal team regarding estimation discovery (0.2); review memorandum outline from Lombard regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombard regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (5).  12/14/23  P I Lombardi  Discuss revisions to outline f		JONES DAT		
Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount  12/14/23 M A Cody 5.10 7,522.50 Review memoranda and precedent regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (3.8); review materials regarding same (1.3).  12/14/23 B B Erens 1.70 2,550.00 Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (20); attend call regarding same (80); call with Calhow to prepare for same (50); call with Guy reparding status of case (20).  12/14/23 B Hart 2.10 Gale 9.20 5,750.00 Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.1); review memorandum regarding same (7.1).  12/14/23 R Hart 0.30 210.00 Emails with Prart reparding estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23 M R Hfirst 2.40 3,060.00 Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production (0.0); communicate with internal team regarding document production (0.2); communicate with Bates White regarding Verus production (0.2); communicate with Time team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Tananbaum regarding estimation discovery issues (0.2).  12/14/23 A P Johnson 6.30 5,040.00 Analyze precedent regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (5).  12/14/23 P Lombardi regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (5).  12/14/23 E Pratt 2.10 787.50 Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (5); review production documents (6); communicate with Part regarding same (1.8); revise outline (9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (1).  12/15/23 E Pratt 2.10 787.50 Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (5); review production documents (6); communicate with Part regarding same (1.8); revise outline (1.9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (1.9); review precedent regarding same (1.9); review and analyze matters regarding ashestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00 Prepare for call with cl	161866			0
12/14/23 M A Cody Review memoranda and precedent regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (3.8); review materials regarding same (1.3).  12/14/23 B B Erens 1.70 2,550.00 Prepare for call with Cahow to prepare for same (50); call with Guy regarding status of case (20).  12/14/23 J L Gale Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (20); attend call regarding same (80); call with Cahow to prepare for same (50); call with Guy regarding status of case (20).  12/14/23 J L Gale Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.1); review memorandum regarding same (7.1).  12/14/23 R Hart 0.30 210.00 Emails with Pratt regarding estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23 M R Hirt 2.40 3,060.00 Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production (0.2); communicate with Internal team regarding document production (0.2); communicate with Bates White regarding Verus production (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Tananbaum regarding estimation discovery issues (0.2).  12/14/23 A P Johnson Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (5).  12/14/23 P Lombardi Discuss revisions to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps with Johnson (6); review precedent concerning same (8); revise outline (9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (1.1)  12/14/23 E Pratt Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (5); review production documents (6); communicate with Ilar regarding same (3); draft email to vendor regarding production set (1.1)  12/15/23 M A Cody Review and analyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (4.9); for the reparding aspects on the regardi	Aldrich Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Review memoranda and precedent regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (3.8); review materials regarding same (1.3)  12/14/23 B B Erens 1.70 2,550.00  Prepare for call with Cahow to prepare for same (.50); call with Guy regarding status of case (.20).  12/14/23 J L Gale 9.20 5,750.00  Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.1); review memorandum regarding same (7.1).  12/14/23 R Hart 0.30 210.00  Emails with Pratt regarding estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23 M R Hirst 0.30 210.00  Emails with Pratt regarding estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23 M R Hirst 2.40 3,060.00  Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production (0.0); communicate with internal team regarding document production (0.2); communicate with lates White regarding Verus production (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery document production (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery document production (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery issues (0.2).  12/14/23 A P Johnson 6.30  5.040.00  Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (5).  12/14/23 P Lombardi 2.40  Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (5); review production documents (6); communicate with Hart regarding same (3); draft email to vendor regarding production (3); review of document production from vendor (3); c	Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (20); attend call regarding same (80); call with Cahow to prepare for same (50); call with Guy regarding status of case (20).  12/14/23 J. Gale 9.20 5.750.00  Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.1); review memorandum regarding same (7.1).  12/14/23 R. Hart 0.30 210.00  Emails with Pratt regarding estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23 M. R. Hirst 0.30 3,060.00  Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production (0.0); communicate with internal team regarding document production (0.0); communicate with internal team regarding document production (0.0); communicate with france team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Tananbaum regarding estimation discovery issues (0.2).  12/14/23 A. P. Johnson 6.30 5,040.00  Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding asme (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (5).  12/14/23 P. Lombardi 2.40 1,680.00  Discuss revisions to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps with Johnson (6); review precedent concerning same (1.8); revise outline (9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (1.1).  12/14/23 E. Pratt 2.10 787.50  Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (5); review production documents (6); communicate with Hart regarding same (3); draft email to vendor regarding production (3); review of document production from vendor (3); communicate with vendor regarding production (3); review of document production from vendor (3); communicate with vendor regarding production (3); review of document production from regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 M. A. Cody 5.70 8,407.50  Telephone conference with client and advisors regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps	Review memor	anda and precedent regarding asbestos issues and		
Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.1); review memorandum regarding same (7.1).  12/14/23 R Hart	Prepare for call	with client regarding asbestos matters and potent	ial next steps (.20);	attend call regarding
12/14/23 R Hart 0.30 210.00 Emails with Pratt regarding estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23 M R Hirst 2.40 3,060.00 Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production (0.6); communicate with internal team regarding document production (0.2); communicate with Tananbaum regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Tananbaum regarding estimation discovery issues (0.2).  12/14/23 A P Johnson 6.30 5,040.00 Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.5).  12/14/23 P Lombardi 2.40 1,680.00 Discuss revisions to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps with Johnson (.6); review precedent concerning same (.8); revise outline (.9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1).  12/14/23 E Pratt 2.10 787.50 Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (.5); review production documents (.6); communicate with Hart regarding same (.3); draft email to vendor regarding production (.3); review of document production from vendor (.3); communicate with vendor regarding production set (.1).  12/15/23 C K Cahow 0.90 1,035.00 Review and analyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with client and advisors regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.1); review and analyze memoranda and precedent regarding same (.4.8).  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00 Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50 Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.	Review precede			· ·
Emails with Pratt regarding estimation discovery document production.  12/14/23 M R Hirst 2.40 3,060.00  Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production (0.6); communicate with internal team regarding document production (0.2); communicate with Bates White regarding Verus production (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Trananbaum regarding estimation discovery issues (0.2).  12/14/23 A P Johnson 6.30 5,040.00  Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.5).  12/14/23 P Lombardi 2.40 1,680.00  Discuss revisions to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps with Johnson (.6); review precedent concerning same (.8); revise outline (.9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1).  12/14/23 E Pratt 2.10 787.50  Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (.5); review production documents (.6); communicate with Hart regarding same (.3); draft email to vendor regarding production (.3); review of document production from vendor (.3); communicate with vendor regarding production set (.1).  12/15/23 C K Cahow 0.90 1,035.00  Review and analyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.1); review and analyze memoranda and precedent regarding same (4.8).  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00  Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50  Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.	, ,			
Attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.0); review estimation discovery document production (0.2); communicate with histernal team regarding document production (0.2); communicate with Trane team regarding estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate with Tananbaum regarding estimation discovery issues (0.2).  12/14/23 A P Johnson 6.30 5,040.00  Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.5).  12/14/23 P Lombardi 2.40 1,680.00  Discuss revisions to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps with Johnson (.6); review precedent concerning same (.8); revise outline (.9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1).  12/14/23 E Pratt 2.10 787.50  Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (.5); review production documents (.6); communicate with Hart regarding same (.3); draft email to vendor regarding production (.3); review of document production from vendor (.3); communicate with vendor regarding production set (.1).  12/15/23 C K Cahow 0.90 1,035.00  Review and analyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 M A Cody 5.70 8,407.50  Telephone conference with client and advisors regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.1); review and analyze memoranda and precedent regarding same (4.8).  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00  Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50  Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.				210.00
Analyze precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (1.8); revise same (2.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.5).  12/14/23 P Lombardi 2.40 1,680.00 Discuss revisions to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps with Johnson (.6); review precedent concerning same (.8); revise outline (.9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1).  12/14/23 E Pratt 2.10 787.50 Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (.5); review production documents (.6); communicate with Hart regarding same (.3); draft email to vendor regarding production (.3); review of document production from vendor (.3); communicate with vendor regarding production set (.1).  12/15/23 C K Cahow 0.90 1,035.00 Review and analyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 M A Cody 5.70 8,407.50 Telephone conference with client and advisors regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.1); review and analyze memoranda and precedent regarding same (4.8).  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00 Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50 Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.	Attend call with estimation disco production (0.2 team regarding	n client and advisors regarding asbestos matters an overy document production (0.6); communicate w c); communicate with Bates White regarding Verus estimation discovery documents (0.2); communicate	d potential next ste ith internal team re production (0.2); o	eps (1.0); review garding document communicate with Trane
Discuss revisions to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps with Johnson (.6); review precedent concerning same (.8); revise outline (.9); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1).  12/14/23 E Pratt 2.10 787.50 Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (.5); review production documents (.6); communicate with Hart regarding same (.3); draft email to vendor regarding production (.3); review of document production from vendor (.3); communicate with vendor regarding production set (.1).  12/15/23 C K Cahow 0.90 1,035.00 Review and analyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 M A Cody 5.70 8,407.50 Telephone conference with client and advisors regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.1); review and analyze memoranda and precedent regarding same (4.8).  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00 Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50 Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.	Analyze preced	ent regarding asbestos matters and potential next	steps (1.6); review r	memorandum outline
Prepare documents for production in estimation discovery (.5); review production documents (.6); communicate with Hart regarding same (.3); draft email to vendor regarding production (.3); review of document production from vendor (.3); communicate with vendor regarding production set (.1).  12/15/23	Discuss revision Johnson (.6); re	ns to outline for memorandum regarding asbestos	matters and poten	tial next steps with
Review and analyze matters regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 M A Cody 5.70 8,407.50 Telephone conference with client and advisors regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.1); review and analyze memoranda and precedent regarding same (4.8).  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00 Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50 Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.	Prepare docum communicate w	ents for production in estimation discovery (.5); re vith Hart regarding same (.3); draft email to vendo	eview production de r regarding product	ocuments (.6); tion (.3); review of
Telephone conference with client and advisors regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (.8); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.1); review and analyze memoranda and precedent regarding same (4.8).  12/15/23 B B Erens 1.20 1,800.00 Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50 Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 R Hart 1.10 770.00				1,035.00
Prepare for call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.00).  12/15/23 J L Gale 3.30 2,062.50 Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 R Hart 1.10 770.00	Telephone contelephone conf	ference with client and advisors regarding asbestos erence with Johnson regarding same (.1); review as	s issues and potenti	al next steps (.8);
Research precedent related to asbestos issues and potential next steps.  12/15/23 R Hart 1.10 770.00	Prepare for call			
		•		2,062.50
				770.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 126 of 188

**IONES DAY** 161866 Page: 24 December 31, 2023 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300366 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 1.30 12/15/23 1,657.50 Finalize document production in estimation discovery (0.4); review issues relating to estimation discovery document review and privilege (0.9). 5,280.00 12/15/23 A P Johnson 6.60 Analyze precedent relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps (.8); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (1.2); revise same (.7); draft emails to Lombardi regarding same (.2); review memorandum regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (2.2); attend call with client and advisors regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.9); review memorandum related to same (.5); discuss same with Cody (.1). 12/15/23 P Lombardi 420.00 0.60Review comments from Johnson concerning memorandum outline relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps (.3); draft revisions concerning same (.2); draft email to Cody concerning same (.1). 12/15/23 450.00 1.20 Review document production received from vendor relating to estimation discovery (.6); prepare same for service (.2); communicate with Hart and Anderson regarding service (.2); coordinate service of estimation discovery document production (.2). 12/16/23 R Hart 1,540.00 Review documents for responsiveness in connection with responding to estimation discovery. 12/17/23 770.00 Review documents for responsiveness in connection with responding to estimation discovery. 12/17/23 A P Johnson 1.40 1,120.00 Analyze precedent relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.2); review memorandum outline from Lombardi regarding same (.2). 7,522.50 12/18/23 5.10 M A Cody Review and analyze precedent and other materials regarding asbestos issues and potential next steps (3.8); review outline and issues list regarding same (.8); meeting with Erens regarding same (.5). 3,900.00 12/18/23 B B Erens 2.60 Telephone call with Evert Weathersby Houff team regarding asbestos matters (.40); communications with mediators (.20); telephone call with Cody regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.20); call with McGonigle regarding discussions with insurers regarding same (.20); conference with Cody regarding same (.60); review materials from Cody regarding same (.30); prepare for call with internal team regarding status and planning (.30); attend call regarding same (.40). 12/18/23 1,500.00 J L Gale Review and revise memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps.

G M Gordon 0.20 360.00 12/18/23

Telephone conference with internal team regarding status and planning.

12/18/23 2.00 2,550.00 M R Hirst Attend call with Trane counsel regarding estimation matters (1.2); attend call with internal team regarding status and planning (.8).

12/18/23 1,440.00 A P Johnson 1.80 Review precedent related to estimation (.3); discuss same with Cahow (.1); analyze precedent relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.4).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 127 of 188 JONES DAY

	JONES DA	1	
161866			Page: 25 December 31, 2023
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/18/23 Participate in	T B Lewis call with internal team regarding developmen	0.20 nts and planning.	270.00
12/18/23 Attend call wi	D S Torborg ith internal team regarding status and planning	0.20 ag.	260.00
12/19/23 Call with Bate discovery.	C K Cahow es White team, Evert Weathersby Houff team	0.90 n, and internal team rega	1,035.00 arding estimation
	M A Cody ng with Lombardi regarding issues list and ou iew and analyze memoranda and precedent re		4,572.50 issues and potential next
12/19/23 Attend estima	M C Corcoran ation discovery planning call (1.0); attend esti	1.40 mation work in process	1,470.00 call (0.4).
	B B Erens White call regarding estimation discovery (1. eathersby Houff regarding same (.20).	1.50 00); telephone call with	2,250.00 mediator (.30); follow up
Masiano regar	M R Hirst White call regarding estimation discovery (0. rding estimation planning (1.0); attend estimations for estimation (2.2).		
	A P Johnson ation discovery call with Bates White and Eve the (.1); review precedent related to asbestos n		
	P Lombardi Cody concerning memorandum outline relat otes concerning same (.2); review precedent o		770.00 and potential next steps
12/19/23 Discuss motion same (.3).	D S Torborg on for ruling in Manville trust discovery dispo	0.60 ute proceeding with Hirs	780.00 st (.3); research regarding
12/19/23 Draft letter to	D C Villalba Asbestos Committee counsel regarding PIQ	3.70 compliance issues.	2,775.00
12/20/23 Review and as	M A Cody nalyze asbestos issues and potential next step	2.80 os.	4,130.00
12/20/23 Prepare for cl	B B Erens ient call regarding asbestos matters and pote	0.30 ntial next steps.	450.00
12/20/23 Draft motion	R Hart for ruling in Manville trust discovery dispute	3.30 e proceeding.	2,310.00
	M R Hirst with McGuire Woods team (0.2); review est with internal team regarding estimation issue		1,275.00 oorts for discovery (0.6);

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 128 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JUNES DAY		
16186	6			Page: 26 December 31, 2023
Aldric	h Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date o	f Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/20/	Review outline	P Lombardi and notes from meeting with Cody relating to asb nt concerning same (4.3); review email from Cody ne (.1).		
12/20/		D C Villalba ls regarding PIQ related issues.	1.40	1,050.00
12/21/		A Anderson with Hirst and Hart regarding estimation discovery g order (.2).	0.70 y and next steps (.5)	490.00 r; review precedent
12/21/	Call with comp	C K Cahow any, Jones Day team and Evert Weathersby Houfe teps (1.00); address matters related to same (1.50).		2,875.00 pestos matters and
12/21/		M A Cody h materials regarding asbestos issues and potential	2.40 next steps.	3,540.00
12/21/	Prepare for call review material	B B Erens with insurers regarding estimation discovery issues from Johnson regarding asbestos matters and pording same (.20); attend call regarding same (.80).		
12/21/	Attend meeting	R Hart g with Anderson and Hirst regarding estimation dis claims sampling (0.7).	1.10 scovery and next sto	770.00 eps (0.4); review draft
12/21/	Call with McGu Hart, Andersor	M R Hirst uire Woods team (0.8); call with McGonigle, Roten regarding estimation discovery next steps (0.4); reps in estimation (0.8); attend call with client and actteps (0.9).	eview Bates White	correspondence (0.4);
12/21/		A P Johnson ent related to asbestos issues and potential next ste	1.10 eps.	880.00
12/21/		P Lombardi dent relating to asbestos matters and potential nex ne (1.2).	3.80 et steps (2.6); draft r	2,660.00 memorandum
12/22/		B B Erens ls from Guy regarding asbestos matters.	0.30	450.00
12/22/		J L Gale andum regarding asbestos matters and potential n	0.50 ext steps.	312.50
12/22/	Communicate v	M R Hirst with Verus counsel regarding meet and confer list on discovery issues (1.0).	1.40 relating to estimation	1,785.00 on discovery (0.4);
40/00	/00	D.T. 1. 1'	4.40	4.000.00

Research precedent relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps (3.8); draft memorandum

6.10

4,270.00

12/22/23

P Lombardi

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 129 of 188 JONES DAY

		JOI LO DI	<b>1</b> 1	
161866		•		Page: 27 December 31, 2023
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300366
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	concerning sam	ne (2.3).		
12/26/2		B B Erens rst and Evert Weathersby Houff team rega	0.30 arding claims sampling ord	450.00 der and related issues.
12/26/2	Review and rev	M R Hirst ise draft order regarding claims sampling (0.2); review estimation discovery issues (		1,020.00 vert and Masiano
12/26/2		P Lombardi ent relating to asbestos matters and potent	6.30 rial next steps (2.2); draft m	4,410.00 nemorandum concerning
12/27/2		J L Gale ndum regarding asbestos matters and pote	3.70 ential next steps.	2,312.50
12/27/2		R Hart for ruling in Manville trust discovery disp	0.60 oute proceeding.	420.00
12/27/2	Review issues re Manville trust d	M R Hirst egarding privilege for estimation case (1.0) liscovery dispute proceeding (0.6); commus s issues (0.2); review estimation discovery	unicate with internal team r	
12/27/2		A P Johnson campling order and related proposed samp	0.30 ble.	240.00
12/27/2	Review precede	P Lombardi ent relating to asbestos matters and potent it memorandum concerning same (1.8).	4.20 ial next steps (1.3); researc	2,940.00 h precedent concerning
12/28/2		J L Gale ndum regarding asbestos matters and pote	1.00 ential next steps.	625.00
12/28/2		M R Hirst nications regarding claims sampling order .3).	0.50 (0.2); review estimation di	637.50 scovery document
12/28/2		P Lombardi dent relating to asbestos matters and potente (3.7).	5.60 ntial next steps (1.9); draft	3,920.00 memorandum
12/28/2		D C Villalba mpliance issues (0.9); draft summary of sa	1.80 ame (0.9).	1,350.00
12/29/2		P Lombardi ent relating to asbestos matters and potent	4.10 rial next steps (.7); draft me	2,870.00 emorandum concerning
12/29/2		D S Torborg ise motion for ruling in Manville trust disc	1.00 covery dispute.	1,300.00

Matter Total 251.70 USD 250,985.00

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 130 of 188 **JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 28

December 31, 2023 Invoice: 241300366

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

#### FORTY-THIRD MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2024 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Forty-Third Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From January 1, 2024 Through January 31, 2024 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

#### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period
 January 1, 2024 through January 31, 2024 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

#### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$1,253,447.50
Total Expenses	\$15.00
TOTAL	\$1,253,462.50

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$1,128,117.75 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

#### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

4. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036 (Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc., (I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103 (Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter & English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019 (Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC, 1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 133 of 188

Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than March 15, 2024 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 6. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.
- 7. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Dated: March 1, 2024

Chicago, Illinois

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585 E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com

macody@jonesday.com ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 135 of 188

#### **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

#### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800 Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

January 31, 2024 161866 Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through January 31, 2024:

	<u>Hours</u>		<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	46.90		59,310.00
Claims Administration	34.40		40,307.50
Court Hearings	8.30		9,897.50
General Corporate and Real Estate	28.60		35,070.00
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator			
Reporting	15.90		17,185.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	658.40		686,437.50
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	23.00		22,247.50
Fee Application Preparation	19.70		10,912.50
Asbestos Matters	317.20		372,080.00
Total Fees	1,152.40	USD	1,253,447.50
Total Billed Disbursements		USD .	15.00
TOTAL		USD	1,253,462.50

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 137 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 2
January 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853

Disbursement & Charges Summary

Travel - Air Fare 15.00

USD \_\_\_\_\_15.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 138 of 188 JONES DAY

Page: 3

January 31, 2024

Invoice: 241300853

161866

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – January 31, 2024

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
	_				
C K Cahow	Partner	2014	13.10	1,275.00	16,702.50
M A Cody	Partner	1996	139.00	1,575.00	218,925.00
M C Corcoran	Partner	2004	1.50	1,150.00	1,725.00
B B Erens	Partner	1991	104.00	1,625.00	169,000.00
G M Gordon	Partner	1980	2.80	2,000.00	5,600.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	47.70	1,375.00	65,587.50
J M Jones	Partner	1986	0.50	1,750.00	875.00
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	14.90	1,450.00	21,605.00
C K Marshall	Partner	2001	22.00	1,450.00	31,900.00
J L Panza	Partner	2007	3.00	1,300.00	3,900.00
D S Torborg	Partner	1998	79.20	1,400.00	110,880.00
Total			427.70		646,700.00
M R Seiden	Of Counsel	1992 _	1.90	1,450.00	2,755.00
Total			1.90		2,755.00
E M Dowling	Associate	2022	52.30	725.00	37,917.50
J L Gale	Associate	2022	67.80	725.00	49,155.00
R Hart	Associate	2021	0.40	825.00	330.00
R H Howell	Associate	2022	7.30	725.00	5,292.50
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	212.20	925.00	196,285.00
J E Leitner	Associate	2023	35.00	675.00	23,625.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2023	146.60	850.00	124,610.00
C P Redmond	Associate		74.50	975.00	
D C Villalba	Associate	2019 2019	83.60	875.00	72,637.50 73,150.00
Total			679.70		583,002.50
J B Mays	Paralegal		7.30	425.00	3,102.50
C L Smith	Paralegal		32.50	525.00	17,062.50
Total			39.80		20,165.00
K A Louis	Librarian		3.30	250.00	825.00
Total			3.30		825.00
Total			1,152.40	USD	1,253,447.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 139 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 4

January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Fee Detail

Fee Detail				
Date of Se.	rvice Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount	
Case Adm	inistration and Business Operations			
01/02/24 T	B B Erens elephone call with Johnson regarding status of outst	0.20 canding projects.	325.00	
01/02/24 R	C L Smith eview and distribute docket (.10); coordinate case ac	0.50 Iministration matters (.40).	262.50	
V	B B Erens valuate upcoming tasks (.40); conference with Gale illalba regarding same (.20); conference with Lomba garding same (.40); conference with Cody regarding	rdi regarding same (.20); conferenc	ce with Johnson	
01/03/24 D	J L Gale iscuss status of outstanding projects with Erens.	0.20	145.00	
01/03/24 D	A P Johnson iscuss status of outstanding projects with Erens.	0.30	277.50	
	C L Smith eview and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently file estem with same (.10).	0.20 ed documents and update electroni	105.00 ic file management	
01/04/24 R	C L Smith eview and distribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
01/05/24 A	C K Cahow ttend work in process call with company, internal te	1.00 ram and advisors.	1,275.00	
01/05/24 T	M A Cody elephone conference with client and advisors regard	1.00 ling work in process matters.	1,575.00	
01/05/24 R	J L Gale evise calendar of key dates and deadlines.	0.40	290.00	
01/05/24 A	M R Hirst ttend client work in process call.	1.00	1,375.00	
01/05/24 A	A P Johnson ttend work in process call with client and advisors.	1.00	925.00	
01/05/24 Pa	T B Lewis articipate in work in process call with client.	1.00	1,450.00	
01/05/24 A	M R Seiden ttend client work in process call.	1.00	1,450.00	
	C L Smith eview and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently file estem with same (.10).	0.20 ed documents and update electroni	105.00 ic file management	

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 140 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JOI LEG E	/1 <b>.</b> I	
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 5 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/08/24 Address case	C K Cahow administration matters.	0.30	382.50
01/08/24 Prepare for w	B B Erens rork in process calls (.20); telephone call w	0.40 with Johnson regarding same (.2	650.00
01/08/24 Review and d system with s	C L Smith istribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ame (.10).	0.20 I documents and update electro	105.00 onic file management
01/09/24 Attend work	C K Cahow in process call with internal team and advi	0.70 isors.	892.50
	M A Cody onference with advisors regarding work in a process report regarding same (.8).	1.90 process matters (.8); review tas	2,992.50 sk list (.3); review and
01/09/24 Prepare for w	B B Erens vork in process call with advisors (.20); atte	1.00 end work in process call with a	1,625.00 dvisors (.80).
01/09/24 Revise task lis	A P Johnson st (.8); revise work in process report (.5); a	2.10 attend work in process call with	1,942.50 advisors (.8).
01/09/24 Participate in	T B Lewis work in process call with advisors.	0.80	1,160.00
01/09/24 Review and d	C L Smith istribute docket.	0.10	52.50
01/09/24 Attend work	D S Torborg in process call with advisors.	0.80	1,120.00
01/10/24 Review upcor	B B Erens ming tasks.	0.50	812.50
01/10/24 Review and d	C L Smith istribute docket.	0.10	52.50
01/11/24 Review and d	C L Smith istribute docket.	0.10	52.50
01/12/24 Revise calend	J L Gale ar of key dates and deadlines.	0.40	290.00
	C L Smith istribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ame (.10); update case calendar (.10).	0.30 I documents and update electro	157.50 onic file management
01/15/24 Prepare for w	B B Erens ork in process call with advisors.	0.40	650.00
01/16/24 Attend work	B B Erens in process call with advisors.	0.50	812.50

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 141 of 188 JONES DAY

161866	JOINES		Page: 6
Aldrich Pump	o LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/16/24 Revise	A P Johnson e work in process report (.3); revise task list (.3); att	1.10 tend work in process call v	1,017.50 with advisors (.5).
01/16/24 Attend	T B Lewis d work in process call with advisors.	0.50	725.00
	C L Smith w and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed in with same (.20); address case administration matt		262.50 ectronic file management
01/16/24 Attend	D S Torborg d work in process call with advisors.	0.50	700.00
01/17/24 Review	B B Erens w upcoming tasks.	0.20	325.00
01/17/24 Review	C L Smith w and distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
	C L Smith w and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed a with same (.10); update case calendar (.10).	0.30 documents and update ele	157.50 ectronic file management
01/19/24 Revise	J L Gale e calendar of key dates and deadlines.	0.40	290.00
01/19/24 Review	C L Smith w and distribute docket (.10); update case calendar	0.20 (.10).	105.00
01/22/24 Comm	A P Johnson nunications with Erens regarding status of outstand	0.30 ding projects.	277.50
01/22/24 Review	C L Smith w and distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
01/23/24 Attend	C K Cahow d work in process call with internal team and advis	0.80 ors.	1,020.00
	M A Cody hone conference with advisors regarding work in prin process report (.5).	1.30 process matters (.8); review	2,047.50 v and revise task list and
	B B Erens re for work in process call with advisors (.30); com- nation for same (.20); attend work in process call w		2,112.50 ad Dowling regarding
01/23/24 Revise	A P Johnson e task list (.2); revise work in process report (.2); att	1.20 tend work in process call v	1,110.00 with advisors (.8).
01/23/24 Partic	T B Lewis cipate in work in process call with advisors.	0.50	725.00
01/23/24 Review	C L Smith w and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed	0.20 documents and update ele	105.00 ectronic file management

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 142 of 188 **JONES DAY**

Page: 7

161866

Aldrich Pump LLO	C and Murray Boiler LLC		January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
system with	same (.10).		
01/23/24 Attend work	D S Torborg in process call with advisors.	0.80	1,120.00
01/24/24 Review task	B B Erens list.	0.60	975.00
01/24/24 Review and system with	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed d same (.10).	0.20 ocuments and update ele	105.00 ctronic file management
01/25/24 Call with Go	B B Erens ordon regarding case administration matters.	0.20	325.00
01/25/24 Telephone o	G M Gordon conference with Erens regarding case adminis	0.20 tration matters.	400.00
01/25/24 Revise task	A P Johnson list (.1); review same (.2); draft email to Hirst:	0.40 regarding same (.1).	370.00
	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed d same (.10); address case administration matter		157.50 ctronic file management
01/26/24 Attend work	C K Cahow s in process call with company, internal team	0.70 and advisors.	892.50
01/26/24 Telephone o	M A Cody conference with client and advisors regarding	0.80 work in process matters.	1,260.00
01/26/24 Prepare for and Evert re	B B Erens client work in process call (.20); attend call regarding the same (.30).	1.20 garding the same (.70); fo	1,950.00 bllow up calls with Miller
01/26/24 Revise calen	J L Gale dar of key dates and deadlines.	0.40	290.00
01/26/24 Attend clien	M R Hirst at work in process call.	0.80	1,100.00
01/26/24 Attend work	A P Johnson x in process call with client and advisors.	0.60	555.00
01/26/24 Participate is	T B Lewis n work in process call with client and advisors	0.80 s.	1,160.00
01/26/24 Review and system with	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed d same (.10).	0.20 ocuments and update ele	105.00 ctronic file management
01/26/24 Attend call v	D S Torborg with client and advisors regarding work in pro	0.70 ocess.	980.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 143 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC			Page: 8 ary 31, 2024 241300853		
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount		
01/27/24 Revise task list	A P Johnson t.	0.40		370.00		
01/29/24 Prepare for ad outstanding pr	B B Erens visor work in process call (.50); communication cojects (.10).	0.60 ons with Johnson reg	arding status o	975.00 f case and		
01/29/24 Discuss status	A P Johnson of case and outstanding projects with Erens.	0.10		92.50		
01/29/24 Review and dis system with sa	C L Smith stribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed docume (.10).	0.20 uments and update e	lectronic file m	105.00 anagement		
01/30/24 Attend work in	C K Cahow n process call with internal team and advisors.	0.60		765.00		
01/30/24 Review task lis process matter	M A Cody st and work in process report (.8); telephone c rs (.8).	1.60 onference with advis	ors regarding v	2,520.00 work in		
regarding the s	B B Erens visor work in process call (.20); attend call reg same (.20); follow up with Dowling regarding ; follow up with Lombardi regarding the same	the same (.20); follow				
01/30/24 Revise task list	A P Johnson t (.4); revise work in process report (.2); attend	1.30 I work in process cal	l with advisors	1,202.50 (.7).		
01/30/24 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10		52.50		
01/30/24 Attend work in	D S Torborg n process call with advisors.	0.70		980.00		
01/31/24 C L Smith 0.70 367.50  Review and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed documents and update electronic file management system with same (.10); emails with Miller, Cody, Johnson regarding case administration matters (.10); coordinate matters relating to same (.40).						
	Matter Total	46.90	USD	59,310.00		
Claims Administration	n					
01/03/24 Review claims same (.4).	A P Johnson register (.2); review omnibus claims objection	0.70 procedures (.1); rev	iew precedent :	647.50 related to		
01/04/24 Communication	J L Gale ons with Johnson regarding omnibus claims ol	0.30 bjections procedures		217.50		
01/04/24 Review omnib	A P Johnson ous claims objection procedures (.1); review pr	0.80 ecedent related to sa	me (.4); discuss	740.00 same with		

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 144 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JUNES DAY		
161866				Page: 9 January 31, 2024
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	Gale (.3).			
01/05/2		M A Cody ng PIQ compliance and related claims issues (.5); tel (.1).	0.60 lephone conferenc	945.00 e with Johnson
01/05/2	Review omnibu	A P Johnson as claims objection procedures (.1); review preceder iscuss PIQ compliance and claims matters with Coo		462.50 (.2); discuss same with
01/06/2		A P Johnson register (.2); review email from Miller regarding sam	0.30 ne (.1).	277.50
01/08/2		M A Cody correspondence and related reports regarding PIQ	0.80 compliance and cl	1,260.00 aims issues.
01/08/2		A P Johnson rom Masiano regarding claims matters.	0.30	277.50
01/09/2	Review corresp	M A Cody condence and related reports regarding PIQ complisms with Erens regarding claims issues (.2).	0.80 ance and claims iss	1,260.00 sues (.6);
01/09/2		B B Erens ns with Cody regarding claims issues.	0.20	325.00
01/11/2		P Lombardi oncerning claims issue (.1); draft email to Cody con ne (.1).	0.30 acerning same (.1);	255.00 draft email to Sands
01/12/2	Telephone con regarding same	M A Cody ference with Masiano regarding claims issues (.5); to (.1); review correspondence and background mater); review claims register summary (.3).		
01/12/2	Review summa	A P Johnson ry of claims register from Miller (.6); review email f y (.1); draft emails to Cody, Tomsic regarding same		
01/15/2		A P Johnson ry of claims register from Miller (.4); review preced-	1.10 ent related to stipu	1,017.50 llation concerning
01/16/2		M A Cody pplements and claims materials (.8); emails with Ma	1.10 asiano regarding sa	1,732.50 me (.3).
01/16/2		A P Johnson ry of claims register from Miller (.2); review preced-	0.40 ent related to stipu	370.00 llation concerning
01/17/2		M A Cody asiano regarding claims issues (.2); review related co	0.40 orrespondence (.2).	630.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 145 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 10 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/17/24 A P Johnson 0.60 555.00 Review summary of claims register from Miller (.2); review precedent related to stipulation concerning claims (.2); discuss same with Gale (.1); draft email to Gale regarding same (.1). 0.50 01/18/24 M A Cody 787.50 Review and analyze correspondence regarding claims issues (.5). 01/19/24 M A Cody 0.60 945.00 Emails with Masiano regarding PIQ compliance and claims issues (.3); review related correspondence (.3). 0.40 370.00 01/19/24 A P Johnson Review claims register (.2); review precedent related to stipulation concerning claims (.2). 01/23/24 630.00 M A Cody Emails with Masiano regarding claims issues (.3); telephone conference with Johnson regarding stipulation related to claims (.1). 01/23/24 0.90652.50 J L Gale Draft and revise stipulation relating to claims (0.6); discuss same with Johnson (0.3). 01/23/24 A P Johnson 1.80 Review emails from Masiano regarding claim withdrawals (.2); draft and revise stipulation relating to claims (.7); discuss same with Cody (.1); review precedent related to same (.5); discuss same with Gale (.3). 1,890.00 01/24/24 M A Cody 1.20 Review drafts of stipulation regarding claims (.3); review related issues (.2); review materials regarding creditor inquiries regarding claim amendments (.5); review related correspondence (.2). 01/24/24 A P Johnson Review emails from Masiano regarding claim withdrawals (.2); draft stipulation relating to claims (1.1); revise same (.8); review precedent related to same (.7); draft email to Cody regarding same (.2); review emails from Masiano, Cody regarding claim withdrawals (.3). 01/25/24 M A Cody 1.80 2,835.00 Review and revise draft stipulation regarding claims (1.1); emails with Masiano regarding claims issues (.2); review omnibus claims objection precedent (.5). 01/25/24 0.60 555.00 A P Johnson Review stipulation relating to claims (.3); draft emails to Masiano, Cody regarding same (.2); discuss same with Masiano (.1). 01/26/24 M A Cody 1.90 2,992.50 Review claims objection precedent and related materials (1.1); review revised stipulation concerning claims and emails relating to same (.8). 01/26/24 A P Johnson 555.00 Review stipulation regarding claims (.3); review emails from Masiano, Cody regarding same (.2); discuss same with Gale (.1). 01/28/24 0.90 A P Johnson 832.50 Review stipulation regarding claims (.3); revise same (.2); review emails from Masiano, Cody regarding same (.2); draft email to Gale regarding same (.2).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 146 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT		
161866	I M D-'l I I C		Page: 11 January 31, 2024
Alarich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/29/24 Review and re	M A Cody vise stipulation regarding claims (.5); emails with	0.80 h Masiano regarding	1,260.00 claims issues (.3).
01/29/24 Revise stipulat	J L Gale ion relating to claims (3.0); emails with Johnson	3.10 n regarding same (.10	2,247.50
01/29/24 Review stipula to Gale regard	A P Johnson tion relating to claims (.3); review supporting doing same (.1).	0.90 ocumentation related	832.50 d to same (.5); draft email
01/30/24 Review emails	M A Cody and related materials regarding claims issues (.7	0.90 7); emails with Masia	1,417.50 no regarding same (.2).
01/30/24 Review stipula	A P Johnson tion regarding claims (.1); discuss same with Ga	0.20 ale (.1).	185.00
01/31/24 Emails with M	M A Cody lasiano regarding claims issues (.3); review and a	1.00 analyze claims mater	1,575.00 ials regarding same (.7).
	Matter Total	34.40	USD 40,307.50
Court Hearings			
01/02/24 Update electro	C L Smith onic file management system with hearing transc	0.10 cript.	52.50
01/27/24 Draft outline f	B B Erens for hearing on motions to certify dismissal opin	1.00 ion.	1,625.00
01/27/24 Draft slides fo	A P Johnson r February 9, 2024 hearing (.6); review outline r	1.40 elated to same (.8).	1,295.00
01/28/24 Draft outline f	B B Erens for hearing on motions to certify dismissal opin	1.20 ion.	1,950.00
	B B Erens ons with Johnson regarding preparations for hea eparation for hearing regarding the same (.30).	0.50 aring on motions to	812.50 certify dismissal opinion
01/30/24 Review outline	A P Johnson e for slides for February 9, 2024 hearing (.5); dis	0.70 scuss same with Eren	647.50 ns (.2).
-	B B Erens with Johnson regarding preparations for hearing with Hirst regarding same (.20).	0.40 ng on motions to ce	650.00 rtify dismissal opinion
01/31/24 Communicate	M R Hirst with Erens regarding preparations for hearing of	0.20 on motions to certif	275.00 y dismissal appeal.
01/31/24 Call with Eren	A P Johnson s regarding preparations for hearing on motion 9); review outline related to same (.7).	2.80	2,590.00

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 147 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES DAT			
161866			Page: 12 January 31, 2024	
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853	
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount	
	Matter Total	8.30	USD 9,897.50	
General Corporate and	l Real Estate			
01/02/24 Emails with Mo	B B Erens cGonigle regarding call with insurers regarding c	0.20 ase status.	325.00	
01/04/24 Review and rev	M A Cody vise corporate disclosure (.8); emails with Lewis a	1.10 and Erens regard	1,732.50 ding same (.3).	
01/04/24 Review and con	T B Lewis mment on draft corporate disclosure (.90); email	1.20 s with Cody and	1,740.00 I Erens regarding same (.30).	
01/07/24 Prepare for call	B B Erens l with insurers regarding case status.	0.20	325.00	
01/08/24 B B Erens 0.60 975.00 Attend call with Evert, client and McGonigle to prepare for call with insurers regarding case status (.30); attend call with insurers regarding case status (.30).				
01/08/24 Attend call with	M R Hirst h insurers regarding case status.	0.30	412.50	
01/09/24 Review materia	J B Mays als in connection with responding to audit letter.	0.30	127.50	
01/11/24 Draft and revis	T B Lewis se response to audit letter.	1.80	2,610.00	
01/12/24 Emails with Le	B B Erens wis and Cody regarding corporate disclosure and	0.30 d response to au	487.50 dit letter.	
01/12/24 Draft response	J B Mays to audit letter.	2.00	850.00	
01/16/24 Draft response	J B Mays to audit letter.	0.50	212.50	
01/17/24 Review and rev	M A Cody vise audit letter response.	0.80	1,260.00	
01/17/24 Review, analyzo	T B Lewis e and revise audit letter response.	2.00	2,900.00	
01/17/24 Draft response	J B Mays to audit letter.	2.00	850.00	
01/17/24 Review audit le	J L Panza etter and materials relating to response to same.	0.30	390.00	
01/18/24 Review and rev	M A Cody vise audit letter response (.5); emails with Lewis r	0.70 regarding same (	1,102.50	

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 148 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JONES DA	11		
161866	LC and Murray Boiler LLC			Page: 13 ary 31, 2024 : 241300853
Marien Fump L	EC and Murray Boller EEC		mvoice	. 241300633
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
01/18/24 Review ar	T B Lewis and revise audit letter response (.3); emails with C	0.50 Cody regarding same (.2)	).	725.00
01/18/24 Draft resp	J B Mays conse to audit letter (1.80); discuss same with int	2.00 ternal team (.20).		850.00
	J L Panza dit letter response (2.00); communications with a p same (.40).	2.70 internal team regarding	same (.30); rev	3,510.00 view materials
01/19/24 Review er	B B Erens mails from Tananbaum regarding upcoming boa	0.20 ard meetings.		325.00
	M A Cody orporate disclosure (.3); emails with Lewis and T in connection with same (.5).	0.90 ananbaum regarding sa	ame (.1); review	1,417.50 prior
01/25/24 Review ag	B B Erens genda for upcoming board meeting.	0.20		325.00
01/25/24 Draft mat	T B Lewis terials for upcoming board meeting.	0.90		1,305.00
01/25/24 Coordinate	J B Mays te matters concerning audit letter response.	0.50		212.50
01/29/24 Prepare fo	B B Erens or upcoming board meeting.	0.30		487.50
01/30/24 Review or same (.5).	M A Cody utline and materials in advance of board meeting	1.30 g (.8); telephone confere	ence with Lewi	2,047.50 is regarding
01/30/24 Call with	B B Erens Evert and Tananbaum regarding preparation for	0.60 r board meeting.		975.00
01/30/24 Participate	T B Lewis e in Aldrich/200 Park board meeting.	0.80		1,160.00
01/31/24 Review m	M A Cody naterials in preparation for board meeting (.5); at	1.90 etend board meeting (1.4	4).	2,992.50
01/31/24 Prepare fo	B B Erens or board meeting (.20); attend board meeting (1.	1.50		2,437.50
	Matter Total	28.60	USD	35,070.00
Schedules/SOFA	/Bankruptcy Administrator Reporting			
	M A Cody nd revise November monthly status reports (1.0) w materials regarding same (.7); telephone confe			

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 149 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JOINEODA	LAI	
161866	np LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 14 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Aldrich Pun	ip LLC and Murray Doner LLC		111voice. 241300633
Date of Servi	ce Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	A P Johnson ew November monthly status reports (.5); draft ema ils from Hakim, Lombardi, Cody regarding same (.2)		
John repo (.6); (.2); (.3);	P Lombardi ew e-mail from Hakim concerning November mont ason concerning same (.4); review materials from Ha arts (.2); draft email to Hakim concerning same (.1); draft email draft email to Cody concerning same (.1); draft email review email from Miller regarding revision to mont discuss revision with Johnson (.1); further revise mont asic, and Johnson concerning same (.1).	akim concerning same (.2); re review revisions to monthly s il to Miller, Tomsic and Lind thly status reports and preced	vise monthly status status reports by Hakim lsay concerning same dent concerning same
01/03/24 Revi	A P Johnson ew November monthly status reports.	0.20	185.00
01/16/24 Dra	A P Johnson ft email to Clarrey, Hakim regarding Rule 2015.3 rep	0.20 port (.1); review previous repo	185.00 orts (.1).
01/17/24 Revi	A P Johnson ew Rule 2015.3 report.	0.20	185.00
01/17/24 Revi	P Lombardi ew Rule 2015.3 report (.7); draft email to Johnson co	0.80 oncerning same (.1).	680.00
01/22/24 Revi	M A Cody ew Rule 2015.3 report (.5); emails with Lombardi re	0.60 garding same (.1).	945.00
	A P Johnson ew Rule 2015.3 report (.2); discuss same with Lomb rding same (.1).	0.40 pardi (.1); review emails from	370.00 Miller, Lombardi
	P Lombardi ew Rule 2015.3 report (.4); draft email to Cody conc e (.1); discuss same with Johnson (.2).	0.90 cerning same (.1); draft email	765.00 to Miller concerning
01/23/24 Tele	M A Cody phone conference with Johnson regarding reporting	0.30 g matters.	472.50
01/28/24 Dra	A P Johnson ft email to Clarrey, Hakim regarding monthly status i	0.10 reports.	92.50
	M A Cody ew drafts of December monthly status reports (.7); t Lombardi regarding same (.3).	1.10 review quarterly fee statemen	1,732.50 ats (.1); communications
	A P Johnson ew December monthly status reports (.5); draft ematerly fee statements (.2).	1.00 ils to Lombardi, Miller regard	925.00 ding same (.3); review
with	P Lombardi ew December monthly status reports (.7); draft e-mail Cody concerning same (.1); draft e-mail to Hakim, tooly for statements (.3); draft e-mail to Cody and Io	Clarrey and Johnson concer	

quarterly fee statements (.3); draft e-mail to Cody and Johnson concerning same (.1).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 150 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 15 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/30/24 M A Cody 0.60 945.00 Review finalized December monthly status reports and quarterly fee statements (.5); emails with Lombardi regarding same (.1). 01/30/24 P Lombardi 1.20 1,020.00 Review finalized December monthly status reports (.4); draft e-mail to Cody concerning same (.1); draft email to Miller, Tomsic, and Lindsay concerning same (.1); review final quarterly fee statements (.2); e-mail with Cody concerning same (.1); e-mail with Hakim and Clarrey concerning same (.2); call with Hakim concerning same (.1); call with Johnson concerning same (.1). 01/31/24 0.30 277.50 A P Johnson Review December monthly status reports (.2); draft emails to Lombardi, Miller regarding same (.1). P Lombardi 01/31/24 0.60 510.00 Draft e-mails to Hakim and Clarrey concerning quarterly fee statements (.2); discuss same with Johnson (.1); review quarterly fee statements (.1); draft e-mail to Cody concerning same (.1); draft e-mail to Miller and Tomsic concerning same (.1). Matter Total 15.90 **USD** 17,185.00 Litigation and Adversary Proceedings 01/02/24 C K Cahow 1.30 1,657.50 Review dismissal opinion matters (1.10); call with Erens regarding same (.20). 01/02/24 M A Cody 5.10 Review and analyze precedent and opinions related to derivative standing and dismissal (2.8); review hearing transcript and commentary regarding same (1.8); review research memo regarding derivative litigation issues (.5).01/02/24 E M Dowling 3.80 2,755.00 Review and analyze dismissal opinion and precedent regarding same in connection with appeal of dismissal opinion (3.2); communicate with Johnson regarding same (.2); draft and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.4). 01/02/24 5.60 9,100.00 B B Erens Communications with Torborg regarding issues concerning opinion on derivative standing (.70); telephone call with Cahow regarding certification issues relating to dismissal opinion (.20); telephone call with Torborg and Johnson regarding analysis of dismissal opinion (.30); prepare for call with Marshall regarding appellate issues relating to same (.20); call with Marshall regarding same (.30); review analysis (.30); review precedent regarding same (.30); analysis regarding same (1.0); emails with Gordon regarding dismissal opinion and potential next steps (.50); telephone call with Gordon regarding dismissal opinion and potential next steps (.30); review emails regarding same (.20); diligence regarding dismissal opinion and potential next steps (.20); prepare for client call regarding same (.20); telephone call with Evert to prepare for client call regarding same (.50); further prepare for client call regarding dismissal opinion and potential next steps (.40).

Telephone conference with Erens regarding dismissal opinion and potential next steps (.20); draft and review emails to and from Erens regarding same (.20).

01/02/24

800.00

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 151 of 188 JONES DAY

Page: 16 January 31, 2024

Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

with Dowling, Erens, Torborg (.5).

01/02/24 J M Jones 0.50 875.00

Communicate with Torborg regarding opinion denying motions to dismiss and related matters.

01/02/24 P Lombardi 0.30 255.00

Draft email to Lewis concerning responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.1); review responses to discovery requests concerning same (.2).

01/02/24 C K Marshall 2.50 3,625.00

Review opinion denying motions to dismiss (2.0); call with Erens regarding certification of opinion (.30); draft email to Redmond regarding same (.20).

01/02/24 C P Redmond 0.40 390.00

Review email from Marshall regarding dismissal opinion and certification of same (.20); analyze materials in connection with same (.20).

01/02/24 D S Torborg 6.90 9,660.00

Discuss precedent relating to dismissal opinion with Erens and Johnson (.3); review associated research (1.8); review opinions denying motions to dismiss and withdrawal of derivative standing (1.0); discuss same with Jones (.4); discuss dismissal opinion and derivative standing opinion with Erens (.5); draft materials regarding opinion on derivative standing (1.4); research regarding same (1.5).

01/03/24 C K Cahow 1.30 1,657.50

Call with Tananbaum, internal, and Evert Weathersby Houff teams regarding dismissal and derivative standing opinions and potential next steps relating to same (1.0); prepare for same (.30).

01/03/24 M A Cody 2.40 3,780.00

Telephone conference with client and advisors regarding dismissal and derivative standing opinions and potential next steps relating to same (1.0); attend meeting with Erens regarding same (.1); review and analyze memorandum related to issues regarding opinion on derivative standing (.5); review memorandum related to derivative litigation issues (.8).

01/03/24 E M Dowling 1.30 942.50

Draft and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.9); discuss same with Lombardi (.4).

01/03/24 B B Erens 6.20 10,075.00

Telephone call Gordon regarding opinion on derivative standing (.20); communications with Torborg regarding same (1.1); emails with client regarding certification issues relating to dismissal opinion (.50); telephone call with Mascitti regarding certification issues (.30); prepare for calls regarding same (.20); communications with Hirst regarding same (.40); telephone call with Evert regarding same (.40); telephone call with Marshall regarding appeal issues regarding same (.30); review opinions regarding same (.30); review Torborg emails regarding same (.30); review issues regarding certification (1.0); prepare for call with client and advisors regarding dismissal and derivative standing opinions and potential next steps (.20); attend call regarding same (1.0).

01/03/24 G M Gordon 1.50 3,000.00

Telephone conferences with Erens regarding dismissal and derivative standing opinions (.40); review and respond to email from Erens regarding same (.20); telephone conferences with internal team regarding same (.40); draft and review emails to and from Erens regarding appeal issues (.20); review emails from Waldrep, Thompson, Ruckdeschel, Erens regarding appeals and certification regarding dismissal opinion (.30).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 152 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 17

January 31, 2024

Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

01/03/24 M R Hirst 1.80 2,475.00

Review correspondence with movants regarding certification issues relating to dismissal opinion (0.3); review and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (0.8); communications with Erens regarding certification of dismissal opinion (0.4); communicate with internal team regarding draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (0.3).

01/03/24 A P Johnson 3.30 3,052.50

Review precedent regarding dismissal opinion and related matters (2.2); discuss same with Dowling, Villalba and Lombardi (.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.2); attend conference call with client and advisors regarding dismissal and derivative standing opinions and potential next steps relating to same (.5).

01/03/24 T B Lewis 0.80 1,160.00

Participate in telephone conference with client and advisors regarding dismissal and derivative standing opinions and potential next steps relating to same.

01/03/24 P Lombardi 0.60 510.00

Discuss precedent regarding dismissal opinion with Johnson (.2); discuss responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings with Dowling (.4).

01/03/24 C K Marshall 0.40 580.00

Call with Erens regarding certification relating to dismissal opinion (.20); email to Redmond regarding certification of dismissal opinion (.20).

01/03/24 C P Redmond 1.50 1,462.50

Review email from Marshall regarding certification of dismissal opinion (.20); emails with Smith regarding opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.10); call with Smith regarding same (.10); analyze materials in connection with opposition to certification (1.10).

01/03/24 C L Smith 1.20 630.00

Emails with Redmond regarding opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.10); research regarding same (.20); draft and revise opposition (.80); call with Redmond regarding same (.10).

01/03/24 D S Torborg 6.90 9,660.00

Review case law and materials regarding opinion denying motions to dismiss (1.8); attend call with client, internal team and advisors to discuss dismissal and derivative standing opinions and next steps (1.0); communications with Erens same (.9); research regarding same (.8); draft memo regarding same (.8); review research and materials pertinent to appellate matters (1.6).

01/03/24 D C Villalba 0.10 87.50

Communicate with Johnson regarding precedent relating to dismissal opinion.

01/04/24 C K Cahow 0.50 637.50

Communicate with Johnson regarding litigation matters.

01/04/24 M A Cody 1.10 1,732.50

Review commentary regarding opinion denying dismissal motions (.6); review and analyze materials regarding potential next steps (.5).

01/04/24 E M Dowling 0.30 217.50

Draft and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.20); discuss same with Lombardi (.10).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 153 of 188

**IONES DAY** 161866 Page: 18 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/04/24 4.10 6,662.50 Telephone call with Gordon and Torborg regarding appeal issues (.50); telephone call with Torborg and Mascitti regarding derivative standing opinion (.30); telephone calls with Marshall regarding same (.30); telephone call with Miller regarding scheduling for certification hearing relating to dismissal opinion (.30); telephone call with Seig regarding discovery issues in derivative standing adversary proceedings (.30); review materials from Lombardi regarding appeal issues (.20); telephone call with Ramsey regarding scheduling of hearing regarding certification of dismissal opinion (.20); review issues regarding certification (1.0); further review and analysis of dismissal opinion (1.0). 01/04/24 A P Johnson 3.20 2,960.00 Communications with Cahow regarding litigation matters (.5); review precedent related to dismissal opinion (1.9); review emails from Erens, Lombardi regarding same (.2); discuss same with Lombardi, Erens (.6). 01/04/24 P Lombardi 2.40 Review precedent concerning dismissal opinion (2.1); discuss same with Johnson (.2); discuss responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings with Dowling (.1). 01/04/24 870.00 C K Marshall 0.60 Communications with Erens, Redmond regarding motions to certify dismissal opinion (.20); call with Erens on motions to certify (.20); analyze issues concerning motions to certify dismissal opinion (.20). C P Redmond 0.10 01/04/24 97.50 Communications with Erens, Marshall regarding motions to certify dismissal opinion. 1,260.00 01/04/24 D S Torborg Discuss opinion regarding derivative standing and potential next steps regarding same with Erens and Gordon (.5); discuss same with Mascitti and Erens (.4). 01/05/24 E M Dowling 652.50 Draft and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings. 01/05/24 B B Erens 0.60 975.00 Emails with counsel regarding scheduling matters relating to certification of dismissal opinion (.30); prepare for calls regarding same (.30). 01/05/24 A P Johnson 3.30 3,052.50 Review precedent related to dismissal opinion (1.7); review summary from Lombardi regarding same (1.6). 01/05/24 P Lombardi 8.80 7,480.00 Draft email to Hirst concerning responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.2); research precedent concerning dismissal opinion (6.7); draft email to Erens and Johnson concerning same (1.9). 01/05/24 D S Torborg 700.00 Review and revise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation adversary proceeding. 01/07/24 1,480.00 A P Johnson 1.60

01/07/24 1,955.00 P Lombardi 2.30 Review responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.9); draft revisions

same with Gale (.1).

concerning same (1.4).

Review precedent related to dismissal opinion (1.3); review email from Gale regarding same (.2); discuss

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 154 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866	JOINEO BILL		Page: 19
	mp LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Marien i un	up LEC and Murray Boller LEC		111VOICC. 241300033
Date of Servi	ice Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	C K Cahow nmunications with Johnson, Dowling regarding discovery requ ceedings.	0.60 ests in derivative l	765.00 itigation adversary
	E M Dowling ft and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigal munications with internal team regarding same (1.0).	3.40 ation adversary pro	2,465.00 occeedings (2.4);
opir Rayl	B B Erens iew case law regarding dismissal opinion issues (.50); communition (.20); call with movants regarding certification of dismissal burn Cooper team regarding same (.30); prepare for hearing regarding (.30).	l opinion (.30); cor	mmunications with
01/08/24 Rev	G M Gordon iew emails from Erens regarding dismissal opinion (.20).	0.20	400.00
revi requ	A P Johnson iew precedent regarding dismissal opinion and related matters ew precedent relating to potential litigation matters (.6); discussests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.3); draft swling, Cahow (.6); draft emails to Lewis regarding same (.1).	s same with Villalb	oa (.3); review discovery
01/08/24 Reso	J E Leitner earch regarding potential litigation matters.	1.10	742.50
	T B Lewis iew and analyze discovery requests in derivative litigation adversasion regarding same (.10).	1.50 rsary proceedings	2,175.00 (1.40); emails with
disc con	P Lombardi et with Johnson concerning dismissal opinion research (.4); med overy requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.2) cerning responses (.1); revise responses (3.9); review precedent borg and Hirst concerning responses (.8); draft email to Dowling	; draft email to H concerning respon	art and Anderson nses (1.1); draft email to
01/08/24 Con	C K Marshall nmunications with Erens regarding motions to certify dismissa	0.20 l opinion and relat	290.00 red briefing matters.
01/08/24 Ana	C P Redmond lyze materials in connection with opposition to motions to cer	0.10 tify dismissal opin	97.50 ion.
	D S Torborg ise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive coonses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary pr		
01/09/24 Rev	M A Cody iew issues related to substantive consolidation proceeding disco	0.80 overy.	1,260.00
01/09/24 Dra	E M Dowling ft and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litiga	0.80 ation adversary pro	580.00 occeedings.

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 155 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JONES DAT		
161866 Aldrich Pur	np LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 20 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
	· ·		
Date of Servi	ce Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/09/24 Rev	B B Erens iew substantive consolidation proceeding discovery.	0.30	487.50
	A P Johnson iew precedent related to dismissal opinion (2.9); draft emaited to same (1.5).	4.60 ls to Miller regardi	4,255.00 ng same (.2); draft outline
01/09/24 Rese	J E Leitner earch regarding potential litigation matters.	5.00	3,375.00
ema	P Lombardi earch precedent concerning dismissal opinion (3.9); draft n il from Torborg concerning responses to discovery reques teedings (.3); revise responses (.7).		
to E	D S Torborg ise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantiverens regarding same (.2); review responses to discovery recedings (1.1); draft email to Lombardi regarding same (.3);	quests in derivative	litigation adversary
01/09/24 Rev	D C Villalba iew case law related to motions to certify direct appeal (3.2	4.30 ); draft analysis of	3,762.50 same (1.1).
01/10/24 Ana	C K Cahow lyze dismissal opinion matters.	0.10	127.50
	M A Cody iew and analyze draft affirmative discovery requests to be s review and analyze pleadings and materials related to same		4,095.00 we consolidation proceeding
with	E M Dowling ft and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative la Lombardi regarding same (1.0); communicate with Johnsoving dismissal (.3).		
com mat disc	B B Erens ference with Johnson regarding materials relating to motion immunications with Marshall regarding certification issues referrials regarding same (.60); telephone call with Torborg regovery (.20); communications with Seig regarding litigation infication (.30).	lating to dismissal garding substantive	opinion (.20); review consolidation proceeding
01/10/24 Con	M R Hirst nmunications with internal team regarding discovery in der	0.50 rivative litigation ad	687.50 lversary proceedings.
	A P Johnson iew precedent related to certification of dismissal opinion (nissal opinion matters (1.3); discuss same with Villalba, Ere		4,255.00 with Dowling (.2); review
01/10/24 Rese	J E Leitner earch regarding potential litigation matters (5.70); discuss s	5.80 ame with Villalba (.	3,915.00 .10).
01/10/24	P Lombardi	6.10	5,185.00

Revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (4.8); discuss same with

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 156 of 188

**JONES DAY** 161866 Page: 21 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount Dowling (.3); research precedent concerning dismissal opinion (.8); draft email to Johnson concerning same 01/10/24 C K Marshall 0.20 290.00 Emails with Erens and Redmond regarding certification motions concerning dismissal opinion. 01/10/24 5.20 5,070.00 C P Redmond Analyze materials in connection with opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (2.4); emails with Marshall, Erens regarding same (0.2); draft opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (0.4); research case law in connection with the same (2.2). 01/10/24 2.40 3,360.00 D S Torborg Review case law and materials cited in dismissal opinion (2.2); discuss same with Erens (.1); discuss affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding with Erens (.1). 01/10/24 8.80 D C Villalba 7,700.00 Communicate with Johnson regarding research regarding motions to certify dismissal opinion (0.2); research regarding same (1.5); email to Erens and Johnson regarding research (0.1); follow up with Erens regarding same (0.1); supplemental research regarding same (4.6); draft summary of same (2.2); meet with Leitner regarding potential litigation matters and research relating to same (0.1). 01/11/24 M A Cody 8,505.00 Review materials relating to draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (1.8); review draft affirmative discovery requests (1.4); review motions to certify dismissal opinion (2.2). 01/11/24 E M Dowling 0.40 290.00 Communications with internal team regarding responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings. 01/11/24 2.10 3,412.50 B B Erens Review motions to certify dismissal opinion (1.10); emails to internal team and movants regarding same (.70); review materials regarding same (.30). 4,625.00 01/11/24 5.00 A P Johnson Review claimants' motion to certify dismissal opinion (1.8); review Asbestos Committee motion to certify dismissal opinion (1.9); review summary of precedent from Villalba regarding same (1.3). 01/11/24 J E Leitner 1.60 1,080.00 Research regarding potential litigation matters. 01/11/24 P Lombardi 6.90 5,865.00 Review email from Torborg concerning responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.3); review emails from Tananbaum, Evert and Torborg regarding responses (.2); research precedent relating to motions to certify dismissal opinion (2.6); draft memorandum concerning same (3.8).

01/11/24 C K Marshall 5,365.00

Call with Erens regarding motions to certify dismissal opinion and related briefing matters (.20); review dismissal opinion (3.50).

01/11/24 C P Redmond 4.10 3,997.50 Analyze materials in connection with opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (4.0); emails with Smith regarding motion to defer briefing in District Court appeals of dismissal opinion (.1).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 157 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 22 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 0.20 01/11/24 C L Smith 105.00 Emails with Redmond regarding motion to defer District Court briefing relating to appeal of dismissal opinion (.10); review precedent regarding same (.10). 01/11/24 4.00 5,600.00 D S Torborg Revise draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.6); revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (2.8); communications with internal team regarding same (.4); emails with client, advisors and internal team regarding same (.2). 01/11/24 D C Villalba 6.50 5,687.50 Review research from Leitner regarding potential litigation matters (0.5); conduct further research regarding same (0.6); draft summary of analysis on same (3.2); review case law related to motions to certify dismissal opinion (0.8); draft summary regarding same (1.4). 01/12/24 M A Cody 1.40 2,205.00 Review draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (1.1); emails with Erens and Torborg regarding same (.3). 0.90 01/12/24 B B Erens 1,462.50 Emails with internal team regarding dismissal opinion appeal matters (.30); emails with Asbestos Committee regarding same (.20); telephone call with Guy regarding same (.20); telephone call with Marshall regarding same (.20). 01/12/24 2.90 2,682.50 A P Johnson Review claimants' motion to certify dismissal opinion (1.2); review Asbestos Committee motion to certify dismissal opinion (1.0); review emails from Miller, Erens regarding same (.1); review summary of precedent from Villalba regarding same (.4); discuss potential litigation matters and research concerning same with Leitner (.2). 01/12/24 810.00 1.20 J E Leitner Research regarding potential litigation matters (1.0); discuss same with Johnson (.2). 01/12/24 P Lombardi 2.40 2,040.00 Revise memorandum concerning dismissal opinion (2.1); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1). 01/12/24 C K Marshall 2.40 Review claimants' motion to certify dismissal opinion (2.10); communications with Erens regarding same (.30).01/12/24 C P Redmond 5,850.00 Analyze materials in connection with opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (4.2); call with Smith regarding joint motion to defer District Court briefing in Asbestos Committee appeal of dismissal opinion (.2); draft opposition (1.6). 01/12/24 2.80 1,470.00 C L Smith Draft joint motion to defer briefing in Asbestos Committee District Court appeal of dismissal opinion (1.90); call with Redmond regarding same (.20); draft joint motion to defer briefing in claimants' District Court appeal of dismissal opinion (.60); draft email to Redmond regarding motions to defer briefing (.10). 01/12/24 D C Villalba 2.90 2,537.50

Research case law related to certification of dismissal opinion (2.7); communicate with Johnson regarding

research related to potential litigation matters (.2).

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 158 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOINED BILL		
161866 Aldrich Pump LLO	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 23 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Thanen Tamp 111	s and natural Boner Edg		111/0100. 2/13/00/03/
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	B B Erens rials regarding certification issues relating to dis eave to appeal dismissal opinion (.8).	2.50 missal opinion (1.7); 1	4,062.50 review precedent regarding
01/13/24 Draft opposi	C P Redmond ition to motions to certify dismissal opinion.	0.70	682.50
01/14/24 Review claim	C K Cahow nants' motion to certify dismissal opinion.	1.30	1,657.50
	B B Erens edent regarding motion for leave to appeal disminism opinion (.3).	1.80 nissal opinion (1.5); dr	2,925.00 aft opposition to motions
01/14/24 Draft opposi	C P Redmond ition to motions to certify dismissal opinion	1.20	1,170.00
	B B Erens Redmond regarding motion for leave to appeal arding issues relating to motions to certify dism		975.00 975.00); prepare for call with
	M R Hirst te with internal team regarding discovery issues (0.3); review and revise responses to discovery 1 (1.7).		
Asbestos Co	A P Johnson nants' motion to certify dismissal opinion (1.1); mmittee motion to certify dismissal opinion (1.1) tential litigation matters (.9); draft emails to Vill	3); review summary o	f precedent from Villalba
01/15/24 Review prece	P Lombardi edent related to dismissal opinion (1.2); draft su	1.40 mmary concerning sa	1,190.00 me (.2).
	C P Redmond erials in connection with opposition to motions 1.7); emails with Erens regarding motion for lea		
01/15/24 Review emai related to san	D C Villalba I from Johnson regarding research concerning p me (0.3).	0.60 potential litigation ma	525.00 tters (0.3); review research
	E M Dowling te with internal team regarding responses to req a regarding responses to discovery requests in de		
	B B Erens with internal team regarding briefing relating to only; emails with Redmond regarding briefing relation.		
01/16/24	M R Hirst	1.80	2,475.00

Review and revise draft responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.1); communicate with internal team regarding same (0.2); review motions to certify dismissal opinion (0.5).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 159 of 188 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 24

January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

01/16/24 A P Johnson 4.00 3,700.00

Discuss certification briefing relating to dismissal opinion with Marshall, Erens, Redmond (.6); review claimants' certification motion (1.1); research precedent related to same (1.3); discuss affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding with Torborg (.1); review summary of precedent from Villalba regarding potential litigation matters (.7); discuss same with Villalba (.2).

01/16/24 J E Leitner 1.70 1,147.50

Research regarding potential litigation matters.

01/16/24 P Lombardi 6.70 5,695.00

Review precedent related to dismissal opinion (1.9); draft memorandum concerning same (.7); review Hirst's comments on responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.3); review emails from Hirst and Torborg concerning same (.2); review materials related to responses (3.6).

01/16/24 K A Louis 1.00 250.00

Research regarding potential litigation matters.

01/16/24 C K Marshall 1.10 1,595.00

Emails with Redmond regarding response to certification motions concerning dismissal opinion (.20); prepare for call regarding same (.20); attend call with Erens, Johnson, and Redmond regarding certification motions (.70).

01/16/24 C P Redmond 8.00 7,800.00

Analyze materials in connection with opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (2.1); draft opposition (4.5); attend call with internal team regarding opposition (0.7); communications with Erens regarding briefing matters concerning motions for leave to appeal dismissal opinion (0.3); communications with Smith regarding motion to defer briefing in Asbestos Committee District Court appeal of dismissal opinion (0.3); review Miller comments to same (0.1).

01/16/24 C L Smith 1.80 945.00

Review Redmond email regarding joint motion to defer briefing in Asbestos Committee District Court appeal of dismissal opinion (.10); review and revise same (.40); call with Redmond regarding same (.10); draft email to Erens, Redmond regarding filing of joint motion to defer (.10); email to Miller regarding same (.10); review Miller comments to joint motion (.10); communications with Redmond regarding same (.10); revise joint motion (.10); prepare same for filing (.10); review Miller emails regarding filing of joint motion (.10); communications with Redmond regarding same (.10); email to Miller regarding same (.10); review Miller additional comments to joint motion (.10); further revise same (.10); prepare same for filing and forward to Miller (.10).

01/16/24 D S Torborg 5.80 8,120.00

Review and revise draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.2); review Asbestos Committee motion for leave to appeal dismissal opinion (.7); revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceeding (4.7); review Hirst comments regarding same (.2).

01/17/24 E M Dowling 0.40 290.00

Draft email to Johnson regarding research relating to claimants' motion to certify dismissal opinion (.2); emails with Erens, Johnson regarding same (.2).

01/17/24 B B Erens 1.40 2,275.00

Review Asbestos Committee motion to certify dismissal opinion (.50); draft outline for research concerning same (.20); emails with Redmond regarding filing of motions to defer briefing in District Court dismissal opinion appeals (.20); draft materials regarding dismissal matters (.50).

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 160 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JOINES	DAI	
161866		and Mannage Rollon LLC		Page: 25 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Aldiici	r rump LLC :	and Murray Boiler LLC		111voice. 241300633
Date of	f Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/17/		J L Gale ch relating to appeal of dismissal opin	0.40 nion with Johnson.	290.00
01/17/		M R Hirst ses to discovery requests in derivative	0.50 e litigation adversary proceedings	687.50
01/17/	Review claiman email from Do	A P Johnson nts' motion to certify dismissal opinio wling regarding same (.3); draft email nac for appeal (.1); review emails fron	ls to Dowling, Erens regarding sa	
01/17/		J E Leitner ding potential litigation matters.	0.40	270.00
01/17/	Communicate	T B Lewis with Torborg regarding responses to 20); review same (.30).	0.50 discovery requests in derivative l	725.00 itigation adversary
01/17/	Review materia proceedings (3.	P Lombardi als in connection with responses to di .7); revise responses (.7); review Torb issal opinion (.8); draft memorandum	oorg comments to responses (.2);	
01/17/	Emails with En	C P Redmond rens regarding motions to defer briefi with regarding joint motion to defer be review same (0.1); communications w	riefing in claimants' District Cour	
01/17/	Emails with Redismissal opini prepare joint masbestos Com	C L Smith edmond regarding joint motion to det on (.10); review and revise same (.40) notion for filing and forward to Redmittee District Court appeal of dismittes with Miller (.10).	; communications with Redmond nond (.10); revise joint motion to	d regarding same (.10); defer briefing in
01/17/	Revise respons	D S Torborg es to discovery requests in derivative arding same (.2); communications wit		
01/17/	Communicate (1.2); commun	D C Villalba with Johnson regarding potential litig icate with Leitner regarding supplement ect appeal of dismissal opinion (4.0).		
01/18/	Revise respons	E M Dowling es to discovery requests in derivative roduction in connection with same (		
01/19/	24	P. P. Erona	1.70	2.762.50

01/18/24 B B Erens 1.70 2,762.50 Review Asbestos Committee certification motion relating to dismissal opinion (.90); review materials relating to same (.30); prepare for calls with internal team regarding same (.30); telephone calls with Marshall and

Johnson regarding same (.20).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 161 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866 Page: 26 January 31, 2024

Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

01/18/24 A P Johnson

5.70 5,272.50 Review joint motion to defer District Court briefing concerning appeal of dismissal opinion (.2); review Asbestos Committee certification motion concerning dismissal opinion (1.6); research precedent related to same (1.8); draft emails to Erens, Villalba regarding same (.3); discuss potential litigation matters and research relating to same with Leitner (.3); review email from Leitner regarding same (.4); discuss responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings with Lombardi (.3); review materials related to same (.5); review summary of Bestwall hearing (.3).

01/18/24 607.50 J E Leitner

Research regarding potential litigation matters (.6); discuss same with Johnson (.3).

01/18/24 P Lombardi 3.90 3,315.00

Review materials in connection with responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (3.1); discuss same with Johnson (.3); revise responses (.2); discuss prior productions related to requests for production with Dowling (.2); draft email to Torborg, Hirst, and Dowling concerning prior document productions (.1).

01/18/24 C K Marshall 1.10 1,595.00

Review Asbestos Committee brief in support of motion to certify dismissal opinion (.70); communications with Erens and Redmond regarding motions to certify dismissal opinion (.40).

01/18/24 4,290.00 C P Redmond

Analyze materials in connection with opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (4.0); communications with Marshall, Erens regarding same (.4).

2.90 01/18/24 D S Torborg 4,060.00

Revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings.

01/19/24 M A Cody 1.00 1,575.00

Telephone conference with Torborg regarding issues concerning discovery in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.5); review emails in connection with same (.5).

01/19/24 E M Dowling 2.30 1,667.50

Revise draft responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.1); draft memorandum regarding certification of dismissal opinion (2.2).

01/19/24 1.40 2,275.00 B B Erens

Telephone call with Torborg regarding issues concerning discovery in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.30); emails with internal team regarding same (.20); review opinion regarding direct certification briefing (.50); review materials regarding same (.40).

01/19/24 M R Hirst 1.80 2,475.00

Review and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.4); emails with internal team regarding same (0.4).

01/19/24 A P Johnson 4.20 3,885.00

Review responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.9); review emails from Torborg regarding same (.2); analyze precedent related to certification briefing in connection with appeal of dismissal opinion (2.9); draft emails to Dowling regarding memo regarding same (.2).

01/19/24 J E Leitner 1.30 877.50

Research regarding potential litigation matters.

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 162 of 188

**JONES DAY** 161866 Page: 27 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/19/24 5.70 P Lombardi 4,845.00 Review documents potentially responsive to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (3.8); review emails from Torborg, Hirst, Dowling, and Sands concerning responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.2); draft email to Torborg concerning same (.1); review comments from Cody on memorandum concerning dismissal appeal matters (.4); discuss same with Johnson (.4); research precedent related to dismissal opinion appeal (.2); draft e-mail to Johnson concerning same (.1); review precedent related to dismissal opinion (.3); draft summary concerning same (.2). 01/19/24 C P Redmond 4.20 4,095.00 Draft opposition to the motions to certify dismissal opinion. 01/19/24 3.90 D S Torborg 5,460.00 Review responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (2.9); emails with client and internal team regarding same (.3); discuss discovery matters in derivative litigation adversary proceedings with Erens (.2); discuss same with Cody (.5). 01/20/24 C P Redmond 2.10 2,047.50 Analyze materials in connection with motions to certify dismissal opinion (0.3); research in connection with same (.8); draft opposition to the motions to certify dismissal opinion (1.0). 01/21/24 A P Johnson 1,017.50 Analyze precedent related to certification briefing concerning dismissal opinion (.5); review memo from Villalba regarding same (.6). 0.90 607.50 01/21/24 J E Leitner Research regarding potential litigation matters. 01/21/24 C P Redmond 2.10 2,047.50 Draft opposition to the motions to certify dismissal opinion. 01/21/24 0.20 280.00 D S Torborg Review comments on draft responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings. 01/21/24 D C Villalba 3.60 3,150.00 Review case law regarding motions to certify dismissal opinion (1.5); draft memo regarding same and forward to Johnson (2.1). 01/22/24 E M Dowling 4.70 Review responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.0); discuss same with Lombardi (.1); attend call with client, advisors and internal team regarding same (1.3); draft and revise memorandum regarding certification of dismissal opinion (2.3). 01/22/24 B B Erens 1.90 3,087.50 Prepare for call regarding responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.30); attend call regarding same with client, internal team and advisors (1.30); review materials for dismissal opinion certification briefing (.30).

01/22/24 1,650.00 M R Hirst 1.20 Emails with internal team regarding responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary

proceedings (0.5); review and comment on draft responses (0.7).

01/22/24 3,145.00 A P Johnson 3.40 Analyze precedent related to certification briefing concerning dismissal opinion (1.5); review motions to certify dismissal opinion (1.9).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 163 of 188

JONES DAY

	JUNEST	JAI	
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 28 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
marien rump LLC i	and Murray Boner Elec		111VOICC. 241300033
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/22/24 Research regar	J E Leitner ding potential litigation matters.	2.80	1,890.00
	T B Lewis all with client, internal team and advisoration adversary proceedings.	1.00 rs regarding responses to disco	1,450.00 overy requests in
with Torborg a	P Lombardi to responses to discovery requests in deand Hirst concerning same (.1); review pass to responses with Dowling (.1); attenda.3).	prior document productions co	oncerning same (.2);
	C P Redmond als in connection with motions to certifitify dismissal opinion (7.5).	11.50 ly dismissal opinion (4.0); draf	11,212.50 it opposition to the
	D S Torborg sponses to discovery requests in derivation (1.1) call with client, internal team and a ses (.2).		
01/23/24 Review preceden	M A Cody ent materials regarding potential litigation	0.80 on matters.	1,260.00
	E M Dowling se memorandum regarding certification of responses to discovery requests in deriv		
01/23/24 Review draft re	B B Erens esponses to discovery requests in derivate	1.00 tive litigation adversary proced	1,625.00 edings.
01/23/24 Review respon	M R Hirst ses to discovery requests in derivative lit	1.00 tigation adversary proceedings	1,375.00 s.
	A P Johnson c related to dismissal appeal (.2); review aft email to Leitner regarding same (.2).		647.50 g potential litigation
9	J E Leitner ding potential litigation matters (1.0); dr regarding same (.2).	1.50 aft email to Johnson regardin	1,012.50 g same (.3); review email
to Torborg cor adversary proc memorandum	P Lombardi ent related to discovery requests in deriv neerning same (.2); draft revisions to res- eedings (.6); draft emails to Torborg, Do- concerning appeal matters (1.8); review erning same (1.6).	ponses to discovery requests owling, and Hirst concerning	in derivative litigation same (.2); revise

 $\begin{array}{ccc} 01/23/24 & C\ K\ Marshall & 0.30 \\ & \text{Communications with Erens regarding motions to certify dismissal opinion.} \end{array}$ 

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 164 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 29 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/23/24 C P Redmond 7.50 7,312.50 Draft and revise opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (7.2); research case law in connection with same (0.2); emails with Smith regarding same (0.1). 01/23/24 C L Smith 0.20 105.00 Emails with Redmond regarding research relating to opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.10); research regarding same (.10). 01/23/24 D S Torborg 4.40 6,160.00 Review matters relating to discovery in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.9); review and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.8); review non-debtor affiliates' draft discovery responses (1.7). 01/23/24 D C Villalba 7.20 6,300.00 Revise summary of research concerning motions to certify dismissal opinion (0.8); email to Johnson regarding same (0.1); review research from Leitner regarding potential litigation matters (2.1); further research regarding same (4.2). 01/24/24 E M Dowling 8.20 5,945.00 Attend call with internal team, advisors and co-counsel regarding responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceeding (1.2); review and revise draft responses (4.3); call with Lombardi, Torborg regarding same (.3); draft and revise memorandum regarding certification of dismissal opinion (2.2); discuss same with Johnson (.2). 01/24/24 B B Erens 2.40 3,900.00 Attend call with internal team, advisors and co-counsel regarding responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.20); follow up with Torborg regarding same (.40); telephone call with Guy regarding certification briefing schedule relating to dismissal opinion (.20); review materials regarding same (.20); review Trane affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.40). 01/24/24 M R Hirst 2.00 2,750.00 Review and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.8); attend call with advisors, internal team and co-counsel regarding same (1.2). 01/24/24 A P Johnson 2.70 2.497.50 Analyze precedent regarding dismissal opinion (1.4); draft summary of same (.5); discuss same with Dowling (.2); discuss same with Villalba (.2); review emails from Miller, Hirst regarding record on appeal concerning dismissal opinion (.4). 01/24/24 0.60 405.00 J E Leitner Research regarding potential litigation matters (.40); discuss same with Villalba (.20). 01/24/24 P Lombardi 8.90 7,565.00

Attend call with internal team, advisors and co-counsel regarding responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.2); attend call with Torborg and Dowling concerning responses (.3); revise draft responses (1.1); review precedent concerning dismissal opinion matters (2.7); draft memorandum concerning dismissal opinion matters (3.6).

01/24/24 C K Marshall 4.60 6,670.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 165 of 188

**IONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 30 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/24/24 C P Redmond 1.10 1,072.50 Analyze materials in connection with opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (1.0); communications with Smith regarding same (0.1). 01/24/24 C L Smith 0.30 157.50 Communications with Redmond regarding research relating to objection to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.10); research regarding same (.20). 01/24/24 D S Torborg 5.40 7,560.00 Review and revise responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (2.3); discuss same with Erens (.4); discuss same with Lombardi and Dowling (.3); attend call with internal team, cocounsel and advisors regarding responses (1.2); discuss matters regarding affirmative discovery to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding with co-counsel (.7); review Trane draft affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.5). 01/24/24 D C Villalba 9,625.00 Communications with Johnson regarding potential litigation matters (0.1); research regarding same (0.3); review research from Leitner regarding same (1.2); call with Leitner regarding same and next steps (0.2); edit summary of research on potential litigation matters (9.2). 01/25/24 E M Dowling 5.20 Draft and revise memorandum regarding certification of dismissal opinion (4.4); communicate with internal team regarding draft responses to discovery in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.8). 01/25/24 B B Erens 12,512.50 Review draft objection to certification motions relating to dismissal opinion (.70); review and revise objection (4.7); review materials regarding the same (1.0); telephone call with Marshall regarding objection (.30); review case law regarding the same (.80); telephone call with Johnson regarding revisions and filing of objection (.20). 01/25/24 1.30 1,787.50 Review of draft responses to discovery in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (1.0); communication with internal team regarding responses (0.3). 01/25/24 A P Johnson 4.60 4,255.00 Analyze precedent regarding dismissal opinion (1.9); revise memo regarding same (2.5); discuss same with Dowling, Erens (.2). 01/25/24 1.90 J E Leitner 1,282.50 Research regarding potential litigation matters. 01/25/24 P Lombardi 10.80 9,180.00 Review precedent concerning dismissal opinion (2.2); draft memorandum concerning dismissal opinion (4.4); revise same (.8); collect materials in connection with responses to discovery in derivative litigation adversary proceedings (.9); draft e-mail to Torborg and Tananbaum concerning same (.1); review and revise responses (1.9); draft e-mail to Torborg concerning same (.1); draft e-mail to Mascitti, Smith, Sieg, and Pavlick concerning responses (.1); draft e-mails to Torborg, Hirst, Dowling and Tananbaum concerning responses (.3).

1.00 01/25/24 C K Marshall 1,450.00 Revise draft opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.70); call with Erens regarding same (.30).

2.30

575.00

01/25/24

K A Louis

Research regarding potential litigation matters.

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main

Ca3C 20 3		e 166 of 188 DAY	Desc Main
161866	JOI 120 1		Page: 31
		J:	anuary 31, 2024
Aldrich Pun	np LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		oice: 241300853
Date of Servi	ce Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	•		
01/25/24	C P Redmond	3.20	3,120.00
	lyze materials in connection with opposition to mosition (1.9); communications with Smith regarding		2); revise
01/25/24	C L Smith	0.10	52.50
	nmunications with Redmond regarding objection	to motions to certify dismissal opinio	n.
01/25/24	D S Torborg	4.70	6,580.00
	ew and revise responses to discovery in derivative		
	client, Lombardi, and co-counsel regarding same erved in substantive consolidation proceeding (1.6		overy requests to
01/26/24	E M Dowling	0.40	290.00
Rese	earch regarding certification of dismissal opinion.		
01/26/24	B B Erens	2.80	4,550.00
Prep Mars	pare for call with Marshall regarding objection to call shall regarding the same (.50); telephone call with certify dismissal opinion (.20); draft slides for hearing	certification of dismissal opinion (.30) Johnson regarding preparation for he	; call with
01/26/24	J L Gale	2.60	1,885.00
	ft memo regarding appellate matters.		-,000.00
01/26/24	M R Hirst	0.50	687.50
	ew designations of record in connection with disr	missal opinion appeal.	
01/26/24	R H Howell	0.50	362.50
Com	nmunications with Redmond regarding Asbestos C	Committee District Court appeal of d	ismissal opinion.
01/26/24	A P Johnson	7.60	7,030.00
revis	lyze precedent regarding dismissal opinion (1.4); resemented regarding same (2.4); review certification edent related to same (.6); discuss same with Erer	briefing relating to dismissal opinion	ng same (.6);
01/26/24	J E Leitner	2.70	1,822.50
	earch regarding potential litigation matters.		,
01/26/24	P Lombardi	7.60	6.460.00
	earch precedent concerning dismissal opinion (1.4		6,460.00 (call with
John conc	ason concerning same (.2); draft e-mail to Johnson cerning appeal issues (3.7); research precedent con t e-mail to Cody and Johnson concerning same (.1	n concerning same (.1); revise memora accerning same (1.1); discuss same with	andum
01/26/24	C K Marshall	1.30	1,885.00
	draft opposition to motions to certify dismissal of		

Edit draft opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.80); call with Redmond regarding draft opposition (.10); call with internal team regarding draft opposition (.40).

01/26/24  $C\ P\ Redmond$ 2.30 2,242.50 Analyze materials in connection with appeal of dismissal opinion (1.7); communications with Smith regarding materials (.1); discuss Asbestos Committee District Court appeal of dismissal opinion with Howell

(.5).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 167 of 188

JONES DAY

		JONESE	Λ1	
161866				Page: 32 January 31, 2024
Aldrıch	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of S	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	Communication	C L Smith  ns with Redmond regarding materials re aterials to Redmond, Howell (.20).	0.30 elating to appeal of dismissal of	157.50 opinion (.10); research
01/26/24		D C Villalba ling appeal of dismissal opinion (2.2); d	4.70 raft summary regarding same	4,112.50 (2.5).
	Review opposit	A P Johnson ion to motions to certify dismissal opin rom Redmond, Erens regarding same (.:		1,757.50 elated to same (.5);
01/27/24		C P Redmond nternal team regarding opposition to m	0.10 otions to certify dismissal opi	97.50 inion.
		J L Gale tion to motions to certify dismissal opin (0.3).	0.60 nion with Johnson (0.3); review	435.00 w email from Johnson
		R H Howell alyze materials in connection with Asbes (1.1).	1.10 stos Committee's appeal of dis	797.50 smissal opinion to the
	Review opposit	A P Johnson ion to motions to certify dismissal opin om Erens regarding same (.3); draft emans (.2).		
01/28/24		J E Leitner ling potential litigation matters.	2.00	1,350.00
01/28/24		C P Redmond ls in connection with opposition to mot	0.60 tions to certify dismissal opini	585.00 ion.
01/29/24		M A Cody nts to affirmative discovery requests to	0.80 be served in substantive cons	1,260.00 solidation proceeding.
	Review movant regarding revisi- regarding the sa	B B Erens est record designations for dismissal opin ons to objection to motions to certify dame (.30); communications with Johnso d on appeal (.30); telephone call with M	ismissal opinion (.30); emails n regarding objection (.40); te	with internal team elephone call with Hirst
	Draft record de	M R Hirst esignations in connection with appeal of (.3); review and revise draft affirmative roceeding (1.0).		
	Review and ana	R H Howell lyze materials regarding Asbestos Com- cations with Redmond regarding same (		2,972.50 of dismissal opinion
01/29/24	Review opposit	A P Johnson ion to motions to certify dismissal opin		

(.4); review comments from Tananbaum, Marshall, Miller regarding same (1.3); draft emails to client and

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 168 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 33 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount advisors regarding same (.4); review summary of potential litigation matters from Villalba, Leitner (.6); revise 01/29/24 J E Leitner 1.10 742.50 Research regarding potential litigation matters. 01/29/24 C K Marshall 0.90 1,305.00 Calls with Erens regarding appeal of dismissal opinion (.30); revise opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.60). 01/29/24 1.80 C P Redmond 1,755.00 Research case law in connection with appeal of dismissal opinion (0.3); communications with Howell regarding same (0.1); revise opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (1.4). 01/29/24 52.50 C L Smith 0.10 Update electronic file management system with responses to discovery requests in derivative litigation adversary proceedings. 01/29/24 D S Torborg 2.90 4,060.00 Review and revise affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (1.2); discuss same with Erens and Hirst (.4); review research memorandum regarding dismissal opinion (1.1); draft email to Erens regarding same (.2). 01/29/24 D C Villalba 9.50 8,312.50 Review memo from Leitner regarding potential litigation matters (0.3); draft email for Erens regarding same (0.3); emails with Johnson regarding dismissal opinion appeal issues (0.1); review case law regarding potential litigation matters (1.1); supplemental research regarding same (3.9); revise memo from Leitner regarding same (3.8). 01/30/24 2,362.50 M A Cody 1.50 Review revised draft of affirmative discovery requests to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.7); review draft objection to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.8). 870.00 01/30/24 E M Dowling 1.20 Research regarding dismissal opinion matters (.9); communicate with Johnson regarding certification issues relating to dismissal opinion (.3). 01/30/24 1.60 B B Erens Review revised opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.20); review revised draft of affirmative discovery to be served in substantive consolidation proceeding (.30); review comments from co-counsel on certification opposition (.30); conference with Johnson regarding same (.60); telephone call with Marshall regarding the same (.20). 01/30/24 M R Hirst 1.00 1,375.00 Review matters concerning record for appeal of dismissal opinion. 3.90 01/30/24 A P Johnson 3,607.50 Review summary from Villalba regarding research concerning certification of dismissal opinion (.7); draft email to Villalba regarding same (.1); review opposition to motions to certify dismissal opinion (.9); discuss same with Erens (.5); revise same (.8); review precedent related to same (.6); discuss same with Dowling (.3).

1.80

1,215.00

4 J E Leitner Research regarding potential litigation matters.

01/30/24

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 169 of 188 JONES DAY

		JONES DAT		
161866				Page: 34 January 31, 2024
Aldrich I	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of S	ervice	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	Call with Erens	C K Marshall regarding appeal of dismissal opinion (.20); re nalyze issues regarding appeal of dismissal opin		1,595.00 otions to certify dismissal
01/30/24		C P Redmond als in connection with appeal of dismissal opin:	0.20 ion.	195.00
01/30/24 I		D S Torborg e affirmative discovery requests to be served in	0.20 n substantive consolid	280.00 lation proceeding.
	Oraft summary	D C Villalba of research related to potential litigation matte on appeal issues (0.2); communicate with Dowl		
		E M Dowling port of opposition to motions to certify dismit (0.3).	4.20 ssal opinion (3.3); con	3,045.00 mmunicate with Johnson
1	Communicatior Marshall regard	B B Erens as with internal team regarding record for disming briefing schedule on certification (.20); reviousition to certification (.20).		
		J L Gale egarding potential litigation matters (3.8); revise	6.30 e memo regarding dis	4,567.50 smissal appeal matters
t	Review briefing eam regarding	M R Hirst related to motions to certify dismissal opinion record for dismissal opinion appeal (0.4); reviewarding record on appeal (0.2).		
		R H Howell lyze materials in connection with District Counond (.80).	1.60 rt appeal of dismissal	1,160.00 opinion (.80); discuss
7	Review summa vith Villalba (.1	A P Johnson ry from Villalba regarding certification briefing ); attend call with Marshall, Hirst, Redmond, F view opposition to motions to certify dismissal	Erens regarding recor	d for appeal of dismissal
01/31/24 I		J E Leitner ling potential litigation matters.	0.70	472.50
(	Attend call with	C K Marshall a internal team regarding designations of record notions to certify dismissal opinion (.30); email ify (.10).		
01/31/24	): 1	C P Redmond	1.50	1,462.50

Review and analyze materials in connection with District Court appeal of dismissal opinion (.60); discuss same with Howell (.80); attend call with internal team regarding record for appeal of dismissal opinion (.10).

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 170 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 35 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/31/24 C L Smith 0.30 157.50 Review and prepare objection to motions to certify dismissal opinion for filing and forward to Johnson, Erens (.20); coordinate filing of same with Miller (.10). 01/31/24 350.00 D C Villalba 0.40 Communicate with Johnson regarding research relating to appeal of dismissal opinion (0.1); communicate with Dowling regarding same (0.3). **Matter Total** 658.40 **USD** 686,437.50 Professional Retention/Fee Issues 01/02/24 A P Johnson 1.50 1,387.50 Review Evert Weathersby Houff November monthly statement (.4); review Rayburn Cooper November monthly statement (.5); review K&L Gates November monthly statement (.3); review Winston May-June monthly statements (.2); draft email to Villalba regarding same (.1). 01/02/24 C L Smith 0.10 52.50 Update electronic file management system with monthly statements. 0.90 01/03/24 A P Johnson 832.50 Review emails from Cumbo and Bowen regarding upcoming payment (.2); review Jones Day supplemental disclosure (.6); discuss same with Villalba (.1). 01/03/24 C L Smith 0.10 52.50 Update electronic file management system with professional monthly statements. 01/04/24 A P Johnson 0.30 277.50 Review Jones Day supplemental disclosure (.2); draft email to Bowen regarding recent payments (.1). 01/08/24 M A Cody 1.80 2,835.00 Review and revise Jones Day supplemental disclosure (1.1); emails with Villalba regarding same (.2); review professional monthly statements (.5). 01/08/24 1.90 A P Johnson Review Jones Day supplemental disclosure (.2); review emails from Cody and Villalba regarding same (.2); review precedent related to same (.4); review Robinson Cole August, September, October monthly statements (.8); draft email to Villalba regarding monthly statements (.1); review Orrick's December monthly statement (.2). 01/09/24 A P Johnson 1.80 1,665.00 Review Jones Day supplemental disclosure (.2); draft email to Villalba regarding same (.2); review precedent related to same (.3); review Winston May monthly statement (.2); review email from Villalba regarding same (.2); review Robinson Cole August, September, October monthly statements (.7). 01/09/24 D C Villalba 3.40 2,975.00 Review professionals' monthly statements (3.1); call with Johnson regarding same (0.1); email to Erens, Cody, and Johnson regarding same (0.2). 01/10/24 A P Johnson 370.00 Review Guy and Grier Wright Martinez December monthly statements (.1); review Robinson Cole August,

September, October monthly statements (.3).

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 171 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866

Page: 36

Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC	I	January 31, 2024 nvoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/11/24 Review email t	A P Johnson from Bowen regarding recent payments (.2):	0.30 ; draft email to Wright regardi	277.50 ing same (.1).
	A P Johnson December monthly statement (.1); review Erdisclosure (.3); draft email to Villalba regard		462.50 Jones Day
01/12/24 Review profes	D C Villalba sionals' monthly statements.	0.70	612.50
01/15/24 Review Erens	A P Johnson declaration in support of Jones Day supple	0.20 mental disclosure (.2).	185.00
01/16/24 Review Jones	B B Erens Day supplemental disclosure.	0.30	487.50
01/16/24 Review Caplin	A P Johnson November monthly statement.	0.30	277.50
01/16/24 Email to Eren	D C Villalba s regarding declaration in support of Jones l	0.20 Day supplemental disclosure.	175.00
	A P Johnson Analysis Systems' October and November n disclosure and declaration in support with E		277.50 ss Jones Day
01/17/24 Communicate regarding same	D C Villalba with Cody declaration in support of Jones I e (0.1).	0.30 Day supplemental disclosure (	262.50 (0.2); email to Fischer
	A P Johnson a's December monthly statement (.1); review disclosure and declaration in support (.1); re		
	P Lombardi ry course professionals report (.2); draft ema I interim fee application (.1); draft email to J		
01/19/24 Emails with C	D C Villalba ody regarding declaration in support of Jone	0.30 es Day supplemental disclosur	262.50 re.
01/22/24 Review revised	M A Cody d Jones Day supplemental disclosure.	0.30	472.50
01/22/24 Review Asbess	J L Gale tos Committee's professionals' monthly state	0.50 ements.	362.50
	A P Johnson Analysis Systems December monthly statem e (.1); review Caplin's October monthly state		
01/23/24 Review Claro	A P Johnson December monthly statement (.3); review Jo	1.00 ones Day supplemental disclos	925.00 sure and declaration

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 172 of 188 JONES DAY

		JONES	5 DAY			
161866						Page: 37
					2	ry 31, 2024
Aldrich	Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC			Invoice:	241300853
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	F.	Hours		Amount
		; review ordinary course professional ew Hamilton Stephens September m			mbardi, Bowe	n regarding
01/23/2	24	D C Villalba		0.80		700.00
, ,		declaration in support of Jones Day ling same (0.1).	supplemental dis	closure (0.7); e	emails to Mille	r, Tomsic,
01/25/2	24	A P Johnson		0.40		370.00
		tion invoice (.2); draft email to Bowe thly statements (.1).	n regarding same	(.1); draft ema	il to Steele (K	&L)
01/26/2		D C Villalba sionals' monthly statements.		0.40		350.00
01/28/2		A P Johnson Canup, Steele regarding monthly st	atements.	0.10		92.50
01 /20 /	24	A D Johnson		1.30		1 202 50
01/29/24 A P Johnson 1.30 1,202.50 Review Bates White's December monthly statement (.6); draft email to Bowen regarding recent payments (.1); review email from Wright regarding same (.1); review Rayburn Cooper's December monthly statement (.4); draft email to Tomsic regarding service of monthly statements (.1).						
01/30/2	Review Evert	A P Johnson Weathersby Houff December month tes White's December monthly state			Canup regard	740.00 ing same
01/30/2		C L Smith	onthly statements.	0.10		52.50
01/31/2	24	A P Johnson		0.10		92.50
01/31/2		t December invoice.		0.10		72.30
04 /24 //				0.40		<b>50.5</b> 0
01/31/2		C L Smith onic file management system with mo	onthly statements.	0.10		52.50
		Matter Total	2	23.00	USD	22,247.50
Fee Ap	plication Prepa	ration				
01/02/2		A P Johnson nber monthly statement (.2); draft en	nails to Bowen re	0.30 garding same (	(.1).	277.50
01/02/2		C L Smith aber monthly statement (.10); submit	same to notice p	0.20 arties (.10).		105.00
01/09/2		C L Smith vise December invoice for privilege a	and compliance.	0.50		262.50
01/12/2		C L Smith vise December invoice for privilege a	and compliance.	0.30		157.50
01/15/2		C L Smith	and compliance	3.60		1,890.00

Review and revise December invoice for privilege and compliance.

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 173 of 188 **JONES DAY**

	JUNESDAI			
161866				Page: 38 ary 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice:	241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
01/17/24 Review and rev	C L Smith vise December invoice for privilege and compliance	2.60 ce.		1,365.00
01/18/24 Review and rev	C L Smith vise December invoice for privilege and compliance	2.30 ce.		1,207.50
same (.10); con	C L Smith ko, Duffin emails regarding invoice matters (.10); nmunications with Fresenko regarding same (.10); ompliance (.70).			
01/22/24 Review and rev	C L Smith vise December invoice for privilege and compliance	0.50 ce.		262.50
01/23/24 Review Decem	B B Erens aber invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.30		487.50
01/23/24 Review and rev	C L Smith vise December invoice for privilege and compliance	0.20 ce.		105.00
	C L Smith ons with Fresenko regarding January invoice mattered compliance (3.60).	3.70 rs (.10); review ar	nd revise Janua	1,942.50 ary invoice
01/25/24 Review and rev	C L Smith vise January invoice for privilege and compliance.	1.70		892.50
01/26/24 Review and rev	C L Smith vise January invoice for privilege and compliance.	1.30		682.50
01/29/24 Review Decem	A P Johnson aber monthly statement (.2); emails with Smith reg	0.30 arding same (.1).		277.50
01/29/24 Draft Decemb	C L Smith er monthly statement (.10); emails with Johnson re	0.20 egarding same (.1	0).	105.00
01/30/24 Submit Decem	C L Smith ober monthly statement to notice parties.	0.10		52.50
01/31/24 Review and rev	C L Smith vise January invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.60		315.00
	Matter Total	19.70	USD	10,912.50
Asbestos Matters				
01/01/24 Research prece	P Lombardi edent concerning asbestos matters and potential no	1.90 ext steps.		1,615.00
01/02/24 Draft memo re	J L Gale elated to asbestos matters and potential next steps.	3.20		2,320.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 174 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866 Aldrich Pump	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC	-	Page: 39 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/02/24 Edit mo	R Hart otion for ruling in Manville trust discovery disput	0.30 e proceeding.	247.50
	M R Hirst draft motion for ruling in Manville trust discover- ng same (0.2); review estimation discovery issues		2,750.00 communicate with client
	D S Torborg edits to motion for ruling in Manville trust disco counsel regarding same (.2).	0.40 very dispute proceeding (.2);	560.00 draft meet and confer
01/03/24 Review	M A Cody precedent and memoranda regarding asbestos m	3.70 atters and potential next step	5,827.50 os.
01/03/24 Draft m	J L Gale nemo related to asbestos matters and potential ne	4.00 ext steps.	2,900.00
01/03/24 Review	M R Hirst estimation discovery issues.	1.80	2,475.00
01/03/24 Review	A P Johnson materials regarding asbestos matters and potentia	2.30 al next steps (2.1); discuss sa	2,127.50 me with Villalba (.2).
01/04/24 Attend (.20).	C K Cahow call with client and advisors regarding asbestos is	0.90 sues and potential next steps	1,147.50 s (.70); prepare for same
Gale reg	M A Cody meeting with Erens regarding asbestos matters an garding same (.2); telephone conference with Joh .3); review and revise memorandum regarding sa	nson regarding same (.2); rev	
regardir	B B Erens for meeting with Cody regarding asbestos issues ag same (.50); prepare for client call regarding sam ne call with Hirst regarding estimation discovery	ne (.20); attend call with clier	nt regarding same (.70);
01/04/24 Draft m	J L Gale nemo related to asbestos matters and potential ne	3.70 ext steps (3.50); discuss same	2,682.50 with Johnson (.20).
motion trusts re	M R Hirst call with client and advisors regarding asbestos m for ruling in Manville trust discovery dispute proggarding productions (0.4); communicate with Bang estimation discovery planning (1.2); communicate with Ba	ceeding (0.4); review and review White regarding same (0.4)	vise draft questions to 2); review matters
	A P Johnson materials regarding asbestos matters and potentia same with Cody, Gale (.2).	2.60 al next steps (1.9); draft outli	2,405.00 ne related to same (.5);
01/04/24 Attend	D S Torborg call with client and advisors regarding asbestos m	0.90 natters and potential next ste	1,260.00 ps (.7); prepare for

same (.2).

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 175 of 188 **JONES DAY**

		JUNES	AI	
161866				Page: 40 January 31, 2024
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/05/2	Communication telephone confi	M A Cody ns with Gale regarding memo concerning erence with Johnson regarding same (.2) eccedent in connection with same (.8).		
01/05/2	Telephone call concerning sam for client call re	B B Erens with Cahow regarding asbestos matters are (.30); call with Evert and mediator (.6 garding same (.30); attend client call regetential next steps (.50).	0); follow up with Evert rega	rding same (.20); prepare
01/05/2	Draft memo re	J L Gale lated to asbestos matters and potential me with Cody (.4).	5.90 next steps (5.1); emails with Jo	4,277.50 ohnson regarding same
01/05/2	Review materia	A P Johnson ls regarding asbestos matters and potent scuss same with Gale, Erens, Cody (.6).	3.20 tial next steps (2.2); review en	2,960.00 nails from Gale related
01/05/2	Revise motion review decision	D S Torborg for ruling in Manville trust discovery dis granting Debtors' motion to transfer M with client and advisors regarding asbes	Ianville trust discovery disput	e to bankruptcy court
01/06/2		J L Gale lated to asbestos matters and potential n	1.70 next steps.	1,232.50
01/07/2		B B Erens emorandum regarding asbestos matters	0.50 and potential next steps.	812.50
01/07/2		J L Gale lated to asbestos matters and potential n	2.50 next steps.	1,812.50
01/08/2		M A Cody alyze memorandum regarding asbestos n	3.20 natters and potential next step	5,040.00 ps.
01/08/2	Review decision (.20); review ma	B B Erens in granting Debtors' motion to transfer Materials from Miller regarding asbestos in regarding same (.20); attend call with inte	natters and potential next step	os (.20); review materials
01/08/2		J L Gale lated to asbestos matters and potential n	4.00 next steps (1.5); revise memor	2,900.00 randum (2.5).
01/08/2		G M Gordon ference with internal team regarding dev	0.20 relopments and planning (.20)	400.00
01/08/2		M R Hirst ion discovery issues (1.0); attend call wit	2.00 h internal team regarding dev	2,750.00 velopments and planning
01/08/2		A P Johnson	1.60	1,480.00

Review materials related to asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.2).

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 176 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DE	A Y	
161866			Page: 41 January 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/08/24 Participate	T B Lewis in call with internal team regarding status and	0.20 planning.	290.00
01/08/24 Attend call	M R Seiden with internal team regarding developments ar	0.50 and planning.	725.00
01/08/24 Attend call	D S Torborg with internal team regarding status and plann	0.40 ing.	560.00
01/09/24 Attend call	C K Cahow with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Hou	0.70 ff teams regarding estimation	892.50 on discovery matters.
	M A Cody d revise memorandum regarding asbestos matt (.5); communicate with Erens regarding same		6,615.00 (3.6); review related
01/09/24 Attend esti	M C Corcoran mation discovery planning call (0.7); attend es	1.50 timation work in process ca	1,725.00 ll (0.8).
	B B Erens call with mediator regarding next steps (.20); a natters (.70).	0.90 attend Bates White call regar	1,462.50 rding estimation
01/09/24 Draft mem	J L Gale o related to asbestos matters and potential ne	4.00 xt steps.	2,900.00
	M R Hirst es White call (0.7); attend estimation work in pregarding estimation discovery (0.3); communissues (0.6).		
	A P Johnson mation discovery call with Bates White and Exsbestos matters and potential next steps (.5).	1.10 vert Weathersby Houff tean	1,017.50 ns (.6); review materials
01/09/24 Revise mer	P Lombardi norandum concerning asbestos matters and po	1.10 otential next steps.	935.00
next steps (	M A Cody and Gale and Johnson regarding comments to m (.5); review proposed outline regarding same (. with same (2.3).		
01/10/24 Review ma (.1).	M A Cody terials related to PIQ compliance and claims is	0.90 ssues (.8); communicate with	1,417.50 h Erens regarding same
	B B Erens terials from Miller related to asbestos matters ing case status (.20); prepare for client call reg		1,462.50 )); telephone call with
01/10/24 Draft mem	J L Gale o related to asbestos matters and potential ne	4.30 xt steps (3.8); emails with Co	3,117.50 ody, Johnson regarding

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 177 of 188 JONES DAY

	JONES DAT		
161866			Page: 42 January 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
same (.5).			
01/10/24 Review estima	M R Hirst tion discovery issues (0.5); communicate with	0.80 internal team regarding	1,100.00 estimation issues (0.3).
	A P Johnson als related to asbestos matters and potential no nails from Gale, Cody regarding same (.5).	2.30 ext steps (1.4); discuss sa	2,127.50 ame with Gale, Erens
01/10/24  Research precedence concerning sar	P Lombardi edent concerning asbestos matters and potentime (2.1).	3.00 ial next steps (.9); draft 1	2,550.00 memorandum
01/11/24 Call with Eren prepare for sar	C K Cahow as, Evert, Tananbaum, Masiano, Hirst regardin me (.60).	1.30 g asbestos matters and p	1,657.50 potential next steps (.70);
01/11/24 Review and re	M A Cody vise draft memorandum regarding asbestos ma	2.50 atters and potential next	3,937.50 t steps.
01/11/24 Attend call wit	B B Erens th client regarding asbestos matters and potent	0.70 tial next steps.	1,137.50
	M R Hirst with internal team concerning estimation disc stos matters and potential next steps (1.0).	1.80 overy issues (0.8); attended	2,475.00 d call with client
01/12/24 Review and re	M A Cody vise memorandum regarding asbestos matters	3.50 and potential next steps	5,512.50 s.
01/12/24 Telephone call potential next	B B Erens I with mediator regarding status (.20); revise m steps (3.4).	3.60 nemorandum regarding a	5,850.00 asbestos matters and
01/12/24 Draft memo re	J L Gale elated to asbestos matters and potential next s	0.90 teps.	652.50
01/12/24 Review materi- regarding same	A P Johnson als related to asbestos matters and potential note (1.3).	2.10 ext steps (.8); review me	1,942.50 mo from Lombardi
	P Lombardi ndum concerning asbestos matters and potent me (3.4); draft email to Cody and Johnson con		4,930.00 se memorandum
01/13/24 Revise memor	B B Erens andum regarding asbestos matters and potenti	2.30 ial next steps.	3,737.50
01/14/24 Review memo	B B Erens randum regarding asbestos matters and potent	1.30 tial next steps.	2,112.50
01/14/24 Draft memo re	J L Gale elated to asbestos matters and potential next s	3.40 teps.	2,465.00

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 178 of 188 JONES DAY

		JUNES DAY		
161866				Page: 43 January 31, 2024
Aldrich	i Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/14/2		A P Johnson ls related to asbestos matters and potential next ste (.7).	1.70 eps (1.0); review mo	1,572.50 emo from Lombardi
01/15/2		B B Erens egarding asbestos matters and potential next steps.	2.00	3,250.00
01/16/2		M A Cody ise memoranda related to asbestos matters and pot (.5).	4.30 tential next steps (3	6,772.50 3.8); review materials
01/16/2		J L Gale lated to asbestos matters and potential next steps.	0.70	507.50
01/16/2		M R Hirst on work in process call.	0.50	687.50
01/16/2		A P Johnson ls related to asbestos matters and potential next ste (1.7).	2.30 eps (.6); review men	2,127.50 mos from Lombardi
01/16/2		D S Torborg ls regarding estimation matters.	0.50	700.00
01/17/2	Review and rev	M A Cody ise memoranda regarding asbestos matters and pot in Erens regarding same (1.0); communications with		
01/17/2	Prepare for call	B B Erens with Cody regarding memo concerning asbestos n Cody regarding same (1.0); emails with mediator r		
01/17/2		J L Gale lated to asbestos matters and potential next steps (2	2.80 2.6); discuss same v	2,030.00 with Johnson (.2).
01/17/2		A P Johnson ls related to asbestos matters and potential next ste	1.90 eps (1.7); discuss sa	1,757.50 ame with Cody, Gale
01/18/2		B B Erens ls regarding asbestos matters and potential next ste (1.1).	1.60 eps (.50); review an	2,600.00 d revise memo
01/18/2		J L Gale lated to asbestos matters and potential next steps.	0.90	652.50
01/18/2		A P Johnson ls related to asbestos matters and potential next ste (1.6).	2.30 eps (.7); review men	2,127.50 mos from Lombardi
01/19/2		M A Cody ise memoranda regarding asbestos matters and pot h same (.8).	4.10 tential next steps (3	6,457.50 3.3); review materials in

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 179 of 188 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAY		
161866			Page: 44 January 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	B B Erens regarding asbestos matters and potential next step and planning (.20).	1.20 s (1.0); prepare for	1,950.00 upcoming call regarding
01/19/24 Revise memora	J L Gale andum regarding asbestos matters and potential no	0.40 ext steps.	290.00
01/19/24 Review memo	A P Johnson related to asbestos matters and potential next step	3.40 s (3.3); discuss sam	3,145.00 e with Lombardi (.1).
	M A Cody rise memorandum and related materials regarding ications with Erens regarding same (.5).	5.10 asbestos matters an	8,032.50 ad potential next steps
call with Evert and Evert rega	B B Erens ediator regarding developments (.30); telephone cato prepare for call with mediator (.30); attend call rding same (.30); telephone call with Cody regarding (.30); attend call with internal team regarding	with mediator (.80) ng memo concernir	; follow up with client ng asbestos matters and
01/22/24 Attend call with	M R Hirst h internal team regarding status and planning.	0.80	1,100.00
01/22/24 Review memos (.6).	A P Johnson s related to asbestos matters and potential next ste	1.80 ps (1.2); research pr	1,665.00 recedent related to same
01/22/24 Participate in c	T B Lewis all with internal team regarding status and plannin	0.10 g.	145.00
01/22/24 Participate in c	M R Seiden all with internal team regarding developments and	0.40 planning	580.00
01/22/24 Attend call with	D S Torborg h internal team regarding status and planning.	0.30	420.00
01/23/24 Attend call rega	C K Cahow arding estimation discovery with Bates White and	0.50 Evert Weathersby	637.50 Houff teams.
	M A Cody g with Johnson regarding asbestos matters and poregarding same (4.3).	4.60 tential next steps (.3	7,245.00 3); review and revise
regarding medi	B B Erens tes White call (.20); attend call regarding same (.50 ation matters (.50); telephone call with Miller rega- ting status of case (.20).		
01/23/24 Discuss memo	J L Gale regarding asbestos matters and potential next step	0.30 os with Johnson.	217.50
01/23/24 Telephone con	G M Gordon ference with Erens regarding case status.	0.10	200.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 180 of 188

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 45 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 01/23/24 1.30 1,787.50 Attend Bates White call (0.6); attend estimation work in process call (0.7). 4.30 01/23/24 A P Johnson 3,977.50 Attend estimation discovery call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams (.6); review memos related to asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.2); revise same (.7); discuss same with Gale (.3); research precedent related to same (.3); discuss same with Lombardi, Erens (.2). 01/24/24 M A Cody 3.80 5,985.00 Review and revise memoranda and related materials regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (3.6); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same (.2). 01/24/24 R Hart 0.10 82.50 Review estimation discovery document custodian matters. 01/24/24 1.80 M R Hirst 2,475.00 Attend call with Evert, Masiano regarding next steps in estimation (1.0); communicate with Asbestos Committee counsel regarding estimation matters (0.1); communicate with insurer counsel regarding same (0.1); follow up regarding Manville trust discovery matters (0.1); follow up regarding estimation issues (0.5). 01/24/24 A P Johnson 2.30 Review memo related to asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.2); review email from Cody regarding same (.1). 01/25/24 5.10 M A Cody 8,032.50 Review and revise memoranda regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (3.8); review related precedent (1.1); meeting with Gale regarding same (.1); telephone conference with Johnson regarding same 01/25/24 1,300.00 B B Erens 0.80 Attend call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps. 3.90 01/25/24 J L Gale 2,827.50 Draft memo related to asbestos matters and potential next steps (3.6); discuss same with Johnson (.3). 2.50 01/25/24 Conference call with co-counsel regarding estimation status (0.8); review and analyze estimation discovery issues (1.0); attend call with client regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (0.7). A P Johnson 01/25/24 5,735.00 Review memo related to asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.9); revise same (2.6); research precedent related to same (1.3); discuss same with Lombardi, Cody, Gale, Villalba (.4). 01/25/24 P Lombardi Review precedent in connection with memo regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.2); draft revisions to memo (.6). 01/25/24 D C Villalba 2.70 2,362.50 Call with Johnson regarding memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (0.2); research for memorandum (0.9); draft insert for memorandum on same (1.6). 01/26/24 7,087.50 M A Cody 4.50

Review and revise memoranda regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (2.8); review and revise draft inserts to memorandum (1.7).

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 181 of 188 JONES DAY

	JOI LEO DA		
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 46 January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/26/24 Revise memo s	J L Gale regarding asbestos matters and potential n	1.60 next steps.	1,160.00
01/26/24 Communication steps.	M R Hirst ons with internal team regarding estimation	1.00 n status, estimation discovery	1,375.00 and potential next
01/26/24 Review memo	A P Johnson related to asbestos matters and potential e (.5); discuss same with Lombardi (.3).	5.80 next steps (1.1); revise same (	5,365.00 (3.9); analyze precedent
	P Lombardi s to memorandum regarding asbestos mat cerning same (2.4); draft e-mails to Johnso	1 1	3,230.00 (1.3); research
01/26/24 Review preced	D C Villalba ent regarding asbestos matters and potent	2.90 tial next steps.	2,537.50
01/27/24 Review materia	B B Erens als from Johnson regarding asbestos matte	0.50 ers and potential next steps.	812.50
	A P Johnson related to asbestos matters and potential e (.2); draft email to Cody regarding same	± , ,	3,330.00 (1.5); analyze precedent
	P Lombardi ndum regarding asbestos matters and potencerning same (.1).	3.90 ential next steps (3.2); revise s	3,315.00 same (.6); draft e-mail
	A P Johnson related to asbestos matters and potential at (6); draft email to Lombardi regarding s		2,405.00 .2); analyze precedent
	M A Cody vise drafts of memorandum regarding asb s in connection with same (.8); review ma		
	B B Erens s with Cody and Johnson regarding memon munications with mediators regarding up		975.00 s and potential next
01/29/24 Revise memora	J L Gale andum regarding asbestos matters and po	2.00 stential next steps.	1,450.00
01/29/24 Review and an	M R Hirst alyze estimation discovery issues.	1.00	1,375.00
	A P Johnson related to asbestos matters and potential e (.7); draft emails to Lombardi regarding		3,330.00 (1.2); analyze precedent
01/29/24	P Lombardi	4.60	3,910.00

Revise inserts to memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (3.8); review comments

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 182 of 188

**JONES DAY** 161866 Page: 47 January 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241300853 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount from Cody and Johnson concerning same (.6); draft emails to Cody and Johnson concerning same (.2). 01/30/24 C K Cahow 0.50 637.50 Attend call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams regarding estimation. 2.30 01/30/24 M A Cody 3,622.50 Attend meeting with Johnson regarding memorandum concerning asbestos matters and potential next steps (.3); review and revise memorandum and various inserts to same (1.5); review related precedent and cases (.5).01/30/24 B B Erens 1.10 1,787.50 Calls with mediators regarding scheduling of meetings (.40); prepare for Bates White call regarding estimation (.20); attend call regarding the same with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams (.50). 01/30/24 M R Hirst 1.80 2,475.00 Attend estimation work in process call (0.5); attend Bates White call (0.5); follow up regarding insurance related discussions (0.3); follow up regarding estimation discovery issues (0.5). 01/30/24 A P Johnson 5.20 4,810.00 Attend estimation discovery call with Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff teams (.5); review memo related to asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.6); revise same (2.7); discuss same with Gale, Lombardi, Cody (.4). 01/30/24 3.90 P Lombardi 3,315.00 Revise inserts to memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.2); draft e-mail to Cody and Johnson concerning same (.1); draft e-mail to Johnson concerning memorandum inserts (.1); review precedent concerning memorandum (.6); draft e-mail to Cody and Johnson concerning same (.2); discuss memorandum with Gale (.1); revise memorandum (1.6). 01/30/24 D C Villalba 4.20 3,675.00 Review precedent regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (1.3); draft summary of same (2.9). 01/31/24 M A Cody 4.20 6,615.00 Review and revise drafts of memorandum regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (3.9); communications with Gale regarding same (.3). 01/31/24 B B Erens 1.50 2,437.50 Telephone call with Hirst regarding estimation trust discovery (.20); telephone call with Evert regarding the same (.20); emails with Hirst and Evert regarding estimation discovery subpoena request (.20); review materials for potential upcoming mediation (.40); telephone call with Evert regarding tort system developments (.30); telephone call with Gordon regarding mediation status (.20). 01/31/24 J L Gale 1.10 797.50 Revise memo regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (0.9); discuss same with Johnson and Lombardi (0.2). 01/31/24 G M Gordon 0.20 400.00 Telephone conference with Erens regarding status of mediation.

1.00 01/31/24 M R Hirst 1,375.00

Review Manville notice of withdrawal of motion to quash subpoenas and anonymity motion in trust discovery dispute (0.2); review estimation discovery issues (0.4); communicate with Asbestos Committee regarding estimation discovery (0.2); communicate with Erens regarding trust discovery analysis (0.2).

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 183 of 188

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 48

January 31, 2024

Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

01/31/24 A P Johnson 7.30 6,752.50

Review memo related to asbestos matters and potential next steps (4.3); discuss same with Lombardi, Gale (.3); revise same (2.3); analyze precedent related to same (.4).

01/31/24 P Lombardi 5.30 4,505.00

Meet with Johnson and Gale concerning memo regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps (.3); review memo (3.4); draft revisions to same (.6); review revised draft of memo (.9); draft e-mail to Gale concerning same (.1).

Matter Total 317.20 USD 372,080.00

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 184 of 188 **JONES DAY**

161866 Page: 49

January 31, 2024 Invoice: 241300853

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Disbursement Detail

Date	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Location	Amount	Total
Case Administra	ation and Business Operations			
TRAVEL - AIR I	FARE			
01/25/24	A P Johnson	CHI	15.00	
Airfare -	Travel to attend mediation.			
Travel - Air Fare	Subtotal			15.00
Matter T	<sup>r</sup> otal		USD	15.00

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 185 of 188

#### **EXHIBIT B**

**Proposed Order** 

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re	Chapter 11	
ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1	Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)	
Debtors.	(Jointly Administered)	

# ORDER GRANTING THE ELEVENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF JONES DAY FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024

This matter coming before the Court on the Eleventh Interim Application of

Jones Day for Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of

Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors for the Period From October 1, 2023 Through January 31,

2024 (the "Interim Fee Application")<sup>2</sup> filed by Jones Day as counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (the "Debtors"); the Court having reviewed the Interim Fee

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein have the meanings given to them in the Interim Fee Application.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 187 of 188

Application; the Court having found that (a) the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334, (b) this is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b), (c) notice of the Interim Fee Application and the notice of an opportunity for hearing were served upon the parties required by Local Rule 2002-1(g) and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained *Professionals* [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order") and no other or further notice is required, (d) the compensation requested in the Interim Fee Application is reasonable and for actual and necessary services rendered by Jones Day on behalf of the Debtors during the period from October 1, 2023 through January 31, 2024 (the "Compensation Period"), (e) the expenses for which reimbursement is sought in the Interim Fee Application are actual and necessary expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Compensation Period on behalf of the Debtors, and (f) the Interim Fee Application fully complies with the Interim Compensation Order, the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the Compensation Guidelines; and the Court having determined that the legal and factual bases set forth in the Interim Fee Application establish just cause for the relief granted herein;

#### IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT:

- 1. The Interim Fee Application is GRANTED.
- 2. Jones Day is awarded, on an interim basis, compensation for professional services rendered during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$2,928,040.00 and reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$5,433.80.
- 3. The Debtors are authorized and directed to pay promptly to Jones Day the amount of fees and expenses approved by this Order, to the extent that such amounts have not previously been paid by the Debtors.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2134 Filed 03/11/24 Entered 03/11/24 19:21:26 Desc Main Document Page 188 of 188

- 4. The Debtors and Jones Day are authorized and empowered to take all actions necessary to implement the relief granted in this Order.
- 5. This Court shall retain exclusive jurisdiction over any and all matters arising from or related to the implementation, enforcement, or interpretation of this Order.

This Order has been signed electronically. The Judge's signature and Court's seal appear at the top of the Order.

United States Bankruptcy Court