

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA  
CHARLOTTE DIVISION**

In re:  ALDRICH PUMP LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>  Debtors.	Chapter 11  Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)  (Jointly Administered)
--	---

**SUMMARY OF THE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF  
VERUS, LLC AS PIQ DATA ADMINISTRATOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE  
OF ASBESTOS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM  
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE  
PERIOD JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023**

<b>Name of applicant:</b>	<b>Verus, LLC</b>
Authorized to provide professional services to:	The Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants
Date retention approved:	May 15, 2023
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	July 1, 2023 through September 30, 2023
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$142,815.00
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$24,900.00
Amount of compensation paid as actual, reasonable and necessary for applicable period:	\$128,848.50
Amount of expenses reimbursed as actual, reasonable and necessary for applicable period:	\$24,900.00
Total amount of unpaid fees and expenses sought for applicable period:	\$13,966.50

This is a(n):  Monthly  Interim  Final Application.

This is the First Interim Fee Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses.

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of the Debtors' taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.



Prior Monthly Fee Statements submitted for this Interim Period:

<b>Date Submitted</b>	<b>Month Covered</b>	<b>Fees</b>	<b>Expenses</b>
9/14/2023	7/1/2023-7/31/2023	\$17,075.00 <sup>2</sup>	\$24,900.00
9/29/2023	8/1/2023-8/31/2023	\$45,555.00	\$0.00
10/17/2023 <sup>3</sup>	9/1/2023-9/24/2023	\$48,863.00	\$0.00
12/14/2023	9/7/2023-9/30/2023	\$31,322.00	\$0.00
	<b>TOTAL:</b>	<b>\$142,815.00</b>	<b>\$24,900.00</b>

---

<sup>2</sup> Due to a clerical error, an initial version of this invoice was issued for \$17,425.00. The payment received to date from the Debtors is based on the \$17,425.00 invoice; the unpaid fees and expenses accurately reflect the amount due considering that overpayment.

<sup>3</sup> Due to an invoicing issue, the initial September invoice omitted certain time. The fee statement served on December 14, 2023 includes the corrected time.

**SUMMARY OF VERUS, LLC FEES BY PROFESSIONAL  
JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023**

The Verus employees who rendered professional services in the case during the fee period are:

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Billing Rate</b>	<b>Total Hours in Fee Period</b>	<b>Total Fees in Fee Period</b>	<b>Total Hours Billed from Date of Retention</b>	<b>Total Compensation from the Date of Retention</b>
Abena Ofori-Atta	\$115.00	1.0	\$115.00	1.0	\$115.00
Aileen Thompson	\$115.00	7.9	\$908.50	7.9	\$908.50
Amanda Thomson	\$115.00	7.4	\$851.00	7.4	\$851.00
Debbie Daloisio	\$250.00	43.5	\$10,875.00	43.5	\$10,875.00
Edward Silverman	\$250.00	23.3	\$5,690.00	23.3	\$5,690.00
Erin Sobke	\$115.00	3.0	\$345.00	3.0	\$345.00
Gencehan Yuksel	\$150.00	28.1	\$3,690.00	28.1	\$3,690.00
Jean Abellard	\$115.00	6.5	\$747.50	6.5	\$747.50
Jose Thomas	\$150.00	111.5	\$13,365.00	111.5	\$13,365.00
Keith Singer	\$250.00	15.0	\$2,650.00	15.0	\$2,650.00
Kim Glasson	\$115.00	4.0	\$460.00	4.0	\$460.00
Kiran Gummaluri	\$175.00	89.2	\$15,610.00	89.2	\$15,610.00
Kiran Jupudi	\$350.00	67.0	\$11,725.00	67.0	\$11,725.00
Knut Fenner	\$350.00	2.0	\$700.00	2.0	\$700.00
Morten Iverson	\$350.00	73.7	\$25,795.00	73.7	\$25,795.00
Sara Leineek	\$350.00	22.1	\$7,735.00	22.1	\$7,735.00
Sarah DeGeronimo	\$115.00	31.6	\$4,565.50	31.6	\$4,565.50
Shavon Brown	\$175.00	1.5	\$172.50	1.5	\$172.50
Toni Devenberg	\$175.00	3.6	\$310.00	3.6	\$310.00
Vivek Chandromohan	\$175.00	95.9	\$16,782.50	95.9	\$16,782.50
Vejey Reddy	\$175.00	9.5	\$1,662.50	9.5	\$1,662.50
Joe Gassman	\$350.00	33.0	\$11,550.00	33.0	\$11,550.00
Mark Eveland	\$350.00	6.6	\$2,310.00	6.6	\$2,310.00
Rachel Anderson	\$350.00	1.0	\$350.00	1.0	\$350.00
Christian Javois	\$115.00	20.0	\$2,300.00	20.0	\$2,300.00
Scott Heisman	\$350.00	4.1	\$1,435.00	4.1	\$1,435.00
Clarissa Gould Green	\$115.00	1.0	\$115.00	1.0	\$115.00
<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>713.0</b>	<b>\$142,815.00</b>	<b>713.0</b>	<b>\$142,815.00</b>

**SUMMARY OF VERUS, LLC  
COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY  
JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023**

<b>Project Category</b>	<b>Hours in July</b>	<b>Hours in Aug.</b>	<b>Hours in Sept.</b>	<b>Total Hours in Fee Period</b>	<b>Total Hours Since Date of Retention</b>
Analytics (An)	2.0	114.5	68.5	185.0	185.0
Communication (Cl)	1.7	3.6	8.4	13.7	13.7
General Administration (GA)	54.0	25.1	117.9	197.0	197.0
Information Technology (IT)	4.8	70.6	184.5	259.9	259.9
Quality (Q)	0	4.0	53.4	57.4	57.4
<b>Total:</b>	<b>62.5</b>	<b>217.8</b>	<b>262.0</b>	<b>432.7</b>	<b>713.0</b>

**VERUS, LLC  
CUMULATIVE EXPENSE SUMMARY  
JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023**

<b>Service Description</b>	<b>Total Expenses for Fee Period</b>	<b>Total Expenses from Date of Retention</b>
Assembly Subscription Fee for Database	\$24,900.00	\$24,900.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$24,900.00</b>	<b>\$24,900.00</b>

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA  
CHARLOTTE DIVISION**

In re:

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, *et al.*,<sup>1</sup>

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

(Jointly Administered)

**FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF  
VERUS, LLC AS PIQ DATA ADMINISTRATOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE  
OF ASBESTOS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM  
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE  
PERIOD JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023**

Verus, LLC (“Verus”), PIQ Data Administrator to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the “Committee”) of Aldrich Pump LLC, *et al.*, (the “Debtors”), hereby submits its first interim fee application (the “First Interim Fee Application”) for allowance of compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred for the period July 1, 2023 through September 30, 2023.

**INTRODUCTION**

1. On June 18, 2020 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtors commenced this proceeding (the “Chapter 11 Case”) by filing a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101 *et seq.* (the “Bankruptcy Code”).

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of the Debtors’ taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors’ address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

2. Pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Debtors have continued as a debtor-in-possession since the Petition Date. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in the Chapter 11 Case.

3. On June 30, 2020, the Bankruptcy Administrator moved for the appointment of the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants in the Debtors' case pursuant section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code [Dkt. No. 126]. The Bankruptcy Court orally granted the motion at a hearing on July 6, 2020 and entered an order memorializing its ruling on July 7, 2020. *See* [Dkt. No. 147].

4. On July 15, 2020, the Court entered the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* [Dkt. No. 171] (the "Interim Fee Order"). Pursuant to the Interim Fee Order, the Court established a procedure for interim compensation and reimbursement of disbursements for professionals appointed in this case. In particular, the Court authorized the service to certain notice parties of monthly fee statements by professionals appointed in this case (including professionals employed by the Committee) and payment by the Debtors of 90% of fees and 100% of expenses, in the absence of an objection made within fourteen (14) days of service of the pertinent fee statement.

5. On March 8, 2023 the Committee filed the *Ex Parte Application of the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants to Retain and Employ Verus, LLC as PIQ Data Administrator for the Personal Injury Questionnaire Responses* [Dkt. No. 1636].

6. On May 15, 2023, the Court entered its *Order Approving the Ex Parte Application of the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants to Retain and Employ Verus, LLC as PIQ Data Administrator for the Personal Injury Questionnaire Responses* [Dkt. No. 1755].

### **RETENTION OF VERUS**

7. The Committee retained Verus as PIQ Data Administrator in the Chapter 11 Case. By order dated May 15, 2023, Verus was appointed as PIQ Data Administrator for the Committee, to perform certain tasks set forth in greater detail in the underlying retention application, effective as of May 15, 2023. *See* [Dkt. No. 1755].

8. As set forth in the in the application to retain Verus, Verus was engaged to perform the following services:

- a. Download PIQ submissions from the Donlin Portal, and link submission data to the respective PIQ IDs based upon Donlin Master Service List PIQ IDs decoded and provided by LAS.
- b. Create and maintain a machine-readable inventory of the documents included for each submission using LAS document type codes and perform ongoing 10% quality control (“QC”) on the document type coding.
- c. Periodically account for and report on missing cases and duplicate cases against the master PIQ Service List.
- d. Design and enter PIQ data into an online data entry platform (the “PIQ Data Capture System”) mirroring the PIQ and providing for capture of additional information from supporting documents as required.
- e. Produce periodic data exports of items (a)-(d) during the PIQ data capture process.
- f. Extract from the documents submitted with PIQs the key data related to disease, e.g., meso diagnosis date, other disease(s) present; exposure, e.g., work history, identification of Debtors’ and other products; defendants named and court cases filed; and trust filings, and include the source document for each data element extracted (capturing the data in a template similar to the PIQ data) and perform ongoing 10-20% QC on coding and data entry.
- g. Provide LAS with access to the online PIQ Data Capture System.
- h. Provide regular reports to LAS on productivity and schedule regular conference calls to discuss operations, troubleshoot and document problems and their resolutions, and answer questions about how to interpret the data.
- i. Provide such other data processing and analysis tasks as may be requested by the Committee or LAS.

**VERUS'S FEE STATEMENTS DURING THE FEE PERIOD**

9. During the period covered by the First Interim Fee Application (the "Fee Period"), Verus provided the Notice Parties with the following monthly fee statements in accordance with the Interim Fee Order and the Guidelines for Compensation (the "Compensation Guidelines") referred to therein:

- For July 1, 2023 through July 31, 2023 – fees of \$17,075.00 and expenses of \$24,900.00 (the "July Monthly Fee Statement"). A copy of the revised July Monthly Fee Statement<sup>2</sup> is attached hereto as Schedule A-1;
- For August 1, 2023 through August 31, 2023 – fees of \$45,555.00 and expenses of \$0.00 (the "August Monthly Fee Statement"). A copy of the August Monthly Fee Statement is attached hereto as Schedule A-2;
- For September 1, 2023 through September 30, 2023 – fees of \$80,185.00 and expenses of \$0.00 (the "September Monthly Fee Statements"). A copy of the September Monthly Fee Statements are attached hereto as Schedule A-3;<sup>3</sup>

10. In total, Verus submitted monthly fee statements during the Fee Period for fees of \$142,815.00 and expenses of \$24,900.00. A chart summarizing the monthly statements submitted during this Fee Period is below:

---

<sup>2</sup> Due to a clerical error, an initial version of this invoice was issued for \$17,425.00.

<sup>3</sup> Due to an invoicing issue, the initial September invoice omitted certain time. Schedule A-3 includes the two monthly statements that together comprise total September time.

<b>Service Date</b>	<b>Applicati on Period</b>	<b>Requested Fees</b>	<b>Requested Expenses</b>	<b>Approved Fees (90% of Fees)</b>	<b>Approved Expenses</b>	<b>10% Fee Holdback</b>	<b>Total Sought to be Paid (including 10% Holdback)</b>
9/14/23	7/1/23-7/31/23	\$17,075.00	\$24,900.00	\$15,367.50	\$24,900.00	\$2,057.50	\$17,075.00
9/29/23	8/1/23-8/31/23	\$45,555.00	\$0.00	\$40,999.50	\$0.00	\$4,555.50	\$45,555.00
10/17/23 <sup>4</sup>	9/1/23-9/24/23	\$48,863.00 <sup>5</sup>	\$0.00	\$43,976.70	\$0.00	\$4,886.30	\$48,863.00
12/14/23	9/7/23-9/30/23	\$31,322.00	\$0.00	\$28,189.80	\$0.00	\$3,132.20	\$31,322.00
<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>\$142,815.00</b>	<b>\$24,900.00</b>	<b>\$128,533.50</b>	<b>\$24,900.00</b>	<b>\$14,281.50</b>	<b>\$142,815.00</b>

**SUMMARY OF SERVICES**

11. The professional services performed by Verus were necessary and appropriate to the administration of the Debtors’ chapter 11 cases. These services were in the best interests of the Debtors, the estates, and creditors. The compensation requested is commensurate with the complexity and nature of the issues and tasks involved.

**PROGRESS OF THE CHAPTER 11 CASE TO DATE**

12. Since its engagement in these cases, Verus has downloaded PIQ submissions, including supporting documentation; begun the design and construction of the online data entry and capture platform; and started the review and QC process. In addition, Verus has conducted regular conference calls with LAS regarding operations and progress to date.

13. Verus has not previously applied for payment of any fees or reimbursement of any disbursement during this Chapter 11 Case except as authorized pursuant to the Interim Fee Order,

---

<sup>4</sup> Due to an invoicing issue, the initial September invoice omitted certain time. The fee statement served on December 14, 2023 includes the corrected time.

<sup>5</sup> Due to a clerical error, the cover letter for this monthly fee statement lists an incorrect amount; the invoice total of \$48,863.00 is correct and is reflected in the time entry detail.

including monthly submissions of fee statements. Verus does not hold a retainer in respect of its services as PIQ Data Administrator for the Committee.

**LEGAL BASIS FOR REQUESTED RELIEF**

14. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code to govern the Court’s award of such compensation. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that a court may award a professional employed under section 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code “reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered . . . and . . . reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses.” 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1)(A) and (B).

15. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code also sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded to . . . [a] professional person, the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including --

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;
- (E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
- (F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3)(A)-(F).

16. The foregoing professional services performed by Verus were appropriate and necessary to the effective administration of the Chapter 11 Case. The services were in the best interests of the Committee. Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, as well as issues or tasks involved. The professional services were performed in an appropriately expeditious and efficient manner.

17. In accordance with section 504 of the Bankruptcy Code and Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2016(a), no agreement or understanding exists between Verus and any other person for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with this case.

18. No agreement or understanding prohibited by 18 U.S.C. § 155 has been or will be made by Verus.

**THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION SHOULD BE ALLOWED**

19. The services for which Verus seeks compensation in this First Interim Fee Application were, at the time rendered, necessary for, beneficial to, and in the best interests of, the Committee and the Debtors' estates. The services rendered by Verus were consistently performed in a timely manner commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the issues involved. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, it is respectfully submitted that the amount requested by Verus is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of this case, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

**NO PRIOR REQUEST**

20. No prior request for the relief sought in this First Interim Fee Application has been made to this or any other court in connection with the Chapter 11 Case apart from the delivery of the monthly fee statements.

**NOTICE**

21. Notice of this First Interim Fee Application has been provided in accordance with the Interim Fee Order. Verus submits that no other or further notice need be provided.

**CONCLUSION**

WHEREFORE, Verus respectfully requests that the Court: (i) enter the order attached as Exhibit A granting the First Interim Fee Application and authorizing interim allowance of compensation in the amount of \$142,815.00 for professional services rendered on behalf of the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants of and reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$24,900.00; (ii) direct payment by the Debtors of the foregoing amounts less any amount already paid pursuant to the Interim Fee Order; and (iii) grant such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

*[Signature on following page]*

Dated: March 19, 2024  
Charlotte, North Carolina

HAMILTON STEPHENS STEELE  
+ MARTIN, PLLC

/s/ Glenn C. Thompson

Glenn C. Thompson (Bar No. 37221)  
525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202  
Telephone: (704) 344-1117  
Facsimile: (704) 344-1483  
gthompson@lawhssm.com

*Local Counsel for the Official Committee of  
Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants*

Natalie D. Ramsey (admitted pro hac vice)  
Davis Lee Wright (admitted pro hac vice)  
Robinson & Cole, LLP  
1201 N. Market Street, Suite 1406  
Wilmington, DE 19801  
Tel: (302) 516-1700  
Fax: (302) 516-1699  
nramsey@rc.com  
dwright@rc.com

*Co-Counsel to the Official Committee of  
Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants*

# **EXHIBIT A**

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA  
CHARLOTTE DIVISION**

In re:

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, *et al.*,<sup>1</sup>

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

(Jointly Administered)

**ORDER GRANTING THE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF VERUS, LLC, AS  
PIQ DATA ADMINISTRATOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS  
PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM COMPENSATION  
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD  
JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023**

This matter coming before the Court on the *First Interim Fee Application of Verus, LLC as PIQ Data Administrator to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants for Payment of Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period July 1, 2023 through September 30, 2023* (the “First Interim Fee Application”) filed by Verus, LLC. (“Verus”), PIQ data administrator to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the “Committee”); the Court having reviewed the First Interim Fee Application; the Court having found that: (a) the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334; (b) this is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b); (c) notice of the First Interim Fee Application was sufficient pursuant to Local Rule 2002-1(g) and the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* [Dkt. No. 171] (the “Interim Fee Order”) and no other or further notice is required; (d) the compensation requested in the First Interim Fee Application is reasonable and for actual and necessary services rendered by Verus on behalf of the Committee during the period of July 1, 2023

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of the Debtors’ taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors’ address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

through September 30, 2023 (the “Fee Period”); (e) the expenses for which reimbursement is sought in the First Interim Fee Application are actual and necessary expenses incurred by Verus during the Fee Period on behalf of the Committee; and (f) the First Interim Fee Application fully complies with the Interim Fee Order, the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the Guidelines; and the Court having determined that the legal and factual bases set forth in the First Interim Fee Application establish just cause for the relief granted herein:

1. The First Interim Fee Application is GRANTED.
2. Verus is awarded, on an interim basis, compensation for professional services rendered during the Fee Period in the amount of \$142,815.00 and reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred by Verus during the Fee Period in the amount of \$24,900.00.
3. The Debtors are authorized and directed to pay Verus promptly the fees and expenses approved in this Order to the extent such amounts have not been paid previously by the Debtors.
4. The Debtors and Verus are authorized and empowered to take all actions necessary to implement the relief granted in this Order.
5. This Court shall retain exclusive jurisdiction over any and all matters arising from or related to the implementation, enforcement, or interpretation of this Order.

This Order has been signed electronically.  
The Judge’s signature and court’s seal appear  
at the top of the Order.

United States Bankruptcy Court

# **SCHEDULE A-1**

September 14, 2023

VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL TO NOTICE PARTIES ON SCHEDULE 1

RE: *In re Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.*, Case No. 20-30608 (Bankr. W.D.N.C.)  
Expense Reimbursement Statement Pursuant to Order Establishing Procedures  
for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Attached please find the monthly fee statement of Verus Claims Services, LLC for fees earned and expenses incurred for the period of July 1, 2023 through July 31, 2023 (the "Statement"). The Statement is being provided to you in accordance with the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* in the above-referenced case [Docket No. 171].

Sincerely,

Mark Eveland

Verus LLC  
3967 Princeton Pike  
Princeton, NJ 08540  
609.466.0427  
[www.verusllc.com](http://www.verusllc.com)



MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT

To: Notice Parties on Schedule 1, (Via E-Mail)  
From: Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Date: September 14, 2023

Re: *In re: Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.* (the “Debtor”)  
Case No. 20-30608  
United States Bankruptcy Court  
Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Pursuant to the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* entered on July 15, 2020 [Docket No. 171] (the “Compensation Order”), Verus Claims Services, LLC (“Verus”) submits this monthly fee statement (the “Statement”) as counsel to The Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants, for the period July 1, 2023 through July 31, 2023 (the “Fee Period”). During the Fee Period, Verus earned fees of \$17,425.00 and incurred expenses of \$24,900.00.

The Compensation Order allows retained professionals such as Verus to request payment of ninety percent (90%) of their fees and one hundred percent (100%) of their expenses on a monthly basis. Accordingly, Verus requests payment from the Debtor of **\$40,582.50** calculated as follows:

\$17,425.00 (100% of fees)  
X .90  
\$15,367.50 (90% of fees)  
+24,900.00 (100% of expenses)  
**\$40,267.50**

Attached hereto and incorporated herein as part of this Statement is Verus’ invoice describing the services rendered and the expenses incurred for the Fee Period. A summary listing of the Verus services during the Fee Period as well as an itemized list of expenses each appears in the invoice.

The amount of fees withheld from Verus at this time that will be sought in an interim fee application in accordance with the Compensation Order is **\$1,742.50**, which represents the holdback from this Fee Period.

**SCHEDULE1**

- 1) Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC  
800-E Beaty Street  
Davidson, NC 28036  
(Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., [atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com](mailto:atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com))
- 2) Jones Day  
77 West Wacker  
Chicago, IL 60601  
(Attn: Brad B. Erens, Esq., [bberens@jonesday.com](mailto:bberens@jonesday.com), Mark A. Cody, Esq., [macody@jonesday.com](mailto:macody@jonesday.com), and Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq., [ccahow@jonesday.com](mailto:ccahow@jonesday.com))
- 3) Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.  
227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202  
(Attn: C. Richard Rayburn, Jr., Esq., [rrayburn@rcdlaw.net](mailto:r-rayburn@rcdlaw.net), and John R. Miller, Jr., Esq., [jmiller@rcdlaw.net](mailto:jmiller@rcdlaw.net))
- 4) U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator  
402 West Trade Street, Suite 200  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., [feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov](mailto:feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov))
- 5) McCarter & English, LLP  
1600 Market St., Suite 3900  
Philadelphia, PA 19103  
(Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., [pamoam@mccarter.com](mailto:pamoam@mccarter.com))
- 6) McCarter & English, LLP  
Four Gateway Center  
100 Mulberry St.  
Newark, NJ 07102  
(Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., [abartell@mccarter.com](mailto:abartell@mccarter.com), and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., [ppavlick@mccarter.com](mailto:ppavlick@mccarter.com))
- 7) McCarter & English, LLP  
Worldwide Plaza  
825 Eighth Avenue, 31<sup>st</sup> Floor  
New York, NY 10019  
(Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., [gmascitti@mccarter.com](mailto:gmascitti@mccarter.com))
- 8) Burt & Cordes, PLLC  
122 Cherokee Road, Suite 1

Charlotte, NC 28207  
(Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., [scordes@burtcordeslaw.com](mailto:scordes@burtcordeslaw.com))

- 9) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered  
One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., [kmaclay@capdale.com](mailto:kmaclay@capdale.com), and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., [tphillips@capdale.com](mailto:tphillips@capdale.com))
- 10) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC  
525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., [gthompson@lawhssm.com](mailto:gthompson@lawhssm.com))
- 11) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP  
Columbia Center  
1152 15<sup>th</sup> Street, NW  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, Esq., [jguy@orrick.com](mailto:jguy@orrick.com), and Debra L. Felder, Esq., [dfelder@orrick.com](mailto:dfelder@orrick.com))
- 12) Grier Wright Martinez, PA  
521 E Morehead Street, Suite 440  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: A. Cotton Wright, Esq., [cwright@grierlaw.com](mailto:cwright@grierlaw.com))

# INVOICE

INVOICE ID: CI-0000003620

DATE: 09/13/23

CLIENT: Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

ADDRESS:

Terms: Net 30 Days  
Due Date: 10/13/23  
Customer ID: 0110

FOR SERVICES RENDERED - SEE ATTACHED REPORTS FOR DETAILS

Hourly Services Fees	\$17,075.00
Expenses	\$24,900.00
<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$41,975.00</b>

**Total** **\$41,975.00**

### ACH Transfer Instructions:

Bank Name: [REDACTED]  
 Bank Address: [REDACTED]  
 Account Name: Verus Claims Services, LLC  
 ABA Number: [REDACTED]  
 Account Number: [REDACTED]

Verus LLC  
 3967 Princeton Pike  
 Princeton, NJ 08540  
 609.466.0427  
 www.verusllc.com



The **Art & Science** of  
 complex dispute resolution.

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
06/29/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	cross org meeting and orientation of work- access to data and docs- etc	2	350.00	\$700.00
06/29/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich Pump - Verus Status Call Review PIQ with Joe Gassman	1	350.00	\$350.00
06/29/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with LAS and Attorneys for Verus kickoff call and follow-up	1	350.00	\$350.00
06/29/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Call with Robinson Cole and LAS to organize data collection process- access PIQ portal. Review aggregate data provided by R C- including metadata from portal downloads.	1.4	350.00	\$490.00
06/30/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	planning work and approach to understanding the data/docs- data structure requirements- output expectations.	2.5	350.00	\$875.00
06/30/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Review data approach with Morten	.4	350.00	\$140.00
06/30/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Planning meeting with Sara L to discuss Alrdidge Pump project; Solution design meeting with Joe Gassman	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/03/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Review materials and plan the system design for implementing the PIQ data capture.	2	350.00	\$700.00
07/05/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Planning the PIQ Project and reviewing the materials available and notes from meetings.	.5	350.00	\$175.00
07/06/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Communication with Analytics department Obtain signed Protective Orders from Ed- Jose- and Clarissa Answer inquiries as to expected resource needs	.3	350.00	\$105.00
07/13/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich status meeting	.5	350.00	\$175.00
07/13/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Follow up Call with Annecca- Cord- et. al.	1	350.00	\$350.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
07/17/23	Rachel Anderson	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich Pump 3month project - Meeting with Ed IT regarding data dictionary 30min - meeting with Mark to discuss the details of this project 30min .	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/17/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	AP Artifacts development	5	115.00	\$575.00
07/19/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	PIQ completion approach planning	2	350.00	\$700.00
07/19/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with Joe and Sara on project status; review of project mind map outline from Joe.	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/19/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Creating project artifacts	2	115.00	\$230.00
07/20/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Meeting with client team to review approach and gather expectations for meetings-reporting needs- timeline- and pilot review. Attended by Verus- LAS and Annecca	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/20/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Project Planning and artifact creation	1	115.00	\$115.00
07/20/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	project planning	4	350.00	\$1,400.00
07/20/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with Christian- the Verus Project Manager- and the initial project Team to refine the project charter and work breakdown structure.	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/20/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meet with project team and LAS to discuss configuration of portal and LAS needs for data feeds- including frequency.	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/20/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meet with Joe- Morten and assigned Project Manager to review project plan- team- and follow ups to address with LAS on afternoon call.	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/21/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	project planning	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/21/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	technology approach alternative evaluation	2	350.00	\$700.00
07/21/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich Pump Project Plan and RACI	2.5	115.00	\$287.50

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
07/21/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Aldrich data review with Morten	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/21/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with C. Thomas and M. Totten from LAS and J. Gassman from Verus to discuss data and technology related to the Aldrich Pump project. Access to LAS SharePoint site and review of SharePoint Site and data files shared by LAS.	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/24/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	AP Gantt; RACI; Project Plan	3.5	115.00	\$402.50
07/24/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Call with M. Iversen to discuss approach to program development data architecture environment and who to allow privileges to access data. Obtain additional Protective Order signatures and create master list of those who have executed	.5	350.00	\$175.00
07/25/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Project Plan Dev.- Project Charter	4	115.00	\$460.00
07/25/23	SCOTT HEISMAN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Data transfer to Verus server	.3	350.00	\$105.00
07/25/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Met with E. Silverman to describe the Aldrich Pump Project and data submission to introduce the Analytics team to the project and prepare for deliverables to LAS. Meeting with K. Jupudi to prepare the IT team for ingestion of submission data to get it analyzed- organized- and imported into database	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/26/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	AP Project Plan dev.	0	115.00	\$0.00
07/27/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	project planning- staffing and roles- charter	2	350.00	\$700.00
07/27/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meet with internal team re: discovery and next steps in database build out- etc	.9	350.00	\$315.00
07/27/23	SCOTT HEISMAN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Project meeting	1	350.00	\$350.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
07/27/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Follow up meeting with project team and LAS to discuss configuration of portal and LAS needs for data feeds- including frequency.	1	350.00	\$350.00
07/27/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Meet with client and team for status updates and discussion of next steps Email to participants/invitees with updates- outcomes- and follow ups	.6	350.00	\$210.00
07/27/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	1 Prep and follow-up meeting with Kiran Jupudi to discuss submission from the debtor- review the data received- and plan how to organize the submissions in a relational format. 2 Aldrich Pump PIQ Project meeting with S Leineek, J. Gassman, S. Heisman, C. Javois	2	350.00	\$700.00
07/27/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Artifact creation: Project Plan Charter for AP	0	115.00	\$0.00
07/27/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	discuss aldrich murray with team- initial review of the data sources	.5	250.00	\$125.00
07/28/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Update meeting invitation for teams	.1	350.00	\$35.00
07/28/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Prepared for and met with Kiran Jupudi to discuss findings from working with claim submission folders received from LAS. Discussed strategy for creating data in a shared format and reviewed the JSON strings submitted in each submission folder. Review of JSON and Excel files.	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
07/28/23	Christian Javois	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Project Charter - Gantt- PP revision	2	115.00	\$230.00
07/28/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Draft of finding on the data sent over by Aldrich Murray	.5	250.00	\$125.00
		<b>SUB-TOTAL</b>		<b>63.5</b>		<b>\$17,075.00</b>
					<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$17,075.00</b>
					<b>Total</b>	<b>\$17,075.00</b>

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
 Professional Services Rendered  
 Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
06/30/2023		Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	FormAssembly subscription fee to support PIQ and the appropriate extraction of data	1	24900.00	\$24,900.00
		<b>SUB-TOTAL</b>		<b>1</b>		<b>\$24,900.00</b>
					<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$24,900.00</b>
					<b>Total</b>	<b>\$24,900.00</b>

# **SCHEDULE A-2**

September 29, 2023

VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL TO NOTICE PARTIES ON SCHEDULE 1

RE: *In re Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.*, Case No. 20-30608 (Bankr. W.D.N.C.)  
Expense Reimbursement Statement Pursuant to Order Establishing Procedures  
for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Attached please find the monthly fee statement of Verus Claims Services, LLC for fees earned and expenses incurred for the period of August 1, 2023 through August 31, 2023 (the "Statement"). The Statement is being provided to you in accordance with the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* in the above-referenced case [Docket No. 171].

Sincerely,

Mark Eveland

Verus LLC  
3967 Princeton Pike  
Princeton, NJ 08540  
609.466.0427  
[www.verusllc.com](http://www.verusllc.com)



MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT

To: Notice Parties on Schedule 1, (Via E-Mail)  
From: Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Date: September 19, 2023

Re: *In re: Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.* (the “Debtor”)  
Case No. 20-30608  
United States Bankruptcy Court  
Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Pursuant to the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* entered on July 15, 2020 [Docket No. 171] (the “Compensation Order”), Verus Claims Services, LLC (“Verus”) submits this monthly fee statement (the “Statement”) as counsel to The Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants, for the period August 1, 2023 through August 31, 2023 (the “Fee Period”). During the Fee Period, Verus earned fees of \$45,555.00 and incurred expenses of \$0.00.

The Compensation Order allows retained professionals such as Verus to request payment of ninety percent (90%) of their fees and one hundred percent (100%) of their expenses on a monthly basis. Accordingly, Verus requests payment from the Debtor of **\$40,999.50** calculated as follows:

\$45,555.00 (100% of fees)  
X .90  
\$40,999.50 (90% of fees)  
+0.00 (100% of expenses)  
**\$40,999.50**

Attached hereto and incorporated herein as part of this Statement is Verus’ invoice describing the services rendered and the expenses incurred for the Fee Period. A summary listing of the Verus services during the Fee Period as well as an itemized list of expenses each appears in the invoice.

The amount of fees withheld from Verus at this time that will be sought in an interim fee application in accordance with the Compensation Order is **\$4,555.50**, which represents the holdback from this Fee Period.

**SCHEDULE1**

- 1) Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC  
800-E Beaty Street  
Davidson, NC 28036  
(Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., [atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com](mailto:atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com))
- 2) Jones Day  
77 West Wacker  
Chicago, IL 60601  
(Attn: Brad B. Erens, Esq., [bberens@jonesday.com](mailto:bberens@jonesday.com), Mark A. Cody, Esq., [macody@jonesday.com](mailto:macody@jonesday.com), and Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq., [ccahow@jonesday.com](mailto:ccahow@jonesday.com))
- 3) Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.  
227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202  
(Attn: C. Richard Rayburn, Jr., Esq., [rrayburn@rcdlaw.net](mailto:r-rayburn@rcdlaw.net), and John R. Miller, Jr., Esq., [jmiller@rcdlaw.net](mailto:jmiller@rcdlaw.net))
- 4) U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator  
402 West Trade Street, Suite 200  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., [feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov](mailto:feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov))
- 5) McCarter & English, LLP  
1600 Market St., Suite 3900  
Philadelphia, PA 19103  
(Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., [pamoam@mccarter.com](mailto:pamoam@mccarter.com))
- 6) McCarter & English, LLP  
Four Gateway Center  
100 Mulberry St.  
Newark, NJ 07102  
(Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., [abartell@mccarter.com](mailto:abartell@mccarter.com), and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., [ppavlick@mccarter.com](mailto:ppavlick@mccarter.com))
- 7) McCarter & English, LLP  
Worldwide Plaza  
825 Eighth Avenue, 31<sup>st</sup> Floor  
New York, NY 10019  
(Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., [gmascitti@mccarter.com](mailto:gmascitti@mccarter.com))
- 8) Burt & Cordes, PLLC  
122 Cherokee Road, Suite 1

Charlotte, NC 28207  
(Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., [scordes@burtcordeslaw.com](mailto:scordes@burtcordeslaw.com))

- 9) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered  
One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., [kmaclay@capdale.com](mailto:kmaclay@capdale.com), and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., [tphillips@capdale.com](mailto:tphillips@capdale.com))
- 10) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC  
525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., [gthompson@lawhssm.com](mailto:gthompson@lawhssm.com))
- 11) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP  
Columbia Center  
1152 15<sup>th</sup> Street, NW  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, Esq., [jguy@orrick.com](mailto:jguy@orrick.com), and Debra L. Felder, Esq., [dfelder@orrick.com](mailto:dfelder@orrick.com))
- 12) Grier Wright Martinez, PA  
521 E Morehead Street, Suite 440  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: A. Cotton Wright, Esq., [cwright@grierlaw.com](mailto:cwright@grierlaw.com))

# INVOICE

INVOICE ID: CI-0000003692

DATE: 09/19/23

CLIENT: Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

ADDRESS: ,

Terms: Net 30 Days

Due Date: 10/19/23

Customer ID: 0110

FOR SERVICES RENDERED - SEE ATTACHED REPORTS FOR DETAILS

Hourly Services Fees	\$45,555.00
Expenses	\$0.00
<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$45,555.00</b>

**Total** **\$45,555.00**

## ACH Transfer Instructions:

Bank Name: [REDACTED]

Bank Address: [REDACTED]

Account Name: Verus Claims Services, LLC

ABA Number: [REDACTED]

Account Number: [REDACTED]

Verus LLC  
3967 Princeton Pike  
Princeton, NJ 08540  
609.466.0427  
www.verusllc.com



The **Art & Science** of  
complex dispute resolution.

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
07/30/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Oversight and consulting services related to proper organization of submissions from Donlin/SharePoint System (LAS)	8	175.00	\$1,400.00
07/31/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	call with A. Anselmi	.5	350.00	\$175.00
07/31/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Discussion and review of file types and writing of required program to allow for appropriate ingestion of same	4	175.00	\$700.00
07/31/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Review of the database created from submission data; meeting with Kiran Jupudi from EW to discuss the database and create a new table listing all cases based on an Excel file from LAS; Met with Joes Thomas from the Verus Analytics team to describe the database so he can start analyzing the data.	2	350.00	\$700.00
07/31/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Data setup discussions- Reviewing data	2.5	115.00	\$287.50
07/31/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with Joe Gassman to review the PIQ Form and plan the data structure.	.2	350.00	\$70.00
08/01/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	meeting with Morten about data structure and location of information for data exploration	.5	250.00	\$125.00
08/01/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Review of sample of PIQ- spreadsheets from Cord to investigate the data for potential issues	3	350.00	\$1,050.00
08/01/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Project planning and action steps	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
08/01/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with Ed Silverman from Analytics to discuss the new database and the content and to plan the next steps. I will follow up with Ed after I meet with Kiran J to discuss the additional data added to the database.	.5	350.00	\$175.00

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/01/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with Kiran J.re submission data management	.5	350.00	\$175.00
08/01/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	data exploration	2	250.00	\$500.00
08/01/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Management and oversight of JSON file extraction into designed database for Verus Team review and use	3	175.00	\$525.00
08/01/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Portal requirements design to prepare walkthrough and feedback with Pat.	2.5	350.00	\$875.00
08/02/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	dataset review	2	250.00	\$500.00
08/02/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Review progress with christian	.2	250.00	\$50.00
08/02/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Meet with BA and Verus team to design additional views for ease of JSON data reading	4	175.00	\$700.00
08/02/23	SCOTT HEISMAN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Program requirements meeting with program manager	1.6	350.00	\$560.00
08/02/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Analysis of data loaded from claim submissions from DOnlin via LAS .	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/03/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with Joe Gassman to discuss the approach to capture PIQ data for Sections 1-4 for phase 1 of the project. We discussed possible technical solutions and which system to use for the quickest implementation Connected to the Relativity database containing the R C Aldrich Relativity POCs PIQs	2.5	350.00	\$875.00
08/03/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich project planning and a doc analysis approach	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
08/04/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Christian Aldrich murray quick update	.2	250.00	\$50.00

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/04/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Oversee process for appropriate extraction into database (from DAT and XLSX files). Manage Verus team management of process	4	175.00	\$700.00
08/07/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Meeting with clients	.5	350.00	\$175.00
08/07/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meet with Joe Gassman re: process Discuss updates with Project Manager in preparation for internal team meeting on 8/9/2023	.6	350.00	\$210.00
08/07/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	cross organizational meeting	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
08/07/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Call with LAS regarding project status and next steps. Follow up with S. Leineek.	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/07/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	dataset research	1	250.00	\$250.00
08/07/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with Joe G to review requirements and map out how Operations team will need to function to meet those needs	1.5	150.00	\$225.00
08/07/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Working on AWS Textract console to read documents	4	175.00	\$700.00
08/08/23	SCOTT HEISMAN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pump project meeting	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/08/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Project meeting with te Verus Team: Sara L- Christian- Joe- Ed- and Scott.	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/08/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich internal leadership team review and planning	2.5	350.00	\$875.00
08/08/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Internal team meeting with Project Manager- and Analytics team	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/08/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Discussion with Joe on Aldrich pumps With Scott on Aldrich pumps	1.3	175.00	\$227.50
08/08/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Planning meeting	1	250.00	\$250.00
08/09/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Updated data AWS TextExtract research	5	175.00	\$875.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/09/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	1. Processed a new submission from Donlin uploaded via LAS submissions-2023-08-07 . 2. Met with Kiran J. to discuss progress on using AI tools to read the PIQs. 3. Review document and data submitted to gain a better understanding of what is provided and how to reconcile between the different data s	3	350.00	\$1,050.00
08/09/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	meeting with M. Iversen and K. Jipudi about the data with Jose/Clarissa. followed up by quick internal regroup meeting	1.2	250.00	\$300.00
08/09/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Review Analytics assessment of docs and data	.5	350.00	\$175.00
08/09/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Exploration of PIQ data	4	115.00	\$460.00
08/09/23	CLARISSA GOULD-GREENE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Aldrich Data and Files Zoom Meeting ID: 677 340 3363	1	115.00	\$115.00
08/10/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	team touchpoint meeting	.3	250.00	\$75.00
08/10/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Setting up Aldrich Murray data objects on the Verus analytics server	5	115.00	\$575.00
08/10/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	1. Meeting with Joe Gassman to discuss design/workflow of PIQ data capture and results from organizing data sources in SQL Server database tables.	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/10/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Discussion with Patricia and Joe on Aldrich Pumps Requirements	1	175.00	\$175.00
08/10/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich portal requirements prep and session with Pat and Vivek	2	350.00	\$700.00
08/10/23	SCOTT HEISMAN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pump project follow-up	.2	350.00	\$70.00
08/10/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Advise Verus team on appropriate load of received data into the data warehouse. Discuss additional needs and made minor updates to the views in system.	2	175.00	\$350.00

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/11/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Exploration of PIQ data	4	115.00	\$460.00
08/11/23	Joe Gassman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Consolidate business requirements notes	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
08/11/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Database view updates. AWS TextExtract research	5	175.00	\$875.00
08/14/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Status update To the PM Call with Joe on Requirements for Aldrich Pumps	1	175.00	\$175.00
08/14/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for future reporting	.5	115.00	\$57.50
08/14/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Discussion with D. Daloisio re QA process and team expectations	.5	350.00	\$175.00
08/14/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with LAS and Verus team to review project plan.	.7	350.00	\$245.00
08/14/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Researching on Azure Vision portal	4	175.00	\$700.00
08/14/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Meet with Pat LAS : Updates provided- discussion related to validation of PIQ responses related to supported documents.	.6	350.00	\$210.00
08/14/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	meeting with S. Leineek re QA process and team expectations	1.5	250.00	\$375.00
08/14/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly status meeting Verus and LAS; Preparation for Weekly status meeting	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/15/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Discussion with Joe on Aldrich Pumps - use case Discussion with KJ on Lucid 3.0 architecture for Aldrich pumps.	.8	175.00	\$140.00
08/15/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	assign action items and explain to Jose	1	250.00	\$250.00
08/15/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	Planning meeting Sara- Joe- Morten- Ed	1	250.00	\$250.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/15/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Assemble mailing and cover letter Attn: Sue Wilkins Phil. office for Robinson Cole - send over executed protective orders	.5	350.00	\$175.00
08/15/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for future reporting	1.5	115.00	\$172.50
08/16/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Researching on Azure Vision API	4	175.00	\$700.00
08/16/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	With Joe on Requirements Analysis of Aldrich Pumps Discussion with Kiran on Aldrich Pumps Technical Discussion with Morten- KJ on Aldrich Pumps	3.7	175.00	\$647.50
08/16/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	reviewing documentation	.5	250.00	\$125.00
08/16/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Multiple micro update meetings with Joe/Christian- discussions with Jose	1	250.00	\$250.00
08/16/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for Ops review reporting	4	115.00	\$460.00
08/16/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with the IT Team to discuss implementation approach for most efficient processing.	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/17/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	With Joe on Requirements for Aldrich Pumps Requirements Analysis - Reviewing a sample PIQ form.. Meeting with Joe on Requirements of Aldrich Pumps Requirement Analysis of the PIQ form Requirement Analysis of the PIQ form	8.4	175.00	\$1,470.00
08/17/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for Ops review reporting	3.5	115.00	\$402.50
08/17/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Microupdate on progress to Christian	.2	250.00	\$50.00
08/18/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	1. Meeting with Kiran J to review the results of using technology to read the PIQs. 2. Meeting with Joe G to review is design of PIQ data capture and process flow.	1.5	350.00	\$525.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/18/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Researching on Azure Vision API and the extracted data patterns	4	175.00	\$700.00
08/18/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for future reporting	2	115.00	\$230.00
08/18/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	meeting with Joe - QC process/flow	1	250.00	\$250.00
08/18/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Requirements Analysis - Reviewing a sample PIQ form.. Requirement Analysis of the PIQ form	5	175.00	\$875.00
08/18/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Review Jose Work product for the data combination	.5	250.00	\$125.00
08/20/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Drafting Ops review reporting	9	115.00	\$1,035.00
08/21/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Requirements analysis on Aldrich Pumps Discussion with Joe on Aldrich Pumps - use case	3.2	175.00	\$560.00
08/21/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Team meeting to review validation needs- critical fields discussion- and phase planning for overall program Follow up email with to-do's and requesting contact information from team	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/21/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly status meeting Verus and LAS; Preparation for Weekly status meeting	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/21/23	MARK EVELAND	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Call with Verus and LAS team on project status.	.5	350.00	\$175.00
08/21/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for future reporting	.5	115.00	\$57.50
08/22/23	Kiran Jupudi	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Researching on Azure Open AI API for documents	4	175.00	\$700.00
08/22/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Aldrich Pump status and planning	1	250.00	\$250.00
08/22/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly project meeting with the Verus PM and the Aldrich team.	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/22/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Design/System Architecture meeting with the Verus IT Team	1	350.00	\$350.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/22/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Requirements analysis on Aldrich Pumps with Morten-Vijay- Kiran J Requirements analysis on Aldrich Pumps Requirements analysis on Aldrich Pumps Discussion with Joe and Vijay on Aldrich pumps use-case Discussion with Joe on Aldrich Pumps - use case Discussion with Joe on Aldrich Pumps - use-case	6.1	175.00	\$1,067.50
08/22/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Team project planning to set hard dates for Phase 1 compliance	.8	350.00	\$280.00
08/22/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for Ops review reporting	1.5	115.00	\$172.50
08/23/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich pump requirements documentation Follow up meeting with J. Gassman on Aldrich Pumps Requirements analysis Follow up meeting with M. Iversen on Aldrich Pumps architecture and DPE capabilities	10	175.00	\$1,750.00
08/23/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with System Architect and BAs to discuss the Aldrich PIQ data capture implementation and next steps for capturing data from supporting documents. Design of a process for Aldrich documents. Downloading Standardized Names from LAS SharePoint site and quick review of documents downloaded.	3	350.00	\$1,050.00
08/23/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Reschedule Mtg with Pat for Monday	.2	350.00	\$70.00
08/23/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for Ops review reporting	3	115.00	\$345.00
08/24/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich pump requirements documentation Follow up meetings with J. Gassman and M. Iversen	1.8	175.00	\$315.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/24/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with BAs to discuss the latest system requirements. Review emails from Patricia Ebener. Design of a process for handling documents and PIQs.	2	350.00	\$700.00
08/24/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for Ops review reporting	1	115.00	\$115.00
08/25/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Going through recordings of meeting with Pat and Joe Requirements analysis on Aldrich Pumps	3	175.00	\$525.00
08/25/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Drafting Ops review reporting	4.5	115.00	\$517.50
08/25/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Review the report Jose put out	.5	250.00	\$125.00
08/25/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with the Program Manager to discuss the implementation and follow- up emails regarding the plan.	1	350.00	\$350.00
		<b>SUB-TOTAL</b>		<b>217.8</b>		<b>\$45,555.00</b>
					<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$45,555.00</b>
					<b>Total</b>	<b>\$45,555.00</b>

# **SCHEDULE A-3**

October 17, 2023

VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL TO NOTICE PARTIES ON SCHEDULE 1

RE: *In re Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.*, Case No. 20-30608 (Bankr. W.D.N.C.)  
Expense Reimbursement Statement Pursuant to Order Establishing Procedures  
for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Attached please find the monthly fee statement of Verus Claims Services, LLC for fees earned and expenses incurred for the period of September 1, 2023 through September 31, 2023 (the "Statement"). The Statement is being provided to you in accordance with the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* in the above-referenced case [Docket No. 171].

Sincerely,

Mark Eveland

Verus LLC  
3967 Princeton Pike  
Princeton, NJ 08540  
609.466.0427  
[www.verusllc.com](http://www.verusllc.com)



MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT

To: Notice Parties on Schedule 1, (Via E-Mail)  
From: Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Date: October 17, 2023

Re: *In re: Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.* (the “Debtor”)  
Case No. 20-30608  
United States Bankruptcy Court  
Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Pursuant to the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* entered on July 15, 2020 [Docket No. 171] (the “Compensation Order”), Verus Claims Services, LLC (“Verus”) submits this monthly fee statement (the “Statement”) as counsel to The Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants, for the period September 1, 2023 through September 31, 2023 (the “Fee Period”). During the Fee Period, Verus earned fees of \$49,085.50 and incurred expenses of \$0.00.

The Compensation Order allows retained professionals such as Verus to request payment of ninety percent (90%) of their fees and one hundred percent (100%) of their expenses on a monthly basis. Accordingly, Verus requests payment from the Debtor of **\$44,176.95** calculated as follows:

\$49,085.50 (100% of fees)  
X .90  
\$44,176.95 (90% of fees)  
+0.00 (100% of expenses)  
**\$44,176.95**

Attached hereto and incorporated herein as part of this Statement is Verus’ invoice describing the services rendered and the expenses incurred for the Fee Period. A summary listing of the Verus services during the Fee Period as well as an itemized list of expenses each appears in the invoice.

The amount of fees withheld from Verus at this time that will be sought in an interim fee application in accordance with the Compensation Order is **\$3,908.55**, which represents the holdback from this Fee Period.

**SCHEDULE1**

- 1) Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC  
800-E Beaty Street  
Davidson, NC 28036  
(Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., [atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com](mailto:atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com))
- 2) Jones Day  
77 West Wacker  
Chicago, IL 60601  
(Attn: Brad B. Erens, Esq., [bberens@jonesday.com](mailto:bberens@jonesday.com), Mark A. Cody, Esq., [macody@jonesday.com](mailto:macody@jonesday.com), and Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq., [ccahow@jonesday.com](mailto:ccahow@jonesday.com))
- 3) Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.  
227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202  
(Attn: C. Richard Rayburn, Jr., Esq., [rrayburn@rcdlaw.net](mailto:r-rayburn@rcdlaw.net), and John R. Miller, Jr., Esq., [jmiller@rcdlaw.net](mailto:jmiller@rcdlaw.net))
- 4) U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator  
402 West Trade Street, Suite 200  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., [feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov](mailto:feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov))
- 5) McCarter & English, LLP  
1600 Market St., Suite 3900  
Philadelphia, PA 19103  
(Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., [pamoam@mccarter.com](mailto:pamoam@mccarter.com))
- 6) McCarter & English, LLP  
Four Gateway Center  
100 Mulberry St.  
Newark, NJ 07102  
(Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., [abartell@mccarter.com](mailto:abartell@mccarter.com), and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., [ppavlick@mccarter.com](mailto:ppavlick@mccarter.com))
- 7) McCarter & English, LLP  
Worldwide Plaza  
825 Eighth Avenue, 31<sup>st</sup> Floor  
New York, NY 10019  
(Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., [gmascitti@mccarter.com](mailto:gmascitti@mccarter.com))
- 8) Burt & Cordes, PLLC  
122 Cherokee Road, Suite 1

Charlotte, NC 28207  
(Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., [scordes@burtcordeslaw.com](mailto:scordes@burtcordeslaw.com))

- 9) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered  
One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., [kmaclay@capdale.com](mailto:kmaclay@capdale.com), and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., [tphillips@capdale.com](mailto:tphillips@capdale.com))
- 10) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC  
525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., [gthompson@lawhssm.com](mailto:gthompson@lawhssm.com))
- 11) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP  
Columbia Center  
1152 15<sup>th</sup> Street, NW  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, Esq., [jguy@orrick.com](mailto:jguy@orrick.com), and Debra L. Felder, Esq., [dfelder@orrick.com](mailto:dfelder@orrick.com))
- 12) Grier Wright Martinez, PA  
521 E Morehead Street, Suite 440  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: A. Cotton Wright, Esq., [cwright@grierlaw.com](mailto:cwright@grierlaw.com))

# INVOICE

INVOICE ID: CI-0000003759

DATE: 10/17/23

CLIENT: Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

ADDRESS:

Terms: Net 30 Days  
Due Date: 11/16/23  
Customer ID: 0110

FOR SERVICES RENDERED - SEE ATTACHED REPORTS FOR DETAILS

Hourly Services Fees	\$48,863.00
Expenses	\$0.00
<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$48,863.00</b>
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$48,863.00</b>

## ACH Transfer Instructions:

Bank Name: [REDACTED]  
Bank Address: [REDACTED]  
Account Name: Verus Claims Services, LLC  
ABA Number: [REDACTED]  
Account Number: [REDACTED]

Verus LLC  
3967 Princeton Pike  
Princeton, NJ 08540  
609.466.0427  
www.verusllc.com



The **Art & Science** of  
complex dispute resolution.

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/28/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with Pat/LAS	1	115.00	\$115.00
08/28/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly client meeting with Pat and Sara and Sarah; Follow-up and preparation for the meeting.	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
08/28/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	PIQ Data capture design	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/30/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Planning data capture and organization for PIQ documents.	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/05/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Review of LAS SharePoint site data files for processing and place files for internal processing and sharing.	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/06/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Design document data capture process and system configuration for document processing and document classification.	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/07/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for data export- Reviewing data structures for export	4.5	115.00	\$517.50
09/07/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich Pump Roadmap meeting	.8	115.00	\$92.00
09/07/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Preparation and meeting with the Verus Project Team re next steps	2	350.00	\$700.00
09/07/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Working on Aldrich Pump Roadmap w/ Sara- Sarah-Morten	1.5	150.00	\$225.00
09/07/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with Programmers and the Analytics Team to discuss index for document processing system and next steps. Design of document management process.	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/08/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with the IT Team and BA to discuss customization of the system to handle PIQ data capture and queues.	.5	350.00	\$175.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/08/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with the Verus Program Manager and Business Analyst to design and plan the next steps for PIQ data capture and document classification. Designed and planned the JSON QC Project.	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
09/08/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Development of a rough draft outline for Aldrich pump process prior to meeting with Morten/Vivek.	1.8	115.00	\$207.00
09/08/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	reviewing documentation-spreadsheets from analytics	1	250.00	\$250.00
09/08/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Preparing data export for integration team	2.5	115.00	\$287.50
09/11/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Verus weekly project meeting with the LAS Team and A. Smith. Meeting with the Verus Program Manager to prep for weekly LAS Meeting and planning next steps in the project.	2	350.00	\$700.00
09/11/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with the Verus QC Manager to discuss the findings so far in the JSON QC Project. Meeting with Verus IT Business Analyst to discuss JSON QC process.	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/11/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	1. process meeting with Sarah 2. training w/Pat	2	250.00	\$500.00
09/12/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Met with the Verus IT Team- Program Manager- and the QC manager to discuss her findings on the JSON QC project and how to make adjustments. Identified truncated PIQ ID's and researching the reason for that. Follow-up meeting with the Verus QC manager to discuss the data capture needed for the JSON	2	350.00	\$700.00
09/12/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with Verus Program Manager Sarah D to coordinate project.	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/12/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	1. testing DPE Json file and uploaded docs 2. project meeting 3- discussions VJ and Vivek	6.5	250.00	\$1,625.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/13/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with the Analytics Team and the IT Team to discuss system configuration and process for getting data into the Document Processing system and how to handle issues identified by the QC Team.	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
09/13/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	1. JSON QC meeting follow up 2. Weekly touch point 3. meeting Sarah and Morten JSON file results	3.5	250.00	\$875.00
09/13/23	GENCEHAN YUKSEL	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	meeting for Aldrich	.6	115.00	\$69.00
09/13/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	PIQ and document data capture planning and meeting with the OC Team and Program Manager to discuss findings and next actions.	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/14/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with the Business Analysts to discuss getting document samples and format of document import file from the database to the document processing system. Designed data capture form for PIQ sections 1-V.	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/14/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	1. DPE initial load for phase 1 meeting 2. Document type index review meeting 3. JSON file review	3	250.00	\$750.00
09/14/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting with the project team to discuss progress and track down outstanding questions. Met with the Program Manager to discuss project focus and next steps.	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/15/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Review of JSON data and how we can use that data going forward.	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/15/23	GENCEHAN YUKSEL	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	.6 review of documents prior to meeting 1 meeting with Aldrich Pump	1.6	115.00	\$184.00
09/15/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Document Type coding training meeting with Verus and LAS	1	350.00	\$350.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/15/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	1. JSON follow up/touchpoint meeting 2. DPE initial demo in QA 3. document type coding training meeting	3.5	250.00	\$875.00
09/15/23	TONI DEVENBERG	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting	1	75.00	\$75.00
09/18/23	TONI DEVENBERG	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meeting	1	75.00	\$75.00
09/18/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly status meeting with LAS and prep for meeting and follow-up; Aldrich Pump Training for document coding and strategy for collecting and reporting data	2	350.00	\$700.00
09/18/23	GENCEHAN YUKSEL	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	demo meeting- meeting with Verus staff on the next steps and working on pp labels	3.6	115.00	\$414.00
09/18/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	1. Testing DPE 2. mapping document types 3. training samples for Pat 4. QA demo 5. Training- Process-Scheduling and Timeline meting	4	250.00	\$1,000.00
09/18/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with Sarah D to discuss processing of PIQs	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/19/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with Sarah and IT Team to design and plan next steps in PIQ data capture and unknown document classification. Planning session with the Operations Team on how to classify documents and how to efficiently capture the PIQ data.	2	350.00	\$700.00
09/19/23	GENCEHAN YUKSEL	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	meeting with manager regarding Aldrich and performed pp document label final	1.6	115.00	\$184.00
09/20/23	GENCEHAN YUKSEL	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	meeting for Aldrich Pump labeling	2.1	115.00	\$241.50
09/20/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Verus weekly Aldrich update and planning meeting	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/20/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Design of data intake and capture of No Data provided for each section of the PIQ 1-5 and 9	1	350.00	\$350.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
 Professional Services Rendered  
 Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/21/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	File count reconciliation	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/21/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	document type mapping	.5	250.00	\$125.00
09/21/23	GENCEHAN YUKSEL	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	meeting with manager on next steps updated write up tested application	3.1	115.00	\$356.50
09/22/23	TONI DEVENBERG	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Training Mtg.	.6	75.00	\$45.00
09/22/23	MORTEN IVERSEN	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Reconciliation of files counts of documents/files received from LAS and what we have at Verus.	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/22/23	DEBORAH DALOISIO	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	1. training plan 2. mapping 3. testing	3.5	250.00	\$875.00
09/22/23	GENCEHAN YUKSEL	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	updating files- testing in qa environment	2.4	115.00	\$276.00
		<b>SUB-TOTAL</b>		<b>86.2</b>		<b>\$20,389.00</b>
					<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$20,389.00</b>
					<b>Total</b>	<b>\$20,389.00</b>

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
08/28/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Meeting with Pat E. re: process to follow and simplification of program planning	1	350.00	\$350.00
08/28/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Requirement analysis	1.3	175.00	\$227.50
08/31/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps PBIs Discussion with Vijay on Aldrich requirements and setup in DPE	3.1	175.00	\$542.50
09/01/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Index file review for Claims creation	.8	175.00	\$140.00
09/06/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Aldrich Pump internal roadmap and planning re: QA involvement and IT completion of DPE set up in preparation of same.	1.2	350.00	\$420.00
09/06/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Requirement analysis Aldrich Pumps Requirement analysis With Ed on understanding the index file for Aldrich Pumps Aldrich Pumps Index file review for Claims creation	6.7	175.00	\$1,172.50
09/07/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich pump roadmap meeting	.6	250.00	\$150.00
09/07/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Requirement analysis	1.5	175.00	\$262.50
09/07/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Meeting with Jose Morten Vivek Vijay to discuss format of DPE loading files	.5	250.00	\$125.00
09/07/23	Knut Fenner	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich Pump Roadmap Meeting: 1h	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/08/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Discussion with Sarah on Aldrich Pumps Aldrich Pumps Project Meeting with Morten and Sarah Aldrich Pumps meeting with Morten-Kiran and Vijay	1.8	175.00	\$315.00
09/11/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich Process info meeting with Sarah and Deb	.5	150.00	\$75.00
09/11/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Show the list of associated law firms in claim search screen	1.3	175.00	\$227.50

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/11/23	Kiran Gummaluri	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Show the list of associated law firms in claim search screen Aldrich Pump LLC - Claims Upload	8.3	175.00	\$1,452.50
09/11/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich pump process outline- goals and needs document development and dissemination to team for review and consideration.	2.9	115.00	\$333.50
09/11/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	meeting with D. Daloisio, S. DeGeronimo, K. Singer	.5	250.00	\$125.00
09/11/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Email to Pat E. re: Doc Classifications; Meeting with clients for update and status review	.8	350.00	\$280.00
09/12/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	email correspondence w/ LAS and internal re JSON QC project- etc.	1	115.00	\$115.00
09/12/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	meeting with Morten Vijay Vivek Jose D. Daloisio about Json QC project	1	250.00	\$250.00
09/12/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	All files analysis for Aldrich Pump JSON QC Project meeting with Morten- Debbie- Ed and Jose	3.7	175.00	\$647.50
09/12/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for future reporting	2	115.00	\$230.00
09/13/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for future reporting	6	115.00	\$690.00
09/13/23	Jean Abellard	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	Meeting with Debbie and Amanda	.5	115.00	\$57.50
09/13/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Zoom meeting with Pat at LAS to walk through email/ask we received.	1.8	115.00	\$207.00
09/13/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Analysis of DAT file given by LAS With Jose and Vijay on getting the documents loaded in DPE Weekly Aldrich Pump update JSON QC Project follow up with Debbie- Morten- Ed- Jose and Sarah	3	175.00	\$525.00
09/13/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly touchpoint Aldrich with Sarah- Gench- Morten- Deb and team to discuss status and updates	1	150.00	\$150.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/13/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Weekly internal meeting to review status- resources- upcoming needs- etc	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/13/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Meetings about json content QC review weekly touchpoint meeting	1	250.00	\$250.00
09/14/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Internal/External LAS correspondence regarding/in preparation for document type coding training- and correspondence regarding access to necessary documents in LAS' share file- etc.	2.4	115.00	\$276.00
09/14/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Planning for future reporting	4	115.00	\$460.00
09/14/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	DPE initial Load with Debbie- Morten Sarah- Vijay Ed and Jose PBI: 70625 CEE Deficiency 1000816: PFT values are outside acceptable ranges. ----- Ref Def 8 With New Framework Asbestos Deficiency Conversion -- Applicable clients: 1 ClientID :15	2	175.00	\$350.00
09/14/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	DPE initial load questions	.5	250.00	\$125.00
09/15/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	internal/external LAS email correspondence regarding DPE document load- protective order completion- staff access to DPE- training- etc.	2.4	115.00	\$276.00
09/15/23	AMANDA THOMSON	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	AP Testing and Training	3.4	115.00	\$391.00
09/15/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	DPE initial Load with Debbie- Morten Sarah- Vijay Ed and Jose JSON project follow-up / touch point	1.1	175.00	\$192.50
09/15/23	Kiran Gummaluri	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Phase 1 DPE Part 1 - Status of Mesothelioma Claim - Dynamic form creation	10	175.00	\$1,750.00
09/15/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Document type coding training with Client and Verus team	2	150.00	\$300.00
09/15/23	Jean Abellard	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Quality	Meeting with Debbie and Amanda.	2.5	115.00	\$287.50

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/15/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Meetings on DPE initial demo JSON project touchpoint	1	250.00	\$250.00
09/15/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	internal team meeting re DPE and CPE management; emails with client Pat LAS ; Complete team contact list to send client; Address resources used and new to add to ensure Protective Order is signed.	.8	350.00	\$280.00
09/15/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Test document imports- Planning for future reporting	5	115.00	\$575.00
09/17/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Standardizing ETL processes for documents	4	115.00	\$460.00
09/18/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	DPE demo- discussion of Aldrich Pump processing with Jose internally	1	115.00	\$115.00
09/18/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	AP Training meeting Sarah-Keith- Toni- Debbie- Gench	1	350.00	\$350.00
09/18/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Confirm personnel needs- and the training process- schedule- and timeline associated with: o Review and coding of the Code 0 documents based on document index provided by LAS o PIQ Review/Data Entry in DPE	1.5	150.00	\$225.00
09/18/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Interview David Bradley for IT Director- complete assessment- and submit to Lori	1.5	350.00	\$525.00
09/18/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	DPE Demo	3	115.00	\$345.00
09/18/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pump Demo UI screens for Aldrich Pump	3.2	175.00	\$560.00
09/19/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Test document imports- Planning for future reporting	6	115.00	\$690.00
09/19/23	Kiran Gummaluri	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pump Field Alignment and UI enhancements Aldrich Pump Dynamic form updates Aldrich Pump Document upload	5.1	175.00	\$892.50
09/19/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Discussion with Sarah on Aldrich Pumps	.8	175.00	\$140.00
09/19/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	worked with Sarah PIQ Review/Data Entry in DPE	2	150.00	\$300.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Professional Services Rendered  
Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/19/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	work with Verus team in development and submission of document type code index to LAS	1.5	115.00	\$172.50
09/20/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Reviewing listing from client and preparing associated document load	6.5	115.00	\$747.50
09/20/23	Sara Leineek	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Communication	Weekly program touchpoint with updates and needs-etc.	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/20/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	With Sarah- Keith- Gench and Morten on Section Blank scenario in Aldrich pump Meeting with Morten regarding Case 0 intake Weekly Aldrich Pump update	2	175.00	\$350.00
09/20/23	Knut Fenner	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly Aldrich Pump Steering Team Meeting	.5	350.00	\$175.00
09/20/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	weekly touchpoint meeting internal f2f discussions	.8	250.00	\$200.00
09/20/23	Kiran Gummaluri	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Phase 1 DPE Part 3 Related Claimant Information - Dynamic Form Creation Aldrich Pumps Phase 1 DPE Part 2 Injured Party information - Dynamic form creation	1.9	175.00	\$332.50
09/20/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Weekly Aldrich Pump touchpoint	.5	150.00	\$75.00
09/20/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Is Section Blank discussion DPE data capture field	1.5	115.00	\$172.50
09/21/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Email correspondence w/ LAS and internal regarding code 0 document and PIQ/PIQ Stand-alone lists	2.2	115.00	\$253.00
09/21/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Meeting with Sarah and Morten regarding field names and views and CPE architecture With Sarah on status of KG and request for documents from Analytics and the field mapping in Dynamic forms	.5	175.00	\$87.50
09/21/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Internal correspondence	.2	250.00	\$50.00
09/21/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Identifying non PDF documents in file provision-Planning for future reporting	5	115.00	\$575.00

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/21/23	Kiran Gummaluri	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pumps Phase 1 DPE Part 1 - Status of Mesothelioma Claim - Dynamic form creation Aldrich Pumps Phase 1 DPE PART 9: QUESTIONNAIRE CERTIFICATION- Dynamic Form Creation Aldrich Pump Adding Document Notes section on header	5.1	175.00	\$892.50
09/21/23	Aileen Thompson	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Zoom regarding DPE	.6	115.00	\$69.00
09/21/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Discussions about data discrepancies- missing files- as well as non-PDFs	.8	250.00	\$200.00
09/22/23	Vivek Chandramohan	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pump Document not getting served in QA queue for non hashed and blobbed documents. UI enhancements and verification in QA environment and addition of QA queue. Aldrich Pump Document upload in Production Environment Code 0	5.6	175.00	\$980.00
09/22/23	Sarah DeGeronimo	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Development of comprehensive list of Verus Team working in DPE with associated environment access and queue access w/ submission to EfficiencyWare and upload to SharePoint.	2.4	115.00	\$276.00
09/22/23	THOMAS, JOSE	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Analytics	Meeting with team on questions concerning client listing- Investigating questions- Planning for future reporting	4	115.00	\$460.00
09/22/23	Keith Singer	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	Aldrich Training plan	.5	150.00	\$75.00
09/22/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review General Administration	document count review discussion	.5	250.00	\$125.00
09/22/23	Kiran Gummaluri	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review Information Technology	Aldrich Pump Document upload in Production Environment Code 0 Aldrich Pump Creation of views specific for Aldrich Pump Aldrich Pumps Phase 1 DPE PART 5: INFORMATION ON MESOTHELIOMA DIAGNOSIS- Dynamic Form Creation Aldrich Pump	10.4	175.00	\$1,820.00

Verus Claims Services, LLC  
 Professional Services Rendered  
 Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

DATE	EMPLOYEE	PROJECT/TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	CHARGE
09/22/23	Edward Silverman	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Discussion with Jose about prioritizing to-dos	.3	250.00	\$75.00
		Analytics		175.8		\$28,474.00
		<b>SUB-TOTAL</b>				
					<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$28,474.00</b>
					<b>Total</b>	<b>\$28,474.00</b>

December 14, 2023

VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL TO NOTICE PARTIES ON SCHEDULE 1

RE: *In re Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.*, Case No. 20-30608 (Bankr. W.D.N.C.)  
Expense Reimbursement Statement Pursuant to Order Establishing Procedures  
for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Attached please find the monthly fee statement of Verus Claims Services, LLC for fees earned and expenses incurred for the period of September 7, 2023 through September 30, 2023 (the "Statement"). The Statement is being provided to you in accordance with the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* in the above-referenced case [Docket No. 171].

Sincerely,

Mark Eveland

Verus LLC  
3967 Princeton Pike  
Princeton, NJ 08540  
609.466.0427  
[www.verusllc.com](http://www.verusllc.com)



MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT

To: Notice Parties on Schedule 1, (Via E-Mail)  
From: Verus Claims Services, LLC  
Date: December 14, 2023

Re: *In re: Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.* (the “Debtor”)  
Case No. 20-30608  
United States Bankruptcy Court  
Western District of North Carolina, Charlotte Division

Pursuant to the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals* entered on July 15, 2020 [Docket No. 171] (the “Compensation Order”), Verus Claims Services, LLC (“Verus”) submits this monthly fee statement (the “Statement”) as counsel to The Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants, for the period September 7, 2023 through September 30, 2023 (the “Fee Period”). During the Fee Period, Verus earned fees of \$31,322.00 and incurred expenses of \$0.00.

The Compensation Order allows retained professionals such as Verus to request payment of ninety percent (90%) of their fees and one hundred percent (100%) of their expenses on a monthly basis. Accordingly, Verus requests payment from the Debtor of **\$28,189.80** calculated as follows:

\$31,322.00 (100% of fees)  
X .90  
\$28,189.80 (90% of fees)  
+0.00 (100% of expenses)  
**\$28,189.80**

Attached hereto and incorporated herein as part of this Statement is Verus’ invoice describing the services rendered and the expenses incurred for the Fee Period. A summary listing of the Verus services during the Fee Period as well as an itemized list of expenses each appears in the invoice.

The amount of fees withheld from Verus at this time that will be sought in an interim fee application in accordance with the Compensation Order is **\$3,132.20**, which represents the holdback from this Fee Period.

## SCHEDULE1

- 1) Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC  
800-E Beaty Street  
Davidson, NC 28036  
(Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., [atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com](mailto:atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com))
- 2) Jones Day  
77 West Wacker  
Chicago, IL 60601  
(Attn: Brad B. Erens, Esq., [bberens@jonesday.com](mailto:bberens@jonesday.com), Mark A. Cody, Esq., [macody@jonesday.com](mailto:macody@jonesday.com), and Caitlin K. Cahow, Esq., [ccahow@jonesday.com](mailto:ccahow@jonesday.com))
- 3) Rayburn Cooper & Durham, P.A.  
227 West Trade Street, Suite 1200  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202  
(Attn: C. Richard Rayburn, Jr., Esq., [rrayburn@rcdlaw.net](mailto:rrayburn@rcdlaw.net), and John R. Miller, Jr., Esq., [jmiller@rcdlaw.net](mailto:jmiller@rcdlaw.net))
- 4) U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator  
402 West Trade Street, Suite 200  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., [feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov](mailto:feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov))
- 5) McCarter & English, LLP  
1600 Market St., Suite 3900  
Philadelphia, PA 19103  
(Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., [pamoa@mccarter.com](mailto:pamoa@mccarter.com))
- 6) McCarter & English, LLP  
Four Gateway Center  
100 Mulberry St.  
Newark, NJ 07102  
(Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., [abartell@mccarter.com](mailto:abartell@mccarter.com), and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., [ppavlick@mccarter.com](mailto:ppavlick@mccarter.com))
- 7) McCarter & English, LLP  
Worldwide Plaza  
825 Eighth Avenue, 31<sup>st</sup> Floor  
New York, NY 10019  
(Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., [gmascitti@mccarter.com](mailto:gmascitti@mccarter.com))
- 8) Burt & Cordes, PLLC  
122 Cherokee Road, Suite 1  
Charlotte, NC 28207  
(Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., [scordes@burtcordeslaw.com](mailto:scordes@burtcordeslaw.com))

9) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered  
One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., [kmaclay@capdale.com](mailto:kmaclay@capdale.com), and Todd E. Phillips, Esq.,  
[tphillips@capdale.com](mailto:tphillips@capdale.com))

10) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC  
525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., [gthompson@lawhssm.com](mailto:gthompson@lawhssm.com))

11) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP  
Columbia Center  
1152 15<sup>th</sup> Street, NW  
Washington, DC 20005  
(Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, Esq., [jguy@orrick.com](mailto:jguy@orrick.com), and Debra L. Felder, Esq.,  
[dfelder@orrick.com](mailto:dfelder@orrick.com))

12) Grier Wright Martinez, PA  
521 E Morehead Street, Suite 440  
Charlotte, NC 28202  
(Attn: A. Cotton Wright, Esq., [cwright@grierlaw.com](mailto:cwright@grierlaw.com))

13) Robinson & Cole, LLP  
180 Trumbull Street  
Hartford, CT 06103  
(Attn: Natalie Ramsey, Esq., [nramsey@rc.com](mailto:nramsey@rc.com) and David Wright, Esq., [dwright@rc.com](mailto:dwright@rc.com))

# INVOICE

INVOICE ID: CI-0000003869

DATE: 12/14/23

CLIENT: Aldrich Pump Claimant Committee

ADDRESS:

Terms: Net 30 Days

Due Date: 01/13/24

Customer ID: 0110

FOR SERVICES RENDERED - SEE ATTACHED REPORTS FOR DETAILS

Hourly Services Fees	\$31,322.00
Expenses	\$0.00
<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$31,322.00</b>

**Total** **\$31,322.00**

## ACH Transfer Instructions:

Bank Name: [REDACTED]

Bank Address: [REDACTED]

Account Name: Verus Claims Services, LLC

ABA Number: [REDACTED]

Account Number: [REDACTED]

Verus LLC  
3967 Princeton Pike  
Princeton, NJ 08540  
609.466.0427  
www.verusllc.com



The **Art & Science** of  
complex dispute resolution.



Professional Services - Summary By Person

Row Labels	Average of Rate	Sum of Hours	Sum of Amount
Abena Ofori-Atta	\$ 115.00	1.00	\$ 115.00
Aileen Thompson	\$ 115.00	7.30	\$ 839.50
Amanda Thomson	\$ 115.00	4.00	\$ 460.00
Debbie Daloisio	\$ 250.00	12.00	\$ 3,000.00
Edward Silverman	\$ 250.00	1.00	\$ 250.00
Erin Sobke	\$ 115.00	3.00	\$ 345.00
Gencehan Yuksel	\$ 150.00	13.10	\$ 1,965.00
Jean Abellard	\$ 115.00	3.50	\$ 402.50
Jose Thomas	\$ 150.00	15.50	\$ 2,325.00
Keith Singer	\$ 250.00	4.00	\$ 1,000.00
Kim Glasson	\$ 115.00	4.00	\$ 460.00
Kiran Gummaluri	\$ 175.00	48.40	\$ 8,470.00
Kiran Jupudi	\$ 175.00	12.00	\$ 2,100.00
Knut Fenner	\$ 350.00	0.50	\$ 175.00
Morten Iverson	\$ 350.00	8.50	\$ 2,975.00
Sara Leineek	\$ 350.00	1.80	\$ 630.00
Sarah DeGeronimo	\$ 250.00	6.90	\$ 1,725.00
Shavon Brown	\$ 115.00	1.50	\$ 172.50
Toni Devenberg	\$ 115.00	1.00	\$ 115.00
Vijay Reddy	\$ 175.00	9.50	\$ 1,662.50
Vivek Chandramohan	\$ 175.00	12.20	\$ 2,135.00
		<b>170.70</b>	<b>\$ 31,322.00</b>

Professional Services - Summary By Task

Row Labels	Sum of Hours	Sum of Amount
Analytics	15.50	\$ 2,325.00
Communication	1.60	\$ 510.00
General Administration	45.80	\$ 8,087.00
Information Technology	88.30	\$ 16,537.50
Quality	19.50	\$ 3,862.50
	<b>170.70</b>	<b>\$ 31,322.00</b>



Task name	Date	Project name	Employee name	Hours	Rate	Amount	Description
Analytics	9/24/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Jose Thomas	2.50	150.00	375.00	Validation of document database
Analytics	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Jose Thomas	2.00	150.00	300.00	Validation of document database
Analytics	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Jose Thomas	8.50	150.00	1,275.00	Validation of document database- Reconciling process to produce documents
Analytics	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Jose Thomas	2.50	150.00	375.00	Planning for future reporting
Communication	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sara Leineek	0.60	350.00	210.00	Call with clients and internal managers (M Iverson, P Ebener, C Thomas, M Totten, S DeGeronimo, A Smith) : .10 prepare for call
Communication	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sarah DeGeronimo	0.50	250.00	125.00	Call with clients and internal managers (M Iverson, P Ebener, C Thomas, M Totten, S DeGeronimo, A Smith)
Communication	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sara Leineek	0.50	350.00	175.00	Internal project team updates and discussions (K Fenner, D Daloisio, K Singer, G Yuksel, M Iverson, V Chandramohan, S DeGeronimo)
General Administration	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Abena Ofori-Atta	1.00	115.00	115.00	Test Website
General Administration	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Aileen Thompson	4.00	115.00	460.00	Train and work with Quality (D Daloisio) on User Guide and Emails
General Administration	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Gencehan Yuksel	0.60	150.00	90.00	Review and edit Pre-Processing labels
General Administration	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Keith Singer	1.50	250.00	375.00	Time Study related to pre-processing and data entry for phase 1 of PIQ
General Administration	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Morten Iverson	1.00	350.00	350.00	0.5 - Prepare for weekly status meeting 0.5 - Weekly status meeting with LAS (P Ebener, M Totten, C Thomas) and Verus (S Leineek, S DeGeronimo)
General Administration	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sarah DeGeronimo	1.10	250.00	275.00	Meeting with Quality (D Daloisio, G Yuksel) related to pre-processing work to commence
General Administration	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Toni Devenberg	1.00	115.00	115.00	User Manual Draft for use in team training
General Administration	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Aileen Thompson	0.80	115.00	92.00	Update User Guide and train Shavon
General Administration	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Gencehan Yuksel	6.10	150.00	915.00	0.5 - Meeting with internal team for 30 minutes (K Singer, S DeGeronimo, D Daloisio, T Devenberg) 5.6 - Work on Pre-processing guide and example locating
General Administration	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Keith Singer	0.50	250.00	125.00	Operations Check in with S Brown, G Yuksel, A Thompson
General Administration	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Morten Iverson	1.00	350.00	350.00	Aldrich Pump document handling planning meeting and emails with IT team (V Reddy, V Chandramohan), K Jupudi)
General Administration	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sarah DeGeronimo	0.50	250.00	125.00	Pre-processing training meeting with (K Singer, G Yuksel, T Devenberg, S DeGeronimo, S Brown, A Thomson, E Sobke)
General Administration	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Shavon Brown	1.00	115.00	115.00	Pre-processing training meeting with (K Singer, G Yuksel, T Devenberg, S DeGeronimo, S Brown, A Thomson, E Sobke)
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Aileen Thompson	1.40	115.00	161.00	1.0 - Pre-processing training meeting with (K Singer, G Yuksel, T Devenberg, S DeGeronimo, S Brown, A Thomson, E Sobke) 0.4 Preparation for training session (ensure materials ready and distributed)
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Edward Silverman	0.50	250.00	125.00	Weekly Steering Committee Call (K Fenner, E Silverman, S DeGeronimo, S Leineek, D Daloisio, G Yuksel, M Iverson, K Singer)
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Gencehan Yuksel	1.70	150.00	255.00	0.5 - Weekly Steering Committee Call (K Fenner, E Silverman, S DeGeronimo, S Leineek, D Daloisio, G Yuksel, M Iverson, K Singer) 1.2 - working on pre processing and going over questions with manager.
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Keith Singer	1.50	250.00	375.00	0.5 - Weekly Steering Committee Call (K Fenner, E Silverman, S DeGeronimo, S Leineek, D Daloisio, G Yuksel, M Iverson, K Singer) 1.0 - weekly check in with team (G Yuksel, A Thompson, S Brown) onboarding /training
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Knut Fenner	0.50	350.00	175.00	Weekly Steering Committee Call (K Fenner, E Silverman, S DeGeronimo, S Leineek, D Daloisio, G Yuksel, M Iverson, K Singer)
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Morten Iverson	1.00	350.00	350.00	0.5 - Weekly Steering Committee Call (K Fenner, E Silverman, S DeGeronimo, S Leineek, D Daloisio, G Yuksel, M Iverson, K Singer) 0.5 - Review of OCR options and shortcomings and efficient PIQ data entry
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sarah DeGeronimo	2.80	250.00	700.00	2.3 - PIQ Data Entry training 0.5 - Weekly Steering Committee Call (K Fenner, E Silverman, S DeGeronimo, S Leineek, D Daloisio, G Yuksel, M Iverson, K Singer)
General Administration	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Shavon Brown	0.50	115.00	57.50	Training meeting with (K Singer, G Yuksel, T Devenberg, S DeGeronimo, D Daloisio, S Brown, A Thomson, E Sobke)
General Administration	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Aileen Thompson	1.10	115.00	126.50	Training Sessions (2) with pre-processing team members (S Brown, Afori)
General Administration	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Edward Silverman	0.50	250.00	125.00	Data extraction results meeting
General Administration	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Erin Sobke	3.00	115.00	345.00	Training related to pre-processing and begin pre-processing work
General Administration	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Gencehan Yuksel	4.70	150.00	705.00	1.7 - prepared for training- meeting with IT-meeting with manager 3.0 - Pre-processing training meeting with (K Singer, G Yuksel, T Devenberg, S DeGeronimo, D Daloisio, S Brown, A Thomson, E Sobke)
General Administration	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Keith Singer	0.50	250.00	125.00	Operations Check in with S Brown, G Yuksel, A Thompson
General Administration	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kim Glasson	4.00	115.00	460.00	Pre-processing work
General Administration	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sarah DeGeronimo	2.00	250.00	500.00	Pre-processing training meeting with (K Singer, G Yuksel, T Devenberg, S DeGeronimo, D Daloisio, S Brown, A Thomson, E Sobke)
Information Technology	9/7/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Jupudi	2.00	175.00	350.00	Making Aldrich submissions intake as a repeatable process
Information Technology	9/8/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Jupudi	2.00	175.00	350.00	Making Aldrich submissions intake as a repeatable process
Information Technology	9/11/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vijay Reddy	1.60	175.00	280.00	Manage and Supervise Claims Upload with M Iverson and E Silverman
Information Technology	9/13/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vijay Reddy	1.00	175.00	175.00	Discuss Claim Loading J Thomas, and V Chandramohan
Information Technology	9/14/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Jupudi	1.00	175.00	175.00	Updates to Adlrch database views in system for data entry
Information Technology	9/14/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vijay Reddy	2.40	175.00	420.00	Manage and Supervise Claims Upload Meet with M Iverson to document build changes
Information Technology	9/15/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Jupudi	1.00	175.00	175.00	Updates to Adlrch database views in system for data entry
Information Technology	9/15/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vijay Reddy	3.50	175.00	612.50	Aldrich Pump Design and Development Brief and Testing
Information Technology	9/18/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Jupudi	1.00	175.00	175.00	Updates to Adlrch database views in system for data entry
Information Technology	9/19/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Jupudi	1.00	175.00	175.00	Updates to Adlrch database views in system for data entry
Information Technology	9/19/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vijay Reddy	1.00	175.00	175.00	Aldrich Pump Analytics data review
Information Technology	9/20/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Sara Leineek	0.70	350.00	245.00	Case Management Prioritization meeting with A Fahy addressing prioritization of development needs for Aldrich Pump management
Information Technology	9/22/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Jupudi	4.00	175.00	700.00	Submission intake process for zip files generated duplicate entries in the database. This is a one-off issue.
Information Technology	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Gummaluri	10.60	175.00	1,855.00	9.0 - Document upload in Production Environment for "Code 0" documents 1.6 - Address hashing and blobbing needs for documents in the database
Information Technology	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Morten Iverson	2.00	350.00	700.00	System configuration meeting with S Deeronimo and V Chandramohan; Workflow design for the Document processing; Data flow to reporting. Processed new Donlin Submission
Information Technology	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vivek Chandramohan	1.80	175.00	315.00	Call with K Singer, S DeGeronimo, and M Iverson regarding hashing and blobbing issues- QA testing and sign off for Process flow chart for phase 1



Task name	Date	Project name	Employee name	Hours	Rate	Amount	Description
Information Technology	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Gummaluri	3.80	175.00	665.00	Scoping needs and development of required views
Information Technology	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vivek Chandramohan	3.40	175.00	595.00	Requirements analysis; Adding Document Notes section on header in QA queue; Analysis of duplicates with K Jupudi; programming work With K Jupudi on Duplicate documents load
Information Technology	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Gummaluri	13.60	175.00	2,380.00	Mapping and development of proram needs in system Upload mangement of Partial PIQs into system
Information Technology	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Morten Iverson	1.00	350.00	350.00	PIQ Queue configuration and workflow design and meeting with IT team (K Gummaluri, V Reddy, V Chandramohan)
Information Technology	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vivek Chandramohan	5.40	175.00	945.00	PIQ queue discussion, Process flow chart for phase 1 Weekly meeting with with V Reddy and K Gummaluri on flow for phase 1 Testing QA queue notes, Document types mapping analysis
Information Technology	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Gummaluri	9.00	175.00	1,575.00	1.4 - Document Types Mapping 5.8 - System development and investigation og escalated issues related to failure to display pages
Information Technology	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Morten Iverson	1.00	350.00	350.00	1.8 - Manage upload of documents in Preprocessing queue Planning for Phase 1 data collection and organization for the Analytics Team and reporting back to LAS
Information Technology	9/29/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Gummaluri	8.60	175.00	1,505.00	7.5 - Development and production of system
Information Technology	9/29/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Morten Iverson	1.50	350.00	525.00	1.1 - Manage support tickets related to document displays Meeting with IT (V Chandramohan) and Analytics (E Silverman) to plan PIQ data reporting back to LAS and scope out Phase 2 design and configuration
Information Technology	9/29/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Vivek Chandramohan	1.60	175.00	280.00	Discussion with V Reddy and K Gummaluri on development of new requirements
Information Technology	9/30/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Kiran Gummaluri	2.80	175.00	490.00	Manage and conclude Production Release from Quality
Quality	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Amanda Thomson	2.00	115.00	230.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Debbie Daloisio	2.00	250.00	500.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/25/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Jean Abellard	2.00	115.00	230.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/26/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Debbie Daloisio	2.50	250.00	625.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Amanda Thomson	1.00	115.00	115.00	Reviewed SharePoint documentation.
Quality	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Debbie Daloisio	4.00	250.00	1,000.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/27/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Jean Abellard	0.50	115.00	57.50	Reviewed SharePoint documentation.
Quality	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Amanda Thomson	1.00	115.00	115.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Debbie Daloisio	2.50	250.00	625.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/28/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Jean Abellard	1.00	115.00	115.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
Quality	9/29/2023	Aldrich Pump Personal Injury Questionnaire Review	Debbie Daloisio	1.00	250.00	250.00	Quality review of pre-processed documents. Quality review of PIQ document data entry
				<b>170.70</b>		<b>31,322.00</b>	

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA  
CHARLOTTE DIVISION**

In re:

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, *et al.*,<sup>1</sup>

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-30608 (JCW)

(Jointly Administered)

**NOTICE OF FILING AND OPPORTUNITY FOR HEARING**

**(No Protest Notice – No Hearing Will be Held Unless a Request for Hearing is Filed)**

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the “Committee”) filed the *First Interim Fee Application of Verus, LLC as PIQ Data Administrator to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants for Payment of Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period July 1, 2023 through September 30, 2023* (the “Application”).

If a copy of the Application is not included with this Notice, a copy may be viewed at the Court’s website, [www.ncwb.uscourts.gov](http://www.ncwb.uscourts.gov) under Debtor Aldrich Pump LLC’s name and case number, you may obtain a copy of the Application from the Debtors’ claims and noticing agent at [www.kcellc.net/aldrich](http://www.kcellc.net/aldrich), or you may request in writing a copy from the undersigned counsel to the Committee.

**YOUR RIGHTS MAY BE AFFECTED. YOU SHOULD READ THESE PAPERS CAREFULLY AND DISCUSS THEM WITH YOUR ATTORNEY, IF YOU HAVE ONE IN THESE BANKRUPTCY CASES. (IF YOU DO NOT HAVE AN ATTORNEY, YOU MAY WISH TO CONSULT ONE.)**

IF YOU DO NOT WANT THE COURT TO GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED IN THE APPLICATION, OR IF YOU WANT THE COURT TO CONSIDER YOUR VIEWS ON THE APPLICATION, THEN ON OR BEFORE **APRIL 2, 2024** YOU MUST:

1. File a formal, written response with the Bankruptcy Court at:

Clerk, United States Bankruptcy Court  
Charles Jonas Federal Building  
401 West Trade Street  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of the Debtors’ taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors’ address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

2. Serve a copy of your response on all parties in interest, including:
  - a) U.S. Bankruptcy Administrator  
401 West Trade Street, Suite 2400  
Charlotte, NC 28202
  - b) HAMILTON STEPHENS STEELE + MARTIN, PLLC  
Glenn C. Thompson  
525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202
  - c) ROBINSON & COLE LLP  
Natalie D. Ramsey  
Davis Lee Wright  
1201 N. Market Street, Suite 1406  
Wilmington, Delaware 19801

If you do not want the Court to grant the relief requested in the Application or if you want the Court to consider your views on the Application, then you or your attorney should attend the hearing on **April 25, 2024 at 9:30 a.m.** before the Honorable J. Craig Whitley at the United States Bankruptcy Court, Charles Jonas Federal Building, Courtroom 2B, 401 West Trade Street, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202.

If you or your attorney do not take these steps, the Court may decide that you do not oppose the relief sought and may enter an Order granting the relief requested. If no objections are timely filed and served, the court may rule on the Application without a hearing. No further notice of that hearing will be given.

Dated: March 19, 2024  
Charlotte, North Carolina

HAMILTON STEPHENS  
STEELE + MARTIN, PLLC

/s/ Glenn C. Thompson  
Glenn C. Thompson (Bar No. 37221)  
525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400  
Charlotte, North Carolina 28202  
Telephone: (704) 344-1117  
Facsimile: (704) 344-1483  
gthompson@lawhssm.com  
*Counsel to the Official Committee of  
Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants*