Dennis F. Dunne
Evan R. Fleck
MILBANK LLP
55 Hudson Yards
New York, New York 10001
Telephone: (212) 530-5000
Facsimile: (212) 530-5219
Email: DDunne@milbank.com
EFleck@milbank.com

Gregory Bray MILBANK LLP 2029 Century Park East, 33rd Floor Los Angeles, CA 90067 Telephone: (424) 386-4000 Facsimile: (213) 629-5063 Email: GBray@milbank.com

Counsel for Debtors and Debtors-In-Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK		
In re:	·x : :	Chapter 11
AVIANCA HOLDINGS S.A., et al., ¹	:	Case No. 20-11133 (MG)
Debtors.	:	(Jointly Administered)

FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF MILBANK LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FROM MAY 10, 2020 THROUGH AND INCLUDING MAY 31, 2020

¹ The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases (the "Chapter 11 Cases"), and each Debtor's federal tax identification number (to the extent applicable), are as follows: Avianca Holdings S.A. (N/A); Aero Transporte de Carga Unión, S.A. de C.V. (N/A); Aeroinversiones de Honduras, S.A. (N/A); Aerovías del Continente Americano S.A. Avianca (N/A); Airlease Holdings One Ltd. (N/A); America Central (Canada) Corp. (00-1071563); America Central Corp. (65-0444665); AV International Holdco S.A. (N/A); AV International Holdings S.A. (N/A); AV International Investments S.A. (N/A); AV International Ventures S.A. (N/A); AV Investments One Colombia S.A.S. (N/A); AV Investments Two Colombia S.A.S. (N/A); AV Taca International Holdco S.A. (N/A); Avianca Costa Rica S.A. (N/A); Avianca Leasing, LLC (47-2628716); Avianca, Inc. (13-1868573); Avianca-Ecuador S.A. (N/A); Aviaservicios, S.A. (N/A); Aviateca, S.A. (N/A); Avifreight Holding Mexico, S.A.P.I. de C.V. (N/A); C.R. Int'l Enterprises, Inc. (59-2240957); Grupo Taca Holdings Limited (N/A); International Trade Marks Agency Inc. (N/A); Inversiones del Caribe, S.A. (N/A); Isleña de Inversiones, S.A. de C.V. (N/A); Latin Airways Corp. (N/A); Latin Logistics, LLC (41-2187926); Nicaraguense de Aviación, Sociedad Anónima (Nica, S.A.) (N/A); Regional Express Américas S.A.S. (N/A); Ronair N.V. (N/A); Servicio Terrestre, Aereo y Rampa S.A. (N/A); Servicios Aeroportuarios Integrados SAI S.A.S. (92-4006439); Taca de Honduras, S.A. de C.V. (N/A); Taca de México, S.A. (N/A); Taca International Airlines S.A. (N/A); Taca S.A. (N/A); Tampa Cargo S.A.S. (N/A); Technical and Training Services, S.A. de C.V. (N/A). The Debtors' principal offices are located at Avenida Calle 26 # 59 - 15 Bogotá, Colombia.



20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 2 of 153

Name of applicant:	Milbank LLP
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Avianca Holdings S.A., <i>et. al.</i> Debtors and Debtors in Possession
Date of retention order:	June 9, 2020, nunc pro tunc to May 10, 2020
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020
Total fees requested in this Fee Statement:	\$2,093,354.80 ² (80% of \$2,616,693.50)
Total expenses requested in this Fee Statement:	\$50,984.28
Total fees and expenses for which interim allowance is sought:	\$2,667,677.78
Total fees and expenses to be paid under the Interim Compensation Order:	\$2,144,339.08
Type of fee statement or application:	Monthly Fee Statement ³

Milbank LLP ("<u>Milbank</u>"), attorneys to the above-captioned debtors and debtorsin-possession (collectively, the "<u>Debtors</u>") in these cases, by this Court's *Order Authorizing Employment and Retention of Milbank LLP as Attorneys for Debtors and Debtors in Possession Nunc Pro Tunc to Petition Date* [Docket No. 259] entered on June 9, 2020, hereby submits this *First Monthly Fee Statement of Milbank LLP for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Counsel to the Debtors From May 10, 2020 Through and Including May 31, 2020* (the "<u>First Monthly Fee Statement</u>"), pursuant to sections 105(a), 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "<u>Bankruptcy Code</u>"), Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "<u>Bankruptcy Rules</u>"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local

² This amount reflects a reduction in fees in the amount of \$106,254.50 on account of voluntary write-offs.

³ Notice of the First Monthly Fee Statement will be served in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order (as defined herein). Objections to payment of the amounts described in this First Monthly Fee Statement, if any, shall be addressed in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 3 of 153

Bankruptcy Rules for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the "Local Rules"), the Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases (the "Local Guidelines"), and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Docket No. 256] entered on June 9, 2020 (the "Interim Compensation Order"), for allowance of compensation and reimbursement of expenses for the period of May 11, 2020 through and including May 31, 2020 (the "First Monthly Period"). By this Fee Statement, Milbank seeks (i) compensation in the amount of \$2,093,354.80, which is equal to 80% of the total amount of reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal services that Milbank incurred in connection with such services during the First Monthly Period (*i.e.*, \$2,616,693.50) and (ii) payment of \$50,984.28 for the actual, necessary expenses that Milbank incurred in connection with such services during the First Monthly Period.

Itemization of Services and Disbursements Incurred

1. In support of this First Monthly Fee Statement, the following exhibits are

attached:

- <u>Exhibit A</u> is a schedule of the number of hours billed by Milbank partners, senior counsel, associates and paraprofessionals during the First Monthly Period with respect to each of the subject matter categories Milbank established in accordance with its internal billing procedures.
- **Exhibit B** is a schedule providing certain information regarding the Milbank attorneys and paraprofessionals for whose work compensation is sought in this First Monthly Fee Statement, including position, level of experience, hourly rate, total hours spent working in these cases during the First Monthly Period, and amount of compensation sought on account thereof. Attorneys and paraprofessionals of Milbank billed a total of 2,479.10 hours in connection with these cases during the First Monthly Period.
- <u>Exhibit C</u> is a schedule setting forth the total amount of reimbursement sought with respect to each category of expenses for which Milbank is seeking reimbursement in this First Monthly Fee Statement. All of these amounts comprise the requested sum of Milbank's out-of-pocket expenses.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 4 of 153

• <u>Exhibit D</u> consists of Milbank's records of fees and expenses incurred in the First Monthly Fee Period in the rendition of professional services to the Debtors.

Representations

2. Although every effort has been made to include all fees and expenses incurred by Milbank attorneys and paraprofessionals during the First Monthly Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this First Monthly Fee Statement due to delays caused in connection with accounting and processing of such time and expenses. Accordingly, Milbank reserves the right to make further application to this Court for the allowance of such fees and expenses incurred during the First Monthly Period, but not included herein.

NOTICE AND OBJECTION PROCEDURES

3. Notice of this First Monthly Statement shall be given by hand or overnight delivery upon the following parties (collectively, the "Fee Notice Parties"): (i) the Debtors c/o Avianca Holdings S.A., Av. Calle 26 # 59-15, 6th Floor, Bogotá, Colombia 111321 (Attn: Renato Covelo, General Counsel and Richard Galindo, Associate General Counsel; Email: Renato.Covelo@avianca.com; Richard.Galindo@avianca.com); (ii) counsel for the Debtors, Milbank LLP, 55 Hudson Yards, New York, New York 10001 (Attn: Evan R. Fleck, Esq., Greg Bray, Esq., and Parker Milender, Esq.; Email: EFleck@milbank.com; GBray@milbank.com; PMilender@milbank.com); (iii) the U.S. Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 201 Varick Street, Suite 1006, New York, New York 10014 (Attn: Brian S. Masumoto, Esq. and Greg M. Zipes, Esq.; Email: Brian.Masumoto@usdoj.gov; Greg.Zipes@usdoj.gov); (iv) counsel for the Committee, Morrison & Foerster LLP, 250 West 55th Street, New York, NY 10019 (Attn: Brett H. Miller, Esq.; Todd M. Goren, Esq.; Erica J. Richards, Esq.; Email: BrettMiller@mofo.com; TGoren@mofo.com; ERichards@mofo.com); and (v) counsel for any other statutory committees appointed in these Chapter 11 Cases.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 5 of 153

4. Objections to this First Monthly Statement, if any, must be filed by the objection deadline and served upon Milbank LLP, 55 Hudson Yards, New York, NY 10001, Attn: Evan R. Fleck, Esq., Greg Bray, Esq., and Parker Milender, Esq.; Email: EFleck@milbank.com; GBray@milbank.com; PMilender@milbank.com, no later than July 9, 2020 at 12:00 p.m. (Prevailing Eastern Time) (the "Objection Deadline"). Objections to this First Monthly Statement, if any, must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.

5. If no objection to this First Monthly Statement is received by the Objection Deadline, the Debtors shall promptly pay Milbank 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses identified in this First Monthly Statement. To the extent that an objection to this First Monthly Statement is received by the Objection Deadline, the Debtors shall withhold payment of that portion of this First Monthly Statement to which the objection is directed and promptly pay the remainder of the fees and expenses in the percentages set forth above. To the extent such objection is not resolved, it shall be preserved and scheduled for consideration at the next interim fee application hearing.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 6 of 153

WHEREFORE, Milbank respectfully requests (i) compensation in the amount of \$2,093,354.80, which is equal to 80% of the total amount of reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal and paraprofessional services incurred by Milbank during the First Monthly Period, and (ii) payment of \$50,984.28, which is equal to 100% of the actual, necessary expenses incurred by Milbank in connections with such services during the First Monthly Period.

Dated: June 24, 2020 New York, New York Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Evan R. Fleck

MILBANK LLP

Dennis F. Dunne Evan R. Fleck 55 Hudson Yards New York, NY 10001 Telephone: (212) 530-5000 Facsimile: (212) 530-5219 Email: DDunne@milbank.com EFleck@milbank.com

-and-

Gregory A. Bray 2029 Century Park East, 33rd Floor Los Angeles, CA 90067 Telephone: (424) 386-4000 Facsimile: (212) 629-5063 Email: GBray@milbank.com

Counsel for Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 7 of 153

<u>Exhibit A</u>

Summary of Fees by Subject Matter

Matter Number	Project Category/Matter Description	Hours Billed	Total Fees Incurred
9	Assumption and Rejection of Leases and Contracts	158.80	\$159,714.00
10	Automatic Stay Enforcement	63.80	\$59,445.00
11	Business Operations	12.70	\$12,967.00
12	Case Administration	234.30	\$154,982.00
13	General Case Strategy (Including team calls)	94.30	\$113,955.00
14	Cash Collateral/Adequate Protection/DIP	82.20	\$102,448.50
15	Cash Management	11.30	\$13,471.50
16	Claims Analysis/Estimation/Objection	8.00	\$8,104.00
17	Communications with Company	58.00	\$78,108.00
18	Supplier and Vendor Issues	117.00	\$139,481.50
19	Communications/Issues/Meetings with U.S. Trustee	22.80	\$24,484.50
20	Communications/Issues/Meetings with Secured	24.10	\$35,530.50
21	Communications/Issues/Meetings with Unsecured	12.90	\$16,740.50
22	Corporate Governance/Board Issues	97.30	\$104,559.00
23	Court Hearings and Communications	60.50	\$75,203.00
24	Employee Benefits/Severance Issues	130.70	\$144,096.50
26	Insurance	2.60	\$2,411.00
27	Litigation	1.50	\$2,422.50
30	Regulatory Issues	88.50	\$92,789.50
31	Retention/Fee Applications	236.20	\$230,496.50
32	Tax	7.80	\$6,886.00
33	Securities & Corporate Governance Issues	84.70	\$86,279.50
34	Finance & Securitization Issues	381.20	\$373,384.50
35	Aircraft and Fleet Issues	339.80	\$376,939.50
36	Local Law Issues	143.80	\$194,849.50
37	Communications with Governments/Interested Parties	4.30	\$6,944.50
	Total	2,479.10	\$2,616,693.50

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 8 of 153

<u>Exhibit B</u>

Attorneys and Paraprofessionals' Information

Name	Department (Position)	Bar Admission ⁴	Hourly Rate ⁵	Total Hours Billed	Total Fees Incurred
	Financial Restructuring				
Gregory Bray	(Partner)	1984	\$1,615	127.00	\$205,105.00
Evan Fleck	Financial Restructuring (Partner)	2002	\$1,615	134.10	\$216,571.50
Jay Grushkin	Alternative Investments (Partner)	1982	\$1,615	17.90	\$28,908.50
Marcelo Mottesi	Global Capital Markets (Partner)	1992	\$1,615	89.10	\$143,896.50
Helfried Schwarz	Transportation & Space (Partner)	1988	\$1,615	75.50	\$121,932.50
Tobias Stirnberg	Global Capital Markets (Partner)	2004	\$1,615	14.90	\$24,063.50
Alan Stone	Litigation (Partner)	1988	\$1,615	95.80	\$154,717.00
Manan Shah	Tax (Partner)	2002	\$1,540	15.20	\$23,408.00
Aaron Renenger	Litigation (Partner)	2002	\$1,450	59.50	\$86,275.00
Francisco Nunez	Global Corporate (Partner)	2016	\$1,215	46.90	\$56,983.50
Jane Hanson	Litigation (Of Counsel)	1984	\$1,315	10.00	\$13,150.00
Dennis O'Donnell	Financial Restructuring (Of Counsel)	1992	\$1,250	171.20	\$214,000.00
James Beebe	Tax (Associate)	2011	\$1,045	16.00	\$16,720.00
Niels Jensen	Transportation & Space (Associate)	2013	\$1,045	19.90	\$20,795.50
James Behrens	Financial Restructuring (Associate)	2011	\$1,035	47.70	\$49,369.50
Erin Dexter	Litigation (Associate)	2014	\$995	55.60	\$55,322.00
Parker Milender	Financial Restructuring (Associate)	2014	\$995	163.40	\$162,583.00
Pablo Richards	Global Capital Markets (Associate)	2016	\$995	50.30	\$50,048.50
Steve Goff	Transportation & Space (Associate)	2016	\$965	178.00	\$171,770.00
Julie Wolf	Litigation (Associate)	2016	\$965	56.40	\$54,426.00
Gonzalo Guitart	Global Capital Markets (Associate)	2019	\$920	41.30	\$37,996.00

⁴ Personnel marked as "Not Yet Admitted" practice under the supervision of licensed attorneys admitted to practice in the applicable jurisdiction.

⁵ Dollar amounts followed by a * represents the amount charged for non-working travel.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 9 of 153

Name	Department (Position)	Bar Admission ⁴	Hourly Rate ⁵	Total Hours Billed	Total Fees Incurred
	Financial Restructuring				
Melanie Cruz Burgos	(Associate)	2018	\$870	21.60	\$18,792.00
Ryan Parchment	Litigation (Associate)	2018	\$870	91.10	\$79,257.00
	Global Capital Markets				
Alexia Raad	(Associate)	2015	\$870	22.50	\$19,575.00
	Financial Restructuring				
	(Associate)	2015	\$870	150.70	131,109.00
	Financial Restructuring				
Yuliya Zahoroda	(Associate)	2018	\$870	80.10	\$69,687.00
Stephen Benz	Litigation (Associate)	2019	\$770	76.20	\$58,674.00
	Litigation (Associate)	2019	\$770	17.60	\$13,552.00
	Global Corporate				
Flora Gonzalez	(Associate)	2019	\$770	42.20	\$32,494.00
Danielle Lee	Litigation (Associate)	2019	\$770	29.70	\$22,869.00
	Transportation & Space				
Victoria Mansoor	(Associate)	2019	\$770	25.80	\$19,866.00
	Financial Restructuring				
Aaron Metviner	(Associate)	2018	\$770	99.30	\$76,461.00
Maria Ortiz	Litigation (Associate)	2019	\$770	10.60	\$8,162.00
Jonathan Sorger	Tax (Associate)	2019	\$770	30.10	\$23,177.00
	Global Capital Markets	Not Yet			
Marcela Barba	(Associate)	Admitted	\$625	28.90	\$18,062.50
Eric Hyla	Litigation (Associate)	2020	\$625	22.20	\$13,875.00
Kristina Lauria	Litigation (Associate)	2020	\$625	76.40	\$47,750.00
Ashton Yarnall	Litigation (Associate)	2020	\$625	13.50	\$8,437.50
	Legal Asst	N/A	\$320	69.20	\$22,144.00
Jacqueline Brewster	Legal Asst	N/A	\$300	52.30	\$15,690.00
Jae Yeon Cecilia Kim	Legal Asst	N/A	\$270	33.40	\$9,018.00
					,
	·	TOTALS:	\$1,055.50 ⁶	2,479.10	\$2,616,693.50

⁶ The blended rate for attorneys is \$1,105.69 per hour. The blended rate for paraprofessionals is \$302.47 per hour.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 10 of 153

Exhibit C

Summary of Expenses Incurred During the First Monthly Period

Expense Categories	Amount
Computerized Database Research	\$49,301.94
Filing Fees	\$117.00
Long Distance Telephone	\$19.72
Translation Fees	\$843.82
Transcript Expense	\$701.80
TOTALS:	\$50,984.28

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 11 of 153

<u>Exhibit D</u>

Records of Fees and Expenses Incurred During the First Monthly Period

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 12 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25459258 5/11/2020	Conduct legal research i/c/w aircraft adequate protection (1.6); revise adequate protection stipulation i/c/w rejected aircraft (.5).	2.10	Parchment, Ryan
25424306 5/11/2020	Consider facts and analysis re credit card receivable issue (3.4); t/c with E. Dexter, S. Benz and R. Parchment re same (.5); review notice of retention and emails re same (.2).	4.10	Renenger, Aaron L.
25421025 5/11/2020	Call with Seabury and SGR re lessor responses and terms of AP stipulation (.5); review Seabury comments re same (.1); review SGR comments re same (.3); provide comments re same (.2).	1.10	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25432827 5/12/2020	Research (.8) and analyze (.6) retention notice from Citi; discuss same with E. Fleck, J. Grushkin, P. Milender et al. re credit card receivables issues (1.0); follow-up discussion with E. Dexter re same (.1); t/c with SGR re same (.5); follow-up discussion with P. Milender re same (.4); t/c with L. Avila (Avianca), E. Fleck, J. Luth et al. re securitization strategy (.9); discussion with J. Grushkin re same (.1); prepare analysis re same (2.5); discuss memos with J. Wolf re same (.1); discuss same with E. Dexter (.1).	7.10	Renenger, Aaron L.
25461679 5/13/2020	Respond to multiple emails re lease rejection issues.	1.80	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25440344 5/13/2020	Review Clifford Chance comments on behalf of CDB to draft AP stipulation (.4); review Norton Rose comments on behalf of DBJ and CPAM re same (.6); review Pillsbury comments on behalf of Nord re same (.3); review AP stipulation issues list prepared by S. Goff (.4); call with G. Bray and S. Goff to discuss our response to AP stipulation comments (.7); comment on revised draft of AP stipulation (1.0).	3.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 13 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44010.00007 Avianca - Assumption and Rejection of E		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25602921 5/14/2020	Call with J. Tenen, E. Fontanella, E. McCallum, A. Stangle (all SGR) and N. Jenson re draft AP stipulation (.6); review Vedder comments on behalf of multiple counterparties re same (.5); review Holland & Knight comments on behalf of FGL and SMBC re same (.6); call with G. Bray and S. Goff (Milbank) re same (.4); review revised AP stipulation (.2); call with G. Bray and S. Goff re same (.3); finalize draft of AP stipulation for circulation to counterparties (.3); comment on Seabury's cover email re same (.3).	3.20	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25461070 5/15/2020	Respond to multiple emails re lease rejection issues.	1.20	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25602922 5/15/2020	Review K&L Gates comments on behalf of Stratos re same (.3); review ALM lease's comments re same (.3); review A&O comments on behalf of BNP re same (.6); review Norton Rose comments on behalf of JP lease and NTT re same (.6); review Pillsbury comments on behalf of Nord and other lenders re same (.4); review SGR comments re same (.2); review Vedder comments on behalf of EXIM, MUFG and other clients re same (.4); review SMBC comments re same (.2); review Fuyo comments re same (.2); review AMCK comments re same (.2); revise 5/14 draft of AP stipulation to reflect comments received from counterparties (.9); internal discussions with G. Bray re same (.9); coordinate population of exhibits and signing logistics with S. Goff and N. Jensen (.4).	5.60	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25447997 5/16/2020	Revise 5/15 draft of AP stipulation to reflect comments received (1.3); internal discussions with G. Bray re same (.8); consider comments to 5/16 draft of AP stipulation from Vedder (.3), Clifford Chance (.2), H&K (.3) and NRF (.2); incorporate final changes to AP stipulation (.6).	3.70	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 14 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	
	1		
25450366 5/17/2020	Review 32 broken out AP stipulations for accurate signatories and proper description of aircraft counterparties.	1.60	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25480185 5/17/2020	Edits to second rejection and abandonment motion (.2); review same and exhibit C (.8); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1).	1.10	Silverman, Stephen D.
25485135 5/18/2020	Calls with H. Schwarz and S. Goff about status of adequate protection stipulations (.3); review last minute comments to adequate protection stipulations (.9).	1.20	Jensen, Niels
25458754 5/18/2020	Draft/revise exhibit to omnibus rejection motion (.2); draft notice for same (.8); emails w/ G. Bray re rejection considerations (.6).	1.60	Milender, Parker
25453909 5/18/2020	Comment on initial draft of AP stipulation re revolving credit agreement with Citibank as collateral agent.	0.70	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25602923 5/19/2020	Research bankruptcy court's ability to reject or assume contracts.	3.50	Capolino, Margherita Angela
25485056 5/19/2020	Call with Latham and Vedder re adequate protection stipulations (.3); call with G. Bray, P. Milender and H. Schwarz re same (.3); draft (1.6) and revise (.7) adequate protection stipulation; call with P. Milender re same (.2); call with H. Schwarz re same (.2).	3.30	Jensen, Niels
25469706 5/19/2020	Draft (.7) and revise (.4) notice for lease rejection stipulations.	1.10	Milender, Parker
25491405 5/19/2020	Draft motion to reject executory contract re USAVflow.	8.20	Parchment, Ryan
25471274 5/20/2020	Prepare for call re executory contracts.	0.50	Capolino, Margherita Angela
25491715 5/20/2020	Revise motion to reject executory contract.	3.70	Parchment, Ryan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 15 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

_	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25485177 5	5/20/2020	Attend internal discussions re application of section 365.	0.90	Renenger, Aaron L.
25490337 5	5/20/2020	Review re precedent settlement procedures pleadings.	0.40	Thomas, Charmaine
25577519 5	5/21/2020	Respond to correspondence re executory contract rejection.	1.10	Dexter, Erin E.
25485500 5	5/21/2020	Discuss adequate protection stipulation with G. Bray, P. Milender and H. Schwarz (.4); revise stipulation re same (1.4); emails re same (.4).	2.20	Jensen, Niels
25479846 5	5/21/2020	Begin bundle contracts rejection research re section 365.	6.60	Lee, Danielle
25491743 5	5/21/2020	Revise motion to reject executory contract re USAVflow agreements.	6.20	Parchment, Ryan
25490780 5	5/21/2020	Further review re precedent settlement procedures pleadings.	1.30	Thomas, Charmaine
25577520 5	5/21/2020	Call re processor agreements and rejection thereof (.6); correspond with E. Dexter re legal research re processor agreement issues (.3); conduct legal research re same (1.4); review and revise draft motion to reject USAV contracts and review 2003 motion re same (3.1).	5.40	Wolf, Julie M.
25482942 5	5/21/2020	Begin research re rejection consequences of multi-party contract.	1.00	Yarnall, Ashton R.
25479835 5	5/22/2020	Continue bundle contracts rejection research re section 365.	8.30	Lee, Danielle
25480688 5	5/22/2020	Finalize rejection procedures motion (.5); review filing re same (.1); review of rejection stipulation (.3).	0.90	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 16 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	44810.00009 Avianca - Assumption and Rejection of Lea Description	Hours	
25491436	5/22/2020	Revise motion to reject executory contract re USAVflow agreements.	2.10	Parchment, Ryan
25478997	5/22/2020	Complete research re rejection consequences of multi-party contract.	5.50	Yarnall, Ashton R.
25480443	5/23/2020	Review rejection/assumption procedures motion in advance of discussions with Company and vendor counterparties re same.	0.70	Silverman, Stephen D.
25602920	5/26/2020	Call w/ Company re assumption/rejection of leases and related strategy (.9); call w/ G. Bray, SGR and Company re lease rejection stipulation issue (.8); revise rejection stipulation (.3); draft lease rejection motion (.6).	2.60	Milender, Parker
25526620	5/26/2020	Conduct legal research re rejection of independent leases/master lease agreement (3.2); prepare email summary re same (.6).	3.80	Parchment, Ryan
25496211	5/26/2020	Review research on rejection of engine leases.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25505202	5/26/2020	Review research re rejection issues.	2.60	Wolf, Julie M.
25502556	5/27/2020	Review research re lease issues.	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25523361	5/28/2020	Emails re proposed rejection motion.	0.20	Dexter, Erin E.
25507563	5/28/2020	Draft/revise rejection motion (.3); review stipulation issues (.3).	0.60	Milender, Parker
25505702	5/28/2020	Review correspondence (.1) and contracts (.2) re engine issues.	0.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25515840	5/29/2020	Begin research re financing executory contract.	5.20	Lee, Danielle
25512509	5/29/2020	Revise rejection procedures order.	0.30	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 17 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44010.00009 Avianca - Assumption and Rejection of		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25526715 5/29/2020	Call w/ A. Renenger re proposed rejection motion (.8); conduct legal research re financing agreements and executory contracts (2.4).	3.20	Parchment, Ryan
25577524 5/29/2020	Revise USAV rejection motion (1.1); discuss same with R. Parchment, J. Wolf et al. (.5).	1.60	Renenger, Aaron L.
25577525 5/29/2020	Revise draft motion to reject executory contracts and provide comments (2.1); calls with K. Lauria, S. Benz, A. Renenger re same (.8); conduct legal research re executory contract rejection (1.7).	4.60	Wolf, Julie M.
25524163 5/30/2020	Research on credit card processing agreements and effect of rejection.	3.20	Benz, Stephen
25515844 5/30/2020	Continue research re financing executory contract.	2.50	Lee, Danielle
25527027 5/30/2020	Conduct legal research re executory contract rejection and financing agreements (1.3); revise rejection motion re. USAVflow agreements (5.4); review relevant agreements re same (.8).	7.50	Parchment, Ryan
25518572 5/30/2020	Research executory contract law in the Second Circuit.	7.00	Yarnall, Ashton R.
25525049 5/31/2020	Conduct research of processing agreements (2.9); correspondence on same with A. Renenger (1.3).	4.20	Benz, Stephen
25602932 5/31/2020	Further revise rejection motion.	1.10	Benz, Stephen
25526981 5/31/2020	Review declaration in support of rejection motion (.6); revise rejection motion for assignment contracts (1.3).	1.90	Parchment, Ryan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 18 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

rejection issues (.3); emails re same (.2).

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25524349 5/31/2020	Call with S. Benz re contract rejection issues (.2); emails re same (.2); revise multiple draft pleadings (1.1); T/C with P. Milender re	2.00	Renenger, Aaron L.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 19 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25447891 5/11/2020	Edit both automatic stay letters (.6); emails re same (.2).	0.80	Silverman, Stephen D.
25428848 5/12/2020	Research violation of automatic stay re Citibank notice (4.4); review underlying securitizations re same (1.0); emails w/ A. Renenger, E. Dexter re same (.6); draft letter to Citibank re same (1.4); emails w/ E. Dexter re same (.1).	7.50	Lauria, Kristina
25459236 5/12/2020	Draft notice letter to Newrest re automatic stay (1.1); draft notice letter to Flying Foods LLC re automatic stay (.2).	1.30	Parchment, Ryan
25447832 5/12/2020	Review edits and analysis re automatic stay letters and related emails (.5); coordinate translation notice re same (.1); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1).	0.70	Silverman, Stephen D.
25462292 5/13/2020	Conduct legal research re setoff and automatic stay issue (3.3); internal emails re same (.4).	3.70	Behrens, James C.
25438395 5/13/2020	Edit letter re automatic stay (.7); respond to correspondence re same (1.0).	1.70	Dexter, Erin E.
25439446 5/13/2020	Research re automatic stay w/r/t Citibank notice of retention event (3.0); emails re same (.5); revise letter to Citi/counsel re same (1.5).	5.00	Lauria, Kristina
25459067 5/13/2020	Review (.7) and revise (.9) draft letters to Newrest and Flying Food LLC re automatic stay notice; review Kayak contract i/c/w termination of services (1.9); draft automatic stay notice letter re same (1.1); review draft (.7) and further revise (.2) automatic stay notice letter to Dnata Brasil.	5.50	Parchment, Ryan
25576318 5/13/2020	Emails re automatic stay letter to Citibank (.1); revise letter to Citibank re same (.3).	0.40	Renenger, Aaron L.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 20 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
		*		
25447899	5/13/2020	Edit various automatic stay letters (.4); correspond w/ E. Fleck, A. Stone and M. Catalina (Avianca) re same and related matters (.3).	0.70	Silverman, Stephen D.
25442138	5/14/2020	Revise of letter re Citibank retention notice and auto stay violation (.6); emails re same (1.4).	2.00	Lauria, Kristina
25458961	5/14/2020	Revise automatic stay notice letter to Dnata Brasil (.1); draft automatic stay notice letter to Swissport (.8); review/revise same (1.1); draft automatic stay notice letter to DDB (.9); draft automatic stay notice letter to Michelin (.8); draft automatic stay notice letter to H. Essers (.7).	4.40	Parchment, Ryan
25576319	5/14/2020	Emails re finalizing stay letter to Citibank (.2); draft email to client re letter re automatic stay (.4).	0.60	Renenger, Aaron L.
25447897	5/14/2020	Multiple rounds of correspondence w/ D. Calixto and M. Catalina (Avianca) re auto stay letters for suppliers (.5); correspond w/ E. Fleck re same (.2); correspond w/ A. Stone re same and go-forward process (.2).	0.90	Silverman, Stephen D.
25456085	5/15/2020	Review correspondence re automatic stay letter re USAVflow.	1.00	Dexter, Erin E.
25447549	5/15/2020	Revise letter to Citibank re stay violation (.9); correspond w/ A. Renenger, E. Dexter re same (.6).	1.50	Lauria, Kristina
25576320	5/15/2020	Review stay violation letter and emails re same.	0.20	Renenger, Aaron L.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 21 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

1	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25459069 5.	5/16/2020	Draft letter to Gategroup re foreign vendor status/automatic stay (.8); draft letter to Alpha Brokers re automatic stay (.7); draft letter to ILS re critical vendor status/automatic stay (.5); draft letter to MVP re critical vendor status/automatic stay (.3).	2.30	Parchment, Ryan
25491557 5	6/18/2020	Revise automatic stay letters to MVP and ILS.	0.80	Parchment, Ryan
25467491 5	5/19/2020	Revise draft of CC securitizations memo sections on automatic stay (1.7); correspond w/ E. Dexter, A. Renenger, M. Capolino re same (.3).	2.00	Lauria, Kristina
25473169 5	5/20/2020	Call w/ A. Renenger re automatic stay.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25479081 5	5/21/2020	Emails w/ E. Fleck re Swissport (.2); emails w/ S. Silverman re GMD (.3); review research on violations of automatic stay (.3).	0.80	Stone, Alan J.
25491674 5	6/22/2020	Confer w/ A. Stone re motion for contempt (.3); draft same (3.1).	3.40	Parchment, Ryan
25487667 5	5/22/2020	Edit letter to GMD counsel (.2); call w/ S. Silverman re enforcement of automatic stay (.3); call w/ R. Parchment re enforcement of automatic stay (.3).	0.80	Stone, Alan J.
25491370 5	6/24/2020	Draft motion for contempt.	3.20	Parchment, Ryan
25488229 5	6/25/2020	Edit motion for contempt (.5); emails w/Debtors re automatic stay enforcement (.2).	0.70	Stone, Alan J.
25526927 5	5/27/2020	Revise motion for contempt.	3.10	Parchment, Ryan
25505265 5	/27/2020	Call w/ Debtors, S. Silverman re enforcement of automatic stay (.5); call re Star Alliance (.5); review Star Alliance agreements, airline partner agreements, background materials (1.5); edit letter to Star Alliance (.7); emails re BBVA (.2); review BBVA letter (.2).	3.60	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 22 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25508598 5/28/2	020 Review materials in advance of internal call (.2); participate on call with A. Stone and S. Silverman re multiple stay matters (.5); participate on portion of call with Lifemiles re stay matters (.4).	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25526693 5/28/2	020 Conduct legal research and prepare answers for the Company re termination of contracts and automatic stay.	2.10	Parchment, Ryan
25511100 5/28/2	 Call re BBVA w/ S. Silverman, G. Bray, E. Fleck (.6); call re BBVA, Star Alliance w/Debtors, LifeMiles, Davis Polk (.7); email w/Debtors re enforcement of automatic stay (.2). 	1.50	Stone, Alan J.
25515293 5/29/2	020 Confer w/ R. Parchment re motion to enforce automatic stay.	0.20	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 23 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00011 Avianca - Business Operations

Torrest Dusiness Operations			
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25419922 5/11/2020	Revise draft confidentiality agreements for review by creditors.	0.80	Goff, Steve
25462285 5/13/2020	Respond to customer programs question from FTI.	0.40	Behrens, James C.
25462272 5/15/2020	Review customer programs issues (1.2); attend customer programs call with Avianca, G. Hughes (Seabury), and A. Stone (1.0); internal emails re same (.6).	2.80	Behrens, James C.
25468693 5/19/2020	Revise customer programs order (1.6); emails with P. Milender re same (.3).	1.90	Behrens, James C.
25473281 5/20/2020	Call w/ third party supplier re ongoing operations.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25502385 5/27/2020	T/C with G. Bray re pending operational matters (.2); correspond with P. Milender re same (.3); multiple calls with CFO re operational considerations (.4).	0.90	Fleck, Evan R.
25508513 5/28/2020	Calls with Seabury re operational matters.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25515162 5/30/2020	Review email from J. Welch (CSC) re Delaware agent services (.1); email F. Gonzalez re same (.1).	0.20	Nunez, Francisco R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 24 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including will and Case Calendar)		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25453510 5/11/2020	Edit PHV motion and notice of appearance (.7); coordinate payment of court filing fees re petitions (.3); prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re PHV motion, notice of appearance, KCC employment application (1.5); correspond w/ team re same (.3).	2.80	Brewster, Jacqueline
25602927 5/11/2020	Download Judge Glenn opinions (2.7); update internal folder re same (.6); dial in (.3) and monitor (.4) first day hearing.	4.00	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia
25426882 5/11/2020	Update case management procedures proposed order (.4); correspond with S. Silverman re same (.1).	0.50	Metviner, Aaron
25425882 5/11/2020	Draft/revise orders to first day motions and attend to filing of same.	2.20	Milender, Parker
25461776 5/11/2020	Revise board summary (2.9); emails re same (.9); update agenda (1.4); emails re same (.6).	5.80	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25447861 5/11/2020	Edit first day press release re responses to succeeding Joele Frank drafts (1.2); correspond w/ T. Ragones re same (.1); edit various other first day PR emails (.7).	2.00	Silverman, Stephen D.
25453831 5/11/2020	File first days and coordinate service with claims agent (1.4); create index and assemble first day ebinders and coordinate for print and distribution (1.3); follow up and confirm same (.3); review re further upload of Judge Glenn's opinions (.2); review re outstanding PACER fees (.2); distribute precedent rejection procedures motion transcripts (.9); review re first day hearing and delivery of transcript (.3).	4.90	Thomas, Charmaine
25602928 5/12/2020	Revise notice of commencement (.5); internal emails re same (.4); review first day orders (.9); review outstanding items and upcoming deadlines (.5).	2.30	Behrens, James C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 25 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including wilp and Case Calendar)		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25453550 5/12/2020	Coordinate court fee payment re petitions (.5); correspond w/ D. O'Donnell re same (.2); prepare pleading for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re notice of second day hearing (.5); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.2).	1.40	Brewster, Jacqueline
25438833 5/12/2020	Review docket filings (.1); review/respond to case correspondence (.7).	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25458413 5/12/2020	Calendar hearing, 341, pleading dates for internal Milbank team (.2); review local and bankruptcy rules re deadlines, scheduling (.1); correspond with P. Milender re 341 meeting scheduling (.1); review case management motion re relevant deadlines and procedures (.2).	0.60	Metviner, Aaron
25436488 5/12/2020	Revise notice of second day hearing (.3); draft 309F notice (.3); review Spanish translations of same (.2).	0.80	Milender, Parker
25461275 5/12/2020	Draft weekly board summary (1.2); draft updated agenda (.9); emails re same (.8).	2.90	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25602929 5/12/2020	Call w/ R. Jordan re noticing issues (.2) ; corr w/ P. Milender re same (.1); edit first day press release (.2); correspond w/ H. Salas (JF) re same (.1); edit IATA talking points (.2): correspond w/ D. O'Donnell and J. Salas (JF) re same (.1); review employer letter and certain talking points re same (.3): review motions re same (.4); correspond w/ C. Lipe (JF) re same (.1); prepare chapter 11 summary email for L. Avila (1.1); correspond w/ G. Guitart re same (.2); review precedent re same (.2).	3.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25602930 5/12/2020	Further follow up with transcriber re first day hearing (.2); distribute same (.2); update ECF case list (.4); distribute firmwide email (.6); assemble responses re same (.2); monitor docket re KCC order (.3); update dockets and pleadings (.2).	2.10	Thomas, Charmaine

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 26 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44610.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (includ	ing wir and Case	e Calendar)
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25461886 5/12/2020	Research notice provisions (.8); draft notices (1.6); emails with P. Milender re same (.2).	2.60	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25436953 5/13/2020	Coordinate JOLCO documentation.	0.10	Barba, Marcela
25453507 5/13/2020	Retrieve precedent 1113/1114 (9.7); review court docket re recent filings posted (.5); compile a list of today's filings (.3).	10.50	Brewster, Jacqueline
25440140 5/13/2020	Review (.2) and respond to (.2) case correspondence; review docket filings (.1).	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25444119 5/13/2020	Pull 1113, 1114 motion precedents (3.5); update working group list (.5); continue pull of Judge Glenn's opinions (2.0).	6.00	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia
25458391 5/13/2020	Review docket (.1) and recently filed pleadings (.2); summarize (.1) and circulate (.1) same.	0.50	Metviner, Aaron
25439438 5/13/2020	Draft/revise 309F notice (.2); emails w/ UST re same (.2); revise customer programs interim order per ticket issues (.5); correspond w/ prepetition lenders (.6); review automatic stay letters and calls w/ A. Stone re same (.7); respond to emails re general case admin (.3).	2.50	Milender, Parker
25453777 5/13/2020	Further review re upload of Judge Glenn opinions (.2); assemble precedent airline cases agendas and related transcripts (6).	6.20	Thomas, Charmaine
25461008 5/13/2020	Research notice of presentment (.6); draft notices re same (.6).	1.20	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25440557 5/14/2020	Coordinate Avianca dataroom access.	0.20	Barba, Marcela
25453701 5/14/2020	Research PACER for new case filings (.5); update internal files re same (.3); prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re notice of case management procedures and notice of filing of amended interim orders (1.7); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.3).	2.80	Brewster, Jacqueline

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 27 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including WIP and Case Calendar)			
Date	Description	Hours	Name	
25458406 5/14/2020	Review docket (.2); prepare and circulate Avianca daily docket update (.3); correspond with Y. Zahoroda re same (.1); calendar omnibus hearing dates for internal team (.1).	0.70	Metviner, Aaron	
25444355 5/14/2020	Draft notice of revised interim orders (.8); correspond w/ clerk re same (.8).	1.60	Milender, Parker	
25602933 5/14/2020	Correspond w/ J. Morrow re letters to accompany notice of commencement (.1); review proposed final versions of same and provide edits (.4); attend internal coordination call (.6).	1.10	Silverman, Stephen D.	
25453621 5/14/2020	Further upload Judge Glenn opinions (.5); further assembly of precedent airline cases agendas and related transcripts (1.4).	1.90	Thomas, Charmaine	
25453654 5/15/2020	Correspond w/ E. Fleck re Sunday filings (.3); circulate today's filings to A. Metviner (.5); update pleading files (.3); deliver proposed orders re PHV motion (.4); circulate first day motions and orders to Y. Zahoroda (.3).	1.80	Brewster, Jacqueline	
25451653 5/15/2020	Review/respond to case correspondence (.4); review docket filings (.2).	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.	
25461697 5/15/2020	Draft weekly board summary (1.2); draft updated agenda (.9).	2.10	O'Donnell, Dennis C.	
25453747 5/15/2020	Distribute precedent re notice of expedited hearing.	0.70	Thomas, Charmaine	
25461661 5/15/2020	Emails re billing procedures (.2); respond to internal emails re potential conflicts (.2).	0.40	Zahoroda, Yuliya	
25451611 5/16/2020	Review (.4) and respond (.4) to case correspondence.	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.	

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 28 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including WIP and Case Calendar)		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25447789 5/16/2020	Correspond w/ S. Goff re internal admin matters, including related to email and distribution groups (.2); follow-up with internal tech team re same (.1).	0.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25453691 5/16/2020	Continue to assemble precedent airline cases agendas and related transcripts.	1.10	Thomas, Charmaine
25451643 5/17/2020	Review (.3) and comment on (.4) board update.	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.
25458663 5/17/2020	Check Avianca docket for recently filed pleadings (.2); review same (.1).	0.30	Metviner, Aaron
25453549 5/17/2020	Further assemble precedent airline cases agendas and related transcripts.	2.20	Thomas, Charmaine
25461190 5/17/2020	Circulate summary re update of the case.	0.20	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25497349 5/18/2020	Review court docket and review entries re new filings, pertinent chapter 11 pleadings and NOA (.5); update NOA list (.5); circulate same to team (.3).	1.30	Brewster, Jacqueline
25457021 5/18/2020	Review/respond to case correspondence (.3); review docket filings (.1).	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25480491 5/18/2020	Correspond w/ T. Ragones (JF) re responsive Peru materials (.1): correspond w/ D. O'Donnell re same (.1); review same (.2): review PR materials re aircraft stipulations and lease rejection (.2): correspond w/ C. Lipe re same and other updates (.2); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1).	0.90	Silverman, Stephen D.
25490630 5/18/2020	Review emails re case administration (.3); update folders re conflicts (.2); update pleadings file (.2); continue to assemble precedent files re airline cases agendas and related transcripts (1.5).	2.20	Thomas, Charmaine
25498333 5/18/2020	Monitor case docket for substantive filings.	0.10	Zahoroda, Yuliya

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 29 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	8	Name
		•		
25466714	5/19/2020	Organize documents in database.	0.40	Barba, Marcela
25497255	5/19/2020	Prepare pleading for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re notice of revised rejection order (.5); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1). review court docket and review entries re new filings and pertinent chapter 11 pleadings and circulate re same (.5); prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re stipulations and orders between Debtors and Aircraft Counterparties (.5); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1).	1.70	Brewster, Jacqueline
25468685	5/19/2020	Respond to case correspondence (.3); participate on internal group update call (.8).	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25505470	5/19/2020	Pull documents from data site.	3.00	Mansoor, Victoria
25491794	5/19/2020	Review recently filed Avianca pleadings (.3); prepare docket update for internal team's review (.2); call w Y. Zahoroda re same (.1).	0.60	Metviner, Aaron
25469674	5/19/2020	Draft/revise final orders for first day motions (1.1); review calendaring, task list, and general case administration (.3).	1.40	Milender, Parker
25480503	5/19/2020	Call w/ J. Morrow (KCC), emails w/ D. Calderon (KCC), P. Milender and D. O'Donnell re 341 notice issues (.3); review case management order re same (.1); review bankruptcy rules re same (.2).	0.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25602935	5/19/2020	Review (.2) and file (.2) emergency Peru motion; upload (.1) and distribute (.1) same; update case files re conflict search results (.2).;	0.80	Thomas, Charmaine
25498647	5/19/2020	Checked for updates (.1); prepare and distributed summaries re same (.5); coordinate with paralegals re same (.2); call with A. Metviner re same (.1).	0.90	Zahoroda, Yuliya

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 30 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including wIP and Case Calendar)		
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25497024	5/20/2020	Review court docket re recent filings posted (.5); compile a list of today's filings (.5); update NOA List (.5); correspond w/ conflicts re search (.3).	1.80	Brewster, Jacqueline
25473312	5/20/2020	Respond to case correspondence (.4); review docket filings (.2).	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25602936	5/20/2020	Update internal conflict tracker list (3.0); update working group list (.6).	3.60	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia
25491851	5/20/2020	Review Avianca docket and pleadings (.2); provide update to internal team (.2).	0.40	Metviner, Aaron
25473388	5/20/2020	Review revisions of AP stipulations and calls/emails w/ clerk of court re same (.4); review task list, calendaring, and general case administration (.4).	0.80	Milender, Parker
25473262	5/20/2020	Prepare letter to ML re swaps.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25498302	5/20/2020	Edit updated working group list (.3); circulate same (.1).	0.40	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25497955	5/21/2020	Review calls and emails.	5.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25497104	5/21/2020	Review court docket re recent filings posted (.5); compile a list of today's filings (.5); update NOA List (.5); correspond w/ conflicts re search (.3).	1.80	Brewster, Jacqueline
25490546	5/21/2020	Respond to case correspondence (.4); review docket filings (.1); participate on internal coordination call (.5).	1.00	Fleck, Evan R.
25489102	5/21/2020	Update conflicts tracker (1.2); follow-up edits re same (1.4); update internal folder re same (.1).	2.70	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 31 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including WIP and Case Calendar)			
	Date	Description	Hours	Name	
25480591	5/21/2020	Edit supplementary IATA statement (.2); correspond w/ D. O'Donnell (.1) and T. Ragones (.1) re same; call w/ M. Smith re case status and transition and business segmentation concerns (.3); follow-up correspondence w/ P. Milender and E. Fleck re same (.1).	0.80	Silverman, Stephen D.	
25490464	5/21/2020	Further assemble precedent airline cases agendas and related transcripts and quality review same.	2.10	Thomas, Charmaine	
25498407	5/21/2020	Check Court Docket for updates (.1); summarize and distribut updates to the team (.2).	0.30	Zahoroda, Yuliya	
25497305	5/22/2020	Prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re rejection motion (.5); circulate today's filings to A. Metviner (.5); update pleading files (.3); coordinate updates to automatic alerts with A. Stone (.3); update NOA chart (.5); correspond w/ conflicts re same (.2).	2.30	Brewster, Jacqueline	
25488992	5/22/2020	Respond to case correspondence.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.	
25491821	5/22/2020	Review Avianca docket and recently filed pleadings (.3); prepare daily summary for team (.2).	0.50	Metviner, Aaron	
25497182	5/23/2020	Correspond w/ A. Metviner and library re retrieval of precedent filings (.5); review case docket re same (1.0); retrieve J. Glenn opinions (4.0).	5.50	Brewster, Jacqueline	
25489120	5/23/2020	Respond to correspondence re case strategy.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.	
25488946	5/23/2020	Coordinate listen only line for 5/26 hearing.	0.70	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia	
25490569	5/23/2020	Continue to review and upload precedent Judge Glenn's chapter 11 opinions.	2.90	Thomas, Charmaine	
25485744	5/24/2020	Update dataroom w/ new documents from J. Ramirez (Avianca).	0.20	Silverman, Stephen D.	

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 32 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including WIP and Case Calendar)		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25490578 5/24/2020	Review docket re 5-26 hearing (.1); review emails re CourtSolutions re same (.2).	0.30	Thomas, Charmaine
25522036 5/25/2020	Prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re 5/26 hearing agenda (.5); correspond w/ A. Metviner re precedent pleadings (.5).	1.00	Brewster, Jacqueline
25486086 5/25/2020	Review work streams, task list, and general case administration (.3); draft/revise proposed Peru order (.2).	0.50	Milender, Parker
25521505 5/25/2020	Further review and upload precedent Judge Glenn's chapter 11 opinions.	2.70	Thomas, Charmaine
25521784 5/26/2020	 Research docket re new filings posted to docket (.5); list today's filing for internal group(.3); update NOA list (.5); correspond/w conflicts re same (.2); correspond w/ P. Prudenti and A. Metviner re archived precedent filings (.5). 	2.00	Brewster, Jacqueline
25496672 5/26/2020	Respond to case correspondence.	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25516841 5/26/2020	Dial in re 5/26 hearing (.2); monitor same (.1).	0.30	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia
25525646 5/26/2020	Review Avianca docket (.1); send internal update re the same (.2); review Peru pleadings (.4); coordinate dial in and hearing setup (.2).	0.90	Metviner, Aaron
25521451 5/26/2020	Monitor filing of airline case (.5); create case files and populate logs (3.2); create index (.6) and organize documents for (.4) first day ebinders; distribute same to team (.2); revise pleadings files (.3); set up CourtSolutions line for 5-28 first day hearing (.4).	5.60	Thomas, Charmaine
25528230 5/26/2020	Review daily case updates.	0.10	Zahoroda, Yuliya

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 33 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including WIP and Case Calendar)		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25521833 5/27/2020	Review court docket re recent filings posted (.4); compile a list of today's filings (.3); update NOA List (.2); correspond w/ conflicts re search (.3).	1.20	Brewster, Jacqueline
25502422 5/27/2020	Review docket filings (.1); respond to case correspondence (.6).	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.
25500959 5/27/2020	Research re utilities issue (.7); review work streams, task list, and general case admin. (.7).	1.40	Milender, Parker
25521491 5/27/2020	Review recent precedent for a notice of filing a document under seal and draft same.	0.30	Thomas, Charmaine
25521538 5/27/2020	Update transcripts and distribute 5-26 hrg. to team (.2); review hearing transcripts invoices, prepare voucher and distribute for atty. sig. (.2).	0.40	Thomas, Charmaine
25522031 5/28/2020	Prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re Notice of Filing Under Seal (.5); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.2); review court docket re recent filings posted (.5); compile a list of today's filings (.5); update NOA List (.2); correspond w/ conflicts re search (.3); retrieve J. Glenn opinions (1.9); prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re Retention Application for Milbank, SGR, FTI, KCC (1.0); prepare pleadings for filing in S.D.N.Y. Bankr. Ct re OCP and Interim Comp Motions (1.0); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.2).	6.30	Brewster, Jacqueline
25508577 5/28/2020	Participate on internal team update call (.4); respond to case correspondence (.7).	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 34 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including will and Case Calendar)			
	Date	Description	Hours	Name	
25521497	5/28/2020	Review and distribute precedent re airline cases (.2); update case documents. re same (.2); review and order 5-28 hrg. transc. re same (.2); update case logs (.2); further review and upload precedent Judge Glenn's chapter 11 opinions (.6).	1.40	Thomas, Charmaine	
25521793	5/29/2020	Review court docket re recent filings posted (.4); compile a list of today's filings (.3); update NOA List (.5); correspond w/ conflicts re search (.3); update pleading files (.3); review J. Glenn opinions (1.8).	3.60	Brewster, Jacqueline	
25518152	5/29/2020	Respond to case correspondence (.4); review docket filings (.2); participate on internal coordination call with P. Milender, G. Bray and D. O'Donnell (.5); follow-up with G. Bray (.2).	1.30	Fleck, Evan R.	
25516978	5/29/2020	Cross reference Judge Glenn's opinions (2.1); pull cases re same (1.8).	3.90	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia	
25512503	5/29/2020	Review task list (.2); coordinate work streams re same (.4).	0.60	Milender, Parker	
25532805	5/29/2020	Prepare agenda re team update call.	1.20	O'Donnell, Dennis C.	
25515311	5/29/2020	Confer w/ S. Silverman, P. Milender re materials for Debtors on assumption/rejection.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.	
25527717	5/29/2020	Review UST guidelines (.8); prepare budget and staffing draft (1.5); emails with D. O'Donnell re same (.2); draft hearing agenda (1.1).	3.60	Zahoroda, Yuliya	
25518518	5/30/2020	Respond to case correspondence.	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.	
25518599	5/31/2020	Respond to matter correspondence.	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.	
25552387	5/31/2020	Comment on board update (.9); address NOA update process (.8).	1.70	O'Donnell, Dennis C.	

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 35 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00012 Avianca - Case Administration (including WIP and Case Calendar)

Date	Description	Hours Name

25521458 5/31/2020 Continue to review (2.1) and upload (2.1) precedent Judge Glenn's chapter 11 opinions.

4.20 Thomas, Charmaine

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 36 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00013 Avianca - General Case Strategy (Including team calls)

	Date Description Hours Na			,
25426516 5	5/11/2020	Review/respond to case correspondence.	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25419914 5	5/11/2020	Call with working group re strategy and coordination.	0.50	Goff, Steve
25427033 5	5/11/2020	Attend to Avianca first day prep (2.3); continue to review Mesa first day relief and transcript (1.2); draft email to internal team noting observations and issues from Mesa (.6); correspond with P. Milender, E. Fleck, D. O'Donnell re same in advance of first day hearing (.2).	4.30	Metviner, Aaron
25602938 5	5/11/2020	Attend Milbank call re internal coordination.	0.50	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25459004 5	5/11/2020	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.5) daily internal coordination call w/ Milbank team.	0.60	Parchment, Ryan
25424614 5	5/11/2020	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.5) Milbank team call re first day hearings.	0.60	Renenger, Aaron L.
25421085 5	5/11/2020	Attend daily internal coordination call.	0.50	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25425303 5	5/11/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Client call (.5); review Swissport documents (.3).	0.80	Stone, Alan J.
25461803 5	5/11/2020	Attend to team call re internal coordination (.5); prepare for first day hearing (1.0).	1.50	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25434162 5	5/12/2020	Attend internal team calls re workstreams.	0.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25602939 5	5/12/2020	Attend call re legal issues stemming from first day hearing (.5).	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25458083 5	5/13/2020	Review second day orders (2.9); t/cs, email re same (1.1).	4.00	Bray, Gregory A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 37 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	,
25458457 5/13/2020	Correspond with P. Milender re precedent airline cases, docket reviews (.1); review AMR, Mesa, Republic dockets, motions (2); correspond with legal assistants re pull of and assistance with same (.2); note pleadings of note for internal team (.2).	2.50	Metviner, Aaron
25438577 5/13/2020	Atttend various calls re workstreams.	0.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25439534 5/13/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Client call (.4); call w/ M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg, F. Nunez, E. Fleck re same (.5).	0.90	Stone, Alan J.
25462439 5/14/2020	Attend internal Milbank planning call.	0.60	Behrens, James C.
25442936 5/14/2020	T/c with Joele Frank regarding emails strategy (.3); participate on Milbank team coordination call (.6).	0.90	Fleck, Evan R.
25458315 5/14/2020	Attend Avianca internal team call.	0.60	Metviner, Aaron
25444410 5/14/2020	Attend Milbank team call (.6); attend fleet strategy call w/ Seabury and Milbank teams (.7); calls/emails w/ FTI re first day motion caps (1.1); first day motions follow up call w/ E. Fleck (.5); emails w/ D. O'Donnell and G. Bray re customer programs strategy (.4).	3.30	Milender, Parker
25440263 5/14/2020	Attend status and coordination call with Milbank team (partial).	0.20	Nunez, Francisco R.
25441889 5/14/2020	Attend team meeting.	0.60	Renenger, Aaron L.
25447835 5/14/2020	Attend first day hearing follow-up call to cover outstanding items and legal research (.5); read Borders opinion per same (.3).	0.80	Silverman, Stephen D.
25442796 5/14/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Client call.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25441455 5/14/2020	Attend bi-weekly team call.	0.60	Wolf, Julie M.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 38 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44010.00015 Avianca - General Case Strategy (Includ	ing team o	(alls)
]	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25451610 5	5/15/2020	Consider resolution of issues from first day hearing.	1.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25450433 5	5/15/2020	Attend team calls re coordination on work streams.	1.30	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25450560 5	5/16/2020	Respond to internal emails re process.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25450312 5	5/17/2020	Review various internal communications re process.	0.70	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25455875 5	5/18/2020	Respond to various communications with team members.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25480490 5	5/18/2020	Correspond w/ P. Milender and E. Fleck re UCC composition matters (.1); review precedent re same (.2).	0.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25462241 5	5/19/2020	Attend bi-weekly call re status update.	0.80	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25491595 5	5/19/2020	Attend Avianca team strategy call.	0.80	Metviner, Aaron
25466575 5	5/19/2020	Attend (partial) status call w/ Milbank team (.6); review correspondence from M. Mottesi, E. Fleck, G. Guitart and S. Silverman re multiple coordination matters (.1).	0.70	Nunez, Francisco R.
25466555 5	5/19/2020	Attend bi-weekly team call.	0.80	Renenger, Aaron L.
25469665 5	5/19/2020	Attend (partial) bi-weekly team call.	0.50	Richards, Pablo
25602942 5	5/19/2020	Attend bi-weekly team call.	0.80	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25480527 5	5/19/2020	Attend (partial) internal call.	0.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25468912 5	5/19/2020	Attend Milbank coordination call.	0.80	Stone, Alan J.
25491716 5	5/20/2020	Review Glenn precedent opinions re multiple chapter 11 case issues.	2.60	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 39 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

I	Date	Description	Hours	
25472964 5/	/20/2020	Attend team calls.	0.70	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25472135 5/	/20/2020	Coordinate case strategy with M. Mottesi.	0.50	Stirnberg, Tobias
25473347 5/	/20/2020	Discussion w/ G. Bray, H. Schwarz, S. Goff, R. Parchment (.5); Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call (.4).	0.90	Stone, Alan J.
25477804 5/	/21/2020	Telephone conference with working group re status and issues.	0.50	Goff, Steve
25491447 5/	/21/2020	Review J. Glenn opinions from prior cases.	1.10	Metviner, Aaron
25477040 5/	/21/2020	Attend bi-weekly Milbank team call (.6); attend daily Seabury/Avianca/Milbank call (.4).	1.00	Milender, Parker
25477852 5/	/21/2020	Respond to team emails.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25476393 5/	/21/2020	Attend (partial) call w/ Milbank team.	0.50	Nunez, Francisco R.
25477624 5/	/21/2020	Attend bi-weekly internal Milbank call.	0.60	Renenger, Aaron L.
25480840 5/	/21/2020	Attend bi-weekly team meeting.	0.60	Richards, Pablo
25480604 5/	/21/2020	Attend (partial) call w/ Milbank team.	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25479054 5/	/21/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call.	0.40	Stone, Alan J.
25498536 5/	/21/2020	Attend (partial) internal call with team.	0.50	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25491381 5/	/22/2020	Continue review of Glenn precedent decisions (2.4); correspond with E. Fleck re same (.2), legal assistants re additional cases (.2).	2.80	Metviner, Aaron
25487579 5/	/22/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25525657 5/	/23/2020	Conduct research re UCC member selections (1.0); correspond with P. Milender, E. Fleck re same (.1).	1.10	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 40 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Horosofi Avianca - Ocnerar Case Se		,
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25529941 5/26/20	Review status of outstanding items (.3); attend internal planning call (.3).	0.60	Behrens, James C.
25525658 5/26/20	20 Attend Avianca internal strategy and workstreams call.	0.30	Metviner, Aaron
25495508 5/26/20	Attend team call (.3); attend (partial) call w/ Seabury, Milbank, and Debtors (.3).	0.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25512125 5/26/20	Correspond w/ C. Lipe (Joele Frank) re multiple pending PR matters and Peru (.2); review materials re same (.3).	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25496265 5/26/20	20 Attend Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25525639 5/27/20	Review 20 second day pleadings and orders (7.6); comment on same (2.1); email re same (.3).	10.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25512118 5/27/20	 Review case management order and judge's procedures (.3); correspond w/ D. O'Donnell and D. Calderon (KCC) re multiple noticing issues (.2). 	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25505036 5/27/20	20 Attend Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25525079 5/28/20	20 Attend internal Milbank planning call.	0.50	Behrens, James C.
25526247 5/28/20	Correspond with E. Fleck, P. Milender, D. O'Donnell re UCC overadvisoring issue (.2); continue research re same (.5); correspond with P. Milender, D. O'Donnell, Y. Zaharoda re Avianca workstreams (.2); attend Avianca internal strategy and workstreams call (.5).	1.40	Metviner, Aaron
25507752 5/28/20	Attend bi-weekly Milbank team call (.5); call w/ A. Stone and DPW re LifeMiles issues (.2).	0.70	Milender, Parker
25508011 5/28/20	Attend multiple team calls.	1.20	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 41 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	0	Name
	1		
25505031 5/28/2020	Attend internal status call with Milbank team.	0.50	Nunez, Francisco R.
25505335 5/28/2020	Attend (partial) bi-weekly internal coordination call.	0.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25505727 5/28/2020	Attend (partial) internal coordination call.	0.40	Silverman, Stephen D.
25511120 5/28/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25526856 5/29/2020	Review Power by hour issues.	4.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25526284 5/29/2020	Continue research re UCC advisor issues (.3); correspond with Y. Zaharoda re same (.1).	0.40	Metviner, Aaron
25512496 5/29/2020	Attend team coordination call w/ D. O'Donnell, G. Bray and E. Fleck.	0.70	Milender, Parker
25516436 5/29/2020	Attend team internal call.	0.70	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25512050 5/29/2020	Review email from S. Silverman re coordination call.	0.10	Nunez, Francisco R.
25515579 5/29/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25516369 5/30/2020	Respond to multiple emails.	0.40	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25526281 5/31/2020	Review Judge Glenn precedent re key chapter 11 issues (2.1); prepare annotated index of Glenn opinions for internal team's review (.8).	2.90	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 42 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	
Date	Description	IIUUIS	
25615009 5/11/2020	Internal emails w/ G. Bray, H. Schwarz, E. Fleck, R. Parchment, P. Milender re adequate protection stipulation (.2); review (.1) and edit (.2) adequate protection stipulation; emails re same (.1).	0.60	Stone, Alan J.
25432416 5/12/2020	Attend conference call with G. Hughes, L. Grindal (Seabury) and G. Bray re comments received from counterparties to draft AP stipulation and proposed revisions to address same.	0.70	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25438305 5/13/2020	Review comments to confidentiality agreements from potential DIP lenders (2.0); provide comments to draft agreements from potential DIP lenders (1.7).	3.70	Goff, Steve
25440325 5/13/2020	Call with L. Grindal, N. Wesson, K. Raff, D. Brand (all Seabury) and G. Bray, S. Goff re terms of proposed AP Stipulation.	1.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25441688 5/14/2020	Review comments to confidentiality agreements from additional potential DIP lenders (1.2); review return NDA proposals from potential DIP lenders (.8); provide comments to such agreements and proposals (.8); review comments from the Company to DIP lender proposal NDA (.2); correspond with the Company re the same (.2).	3.20	Goff, Steve
25442103 5/14/2020	Call with G. Hughes, L. Grindal, N. Wesson, D. Brand (all Seabury), G. Bray, S. Goff re revised draft AP stipulation (.8); call with L. Avila (Avianca), G. Hughes and L. Grindal (both Seabury), J. Tenen and P. Barlow (both SGR) re further revised draft AP stipulation and rejection motion (.7).	1.50	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 43 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description		Name
25444757	5/15/2020	Review comments to confidentiality agreements from new potential DIP lenders (1.5); review return NDA proposals from potential DIP lenders (.8); draft comments to such agreements and proposals (1.0); call with potential DIP lender and counsel re NDA (.4); correspondence with the Company re execution of agreements (.3).	4.00	Goff, Steve
25444913	5/15/2020	Call w/ potential DIP lender re NDA.	0.50	Milender, Parker
25450390	5/15/2020	Multiple teleconferences with DIP providers re their questions.	1.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25447681	5/16/2020	Review NDA proposals from potential DIP lenders (.7); draft comments to such agreements and proposals (.5); correspond with Company and Seabury re same (.2).	1.40	Goff, Steve
25455330	5/18/2020	Review return NDA proposals from potential DIP lenders (.7); draft comments to such agreements and proposals (.4); conference with Seabury re the same (.1); correspondence with Seabury re the same (.2).	1.40	Goff, Steve
25468658	5/19/2020	Consider adequate protection issues for counterparties.	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25468774	5/19/2020	Review return NDA proposals from potential DIP lenders (2.7); telephone conferences with potential lenders re the same (.8); correspondence with potential lenders re the same (.8); revise draft NDAs (2.0).	6.30	Goff, Steve
25469671	5/19/2020	Revise NDAs for DIP solicitation w/ S. Goff.	1.20	Milender, Parker
25469816	5/19/2020	Review notice of revised rejection order (.2); comment on drafts of AP stipulation for revolving credit agreement with Citibank as collateral agent (1.4).	1.60	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 44 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

D - 4 -	Nama		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
5497788 5/20/2020	Review stipulations and other adequate protection issues.	5.00	Bray, Gregory A.
5473333 5/20/2020	Continued work on adequate protection stipulations.	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.
5473046 5/20/2020	Review return NDA proposals from additional potential DIP lenders (1.8); telephone conferences with potential lenders and counsel re the same (1.2); correspondence with potential lenders re the same (.5); revise draft NDAs re discussions (1.6).	5.10	Goff, Steve
5473290 5/20/2020	Revise NDAs for DIP solicitation (.6); call w/ prospective DIP lender re same (.5).	1.10	Milender, Parker
5473362 5/20/2020	Consider A&O comments on behalf of Airbus ECAs and ATR ECAs to form of AP stipulation (.5); comment on SGR draft of Exhibit B to second AP stipulation re power-by-the hour arrangements for use of aircraft (1.1); comment on internal draft of second AP stipulation to amend and restate first AP stipulation (.7); review revised SGR draft of Exhibit B to second AP stipulation re power-by-the hour arrangements for use of aircraft (.1).	2.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.
5477664 5/21/2020	Review return NDA proposals from additional potential DIP lenders (1.1); telephone conference with potential lenders and counsel re the same (.3); correspondence with potential lenders re the same (.4); revise draft NDAs re discussions and comments (1.7); email correspondence with Avianca re execution of NDAs (.2); coordinate filing of AP stipulations with court (.5); email correspondence with counsel re filing of first stipulation (.3); telephone conferences with counsel re the same (.2).	4.70	Goff, Steve

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 45 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	_	44010.00014 Avianca - Casii Conateral/Adequate 1		
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25602943	5/21/2020	Call re DIP financing collateral (.3); draft	1.70	Milender, Parker
		(.4) and revise (.3) AP stipulation; calls w/G. Bray, N. Jensen and H. Schwartz re same (.7).		
25479780	5/22/2020	Telephone conference with Avianca and Seabury re potential DIP lender NDA (.2); telephone conferences with counsel to potential DIP lenders re NDAs (.2); review comments to draft NDAs from potential DIP lenders and counsel (2.2); revise NDAs re the same (1.5); email correspondence with Avianca re execution of agreed NDAs (.2); coordinate service to creditors re signed first stipulations (.6).	4.90	Goff, Steve
25480671	5/22/2020	Call re DIP NDAs (.4); revise same (.8).	1.20	Milender, Parker
25485287	5/22/2020	Review DIP teaser materials.	0.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25482651	5/22/2020	Review NRF comments on behalf of KGAL to rejection stipulation (.2); confer G. Bray, S. Goff and P. Milender re same (.2); prepare note to Seabury re NRF comments and proposed resolution (.2); correspondence with Mayer Brown (counsel to BNP) and Seabury re rejection of 4 ATRs (.2); call with G. Hughes (Seabury) re her call with BNP re rejection of 4 ATRs (.2).	1.00	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25482468	5/23/2020	Review agreed form NDAs (.2); correspond with Avianca re the same (.1).	0.30	Goff, Steve
25577515	5/23/2020	Research precedent re DIP lenders.	1.50	Metviner, Aaron
25482749	5/23/2020	Correspond with J. Tenen (SGR) re available DIP collateral.	0.20	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 46 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44010.00014 Avianca - Cash Conateral/Ade	quate Protection/1	DIP
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25482427 5/24/2020	Conference with potential DIP lender re draft NDA (.1); review agreement re the same (.2); review agreed NDA from potential DIP lender (.1); email correspondence with Avianca re the same (.1); email correspondence with Seabury re the same (.1).	0.60	Goff, Steve
25485503 5/25/2020	Prep for and participate in T/C with GS re DIP questions.	1.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25483099 5/25/2020	Call with A. Neuhauser (Avianca), P. Armstrong, E. Chase (Goldman), E. Fleck, G. Bray et al. re DIP questions.	0.90	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25496293 5/26/2020	Review comments to NDA from potential DIP lenders (.5); provide comments to NDA proposals (.3); email correspondence with Seabury and Avianca re the same (.2).	1.00	Goff, Steve
25498133 5/26/2020	Call w/ third party potential DIP lender (.9); review NDAs for same (.3).	1.20	Milender, Parker
25493872 5/26/2020	Call with A. Neuhauser (Avianca), J. Luth (Seabury), E. Chase (Goldman), T. Stirnberg, M. Mottesi (Milbank) re financial model and collateral for purposes of DIP.	1.00	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25515220 5/27/2020	Review comments to adequate protection stipulation (.2); discuss same with H. Schwarz (.1); correspond w/ Seabury re same (.1).	0.40	Jensen, Niels
25500934 5/27/2020	Review four broken out AP stipulations for ATR ECA aircraft.	0.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25525690 5/28/2020	Review adequate protection for Citi and multiple stipulations (8.8); t/cs, email re same (1.2).	10.00	Bray, Gregory A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 47 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25515321 5/28/2020	Call with Seabury and Avianca re adequate protection stipulation (.5); review underlying financing documents re same (.6); discuss same with G. Bray, P. Milender, H. Schwarz and S. Goff (.2).	1.30	Jensen, Niels
25506361 5/28/2020	Provide comments on side letter to stakeholder loan and Citadel loan.	0.60	Stirnberg, Tobias
25525550 5/29/2020	Review DIP issues.	3.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25515506 5/29/2020	Comment on stakeholder and Citadel side letters for second liens (.3); emails re same (.1).	0.40	Stirnberg, Tobias
25518539 5/30/2020	T/C with counsel to secured bondholders re adequate protection (.3); email with Debtors (.1).	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 48 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00015 Avianca - Cash Manangement

Da	ıte	Description	Hours	Name
25425936 5/11	1/2020	Revise cash management order (.4); attend to bank/cash issues (.5).	0.90	Milender, Parker
25456919 5/13	3/2020	Review cash management agreement.	0.10	Grushkin, Jay D.
25444366 5/14	4/2020	Draft email to L. Avila (Avianca) re bank account/cash management issues.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25453541 5/14		Coordinate precedent search of Judge Glenn's final cash management orders (.5); circulate same (.3).	0.80	Thomas, Charmaine
25453793 5/16		Further review Judge Glenn final cash management orders and distribute same.	0.40	Thomas, Charmaine
25458697 5/18	3/2020	Emails w/ Company re cash management issues.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25457838 5/18	3/2020	Attend payment committee call.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25468882 5/19	9/2020	Attend payment Committee call.	1.00	Stone, Alan J.
25473263 5/20	0/2020	Call w/ third party vendor re cash management solutions; review of services agreement for same.	1.10	Milender, Parker
25473117 5/20)/2020	Attend payment Committee call.	0.70	Stone, Alan J.
25479086 5/21	1/2020	Attend payment Committee call.	1.30	Stone, Alan J.
25487654 5/22	2/2020	Attend payment Committee call.	0.70	Stone, Alan J.
25505097 5/27	7/2020	Attend payment Committee call.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25507529 5/28		Call w/ Company re cash management issues and review of emails for same.	0.80	Milender, Parker
25512487 5/29		Call w/ FTI and UCC advisors re cash management issues (1.0); emails w/ Company re same (.8).	1.80	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 49 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00015 Avianca - Cash Manangement

Date	Description	Hours Name

25515282 5/29/2020 Attend payment Committee call.

0.30 Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 50 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00016 Avianca - Claims Analysis/Estimation/Objection

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25468750 5/19/2020	Review reclamation claims questions (1.8); emails with S. Silverman and P. Milender re same (.7).	2.50	Behrens, James C.
25473377 5/20/2020	Draft settlement procedures motion.	3.10	Milender, Parker
25477063 5/21/2020	Revise settlement procedures motion.	0.50	Milender, Parker
25480674 5/22/2020	Emails w/ Company re settlements of prepetition claims.	0.80	Milender, Parker
25524743 5/29/2020	Review emails related to reclamation claims (.6); internal communications re reclamation issues (.5).	1.10	Behrens, James C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 51 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44010.00017 Avianca - Communications with	Company	
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25426502	5/11/2020	Numerous follow-up calls and preparation calls with client in connection with first-day hearing (1.8); participate on Board working group call (1.0); attention to follow-up (.2).	3.00	Fleck, Evan R.
25436047	5/12/2020	Numerous calls and emails with Company management re payment questions and counterparty issues.	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25436422	5/12/2020	Call w/ Company re chapter 11 operating considerations (1.9); draft emails to Company re chapter 11 inquiries (2.0).	3.90	Milender, Parker
25433998	5/12/2020	Follow-up re status of Peru cargo flights.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25615367	5/12/2020	Calls with R. Galindo (.4), L. Avila (.3), R. Covelo (.2); A. Neuhauser (.2) (all Avianca) re Company issues and strategy.	1.10	Stirnberg, Tobias
25439468	5/13/2020	Calls w/ Company re Peru strategy (1.1), labor issues (.5), lender-specific issues (.7), insurance motion issues (1.7), and vendor issues (1.2).	5.20	Milender, Parker
25438479	5/13/2020	Prepare training to region-wide employees (2.7); attend virtual meeting with region wide employees (.9); attend working group coordination call (.6).	4.20	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25442777	5/14/2020	Participate on daily call with leadership team (.5); review follow-up matters (.3); review/respond to client correspondence (.4); participate on board working group (.5); calls with Directors re governance considerations (.8).	2.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25444402	5/14/2020	Attend daily Milbank/Avianca/Seabury call (.4); draft email responses to Company re inquiries re first day motions (.8).	1.20	Milender, Parker
25442407	5/14/2020	Respond to multiple emails with Company.	1.30	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 52 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44010,00017 Avianca - Communications with C	ompany	
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25645400		Calle with A. Newharrens (2), L. Avile (4).	0.20	Otimberg Tabias
25615499 5	5/14/2020	Calls with A. Neuhauser (.2), L. Avila (.1) (both Avianca) re Company issues and strategy.	0.30	Stirnberg, Tobias
25444880 5	5/15/2020	Daily call w/ Seabury and Company (.4); call w/ Seabury and Company re labor issues (.7).	1.10	Milender, Parker
25457035 5	5/18/2020	Calls with Debtors regarding vendor matters (.8); participate on board working group call (1.0); work on board memo (.8); t/cs with CFO (.4).	3.00	Fleck, Evan R.
25602944 5	5/18/2020	Calls/emails w/ Company (C. Ortega, R. Galindo, L. Avila) re settlement of claims, Peru issues, and other general restructuring questions (1.6); attend daily call w/ Seabury and management (.3); draft/revise restructuring update memo to board (.6).	2.50	Milender, Parker
25468779 5	5/19/2020	Numerous calls with Debtors' management re pending matters.	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25469647 5	5/19/2020	Attend (partial) daily call w/ management, Milbank and Seabury (.4); emails w/ Company re customer programs and general ch. 11 inquiries (.6).	1.00	Milender, Parker
25467388 5	5/19/2020	Catch up call (.4); calls w/ team re same (.8).	1.20	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25577513 5	5/19/2020	Call with G. Pena (Avianca) re cargo receivables of Tampa Cargo under revolving credit facility with Citi as collateral agent (.3).	0.30	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25473376 5	5/20/2020	Participate on daily update call with management and Seabury (.4); calls with CFO re multiple case management matters (.6).	1.00	Fleck, Evan R.
25473338 5	5/20/2020	Attend daily call w/ Milbank, Seabury and Avianca teams.	0.40	Milender, Parker
25473096 5	5/20/2020	Calls with Company.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 53 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44010.00017 Avianca - Communications v	with Company	
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25490785 5/21/2020	Participate in daily leadership call (.4); prepare for Board working group call (.2); participate on same (1.1); numerous calls with CFO (.7).	2.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25477665 5/21/2020	Multiple calls with Company.	0.70	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25489032 5/22/2020	Participate on daily leadership team call (partial) (.3); numerous calls with CFO re operational matters (.9).	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25485463 5/22/2020	TCs with Company.	1.20	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25489106 5/23/2020	Comment on weekly status update for Board (.4); call with CEO re UCC (.3).	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.
25602945 5/23/2020	Draft email to Debtors re SFC request (.6); draft update memo to board re restructuring (1.1).	1.70	Milender, Parker
25482231 5/24/2020	Draft/revise restructuring update memo for board.	0.50	Milender, Parker
25487337 5/25/2020	Call with CFO re multiple pending matters (.4); revise materials for Board and respond to questions (.4).	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25602946 5/25/2020	Draft email to Company re settlement of claims issues (.2); draft/revise restructuring update for board (.3); call w/ Company re distribution contracts (.5).	1.00	Milender, Parker
25496642 5/26/2020	Participate on weekly leadership call.	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25498077 5/26/2020	Attend daily call w/ Company and Milbank/Seabury teams (.7); draft email to Company re Peru inquiry (.2).	0.90	Milender, Parker
25495472 5/26/2020	Multiple T/Cs with Company management.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 54 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
	•		
25502432 5/27/2020	Participate on daily leadership team call.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25500990 5/27/2020	Attend daily Seabury/Milbank/Avianca call (.5); calls w/ L. Avila (Avianca) and legal teams re rejection and Peru issues (.8).	1.30	Milender, Parker
25508492 5/28/2020	Participate on board call (1.1); review follow-up matters (.2); numerous calls with CFO re same (.3).	1.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25507771 5/28/2020	Call with Company re Peru/credit card issues (.5); correspond with Company re contract rejection and general operational issues (1.2).	1.70	Milender, Parker
25518139 5/29/2020	Participate on daily leadership team call (.4); follow-up call re Committee issues (.5).	0.90	Fleck, Evan R.
25512505 5/29/2020	Attend daily Milbank/Seabury/Avianca call (.3); respond to email inquiries from Company re operational/chapter 11 issues (1.0).	1.30	Milender, Parker
25513176 5/30/2020	Draft restructuring update memo to board.	1.10	Milender, Parker
25518678 5/31/2020	Continue draft of restructuring update memo to board.	0.30	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 55 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44010.00010 Avianca - Supplier and v	chuor issues	
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25425373 5/11/2020	Call w/ C. Galixto and team re vendor reaction (1.0); call w/ G. Hughes (Seabury), L. Avila (Avianca) re credit card processors (.3).	1.30	Stone, Alan J.
25430121 5/12/2020	Translate relevant provisions of vendor agreement (.3) and notice of termination of agreement (.4).	0.70	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25447819 5/12/2020	Correspond w/ P. Milender re claims' issues and vendor inquiries (.1); review motion re same (.2).	0.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25435490 5/12/2020	Review Elavon agreements (1.0); follow up emails to D. Calixto re vendors (.3); review emails from D. Calixto re vendor terminations (.2); call w/ Dorsey re Elavon (vendor) (.3); email report to L. Avila (Avianca) re Elavon call (.2); analyze termination letters from vendors (.5); confer with G. Hughes (Seabury) re vendor terminations (.3); confer with R. Parchment re vendor responses (.2); confer with E. Fleck re interest rate swaps (.2).	3.20	Stone, Alan J.
25436430 5/13/2020	Review translation of e-mails re Kayak termination.	0.30	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25447854 5/13/2020	Review (.3) and update (.9) supplementary letters to employee and supplier groups re notice of commencement; correspond w/ L. Parrish (Joele Frank (.2), E. Fleck (.1), P. Milender (.1) re same; call w/ J. Morrow re numerous noticing matters and same (.3); follow-up correspondence w/ D. O'Donnell re same (.1); correspond w/ U.S. Trustee re same (.1).	1.90	Silverman, Stephen D.
25602947 5/13/2020	Call w/ certain vendor (.3); review motions and orders re his inquiries (.3); correspond w/ E. Fleck re same (.1); correspond w/ G. Hughes (Seabury) and P. Milender re claims' issues (.1); call w/ another vendor re same (.3).	1.10	Silverman, Stephen D.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 56 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25439629 5/13/2020	Edit letters to vendors (.5); analyze Kayak agreements (.5); confer with R. Parchment re Kayak (.2); emails w/ client re vendors for Brazil flight (.4); review vendor contracts and respond to threats of termination (2.0); call w/ P. Milender re vendors (.2); call w/ R. Parchment re vendor letters (.2); emails w/ D. Calixto re vendors (.5).	4.50	Stone, Alan J.
25440500 5/14/2020	T/c with L. Avila (Avianca), N. Garcia and Davivienda business team re chapter 11 background (.5); T/c with L. Avila, N. Garcia and Banco Agricola business team re chapter 11 background (.4); translate e-mail from Chubb for internal review (.5).	1.40	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25442778 5/14/2020	Email w/ G. Hughes (Seabury) and review Michelin documents (.2); emails w/ client re Dnata (.3); edit vendor letters (1.0); emails w/ D. Calixto re vendors (1.0); call w/ counsel for Boeing (.3); emails w/ client re Boeing (.3); emails w/ S. Silverman re letters to vendors (.2); emails re Chubb/surety bonds (.2).	3.50	Stone, Alan J.
25446192 5/15/2020	Translate internal correspondence re eDreams-Odigeo agency.	0.30	Guitart, Gonzalo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 57 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

_	Date	Description	Hours	Name
254477	95 5/15/2020	Correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) and A. Stone (Milbank) re suppliers and vendors issuing threats and seeking to modify certain contractual terms (.6); edit automatic stay letters re same (.7); attend another call w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re particularly urgent vendor issue and threat of litigation (.3); call w/ R. Jaffe (Morgan Lewis) re another vendor and supplier matter (.3); review certain orders and motions re same (.5); correspond w/ E. Fleck re same (.1); attend call w/ L. Parrish (Joele Frank) and multiple people at Company re revisions to vendor and supplier letters and other public materials (.4); edits and drafting to materials re same (.5): correspond w/ D. O'Donnell re same (.1); review hid edits to materials re same (.2); further correspond w/ L. Parrish re same (.1); legal research re same (.8).	4.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
254504	65 5/15/2020	Call w/ client re treatment of vendors, customers, agencies (1.0); emails w/ client re Swissport (.2); edit Michelin letter (.2); emails w/ client re Boeing (1.0); emails w/ counsel for Boeing (.2); review documents from vendors (.5); emails w/ Maria Catalina Perdomo re vendors (.3); review documents relating to edreams (.3); emails w/ client re surety programs (.3); call w/ P. Milender re surety program (.2).	4.20	Stone, Alan J.
254478	21 5/16/2020	Edit revised ally and supplier letters, FAQs, and talking points (.8); correspond w/ H. Salas (Joele Frank) re same (.1).	0.90	Silverman, Stephen D.
254502	30 5/16/2020	Confer with R. Parchment re vendor letters (.3); edit vendor letters (.4); emails w/ D. Calixto re vendors (.2).	0.90	Stone, Alan J.
254516	50 5/17/2020	Review materials regarding Boeing (.4); attend client call re same (.5).	0.90	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 58 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25480201 5/17/2020	Edit six new auto stay letters to six individual vendors issuing threats (1.3); correspond w/ R. Parchment re same and related legal issues (.2); correspond w/ M. Catalina re same (.2); attend call w/ multiple Avianca employees re Boeing contract and procurement issues (.5); correspond w/ E. Fleck re same (.1); correspond w/ A. Stone re same (.1); prepare notes summarizing call for A. Stone (.4); edit three additional FAQs and letters concerning allys, vendors and suppliers (2.1); correspond w/ H. Salas re same(.1).	5.00	Silverman, Stephen D.
25451432 5/17/2020	Call w/ E. Fleck, client re Boeing (.7) emails w/M. Catalina Perdomo re vendors (.2).	0.90	Stone, Alan J.
25454118 5/18/2020	Call with C. Borrero and G. Monroy (Bancolombia) and L. Avila (Avianca) re update on chapter 11 process (.4); complete review of KYC documents re appointment of CSC as trustee (1.1); revise translation of notice to Ecuadorian vendor (.7).	2.20	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25480516 5/18/2020	Comment on three more vendor letters or revised versions of same (.8); correspond w/ R. Parchment re same (.1): review his edits (.2); correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re the foregoing (.2); correspond w/ A. Stone re related matters (.1); correspond w/ P. Milender and D. O'Donnell re prepetition vendor settlement (.2); brief legal research re same (1.4).	3.00	Silverman, Stephen D.
25457784 5/18/2020	Call w/client re Boeing (.5); call w/ counsel for Boeing (.5); edit AMEX letter (.3); review letter to CAE (.2); review vendor letters (.5); email re Total Pack (.2); emails re Ecuador cleaning service (.2); emails w/client re ticket refunds (.2); review customer programs order (.2); research re EU regulations re refunds for tickets (.5).	3.30	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 59 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25480518	5/19/2020	Review and edit supplier claims internal letter (.4); correspond w/ G. Hughes (Seabury), w/ Brown (FTI), P. Milender and J. Behrens re same (.6); review reclamation and 503(b) orders re same (.3); review precedent and bankruptcy code re same (.6); correspond w/ C. Lipe (JF) re related matters (.1); correspond w/ L. Parrish (JF) re same (.1); calls w/ numerous third party vendors and suppliers to answer their questions (1.0); correspond w/ E. Fleck re same (.1): review and edit two automatic stay letters to vendors issuing threats (.3); correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re same (.2): correspond w/ C. Salamanca (Avianca) re same (.2); answer three follow-up questions from C. Salamanca (.5); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1); correspond w/ A. Stone and P. Milender re vendor tax-related inquiry (.2): review tax order and motion re same (.2): follow-up correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re vendor matters (.1).	5.00	Silverman, Stephen D.
25468887	5/19/2020	Call w/ Debtors, Seabury re vendors, agencies, refunds (1.0); call w/ Debtors re Alpha (.7); call w/ counsel for Boeing (.4); call w/ Alpha (.5); review and edit vendor letters (.5); emails w/ Debtors re vendors (1.5); emails re Boeing (.2); emails re Debtors swaps (.2); research re Alpha claim (.5).	5.50	Stone, Alan J.
25473298	5/20/2020	Numerous calls with Company re vendor inquiries and responses.	2.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25470326	5/20/2020	Respond to query from G. Penadia re ongoing reporting obligations under Citi RCF.	0.90	Guitart, Gonzalo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 60 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Da	ate	Description	Hours	Name
25480529 5/2		Call w/ Company and A. Stone re Honeywell issues (.4); review materials in advance of same (.1); call w/ counsel to certain vendors and answered her questions (.4): correspond w/ P. Milender re related issues (.1); correspond w/ Avianca, A. Stone and P. Milender re Rolls Royce issues (.3); analysis re same (.7); correspond w/ K. Raff and G. Hughes (Seabury) re same (.2); brief research re settlement issues (.6).	2.80	Silverman, Stephen D.
25473360 5/2		Call w/ Debtors re vendors (.8); call w/ R. Galindo (Avianca), S. Silverman, Torres re Honeywell (.5); confer w/G. Hughes (Seabury) re ticket refunds (.3); calls w/ Alpha (.5); emails w/ Debtors re Alpha (.2); emails w/ Debtors, S. Silverman re Rolls Royce (.3); call w/ Worldwide Flight Services (.3); review letters to vendors (.5); call w/ E. Hyla re research on refunds (.2).	3.60	Stone, Alan J.
25480598 5/2		Extensive call w/ K. Raff re Rolls Royce concerns (.6); draft reply to C. Salamanca (Avianca) re same (.2); cull and review lease agreements re same (.4); brief contempt motion re search (1.1); correspond w/ A. Stone re same (.1): review another vendor auto stay letter (.1): correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re same (.1); multiple rounds of correspond w/ M. Catalina, A. Corredera (Avianca) and A. Stone re certain vendor threat and upcoming flight (.3); email to vendor counsel re same (.1): review written letter response re same (.2); brief research re same (.4).	3.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25479077 5/2		Call w/ Debtors, D. O'Donnell re DDB (vendor) (.4); Emails w/ D. O'Donnell re DDB (.2); review letter from GMD (vendor) and emails w/Debtors re same (.5); call w/Alpha (vendor) (.3); draft letter to Alpha (.5); review research on fines for failing to refund tickets (.3).	2.20	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 61 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25480590	5/22/2020	Correspond w/ A. Stone, M. Catalina (Avianca) and A. Corredor (Avianca) re certain vendor	3.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
		concerns and updates (.4); brief research re related issues (.5): draft two supplementary letters to vendor in light of its position and upcoming flight (1.4); correspond w/ A. Stone re same (.1); correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re same (.1); email to vendor counsel re same (.1); review certain precedent contempt motions (.4); correspond w/ R. Parchment and A. Stone re same (.1): correspond w/ D. Diaz (Avianca) re Rolls Royce lease extension issue		
05 107 100	= /20 /2000	(.2).		
25487426	5/22/2020	Emails w/Debtors re Alpha and revise letter re same (.6); numerous emails w/ Debtors and S. Silverman re GMD (.8); emails re Rolls Royce (.2); call w/ Alpha (.2); call w/MVP International (.3); review chart re ticket refunds (.2).	2.30	Stone, Alan J.
25487414	5/24/2020	Emails w/counsel for Boeing.	0.20	Stone, Alan J.
25512138	5/25/2020	Correspond w/ internal team re multiple vendors, supplier and aircraft contract counterparty issues (.2): correspond w/ A. Stone re same (.1); review contracts and perform analysis re same (.9).	1.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25488273	5/25/2020	Emails w/ D. O'Donnell and Smith Gambrell re refunds (.2); confer w/ D. O'Donnell re refunds (.3).	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25492310	5/26/2020	Respond to query from N. Castro re response to Cuscatlan (.3); revise proposed translation to note addressed to suppliers (.2).	0.50	Guitart, Gonzalo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 62 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
			-
25512119 5/26/2020	Review and edit two automatic stay letters (.4); analysis re same (.4); correspond w/ A. Stone and M. Catalina (Avianca) (Avianca) re same (.3); review analysis re certain other vendor and supplier issues w/ A. Stone (.3); correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re same (.1).	1.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25496259 5/26/2020	Emails w/ D. O'Donnell, SGR, G. Bray re refunds (.3); confer w/Debtors re pre-payment proviso (.2); confer w/Debtors re Terpel (.3) confer w/Debtors re Swissport (.2); confer w/ Debtors re Alpha (.3); confer w/Debtors re Flying Food (.3); confer w/Debtors re Dnata (.2).	1.80	Stone, Alan J.
25512082 5/27/2020	Correspond w/ K. Raff re Rolls Royce issues (.1); correspond w/ multiple vendors and w/ Brown (FTI) re vendor and 503(b)(9) issues/ claims (.2); correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) and analysis re another vendor prepayment threat (.3); correspond w/ P. Milender re related issues (.1).	0.70	Silverman, Stephen D.
25505086 5/27/2020	Review revised draft motion for relief and memorandum of law (1.1); review revised draft adversary complaint (.8).	1.90	Stone, Alan J.
25532813 5/28/2020	Conference call re Star Alliance, BBVA, Boeing and related issues (1.2); review DPW/LifeMiles letter (.2); email A. Stone re same (.2); emails re DDB issues (.6); review related documents (.7).	2.90	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 63 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25505698 5/28/2020	Correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) and A. Stone re multiple automatic stay violations and responses (.4); call w/ A. Stone and E. Fleck re same (.2); follow-up correspond w/ A. Stone, P. Milender and E. Fleck re same (.3); review numerous questions from Company re Code section 362 and 365 issues (.1); correspond w/ P. Milender and R. Parchment re same (.2); edit R. Parchment responses to certain questions and draft answers to others (.6); research re same (2.1); review and edit motion for contempt against certain vendor (2.3); correspond w/ M. Catalina, R. Parchment and A. Stone re same and missing materials (.3); review certain contracts, amendments, letters and precedent re same (1.2); other legal research re same (1.5); attend call w/ Davis Polk, Lifemiles, Avianca and A. Stone re certain contract counterparty issues and potential response (.4); follow-up w/ A. Stone re same (.2).	9.80	Silverman, Stephen D.
25505703 5/28/2020	Conduct Code section 362 and 365 research i/c/w multiple vendor and supplier issues.	3.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25511006 5/28/2020	Call w/Debtors re vendors (.5); edit letter to Star Alliance (.3); review questions re unilateral terminations (.2); confer w/Debtors re Pullman Miami Airport (.3).	1.30	Stone, Alan J.
25532693 5/29/2020	Attend follow-up discussions re Star Alliance and BBVA issues (1.1); review DPW letter (.7); email A. Stone re same (.4); emails w/ DDB issues (.9); review related documents (.8).	3.90	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 64 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25512056 5/29/20	 Call w/ Company and A. Stone re certain vendor issues and contract modifications (.3); follow-up correspond w/ A. Stone (.2); review contracts and proposed amendments re same (1.2); follow-up correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) and C. Salamanca (Avianca) re same (.2); research re multiple rejection issues (.8); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1): respond to M. Catalina (Avianca) questions re same (.2); correspond w/ A. Stone re same (.1); prepare and edit executory contracts primer memo for Company (1.2); correspond w/ P. Milender and A. Stone re same (.2): research re same (.4); correspond w/ R. Parchment re motion for contempt form issues and propose order (.1); review precedent re same (.2). 	5.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25515304 5/29/20	 Call with Debtors re Accenture (.5); review materials re same (.3); emails w/Debtors re Boeing (.2); emails w/Debtors re Honeywell (.2); confer w/Debtors re Priority Pass (.3); confer w/Debtors re Adobe (.3). 	1.80	Stone, Alan J.
25522072 5/30/20	20 Review Credomatic agreement (.4); draft summary of relevant provisions re collateral requirement (2.3).	2.70	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25522386 5/30/20	020 Research (1.1) and correspondence (.2) re reclamation procedures issues Company inquiries.	1.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25520487 5/30/20	D20 Emails w/ Debtors re DDB (.2); emails w/ Seabury re Amadeus (.2).	0.40	Stone, Alan J.
25522145 5/31/20	20 Revise letter to stakeholders re second lien.	0.30	Guitart, Gonzalo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 65 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00019 Avianca - Communications/Issues/Meetings with U.S. Trustee

	44810.00019 Avianca - Communications/Issues/Meetings with U.S. Trustee			Trustee
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25462031	5/11/2020	Correspond w/ UST re interim order issues and committee formation.	1.50	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25444886	5/15/2020	Emails w/ UST re Peru issues.	0.90	Milender, Parker
25456899	5/18/2020	Call with UST regarding committee formation (.4); prepare for (.3) and follow-up (.4) same.	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25458634	5/18/2020	Call w/ E. Fleck, G. Hughes (Seabury) and B. Masumoto re committee considerations (.6); draft email to UST re same (.6).	1.20	Milender, Parker
25490353	5/21/2020	Prepare for UST call (.3); participate on same (.6).	0.90	Fleck, Evan R.
25477019	5/21/2020	Call w/ E. Fleck and UST re committee formation.	0.80	Milender, Parker
25602948	5/22/2020	Calls with unsecured creditors and potential UCC counsel re case background (.9); review/consider UST information requests (.2).	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25480666	5/22/2020	Emails to UST re committee issues.	0.60	Milender, Parker
25488804	5/23/2020	Comment on memo to UCC re committee formation (.4); emails with Debtors re same (.2).	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25480675	5/23/2020	Draft email to UST committee appointment.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25498511	5/23/2020	Research committee issues section 1102 (3.5); review precedent motions (2.4); draft memo (2.5); exchanged emails re same with P. Milender (.2)	8.60	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25498583	5/24/2020	Further revise memo (1.1); emails with P. Milender and E. Fleck re same (.3).	1.40	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25496585	5/26/2020	Call with B. Masumoto re committee composition and related matters.	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 66 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00019 Avianca - Communications/Issues/Meetings with U.S. Trustee

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25498092	5/26/2020	Draft emails to UST re first/second day motions and disclosure issues.	0.80	Milender, Parker
25501021	5/27/2020	Emails w/ UST re diligence requests and utilities issue.	1.20	Milender, Parker
25507656	5/28/2020	Emails w/ UST re diligence requests and review filing of vendor information under seal.	0.70	Milender, Parker
25513157	5/30/2020	Draft email to UST re incentive plan/incentive programs.	0.50	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 67 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	++010.00020 Avianca - Communications/ issues/ wicci	ings with Secure	
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25419947 5/11/2020	Prepare for call with N. Rose (DBJ Counsel).	0.40	Goff, Steve
25434133 5/12/2020	Call with Norton Rose (counsel to DBJ and KGAL) re stipulation and issues thereto (.6); call with Pillsbury (counsel to NordLB) re same (.4); draft summary of issues list re same (1.8); review equipment related to creditor conferences (.3).	3.10	Goff, Steve
25436478 5/12/2020	Call w/ H. Schwartz and JOLCO secured party (.3); correspond w/ JPM re same (.3).	0.60	Milender, Parker
25432510 5/12/2020	Call with D. Rosenzweig and D. Bachelor (Norton Rose) re AP stipulation relating to 5 aircraft involving Development Bank of Japan (.5); call with L. Avila (Avianca), L. Grindal (Seabury), S. Alagappan (MUFG), Z. Sehgal and J. DeMarco (Clifford Chance) re AP stipulation relating to aircraft involving SMFL/SMBC/MUFG JOLCO (.5); call with L. Grindal (Seabury), C. Ziemer (NORD) and DBJ re AP stipulation relating to aircraft MSN 37511 (.5); call with M. Lessard and L. Crowley (Pillsbury) re comments to AP stipulation relating to aircraft MSN 37511 (.5); call with L. Avila, S. Torres (Avianca), L. Grindal (Seabury), V. Bajaj (NTT Finance), Nishimura law firm re questions to AP stipulation relating to aircraft MSN 3800 (1.0).	3.00	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 68 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25440373 5/13/2020	Call with L. Avila (Avianca), L. Grindal (Seabury), J. Versnel (FPG), C. Ziemer (Nord), S. Hikoma (DBJ), R. Honeywell (K&L Gates), J. DeMarco (Clifford Chance) re comments to AP stipulation for MSN 39407 (.8); call J. Luth, G. Hughes (both Seabury), T. Kolberg (Euler Hermes), P. Nelson (Allen & Overy), UKEF, BPI France re Airbus ECA transactions (1.0); call with A. Neuhauser (Avianca), G. Hughes (Seabury), M. Jacovides (Allen & Overy), BPI France and SACE re ATR ECA transactions (.9); call with L. Avila (Avianca), G. Hughes (Seabury), D. Cohen (EXIM), P. Williams (EXIM), J. Veber (Vedder) re EXIM transactions (.5); call with L. Grindal (Seabury), Kawahara (JP lease), M. Edelman, C. Gee (Vedder), K. Sengoku (Nishimura) re JP lease JOLCO (.4).	3.60	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25442221 5/14/2020	Call with M. Edelman (Vedder), G. Hughes (Seabury) re Vedder comments to AP stipulation and possible compromises (.6); attend bi-weekly internal coordination call (.5).	1.10	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25444902 5/15/2020	Call w/ E. Fleck and third party secured creditor.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25447429 5/15/2020	Call with A. Neuhauser (Avianca), J. Luth (Seabury), T. Kolberg (Euler Hermes), J. Franklin (UKEF), P. Nelson (A&O) re Airbus ECA transactions and overview of financials (.7); call with L. Avila (Avianca), G. Hughes (Seabury), M. Jacovides (Allen & Overy), BPI France and SACE re ATR ECA transactions and questions to AP stipulation (.9). call with M. Edelman, C. Setteducatti (Vedder) re comments to AP stipulation and Citibank RCF (.4); call with L. Grindal (Seabury) re follow-up on Vedder call and discuss open issues on AP stipulation (.5); call with G. Hughes, L. Grindal (Seabury), J. Tenen and P. Barlow (SGR) re comments to revised stipulation (.8).	3.30	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 69 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44610.00020 Avianca - Communications/issues/ivicetings with Secured Creations		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25447982 5/16/2020	Call with R. Fumero, D. Flaherty (ICBC) and J. Pritchard, B. Parlin (H&K) re 5/15 draft of AP stipulation (.6); call with G. Bray to go over H&K comments (.3); call with L. Jiang (AMCK) re AP stipulation (.4); call with D. Elkhatib (SMBC), P. Durham (H&K) re 5/15 draft of AP stipulation (1.0); follow-up call with G. Hughes (Seabury), J. Tenen, P. Barlow (SGR), G. Bray, S. Goff re AP stipulation discussions (1.0); call with D. Guyder (A&O) re cash deposit maintained with BNP on ATR financings (.3).	3.60	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25450481 5/17/2020	Call with M. Edelman (Vedder) re aircraft counterparties in the AP stipulations.	0.30	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25455286 5/18/2020	Call with M. Edelman (Vedder) re signatory of AP stipulation (.2); call with N. Boyce (H&K) re submission of AP stipulations to bankruptcy court (.2); call with J. Pritchard re signing of AP stipulation by ICBC (.2); call with P. Durham (H&K) re signing of AP stipulation by SMBC (.2).	0.80	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25469666 5/19/2020	Calls w/ secured creditors re cash management/general inquiries.	0.90	Milender, Parker
25469870 5/19/2020	Call with K. Simon (Latham), D. Lipke (Vedder), E. Fleck, G. Bray re terms of AP stipulation for revolving credit facility with Citibank as collateral agent (.5); call with D. Lipke (Vedder) re change in requested adequate protection terms (.2); call with C. Setteducatti (Vedder) re change in requested adequate protection terms (.3).	1.00	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25477045 5/21/2020	Call with L. Avila (Avianca), J. Luth, G. Hughes (both Seabury), J. Franklin (UKEF), P. Nelson (A&O), G. Bray, S. Goff re Airbus ECA comments to form of AP stipulation (.9); follow-up call with P. Nelson (A&O) re same (.3).	1.20	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 70 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
2548275	9 5/23/2020	Correspond with L. Avila (Avianca) and C. Torres re Avianca Peru sublease terminations.	0.20	Schwarz, Helfried J.
2551357	1 5/30/2020	Call with L. Crowley (Pillsbury) and G. Bray re AP stipulation and rejection procedures motion.	0.70	Schwarz, Helfried J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 71 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	44810.00021 Avianca - Communications/Issues/Meetings with Description	Hours	
		r		
25473348	5/20/2020	T/Cs with creditors and potential counsel to creditors' committee.	1.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25489069	5/22/2020	Consider issues with respect to parties selected for UCC.	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25480681	5/22/2020	Draft email to Committee re Peru motion.	1.00	Milender, Parker
25480603	5/22/2020	Call w/ L. Parrish (JF) re UCC composition (.2): follow-up correspond w/ P. Milender and G. Guitart re same (.1); review interested parties list re same (.1); another email to JF team re same (.1).	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25488943	5/24/2020	Calls and emails with new UCC counsel.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25487124	5/25/2020	Email exchange with UCC re hearing (.2); emails re general coordination with committee (.2).	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25498048	5/26/2020	Emails w/ Committee re second day issues.	0.60	Milender, Parker
25502436	5/27/2020	Correspond with UCC advisors re coordination of matters.	0.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25500942	5/27/2020	Draft comments to Committee's bylaws (confidentiality section) (1.8); calls w/ E. Richards re utilities issue (.3).	2.10	Milender, Parker
25508558	5/28/2020	Call with UCC banker.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25508571	5/28/2020	Respond to creditor communication.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25507537	5/28/2020	Call w/ UCC advisors re first day hearing issues (.9); draft/revise UCC bylaws and emails re same (.4).	1.30	Milender, Parker
25505723	5/28/2020	Attend (partial) call w/ Committee advisors re second day hearing.	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 72 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25518036 5/29/2020	Call with Committee members (.5); call with UCC counsel and Seabury (.6).	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25512484 5/29/2020	Call w/ D. O'Donnell and MoFo re case management/noticing issues.	0.40	Milender, Parker
25520515 5/30/2020	Draft slides for UCC presentation.	1.00	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 73 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description		Name
Date		110015	
25422045 5/11/202	 Review draft AVH board minutes from 5/8 (3.2), 5/10 (2.8); correspond with F. Nunez and P. Richards re same (.4). 	6.40	Gonzalez, Flora
25421047 5/11/202	20 Emails w/ Avianca director re question on board matter (.1); discuss preparation of board meeting minutes with P. Richards (.1); review board meeting minutes (.2); emails re same (.1); review board decks prepared by Company advisors (.5); comment on board meeting minutes (2.4).	3.40	Nunez, Francisco R.
25421824 5/11/202	20 Emails w/ E. Hurtado Fino (Avianca) re board meeting minutes.	0.10	Nunez, Francisco R.
25430348 5/11/202	20 Draft 5/8 board meeting minutes (1.9); review 5/5 board meeting minutes and make changes re the same (1.7).	3.60	Richards, Pablo
25425422 5/11/202	20 Emails w/ L. Avila (Avianca) re captive (.2); emails w/ Wilmington Trust re Trust (.2); call w/ D. Young (Wilmington Trust) re same (.2).	0.60	Stone, Alan J.
25435574 5/12/202	20 Comment on board minutes (.8); review emails re HR committee minutes (.2).	1.00	Beebe, James M.
25432811 5/12/202	20 Review markup of AVH 5/5/20 board Meeting Minutes (2.2); correspond with J. P. Chabaneix (Estudio Rodrigo) re same (.1); further revise re same per additional internal comments (1.4); review markup of AVH 5/8/20 board Meeting Minutes (1.9); further revise re same per additional internal comments (.6); review draft of AVH 5/4/20 HR Committee Meeting Minutes (1.5); review draft of AVH 4/22/20 board Meeting Minutes (2.2); correspond with A. Stone, F. Nunez, and P. Richards re the foregoing (.7).	10.60	Gonzalez, Flora

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 74 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25432644 5/12/2020	Emails w/ F. Gonzalez and P. Richards re preparation of board meeting minutes and committee meeting minutes (.3); review drafts re same (3.9); emails re same (.6); calls w/ F. Gonzalez re same (.); call w/ P. Richards re same (.2).prepare for (.1) and call (.3) w/ Avianca director and A. Stone re board matter.	5.40	Nunez, Francisco R.
25430335 5/12/2020	Respond to emails re SFC disclosure (.5); review HR Committee minutes (1.5); review internal comments re the same (.5); review 5/22 minutes (.5); draft 5/9 minutes (1.8); emails re corporate governance issues (.1).	4.90	Richards, Pablo
25435477 5/12/2020	Edit board meeting minutes (.5); call w/ board member re corporate governance and follow up w/ F. Nunez (.5); call w/ M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg, F. Nunez re corporate governance (.3); emails w/ L. Avila (Avianca) re captive (.3).	1.60	Stone, Alan J.
25440173 5/13/2020	Attend internal call regarding governance matters (.4); consider board/governance matters (.6).	1.00	Fleck, Evan R.
25439732 5/13/2020	Review draft AVH board meeting minutes of April 22, 2020, and related presentation (2.3); emails re AVH HR committee minutes of May 4, 2020 (.6); review draft board meeting minutes of May 9, 2020 (2.2); discuss same with F. Nunez and P. Richards (.2).	5.30	Gonzalez, Flora
25438496 5/13/2020	Attend team calls re Sergio Michelsen (1.1); T/C with Colombian counsel re same (.6); T/C with Panamanian counsel re same (.4).	2.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 75 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25436482 5/13/2020	Call (.4) and emails (.2) w/ R. Covelo, R. Galindo (Avianca), M. Mottesi, A. Stone and T. Stirnberg re board matter; emails w/ Avianca director re same (.1); call w/ M. Shah, J. Beebe, P. Richards and F. Gonzalez re same (.2); call w/ R. Fandiño (Gomez Pinzon), M. Mottesi and A. Stone re same (.4); emails re same (.7); call w/ A. Anguizola (Morgan & Morgan), M. Mottesi and A. Stone re same (.4); call w/ M. Mottesi, E. Fleck, A. Stone and T. Stirnberg re same (.5); revise board minutes (1.3); review SEC filing of Avianca Holdings (.5); discuss governance matter w/ P. Richard and F. Gonzalez (.1); email w/ P. Richards re registration of resignation of R. Zamora (.1).	4.90	Nunez, Francisco R.
25436489 5/13/2020	Review of minutes of the board (1.9); emails re same (.2); follow-up on other issues re corporate matters (.3).	2.40	Richards, Pablo
25576316 5/13/2020	Review committee and board meeting documents.	0.50	Shah, Manan
25441637 5/13/2020	Call with Gomes Pinzon Advogados re Sergio Michelsen (.3); emails re same (.1).	0.40	Stirnberg, Tobias
25441710 5/13/2020	Call with A. Neuhauser (Avianca) re Sergio Michelsen conflicts of interest, internal emails re same.	0.10	Stirnberg, Tobias
25441726 5/13/2020	Call with Morgan & Morgan re Sergio Michelsen conflicts of interest, internal emails re same.	0.30	Stirnberg, Tobias
25439554 5/13/2020	Call w/ client, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg, F. Nunez re corporate governance (.5); analyze letter from board member and follow up with M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg (.3); emails w/ client and Marsh re captive (.2); call w/ F. Nunez, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg and Gomez, Pinzon re corporate governance (.6); call w/ F. Nunez, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg and Morgan & Morgan re corporate governance (.4).	2.00	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 76 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	
Date	Description	nours	
25576314 5/14/2020	Discuss board minutes and HR minutes (.4);	0.90	Beebe, James M.
	comment on HR committee minutes (.5).		
25442088 5/14/2020	Prepare for and join call with R. Galindo (Avianca) re board minutes (.6); coordinate with IT re board member resignation letter (.4); review draft of AVH HR Committee Minutes of 5/4/20 (1.7); organize draft minutes and circulate same internally for review (.4); internal discussions with F. Nunez and P. Richards re the foregoing (.5).	3.60	Gonzalez, Flora
25442728 5/14/2020	Attend multiple calls re Michelsen requests.	1.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25440210 5/14/2020	Emails w/ R. Galindo (Avianca) re board minutes matters (.1); emails with P. Richards, F. Gonzalez, A. Stone, J. Beebe and M. Shah re same (.3); emails with M. Mottesi, A. Stone, T. Stirnberg and E. Fleck re same (.2); call w/ A. Neuhauser (Avianca), E. Fleck, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg and A. Stone re same (.2); call w/ E. Hurtado, R. Galindo, M. Shah, F. Gonzalez and P. Richards re corporate governance matter and director registration issue (.2); correspond w/ F. Gonzalez and P. Richards re same (.2); review updated drafts of minutes (.2); provid comments re same (.5); call w/ J. Gurdian, R. Salcedo, A. van der Werff, E. Fleck, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg and A. Stone re same (.2); emails w/ P. Richards and A. Anguizola (Morgan) re director registration (.1).	2.20	Nunez, Francisco R.
25458378 5/14/2020	Review minutes (.5); call re status (.5); coordinate resignation and updates on other issues (1.3).	2.30	Richards, Pablo
25441672 5/14/2020	Calls (.3) and emails (.5) with internal team re board member conflicts of interest.	0.80	Stirnberg, Tobias
25442924 5/14/2020	Call w/ T. Stirnberg, M. Mottesi, F. Nunez, E. Fleck, Adrian Neuhauser re corporate governance (.4); attend Milbank coordination call (.5).	0.90	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 77 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25451099	5/15/2020	Further revise AVH board and HR committee meeting minutes (2.1); correspond and discuss with internal team re same (.6).	2.70	Gonzalez, Flora
25444683	5/15/2020	Email correspondence from Avianca director re board matter (.1); emails w/ E. Fleck, M. Mottesi, A. Stone and T. Stirnberg re board matter (.2); emails w/ F. Gonzalez, P. Richards and A. Stone re minutes for board meetings (.1); review minutes for board meetings (.2); provided comments on minutes for board meetings (.4); email correspondence with R. Galindo (Avianca) re board matter (.1); emails w/ A. Stone re board matter (.1); emails w/ A. Stone re director issue (.1); prepared draft response to board matter (.2).	1.50	Nunez, Francisco R.
25450071	5/15/2020	Discuss Sergio board conflicts w/ A. Stone.	0.40	Stirnberg, Tobias
25450319	5/15/2020	Emails w/ M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg, E. Fleck, F. Nunez, R. Galindo (Avianca) re corporate governance (.5); call w/ F. Nunez re corporate governance (.3).	0.80	Stone, Alan J.
25451367	5/16/2020	Call with M. Mottesi, A. Stone, and client re governance matters.	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25450922	5/16/2020	Review all drafts of AVH board and HR committee minutes (1.7); compile re same (.2); correspond with R. Galindo (Avianca) re same (.1); discuss re same with A. Stone and F. Nunez (.1).	2.10	Gonzalez, Flora
25447727	5/16/2020	Email correspondence with F. Gonzalez re board matter (.1); email correspondence with R. Covelo (Avianca), R. Galindo (Avianca) A. Stone, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg and E. Fleck re board matter (.1); conf. call with R. Covelo (Avianca), R. Galindo (Avianca) A. Stone, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg and E. Fleck re board matter (.5).	0.70	Nunez, Francisco R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 78 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	
	-		
25450602 5/16/2020	Call w/ M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg, F. Nunez, E. Fleck, R. Galindo (Avianca), R. Covelo (Avianca) re corporate governance (.5); emails w/ M. Mottesi, F. Nunez re corporate governance (.2).	0.70	Stone, Alan J.
25448185 5/17/2020	Draft update memo to board re restructuring developments.	1.40	Milender, Parker
25448177 5/17/2020	Emails w/ A. Stone re board matter (.1); conf. call w/ director and A. Stone re board matter (.3); correspondence to M. Mottesi, E. Fleck, T. Stirnberg and A. Stone re board matter (.1).	0.50	Nunez, Francisco R.
25451588 5/17/2020	Call w/ F. Nunez re corporate governance (.3); call w/ F. Nunez and board member re corporate governance (.5); review comment to notice of circumstances (.2).	1.00	Stone, Alan J.
25455679 5/18/2020	Consider board governance issues.	0.30	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25453681 5/18/2020	Emails w/ director, A. Stone and M. Mottesi re board matter.	0.10	Nunez, Francisco R.
25457843 5/18/2020	Review board minutes (.3); emails w/ board member and F. Nunez, M. Mottesi, T. Stirnberg re corporate governance (.5).	0.80	Stone, Alan J.
25466754 5/19/2020	Join internal status call (.6); discuss with F. Nunez re draft AVH board and HR committee minutes (.2).	0.80	Gonzalez, Flora
25485416 5/22/2020	T/C re board member.	0.20	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25486153 5/24/2020	Email correspondence w/ director and A. Stone re board matter.	0.10	Nunez, Francisco R.
25487580 5/24/2020	Emails w/ F. Nunez re corporate governance.	0.20	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 79 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44810.00022 Avianca - Corporate Governanc	ce/doard issues	
Dat	te	Description	Hours	Name
25486164 5/25/	/2020	Email correspondence w/ A. Stone re board matter (.1); call w/ A. Stone and director re same (.2).	0.30	Nunez, Francisco R.
25488197 5/25/	/2020	Call w/ F. Nunez and director re corporate governance (.5); confer w/ F. Nunez re corporate governance (.2).	0.70	Stone, Alan J.
25494158 5/26/	/2020	Join internal status call.	0.10	Gonzalez, Flora
25493847 5/26/	/2020	Email correspondence w/ M. Mottesi re board matters.	0.10	Nunez, Francisco R.
25496296 5/26/	/2020	Emails w/ F. Nunez, M. Mottesi, G. Bray corporate governance.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25501884 5/27/	/2020	Correspond with R. Galindo (Avianca) re board and committee minutes (.1); discuss with F. Nunez and P. Richards re same (.2).	0.30	Gonzalez, Flora
25498421 5/27/	/2020	Email correspondence w/ F. Gonzalez and P. Richards re board matters.	0.10	Nunez, Francisco R.
25527855 5/27/	/2020	Follow-up on minutes of the board status.	0.30	Richards, Pablo
25507773 5/28/	/2020	Correspond with D. Rivas (Avianca) re questions about Avianca Enterprises, LLC (.1); discuss considerations re DE LLC with registered agent (.3); conduct research re recordkeeping of DE LLCs under Delaware law (2.4); draft email response re same (.4); correspond with F. Nunez re the foregoing (.1).	3.30	Gonzalez, Flora
25516099 5/29/	/2020	Review draft email to D. Rivas (Avianca) re questions related to Avianca Enterprises, LLC (.2); correspond with A. Walker and A. Stone re same (.2); introduce D. Rivas (Avianca) to CSC Global contact via email (.2); correspond with F. Nunez re the foregoing (.2).	0.80	Gonzalez, Flora

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 80 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

_	Date	Description	Hours	Name
255153	88 5/29/2020	Review Debtors' questions re corporate governance and confer w/F. Gonzalez re same (.3); confer w/Debtors re corporate governance (.2); confer w/ R. Parchment re corporate governance (.2).	0.70	Stone, Alan J.
255185	96 5/30/2020	Comment on board of directors' weekly update.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 81 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00023 Avianca - Court Hearings and Communications

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25462384	5/11/2020	Prepare for first day hearing (4.1); calls and emails with Milbank and FTI teams re first day hearing and related issues raised by the U.S. Trustee (2.8); attend first day hearing (2.7); prepare for (.1) and attend (.5) internal debrief call re same.	10.20	Behrens, James C.
25426509	5/11/2020	Prepare for first-day hearing (1.2); participate on first-day hearing (2.7); review follow-up matters (.4).	4.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25425801	5/11/2020	Prepare for (6.0) and attend (2.7) first day hearing.	8.70	Milender, Parker
25447766	5/11/2020	Edit first day hearing script (1.5); attend first day hearing (2.7); summarize notes re same (1.2); correspond w. P. Milender re comments from UST and Court (.2); edit orders to motions (1.1); correspond w/ R. Jordan (KCC) re retention matters and service issues (.2).	6.90	Silverman, Stephen D.
25425426	5/11/2020	Attend first day hearing.	2.70	Stone, Alan J.
25442956	5/14/2020	Internal follow-up call regarding first day hearing (.5); review transcript (.2).	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.
25480682	5/23/2020	Draft script for emergency Peru hearing.	2.60	Milender, Parker
25487621	5/23/2020	Prepare for hearing on Peru.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25489104	5/24/2020	Participate in Debtors preparation for Tuesday's hearing (.9); emails re same (.2).	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25482225	5/24/2020	Witness preparation w/ A. Stone and E. Fleck for Peru hearing (1.2); emails re same (.7).	1.90	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 82 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00023 Avianca - Court Hearings and Communications

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25487503 5/24/2020	Emails w/ P. Milender and E. Fleck re witness prep for Peru hearing (.2); preparation of L. Avila (Avianca) for Peru hearing (1.7); call w/ A. Renenger re hearing on Peru (.3); emails re Peru employee payments in prep for Peru hearing (.3).	2.50	Stone, Alan J.
25487234 5/25/2020	Numerous calls with Debtors, Peru counsel, internally to prepare for emergency hearing.	1.90	Fleck, Evan R.
25485855 5/25/2020	Draft hearing agenda for Peru hearing.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25488176 5/25/2020	Prepare for L. Avila (Avianca) for testimony (1.5); prepare for hearing (.5).	2.00	Stone, Alan J.
25496622 5/26/2020	Prepare for Peru hearing (.4); participate on hearing (.7); follow-up with Debtors post-hearing (.3).	1.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25498099 5/26/2020	Prepare for (1.2) and telephonically attend (1.0) emergency hearing re Peru.	2.20	Milender, Parker
25496258 5/26/2020	Prepare for (.5) and attend (partial) (.7) hearing on Peru.	1.20	Stone, Alan J.
25520438 5/30/2020	Confer w/ E. Fleck, P. Milender re second day hearing.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 83 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	
Date	Description	nours	
25435581 5/11/20	20 Review emails re wages motion.	0.20	Beebe, James M.
25425266 5/11/20	20 Review Littler M supplemental package (.3); confer w/ A. Carter re same (.2).	0.50	Hanson, Jane L.
25425760 5/11/20	20 Review relevant decisions and employee wages issue.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25422531 5/11/20	20 Respond to Company and internal correspondence re Peruvian severance payments.	0.70	Stirnberg, Tobias
25434033 5/12/20	Call w/ E. Fleck, G. Bray and Littler re CBA issues (.2); prepare notes to file (.3).	0.50	Hanson, Jane L.
25433997 5/12/20	Attend multiple T/Cs re Peru severance treatment (1.8); review local counsel materials and board presentations re Peru treatment of employees (1.3).	3.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25434536 5/12/20	Call with P. Milender re incentive plan (.4); review meeting minutes (.5).	0.90	Shah, Manan
25441717 5/13/20	Review emails re CBA process (.5); review CBA rules (.4); review summary of CBA process in chapter 11 cases (.5); discuss labor matters with Company (.4); review HR committee minutes (.4).	2.20	Beebe, James M.
25440172 5/13/20	Consider employee issues correspondence from Company (.8); calls with various professionals at Company regarding same (1.3); call with Colombian labor counsel (.3).	2.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25438349 5/13/20	Call w/ M. Shah, J. Beebe and J. Sorger re summary of CBA process (.3); review materials re same (.7); emails re same (.3).	1.30	Hanson, Jane L.
25455179 5/13/20	20 Review memo re CBA process (.7); review CBA matters (.8); call with financial restructuring team to discuss CBA matters (.6).	2.10	Shah, Manan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 84 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Horocovic Avianca - Employee Benen		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25439064 5/13/2020	Call w/ J. Hanson, M. Shah, and J. Beebe re CBA process (.4); research survey of CBA motions in airline industry (1.8); review CBA related filings (3.8); draft CBA memo with case examples (4.3); email P. Milender re same (.1); call w/ E. Fleck, J. Beebe, and M. Shah re same (.4); pull CBA related pleadings from cases (.9).	11.70	Sorger, Jonathan
25441875 5/14/2020	Review CBA process memo (.7); emails re same (.3); attend internal update call re same (.6).	1.60	Beebe, James M.
25535337 5/14/2020	Call with P. Milender re incentive plan (.3); review motion re same (.3).	0.60	Cruz Burgos, Melany
25442802 5/14/2020	Consider labor-related matters.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25443737 5/14/2020	Review (1.1) and revise (1.6) memo re CBA issues; review supporting materials re same (1.5); emails re same (.5).	4.70	Hanson, Jane L.
25450096 5/14/2020	Review incentive plan related issues (.8); call with client re minutes (.5); review CBA issues (1.2).	2.50	Shah, Manan
25442218 5/14/2020	Review CBA related pleadings (3.4); revise CBA process memo (6.1); email J. Hanson re same (.2); email E. Fleck re the same (.1).	9.80	Sorger, Jonathan
25450920 5/15/2020	Respond to email re union issues (1.1); review CBA issues and rules (.4); review emails re UST comments re incentive plan (.3).	1.80	Beebe, James M.
25451371 5/15/2020	Participate on labor working group call (1.0); prepare for same (.2).	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25452907 5/15/2020	Revise memo re CBA issues (.7); emails re same (.3).	1.00	Hanson, Jane L.
25456020 5/15/2020	Review CBA issues memo (.5); call with client re same (1.0).	1.50	Shah, Manan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 85 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25449437	5/15/2020	Review email from E. Fleck re CBA process (.1); emails M. Shah and J. Hanson re same (.2); research CBA issues (.3); review CBA process memo (1.0).	1.60	Sorger, Jonathan
25451416	5/16/2020	Revise CBA memo for distribution to client.	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.
25456230	5/18/2020	Review emails (.2) and presentations (.2) re labor negotiation summaries; emails re incentive plan matters (.1).	0.50	Beebe, James M.
25535457	5/18/2020	Draft memorandum of law re incentive plan.	0.90	Cruz Burgos, Melany
25456852	5/18/2020	Review labor documentation from client (1.7); confer with M. Shah re same (.1).	1.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25457152	5/18/2020	Review summary of negotiations re pilot unions (.6); emails re Spanish labor documents (.4).	1.00	Hanson, Jane L.
25456134	5/18/2020	Review correspondence from E. Mendoza (Avianca) re labor strategies (.3); discuss translation w/ P. Richards (.1).	0.40	Sorger, Jonathan
25467530	5/19/2020	Discuss UST comments re incentive plan w/ Debtors and Willis Towers Watson (.3); review wages memo (.2); attend update call re same (.8).	1.30	Beebe, James M.
25530389	5/19/2020	Review incentive plan materials (.3); draft motion re same (.7).	1.00	Cruz Burgos, Melany
25469701	5/19/2020	Prepare for (.3) and attend (.3) call w/ Willis Towers Watson re retention/incentive plan issues.	0.60	Milender, Parker
25472082	5/19/2020	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.4) call with Company and WTW re compensation matters; attend update call re same (.8).	1.30	Shah, Manan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 86 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	
	Date	Description	nours	
25473118	5/20/2020	Review incentive plan emails re UST requests (.2); review translations of summaries re union discussions (.5).	0.70	Beebe, James M.
25529985	5/20/2020	Draft incentive plan memorandum of law (3.7) and accompanying declarations (2.3).	6.00	Cruz Burgos, Melany
25470343	5/20/2020	Review employee termination agreement.	0.60	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25472134	5/20/2020	Review translations of labor status documents (.7); emails re same (.3).	1.00	Hanson, Jane L.
25478122	5/21/2020	Review incentive plan deck from Willis Towers Watson (.3); review (.6) and comment (.3) on incentive plan motion; attend update call re same (.6);	1.80	Beebe, James M.
25486394	5/21/2020	Edit case law and citations in the incentive plan memorandum of law.	1.50	Cruz Burgos, Melany
25490401	5/21/2020	Consider labor analysis from local counsel (.3); discuss same with M. Mottesi (.2).	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25477144	5/21/2020	Draft (3.7) and revise (1.9) incentive plan memorandum of law; call w/ Company re same (.5).	6.10	Milender, Parker
25477186	5/21/2020	Review documents re labor relations.	0.90	Sorger, Jonathan
25498360	5/21/2020	Research employee issues (2.3); draft summary of research (1.1); emails with P. Milender re same (.3).	3.70	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25485396	5/22/2020	Review incentive plan memorandum and declaration.	0.60	Beebe, James M.
25497926	5/22/2020	Review labor issues.	3.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25488924	5/22/2020	Review materials from local counsel re labor disputes.	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 87 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	- ++010.0002+ Avianca - Employee Benefits/		
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25480668 5/22/2020	Revise incentive plan memorandum of law.	0.70	Milender, Parker
25485442 5/22/2020	T/C re employee matters.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25488758 5/22/2020	Review email re 503(c).	0.20	Shah, Manan
25479897 5/22/2020	Review Colombian labor opinion (.4); discuss labor issue w/ M. Shah (.1); review correspondence from F. Alvarez (Allabogados) re Colombian labor code (.2).	0.70	Sorger, Jonathan
25485150 5/23/2020	Review emails re incentive plan declaration.	0.20	Beebe, James M.
25529994 5/23/2020	Revise incentive plan memorandum of law (2.8); email with P Milender re: same (.3) make further revisions to incentive plan memorandum of law (1.5).	4.60	Cruz Burgos, Melany
25489029 5/23/2020	Comment on brief in support of incentive program.	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25480689 5/23/2020	Revise incentive plan brief (.9); emails w/ M. Cruz Burgos re same (.2).	1.10	Milender, Parker
25495570 5/23/2020	Review memo re 503(c).	1.00	Shah, Manan
25485467 5/24/2020	Review additional emails re incentive plan declaration.	0.20	Beebe, James M.
25482202 5/24/2020	Revise incentive plans memorandum of law.	2.10	Milender, Parker
25577516 5/25/2020	Call w/Debtors and Peruvian counsel re employee payments (.5); emails re Peru motion (.5).	1.00	Stone, Alan J.
25495908 5/26/2020	Attend call re incentive plan matters (.7); review incentive plan memorandum and background documents (.5); review emails re same (.3).	1.50	Beebe, James M.
25535398 5/26/2020	Call re retention plans and incentive plans (.7); revise motion re same (4.3).	5.00	Cruz Burgos, Melany

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 88 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	
		1		
25498064	5/26/2020	Revise incentive plan brief (.7); call w/ Company and M. Cruz Burgos re same (1.0).	1.70	Milender, Parker
25497805	5/26/2020	Attend call with Debtors (.6); review multiple labor related materials (2.2).	2.80	Shah, Manan
25494154	5/26/2020	Review correspondence from E. Fleck re labor documents.	0.10	Sorger, Jonathan
25503222	5/27/2020	Review emails re incentive plan memorandum.	0.30	Beebe, James M.
25500989	5/27/2020	Revise incentive plan memorandum of law (1.3); calls w/ M. Cruz Burgos re same (.1).	1.40	Milender, Parker
25508816	5/27/2020	Revise labor memo.	1.60	Shah, Manan
25501857	5/27/2020	Review main topics re ADPA and ODEAA construction boards presentation (.3); review normalization of Avianca-ACDAC relations presentation (1.3); review initial Avianca-ADPA-ODEAA working party proposals (.5); draft high-level summary of labor relations and legal opinion (2.4); draft correspondence to M. Shah re labor summary (.1); review comments on labor summary (.2); draft correspondence to E. Fleck re labor summary (.1).	4.90	Sorger, Jonathan
25507780	5/28/2020	Revise incentive plan brief (.4); review precedent transcript re same (.3).	0.70	Milender, Parker
25520818	5/29/2020	Prepare slides re summary of prepetition payments.	0.50	Beebe, James M.
25517985	5/29/2020	Call with Colombian labor counsel re analysis of labor issues.	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25512499	5/29/2020	Call w/ local Colombian labor counsel re CBA issues (.8); revise incentive plan brief (2.0).	2.80	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 89 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25525746	5/29/2020	Review summary of employment issues for UCC counsel.	0.80	Shah, Manan
25515271	5/29/2020	Edit motion to approve compensation programs.	1.00	Stone, Alan J.
25513178	5/30/2020	Provide comments to employee benefits memorandum.	0.50	Milender, Parker
25552225	5/31/2020	Review labor union issues (.6); call w/ Colombian counsel re same (.7).	1.30	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 90 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00026 Avianca - Insurance

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25447833 5/12/2020	Correspond w/ M. Catalina re insurance issues (.2); review motion re same (.1); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1).	0.40	Silverman, Stephen D.
25447894 5/13/2020	Attend call w/ numerous Avianca employees and P. Milender re insurance issues (.4); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1).	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25457875 5/18/2020	Emails w/ client re insurance claims.	0.20	Stone, Alan J.
25505713 5/28/2020	Correspond w/ S. Aguirre (FTI), Avianca and P. Milender re multiple insurance concerns and payments (.2); review of motions, orders and precedent re same (.3).	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25526701 5/29/2020	Call w/ A. Stone re presentation to UCC re D&O insurance.	0.20	Parchment, Ryan
25527015 5/31/2020	Prepare slides re presentation to UCC re D&O insurance.	0.80	Parchment, Ryan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 91 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00027 Avianca - Litigation

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25436008 5/12/2020	Participate on call with Seabury and SGR re litigation strategy (.7); internal preparation for same (.8).	1.50	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 92 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Data	Description		Name
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25422700 \$	5/11/2020	Revise form 6K submissions.	0.50	Stirnberg, Tobias
25422931	5/11/2020	Correspond w/ L. Avila (Avianca) and S.	0.40	Stirnberg, Tobias
		Silverman re Brazilian servicing contract and Swiss Port request for prepayment.		
		Swiss Portrequest for prepayment.		
25434011 క	5/12/2020	Prepare for (2.2) and t/c (.9) with Colombian	3.50	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
		ministers; review materials re Colombian	0.00	
		recognition proceedings (.4).		
25462032	5/13/2020	T/Cs, email Colombian regulators (1.4); review	2.50	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
		requested disclosure (1.1).		
25442211	5/14/2020	Internal discussions with P. Richards re	1.20	Gonzalez, Flora
20442211	0/14/2020	request of Superintendencia de Transporte (.3);	1.20	
		review request re same (.9).		
25615012	5/14/2020	Email correspondence from P. Richards re	0.20	Nunez, Francisco R.
		request from Colombian SFC (.1); discussed requested posed by Colombian governmental		
		agencies with P. Richards and F. Gonzalez (.1).		
25458393	5/14/2020	Review request by SuperTransporte (.3);	2.90	Richards, Pablo
		coordinate response re same (.6); translate		
		same (.5); attends call re same (.8); attend team call re same (.7).		
25602949	5/14/2020	Attend call re letter in response to Colombian	1.00	Silverman, Stephen D.
		regulator request (.4); follow-up correspond w/		
		P. Richards re same (.2); attend another call w/ local Colombian counsel and internal team re		
		Colombian regulator request (.4).		
25615013	5/15/2020	Call w/ Muniz re disclosure requirements.	0.50	Milender, Parker
25576321 8	5/15/2020	Respond to Colombian regulators re various	4.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
		issues.		

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 93 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25444701 5/15/2020	Review information request made by Colombian Superintendence of Transportation (.2); emails w/ P. Richards and D. Rivas re same (.3); call w/ G. Velez, R. Galindo, D. Rivas, M. Mottesi, P. Richards and F. Gonzalez re same (1.0); review (.4) and comment on (.3) draft response re same (.2).	2.40	Nunez, Francisco R.
25447732 5/16/2020	Review SEC filings in connection with preparation of responses to regulatory requests by Superintencia Financiera and Superintencia de Transporte (.7); review drafts responses re same (.8); correspond with P. Richards re same (.1).	1.60	Nunez, Francisco R.
25469620 5/16/2020	Review coordination correspondence re responses to Transporte and Financiera (.5); review changes proposed by AVH re same (.3); draft revised response re same (.5); further review of responses to Transporte (1.2); review of proposed responses to Financiera (.7).	3.20	Richards, Pablo
25576317 5/17/2020	Call with M. Mottesi, F. Nunez and P. Richards re information requests received from Colombian regulators.	0.70	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25448376 5/17/2020	Emails w/ M. Mottesi and P. Richards re responses to Superintencia Financiera and Superintencia de Transporte (.2); review draft responses re same (.7); provide comments re same (1.5); review Company public filings i/c/w same (1.2); call w/ M. Mottesi, P. Richards and G. Guitart re same (.5); email w/ from L. G. Velez (Urdaneta) and M. Mottesi re same (.1); email w/ R. Galindo (Avianca) D. Rivas (Avianca) re same (.1); review comments to responses to Colombian regulators provided by D. O'Donnell and S. Silverman (.2).	4.50	Nunez, Francisco R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 94 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

_	Date	Description	Hours	Name
254802	04 5/17/2020	Prepare response to another Colombian regulatory request re chapter 11 (1.3); correspond w/ P. Richards re same (.1); follow-up correspond w/ P. Richards re same (.1).	1.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
254541	55 5/18/2020	Correspond w/ L. Velez (Urdaneta), R. Fandiño (Gomez Pinzon), R. Galindo (Avianca), P. Milender, D. Flórez (Gomez Pinzon), S. Silverman, D. Rivas, D. O'Donnell, M. Mottesi and P. Richards re drafts responses to requests posed by Colombian regulators (1.5); call with R. Galindo (Avianca), L. G. Velez (Urdaneta), M. Mottesi and P. Richards re same (.5); emails P. Richards re same (1.3); review (.6) and comment on (1.2) draft responses re same; review Avianca's SEC filings in connection with same (.6).	5.70	Nunez, Francisco R.
255763	22 5/18/2020	Address Colombian regulator issues (.9); review proposed response (1.2).	2.10	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
254665	95 5/19/2020	Review revised draft of response to SFC in Spanish and English translation (.8); provide comments to English translation of draft of response to SFC (3.0); review comments from by S. Silverman, D. O'Donnell and P. Richards re same (.2); emails w/ E. Hurtado (Avianca), D. Rivas (Avianca), R. Galindo (Avianca), S. Silverman, D. O'Donnell and P. Richards re draft of response to SFC (.5); discuss draft of response to SFC w/ S. Silverman and P. Richards (.2); multiple communications w/ P. Richards to discuss response to SFC (.2).	4.90	Nunez, Francisco R.
254721	12 5/19/2020	Internal emails and discussions re Colombia local regulator information submissions.	0.30	Stirnberg, Tobias
254855	40 5/20/2020	Call with A. Stone re ticket refund regulation spreadsheet (.3); prepare shell for ticket refund regulations spreadsheet (.1).	0.40	Hyla, Eric
255775	27 5/20/2020	Respond to Colombian regulator requests.	1.50	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 95 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25469818 5/20/2020	Review English version of response to SFC for inclusion on 6-K (.3); revise English version of response to SFC for inclusion on 6-K (.1); discuss same w/ P. Richards (.1); emails w/ P. Richards and L. Pfeifer (Avianca) re same (.1).	0.60	Nunez, Francisco R.
25498676 5/20/2020	Respond to emails re regulator demands (1.1); review proposed responses re same (.8).	1.90	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25473174 5/20/2020	Draft email to customs & border patrol.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25485022 5/21/2020	Emails w/ library re researching foreign regulations and laws (.3), UK ticket refund regulations (.6), regulations re Spain (1.4), German (1.1), Belgium (.5), Argentina (.4), Canada (.3); email to A. Stone re results re same (.2).	4.80	Hyla, Eric
25577528 5/21/2020	Address matters w/ local regulators.	1.70	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25485125 5/22/2020	Research aircraft ticket cancellations regulations for Aruba (.3), Brazil (.6), Chilean (.5), Cuba (1.0), Ecuador (.2), El Salvador (.2), Guatemala (.4), Bolivian (.3), Paraguay (.2).	3.70	Hyla, Eric
25515568 5/26/2020	Research aircraft ticket cancellations regulations for Mexico (.5), Nicaragua (.2), Honduras (.8), Panama (.7), Peru (.2), Uruguay (.2), Curacao (.6), Aruba (.3); correspond w/ H. Isaacs re Spanish translator (.2); call with M. Ortiz re regulations research and interpreting Spanish documents (.4).	4.10	Hyla, Eric
25495456 5/26/2020	Prepare for (.3) and attend (1.6) calls w/ Colombian regulators; emails re same (.9).	2.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25522180 5/26/2020	Research aircraft and airline ticket cancellation laws and regulations (4.0); call with E. Hyla re same (.3).	4.30	Ortiz, Maria

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 96 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25602950	5/27/2020	Review background materials for US ticket refund regulations (.7); call re Curacao civil aviation authority website (.2); review Curacao civil aviation law and regulations (.3); correspond with M. Ortiz re Spanish language documents (.3).	1.50	Hyla, Eric
25501622	5/27/2020	T/C re customer refunds and follow-up.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25522249	5/27/2020	Continue research re aircraft and airline ticket cancellation laws and regulations.	6.30	Ortiz, Maria
25526774	5/27/2020	Review DOT guidance and prior airline enforcement notices.	0.80	Parchment, Ryan
25515420	5/28/2020	Research post-petition agency actions (4.3); emails w/ R. Parchment re summary of same (.5); draft memo section re same (2.9).	7.70	Hyla, Eric
25527030	5/29/2020	Review relevant DOT statutes i/c/w DOT refund guidance (.7); draft memo sections re same (.4).	1.10	Parchment, Ryan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 97 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25462423 5/12/2020	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.4) internal call	0.50	Behrens, James C.
	re retention applications.		
25602951 5/12/2020	Correspond with S. Silverman re conflicts review (.1); correspond with D. O'Donnell re annex to Fleck Declaration (.1); review annex (.1); continue conflicts review (.3); correspond with Y. Zahoroda re conflicts review (.1); correspond with D. O'Donnell re OCP motion (.2); review OCP motion (.4); revise same (1.2); correspond with P. Milender, R. Galindo (Avianca), and C. Ortego (Avianca) re same (.3); review local rules for OCP motion deadlines (.4).	3.20	Metviner, Aaron
25436448 5/12/2020	Call w/ Milbank team re conflicts/retention applications.	0.40	Milender, Parker
25615011 5/12/2020	Attend internal call re retention and conflicts issues (.3).	0.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25461539 5/12/2020	Conduct research re investment bankers' retention application.	0.40	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25458349 5/13/2020	Continue Avianca conflicts review.	0.70	Metviner, Aaron
25447857 5/13/2020	Edit KCC retention motion under 327 (.2); review same to prepare for filing (.7); correspond w/ R. Jordan (KCC) re same (.1).	1.00	Silverman, Stephen D.
25461758 5/13/2020	Draft FTI retention application (1.3), Seabury retention application (2.1), and Milbank retention application (1.2); emails re same (.2); attend team calls re status of retention application (.4).	5.20	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25447883 5/14/2020	Edit KCC retention app under 327 (.4); correspond w/ C. Thomas re edits to string cite per judge's comments at first day hearing (.1).	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 98 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25602952 5/14/2020	Review Milbank's retention application (.8); review notice provision (.2); review conflicts for retention application (3.1).	4.10	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25458871 5/15/2020	Revise OCP motion (.2); correspond with Avianca team and P. Milender, D. O'Donnell re same (.1); draft email to Avianca team requesting information (.2).	0.50	Metviner, Aaron
25453521 5/15/2020	Update KCC 327 retention application string cites.	2.20	Thomas, Charmaine
25461143 5/15/2020	Review conflicts for retention application.	1.00	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25458811 5/16/2020	Continue review of Avianca conflicts (1.6); prepare annex to Fleck declaration (.7).	2.30	Metviner, Aaron
25492269 5/16/2020	Conduct second level conflicts review (3.2); emails re same (.7); revise Milbank retention application (1.9); review Seabury application (1.1); emails re same (.8).	7.70	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25461266 5/16/2020	Further revise Seabury's retention application.	1.40	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25462115 5/17/2020	Revise SGR retention application.	0.50	Behrens, James C.
25458640 5/17/2020	Review Avianca conflicts (1.4); prepare annex to Fleck declaration (1.0); correspond with Y. Zahoroda re interested parties list (.2); correspond with legal assistants, D. O'Donnell re NOAs, conflicts (.3).	2.90	Metviner, Aaron
25492279 5/17/2020	Continue second level conflicts review (2.4); review FTI application (1.1); t/c w/ Seabury (.6); review SGR retention application (1.1); emails re same (.4).	5.60	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25497311 5/18/2020	Coordinate conflicts check with NOA entities (.4); search case files for sample retention applications (2.0); correspond w/ J. Behrens re same (.2).	2.60	Brewster, Jacqueline

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 99 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25602953 5/18/2020	Continue review of Avianca conflicts (2.0); correspond with Y. Zahoroda re same (.2); continue to prepare annex of connections to Fleck declaration (1.8); coordinate additional conflicts searches with legal assistants (.1); review company's OCP list (.2); correspond with M. Catalina Perdomo Ortego (Avianca) (.1), J. Barrios (Avianca) (.1), P. Milender re same (.1).	4.60	Metviner, Aaron
25498654 5/18/2020	Continue second level conflicts review (1.3); revise application and declarations (1.8); emails re same (1.1); review/revise SGR application (1.2).	5.40	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25498246 5/18/2020	Review (.3) and revise (.7) potential parties list; review Fleck declaration (.5).	1.50	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25497234 5/19/2020	Update NOA List and circulate parties to conflicts. (1.7); correspond w/ A. Metviner re same (.1); update conflicts folder re same (.1).	1.90	Brewster, Jacqueline
25491816 5/19/2020	Continue review of Avianca conflicts i/c/w Milbank retention application (1.8); correspond with Y. Zahoroda re same (.2); follow-up call with Y. Zahoroda re same and next steps (.2).	2.20	Metviner, Aaron
25602954 5/19/2020	Call with J. Santos re preparation of Milbank second interim/final fee applications (.6); review of progress re the same (.2); prepare OCP motion (.3); review OCP information from Company (.3); incorporate into OCP motion (.2); further review and revise motion (.2); correspond with J. Barrios Camargo (Avianca) and M. Catalina (Avianca) re OCP list (.2).;	2.00	Metviner, Aaron
25498825 5/19/2020	Conduct second level conflicts review (2.3); emails re same (.7); revise Milbank retention application (1.1).	4.10	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 100 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description		Name
Date	Description	nours	
25498344 5/19/2020	Follow up on FTI retention application (.1); review FTI draft (.6); emails with FTI re same (.3); review conflict results (1.7); update disclosures chart for Milbank application (1.0).	3.70	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25473051 5/20/2020	Revise SGR retention application.	2.90	Behrens, James C.
25602955 5/20/2020	Call with Y. Zahoroda re conflicts progress and next steps (.1); progress review of conflicts (.3); correspond with D. O'Donnell, S. Silverman re same (.1); set up internal call to discuss further (.1); continue to prepare OCP motion (.5); review OCP information from Company (.2); correspond with Company re additional information requests (.3).	1.60	Metviner, Aaron
25498852 5/20/2020	Continue second level conflicts review (4.4); review SGR retention application (.9); T/C with Seabury re same (.6).	5.90	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25498538 5/20/2020	Review Seabury's retention application (.5); review declaration of same (.7); review precedent (.3); continue revisions to application (1.0).	2.50	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25525354 5/21/2020	Further revise SGM retention application.	3.90	Behrens, James C.
25602956 5/21/2020	Call with Y. Zahoroda, D. O'Donnell, S. Silverman re conflicts progress, next steps, Milbank retention application (.4); revise OCP motion (.5); correspond with P. Milender re same (.1).	1.00	Metviner, Aaron
25477071 5/21/2020	Emails w/ Company re ordinary course issues and OCPs.	1.40	Milender, Parker
25498898 5/21/2020	Continue second level conflicts review (3.6); edit Seabury application (1.3); T/C with Seabury re same (.8).	5.70	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 101 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25480605 5/21/2020	Attend internal coordination call re status of 2nd day retention apps (.3); review and mark-up conflicts schedule for Milbank retention app (3.8); correspond w/ A. Metviner, Y. Zahoroda, and D. O'Donnell re same (.2).	4.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25498340 5/21/2020	Review conflicts results (.5); update disclosure chart (.2).	0.70	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25491515 5/22/2020	Revise OCP motion (.8); correspond with Company re information requests (.3); review OCP Lists (.4); review OCP precedent re accountant issues (.2); review US Trustee correspondence (.1); follow-up correspondence with Avianca re OCP motion and US Trustee update (.4); correspond with P. Milender re same (.2);	2.40	Metviner, Aaron
25480683 5/22/2020	Review OCP motion and emails/calls w/ A. Metviner re same.	0.30	Milender, Parker
25498914 5/22/2020	Conduct second level conflicts review (4.3); revise application and declarations (1.9); respond to correspondence re same (1.1).	7.30	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25490497 5/22/2020	Assemble FTI retention application.	0.30	Thomas, Charmaine
25486488 5/22/2020	Review Seabury retention application (.5); review Seabury declaration in support of retention application (.2); exchanged emails with D. O'Donnell re same (.1); call with Seabury team to discuss disclosure of interested parties in declaration (.4); follow-up call with D. O'Donnell re Seabury declaration (.1).	1.30	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25525744 5/23/2020	Continue review of Milbank conflicts (2.9); continue to draft conflicts annex to Fleck declaration (1.1); correspond with D. O'Donnell, Y. Zahoroda re same (.2).	4.20	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 102 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description		Name
25498973	5/23/2020	Conduct second level conflicts review (5.2); emails re same (.7); revise Milbank retention application (1.9).	7.80	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25498409	5/23/2020	Review Milbank application & disclosures (1.1); further revise Milbank declaration for the retention application (1.2).	2.30	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25489076	5/24/2020	Comment on retention application.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25525686	5/24/2020	Draft OCP motion (1.0); correspond with Company legal department re same (.4); review information provided by Company and incorporate into motion (1.5).	2.90	Metviner, Aaron
25498926	5/24/2020	Continue second level conflicts review (2.8); review Ropes application (1.3); T/C with Seabury (.8).	4.90	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25498487	5/24/2020	Review (.4) and revise (.5) Seabury retention application; review (.6) and revise (1.9) FTI retention application and disclosure.	3.40	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25487028	5/25/2020	Further review of Milbank retention application (.3); internal inquiries related thereto (.2).	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25602959	5/25/2020	Continue review of OCP information from Company and research into the same (.8); incorporate into motion, draft and revise motion and proposed OCP procedures (1.0); oordinate with J. Brewster re Avianca pleadings, relevant precedent pull for internal team's review (.2); correspond with P. Milender re OCP (.1), D. O'Donnell re interim comp motions (.1); review interim comp motion (.1).	2.30	Metviner, Aaron
25486046	5/25/2020	Review of OCP motion and emails w/ E. Fleck re same (.9); research re same (1.5).	2.40	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 103 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	HOID.00051 Avianca - Ketention/1	ee Applications	
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25528030 5/25/2	020 Review Ropes & Gray application (.6); edit same (.4); review Milbank's application (.7); edit same (.3); edit Milbank's declaration (.7); emails w/ D. O'Donnell re same (.2); edit FTI's retention application (.8).	3.70	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25516768 5/26/2	020 Review OCP motion (.4); prepare exhibits re same (4.1).	4.50	Kim, Jae Yeon Cecilia
25602961 5/26/2	 Call with Y. Zahoroda re conflicts and retention application (.2); review NOAs, consider next steps re conflicts review and preparation of Milbank retention application (.3); review, edit interim comp procedures (1.0) and OCP motions (.7); correspond with P. Milender re same (.2); review OCP and interim comp motion precedent (.6); review correspondence with B. Masumoto (US Trustee) re OCP issues (.2); further revise OCP List (.4); correspond with Avianca team re the same (.1). 	3.70	Metviner, Aaron
25498036 5/26/2	020 Review of OCP/interim comp motions.	0.70	Milender, Parker
25528669 5/26/2	020 Revise Milbank fee application (1.7); review Ropes retention application (1.7); revise Seabury retention application (1.2); multiple emails UST re open issues (1.6).	6.20	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25527696 5/26/2	020 Review (.8) and edit (.3) Milbank's disclosures.	1.10	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25525372 5/27/2	020 Amend SGR retention application (1.4); emails re same (.3).	1.70	Behrens, James C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 104 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25603156	5/27/2020	Research Avianca research re committee retention applications (2.0); draft email re same to internal Avianca team (.8); correspond with P. Milender and D. O'Donnell re interim comp, OCP motions (.2); review re same (.2); review Judge Glenn precedent re payments to foreign affiliates (2.1); prepare email to internal team re key takeaways, summary of precedent (1.3); review second day hearing transcript with respect to 363(b) and non-debtor transfers (.3); correspond with J. Barrios Camargo (Avianca) re OCP motion (.2).	7.10	Metviner, Aaron
25528386	5/27/2020	Revise Milbank fee application (1.9); review Ropes retention application (1.6); revise Seabury retention application (1.8); multiple emails UST re open issues (1.6); review SGR retention application (1.7).	8.60	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25521483	5/27/2020	Review and assemble retention application documents.	0.40	Thomas, Charmaine
25527925	5/27/2020	Review (.6) and revise (1.4) SGR retention application; review (.7) and revise (1.3) Seabury's retention application; update Milbank's disclosure and parties in interest list (1.3); emails w/ D. O'Donnell re same (.1); review UST comments re retention application (.3); discuss UST comments with professionals (.4).	6.10	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25525080	5/28/2020	Revise Smith, Gambrell retention application (.8); emails re same (1.2); revise Seabury retention application (.6).	2.60	Behrens, James C.
25603157	5/28/2020	Review retention applications of UCC bankers in similarly sized chapter 11s for comparable fee structures (1.0); correspond with P. Milender re same (.1); further review, draft OCP, Interim comp motions (2.9); multiple correspondence with company re OCP issues (1.2); finalize motions and arrange for filing (2.1).	7.30	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 105 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
Date	Description	110013	
25507777 5/28/2020	Attend to filing of retention apps, OCP and interim comp motions and review of same.	0.80	Milender, Parker
25528647 5/28/2020	Revise Milbank fee application (1.9); review Ropes retention application (1.8); revise Seabury retention application (1.9); multiple emails UST re open issues (1.6); review SGR retention application (1.8); arrange of same (1.6).	10.60	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25505729 5/28/2020	Attend internal call w/ Y. Zahoroda and A. Metviner re retention app issues (.3); review, edit and finalize KCC 327 app (.8); review, edit and comment on Milbank retention app (1.1); follow-up correspond w/ Y. Zahoroda and D. O'Donnell re same (.2); correspond w/ D. Calderon (KCC) re filing and notice (.1).	2.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25603158 5/28/2020	Prepare Smith, Gambrell & Russell, LLP application for filing (.7); collect and distribute precedent UCC IBs and FAs retention applications (1.6).	2.30	Thomas, Charmaine
25528156 5/28/2020	Edit Milbank, FTI, Seabury, SGR, Ropes, KCC, Interim Comp, and OCP applications (5.5); prepare each for filing (.5); coordinate w/ paralegals re filing (.5); exchange emails w/ professionals re final sign offs (.4).	6.90	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25526175 5/29/2020	Continue research re UCC IB comps (.9); prepare chart re findings (.8); correspond with E. Fleck, P. Milender re same (.2); correspond with D. O'Donnell, P. Milender re budget and staffing (.2).	2.10	Metviner, Aaron
25528637 5/29/2020	Revise Milbank fee application (1.8); review Ropes retention application (1.9); revise Seabury retention application (1.6); multiple emails w/ UST re open issues (1.6); review SGR retention application (1.2).	8.10	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 106 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25528261	5/29/2020	Review UST comments re retention applications (.4); emails with professionals re same (.3); draft revised proposed orders based on UST comments (1.0).	1.70	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25526210	5/30/2020	Correspond with E. Fleck, G. Bray, P. Milender re OCP list (.3); review proposed OCP procedures re removal of OCPs (.2).	0.50	Metviner, Aaron
25513181	5/30/2020	Emails w/ G. Bray and E. Fleck re OCPs and rejection issues.	0.50	Milender, Parker
25552429	5/30/2020	Address retention issues (1.2); email US Trustee re same (.8); review Ropes issues (.6).	2.60	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25552460	5/31/2020	Review open UST retention issues (.9); emails re same (.7).	1.60	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 107 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00032 Avianca - Tax

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25447777 5/11/2020	Correspond w/ M. Buendia (Avianca) re various tax motion and order issues (.2); internal correspond and document review re same (.3); follow-up correspond w/ M. Buendia (Avianca) re same (.1).	0.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25447846 5/13/2020	Attend calls w/ numerous Avianca employees re tax deferral agreement issues (.7); emails re same (.2); research re same (2.3); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1); correspond w/ E. Fleck and G. Bray re same (.2).	3.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25447877 5/14/2020	Correspond w/ various Avianca employees and P. Milender re trust-related matters connected to tax payments (.3); brief research re same (.6).	0.90	Silverman, Stephen D.
25447895 5/15/2020	Call w/ multiple Avianca team members re tax deferral agreement issues (.4); review precedent re same (.8); legal research re same (.3); follow-up correspond w/ Company re same (.1).	1.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25477140 5/21/2020	Calls/emails w/ IRS re tax returns and review of letters re same.	0.60	Milender, Parker
25485730 5/25/2020	Draft email to IRS re tax returns.	0.20	Milender, Parker
25512101 5/27/2020	Correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) re U.S. state tax issue (.1): review document re same (.1).	0.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25577518 5/31/2020	Discuss tax disclosure in 20-F and financial statement inquiries with D. Hanno.	0.20	Raad, Alexia Theodora

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 108 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00033 Avianca - Securities & Corporate Governance Issues

44010.00055 Avianca - Securities & Corporate Governance issues			
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25420373 5/11/202	20 Revise 6-K re suspension of listing in NYSE (1.4); draft 6-K re ratings downgrade (.3); prepare Spanish language slides re chapter 11 overview (.9).	2.60	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25424661 5/11/202	Comment on 6ks (1.1); review of various matters re delisting and comms with NYSE (1.2); draft deregistration strategy (1.3).	3.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25447757 5/11/202	 Revise SFC requested disclosure (1.6)); correspond w/ P. Richards re same (.2); correspond w. D. Linero (Gomez) re same (.1); review FINRA notice (.2); correspond w/ B. Stewart re same (.2). 	2.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25425276 5/11/202	Confer with S. Silverman re FINRA letter.	0.10	Stone, Alan J.
25430159 5/12/202	Draft and file 6-Ks re S&P and Fitch downgrades (.3); revise step plan re deregistration (1.7); correspondence with D. Florez (Gomez Pinzon) re deregistration in Colombia (.4).	2.40	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25434068 5/12/202	 Review delisting and de registration materials (.9); t/c re approach to deregistration (.4); review Colombian annual report filing (.3). 	1.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25447862 5/12/202	 Review (1.2) and draft (.9) re supplemental SFC disclosure; correspond w/ G. Guitart re same (.1). 	2.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25436018 5/12/202	Respond to emails re SEC reporting obligations, NYSE listing, Colombian listing process.	1.10	Stirnberg, Tobias
25436535 5/13/202	20 Revise step plan re delisting and deregistration.	0.40	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25441648 5/13/202	20 Revise memorandum of delisting and deregistration process.	0.60	Stirnberg, Tobias
25441654 5/13/202	0 Prepare 20F filing analysis.	0.20	Stirnberg, Tobias

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 109 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00055 Avianca - Securities & Corporate Governance issues			
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25441798 5/14/2020	Call with L. Pfeiffer (Avianca) re 20-F.	0.20	Stirnberg, Tobias
25451233 5/15/2020	Review request from Super de Transporte (1.2); discuss the foregoing with P. Richards (.2).	1.40	Gonzalez, Flora
25446200 5/15/2020	T/c with L. Pfeifer (Avianca) and R. Fandino (Gomez Pinzon) re SFC request for information (.5).	0.50	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25458077 5/15/2020	Research precedent annual report filings on Form 20-F or Form 10-K by companies in chapter 11 bankruptcy.	2.20	Raad, Alexia Theodora
25469614 5/15/2020	Call with GPA and the Company regarding response to the SuperFinanciera (1.0); review of documents related to the response (.5); review of recent filings related to Ch11 (.5); draft response in Spanish (1.5); internal comments and discussions (.6); follow up call related to SuperTransporte (1.0); prepare documents for translations and annexes for the response (1.2).	6.30	Richards, Pablo
25447779 5/15/2020	Attend call re SFC request (.3); follow-up re same internally (.1).	0.40	Silverman, Stephen D.
25449913 5/15/2020	Provide 20F comments.	0.40	Stirnberg, Tobias
25446186 5/16/2020	Draft 6-K re disclosure on Company's 5 largest creditors (.5); draft 6-K on management financial info for Q1 2020 (1.1); draft 6-K on outstanding bonds of the Company (1.0).	2.60	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25448014 5/17/2020	Revise 6-K wording.	0.30	Guitart, Gonzalo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 110 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25469669	5/17/2020	Call re responses to Financiera and Transporte (.5); draft responses to SuperTransporte for restructuring group (1.3); call with restructuring group re same (.3); internal coordination and discussions re same (1.5); review responses based on internal feedback (1.5).	5.10	Richards, Pablo
25450054	5/17/2020	Comment on Colombians SEC 6Ks.	0.50	Stirnberg, Tobias
25480776	5/18/2020	Edit responses to Transporte (2.1); call re same (.7); consolidate (1.5) and translate(1.8) comments re same (1.5); coordinate with internal teams and Company re same (.5); review GPA email re response to Financiera (.5); send response to questions from GPA (.5).	9.10	Richards, Pablo
25480523	5/18/2020	Review further edits to SFC response (.1); correspond w/ D. O'Donnell and P. Richards re same (.2).	0.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25458334	5/18/2020	Review and revise various 6Ks.	0.80	Stirnberg, Tobias
25458346	5/18/2020	Review and provide comments to 20F.	0.30	Stirnberg, Tobias
25462155	5/19/2020	T/C with S. Wickouski (counsel to Delaware Trust Company) re replacement of trustee for unsecured notes (.2); review tripartite agreement (.6).	0.80	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25483049	5/19/2020	Discuss 20-F with Company (.1); begin updating draft re recent developments (3.2).	3.30	Raad, Alexia Theodora
25469641	5/19/2020	Coordinate comments to release and 6-K re Peru (1.6); prepare translation of release and 6-K re Peru (2.3); attend internal discussions re changes (.8); coordinate with the Company re filing of SFC and Peru (.5).	5.20	Richards, Pablo

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 111 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25480493	5/19/2020	Multiple emails re information submissions (.6); correspond w/ P. Richards, F. Nunez and D. O'Donnell re same (.3).	0.90	Silverman, Stephen D.
25472251	5/19/2020	Correspond w/ A. Raad re 20F.	0.40	Stirnberg, Tobias
25483105	5/20/2020	Comment on draft of triparty resignation agreement w/ Wilmington Trust (1.8); discuss certain Company representations w/ G. Guitart and T. Stirnberg (.2); discuss 20-F disclosure approach and precedents with T. Stirnberg (.2); revise 20-F draft to include chapter 11 disclosure (4.3); complete draft re recent developments (1.8); discuss 20-F tax disclosure with D. Hanno (.1).	8.40	Raad, Alexia Theodora
25469668	5/20/2020	Review of translation of 6-K (1.5); coordinate filing re same (.8).	2.30	Richards, Pablo
25477099	5/21/2020	Review stakeholder loans re liens granted to lenders (.3); internal call re existing liens (.4).	0.70	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25483126	5/21/2020	Complete revisions to 20-F draft to include chapter 11 disclosure and check against 20-F and 10-K precedents.	4.60	Raad, Alexia Theodora
25492435	5/26/2020	Revise 6-K translation.	1.70	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25503052	5/27/2020	Revise 6-K re SFC request (.8); revise local filing in response to request re first day motions (1.2).	2.00	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25505257	5/27/2020	Research 20-F disclosure requirement and precedents re remediation activities for material weakness in internal control over financial reporting (.5); follow-up re redacted exhibits to 20-F (.1).	0.60	Raad, Alexia Theodora
25507851	5/28/2020	Review multiple SEC issues.	0.40	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 112 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25505709 5/28/2020	Correspond w/ D. Rivas (Avianca) re Delaware LLC questions (.1); emails w/ F. Gonzalez, L. Aboodi and A. Walker re same (.2); correspond w/ CSC and F. Gonzalez re same (.2); emails w/ F. Gonzalez and L. Aboodi re same (.2); research same (.9); prepare response re same (.7); review Avianca's SEC filings (.1); review board minutes (.1).	2.50	Nunez, Francisco R.
25512058 5/29/2020	Emails w/ F. Gonzalez, A. Walker and A. Stone re responses to Delaware LLC questions posed by D. Rivas (Avianca) (.1); prepare email to CSC (registered agent) re Delaware LLC (.1).	0.20	Nunez, Francisco R.
25514879 5/31/2020	Discuss pending KPMG comments on 20-F with Company (.1) and T. Stirnberg (.1); revise COVID and chapter 11 disclosure in financial statements against 20-F disclosure and suggest edits (.8); review updates to and additional comments on 20-F draft (1.3); consolidate same (.9).	3.20	Raad, Alexia Theodora

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 113 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25419917 5/11/2020	Finalize non-disclosure agreements for all creditors and prepare deliverables of the same.	3.30	Barba, Marcela
25419665 5/11/2020	T/c with A. Renenger, E. Dexter, and R. Parchment re securitization agreements (.5); conduct research on choice-of-law re secuitization transaction (2.1); conduct research on jurisdiction issues (1.5); prepare memo re same (1.1); conduct research re retention event announcement (.8).	6.00	Benz, Stephen
25422006 5/11/2020	Correspondence concerning credit card securitizations (1.1) and calls with A. Renenger regarding same (.5); research regarding credit card securitizations (1.5).	3.10	Dexter, Erin E.
25420372 5/11/2020	T/C with G. Hughes (Seabury) and L. Avila (Avianca) re information to be provided to local banks.	0.30	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25459001 5/11/2020	Confer w/ Milbank team re credit card securitization issues (.4); conduct legal research on rejection of executory contracts (3.4); prepare summary re same (1.1).	4.90	Parchment, Ryan
25440380 5/11/2020	Emails and call re credit card securitization issues.	1.10	Wolf, Julie M.
25430218 5/12/2020	Update deferral letter and reservation of rights chart.	1.10	Barba, Marcela
25576324 5/12/2020	Correspond with team re spare parts approach and status of pledges.	0.50	Barba, Marcela
25426735 5/12/2020	Conduct research on securitization-related issues (2.4); respond to correspondence re same (.5); draft memo re same (2.2).	5.10	Benz, Stephen
25426901 5/12/2020	T/C with Avianca team re securitization memos.	0.60	Benz, Stephen

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 114 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Horosof Avianca - Finance & Se	culturation issues	
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25438341 5/12/2020	Calls re securitization structures (2.5); call with client re same (1.0); research issues re securitization structures (2.5); respond to correspondence re same (1.1).	7.10	Dexter, Erin E.
25435963 5/12/2020	Calls with potential financing sources.	2.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25456806 5/12/2020	Call w/ Smith Gambrell re securitization mechanics; prepare therefor (1.0); t/c w/ A. Renenger re securitization structures and all-hands call re same (2.7).	3.70	Grushkin, Jay D.
25430069 5/12/2020	Draft e-mail for Latin American banks re chapter 11 proceedings.	0.80	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25428786 5/12/2020	Review background on securitization issues (1.0); emails w/A. Renenger, E. Dexter, J. Wolf re same (.5).	1.50	Lauria, Kristina
25436530 5/12/2020	Calls w/ A. Renenger and R. Barab (SGR) re credit card securitization issues (1.8); review of securitization documents (.5); research re post-petition security interests and related issues (3.3).	5.60	Milender, Parker
25459247 5/12/2020	Call w/ Milbank team re credit card securitization issues (.7); conduct legal research re executory contracts i/c/w same (1.8).	2.50	Parchment, Ryan
25430276 5/12/2020	Review 20-F re 2004 Notes.	0.20	Richards, Pablo
25435535 5/12/2020	Call re securitization facilities.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25440360 5/12/2020	Attend litigation team call with A. Renenger re credit card securitization research and issues.	0.70	Wolf, Julie M.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 115 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	e Description	Hours	Name
25450064 5/13/2	2020 Review NY security agreement (1.2); review secuitization transaction (2.8); conduct related research re same (1.8); correspond with A. Renenger, E. Dexter re same (.5); conduct further research in Westlaw re same (.9); draft memo re same (2.1).	9.30	Benz, Stephen
25439975 5/13/2	Calls with potential DIP lender parties.	1.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25439431 5/13/2	2020 Draft memo re legal issues w/r/t securitizations (4.0); emails w/ team re same (.7).	4.70	Lauria, Kristina
25438870 5/13/2	Prepare analysis re securitization flow of funds (.8); review analysis of related legal (2.5).	3.30	Renenger, Aaron L.
25440467 5/13/2	2020 Revise letter re stay violation (.2); review notice re same (.2); review security agreement and credomatic credit card agreement (1.4); conduct related legal research (1.1).	2.90	Wolf, Julie M.
25449754 5/14/2	Research (2.1) and revise (1.4) securitization memo to be sent to client; call with A. Renenger re same (.3); email to E. Dexter re same (.1); make further revisions to memo (1.2).	5.10	Benz, Stephen
25456351 5/14/2	Research securitization structure arguments (4.0); respond to correspondence re same (1.8).	5.80	Dexter, Erin E.
25442957 5/14/2	2020 Comment on securitization documentation/analysis (.8); t/c with A. Neuhauser (Avianca) re same (.2); t/c with counsel to stakeholder loan (.4); prepare for same (.2); emails with management re same (.2).	1.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25441531 5/14/2	Draft summary of stakeholder loan collateral.	1.60	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25442199 5/14/2	2020 Draft memo re securitization issues (4.5); emails w/ Milbank team re same (1.1).	5.60	Lauria, Kristina

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 116 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Nama
Date	Description	IIVUIS	
25459060 5/14/2020	Conduct legal research re securitization issues (3.6); draft memo sections re same (1.7).	5.30	Parchment, Ryan
25441689 5/14/2020	Revise draft memo re securitization litigation issues (1.7); emails re same (.3); conduct further analysis of legal issues (1.5); call with S. Benz re same (.2).	3.70	Renenger, Aaron L.
25441519 5/14/2020	Revise memorandum re credit card securitization legal issues (3.6); review case law and conduct research re same (3.4); discuss same with E. Dexter (.2).	7.20	Wolf, Julie M.
25450161 5/15/2020	Revise memo re securitization (2.2); attend call re motion (.3); review related motions from prior Avianca bankruptcy (1.5).	4.00	Benz, Stephen
25456158 5/15/2020	Edit securitization strategy memo (3.4); respond to correspondence re same (2.0); emails (.5) and call (.5) re draft securitization-related pleadings.	6.40	Dexter, Erin E.
25451654 5/15/2020	Revise documentation in support of DIP financing.	2.80	Fleck, Evan R.
25446185 5/15/2020	Correspond with L. Avila (Avianca) and N. Garcia re received queries from secured creditor (.4); call with B. Dobbin and A. J. Issenman (both Seabury) re liens (.4); review confidentiality provisions (.6); call with B. Dobbin and A. J. Issenman (both Seabury) and M. Mottesi re same (.3); draft email re disclosure of financing documents (.2).	1.90	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25446194 5/15/2020	Draft summary of stakeholder loan collateral.	0.20	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25447541 5/15/2020	Revise strategy memo re securitizations legal issues (3.0); emails w/ A. Renenger, E. Dexter, et al. re same (1.0); attend team call re draft pleadings w/r/t securitizations (.5); review related pleadings (1.0); emails w/ J. Wolf, E. Dexter re same (.3).	5.80	Lauria, Kristina

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 117 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25459285 5/15/2020	Conduct follow up legal research re executory contracts i/c/w credit card securitization issues (2.4); revise memo sections re same (.9).	3.30	Parchment, Ryan
25450348 5/15/2020	Call with E. Dexter and J. Wolf re litigation strategy for credit card securitizations (.5); review securitization pleadings from 2003 bankruptcy re consideration of litigation strategy (.5); consider litigation strategy and revise related memorandum (2.1); call with R. Barab re same (.4).	3.50	Renenger, Aaron L.
25447508 5/15/2020	 Call with E. Dexter and A. Renenger re credit card securitizations memo (.5); revise memorandum re securitization recommendations (1.1); conduct legal and factual research re same (.8); call with research team re drafting pleadings re securitizations (.3); conduct legal research re requests for relief under local rules (.4). 	3.10	Wolf, Julie M.
25451482 5/16/2020	Review letter re retention event (.1); review securitizations memo (1.6); revise same (1.6).	3.30	Grushkin, Jay D.
25451182 5/16/2020	Emails re disclosure re data room model.	0.10	Renenger, Aaron L.
25456886 5/17/2020	Review correspondence re securitization strategies memo.	0.70	Dexter, Erin E.
25451613 5/17/2020	Review revisions to securitization memo (1.1); email comments to team re same (.3).	1.40	Grushkin, Jay D.
25447531 5/17/2020	 Research re legal and procedural requests (4.0); draft summary re same (1.0); emails w/ E. Dexter and J. Wolf re same (.4). 	5.40	Lauria, Kristina
25451508 5/17/2020	Review memo re securitizations.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25458546 5/18/2020	Begin draft of secuitization complaint.	4.10	Benz, Stephen

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 118 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	44010.00054 Avianca - Finance & Securit	ization issues	
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25458392 5/18/2020	Research bankruptcy court's ability to reject or assume certain types of contracts.	0.40	Capolino, Margherita Angela
25455646 5/18/2020	Attend call re securitization structures recommendation memo (.8); revise same (4.4); emails re same (1.0).	6.20	Dexter, Erin E.
25495885 5/18/2020	Review UCC filing issue.	0.30	Grushkin, Jay D.
25467424 5/18/2020	Draft motion re credit card receivables (4.3); emails w/ E. Dexter, J. Wolf re same (.5); begin research re Bankr. S.D.N.Y. standard of same (2.4).	7.20	Lauria, Kristina
25491611 5/18/2020	Conduct legal research re executory contracts i/c/w motion to reject securitization agreements.	1.40	Parchment, Ryan
25455687 5/18/2020	Consider AIP revisions to memo re credit card securitizations (.3); review research re recharacterization and rejection (.8); revise litigation memo re credit card receivables (.7); discuss same with J. Wolf and E. Dexter (.6).	2.40	Renenger, Aaron L.
25453925 5/18/2020	Call with E. Dexter and A. Renenger re credit card securitizations memo (.7); revise memo re same (1.5); review outline of related motion (1.7).	3.90	Wolf, Julie M.
25469240 5/19/2020	Draft secuitization-related complaint (6.9); review email from K. Lauria re same (.2).	7.10	Benz, Stephen
25467483 5/19/2020	Revise memo re securitizations legal issues.	1.90	Capolino, Margherita Angela
25469552 5/19/2020	Edit memo re securitization strategies (4.9); respond to emails re same (1.1).	6.00	Dexter, Erin E.
25468713 5/19/2020	Calls with potential sources of DIP financing.	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25495941 5/19/2020	Review issues re sweeping of accounts.	1.00	Grushkin, Jay D.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 119 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25467575 5/19/2020	D Draft memorandum re securitization transaction (4.5); conduct related research (2.3); emails w/ J. Wolf, E. Dexter re same (.3).	7.10	Lauria, Kristina
25466647 5/19/2020	Revise memo re credit card receivable securitizations (1.9); review analysis (.6) and emails (.3) re sweeping of accounts.	2.80	Renenger, Aaron L.
25482336 5/19/2020	Review summary of related standards (1.2); correspond with K. Lauria re same (.1).	1.30	Wolf, Julie M.
25476006 5/20/2020) Revise draft complaint.	1.50	Benz, Stephen
25603159 5/20/2020	 Intro call with E. Dexter and J. Wolf re finance securitization issues (.4); call with A. Renenger and J. Wolf re securitization issues (.5); call with J. Wolf re securitization issues memo (.2); email w/ K. Lauria re same (.1). 	1.20	Capolino, Margherita Angela
25473136 5/20/2020	Edit securitization memo (1.5); calls with A. Renenger re same (1.0); emails re same (1.0).	3.50	Dexter, Erin E.
25473326 5/20/2020	Calls with potential sources of DIP financing.	2.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25495880 5/20/2020	 Review revised securitization memo (.8); respond to multiple questions posed by A. Renenger et al. (1.0). 	1.80	Grushkin, Jay D.
25470329 5/20/2020	Review execution of tripartite agreement.	0.60	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25603160 5/20/2020	 Draft motion related to securitization issues (3.5); conduct related case law research (1.5); emails re same (.3); edit memo re securitizations (1.2); emails w/ J. Wolf, E. Dexter, M. Capolino, A. Renenger re same (.3).; 	6.80	Lauria, Kristina
25473284 5/20/2020	Review of credit card securitization/receivables memo (.8); draft comments to same (.3).	1.10	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 120 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		44010.00054 Itvianca - I mance & Securitization	135005	
D	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25485560 5/2		Discussion with E. Fleck, E. Dexter and J. Wolf re credit card securitization memo (.4); review (.6) and revise (.7) draft memo re same; prepare analysis re credit card processing agreements (2.0).	3.70	Renenger, Aaron L.
25482314 5/2		Call with E. Dexter and M. Capolino re ongoing research (.3); call with A. Renenger and M. Capolino re same (.6); conduct legal research re same (.5); review and revise draft adversary complaint (2.2); review related motion and memorandum of law (1.1); review case law re same (1.3); call with E. Dexter, E. Fleck, and A. Renenger re Debtors' memo re securitization issues (.4); review credit card processor agreements and consents (.9).	7.30	Wolf, Julie M.
25475968 5/2		Edit draft complaint (2.4); emails w/ J. Wolf re same (.2); conduct Westlaw research re same (.5); draft related pleadings (4.2).	7.30	Benz, Stephen
25476867 5/2	21/2020	Draft memo of related securiztization issues.	6.80	Capolino, Margherita Angela
25476976 5/2		Edit cc securitizations strategy memo (1.2); calls with A. Renenger, P. Milender, J. Wolf re same (.8); emails re same (.7).	2.70	Dexter, Erin E.
25490661 5/2		Calls internally and with counterparties re financing NDAs (.7); calls with potential DIP lenders re diligence (1.1); call with internal DIP team re financing considerations (.5).	2.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25495875 5/2		Respond to numerous queries re securitization structures (1.0); revise memo on securitization (2.0); review consents and agreements (1.5).	4.50	Grushkin, Jay D.
25476272 5/2		Draft executive summary for memo re securitizations legal issues (1.0); correspond w/ E. Dexter, J. Wolf re same (.5).	1.50	Lauria, Kristina
25477100 5/2		Call w/ A. Renenger re credit card processors/receivables agreements.	0.60	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 121 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25477410	5/21/2020	Discussion with J. Wolf re credit card processor issue (.3); further analysis re same (2.5); attend discussion with P. Milender, J. Wolf and E. Dexter re same (.6); correspond with R. Barab (SGR) re same (.2); revise memorandum re same (.3); review edits from R. Barab (SGR) re same (.3).	4.20	Renenger, Aaron L.
25482264	5/21/2020	Update memorandum re securitization issues.	0.60	Wolf, Julie M.
25490557	5/22/2020	Revise securitization strategy memo (1.5); emails re same (1.1).	2.60	Dexter, Erin E.
25603161	5/22/2020	Revise securitization analysis (1.2); resolve NDA matters with multiple potential DIP providers (.8).	2.00	Fleck, Evan R.
25496031	5/22/2020	Conduct final review of memo re securitizations.	0.80	Grushkin, Jay D.
25485152	5/22/2020	Draft side letter between stakeholder creditors and AVH re second lien collateral for DIP lender.	2.60	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25480928	5/22/2020	Draft motion (.9) and memo of law (1.1) re securitization and relief; review factual circumstances re same (.6); correspond w/ J. Wolf, E. Dexter re same (.4).	3.00	Lauria, Kristina
25485144	5/22/2020	Revise memorandum re credit card securitizations (.7); emails re same (.6).	1.30	Renenger, Aaron L.
25482334	5/22/2020	Revise credit card securitization memorandum re comments from co-counsel and advisors (.7); review draft adversary complaint (.7).	1.40	Wolf, Julie M.
25489057	5/23/2020	Calls with potential sources of financing re legal diligence (1.1); internal email re same (.1).	1.20	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 122 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

		++010.0000+ Avianca - I mance & Securnizatio	II ISSUES	
Ľ	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25482355 5/:	23/2020	Revise side letter re granting of second lien on available equity.	1.80	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25603162 5/:	23/2020	Edit chapter 11 background slides for interested financing party (.9); compile related materials for same (.8); conduct initial DIP research (3.9); correspond w/ P. Milender and D. O'Donnell re same (.2).	5.80	Silverman, Stephen D.
25488852 5/	24/2020	Prepare for calls with potential financing parties.	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.
25485775 5/:	24/2020	Research DIP-related issues (4.6); preliminary write-up re same (.5).	5.10	Silverman, Stephen D.
25487070 5/:	25/2020	Call with Debtors and investment bank re financing proposal.	0.90	Fleck, Evan R.
25485447 5/:	25/2020	Distribute agenda items for discussion with investment bank across Milbank teams (.7); attend diligence conference call w/ team (1.0); revise 6-K re trading (.5).	2.20	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25512112 5/:	25/2020	Research re DIP issues (4.1); email to P. Milender re findings (.4): follow-up correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1).	4.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25524415 5/2	26/2020	Review correspondence re preference claim.	0.30	Benz, Stephen
25495854 5/	26/2020	Emails re additional potential challenges to securitization structures.	0.90	Dexter, Erin E.
25496590 5/	26/2020	Calls with potential financing parties (.5); review NDA issues (.1); call with CFO re financing matters (.3).	0.90	Fleck, Evan R.
25512114 5/:	26/2020	Continue work fee research (1.8); correspond w/ E. Fleck re same (.3).	2.10	Silverman, Stephen D.
25502682 5/	27/2020	Review correspondence re securitization strategy Debtors' call.	0.60	Dexter, Erin E.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 123 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description		Name
Date		nours	
25502473 5/27/2020	Calls with potential financing parties.	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25501136 5/27/2020	Emails re credit card securitization discussions.	0.10	Renenger, Aaron L.
25512153 5/27/2020	Continue DIP-related research (2.9); review numerous pleadings and filings re same (1.2); finalize chart detailing research (1.1); correspond w/ E. Fleck re same (.1).	5.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25505122 5/27/2020	Review revised securitization pleadings (1.1); review revised draft adversary complaint (.8).	1.90	Wolf, Julie M.
25507863 5/28/2020	Review (.4) and comment on (.7) amendment to stakeholder loan.	1.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25524286 5/28/2020	Review memo re credit card securitization strategy (.7); draft talking points for Debtors call re same (.9).	1.60	Renenger, Aaron L.
25524256 5/29/2020	Revise securitization pleadings (1.6); further revise same (1.1).	2.70	Benz, Stephen
25524304 5/29/2020	Attend (partial) call re securitization complaints.	0.70	Benz, Stephen
25524424 5/29/2020	Revise motion requesting securitization-related relief.	3.50	Benz, Stephen
25523375 5/29/2020	Respond to correspondence re credit card securitization pleadings.	3.80	Dexter, Erin E.
25603163 5/29/2020	Participate on securitization strategy call with Debtors (1.0); review follow-up matters (.2); comment on secured lender agreement (.4).	1.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25525700 5/29/2020	Attend all-hands securitization call.	1.00	Grushkin, Jay D.
25522095 5/29/2020	Revise letter to stakeholders re second lien collateral.	0.70	Guitart, Gonzalo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 124 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description		Name
Date		IIUUIS	
25512495 5/29/2020	Draft (1.6) and revise (2.2) securitization pleadings; correspond with A. Renenger, J. Wolf, E. Dexter re same (.6).	4.40	Lauria, Kristina
25516444 5/29/2020	Address multiple issues re securitization facilities.	1.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25524474 5/29/2020	Prepare for (.3) and attend call (1.0) with A. Neuhauser (Avianca), L. Avila (Avianca) et al. re credit card securizations; follow-up with R. Barba re same (.3); attend discussion with E. Dexter and J. Wolf re draft pleadings (.2); call with J. Wolf, S. Benz and K. Lauria re motion (.6); revise motion for relief (1.9) and draft complaint (1.5); discuss same w/ E. Dexter (.2).	6.00	Renenger, Aaron L.
25513417 5/29/2020	Review draft relief motion (.9); provide comments re same (.5); review draft complaints (.5) provide comments re same (.6).	2.50	Wolf, Julie M.
25603164 5/30/2020	Revise fiduciary complaint (2.7); revise securitization complaint (1.9); research potential preference claim under related transaction (2.1); revise motion for relief (1.9).	8.60	Benz, Stephen
25523476 5/30/2020	Emails re credit card securitization papers.	0.50	Dexter, Erin E.
25518538 5/30/2020	Call with Seabury and A. Renenger re receivables litigation (.4); review follow-up (.1).	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25513237 5/30/2020	Revise securitization pleadings (4.2); emails w/ S. Benz, J. Wolf, A. Renenger re same (.4); draft declaration from L. Avila (Avianca) re same (.8).	5.40	Lauria, Kristina

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 125 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25524402 5/30/2020	Attend discussion with E. Fleck, J. Luth (Seabury) re credit card processing agreements (.5); analysis and emails re same (.6); revise related complaint (.7); revise motion for relief (.6).	2.40	Renenger, Aaron L.
25513420 5/30/2020	Revise secuitization pleadings (3.9); correspondence re same (.8).	4.70	Wolf, Julie M.
25603165 5/31/2020	Call w/ A. Renenger re securitization issues (.3); call w/ A. Renenger re credit card processing agreements (.3); revise securitization pleading (1.2).	1.80	Benz, Stephen
25523527 5/31/2020	Respond to correspondence re credit card securitization pleadings.	0.80	Dexter, Erin E.
25518558 5/31/2020	Review updated financing letter.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25515949 5/31/2020	Complete research re financing executory contract.	7.10	Lee, Danielle
25518780 5/31/2020	Review securitization agreement (1.0); call w/ A. Renenger re same (.5).	1.50	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 126 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	HOID.00055 Avianca - Antri art ar	iu Ficet Issues	
Date	Description	Hours	Name
25458145 5/11/2020	Review (5.3) and revise (7.2) aircraft stipulation; calls re same (3.4); emails re same (4.1).	20.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25435119 5/11/2020	Review/comment on stipulations (.6); participate on aircraft working group call (.6); calls with aircraft counterparties regarding treatment in cases (1.8).	3.00	Fleck, Evan R.
25614749 5/11/2020	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.5) call with Seabury and team re fleet management.	0.60	Goff, Steve
25425758 5/11/2020	Attend daily Milbank call (.5); attend fleet strategy call w/ Seabury and Milbank teams (.5).	1.00	Milender, Parker
25615001 5/11/2020	Attend fleet strategy call.	0.50	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25425478 5/11/2020	Call w/ G. Hughes (Seabury), G. Bray re aircraft issues.	0.40	Stone, Alan J.
25603166 5/11/2020	Emails w/ E. Fleck, G. Bray and team re aircraft issues (.3); attend (partial) fleet strategy call (.4).	0.70	Stone, Alan J.
25615010 5/11/2020	Attend to fleet strategy call.	0.50	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25576315 5/12/2020	Review aircraft rejection.	5.10	Bray, Gregory A.
25435945 5/12/2020	Numerous calls with aircraft counterparties re stipulations/next steps (2.3); updates to Seabury re same (.3).	2.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25435519 5/12/2020	Review Swissport documents (.5); emails w/ G. Bray re fleet management/adequate protection (.2); attend Seabury-Milbank-Client call (.4).	1.10	Stone, Alan J.
25436906 5/13/2020	Coordinate Central American pledge status with client.	0.10	Barba, Marcela

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 127 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25458240	5/13/2020	Review aircraft parties' requests.	5.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25439917	5/13/2020	Participate on numerous calls with aircraft parties regarding stipulations and treatment in case (1.7); comment on stipulation comments (.6).	2.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25438483	5/13/2020	Review comments to stipulations from creditors counsel (2.5); draft issues list re the same (2.0); call with advisors re responses to creditor proposals to stipulations (1.4); revise form stipulation re comments received and group discussion (1.8).	7.70	Goff, Steve
25459252	5/13/2020	Confer with SGR and Seabury re aircraft adequate protection stipulation (.7); review issues list re same (.4).	1.10	Parchment, Ryan
25442799	5/14/2020	Participate on fleet strategy call with SGR and Seabury (.7); comment on stipulations (.6).	1.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25441619	5/14/2020	Review comments to stipulations from creditors' counsel (1.2); calls with advisors and team re response stipulation (1.3); revise draft form response stipulation per comments from creditors and internal discussions (3.5); call with G. Bray and H. Schwarz re draft stipulation (.6); call with VP re draft stipulation (.6).	7.20	Goff, Steve
25450244	5/14/2020	Call with Smith Gambrell to coordinate preparation of aircraft equipment stipulations (.2); review stipulation exhibits prepared by Smith Gambrell (.9); compare aircraft tracker against list of required stipulations (.1).	1.20	Jensen, Niels
25447856	5/14/2020	Correspond w/ P. Milender re aircraft stipulation issues and strategy.	0.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25442920	5/14/2020	Attend fleet management call (.7); call w/ client and G. Hughes (Seabury) re airport leases (.7).	1.40	Stone, Alan J.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 128 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25444553 5/15/2020	Cross compare SGR stipulation exhibit against Avianca's expected list of rejected aircraft.	2.30	Barba, Marcela
25451459 5/15/2020	Numerous external and internal calls regarding stipulations (2.0); review drafts re same (.3).	2.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25444720 5/15/2020	Call re stipulation with Airbus ECAs and counsel (.7); call re stipulation with ATR ECAs and counsel (.8); review comments to the revised draft stipulation from various creditors (2.8); draft issues list summary re the same (2.0); review stipulation exhibits for expected signing or rejection of aircraft (2.2).	8.50	Goff, Steve
25450541 5/15/2020	Review exhibits to aircraft equipment stipulations prepared by Smith Gambrell (.8); confirm leasing structure for certain aircraft (.4); draft exhibits to aircraft equipment stipulations re required signatories (1.5); prepare exhibits to aircraft rejection motions (.5).	3.20	Jensen, Niels
25461083 5/15/2020	Review stipulation exhibits and related aircraft agreements for MSNs.	8.00	Mansoor, Victoria
25458519 5/15/2020	Correspond with P. Milender re aircraft precedent motions (.1); continue review of aircraft cases, pleadings, agendas, transcripts (4.0); summarize findings for internal team (2.0).	6.10	Metviner, Aaron
25447827 5/15/2020	Review updated schedule detailing next aircraft rejection and abandonment (.2); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1); brief precedent research re aircraft rejection and abandonment motion (.4); draft same (2.2); review orders cited and same and confirm accuracy of citations (.7).	3.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25449922 5/15/2020	Respond to emails from company and internal team re AP stipulations.	0.50	Stirnberg, Tobias

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 129 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25450389 5/15/202	0 Emails w/ fleet management team re leases.	0.20	Stone, Alan J.
25448336 5/16/202	0 Review dataroom management and spot check stipulations for second day rejection of aircrafts.	1.50	Barba, Marcela
25451621 5/16/202	0 Review (.2) and consider (.5) changes to stipulations; t/c with G. Bray re procedural stipulation matters (.4).	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25447685 5/16/202	0 Call with ICBC counsel re stipulation (.6); calls with various counsels re first stipulation (.8); call with SMBC and counsel re same (.9); call with advisors re same (.4); review draft exhibits to stipulation for various creditors and related aircraft agreements (1.0); draft first stipulations for individual creditors and aircraft (9.5).	13.20	Goff, Steve
25449952 5/16/202	0 Conference call with Holland & Knight and Smith Gambrell re terms of aircraft equipment stipulations (.4); call with Vedder and Clifford Chance re same (.3); review comments to aircraft stipulations (.9); correspond with S. Goff and H. Schwarz re same (.2).	1.80	Jensen, Niels
25505516 5/16/202	0 Review aircraft lease documents.	3.00	Mansoor, Victoria
25448170 5/16/202	0 Call w/ G. Bray re aircraft rejection procedures (.1); review precedent for same (.5).	0.60	Milender, Parker
25447774 5/16/202	 Edit second aircraft rejection motion (.6); correspond w/ P. Milender re same (.1); correspond w/ Seabury team re same (.2): review certain precedent re aircraft issue (.4). 	1.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25448313 5/17/202	0 Coordinate the execution of second round of rejections and stipulations for 91 aircraft with various creditors, consisting of 44 separate documents for signature.	6.70	Barba, Marcela

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 130 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25451329	5/17/2020	Review stipulations with aircraft lessors.	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.
25455253	5/17/2020	Calls with creditors and counsel re comments to first stipulation (1.3); draft correspondence to creditors and counsel re comments to stipulations (2.8); draft additional first stipulations for creditors and aircraft (3.8); review comments from creditors and counsel to first draft stipulations (4.2); revise first draft stipulations re comments received and discussions (2.2); draft exhibits to stipulation for various creditors and related aircraft agreements (2.1).	16.40	Goff, Steve
25450155	5/17/2020	Draft aircraft equipment stipulations for certain aircraft (1.3); analyze existing lease (1.2) and financing documents (1.1) to determine appropriate counterparties; review comments to (.3) and revise (.5) aircraft equipment stipulations; correspond w/ S. Goff and H. Schwarz re same (.2); draft stipulations for financing secured by aircraft and other collateral (.4).	5.00	Jensen, Niels
25462116	5/17/2020	Revise stipulation exhibits and related aircraft agreements.	6.00	Mansoor, Victoria
25448180	5/17/2020	Draft omnibus aircraft rejection procedures motion.	4.00	Milender, Parker
25450494	5/17/2020	Call with S. Goff re logistics for AP stipulations (.3); call with G. Bray re BNP cash deposit in ATR financing (.3); confer with N. Jensen re JOLCO structure and need for lenders/agent to sign AP stipulations (.3); correspondence with Milbank team re same (.8); confer w/ P. Milender re same (.2).	1.90	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25603167	5/18/2020	Coordinate with various counsels to finalize, execute, and prepare for filing 44 stipulation agreements for filing with the bankruptcy court (10.0); update stipulation tracker and rejections (.4).	10.40	Barba, Marcela

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 131 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

TTOTO.00000 AVIANCA - AMICIAIL AND FREE ISSUES				
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
	25497924 5/18/2020	Review multiple aircraft stipulations and issues (11.2); review revised versions of same (6.9); t/cs, email re: same (1.9).	20.00	Bray, Gregory A.
	25456713 5/18/2020	Consider stipulations and related correspondence (.6); t/c with Seabury regarding status of rejections (.2).	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.
	25455486 5/18/2020	Calls with counsel re stipulations (.6); draft correspondece (3.8) and review responses (1.8) from creditors and counsel re same; review comments re same (4.2); revise draft stipulations re same (5.7).	16.10	Goff, Steve
	25505426 5/18/2020	Revise aircraft stipulations (3.4); review leasing documents (2.4).	5.80	Mansoor, Victoria
	25455451 5/18/2020	Call with N. Jensen and S. Goff re status of AP stipulation signing (.3); correspondence with Milbank team re deal structures, signing logistics, AP stipulations, et al. (1.5).	1.80	Schwarz, Helfried J.
	25480489 5/18/2020	Correspond w/ P. Milender and G. Hughes re aircraft issues (.2); correspond w/ P. Milender re Boeing contracts and related issues (.2).	0.40	Silverman, Stephen D.
	25457717 5/18/2020	Call w/ client and Swissport (.7); attend Seabury-Milbank-Client call (.3).	1.00	Stone, Alan J.
	25468676 5/19/2020	Attend internal Milbank planning call.	0.80	Behrens, James C.
	25530413 5/19/2020	Edit settlement procedures motion.	2.00	Cruz Burgos, Melany
	25468668 5/19/2020	Final review of aircraft stipulations.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 132 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Da	ate	Description	Hours	Name
25468717 5/19		Telephone conference with counsel re first stipulations (.2); correspondence with counsel re first stipulations and filing (.3); revise first stipulation per comment from counsel (.3); prepare all first stipulations for filing (.4); draft amended and restated stipulation (.4); prepare exhibits for amended and restated stipulation (.5); telephone conference with Debtors and advisors re fleet management (.5); telephone conference with Debtors re receivables (.2).	2.80	Goff, Steve
25615014 5/19		Call with G. Hughes, L. Grindal (both Seabury), J. Tenen, I. Sanchez (SGR) and G. Bray re terms of PHB arrangements and incorporation into amended/second AP stipulation (.9); call with L. Avila (Avianca), Santiago, G. Hughes, K. Raff (Seabury) re fleet discussions (.5).	1.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25615015 5/19	9/2020	Attend Seabury-Milbank-Debtors call (.4).	0.40	Stone, Alan J.
25470065 5/20	0/2020	Coordinate stipulation amendments with H. Schwarz.	0.10	Barba, Marcela
25472987 5/20		Telephone conference re remaining aircraft stipulations (1.3); prepare signed first stipulations for filing (1.3); reviewing comments to stipulations for remaining aircraft (.5); correspondence with counsel to creditors of remaining aircraft (.2); draft second stipulation form (1.6); review PBH agreement re the same (.3).	5.20	Goff, Steve
25491558 5/20		Confer w/ team re aircraft lease rejection (.4); conduct legal research re cross-default provisions and lease assumption/rejection (3.6).	4.00	Parchment, Ryan

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 133 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25473282	5/20/2020	Confer with G. Bray, A. Stone and R. Parchment re effect of cross-default and cross-collateralization provisions in ECA transactions on partial rejection of passenger aircraft and assumption of freighter aircraft (.4); review summary of research results (.2); confer w/ E. Fleck re review of Boeing purchase agreement in the context of a rejection (.2); confer w/ G. Kim re same (.3); call with G. Hughes, L. Grindal (Seabury), J. Tenen, I. Sanchez (SGR), G. Bray and S. Goff re Airbus ECA and ATR ECA comments to form of AP stipulation (1.3); prepare revised draft AP stipulation annotated to respond to comments raised by ECAs and draft cover email (1.5); confer w/ G. Bray re initial SGR draft of Exhibit B to second AP stipulation re power-by-the hour arrangements for use of aircraft (.3); respond to S. Silverman re Rolls Royce proposal (.3).	4.50	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25473007	5/20/2020	Review research on cross defaults.	0.30	Stone, Alan J.
25490386	5/20/2020	Update stipulations (1.8); prepare same for filing (1.9); compile same re executed signature pages (1.7); emails re same (1.3).	6.70	Thomas, Charmaine
25476346	5/21/2020	Update signature information for forty-four signatories.	2.00	Barba, Marcela
25477807	5/21/2020	Draft second stipulation (2.7); calls with G. Bray and H. Schwarz re stipulation issues (.7); T/C with Seabury, SGR and working group re PBH agreement (.7); review form PBH agreement re the same (.5).	4.60	Goff, Steve

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 134 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25477339	5/21/2020	Call with G. Bray, S. Goff re draft of second AP stipulation (.3); call with G. Hughes, K. Raff, N. Wesson, L. Grindal (Seabury), J. Tenen, I. Sanchez (SGR), G. Bray, S. Goff re same (.8); call with G. Bray, N. Jensen and P. Milender re same (.2); review (.6) and comment on (.5) revised stipulation; call with G. Bray and S. Goff re same (.4); correspond with N. Wesson and K. Raff (Seabury) re same (.3).	3.10	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25479800	5/22/2020	Telephone conference with ECA counsel re first stipulations (.2); review ECA operative documentation re the first stipulation execution (3.8); review draft exhibits re ECA first stipulations (1.2); telephone conference with SGR re the same (.2); revise form rejection motion (1.0); email correspondence with NRF re the same (.1).	6.50	Goff, Steve
25482672	5/22/2020	Review amendment provision in sample Airbus ECA financing and sample ATR ECA financing re necessary consents from agent/lenders/ECAs to sign AP stipulation (.4); confer S. Goff re his analysis of same and discussions with A&O (.3); follow-up on same with J. Tenen and I. Sanchez (AGR) (.2).	0.90	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25482457	5/23/2020	Review transaction documents for top secured loans re debtors and guarantors (.7); review draft rejection motion (.2).	0.90	Goff, Steve
25577514	5/23/2020	Research prepetition pending aircraft purchase orders, Airbus/Boeing master agreements, in major airline bankruptcies.	1.00	Metviner, Aaron
25482437	5/24/2020	Review EOD, indenture and transaction materials of exchange notes re collateral and lien release.	2.40	Goff, Steve

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 135 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25485985 5/25/2020	Review EOD, indenture and transaction materials of exchange notes re collateral and lien release (1.8); review engine lease requirements re stipulations with engine lessors (.5); review engine lease agreements re the same (1.0); email correspondence with Avianca re the same (.2); revise draft exhibits for ECA stipulations (1.0).	4.50	Goff, Steve
25483112 5/25/2020	Correspond with K. Raff (Seabury) re engine lease status and possible returns and rejections (.3); call with G. Bray re same (.2); review S. Goff's email re same (.2).	0.70	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25525725 5/26/2020	Review aircraft ECA stipulations (5.2); review revised versions of same (3.9); t/cs, email re: same (.9).	10.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25496620 5/26/2020	Review and consider correspondence with aircraft counterparties re stipulations.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25496197 5/26/2020	Review engine leases re stipulations thereto (3.6); email correspondence with Avianca re the same (.1); revise rejection stipulation for KGAL aircraft (.4); draft stipulation exhibits for ECA aircraft (2.6); review ECA documentation re the same (1.7).	8.40	Goff, Steve
25515565 5/26/2020	Correspond with H. Schwarz re sublease questions.	0.10	Jensen, Niels
25577512 5/26/2020	Continue research re aircraft purchases in major airline bankruptcies (1.4); correspond with P. Milender re same (.1).	1.50	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 136 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25603171	5/26/2020	Review NRF comments on behalf of KGAL to rejection stipulation (.2); confer w/ G. Bray and P. Milender re same (.3); confer with S. Goff re same (.2); call with C. Torres, D. Pinzon (Avianca), P. Barlow (SGR), G. Bray and P. Milender re terms of return of 4 rejected KGAL aircraft and expense allocation (.5); review Latham comments on behalf of Citibank on draft AP stipulation for revolving credit agreement (.2).	1.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25512111	5/26/2020	Review aircraft rejection motion edits (.2); correspond w/ P. Milender and G. Hughes (Seabury) re same (.2).	0.40	Silverman, Stephen D.
25502535	5/27/2020	Draft form engine lease rejection stipulation (3.3); review engine leases re the form stipulation and GE return request (1.3); telephone conference with Seabury re the same (.4); email correspondence with Avianca and Seabury re the same (.1); draft ECA ATR stipulations (2.6); review ECA transaction documents re the same (1.0); telephone conference with A&O re the same (.3); email correspondence with SGR re the same (.1); email correspondence with ECA parties re the same (.1); research market rejection motion orders (.4).	9.60	Goff, Steve
25577511	5/27/2020	Continue pending aircraft purchases research.	1.00	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 137 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Da	ate	Description	Hours	Name
25501330 5/2	27/2020	Call with R. Bubbra (A&O), I. Sanchez (SGR) and S. Goff re AP stipulations for ECA financed aircraft and signing protocol (.3); comment on Seabury's draft of commercial explanation for PBH arrangements (.3); review R. Parchment's analysis of partial vs full rejection of leased engines (.2); call with K. Raff, L. Grindal (Seabury), G. Bray and S. Goff re rejection of 3 leased engines (.2); correspondence re Latham comments on behalf of Citibank to AP stipulation (.3); review initial draft of leased engine rejection stipulation (.2); confer S. Goff re comments on same (.3); review revised engine rejection stipulation (.2); call with M. Edelman, C. Gee (Vedder), G. Hughes, L. Grindal (Seabury), J. Tenen (SGR) re Vedder's questions on PBH arrangements and need for separate lease amendment (.8).	2.80	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25512147 5/2	27/2020	Correspond w/ M. Catalina (Avianca) and analysis re charter flight issues.	0.60	Silverman, Stephen D.
25521452 5/2	27/2020	Assemble precedent for team's review re aircraft purchases.	1.40	Thomas, Charmaine
25507643 5/2	28/2020	Review email from Debtors re AV Peru liquidation spare part security.	0.20	Barba, Marcela
25506502 5/2	28/2020	Draft engine lease rejection stipulations for 3 engines (2.3); telephone conferences with Avianca and Seabury re engine leases (1.0), RCF and spare engine facility proposals (.9); review OnPoint agreement re the same (.7); revise ECA ATR stipulations (.7); call with I. Sanchez re the same (.1); emails with A&O re the same (.1); draft Airbus ECA AP stipulations (3.2); review transaction documents re the same (1.0); emails with A&O re the same (.1); call with KGAL counsel re rejection stipulation (.2); revise same (.6); draft AP stipulation (.4); review fleet movement issues re Honduran aircraft (.1); conference with I. Sanchez re the same (.1).	11.50	Goff, Steve

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 138 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25506550	5/28/2020	Review correspondence from K. Raff (Seabury) re leased engines (.2); call with G. Bray and S. Goff re same (.2); consider rejection/termination of sublease re same (.3); call with K. Pinzon, F. Raddatz, J. Quiros (Avianca), K. Raff, L. Grindal (Seabury), G. Bray, S. Goff re same (.6); consider J. Quiros' response to K. Raff's recommendation re same (.2); review on point agreement re same (.3); call with L. Avila (Avianca), G. Pena (Avianca), G. Hughes, L. Grindal (both Seabury), G. Bray, N. Jensen, S. Goff re same (.9); confer w/ G. Bray re spare parts (.3); correspond with D. Rivas re same (.3); review amendment/waiver provisions re same (.3); confer w/ S. Goss re same (.3).	3.90	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25512681	5/29/2020	Revise draft engine lease rejection stipulations for 3 engines (.8); review engine lease agreements re the same (.7); email correspondence with Avianca and Seabury re the same (.1); review GE services agreement re Avianca inquiry (1.3); research loaner engine issue re the same (.4); revise draft KGAL stipulation (.9); email correspondence with Avianca re the same (.1); telephone conference with KGAL counsel re the same (.1); review ECA Transaction Documents re restructuring lease and registration of Aircraft (1.0); revise draft BNP stipulation (2.2); review comments from BNP's counsel re the same (.6); email correspondence with Avianca re the same (.1).	8.30	Goff, Steve
25515517	5/29/2020	Discuss aircraft subleasing structure with H. Schwarz and S. Goff.	0.20	Jensen, Niels
25526253	5/29/2020	Research re master Boeing/Airbus agreements, pending aircraft purchases, in previous chapter 11s (.6); continue draft of memo (.3).	0.90	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 139 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25513534	5/29/2020	Call with P. Barlow (SGR), G. Bray and S. Goff re 3 loaner engines and alternatives to on point agreements (.5); call with K. Raff re same (.3); confer S. Goff re questions on rejection stipulations for KGAL and BNP aircraft and 3 leased engines (.3); review revised rejection stipulation for KGAL aircraft (.1); correspondence re rejection stipulation for BNP aircraft (.2).	1.40	Schwarz, Helfried J.
25516464	5/30/2020	Review comments to Airbus ECA stipulations from A&O (.5); review draft ECA stipulations re the same (.5); review ECA Transaction Documents re the same (.3).	1.30	Goff, Steve
25516876	5/31/2020	Revise draft ECA stipulations re comments from A&O (.3); email correspondence with A&O re the same (.1).	0.40	Goff, Steve

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 140 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25615002 5/11/2020	Consider strategy re Colombian recognition issues (1.1); emails re same (.8); rspond to team strategy emails re Colombian recognition issues (1.7).	3.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25430349 5/11/2020	Coordinate filing of material information re information request made by Colombian Superintendence of Transportation.	0.90	Richards, Pablo
25602934 5/12/2020	Address Peru issues.	3.90	Bray, Gregory A.
25435940 5/12/2020	Review updated analysis from local counsel re Peru matters (.3); participate on calls with counsel, Company and Milbank re same (.8); participate on call re Peru flight matters (.4).	1.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25436429 5/12/2020	Call w/ Milbank Peru team and Company re Peru cargo issue.	0.60	Milender, Parker
25462014 5/12/2020	Multiple t/cs, email re Peru issues (1.6); revise customer program order re refunds (1.4); follow-up calls w/ client re implementation and interpretation (1.8).	4.80	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25436003 5/12/2020	Discuss Peru strategy with Milbank team.	0.80	Stirnberg, Tobias
25436020 5/12/2020	Correspond with L. Avila (Avianca), R. Galindo (Avianca) and Milbank team re Peru customer and employee claims.	1.60	Stirnberg, Tobias
25440187 5/13/2020	Participate on numerous calls with Company, local counsel and internally regarding Peru proceedings and related issues.	2.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25438444 5/13/2020	Multiple teleconferences and correspondence re treatment of Peru obligations.	2.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25461843 5/13/2020	Address Peru issues (2.4); review motion re same (1.4); t/c and emails re same (1.9).	5.70	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 141 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25447873	5/13/2020	Attend two calls w/ foreign advisors and Company re Peru issues (1.1); correspond w/ D.	1.20	Silverman, Stephen D.
25442704	5/14/2020	O'Donnell re same (.1). Respond to correspondence re Columbian regulators (2.5), Peruvian labor issues (2.6).	5.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25461600	5/14/2020	Address Peru issues (1.9); review motion (1.4); draft notice (1.9).	5.20	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25451593	5/15/2020	Continue preparations re Peru proceeding (1.8); participate on call regarding Colombia oversight (.5); review follow-up documentation (.3).	2.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25444876	5/15/2020	Attend strategy call re Peru (.5).	0.50	Milender, Parker
25444897	5/15/2020	Draft motion re cash obligations of Peru entities (4.4); emails w/ local counsel re Peru law issues (1.8); call w/ E. Fleck and L. Avila (Avianca) re Peru accounts (.3).	6.50	Milender, Parker
25450420	5/15/2020	Multiple teleconferences re Peru labor matters (.9); multiple calls re Peru treatment (1.2).	2.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25461181	5/15/2020	Address Peru issues (1.8); review motion (1.4); draft notice (1.9); emails re same (.6)	5.70	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25450036	5/15/2020	Emails with Company and Milbank team re Peru employee indemnity.	0.30	Stirnberg, Tobias
25461760	5/15/2020	Call with P. Richards re Peru local issues (.7); review package for local proceeding (.2).	0.90	Zahoroda, Yuliya
25451664	5/16/2020	Review Peru-related pleadings.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.
25451449	5/17/2020	Comment on Peru pleading.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 142 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25458737 5/17/2020	Correspond with P. Milender re emergency Peru motion (.1); review precedent emergency motions (.2); conduct 363(b) research for same (.9); revise motion with additional case backup (.3).	1.50	Metviner, Aaron
25448121 5/17/2020	Draft/revise emergency Peru liquidation motion.	1.10	Milender, Parker
25492229 5/17/2020	Research Colombian recognition proceeding (1.9); obtain certified copy of Auto Stay Order (.6); review Colombian recognition pleading draft (.9).	3.40	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25456714 5/18/2020	Comment on Peruvian proceeding motion.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25458538 5/18/2020	Correspond w/ G. Bray and E. Fleck re Peru and rejection strategy.	0.80	Milender, Parker
25458644 5/18/2020	Draft/revise emergency Peru motion and emails w/ G. Bray and E. Fleck re same.	2.70	Milender, Parker
25603168 5/18/2020	Consider various issues re Colombian filings (2.5); t/c re aircraft rejection issue (.2).	2.70	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25498754 5/18/2020	Research Peru refund issues (1.6); obtain certified copy of automatic stay order (.9).	2.50	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25497818 5/19/2020	Review Peru-related issues (5.6); review related documents (3.3); respond to correspondence re same (1.1).	10.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25468777 5/19/2020	Numerous Debtors' calls re Peru motion (1.2); final review of same (.3).	1.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25469649 5/19/2020	Draft/revise emergency Peru motion and review filing of same (.5); calls w/ E. Fleck and M. Mottesi re Peru relief (.6); call w/ Company re same (1.0); emails w/ Peru local counsel re Peru labor issues (.2).	2.30	Milender, Parker

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 143 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25467446 5/19/2020	Attend working group call re Peru payments (.8); review Peruvian counsel memos re local payments and consideration of issues (1.1); prepare for (.6) and participate on (2.1) calls with superintendents of aviation and of corporations in Colombia.	4.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25473159 5/20/2020	Review Colombian labor counsel memo and findings (.8); comment on same (.5); review multiple matters re Peru liquidation process (.9).	2.20	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25498782 5/20/2020	Follow-up research and email re Colombian recognition proceeding (1.6); respond to correspondence re same (1.6); address Peruvian recognition issues (.9).	4.10	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25480492 5/20/2020	Correspond w/ D. O'Donnell re Colombian local proceeding issues (.1): coordinate same (.1); attend (partial) call re same (.3).	0.50	Silverman, Stephen D.
25480507 5/20/2020	Correspond w/ T. Ragones (JF) and D. O'Donnell re IATA talking points and Peru issues (.2); review JF materials re same (.2).	0.40	Silverman, Stephen D.
25477857 5/21/2020	Correspond with local counsel and Company re liquidator seeking Peru amounts owed.	2.40	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25498792 5/21/2020	Review research (1.1) and emails (.7) re Colombian recognition proceeding; obtain certified copy of auto stay order (.7).	2.50	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25497931 5/22/2020	Review Colombian recognition and related issues.	5.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25603172 5/22/2020	Revise memo to file re extraterritorial application of section 365 of the Bankruptcy Code (1.4); finalize memo re same (1.9).	3.30	Capolino, Margherita Angela
25485202 5/22/2020	Address various issues re possible Columbian recognition.	1.10	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 144 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44010.00000 Avianca - Locai Law issues				
	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25498895	5/22/2020	Respond to correspondence re local law refund	2.30	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
25577521	5/22/2020	issue (.9); research and review re same (1.4). Call with Colombian counsel re	0.70	Renenger, Aaron L.
		recharacterization law (.5); discuss same with E. Dexter and J. Wolf (.2).		
25487356	5/22/2020	Revise customer programs motion re Peru.	0.50	Stone, Alan J.
25577522	5/22/2020	Call with Colombian counsel re recharacterization analysis (.4); review Colombian sale opinions re same (.6); call with A. Renenger and E. Dexter re same (.2); review and revise memorandum re extraterritorial application of bankruptcy code section 365 (1.7); review case law re same (.4).	3.30	Wolf, Julie M.
25489114	5/23/2020	Comment on Peru update.	0.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25485284	5/24/2020	Discuss motions and pleadings with A. Stone re Peruvian entities.	0.40	Renenger, Aaron L.
25486274	5/25/2020	Call w/ Peru counsel re emergency Peru motion relief (.5); attend prep session w/ L. Avila (Avianca), A. Stone and A. Renenger (1.3); draft/revise script for Peru hearing (1.0); review rationalizing total obligations due (.9).	3.70	Milender, Parker
25485024	5/25/2020	Attend Avila witness prep (1.3); prepare for same (.8).	2.10	Renenger, Aaron L.
25603173	5/26/2020	Call with Richard and internal team re Colombia considerations (.2); consider implementation of Peru funding (.3).	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25602931	5/26/2020	Review Judge Glenn precedent re payments to foreign affiliates.	0.20	Metviner, Aaron

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 145 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

	Date	Description	Hours	Name
25502475	5/27/2020	Call with G. Hughes (Seabury) re Peru matters (.3); call with Debtors and Seabury re Peru matters (.5); call with Debtors and Colombia counsel re recognition strategy (.5).	1.30	Fleck, Evan R.
25615688	5/27/2020	Prepare for (.6) and attend (.7) call re Colombian recognition strategy; follow up re same (.7).	2.00	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25522087	5/28/2020	Translate memorandum re rationale for requesting recognition of chapter 11 proceedings in Colombia (2.5); revise stakeholder authorization letter (.4).	2.90	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
25507972	5/28/2020	Attend to multiple issues re Colombian labor issues.	0.80	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25511106	5/28/2020	Call w/ L. Avila (Avianca) re Peru.	0.20	Stone, Alan J.
25525693	5/29/2020	Continue to review Peru issues.	4.00	Bray, Gregory A.
25516437	5/29/2020	Multiple local disclosure matters.	1.20	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25577523	5/29/2020	T/C with Gomez Pinzon re Colombian recharacterization law.	0.70	Renenger, Aaron L.
25512057	5/29/2020	Correspond w/ C. Lipe re new PR issues (.2); review correspondence re admin and group call rescheduling (.1).	0.30	Silverman, Stephen D.
25577526	5/29/2020	Calls with Debtors, A. Renenger, E. Dexter, and Colombian counsel re Colombian recharacterization analysis and litigation strategy.	1.30	Wolf, Julie M.
25516555	5/30/2020	Review local law documents.	0.90	Mottesi, Marcelo A.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 146 of 153 MILBANK LLP

Description of Legal Services

May 11, 2020 through May 31, 2020

44810.00037 Communications with Governments/Interested Parties

Date	Description	Hours	Name
25424236 5/11/2020	Prepare for (.8) and attend (1.8) discussion with government ministers.	2.60	Mottesi, Marcelo A.
25438347 5/12/2020	Join portion of call with Colombian government and M. Mottesi.	0.60	Fleck, Evan R.
25451627 5/15/2020	Attend meeting with government regarding status of cases.	0.50	Fleck, Evan R.
25456704 5/18/2020	Consider reporting for Colombian government.	0.20	Fleck, Evan R.
25458379 5/18/2020	Review Colombian government/agency responses.	0.40	Stirnberg, Tobias

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 147 of 153 MILBANK LLP

May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020

FILING FEES

Date	Description	Amount	Name
38745503 5/11/2020	FILING FEES Telephonic Appearance Fee on May 11, 2020, Vendor: Court Solutions	70.00	Prey, Nicholas
38757604 5/26/2020	FILING FEES Certified Copy Fee of Order on May 26, 2020, Vendor: U.S. District Court for the Southern District of New York	47.00	Kaplan, Daniel B.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 148 of 153 MILBANK LLP

May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020

LEXIS

Date	Description	Amount	Name
38745480 5/11/2020	LEXIS	194.00	Benz, Stephen
38745479 5/12/2020	LEXIS	1236.00	Lauria, Kristina
38745478 5/13/2020	LEXIS	289.00	Behrens, James C.
38745481 5/15/2020	LEXIS	380.00	Dexter, Erin E.
38745482 5/17/2020	LEXIS	396.00	Lauria, Kristina
38758552 5/19/2020	LEXIS	297.00	Lauria, Kristina
38758554 5/19/2020	LEXIS	297.00	Capolino, Margherita Angela
38758555 5/19/2020	LEXIS	449.00	Lauria, Kristina
38758553 5/20/2020	LEXIS	392.00	Wolf, Julie M.
38758556 5/20/2020	LEXIS	297.00	Lauria, Kristina
38758557 5/21/2020	LEXIS	293.00	Lee, Danielle
38758558 5/22/2020	LEXIS	693.00	Yarnall, Ashton R.
38764655 5/26/2020	LEXIS	190.00	Benz, Stephen
38764653 5/29/2020	LEXIS	190.00	Wolf, Julie M.
38764654 5/30/2020	LEXIS	194.00	Lauria, Kristina
38764656 5/30/2020	LEXIS	475.00	Benz, Stephen
38764657 5/30/2020	LEXIS	2013.00	Yarnall, Ashton R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 149 of 153 MILBANK LLP

May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020

TELEPHONE

Date	e Des	cription	Amount	Name
38759323 5/17/2	2020 TELE	EPHONE Brazil	7.66	Guitart, Gonzalo A.
38759325 5/19/2	2020 TELE	EPHONE Texas	2.56	Silverman, Stephen D.
38759324 5/20/2	2020 TELE	EPHONE West Virginia	0.35	Milender, Parker
38759326 5/22/2	2020 TELE	EPHONE Texas	9.15	Silverman, Stephen D.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 150 of 153 MILBANK LLP

May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020

TRANSCRIPT/DEPOSITION FEES

DateDescriptionAmountName387413285/11/2020TRANSCRIPT/DEPOSITION FEES Precedent First Day Hearing
Transcript, Vendor: Judicial Transcribers of Texas LLC701.80Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 151 of 153 MILBANK LLP

May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020

TRANSLATION FEES

	Date	Description	Amount	Name
38759616	5/28/2020	TRANSLATION FEES Notice of Second Day Hearing (English/Spanish), Vendor: Ubiqus Reporting	277.03	Fleck, Evan R.
38759617	5/28/2020	TRANSLATION FEES Form 309F (English/Spanish), Vendor: Ubiqus Reporting	348.04	Fleck, Evan R.
38759618	5/28/2020	TRANSLATION FEES Automatic Stay Notice (English/Spanish), Vendor: Ubiqus Reporting	218.75	Fleck, Evan R.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 152 of 153 MILBANK LLP

May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020

WESTLAW

	Date	Description	Amount	Name
38745332	5/11/2020	WESTLAW	1176.94	Parchment, Ryan
38745339	5/11/2020	WESTLAW	1914.34	Benz, Stephen
38745333	5/13/2020	WESTLAW	1059.99	Behrens, James C.
38745337	5/13/2020	WESTLAW	390.86	Sorger, Jonathan
38745338	5/13/2020	WESTLAW	155.69	Wrenn, Teresa
38745340	5/13/2020	WESTLAW	855.41	Benz, Stephen
38745334	5/14/2020	WESTLAW	444.21	Parchment, Ryan
38745341	5/14/2020	WESTLAW	410.22	Benz, Stephen
38745335	5/15/2020	WESTLAW	622.75	Parchment, Ryan
38745336	5/15/2020	WESTLAW	303.16	Wolf, Julie M.
38745342	5/15/2020	WESTLAW	151.58	Wolf, Julie M.
38758435	5/18/2020	WESTLAW	1286.90	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
38758428	5/19/2020	WESTLAW	265.00	Behrens, James C.
38758438	5/19/2020	WESTLAW	3266.89	Capolino, Margherita Angela
38758429	5/20/2020	WESTLAW	2150.27	Parchment, Ryan
38758431	5/20/2020	WESTLAW	768.49	Wolf, Julie M.
38758439	5/20/2020	WESTLAW	606.31	Benz, Stephen
38758432	5/21/2020	WESTLAW	1792.06	Parchment, Ryan
38758433	5/21/2020	WESTLAW	1067.41	Wolf, Julie M.
38758436	5/21/2020	WESTLAW	778.45	O'Donnell, Dennis C.
38758440	5/21/2020	WESTLAW	432.48	Benz, Stephen
38758441	5/21/2020	WESTLAW	732.72	Lee, Danielle
38758442	5/21/2020	WESTLAW	1747.92	Capolino, Margherita Angela
38758434	5/22/2020	WESTLAW	311.38	Parchment, Ryan
38758437	5/22/2020	WESTLAW	1419.72	O'Donnell, Dennis C.

20-11133-mg Doc 332 Filed 06/24/20 Entered 06/24/20 20:57:55 Main Document Pg 153 of 153 MILBANK LLP

May 10, 2020 through May 31, 2020

WESTLAW

	Date	Description	Amount	Name
38758443	5/22/2020	WESTLAW	1061.05	Capolino, Margherita Angela
38758444	5/22/2020	WESTLAW	789.34	Lee, Danielle
38758430	5/23/2020	WESTLAW	1511.17	Zahoroda, Yuliya
38764259	5/24/2020	WESTLAW	155.69	Zahoroda, Yuliya
38764267	5/25/2020	WESTLAW	3869.38	Silverman, Stephen D.
38764274	5/26/2020	WESTLAW	622.76	Parchment, Ryan
38764260	5/27/2020	WESTLAW	1245.52	Parchment, Ryan
38764264	5/27/2020	WESTLAW	155.69	Cruz Burgos, Melany
38764268	5/27/2020	WESTLAW	709.85	Silverman, Stephen D.
38764275	5/27/2020	WESTLAW	155.69	Parchment, Ryan
38764266	5/28/2020	WESTLAW	467.07	Hyla, Eric
38764261	5/29/2020	WESTLAW	778.45	Prudenti, Paula M.
38764269	5/29/2020	WESTLAW	390.86	Lee, Danielle
38764270	5/29/2020	WESTLAW	387.96	Wolf, Julie M.
38764262	5/30/2020	WESTLAW	311.38	Prudenti, Paula M.
38764263	5/30/2020	WESTLAW	155.69	Thomas, Charmaine
38764265	5/30/2020	WESTLAW	622.75	Cruz Burgos, Melany
38764271	5/30/2020	WESTLAW	454.74	Wolf, Julie M.
38764272	5/30/2020	WESTLAW	865.55	Lee, Danielle
38764273	5/30/2020	WESTLAW	1426.75	Benz, Stephen
38764276	5/30/2020	WESTLAW	778.45	Parchment, Ryan