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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
SOUTHERN DIVISION

Inre: ) Chapter 9
)
CITY OF DETROIT, MICHIGAN, ) Case No. 13-53846
)
Debtor. ) Hon. Steven W. Rhodes

FEE EXAMINER’S FOURTH QUARTERLY REPORT FOR MONTHS OF
APRIL, MAY AND JUNE 2014

Robert M. Fishman, the duly appointed fee examiner (the “Fee Examiner”), submits this

Fourth Quarterly Report (the “Fourth Quarterly Report™”) for the Months of April, May and June

2014 (the “Reporting Period”) pursuant to paragraph 8 of the Court’s Fee Review Order dated

September 11, 2013 [Docket No. 810] (the “Fee Review Order”):!

Background
1. Pursuant to the Order Appointing Fee Examiner dated August 19, 2013 [Docket

No. 383] (the “Appointment Order”), the Court appointed Robert M. Fishman as the Fee

Examiner in connection with the above-captioned bankruptcy case (the “Case”). Pursuant to the
Appointment Order, it is the Fee Examiner’s responsibility to assure the Court, the City, the
creditors, and the public that the City’s Professional Fee Expenses (as defined in the
Appointment Order) are fully disclosed and are reasonable, as required by 11 U.S.C. § 943(b)(3).

2. Pursuant to paragraph 1 of the Fee Review Order, by no later than September 30,
2013, the City and the Committee were both required to submit lists of all professionals who
have been retained to render services in connection with the Case and who seek payment of

compensation and reimbursement of expenses from the City for post-petition services, excluding

1 Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meaning assigned in the Fee
Review Order.
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ordinary course professionals hired by the City not in conjunction with the Case, but rather in the
same contexts and capacities as such professionals were typically hired by the City prior to the
commencement of the Case. Fee Review Order, § 1. The City and the Committee both complied
with this requirement by submitting lists of the following City Professionals and Committee
Professionals:?

City Professionals

Conway MacKenzie, Inc.

Dykema Gossett, PLLC

Ernst & Young LLP

Jones Day

Foley & Lardner LLP

Kilpatrick & Associates, PC
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
Miller Buckfire & Co. LLC

Miller, Canfield, Paddock & Stone, P.L.C.
Milliman, Inc.

Ottenwess, Allman & Taweel, PLC
Pepper Hamilton LLP

Committee Professionals

Dentons US LLP/Salans FMC SNR Denton Europe LLP
Brooks Wilkins Sharkey & Turco PLLC

Lazard Freres & Co. LLC

Segal Consulting

3. Additionally, counsel for Christie’s Inc, Debevoise & Plimpton LLP
(“Debevoise™), has also agreed to be designated as a City Professional and have its invoices
reviewed by the Fee Examiner. The Fee Examiner has just received the applicable invoices for
Debevoise and has just begun his review thereof, and will be filing the appropriate Final Monthly

and Quarterly Reports in the future.

2 The City added Professionals (Dykema Gossett, PLLC, Kilpatrick & Associates, PC and
Ottenwess, Allman & Taweel, PLC) in a letter to the Fee Examiner dated December 13, 2013.
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4. By no later than October 4, 2013, each City Professional and Committee
Professional was required to submit to the Fee Examiner (a) an executed copy of its engagement
letter, (b) a verified rate statement respecting regular hourly rates and Discounted Rates, and (c)
a list of billing and expense categories to be used in Monthly Invoices, which list had to be
acceptable to the Fee Examiner in his reasonable discretion (collectively, the “Initial

Submissions™). Fee Review Order, 1 2.

5. Each of the Professionals has provided its Initial Submissions to the Fee
Examiner.
6. Pursuant to the Fee Review Order, each Professional is required to submit

Monthly Invoices to the Fee Examiner within 49 days after the end of each calendar month;
provided, however, that the July and August 2013 Monthly Invoices were due on or before

October 21, 2013 (each, an “Invoice Deadline”). Id., 1 4. Within 35 days of each Invoice

Deadline, the Fee Examiner is required to create Preliminary Reports with respect to each timely
submitted Monthly Invoice and transmit that Preliminary Report to the applicable Professional.
Id., 1 5. During the 14-day period after the Fee Examiner transmits the Preliminary Report (the

“Resolution Period”), the Fee Examiner and each Professional are required to meet and confer

respecting any issues raised by the Fee Examiner in the Preliminary Report in an effort to resolve

such issues by agreement (the “Resolution Discussion”). Id., | 6.

7. Within 14 days after the expiration of the Resolution Period, the Fee Examiner is
required to prepare a Final Monthly Report respecting all of the Monthly Invoices. Fee Review
Order, 1 7. In the Final Monthly Report, the Fee Examiner is required to delineate all write-offs
and other adjustments made to each Monthly Invoice, both before the submission of the Monthly

Invoice and as a result of the Resolution Discussions. Id.
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8. Beginning on February 4, 2014° and approximately every 91 days thereafter, the
Fee Examiner is required to prepare Quarterly Reports, which must include the following: ()
copies of each of the Final Monthly Reports for the applicable months and copies of each
Monthly Invoice (subject to redaction requirements); (b) a summary of the Professional Fee
Expenses for each Professional for the applicable time period, as well as for all prior time
periods; and (c) a statement by the Fee Examiner as to whether all of the Professional Fee
Expenses covered by the Quarterly Report have been fully disclosed and are reasonable. Fee
Review Order, § 8. The Quarterly Reports must be filed with the Court and posted on the
Emergency Manager’s page of the City’s website and on the restructuring website maintained by
the City’s claims and noticing agent. Id.

0. The Fee Review Order sets forth other procedures and requirements that apply to
and govern the submission, disclosure and review of all Professional Fees in the Case.

Final Monthly Reports and Monthly Invoices

10.  Asrequired by the Fee Review Order, the Fee Examiner prepared and transmitted
Preliminary Reports to each Professional that submitted a Monthly Invoice and engaged in
Resolution Discussions with the Professionals prior to preparing the Final Monthly Reports. The
April, May and June Final Monthly Reports are attached to this Fourth Quarterly Report as

Group Exhibit 1 (April 2014 Final Monthly Reports), Group Exhibit 2 (May 2014 Final Monthly

Reports), and Group Exhibit 3 (June 2014 Final Monthly Reports) and they include copies of the

applicable Monthly Invoices (redacted where applicable) submitted by each Professional for the

relevant months.

3 The original date set forth in the Fee Review Order was January 15, 2014, but the Court entered
an Order extending that date to February 4, 2014 [Dkt. # 2435].
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11. Each of the attached Final Monthly Reports includes summaries of the
Professional Fee Expenses for each set of applicable Monthly Invoices, including a statement of
voluntary write-offs and other reductions made by each of the Professionals with respect to each
Monthly Invoice, both before the submission of each Monthly Invoice and as a result of the
Resolution Discussions between the Fee Examiner and each Professional.

Summary of Professional Fee Expenses for Reporting Period

12.  The following are summaries of the Professional Fee Expenses for the Reporting

Period following the Fee Examiner’s review of the Monthly Invoices and related Resolution

Discussions with each Professional:

City Professionals:

Conway MacKenzie, Inc.

Total Fee Request | Total Expense Request
April 2014 $1,053,826.34 $966.68
May 2014 $1,010,541.07 $800.00
June 2014 $1,073,300.11 $1,297.09
Quarterly Totals: $3,137,667.52 $3,063.77
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $2,258,042.61 $1,218.89
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $3,082,908.50 $15,469.82
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $2,995,113.10 $9,662.60
Total for Case: $11,473,731.73 $29,415.08
Jones Day

Total Fee Request | Total Expense Request
April 2014 $3,955,036.62 $157,939.35
May 2014 $4,063,048.87 $112,608.50
June 2014 $3,819,724.87 $173,341.70
Quarterly Totals: $11,837,810.36 $443,889.55
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $6,589,572.64 $143,273.82
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $10,025,613.74 $590,248.51
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $8,511,072.51 $289,100.62
Total for Case: $36,964,069.25 $1,466,512.50
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Foley & Lardner LLP

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $9,684.00 $0.00
May 2014 $25,200.50 $66.75
June 2014 $24,293.50 $0.00
Quarterly Totals: $59,178.00 $0.00
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $114,855.00 $0.00
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $22,621.50 $0.00
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $16,659.50 $0.00
Total for Case: $213,314.00 $66.75

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $69,133.75 $24,732.25
May 2014 $205,195.87 $271,011.28
June 2014 $160,703.88 $938,541.39
Quarterly Totals: $435,033.50 $1,234,282.92
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $87,062.00 $123,176.90
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $117,017.50 $314,747.83
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $338,250.75 $341,337.46
Total for Case: $977,363.75 $2,013,545.11

Miller Buckfire & Co. LLC

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $480,000.00 $17,918.23
May 2014 $300,000.00 $31,930.39
June 2014 $300,000.00 $10,926.16
Quarterly Totals: $1,080,000.00 $60,774.78
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $1,225,806.45 $51,302.29
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $1,500,000.00 $60,108.30
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $900,000.00 $79,354.63
Total for Case: $4,705,806.45 $251,540.00
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Miller, Canfield, Paddock & Stone, P.L.C.

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $327,518.00 $5,852.35
May 2014 $227,168.50 $1,754.45
June 2014 $240,452.00 $2,057.48
Quarterly Totals: $795,138.50 $9,664.28
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $575,840.25 $4,160.23
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $880,464.00 $22,279.44
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $884,652.50 $6,829.37
Total for Case: $3,136,095.25 $42,933.32
Milliman, Inc.
Total Fee Request | Total Expense Request

April 2014 $260,009.90 $0.00
May 2014 $62,955.15 $947.05
June 2014 $57,768.00 $0.00
Quarterly Totals: $380,733.05 $947.05
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $261,762.20 $18,311.78
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $279,256.90 $3,744.17
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $270,239.00 $4,798.91
Total for Case: $1,191,991.15 $27,801.91

Pepper Hamilton LLP

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $152,208.90 $781.55
May 2014 $143,768.25 $2,392.35
June 2014 $179,098.20 $297.33
Quarterly Totals: $475,075.35 $3,471.23
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $272,080.50 $6,847.68
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $518,850.88 $7,806.17
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $601,416.45 $4,588.41
Total for Case: $1,867,423.18 $22,713.49
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Ernst & Young LLP

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $1,286,126.00 $48,860.00
May 2014 $962,840.00 $101,024.00
June 2014 $918,164.00 $61,286.00
Quarterly Totals: $3,167,615.00 $211,170.00
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $2,447,631.00 $96,806.00
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $3,932,622.00 $217,265.00
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $3,490,006.00 $204,160.00
Total for Case: $13,037,874.00 $729,401.00

Kilpatrick & Associates, PC

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $4,390.00 $0.00
May 2014 $14,530.00 $0.00
June 2014 $11,640.00 $0.00
Quarterly Totals: $30,560.00 $0.00
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $24,705.00 $61.60
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $25,240.00 $0.00
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $25,995.00 $140.10
Total for Case: $106,500.00 $201.70

Dykema Gossett, PLLC

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $20,688.60 $38.30
May 2014 $32,874.30 $92.08
June 2014 $30,044.00 $95.30
Quarterly Totals: $83,586.90 $225.68
Total for First and Second Quarter (July- $152,772.00 $541.84
Dec) 2013:

Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $73,863.00 $412.96
Total for Case: $310,221.90 $1,180.48

Ottenwess, Taweel & Schenk, PLC

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $5,925.00 $0.00
May 2014 $9,765.00 $22.20
June 2014 $12,397.50 $32.13
Quarterly Totals: $28,087.50 $54.33
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $9,855.00 $28.80
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $20,542.50 $15.30
Total for Case: $58,485.00 $98.43
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Committee Professionals:

Dentons US LLP/Salans FMC SNR Denton Europe LLP
Total Fee Request | Total Expense Request

April 2014 $1,010,392.80 $29,943.15
May 2014 $1,023,639.50 $50,702.19
June 2014 $1,240,279.25 $38,458.78
Quarterly Totals: $3,274,311.55 $119,104.12
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $1,512,979.75 $54,102.83
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $2,923,504.56 $131,448.02
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $2,978,001.00 $179,974.67
Total for Case: $10,688,796.86 $484,629.64

Brooks Wilkins Sharkey & Turco PLLC

Total Fee Request | Total Expense Request

April 2014 $70,773.00 $512.70
May 2014 $77,824.50 $903.29
June 2014 $60,064.00 $406.67
Quarterly Totals: $208,661.50 $1,822.66
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $74,478.00 $305.20
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec 2013) $198,092.50 $2,189.04
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $203,674.00 $5,763.66
Total for Case: $684,906.00 $10,080.56

Lazard Freres & Co. LLC

Total Fee Request

Total Expense Request

April 2014 $175,000.00 $9,632.10
May 2014 $175,000.00 $43.05
June 2014 $175,000.00 $9,886.90
Quarterly Totals: $525,000.00 $19,562.05
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $163,333.33 $0.00
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $525,000.00 $55,476.57
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $525,000.00 $27,732.98
Total for Case: $1,738,333.33 $102,771.60
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Segal Consulting
Total Fee Request | Total Expense Request

April 2014 $393,137.00 $14,128.25
May 2014 $186,968.00 $5,357.15
June 2014 $194,094.00 $5,504.40
Quarterly Totals: $774,199.00 $24,989.80
Total for First Quarter (July-Sept) 2013: $209,204.50 $7,103.37
Total for Second Quarter (Oct-Dec) 2013: $699,553.00 $31,284.52
Total for Third Quarter (Jan-Mar) 2014: $995,137.00 $34,769.94
Total for Case: $2,678,093.50 $98,147.63

Statement Regarding Disclosure and Reasonableness of Professional Fee Expenses

13.  The procedures and requirements set forth in the Fee Review Order, including but
not limited to the submission of the information contained in this Fourth Quarterly Report, are
intended to ensure the adequacy of disclosure and provide a mechanism to assess the
reasonableness of all Professional Fee Expenses. For example, the Initial Submissions enabled
the Fee Examiner (i) to understand the terms of the engagement letters pursuant to which each
Professional is employed, (ii) to evaluate the significance of any Discounted Rates in comparison
to each Professional’s regular hourly rates, and (iii) to obtain Monthly Invoices in a sufficiently
detailed and organized format that is conducive to meaningful review. The Fee Examiner,
individually and through his professionals, conducted a thorough review of each Monthly
Invoice and generated a Preliminary Report for each Monthly Invoice that contained the Fee
Examiner’s detailed comments and questions, which were aimed at (a) generating compliance
with the substantive requirements of the Fee Review Order and the reasonableness standards
developed by the Fee Examiner based on his extensive experience in bankruptcy cases, and (b)
providing full public disclosure of the Professional Fee Expenses (subject only to redacting as

determined by the applicable Professional).
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14, Over the course of the many months of the creation, submission, review and
related discussions, the Fee Examiner and the Professionals have developed an understanding of
the manner in which invoices are going to be prepared, submitted and reviewed. The Fee
Review Process itself has allowed the Professionals to improve the substantive content and
quality of their respective invoices. This has resulted in both a more complete and meaningful
disclosure of the services rendered. Additionally, the Fee Review Process has enabled the
Professionals to present their billing services in formats and manners that are acceptable to the
Fee Examiner. As the Fee Review Process has proceeded, the Professionals are generally doing
a better job with their respective invoices, thereby decreasing both the modifications/
clarifications and billing adjustments that the Fee Examiner has requested.

15.  As has been the case throughout this process, the Professional Fee Expenses
incurred during the Reporting Period were substantial. The Case presents issues of a magnitude
and complexity that challenge the Professionals’ and the Fee Examiner’s ability to assimilate and
digest. The novelty of the legal issues, the deadlines imposed by the Case and the strong
differences in opinion between the various parties on the appropriate resolution of issues, has
made (and continues to make) the Case extremely time intensive for all concerned. It is
impossible (and inappropriate) to view the Professional Fee Expenses in the abstract. They must
be tested against the circumstances of the Case, such as the amount of debt being addressed, the
number of competing interests that have to be considered, the number of diverse problems and
public interest issues that must be simultaneously considered and solved within the uncharted
waters of a Chapter 9 case of this magnitude.

16. During this Reporting Period, the focus of the Case has increasingly been the

City’s Plan of Adjustment (the “Plan”) and Disclosure Statement. The drafting, revising and
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negotiation of the terms of the Plan, the drafting and revising of the Disclosure Statement, the
litigation of the Objections to both the Plan and the Disclosure Statement and general preparation
for the Confirmation Hearing on the Plan have been at the center of activity in the Case. At the
same time, closely related matters such as the Detroit Water and Sewer Department’s
contemplated transaction, the COPS/Swap assumption motion and settlement, claims review and
objections, post-petition financing, and the multi-track mediations, have all proceeded at full
speed. Additionally, substantial time was expended in the areas of labor and pension, including
the negotiation of new collective bargaining agreements, the litigation of certain alleged unfair
labor practices and the modification/restructuring of various City pension plans. Further, several
matters of consequence were the subject of appeals, such as the eligibility ruling and the
COPS/Swap assumption motion approval. Nonetheless, the context of much of the Case has
shifted to the terms of the Plan and manner of the implementation of the Plan process. Most of
the substantive disputes are now focused on Plan treatment and efforts to negotiate resolutions of
those disputes that might result in confirmation of the Plan.

17.  All of the issues that the Fee Examiner identified in the Preliminary Reports were
reasonably addressed to his satisfaction through the Resolution Discussions and the subsequent
revisions to invoices, which in many instances resulted in additional voluntary reductions by the
Professionals. That is not to say that every recommendation of the Fee Examiner was accepted
by every Professional. The Fee Review Process limits the Fee Examiner to raising questions and
seeking clarification of issues. The power of the Fee Examiner under the Fee Review Order is
limited to recommendations and challenges made through the Preliminary Reports and the

Resolution Discussions. The Fee Examiner has no authority to require modifications of the
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Monthly Invoices or to unilaterally reduce the amount of any firm’s Professional Fee Expense
request.

18. The Final Monthly Reports prepared by the Fee Examiner delineate the voluntary
write-offs and reductions by each Professional, both before the submission of each Monthly
Invoice and as a result of the Resolution Discussions with the Fee Examiner. As a result of this
fee review process, the Fee Examiner has determined that the Professional Fee Expenses
incurred by the Professionals during the Reporting Period and covered by this Fourth Quarterly
Report, while substantial by any measure, are commensurate with the complexity and speed of
the Case, and the quality of the services that the Professionals have provided. However, the Fee
Examiner reserves judgment on the adequacy of disclosure and overall reasonableness of the
Professional Fee Expenses incurred by each of the Professionals on an aggregate basis, as
required by 11 U.S.C. §8 943(b)(3), because such determinations must be made at the conclusion
of the Case, and after full consideration of the totality of the services, the value of the
contributions to the Case of each of the Professionals, and the outcome of the Case as a whole.

Respectfully submitted,

Dated: November 5, 2014 By: /s/ Robert M. Fishman
Robert M. Fishman, Fee Examiner

Robert M. Fishman

Shaw Fishman Glantz & Towbin LLC
321 North Clark Street, Suite 800
Chicago, IL 60654

(312) 541-0151
rfishman@shawfishman.com
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
SOUTHERN DIVISION

In re: ) Chapter 9
)
CITY OF DETROIT, MICHIGAN, ) Case No. 13-53846
)
) Hon. Steven W. Rhodes
Debtor. )

FEE EXAMINER’S FINAL MONTHLY REPORT
REGARDING APRIL 2014 MONTHLY INVOICES

Robert M. Fishman, the duly appointed fee examiner (the “Fee Examiner”), presents this
Final Monthly Report regarding the April 2014 Monthly Invoices (each an “April Invoice”)
pursuant to paragraph 7 of the Court’s Fee Review Order dated September 11, 2013 [Docket No.

810] (the “Fee Review Order”):!

Background

1. Pursuant to the Order Appointing Fee Examiner dated August 19, 2013 [Docket

No. 383] (the “Appointment Order”), the Court appointed Robert M. Fishman as the Fee

Examiner in connection with the above-captioned bankruptcy case. According to the
Appointment Order, it is the Fee Examiner’s responsibility to assure the Court, the City, the
creditors, and the public that the City’s Professional Fee Expenses (as defined in the
Appointment Order) are fully disclosed and are reasonable, as required by 11 U.S.C. § 943(b)(3).

2. Pursuant to paragraph 1 of the Fee Review Order, the City and the Committee
have identified the following City Professionals and Committee Professionals, whose

Professional Fee Expenses are subject to review by the Fee Examiner:

! Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meaning assigned in the Fee Review
Order.
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City Professionals Committee Professionals

Conway MacKenzie, Inc. Dentons US LLP/Salans FMC SNR Denton
Europe LLP

Ernst & Young LLP Brooks Wilkins Sharkey & Turco PLLC

Jones Day Lazard Freres & Co. LLC

Foley & Lardner LLP Segal Consulting

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

Miller Buckfire & Co. LLC

Miller, Canfield, Paddock & Stone, P.L.C.

Milliman, Inc.

Pepper Hamilton LLP

Kilpatrick & Associates, PC

Dykema Gossett, PLLC

Ottenwess, Taweel & Schenk, PLC

3. Pursuant to paragraph 4 of the Fee Review Order, the Professionals are required
to submit monthly invoices to the Fee Examiner within 49 days after the end of each calendar
month. Therefore, the April Invoices were due on or before June 18, 2014.

4. The Fee Examiner received timely April Invoices from each of the Professionals
except Dykema Gossett, PLLC, Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC, Miller Buckfire & Co. LLC
and Foley & Lardner LLP. Dykema Gossett, PLLC submitted its April Invoice on June 20,
2014. Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC submitted its April Invoice on July 25, 2014, Miller
Buckfire & Co. LLC submitted its April Invoice on July 21, 2014, and Foley & Lardner LLP
submitted its April Invoice on July 11, 2014. Additionally, counsel for Christie’s Inc, Debevoise

& Plimpton LLC (“Debevoise”), has also agreed to be designated as a City Professional and have
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its invoices reviewed by the Fee Examiner. The Fee Examiner has just received the applicable
Debevoise invoices and has just begun the process of reviewing and commenting on these
invoices.

5. Pursuant to paragraph 5 of the Fee Review Order, the Fee Examiner is to issue
Preliminary Reports to each of the Professionals with respect to each month’s Invoices. The

April Preliminary Reports (each a “Preliminary Report”) were issued by the Fee Examiner on or

about July 29, 2014 (and transmitted to each Professional) with respect to each of the April
Invoices. Thereafter, the Fee Examiner engaged in Resolution Discussions with each of the
Professionals in an effort to resolve the Fee Examiner’s comments and questions regarding the
April Invoices.

6. Pursuant to paragraph 7 of the Fee Review Order, the Fee Examiner submits this
April Final Monthly Report regarding the April Invoices.

Summary of April Invoices by Professional

7. The following are summaries of the submitted April Invoices organized by
Professional, indicating total requested fees and expenses, as well as voluntary write-offs and
other reductions made by each of the Professionals with respect to its April Invoice, both before
the submission of the April Invoice and as a result of the Resolution Discussions between the Fee
Examiner and each Professional. As referenced beside the name of each Professional, attached
as exhibits to this April Final Monthly Report are copies of the final, redacted (as applicable)
April Invoices which in many respects have been revised and/or reduced based on the
Preliminary Reports and Resolution Discussions between the Fee Examiner and the

Professionals.
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City Professionals:

8. Conway MacKenzie, Inc. (“Conway”) (Exhibit A)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction? $8,910.00
Original Fee Request $1,059,244.50
Subsequent Voluntary Fee Reduction $5,418.16
Final Fee Request $1,053,826.34
Expenses Incurred $4,583.19
Voluntary Expense Reduction $3,616.51
Final Expense Request $966.68
Total Final Fee and Expense Request $1,054,793.02

Conway’s April 2014 Monthly Invoice initially included a voluntary fee reduction of
$8,910.00, and provided for a fee request of $1,059,244.50 and an expense request of $966.68,
for a total request of $1,060,211.18. In his Preliminary Report regarding Conway’s April
Invoice, the Fee Examiner identified several issues and made certain requests of Conway relating
to, among other things: (i) the sufficiency of certain service descriptions; (ii) clarification as to
the nature of certain services relating to preparation of invoices; and (iii) the improper
categorization of certain time entries.

Based on the Preliminary Report, Conway made substantial revisions to the Invoice to
supplement, re-categorize, and clarify certain service descriptions. Conway made additional
voluntary reductions totaling $5,418.16 relating to certain inconsistent meeting times and other
issues identified by the Fee Examiner. Conway has provided an affirmative statement that the
fees requested in the Invoice comply with the terms and conditions of Conway’s fee agreement

with the City and has further demonstrated that the fees are being monitored to comply with the

2 Pursuant to the service contract between Conway and the City, Conway is charging discounted rates
that reflect, on average, a 25% discount from its standard hourly rates. In addition, Conway has agreed to
cap its fees for each bi-weekly period at $400,000 for Conway employees and $208,000 for
subcontractors, and to cap its overall advisory fees for the period from June 1, 2013 through September
30, 2014 at $19,300,000.
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amount restrictions set forth therein. In sum, based on Conway’s revised April Invoice, which
includes a modified fee and expense request of $1,054,793.02, there are no open issues with
respect to the April Invoice.

0. Jones Day (Exhibit B)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction® $474,949.11
Original Fee Request $3,977,380.12
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction $22,343.50
Final Fee Request $3,955,036.62
Original Expense Request $158,171.35
Additional Voluntary Expense Reduction $232.00
Final Expense Request $157,939.35
Total Fee and Expense Request $4,112,975.97

In the Preliminary Report regarding Jones Day’s April Invoice, the Fee Examiner
identified several issues and made certain requests, including, but not limited to, issues with
respect to individual time entries and expenses (including, e.g., insufficient detail about the tasks
performed, potential internal inconsistencies, improper allocation of resources, incorrect
categorization and lumping). With respect to each of the Fee Examiner’s requests and
comments, Jones Day has either reduced or written off such time entry or provided an adequate
explanation with respect to the Fee Examiner’s comments on such time entry or expense. There

are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

% Jones Day has agreed to reduce its standard hourly rates by 10%.
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10. Foley & Lardner LLP (“Foley”) (Exhibit C)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction* None
Original Fee Request $9,684.00
Additional VVoluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $9,684.00
Original Expense Request $0.00
Additional VVoluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $0.00
Total Fee and Expense Request $9,684.00

In the Preliminary Report regarding Foley April Invoice, the Fee Examiner identified
several issues and suggested certain revisions related to, among other things, the sufficiency of
various service descriptions. In response to the Fee Examiner’s Preliminary Report, Foley made
the suggested revisions to the Invoice which clarified the nature of the services rendered. As a
result, there are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

11. Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC (“KCC”) (Exhibit D)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction® None
Original Fee Request $69,133.75
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $69,133.75
Original Expense Request $24,732.25
Additional VVoluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $24,732.25
Total Fee and Expense Request $93,866.00

In the Preliminary Report regarding KCC’s April Invoice, the Fee Examiner identified

certain expenses that required further clarification. In response to the Fee Examiner’s request for

4 Foley has agreed to charge a blended professional hourly rate of $360/hour for services charged to the
City.

5 KCC has agreed to provide the estate with a 50% discount on its hourly rates. Additionally, pursuant to
the engagement letter between KCC and the City, the rates for KCC’s various levels of professionals have
been capped.
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information, KCC provided adequate clarification on these expenses which are recoverable from
the estate. Accordingly, there are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

12. Miller Buckfire & Co. LLC (“Miller Buckfire) (Exhibit E)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction® None
Original Monthly Invoice Fee Request $300,000.00
Original Special Invoice Fee Request $180,000.00
Additional VVoluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Invoice and Special Invoice Fee Request $480,000.00
Original Expense Request $17,918.23
Additional VVoluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $17,918.23
Total Fee and Expense Request $497,918.23

Miller Buckfire submitted two April 2014 invoices. On July 7, Miller Buckfire submitted
its invoice for certain financial restructuring fees earned in April, 2014 (the “Special Invoice”).
On July 21, 2014, Miller Buckfire submitted its regular April Invoice. In the Preliminary Report
regarding both the Special Invoice and the Invoice, which was sent to Miller Buckfire on July 31,
2014, the Fee Examiner noted: (i) that the Special Invoice was for restructuring fees due from
two separate transactions, which after application of certain agreed upon credits, required the
City to pay Miller Buckfire an additional fee of $180,000.00 and; (ii) that the Invoice was in the
amount of the reduced monthly fee of Miller Buckfire beginning as of January 2014 and that all
prior comments by the Fee Examiner on specificity concerning expenses had been addressed.
The Fee Examiner did request additional information concerning what appeared to be a duplicate
airfare charge and excessive charges for use of a car service rather than a commercial cab

service. Miller Buckfire provided the Fee Examiner with a thorough explanation by email on

® Pursuant to the service contract entered into between Miller Buckfire and the City, Miller Buckfire was
paid a monthly advisory fee of $500,000 per month through December 2013, which monthly fee was
reduced to $300,000 per month beginning in January 2014, plus Miller Buckfire has been reimbursed for
its out of pocket expenses. In addition to the monthly advisory fee, Miller Buckfire is entitled to seek
certain transactional and restructuring fees identified in the service contract.
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October 27, 2014. The response received addresses all concerns raised by the Fee Examiner and
there are no unresolved issues.

13. Miller, Canfield, Paddock & Stone, P.L.C. (“Miller Canfield”) (Exhibit F)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction’ None
Original Fee Request $331,891.00
Subsequent Voluntary Fee Reduction $4,373.00
Final Fee Request $327,518.00
Original Expense Request $5,852.35
Additional VVoluntary Expense Reduction None
Final Expense Request $5,852.35
Total Fee and Expense Request $333,370.35

In the Preliminary Report regarding Miller Canfield’s April Invoice, the Fee Examiner
identified several issues, including, but not limited to: (i) the inconsistent use of billing
categories, (ii) the inadequacy of several descriptions of services rendered in individual time
entries, and (iii) the significant overlap in work performed by multiple Miller Canfield
professionals with respect to automatic stay matters and the drafting and review of internal
memoranda. Pursuant to its modified retention agreement with the City, effective retroactively
to October 1, 2013, Miller Canfield charges the City the lesser of (a) standard hourly rates for all
of lawyers; and (b) a blended hourly rate of $395 per hour for all non-bankruptcy lawyers and
standard hourly rates for all bankruptcy lawyers.

With regard to the Fee Examiner’s comments concerning billing categories and the
insufficiency of certain service descriptions, Miller Canfield revised its Invoice to correct the
billing categories and provide additional detail of the services rendered. Miller Canfield also

provided explanations to the Fee Examiner regarding the services provided by multiple Miller

" Pursuant to the service contract entered into between Miller Canfield and the City, Miller Canfield
charges the lesser of (a) standard hourly rates for all attorneys, and (b) a blended hourly rate of $395/hr
for all non-bankruptcy lawyers and standard hourly rates for bankruptcy lawyers.
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Canfield professionals relating to the same tasks. Miller Canfield explained that the services
were not duplicative, but did voluntarily remove some of the time entries for which it sought
compensation. Miller Canfield’s revised April Invoice addresses all of the issues raised by the
Fee Examiner in the Preliminary Report.

14, Milliman, Inc. (“Milliman”) (Exhibit G)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction® None
Original Fee Request $260,009.90
Additional VVoluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $260,009.90
Original Expense Request $0.00
Additional Voluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $0.00
Total Fee and Expense Request $260,009.90

On July 30, 2014 the Fee Examiner sent Milliman the April 2014 Preliminary Report
respecting its April Invoice received on June 2, 2014. In the Preliminary Report, Milliman was
asked to revise the Invoice to provide more detail in describing the work performed by
professionals whose billed entries totaled less than an hour for the entire month, and to provide
an explanation of the work performed by professionals who were designated as
“Administrative/Clerical.” Milliman was also asked to provide additional detail of the work
performed in the billing category “Mediation and Litigation Support.” Lastly, the Fee Examiner
requested that Milliman provide a discounted rate for its services, as the City is not receiving any
discount on the work Milliman performs. Milliman provided written comments in response to
the Preliminary Report explaining the work performed by the individuals who billed less than an
hour for the entire month. Milliman also submitted a revised Invoice correcting the

“Administrative/Clerical” professional designations as the Fee Examiner requested. Milliman

8 Milliman offers no discount on its services rendered in the Case.
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continues to decline to provide a discounted rate to the City for its services. There are no other
unresolved issues.

15. Pepper Hamilton LLP (“Pepper”) (Exhibit H)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction® None
Original Fee Request $152,208.90
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $152,208.90
Original Expense Request $781.55
Voluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $781.55
Total Fee and Expense Request $152,990.45

In the Preliminary Report regarding Pepper’s April Invoice, the Fee Examiner identified
several issues and suggested certain revisions related to the sufficiency of various service
descriptions, including identifying communications between Pepper professionals and other
professionals in the case. In response to the Fee Examiner’s suggestions and requests, Pepper
made substantial revisions to the April Invoice, including providing more detailed descriptions of
the particular services performed by Pepper professionals. Based upon the foregoing revisions,

there are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

9 Pepper has agreed to provide a 10% discount on all hourly fees charged to the City and to maintain its
year 2013 professional rates for the remainder of the Case.
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16. Ernst & Young (“EY”) (Exhibit 1)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction®® None
Original Fee Request $1,289,987.00
Agreed Fee Write-Offs (before Hold-Back) $3,861.00
Revised Fee Request After Agreed Write-Offs $1,286,126.00
10% Contractual Fee Hold-Back™ $128,613.00
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction (after Hold-Back) $0.00
Final Fee Request (without Hold-Back) $1,286,126.00
Interim Fee Request (with Hold-Back) $1,157,513.00
Original Expense Request $48,860.00
Voluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $48,860.00
Total Fee and Expense Request (without Hold-Back) $1,334,986.00
Interim Fee and Expense Request (with Hold-Back) $1,206,373.00

In the Preliminary Report regarding the April Invoice of EY, the Fee Examiner attached a
spreadsheet that identified specific issues and suggested revisions to particular time and expense
entries that were vague, incomplete, improperly categorized or inconsistent with other time and
expense entries. The Preliminary Report also requested that EY provide additional information
on certain time entries that had been redacted in the April Invoice.

EY provided the Fee Examiner with a written response to the Preliminary Report. EY’s
response included a supporting spreadsheet that mirrored the Fee Examiner’s spreadsheet,
responded to each of the Fee Examiner’s comments on particular time and expense entries, and
detailed specific revisions and adjustments that EY agreed to make to its April Invoice in order

to address the Fee Examiner’s concerns. EY’s response also included the redacted information

19 During the course of its postpetition engagement with the City, EY has agreed to certain discounts and
limitations on its fees and expenses, including (i) to charge professional fees at 65% of its standard rates,
(ii) to cap non-working travel time at the lower of actual time or 2 hours, (iii) to cap lodging expenses at
$200/night for the metro Detroit area and $300/night for the metro New York City area, and (iv) to write
off all meal expenses. These discounts and limitations were reflected in the Original Fee Request.

11 Under the terms of EY’s engagement agreement with the City, the monthly fees of EY are “subject to a
10% holdback that will be payable upon the confirmation of a Plan of Adjustment of Debts by the
Bankruptcy Court by December 31, 2014. In the event a Plan of Adjustment of Debts is not confirmed by
December 31, 2014, the cumulative holdback amount will not be payable.”
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that the Fee Examiner requested. On the basis of EY’s response and agreed adjustments to its
invoice, there are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

17. Kilpatrick & Associates, PC (“Kilpatrick) (Exhibit J)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction'? None
Original Fee Request $4,610.00
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction $220.00
Final Fee Request $4,390.00
Original Expense Request $0.00
Additional VVoluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $0.00
Total Fee and Expense Request $4,390.00

On July 29, 2014 the Fee Examiner sent Kilpatrick the April 2014 Preliminary Report
with respect to Kilpatrick’s April Invoice received on June 18, 2014. In the Preliminary Report,
Kilpatrick was asked to revise the Invoice to provide more descriptive summaries for services
rendered in various time entries, and to consider removing entries for time spent reviewing
articles written about the City’s bankruptcy case from its total compensation request. Kilpatrick
provided written comments in response to the Preliminary Report, adding more detail to those
entries identified in the Preliminary Report. Kilpatrick later incorporated the Fee Examiner’s
comments into its revised and final Invoice, including removing entries for time spent reviewing
news articles from its total compensation request. The revised Invoice addresses all of the Fee

Examiner’s concerns and there are no unresolved issues.

12 pursuant to the service contract between Kilpatrick and the City, Kilpatrick is charging discounted rates
that reflect a 33-48% discount from its standard hourly rates.
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18. Ottenwess, Taweel & Schenk, PLC (“Ottenwess”) (Exhibit K)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction®® None
Original Fee Request $5,925.00
Additional VVoluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $5,925.00
Original Expense Request $0.00
Voluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $0.00
Total Fee and Expense Request $5,925.40

In the Preliminary Report regarding Ottenwess April Invoice, the Fee Examiner had no
comments or suggested revisions for Ottenwess. As a result, there are no open issues with
respect to the April Invoice.

19. Dykema Gossett, PLLC (“Dykema”) (Exhibit L)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction* None
Original Fee Request $31,291.00
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction $10,602.40
Final Fee Request $20,688.60
Original Expense Request $38.30
Additional Voluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $38.30
Total Fee and Expense Request $20,726.90

On June 25, 2014, Dykema submitted its April Invoice to the Fee Examiner. On July 29,
2014, the Fee Examiner served Dykema with his Preliminary Report regarding Dykema’s April
Invoice. In the Preliminary Report, the Fee Examiner stated that he had no comments or
suggested revisions to the time entries in Dykema’s invoice. However, the Fee Examiner did
express his concern that the amount of time that Dykema spent on fee preparation matters was

excessive and disproportionate under standards established for professional compensation in this

13 Ottenwess has agreed to charge a capped professional hourly rate of $225/hour for services billed to
the City.

14 In its engagement agreement with the City, Dykema agreed to charge professional fees at a maximum
hourly rate of $290 for attorneys and $65 for paralegals/law clerks.
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District. Dykema promptly revised the April Invoice and reduced the requested fees for fee
preparation matters in order to comply with those standards. In light of Dykema’s revisions and
adjustments, there are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

Committee Professionals:

20. Dentons US LLP (“Dentons”) (Exhibit M)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction?® None
Original Fee Request $1,023,994.00
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction $13,601.20
Final Fee Request $1,010,392.80
Original Expense Request $29,943.15
Additional Voluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $29,943.15
Total Fee and Expense Request $1,040,335.95

The Fee Examiner reviewed the April Invoice of Dentons and raised several issues in the
Preliminary Report, including, but not limited to: (i) Dentons’ continued practice of billing for
services rendered in connection with monitoring press reports, preparing summaries of media
coverage, and preparing and responding to press reports (“Media Activities”) (in excess of
$28,000); and (ii) issues with respect to individual time entries and expenses (including, e.g.,
insufficient detail about the tasks performed, potential internal inconsistencies, and incorrect
categorization, and unreasonable or non-compensable expenses).

With respect to the Media Activities, Dentons agreed to reduce its fee for such services

by 40%, for a total discount of $11,348.20. The Fee Examiner believes that the discount is an

15 Dentons agreed to bill attorneys at the lower of: (i) the highest rate of a comparable Jones Day

attorney, less a 10% discount; or (ii) the standard Dentons rate (with the exception of Carole Neville,
whose rate is discounted by 16%). Using this billable hour structure, to the extent that the balance on a
given month would not result in a 10% or greater overall discount from Dentons’ standard rates, Dentons
has agreed to further reduce the balance of its bill such that it equals a 10% discount.
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appropriate and reasonable resolution to the issue and has no further comments with respect to
the Media Activities for the April Invoice.

With respect to individual time entries and expenses, Dentons has either reduced or
written off such time entry, revised the description, or provided an adequate explanation with
respect to the Fee Examiner’s comments on such time entry or expense. There are no
outstanding issues with respect to the April Invoice.

21. Brooks Wilkins Sharkey & Turco, PLLC (*Brooks Wilkins”) (Exhibit N)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction®® None
Original Fee Request $70,773.00
Additional VVoluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $70,773.00
Original Expense Request $512.70
Additional VVoluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $512.70
Total Fee and Expense Request $71,285.70

The Fee Examiner reviewed the April Invoice for Brooks Wilkins and identified several
issues and made certain requests of Brooks Wilkins in the Preliminary Report with respect to
certain individual time entries (e.g., insufficient description, potentially duplicative services, and
lumping). In response, Brooks Wilkins either revised the description or provided an adequate
explanation with respect to the Fee Examiner’s comments on such time entry. As a result of the

response from Brooks Wilkins, there are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

16 Brooks Wilkins has agreed to reduce its standard hourly rates by 10%.
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22. Lazard Freres & Co. LLC (*Lazard”) (Exhibit O)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction?’ None
Original Fee Request $175,000.00
Additional VVoluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $175,000.00
Original Expense Request $9,632.10
Additional Voluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $9,632.10
Total Fee and Expense Request $184,632.10

The Fee Examiner reviewed the April Invoice for Lazard and identified one minor issue
with respect to a certain expense item, and Lazard provided an adequate explanation. As a result
of the response from Lazard, there are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.

23.  Segal Consulting (“Segal”) (Exhibit P)

Initial Voluntary Fee Reduction'® None
Original Fee Request $393,137.00
Additional Voluntary Fee Reduction $0.00
Final Fee Request $393,137.00
Original Expense Request $14,128.25
Additional VVoluntary Expense Reduction $0.00
Final Expense Request $14,128.25
Total Fee and Expense Request $407,265.25

On July 30, 2014 the Fee Examiner sent Segal the April Preliminary Report. In the April
Preliminary Report, the Fee Examiner requested that Segal provide greater detail in its
description of “Case Management” activities. The Fee Examiner noted that the time spent by
Segal professionals in the billing category “Case Management” comprised approximately 10% of
Segal’s entire compensation request, and that the description of activities was too generic. The

Fee Examiner also requested that Segal explain what work was completed for “Billing/invoicing

7 Lazard has agreed to charge a flat monthly fee of $175,000, plus a transaction fee upon the earlier of
the settlement of the material claims of the Retiree Committee and the conformation of a plan of
adjustment. The transaction fee is subject to the approval of the Retiree Committee and the Fee Examiner
and the consent of the City.

18 Segal offers no discount on its services rendered in the Case.
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work above standard Segal practice.” Segal submitted a response to the April Preliminary
Report advising the Fee Examiner that the majority of time allocated to “Case Management” was
related to the review of and responses to several hundred emails related to (i) mortality
assumptions, (ii) projections, (iii) mediation, (iv) benefit restoration, (v) ballots, (vi) pension
data, (vii) annuity savings fund restitution, and (viii) plan governance. Additionally, Segal’s
response to the April Preliminary Report explained that Segal does not charge for all of its
professionals’ time compiling the invoices submitted to the Fee Examiner. However, Segal did
explain that time spent providing the necessary detail in the invoices regarding billing rates and
billing categories was accounted for in Segal’s total compensation request, as Segal typically
does not have to provide that level of detail in its standard billing practices. Segal submitted a
revised April Invoice (recoding the majority of time spent in “Case Management” to more
appropriate billing categories), and the Fee Examiner is satisfied with Segal’s revised Invoice.
There are no open issues with respect to the April Invoice.
Respectfully submitted,

Dated: November 5, 2014 By: _ /s/ Robert M. Fishman
Robert M. Fishman, Fee Examiner

Robert M. Fishman

Shaw Fishman Glantz & Towbin LLC
321 North Clark Street, Suite 800
Chicago, IL 60654

Phone: (312) 541-0151
rfishman@shawfishman.com
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401 South Old Woodward Avenue, Suite 340
Birmingham, Michigan 48009
248.433.3100 | 248.433.3143 FAX
www.ConwayMacKenzie.com

May 21, 2014
Private and Confidential Amended: September 26, 2014

Mr. Kevyn D. Orr

City of Detroit

Two Woodward Avenue
Suite 1126

Detroit, Ml 48226

Re: Professional Services of Conway MacKenzie, Inc. to the City of Detroit
Related to Operations Restructuring

Fee statement for professional services rendered from April 1, 2014 through April 30, 2014.

Total Professional SEIVICES .....ovieiiiee it e e e e e e $923,316.50
Total Travel Time (Billed at 50%0) ..........cccoeeeiriiieeeiiiee e e, $0.00
Less: Courtesy Discount — Professional Services ...........c.cccevvvvvinnnne, ($8,910.00)
AdMINIStrative SEIVICES ... . ovieiir e eecee et e e $15,288.00
Subtotal AdVISOIY FEES ....cvueieiiiie et e e e e e e $929,694.50
Less: Fee Revisions per Fee EXaminer ..........coovvieiiiiiiieiie e ieean, ($5,083.50)
Subtotal AdVISOIY FEES ......uit et et e e e e e $924,611.00
Less: Fee Revisions per Fee Examiner (Meetings) ...........cc.vvvvvnervneennn. ($334.66)
Total AVISONY FEES ... vuve et iee it et e e e e e, $924,276.34
Total SUDCONTIACLOr SEIVICES ....ueeieee et e et e et e e $129,550.00
OUL-0f-POCKEL EXPENSES ...t vttt vet et et ettt e e ee e e e $4,583.19
Less: Courtesy DiSCOUNt - EXPENSES ... ..ueiverie et et e e e, ($3,616.51)
Fee Statement Total ..........cooeiiii e $1,054,793.02
Less: HOIADACK .......vuee e ($153,468.52)
BalanCe DUE ... .o e $901,324.50
Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Conway MacKenzie Fee Statement

Summary of Hours and Fees by Professional

V. Conway

D. MacKenzie
C. Moore

G. Kushiner
K. Hand

C. Gannon

M. Hausman
T. Eddy

C. Sekely

J. Addison

D. Reich

E. Petrovski
D. lafrate

W. Johnston
M. Walsh
Total Prof. Services

17.00
1.00
147.90
224.10
186.90
215.60
102.90
136.00
259.30
208.10
125.50
187.20
229.20
201.90
236.10
2,478.70

hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours

Q)

CEONONONONONONONONONONONONONE)

$495.00
$495.00
$495.00
$425.00
$425.00
$425.00
$425.00
$425.00
$425.00
$345.00
$345.00
$345.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$372.50

per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......
per hour .......

Total Travel TimMe .o e e e e,

Administrative

Less: Courtesy Discount — Professional Services

117.60 hours @ $130.00 per hour......

Total AdVISOrY SEIVICES. .. vt et e e e e e

Invoice # 25954

13-53846-swr

Page 2 of 20

$8,415.00
$495.00
$73,210.50
$95,242.50
$79,432.50
$91,630.00
$43,732.50
$57,800.00
$110,202.50
$71,794.50
$43,297.50
$64,584.00
$63,030.00
$55,522.50
$64,927.50
$923,316.50

$0.00

$15,288.00

($8,910.00)

$929,694.50

CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Summary of Hours and Fees by Subcontractor

F. Crawford 164.00 hours @  $100.00 perhour ....... $16,400.00
P. Natke 14750 hours @  $100.00 perhour ....... $14,750.00
S. Mengel 23.20 hours @  $100.00 perhour....... $2,320.00
C. Vadino 10250 hours @  $100.00 perhour ....... $10,250.00
Y. Hackney 161.40 hours @  $100.00 per hour ....... $16,140.00
J. Brown 19410 hours @  $100.00 perhour ....... $19,410.00
B. O'Droski 18450 hours @  $100.00 perhour....... $18,450.00
J. Stewart 96.80 hours @  $100.00 perhour....... $9,680.00
A. Taylor 28.70 hours @  $100.00 perhour....... $2,870.00
K. Mitchell 192.80 hours @  $100.00 perhour ....... $19,280.00
Total Subcontractor Services $129,550.00
Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Summary of Billable Expenses

Telephone — Cellular / Intercall Conference Calls .......................... $966.68

Billable Expense Total ........ccoviniiiiii e e $966.68

Courtesy DiSCOUNt — EXPENSES ....uuvine e ettt ie e ieee e eenae $3,616.51

EXPEnse Total ... ..o e e e e $4,583.19
Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Summary of Hours and Fees by Code

Description Code Hours Fees
36th District Court Matters 36D 53.90 $20,397.50
Attorney General AG 2.40 $857.00
Coleman A. Young International Airport Matters AIR 5.70 $1,777.50
Other Asset Analysis and Recovery / Disposition Matters ASST 122.10 $51,892.50
Blight and Surplus Land Matters BLT 20.90 $8,497.50
Buildings and Safety Department Matters BSEED 59.00 $17,935.00
City Council CcC 3.90 $1,072.50
City Clerk CLK 3.70 $1,077.50
Department of Administrative Hearings DAH 3.70 $1,045.50
Detroit Department of Transportation DDOT 30.80 $11,841.00
Debt and Balance Sheet Matters DEBT 17.00 $6,900.00
Detroit Fire Department Matters DFD 146.60 $52,271.50
Department of Health and Wellness Promotion Matters DHWP 1.60 $524.00
Detroit Police Department Matters DPD 159.80 $50,832.50
Department of Public Works Matters DPW 4.90 $1,650.00
Detroit Water and Sewerage Department Matters DWSD 105.40 $35,999.50
Elections ELC 6.10 $1,722.50
Fee Examiner Matters FEE 146.70 $45,896.50
Finance Department Matters FIN 547.30 $179,834.00
General Operational Matters GEN 202.70 $75,200.50
General Services Department Matters GSD 81.80 $32,363.00
Human Resources Matters HR 72.60 $28,579.00
Information Technology Services Matters ITS 10.00 $3,985.00
Law Department Matters LAW 13.20 $3,975.00
Mayor's Office Matters MAY 28.30 $10,628.50
Mediation Matters MED 62.30 $30,164.50
Municipal Parking Department Matters MPD 106.40 $43,393.00
Ombudsman OMB 2.90 $972.50
OPEB OPEB 0.60 $297.00
Planning and Development Department Matters PDD 40.10 $13,712.50
Pension Matters PEN 168.70 $61,485.50
Public Lighting Department Matters PLD 17.00 $6,383.50
Plan of Adjustment POA 226.90 $92,274.50
Projections and Modeling Matters PROJ 105.80 $36,987.00
Recreation Department Matters REC 3.20 $1,096.00
Total 2584.00 $933,521.00
Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Below is a summary of services provided by task code, additional time entry detail can be found
in Attachment 1.

36" District Court (36D)
(53.90 Hours; $20,397.50)
Conway provided services for the 36" District Court related to analysis, development and implementation

of restructuring plans and facilities improvements as summarized below:

e Plan of Adjustment and Disclosure Statement: Conway worked on refining and updating the
timing and financial impact of key restructuring initiatives in order to amend the 10 year
restructuring plan. Conway amended Disclosure Statement for Court filing.

e Budgeting Process: Conway evaluated the Court’s FY2015 through FY2017 proposed budget for
comparative analysis with the Plan of Adjustment. Additionally, Conway worked with the
Finance department and 36" District Court’s management team to review the 10 year
restructuring initiative plan.

e Operations improvement: Conway continued to direct and oversee key operational process and
procedures improvements in the Civil department.

Auditor General (AG)

(2.40 Hours; $857.00)

During the month of April 2014, Conway provided services related to the continued review, examination
and preparation of restructuring initiatives for the 10-year projections as it relates to the overall COD Plan
of Adjustment. These efforts assisted in identifying additional or updated restructuring initiatives for
inclusion in the revised 10-year projection to move the Plan of Adjustment process forward.

Coleman A. Young International Airport (AIR)

(5.70 Hours; $1,777.50)

Activities related to development of revised 10-year projections for the Amended Plan of Adjustment and
preparation and compilation of summary responses from employee surveys. Conway continued to refine
and revise the 10-year projections for the Amended Plan of Adjustment as more detailed information was
received. This effort assisted in identifying additional or updated restructuring initiatives for inclusion in
the revised 10-year projection. Conway also compiled all completed Airport employee surveys
distributed by the Finance Department and summarized in Excel format. This activity will help Finance
Department leaders easily review summarized responses and make interpretations.

Other Asset Analysis and Recovery / Disposition Matters (ASST)

(122.10 Hours; $51,892.50)

During the month of April 2014, Conway completed the RFP for a City-wide surplus asset auction,
worked with the EMO and departmental directors to obtain approval, facilitated on-site reviews for all the
bidders and fielded questions from the pool of bidders to generate a high-level of interest and activity
related to the RFP.

Blight / Surplus Land (BLT)

(20.90 Hours; $8,497.50)

Activities were related to meetings with the Detroit Land Bank and Blight Task Force to discuss Blight
funding, Hardest Hit Funds, requirements, demolition costs, implementation strategy, and timeline.

Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Conway also assisted with the Blight business case for Quality of Life loan. Additionally, activities were
related to updating the disclosure statement and updates to information in the 10-year projections for the
Plan of Adjustment.

Buildings, Safety Engineering & Environmental Department (BSEED)

(59.00 Hours; $17,935.00)

During the reporting period Conway provided various services to BSEED with a focus on
revenue/collection activities, improving Department productivity, development of the department’s
triennial budget, and implementation of operational efficiencies as summarized below:

o Revenue/Collection: Conway continued working with BSEED’s existing accounts receivable
(“A/R™) data in order to identify the correct company and agency pay sources with significant
delinquent receivables (valid A/R) balances. Additionally, Conway continued its management of
collection personnel A/R collection initiative process which is driving collection of past due A/R.

e Productivity Improvement: Conway continued working with BSEED senior managers to define
appropriate/necessary department, divisional and individual employee productivity/performance
metrics and management tools. Conway continued to work with BSEED to develop performance
metrics on a real-time basis.

e Operational Efficiency: Conway worked with BSEED to improve the Department’s service
delivery and promote economic development. Conway worked with BSEED to finalize the
Permitting, Regulation, Enforcement and Property Information Technology System’s business
case in order to receive the Quality of Life loan financing needed to replace two disparate,
parallel IT systems. Conway provided the department with additional cost analysis related to
Zoning/Planning reorganization, and grant related job activity. Additionally, Conway provided
input in designing Customer Service Improvement material for the service training seminar.

o Revenue/Expenses: Conway reviewed, analyzed, and produced monthly financial information for
the last four fiscal years. Further, Conway built the department fee schedule template, which is
an important step in updating the department fee schedule.

e Triennial Budget and Restructuring Plan: Conway reviewed and analyzed various pertinent
documents and Department proposals related to: capital expenditures, IT needs and staffing
levels, etc. to identify potential opportunities for BSEED to further enhance customer service and
economic development within the City of Detroit. Additionally, Conway provided services to
BSEED regarding the development of the department’s triennial budget. The information
presented will assist the CFO and his team in making strategic decisions related to BSEED.
Conway conducted multiple meetings with BSEED senior members to discuss the restructuring
initiatives and the strategic restructuring plan. Finally, Conway updated the restructuring plan
projections and disclosure statement for the purpose of supporting the City’s Plan of Adjustment.

City Council (CC)
(3.90 Hours; $1,072.50)
During the reporting period Conway provided services related to the development of the revised 10-year

projections for the Amended Plan of Adjustment and provided assistance to the Emergency Manager’s
Office regarding transfer of certain City Council employees. Conway continued to refine and revise the
10-year projections for the Amended Plan of Adjustment as more detailed information was received. In
addition, Conway developed an analysis of City Council City Planning Commission/Historical
Designation Advisory Board employees to be transferred to the Planning and Development Department,

Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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as requested by the Emergency Manager’s Office. Conway conducted various meetings with members
from the Emergency Manager’s Office to discuss this transfer. These efforts assisted in further enhancing
City Council restructuring initiatives for their inclusion in the revised 10-year projection, as well as
pushing forward the initiative to reduce redundancy within City departments.

City Clerk (CLK)

(3.70 Hours; $1,077.50)

During the reporting period Conway provided services to City Clerk related to the department’s triennial
budget, and continued to assist with dangerous buildings document processing. Per instruction from the
City’s CFO, Conway continued developing a budget package for City Clerk to be used as the Budget
Department’s primary source in developing the triennial budget. Further, Conway corresponded with the
City Clerk executives regarding restructuring initiatives, anticipated revenue and expenses and strategy
over the next ten years. Additionally, Conway updated the restructuring plan projections and disclosure
statement for the purpose of supporting the City’s Plan of Adjustment.

Department of Administrative Hearings (DAH)
(3.70 Hours; $1,045.50)

During the reporting period Conway provided services to the Department of Administrative Hearings
regarding the development of the department’s triennial budget. Conway continued constructing a budget
package for the Department of Administrative Hearings to be used at the Budget Department’s primary
source for their triennial budget initiative. Additionally, Conway corresponded with the Department of
Administrative Hearings executives regarding restructuring initiatives, anticipated revenue and expenses
and strategy over the next ten years. Finally, Conway updated the restructuring plan projections and
disclosure statement for the purpose of supporting the City’s Plan of Adjustment.

Detroit Department of Transportation (DDOT)
(30.80 Hours; $11,841.00)
Conway provided services for DDOT related to addressing and improving of operational issues and

securing federal funding and grants to support improvements as summarized below:

e Plan of Adjustment and Disclosure Statement: Conway worked on refining and updating the
timing and financial impact of key restructuring initiatives in order to amend the 10 year
restructuring plan. Conway amended Disclosure Statement as it relates to DDOT for Court filing.

e Quality of Life funds: Conway worked with DDOT management team to identify restructuring
plan initiatives that may qualify for quality of life funds. Additionally, Conway worked with the
DDOT team to assist in developing applications and business cases for use of quality of life
funds.

e Surplus Asset Identification: Conway worked with DDOT management to identify, document
and categorize all assets that will be made available for the City wide surplus asset auction
process.

Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Debt and Balance Sheet- Vendor Interaction, Creditor Interaction, Postpetition/Exit Financing,
Other Contract Issues (DEBT)

(17.00 Hours; $6,900.00)

During the month of April, Conway provided services for vendor interaction, creditor interaction, post-
petition/exit financing, and other contract issues that related to creditor due diligence. A significant
amount of time was spent corresponding with other advisors regarding Plan of Adjustment ongoing
activities. Conway coordinated internally as well as with Ernst and Young and Miller Buckfire to discuss
Plan of Adjustment projections and reconciliations between baseline and reinvestment forecasts. Conway
also conducted meetings with the Mayor’s Office, Jones Day and the Emergency Manager’s Office to
discuss proposed uses of Quality of Life Loan proceeds. In addition to due diligence efforts related to the
Plan of Adjustment, Conway also compiled and reviewed creditor due diligence information requested
from various creditor constituents and where appropriate, forwarded to Miller Buckfire and Jones Day for
further distribution. Conway coordinated with Ernst & Young and Miller Buckfire to fulfill all creditor
requests and corresponded with City of Detroit personnel to retrieve the requested information, when not
already in possession. These efforts assisted in ongoing good faith negotiations with creditor
constituencies.

Detroit Fire Department (DFD)

(146.60 Hours; $52,271.50)

Conway provided services for the Detroit Fire Department related to the implementation of the
comprehensive strategic restructuring plan. Activities also related to updating the disclosure statement
and modifying labor assumptions used in the 10-year Plan of Adjustment.

o Development of the comprehensive strategic restructuring plan: Conducted several meetings
with DFD and DFFA leadership to discuss current issues, recommendations and next steps to be
included in comprehensive restructuring plan of action. Time was also spent reviewing the
current draft plan and providing revisions and recommendations.

o Development of DFD RFPs/RFQs: Conway assisted the Detroit Fire Department with the
RFP/RFQ process and with creating RFPs/RFQs. Conway also developed timelines, budgets and
plans for the Department to use to create the RFPs/RFQs. Lastly, Conway assisted the
Department with reviewing RFP/RFQ responses, developing follow up vendor questions,
assessing labor issues and other related analyses required to make RFP/RFQ recommendations.

o Department Business Case Assistance: Assisted with development of Department business cases
required for Quality of Life loan funding approval.

o Financial Department Assistance: Conway assisted with budget, purchasing and grant related
operations within the Detroit Fire Department. Additionally, provided assistance with financial
and IT related needs for Finance employees.

e Fire Apparatus Assistance: Conway assisted with initiatives to improve Fire Apparatus division
operations and equipment procurement.

Department of Health and Wellness Promotion (DHWP)

(1.60 Hours; $524.00)

Activities related to updating the disclosure statement and modifying labor assumptions used in the 10-
year Plan of Adjustment. Activities also related to Department contactors and outsourcing of activities in
the Department.

Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915
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Detroit Police Department (DPD)

(159.80 Hours; $50,832.50)

Conway provided services for DPD related to the development of the revised 10-year projections for the
Amended Plan of Adjustment, development of strategies regarding civilianization, recruitment, fleet
management, facility infrastructure, equipment and IT, and provided guidance to DPD regarding their
business case submissions as summarized below:

Development of the revised 10-year projections for the Amended Plan of Adjustment: Conway
conducted many activities related to developing and revising the 10-year projections for the
Amended Plan of Adjustment. Conway conducted various meetings with DPD senior leadership
to discuss existing operations and costs, restructuring and reinvestment initiatives related to
revenue and expenses (including labor, civilianization, recruitment, equipment, fleet, facilities,
IT, operations overhaul, etc.) over the next ten years. In addition, Conway continued
development of a DPD pension and wage analysis to address the impact on restructuring and
reinvestment initiatives.

Conway also worked closely with DPD Budget, City Budget, and Ernst
&Young to evaluate the baseline forecast and restructuring and reinvestment initiatives. In
addition, Conway conducted meetings with DPD senior leadership to verify and confirm that
adjustments made to the revised 10-year projections were based on realistic assumptions and met
the needs of the DPD. Many updates were made to the projections based on revised benefit and
wage assumptions as a result of ongoing negotiations. These efforts assisted in identifying
additional or updated restructuring initiatives for inclusion in the revised 10-year projection to
move the Plan of Adjustment process forward. DPD leadership approved the 10-year projection
for inclusion in the Amended Plan of Adjustment.

Development of strategies regarding civilianization, recruitment, fleet management, facility
infrastructure, equipment and IT infrastructure: Conway conducted meetings with DPD senior
leadership to discuss strategies related to civilianization, recruitment, fleet management, facility
infrastructure and IT infrastructure. Conway conducted several meetings and assisted DPD in
further evaluating facility consolidation options (lease versus buy or build) with input from
Department senior leadership, the City’s CFO, Detroit Building Authority, General Services
Department and the real estate groups currently managing DPD’s facilities. Conway also
collaborated with DPD to refine the detailed fleet requirements analysis which was based on
current and anticipated staffing levels, maintenance and repair issues, etc. An in-depth fleet
analysis meeting was conducted by Conway to refine required fleet needs in the amended Plan of
Adjustment, which was followed by a fleet specifications meeting with the General Services
Department and Purchasing Department to discuss RFQ options.

These efforts helped to ensure that the Department stays on track with issues related to
the aforementioned areas of concentration. In addition, the meetings conducted and the analyses
developed continued to refine the personnel and capital investment needs of the Department.
Provided guidance to DPD regarding business case submission for all restructuring initiatives:
Conway provided the financial information necessary for the Department to develop their
business case write-ups for all restructuring initiatives identified as “shovel-ready.” Additionally,
Conway provided guidance in the form of recommendations of items for inclusion in the written
portion of the business cases to assist DPD. These activities enabled the Department to pursue
funding for priority restructuring initiatives.

Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
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Department of Public Works (DPW)

(4.90 Hours; $1,650.00)

During the month of April, Conway continued to work with DPW on continued efforts related to the
collection rates of solid waste fees, as well as updating assumptions in the POA projections. Conway
worked with Treasury, Finance and Law to revise the local ordinances and processes to enhance
collections of the solid waste fees.

Department of Water and Sewer (DWSD)
(105.40 Hours; $35,999.50)
During the month of April, Conway provided various services to DWSD with the focus on preparation of

materials and analyses in response to creditor due diligence questions, discussions with DWSD
management and advisors related to DWSD bond issuance and revisions to 10-year Business Plan for
revised Disclosure Statements:

e Reuvisions to 10-year Business Plan: Conway prepared various 10-year Business Plan forecasts to
reflect updated information received from creditor negotiations that related to DWSD and
impacted the 10-year Business Plan.

o Creditor Due Diligence: Conway was involved in various communications and meetings related
creditor due diligence. Various analysis and time was required in preparation for or to respond to
specific due diligence requests.

e DWSD Bond Issue: Conway was involved in various conference calls with DWSD management,
advisors and legal counsel related to the potential bond issuance to fund capital improvement
projects. Conway’s involvement is necessary due to previous work performed related to 10-year
Business Plan and other matters.

Department of Elections (ELC)

(6.10 Hours; $1,722.50)

During the reporting period Conway provided services to the Department of Elections regarding the
development of the department’s triennial budget. Conway continued constructing a budget package for
the Department of Elections to be used at the Budget Department’s primary source for their triennial
budget initiative. The information presented will assist the CFO and his team in making strategic
decisions related to the Department of Elections. Additionally, Conway corresponded with the
Department of Elections senior members regarding restructuring initiatives, anticipated expenses and
strategy over the next ten years. Conway also provided assistance in the development of the department’s
Quality of Life loan business case pertaining to the financing needed for technology to both improve
election efficiency and drive cost savings through the projection period. Finally, Conway updated the
restructuring plan projections and disclosure statement for the purpose of supporting the City’s Plan of
Adjustment.

Fee Examiner Matters (FEE)

(146.70 Hours; $45,896.50)

Fee Examiner matters relate to fee order review and preparation of invoice and payment analysis.
Conway reviewed and analyzed the professional fee order entered into Court in preparation for
development of invoice and other fee related matters. Time spent includes preparing the fee applications
and payment analysis necessary for the Fee Examiner to review for the month of March and corresponded
with City of Detroit leadership regarding the same. As requested, Conway also developed and finalized

Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
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responses to the Fee Examiner's comments on the December fee application for submission per the fee
order. Conway also performed redaction of time entries for the month of November. Where possible,
Conway utilizes administrative personnel to prepare and perform fee related activities, however
administrative personnel do not have the background and understanding of daily work streams required to
prepare all aspects of the fee application. In these instances, professional time is required to prepare
various portions of the fee application and perform review of work completed by administrative staff.
Time incurred related to the fee application process is required by the Court and is not an administrative
or overhead expense, as described above the process requires professional involvement to complete.

Finance Department (FIN)

(547.30 Hours; $179,834.00)

During the month of April 2014, Conway provided multiple services to the Finance Department that
primarily related to preparing the restructured organizational structure for the City’s finance function,
prepared responses and participated in multiple conference calls with the State of Michigan regarding the
City’s Income Tax Division operations, prepared multiple financial analyses for the Bankruptcy Court
and potential Lenders regarding the Quality of Life Loan, reviewed and analyzed property taxes with
respect to the revolving fund settlement and assisted with the UTGO mediation process regarding
property tax collections and chargebacks, and identified surplus assets and developed a draft RFP for a
City-wide auction, as summarized below:

e Finance Department Organizational Restructuring: Conway continued to prepare the restructured
organizational structure for the City’s finance function including review and analysis of current
job descriptions and requirements by position. Conway also reviewed and analyzed responses
from employee survey in order to develop a summary of the responses and macro observations by
Finance Division. The above work, along with preparing a master task/function listing by
Division allowed development of the new Finance Department organizational structure with
better matched job specifications.

e Income Tax Operations: Conway, in conjunction with the City, responded to various questions
and information requests with respect to the operations of the Income Tax Division. This
information allowed both the City and State the ability to assess whether or not a transition of this
operation to the Michigan Department of Treasury is feasible.

e Quality of Life Loan: Conway prepared multiple financial analyses at the request of the
Bankruptcy Court and potential Lenders regarding the Quality of Life Loan. The financial
analyses included, but were not limited to, a listing of specific projects that would utilize the
Quality of Life loan proceeds as well as income tax and other financial information to assist the
Lender in potential syndication of the debt. Conway also worked with the Finance and other
Departments on the preparation and completion of business case templates necessary for the
planning and approval of individual restructuring projects.

e UTGO Bondholder Due Diligence: Conway assisted in the UTGO mediation process by
analyzing monthly and annual Wayne County revolving fund settlement statements regarding
property tax collections and chargebacks.

e Surplus Assets: Conway continued to work with the City to organize and prepare the City’s
surplus assets for auction and worked with various parties to preview the inventory available for
sale. Conway also assisted the City in preparation of the surplus asset RFP to solicit bids for
these assets.

General Operational (GEN)

(202.70 Hours; $75,200.50)

Services provided in General Operational matters relate to work in process (“WIP”) status meetings,

internal communications, Emergency Manager Office (“EM Office”) operational restructuring activity
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communications, Mayor operational restructuring activity communications ||| G

as summarized below:
Work in progress status meetings: Review and analysis of updated WIP reports on a weekly basis
in preparation for participation in weekly WIP status meetings with the EM Office and advisors.
These efforts allowed for important topics to be discussed on a weekly basis with input received
from all parties.
Internal communications: Weekly internal meeting conducted to discuss, develop, and coordinate
operational restructuring strategies and initiatives for the week ahead. These necessary
communications assisted in planning for weekly activities, including strategy development and
coordination of team efforts to efficiently and effectively complete tasks at hand.
EM Office operational restructuring activity communications: Conway compiled status updates
for all restructuring activities on a weekly basis and presented to the EM Office. In addition,
Conway met with the EM Office, the Mayor’s Office and City leadership to provide a
comprehensive update on operational restructuring across all departments and strategic options
being considered related to restructuring initiatives. These efforts assisted in conveying
milestones reached, as well as constraints experienced regarding ongoing operational
restructuring activities.
Mayor operational restructuring activity communications: Conway met with members from
Mayor Duggan’s team to discuss ongoing operational restructuring activities.  These
communications were necessary to provide status/completion updates on requests made by the
Mayor’s Office.

Discovery: Conway prepared and produced information in order to fulfill creditor discovery
requests. This included the production of email communications/documents and meetings with
financial advisors to provide detailed information regarding the City’s projections.

Quality of Life Loan Business Cases: Conway assisted in the City in evaluation of business case
responses of City departments to determine the priority and necessity of proposed capital projects.
This was necessary to determine project funding and uses of Quality of Life loan proceeds.

General Service Division (GSD)

(81.80 Hours; $32,363.00)
Services provided to the General Service Department include but were not limited to implementation of

the privatization of select services, development of financial reporting and cost allocation methodology
and an overall department restructuring plan as summarized below:

Privatization of Select Services: Conway continued to work closely with the Purchasing and
GSD departments to drive the Request for Proposal (RFP) processes for potential privatization
and related cost savings of fleet maintenance, fire apparatus emergency maintenance, and
custodial services. Conway performed financial cost modeling to support the cost evaluation of
outsource vs. insourcing for these RFP’s. Conway was responsible to develop the supporting
documentation and information packages for RFP decision approval. Additionally, Conway
participated in the vendor proposal evaluation process and the drafting of a new RFP’s for
privatization of various other GSD functions.

Space Consolidation Strategy: Conway worked with GSD team in developing detailed projected
plan for City wide space consolidation tasks and timing. Additionally, Conway developed the
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business case analysis for cost, subsequent lease savings and resulting return on investment for
each consolidation move support funding for this restructuring initiative.

e Plan of Adjustment and Disclosure Statement: Conway worked on refining and updating the
timing and financial impact of key restructuring initiatives in order to amend the 10 year
restructuring plan. Conway amended Disclosure Statement, as it relates to GSD, for Court filing.

e Quality of Life funds: Conway worked with GSD management team to identify restructuring
plan initiatives that may qualify for quality of life funds. Additionally, Conway worked with the
GSD team to assist in developing applications and business cases for use of quality of life funds.

Human Resources Department (HR)
(72.60 Hours; $28,579.00)

During the month of April 2014, Conway provided services for the Human Resource Department focused
on support of the Finance Department reorganization work-stream, preparation of the updated Human
Resource, Labor Relations, and Human Rights/Board of Ethics 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization
projections and multiple supporting analyses; preparation of various analyses related to personal service
contractors and temporary staff; support for labor union negotiations and analyzing impact to City-wide
operations; provided guidance and assistance ; provided management
and over-sight of the various Department requested sub-contractors working on multiple restructuring
initiatives, as summarized below:

e Provided Support and Analysis for Finance Department Reorganization: Conway worked with
the City and other consultants on developing a restructured organizational structure for the City-
wide finance function. Conway provided background and work performed to-date to an HR
Consultant overseeing the project.

o Preparation of Updated 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections: Conway prepared
multiple updates to the 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections for the Human
Resource and Human Rights/Board of Ethics Department as well as the Labor Relations Division.
Conway also prepared and reviewed multiple analyses supporting these updated projections.

o Preparation of Other Supporting Human Resource Related Analysis: Conway prepared and
reviewed the personal service contractor listing by department by position with wage information
and the sub-contractor listing by department by functional area. Conway also prepared and
reviewed the current and projected temporary staff spending analysis. In addition, and as part of
the normal monitoring process of staffing levels, Conway reviewed and analyzed the monthly
headcount report by department.

e Provided Support for Labor Union Negotiations: Conway participated in numerous meetings and

conference calls with Jones Day and City representatives regarding on-going union negotiations.
Conway reviewed and provided comments related to

Subcontractor Management and Oversight. During the reporting period, Conway incurred time
related to management and oversight of the Impact sub-contractors including meetings and
discussions related to work-streams, employee performance, clarity of scope, and time-reporting
matters.
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Information Technology Services Department (ITS)

(10.00 Hours; $3,985.00)

Conway performed services for the Information Technology Services Department primarily focused on
review and analysis of an ITS RFP for contractual services and participation in meetings regarding the
ITS 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization projections including IT project timing.

Law Department (LAW)

(13.20 Hours; $3,975.00)

During the reporting period Conway worked with Law Department senior leadership on activities related
to the development of revised 10-year projections for the Amended Plan of Adjustment, development of a
labor scenario analysis based on proposed revised organizational structure and preparation and
compilation of summary responses from employee surveys. Conway continued to obtain more detailed
information to refine the projections included in the amended Plan of Adjustment. Additionally and per
instruction from Jones Day, Conway developed a labor scenario analysis based on proposed revised
organizational structure for the Law Department to be used for determining funding sources for additional
positions and salary increases. Conway also compiled all completed Law employee surveys distributed
by the Finance Department and summarized in Excel format. This activity will help Finance Department
leaders easily review summarized responses and make interpretations. Collectively, these activities
assisted in moving the Amended Plan of Adjustment process forward.

Mayor’s Office (MAY)

(28.30 Hours; $10,628.50)

Activities related to updating the disclosure statement and modifying labor assumptions used in the 10-
year Plan of Adjustment. Conway also met with Mayor’s Office staff regarding departmental
restructuring and reinvestment initiatives, business case process, analysis requirements, as well as,
expectations and instructions for business cases. In addition, Conway participated in meetings with the
Department of Hospitality and Service Improvement related to customer service enhancements.

Mediation Matters (MED)
(62.30 Hours; $30,164.50)
Services provided related to Mediation Matters include information requests from mediation sessions,
preparation for mediation sessions and participation in mediation sessions, as summarized below:

e Information requests from mediation sessions: Conway corresponded and participated in
meetings and telephone conferences with Jones Day, Miller Buckfire and Ernst &Young
regarding mediation requests to further understand the requests and timing, as well as to address
questions. Conway also compiled and prepared materials responsive to the mediation requests to
fulfill the requirement.

e Preparation for mediation sessions: Conway reviewed and commented on topics for mediation
sessions. Conway worked with Jones Day and Ernst &Young to understand the status of all

information requests and items for mediation

. These efforts assisted in

developing definitive responses to questions in mediation sessions.
e Participation in_mediation sessions:

Invoice # 25954 CPO #2874390
SPO #2875915

13-53846-swr Doc 8186-2 Filed 11/05/14 Entered 11/05/14 18:21:50 Page 16 of
171



Conway MacKenzie Fee Statement Page 16 of 20

Municipal Parking Department (MPD)

(106.40 Hours; $43,393.00)

During the month of April, Conway continued to work with MPD on numerous tasks including, but not
limited to, obtaining final approval on the revenue enhancement actions, facilitating the due diligence
process with Desman Associates, obtaining approval to redeem the parking bonds, reconciling the “due
to/due from” amounts with Olympia and updating assumptions in the POA projections, as summarized
below:

o Revenue Enhancement Actions: Conway continued to work with the Emergency Manager’s
Office, Corporate Counsel and Jones Day to obtain final approval of the ordinance revisions to
effectuate the parking violation rate increases.

e Due Diligence Process with Desman Associates: Conway continued to work closely with
Desman Associates, Miller Buckfire and MPD management to facilitate the due diligence and
financial projection process, ultimately leading to a report from Desman that will provide options
to enhance MPD’s operations and potentially monetize upon the assets.

o Redemption of Parking Bonds: Conway worked with Finance, MPD, DBA, Corporate Counsel,
Lewis & Munday, Miller Buckfire, Jones Day and the parking bond trustee to obtain consensus
on, and approval of, proposal to redeem the parking bonds and apply excess cash reserves in a
DBA account.

e Due To/Due From Reconciliation with Olympia: Conway worked closely with Olympia
Entertainment, Jones Day and Finance to initiate a reconciliation audit of the due to/due from
analysis dating back to 2010 between Olympia and MPD as a requirement of the settlement
agreement between Olympia and the City related to lease extension for the JLA and JLA Garage.

o POA Assumptions: Conway updated the POA projections for MPD to reflect revised
assumptions for wages, benefits, training and related matters.

Ombudsperson Office (OMB)
(2.90 Hours; $972.50)
Activities related to updating the disclosure statement and modifying labor assumptions used in the 10-

year Plan of Adjustment. Additionally, Conway assisted with summarizing Ombudsperson restructuring
projects and initiatives.

Planning & Development Department (PDD)

(40.10 Hours; $13,712.50)

Activities related to development of a strategic planning function, flushed out options for restructuring
that include outsourcing key functions, utilizing interim managers to lead the transition while also
working out current contracts, and coordinating across departments and agencies. Conway worked closely
with the EM’s Office, Mayor’s Office, PDD management, other agencies and other consultants to
reaffirm the feasibility of the restructuring plan, identify major hurdles and identify next steps. This work
required the synthesis of complex, disparate information from multiple parties with multiple points of
view, to derive insights and recommendations regarding the restructuring of PDD. These efforts assisted
in updating the restructuring plan for inclusion in the revised 10-year projection to move the Plan of
Adjustment process forward. Conway continued constructing a budget package for PDD to be used as the
Budget Department’s primary source for their triennial budget initiative. The information presented will
assist the CFO and his team in making strategic decisions related to the PDD. Conway also worked with
the contracted subject matter experts to assist in grant and financial records back office cleanup in
anticipation of the grant administration consolidation citywide.
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Pensions (PEN)

(168.70 Hours; $61,485.50)

During the month of April, Conway provided services related to the continued review and examination of
both the (1) Detroit General Retirement System (“DGRS”) and the (2) Detroit Police and Fire Retirement
System (“DPFRS”). This review and examination is being monitored and supervised by EM’s office
through an organized group known as the Pension Task Force which is headed up by Chuck Moore of
Conway MacKenzie and includes outside counsel from both Jones Day and Miller Canfield. The group
also includes members of the Milliman actuarial firm and the activities are closely monitored by
representatives of the EM’s office.

The review and examination of the two City of Detroit pension systems serves many purposes, including
but not limited to, assisting with the development of a viable City of Detroit financial restructuring plan,
eligibility trial tasks, communications and meetings with interested parties such as the Retirement
Committee and the Retirement Systems, labor unions, assisting both the Auditor General’s (“AG”) and
Office of the Inspector General’s (“1G”) with Emergency Manger Order No. 8, relevant analysis
associated with the determination of plan underfunding status, potential changes in plan governance,
examination and identification of potential system deficiencies, determining the accuracy of past
payments made from systems to members, determining the proper calculation of pension claims, the
pursuit of any potential bankruptcy related recoveries, and other Pension Task Force determined
activities. The key activities which occurred in April 2014 can be summarized below:

e Plan of Adjustment: Review and update projections based on anticipated changes to pension
plans and impact on COD financial plans.

e Annuity Savings Fund (“ASF”): Assist Jones Day with financial analysis related to ASF interest
crediting and plan market rates of return including preparation of charts and graphs related to
active, inactive (deferred vested), and retirees accounts.  This analysis also involved preparation
of various ASF recoupment scenarios as instructed by Counsel.

o Ballot Preparation: Assist Jones Day with the drafting of ballot language related to DPFRS and
DGRS plan voting ballots. This included participation on conference calls with representatives of
the Retiree Committee and pension systems. This also included coordinating discussions with
actuarial firms to ensure consistency in valuation analyses by plan participant and related ballot
data points.

o EM Office: Among other things, CM assisted the EM office in preparation for discussions with
State of Michigan related to potential funding of pension plan obligations.

e Pension Task Force Sub-Committee Activities: Conway continued to being involved in
negotiations and discussions related to the development of pension plan concepts and
proposals/counter proposals, among other things. Conway continued to work closely with the
actuary firm Milliman in obtaining the necessary pension plan details as it relates to creating
various actuary scenarios as well as the process of confirming status of potential plan
underfunding and identifying available projected resources according to ten-year financial plans
for COD.

Public Lighting Department (PLD)

(17.00 Hours; $6,383.50)

Services provided to the Public Lighting Department (PLD) focused on meetings and communications
with Jones Day and City representatives regarding the Energy Delivery Services Agreement and related
draft exhibits. Conway communicated with multiple PLD customers and City representatives regarding
the PSCRF surcharge and other related issues. In addition, Conway provided recommendations to City
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representatives regarding completion of the business case templates for access to Quality of Life
proceeds.

Plan of Adjustment (POA)
(226.90 Hours; $92,274.50)
Services related to Plan of Adjustment include Conway’s participating in various drafting sessions and

telephone conferences with Jones Day, Ernst & Young and Miller Buckfire to work on the Amended Plan
of Adjustment and refine 40 year financial projection and potential treatment of creditor claims. In
addition, senior members of the Conway team met with the Emergency Manager’s Office, Jones Day,
Emst and Young and Miller Buckfire ||| G
I Convway also conducted calls with financial advisors and all
creditor constituents to present underlying financial projections and restructuring initiatives in the draft
Plan of Adjustment. Conway participated in various telephone conferences with Jones Day to discuss the
Amended Plan of Adjustment and Disclosure Statement. Additionally, Conway assisted with balloting
process required for 10-year Plan of Adjustment Approval. Conway also participated in numerous
meetings with Phoenix Management relating to 10-year Plan of Adjustment review process. Lastly,
Conway coordinated with Jones Day to address Plan of Adjustment document discovery requests. These
efforts assisted to ensure that City leadership were fully abreast of the activity surrounding the Plan of
Adjustment projections and negotiations with creditor constituents.

Projections and Modeling (PROJ)
(105.80 Hours; $36,987.00)
Activities and services provided during the month of April 2014 for Projections and Modeling related to

updating the 10-Year Restructuring/Reinvestment department-level projections and related supporting
analyses inclusive of variance analysis based on updated information. Conway also reviewed, analyzed,
and provided updates to the Disclosure Statement based on current and projected restructuring and
reinvestment activities.

Recreation Department (REC)
(3.20 Hours; $1,096.00)
Activities related to updating the disclosure statement and modifying labor, project timing and utility cost

assumptions used in the 10-year Plan of Adjustment. Activities also related to Department contactors and
outsourcing of activities in the Department.
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Below is a summary of services provided by Contractors during the reporting period:

36" District Court (36D)
C. Vadino - 102.5 Hours; $10,250.00
S. Mengel — 23.20 Hours; $2,320.00
Sub-total — 125.70 Hours; $12,570.00
Conway provided subcontractors to the 36" District Court related to assisting in the evaluation of
processes and systems in order to identify and implement workflow improvements as summarized below:
e Case Management:  Subcontractors reviewed civil case load and backlog in order to reduce
backlog and improve case processing procedures. Improvements in case management will
generate higher efficiency and improve customer service of the court.
e Process Improvement: Subcontractors analyzed and provided recommendations to streamline the
appeals process. Subcontractors met with appeals personnel regarding various issues within the
appeals process to determine appropriate recommendations on improving the appeals procedures.

Buildings, Safety Engineering & Environmental Department (BSEED)

J. Stewart — 96.80 Hours; $9,680.00

Sub-total — 96.80 Hours; $9,680.00

Conway provided subcontractors to BSEED with a focus on productivity improvement and finalizing the
business case to support the new purchasing process related to the license permitting RFP.

e Productivity Improvement: Subcontractor worked with employees in the department to identify
productivity measures. Additionally, subcontractor reviewed and revised the department’s
standard operating protocols.

e Revenue Collections: Subcontractor analyzed delinquent receivables in Tidemark systems to
support collection efforts and pursuit of delinquent accounts.

Human Resources Department (HR)

Y. Hackney — 161.40 Hours; $16,140.00

P. Natke — 147.50 Hours; $14,750.00

Sub-total — 308.90 Hours; $30,890.00

Conway provided a subcontractor to the Human Resource Department focused on recruiting, evaluating
temporary staffing candidate resumes and other supporting documents, and issue new temporary job
orders. Additionally, subcontractors performed tasks to facilitate the planning and implementation of the
learning and development project to establish a training program for the City.

Planning & Development Department (PDD)

K. Mitchell — 192.80 Hours; $19,280.00

Sub-total — 192.80 Hours; $19,280.00

Conway provided a subcontractor to assess restructuring options and provide recommendations to address
issues with grant managements, strategic planning, and services coordination across departments and
agencies. During the reporting period, subcontractor updated PDD databases, provided analysis of
investment strategy, participated in meetings with and regarding HUD and PDD management staff to
discuss and address various options and issues regarding demolition and blight removal activity, grants
management, fund allocations, real estate property, and development of restructuring plan.
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Detroit Police Department (DPD)

B.O’Droski — 184.50 Hours; $18,450.00

Sub-total — 184.50 Hours; $18,450.00

Conway provided a subcontractor to the Detroit Police Department to serve as the interim Chief Financial
Officer. Work performed during the reporting period involved oversight of the accounting and finance
function, which included leading department meetings, and analyzing payroll and vendor disbursements.

Finance Department (FIN)

F. Crawford — 164.00 Hours; $16,400.00

A. Taylor — 28.70 Hours; $2,870.00

Sub-total — 192.70 Hours; $19,270.00

Conway provided subcontractors to the Finance Department with a focus on the income tax division.
Subcontractor worked within the Income Tax Division to audit returns along with supporting schedules;
draft correspondence to tax payers; participate in meetings with taxpayers. Additionally, subcontractors
researched and performed various analyses to assist in the reorganization of the City’s finance
department.

General Services Department (GSD)
J. Brown — 194.10 Hours; $19,410.00
Sub-total — 194.10 Hours; $19,410.00
Conway is utilizing a subcontractor to assist in the financial accounting, analysis, and examination of the

General Services Department. Subcontractor performed various financial analyses to support GSD space
consolidation activities. Additionally, subcontractor worked with several other GSD personnel to develop
cost analyses to assess various activities at several work sites. Subcontractor’s work involved several
meetings with staff and site-visits to assess workload, conditions, and problem areas.
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City of Detroit, Michigan, Debtor
Chapter 9 Case No. 13-53846
United States Bankruptcy Court
Eastern District of Michigan
Southern Division

Conway MacKenzie - April 2014 Invoice - Detailed Professional Fees

Billing Date of
Category Service [Professional Description Hours Rate Amount

Performed detail analysis of 36D FY 2015 budget against plan of adjustment

36th District Court baseline in order to provide feedback on necessary inclusions and eliminations for

Matters 04/02/14 TAE matching of budget to POA 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

36th District Court Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Matters 04/03/14 MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.10 | 275.00 27.50

36th District Court Revised and edited10 year restructuring plan of adjustment to account for

Matters 04/03/14| TAE updated information regarding benefits assumptions as it relates to 36D plan 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court

Matters 04/04/14| TAE Updated 36 District Plan of Adjustment for revised timing of initiatives 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

36th District Court Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

Matters 04/07/14 MCW Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Conducted detail analysis of operational improvement initiatives and progress

36th District Court made by S. Mengel, and C. Vadino in order to coordinate operational restructuring

Matters 04/07/14| TAE activities, report on progress and provide direction as needed 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Made substantial revisions to 36D's Plan of Adjustment based on updated

36th District Court information with regards to timing and deferrals of initiatives, spending and other

Matters 04/07/14 TAE adjustments 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court E-mail correspondence with J. Naglick regarding 36D Plan of adjustments for

Matters 04/07/14 TAE review with 36D Court management 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court Met with J. Naglick (Finance) to provide detail review and explanation of 36D Plan

Matters 04/08/14| TAE of Adjustment deferrals to support discussions and review with 36D personnel 1.10 @ 425.00 467.50

36th District Court Call with T. Eddy (CM) to discuss 36D 3 year budget comparison and process for

Matters 04/09/14| CMM updating reinvestment initiatives 0.20 | 495.00 99.00

36th District Court Made substantial revisions to 36 D court Plan of adjustments to accommodate for

Matters 04/09/14| TAE update cost information as a result of union negotiations 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

36th District Court Met with J. Naglick to discuss 36D plan of adjustment and restructuring initiatives

Matters 04/09/14 TAE in preparation with review with 36D management 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Performed detail comparative analysis of 36D Court's 3 year budget submission to

36th District Court Plan of Adjustments in order to provide variance analysis for evaluation of budget

Matters 04/09/14 TAE to POA 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

36th District Court Discussed 36D three year budget submission with budget department for

Matters 04/09/14| TAE understanding and clarification of detail 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court Compiled detailed listing of 36D restructuring initiatives' risk and opportunities for

Matters 04/09/14| TAE summary to be provided to Mayor Duggan 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Discussions with C. Gannon (CM) regarding 36D POA adjustments and revisions

Matters 04/09/14 TAE required 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

36th District Court Telephone conversation with C. Moore (CM) regarding communications and

Matters 04/10/14| TAE distribution of amended 36D Plan of Adjustments 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court E-mail communications with Judge Talbot (36D) regarding review of amendments

Matters 04/10/14| TAE and status of restructuring initiatives contained in 36D's Plan of Adjustment 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
E-mail communications with C. Moore (CM) and J. Naglick (Finance) regarding

36th District Court review of amendments and status of restructuring initiatives contained in 36D's

Matters 04/10/14 TAE Plan of Adjustment 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court Met with J. Naglick to review analysis of 36D's three year budget vs. plan of

Matters 04/10/14 TAE adjustment and discuss method to address discrepancies, changes, and variances 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

36th District Court Revised Plan of Adjustments risk and opportunities related to status of 36D

Matters 04/11/14 TAE identified restructuring initiatives 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Discuss and provided feedback to C. Gannon (CM) on 36D's updated Plan of

36th District Court Adjustment restructuring initiatives impact and timing in preparation for review

Matters 04/12/14| TAE meeting with 36D and Finance personnel 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

36th District Court E-mail communications with Finance and CM personnel regarding plan of

Matters 04/12/14 TAE adjustment review meeting preparation 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court Made substantial reviews, updates and revisions to amended Disclosure

Matters 04/13/14| TAE Statement for 36D 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court Made revisions and updates to 36D's plan of adjustment to incorporate revised

Matters 04/13/14| TAE labor wage rate and benefits assumptions 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
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Billing Date of
Category Service [Professional Description Hours Rate Amount

36th District Court Teleconference with T. Eddy (CM) regarding 36D 10 year plan assumptions and

Matters 04/14/14|CMG City discussions with J. Talbot regarding plan 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Conducted detail analysis of operational improvement initiatives and progress

36th District Court made by C Vadino in order to coordinate operational restructuring activities, report

Matters 04/14/14| TAE on progress and provide direction as needed 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court Call with C. Moore (CM) to discuss 36D 3 year budget comparison and process for

Matters 04/14/14| TAE updating reinvestment initiatives 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court Continued to make revisions and updates to 36D's plan of adjustment to

Matters 04/14/14 | TAE incorporate revised labor wage rate and benefits assumptions (.5) 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

36th District Court Meeting with T. Eddy (CM) to prepare for 36D meeting with Judge Talbot later in

Matters 04/15/14|CMG week 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

36th District Court

Matters 04/15/14|EMP Met with T. Eddy (CM) re: 36D restructuring initiative summary 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

36th District Court Met with C. Gannon regarding 36D 10 year plan assumptions and City discussions

Matters 04/15/14 | TAE with J. Talbot regarding plan 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Met with E. Petrovski (CM) to review 36D's restructuring plan and development

36th District Court timeline progression in preparation for meeting between City finance department

Matters 04/15/14| TAE and 36D Court management team regarding budget vs POA 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court

Matters 04/17/14|CMG Preparation for meeting with 36D regarding POA 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court Meeting with 36D, J. Hill (CFO), J. Naglick (Finance) and M. Walsh (CM)

Matters 04/17/14|CMG regarding POA, labor negotiations and next steps 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

36th District Court Pre meeting with J. Hill (CFO), J. Naglick (Finance) and M. Walsh (CM) to prepare

Matters 04/17/14|CMG for 36D meeting 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

36th District Court Evaluated 36D POA forecast vs. currently submitted budget to compare

Matters 04/17/14|CMG discrepancies, forwarded analysis to M. Walsh to complete 2.40 | 425.00 1,020.00

36th District Court Correspondence with T. Eddy (CM) regarding results of meeting with 36D and

Matters 04/17/14|CMG follow up questions 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

36th District Court Review requests from L. Nelson, Esq. (JD) regarding interrogatories and

Matters 04/17/14| CMM document requests related to 36D as part of Plan of Adjustment 0.40 | 495.00 198.00

36th District Court Prepared summary for meeting with City and 36D related to variances between

Matters 04/17/14| MCW Plan of Adjustment and Trienniel Budget 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

36th District Court Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM), J. Hill (City CFO), and J. Naglick

Matters 04/17/14| MCW (Finance) regarding Plan of Adjustment and Trienniel Budget 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

36th District Court Prepared Plan of Adjustment documents and Trienniel Budget for meeting with J.

Matters 04/17/14| MCW Hill (City CFO) and J. Naglick (Finance) 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
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Conway MacKenzie - April 2014 Invoice - Detailed Professional Fees

Billing Date of
Category Service |Professional Description Hours Rate Amount

Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM), J. Hill (City CFO), J. Naglick

36th District Court (Finance), M. Talbot (36D) and other 36D representatives regarding Plan of

Matters 04/17/14|MCW Adjustment and Trienniel Budget 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

36th District Court Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Jones Day request related

Matters 04/17/14| MCW to 36D information 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
E-mail communication with M. Walsh(CM) regarding information request

36th District Court responses for Finance department regarding 36D financial structure and asset

Matters 04/17/14| TAE distribution procedures and processes 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court

Matters 04/18/14|CMG Meeting with M. Walsh regarding changes to 36D restructuring initiatives 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Meeting with M. Walsh (CM) to provide guidance on next steps related to Jones

Matters 04/18/14|CMG Day information request on Interrogatories 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court Teleconference with L. Nelson (Jones Day) and M. Walsh (CM) regarding

Matters 04/18/14|CMG interrogatories request 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Reviewed information gathered for interrogatories and provided comments to M.

Matters 04/18/14|CMG Walsh 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court

Matters 04/18/14|CMG Follow up with P. Scales and J. Naglick regarding 36D interrogatory responses 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding potential movement of

Matters 04/18/14| MCW restructuring initiatives from 36D 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

36th District Court Reviewed department interrogatories request from Jones Day with C. Gannon

Matters 04/18/14|MCW (CM) 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

36th District Court Teleconference with L. Nelson (Jones Day) and C. Gannon (CM) regarding

Matters 04/18/14|MCW department interrogatories request 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
E-mail communication with C. Gannon (CM) regarding building upgrades and

36th District Court capital improvements to support DPD's overall facilities and space plan (.3) and

Matters 04/18/14| TAE follow up from meeting with 36D regarding amended restructuring plans (.3) 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Coordination with H. Schifman on POA due diligence requests from Creditors

Matters 04/21/14|CMG related to 36D 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

36th District Court Teleconference with H. Schifman to coordinate responses to bankruptcy

Matters 04/21/14|CMG interrogatories 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Performed review and analysis of 36th District Court contractor's weekly time
submission to ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing

36th District Court agency. This is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with

Matters 04/21/14|DMI the Fee Examiner. 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

36th District Court Teleconference with H. Shifman (36D) and C. Gannon (CM) regarding department

Matters 04/21/14  MCW interrogatories request 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

36th District Court

Matters 04/22/14|CMG Teleconference with H. Schiffman regarding 36D interrogatories 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

36th District Court

Matters 04/22/14|CMG Reviewed interrogatory responses from 36D and provided edits to M. Walsh (CM) 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

36th District Court

Matters 04/22/14|CMG Reviewed and provided comments to M. Walsh (CM) regarding 36D asset listing 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court Reviewed 36D response from H. Shifman (36D) pertaining to interrogatories

Matters 04/22/14 MCW request from Jones Day 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

36th District Court Reviewed responses from E. Higgs (Finance) and S. Rouhani (Finance) regarding

Matters 04/22/14|MCW City assets/inventory related to interrogatories request from Jones Day 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
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36th District Court

Matters 04/23/14|CMG Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) regarding Bankruptcy interrogatories 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

36th District Court

Matters 04/23/14|CMG Meeting with M. Walsh (CM) to provide guidance on 36D interrogatories. 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Correspondence with M. Hale (JD) and L. Nelson (JD) regarding 36D

Matters 04/23/14|CMG interrogatories 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court

Matters 04/23/14|CMG Reviewed and provided comments to M. Walsh (CM) regarding interrogatories 2.20 | 425.00 935.00

36th District Court Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

Matters 04/23/14|MCW department 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

36th District Court Teleconference with S. Rouhani (Finance) regarding department assets/inventory

Matters 04/23/14\ MCW related to interrogatories request from Jones Day 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

36th District Court Prepared asset/inventory summary for department related to interrogatories

Matters 04/23/14|MCW request from Jones Day 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

36th District Court Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding interrogatories request

Matters 04/23/14|MCW from Jones Day 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

36th District Court

Matters 04/23/14|MCW Prepared responses to interrogatories request from Jones Day 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

36th District Court Participated in meeting with C. Mclnnis (Budget) regarding department triennial

Matters 04/23/14|MCW budget 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Email correspondence with H. Shifman (36D), H. Burden (36D), and R. Jackson

36th District Court (36D) regarding asset/inventory list related to interrogatories request from Jones

Matters 04/23/14|MCW Day 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

36th District Court Email correspondence with M. Hail (Jones Day) and L. Nelson (Jones Day)

Matters 04/23/14| MCW regarding interrogatories request pertaining to 36D open items 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

36th District Court

Matters 04/23/14| MCW Teleconference with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Bankruptcy interrogatories 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

36th District Court Updated interrogatory request from Jones Day based on comments received from

Matters 04/23/14|MCW C. Gannon (CM) 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

36th District Court Meeting with T. Eddy (CM) and M. Walsh (CM) regarding POA updates to 36D

Matters 04/24/14|CMG baseline and restructuring and reinvestment overlay 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court Correspondence with EY regarding adjustments to 36D POA baseline and

Matters 04/24/14|CMG restructuring and reinvestment overlay 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

36th District Court Review of updated 36D baseline and restructuring and reinvestment initiatives

Matters 04/24/14|CMG forecast 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Meeting with T. Eddy (CM) and C. Gannon (CM) regarding POA updates to 36D

Matters 04/24/14| MCW baseline and restructuring and reinvestment overlay 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

36th District Court Continued updates to interrogatory request from Jones Day based on comments

Matters 04/24/14 | MCW received from C. Gannon (CM) 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

36th District Court

Matters 04/24/14| MCW Drafted email to Jones Day regarding interrogatory request 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Teleconference with H. Shifman (36D) regarding assumptions for labor costs,

36th District Court wage inflation, and benefits for the 10 year projection period for the purpose of

Matters 04/24/14|MCW updating the restructuring / reinvestment projection 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

36th District Court Reviewed updated EY baseline per discussion with T. Eddy (CM) and S. Sarna

Matters 04/24/14| MCW (EY) for the purpose of updating department restructuring/reinvestment plan 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

36th District Court Made revisions to 36D's plan of adjustment restructuring initiatives to reflect

Matters 04/24/14| TAE changes in the plan's baseline as a result of meeting with 36D leadership 1.40 | 425.00 595.00
Compiled variance analysis of 36 District Court's FY2015 budget submission to

36th District Court the revised plan of adjustment baseline in order to understand and explain

Matters 04/24/14 | TAE changes and differences to support revised plan of adjustment 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

36th District Court Meeting with C. Gannon (CM) and M. Walsh (CM) regarding POA updates to 36D

Matters 04/24/14| TAE baseline and restructuring and reinvestment overlay 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

36th District Court Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) and S. Sarna (EY) related to adjustments in

Matters 04/24/14| TAE 36D baseline 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Discussed 36D plan of adjustment changes with J. Addison for inclusion in

Matters 04/24/14| TAE updated plan of adjustment and disclosure statement submission 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Reviewed amended Disclosure Statement and Plan of Adjustment for proper edits

Matters 04/24/14 | TAE and revisions related to changes to 36th District Courts restructuring plan 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

36th District Court Reviewed amended POA and Disclosure statement submissions for accuracy

Matters 04/25/14| TAE pertaining to 36D initiatives, cost impact and comments 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
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Conducted detail analysis of operational improvement initiatives and progress

36th District Court made by C. Vadino in order to coordinate operational restructuring activities,

Matters 04/29/14| TAE report on progress and provide direction as needed 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

36th District Court Reviewed and commented on summary of city wide collection activities summary

Matters 04/29/14| TAE as related to 36D 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document

Attorney General 04/02/14 | MCW provided by HR 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Attorney General 04/04/14| GMK Preparation of updated AG/IG 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization Projection 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

Attorney General 04/06/14| MCW Adjustment 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Prepare sample testing update with details selects made by AG's office related to

Attorney General 04/16/14|DAR AG No.8 1.10 | 345.00 379.50
Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

Attorney General 04/23/14|MCW department 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Blight and Surplus Participated in telephone conference with J.Doak (Miller Buckfire) regarding Blight,

Land Matters 04/02/14|KJH demolition, responsible parties, and project status 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Blight and Surplus Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to B. Farkas (EMO) regarding Blight,

Land Matters 04/02/14|KJH demolition, strategies, and project status 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Prepared for meeting with B. Farkas (EMO) and J.Doak (Miller Buckfire) regarding

Blight and Surplus Blight, demolition, strategies, backlog, property ownership, constraints, and

Land Matters 04/02/14|KJH funding 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Blight and Surplus Met with B. Farkas (EMO) and J.Doak (Miller Buckfire) regarding Blight,

Land Matters 04/02/14|KJH demolition, strategies, backlog, property ownership, constraints, and funding 2.40 | 425.00 1,020.00
Participated in telephone conference with B. Farkas (EMO) regarding Blight,

Blight and Surplus demolition, strategy, funding, and follow-up meeting with full Detroit Building

Land Matters 04/03/14|KJH Authority (DBA) team 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Blight and Surplus Met with S.Mays (EMO) regarding Blight, strategy, and communication with

Land Matters 04/04/14|KJH creditors 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Blight and Surplus

Land Matters 04/05/14|EMP Revised Blight plan of adjustment forecast to account for timing adjustments 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Blight and Surplus

Land Matters 04/06/14|MCW Input comments for the restructuring/reinvestment projections 0.10 | 275.00 27.50

Blight and Surplus Researched Hardest Hit Funds requirements and milestones to understand near

Land Matters 04/08/14|KJH term requirements and compliance risks at request of S.Mays (EMO) 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Blight and Surplus Participated in telephone conference with S.Mays (EMO) regarding Hardest Hit

Land Matters 04/08/14 |KJH Funds, progress, milestones, and constraints 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Blight and Surplus Participated in telephone conference with J.Doak (Miller Buckfire) regarding Blight,

Land Matters 04/09/14|KJH demolition, responsible parties, and project status 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Blight and Surplus Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to B. Farkas (EMO) regarding Blight,

Land Matters 04/09/14|KJH demolition, strategies, and project status 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Prepared for meeting with B. Farkas (EMO) and J.Doak (Miller Buckfire) regarding

Blight and Surplus Blight, demolition, strategies, backlog, property ownership, constraints, and

Land Matters 04/09/14 |KJH funding 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Blight and Surplus Met with B. Farkas (EMO) and J.Doak (Miller Buckfire) regarding Blight,

Land Matters 04/09/14|KJH demolition, strategies, backlog, property ownership, constraints, and funding 2.40 | 425.00 1,020.00

Blight and Surplus Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to S.Mays (EMO) regarding Blight,

Land Matters 04/11/14|KJH strategy, and communication with creditors 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Blight and Surplus Met with S.Mays (EMO) regarding Blight, strategy, Blight Task Force report, and

Land Matters 04/11/14|KJH Detroit Land Bank demolition pilots 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Blight and Surplus Responded to creditor inquiries regarding Blight, demolition, and Hardest Hit

Land Matters 04/11/14|KJH Funds 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Blight and Surplus Teleconference with B. Farkas (Land Bank) regarding business case template and

Land Matters 04/21/14 MCW land strategy related to demolition 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Blight and Surplus

Land Matters 04/25/14|JAA Met with D. Jerenycic (EY) regarding Blight and updates to 10-year plan 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Blight and Surplus Updated 10-year projections related to Blight per comments from D. Jerenycic

Land Matters 04/25/14|JAA (EY) 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Blight and Surplus Email correspondence regarding updated Blight 10-year projection with K. Hand

Land Matters 04/25/14|JAA (CM) and E. Petrovski (CM) 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Met with M. Walsh (CM) regarding Blight initiatives, priorities, demolition costs,

Blight and Surplus and business case for restructuring and reinvestment funding from Quality of Life

Land Matters 04/25/14 | KJH loan 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
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Blight and Surplus Corresponded via e-mail with C. Gannon (CM) regarding changes in Blight funding

Land Matters 04/25/14|KJH within Plan of Adjustment projections 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Blight and Surplus Participated in telephone conference with S.Mays (EMO) regarding Blight budget,

Land Matters 04/25/14|KJH assumptions, available funding, and costs within Plan of Adjustment projections 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Blight and Surplus Corresponded via e-mail with J. Addison (CM) regarding changes in Blight funding

Land Matters 04/25/14|KJH within Plan of Adjustment projections, updated model, and coordination with E&Y 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Blight and Surplus Followed-up, via-e-mail, with S.Mays (EMO) regarding Blight budget and

Land Matters 04/25/14|KJH assumptions, including distribution of files for review 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Blight and Surplus

Land Matters 04/25/14|KJH Updated Blight analyses to reflect changes in Plan of Adjustment projections 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Blight and Surplus Participated in meeting with K. Hand (CM) regarding Blight initiative, land strategy,

Land Matters 04/25/14| MCW and demolition related to business case for Quality of Life loan 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Blight and Surplus Follow-up email correspondence with B. Farkas (Demolition) regarding land

Land Matters 04/25/14|MCW strategy and demolition related to business case for Quality of Life loan 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Blight and Surplus Meeting with M. Smiley (Mayor's) and K. Hand (CM) regarding blight questions

Land Matters 04/28/14|CMG from Mayor and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Blight and Surplus Reviewed and responded to e-mail correspondence with S.Mays (EMO) regarding

Land Matters 04/28/14|KJH Blight meeting logistics, agenda, and schedule 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Prepared for meeting with Blight Task Force representatives (D. Dansby, E.Ward-

Blight and Surplus Gerson, S.0gden, and L.Trudeau) with S.Mays (EMO) regarding Blight funding,

Land Matters 04/28/14|KJH requirements, business case, demolition costs, strategy, and timeline 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Participated in meeting with Blight Task Force representatives (D.Dansby, E.Ward-

Blight and Surplus Gerson, S.0gden, and L.Trudeau) with S.Mays (EMO) regarding Blight funding,

Land Matters 04/28/14|KJH requirements, business case, demolition costs, strategy, and timeline 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

Blight and Surplus Met with M. Smiley (Mayor's Office) with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Blight

Land Matters 04/28/14 |KJH questions, Mayor's Office initiatives, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Buildings and Safety Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) regarding methodology for activity based

Department Matters 04/02/14|CMG costing analysis 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Review of methodology previously used , an activity based

Buildings and Safety costing analysis, that will be the basis for performing the activity based costing

Department Matters 04/02/14|MCW analysis and result in setting the new fee schedule 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Buildings and Safety Updated active benefits and general fund repayment information for department in

Department Matters 04/02/14|MCW the restructuring/reinvestment model related to the Plan of Adjustment 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters 04/02/14| MCW Provided updates on status of restructuring projects for department 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Participated in meeting with J. Stewart (Impact) regarding AR collection effort

Buildings and Safety reporting documents, tracking reports, payment posting, collections management

Department Matters 04/02/14\ MCW transition, and next initiatives 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Buildings and Safety Teleconference with C. Gannon (CM) regarding methodology for activity based

Department Matters 04/02/14|MCW costing analysis 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Review of methodology previously used , an activity based

Buildings and Safety costing analysis, that will be the basis for performing the activity based costing

Department Matters 04/03/14|MCW analysis and result in setting the new fee schedule 1.70 | 275.00 467.50

Buildings and Safety Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Department Matters 04/03/14|MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Updated active benefits and inflation factors for department in the

Buildings and Safety restructuring/reinvestment model related to the Plan of Adjustment with newest

Department Matters 04/03/14|MCW information received from E&Y 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters 04/03/14|MCW Began building activity based costing analysis for fee schedule model template 1.90 | 275.00 522.50

Buildings and Safety Meeting with M. Walsh (CM) to discuss and provide guidance on BSEED fee

Department Matters 04/04/14|CMG study, contractor work plan, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Buildings and Safety Continued building model that will be used to perform activity based cost analysis

Department Matters 04/04/14 MCW for the purpose of setting a new fee schedule 2.30 | 275.00 632.50

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters | 04/04/14|MCW Inserted current Fee Schedule into model template 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Buildings and Safety Input training costs, capital expenditures, assumptions and comments for the

Department Matters 04/04/14 MCW restructuring/reinvestment projections 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Buildings and Safety Meeting with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss and receive guidance on BSEED fee

Department Matters 04/04/14| MCW study, contractor work plan, and next steps 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with M. Walsh (CM) regarding department training costs,

Department Matters 04/05/14 | CMG capital expenditures, IT purchases, and labor onboarding 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
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Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding department training costs,

Department Matters 04/05/14|MCW capital expenditures, IT purchases, and labor onboarding 0.90 | 275.00 247.50

Buildings and Safety Input department training costs, capital expenditures, IT purchases, collection rate

Department Matters 04/05/14|MCW and labor onboarding assumptions for the restructuring/reinvestment projections 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters | 04/05/14|MCW Continued building activity based costing analysis for fee schedule model template 1.70 | 275.00 467.50

Buildings and Safety Narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

Department Matters 04/06/14|MCW Adjustment 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Continued updating department training costs, capital expenditures, IT purchases,

Buildings and Safety collection rate and labor onboarding assumptions for the

Department Matters 04/06/14|MCW restructuring/reinvestment projections related to Plan of Adjustment 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Buildings and Safety Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) regarding changes to department training

Department Matters 04/07/14|CMG costs, capital expenditures, IT purchases, and labor onboarding 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with J. Stewart (Impact) regarding collections activity,

Department Matters 04/07/14|MCW transfer of collections management, and department initiatives 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Buildings and Safety Teleconference with C. Gannon (CM) regarding changes to department training

Department Matters 04/07/14|MCW costs, capital expenditures, IT purchases, and labor onboarding 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Updated department training costs, capital expenditures, IT purchases, collection

Buildings and Safety rate and labor onboarding assumptions for the restructuring/reinvestment

Department Matters 04/07/14 MCW projections based on discussion with C. Gannon (CM) 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) regarding meeting with J. Stewart (Impact),

Buildings and Safety restructuring initiatives, collections, and next steps with Law Department's pursuit

Department Matters 04/08/14|CMG of past due receivables 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Buildings and Safety Correspondence with Impact regarding onboard and off boarding of Impact

Department Matters 04/08/14|CMG personnel 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with A. Tonon (Department of Neighborhoods) regarding

Department Matters 04/08/14|MCW customer service improvement and upcoming customer service seminar 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Participated in meeting with J. Stewart (Impact) regarding department

Buildings and Safety restructuring initiatives, received updates on collections, and discussion on next

Department Matters 04/08/14\ MCW steps with Law Department's pursuit of past due receivables 1.70 | 275.00 467.50
Teleconference with C. Gannon (CM) regarding meeting with J. Stewart (Impact),

Buildings and Safety restructuring initiatives, collections, and next steps with Law Department's pursuit

Department Matters 04/08/14|MCW of past due receivables 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Buildings and Safety Reviewed BSEED POA restructuring initiative summary and provided guidance to

Department Matters 04/09/14 | CMG W. Walsh regarding necessary updates 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) regarding necessary changes to be made to

Buildings and Safety department restructuring/reinvestment projection related to collections, labor, and

Department Matters 04/09/14|CMG repayment of general fund debt by enterprise fund 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Buildings and Safety Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) regarding risks/opportunities related to Plan

Department Matters 04/09/14 |CMG of Adjustment for department 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Teleconference with C. Gannon (CM) regarding necessary changes to be made to

Buildings and Safety department restructuring/reinvestment projection related to collections, labor, and

Department Matters 04/09/14 | MCW repayment of general fund debt by enterprise fund 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Buildings and Safety Updated collections, labor, and repayment of general fund debt by enterprise fund

Department Matters 04/09/14|MCW in restructuring/reinvestment projection related to the Plan of Adjustment 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters 04/09/14|MCW Discussed enterprise fund baseline projection with S. Sarna (EY) 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Buildings and Safety Updated enterprise fund baseline projection based on conversation with S. Sarna

Department Matters | 04/09/14 | MCW (EY) 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Buildings and Safety Provided guidance through email correspondence with M. Wash (CM) regarding

Department Matters 04/10/14|CMG Service Delivery Alternatives updates for EM and Mayor meeting 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Buildings and Safety Reviewed C. Gannon (CM) comments regarding Service Delivery Alternatives

Department Matters 04/10/14|MCW document for meeting with Mayor 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Buildings and Safety Updated risks and opportunities analysis for department related to Mayor's Office

Department Matters 04/10/14| MCW strategy review meeting 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters | 04/14/14|MCW Updated monthly enterprise fund financials 0.90 | 275.00 247.50

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters 04/14/14|MCW Consolidated monthly enterprise fund financials for Administration and Operations 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with D. Robinson (Budget) regarding administration and

Department Matters 04/14/14 \ MCW operations cost centers 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with A. Tonon (Department of Neighborhoods) regarding

Department Matters | 04/14/14|MCW customer service improvement and customer service seminar 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
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Buildings and Safety Reviewed customer service seminar metrics produced by A. Tonon (Department

Department Matters 04/14/14\ MCW of Neighborhoods) for the purpose of providing insight into program changes 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters 04/15/14|CMG Correspondence with Impact regarding additional financial resources for BSEED 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Buildings and Safety Meeting with M. Farr (City) regarding BSEED restructuring impediments, project

Department Matters 04/16/14|CMG plan, potential solutions to impediments, and next steps 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Meeting with J. Stewart (Impact) and partial participation of M. Walsh (CM)

Buildings and Safety regarding transfer of responsibilities, additional restructuring initiatives to add to

Department Matters 04/16/14|CMG assessment, collection process, and other open items 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Partially participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) and J. Stewart (Impact)

Buildings and Safety regarding transfer of responsibilities, additional restructuring initiatives to add to

Department Matters 04/16/14|MCW assessment, collections progress, and other open items 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Buildings and Safety Meeting with G. Giannotti (BSEED) and M. Walsh (CM) regarding department

Department Matters 04/17/14|CMG restructuring initiatives, restructuring project plan, and next steps 2.50 | 425.00 1,062.50

Buildings and Safety

Department Matters 04/17/14|CMG Reviewed and commented on BSEED revenue collections report 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Buildings and Safety Participated in weekly meeting with C. Gannon (CM) and G. Giannotti (BSEED)

Department Matters 04/17/14|MCW regarding department restructuring initiatives and next steps 2.50 | 275.00 687.50

Buildings and Safety Meeting with M. Walsh regarding updates to restructuring plan, new initiatives,

Department Matters 04/18/14|CMG and next steps 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding updates to restructuring

Department Matters 04/18/14|MCW plan, new restructuring initiatives, and next steps 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Buildings and Safety Analyzed Manager | position within the department related to responses from

Department Matters 04/20/14|MCW employee surveys Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Buildings and Safety Analyzed General Manager position within the department related to responses

Department Matters 04/20/14|MCW from employee surveys Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Performed review and analysis of BSEED contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This

Buildings and Safety is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI Examiner. 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Continued analysis of General Manager position within the department related to

Buildings and Safety responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW reorganization/restructuring 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

Buildings and Safety Analyzed Principal Accountant position within the department related to responses

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW from employee surveys Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Analyzed Administrative Supervisor position within the department related to

Buildings and Safety responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Department Matters 04/21/14| MCW reorganization/restructuring 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Analyzed Administrative Assistant position within the department related to

Buildings and Safety responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Department Matters 04/21/14\ MCW reorganization/restructuring 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Analyzed Administrative Assistant Il position within the department related to

Buildings and Safety responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW reorganization/restructuring 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Analyzed Office Management Assistant position within the department related to

Buildings and Safety responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Department Matters 04/21/14 MCW reorganization/restructuring 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Buildings and Safety Analyzed Office Assistant Ill position within the department related to responses

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW from employee surveys Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 0.90 | 275.00 247.50

Buildings and Safety Analyzed Senior Clerk position within the department related to responses from

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW employee surveys Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.00 | 275.00 275.00
Analyzed Revenue Collection Specialist position within the department related to

Buildings and Safety responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW reorganization/restructuring 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Buildings and Safety Meeting with M. Walsh (CM) to discuss BSEED restructuring next steps,

Department Matters 04/22/14|CMG discussed fee statement, IT system business case, and other restructuring items 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Buildings and Safety Review of Dangerous Buildings labor costs and compared to POA enterprise fund

Department Matters 04/22/14|CMG amounts 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding department restructuring

Buildings and Safety and next steps related to fee study, strategic planning, and execution of planned

Department Matters 04/22/14\ MCW initiatives 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Reviewed BSEED FY15 budget request and FY 13 actuals for the purpose of

Buildings and Safety creating a summary cost document to provide Planning and Development related

Department Matters 04/22/14|MCW to grant distribution 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
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Buildings and Safety Teleconference with A. Anyanwu (BSEED) regarding dangerous buildings

Department Matters 04/22/14|MCW administration budget 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding dangerous buildings

Buildings and Safety administration cost summary and document needed for Planning and

Department Matters 04/22/14 \ MCW Development related to grant distribution 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Buildings and Safety Created creating a summary cost document to provide Planning and Development

Department Matters 04/22/14|MCW related to grant distribution for FY15 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Buildings and Safety Updated summary cost document to provide to Planning and Development based

Department Matters 04/22/14\ MCW on comments received from C. Gannon (CM) 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Buildings and Safety Participated in meeting with A. Anyanwu (BSEED) regarding Quality of Life

Department Matters 04/23/14| MCW business case template and necessary steps for requisition 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Buildings and Safety Teleconference with B. Ellison (PDD) regarding BSEED IT reinvestment, business

Department Matters 04/24/14|CMG case development and next steps 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Buildings and Safety Meeting with C. Beckham (Mayor's) to discuss BSEED personnel, project plan,

Department Matters 04/24/14|CMG restructuring initiatives and next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Buildings and Safety Assembled Quality of Life Business Case and budget package for department for

Department Matters 04/24/14|MCW the purpose of soliciting of Quality of Life funding for projects 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Buildings and Safety Provided update to interrogatory request from Jones Day pertaining to collection

Department Matters 04/28/14| MCW activity within the City since January 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Updated active benefits for department in the restructuring/reinvestment model

City Clerk 04/02/14|MCW related to the Plan of Adjustment with information received from E&Y 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Updated active benefits and inflation factors for department in the
restructuring/reinvestment model related to the Plan of Adjustment with newest

City Clerk 04/03/14|MCW information received from E&Y 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Input training costs, assumptions and comments for the restructuring/reinvestment

City Clerk 04/04/14|MCW projections related to Plan of Adjustment 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Meeting with C. Walsh (CM) regarding department training costs labor onboarding

City Clerk 04/05/14|CMG and additional expenses 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Participated in meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding department training costs

City Clerk 04/05/14| MCW labor onboarding and additional expenses 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

City Clerk 04/06/14| MCW Adjustment 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Updated wage increases and benefit rates in restructuring/reinvestment projection

City Clerk 04/13/14|MCW related to Plan of Adjustment 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

City Clerk 04/23/14| MCW department 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Adjust BZA restructuring schedules to reflect revised salary and labor benefit

City Council 04/02/14|WPJ assumptions per EY for POA 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

City Council 04/03/14|DMI Performed revisions to City Council POA regarding deferrals for revised POA 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

City Council 04/03/14| MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

City Council 04/06/14|MCW Adjustment 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Revised POA 10-year projections based on updated assumptions received from
E&Y to be included in Second Amended Disclosure Statement, as it relates to City

City Council 04/13/14|DMI Council 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Updated wage increases and benefit rates in restructuring/reinvestment projection

City Council 04/13/14|MCW related to Plan of Adjustment 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

City Council 04/23/14| MCW department 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Participated in call with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss personnel identified to transfer
from City Planning Commission and Historic Designation Advisory Board to

City Council 04/24/14|DMI Planning and Development Dept 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Email correspondence with C. Gannon (CM) regarding personnel identified to

City Council 04/24/14|DMI transfer from CPC and HDAB to PDD 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Provided updates on restructuring initiatives for Airport, per request from J. Hill

Matters 04/02/14 | DMI (CFO) 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Performed updates and revisions to Airport Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,

Matters 04/02/14|DMI based on revised benefit information received from EY 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Performed updates and revisions to Airport Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,

Matters 04/03/14 | DMI based on revised benefit information received from EY on 4/3 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
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Coleman A. Young Reviewed and commented on revised and updated Airport restructuring and

International Airport reinvestment initiatives overlay for Plan of Adjustment projections, reflecting

Matters 04/03/14|KJH updated wage and fringe assumptions 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

Matters 04/06/14|MCW Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Participated in call with K. Hand (CM) to discuss necessary deferrals regarding

Matters 04/08/14|DMI Airport Plan of Adjustment projections 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Coleman A. Young

International Airport

Matters 04/08/14|DMI Performed updates to Airport Plan of Adjustment 10-year projections 0.90 | 275.00 247.50

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Participated in telephone conference with D. lafrate (CM) regarding Airport

Matters 04/08/14|KJH restructuring and reinvestment POA projections and required deferrals 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Reviewed and provided comments on updated Airport restructuring and

Matters 04/08/14 |KJH reinvestment POA projections 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Reviewed updated restructuring and reinvestment initiative projections for Airport

Matters 04/11/14|KJH reflecting revised wage, pension, and benefit assumptions 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Coleman A. Young Revised POA 10-year projections based on updated assumptions received from

International Airport E&Y to be included in Second Amended Disclosure Statement, as it relates to

Matters 04/13/14 | DMI Airport 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Prepared summary of Airport Department related to responses from employee

Matters 04/16/14|DMI surveys 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Coleman A. Young

International Airport Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

Matters 04/23/14\ MCW department 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Debt and Balance

Sheet Matters 04/01/14|CMM 0.30 | 495.00 148.50

Debt and Balance

Sheet Matters 04/01/14|GMK Review and analysis of Quality of Life restructuring project break-out summary 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Debt and Balance Communications with CFO, Finance Director, and other Finance Department

Sheet Matters 04/01/14|GMK representatives regarding Quality of Life restructuring project break-out summary 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Debt and Balance Review and analysis of actual restructuring spending YTD in preparation for

Sheet Matters 04/01/14 | GMK Quality of Life Loan hearing 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Debt and Balance Review and analysis of objections and other legal documents in preparation for

Sheet Matters 04/01/14|GMK Quality of Life Loan hearing 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Debt and Balance Review and analysis of Quality of Life Loan restructuring project summary and

Sheet Matters 04/01/14|GMK supporting details in preparation for Quality of Life Loan hearing 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Debt and Balance

Sheet Matters 04/01/14|GMK 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Debt and Balance

Sheet Matters 04/02/14|CMM 0.20 | 495.00 99.00
Participation in conference call with J. Addison (CM), Finance Director, Deputy

Debt and Balance Treasurer, E&Y, JD, and Miller Canfield regarding next steps for obtaining Quality

Sheet Matters 04/03/14 | GMK of Life loan proceeds 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Preparation for conference call with J. Addison (CM), Finance Director, Deputy

Debt and Balance Treasurer, E&Y, JD, and Miller Canfield regarding next steps for obtaining Quality

Sheet Matters 04/03/14 | GMK of Life loan proceeds 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Debt and Balance

Sheet Matters 04/03/14|GMK Review and analysis of updated Quality of Life Loan Restructuring Project detail 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Debt and Balance Email communications with J. Addison (CM) regarding updated Quality of Life

Sheet Matters 04/03/14 | GMK Loan Restructuring Project detail 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Debt and Balance Participation in meeting with Mayor Deputy Chief of Staff regarding quality of Life

Sheet Matters 04/03/14| GMK restructuring projects and process for obtaining funds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Debt and Balance

Sheet Matters 04/04/14|GMK 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Debt and Balance Discussion with Mayor Deputy Chief of Staff regarding Quality of Life Loan

Sheet Matters 04/04/14| GMK detailed restructuring project listing 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Debt and Balance Discussion with COO regarding "shovel ready" restructuring projects for QOL

Sheet Matters 04/08/14 | GMK proceeds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
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Debt and Balance Email communications with C. Moore (CM), K. Hand (CM), and C. Gannon (CM)
Sheet Matters 04/10/14 | GMK regarding Quality of Life proceed status 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Debt and Balance Email communications with K. Hand (CM) and C. Gannon (CM) regarding break-
Sheet Matters 04/10/14|GMK out of Quality of Life restructuring project spending 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Debt and Balance
Sheet Matters 04/10/14|JAA Reviewed Quality of Life financing summary related to financial reporting 0.90 | 345.00 310.50
Debt and Balance Email communications with various representatives of EY, MB, and JD regarding
Sheet Matters 04/17/14|GMK Creditor request on property tax collection system updates/improvements 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Debt and Balance
Sheet Matters 04/24/14| GMK Preparation of bankruptcy summary presentation slides at request of EMO office 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
Debt and Balance
Sheet Matters 04/24/14|GMK Review and analysis of draft Michigan legislature presentation 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Debt and Balance Review and analysis of updated bankruptcy summary presentation slides at
Sheet Matters 04/28/14 | GMK request of EMO office 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Debt and Balance Assigned responsibility (City, CM, and E&Y) to open item list for syndication
Sheet Matters 04/30/14 | GMK materials for Quality of Life Loan 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Debt and Balance Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding request from Jones Day regarding
Sheet Matters 04/30/14|JAA Barclays narrative and income tax data request 1.30 | 345.00 448.50
Debt and Balance
Sheet Matters 04/30/14|JAA 1.70 | 345.00 586.50
Debt and Balance
Sheet Matters 04/30/14|JAA 0.60 | 345.00 207.00
Department of
Administrative Updated active benefits for department in the restructuring/reinvestment model
Hearings 04/02/14| MCW related to the Plan of Adjustment with information received from E&Y 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Department of Updated active benefits and inflation factors for department in the
Administrative restructuring/reinvestment model related to the Plan of Adjustment with newest
Hearings 04/03/14|MCW information received from E&Y 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Department of
Administrative Input training costs, assumptions and comments for the restructuring/reinvestment
Hearings 04/04/14|MCW projections related to Plan of Adjustment 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Department of
Administrative Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of
Hearings 04/06/14| MCW Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Department of
Administrative Input department personal service contract information related to document
Hearings 04/07/14|MCW provided by HR 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Department of
Administrative Email correspondence with M. Walsh (CM) re: Administrative Hearings updated
Hearings 04/08/14 EMP restructuring summary 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Department of
Administrative Email correspondence with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding Administrative Hearings
Hearings 04/08/14 | MCW updated restructuring summary 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Department of
Administrative Updated training costs in restructuring/reinvestment projection related to Plan of
Hearings 04/09/14| MCW Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Department of
Administrative Updated wage increases and benefit rates in restructuring/reinvestment projection
Hearings 04/13/14|MCW related to Plan of Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Department of
Administrative Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for
Hearings 04/22/14 MCW department 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Department of Health
and Wellness
Promotion Matters 04/02/14|EMP Telephone conference with G. Kushiner (CM) re: Herman Keifer demolition costs 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Department of Health
and Wellness Continued to update plan of adjustment consolidating model to account for
Promotion Matters 04/04/14|EMP additional changes due to timing adjustments related to DHWP 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Department of Health
and Wellness Continued to update plan of adjustment consolidating model to account for
Promotion Matters 04/05/14|EMP additional changes due to timing adjustments related to DHWP 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Department of Health
and Wellness Updated summary of outsourcing and privatization for Mayor meeting as it relates
Promotion Matters 04/08/14 EMP to DHWP 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
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Department of Health

and Wellness Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document

Promotion Matters 04/11/14| MCW provided by HR 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Department of Public Revised 10-year financial projections for POA to reflect revised fringe rates

Works Matters 04/02/14|CJS provided by S. Sarna (EY) for DPW 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Department of Public Updated active benefits for department in the restructuring/reinvestment model

Works Matters 04/02/14|MCW related to the Plan of Adjustment with information received from E&Y 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Department of Public Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Works Matters 04/03/14 MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Updated active benefits and inflation factors for department in the

Department of Public restructuring/reinvestment model related to the Plan of Adjustment with newest

Works Matters 04/03/14| MCW information received from E&Y 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Department of Public Input training costs, capital expenditures, assumptions and comments for the

Works Matters 04/05/14 MCW restructuring/reinvestment projections 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Department of Public

Works Matters 04/06/14|MCW Input comments for the restructuring/reinvestment projections 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Department of Public Input department personal service contract information related to document

Works Matters 04/07/14| MCW provided by HR 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Department of Public Reviewed and updated City's master privatization schedule as it relates to DPW

Works Matters 04/09/14|CJS and distributed to GMK (CM) at request of J. Hill (EMO) 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Department of Public Reviewed and confirmed to EMP (CM) revised 10-year POA financial projection

Works Matters 04/09/14|CJS with timing adjustments for DPW for revised Citywide rollup 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Department of Public Reviewed and revised summary of service delivery requirements from GMK (CM)

Works Matters 04/10/14|CJS at request of J. Hill (EMO) as it related to DPW 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Department of Public Correspondence with S. Sarna (EY) regarding solid waste outsourcing cost

Works Matters 04/11/14|CJS analysis 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Department of Public Updated wage increases and benefit rates in restructuring/reinvestment projection

Works Matters 04/13/14|MCW related to Plan of Adjustment 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Department of Public

Works Matters 04/19/14|CJS Reviewed and redacted November fee as required for DPW 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Department of Public Reviewed final draft of Finance directive from M. Jamison (Fin) regarding

Works Matters 04/20/14|CJS application of partial-payments for property taxes 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Prepare summary of Public Works (Solid Waste) finance-function employee

Department of Public responses related to job description questionnaires for Finance Department labor

Works Matters 04/21/14|EAC restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Department of Public Corresponded with L. Duncan (Treasury) regarding Finance directive to affect

Works Matters 04/29/14|CJS payment of solid waste fees 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Department of Email communications with CFO and CMG regarding DDOT capital expenditures

Transportation 04/03/14 | GMK in 10 year projections 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Department of Multiple email communications with JD, CMG, and TAE regarding DDOT grant

Transportation 04/03/14| GMK status 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Department of Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Transportation 04/03/14|MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Detroit Department of Revised and edited10 year restructuring plan of adjustment to account for

Transportation 04/03/14| TAE updated information regarding benefits assumptions as it relates to DDOT plan 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/04/14|CMG Correspondence via e-mail with J. Hill (CFO) regarding POA questions for DDOT 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Department of Email communications with TAE regarding grant status information and DDOT

Transportation 04/04/14| GMK questions on 10 Year reinvestment/reorganization projections 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/04/14| TAE Updated DDOT's Plan of Adjustment for revised timing of initiatives 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Department of E-mail communications with E. Jones, P.Toliver (DDOT) to follow up on data

Transportation 04/05/14 | TAE collection on DDOT buses to support auction RFP 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Department of E-mail communications with P.Toliver (DDOT) to clarify and update DDOT Grant

Transportation 04/05/14| TAE status summary(.2) Updated same based on input received (.3) 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Department of Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

Transportation 04/06/14|MCW Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Detroit Department of Met with G. Brown (COQ) to discuss DDOT Capital and grant funding issues in

Transportation 04/07/14| TAE order to get feedback and direction on resolution of issues 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Department of Reviewed DDOT plan of adjustment changes regarding grant funding assumptions

Transportation 04/07/14| TAE with S. Sarna (E&Y) 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

13-53846-swr

171

Doc 8186-2 Filed 11/05/14 Entered 11/05/14 18:21:50 Page 33 of




I Exhibit A I

City of Detroit, Michigan, Debtor
Chapter 9 Case No. 13-53846
United States Bankruptcy Court
Eastern District of Michigan
Southern Division

Conway MacKenzie - April 2014 Invoice - Detailed Professional Fees

Billing Date of
Category Service [Professional Description Hours Rate Amount

Prepared for Budget and POA review meeting with DDOT management by

Detroit Department of developing comparison of budget and current version of plan of adjustment

Transportation 04/07/14| TAE initiatives 1.80 | 425.00 765.00
Met with DDOT management (D. Dirks, P. Toliver, and A. Jones to discuss,

Detroit Department of review and provide detail understanding of DDOT's Plan of Adjustment initiatives

Transportation 04/07/14| TAE cost, timing, and impact in order to support FY2015 budgeting process 2.20 | 425.00 935.00

Detroit Department of Participated in meting with DDOT Budget team to continue work on development

Transportation 04/08/14| TAE of FY2015 and integration with the DDOT Plan of Adjustments 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/08/14| TAE Meet with E. Jones (DDOT) to review surplus bus auction item detail 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Department of Walked through of DDOT garage with D. Dirks (DDOT) to identify assets

Transportation 04/08/14| TAE available for auction 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/08/14| TAE Met with P. Toliver (DDOT) to discuss potential DTC and DDOT merger analysis 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Department of Review and analysis of updated DDOT 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization

Transportation 04/09/14| GMK Projections 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Detroit Department of Discuss with TAE regarding updated DDOT 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization

Transportation 04/09/14|GMK Projections 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Department of Made substantial revisions to DDOT Plan of adjustments to accommodate for

Transportation 04/09/14| TAE update cost information as a result of union negotiations 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

Detroit Department of Compiled detailed listing of DDOT restructuring initiatives' risk and opportunities

Transportation 04/09/14 | TAE for summary to be provided to Mayor Duggan 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Department of Discussions with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding DDOT POA adjustments and

Transportation 04/09/14 | TAE revisions required 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Department of E-mail communications with P. Toliver, D.Dirks, and E. Jones (DDOT) regarding

Transportation 04/10/14| TAE status of information requirement for surplus DDOT asset items for auction 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Department of Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document

Transportation 04/11/14|MCW provided by HR 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Detroit Department of Made substantial reviews, updates and revisions to amended Disclosure

Transportation 04/13/14| TAE Statement for GSD 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Detroit Department of Made revisions and updates to DDOT's plan of adjustment to incorporate revised

Transportation 04/13/14| TAE labor wage rate and benefits assumptions 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/15/14|EMP Met with T. Eddy (CM) re: DDOT restructuring initiative summary 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
POA review with E. Petrovski to support future revisions, analyzed current plan of

Detroit Department of adjustment's initiatives and status/progress to date and other updates/changes to

Transportation 04/15/14| TAE DDOT in order to assess any POA adjustments that may be necessary 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Department of E-mail communication with J. Ringo, P. Toliver (DDOT) regarding development of

Transportation 04/16/14 | TAE quality of Life loan fund applications 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Department of Multiple email communications with JD regarding Creditor requests for various

Transportation 04/18/14 | GMK DDOT information supporting POA/DS 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Department of Multiple email communications with JD regarding DDOT information request item

Transportation 04/21/14| GMK from Creditor financial advisor group 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/21/14|GMK Discussion with COO regarding potential DDOT outsourcing initiatives 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Department of Research union affiliation for department employees for the purpose of providing

Transportation 04/21/14|MCW information related to service delivery alternatives 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Detroit Department of Prepare summary of DDOT finance-function employee responses related to job

Transportation 04/22/14|EAC description questionnaires for Finance Department labor restructuring plan 2.00 | 130.00 260.00

Detroit Department of Completed summary of DDOT finance-function employee responses related to job

Transportation 04/22/14|EAC description questionnaires for Finance Department labor restructuring plan 1.00 | 130.00 130.00

Detroit Department of Discussion with Mayor Lean team regarding previously produced DDOT reports

Transportation 04/22/14|GMK and DDOT issues 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Email communications with Budget Director, other Budget representatives, and

Detroit Department of TAE regarding DDOT 10 Yr. projections inclusive of restructuring/reinvestment

Transportation 04/22/14| GMK initiatives 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Researched new information received from Human Resources and Labor

Detroit Department of Relations pertaining to union affiliation for department employees for the purpose

Transportation 04/23/14| MCW of providing information related to service delivery alternatives 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Detroit Department of E-mail communication with R. Presnell (Director of Strategic Planning) regarding

Transportation 04/25/14| TAE development of DDOT's quality of Life loan fund applications 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Department of Reviewed amended POA and Disclosure statement submissions for accuracy

Transportation 04/25/14| TAE pertaining to DDOT initiatives, cost impact and comments 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
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Detroit Department of E-mail communication with D. Dirks, P. Toliver (DDOT) regarding development of

Transportation 04/25/14 | TAE quality of Life loan fund applications 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Department of Prepared for meeting with DDOT management regarding application for quality of

Transportation 04/28/14| TAE life funds included in the Plan of Adjustment 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Participated in meeting with D. Dirks, A. Jones, S. EImer (DDOT management) to

Detroit Department of develop plans and action tasks for building business case detail in order to secure

Transportation 04/28/14| TAE quality of life funds included in the Plan of Adjustment 2.30 | 425.00 977.50

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/29/14|EMP Reviewed revised fringe rate information for DDOT provided by E&Y 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Department of

Transportation 04/29/14 | GMK Email communications with TAE and EMP regarding DDOT revised fringe rates 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Department of Reviewed and commented on summary of city wide collection activities summary

Transportation 04/29/14 | TAE as related to DDOT 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/01/14|EMP Prepared DFD preventative maintenance cost budget 1.40 | 345.00 483.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/01/14|EMP Prepared DFD training cost budget and timeline 1.30 | 345.00 448.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters | 04/01/14 | EMP 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire Telephone conference with T. Eddy (CM) re: preparation for emergency

Department Matters 04/01/14 EMP mechanics RFP meeting 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire Met with C. Dougherty (Fire), M. Butler, D. Bryant (Purchasing) re: Fire apparatus

Department Matters 04/01/14 | EMP RFQ plans and revisions required 1.70 | 345.00 586.50

Detroit Fire Met with C. Dougherty, S. Larkins (Fire), Y. Gaines, D. Bryant (Purchasing) re:

Department Matters 04/01/14 EMP Fire training RFP plans and revisions required 1.90 | 345.00 655.50

Detroit Fire Revised Fire department plan of adjustment forecast to account for labor

Department Matters 04/01/14 | EMP negotiation adjustments 2.60 | 345.00 897.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/01/14|EMP Corresponded via e-mail with E. Jenkins (Fire) re: EMS vehicles specifications 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with E. Jenkins, N. Louie, J. King (Fire) re: facility repair

Department Matters 04/01/14|EMP contract update 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/01/14|KJH 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Fire Reviewed and provided comments to updated Fire restructuring and reinvestment

Department Matters 04/01/14|KJH POA forecast reflecting labor adjustments resulting from negotiations 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

Detroit Fire Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to E. Petrovski (CM) regarding updated

Department Matters 04/01/14|KJH Fire restructuring and reinvestment POA forecast 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Fire Telephone conference with E. Petrovski (CM) re: preparation for emergency

Department Matters 04/01/14| TAE mechanics RFP meeting 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Fire Telephone conference with D. Bryant (Purchasing) re: Fire EMS vehicle

Department Matters 04/02/14|EMP purchases update 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/02/14|EMP Corresponded via e-mail with S. Larkins (Fire) re: EMS vehicles specifications 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Revised Fire department plan of adjustment forecast to account for labor

Department Matters 04/02/14 EMP negotiation adjustments 2.30 | 345.00 793.50

Detroit Fire Met with C. Dougherty (Fire), J. Anderson (GSD), J. Brown (CM Contractor) re:

Department Matters 04/02/14 | EMP Fire emergency mechanic RFP 2.10 | 345.00 724.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/02/14|JAA Call with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding updated DFD overlay 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/02/14|KJH 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

Detroit Fire Revised Fire department plan of adjustment forecast to account for labor

Department Matters 04/03/14 EMP negotiation adjustments 1.70 | 345.00 586.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/03/14 | EMP Reviewed and updated Fire training RFP 1.40 | 345.00 483.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/03/14 EMP Updated Fire vehicle purchase plan summary 1.70 | 345.00 586.50
Reviewed and commented on revised and updated Fire restructuring and

Detroit Fire reinvestment initiatives overlay for Plan of Adjustment projections, reflecting

Department Matters 04/03/14|KJH updated wage and fringe assumptions 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Fire Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Department Matters 04/03/14| MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
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Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with O. Watkins, E. Jenkins (Fire) re: document
Department Matters 04/04/14 | EMP management system participation 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/04/14|EMP Met with Y. Gaines (Purchasing) re: revised Fire training RFP 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/04/14 | EMP Continued to update Fire vehicle purchase plan summary 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
Detroit Fire Continued to update plan of adjustment consolidating model to account for
Department Matters | 04/04/14|EMP additional changes due to timing adjustments related to Fire department 0.60 | 345.00 207.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/04/14|EMP Telephone conference with J. Berlin (Fire) re: revised Fire training RFP 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Detroit Fire Revised Fire department plan of adjustment forecast to account for labor
Department Matters 04/04/14 EMP negotiation and timing adjustments 3.30 | 345.00 1,138.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/05/14|EMP Reviewed revised Fire training RFP 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Detroit Fire Continued to update plan of adjustment consolidating model to account for
Department Matters | 04/05/14|EMP additional changes due to timing adjustments related to Fire department 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Detroit Fire Input comments for the restructuring/reinvestment projections related to the Fire
Department Matters 04/06/14|MCW Department 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/07/14 EMP Prepared presentation for EMS quarterly department overview 3.10 | 345.00 1,069.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/07/14 | EMP Met with C. Dougherty (Fire) re: updated training RFP 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Detroit Fire Met with K. Hand (CM) to review presentation for EMS quarterly department
Department Matters 04/07/14 EMP overview 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/07/14|EMP Partial participation in EMS quarterly department meeting 2.60 | 345.00 897.00
Detroit Fire Met with E. Jenkins (Fire) and K. Hand (CM) to discuss recruiting class updates,
Department Matters 04/07/14 EMP union negotiations and training RFP 0.60 | 345.00 207.00
Detroit Fire Met with S. Zack (Fire) re: hiring benchmarking update, emergency mechanic
Department Matters | 04/07/14|EMP labor issues and labor negotiation considerations 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/07/14|KJH Reviewed and updated CM overview for EMS quarterly staff meeting 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Detroit Fire Met with E. Petrovski (CM) to review and finalize CM overview for EMS quarterly
Department Matters 04/07/14|KJH staff meeting 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/07/14|KJH Prepared for EMS quarterly staff meeting 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/07/14|KJH Participated in EMS division quarterly staff meeting 3.10 | 425.00 1,317.50
Detroit Fire Met with J.Barney (EMS) and J. Barr (POAM) regarding proposed changes to
Department Matters 04/07/14|KJH EMS staffing, coverage area, and ambulance purchases 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Fire Prepared for Fire update meeting with E. Jenkins (Fire) regarding recruiting, union
Department Matters 04/07/14|KJH negotiations, and training 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Fire Met with E. Jenkins (Fire) and E. Petrovski (CM) regarding Fire update, recruiting,
Department Matters 04/07/14|KJH union negotiations, and training RFP 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/07/14|MCW 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Detroit Fire Updated summary of outsourcing and privatization for Mayor meeting as it relates
Department Matters 04/08/14 | EMP to Fire department 1.30 | 345.00 448.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/08/14|EMP Met with T. Eddy (CM) to discuss emergency mechanic RFP plan 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
Prepared for meeting with POAM representatives (B. Birdseye, J.Barney, J. Barr)
regarding Fire department restructuring and reinvestment initiatives, proposed
Detroit Fire EMS staffing changes, proposed EMS geographic response plans, proposed
Department Matters 04/08/14|KJH department integration, leadership changes, and bankruptcy timeline 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Participated in meeting with POAM representatives (B. Birdseye, J.Barney, J.
Barr) regarding Fire department restructuring and reinvestment initiatives,
Detroit Fire proposed EMS staffing changes, proposed EMS geographic response plans,
Department Matters 04/08/14|KJH proposed department integration, leadership changes, and bankruptcy timeline 3.60 | 425.00 1,530.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/08/14| TAE Met with E. Petrovski (CM) to discuss emergency mechanic RFP plan 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
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Reviewed and commented on updated Fire labor assumptions and costs

Detroit Fire associated with restructuring and reinvestment initiative overlay for Plan of

Department Matters 04/09/14|KJH Adjustment projections 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Detroit Fire Reviewed and provided comments to summary of Fire department service delivery

Department Matters | 04/09/14 |KJH alternatives 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Developed analysis of Fire Fighter personnel for grant reimbursement to assist K.

Detroit Fire Russell (Fire) with submitting personnel requirements for SAFER grant

Department Matters 04/10/14|EMP reimbursement 1.60 | 345.00 552.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters | 04/10/14|EMP Met with K. Hand (CM) re: Fire department hiring and recruiting benchmarking 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire Met with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding Fire department benchmarking for recruiting,

Department Matters 04/10/14|KJH testing, requirements, and training 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Fire Reviewed updated restructuring and reinvestment initiative projections for Fire

Department Matters 04/11/14|KJH reflecting revised wage, pension, and benefit assumptions 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Fire Reviewed and updated outsourcing summary sheet for union impact Fire

Department Matters 04/12/14|EMP department changes 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Updated analysis of Fire Fighter personnel to assist K. Russell (Fire) with

Department Matters | 04/14/14|EMP submitting personnel requirements for SAFER grant reimbursement 3.60 | 345.00 1,242.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/14/14|EMP Prepared Fire department hiring benchmarking question list 2.90 | 345.00 1,000.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with K. Hand (CM) re: Fire department hiring

Department Matters 04/14/14 EMP benchmarking question list 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/14/14 | EMP Prepared Fire department hiring benchmarking target comparable City list 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with E. Jenkins, S. Zack (Fire) re: Fire department hiring

Department Matters 04/14/14 EMP benchmarking question list 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/14/14|KJH Reviewed and commented on draft Fire recruiting and training questionnaire 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

Detroit Fire Reviewed and replied to e-mail correspondence with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding

Department Matters 04/14/14|KJH Fire recruiting and training questionnaire 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Fire Reviewed and commented on suggested peer municipalities for Fire recruiting and

Department Matters 04/14/14|KJH training questionnaire 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Reviewed and commented on draft request from Fire Commissioner requesting

Detroit Fire peer municipalities participation and completion of recruiting and training

Department Matters 04/14/14|KJH questionnaire 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Reviewed and replied to e-mail correspondence with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding

Detroit Fire Fire recruiting and training survey process, timeline, suggested peer

Department Matters 04/14/14|KJH municipalities, and draft request for distribution to peer municipalities 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/15/14 EMP Participated in Fire Department month staffing meeting 2.20 | 345.00 759.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/15/14 | EMP Met with C. Dougherty (Fire) re: apparatus purchase plan and RFQ next steps 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Detroit Fire Teleconferenced with C. Dougherty (Fire), J. Anderson (GSD) re: apparatus

Department Matters 04/15/14 EMP budget and PO for contract 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire Met with C. Dougherty, D. Brawley, E. Jenkins (Fire) re: apparatus purchase plan

Department Matters 04/15/14|EMP and budget 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Prepared summary of outsourced items included in Fire department plan of

Department Matters 04/15/14 EMP adjustment for E&Y request 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/15/14 | EMP Continued to update Fire apparatus vehicle purchase quantity summary report 1.40 | 345.00 483.00

Detroit Fire Continued to update analysis of Fire Fighter personnel to assist K. Russell (Fire)

Department Matters 04/16/14|EMP with submitting personnel requirements for SAFER grant reimbursement 3.60 | 345.00 1,242.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/16/14 | EMP Continued to update Fire apparatus vehicle purchase quantity summary report 2.80 | 345.00 966.00

Detroit Fire Met with K. Russell (Fire) re: updated analysis of Fire Fighter personnel for grant

Department Matters 04/16/14|EMP reimbursement 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Met with C. Dougherty (Fire) re: Fire apparatus vehicle purchase quantity

Department Matters 04/16/14 | EMP summary report 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/16/14|EMP Met with N. Louie (Fire) re: Fire maintenance and repair budget 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with K. Haves (HR) re: separated Fire Fighter personnel

Department Matters 04/16/14 | EMP information required for grant reimbursement 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
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Detroit Fire Continued to update analysis of Fire Fighter personnel to assist K. Russell (Fire)

Department Matters 04/17/14|EMP with submitting personnel requirements for SAFER grant reimbursement 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with D. Fredrick (Fire) re: separated Fire Fighter

Department Matters 04/17/14|EMP personnel information required for grant reimbursement 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Updated fire budget cost center information to include fire station level information

Department Matters 04/17/14|EMP for each cost center 2.60 | 345.00 897.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/17/14|EMP Met with D. Brawley (Fire) re: Fire budget cost center information 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Met with D. Fredrick (Fire) re: Fire department personnel database use, update

Department Matters 04/17/14|EMP process and needs for improvement and process improvement 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/17/14 EMP Reviewed Fire training RFP questions 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with S. Zack and K. Jones (Fire) re: Fire department

Department Matters 04/17/14|EMP personnel database use 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Reviewed business case template for funding requests for requests related to Fire

Department Matters 04/17/14 EMP department 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/17/14|EMP Met with J. Berlin (Fire) re: new role and current responsibilities 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Prepared summary of Fire finance-function employee responses related to job

Department Matters 04/18/14|EAC description questionnaires for Finance Department labor restructuring plan 2.00 | 130.00 260.00

Detroit Fire Continued to update fire budget cost center information to include fire station level

Department Matters 04/18/14|EMP information for each cost center 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Detroit Fire Prepared summary of Fire finance-function employee responses related to job

Department Matters 04/21/14|EAC description questionnaires for Finance Department labor restructuring plan 1.50 | 130.00 195.00

Detroit Fire Telephone conference with D. Bryant (Purchasing) re: fire department participation

Department Matters | 04/21/14|EMP in document management RFP and EMS vehicle requisition 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Detroit Fire Telephone conference with K. Hand (CM) re: fire department unions affected by

Department Matters 04/21/14 EMP outsourcing 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with G. Malhotra and J. Santambro (E&Y) re: fire fighter

Department Matters 04/21/14 | EMP salary benchmarking information request 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to E. Jenkins (Fire) regarding weekly

Department Matters 04/21/14|KJH update meeting, schedule, and work plan 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with C. Dougherty, O. Gregory, S. Larkins (Fire) re:

Department Matters 04/22/14 EMP training RFP question follow up 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/22/14 | EMP Corresponded via e-mail with O. Gregory (Fire) re: training facility meeting 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with D. Brawley, E. Jenkins, K. Russell, C. Dougherty

Department Matters | 04/22/14|EMP (Fire) re: apparatus repair and purchase budget encumbrance next steps 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Telephone conference with J. Santambro (E&Y) re: fire fighter salary

Department Matters 04/22/14 | EMP benchmarking follow up questions 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/22/14 EMP Reviewed and updated apparatus repair and purchase budget 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire Met with K. Hand (CM) to discuss Fire department RFQ and RFP status updates

Department Matters 04/22/14 | EMP and meeting requests 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters | 04/22/14|EMP Met with R. Presnell (EMO) re: DFD and DPD salary benchmarking information 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/22/14|EMP Updated format of DFD salary benchmarking information 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Reviewed Fire training RFP question responses by C. Dougherty and S. Larkins

Department Matters 04/22/14|EMP (Fire) and provided comments 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with D. Brawley and K. Russell (Fire) re: SAFER grant

Department Matters 04/22/14|EMP reimbursement process 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/22/14 EMP Continued to update Fire apparatus vehicle purchase quantity summary report 1.30 | 345.00 448.50
Met with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding Fire and EMS training, EMS ride alongs,

Detroit Fire ambulance purchases, budget preparation, and business case development

Department Matters 04/22/14|KJH required for quality of life funding 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters | 04/22/14|MCW Updated revenue restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for department 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

Detroit Fire Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

Department Matters 04/22/14|MCW department 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
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Detroit Fire Reviewed Fire department asset listing summary for accuracy to fulfil request by

Department Matters 04/23/14|EMP A. Horne (Finance) 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with R. Presnell (EMO) re: salary benchmarking research

Department Matters 04/23/14 EMP sources 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Met with E. Jenkins (Fire) and K. Hand (CM) re: Fire department business case

Detroit Fire preparation, budget adjustments, department plan update, hiring benchmarking

Department Matters 04/23/14|EMP materials and staffing roles and responsibilities 1.60 | 345.00 552.00

Detroit Fire Met with D. Bryant (Purchasing) re: Fire training RFP response to questions and

Department Matters 04/23/14 [ EMP next steps 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with C. Dougherty, O. Gregory, S. Larkins (Fire) D.

Department Matters 04/23/14|EMP Bryant (Purchasing) re: training RFP question follow up items 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Prepared for Fire update meeting with E. Jenkins (Fire), including preparation of

Department Matters 04/23/14 |KJH agenda and topics to be covered 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participated in meeting with E. Jenkins (Fire) and E. Petrovski (CM) regarding
restructuring initiative work plan, budget, development of restructuring and

Detroit Fire reinvestment business cases, recruiting and training, fleet replacement,

Department Matters 04/23/14|KJH benchmarking, training RFP, promotions, and next steps 1.60 | 425.00 680.00

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with S. Zack, K. Jones (Fire) re: personnel database

Department Matters | 04/24/14 | EMP meeting 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with D. Brawley (Fire) re: personnel issues and next

Department Matters 04/24/14|EMP steps 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters | 04/24/14|EMP Corresponded via e-mail with G. Goldstein (Fire) re: weekly meeting scheduling 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Researched new information received from Human Resources and Labor

Detroit Fire Relations pertaining to union affiliation for department employees for the purpose

Department Matters 04/24/14|MCW of providing information related to service delivery alternatives 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters | 04/25/14|EMP Met with J. Berlin (Fire) re: oversight of EMS and changes that are in process 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/25/14 | EMP Met with E. Jenkins (Fire) re: department training plan 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Met with D. Brawley and K. Russell (Fire) re: SAFER grant funding process and

Department Matters 04/25/14 | EMP information requests and budget procedures 1.60 | 345.00 552.00

Detroit Fire Met with K. Kennedy, S. Zack, D. Fredrick (Fire) re: personnel database uses and

Department Matters 04/25/14 | EMP information request and process for HR 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with W. Davis (Risk Management) re: Fire department

Department Matters 04/25/14 [ EMP injury rates and follow up questions 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire

Department Matters 04/25/14 | EMP Reviewed finance department survey responses for Fire department employees 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Detroit Fire Finalized Fire training RFP question responses and sent to Y. Gaines

Department Matters 04/25/14 EMP (Purchasing) for vendor disbursement 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Detroit Fire Met with C. Dougherty (Fire) re: department training estimates and Fire apparatus

Department Matters 04/25/14|EMP maintenance 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with C. Dougherty (Fire), B. Walker (GSD) re: Fire

Department Matters 04/25/14 EMP apparatus maintenance PO 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with D. Bryant (Purchasing) re: ambulance order status

Department Matters 04/25/14|EMP and next steps 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Responded to information request from G. Kushiner (CM) regarding collection

Department Matters 04/28/14 EMP activity improvements 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Detroit Fire Met with S Larkins (DFD) re: EMS training, recruiting class timing updates, EMS

Department Matters 04/28/14|EMP revenue update and change potential with development of consortium 1.20 | 345.00 414.00

Detroit Fire Met with D. Brawley (DFD) re: ladder truck maintenance budget encumbrances

Department Matters 04/28/14 EMP and budget funding availability 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Corresponded via e-mail with C. Dougherty (DFD), J. Anderson, L. Swole, B. Dick,

Detroit Fire E. Porsche (GSD) re: ladder truck maintenance budget encumbrances and budget

Department Matters 04/28/14|EMP funding availability 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Detroit Fire Teleconferenced with J. Anderson (GSD) re: maintenance budget encumbrances

Department Matters 04/28/14 EMP and budget funding availability 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Detroit Fire Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to E. Jenkins (Fire) and E. Petrovski

Department Matters 04/28/14|KJH (CM) regarding Fire update meeting schedule and agenda 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Fire Email correspondence with M. Rossman, Esq. regarding participation in collective

Department Matters 04/29/14|CMM bargaining session with EMS Supervisors 0.30 | 495.00 148.50

Detroit Fire Reviewed Fire fleet business case draft for accuracy and completeness prior to

Department Matters 04/29/14 | EMP being submitted to Finance for approval 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
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Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14 | EMP Met with D. Bryant (Purchasing) re: ambulance RFQ next steps 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with D. Bryant (Purchasing) and D. Brawley (Fire) re:
Department Matters 04/29/14 EMP ambulance RFQ budgeting next steps 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14 | EMP Met with R. Short and P. Scales (Budget) re: ambulance RFQ budgeting process 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|EMP Corresponded via e-mail with R. Shinske (DFFA) re: Fire medical injury costs 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14 | EMP Reviewed Fire medical injury cost analysis 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|EMP Met with D. Jernyecic (E&Y) re: DFD comparable wage rates 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|EMP 1.00 | 345.00 345.00
Detroit Fire Met with E. Jenkins (Fire) re: Fire business case deliverables, budget
Department Matters 04/29/14|EMP requirements, personnel changes 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with M. Jamison (Finance) re: Fire property tax bill follow
Department Matters 04/29/14 EMP up 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Began to review and provide comments to draft Fire fleet business case write-up,
financial summary, timeline, and constraints for consistency with restructuring and
Detroit Fire reinvestment initiatives, completeness, and adherence to business case template
Department Matters 04/29/14|KJH and guidelines 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|KJH 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|KJH 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|KJH 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|KJH 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/29/14|KJH 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Detroit Fire Reviewed e-mail correspondence with DFFA and E. Petrovski (CM) regarding
Department Matters 04/29/14|KJH injury and workers compensation reports, per information request 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Detroit Fire Continued to review Fire fleet business case draft for accuracy and completeness
Department Matters 04/30/14 | EMP prior to being submitted to Finance for approval 1.90 | 345.00 655.50
Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with A. Horne (Finance) re: Fire property tax bill follow up
Department Matters 04/30/14 EMP and DFD property listing 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Detroit Fire Corresponded via e-mail with B. Jackson (Finance) re: Fire ambulance purchase
Department Matters 04/30/14|EMP process update 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Detroit Fire Met with E. Jenkins (DFD) and K. Hand (CM) re: business plan review and
Department Matters 04/30/14|EMP recommendations, labor negotiations and HR questionnaire 1.60 | 345.00 552.00
Detroit Fire Updated Fire Apparatus inventory, placement plan and service level summary for
Department Matters | 04/30/14|EMP inclusion in DFD fleet business case summary 1.80 | 345.00 621.00
Reviewed and provided comments to draft Fire fleet business case exhibits for
Detroit Fire consistency with restructuring and reinvestment initiatives, completeness, and
Department Matters 04/30/14|KJH adherence to business case template and guidelines 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/30/14|KJH 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Detroit Fire Participated in telephone conference with CMM regarding DFFA negotiations
Department Matters 04/30/14 |KJH update 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Detroit Fire Prepared for meeting Fire update meeting with E. Jenkins (Fire), including
Department Matters 04/30/14|KJH preparation of agenda and topics to be covered 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Participated in Fire update meeting with E. Jenkins (Fire) and E. Petrovski (CM)
regarding restructuring initiative work plan, budget, development of restructuring
Detroit Fire and reinvestment business cases, recruiting and training, fleet replacement,
Department Matters 04/30/14|KJH benchmarking, training RFP, promotions, and next steps 1.60 | 425.00 680.00
Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/30/14|KJH 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
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Detroit Fire
Department Matters 04/30/14|KJH 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Detroit Fire Continued to review and provide comments to draft Fire fleet business case write-
Department Matters 04/30/14|KJH up, financial summary, timeline, and constraints 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/01/14|CMG 2.20 | 425.00 935.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/01/14|CMG 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Detroit Police Teleconference with D. lafrate (CM) to provide guidance on outcome of DPD
Department Matters 04/01/14|CMG facilities meeting and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Police Participated in call with C. Gannon (CM) to receive guidance on outcome of DPD
Department Matters 04/01/14|DMI facilities meeting and next steps 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters | 04/01/14|DMI Email correspondence with T. Eddy (CM) regarding DPD space consolidation 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Detroit Police Prepared for meeting with Lt. Lee (DPD), Sgt. Myles (DPD), G. Oxendine (DPD),
Department Matters 04/01/14|DMI Cpt. Ewing (DPD) and B. O'Droski (DPD) to discuss fleet and facilities 1.70 | 275.00 467.50
Detroit Police Participated in meeting with Lt. Lee (DPD), Sgt. Myles (DPD), G. Oxendine (DPD),
Department Matters 04/01/14|DMI Cpt. Ewing (DPD) and B. O'Droski (DPD) to discuss fleet and facilities 2.30 | 275.00 632.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/01/14|DMI Performed review and analysis of suggested changes to DPD POA 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Detroit Police Email correspondence with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding DPD labor negotiation
Department Matters 04/01/14|DMI analysis 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/01/14|DMI Made updates and revisions to space consolidation review for DPD 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/01/14|MCW Updated restructuring initiatives department detail related to Plan of Adjustment 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Police Updated assumptions / comments on restructuring initiatives for the department
Department Matters 04/01/14|MCW related to Plan of Adjustment 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Detroit Police Meeting with DPD regarding POA, promotions strategy and costs, fleet review,
Department Matters 04/02/14|CMG and facilities reinvestment 4.50 | 425.00 1,912.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/02/14|CMG Review and commented on current draft of promotion analysis related to DPD 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Police Email correspondence with R. Short (Budget), B. O'Droski (DPD) and T. Clifton
Department Matters 04/02/14|DMI (DBA) to discuss funding for facility build-outs 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Detroit Police Provided updates on restructuring initiatives for DPD, per request from J. Hill
Department Matters | 04/02/14|DMI (CFO) 1.80 | 275.00 495.00
Detroit Police Prepared for meeting with AC Houser (DPD) and B. O'Droski (DPD) to discuss
Department Matters 04/02/14|DMI DPD restructuring initiatives 2.10 | 275.00 577.50
Detroit Police Performed updates and revisions to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,
Department Matters | 04/02/14|DMI based on revised benefit information received from EY 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Detroit Police Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document
Department Matters 04/02/14\ MCW provided by HR 1.40 | 275.00 385.00
Met with D. lafrate (CM) to perform updates and revisions to DPD Plan of
Adjustment 10-year projection, based on revised benefit and wage increase
Detroit Police information received from EY on 4/3, as well as updated information on fleet,
Department Matters 04/03/14|CMG facilities, and IT 4.50 | 425.00 1,912.50
Detroit Police Meeting with N. Bugden (EY) regarding DPD baseline changes based on creditor
Department Matters 04/03/14|CMG negotiations and revisions to promotions from DPD 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Police Teleconference with B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding DPD promotion and incremental
Department Matters 04/03/14|CMG hire costs 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters | 04/03/14|CMG Teleconference with B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding cost information for POA 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Police Correspondence with DBA regarding bond fund dollars available for DPD facility
Department Matters 04/03/14|CMG expenditures 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Detroit Police Reviewed and revised Fleet plan based on updated information from DPD on
Department Matters 04/03/14|CMG patrol operations 3.50 | 425.00 1,487.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/03/14|CMG Met with D. lafrate (CM) to discuss and provide guidance on POA deferrals 2.20 | 425.00 935.00
Detroit Police Met with J. Addison (CM) regarding DPD overlay to discuss changes made to
Department Matters 04/03/14|DMI training and labor 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Met with C. Gannon (CM) to perform updates and revisions to DPD Plan of
Detroit Police Adjustment 10-year projection, based on revised benefit and wage increase
Department Matters 04/03/14 |DMI information received from EY on 4/3 4.50 | 275.00 1,237.50
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Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/03/14|DMI Participated in call with T. Clifton (DBA) regarding plans for DPD facilities 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters | 04/03/14|DMI Met with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss POA deferrals as they relate to DPD 2.20 | 275.00 605.00

Detroit Police Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Department Matters 04/03/14|MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Detroit Police Met with D. lafrate (CM) to discuss fleet reinvestment plan for DPD, as it relates to

Department Matters | 04/04/14|CMG the POA 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/04/14|CMG Reviewed fleet reinvestment plan prior to meeting with D. lafrate (CM) 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Teleconference with T. Bettison (DPD) to discuss fleet restructuring and

Detroit Police reinvestment initiatives, next steps in approval process and other restructuring and

Department Matters 04/04/14|CMG reinvestment assistance needed 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Detroit Police Correspondence with S. Meisel (DPD) regarding current manpower updates at

Department Matters 04/04/14|CMG DPD for inclusion in POA 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Police Participated in call with D. lafrate (CM) to discuss DPD deferrals as it relates to

Department Matters | 04/04/14|CMG revised POA 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Police Met with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss fleet reinvestment plan for DPD, as it relates

Department Matters 04/04/14|DMI to the POA 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Detroit Police Email correspondence with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss DPD deferrals as it relates

Department Matters 04/04/14|DMI to revised POA 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Detroit Police Performed updates and revisions to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,

Department Matters 04/04/14|DMI regarding fleet reinvestment 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Detroit Police Performed updates and revisions to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,

Department Matters 04/04/14 |DMI regarding materials and supplies 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Detroit Police Performed updates and revisions to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,

Department Matters 04/04/14|DMI regarding purchased services 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Detroit Police Participated in call with B. O'Droski (DPD) to discuss deferrals of materials and

Department Matters 04/04/14|DMI supplies spending at DPD 0.90 | 275.00 247.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/05/14|CMG Correspondence with DPD regarding new position request 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Police Email correspondence with B. Hollowell (Law) regarding DPD records retention

Department Matters 04/05/14|DMI policy 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/05/14|DMI Email correspondence with Cpt. Bettison (DPD) regarding DPD fleet requirements 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/05/14|DMI Continued development of DPD fleet analysis 3.20 | 275.00 880.00

Detroit Police Updated comments to the restructuring/reinvestment projections to be included in

Department Matters | 04/06/14 | MCW POA 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Conducted fleet analysis meeting to further refine requirements with DPD senior

Detroit Police executives, including Cpt. Ewing, Cmdr. Bettison, DC LeValley, DC Brown, Lt.

Department Matters 04/07/14|DMI Lee, Sgt. Lightfoot, and Lt. Meisel (all DPD) 4.10 | 275.00 1,127.50

Detroit Police Continued development of DPD fleet analysis based on revised information

Department Matters 04/07/14|DMI received from DPD executive team 2.90 | 275.00 797.50

Detroit Police Email communications with C. Gannon and D. lafrate (CM) and oral

Department Matters 04/07/14| GMK communications with COO regarding DPD fleet analysis 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/08/14|CMG Teleconference with D. lafrate (CM) regarding DPD fleet analysis revisions 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters | 04/08/14|CMG Reviewed and provided comments on DPD fleet analysis further revisions 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Police Correspondence with DPD to coordinate resources for Restructuring and

Department Matters | 04/08/14|CMG Reinvestment case write up, resource needs, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Police Provided responses to questions posed by C. Gannon (CM) during his review of

Department Matters 04/08/14|DMI DPD fleet analysis 2.70 | 275.00 742.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/08/14|DMI Participated in call with Cpt. Ewing (DPD) to discuss DPD fleet analysis 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Detroit Police Participated in call with Lt. Meisel (DPD) regarding the status on Chief's initiative

Department Matters 04/08/14|DMI on disability and leave absences 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Detroit Police Participated in call with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss my responses to his questions

Department Matters 04/08/14|DMI regarding revised DPD fleet analysis 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/08/14|DMI Performed updates to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projections 1.70 | 275.00 467.50

Detroit Police Participated in call with Cmdr. Bettison (DPD) to discuss fleet analysis and

Department Matters 04/08/14|DMI business case write-up 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
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Detroit Police Teleconference with D. lafrate (CM) regarding DPD IT deferrals for POA

Department Matters 04/09/14|CMG restructuring initiatives 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/09/14|DMI Participated in call with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss DPD IT deferrals 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/09/14|DMI Continued to perform updates to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projections 1.70 | 275.00 467.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters | 04/09/14|DMI Participated in call with S. Hayes (DPD) to discuss IT deferrals in the POA 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Performed updates to City of Detroit Restructuring Projects Risks and

Detroit Police Opportunities schedule, as it relates to DPD for purposes of presenting to the

Department Matters 04/09/14|DMI Mayor 2.30 | 275.00 632.50

Detroit Police Reviewed and provided comments to D. lafrate (CM) on New vs. Old POA

Department Matters | 04/10/14|CMG Restructuring and Reinvestment timing adjustments for EM and Mayor meeting 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Continued to perform updates to City of Detroit Restructuring Projects Risks and

Detroit Police Opportunities schedule, as it relates to DPD for purposes of presenting to the

Department Matters 04/10/14|DMI Mayor 1.80 | 275.00 495.00

Detroit Police Continued to perform updates to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projections, as

Department Matters 04/10/14|DMI it relates to fleet and facility spend 3.10 | 275.00 852.50

Detroit Police Teleconference with D. lafrate (CM) regarding Disclosure Statement

Department Matters 04/11/14|CMG updates/revisions related to DPD 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Detroit Police Email correspondence with B. O'Droski (DPD) and Cmdr. Bettison (DPD)

Department Matters 04/11/14|DMI regarding fleet purchase meeting 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/11/14|DMI Performed review of DPD's request regarding 8th Precinct build-out 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Detroit Police Participated in call with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss required revisions to

Department Matters 04/11/14|DMI Disclosure Statement, as it relates to DPD 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Revised POA 10-year projections based on updated assumptions received from

Detroit Police E&Y to be included in Second Amended Disclosure Statement, as it relates to

Department Matters | 04/13/14|DMI DPD 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Detroit Police Teleconference with B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding DPD restructuring and

Department Matters 04/14/14 | CMG reinvestment initiative write ups 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Detroit Police Correspondence with DPD regarding restructuring and reinvestment initiative write

Department Matters 04/14/14|CMG ups and coordination of same 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/14/14|DMI Performed review of revised DPD organizational structure 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/14/14|DMI Continued to perform updates to DPD Plan of Adjustment 10-year projections 2.30 | 275.00 632.50

Detroit Police Email correspondence with B. O'Droski (DPD) and D. lafrate (CM) regarding DPD

Department Matters 04/15/14|CMG restructuring and reinvestment write ups and fleet open items 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Detroit Police Gathered and distributed revised DPD POA to DPD executive team per their

Department Matters 04/15/14|DMI request, for development of business case write-ups 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

Detroit Police Met with T. Eddy (CM) to discuss Space Consolidation Review analysis as it

Department Matters 04/15/14|DMI relates to DPD 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/15/14|DMI Participated in call with B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding current facility contracts 0.90 | 275.00 247.50

Detroit Police Meeting with D. lafrate (CM), G. Brown (COOQ) regarding DPD fleet requirements

Department Matters 04/16/14 | CMG review and needs analysis 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Detroit Police Participated in discussion with C. Gannon (CM) and G. Brown (COO) regarding

Department Matters 04/16/14|DMI DPD fleet requirements 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Detroit Police Obtained latest DPD baseline projection from E&Y and distributed to B. O'Droski

Department Matters | 04/16/14|DMI (DPD) 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Detroit Police Teleconference with T. Bettison (DPD) to provide guidance on agenda for DPD

Department Matters 04/17/14|CMG fleet replacement, and discussed next steps 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Detroit Police Email correspondence with D. lafrate (CM) regarding GSD Fleet maintenance,

Department Matters 04/17/14|CMG DPD fleet RFPs and next steps 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Prepared for meeting with Cmdr. Bettison, G. Oxendine, Sgt. Myles, Lt. Lee, Sgt.

Detroit Police Lightfoot (DPD), D. Bryant (Purchasing) and G. Steffes (GSD) to discuss fleet

Department Matters 04/17/14|DMI vehicle specs and RFQ 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Participated in meeting with Cmdr. Bettison, G. Oxendine, Sgt. Myles, Lt. Lee, Sgt.

Detroit Police Lightfoot (DPD), D. Bryant (Purchasing) and G. Steffes (GSD) to discuss fleet

Department Matters 04/17/14 | DMI vehicle specs and RFQ 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Detroit Police Meeting with D. lafrate (CM) regarding DPD space consolidation analysis in

Department Matters 04/18/14|CMG preparation of upcoming meeting with J. Hill (CFO) 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

Detroit Police

Department Matters 04/18/14|CMG Reviewed DPD space consolidation and provided comments to D. lafrate (CM) 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
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Detroit Police Met with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss DPD space consolidation review analysis in
Department Matters 04/18/14|DMI preparation of upcoming meeting with J. Hill (CFO) 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Detroit Police Continued development of DPD space consolidation review for purposes of
Department Matters | 04/18/14|DMI providing to J. Hill (CFO) 2.90 | 275.00 797.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/21/14|CMG 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/21/14|CMG 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Detroit Police Provided J. Santambrogio (EY) with DPD compensation analysis to be included in
Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI presentation to creditors 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Detroit Police Meeting with D. lafrate (CM) to discuss DPD priority call information request and
Department Matters 04/22/14|CMG DPD data times for interrogatory responses, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Police Teleconference with B. Dick (GSD) regarding DPD facility option for 9001
Department Matters 04/22/14|CMG Woodward 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Police Meeting with S. Fox (EMO) regarding DPD facility options related to 7310
Department Matters 04/22/14 | CMG Woodward 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/22/14|CMG Reviewed DPD response time information for interrogatory responses 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/22/14|DMI Further revisions to GSD/DPD space consolidation review 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Detroit Police Analyzed financial information regarding DPD suggested move to 9001 Woodward
Department Matters | 04/22/14|DMI versus 7310 Woodward for Central District/First Precinct 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/22/14|DMI Continued to revise GSD/DPD space consolidation review analysis 2.30 | 275.00 632.50
Detroit Police Met with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss analyses received from Lt. Meisel (DPD) as it
Department Matters 04/22/14|DMI relates to objector requests for DPD response time statistics 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Police Drafted email to Lt. Meisel (DPD) regarding additional requests for DPD statistical
Department Matters 04/22/14|DMI information 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Police Participated in call with Lt. Meisel (DPD) to discuss additional DPD statistical
Department Matters 04/22/14|DMI request from objectors, per Jones Day 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Detroit Police Prepare summary of Police department budget division (Police) position
Department Matters 04/22/14 KAD questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/22/14|MCW Updated revenue restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for department 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Detroit Police Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for
Department Matters 04/22/14 MCW department 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Police Correspondence with J. White (DPD) and E. Ewing (DPD) regarding 7310
Department Matters 04/23/14|CMG Woodward facility options 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Teleconference with B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding DPD facility consolidation,
Detroit Police restructuring prioritization of initiatives, restructuring and reinvestment initiative
Department Matters 04/23/14 | CMG write ups 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Police Provided comments to T. Eddy (CM) regarding GSD sections of space
Department Matters 04/23/14|DMI consolidation review analysis 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/23/14|DMI Continued to revise GSD/DPD space consolidation review analysis 2.40 | 275.00 660.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/23/14|DMI Performed review of revised DPD prioritization listing 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Detroit Police Email correspondence with C. Gannon (CM) and B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding
Department Matters 04/23/14|DMI funding source for build-out of 5th precinct 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Detroit Police Email correspondence with C. Gannon (CM) regarding status of DPD statistical
Department Matters 04/23/14|DMI request from objectors 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/24/14|DMI Continued to revise GSD/DPD space consolidation review analysis 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Detroit Police Participated in call with M. Walsh (CM) to discuss delay of realized lease savings
Department Matters 04/24/14|DMI in DPD plan of adjustment 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Police Participated in call with B. Dick (GSD) to discuss allocation of lease savings on a
Department Matters 04/24/14|DMI monthly basis in the DPD plan of adjustment 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/24/14|DMI Made revisions to DPD plan of adjustment as it relates to lease savings 2.50 | 275.00 687.50
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Detroit Police Teleconference with D. lafrate (CM) to provide updates regarding DPD space
Department Matters 04/24/14 | MCW consolidation savings in restructuring/reinvestment projection 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/24/14|MCW Updated space consolidation analysis for CM meeting with department 1.50 | 275.00 412.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/24/14|MCW Updated space consolidation analysis with comments from C. Gannon (CM) 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Detroit Police Meeting with J. White (DPD), L. Houser (DPD), B. O'Droski (DPD) and others
Department Matters | 04/25/14|CMG regarding restructuring and reinvestment case studies, forfeiture funds next steps 3.40 | 425.00 1,445.00
Detroit Police Email correspondence with C. Gannon (CM) regarding necessary fleet changes to
Department Matters 04/25/14|DMI DPD 10-year plan 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Detroit Police Meeting with J. Holley (Mayor's) to discuss 9001 Woodward potential
Department Matters | 04/28/14|CMG consolidation 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/28/14|CMG Meeting with S. Fox (EMO) to discuss DPD facility consolidation and DDC options 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Police Meeting with J. Hill (CFO), L. Houser (DPD), B. O'Droski (DPD) to discuss desired
Department Matters 04/28/14 | CMG promotions and cost impact to POA, potential options to absorb cost, next steps 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Detroit Police Prepared analysis of DPD vehicle purchases per QOL proceeds and provided to
Department Matters 04/28/14|CMG J. Hill (CFO) for discussion with EM 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Police Teleconference with DPD regarding restructuring and reinvestment sample write
Department Matters 04/28/14|CMG ups 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Police Correspondence with DPD leadership and D. lafrate (CM) regarding
Department Matters 04/28/14|CMG interrogatories 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Police Teleconference with T. Leach (DPD) regarding restructuring and reinvestment
Department Matters 04/28/14 | CMG questions and clarification 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/29/14|DMI Email correspondence with B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding 800 mhz contract 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/30/14|CMG Meeting with D. lafrate (CM) regarding DPD fee study next steps 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Detroit Police Teleconference with D. lafrate (CM) and B. O'Droski (DPD) regarding compilation
Department Matters 04/30/14|CMG of promotional analysis to determine shortfall in funding per request from DPD 2.80 | 425.00 1,190.00
Detroit Police Teleconference with B. O'Droski regarding Quality of Life loan proceeds and DPD
Department Matters 04/30/14|CMG write ups necessary to access funds, strategized on new steps 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Police Correspondence with DPD regarding restructuring related items, next steps with
Department Matters | 04/30/14|CMG civilianization restructuring and reinvestment initiative write ups 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Police Correspondence with DPD regarding available funds for promotions and current
Department Matters 04/30/14|CMG analysis implications, need for reductions in request from DPD 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Police Made revisions/updates to DPD 10-year projections, as it relates to facility
Department Matters 04/30/14|DMI changes 2.30 | 275.00 632.50
Detroit Police Met with T. Eddy (CM) to discuss facility capital expenditures analysis as it relates
Department Matters | 04/30/14|DMI to DPD 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Detroit Police
Department Matters 04/30/14|DMI Met with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss process for DPD fee study 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Detroit Police Email correspondence with B. O'Droski and Cmdr. Bettison (both DPD) regarding
Department Matters 04/30/14|DMI fee study to be completed 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Police Meeting with B. O'Droski (DPD) and C. Gannon (CM) to discuss compilation of
Department Matters 04/30/14|DMI promotional analysis as it relates to DPD business case write-up 2.80 | 275.00 770.00
Detroit Police Provided guidance to B. O'Droski (DPD) by making additional edits/revisions to
Department Matters 04/30/14|DMI promotional analysis for DPD business case write-up 1.70 | 275.00 467.50
Detroit Police Performed review and analysis of data received from DPD regarding objector
Department Matters 04/30/14|DMI requests for response time information 2.40 | 275.00 660.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department
Matters 04/01/14|CMM Prepare edits to letter to Counties related to regional water authority 0.60 | 495.00 297.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review letter from Emergency Manager to Counties in response to letters
Matters 04/01/14|MJH received from County representatives related to negotiation process 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Telephone call with N. Bateson (DWSD) to discuss update on various issues
Matters 04/01/14 \MJH including bond issue 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Water and Review draft of letter from K. Orr to County Representatives responding to
Sewerage Department Counties issues regarding DWSD transaction to ensure accuracy of information
Matters 04/01/14|WPJ related to transaction due diligence process 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
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Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review and provide comments to finalize letter to Counties regarding DWSD
Matters 04/02/14|CMM interactions 0.40 | 495.00 198.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Preliminary review of due diligence questions received from S. Marken (Miller
Matters 04/02/14 \MJH Buckfire) related to RFI for conference call to discuss responses 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review of revised letter from City to county representatives regarding Authority
Matters 04/02/14|\WPJ transaction discussions for accuracy 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Participate in conference call with S. Marken and K. Haggard (MB) and W.
Matters 04/03/14|MJH Johnston (CM) to review due diligence questions MB has received to date 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Telephone call with W. Johnston (CM) to review preliminary responses on due
Matters 04/03/14|MJH diligence questions prior to conference call with Miller Buckfire 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Water and Preparation for call with GLC related to due diligence questions. Preparation
Sewerage Department included review of revised 10-year Business Plan and prior GLC questions
Matters 04/03/14|MJH discussed. 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Water and Participate in conference call with S. Marken and K. Haggard (MB), W. Johnston
Sewerage Department (CM) and representatives from GLC to discuss due diligence questions from GLC
Matters 04/03/14 \MJH prior to mediation meeting 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Detroit Water and Participate in conference call with GLC Advisors (DWSD Trustee Advisors), S.
Sewerage Department Marken and K. Haggard (MB) and M. Hausman (CM) to discuss due diligence on
Matters 04/03/14|WPJ revised DWSD business plan 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Phone call with M. Hausman (CM) to prepare for call with Miller Buckfire to
Matters 04/03/14|\WPJ discuss DWSD RFI respondents due diligence requests 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review due diligence list in order to prepare responses for requests
Matters 04/03/14|WPJ related to DWSD business plan 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Participate in conference call with GLC Advisors (DWSD Trustee Advisors) to
Matters 04/03/14|WPJ discuss due diligence on revised DWSD business plan 1.00 | 275.00 275.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with K. Haggard (MB) regarding potential process for
Matters 04/07/14 | CMM further solicitation of counties for potential regional water authority 0.40 | 495.00 198.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Telephone conversation with M. Hale (JD) related to DWSD due diligence request
Matters 04/07/14|MJH list received from trustee 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Participate in conference call with W. Johnston (CM), S. Marken (MB) and L.
Matters 04/07/14|MJH Nelson (JD) to review US Bank due diligence list and coordinate responses 1.40 | 425.00 595.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review of US Bank Plan of Adjustment requests as they relate to DWSD in
Matters 04/07/14|\WPJ preparation for call with Jones Day and Miller Buckfire 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Respond to US Bank DWSD due diligence requests by collecting required
Matters 04/07/14|WPJ information 2.60 | 275.00 715.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Participation in call with S. Marken (MB), K. Haggard (MB), L. Nelson (JD) and M.
Matters 04/07/14|\WPJ Hausman (CM) to discuss US Bank POA requests as they relate to DWSD 1.40 | 275.00 385.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email communication with Jones Day and Miller Buckfire regarding outstanding
Matters 04/07/14|WPJ due diligence requests related to DWSD 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Water and Prepare email to B. Foster (Foster Group) regarding information on historical
Sewerage Department DWSD debt service coverage statistics to satisfy DWSD bondholders FAs due
Matters 04/07/14|WPJ diligence requests 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department
Matters 04/08/14|CMM Respond to questions from S. Fox (EMO) regarding media inquiry on DWSD 0.30 | 495.00 148.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Meeting with W. Johnston (CM) to review files for submission to L. Nelson at
Matters 04/08/14|MJH Jones Day in response to US Bank due diligence request 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
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Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review files prepared for presentation to US Bank per due diligence request,

Matters 04/08/14|MJH recommend changes 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review reconciliation of O&M expense detail to audit reports, advise W. Johnston

Matters 04/08/14|MJH (CM) how to present data 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department

Matters 04/08/14|MJH Various emails with L. Nelson (JD) related to US Bank due diligence request 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department

Matters 04/08/14|MJH Review files at Jones Day request for file B. Wolfson (DWSD) noted we may have 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Analysis of 5-years historical Water System debt service coverage statistics and

Matters 04/08/14|WPJ calculations for creditor due diligence per Miller Buckfire 2.40 | 275.00 660.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Analysis of 5-years historical Sewer System debt service coverage statistics and

Matters 04/08/14|WPJ calculations for creditor due diligence per Miller Buckfire 2.20 | 275.00 605.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department

Matters 04/08/14|WPJ Continue preparing US Bank DWSD projections due diligence requests 2.40 | 275.00 660.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Prepare summary of files by request number for Jones Day to facilitate fulfillment

Matters 04/08/14 |\WPJ of US Bank due diligence requests 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Meeting with M. Hausman (CM) to review files for submission to L. Nelson at

Matters 04/08/14|WPJ Jones Day in response to US Bank due diligence request 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Email communication with Miller Buckfire and Jones Day regarding outstanding

Matters 04/08/14|WPJ due diligence requests related to DWSD 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review DWSD forecast model submitted to Jones Day to be included in revised

Matters 04/09/14| MJH Disclosure Statement 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review Disclosure Statement in order to confirm DWSD figures and references.

Matters 04/09/14|MJH Contact Jones Day regarding source of FY 2013 figures noted in Statement 2.80 | 425.00 1,190.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Reviewed and organized surplus inventory data from C. Griswell (DWSD) per C.

Matters 04/09/14|PCA Griswell's direction for inclusion in the potential surplus assets auction RFP 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Prepare response to questions from L. Nelson (JD) regarding US bank DWSD due

Matters 04/09/14 | WPJ diligence requests 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Email correspondence with M. Eaton, Esq. (JD) regarding discovery requests of

Matters 04/10/14|CMM Counties related to DWSD 0.30 | 495.00 148.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department

Matters 04/10/14|CMM Review motion filed by Wayne County to request mediation related to DWSD 0.40 | 495.00 198.00
Participate in meeting with N. Bateson (DWSD) and J. Naglick (Finance Director)

Detroit Water and to discuss various issues related to DWSD including finance department

Sewerage Department reorganization, PayNearMe, status of Authority negotiations with Counties and Fox

Matters 04/10/14|MJH Lawson report 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

Detroit Water and In response to Jones Day request, complete list of questions and information

Sewerage Department required from Ad Hoc Committee for DWSD bondholders and Trustee for due

Matters 04/10/14|MJH diligence request 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review of Macomb and Oakland Counties' objections to the Plan of Adjustment

Matters 04/10/14|\WPJ and prepare notes related to City's discovery requests per M. Eaton (JD) request 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

Detroit Water and Review of Ad hoc committee of DWSD bondholders and DWSD bond indenture

Sewerage Department trustee (US Bank) objections to the Plan of Adjustment and prepare notes related

Matters 04/10/14|WPJ to City's discovery requests per M. Eaton (JD) request 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
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Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review and recommend revisions to DWSD historical financial information and
Matters 04/12/14|MJH projections for update to Disclosure Statement 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Prepare historical Water and Sewer funds trended financial statements for
Matters 04/13/14|WPJ disclosure statement exhibit 1.40 | 275.00 385.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Prepare verbiage for disclosure statement related to historical DWSD capital
Matters 04/13/14|\WPJ expenditures per Jones Day request 1.00 | 275.00 275.00
Detroit Water and Review DWSD verbiage and figures of draft amendment to disclosure statement
Sewerage Department to ensure proper and accurate presentation in preparation for submitting
Matters 04/13/14|\WPJ amendment to Court 1.80 | 275.00 495.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with D. Merrett (JD) related to DWSD CIP figures in
Matters 04/14/14|MJH disclosure statement 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department
Matters 04/15/14|MJH Review DWSD Finance Committee package received from N. Bateson (DWSD) 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department
Matters 04/15/14|MJH Email correspondence with T. Melvin ||l re'ated to DWSD 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review letter from SOWCA received from K. Haggard (MB) related to support for
Matters 04/16/14 \MJH Authority transaction 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Participation in call with K. Haggard to discuss RFI process and updates regarding
Matters 04/16/14|WPJ the same 2.00 | 275.00 550.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Prepare DWSD forecasting model and related schedules for transmission to RFI
Matters 04/17/14 | WPJ respondents 1.70 | 275.00 467.50
Detroit Water and Participate in conference call with N. Bateson (DWSD), Miller Canfield, First
Sewerage Department Southwest, Miller Buckfire, Jones Day, State of Michigan and W/ Johnston (CM)
Matters 04/18/14 |MJH related to DWSD Sewer Financing Update call 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Detroit Water and Preparation for conference call with N. Bateson (DWSD), Miller Canfield, First
Sewerage Department Southwest, Miller Buckfire, Jones Day, State of Michigan related to DWSD Sewer
Matters 04/18/14 |MJH Financing Update call 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review DWSD model to be provided to Miller Buckfire for submission to parties
Matters 04/18/14|MJH responding to RFI related to DWSD 1.10 | 425.00 467.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review DWSD forecast in Disclosure Statement to confirm assumed pension level
Matters 04/18/14 \MJH to determine if revision is required 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Water and Participate in conference call with N. Bateson, M. Hausman (CM), Miller Canfield,
Sewerage Department First Southwest, Miller Buckfire, Jones Day, State of Michigan related to DWSD
Matters 04/18/14|\WPJ Sewer System financing update 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Phone call with S. Marken (Miller Buckfire) to discuss providing DWSD RFI
Matters 04/18/14 | WPJ respondent due diligence requests 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Prepare DWSD forecasting model for posting in data room for DWSD RFI
Matters 04/18/14|\WPJ respondents due diligence 2.30 | 275.00 632.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review DWSD files to determine files submitted to Counties during negotiation
Matters 04/21/14 \MJH process at request of Miller Buckfire 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with D. Merrett (JD) related to updated DWSD forecast
Matters 04/21/14|MJH model for disclosure statement 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with W. Johnston (CM) related to updated DWSD forecast
Matters 04/21/14|MJH model for disclosure statement 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and Review Second Amended Disclosure Statement in order to determine amounts
Sewerage Department related to DWSD funding of pension and OPEB. Review related to revisions of 10-
Matters 04/21/14| MJH year business plan 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
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Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Telephone call with W. Johnston (CM) to discuss required revisions to DWSD 10-
Matters 04/21/14|MJH year business plan for Disclosure Statement 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Telephone call with M. Hausman (CM) to discuss required revisions to DWSD 10-
Matters 04/21/14|\WPJ year business plan for Disclosure Statement 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Discussion with D. Jernecyic (EY) regarding DWSD pension contributions required
Matters 04/21/14|\WPJ per City forecast for DWSD POA projections 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Corresponded via e-mail with D. Merrett (Jones Day), W. Johnston and M.
Matters 04/22/14|EMP Hausman (CM) re: update to DWSD assumptions 0.60 | 345.00 207.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with D. Merrett (JD) related to required revision to the
Matters 04/22/14|MJH DWSD 10-year business plan contained in the Disclosure Statement 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email communication with Jones Day regarding DWSD POA projections and
Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ upcoming amendment to Plan of Adjustment and Disclosure Statement 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Revised DWSD model for transmission to RFI respondents per S. Marken (MB)
Matters 04/22/14|WPJ comments 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Research and provide DWSD historical pension contributions and expense per S.
Matters 04/22/14 \WPJ Sarna (EY) request 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Detroit Water and Analysis of pension, OPEB, and pension obligation certificate expenses projected
Sewerage Department in City's 10-yaer forecast to be funded from DWSD per B. Foster (Foster Group)
Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ and N. Bateson (DWSD) requests 2.40 | 275.00 660.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Prepare backup schedules regarding calculations of 10-year projections of legacy
Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ costs for B. Foster (Foster Group) and N. Bateson (DWSD) per their request 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Prepare email to B. Foster (Foster Group) and N. Bateson (DWSD) regarding
Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ DWSD legacy costs contained in plan of adjustment 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Corresponded via e-mail with D. Merrett (Jones Day) re: update to DWSD
Matters 04/23/14 EMP assumptions 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Met with W. Johnston (CM) re: DWSD model and data points to be updated with
Matters 04/23/14|EMP pension, OPEB and POC changes 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Reviewed DWSD model and data points to be updated with pension, OPEB and
Matters 04/23/14|EMP POC changes 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with E. Petrovski (CM) related to revisions of DWSD 10-
Matters 04/23/14|MJH year business plan in Disclosure Statement 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with W. Johnston (CM) related to response to D. Merrett
Matters 04/23/14|MJH (JD) to questions received by Jones Day from creditors related to DWSD 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Met with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding DWSD model and data points to be updated
Matters 04/23/14|\WPJ with pension, OPEB and POC changes for Plan of Adjustment projections 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Analysis of Sewer Bond Trustee comments regarding the principal of Sewer
Matters 04/23/14|\WPJ outstanding debt as of the petition date 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Analysis of the impact of Sewer Bond Trustee comments regarding the principal of
Matters 04/23/14|\WPJ outstanding Sewerage bonds on DWSD projections 1.80 | 275.00 495.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email communication with Miller Buckfire and M. Hausman regarding Sewer
Matters 04/23/14 \WPJ outstanding bond balances 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review information related to request from Miller Buckfire for information related to
Matters 04/24/14 \MJH DWSD management presentation 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
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Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with K. Haggard (MB) related to conference call to review
Matters 04/24/14 \MJH DWSD management presentation 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email correspondence with W. Johnston (CM) related to completing revisions to
Matters 04/24/14|MJH DWSD 10-year business plan for Jones Day 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department
Matters 04/24/14|MJH Email communications with M. Hale (JD) related to document request by creditors 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review financial information in order to respond to questions from M. Hale (JD)
Matters 04/24/14|MJH related to due diligence requests 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Additional email correspondence with M. Hale (JD) related to due diligence
Matters 04/24/14 \MJH questions 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email communication with Jones Day regarding DWSD interrogatories and other
Matters 04/24/14 |\ WPJ requests 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Telephone conversation with M. Hale (JD) related to production of information
Matters 04/25/14 |MJH related to creditor interrogatories 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review files to provide information to Miller Buckfire information on DWSD
Matters 04/25/14 \MJH contract terms with customers, provide information to Miller Buckfire 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review file received from W. Johnston (CM) related to revised pension, OPEB
Matters 04/25/14|MJH and COP obligations per information from Ernst & Young 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department
Matters 04/25/14|MJH Review email correspondence from M. Hale (JD) related to creditor interrogatories 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Participation in call with DWSD and other financial advisors related to potential
Matters 04/25/14| MJH bond issue 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department
Matters 04/25/14|MJH Email communications with M. Hale (JD) related to document request by creditors 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review revised DWSD 10-year business plan document submitted by W.
Matters 04/25/14|MJH Johnston (CM) and requested by Jones Day for disclosure statement 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Participate in conference call with DWSD Sewer System Financing Work Group to
Matters 04/25/14|\WPJ discuss updates and current work-streams 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Detroit Water and Participate in conference call with DWSD management, B. Foster (Foster Group),
Sewerage Department K. Haggard (MB),S. Marken (MB) to discuss and prepare for DWSD management
Matters 04/25/14|\WPJ presentations to RFI respondents 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email communication with Jones Day and EY regarding DWSD POA projection
Matters 04/25/14|\WPJ updates 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Email communication with EY regarding pension and OPEB assumptions in
Matters 04/25/14|\WPJ DWSD POA projection updates 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Update DWSD projections to reflect assumptions provided by EY and Jones Day
Matters 04/25/14|\WPJ regarding pension/OPEB/Certificates of Participation assumptions 1.00 | 275.00 275.00
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review revised DWSD 10-year Business Plan prepared for Disclosure Statement
Matters 04/26/14|MJH including review of revised pension, OPEB and COP's figures 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review memo from B. Foster dated 4/21/14 related to Detroit Retail rate
Matters 04/26/14 \MJH recommendations to determine potential impact on 10-year business plan 1.10 | 425.00 467.50
Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department Review City of Detroit Central Services report to determine if DWSD is charged for
Matters 04/28/14 |MJH police and fire costs, respond to C. Moore (CM) regarding came 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
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Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department

Matters 04/28/14|MJH Review revised DWSD 10-year business plan prepared for Disclosure Statement 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review City of Detroit Central Services allocation to determine is Fire and Police

Matters 04/28/14 \MJH expenses are allocated in expenses and therefore to DWSD 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review DWSD 10-year business plan file prepared by W. Johnston (CM) for

Matters 04/28/14 |MJH submission to M. Hale at Jones Day 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Prepare DWSD forecasting model for transmission to Jones Day for creditor

Matters 04/28/14 | WPJ requests 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Email correspondence with C. Moore (CM) related to reconciliation of variance in

Matters 04/29/14|MJH DWSD pension obligations 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Met with W. Johnston (CM) to review DWSD 10-year business plan prior to

Matters 04/29/14|MJH submitting to M. Hale (JD) to determine required changes to model 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Prepare revisions to DWSD POA forecast schedules to be provided to Jones Day

Matters 04/29/14|\WPJ for amended disclosure statement 2.20 | 275.00 605.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Meeting with M. Hausman (CM) to discuss and review DWSD forecasting model

Matters 04/29/14|\WPJ to provide creditor groups in relation to requests of the same 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Continue to prepare DWSD forecasting model for Jones Day in order to fulfill

Matters 04/29/14|WPJ creditor requests per comments received from M. Hausman (CM) 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Detroit Water and Meeting with N. Bateson, Al Diebold (DWSD), B. Foster and W. Johnston (CM) to

Sewerage Department discuss DWSD impacts related to Plan of Adjustment, the ongoing RFI process

Matters 04/30/14|MJH and assumptions for various expense items including pension, POC's and OPEB 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Follow-up call with W. Johnston (CM) to receive update of conversation with GLC

Matters 04/30/14|MJH occurring after C. Moore and M. Hausman had to drop off call 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Meeting with W. Johnston to develop responses to GLC due diligence list in

Matters 04/30/14 \MJH preparation for call related to same 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Detroit Water and Meeting with B. Foster (Foster Group), N. Bateson and A. Deabol (DWSD), and

Sewerage Department M. Hausman (CM) to discuss reconciliation of DWSD business plan and CM

Matters 04/30/14|WPJ business plan for management presentations 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Participate in weekly DWSD Sewer System Financing Work Group conference

Matters 04/30/14|\WPJ call to discuss updates and work streams 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Detroit Water and

Sewerage Department Review GLC due diligence list for meeting with M. Hausman (CM) to discuss the

Matters 04/30/14|WPJ same and prepare for conference call with City Advisors and Creditor Advisors 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document
provided by HR, personnel list of Full-time employees and personal service

Elections 04/02/14|MCW contractors that are reported as currently working for the City of Detroit 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Updated active benefits for department in the restructuring/reinvestment model

Elections 04/02/14|MCW related to the Plan of Adjustment with information received from E&Y 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Email correspondence with W. Wesley (ELC) regarding progress of capital

Elections 04/02/14|MCW expenditures related to restructuring projects for the City 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Elections 04/02/14| MCW Provided updates on status of restructuring projects for department 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Elections 04/03/14|MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Updated active benefits and inflation factors for department in the
restructuring/reinvestment model related to the Plan of Adjustment with newest

Elections 04/03/14| MCW information received from E&Y 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Input training costs, capital expenditures, assumptions and comments for the

Elections 04/04/14|MCW restructuring/reinvestment projections 1.00 | 275.00 275.00
Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

Elections 04/06/14| MCW Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
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Elections

04/09/14

CMG

Teleconference with M. Walsh (CM) regarding risks/opportunities related to Plan
of Adjustment for department

0.30

425.00

127.50

Elections

04/09/14

MCW

Teleconference with C. Gannon (CM) regarding risks/opportunities related to Plan
of Adjustment for department

0.30

275.00

82.50

Elections

04/09/14

MCwW

Adjusted risks/opportunities summary related to Plan of Adjustment for the
department

275.00

55.00

Elections

04/10/14

MCW

Updated risks and opportunities analysis for department related to Mayor's Office
strategy review meeting

0.40

275.00

110.00

Elections

04/13/14

MCwW

Updated wage increases and benefit rates in restructuring/reinvestment projection
related to Plan of Adjustment

0.30

275.00

82.50

Elections

04/23/14

MCwW

Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for
department

0.30

275.00

82.50

Elections

04/24/14

MCwW

Email correspondence with W. Wesley (ELC) regarding Quality of Life Business
Case related to Plan of Adjustment initiatives

275.00

55.00

Elections

04/30/14

MCwW

Teleconference with W. Wesley (ELC) regarding Quality of Life loan business
case for fund requisition related to restructuring projects

0.70

275.00

192.50

Elections

04/30/14

MCwW

Provided department with budget information related to restructuring plan for the
purpose of assisting with Quality of Life loan requisition

0.40

275.00

110.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/01/14

DAR

Prepared required detail descriptions by department code for March fee
application

0.80

345.00

276.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/01/14

DMI

Performed review and analysis of DPD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Examiner.

0.30

275.00

82.50

Fee Examiner Matters

04/02/14

MJH

Research Fee Examiner response on WPJ November time entries. Determine
Examiner copied incorrect response into entries.

0.80

425.00

340.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/02/14

MJH

Draft email to Fee Examiner related to error on November responses by Fee
Examiner to Conway responses

0.40

425.00

170.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/02/14

MJH

Review October redactions prior to submitting file to Fee Examiner

1.20

425.00

510.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/02/14

MJH

Revise February fee application and submit revised to Fee Examiner

0.90

425.00

382.50

Fee examiner matters

04/04/14

DMI

Performed review and analysis of HR contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Examiner.

0.40

275.00

110.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/06/14

MJH

Review November Fee Examiner comments to determine amount of fees in
question

0.80

425.00

340.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/06/14

MJH

Draft email correspondence to C. Moore related November revised invoice

0.30

425.00

127.50

Fee Examiner Matters

04/06/14

MJH

Draft email to CM team related to work-plan for March fee application and
submission of time entries for consolidation

0.30

425.00

127.50

Fee Examiner Matters

04/07/14

DMI

Performed review and analysis of 36D contractors' weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Examiner.

0.50

275.00

137.50

Fee Examiner Matters

04/07/14

DMI

Performed review and analysis of BSEED contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Examiner.

275.00

55.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/07/14

DMI

Performed review and analysis of DPD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Examiner.

0.40

275.00

110.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/07/14

DMI

Performed review and analysis of GSD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Examiner.

275.00

55.00

Fee Examiner Matters

04/07/14

DMI

Performed review and analysis of Finance contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Examiner.

275.00

55.00
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Performed review and analysis of HR contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Fee examiner matters | 04/07/14|DMI Examiner. 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Performed review and analysis of PDD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Fee examiner matters | 04/07/14|DMI Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Reviewed contractor time and progress reports for previous weeks and provided

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/07/14| MCW comments and guidance on current week 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/07/14|MJH Preliminary review of December Preliminary Report received from Fee Examiner 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Draft email to CM team related to work-plan for December Preliminary Report and

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/07/14 | MJH responses for Fee Examiner 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/08/14 |DMI Developed responses to Fee Examiner's comments on December fee application 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/08/14 |MJH Review revised November invoice detail received from J. Wood (CM) 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Preparation of responses to Fee Examiners comments on November fee

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/08/14 |MJH application 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/08/14|WPJ Prepare responses to fee examiners comments to WPJ December time entries 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14|DMI Prepared March 2014 time entries for submission to fee examiner 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Responses to Fee Examiner questions/comments on GMK time entries for

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14| GMK December 2013 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
March time entries received from team members integrated to March master file

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14 |JLW for monthly invoice 0.80 | 130.00 104.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14|JLW Compilation of responses for team to December invoice questions from FE 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14 |JLW Finalize November responses to FE comments for team 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14 |KAD Revisions to November Fee Statement per request of Fee Examiner 1.00 | 130.00 130.00
Draft email to K. Dippel (CM) providing instruction on required revisions to

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14 |MJH November fee application to prepare revised fee application. 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14 |MJH Review revised November invoice detail received from J. Wood (CM) 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Review adjustments to November time detail and verbiage to complete revised

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/09/14|MJH November invoice 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Updated fee examiner revision request file to respond to questions related to my

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/10/14|EMP time entries 1.40 | 345.00 483.00
Process additional changes to November Fee Statement and correspondence with

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/10/14 |KAD MJH regarding same 0.50 | 130.00 65.00
Drafted responses to Fee Examiner's Resolution Discussion Comments /

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/10/14 | MCW Requests for December 2013 Fee Application 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/10/14 |MJH Review revised verbiage for November fee application 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Review adjustments to November time detail and verbiage to complete revised

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/10/14|MJH November invoice 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Review contractor time detail in order to prepare contractor time summaries for

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/10/14|WPJ March 2014 fee statement 2.60 | 275.00 715.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/10/14|WPJ Prepare contractor time summaries for March 2014 fee statement 1.80 | 275.00 495.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/11/14 | MJH Email correspondence with Fee Examiner related to Revised November Invoice 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Complete March fee application submission, all time entries require review and
edits in order to comply with fee examiner order for final monthly fee application

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/11/14 | TAE process 1.60 | 425.00 680.00
Review revisions and make edits to November time descriptions revised by CM

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/12/14|MJH and J. Wood 2.20 | 425.00 935.00
Completed December fee application responses to fee examiners comments and

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/13/14| TAE concerns 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Performed review and analysis of DPD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|DMI Examiner. 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Performed review and analysis of 36D contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|DMI Examiner. 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
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Performed review and analysis of Finance contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|DMI Examiner. 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Performed review and analysis of HR contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee examiner matters | 04/14/14|DMI Examiner. 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Performed review and analysis of PDD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee examiner matters | 04/14/14|DMI Examiner. 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|JAA Redact November time entries for Finance and PROJ codes 2.30 | 345.00 793.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|JAA Respond to December Fee Examiner questions related to J. Addison (CM) entries 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
March time entries for the team, March time entries received from team members
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|JLW integrated to March master file for monthly invoice 0.80 | 130.00 104.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14 |JLW Compilation of responses for team to December invoice questions from FE 1.00 | 130.00 130.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|KJH Prepared responses to December 2013 Fee Examiner comments 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to JLW regarding responses to
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|KJH December 2013 Fee Examiner Comments 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Reviewed contractor time and progress reports for previous weeks and provided
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14| MCW comments and guidance on current week 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|MJH Draft email to CM assigning redaction responsibilities for November invoice 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finalize November revised invoice including review of adjusted descriptions,
review of calculation of fees reflecting reductions and review of detail in fee
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14 |\ MJH application 2.50 | 425.00 1,062.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/14/14|MJH Draft email correspondence to Fee Examiner to submit November revised invoice 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Performed review and analysis of 36D contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/15/14|DMI Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/15/14| GMK Review and redaction of November Fee statement for HR, ITS, and PLD 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/15/14| GMK Review and redaction of November Fee statement for Finance 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/15/14|JLW November redactions for team 0.80 | 130.00 104.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/15/14 | MJH Email correspondence from Fee Examiner related to November redactions 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/15/14| TAE November redactions 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Reviewed and responded to Fee Examiner comments on December fee statement
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/16/14|CMG related to C. Gannon time entries 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/16/14|DMI Performed November redaction for the following codes: DEBT, DPD, EM, FEE 3.10 | 275.00 852.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/16/14|DMI Performed November redaction for the following codes: GEN, MED, POA, ADMIN 2.80 | 275.00 770.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/16/14| GMK Review and redaction of November 2013 Fee statement for Debt and Projections 1.40 | 425.00 595.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/16/14|JLW Continued November redactions for team 0.50 | 130.00 65.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/16/14|JLW Continue compilation of December responses for FE for team 0.30 | 130.00 39.00
Review file containing December responses to Fee Examiner comments prepared
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/16/14 |MJH by J. Wood (CM) to address questions 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14|CMM Prepare redactions for November fee statement 0.50 | 495.00 247.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14|DMI Performed additional redactions for DEBT code, per request of G. Kushiner (CM) 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14|DMI Performed additional redactions for MED code, per request of C. Moore (CM) 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14 |JLW Continue compilation of December responses for FE for team 0.40 | 130.00 52.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14|JLW November redactions for team 0.20 | 130.00 26.00
Review redactions for FEE, GEN and ADMIN departments in November invoice
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14 | MJH completed by D. lafrate (CM) 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14 | MJH Review December responses to Fee Examiner comments received from J. Wood 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Prepare analysis related to Conway weekly team meetings related to the
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/17/14|MJH December invoice 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/18/14 |JLW Continue compilation of November redactions for team 0.10 | 130.00 13.00
Finalize Conway responses related to Preliminary December Report from the Fee
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/18/14|MJH Examiner 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

13-53846-swr

171

Doc 8186-2 Filed 11/05/14 Entered 11/05/14 18:21:50 Page 54 of




I Exhibit A I

City of Detroit, Michigan, Debtor
Chapter 9 Case No. 13-53846
United States Bankruptcy Court
Eastern District of Michigan
Southern Division

Conway MacKenzie - April 2014 Invoice - Detailed Professional Fees

Billing Date of
Category Service [Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
Submit Conway responses related to Preliminary December Report to Fee
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/18/14|MJH Examiner 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Complete redactions for DWSD and LAW department time detail and department
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/18/14|MJH summaries 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/19/14 | MJH Review November Fee Statement redactions completed by CM team 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Performed review and analysis of DPD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/21/14|DMI Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Performed review and analysis of HR contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee examiner matters | 04/21/14|DMI Examiner. 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Performed review and analysis of PDD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee examiner matters | 04/21/14|DMI Examiner. 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/21/14 |JLW Continue compilation of November redactions for team 1.00 | 130.00 130.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/21/14|JLW Continue compilation of March time entries for team 2.00 | 130.00 260.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/21/14 | KAD Prepare March time detail for DSM and KAD for March Fee Statement 0.30 | 130.00 39.00
Reviewed and redacted November 2013 time entries for Blight and Surplus Land,
Fire Department, EM and Michigan Statute, Finance, and Human Resources
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/21/14|KJH matters 1.60 | 425.00 680.00
Prepare email correspondence to CM team related to update of required
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/21/14|MJH information and dates 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/21/14 | TAE Completed and submitted March Fee application detail 1.80 | 425.00 765.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14|CMG Reviewed and edited fee redactions for fee statement 1.70 | 425.00 722.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14|JAA Reviewed March time detail for Finance 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14|JLW November redactions finalized and submitted to FE 1.00 | 130.00 130.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14 | KAD Prepare contractor's time for March Fee Statement 0.30 | 130.00 39.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14 | KAD Prepare time and expense detail for March Fee Statement 0.50 | 130.00 65.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14|KAD Prepare detailed expense schedule for March Fee Statement 0.20 | 130.00 26.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14 | KAD Prepare first draft of March Fee Statement 0.50 | 130.00 65.00
Review March expense detail prepared by K. Dippel (CM) and email to her
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14 | MJH regarding same 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Review redacted invoice prepared by J. Wood (CM) reflecting redactions by
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/22/14 |MJH various CM professionals to approve prior to submission to the Fee Examiner 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/23/14|JLW Continue compilation of March time entries for team 3.00 | 130.00 390.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/23/14 |KJH Reviewed and updated March 2014 time detail and task codes 1.70 | 425.00 722.50
Review time entries and submit to J. Wood (CM) for inclusion in consolidated
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/23/14|MJH March time detail schedule 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/24/14|JAA Finalize time detail related to the month of March 0.90 | 345.00 310.50
Continue compilation of March time entries for team, March time entries received
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/24/14|JLW from team members integrated to March master file for monthly invoice 0.40 | 130.00 52.00
Email correspondence with M. Hausman (CM) related to March time detail and
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/24/14 | JLW assignment of department summaries 0.40 | 130.00 52.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/24/14|KAD Revisions to draft March Fee Statement regarding time detail 0.30 | 130.00 39.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/24/14 |KJH Continued to review and updated March 2014 time detail and task codes 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Email correspondence with J. Wood (CM) related to March time detail and
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/24/14 |\ MJH assignment of department summaries 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/25/14 | DAR Prepare time summary and details for March 2014 fee application 0.90 | 345.00 310.50
E-mail communications with J. Wood regarding time details and fee application
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/25/14| DAR issues 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
Provided guidance via email correspondence to A. Solovich and E. Crandell (CM)
regarding their time reporting requirements, necessary for invoice submission to
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/25/14|DMI fee examiner 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Continue compilation of March time entries for team, March time entries received
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/25/14|JLW from team members integrated to March master file for monthly invoice 1.80 | 130.00 234.00
E-mail communications with D. Reich regarding time details and fee application
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/25/14|JLW issues 0.70 | 130.00 91.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/25/14 |KJH Completed review and updated March 2014 time detail and task codes 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/25/14| TAE Complete summary write ups for March Fee Application 1.10 | 425.00 467.50
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Drafted March fee statement departmental write-up for DPW related to certain
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14|CJS activities 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Drafted March fee statement departmental write-up for FIN related to certain
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14|CJS activities 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
E-mail communications with J. Wood regarding time details and fee application
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14| DAR issues 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14 | DAR Update time summary and details for March 2014 fee application 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14|JAA Prepare summary of activities related to the month of March for PROJ time code 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14|JAA Prepare summary of activities related to the month of March for FIN time code 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
E-mail communications with D. Reich regarding time details and fee application
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14|JLW issues 0.40 | 130.00 52.00
Review preliminary March fee application summary pages prepared by K. Dippel
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/26/14|MJH (CM) 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Performed review of March time detail for the following codes: AIR, CC, DEBT,
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/27/14|DMI DPD 1.60 | 275.00 440.00
Performed review of March time detail for the following codes: EM, FEE, GEN,
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/27/14|DMI LAW, MED, POA 2.40 | 275.00 660.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/27/14|JAA Review PROJ and FIN project code time detail related to the month of March 1.70 | 345.00 586.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/27/14|JAA Review PROJ time detail related to the month of March 1.50 | 345.00 517.50
Reviewed and edited March fee application write ups, time entries, and related
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|CMG items 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Performed review and analysis of DPD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|DMI Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Performed review and analysis of 36th District Court contractor's weekly time
submission to ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing
agency. This is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|DMI the Fee Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Prepared verbiage for March fee application related to the following codes: AIR,
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|DMI CC, DEBT, DPD 1.90 | 275.00 522.50
Prepared verbiage for March fee application related to the following codes: EM,
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|DMI FEE, GEN, LAW, MED, POA 2.80 | 275.00 770.00
Performed review and analysis of HR contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee
Fee examiner matters | 04/28/14|DMI Examiner. 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Reviewed and updated March time entries related to Blight 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14 | EMP Prepared March department time entry summary related to Blight 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Reviewed and updated March time entries related to Fire department 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Prepared March department time entry summary related to Fire department 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Reviewed and updated March time entries related to DHWP 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14 | EMP Prepared March department time entry summary related to DHWP 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Reviewed and updated March time entries related to Mayor's Office 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14 | EMP Prepared March department time entry summary related to Mayor's Office 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Reviewed and updated March time entries related to Ombudsperson Office 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Prepared March department time entry summary related to Ombudsperson Office 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Reviewed and updated March time entries related to Recreation department 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|EMP Prepared March department time entry summary related to Recreation department 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Fee examiner matters | 04/28/14|GMK Review and analysis of ITS time entries for March 2014 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Fee examiner matters | 04/28/14| GMK Preparation of ITS summary write-up for March 2014 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Preparation of detailed descriptions/summary of the services rendered during the
invoice’s referenced time period. Preparation of the detailed description/summary
of services rendered for the CM monthly invoice is required in order to comply with
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|JAA the Court's Fee Review Order 1.40 | 345.00 483.00
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14|JLW March revisions for invoice review, for team 1.50 | 130.00 195.00
Prepared verbiage for March fee application related to the following codes:
Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14| MCW BSEED, CLK, DAH, ELC, and some PROJ 2.40 | 275.00 660.00
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Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14 |MJH Review DWSD and Law department verbiage and make required edits 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Finalized time entry submissions review for March fee application process for 36D,

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/28/14| TAE GSD, and DDOT 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Developed schedule identifying roles of CM professionals per request from Fee

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/29/14|DMI Examiner 3.20 | 275.00 880.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/29/14|JAA Review PROJ and FIN project code time detail related to the month of March 2.10 | 345.00 724.50

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/29/14|JAA Redacted December time entries for FIN and PROJ codes 1.20 | 345.00 414.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/29/14|JLW Finalize March revisions for invoice review, for team 4.00 | 130.00 520.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/29/14 |JLW December Invoice revisions update for team, prepare document for redactions 1.00 | 130.00 130.00
Work on March fee application including review and edit to department summaries

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/29/14 |MJH prepared by CM professionals 2.50 | 425.00 1,062.50

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14|CMG Drafted PDD March fee application overview 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14|CMG Performed review of time entry redactions performed by D. lafrate (CM) 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Performed review and analysis of PDD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This
is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Fee examiner matters | 04/30/14|DMI Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Finalize December Invoice revisions update for team, prepare document for

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14|JLW redactions 2.00 | 130.00 260.00
Email correspondence with M. Hausman related to revisions and redaction of

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14 |JLW December fee application 0.40 | 130.00 52.00
Revisions to March Fee Statement regarding professional time and fee code

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14 |KAD summary 0.70 | 130.00 91.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14|KAD Revisions to December Fee Statement per Fee Examiner's instructions 0.80 | 130.00 104.00

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14 | KAD Additional revisions to December Fee Statement per Fee Examiner's instructions 0.20 | 130.00 26.00
Email correspondence with J. Wood related to revisions and redaction of

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14 |MJH December fee application 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Continue work on March fee application including review and edit to department

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14 |MJH summaries prepared by CM professionals 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Review revisions to December fee application per Fee Examiner comments

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14 |MJH prepared by J. Wood (CM) 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Fee Examiner Matters | 04/30/14 | TAE Complete redactions of December fee application for distribution 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Meeting with J. Hill (CFO), senior finance staff, and G. Kushiner (CM) regarding

Finance Department Finance reorg process, ERP system selection and implementation process,

Matters 04/01/14|CMG revised org charts, and next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/01/14|CMG Meeting with N. Johnson (Grants) regarding org chart and job descriptions 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/01/14|CMG Meeting with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding finance restructuring 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participation in meeting with J. Hill (CFO), senior Finance staff, and C. Gannon

Finance Department (CM) regarding Finance reorganization process, ERP system selection and

Matters 04/01/14|GMK implementation process, revised org charts, and next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Preparation for Meeting with J. Hill (CFO), senior Finance staff, and C. Gannon

Finance Department (CM) regarding Finance reorganization process, ERP system selection and

Matters 04/01/14|GMK implementation process, revised org charts, and next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/01/14| GMK Preparation of Finance Department organizational restructuring work-plan 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Email communications with C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison (CM), and PM regarding

Matters 04/01/14|GMK future meeting agenda on Finance Dept. organizational restructuring work-stream 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Reviewed Treasury Division data including revenue billed for other departments

Matters 04/01/14|JAA from T. Tolliver (Treasury) regarding cost allocations 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department Edited document to provide Barclays information related to breakdown of

Matters 04/01/14|JAA operating, capital and blight related expenses 1.50 | 345.00 517.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/01/14|JAA Communicated with R. Quinton (PCG) regarding Treasury Cost Allocations 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department Met with E. Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer) regarding capitalization threshold

Matters 04/01/14|JAA policy 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/01/14|JAA Email correspondence with T. Eddy (CM) regarding GSD capital plan 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
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Finance Department Email correspondence with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding capital expenses included
Matters 04/01/14|JAA in Quality of Life project summary 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/01/14|JAA 2.30 | 345.00 793.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/01/14|JAA 1.30 | 345.00 448.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/01/14|JAA Call with regarding request of information from City of Detroit 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Finance Department Followed-up L. Duncan (Treasury) regarding- data request for NSF
Matters 04/01/14|JAA checks 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/01/14|MJH 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/01/14|MJH 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/01/14| TAE 1.10 | 425.00 467.50
Finance Department E-mail communications with D. Settles (Risk Management) to receive feedback
Matters 04/01/14| TAE and necessary edits to Risk Management cost analysis 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/01/14| TAE 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Discussion with B. Dick (GSD) regarding status and next steps for lease
Matters 04/01/14| TAE renegotiations 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Finance Department Reviewed amended Disclosure Statement for required edits to DDOT narrative
Matters 04/01/14 | TAE and summary 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Prepare detailed analysis of solid waste and water delinquent property tax
Finance Department recoveries and chargebacks for FY 2008 - 2013 per N. Timmons (Treasury)
Matters 04/01/14|\WPJ request 2.30 | 275.00 632.50
Prepare revisions to delinquent property tax recoveries and chargebacks analysis
Finance Department for Treasury's on going use in Wayne County Revolving Fund process per N.
Matters 04/01/14|WPJ Timmons and L. Duncan (Treasury) requests 2.60 | 275.00 715.00
Finance Department Reviewed latest draft analysis from W. Johnston (CM) regarding monthly property
Matters 04/02/14|CJS tax settlement statements from Wayne County covering previous five years 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Finance Department Met with W. Johnston (CM) to review and provide further direction on analysis
Matters 04/02/14|CJS regarding monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne County 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
Finance Department Reviewed due diligence information from K. Herman (MB) for UTGO financial
Matters 04/02/14|CJS advisors 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/02/14|CJS Updated master restructuring project list for J. Hill (CFO) related to MPD 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Updated master restructuring project list for J. Hill (CFO) related to surplus asset
Matters 04/02/14|CJS auction 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Reviewed and revised analysis regarding monthly property tax settlement
Matters 04/02/14|CJS statements from Wayne County 2.70 | 425.00 1,147.50
Finance Department Correspondence with J. Hill (CFO) regarding onboarding additional finance
Matters 04/02/14|CMG contractor assistance 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Finance Department Participation in conference call with J. Addison (CM) and PM regarding Finance
Matters 04/02/14| GMK Department organizational restructuring work-stream 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Finance Department Preparation for conference call with J. Addison (CM) and PM regarding Finance
Matters 04/02/14|GMK Department organizational restructuring work-stream 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/02/14|GMK 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) and PM regarding Assessing
Matters 04/02/14 | GMK Corrective Action Plan vendor responses and cost 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finance Department Email communications with JD, J. Naglick (Finance), J. Addison (CM), and other
Matters 04/02/14|GMK City representatives regarding status of Quality of Life tax exempt analysis 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Finance Department Review and analysis of Budget Best Practices from Best Practices for Michigan
Matters 04/02/14|GMK Local Government Business Processes document 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Met with CityTax regarding data conversion update, Comerica lockbox interface
test update, Chase file interface test update, Dummy record test update, Treasury
payment file interface test update, update on court charges, letters and notices
Finance Department update, test file, tasks to be completed and City update on check stock and
Matters 04/02/14|JAA cleared check file 1.70 | 345.00 586.50
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Finance Department Participated in call with G. Kushiner (CM), and

Matters 04/02/14|JAA regarding finance department organizational charts 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

Finance Department Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document

Matters 04/02/14|MCW provided by HR 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Finance Department Meeting with D. Settles (Risk Management) regarding files provided related to

Matters 04/02/14|MJH Risk Management 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Email correspondence with R. Presnell (EMO) related to cost analysis on workers

Matters 04/02/14 |MJH compensation 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Meeting with N. Timmons (Treasury) to discuss outstanding requests and follow-

Finance Department up on questions to facilitate completion of UTGO bondholder due diligence

Matters 04/02/14|\WPJ analysis 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Finance Department Met with C. Sekely (CM) to review and receive further direction on analysis

Matters 04/02/14|WPJ regarding monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne County 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Meeting with N. Timmons (Treasury) to discuss missing check copies and other

Finance Department requested information in order to complete UTGO bondholder due diligence

Matters 04/02/14|WPJ analysis 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

Finance Department Added one further revision to analysis regarding monthly property tax settlement

Matters 04/03/14|CJS statements from Wayne County 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussed future state purchasing functions and reorganization process with T.

Matters 04/03/14|EMP Eddy (CM) 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Finance Department Multiple email communications with M. Jamison (Finance), L. Duncan (Treasury),

Matters 04/03/14| GMK and J. Addison (CM) regarding employee questionnaire responses 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Email communications with HR representatives regarding Finance Dept. employee

Matters 04/03/14|GMK questionnaires 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Multiple email communications with J. Addison (CM) and M. Jamison (Finance)

Matters 04/03/14| GMK regarding Operating Departments Finance function employee questionnaires 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Meeting with D. lafrate (CM) regarding DPD overlay to discuss training and labor

Matters 04/03/14|JAA changes 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Finance Department Call with J. Doak (MB), JD, J. Naglick (CM), L. Duncan (CM) and G. Kushiner

Matters 04/03/14|JAA (CM) regarding tax vs. non-tax proceeds from post-petition financing 1.50 | 345.00 517.50

Finance Department Preparation for call with J. Doak (MB), JD, J. Naglick (CM), L. Duncan (CM) and

Matters 04/03/14|JAA G. Kushiner (CM) regarding tax vs. non-tax proceeds from post-petition financing 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
Reviewed cooperative purchasing process and requirements, including

Finance Department cooperative memberships, for inclusion in Request for Quote and Request for

Matters 04/03/14 |KJH Proposal process flow maps 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

Finance Department Reviewed contract checklist for inclusion in Request for Quote and Request for

Matters 04/03/14|KJH Proposal process flow maps 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Finance Department Updated Purchasing Request for Quote and Request for Proposal process flow

Matters 04/03/14 |KJH maps 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

Finance Department Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Matters 04/03/14| MCW document for MB and JD 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/03/14|MJH 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Email correspondence with R. Presnell (EMO) related to cost analysis on workers

Matters 04/03/14|MJH compensation 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/03/14|MJH 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Prepared for meeting with Risk Management group by updating and distributing

Finance Department claims administration's future organization and function chart for review and

Matters 04/03/14| TAE discussion 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Met with D. Settles (Risk Management) to discuss and review current Risk

Finance Department Management organization and functions in order to determine inner cost to provide

Matters 04/03/14|TAE workers comp claim services, 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

Finance Department Discussed future state purchasing functions and reorganization process with E.

Matters 04/03/14| TAE Petrovski (CM) 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Make revisions to UTGO bondholder due diligence analysis of monthly delinquent

Matters 04/03/14|WPJ tax receipts per C. Sekely' s (CM) comments 2.40 | 275.00 660.00

Finance Department Phone call with W. Johnston (CM) regarding monthly property tax settlement

Matters 04/04/14|CJS statements from Wayne County covering previous five years 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Performed review of Treasury materials provided by L. Duncan (Finance) in

Matters 04/04/14|DMI preparation of organizational chart meeting 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
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Finance Department Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding preparation of summary of employee

Matters 04/04/14 | GMK questionnaire results 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/04/14| GMK Review and analysis of Corporate income tax analysis 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) and M. Smiley (Mayor's)regarding

Matters 04/04/14 | GMK Corporate income tax analysis 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) regarding Operating Department

Matters 04/04/14|GMK Finance function related employee questionnaires received 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Review email questions from || r<c=cing Treasury

Matters 04/04/14|JAA Division Indirect Rates 1.60 | 345.00 552.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/04/14|JAA Pre-call with MB, JD, EY regarding 40-year projections (partial participation) 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/04/14|JAA Update Finance Department 10-year projections related to timing deferrals 1.70 | 345.00 586.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/04/14|JAA Prepared Corporate tax analysis for L. Howse (Mayor Chief of Staff) 1.80 | 345.00 621.00

Finance Department Email communication with G. Kushiner (CM) to discuss analysis for Mayor

Matters 04/04/14|JAA regarding Corporate Income tax 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Finance Department Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding CityTax, Non-filer program,-

Matters 04/04/14|JAA 1.30 | 345.00 448.50
Meeting with W. Johnston (CM) to discuss preparing template to create

Finance Department summaries of job description questionnaire responses for Finance department

Matters 04/04/14|JAA restructuring 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/04/14|JAA Review CityTax update from R. Carpenter (ISSI) 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department Met with F. Crawford (Income Tax) to review data related to Corporate income tax

Matters 04/04/14|JAA request from Mayor's office 1.40 | 345.00 483.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/04/14|JAA Respond to email questions from-regarding Treasury Division Indirect Rates 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding preparation of summary of employee

Matters 04/04/14|JAA questionnaire results 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Reviewed Purchasing Ordinances and requirements, for inclusion in Request for

Matters 04/04/14|KJH Quote and Request for Proposal process flow maps 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

Finance Department Reviewed Purchasing Request for Proposal template, for inclusion in Request for

Matters 04/04/14|KJH Proposal process flow map 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Reviewed Purchasing presentations, process outlines, EM orders, and

Finance Department suggestions, for inclusion in Request for Quote and Request for Proposal process

Matters 04/04/14|KJH flow maps 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Finance Department Continued to update Purchasing Request for Quote and Request for Proposal

Matters 04/04/14 |KJH process flow maps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Drafted and sent e-mail correspondence to C. Gannon (CM) regarding

Matters 04/04/14 |KJH procurement process flow maps 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Review analysis prepared by T. Eddy (CM) related to Risk Management future

Matters 04/04/14|MJH cost scenario's 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Reviewed and created summary analysis of Finance Family Medical Leave

Matters 04/04/14| TAE Absences 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Met with K. Hand (CM) to discuss changes for purchasing process work flow

Matters 04/04/14| TAE analysis in order to develop improved process 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
E-Mail communications with M. Hausman (CM) and R. Presnell (EMO) regarding

Finance Department status and next steps for implementation of third party administration for workers

Matters 04/04/14 | TAE compensation administration 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Complied revision of Internal Risk Management cost analysis for Request for

Finance Department Proposal evaluation based on input and changes from Risk Management

Matters 04/04/14 | TAE department 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
E-mail communications with D. Settles (Risk Management) regarding revisions

Finance Department and updates to worker's compensation administration future state organizational

Matters 04/04/14| TAE chart 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Prepare revisions to analysis of Wayne County revolving fund worksheet for N.

Finance Department Timmons (Treasury) for her continued use in analysis of monthly settlement

Matters 04/04/14|WPJ statements 1.70 | 275.00 467.50

Finance Department Meeting with J. Addison (CM) to discuss preparing template to create summaries

Matters 04/04/14|WPJ of job description questionnaire responses for Finance department restructuring 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
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Finance Department Review of comments from C. Sekely (CM) regarding UTGO bondholder due

Matters 04/04/14|\WPJ diligence revisions 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Finance Department Phone call with C. Sekely (CM) regarding monthly property tax settlement

Matters 04/04/14|\WPJ statements from Wayne County covering previous five years 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Finance Department Continued review of Treasury materials provided by L. Duncan (Finance) in

Matters 04/05/14|DMI preparation of organizational chart meeting 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Finance Department Email communications with C. Gannon (CM) regarding status of updated business

Matters 04/05/14 | GMK case template 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Email communications with C. Moore (CM) regarding Corporate income tax

Matters 04/05/14 | GMK analysis 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/05/14|JAA 2.10 | 345.00 724.50
Reviewed and responded to e-mail correspondence with C. Gannon (CM) and T.

Finance Department Eddy (CM) regarding Purchasing process flow, requirements, supplier concerns,

Matters 04/05/14|KJH initiatives, departmental communication plan, and next steps 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Met with T. Eddy (CM) regarding Purchasing process flow, requirements, supplier

Matters 04/05/14|KJH concerns, initiatives, departmental communication plan, and next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Met with K. Hand (CM) to discuss and develop strategy and next steps tasks

Finance Department related to purchasing RFP and RFQ process improvements and plans to

Matters 04/05/14 | TAE coordinate efforts with Lean Process Improvement and teams 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Input comments for the restructuring/reinvestment projections in Plan of

Matters 04/06/14| MCW Adjustment 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Reviewed and commented on latest draft analysis from W. Johnston (CM)

Finance Department regarding monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne County

Matters 04/07/14|CJS covering previous five years 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Met with W. Johnston (CM) to provide direction on finalizing the draft analysis

Finance Department regarding monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne County

Matters 04/07/14|CJS covering previous five years 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Distributed draft analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements from

Finance Department Wayne County covering previous five years to K. Herman (MB) and D. Jerneycic

Matters 04/07/14|CJS (EY) 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Distributed draft analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements from

Finance Department Wayne County covering previous five years to L. Duncan (Treasury), M. Jamison

Matters 04/07/14|CJS (Finance) and E. Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer) 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Correspondence with K. Herman (Buckfire) regarding surplus assets auction

Matters 04/07/14|CJS process 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Participated in Treasury org chart meeting with L. Duncan (Finance), M. Jamison

Matters 04/07/14|DMI (Finance) and L. Zyla (PM) to discuss transitional period and future state 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Finance Department Prepared for Treasury org chart meeting with L. Duncan (Finance), M. Jamison

Matters 04/07/14|DMI (Finance) and L. Zyla (PM) to discuss transitional period and future state 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Finance Department Met with G. Kushiner (CM) and J. Addison (CM) to provide a status update on

Matters 04/07/14|DMI Finance transitional and future state organizational structure 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14 |GMK employee questionnaire responses 0.10 | 425.00 42.50

Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14 GMK employee questionnaire response summary template 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Email communications with C. Moore (CM), K. Hand (CM), and C. Gannon (CM)

Finance Department regarding status of Quality of Life loan and impact on City-wide restructuring

Matters 04/07/14|GMK project templates 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Participation in meeting with J. Naglick (Director of Finance) regarding status of

Finance Department Quality of Life Loan and Finance Department organizational restructuring work-

Matters 04/07/14| GMK stream 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Discussion with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding next steps for Finance

Matters 04/07/14| GMK Department organizational restructuring work-stream 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Participation in meeting with D. lafrate (CM) and J. Addison (CM) to provide a

Matters 04/07/14|GMK status update on Finance transitional and future state organizational structure 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14| GMK Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding work priorities for the day 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Email communications with HR Deputy Director regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14 |GMK employee questionnaire responses 0.10 | 425.00 42.50

Finance Department Updated timing for training related expenses within the Finance Department 10-

Matters 04/07/14|JAA year projections 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14|JAA Updated Finance Department Organizational chart 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
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Finance Department Met with G. Kushiner (CM) and D. lafrate (CM) to receive a status update on

Matters 04/07/14|JAA Finance transitional and future state organizational structure 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding finalizing questions for-

Matters 04/07/14|JAA 1.30 | 345.00 448.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14|JAA 1.90 | 345.00 655.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14|JAA Met with K. Haves (HR) regarding employee roster and surveys 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14|JAA Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding work priorities for the day 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/07/14|JAA Coordinate updates to 10-year restructuring projections with CM team 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Create variance analysis of revised 10-year plan to prior version in order to explain

Matters 04/07/14|JAA variances 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Met with D. Brown (Income Tax) regarding corporate income tax return and

Finance Department withholding tax return data in order to respond to questions ||

Matters 04/07/14|JAA 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Review email correspondence with and regarding ITS

Matters 04/07/14|JAA project costs 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Reconciled personal service contracts for department with information provided by

Finance Department Purchasing Department (Finance) in order to provide City with accurate account

Matters 04/07/14| MCW of contracts 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Finance Department Review Risk Management budget analysis assuming an outside third party

Matters 04/07/14|MJH administrator is hired 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Met with J. Naglick (Director of Finance) regarding status and next step tasks

Finance Department regarding evaluation of third party administrator for workers' compensation claims

Matters 04/07/14| TAE administration 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Prepare reconciliation analysis of Wayne County Annual Settlement figures of

Finance Department 2010 delinquent tax collections to UTGO bondholder due diligence analysis per

Matters 04/07/14 \WPJ MB request 1.40 | 275.00 385.00
Met with C. Sekely (CM) to received further direction on finalizing the draft

Finance Department analysis regarding monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne

Matters 04/07/14|\WPJ County covering previous five years 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Finance Department Discussion with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding Detroit Resource Management

Matters 04/08/14 | GMK System related job descriptions 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Participation in meeting with M. Smiley (Mayor's) regarding Quality of Life Loan

Matters 04/08/14| GMK restructuring projects and process for obtaining funds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Preparation for meeting with M. Smiley (Mayor's) regarding Quality of Life Loan

Matters 04/08/14| GMK restructuring projects and process for obtaining funds 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Email communications with M. Walsh (CM) and J. Addison (CM) regarding

Matters 04/08/14| GMK Finance Department employee questionnaire responses 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/08/14 | GMK outsourcing/privatization potential projects 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Email communications with HR Deputy Director regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/08/14 | GMK employee questionnaire responses 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Met with J. Addison (CM) regarding Finance Department opportunities for

Matters 04/08/14|GMK upcoming meeting with EM and Mayor 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/08/14|JAA Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding corporate income tax analysis 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding weekly meeting including CityTax,

Matters 04/08/14|JAA non-filers for 2012, Compuware and corporate taxes 1.40 | 345.00 483.00

Finance Department Teleconference with C. Dodd (ITS), Karl (PM) and L. Zyla (PM) regarding ITS

Matters 04/08/14|JAA budget and recommended updates 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Finance Department Email correspondence with S. Patton (PM) regarding assessing Request for

Matters 04/08/14|JAA Proposal and associated costs 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Finance Department Updated Finance Department 10-year projections to reflect latest labor and benefit

Matters 04/08/14|JAA assumptions 1.60 | 345.00 552.00

Finance Department Met with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding Finance Department opportunities for

Matters 04/08/14|JAA upcoming meeting with EM and Mayor 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department Met with T. Hadley (Finance) to accumulate completed Finance Department

Matters 04/08/14|JAA Surveys in order to analyze for Finance Department Reorganization 1.00 | 345.00 345.00
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Finance Department

Matters 04/08/14|JAA Updated related to the Finance Department 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/08/14|JAA I o oicctions 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/08/14|JAA Met with K. Haves (HR) regarding employee surveys for the Finance Department 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department Met with D. Brown (Income Tax) regarding latest update from CityTax and status

Matters 04/08/14 |JAA report on implementation 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Discussed WC TPA status and internal evaluation information with M. Hausman

Finance Department (CM), WC TP refers to the Workers Compensation's claims Third Party

Matters 04/08/14| TAE Administrator (WC TPA) 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Prepared for meeting with L. Duncan (Treasury) and W. Johnston (CM) to discuss

Finance Department draft analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne County

Matters 04/09/14|CJS covering previous five years 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Met with L. Duncan (Treasury) and W. Johnston (CM) to discuss draft analysis of

Finance Department monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne County covering previous

Matters 04/09/14|CJS five years 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Finance Department Email communications with C. Moore (CM), K. Hand (CM), and C. Gannon (CM)

Matters 04/09/14| GMK regarding status of Quality of Life loan proceeds 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Email communications with potential payment vendor regarding ability to provide

Matters 04/09/14|GMK services at Parking 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Email communications with P. Scales (Budget) regarding restructuring project

Matters 04/09/14|GMK template 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Reviewed related to each division of the Finance

Matters 04/09/14|JAA Department in order to quantify and summarize for meeting with City management 1.40 | 345.00 483.00

Finance Department Reviewed correspondence from CityTax regarding income tax system

Matters 04/09/14|JAA implementation 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Updates to Finance Department opportunities matrix for upcoming meeting with

Matters 04/09/14|JAA EM and Mayor 1.70 | 345.00 586.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/09/14|JAA Reviewed updates related to the Finance Department 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department Make revisions to Wayne County revolving fund analysis per comments from L.

Matters 04/09/14|WPJ Duncan (Treasury) 1.40 | 275.00 385.00
Meeting with L. Duncan (Treasury), C. Sekely (CM), and N. Timmons (Treasury)

Finance Department to discuss Wayne County revolving fund analysis for UTGO bondholder due

Matters 04/09/14|WPJ diligence 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Finance Department Met with J. Naglick (Director of Finance) to discus<|j| | NN

Matters 04/10/14|CJS property taxes 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Prepared for meeting with K. Herman (MB), D. Jerneycic (EY) and W. Johnston

Finance Department (CM) to discuss draft analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements from

Matters 04/10/14|CJS Wayne County covering previous five years 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Conference call with K. Herman (MB), D. Jerneycic (EY) and W. Johnston (CM) to

Finance Department discuss draft analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne

Matters 04/10/14|CJS County covering previous five years 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Met with W. Johnston (CM) to discuss next steps in analysis of monthly property

Matters 04/10/14|CJS tax settlement statements from Wayne County covering previous five years 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Participation in meeting with J. Hill (CFO) and K. Hand (CM) regarding business

Matters 04/10/14 | GMK case template for Quality of Life proceeds and related department communications 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Participation in meeting with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding Quality of Life

Matters 04/10/14 | GMK proceeds request and approval process 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Finance Department Preparation for meeting with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding Quality of Life

Matters 04/10/14 |GMK proceeds request and approval process 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Email communications with C. Moore (CM) and J. Addison (CM) regarding status

Matters 04/10/14|GMK of GC Services contract for income tax collections 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Review of email communications between J. Naglick (Finance) and legal counsel

Matters 04/10/14|GMK regarding use of Quality of Life proceeds 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Updated Assessing Division 10-year projection related to latest information

Matters 04/10/14|JAA gleaned from Assessing Corrective Action Plan RFP process 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department Communication with regarding Assessing Corrective Action Plan

Matters 04/10/14 | JAA and Organizational Chart 0.90 | 345.00 310.50
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Finance Department Reviewed all updates to 10-year restructuring projections to understand key

Matters 04/10/14|JAA variances by department 2.40 | 345.00 828.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/10/14|JAA Created summary file of 10-year projections to include in Disclosure Statement 1.20 | 345.00 414.00

Finance Department Met with S. Sarna (EY) regarding updated 10-year restructuring projections and

Matters 04/10/14|JAA link to the base case projections 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Created variance analysis for 10-year restructuring projections to prior version in

Matters 04/10/14|JAA order to analyze changes 1.70 | 345.00 586.50

Finance Department Reviewed e-mail correspondence with Finance leadership and CM representatives

Matters 04/10/14|KJH regarding Finance restructuring planning meeting agenda and schedule 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Provided edits to Restructuring Initiatives Business Case Template for use by

Matters 04/10/14 | MCW Purchasing Department 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/10/14| TAE Interviewed potential Purchasing candidate for contract staffing resource 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

Finance Department E-mail communications with R. Presnell (EMO) regarding status and next steps

Matters 04/10/14| TAE regarding privatization of worker's comp third party administration 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Provided edits and revisions to ||| NG ' r'icv

Matters 04/10/14 | TAE with Mayor Duggan 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Conference call with K. Herman (MB), D. Jerneycic (EY) and C. Sekely (CM) to

Finance Department discuss draft analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements from Wayne

Matters 04/10/14 \WPJ County covering previous five years 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Finance Department Met with C. Sekely (CM) to discuss next steps in analysis of monthly property tax

Matters 04/10/14|\WPJ settlement statements from Wayne County covering previous five years 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Finance Department Reviewed Request for Proposal for surplus assets auction posted to City's website

Matters 04/11/14|CJS and requested M. Butler (Purchasing) to distribute the enhanced version 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Reviewed and responded to correspondence from K. Herman (Buckfire) regarding

Matters 04/11/14|CJS Wayne County revolving fund property tax matters 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Reviewed and approved analysis from WPJ (CM) that summarizes the Wayne

Matters 04/11/14|CJS County revolving fund monthly statements over the last five years 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

Finance Department Preparation of draft email to Department Directors regarding preparation of

Matters 04/11/14 | GMK business case templates requesting Quality of Life proceeds 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Multiple email communications with K. Hand (CM), C. Gannon (CM), M. Jamison
(Finance), and other City representatives regarding draft email to Department

Finance Department Directors regarding preparation of business case template requesting Quality of

Matters 04/11/14 | GMK Life proceeds 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussion with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding Department Directors who should

Matters 04/11/14|GMK receive business case template 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Met with B. Jackson and D. Bryant (Purchasing) to discuss staffing requirements

Matters 04/11/14 |\ TAE and opportunity to fill temporary needs with contract resources. 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Met with R. Presnell (EMO) to discuss status and next steps for evaluation of third

Matters 04/11/14| TAE party administrator for workers compensation administration 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Met with B. Jackson and D. Bryant (Purchasing) to discuss future state purchasing

Finance Department organization to support development of reorganization plan and necessary steps

Matters 04/11/14|TAE to accomplish 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Met with D. Settles (Risk Management) to review and update Request for Quote

Finance Department level services for City to provide comparable workers compensation administration

Matters 04/11/14| TAE (.5) and discuss potential improvements and savings that may result (.3) 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Prepare summary schedules for UTGO bondholder due diligence analysis per K.

Matters 04/11/14|WPJ Herman (MB) request 2.40 | 275.00 660.00

Finance Department Prepare revisions to UTGO bondholder due diligence analysis per discussion with

Matters 04/11/14|WPJ K. Herman (MB) 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Finance Department Prepared for phone call with D. Patel (EY) to discuss property tax reporting

Matters 04/12/14|CJS matter 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Phone call with D. Patel (EY) to discuss property tax reporting matters to-

Matters 04/12/14|CJS 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Reviewed draft revisions to the POA and Disclosure Statement relative to MPD,

Matters 04/12/14|CJS DPW and property tax matters 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/12/14 | GMK employee questionnaire 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Review and analysis of updated FY 2015 Finance administration organizational

Matters 04/12/14| GMK chart 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
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Finance Department research regarding the finance department employees for each division

Matters 04/12/14|JAA to understand affiliation with unions with respect to request from EM's office 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Finance Department Reviewed memo from Miller Canfield regarding the State's tax collection process

Matters 04/13/14|CJS and revisits the application of partial pay processes 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Reviewed revised memo from Miller Canfield and related comments from K.

Finance Department Herman (Buckfire( regarding property tax collection process and responded

Matters 04/14/14|CJS accordingly 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Reviewed correspondence from A. Van Dusen (JD) and K. Herman (MB)

Matters 04/14/14|CJS related to property taxes 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/14/14|CMG Review of write up on finance job descriptions by level 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Review of Finance restructuring documents, current state and potential future

Matters 04/14/14 | CMG state org charts, ERP write up to develop plan for finance restructuring 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

Finance Department Obtained Project administration FY 15 transitional org chart from M. Jamison

Matters 04/14/14|DMI (Finance) and performed review 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Finance Department Performed review of| Finance job descriptions as it relates to certain

Matters 04/14/14|DMI Treasury and Grants administration positions in revised org chart 1.50 | 275.00 412.50
Multiple email communications with K. Hand (CM), C. Gannon (CM), T. Eddy

Finance Department (CM), C. Sekely (CM), E. Petrovski (CM), D. lafrate (CM), and M. Walsh (CM)

Matters 04/14/14| GMK regarding Department business case templates 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/14/14|JAA Reviewed updated version of the contract for Income Tax Collections 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Finance Department Met with W. Johnston (CM) and M. Walsh (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/14/14|JAA surveys and summaries along with discussion on outstanding divisions 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department Reviewed e-mail correspondence with C. Dodd (ITS) regarding systems and

Matters 04/14/14|KJH technology used by operating departments 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Analyzed Data Management position employee survey responses for Assessing

Matters 04/14/14|MCW Division in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Finance Department Analyzed Office Assistant Il position employee survey responses for Assessing

Matters 04/14/14|MCW Division in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Finance Department Analyzed Clerk position employee survey responses for Assessing Division in

Matters 04/14/14|MCW connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 0.10 | 275.00 27.50

Finance Department Met with J. Addison (CM) and W. Johnston (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/14/14|MCW surveys and summaries along with discussion on outstanding divisions 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Finance Department E-mail correspondence with B. Jackson (Purchase) regarding hiring of purchasing

Matters 04/14/14| TAE resources 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Analyze income tax investigator job questionnaire responses in connection with

Matters 04/14/14|WPJ finance department organizational restructuring plan 3.00 | 275.00 825.00

Finance Department Analyze income tax division senior income tax investigator job questionnaire

Matters 04/14/14|\WPJ responses in connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 2.60 | 275.00 715.00

Finance Department Analyze income tax division supervising income tax investigator job questionnaire

Matters 04/14/14 \WPJ responses in connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 1.60 | 275.00 440.00

Finance Department Analyze income tax division head clerk job questionnaire responses in connection

Matters 04/14/14|\WPJ with finance department organizational restructuring plan 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

Finance Department Analyze income tax division office assistant Ill (3) job questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/14/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 2.30 | 275.00 632.50

Finance Department Met with J. Addison (CM) and M. Walsh (CM) regarding Finance Department

Matters 04/14/14|\WPJ surveys and summaries along with discussion on outstanding divisions 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Finance Department Participation in meeting with W. Johnston (CM) to discuss finance questionnaire

Matters 04/15/14|ALS summaries and work-stream 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department Begin the summary of Finance department accounting division (Departmental

Matters 04/15/14|ALS Accounting) position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.00 | 130.00 260.00

Finance Department Phone call with K. Herman (Buckfire) regarding partial pay property tax collection

Matters 04/15/14|CJS matters 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Phone call with R. Presnell (EMO) and B. Taylor (PLD) regarding execution plan

Finance Department leading up to preview days for each department involved in the surplus assets

Matters 04/15/14|CJS auction 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Drafted and distributed correspondence to B. Taylor (PLD) regarding execution

Finance Department plan leading up to preview days for each department involved in the surplus

Matters 04/15/14|CJS assets auction 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
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Finance Department Finalized and distributed Request for Proposal Rider #1 for surplus assets auction
Matters 04/15/14|CJS to M. Butler (Purchasing) and D. Bryant (Purchasing) for posting to City's website 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Finance Department Finalized and distributed Request for Proposal Rider #2 for surplus assets auction
Matters 04/15/14|CJS to M. Butler (Purchasing) and D. Bryant (Purchasing) for posting to City's website 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finance Department Reviewed property tax collection rate analysis from D. Patel (EY) || | N N ]JNEE
Matters 04/15/14|CJS 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Finance Department Reviewed drafts of settlement and escrow agreements |||
Matters 04/15/14|CJS as it relates to property taxes 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Finance Department Meeting with G. Kushiner to discuss finance restructuring next steps, meeting
Matters 04/15/14|CMG regarding PMO, and next steps in finance 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participated in meeting with G. Kushiner, C. Gannon, J. Addison, E. Petrovski
(CM), J. Naglick, A. Hohrn, L. Duncan (Finance) to
Finance Department discuss Project administration group and transitional/future state organizational
Matters 04/15/14|CMG structure of Finance Department 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Preparation for meeting with Finance leadership and. regarding Finance
Finance Department restructuring by reviewing current and future state org. charts, Treasury
Matters 04/15/14|CMG assessment reports, ERP best practices documents 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Finance Department Meeting with N. Johnson (Grants) to discuss PDD and grants restructuring
Matters 04/15/14|CMG activities 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Finance Department Follow up correspondence with N. Johnson (Grants) to provide back up materials
Matters 04/15/14|CMG on PDD and grants restructuring activities 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finance Department Correspondence with K. Hand (CM) and E. Petrovski (CM) regarding Lean team
Matters 04/15/14|CMG requests for QOL dollars 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Participated in meeting with G. Kushiner (CM), C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison (CM),
E. Petrovski (CM), J. Naglick (Director of Finance),
Finance Department A. Hohrn (Assessing), L. Duncan (Finance) to discuss Project administration group
Matters 04/15/14|DMI and transitional/future state organizational structure of Finance Department 1.50 | 275.00 412.50
Prepared for meeting with G. Kushiner, C. Gannon, J. Addison, E. Petrovski (CM),
J. Naglick, A. Hohrn, L. Duncan (Finance) to discuss
Finance Department Project administration group and transitional/future state organizational structure
Matters 04/15/14 |DMI of Finance Department 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Performed review and analysis of Treasury process workflow document prepared
Finance Department by PM, for the purpose of understanding direction of revised organizational
Matters 04/15/14|DMI structure 2.30 | 275.00 632.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/15/14|DMI Discussed results of Finance employee surveys with M. Walsh (CM) 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Partially participated in meeting with G. Kushiner (CM), C. Gannon (CM), J.
Addison (CM), E. Petrovski (CM), J. Naglick
(Director of Finance), A. Hohrn (Assessing), L. Duncan (Finance) to discuss
Finance Department Project administration group and transitional/future state organizational structure
Matters 04/15/14| EMP of Finance Department 1.30 | 345.00 448.50
Finance Department Email communications with Finance Director and Deputy Director regarding
Matters 04/15/14 | GMK responses to business case templates 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Discussion with C. Gannon (CM) to discuss Finance organizational restructuring
Finance Department next steps, meeting regarding PMO, and other Finance Department restructuring
Matters 04/15/14|GMK items 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Finance Department Email communications with J. Hill (CFO) regarding "2 for 1" business case
Matters 04/15/14| GMK templates 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/15/14 | GMK Email communications with M. Smiley (Mayor's)regarding business case templates 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) and W. Johnston (CM) regarding
Matters 04/15/14|GMK Finance Dept. employee questionnaires 0.10 | 425.00 42.50
Participated in meeting with D. lafrate (CM), C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison (CM), E.
Petrovski (CM),., J. Naglick (Finance), L. Duncan (Treasury), and other City
Finance Department representatives to discuss Project administration Group and transitional/future
Matters 04/15/14| GMK state organizational structure for Finance Department 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
E. Petrovski (CM),., J. Naglick (Finance), L. Duncan (Treasury), and other City
representatives to discuss Project administration Group and transitional/future
state organizational structure for Finance Department. Preparation included
Finance Department review of current future state organizational chart and draft PMO organization
Matters 04/15/14| GMK chart 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
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Finance Department

Matters ounsiralovc | 120 | 42500 51000

Finance Department

Matters 04/15/14|GMK Review and analysis of Accounting draft structure analysis ||| | | IR 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Finance Department Edited scope to finalize ||| | G co -t

Matters 04/15/14|JAA related to Income Tax collections 1.30 | 345.00 448.50

Finance Department Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding || CityTax. 2012 non-

Matters 04/15/14|JAA filer project and field auditor staffing 1.10 | 345.00 379.50
Prepared for meeting with J. Naglick (Finance), L. Duncan (Treasury), A. Horhn
(Assessing), G. Kushiner (CM), C. Gannon (CM), E.

Finance Department Petrovski (CM) and D. lafrate (CM) to discuss Project administration group and

Matters 04/15/14|JAA transitional/future state organizational structure of Finance Department 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
Met with J. Naglick (Finance), L. Duncan (Treasury), A. Horhn (Assessing),.

, G. Kushiner (CM), C. Gannon (CM), E. Petrovski (CM)

Finance Department and D. lafrate (CM) to discuss Project administration group and transitional/future

Matters 04/15/14|JAA state organizational structure of Finance Department 1.50 | 345.00 517.50

Finance Department Prepared summary of ||| N ithi the 10-vear

Matters 04/15/14|JAA restructuring initiatives 1.20 | 345.00 414.00

Finance Department Email correspondence with CM team regarding |||

Matters 04/15/14|JAA ] 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/15/14 | JAA Incorporated edits into_ summary 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/15/14 KAD Separate questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan project 0.20 | 130.00 26.00

Finance Department Continued analysis of Clerk position employee survey responses for Assessing

Matters 04/15/14| MCW Division in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.30 | 275.00 357.50

Finance Department Analyzed Appraiser | position employee survey responses for Assessing Division

Matters 04/15/14 MCW in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Finance Department Analyzed Appraiser Il position employee survey responses for Assessing Division

Matters 04/15/14| MCW in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department Analyzed Appraiser Il position employee survey responses for Assessing Division

Matters 04/15/14 MCW in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Finance Department Analyzed Project Assistant position employee survey responses for Assessing

Matters 04/15/14|MCW Division in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Finance Department Analyzed Appraiser Tech | position employee survey responses for Assessing

Matters 04/15/14| MCW Division in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Finance Department Analyzed Appraiser Tech Il position employee survey responses for Assessing

Matters 04/15/14| MCW Division in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/15/14  MCW Discussed results of Finance employee surveys with D. lafrate (CM) 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Analyzed Business Support Specialist Il position employee survey responses for

Finance Department Assessing Division in connection with the Finance Department

Matters 04/15/14| MCW reorganization/restructuring 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Finance Department Analyzed Assessor position employee survey responses for Assessing Division in

Matters 04/15/14 MCW connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Meeting with W. Johnston (CM) to provide direction regarding City of Detroit

Finance Department position description questionnaire summaries for finance department labor

Matters 04/15/14|PCA restructuring 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department E-mail correspondence with || S r<o2cing hiring of purchasing

Matters 04/15/14| TAE resources 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Participation in meeting with A. Solovich (CM) to discuss finance questionnaire

Matters 04/15/14|WPJ summaries and work-stream 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Meeting with P. Andrews (CM) to provide direction regarding City of Detroit

Finance Department position description questionnaire summaries for finance department labor

Matters 04/15/14|\WPJ restructuring 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Finance Department Analyze income tax division principal accountant job questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/15/14|\WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 2.80 | 275.00 770.00

Finance Department Analyze income tax division office assistant Il (2) job questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/15/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 1.40 | 275.00 385.00
Analyze income tax division contract/personal service contractors employees

Finance Department questionnaire responses in connection with finance department organizational

Matters 04/15/14|WPJ restructuring plan 2.20 | 275.00 605.00

Finance Department Analyze income tax division manager | (1) and Il (2) questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/15/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 2.60 | 275.00 715.00
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Finance Department Analyze income tax division project managers questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/15/14|\WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 1.80 | 275.00 495.00

Finance Department Complete the summary of Finance department accounting division (Departmental

Matters 04/16/14|ALS Accounting) position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 3.00 | 130.00 390.00
Prepare and complete the summary of Finance department accounting division

Finance Department (Accounts Payable) position questionnaire responses for finance labor

Matters 04/16/14|ALS restructuring plan 4.00 | 130.00 520.00
Prepare and complete summary of Finance department accounting division

Finance Department (Central Accounting) position questionnaire responses for finance labor

Matters 04/16/14|ALS restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division (Unclassified)

Matters 04/16/14|ALS position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.50 | 130.00 325.00
Reviewed pro-forma property tax debt millage and debt escrow projection-

Finance Department from K. Herman (MB) and responded

Matters 04/16/14|CJS accordingly 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Prepared for meeting with Finance, Treasury, Accounting, E&Y, and W.

Finance Department Johnston (CM) to discuss analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements

Matters 04/16/14|CJS from Wayne County covering previous five years 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Met (partial participation) with Finance, Treasury, Accounting, E&Y,-and W.

Finance Department Johnston (CM) to discuss analysis of monthly property tax settlement statements

Matters 04/16/14|CJS from Wayne County covering previous five years 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Finance Department Corresponded with and K. Herman (MB) regarding due

Matters 04/16/14|CJS diligence issues with MPD and planning for meeting with G. Brown (EMO) 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Reviewed initial staging of vehicles at Herman Kiefer lot for surplus assets leading

Matters 04/16/14|CJS up to the RFP preview days 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participation in meeting with L. King (HR Consultant) and G. Kushiner (CM)

Finance Department regarding Finance Department organizational restructuring work-stream, current

Matters 04/16/14|CMG organizational chart, current activities, and next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

Finance Department Prepared summary of Treasury Division within the Finance Department related to

Matters 04/16/14 |DMI responses from employee surveys 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Participation in meeting with L. King (HR Consultant) and C. Gannon (CM)

Finance Department regarding Finance Department organizational restructuring work-stream, current

Matters 04/16/14 | GMK organizational chart, current activities, and next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Preparation for meeting with HR Consultant and C. Gannon (CM) regarding

Finance Department Finance Department organizational restructuring work-stream, current

Matters 04/16/14 |GMK organizational chart, current activities, and next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Follow-up from meeting with L. King (HR Consultant) and C. Gannon (CM)
regarding Finance Department organizational restructuring work-stream, current

Finance Department organizational chart, current activities, and next steps including providing various

Matters 04/16/14| GMK files and analyses completed to-date 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14| GMK 2.10 | 425.00 892.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14| GMK 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Met with CityTax regarding status of implementing new Income Tax software

Matters 04/16/14|JAA system, including timeframe, open issues, and key deliverables 1.50 | 345.00 517.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14|JAA 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Reviewed restructuring initiative information in order to discuss with Finance

Matters 04/16/14 |JAA Department Divisions 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14|JAA Reviewed email related to Finance Initiatives from M. Jamison (Finance) 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14|JAA 2.10 | 345.00 724.50

Finance Department Email correspondence with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding |||

Matters 04/16/14|JAA 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14| JAA Reviewed final draft of letter and bill template from CityTax 0.50 | 345.00 172.50
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Continued analysis of Assessor position employee survey responses for

Finance Department Assessing Division in connection with the Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14| MCW reorganization/restructuring 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Finance Department Analyzed Manager Il position employee survey responses for Assessing Division

Matters 04/16/14|MCW in connection with the Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Analyzed Administrative Specialist | position employee survey responses for

Finance Department Assessing Division in connection with the Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14|MCW reorganization/restructuring 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Analyzed Tax Incentive Specialist / Board Of Review Secretary position within the

Finance Department Finance Department related to responses from employee surveys Finance

Matters 04/16/14|MCW Department reorganization/restructuring 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Analyzed Assessor Board Coordinator Division within the Finance Department

Finance Department related to responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14| MCW reorganization/restructuring 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Analyzed Supervisor Of Assessments & Data Management position within the

Finance Department Finance Department related to responses from employee surveys Finance

Matters 04/16/14|MCW Department reorganization/restructuring 1.50 | 275.00 412.50
Analyzed Assessment Records & Administrative Service Supervisor position

Finance Department within the Finance Department related to responses from employee surveys

Matters 04/16/14|MCW Finance Department reorganization/restructuring 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Analyzed General Accounting positions within the Finance Department related to

Finance Department responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Matters 04/16/14 MCW reorganization/restructuring 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division Purchasing position

Matters 04/16/14|PCA questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.50 | 130.00 325.00

Finance Department E-mail communication with regarding resumes and

Matters 04/16/14| TAE candidate qualifications for contract support resources for purchasing 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Continue to analyze income tax division principal accountant job questionnaire

Matters 04/16/14|WPJ responses in connection with finance department organizational restructuring plan 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department Participate in meeting with COD Treasury personnel, C. Sekely (CM-partial

Matters 04/16/14|\WPJ participation), and EY to discuss UTGO bondholder due diligence analysis 2.00 | 275.00 550.00

Finance Department Meeting with A. Crawford (Finance) and EY to discuss property tax roll data and

Matters 04/16/14|WPJ possible system outputs to provide to facilitate analysis of tax payer trends 1.80 | 275.00 495.00

Finance Department Analyze treasury division call center representatives questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/16/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring 2.60 | 275.00 715.00

Finance Department Continuation of Finance department accounting division (General Accounting)

Matters 04/17/14|ALS position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department Complete summary of Finance department accounting division (Unclassified)

Matters 04/17/14|ALS position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 1.00 | 130.00 130.00

Finance Department (Payroll Audit) position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring

Matters 04/17/14|ALS plan 2.50 | 130.00 325.00

Finance Department Complete the summary of Finance department accounting division (Payroll Audit)

Matters 04/17/14|ALS position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division (General

Matters 04/17/14|ALS Accounting) position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.50 | 130.00 325.00

Finance Department Continued to prepare summary of Treasury Division within the Finance

Matters 04/17/14|DMI Department related to responses from employee surveys for Principal Accountants 2.40 | 275.00 660.00

Finance Department Prepared summary of Treasury Division within the Finance Department related to

Matters 04/17/14|DMI responses from employee surveys for Clerks 2.90 | 275.00 797.50

Finance Department Email communications with HR consultant regarding Finance Dept. employee

Matters 04/17/14|GMK questionnaire 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Multiple email communications with E. Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer) regarding

Matters 04/17/14 | GMK business case templates for Quality of Life proceeds 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Multiple email communications with Income Tax Manager regarding business case

Matters 04/17/14 | GMK templates for Quality of Life proceeds 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Multiple email communications with Assessor's Office representatives regarding

Matters 04/17/14 | GMK business case templates for Quality of Life proceeds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Email communications with Purchasing Director regarding business case

Matters 04/17/14 | GMK templates for Quality of Life proceeds 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Email communications with L. Duncan (Treasury) regarding business case

Matters 04/17/14 | GMK templates for Quality of Life proceeds 0.10 | 425.00 42.50

Finance Department Email communications with Finance Deputy Director regarding status of completed

Matters 04/17/14| GMK business case templates 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
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Finance Department Email communications with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding current thinking

Matters 04/17/14| GMK surrounding establishment of a Program Management Office 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussions with HR consultant regarding Finance Department union Collective

Matters 04/17/14|GMK Bargaining Agreement and City Employment Terms 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Email communications with L. King (HR Consultant) regarding Finance Dept.

Matters 04/17/14| GMK examples of performance evaluations 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Review and analysis of Program Management Office organizational structures in

Matters 04/17/14|GMK comparable cities 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14|GMK 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding Finance Department priority work-

Matters 04/17/14| GMK streams 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Multiple email communications with PCG and other Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14| GMK representatives regarding business case templates for QOL proceeds 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14|JAA 1.60 | 345.00 552.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14|JAA Met with A. Horhn (Assessing) regarding organizational chart 1.30 | 345.00 448.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14|JAA Correspondence with Finance Division regarding restructuring templates 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14|JAA 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding Finance Department priority work-

Matters 04/17/14|JAA streams 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Email correspondence with Jones Day and Miller Buckfire regarding Creditor

Matters 04/17/14|JAA questions for supporting documentation of Disclosure Statement data 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department Provided comments to A. Horhn (Assessing) regarding restructuring template for

Matters 04/17/14|JAA Quality of Life Loan proceeds 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14|JAA Reviewed salary band data regarding the Finance Department 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Email correspondence with T. Tolliver (Treasury) and_ regarding

Matters 04/17/14|JAA Treasury Division indirect rate analysis 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division position

Matters 04/17/14|JLW questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 3.50 | 130.00 455.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division risk management

Matters 04/17/14 KAD position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.00 | 130.00 260.00
Analyzed Central Accounting positions within the Finance Department related to

Finance Department responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14| MCW reorganization/restructuring 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Analyzed Departmental Accounting positions within the Finance Department

Finance Department related to responses from employee surveys Finance Department

Matters 04/17/14\ MCW reorganization/restructuring 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division Risk Management

Matters 04/17/14|PCA position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.00 | 130.00 260.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division Purchasing position

Matters 04/17/14 | PCA questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 0.60 | 130.00 78.00

Finance Department Analyze treasury division clerk position questionnaire responses in connection with

Matters 04/17/14|\WPJ finance department organizational restructuring 2.70 | 275.00 742.50

Finance Department Analyze treasury division revenue collector position questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/17/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring 2.60 | 275.00 715.00

Finance Department Analyze treasury division manager positions questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/17/14|\WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring 2.40 | 275.00 660.00

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding priorities of restructuring projects for

Matters 04/18/14|CMG QOL proceeds. 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Continued discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding priorities of restructuring

Matters 04/18/14|CMG projects for Quality of Life proceeds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Correspondence with N. Johnson (Grants) and || I re92rcing QOL

Matters 04/18/14|CMG proceeds and required case write ups to access funds 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Continued to prepare summary of Treasury Division within the Finance

Matters 04/18/14|DMI Department related to responses from employee surveys for Clerks 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding potential assistance to be provided

Matters 04/18/14| EMP related to business case templates for QOL loan. 1.40 | 345.00 241.50
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Finance Department Email communications with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Quality of Life business

Matters 04/18/14| GMK case templates for Grants administration function 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Email communications with J. Hill (CFO), K. Hand (CM), C. Gannon (CM), and E.

Finance Department Petrovski (CM) regarding completion of business case templates for previously

Matters 04/18/14 | GMK approved restructuring projects 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussion with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding potential assistance to be provided

Matters 04/18/14| GMK related to business case templates for Quality of Life loan 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Finance Department Discussion with C. Gannon (CM) regarding priorities of restructuring projects for

Matters 04/18/14| GMK Quality of Life proceeds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/18/14|JAA Analyzed summary of Income Tax job survey responses 1.50 | 345.00 517.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/18/14|JAA Analyzed summary of Accounting Manager and Supervisor job survey responses 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/18/14|JAA Analyzed Assessing job survey responses 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Finance Department Continue to analyze treasury division manager positions questionnaire responses

Matters 04/18/14 \WPJ in connection with finance department organizational restructuring 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department Continue to analyze treasury division revenue collector position questionnaire

Matters 04/18/14|WPJ responses in connection with finance department organizational restructuring 2.30 | 275.00 632.50

Finance Department Analyze treasury division treasurer/cashier positions questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/18/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Finance Department Continue to analyze treasury division clerk position questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/18/14|WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Finance Department Analyze treasury division administrative staff positions questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/18/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department Begin the preparation summary of Police department accounting division (Police)

Matters 04/19/14|ALS position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division (Health) position

Matters 04/19/14|ALS questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division (Lighting) position

Matters 04/19/14|ALS questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 0.50 | 130.00 65.00

Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division (GSD) position

Matters 04/19/14|ALS questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 1.50 | 130.00 195.00

Finance Department Reviewed revised draft settlement agreement from H. Lennox, Esq. (JD) regarding

Matters 04/19/14|CJS UTGO bondholders as it relates to property tax matters 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Reviewed paper from regarding property tax assessment processes

Matters 04/19/14|CJS as it relates to property tax collections 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Reviewed paper from |l revarding Treasury operations as it relates to

Matters 04/19/14|CJS property tax collections 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Review of finance questionnaire summaries prepared by CM administrative staff

Matters 04/19/14 \WPJ and make revisions as necessary 2.30 | 275.00 632.50

Finance Department Analyze treasury division personal service contractor positions questionnaire

Matters 04/20/14|WPJ responses in connection with finance department organizational restructuring 1.30 | 275.00 357.50

Finance Department Prepare summary of Police department accounting division (Police) position

Matters 04/21/14|ALS questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.00 | 130.00 260.00

Finance Department Continued prep of summary of Police department accounting division (Police)

Matters 04/21/14|ALS position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.00 | 130.00 260.00
Prepare for meeting with Finance, Treasury, E&Y, Miller Buckfire, and Miller

Finance Department Canfield regarding property tax partial pay matters and related UTGO due

Matters 04/21/14|CJS diligence matters 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Met with Finance, Treasury, E&Y, Miller Buckfire, and Miller Canfield regarding

Matters 04/21/14|CJS property tax partial pay matters and related UTGO due diligence matters 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/21/14|CMG 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This

Finance Department is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Matters 04/21/14|DMI Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Participation in meeting with E. Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer), J. Addison (CM),

Finance Department and other Accounting representatives to discuss FY 2014/2015 Budget, business

Matters 04/21/14|GMK case templates, and other Accounting related restructuring initiatives 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Preparation for meeting with E. Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer), J. Addison (CM),

Finance Department and other Accounting representatives to discuss FY 2014/2015 Budget, business

Matters 04/21/14|GMK case templates, and other Accounting related restructuring initiatives 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
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Finance Department Email communications with W. Johnston (CM) regarding status of Finance

Matters 04/21/14| GMK Department employee surveys 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Email communications with C. Gannon (CM) and JLW regarding fleet insurance

Matters 04/21/14|GMK for City 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Discussion with J. Hill (CFO) regarding next steps for Finance Department

Matters 04/21/14|GMK organizational restructuring work-stream 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/21/14|GMK Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding work-stream priorities for the week 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/21/14|GMK 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/21/14|JAA Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding work-stream priorities for the Week 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department Reviewed draft of business base request from Assessing in order to provide

Matters 04/21/14|JAA comments on document before submission to the Finance Department 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Finance Department Met with A. Horhn (Assessing) regarding comments on restructuring/reinvestment

Matters 04/21/14|JAA initiative business case 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

Finance Department Email communication with A. Horhn (Assessing) regarding comments on

Matters 04/21/14|JAA restructuring/reinvestment initiative business case 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Finance Department Reviewed triennial budget package from Assessing in order to populate

Matters 04/21/14|JAA restructuring/reinvestment initiative business case request 1.60 | 345.00 552.00

Finance Department Met with E. Higgs (Accounting), C. Parker (Accounting) and G. Kushiner (CM)

Matters 04/21/14|JAA regarding Accounting staffing and reorganization 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/21/14|MCW 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Analyze planning and development department office assistant Ill (3) positions

Finance Department questionnaire responses in connection with finance department organizational

Matters 04/21/14|WPJ restructuring 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Analyze planning and development department principal development specialist

Finance Department positions questionnaire responses in connection with finance department

Matters 04/21/14 \WPJ organizational restructuring 2.30 | 275.00 632.50
Analyze planning and development department senior accountant positions

Finance Department questionnaire responses in connection with finance department organizational

Matters 04/21/14|WPJ restructuring 2.50 | 275.00 687.50
Analyze planning and development department principal accountant positions

Finance Department questionnaire responses in connection with finance department organizational

Matters 04/21/14|\WPJ restructuring 2.70 | 275.00 742.50

Finance Department Analyze planning and development department manager positions questionnaire

Matters 04/21/14|\WPJ responses in connection with finance department organizational restructuring 2.30 | 275.00 632.50

Finance Department Prepare summary of Police department budget division (Police) position

Matters 04/22/14|ALS questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.50 | 130.00 325.00

Finance Department Continued the summary of Police department accounting division (Police) position

Matters 04/22/14|ALS questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 2.50 | 130.00 325.00

Finance Department Completed the summary of Police department accounting division (Police) position

Matters 04/22/14|ALS questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 1.00 | 130.00 130.00

Finance Department Phone call regarding Request for Proposal for surplus

Matters 04/22/14|CJS assets auction 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Initial review of bidder questions from M. Butler (Purchasing) and disseminated

Matters 04/22/14|CJS same to C. Griswell (DWSD) 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Meeting with discuss finance transitional org chart with K. Hand (CM), G. Kushiner

Matters 04/22/14|CMG (CM), D. lafrate (CM), J. Addition (CM) and Finance leadership 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Prepared for Finance Transitional Org Chart meeting with E. Higgs (Chief
Accounting Officer), M. Jamison (Finance), J. Naglick (Director of Finance), A.

Finance Department Hohrn( Assessing), L. Duncan (Treasury) and C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison (CM),

Matters 04/22/14|DMI K. Hand (CM) and G. Kushiner (CM) 1.60 | 275.00 440.00
Participated in Finance Transitional Org Chart meeting with E. Higgs (Chief
Accounting Officer), M. Jamison (Finance), J. Naglick (Director of Finance), A.

Finance Department Hohrn( Assessing), L. Duncan (Treasury) and C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison (CM),

Matters 04/22/14|DMI K. Hand (CM) and G. Kushiner (CM) 1.50 | 275.00 412.50
Participation in meeting with J. Naglick (Finance), M. Jamison (Finance), L.
Duncan (Treasury), E. Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer), other City
representatives, K. Hand (CM), C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison (CM), and D. lafrate

Finance Department (CM) to discuss Finance Department reorganization including discussion on

Matters 04/22/14 | GMK restructuring priorities 1.40 | 425.00 595.00
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Preparation for meeting with J. Naglick (Finance), M. Jamison (Finance), L.
Duncan (Treasury), E. Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer), other City
representatives, K. Hand (CM), C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison (CM), and D. lafrate
Finance Department (CM) to discuss Finance Department reorganization including discussion on
Matters 04/22/14 | GMK restructuring priorities 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finance Department Discussion with J. Naglick (Finance) regarding status of TPA administrator
Matters 04/22/14|GMK Request for Quote for processing of Worker's Comp and auto claims 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Finance Department Discussion with G. Brown (EMO) and K. Hand (CM) regarding process for
Matters 04/22/14 | GMK completion of business case templates 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Finance Department Multiple email communications with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding potential
Matters 04/22/14|GMK organizational structure for proposed Program Management Office 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Email communications with J. Addison (CM), M. Jamison (Finance), and HR
Finance Department representative regarding future meeting agenda to discuss written test examples
Matters 04/22/14|GMK for Finance Dept. organizational restructuring work-stream 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Email communications with M. Hausman (CM) and T. Eddy (CM) regarding
Matters 04/22/14| GMK potential insurance broker Request for Proposal process 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/22/14 | GMK Review and analysis of Detroit fleet insurance comparison analysis 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Finance Department Review of email communications regarding status of CityTax software
Matters 04/22/14|GMK implementation 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Review of email communications regarding Quality of Life business case template
Matters 04/22/14 | GMK reporting process 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Finance Department Review and analysis of PwC GRC material regarding potential municipal
Matters 04/22/14|GMK governance structure 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Finance Department Met with A. Horhn (Assessing) regarding comments on restructuring/reinvestment
Matters 04/22/14|JAA initiative business case 1.20 | 345.00 414.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/22/14|JAA Reviewed email regarding Treasury NSF check analysis 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Finance Department Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding weekly meeting including CityTax,
Matters 04/22/14|JAA non-filers for 2012, Compuware and corporate taxes 0.90 | 345.00 310.50
Finance Department
Matters 04/22/14|JAA Responded to questions from Creditors regarding Income Tax 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
Prepared for Finance Transitional Org Chart meeting with E. Higgs, M. Jamison,
Finance Department J. Naglick, A. Hohrn, L. Duncan (FIN) and C. Gannon, D. lafrate, K. Hand and G.
Matters 04/22/14|JAA Kushiner (CM) 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Participated in Finance Transitional Org Chart meeting with E. Higgs, M. Jamison,
Finance Department J. Naglick, A. Hohrn, L. Duncan (FIN) and C. Gannon, D. lafrate, K. Hand and G.
Matters 04/22/14|JAA Kushiner (CM) 1.50 | 345.00 517.50
Finance Department Met with C. Parker (Accounting) regarding listing of unions related to the Finance
Matters 04/22/14|JAA Department 0.20 | 345.00 69.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/22/14|JAA Reviewed document related to the Finance Department 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
Finance Department Reviewed e-mail correspondence from L. Duncan (Finance) regarding potential
Matters 04/22/14|KJH Program Management Office structure and initial projects 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Preparation for meeting with City leadership (J. Naglick (Director of Finance), M.
Jamison (Finance), A.Horne (Assessing), E.Higgs (Chief Accounting Officer), and
Finance Department L. Duncan(Treasury)) regarding Finance restructuring initiatives, options, strategy,
Matters 04/22/14|KJH work plan, and next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Participated in meeting with City leadership (J. Naglick, M. Jamison, A.Horne,
E.Higgs, and L. Duncan) with G. Kushiner (CM), C. Gannon (CM), J. Addison
(CM), and D. lafrate (CM) regarding Finance restructuring initiatives (billing,
Finance Department collections), options, strategy, work plan, and next steps, with personal focus on
Matters 04/22/14|KJH Shared Services, Fire, Recreation, Health and Wellness, and Airport 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Finance Department Reviewed PwC integrated governance, risk, and compliance activities
Matters 04/22/14|KJH enhancement methodology white paper 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finance Department Reviewed KPMG report regarding managing change / opportunities for municipal
Matters 04/22/14|KJH efficiency and effectiveness for City of Tulsa 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Finance Department
Matters 04/22/14|MCW Updated revenue restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for department 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Finance Department Email correspondence with G. Kushiner (CM) related to workers compensation
Matters 04/22/14 \MJH Request for Proposal 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Finance Department Prepare summary of Finance department accounting division Risk Management
Matters 04/22/14|PCA position questionnaire responses for finance labor restructuring plan 1.90 | 130.00 247.00
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E-mail correspondence with G. Kushiner (CM) and M. Hausman (CM) to provide

Finance Department status update of Workers' compensation claims administration Request for Quote

Matters 04/22/14| TAE for privatization 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Continue to analyze planning and development department manager positions

Finance Department questionnaire responses in connection with finance department organizational

Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ restructuring 1.90 | 275.00 522.50

Finance Department Analyze law department Administrative assistant staff positions questionnaire

Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ responses in connection with finance department organizational restructuring 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Finance Department Analyze law department principal clerk staff positions questionnaire responses in

Matters 04/22/14 \WPJ connection with finance department organizational restructuring 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Finance Department Analyze city airport manager staff positions questionnaire responses in connection

Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ with finance department organizational restructuring 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Finance Department Analyze public works staff positions questionnaire responses in connection with

Matters 04/22/14|\WPJ finance department organizational restructuring 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Finance Department Meeting with L. Duncan and M. Jamison regarding Treasury restructuring next

Matters 04/23/14|CMG steps 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Meeting with M. Walsh (CM) to provide guidance on job classification request from

Matters 04/23/14|CMG L. King (HR consultant) 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Meeting with L. King (HR consultant), K. Hand (CM) and G. Kushiner (CM) to

Matters 04/23/14|CMG discuss finance restructuring and next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/23/14|CMG Meeting with L. King (HR consultant) regarding job classifications 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Reviewed best practices materials for Michigan local government business

Matters 04/23/14|EMP processes related to the Budget department 1.30 | 345.00 448.50

Finance Department Met with G. Kushiner (CM) P. Scales (Budget), R. Short (Finance), F. Stanley

Matters 04/23/14|EMP (Budget) regarding reorganization of Budget department organizational chart 1.30 | 345.00 448.50
Participation in meeting with K. Hand (CM), C. Gannon (CM), and L. King (HR

Finance Department Consultant) regarding Finance Department reorganization work-stream including

Matters 04/23/14|GMK discussion on background, current activities, and next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Preparation for meeting with K. Hand (CM), C. Gannon (CM), and L. King (HR

Finance Department Consultant) regarding Finance Department reorganization work-stream including

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK discussion on background, current activities, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participation in meeting with P. Scales (Budget), M. Jamison (Finance), F. Stanley

Finance Department (Budget), and E. Petrovski (CM) regarding Future State Budget organizational

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK chart, removal of existing function, addition of other functions, and next steps 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Preparation for meeting with. Scales (Budget), M. Jamison (Finance), F. Stanley

Finance Department (Budget), and E. Petrovski (CM) regarding Future State Budget organizational

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK chart, removal of existing function, addition of other functions, and next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Participation in meeting with J. Addison (CM) and W. Johnston (CM) regarding

Matters 04/23/14| GMK preparation of Finance Department employee survey summarization 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Finance Department Preparation for meeting with J. Addison (CM) and W. Johnston (CM) regarding

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK preparation of Finance Department employee survey summarization 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Multiple email communications with M. Hausman (CM) and T. Eddy (CM)

Finance Department regarding workers compensation and auto fleet TPS work-stream and potential

Matters 04/23/14|GMK insurance broker work-stream 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Email communications with W. Johnston (CM) and J. Addison (CM) regarding

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK employee questionnaire 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Review and analysis of Finance function employee comparison analysis with

Matters 04/23/14|GMK benchmark cities 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Responded to questions from Creditors regarding Income Tax, regarding third

Matters 04/23/14|JAA party collection agency and outstanding accounts receivable 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/23/14|JAA Created summary of comparable cities related to Finance Department Staffing 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Finance Department Updated Assessing Restructuring Business Case template related to Assessing

Matters 04/23/14|JAA Corrective Action Plan 2.40 | 345.00 828.00

Finance Department Email communication with C. Parker (Accounting) regarding Accounting Business

Matters 04/23/14|JAA Case templates 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/23/14|JAA Met with A. Minter (Recreation) regarding business case templates 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Finalized business case template for Assessing related to Assessing Corrective

Matters 04/23/14|JAA Action Plan 0.70 | 345.00 241.50
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Finance Department

Matters 04/23/14|JAA Reviewed summary of Finance jobs titles and 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Provided additional Finance Department job surveys by email to W. Johnston

Matters 04/23/14|JAA (CM) to incorporate into respective summary 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Finance Department Prepared for meeting with G. Kushiner (CM) and W. Johnston (CM) regarding

Matters 04/23/14|JAA Finance Department Surveys 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department Met with G. Kushiner (CM) and W. Johnston (CM) regarding summary of Finance

Matters 04/23/14 |JAA Department Surveys 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

Finance Department Reviewed Finance Department discussion outline prepared by M. Jamison

Matters 04/23/14|KJH (Finance) 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Reviewed and provided comments to proposed Finance Department Program

Matters 04/23/14|KJH Management Department organization chart 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Reviewed and provided comments to draft Finance job classification structure, job

Finance Department summary, distinguishing characteristics, minimum qualifications, knowledge, skills,

Matters 04/23/14|KJH and abilities 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Prepared for meeting with J. King (HR Consultant) regarding Finance

Finance Department restructuring, human resource related requirements, guidelines, and constraints,

Matters 04/23/14 |KJH and next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Participated in meeting with L.King (HR Consultant) with GMK and CMG regarding

Finance Department Finance restructuring, job requirements, human resource related requirements,

Matters 04/23/14|KJH guidelines, and constraints, and next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

Finance Department Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

Matters 04/23/14| MCW department 0.90 | 275.00 247.50
Researched new information received from Human Resources and Labor

Finance Department Relations for department employees for the purpose

Matters 04/23/14| MCW of providing information related to service delivery alternatives 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Finance Department Meeting with C. Gannon (CM) to receive guidance on job classification request

Matters 04/23/14| MCW from L. King (HR consultant) 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Email correspondence with G. Kushiner (CM) related to assisting J. Naglick

Finance Department (Director of Finance) with Request for Proposal process related to insurance

Matters 04/23/14|MJH policies 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Email correspondence with G. Kushiner (CM) related to potential Request for

Matters 04/23/14 |MJH Proposal process for insurance broker 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Meeting with G. Kushner (CM) and J. Addison (CM) to discuss status of job

Matters 04/23/14|\WPJ description questionnaire responses 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

Finance Department Make revisions to City financial comparability study spreadsheet per J. Addison

Matters 04/23/14|WPJ (CM) request 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Finance Department Analysis of job description questionnaire responses received in email from M.

Matters 04/23/14|\WPJ Jamison (Treasury) 1.60 | 275.00 440.00

Finance Department Create job description questionnaire responses comparison to City job

Matters 04/23/14|\WPJ descriptions template to be used to in finance organizational restructuring process 2.40 | 275.00 660.00

Finance Department Reviewed final memo from Miller Canfield regarding property tax matters-

Matters 04/24/14|CJS 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Corresponded with M. Butler (Purchasing) regarding potential bidders in the

Matters 04/24/14|CJS surplus assets auction Request for Proposal 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/24/14|CJS 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussion with B. Jackson (Purchasing) regarding CM assistance with Request

Matters 04/24/14|GMK for Proposal/Request for Quote work-streams 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Discussions with JAA regarding summary results document for employee

Matters 04/24/14|GMK questionnaires 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding summary results document for

Matters 04/24/14 |JAA employee questionnaires 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Updated 10-year restructuring projections for non-departmental data from 36th

Matters 04/24/14|JAA District Court 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Finance Department Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) to review interrogatory responses related to

Matters 04/24/14|JAA income tax 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Finance Department Provided comments to W. Johnston (CM) regarding job survey comparison

Matters 04/24/14|JAA template 0.80 | 345.00 276.00
Participated in meeting with J. Naglick (Director of Finance) with G. Kushiner (CM)

Finance Department and C. Gannon (CM) regarding information technology investments, post-

Matters 04/24/14| KJH bankruptcy oversight, feasibility, and personnel limitations 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
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Met with K. Hand (CM) to discuss finance organizational chart changes/updates,
work stream identification by division, coordination of restructuring activities by CM

Finance Department professional, key considerations related to organization changes given labor

Matters 04/25/14|CMG agreements, and next steps 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/25/14|DMI Began populating Finance organizational restructuring template for Treasury 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/25/14|EMP Reviewed finance department survey analysis as it relates to Budget department 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
Participation in meeting with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding Finance

Finance Department organizational restructuring work-stream status, next steps, and received business

Matters 04/25/14 | GMK case templates 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

Finance Department Email communications with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding position descriptions

Matters 04/25/14|GMK for Accountants 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Discussion with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding employee questionnaire summary for

Matters 04/25/14|GMK Budget Department and other related topics 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding work-stream priorities, status of

Matters 04/25/14| GMK employee questionnaire summary, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding work-stream priorities, status of

Matters 04/25/14|JAA employee questionnaire summary, and next steps 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Updated employee job survey template in order to compare responses to current

Matters 04/25/14|JAA job descriptions for each Finance Division 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/25/14|JAA Review status update from R. Carpenter (ISSI) regarding CityTax implementation 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department Reviewed e-mail correspondence with CM team regarding Finance department

Matters 04/25/14|KJH reorganization tasks and work plan 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Met with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Finance organizational chart, proposed

Finance Department changes, work stream identification and development by division, coordination of

Matters 04/25/14|KJH restructuring activities, and next steps 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

Finance Department Email correspondence with M. Jamison (Finance) regarding personal service

Matters 04/25/14|MCW contractors and reconciliation with roster provided with payroll 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Finance Department E-mail communications with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding status and next step

Matters 04/25/14| TAE planning and analysis require for purchasing future state reorganization 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Analyzed purchasing organization job surveys summary (1.8 and compiled detail

Finance Department summary of current state purchasing organization job descriptions versus actual

Matters 04/25/14| TAE responses along with individual qualifications (1.8) 3.60 | 425.00 1,530.00

Finance Department Review data provided by ISSI related to the implementation of CityTax and

Matters 04/26/14|JAA outstanding items 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/26/14|JAA Email correspondence with R. Carpenter (ISSI) regarding CityTax project plan files 0.30 | 345.00 103.50
Reviewed draft responses from W. Johnston (CM) regarding questions from K.

Finance Department Herman (MB) related to the Wayne County monthly settlement statement analysis

Matters 04/27/14|CJS and drafted responses to finalize response 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/27/14|JAA Prepared comparison of Income Tax employee surveys to current job descriptions 1.70 | 345.00 586.50
Met with W. Johnston (CM) to provide further direction on responding to questions

Finance Department from K. Herman (MB) related to the Wayne County monthly settlement statement

Matters 04/28/14|CJS analysis 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Draft final responses to due diligence questions from K. Herman (MB) related to

Finance Department the Wayne County monthly settlement statement analysis and distribute

Matters 04/28/14|CJS accordingly 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding coordination and priority of Finance

Matters 04/28/14|CMG Department organizational restructuring work-stream items 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Provided guidance to assisting in the Finance Department

Finance Department (i.e. provided documents for review and gave instruction on Administrative actions

Matters 04/28/14|DMI necessary for time reporting) 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Performed review and analysis of Finance contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This

Finance Department is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Matters 04/28/14|DMI Examiner. 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Finance Department Developed Treasury questionnaire summary in preparation of upcoming Finance

Matters 04/28/14|DMI Transitional Org Chart Meeting per request from J. Hill (CFO) 3.40 | 275.00 935.00
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Finance Department

Matters 04/28/14|EMP Updated Budget department summary analysis 0.90 | 345.00 310.50

Finance Department Email communications with CM team members regarding status of employee

Matters 04/28/14 | GMK questionnaire summaries 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Review and analysis of Finance Department time entries and summary write-up

Matters 04/28/14| GMK for March 2014 2.00 | 425.00 850.00

Finance Department Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding Finance Department time entries and

Matters 04/28/14| GMK summary write-up for March 2014 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Discussion with C. Gannon (CM) regarding coordination and priority of Finance

Matters 04/28/14| GMK Department organizational restructuring work-stream items 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding Finance Department time entries and

Matters 04/28/14|JAA summary write-up for March 2014 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Email correspondence with L. Duncan and A. Smith (Treasury) regarding creditor

Matters 04/28/14|JAA interrogatories 0.10 | 345.00 34.50

Finance Department Email correspondence with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding creditor

Matters 04/28/14|JAA interrogatories 0.10 | 345.00 34.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/28/14|JAA Met with K. Mitchell (Income Tax) regarding creditor interrogatories 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/28/14|JAA Respond to interrogatories related to Treasury as request by JD 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department Teleconference with S. Sarna (EY) and S. Woo (JD) regarding interrogatory

Matters 04/28/14|JAA request related to work rule impact 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/28/14|JAA Met with S. Sarna (EY) regarding interrogatory request related to work rule impact 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department Call regarding results of analysis on Treasury's

Matters 04/28/14|JAA delinquent check data 0.70 | 345.00 241.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/28/14|JAA Respond to interrogatories related to Income Tax as request by JD 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/28/14|JAA Prepared comparison of Assessing employee surveys to current job descriptions 2.10 | 345.00 724.50
Reviewed Income Tax Division employee survey summary for the purpose of

Finance Department providing CFO with current capabilities of division related to Finance Department

Matters 04/28/14 MCW reorganization 0.50 | 275.00 137.50
Summarized Assessing Division employee surveys for the purpose of providing

Finance Department Directors and Managers job description and most common survey responses for

Matters 04/28/14 | MCW CFO document related to Finance Department reorganization 2.00 | 275.00 550.00
Summarized Assessing Division employee surveys for the purpose of providing

Finance Department Supervisors and Staff job description and most common survey responses for

Matters 04/28/14| MCW CFO document related to Finance Department reorganization 1.80 | 275.00 495.00
Summarized Assessing Division employee surveys for the purpose of providing

Finance Department Clerical job description and most common survey responses for CFO document

Matters 04/28/14|MCW related to Finance Department reorganization 1.30 | 275.00 357.50

Finance Department Discussed status and required activities/next steps for Workers' Compensation

Matters 04/28/14| TAE Third Party administration privatization with R. Presnell (EMO) 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Review comments from K. Herman (MB) and C. Sekely (CM) regarding WC

Matters 04/28/14|WPJ monthly delinquent property tax analysis in order to revisions to analysis 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Finance Department Revise UTGO bondholder due diligence analysis with comments and edits from K.

Matters 04/28/14|WPJ Herman (MB) and C. Sekely (CM) 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department Spread detailed March 2014 delinquent property tax data received from N.

Matters 04/28/14|WPJ Timmons (Treasury) in order to update UTGO bondholder due diligence analysis 2.50 | 275.00 687.50
Analysis of historical chargebacks and recoveries regarding the Wayne County

Finance Department revolving fund and determine cause for recent trends in higher monthly

Matters 04/28/14 \WPJ settlements per C. Sekely (CM) request 1.30 | 275.00 357.50
Met with C. Sekely (CM) to receive further direction on responding to questions

Finance Department from K. Herman (MB) related to the Wayne County monthly settlement statement

Matters 04/28/14|\WPJ analysis 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Finance Department Reviewed and responded to interrogatory requested information from G. Kushiner

Matters 04/29/14|CJS (CM) vis-a-vis JD regarding AR collection activities 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Review of Finance current state organizational charts, draft future state

Matters 04/29/14|CMG organizational charts, research on job descriptions/classifications 3.10 | 425.00 1,317.50

Finance Department Meeting with L. King (HR Consultant) and A. Taylor (Impact) regarding Finance

Matters 04/29/14|CMG job classifications and job description information gathering for re writes 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
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Finance Department Meeting with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding Finance department restructuring status,

Matters 04/29/14|CMG current information collected, next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Meeting with L. King (HR Consultant), K. Hand (CM) and G. Kushiner (CM)

Matters 04/29/14|CMG regarding Finance restructuring next steps 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

Finance Department Meeting with A. Taylor (Impact) to provide guidance on Finance classifications and

Matters 04/29/14|CMG descriptions data sources and others 2.00 | 425.00 850.00

Finance Department Teleconference with D. Burnbaum (JD) regarding Finance cluster restructuring,

Matters 04/29/14|CMG and next step meetings to finalize strategy 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department Performed review of summary of collection/revenue activity, as it relates to my

Matters 04/29/14 | DMI respective departments 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/29/14|EMP Updated Budget department summary analysis 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/29/14|EMP Updated Purchasing department summary analysis 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department Met with B. Jackson (Purchasing) re: Purchasing division restructuring of

Matters 04/29/14|EMP organizational chart 1.50 | 345.00 517.50

Finance Department Spoke with B. Jackson (Purchasing) re: Purchasing division restructuring

Matters 04/29/14|EMP personnel needs 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department Reviewed- memorandum on purchasing department recommendations

Matters 04/29/14|EMP provided by B. Jackson (Purchasing) 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

Finance Department Meeting with B. Jackson (Purchasing) regarding CM assistance with current and

Matters 04/29/14| GMK future Request for Proposals 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participation in meeting with C. Gannon (CM), K. Hand (CM), and L. King ( HR

Finance Department Consultant) regarding status of Finance Department organizational restructuring

Matters 04/29/14 | GMK work-stream, current activities, and next steps 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

Finance Department Email communication with., C. Gannon (CM), and J. Addison (CM) regarding

Matters 04/29/14|GMK various documents 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Meeting with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Finance department restructuring status,

Matters 04/29/14 | GMK current information collected, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/29/14 | JAA Met with_ regarding income tax revenue 1.50 | 345.00 517.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/29/14|JAA Prepared Income Tax quality of life loan request related to field audit staff 2.40 | 345.00 828.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/29/14|JAA Met with T. Stoudemire (Income Tax) regarding business case for field audit staff 1.30 | 345.00 448.50

Finance Department Reviewed Budget Department employee survey summary comparison to job

Matters 04/29/14|JAA descriptions 0.60 | 345.00 207.00

Finance Department Email correspondence with Y. Hackney (HR) regarding missing position

Matters 04/29/14|JAA descriptions 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Met with C. Gannon (CM) and G. Kushiner (CM) regarding Finance job

Matters 04/29/14|KJH specifications and requirements, analysis, and summary document 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Met with L.King (HR Consultant), G. Kushiner (CM), and C. Gannon (CM)

Finance Department regarding HR restructuring issues, work rules, Finance restructuring, job

Matters 04/29/14|KJH specifications and requirements, work plan, and strategy 1.80 | 425.00 765.00
Summarized Accounting Division employee surveys for the purpose of providing

Finance Department Directors and Managers job description and most common survey responses for

Matters 04/29/14| MCW CFO document related to Finance Department reorganization 2.40 | 275.00 660.00
Summarized Accounting Division employee surveys for the purpose of providing

Finance Department Supervisors and Staff job description and most common survey responses for

Matters 04/29/14 | MCW CFO document related to Finance Department reorganization 2.20 | 275.00 605.00
Summarized Accounting Division employee surveys for the purpose of providing

Finance Department Clerical job description and most common survey responses for CFO document

Matters 04/29/14|MCW related to Finance Department reorganization 2.00 | 275.00 550.00

Finance Department Updated Assessing Division employee survey summary document for CFO with

Matters 04/29/14|MCW comments made by G. Kushiner (CM) 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department Prepare listing of all received and missing job descriptions from the Human

Matters 04/29/14 | WPJ Resources Department 2.40 | 275.00 660.00
Analysis of information received from Wayne County regarding March 2014

Finance Department monthly settlement reports of delinquent property tax collections for UTGO

Matters 04/29/14|\WPJ bondholders due diligence analysis 1.70 | 275.00 467.50

Finance Department Reviewed City ordinance provided by M. Austin, Esq. (JD) regarding City

Matters 04/30/14|CJS ordinance dictating the privatization process going forward 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
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Meeting with J. Hill (CFO) and L. King (HR Consultant) regarding Finance

Finance Department restructuring initiatives, new organizational chart, HR department deficiencies,

Matters 04/30/14|CMG strategy to address HR deficiencies 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

Finance Department Phone call with C. Sekely (CM) to provide direction and timing for analyzing the

Matters 04/30/14|DAR bids on the surplus assets auction Request for Proposal 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department

Matters 04/30/14 | EMP Reviewed recommended changes to Purchasing department summary analysis 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding use of Quality of Life proceeds for

Matters 04/30/14|EMP various restructuring initiatives 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Finance Department Email communications with Purchasing Manager regarding status of ||

Matters 04/30/14 | GMK and ITS Contractor Request for Proposal 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Discussion with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding use of Quality of Life proceeds for

Matters 04/30/14| GMK various restructuring initiatives 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Multiple email communications with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Finance

Matters 04/30/14| GMK Department task listing by Division 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Email communications with J. Addison (CM) regarding status of employee surveys

Finance Department and requested job position/requirements for Finance Dept. organization

Matters 04/30/14 | GMK restructuring work-stream 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/30/14 | GMK Review and analysis of Assessors Office employee questionnaire summary 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Finance Department Email communications with J. Addison (CM) regarding Assessors Office employee

Matters 04/30/14 |GMK questionnaire summary 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/30/14| GMK Review and analysis of Purchasing employee questionnaire summary 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Finance Department Discussion with J. Addison (CM) regarding Purchasing employee questionnaire

Matters 04/30/14| GMK summary 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/30/14 | GMK Review and analysis of Treasury employee questionnaire summary 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Finance Department Email communications with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Treasury employee

Matters 04/30/14 |GMK questionnaire summary 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Finance Department Discussion with J. Hill (CFO) and L. King (HR Consultant) regarding constraints to

Matters 04/30/14| GMK Finance Department organizational restructuring 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Finance Department Discussion with Purchasing Manager regarding Request for Proposal assistance

Matters 04/30/14| GMK and 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Finance Department Discussion with G. Kushiner (CM) regarding Purchasing employee questionnaire

Matters 04/30/14 |JAA summary 0.20 | 345.00 69.00

Finance Department

Matters 04/30/14|JAA Analyzed Income Tax non-filer schedule to compare against budget 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Finance Department Participated in discussion with S. Panagiotakis (EY) regarding Accounts Payable

Matters 04/30/14|MCW division job function, qualifications, and performance 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Finance Department Updated Assessing Division employee survey summary document for J. Hill (CFO)

Matters 04/30/14|MCW with additional comments made by G. Kushiner (CM) 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

Finance Department Updated Accounting Division employee survey summary document for J. Hill

Matters 04/30/14| MCW (CFO) with comments made by G. Kushiner (CM) 2.00 | 275.00 550.00
E-mail correspondence with to discuss and review

Finance Department new candidate qualifications and availability to support purchasing improvement

Matters 04/30/14| TAE initiatives 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Reviewed report on findings and recommendations for

Finance Department improved purchasing processes in order to apply to on-going restructuring

Matters 04/30/14| TAE initiatives and efforts 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

Finance Department Prepare a listing of all received finance job description questionnaires for J.

Matters 04/30/14|WPJ Addison (CM) 2.80 | 275.00 770.00

Finance Department Prepare a listing of all missing finance job description questionnaires for J.

Matters 04/30/14|WPJ Addison (CM) 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Finance Department Continue to prepare listing of all received and missing job descriptions from the

Matters 04/30/14 |WPJ Human Resources Department 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

Finance Department Reconcile missing finance job description questionnaires to list provided by City

Matters 04/30/14|WPJ and note differences 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

General Operational Meeting with S. Mays (EMO) regarding restructuring next steps at PDD, general

Matters 04/01/14|CMG restructuring issues 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Operational Reviewed and updated Restructuring and Reinvestment template to be distributed

Matters 04/01/14|CMG to city departments 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

General Operational Correspondence with D. lafrate (CM) regarding Restructuring and Reinvestment

Matters 04/01/14|CMG template updates 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
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General Operational

Matters 04/01/14|DMI 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

General Operational

Matters 04/01/14|DMI 1.80 | 275.00 495.00

General Operational Email correspondence with C. Gannon (CM) regarding Restructuring and

Matters 04/01/14|DMI Reinvestment template updates 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

General Operational Multiple email communications with KJH, CMG, MJH, and CJS regarding

Matters 04/01/14|GMK document discovery project next steps 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational

Matters 04/01/14|KJH 2.10 | 425.00 892.50

General Operational Meeting with J. Hill (CFO) regarding DPD IT, Finance restructuring, HR

Matters 04/02/14|CMG restructuring next steps 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Operational Review and commented on Restructuring and Reinvestment case write up

Matters 04/02/14|CMG template for QOL funds 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Operational Reviewed and provided comments to list of restructuring related vendors actively

Matters 04/02/14|KJH performing work for the City 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Reviewed e-mail correspondence from CM team regarding report summarizing the

Matters 04/02/14|KJH status of restructuring projects for J. Hill (CFO) 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational

Matters 04/02/14|KJH 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Met with G. Brown (EMO) regarding restructuring initiatives, quality of life loan,

Matters 04/02/14|KJH priorities, and initial restructuring initiatives 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Revised and updated CM operational and department responsibilities matrix for

Matters 04/02/14|KJH Jones Day 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

General Operational

Matters 04/03/14|CMM 0.20 | 495.00 99.00

General Operational

Matters 04/03/14 | DMI 0.60 | 275.00 165.00

General Operational

Matters 04/03/14|DSM Researched and reviewed documents 0.80 | 495.00 -

General Operational

Matters 04/03/14|DSM 0.20 | 495.00 -

General Operational Continued to revise and update CM operational and department responsibilities

Matters 04/03/14|KJH matrix for Jones Day 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
E-Mail communications with B. Benjamin (Lawrence Tech University) regarding

General Operational strategy and next step tasks for LTU to assist in and support lean process

Matters 04/03/14| TAE improvement projects with City of Detroit 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/04/14|CJS activities for week regarding DPW and MPD 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Teleconference with T. Clifton (DBA) regarding capital projects and DBA funding,

Matters 04/04/14|CMG need for source and uses of funds, and information requests 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Operational Meeting with S. Mays (EMO) regarding Grants restructuring, additional labor

Matters 04/04/14|CMG resources 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Operational EM meeting agenda and presentation strategy, execution of restructuring

Matters 04/04/14|CMG initiatives 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Participated in CM team meeting to strategize on mediation matters, Second

General Operational Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement, prepare for meeting with K. Orr and

Matters 04/04/14|CMM Mayor Duggan, work streams 0.80 | 495.00 396.00

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/04/14|DMI activities for week, as it relates to DPD and Finance 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/04/14 | EMP activities for week, as it relates to Fire department and plan of adjustment 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

General Operational Preparation for weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/04/14| GMK activities for week 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Participation in CM team meeting regarding preparation of updated 10 Year

Matters 04/04/14| GMK Reinvestment/Reorganization projections incorporating timing and other changes 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/04/14|JAA activities for week, as it relates to Finance 0.80 | 345.00 276.00

General Operational

Matters 04/04/14|KJH Prepared agenda for CM team conference call 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

General Operational activities for the week, as it relates to Fire, Airport, Recreation, Health and

Matters 04/04/14 | KJH Wellness, Purchasing, Blight, case updates, ||| NN 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
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General Operational Participated in CM team weekly conference call to discuss weekly restructuring

Matters 04/04/14| MCW initiatives and progress 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Participated in CM team meeting to strategize on mediation matters, due diligence

General Operational requirements, discovery demands, work streams and priorities as it relates to

Matters 04/04/14| TAE GSD, DDOT and 36th District Court 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
Researched and reviewed documents in order to keep apprised of various

General Operational activities and developments related to engagement including review of publicly

Matters 04/04/14|VEC made documents and articles for the week 3.00 | 495.00 -

General Operational Meeting with CM team to discuss status of engagement including strategy and

Matters 04/04/14|\WPJ coordination of team efforts 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

General Operational

Matters 04/05/14|AAB 1.00 | 130.00 130.00
Per Creditor document requests reviewed CMG emails to determine which were

General Operational related to City of Detroit engagement and which were not, eliminated emails not

Matters 04/05/14|CMG related to City of Detroit, provided to IT to gather and provide to Jones Day 5.70 | 425.00 2,422.50

General Operational Meeting with K. Hand (CM) and G. Kushiner (CM) to plan for meeting with EM and

Matters 04/05/14|CMG Mayor 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Operational Meeting with K. Hand (CM) and G. Kushner (CM) to further discuss meeting with

Matters 04/05/14 | CMG EM and Mayor, presentation materials considerations, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational

Matters 04/05/14| GMK Review of prepared email files from document discovery request 2.50 | 425.00 1,062.50

General Operational

Matters 04/05/14| GMK Meeting with KJH and CMG to plan for meeting with EM and Mayor 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Operational

Matters 04/05/14|KJH Met with CMG and GMK to plan for upcoming meeting with EM and Mayor 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Operational Met with CMG to further plan for upcoming meeting with EM and Mayor, including

Matters 04/05/14 |KJH presentation materials, considerations, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Reviewed privatization presentation, developed outline for more detailed

General Operational privatization and shared service proposed presentation for EMO and Mayor

Matters 04/06/14|CMG meeting 3.60 | 425.00 1,530.00
Reviewed previously prepared summaries of privatization / outsourcing

General Operational opportunities to evaluate and consider for current situation and to create template

Matters 04/06/14 |KJH for updated version 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

General Operational Review updated WIP report received from Jones Day for items relevant to

Matters 04/07/14|CMM operational restructuring; 0.40 | 495.00 198.00

General Operational Review of prepared email files from document discovery request to ensure all, and

Matters 04/07/14|GMK only, City of Detroit related emails were produced at the request of Jones Day 3.80 | 425.00 1,615.00

General Operational Email communication with KIH, CMG, and EMP regarding preparation of meeting

Matters 04/07/14|GMK materials for meeting with Mayor and EM 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Email communications with KJH, CMG, MJH, and CJS regarding status of

Matters 04/07/14 |GMK document discovery request 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Telephone call with KJH regarding preparation of material for future meeting with

Matters 04/07/14| GMK Mayor and EM 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Discussion with Deputy EM regarding agenda for future meeting with Mayor and

Matters 04/07/14|GMK EM 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Continued with filtering remaining CM employees' emails per the specifications set

Matters 04/07/14|JCB forth by Jones Day 3.00 | 130.00 390.00

General Operational Reviewed weekly updated work-in-process report distributed by Jones Day

Matters 04/07/14|KJH regarding case work plan, timeline, deliverables, and strategy 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Participated in work-in-process conference call with EM Office representatives,

General Operational Jones Day representatives, Miller Buckfire representatives, and E&Y

Matters 04/07/14|KJH representatives regarding schedule, work plan, deliverables, 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational

Matters 04/07/14|KJH 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Reviewed and replied to e-mail correspondence with CM team regarding
preparation and materials for upcoming meeting with EM and Mayor's

General Operational representatives to review Plan of Adjustment projections and service delivery

Matters 04/07/14|KJH alternatives 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
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Continued review of prepared email files from document discovery request to

General Operational ensure all, and only, City of Detroit related emails were produced at the request of

Matters 04/08/14 | GMK Jones Day 2.40 | 425.00 1,020.00

General Operational Discussion with Deputy EM regarding agenda topics and consultant participation

Matters 04/08/14 | GMK for future meeting with Mayor and EM 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Email communications with CMM, KJH, and CMG regarding deliverables for future

Matters 04/08/14| GMK meeting with Mayor and EM 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational

Matters 04/08/14| GMK Coordination of completion of outsourcing/privatization summary with CM team 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Finished filtering all CM employees' emails and started downloading the emails to

Matters 04/08/14|JCB convert to requested PST format 2.00 | 130.00 260.00

General Operational Created department summary workbook for the purpose of tracking changes to

Matters 04/08/14|MCW the restructuring/reinvestment projections 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

General Operational Helped J. Barone (CM) with downloading remaining content for Plan of Adjustment

Matters 04/09/14 | AAB to help stay on pace to meet 4/11/14 deadline 5.00 | 130.00 650.00

General Operational Continued making revisions to restructuring initiative overview, business case

Matters 04/09/14|DMI outline 1.50 | 275.00 412.50

General Operational

Matters 04/09/14|GMK Discussion with AAB regarding email files from document discovery request 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Preparation of the alternative service delivery summary including specific review

General Operational and preparation of Finance and HR sections and consolidation/clean-up of other

Matters 04/09/14 | GMK departments 2.40 | 425.00 1,020.00

General Operational Continued with downloading and converting all user's emails to PST format for

Matters 04/09/14|JCB Jones Day 5.00 | 130.00 650.00

General Operational Reviewed and updated restructuring and reinvestment initiative business case

Matters 04/09/14|KJH template, outline, and spreadsheets 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Operational Reviewed and provided comments to list of restructuring related vendors actively

Matters 04/09/14|KJH performing work for the City 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Met with G. Brown (EMO) regarding restructuring initiatives, quality of life loan,

Matters 04/09/14|KJH priorities, and initial restructuring initiatives 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Operational Revised and updated CM operational and department responsibilities matrix for

Matters 04/09/14 | KJH Jones Day 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational

Matters 04/09/14|KJH Reviewed and provided comments to summary of service delivery alternatives 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Provided updates to City of Detroit Restructuring Projects document for purpose of

Matters 04/09/14|MCW internal discussions with Mayor and staff 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

General Operational Discussions with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding POA adjustments requirements for

Matters 04/09/14 | TAE summary 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Discussions with J, Addison (CM) regarding POA revisions methodology and

Matters 04/09/14 | TAE requirements for updated roll up of amendments 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Continued with downloading and converting all remaining user's emails per the

Matters 04/10/14|AAB requested filters set forth in the Plan of Adjustment 5.00 | 130.00 650.00

General Operational Updated risks and opportunities analysis re: Mayor's Office strategy review

Matters 04/10/14|EMP meeting 1.10 | 345.00 379.50
Preparation of the alternative service delivery summary including specific review

General Operational and preparation of Finance and HR sections and consolidation/clean-up of other

Matters 04/10/14|GMK departments 1.90 | 425.00 807.50

General Operational Began transferring all requested email's to requested medium in preparation for all

Matters 04/10/14|JCB documents being sent by 4/11/14 5.00 | 130.00 650.00

General Operational Reviewed documents and requirements associated with Quality of Life loan as

Matters 04/10/14|KJH funding will be used for departmental restructuring and reinvestment initiatives 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

General Operational Reviewed and finalized restructuring and reinvestment initiative business cash

Matters 04/10/14 |KJH template, outline, and spreadsheets 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Operational Began to prepare instructions to assist departments with completion of

Matters 04/10/14 |KJH restructuring and reinvestments initiatives business case templates 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Operational Shipped all remaining requested users emails as outlined in the Plan of

Matters 04/11/14| AAB Adjustment to the company Alpha Lit per Jones Day instruction 0.50 | 130.00 65.00
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General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/11/14|JAA activities for week, as it relates to Finance 0.50 | 345.00 172.50

General Operational Finalized transferring all documents to requested medium so A. Brink (CM) could

Matters 04/11/14|JCB prepare for shipping to the company Alpha Lit 3.00 | 130.00 390.00
Reviewed and commented on draft correspondence / cover letter to department

General Operational directors regarding business case templates, process, funding, and Quality of Life

Matters 04/11/14|KJH loan 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Reviewed e-mail correspondence with Finance leadership and CM representatives

General Operational regarding draft correspondence / cover letter to department directors regarding

Matters 04/11/14|KJH business case templates, process, funding, and Quality of Life loan 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational

Matters 04/11/14|KJH Prepared agenda for CM team conference call 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Email correspondence with G. Kushiner (CM) related to proposed verbiage to City

Matters 04/11/14 \MJH of Detroit Departments related to use of quality of life funds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participated in CM team meeting to strategize on mediation matters, due diligence

General Operational requirements, discovery demands, work streams and priorities as it relates to

Matters 04/11/14| TAE GSD, DDOT and 36th District Court 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Reviewed application process documentation (.3) and provided feedback

Matters 04/11/14| TAE comments to G. Kushiner, C. Gannon, and K. Hand (CM) on the same (.2) 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Review, finalize and distribute schedule reflecting alternative service delivery

Matters 04/12/14|CMM opportunities to K. Orr 0.40 | 495.00 198.00

General Operational

Matters 04/12/14|EMP Corresponded via e-mail with S. Sarna (E&Y) re: union affiliation information 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

General Operational

Matters 04/12/14| GMK Review and analysis of updated alternative service delivery document 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Email communications with CM team regarding updated alternative service

Matters 04/12/14 | GMK delivery document 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Researched and reviewed documents in order to keep apprised of various

General Operational activities and developments related to engagement including review of publicly

Matters 04/13/14|VEC made documents and articles for the week 5.00 | 495.00 -

General Operational Participated in weekly Work In Process call with Jones Day, EY, Miller Buckfire,

Matters 04/14/14|CMG EM office, and CM personnel 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational

Matters 04/14/14|CMG Reviewed union list by department and updated presentation format 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Operational Review updated WIP report received from Jones Day for items relevant to

Matters 04/14/14|CMM operational restructuring; 0.40 | 495.00 198.00

General Operational Performed detailed review of business case outlines for DPD, City Council, Grants

Matters 04/14/14 |DMI Administration, Law and Airport 1.20 | 275.00 330.00
Participated in work-in-process conference call with EM Office representatives,

General Operational Jones Day representatives, Miller Buckfire representatives, and E&Y

Matters 04/14/14|KJH representatives regarding schedule, work plan, deliverables 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Continued to prepare instructions to assist departments with completion of

Matters 04/14/14 |KJH restructuring and reinvestments initiatives business case templates 3.20 | 425.00 1,360.00

General Operational Reviewed and replied to e-mail correspondence with EMP regarding staffing and

Matters 04/14/14|KJH vacation schedules 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Created bargaining unit by agency matrix for the purpose of providing consolidated

Matters 04/14/14|MCW union information based by department 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

General Operational

Matters 04/15/14|CMG 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational

Matters 04/15/14|CMG 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Correspondence with Jones Day and G. Kushiner (CM) regarding POA

Matters 04/15/14|CMG negotiations and potential impact on restructuring implementation City wide 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Operational Meeting with J. Kastin (Jones Day) and B. Jackson (Purchasing) to discuss

Matters 04/15/14|CMG privatization next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Printed and Organized Round 1 and Round 2 of questionnaires in preparation for

Matters 04/15/14|PCA summarization 0.90 | 130.00 117.00
Researched and reviewed documents in order to keep apprised of various

General Operational activities and developments related to engagement including review of publicly

Matters 04/15/14|VEC made documents and articles for the week 4.00 | 495.00 -
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General Operational Meeting with S. Fox (EMO) and G. Brown (COO) and G. Kushiner (CM) regarding

Matters 04/16/14|CMG AFSME negotiations and impact on restructuring activities 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Review of AFSME negotiation draft documents provided by Jones Day to

Matters 04/16/14|CMG determine impact to restructuring initiatives 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Correspondence with A. Taylor (Impact) to provide direction on areas of focus

Matters 04/16/14|CMG when join restructuring team 0.10 | 425.00 42.50

General Operational Met with G. Kushiner (CM) to discuss AFSME negotiations, impact on

Matters 04/16/14|CMG restructuring activities and next steps 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Meeting with CMG to discuss AFSME negotiations, impact on restructuring

Matters 04/16/14 | GMK activities, and next steps 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Meeting with Deputy EM, COO, and CMG regarding AFSME negotiations and

Matters 04/16/14| GMK impact on restructuring activities 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Participated in meeting with S.Panagiotakis (EY) and S. Swaminathan (EY)

Matters 04/16/14| MCW regarding upcoming initiatives 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/18/14|CJS activities for week regarding DPW and MPD 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational Participated in CM team weekly conference call to discuss weekly restructuring

Matters 04/18/14|CMG activities, key issues to address, and next steps 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Participated in CM team meeting to strategize on Third Amended Plan and

General Operational Disclosure Statement, impact across departments on proposed changes to

Matters 04/18/14|CMM outsourcing, work streams 1.00 | 495.00 495.00

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/18/14|DMI activities for week, as it relates to DPD and Finance 1.00 | 275.00 275.00
Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

General Operational activities for week, as it relates to Fire and DHWP department, plan of adjustment

Matters 04/18/14|EMP and disclosure statement 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

General Operational Participation in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/18/14|GMK activities for week 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational Preparation for weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/18/14| GMK activities for week 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Multiple email communications with Deputy EM, CFO, COO, CIO, and CMG

Matters 04/18/14| GMK regarding proposed labor union agreement and impact on operations 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/18/14|JAA activities for week, as it relates to Finance 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

General Operational Participated in CM team weekly conference call to discuss weekly restructuring

Matters 04/18/14| MCW initiatives and progress 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

General Operational Participate in weekly City WIP call to stay informed of various work streams with

Matters 04/18/14 \MJH specific attention to DWSD related actions including RFI process 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational Meeting with CM team to discuss status of engagement ||| NN

Matters 04/18/14|WPJ 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

General Operational

Matters 04/20/14|CMG 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14|CMG 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14|CMG 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14|CMG Reviewed and updated privatization options per J. Hill (CFO) and S. Fox (EMO) 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Meeting with S. Mays (EMO) to discuss recent negotiation developments and

Matters 04/21/14|CMG impact on restructuring next steps 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Review updated WIP report received from Jones Day for items relevant to

Matters 04/21/14|CMM operational restructuring; 0.40 | 495.00 198.00

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14|GMK 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14|GMK 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14| GMK Preparation of Potential Outsourcing/Prioritization Summary 2.40 | 425.00 1,020.00
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General Operational Reviewed weekly e-mail update distributed by Jones Day regarding recent events

Matters 04/21/14|KJH and upcoming schedule 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Reviewed weekly updated work-in-process report distributed by Jones Day

Matters 04/21/14|KJH regarding case work plan, timeline, deliverables, and strategy 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Participated in work-in-process conference call with EM Office representatives,

General Operational Jones Day representatives, Miller Buckfire representatives, and E&Y

Matters 04/21/14|KJH representatives regarding schedule, work plan, deliverables, 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Reviewed and responded to e-mail correspondence with K.Herman (Miller

General Operational Buckfire) regarding labor negotiations and provisions regarding outsourcing and

Matters 04/21/14 |KJH privatization 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Met with M. Walsh (CM) regarding service delivery alternatives and union coalition

Matters 04/21/14|KJH negotiation impact on requirements, timing, and options summary for EM Office 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Operational Participated in telephone conference with E. Petrovski (CM) regarding service

Matters 04/21/14|KJH delivery alternatives, potential impact on Fire labor, process, and strategy 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Reviewed draft letter agreement with union coalition regarding contractual work

General Operational and outsourcing provisions to understand potential parameters impacting service

Matters 04/21/14|KJH delivery alternatives and restructuring initiatives 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14|KJH 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational

Matters 04/21/14|KJH 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

General Operational Reviewed and updated summary of service delivery alternatives, estimated

Matters 04/21/14|KJH financial impact, and labor impact for EM Office 1.60 | 425.00 680.00

General Operational Met with M. Walsh (CM) regarding service delivery alternatives and union coalition

Matters 04/21/14|KJH negotiation impact on requirements, timing, and options 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Met with M. Farr (Mayor's Office) regarding lean operations initiatives work

Matters 04/21/14|KJH stream, assignments, and target list 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Reviewed summary of lean process management summary and project sheet,

Matters 04/21/14|KJH responsibilities, and volunteer resources 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Discussion with K. Hand (CM) regarding union impact on service delivery

Matters 04/21/14| MCW alternatives 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

General Operational Meeting with K. Hand (CM) regarding COD service delivery alternatives and union

Matters 04/21/14| MCW impact document for EMO 0.70 | 275.00 192.50

General Operational

Matters 04/22/14|CMG Coordination of Impact contractor onboarding 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Email communications with Finance Director regarding Alternative Service

Matters 04/22/14|GMK Delivery schedule 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Operational Met with G. Brown (EMO) regarding business case development, template

Matters 04/22/14|KJH requirements, and department assistance 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Operational Met with G. Brown (EMO) regarding service delivery alternatives, strategies,

Matters 04/22/14|KJH options, priorities, and impediments to change 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Continued to review and update summary of service delivery alternatives,

Matters 04/22/14|KJH estimated financial impact, and labor impact for EM Office 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Reviewed City Code language and requirements related to privatization of certain

Matters 04/22/14|KJH city services 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Operational Reviewed Annex B of Financial Stability Agreement for outsourcing / privatization

Matters 04/22/14|KJH initiatives 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Drafted, sent, and reviewed responses and follow-up e-mail correspondence with

General Operational EM Office, Jones Day, and CM team regarding Coalition of Detroit Unions,

Matters 04/22/14|KJH negotiations, and impact on restructuring efforts 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Reviewed and commented on analyses and summary of headcount by agency and

Matters 04/22/14|KJH union represented by Coalition of Detroit Unions 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Reviewed e-mail correspondence with S.Fox (EMO) regarding service delivery

Matters 04/22/14|KJH alternatives, strategies, priorities, and next step 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Developed service delivery alternatives work plan and document outline for use by

Matters 04/22/14|KJH Restructuring Team, including EM Office and advisors 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

General Operational Meeting with B. Jackson (Purchasing), G. Kushiner (CM), K. Hand (CM) to discuss

Matters 04/23/14|CMG restructuring of finance area, recommended consolidation next steps 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
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General Operational

Matters 04/23/14|CMG Correspondence with M. Kopacz (Phoenix) to coordinate meeting to discuss POA 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational

Matters 04/23/14|GMK 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Reviewed e-mail correspondence with J. (Jones Day) regarding unions

General Operational represented by Coalition of Detroit Unions, negotiation progress, and significant

Matters 04/23/14|KJH terms 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Reviewed and commented on updated analyses and summary of headcount by

Matters 04/23/14|KJH agency and union represented by Coalition of Detroit Unions 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Met with B. Jackson (Purchasing), GMK, and CMG regarding restructuring

General Operational initiatives, service delivery alternatives, and Mayor Duggan plans to review,

Matters 04/23/14|KJH evaluate, and prioritize initiatives 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Meeting with L. King (HR Consultant), G. Kushiner (CM) and K. Hand (CM) to

General Operational discuss details to POA, restructuring and reinvestment initiatives, labor

Matters 04/24/14|CMG agreements and impact to restructuring, and next steps 2.50 | 425.00 1,062.50

General Operational Meeting with J. Hill (CFO) regarding EM meeting next week concerning

Matters 04/24/14|CMG privatization 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Participation in meeting with HR Consultant, KJH, and CMG to discuss details to

General Operational POA, restructuring and reinvestment initiatives, labor agreements and impact to

Matters 04/24/14 |GMK restructuring, and next steps 2.50 | 425.00 1,062.50
Preparation for meeting with HR Consultant, KJH, and CMG to discuss details to

General Operational POA, restructuring and reinvestment initiatives, labor agreements and impact to

Matters 04/24/14 | GMK restructuring, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Discussion with Finance Director, KJH, and CMG regarding Phoenix involvement,

Matters 04/24/14|GMK POA opportunities and risks, DPD finance staffing, and other issues 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Continued to prepare instructions to assist department with completion of

Matters 04/24/14|KJH restructuring and reinvestments initiatives business case templates 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

General Operational Reviewed and updated City of Detroit Bankruptcy overview and impact

Matters 04/25/14|CMG presentation per J. Fox (EMO) request 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

General Operational Preparation of email update for S. Mays and D. Sutton regarding significant

Matters 04/25/14| GMK operational activities including coordination of information within CM team 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Researched and reviewed documents in order to keep apprised of various

General Operational activities and developments related to engagement including review of publicly

Matters 04/25/14|VEC made documents and articles for the week 5.00 | 495.00 -

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/28/14|CJS activities for week regarding DPW and MPD 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team conference call to discuss developments from last

Matters 04/28/14 | CMG week and plans for the next few weeks 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational

Matters 04/28/14|CMG Updated COD Bankruptcy Summary for S. Fox (EMO) 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational

Matters 04/28/14|CMG Updated EM presentation on bankruptcy related matters for S. Fox (EMO) 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Operational

Matters 04/28/14|CMG Meeting with EY regarding POA updates and timing 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participated in CM team meeting to discuss next steps on balloting and solicitation

General Operational for Third Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement, implementation and tracking of

Matters 04/28/14|CMM restructuring initiatives, department work streams 1.00 | 495.00 495.00

General Operational Participate in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/28/14| DAR activities for week 1.10 | 345.00 379.50

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/28/14|DMI activities for week, as it relates to DPD and Finance 1.00 | 275.00 275.00
Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

General Operational activities for week, as it relates to Fire department, ongoing negotiations, plan of

Matters 04/28/14|EMP adjustment and disclosure statement 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

General Operational Participation in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/28/14| GMK activities for week 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational Preparation for weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/28/14|GMK activities for week 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/28/14|JAA activities for week, as it relates to DPD and Finance 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

General Operational Reviewed weekly e-mail update distributed by Jones Day regarding recent events

Matters 04/28/14 | KJH and upcoming schedule 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
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General Operational Reviewed weekly updated work-in-process report distributed by Jones Day

Matters 04/28/14|KJH regarding case work plan, timeline, deliverables, ||  NJJEEE 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational

Matters 04/28/14|KJH Prepared agenda for CM team conference call 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Participated in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

General Operational activities for the week, as it relates to Fire, Airport, Recreation, Health and

Matters 04/28/14|KJH Wellness, Purchasing, Blight, case updates, and strategy development 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational Participated in CM team weekly conference call to discuss weekly restructuring

Matters 04/28/14  MCW initiatives and progress 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

General Operational Participate in weekly CM team meeting to discuss and coordinate operational

Matters 04/28/14|MJH activities for week 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational

Matters 04/28/14| TAE 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Operational Meeting with CM team to discuss status of engagemen

Matters 04/28/14|WPJ 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

General Operational Discussion with COO regarding status of various outsourcing initiatives and RFP

Matters 04/29/14| GMK assistance for Purchasing Department 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Operational Prepared for upcoming meeting with EM Office regarding service delivery

Matters 04/29/14|KJH alternatives, constraints, work plan, and timeline 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Operational Discussion with HR Consultant and G. Kushner (CM) regarding responsibility for

Matters 04/30/14 | CMG restructuring initiatives 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Discussion with HR Consultant and CMG regarding responsibility for restructuring

Matters 04/30/14| GMK initiatives 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Operational Email communications with CMM regarding staffing assignments and

Matters 04/30/14 |GMK responsibilities 0.10 | 425.00 42.50

General Operational Reviewed e-mail correspondence with J.Kastin (Jones Day) regarding service

Matters 04/30/14|KJH delivery alternatives, limitations 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Operational Participated in meeting with K. Hand (CM) regarding summarized data for the

Matters 04/30/14|MCW unions covered by the Coalition before providing to Jones Day 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

General Services

Department Matters 04/01/14|CMG Correspondence with B. Dick (GSD) regarding facility consolidation next steps 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Compiled, updated, and prepared overall city wide space consolidation plan

General Services including move and build out costs and related lease savings for overall

Department Matters 04/01/14|TAE coordination and approval of projects 2.10 | 425.00 892.50

General Services Participated in meeting with GSD and DPD leadership to finalize and agree to

Department Matters 04/01/14| TAE space consolidation plan, priorities and tasks for implementation 2.60 | 425.00 1,105.00

General Services Met with J. Brown (CM) to update and provide feedback and guidance on solid

Department Matters 04/01/14|TAE waste fleet maintenance privatization 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
E-mail communications with W. Johnston (CM) regarding Plan and Development

General Services Departments plans and related costs and lease savings related to office move to

Department Matters | 04/01/14 | TAE CAYMC 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
E-Mail communications with J. Bryant, B.Dick, and J. Knight (GSD) regarding plan

General Services of adjustment assumptions and inclusions for space consolidation and office build

Department Matters 04/01/14 | TAE outs 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Corresponding emails with J. Brown (Impact) regarding department personal

General Services service contractors and temporary employees for the purpose of reconciling active

Department Matters 04/02/14|MCW personal service contracts 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Performed detail analysis of GSD's FY 2015 budget against plan of adjustment

General Services baseline in order to provide feedback on necessary inclusions and eliminations for

Department Matters 04/02/14 | TAE matching of budget to POA 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

General Services Reviewed updates on status of restructuring projects for department related to

Department Matters 04/03/14|MCW document for Miller Buckfire and Jones Day 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

General Services Participated in meeting with RFP evaluation team regarding status and next steps

Department Matters 04/03/14 | TAE for evaluation of privatization of emergency roadside fire apparatus maintenance 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Services Revised and edited10 year restructuring plan of adjustment to account for

Department Matters 04/03/14| TAE updated information regarding benefits assumptions as it relates to GSD plan 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
E-Mail communications with B. Dick, J. Brown, J. Knight, J. Bryant (GSD)

General Services regarding status of opportunity for DPD to purchase new facility for precinct

Department Matters 04/03/14| TAE consolidation 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services Correspondence with B. Dick (GSD) regarding State and City record retention

Department Matters 04/04/14|CMG policies 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
E-Mail communications with D. lafrate (CM) regarding potential lease savings

General Services related to DPD facilities move to be included in GSD's overall space consolidation

Department Matters 04/04/14 | TAE plan 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
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Worked on development of overall City wide space consolidation plan by

General Services complying and validating estimated cost for building improvements and

Department Matters 04/04/14| TAE departmental moves 2.30 | 425.00 977.50

General Services

Department Matters 04/04/14| TAE Updated GSD Plan of Adjustment for revised timing of initiatives 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Services E-Mail communications with J. Brown (CM) to update status of RFP evaluation for

Department Matters 04/05/14| TAE privatization of Emergency Roadside repair service for Fire Apparatus 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Services Input narrative for Restructuring / Reinvestment Initiative projections for Plan of

Department Matters 04/06/14 MCW Adjustment 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Participated in Space consolidation meeting with GSD and PDD to develop plans,

General Services costs, and requirements to move PDD and consolidate into Coleman A Young

Department Matters 04/07/14| TAE Municipal Center building 1.60 | 425.00 680.00

General Services

Department Matters 04/07/14 | TAE 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

General Services GSD Budget discussion with B. Dick (GSD) regarding tie in of plan of adjustment

Department Matters 04/07/14| TAE with FY2015 budget 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Made substantial revisions to GSD Plan of Adjustment based on updated

General Services information with regards to timing and deferrals of initiatives, spending and other

Department Matters 04/07/14 | TAE adjustments 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

General Services Participated in meting with GSD Budget team to continue work on development of

Department Matters | 04/08/14 | TAE FY2015 and integration with the GSD Plan of Adjustments 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

General Services Participated in meeting with GSD Management team to discuss contract terms for

Department Matters 04/08/14 | TAE Kristel custodial services to transition work to outside contractor 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Services Met with D. Bryan(Purchasing) to discuss status and required tasks for evaluation

Department Matters 04/08/14 | TAE of emergency vehicle maintenance RFP 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services Made substantial revisions to GSD Plan of adjustments to accommodate for

Department Matters 04/09/14| TAE update cost information as a result of union negotiations 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Services Compiled detailed listing and status of City service alternatives for summary to be

Department Matters 04/09/14 | TAE provided to Mayor Duggan 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Services Compiled detailed listing of GSD restructuring initiatives' risk and opportunities for

Department Matters 04/09/14 | TAE summary to be provided to Mayor Duggan 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Services Discussions with C. Gannon (CM) regarding GSD POA adjustments and revisions

Department Matters | 04/09/14| TAE required 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Services Telephone conference with Jay Brown (CM) to update on revised GSD POA

Department Matters 04/10/14| TAE adjustments and provide direction regarding inclusion in budgeting process 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
E-Mail communications with J. Bryant, B.Dick, and J. Knight (GSD) regarding plan

General Services of adjustment assumptions and inclusions for space consolidation and office build

Department Matters | 04/10/14 | TAE outs 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Services Made substantial revisions and updates to City wide Space Consolidation plan

Department Matters 04/10/14 | TAE based on updated plans and information from DPD and PDD 1.40 | 425.00 595.00

General Services Telephone conversation with J. Bryant (GSD) regarding updates, changes and

Department Matters 04/11/14| TAE clarifications to City space consolidation cost and savings plans 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services

Department Matters 04/11/14 | TAE Participated in GSD FY2015 Budget development meeting 2.10 | 425.00 892.50
Complied detail, status and potential union effect of proposed GSD privatization

General Services initiatives in support of and at the request of AFSCME negotiations and

Department Matters 04/12/14| TAE mediations sessions 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Services Teleconference with T. Eddy (CM) regardindi |

Department Matters 04/13/14 MCW 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

General Services Made substantial reviews, updates and revisions to amended Disclosure

Department Matters 04/13/14| TAE Statement for GSD 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

General Services Compiled and documented responses to inquiries regarding ||| | EEGcGzNGEG

Department Matters 04/13/14 | TAE 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

General Services Made revisions and updates to GSD's plan of adjustment to incorporate revised

Department Matters 04/13/14 | TAE labor wage rate and benefits assumptions 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Performed review and analysis of GSD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This

General Services is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Department Matters 04/14/14|DMI Examiner. 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

General Services Continued to make revisions and updates to DDOT's plan of adjustment to

Department Matters 04/14/14 | TAE incorporate revised labor wage rate and benefits assumptions (.8) 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
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Teleconference with J. Bryant and J. Knight (GSD) regarding update of space

General Services consolidation plans, move and build out costs and related savings to support

Department Matters 04/14/14 | TAE restructuring fund approvals 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Services

Department Matters 04/15/14|EMP Met with T. Eddy (CM) re: GSD restructuring initiative summary 0.40 | 345.00 138.00
POA review with E. Petrovski to support future revisions, analyzed current plan of

General Services adjustment's initiatives and status/progress to date and other updates/changes to

Department Matters 04/15/14| TAE GSD in order to assess any POA adjustments that may be necessary 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
Space Consolidation plan update, analyzed and evaluated new proposed space

General Services consolidation and departmental move plans and updated new costs, timing, and

Department Matters 04/15/14| TAE lease savings analytics 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Participated in meeting with Fleet maintenance strategy team (C. Rice, J.
Anderson, G. Steffes (GSD), D. Bryant (Purchasing) to develop next step tasks

General Services and strategies related to the improvement and potential outsourcing of some or all

Department Matters 04/15/14| TAE of City fleet maintenance services 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Services Met with J. Brown (CM) to discuss tasks and provide direction in development of

Department Matters 04/15/14 | TAE updated space consolidation plan to support application for funding 0.90 | 425.00 382.50

General Services Met with D. lafrate (CM) to discuss tasks and provide direction in development of

Department Matters 04/15/14 | TAE updated space consolidation plan to support application for funding 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services

Department Matters 04/15/14| TAE Discussions with B. Dick regarding Quality of Life loan fund usage business cases 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Services Discussions with J. Brown regarding Quality of Life loan fund usage business

Department Matters | 04/15/14 | TAE cases 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services E-mail communication with J. Brown (GSD) regarding GSD's space consolidation

Department Matters 04/16/14| TAE business case in preparation of meeting to review with CFO 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services

Department Matters 04/17/14|CMG Meeting with J. Hill (CFO) regarding GSD facility consolidation plan status 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Services

Department Matters 04/17/14|CMG Reviewed draft facility consolidation analysis and provided comments 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Services E-mail communication with J. Bryant and J. Knight (GSD) regarding GSD's space

Department Matters 04/17/14| TAE consolidation business case in preparation of meeting to review with CFO 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services Teleconference with B. Dick (GSD) and D. lafrate (CM) regarding GSD space

Department Matters 04/18/14|CMG consolidation analysis in preparation for meeting with J. Hill (CFO) 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Services Preparation for call with B. Dick (GSD) regarding space consolidation plan

Department Matters | 04/18/14|CMG analysis 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Participated in call with B. Dick (GSD) and C. Gannon (CM) to discuss GSD's

General Services space consolidation review analysis in preparation of upcoming meeting with J. Hill

Department Matters | 04/18/14|DMI (CFO) 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

General Services Continued development of GSD space consolidation review for purposes of

Department Matters | 04/18/14|DMI providing to J. Hill (CFO) 1.80 | 275.00 495.00
E-mail communication with J. Hill (Finance) C. Gannon (CM) process and

General Services responsibilities for completing and submitted business case applications for

Department Matters 04/18/14 | TAE access to quality of life funds 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Services Email correspondence with J. Brown (Impact - GSD) regarding revised analysis for

Department Matters 04/19/14|DMI GSD space consolidation review 0.80 | 275.00 220.00

General Services Continued development of GSD space consolidation review for purposes of

Department Matters | 04/19/14|DMI providing to J. Hill (CFO) 1.30 | 275.00 357.50

General Services Meeting with B. Dick (GSD), D. lafrate (CM) regarding City of Detroit facility

Department Matters 04/21/14|CMG consolidation 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Services

Department Matters | 04/21/14|CMG 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Services Participated in call with J. Brown (Impact - GSD) and J. Bryant (GSD) to discuss

Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI GSD space consolidation review analysis 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Performed review and analysis of GSD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This

General Services is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI Examiner. 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

General Services

Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI Performed review of GSD business case write-up request for facility consolidation 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

General Services Prepared for meeting with B. Dick, J. Bryant (GSD), J. Brown (Impact - GSD) and

Department Matters | 04/21/14|DMI C. Gannon (CM) to discuss revised GSD space consolidation review analysis 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
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General Services Participated in meeting with B. Dick, J. Bryant (GSD), J. Brown (Impact - GSD)

Department Matters 04/21/14|DMI and C. Gannon (CM) to discuss revised GSD space consolidation review analysis 1.00 | 275.00 275.00

General Services Research union affiliation for department employees for the purpose of providing

Department Matters 04/21/14|MCW information related to service delivery alternatives 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
E-mail correspondence with C. Gannon, J. Brown and D. lafrate (CM) to provide

General Services feedback and direction regarding necessary changes, additions, and edits to

Department Matters 04/21/14| TAE space consolidation plan 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services Corresponded with J. Hill (CFO) regarding revised meeting date to discuss

Department Matters 04/22/14|DMI GSD/DPD space consolidation review 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

General Services Email communication with J. Brown (Impact - GSD) regarding GSD space

Department Matters 04/22/14|DMI consolidation review analysis 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

General Services

Department Matters | 04/22/14|MCW Updated revenue restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for department 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Detailed review and analysis of updated City space consolidation plan for costs

General Services and savings (.8) Provided comments and edits for further revisions to J. Brown

Department Matters 04/22/14 | TAE and D. lafrate (CM) (.3) 1.10 | 425.00 467.50

General Services Teleconference with J. Brown (Impact) related to facility consolidation presentation

Department Matters 04/23/14|CMG adjustments 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Services Email correspondence with J. Brown (Impact - GSD) regarding changes to space

Department Matters 04/23/14|DMI consolidation review analysis 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Researched new information received from Human Resources and Labor

General Services Relations pertaining to union affiliation for department employees for the purpose

Department Matters 04/23/14|MCW of providing information related to service delivery alternatives 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Detailed review and analysis of updated with substantial revisions of City space

General Services consolidation plan for costs and savings (.9) Provided comments and edits for

Department Matters 04/23/14 | TAE further revisions to J. Brown and D. lafrate (CM) (..4) 1.30 | 425.00 552.50

General Services Meeting with J. Hill (CFO), T. Eddy (CM), GSD leadership regarding space

Department Matters 04/24/14 | CMG consolidation plan overview, approvals and next steps 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

General Services Reviewed and provided comments to J. Brown (Impact) on space consolidation

Department Matters 04/24/14|CMG plan presentation for meeting with J. Hill (CFO) 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Services

Department Matters 04/24/14 MCW Updated space consolidation analysis for CM meeting with department 1.70 | 275.00 467.50

General Services

Department Matters 04/24/14|MCW Updated space consolidation analysis with comments from C. Gannon (CM) 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Participated in meeting with J. Hill (CFO), C. Gannon (CM), GSD leadership
regarding space consolidation plan overview, approvals and next steps (1.0),

General Services meeting follow up discussions with GSD (B. Dick, J. Knight) to assign task

Department Matters 04/24/14 | TAE responsibilities and required information gathering assignments from meeting (.6) 1.60 | 425.00 680.00

General Services Prepared for meeting to review and gain approval of update space consolidated

Department Matters 04/24/14 | TAE plan and related costs 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Made revisions to GSD plan of adjustment restructuring initiatives to reflect

General Services changes in the plan's baseline as a result of shifting of costs of security from GSD

Department Matters 04/24/14| TAE to 36D's budget 0.70 | 425.00 297.50
Made substantial edits and updates to GSD and DPD's space consolidation plan

General Services to reflected updated costs, lease savings, and return on investment to support

Department Matters 04/24/14 | TAE funding of initiative 1.20 | 425.00 510.00

General Services Discussed GSD plan of adjustment changes with J. Addison for inclusion in

Department Matters 04/24/14| TAE updated plan of adjustment and disclosure statement submission 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Services Telephone call with D. lafrate, M. Walsh (CM) regarding changes of assumptions

Department Matters 04/24/14 | TAE of lease consolidation savings in updated plan of adjustments 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

General Services Met with C. Gannon to review changes to lease savings included in plan of

Department Matters 04/24/14| TAE adjustment based on changes in space consolidation plan 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

General Services Reviewed amended POA and Disclosure statement submissions for accuracy

Department Matters 04/25/14| TAE pertaining to GSD initiatives, cost impact and comments 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Services

Department Matters 04/28/14|CMG Correspondence with J. Brown (Impact) regarding facility consolidation analysis 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services Correspondence with B. Dick, J. Brown regarding DDC build out following meeting

Department Matters 04/28/14 | CMG with S. Fox on matter 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
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Performed review and analysis of GSD contractor's weekly time submission to
ensure accurate reporting and subsequently approved with staffing agency. This

General Services is a required activity to properly process our monthly invoices with the Fee

Department Matters 04/28/14|DMI Examiner. 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Participated in meeting with GSD management to develop plans and action tasks

General Services for building business case detail in order to secure quality of life funds included in

Department Matters 04/28/14| TAE the Plan of Adjustment 1.80 | 425.00 765.00
E-mail correspondence with D. lafrate, C. Gannon, and J. Brown (CM) regarding

General Services processing of quality of life loan funds business case for DPD capital improvement

Department Matters 04/29/14 | TAE requirements 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services Telephone conference with E. Petrovski regarding status || |

Department Matters | 04/29/14 | TAE 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

General Services Examined and analyzed new privatization code agreement and procedures for

Department Matters | 04/30/14| TAE application to current outsourcing activities 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

General Services E-mail correspondence with. Brown, J. Anderson, B. Dick (GSD) regarding tasks

Department Matters 04/30/14| TAE required and responsibility for completion of business case applications for funds 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

General Services Telephone conference with J. Brown (CM) to provide feedback, updates and

Department Matters 04/30/14| TAE guidance as related to GSD restructuring activities 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

General Services Participate in meeting to discuss final contract terms, scope of work, and transition

Department Matters | 04/30/14| TAE of custodial services to outside contractor, Kristal Janitorial Services 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Participate in meeting to GSD management team to develop business case plans

General Services and responsibilities for application for quality of life loan funds to implement key

Department Matters 04/30/14 | TAE restructuring initiatives 3.50 | 425.00 1,487.50

Human Resources Email communications with Purchasing Manager regarding ||| ]I 2~¢

Matters 04/01/14 | GMK current temporary labor spend 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Email communications with Y. Hackney regarding current temporary labor spend,

Matters 04/01/14|GMK 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Email and oral communications with MCW, Purchasing Director, and Purchasing

Matters 04/01/14| GMK employee regarding previously provide PSC summary 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Reviewed current list of personal service contracts provided by HR for the purpose

Matters 04/01/14| MCW of understanding reported inaccuracies 0.40 | 275.00 110.00

Human Resources Reviewed department responses to request for information on active personal

Matters 04/01/14|MCW service contracts 1.50 | 275.00 412.50
Reviewed Payroll Register B (document) for the purpose of reconciliation between

Human Resources list of personal service contracts provided by HR in order to get accurate count of

Matters 04/01/14 | MCW active employees 1.80 | 275.00 495.00
Reviewed Payroll Register C (document) for the purpose of reconciliation between

Human Resources list of personal service contracts provided by HR in order to get accurate count of

Matters 04/01/14|MCW active employees 1.40 | 275.00 385.00

Human Resources Reviewed temporary employee list for the purpose of eliminating double counting

Matters 04/01/14 MCW between personal service contract list and temporary employee list 0.50 | 275.00 137.50

Human Resources Discussion with Y. Hackney regarding status of various current HR restructuring

Matters 04/02/14|GMK initiatives 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Human Resources Preparation of updated HR, LR, and Human Rights 10 Year

Matters 04/02/14|GMK Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections utilizing updated fringe rates 1.40 | 425.00 595.00
Continued to reviewed Payroll Register B (document) for the purpose of

Human Resources reconciliation between list of personal service contracts provided by HR in order to

Matters 04/02/14| MCW get accurate count of active employees 1.20 | 275.00 330.00

Human Resources Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document

Matters 04/02/14|MCW provided by HR 0.20 | 275.00 55.00

Human Resources Review and analysis of updates to benefit factors by employee type to be used in

Matters 04/03/14|CMM projections, including primary causes for changes 0.40 | 495.00 198.00

Human Resources

Matters 04/03/14|GMK Discussion with Y. Hackney regarding status of updated temporary spend analysis 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Email communications with Director and Deputy Director regarding status of

Matters 04/03/14|GMK recruitment and selection memo 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Email communications with Director and Deputy Director regarding future meeting

Matters 04/03/14| GMK agenda 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Preparation of updated HR, LR, and Human Rights 10 Year

Human Resources Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections utilizing updated wage and fringe rates

Matters 04/03/14| GMK as well as other adjustments 1.80 | 425.00 765.00

Human Resources E-mail communications with D. Azzopard regarding

Matters 04/03/14 | TAE status of search for candidates for lean process improvements 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
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Human Resources Email communications with Purchasing Manager regarding ||| Il 2~¢
Matters 04/04/14 | GMK current temporary labor spend analysis 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Human Resources Email communications with TAE, Deputy Finance Director, and Deputy HR
Matters 04/04/14| GMK Director regarding requested FMLA information 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Human Resources Preparation of updated Human Resource Department 10 Year
Matters 04/04/14| GMK Reinvestment/Reorganization Projection 1.30 | 425.00 552.50
Human Resources Preparation of updated Labor Relations Division 10 Year
Matters 04/05/14| GMK Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
Human Resources Preparation of updated Human Rights/Board of Ethics Department 10 Year
Matters 04/05/14| GMK Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Human Resources Email communications with Y. Hackney regarding status of updated temporary
Matters 04/05/14| GMK spend analysis 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Human Resources Input comments for the Human Resource Restructuring/Reinvestment 10 Year
Matters 04/06/14|MCW Projections 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Human Resources
Matters 04/07/14|DMI Performed update and revision to HR Budget Package 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Human Resources Participation in meeting with Director and Deputy Director regarding HR and LR 10
Matters 04/07/14 | GMK Year Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections and restructuring project template 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Human Resources Preparation for meeting with Director and Deputy Director regarding HR and LR 10
Matters 04/07/14 | GMK Year Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections and restructuring project template 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Human Resources
Matters 04/07/14 | GMK Preparation of updated LR restructuring project template 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Human Resources Email communications with DMI, Director, and Deputy Director regarding LR
Matters 04/07/14 | GMK restructuring project template 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Reconciled department personal service contract information related to document
Human Resources provided by HR for the purpose of getting an accurate count of number of City
Matters 04/07/14| MCW personal service contractors and amount being spent 1.80 | 275.00 495.00
Human Resources Input non-department personal service contract information related to document
Matters 04/07/14|MCW provided by HR 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Human Resources
Matters 04/08/14| GMK Review and analysis of updated temporary staffing contract run-rate analysis 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Email communications with Y. Hackney, Purchasing Director, Purchasing
Human Resources Manager, and E&Y (oral discussion with E&Y as well) regarding updated
Matters 04/08/14| GMK temporary staffing contract run-rate analysis 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Human Resources Participation in meeting with Y. Hackney regarding status of current temporary
Matters 04/09/14| GMK labor spend analysis and other work-streams including recommended next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Human Resources Preparation for meeting with Y. Hackney regarding status of current temporary
Matters 04/09/14| GMK labor spend analysis and other work-streams including recommended next steps 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Human Resources Email communications with Deputy Mayor Chief of Staff regarding |||
Matters 04/09/14| GMK 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Human Resources
Matters 04/09/14| GMK Preparation of updated LR 10 Year Reinvestment/Reorganization Projections 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Human Resources Discussion with E&Y and email communications with Y. Hackney regarding
Matters 04/10/14| GMK current temporary staffing agency spend and charging methodology 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Human Resources Email communications with and TAE regarding potential
Matters 04/10/14|GMK Purchasing contractor resource 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Human Resources Reviewed, compared, and analyzed HR reports of active City employees from
Matters 04/10/14 |KJH multiple sources 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Human Resources Review and analysis of memorandum regarding the status of the City's organized
Matters 04/11/14|GMK labor relations 1.20 | 425.00 510.00
Human Resources Continued reviewing department personal service contract information related to
Matters 04/11/14|MCW document provided by HR 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Human Resources Continued reviewing department personal service contract information related to
Matters 04/11/14  MCW document provided by HR 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
Human Resources Email communications with CMG and ||l re9arding contractor
Matters 04/14/14 | GMK resource availability 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Human Resources
Matters 04/15/14|CMG Correspondence with K. Haves regarding il invcice clarification 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
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Human Resources Correspondence with K Haves (HR) regarding | ili] invcice and timing of

Matters 04/15/14|CMG deliverables 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Email communications with Mayor Deputy Chief of Staff regarding status of-

Matters 04/15/14| GMK [ | 0.10 | 425.00 42.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/15/14 | GMK Email communications with P. Natke regarding limited service employment option 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Various discussions with Deputy EM, CFO, and CMG regarding impact on

Matters 04/15/14 | GMK operational restructuring from 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Human Resources Email discussions with JD and CMG regarding impact on operational restructuring

Matters 04/15/14| GMK frol 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Participated in weekly HR meeting with G. Kushiner (CM) and Y. Hackney

Matters 04/16/14|CMG (Impact) regarding current activities with HR department and potential next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Participated in weekly HR meeting with G. Kushiner (CM) and P. Natke (Impact)

Human Resources regarding current activities in Training and document retention within HR

Matters 04/16/14|CMG department 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Human Resources Email communications with JD and CMG regarding impact on operational

Matters 04/16/14 | GMK restructuring from 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Participation in meeting with Y. Hackney and CMG regarding current week

Matters 04/16/14| GMK activities, work-stream priorities, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Preparation for meeting with Y. Hackney and CMG regarding current week

Matters 04/16/14 | GMK activities, work-stream priorities, and next steps 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Participation in meeting with P. Natke and CMG regarding current week activities,

Human Resources document imaging and management work-stream, other work-stream priorities,

Matters 04/16/14|GMK and next steps 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Preparation for meeting with P. Natke and CMG regarding current week activities,

Human Resources document imaging and management work-stream, other work-stream priorities,

Matters 04/16/14 | GMK and next steps 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources

Matters 04/17/14|GMK 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Human Resources Email communications with Director of Human Rights/Board of Ethics regarding

Matters 04/17/14|GMK business case templates for QOL proceeds 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Multiple email communications with HR Director and Deputy Director regarding

Matters 04/17/14|GMK business case templates for QOL proceeds 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Multiple email communications with HR Deputy Director and CMG regarding status

Matters 04/17/14|GMK of_ compensation study work 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/17/14|GMK Email communications with P. Natke regarding additional HR restructuring projects 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Email communications with HR Deputy Director regarding status of current

Matters 04/17/14|GMK headcount report 0.10 | 425.00 42.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/18/14|GMK Email communications with HR consultant regarding performance evaluations 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Review and analysis of March headcount report for changes in key departments

Matters 04/21/14|CMM and status against budget 0.30 | 495.00 148.50

Human Resources Participation in meeting with HR Deputy Director regarding advice and guidance

Matters 04/21/14 | GMK for completion of business case templates 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Human Resources Preparation for meeting with HR Deputy Director regarding advice and guidance

Matters 04/21/14|GMK for completion of business case templates 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
Multiple email communications with Mayor Deputy Chief of Staff, Purchasing

Human Resources Manager, and HR Deputy Director regarding contract and next

Matters 04/21/14|GMK steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/21/14| GMK Review and analysis of monthly headcount report by department 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Human Resources

Matters 04/21/14|MCW 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Participation in meeting with Deputy Director, Purchasing Manager, and Y.

Human Resources Hackney regarding current temporary labor spend, , and

Matters 04/22/14|GMK other HR issues 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Human Resources Review and analysis of comments provided by Mayor Deputy Chief of Staff on

Matters 04/22/14| GMK ] 0.80 | 425.00 340.00
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Multiple email communications with E&Y, Purchasing representatives, and HR

Human Resources representatives regarding current temporary labor spend and reconciliation

Matters 04/22/14|GMK process 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Human Resources Email communications with MCW for preparatior|jj | |

Matters 04/22/14|GMK ] 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/22/14 | GMK Email communications with MCW regarding preparation of PSC summary listing 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Email and verbal communications with City Project Analyst, EMP, and CMG

Matters 04/22/14 | GMK regarding preparation of wage compensation comparison analysis 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/22/14|MCW Updated revenue restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for HR department 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Human Resources Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for HR

Matters 04/22/14\ MCW department 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Participated in meeting with L. King, S. Mays (EMO), and KJH to discuss labor

Human Resources negotiations, work rules, management rights, and limitations on hiring,

Matters 04/23/14|CMG terminations and job eliminations in light of restructuring strategy 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Human Resources Participation in meeting with Test and Test Development employee regarding

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK potential tests for Finance Department reorganization work-stream 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Preparation for meeting with Test and Test Development employee regarding

Matters 04/23/14| GMK potential tests for Finance Department reorganization work-stream 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Participation in meeting with Y. Hackney regarding current week activities, work-

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK stream priorities, current and projected temporary labor spend, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Preparation for meeting with Y. Hackney regarding current week activities, work-

Matters 04/23/14 | GMK stream priorities, current and projected temporary labor spend, and next steps 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Participation in meeting with P. Natke regarding current week activities, document

Human Resources imaging and management work-stream, other work-stream priorities, and next

Matters 04/23/14| GMK steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Preparation for meeting with P. Natke regarding current week activities, document

Human Resources imaging and management work-stream, other work-stream priorities, and next

Matters 04/23/14|GMK steps 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Email communications with JD ||| NG

Matters 04/23/14|GMK 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Email communications with MCW regarding

Matters 04/23/14|GMK 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Met with L.King (HR Consultant), S.Mays (EMO), and CMG regarding labor

Human Resources negotiations, work rules, management rights, and limitations on hiring,

Matters 04/23/14|KJH terminations, and job elimination 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Human Resources

Matters 04/23/14|KJH Reviewed and analyzed March 2014 headcount report 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Researched new information received from Human Resources and Labor

Human Resources Relations pertaining to

Matters 04/23/14|MCW 0.20 | 275.00 55.00
Meeting with L. King (HR Consultant),and K. Hand (CM) regarding HR strategies,

Human Resources written exams, self certification, and job descriptions, training and update from

Matters 04/24/14|CMG meeting with HR leadership 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

Human Resources Review of email communications regarding temporary staffing spending run-rates

Matters 04/24/14 |GMK and payment schedule 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Prepared for meeting with L.King (HR Consultant) and CMG regarding role of HR

Human Resources restructuring in operational restructuring, Finance restructuring, job requirements,

Matters 04/24/14|KJH human resource related requirements, guidelines, and constraints, and next steps 2.50 | 425.00 1,062.50
Met with L.King (HR Consultant) with CMG regarding potential HR strategies,

Human Resources written examinations, self-certification, job descriptions, training, and update from

Matters 04/24/14|KJH meeting with HR leadership (M.Hall, K.Haves) 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Weekly meeting with HR Director, Deputy Director, and GMK regarding business

Human Resources case templates, priority restructuring initiatives, and

Matters 04/25/14|CMG terms, and results of job fair 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Participation in meeting with HR Director, Deputy Director, and CMG regarding

Human Resources business case templates, priority restructuring initiatives, || | | | GccNGETEcNING

Matters 04/25/14 | GMK and terms, and results of job fair 1.00 | 425.00 425.00
Preparation for meeting with HR Director, Deputy Director, and CMG regarding

Human Resources business case templates, priority restructuring initiatives.

Matters 04/25/14 | GMK and terms, and results of job fair 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Human Resources Multiple email communications with Deputy Finance Director and MCW regarding

Matters 04/25/14| GMK updated PSC listing 0.40 | 425.00 170.00
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Human Resources

Matters 04/26/14| GMK Review and analysis of HR Department time entries for March 2014 0.50 | 425.00 212.50
Meeting with L. King (HR Consultant) and K. Hand (CM) to discuss HR information

Human Resources received, initial impressions of department, key deficiencies, and recommended

Matters 04/28/14 | CMG next steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/28/14 | GMK Preparation of HR summary write-up for March 2014 0.90 | 425.00 382.50
Met with L.King (HR Consultant) with CMG regarding HR information received,

Human Resources initial impressions of department, major weaknesses, and recommended next

Matters 04/28/14|KJH steps 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Participation in meeting with HR Deputy Director, Purchasing Manager, and Y.

Human Resources Hackney regarding

Matters 04/29/14|GMK 1.50 | 425.00 637.50
Preparation for meeting with HR Deputy Director, Purchasing Manager, and Y.

Human Resources Hackney regarding

Matters 04/29/14|GMK 0.40 | 425.00 170.00

Human Resources Email communications with HR employee regarding testing related information

Matters 04/29/14|GMK request 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Email communications with Y. Hackney regarding status of various open

Matters 04/29/14 | GMK information request items 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources

Matters 04/30/14|CMG Participated in weekly HR meeting with Y. Hackney 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Correspondence with D. Burnbaum (Jones Day) regarding bargaining unit

Matters 04/30/14|CMG negotiations and current implications 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources Participation in meeting with Y. Hackney regarding current temporary labor spend

Matters 04/30/14| GMK analysis, current week activities, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Preparation for meeting with Y. Hackney regarding current temporary labor spend

Matters 04/30/14|GMK analysis, current week activities, and next steps 0.20 | 425.00 85.00

Human Resources Participation in meeting with P. Natke regarding status of document imaging and

Matters 04/30/14| GMK management RFP, current week activities, and next steps 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Human Resources Preparation for meeting with P. Natke regarding status of document imaging and

Matters 04/30/14 |GMK management RFP, current week activities, and next steps 0.30 | 425.00 127.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/30/14| GMK Review and analysis of updated HR Department organizational chart 0.80 | 425.00 340.00

Human Resources

Matters 04/30/14|GMK Review and analysis of ||| [ N N 0.70 | 425.00 297.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/30/14| MCW Analyzed HR employee information and updated workbookq 2.10 | 275.00 577.50

Human Resources Email correspondence with department regarding current employee roster

Matters 04/30/14|MCW 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Human Resources

Matters 04/30/14|MCW 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Information

Technology Services Participation in meeting with CIO, JAA, and Director regarding 10 Year

Matters 04/08/14| GMK Reinvestment/Reorganization Projection project timing and priorities 1.00 | 425.00 425.00

Information

Technology Services Preparation for meeting with CIO, JAA, and Director regarding 10 Year

Matters 04/08/14 | GMK Reinvestment/Reorganization Projection project timing and priorities 0.50 | 425.00 212.50

Information

Technology Services Prepared for meeting with B. Niblock (ITS), C. Dodd (ITS) and G. Kushiner (CM)

Matters 04/08/14|JAA to discuss the updated 10-year plan with respect to IT related projects 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Information

Technology Services Met with B. Niblock (ITS), C. Dodd (ITS) and G. Kushiner (CM) to discuss the

Matters 04/08/14|JAA updated 10-year plan with respect to IT related projects 1.00 | 345.00 345.00

Information

Technology Services

Matters 04/10/14|EMP Corresponded via e-mail with B. Niblock (ITS) re: 311 systems costs 0.40 | 345.00 138.00

Information

Technology Services

Matters 04/10/14|EMP Spoke with B. Niblock (ITS) re: 311 systems plan and related cost estimates 0.30 | 345.00 103.50

Information

Technology Services

Matters 04/11/14|CMG Correspondence with C. Dodd (ITS) regarding historical IT inventory development 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
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Information
Technology Services Review of multiple email communications regarding IT systems and applications
Matters 04/11/14| GMK used in Operating Departments 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Information
Technology Services Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document
Matters 04/11/14|MCW provided by HR 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Information Document management RFP meeting to discuss responses to bidders questions,
Technology Services Electronic Document Management system bid evaluation team includes P. Natke,
Matters 04/15/14| TAE K. Haves (HR), C. Dodd, J. Devanport (ITS), Y. Gaines (Purchasing) 1.10 | 425.00 467.50
Information
Technology Services Correspondence with B. Niblock and E. Petrovski (CM) regarding- Motorola
Matters 04/17/14|CMG and Tiburon issues, and current alternatives 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Information
Technology Services Multiple email communications with CIO and ITS Director regarding business case
Matters 04/17/14|GMK templates for Quality of Life proceeds 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Information
Technology Services
Matters 04/21/14|GMK Email communications with CIO regarding potential ITS ||| | I 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Information
Technology Services Email communications with ITS Director regarding preparation of business case
Matters 04/22/14|GMK templates 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Information
Technology Services Review and analysis of multiple email communications between ITS and HR
Matters 04/25/14| GMK representatives regarding IT contractor RFP work-stream 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Information Participation in meeting with ITS Director, ITS Manager, Purchasing Manager,
Technology Services Purchasing Buyer, Y. Hackney regarding proposed RFP for contractual IT
Matters 04/29/14|GMK assistance 2.00 | 425.00 850.00
Information Preparation for meeting with ITS Director, ITS Manager, Purchasing Manager,
Technology Services Purchasing Buyer, Y. Hackney regarding proposed RFP for contractual IT
Matters 04/29/14| GMK assistance 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Information
Technology Services Email communications with ITS Director regarding ITS contractor strategy
Matters 04/29/14|GMK recommendation 0.20 | 425.00 85.00
Law Department Provided updates on restructuring initiatives for Law, per request from J. Hill
Matters 04/02/14 | DMI (CFO) 0.30 | 275.00 82.50
Law Department Performed updates and revisions to Law Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,
Matters 04/02/14|DMI based on revised benefit information received from EY 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Reviewed department personal service contract information related to document
provided by HR, Document received from HR was personnel list of Full-time
Law Department employees and personal service contractors that are reported as currently working
Matters 04/02/14 | MCW for the City of Detroit 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Law Department Performed updates and revisions to Law Plan of Adjustment 10-year projection,
Matters 04/03/14|DMI based on revised benefit information received from EY on 4/3 0.70 | 275.00 192.50
Law Department
Matters 04/06/14|MCW Input comments for the restructuring/reinvestment projections 0.10 | 275.00 27.50
Law Department Met with M. Hausman (CM) to discuss necessary deferrals regarding Law
Matters 04/08/14|DMI Department Plan of Adjustment projections 0.60 | 275.00 165.00
Law Department
Matters 04/08/14|DMI Performed updates to Law Plan of Adjustment 10-year projections 1.10 | 275.00 302.50
Law Department Meeting with D. lafrate (CM) to discuss necessary deferrals regarding Law
Matters 04/08/14|MJH Department Plan of Adjustment projections 0.60 | 425.00 255.00
Law Department Revised POA 10-year projections based on updated assumptions received from
Matters 04/13/14|DMI E&Y to be included in Second Amended Disclosure Statement, as it relates to Law 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Law Department Email communications with HR Director and Law Director regarding FY 2014 and
Matters 04/15/14| GMK FY 2015 budgeted headcount for Law Department 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Law Department Prepared summary of Law Department related to responses from employee
Matters 04/16/14|DMI surveys 0.80 | 275.00 220.00
Law Department Discussion with JD attorney and coordination with CM team regarding Law
Matters 04/17/14 | GMK Department FY 2015 Budget information 0.30 | 425.00 127.50
Law Department
Matters 04/22/14|MCW Updated revenue restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for department 0.40 | 275.00 110.00
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Law Department Updated technology infrastructure restructuring/reinvestment initiatives for

Matters 04/22/14| MCW department 0.30 | 275.00 82.50

Law Department Multiple email communications with JD, CM, and other City representatives

Matters 04/28/14| GMK regarding Law Department organizational restructuring and budget impact 0.60 | 425.00 255.00

Law Department Performed review of K. Orr draft letter to B. Hollowell (Law) as it relates to

Matters 04/29/14|DMI restructuring of department 1.10 | 275.00 302.50

Law Department Developed analysis providing differing scenarios for revised organizational

Matters 04/29/14|DMI structure, per request from Jones Day 2.70 | 275.00 742.50

Law Department Met with M. Hausman (CM) to discuss Law analysis on r