IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

in re:	: Chapter 11				
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1	: Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)				
Debtors.	: Jointly Administered : Objection Deadline: 3/22/2010 @ 4 PM Hearing: TBD if Objections filed				
NINTH MONTHLY APPLICATION (DECEMBER 1, 2009 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2009) OF ELLIOTT GREENLEAF, SPECIAL LITIGATION AND CONFLICTS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS, FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES PURSUANT TO 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 AND 331					
Name of Applicant:	Elliott Greenleaf				
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	<u>Debtors</u>				
Date of Retention:	Nunc Pro Tunc to September 26, 2008				
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	December 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009				
Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$42,915.00 (80%, \$34,332.00)				
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$9,631.52				

The total time expended for fee application preparation is approximately 4.0 hrs and the corresponding compensation requested is approximately \$800.00.

_X monthly ___ interim __ final application

This is a:

¹ The Debtors in these Chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification numbers are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395).



08122291003010000000000001

If this is not the first application filed, disclose the following for each prior application:

Fee Application Covered Dates, Date Filed, Doc. No.	Total Fee Request	Total Expense Request	Certificate of No Objection/ Certification of Counsel Filing Date, Doc. No.	Total Amount of Fees Approved to Date via Certificate of No Objection (80%)	Total Amount of Expenses Approved to Date via Certificate of No Objection (100%)	Amount of Holdback Fees
4/1/09-4/30/09 7/1/09 Doc. No. 1258	\$13,117.50	\$414.08	7/23/2009 Doc. No. 1381	\$10,494.00	\$414.08	\$2,623.50
5/1/09-5/31/09 7/1/09 Doc. No. 1260	\$44,086.50	\$2,370.69	7/23/2009 Doc. No. 1382	\$35,269.20	\$2,370.69	\$8,817.30
6/1/09-6/30/09 7/20/2009 Doc. No. 1350	\$56,307.00	\$1,801.27	8/13/2009 Doc. No. 1487	\$45,045.60	\$1,801.27	\$11,261.40
7/1/09-7/31/09 8/25/2009 Doc. No. 1548	\$81,265.00	\$15,070.71	9/16/2009 Doc. No. 1616	\$65,012.00	\$15,070.71	\$16,253.00
8/1/09-8/31/09 9/28/2009 Doc. No. 1663	\$59,267.00	\$3,153.27	10/22/2009 Doc. No. 1751	\$47,413.60	\$3,153.27	\$11,853.40
9/1/09-9/30/09 11/5/2009 Doc. No. 1838	\$85,135.50	\$3,400.05	12/2/2009 Doc. No. 1954	\$68,108.40	\$3,400.05	\$17,027.10
10/1/09- 10/31/09 12/23/2009 Doc. No. 2052	\$55,948.50	\$3,585.61	1/15/2010 Doc. No. 2165	\$44,758.80	\$3,585.61	\$11,189.70
11/1/09- 11/30/09 12/23/2009 Doc. No. 2053	\$45,407.50	\$2,960.77	1/15/2010 Doc. No. 2166	\$36,326.00	\$2,960.77	\$9,081.50

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	X	
In re:	:	Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1	: :	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
Debtors.	: : :	Jointly Administered Objection Deadline: 3/22/2010 @ 4 PM Hearing: TBD if Objections filed
	X	

NINTH MONTHLY APPLICATION (DECEMBER 1, 2009 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2009) OF ELLIOTT GREENLEAF, SPECIAL LITIGATION AND CONFLICTS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS, FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES PURSUANT TO 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 AND 331

Elliott Greenleaf ("EG"), special litigation and conflicts counsel to Washington Mutual, Inc. and WMI Investment Corp., the above-captioned debtors and debtors-in-possession ("Debtors"), hereby submits this Ninth Monthly Application of Elliott Greenleaf, Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors, for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 and 331 ("Application") for legal services performed during the period commencing December 1, 2009 through and including December 31, 2009 ("Application Period"). In support thereof, EG respectfully represents as follows:

BACKGROUND

1. On September 26, 2008 (the "Petition Date") the Debtors filed voluntary petitions for reorganization under Chapter 11 of Title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"). This Court has entered an Order directing

¹ The Debtors in these Chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification numbers are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395).

joint administration of these Chapter 11 cases. The Debtors continue to operate their businesses and manage their properties as debtors-in-possession pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these cases.

- 2. On October 15, 2008, the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware (the "United States Trustee") appointed the Committee pursuant to Section 1102(a)(l) of the Bankruptcy Code (Docket No. 78).
- 3. On May 18, 2009, the Court entered an Order Authorizing Employment and Retention *Nunc Pro Tunc* of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors (Docket no. 1042). On May 19, 2009, this Court entered an Order Authorizing Employment and Retention *Nunc Pro Tunc* of Elliott Greenleaf as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession (Docket No. 1053) ("EG Retention Order"). Pursuant to the EG Retention Order, EG was retained *nunc pro tunc* to September 26, 2008.

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

- 4. This Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. Venue of this proceeding and this Application is proper on this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2)(A) and (M).
- 5. The statutory bases for relief requested herein are §§ 105(a), 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code.

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF COMPENSATION OF EG

6. Subject to Court approval, EG seeks payment for compensation on an

hourly basis, plus reimbursement of actual, necessary expenses incurred by EG during the Application Period. With the exception of copy charges (which are charged at a lower rate), the rates charged by EG in this case do not materially differ from the rates charged to EG's non-bankruptcy clients and are lower in many cases.

- 7. A summary of the hours spent, the names of each professional and paraprofessional rendering services to the Debtors during the Application Period, the regular customary billing rates and the total value of time incurred by each of the EG attorneys rendering services to the Debtors is attached hereto as Exhibit A. A copy of the computer generated time entries reflecting the time recorded for these services, organized in project billing categories in accordance with the United States Trustee's Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 ("Guidelines"), is attached hereto as Exhibit B. A statement of expenses incurred by EG during the Application Period is also included in Exhibit B. All time entries and requested expenses are in compliance with Local Rule 2016-2.²
- 8. On November 14, 2008, this Court entered the Amended Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (Docket No. 302) ("Amended Interim Compensation Order"). Pursuant to the Amended Interim Compensation Order, EG and other professionals retained in this case are authorized to file and to serve upon the Debtors and the parties identified in the Amended Interim Compensation Order monthly fee applications ("Monthly Fee Application") of their fees and expenses. After the expiration of a twenty

² EG has also attempted to ensure that this Application complies with the Guidelines. To the extent that the Guidelines conflict with local rules, in particular, Local Rule 2016-2, EG has chosen to comply with such local rule. EG will supplement this Application with additional detail or information upon request.

- (20) day objection period, the Debtors are authorized to promptly pay eighty percent (80%) of the fees and one hundred percent (100%) of the expenses requested in the Monthly Fee Application, unless an objection specifically objects to fees and/or expenses of a professional, or the Court orders otherwise.
- 9. In accordance with the Amended Interim Compensation Order, EG has filed and served upon the Notice Parties identified in the Amended Interim Compensation Order this Application with respect to fees and expenses incurred during the Application Period in the amount of \$42,915.00 in fees and in the amount of \$9,631.52 in expenses.
- 10. All services and costs for which compensation is requested by EG in this Application were reasonable and necessary and were performed for and on behalf of the Debtors during the Application Period.

CASE STATUS

- 11. To the best of EG's knowledge, the Debtors' monthly operating reports contain up-to-date information regarding the amount of cash on hand or on deposit in the Debtors' estate, the amount and nature of accrued unpaid administrative expenses, the Debtors' operating profits or losses, and the amount of unencumbered funds in the Debtors' estate.
- 12. To the best of EG's knowledge, the Debtors have paid to the United States

 Trustee its initial quarterly fees and has filed its initial monthly operating report.

NARRATIVE SUMMARY OF SERVICES

13. EG has rendered actual and necessary services on behalf of the estate and is requesting reasonable compensation for their services for the Application Period. As

noted above, a summary by project category is attached as <u>Exhibit B</u>, as are detailed time entries organized by category and chronology within the categories.

retained to perform all necessary legal services related to suits or other legal actions against present or former clients of Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP and Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A. ("Conflict Parties") in these cases as is appropriate. EG will not be doing any work that is duplicative of Debtors' Counsel. EG has been primarily retained, but not to the exclusion of any related duties described in the Application, to commence, prosecute, and defend, as appropriate, adversary proceedings against the Conflict Parties including, but not limited to, adversary and other necessary parties (Adv. Proc. 09-50551 (MFW) commenced in this Court on March 24, 2009 by JPMorgan against the Debtors and the FDIC. On March 30, 2009, JPMorgan Chase moved to intervene.). The retention of EG has been requested by the Debtors because, and shall be limited to those instances in which Debtors' Counsel have conflicts which they have been unable to resolve through a waiver or otherwise. These conflicts preclude them from representing the Debtors' interests against JPMorgan and other necessary parties to the dispute with JPMorgan.

COMPENSATION REQUESTED

15. EG expended 136.4 hours during the Application Period in furtherance of its efforts on behalf of the Debtors. EG requests allowance of compensation in amount of \$42,915.00 for legal services rendered during the Application Period at a blended hourly rate of \$314.63. Pursuant to the Amended Interim Compensation Order, EG requests payment of 80% of the total fees requested, or \$34,332.00. None of the requested fees detailed herein have been paid.

REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES

- 16. During the Application Period, EG incurred certain necessary expenses in rendering legal services to the Debtors as set forth in Exhibit C. Exhibit C sets forth in summary detail the expenses incurred during the Application Period (copies of invoices from EG's vendors are available for inspection upon request). Telecopying services completed in-house by EG were charged at \$1.00 per page for outgoing facsimiles only. EG represents that its rate for duplication is \$0.10 per page, consistent with the Local Rules and Guidelines. In order to more efficiently handle the voluminous copying of pleadings served and filed in this case, EG on occasion retained third-party duplication service providers. EG seeks reimbursement only for the actual expenses charged by such third-party service providers. Finally, EG seeks reimbursement for computer assisted research, which is the actual cost of such charges, if any.
- 17. EG seeks reimbursement for its reasonable, necessary and actual expenses incurred during the Application Period for the total amount of \$9,631.52.

LEGAL STANDARD

- 18. Section 330(a)(l) of the Bankruptcy Code allows the payment of:
- (A) reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered by the trustee, examiner, professional person, or attorney and by any paraprofessional person employed by any such person; and
- (B) reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses.
- 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1). Reasonableness of compensation is driven by the "market-driven approach" which considers the nature, extent and value of services provided by the professional and cost of comparable services in the non-bankruptcy contexts. *See Zolfo Cooper & Co. v. Sunbeam-Oster Co.*, 50 F.3d 253, 258 (3d Cir. 1995); *In re Busy Beaver*

Building Ctr., Inc., 19 F.3d 833, 849 (3d Cir, 1994). Thus, the "baseline rule is for films to receive their customary rates." Zolfo Cooper, 50 F.3d at 259.

- 19. In accordance with its practices in non-bankruptcy matters, EG has calculated its compensation requested in their Application by applying the standard hourly rates. EG's calculation is based upon hourly rates that are well within the range of rates that are charged by comparable firms in similar bankruptcy cases. Accordingly, EG's rates should be determined to be reasonable under § 330 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 20. EG's fees during the Application Period are also reasonable under the prevailing legal standard and should be allowed. The amount of these fees is not unusual given the complexity, accelerated deadlines, aggressive sale schedule, and size of the Debtors' Chapter 11 case. EG's fees are commensurate with fees that other attorneys of comparable experience and expertise have charged and been awarded in similar Chapter 11 cases. Accordingly, EG's fees are reasonable pursuant to § 330 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 21. Section 330(a)(1)(B) of the Bankruptcy Code permits reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses. EG's legal services and expenses incurred during the Application Period are set forth in this Application and constitute only those necessary expenses that were incurred for the benefit of the Debtors' estate. EG has properly requested reimbursement of only actual, necessary and appropriate legal expenses.
- 22. Except as permitted by Bankruptcy Rule 2016, no agreement or understanding exists between EG and/or any third person for the sharing or division of compensation. All of the services for which compensation is requested in this Application were rendered at the request of and solely on behalf of the Debtors.

- 23. Pursuant to the standards set forth in §§ 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, EG submits that the compensation requested is for actual and necessary services and expenses, and is reasonable, based upon the nature, extent and value of such services, the time spent thereon, and the costs of comparable services in a case under the Bankruptcy Code.
- 24. The time records annexed to this Application constitute only a general statement of the services rendered and time expended without description of the pressure and constraints under which EG actually rendered these services. The considerable challenges of this case have been attended to and managed by EG at all levels, promptly, expertly, and often to the exclusion of the other matters in EG's office. EG submits, therefore, that its fees and expenses were actually, necessary, reasonable and justified, and should be allowed in full.

NOTICE AND NO PRIOR APPLICATION

- 25. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in this Chapter 11 case. Notice and service of this Application has been given to the Debtors; co-counsel to the Debtors; the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware; and counsel to any Committees appointed in the Debtors' Chapter 11 case pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order. Pursuant to the Fed. R. of Bank. Pr. 2002(a)(6), notice of this Application has also been given to all parties requesting notices pursuant to Fed. R. Bank. Pr. 2002. In light of the nature of the relief requested herein, EG submits that no further or other notice is required.
- 26. No previous application for the relief sought herein has made to this or any other Court.

VERIFICATION

I am familiar with the work performed on behalf of the Debtors by the 27.

lawyers and paraprofessionals in the firm.

I have reviewed the foregoing Application and the facts set forth therein 28.

are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief. Moreover, I

have reviewed Del. Bankr. L.R. 2016-2, and submit that the Application substantially

complies with such Local Rule.

WHEREFORE, EG requests that its Application for fees in the amount of

\$42,915.00 and expenses in the amount of \$9,631.52 be allowed and that if no objections

are filed, 80% of the requested fees in the amount of \$34,332.00 and 100% of the amount

of \$9.631.52 be paid for reimbursement of actual and necessary costs and expenses

incurred during the Application Period, and further requests such other and further relief

as the court may deem just and proper.

Dated: March 1, 2010

Wilmington, Delaware

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF

Zahralddin-Aravena (DE Bar No. 4166) Raďaél X√

Weil R. Lapinsk (DE Bar No. 3645)

Shelley A. Kinsella (DE Bar No. 4023)

1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700

Wilmington, Delaware 19801

Telephone: (302) 384-9400

Facsimile: (302) 384-9399

Email: rxza@elliottgreenleaf.com

Email: nrl@elliottgreenleaf.com

Email: sak@elliottgreenleaf.com

Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to

Washington Mutual, Inc. and WMI Investment Corp

9

Exhibit A

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL AND PARAPROFESSIONALS RENDERING SERVICES FROM DECEMBER 1, 2009 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2009

Name of Professional	Position	Total Billed Hours	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Compensation
Jessi A. Adkins	Paralegal	30.70 Hrs	\$200/hr	\$6,140.00
Kristin McCloskey	Paralegal	17.90 Hrs	\$200/hr	\$3,580.00
Neil R. Lapinski	Counsel	46.80 Hrs	\$375/hr	\$17,550.00
Phillip A. Giordano	Paralegal	0.80 Hrs	\$160/hr	\$128.00
Shelley A. Kinsella	Counsel	10.0 Hrs	\$385/hr	\$3,850.00
Rafael X. Zahralddin	Partner	13.50 Hrs	\$575/hr	\$7,762.50
Rafael X. Zahralddin	Partner	0.10 Hrs	\$575/hr	No change
Theodora A. Kittila	Counsel	1.20 Hrs	\$385/hr	\$462.00
Andrew G. Mirisis Aron M. Pillard	Law Clerk	13.30 Hrs	\$225/hr	\$2,992.50
	Paralegal	0.90 Hrs	\$200/hr	\$180.00
	Law Clerk	1.20 Hrs	\$225/hr	\$270.00
Darcy A. White Total:	Law Clerk	1.20 Hrs	\$223/III	\$42,915.00
Blended Rate:		\$314.63/hr	•	

Exhibit B

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF P.O. Box 3010 Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422 EIN #23-2617189

March 1, 2010

Bill Number 00945 File Number 60124-001

Washington Mutual, Inc. 1301 Second Avenue Seattle, WA 98101

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel Case No. 08-12229

LEGAL SERVICES

Through December 31, 2009

Case Administration

12/09/09 AMP	Confer with N. Lapinski and J. Adkins re: filing dates and deadlines, phone call with E. Parness [B110]	0.20 Hrs	
Relief from S	Case Administration Totals tay/Adequate Protection Pro	0.20 Hrs	\$ 40.00
12/01/09 JAA	Review email from N. Lapinski re: docket no. 1951 - Reply of the FDIC-Receiver in Further Support of Its Motion for an Order Modifying the Automatic Stay [B140]	0.10 Hrs	
12/01/09 JAA	Review docket no. 1951 - Reply of the FDIC-Receiver in Further Support of Its Motion for an Order Modifying the Automatic Stay [B140]	0.10 Hrs	
12/01/09 JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 1951 - Reply of the FDIC-Receiver in Further Support of Its Motion for an Order Modifying the Automatic Stay [B140]	0.10 Hrs	
	Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Pro Totals	0.30 Hrs	\$ 60.00

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel

Case No. 08-12229

Employment & Retention Application EGS

	-				
12/15/09	NRL	Review supplemental Kirpalani declaration regarding contract attorneys and forward to S. Kinsella for analysis of whether EG supplemental declaration is needed [B160]	0.30 Hrs		
12/22/09	DAW	Review and Revise Second Supplemental Affidavit of Rafael X. Zahralddin-Aravena In Connection With Employment of Elliott Greenleaf as Delaware Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B160]	0.20 Hrs		
12/22/09	SAK	Conference with J. Adkins re Affidavit [B160]	0.10 Hrs		
12/22/09		Review and edit Retention Affidavit; conferences with R. Zahralddin and D. White re same [B160]	0.20 Hrs		
		Employment & Retention Application EGS Totals	0.80 Hrs	\$	273.00
<u>Emplo</u>	yment	& Retention Application Other		•	
12/15/09	SAK	Email exchange with N. Lapinski re Kirpalani Declaration [B165]	0.10 Hrs		
12/18/09	JAA	Review email from N. Lapinski re: Docket No. 2031 - Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B165]	0.10 Hrs		
12/18/09	JAA	Review Docket No. 2031 - Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B165]	0.10 Hrs		
12/18/09	JAA	Email counsel re: Docket No. 2031 - Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B165]	0.10 Hrs		
12/18/09	JAA	File and serve docket no. 2031 - Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B165]	0.50 Hrs		

12/18/09	RXZ	Review draft of Supplemental Declaration (Fourth) of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B165]	0.30 Hrs	
12/18/09	SAK	Review 4th Supplemental Affidavit of Susheel Kirpalani [B165]	0.10 Hrs	
		Employment & Retention Application Other Totals	1.30 Hrs	\$ 409.50
Fee/A	oplicatio	ons and Invoices - EGS		
12/02/09	AGM	Assist with service of CNO to EG 6th fee application. [B170]	0.60 Hrs	
12/08/09	KXM	Review Exhibit B to Elliott Greenleaf November fee application [B170]	0.80 Hrs	
12/15/09	NRL	Review proposed interim fee application order [B170]	0.10 Hrs	
12/17/09	SAK	Review revised proposed fee applications order [B170]	0.10 Hrs	
12/18/09	SAK	Review Order approving Interim Fee Applications [B170]	0.10 Hrs	
12/21/09	JAA	Review email from R. Zahralddin re: docket no. 2037 - Omnibus Order Awarding Interim Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and for Reimbursement of Expenses [B170]	0.10 Hrs	
12/21/09	JAA	Review docket no. 2037 - Omnibus Order Awarding Interim Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and for Reimbursement of Expenses [B170]	0.10 Hrs	
12/21/09	JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 2037 - Omnibus Order Awarding Interim Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and for Reimbursement of Expenses [B170]	0.10 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Draft Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.70 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Draft Notice to Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Draft cover page to Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Draft Exhibit A to Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Draft Exhibit C to Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.20 Hrs	

12/22/09	KXM	Draft task billing page to Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Draft COS to Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Edit Exhibit B to Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	AGM	Assist with service of 7th EG Fee Application. [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	AGM	Assist with service of 8th EG Fee Application. [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	JAA	Assist with service re: 7th Elliott Greenleaf Fee App [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	JAA	Assist with service re: 8th Elliott Greenleaf Fee App [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.80 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft Notice to Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft cover page to Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft Exhibit A to Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft Exhibit C to Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft COS to Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Edit Exhibit B to Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.60 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	File Elliott Greenleaf 7th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	File Elliott Greenleaf 8th fee application [B170]	0.30 Hrs	
12/24/09	KXM	Email to counsel with Elliott Greenleaf 7th and 8th fee applications [B170]	0.10 Hrs	
12/28/09	SAK	Draft payment chart for fee application calculation purposes [B170]	0.50 Hrs	
12/30/09	SAK	Instructions to D. White re data needed to complete fee application calculations [B170]	0.20 Hrs	
		Fee/Applications and Invoices - EGS Totals	9.50 Hrs	\$ 2,114.00
Fee O	bjectior	ns EGS		
12/02/09	KXM	Review docket re: objections to Elliott Greenleaf's 6th fee application [B171]	0.30 Hrs	

12/02/09 12/02/09	KXM KXM	File CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 6th fee application [B171] Serve CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 6th fee application	0.30 Hrs 0.60 Hrs	
12/04/09	KXM	[B171] Email to J. Truong with docket no. 1954 - the CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 6th fee application [B171]	0.10 Hrs	
12/07/09	KXM	Review/edit Exhibit B to Elliott Greenleaf October fee application [B171]	0.50 Hrs	
12/09/09	JAA	Assist with service of CNO to 2nd Elliott Greenleaf Interim Fee App [B171]	0.40 Hrs	
12/09/09	KXM	Draft CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 2nd interim fee application [B171]	0.30 Hrs	
12/09/09	KXM	Draft COS to CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 2nd interim fee application [B171]	0.20 Hrs	
12/09/09	KXM	File CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 2nd interim fee application [B171]	0.30 Hrs	
12/09/09	KXM	Serve CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 2nd interim fee application [B171]	0.30 Hrs	
12/09/09	NRL	Review and execute Certificate of No Objection to Elliott Greenleaf's 2nd Interim Fee Application and certificate of service thereof [B171]	0.40 Hrs	
12/18/09	KXM	Email to J. Truong with docket no. 1970 - the CNO to Elliott Greenleaf's 2nd interim fee application [B171]	0.10 Hrs	
12/24/09	KXM	Email to counsel with objection deadline to Elliott Greenleaf 7th and 8th fee applications [B171]	0.10 Hrs	
12/24/09	KXM	Email to counsel with CNO date to Elliott Greenleaf 7th and 8th fee applications [B171]	0.10 Hrs	
		Fee Objections EGS Totals	4.00 Hrs	\$ 870.00
Fee A	pplication	ons and Invoices - Others		
12/01/09	RXZ	Review e-mail from J. Adkins re: Deadline to File 3rd Interim Fee Apps November 16, 2009 [B175]	0.10 Hrs	
12/22/09	KXM	Emails to/from O. Urbieta re: Quinn Emanuel October fee application [B175]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	AGM	Assist with service of QE 7th monthly fee application. [B175]	0.30 Hrs	

12/23/09	JAA	Assist with service re: 7th Quinn Emanuel Fee App [B175]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft Notice to Quinn Emanuel 7th fee application [B175]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Draft COS to Quinn Emanuel 7th fee application [B175]	0.20 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	Conform Quinn Emanuel 7th fee application to Local Rules [B175]	0.30 Hrs	
12/23/09	KXM	File Quinn Emanuel 7th fee application [B175]	0.30 Hrs	
12/24/09	KXM	Email to counsel with Quinn Emanuel 7th fee application [B175]	0.10 Hrs	
12/29/09	RXZ	Review Order (Omnibus) Awarding Interim Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and for Reimbursement of Expenses and related follow up with J.Adkins [B175]	0.30 Hrs	
		Fee Applications and Invoices - Others Totals	2.30 Hrs	\$ 617.50
Fee O	bjection	ns - Others		
12/01/09	RXZ	Review e-mail from K. McCloskey re: Deadline to file objection to QE 5th fee application December 01, 2009 [B176]	0.10 Hrs	
12/01/09	RXZ	Review e-mail from K. McCloskey re: File CNO to QE 5th fee application December 03, 2009 [B176]	0.10 Hrs	
12/03/09	KXM	Draft CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs	
12/03/09	KXM	Draft Certificate of Service to CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	0.20 Hrs	
12/03/09	KXM	Email to O. Urbieta re: objections to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	0.10 Hrs	
12/03/09	KXM	Review docket re: objections to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs	
12/04/09	AGM	Assist with service of CNO for Quinn Emanuel's 5th Monthly Fee Application (D.I. 1961). [B176]	0.60 Hrs	
12/04/09	KXM	File CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs	
12/04/09	KXM	Serve CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	0.60 Hrs	
12/04/09	KXM	Email to co-counsel with docket no. 1961 - the CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	0.10 Hrs	

12/04/09	KXM	Email to J. Truong with docket no. 1961 - the CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 5th fee application [B176]	1.00 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Assist with service of CNO to 2nd Quinn Emanuel Interim Fee App [B176]	0.40 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Assist with service of CNO to 6th Quinn Emanuel Monthly Fee App [B176]	0.40 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Emails to/from O. Urbieta re: objections received to Quinn Emanuel 6th fee application or 2nd interim fee application [B176]	0.10 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Review docket for objections to Quinn Emanuel 6th fee application and Quinn Emanuel and Elliott Greenleaf 2nd interim applications [B176]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Draft CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 6th fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Draft COS to CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 6th fee application [B176]	0.20 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Draft CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 2nd interim fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Draft COS to CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 2nd interim fee application [B176]	0.20 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	File CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 6th fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	File CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 2nd interim fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Serve CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 6th fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	KXM	Serve CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 2nd interim fee application [B176]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	NRL	Review and execute Certificate of No Objection to Quinn Emanuel's 6th fee application and certificate of service thereof [B176]	0.50 Hrs
12/09/09	NRL	Review and execute Certificate of No Objection to Quinn Emanuel's 2nd Interim Fee Application and certificate of service thereof [B176]	0.40 Hrs
12/18/09	KXM	Email to J. Truong with docket no. 1971 - the CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 2nd interim fee application [B176]	0.10 Hrs
12/18/09	KXM	Email to J. Truong with docket no. 1969 - the CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 6th monthly fee application [B176]	0.10 Hrs

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel Case No. 08-12229

12/18/09 KXM	Email to counsel with docket no. 1969 - the CNO to Quinn Emanuel's 6th monthly fee application [B176]	0.10 Hrs	
12/18/09 KXM		0.10 Hrs	
12/18/09 NRL		0.10 Hrs	
12/18/09 NRL	· ·	0.10 Hrs	
12/24/09 KXN	Email to counsel with objection deadline to Quinn Emanuel 7th fee application [B176]	0.10 Hrs	
12/24/09 KXM		0.10 Hrs	
	Fee Objections - Others Totals	8.80 Hrs	\$ 2,042.50
Other Conte	ested Matters (excluding assum		
12/17/09 SAK	Review Amended Notice of Agenda of Matters Scheduled for Hearing scheduled for 12/18/2009 at 11:30 AM and related communications with N. Lapinksi re: same [B190]	0.20 Hrs	
	Other Contested Matters (excluding assum Totals	0.20 Hrs	\$ 77.00
<u>Court Heari</u>	<u>ngs</u>		
11/24/09 JAA	Email E. Taggart re: confirmation of cancellation of telephonic appearance for the 11/24 hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs	
11/24/09 JAA	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.10 Hrs	
12/01/09 RXZ		0.10 Hrs	
12/01/09 RXZ	· · · · · ·	No charge	

February 22, 2010 [B430]

12/01/09	RXZ	Review e-mail from J. Adkins re: Omnibus Hearing January 20, 2010 [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/01/09	SAK	Review Notice of Agenda [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Email counsel re: 12/16 deadline to request telephonic appearance for 12/18 hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Review email from S. Kinsella re: docket no. 2001 - Notice of Agenda of Matters Scheduled for Hearing on 12/18/2009 at 11:30 AM [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Review docket no. 2001 - Notice of Agenda of Matters Scheduled for Hearing on 12/18/2009 at 11:30 AM [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 2001 - Notice of Agenda of Matters Scheduled for Hearing on 12/18/2009 at 11:30 AM [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Set up telephonic appearance for E. Taggart for 12/18 hearing [B430]	0.20 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Set up telephonic appearance for R. Williams for 12/18 hearing [B430]	0.20 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Set up telephonic appearance for C. Smith for 12/18 hearing [B430]	0.20 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Email C. Smith confirmation and instructions for telephonic appearance for 12/18 hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Email E. Taggart confirmation and instructions for telephonic appearance for 12/18 hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Email R. Williams confirmation and instructions for telephonic appearance for 12/18 hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	SAK	Review Notice of Agenda of Matters Scheduled for Hearing scheduled for 12/18/2009 at 11:30 AM and related communications with N. Lapinksi and J. Adkins re: same [B430]	0.30 Hrs
12/16/09	SAK	Prepare for hearing and review proposed filings pre-hearing [B430]	0.40 Hrs
12/17/09	RXZ	Review amended agenda and related follow up with J.Adkins [B430]	0.30 Hrs
12/17/09	SAK	Review various court call appearances and confirm team from co-counsel with J.Adkins [B430]	0.20 Hrs

12/17/09	SAK	Prepare for upcoming hearing; email exchange with R. Zahralddin re same [B430]	0.40 Hrs
12/17/09	SAK	Review Amended Notice of Agenda [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/18/09	SAK	Email exchange with N. Lapinski re upcoming hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/18/09	SAK	Attend hearing [B430]	1.00 Hrs
12/21/09	JAA	Email counsel re: update to agenda for 1/20 hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/23/09	JAA	Review email from R. Zahralddin re: docket no. 2050 - Certification of Counsel Regarding Scheduling of Omnibus Hearing Dates [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/23/09	JAA	Review docket no. 2050 - Certification of Counsel Regarding Scheduling of Omnibus Hearing Dates [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/23/09	JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 2050 - Certification of Counsel Regarding Scheduling of Omnibus Hearing Dates [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/23/09	JAA	Email counsel re: 3/4 proposed omnibus hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/23/09	JAA	Email counsel re: 2/5 proposed omnibus hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/23/09	SAK	Review Certification of Counsel re proposed Omnibus Hearing Dates [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	JAA	Review email from N. Lapinski re: docket no. 2064 - Order Scheduling Additional Omnibus Hearing Dates [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	JAA	Review docket no. 2064 - Order Scheduling Additional Omnibus Hearing Dates [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 2064 - Order Scheduling Additional Omnibus Hearing Dates [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	JAA	Email counsel re: scheduling of 2/5 omnibus hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	JAA	Email counsel re: scheduling of 3/5 omnibus hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	SAK	Review Notice of Rescheduled Hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/29/09	JAA	Email counsel re: 1/20 hearing rescheduled to 1/28 [B430]	0.10 Hrs
12/29/09	JAA	Review email from S. Kinsella re: docket no. 2067 - Notice of Adjourned/Rescheduled Hearing [B430]	0.10 Hrs

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel Case No. 08-12229

12/29/09	JAA	Review docket no. 2067 - Notice of	0.10 Hrs	
12/29/09	JAA	Adjourned/Rescheduled Hearing [B430] Email counsel re: docket no. 2067 - Notice of	0.10 Hrs	
		Adjourned/Rescheduled Hearing [B430]		
12/29/09	RXZ	Review Certification of Counsel Regarding Scheduling of	0.20 Hrs	
		Omnibus Hearing Dates and forward to J.Adkins [B430]		
12/29/09	SAK	Review Order Scheduling Additional Omnibus Hearing	0.30 Hrs	
		Dates and related follow up with J.Adkins [B430]		
		Court Hearings Totals	6.80 Hrs	\$ 2,196.00

et seq. Litigation

12/01/09	JAA	Review emails to/from E. Parness re: draft of 2004 motion [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/01/09	JAA	Review email from A. Mirisis re: subpoenas to the 2004 motion [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/01/09	JAA	Review multiple emails to/from E. Parness and N. Lapinski re: 2004 motion and related subpoenas [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/02/09	AGM	Email to Evan Parness re fixed address errors in D.C. subpoena spreadsheet. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/02/09	JAA	Review multiple emails to/from E. Parness and A. Mirisis re: changes and additions to subpoenas for 2004 motion [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/02/09	SAK	Review Reply of the FDIC-Receiver in Further Support of Its Motion for an Order Modifying the Automatic Stay [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/02/09	SAK	Hiring document review attorneys, Providus contract, and supplemental declaration [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Drafted rule 2004 subpoena for BKSH & Associates for production of documents to be issued from D.C. Bankruptcy Court. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Email to Evan Parness re: Issuing attorney's name for the D.C. subpoenas. [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/03/09	AGM	Edited David Horne LLC subpoena to include Evan Parness's revisions that is to be issued out of the D.C. Bankruptcy Court [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Edited BKSH & Associates subpoena to include Evan Parness's revisions. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Email Evan Parness re: forwarded all completed D.C. subpoenas in pdf form. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Email Evan Parness re: forwarded SDNY, CA and DE subpoenas. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Edited 2004 subpoena for Toronto Dominion Bank to include Evan Parness's revisions. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Edited rule 2004 subpoena for Banco Santader to include Evan Parness's revisions. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/03/09	AGM	Edited rule 2004 subpoena for FHLB to include Evan Parness's revisions. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/03/09	JAA	Emails to/from N. Lapinski re: 2004 motion and next omnibus hearing date [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/03/09	RXZ	Review e-mails and draft letter to B. Glueckstein from T. O'Brien [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/04/09	AGM	Email Evan Parness re: forwarded completed FHLB rule 2004 subpoena to Evan Parness. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	AGM	Draft Rule 2004 subpoena to be served on the Department of Treasury. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	AGM	Draft rule 2004 subpoena to be served on the Comptroller of the Currency. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	AGM	Draft Goldman Sachs Rule 2004 subpoena. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	AGM	Email to Evan Parness re: forwarded Dept of Treasury & Comptroller of the Currency rule 2004 subpoenas for issuing agent's signature. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	JAA	Review email from N. Lapinski re: docket no. 20 (1:09-cv-734) - Notice of Completion of Mediation by Ian Connor Bifferato [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	JAA	Review docket no. 20 (1:09-cv-734) - Notice of Completion of Mediation by lan Connor Bifferato [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 20 (1:09-cv-734) - Notice of Completion of Mediation by Ian Connor Bifferato [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/07/09	JAA	Review emails to/from E. Parness re: 3 additional subpoenas [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/07/09	NRL	Email to E. Parness regarding message to L. Capp requesting special hearing date for non-party 2004 motion [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	NRL	Review Notice of Completion of Mediation from C. Bifferato [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/07/09	NRL	Review and revise 2004 motion and subpoena exhibits and confer with E. Parness regarding same [B601]	5.20 Hrs
12/07/09	SAK	Review Providus contract [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/07/09	SAK	Review Notice of Completion of Mediation [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/08/09	JAA	Edit Confidentiality Stipulation [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/08/09	JAA	Edit Scheduling Order Stipulation [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/08/09	JAA	Email E. Parness re: Confidentiality Stipulation and Scheduling Order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/08/09	JAA	Edit Stipulation for Scheduling Order [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/08/09	JAA	Edit Confidentiality Stipulation [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/08/09	NRL	Review and edit draft confidentiality stipulation and order [B601]	1.20 Hrs
12/08/09	NRL	Review local rules for certification of counsel requirements and need to separate stipulation from order [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/08/09	NRL	Email exchange with counsel for Cerberus regarding confidentiality stipulation [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/08/09	NRL	Email exchange with E. Parness regarding content and form of confidentiality stipulation, certification of counsel and order and timing of filing [B601]	0.70 Hrs
12/08/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with counsel for Blackstone regarding email search terms for discovery responses [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/08/09	RXZ	Review B. Glueckstein e-mails re: discovery issues [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/08/09	RXZ	Review B. Glueckstein letter reply to 12/3 e-mails and related correspondence re: discovery issues [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/08/09	RXZ	Review draft of protocol attached to B. Glueckstein letter reply to 12/3 discovery correspondence [B601]	0.30 Hrs

12/08/09	RXZ	Review Kirpilani declaration and revise to correspond with prior Delaware precedent on subject of contract lawyers [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/08/09	RXZ	Review Notice of Completion of Mediation by Ian Connor Bifferato [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/08/09	RXZ	Review Reply of the FDIC-Receiver in Further Support of Its Motion for an Order Modifying the Automatic Stay [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/08/09	RXZ	Review Providus contract and compare to supplemental declaration [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Telephone call with E. Parness and E. Taggart re: 2004 Motion [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Assist with service of Certification of Counsel re: Confidentiality Stipulation [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Email N. Lapinski, E. Parness, and E. Taggart re: 12/15 proposed date to file 2004 Motion [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Email N. Lapinski, E. Parness, and E. Taggart re: 12/22 proposed date to objections/responses to 2004 Motion [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Email opposing counsel re: Confidentiality Stipulation [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Email N. Lapinski re: contact information for opposing counsel re: Confidentiality Stipulation [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Edit Debtors' First Request for Production of Documents to the FDIC [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Draft Order Approving Confidentiality Stipulation and Protective Order [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Edit Order Approving Confidentiality Stipulation and Protective Order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Draft COS re: Confidentiality Stipulation and Protective Order [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Draft Notice of Service re: Debtors' First Request for Production of Documents to the FDIC [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/09/09	JAA	Review email from J. Brownstone re: Debtors' First Request for Documents to FDIC; save to database [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/09/09	NRL	Meeting with A. Pillard and J. Adkins regarding LBR 2004-1 and filing and serving on non-parties 2004 motion to be heard on Jan. 4 [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/09/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with E. Taggart, E. Parness, A. Pillard, and J. Adkins regarding timing of filing and serving 2004 motion [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/09/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with E. Parness and J. Adkins regarding filing confidentiality stipulation and certification of counsel [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Email Evan Parness re: Updating Date & time of production in Rule 2004 subpoenas and changing issuing officer to NRL. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Conference call with Evan Parness re: NRL signing off as issuing officer for Rule 2004 subpoenas and changing date & time of production, and adding additional subpoenas. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Drafted new rule 2004 subpoena for BKSH associates to include issuing agent as Neil R. Lapinski, at DE EGS Office and new date & time of production. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Drafted new rule 2004 subpoena for David Horne LLC to include issuing agent as Neil R. Lapinski, at DE EGS Office and new date & time of production. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Drafted new rule 2004 subpoena for Equale to include issuing agent as Neil R. Lapinski, at DE EGS Office and new date & time of production. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Drafted new rule 2004 subpoena for Hohlt to include issuing agent as Neil R. Lapinski, at DE EGS Office and new date & time of production. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Drafted new rule 2004 subpoena for Office of the Comptroller of the Currency to include issuing agent as Neil R. Lapinski, at DE EGS Office and new date & time of production. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AGM	Drafted new rule 2004 subpoena for U.S. Dept of Treasury to include issuing agent as Neil R. Lapinski, at DE EGS Office and new date & time of production. [B601]	0.20 Hrs

12/10/09	AMP	Confer with N. Lapinski & A. Merisis re: expected filing dates and related preparation of 2004 motion [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AMP	Draft COS (ex. 1) to Notice of service re: Debtors' first request for document production to Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	AMP	File Notice of service re: Debtors' first request for document production to Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/10/09	NRL	Revise and coordinate negotiations regarding confidentiality stipulation and order in Declaratory Judgment Adversary [B601]	6.30 Hrs
12/10/09	PXG	Assist with service of Docket No. 168 - Certificate of Counsel Seeing Entry of Confidentiality Stipulation and Protective Order [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/10/09	RXZ	Review e-mail from T. O'Brien re: motion for entry of scheduling order and related documents [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/10/09	RXZ	Review motion for entry of scheduling order and related documents with T. Kittila and S. Kinsella [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/10/09	RXZ	Review Response to Debtors' Objection to Movants' Buus et al. Motion for Relief from the Automatic Stay for relevance to dispute and forward to N. Lapinski [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	RXZ	Review issues with stipulation and assist N. Lapinski re: execution of agreement by various parties [B601]	0.80 Hrs
12/10/09	RXZ	Review Notice of Service Regarding Debtors' First Request for Production of Documents to the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation and production of documents [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/10/09	SAK	Review motion for entry of scheduling order and related documents with T. Kittila and S. Kinsella [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/10/09	SAK	Conference with N. Lapinski re upcoming filings [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/10/09	SAK	Review Notice of Service re Debtors' 1st Request for Production of Documents directed at the FDIC [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edit Banco Santander Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production and issuing attorney. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edit Bryan Cave Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production and issuing attorney. [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/11/09	AGM	Edit Goldman Sachs Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edit Moodys Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production and issuing attorney. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edit Morgan Stanley Adversary Proceeding subpoena to reflect change in date and time of production. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edit PricewaterhouseCoopers Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edited TD Bank Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edited Toronto Dominion Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production and issuing attorney. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Edited Wells Fargo Rule 2004 subpoena to reflect changed date and time of production. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Conference call with O'Rourke Private Investigations/process servers to arrange delivering of Rule 2004 motion/stipulation/and exhibits for 12/14 or 12/15. [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Follow up conference call with O'Rourke Private Investigation/process servers to determine whether they can coordinate serving Rule 2004 motion/stipulation and exhibits to all targets throughout the U.S. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Draft new Rule 2004 subpoena for Federal Reserve to be issued out of the District of Columbia Bankruptcy Court. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Draft new Rule 2004 subpoena for Henry Paulson to be issued out of the District of Columbia Bankruptcy Court. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Draft new Rule 2004 subpoena for Federal Home Loan Bank - Seattle to be issued out of the Western District of Washington Bankruptcy Court. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Final review of all rule 2004 subpoenas that will be attached as exhibits to the Rule 2004 motion. [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/11/09	AGM	Email Evan Parness re: new rule 2004 subpoenas and arranging process server for delivering rule 2004 motion/stipulation/and exhibits on 12/14 or 12/15. [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/11/09	AGM	Email to J. Adkins re: location of correct subpoena docs	0.10 Hrs
		on EG system and hand delivery by O'Rourke on 12/14 and 12/15. [B601]	
12/11/09	KXM	Conference with N. Lapinski re: filing of Stipulation [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	KXM	Filed Certification of Counsel in adversary matters [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/11/09	SAK	Review Briefing Scheduling Order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/11/09	SAK	Review Certification of Counsel re Confidentiality Stipulation/Protective Order [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/13/09	AGM	Drafted rule 2004 subpoena to be issued on Standard and Poors as an exhibit to the Rule 2004 motion. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/13/09	AGM	Drafted rule 2004 subpoena to be issued on the Securities and Exchange Commission as an exhibit to the Rule 2004 motion. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/13/09	AGM	Drafted rule 2004 subpoena to be issued on the Office of Thrift Supervision as an exhibit to the Rule 2004 motion. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/13/09	AGM	Drafted rule 2004 subpoena to be issued on the Sullivan and Cromwell as an exhibit to the Rule 2004 motion. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/13/09	AGM	Email to E. Parness re: creation of new S&P subpoena, removal of BKSH and Bryan Cave subpoena and information for FDIC subpoenas. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/13/09	AGM	Email to J. Adkins re: completed subpoenas on EG system; method of creating new subpoenas for FDIC; serving courtosey copies of subpoenas; contacting Mike O'Rourke for service of motion/exhibits. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/13/09	RXZ	Review subpoena forms [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/14/09	DAW	Assist with service regarding Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties (Docket No. 1997) [B601]	1.00 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Review email from E. Parness re: exhibits to 2004 motion [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Compile exhibits to 2004 motion [B601]	2.00 Hrs

12/14/09 12/14/09	JAA JAA	Compile subpoenas to be filed with 2004 motion [B601] Review email from N. Lapinski re: docket no. 1997 - Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	1.50 Hrs 0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Review docket no. 1997 - Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 1997 - Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Telephone M. O'Rourke re: service of subpoenas [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Email M. O'Rourke re: draft of subpoenas to be served [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Review email from E. Parness re: 2004 motion; save to database [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Edit 2004 motion [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Draft Notice of 2004 Motion [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Emails to/from E. Parness re: missing exhibit [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	Draft Order to 2004 Motion [B601]	0.70 Hrs
12/14/09	JAA	File and serve Docket No. 1997 - Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	2.30 Hrs
12/14/09	NRL	Review, revise and file 2004 Motion on Non-party Targets, Notice thereof and individual subpoenas and document requests [B601]	5.60 Hrs
12/14/09	RXZ	Review open issues with team re: appeals [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/14/09	SAK	Conference with N. Lapinski re 2004 Motion preparations; review motion and conference with J. Adkins re same [B601]	0.40 Hrs

12/14/09	SAK	Email exchange with N. Lapinski and E. Parness re upcoming 2004 Motion filing [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/14/09	SAK	Review Noteholders Group's Notice of Appeal from Order granting JPMC's motion to compel Rule 2019 compliance [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	JAA	File and serve docket no. 1998 - Certificate of Service Regarding Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.70 Hrs
12/15/09	JAA	Serve docket no. 1997 - Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	1.00 Hrs
12/15/09	JAA	Draft Certificate of Service Regarding Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/15/09	JAA	Review email from M. O'Rourke re: status of service of the subpoenas [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	JAA	Review email from T. O'Brien re: 4th Supplemental Kirpalani Declaration; save to database [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Telephone and email exchanges with process server regarding timing, location and content of service to non-party targets of 2004 Motion [B601]	0.80 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with E. Parness regarding status of service [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Review, revise and execute for filing certificate of service for 2004 Motion [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Email to J. Brownstone regarding status of Motion to Compel 2004 Response and Motion for Scheduling Order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Email exchange with B. Finestone regarding exhibits for 12/18 hearing [B601]	0.20 Hrs

12/15/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with M. McGuire regarding proposal to request that court adjourn Stay Motion and not rule on Motion for Summary Judgment before January Omnibus Hearing [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with B. Finestone and D. Ellsberg regarding proposal to request that court adjourn Stay Motion and not rule on Motion for Summary Judgment before January Omnibus Hearing [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Telephone discussions and emails between M. McGuire and B. Finestone to reach agreement on language proposing adjournment of lift-stay motion [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Telephone message left for L. Capp regarding adjournment [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with B. Finestone regarding possible Court responses to lift-stay adjournment proposal [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Review email from C. Greer regarding proposed interim fee application order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Email exchange and telephone discussions with J. Luton and E. Parness regarding continuance of 2004 Motion Hearing and related objection deadline [B601]	2.30 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Review documents produced by Blackstone Group as a result of 2004-1 meet & confer to determine responsiveness [B601]	2.20 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Review 2004-1 notice of disclosure requirements with A. Mirisis [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Telephone discussions and email exchanges with M. O'Rourke, process server, regarding hand delivery of all 2004 motions in Los Angeles, CA; Seattle, WA; Washington, DC; Arlington, VA; Wilmington, DE; Philadelphia, PA, and New York, NY [B601]	0.70 Hrs
12/15/09	NRL	Review email from T. O'Brien regarding supplemental Kirpalani declaration regarding contract attorneys [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/15/09	RXZ	Review Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.50 Hrs

12/15/09 12/15/09	RXZ RXZ	Review Exhibits to 2004 motion [B601] Review Notice of Appeal from Order Granting JP Morgan	0.90 Hrs 0.20 Hrs
		Chase Bank, National Association's Motion to Compel [B601]	
12/15/09	RXZ	Review Certification of Counsel Seeking Entry of Confidentiality Stipulation and Protective Order [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/15/09	RXZ	Review various e-m ails from J. Luton re: FDIC motion to continue 2004, related follow up and conferences with N. Lapinksi and S. Kinsella and reply [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/16/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for OBC Group LLC [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Draft Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Draft COS to Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	File and serve Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.80 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Research Motions for Protective Order [B601]	0.70 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Email E. Parness re: sample Motions for Protective Order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Email E. Parness re: draft of Re-Notice of 2004 Motion [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Review email from N. Lapinski re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/16/09	JAA	Review Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Email counsel re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	JAA	Prepare hearing binder for 12/18 hearing [B601]	1.00 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Email exchange and telephone discussions with J. Luton, B. Cleary, and E. Parness regarding continuance of 2004 Motion and related objection deadline [B601]	2.60 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with E. Parness regarding LR 2004-1; 7026-1; FRCP 26(c); DRPC 4.2 and 4.4(a) and communication with former counsel regarding privileged information [B601]	1.30 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Research support for Motion for Protective Order to	1.40 Hrs
		prevent contact in violation of third-party interest [B601]	0.70 11
12/16/09	NRL	Email exchange and telephone discussions with M. McGuire, B. Cleary, and B. Finestone, et al. regarding content of agenda related to lift-stay motion [B601]	0.70 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Telephone message for L. Capp regarding lift-stay motion continuance [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Email exchange among Blackstone Group IT representative and E. Parness regarding technical problem with document production [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Review, edit, and execute Re-notice of Hearing of 2004 Motion and Certificate of Service thereof [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Review and edit Notice of Disclosure of Documents related to OB-C Group and review of 2004-1 [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/16/09	NRL	Email exchange with E. Parness regarding additional notice to non-party 2004 targets of continuance [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/16/09	RXZ	Review Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.20 Hrs

12/16/09	RXZ	Review various issues with hearing and requested continuances with N. Lapinski, co-counsel and opposing counsel [B601]	1.50 Hrs
12/16/09	RXZ	Review Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/16/09	RXZ	Review Notice of Agenda of Matters Scheduled for Hearing scheduled for 12/18/2009 at 11:30 AM and related follow up with staff, S. Kinsella and N. Lapinski [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/16/09	SAK	Review UST's Motion to Compel Debtors to Produce List of Equity Security Holders [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for the Blackstone Group. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for Carlyle Group, LLC. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for Cerberus Capital Management L.P. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for Citigroup Inc. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for Fitch, Inc. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for Lehman Brothers. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for Morgan Stanley. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for Oak Hill Capital Partners. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	AGM	Draft Notice of Agreement of Production of Documents for TPG Capital. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Review email from N. Lapinski re: Docket No. 2025 - Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/17/09	JAA	Review Docket No. 2025 - Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email counsel re: Docket No. 2025 - Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email M. Davis re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email S. Alleyne and M. Mazour re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email R. White re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email J. Dickey and D. Kitchens re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	[B601] Email L. Arias re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/17/09	JAA	Email A. Griffiths re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email A. Bono re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email A. Bambach re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email S. Meyer re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email C. Gerry re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email Severson re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email Paul re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email P. Hohltl re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs

12/17/09	JAA	Email D. Horne re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email S. Davidoff re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email B. Kitt re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email B. Lawson re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Email F. Barrett re: Docket No. 2006 - Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Review email from E. Parness re: Motion for Protective Order; save to database [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Edit Motion for Protective Order [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Draft Notice re: Motion for Protective Order [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Draft Order re: Motion for Protective Order [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/17/09	JAA	Edit Order re: Motion for Protective Order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	NRL	Email exchange with B. Finestone regarding attendance or telephonic appearance at omnibus hearing regarding interim fee applications [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with E. Parness and Blackstone Group regarding form of document disclosure [B601]	0.20 Hrs

12/17/09	NRL	Telephone discussion with counsel for Lehman regarding document disclosure [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	RXZ	Review proposed filings with team [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/17/09	RXZ	Review Re-Notice of Debtors' Motion for an Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2004 and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2004-1 Directing the Examination of Witnesses and Production of Documents from Knowledgeable Parties [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	SAK	Review Motion for Protective Order [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/17/09	SAK	Review Notice of Bank Bondholders 1st Set of Document Requests propounded upon Debtors [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/17/09	TAK	Review and revise motion for protective order [B601]	1.20 Hrs
12/18/09	JAA	Review email from N. Lapinski re: docket no. 2032 - Certificate of Service Regarding (2) Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information and (2) Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/18/09	JAA	Review docket no. 2032 - Certificate of Service Regarding (2) Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information and (2) Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/18/09	JAA	Email counsel re: docket no. 2032 - Certificate of Service Regarding (2) Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information and (2) Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel	0.10 Hrs

		to the Debtors [B601]	
12/18/09	JAA	File and serve docket no. 2032 - Certificate of Service Regarding (2) Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information and (2) Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver &	0.50 Hrs
		Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B601]	
12/18/09	JAA	Draft Certificate of Service Regarding (2) Debtors' Motion for Protective Order Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information and (2) Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Susheel Kirpalani in Connection with Employment of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP as Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/18/09	RXZ	Review Motion for Protective Order of the Debtors Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7026(c) Requiring JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to Provide Advance Notice to Debtors of Requests to Third Parties Seeking WMI-Privileged Information and discuss same with T. Kittila [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/18/09	RXZ	Review notice of discovery from bondholders to debtors and follow up with N. Lapinski and J.Adkins. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/21/09	JAA	Email counsel re: 1/11 objection deadline to 2004 motion [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/21/09	NRL	Review email from M. Possick and attached drafts regarding meet & confer over confidentiality agreement [B601]	0.50 Hrs
12/21/09	NRL	Email exchange with S. Cave regarding specs and meta data on voluntary production of Lehman Brothers Holdings [B601]	0.40 Hrs

12/21/09	NRL	Email to with S. Sadhigi regarding specs and meta data on voluntary production of Cerberus [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/21/09	NRL	Email to with J. Dickey regarding specs and meta data on voluntary production of Morgan Stanley [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/21/09	NRL	Email exchange with E. Parness regarding status of voluntary disclosures of Cerberus, Morgan Stanley, and Lehman [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/21/09	RXZ	Review B. Glueckstein correspondence response re ongoing discovery dispute [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/21/09	SAK	Review B. Glueckstein correspondence re discovery dispute [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/22/09	NRL	Email exchange with T. O'Brien regarding meet & confer with JPMC counsel and possible motion for scheduling order [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/22/09	NRL	Review interim fee order [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/22/09	NRL	Discussions with S. Cave regarding meet & confer over 2004 and adversary discovery on Lehman [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/22/09	NRL	Review draft certification and interim fee application for Quinn Emanuel [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/23/09	NRL	Confer with J. Adkins and Email exchange with T. O'Brien regarding motion for a scheduling order in adversaries [B601]	0.40 Hrs
12/23/09	NRL	Review Certification of Counsel regarding Scheduling of Omnibus Hearing Dates [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/23/09	SAK	Review Debtors' Certification of Counsel re disagreement concerning form of Order re Motion to Supplement [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/28/09	NRL	Review Email from E. Parness regarding notices of voluntary production [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	NRL	Review LR 2004-1 and status of voluntary production and notices thereof for OB-C Group and Blackstone Group [B601]	0.60 Hrs
12/28/09	NRL	Review Order Scheduling Additional Omnibus Hearing Dates and review LR 2004-1 and confer with paralegals regarding effect on 2004 Motion Response Deadlines [B601]	0.40 Hrs

12/28/09	NRL	Review Email from J. Brownstone regarding discovery meet and confer response letter [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/28/09	NRL	Review meet & confer response letter from E. Taggart [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/28/09	NRL	Review Bank Bondholder's designation of record on appeal [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/28/09	SAK	Review Appellant Designation of Items For Inclusion in Record On Appeal and Statement of Issues Presented on Appeal for relevance to client [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/28/09	SAK	Review Notice of Adjourned/Rescheduled Hearing scheduled for 1/28/2010 at 04:00 PM and related follow up [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/28/09	SAK	Review Order Supplementing Record re Debtors' HFA Trust Motion [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/28/09	SAK	Review Noteholder's Designation of Iterms re Appeal of Rule 2019 Compliance Order [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/29/09	AGM	Draft rule 2004 subpoena for Moodys Investors Services. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/29/09	NRL	Email exchange with B. Cleary regarding extension of response deadline to 2004 Motion [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/30/09	AGM	Reviewed and analyzed Moodys Rule 2004 subpoena that was returned and the redraft to new service of process address. [B601]	0.30 Hrs
12/30/09	AGM	Draft Certificate of Service for Moody's 2004 subpoena. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/30/09	AGM	Conference call to O'Rourke investigations to serve Rule 2004 subpoena on Moodys. [B601]	0.20 Hrs
12/30/09	AGM	Edit Notice of Production of Documents re: Blackstone Group, L.P. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/30/09	AGM	Edit Notice of Production of Documents of the OB-C Group LLC. [B601]	0.10 Hrs
12/30/09	NRL	Review, edit and execute final notices of document production and exhibits by OB-C and Blackstone Groups [B601]	1.30 Hrs
12/30/09	NRL	Email exchanges among B. Finestone, B. Cleary and B. Rosen regarding extension of response deadline to 2004 Motion [B601]	0.80 Hrs

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel

Case No. 08-12229

12/30/09	NRL	Telephone discussions with and messages left for B. Finestone and B. Cleary regarding extension of response deadline to 2004 Motion [B601]	0.30 Hrs	
12/30/09	PXG	File Notice of Production of Documents (Blackstone) [B601]	0.20 Hrs	
12/30/09	PXG	File Notice of Production of Documents (OB-C Group) [B601]	0.20 Hrs	
12/30/09	SAK	Review Blackstone Group's Notice of Service of Production of Documents [B601]	0.10 Hrs	
12/30/09	SAK	Review Notice of Service re OB-C Groups Production of Documents [B601]	0.10 Hrs	
		et seq. Litigation Totals	102.10 Hrs	\$ 34,215.50

TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES \$42,915.00

LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY

Andrew G. Mirisis	13.30 Hrs	225/hr	\$2,992.50
Aron M. Pillard	0.90 Hrs	200/hr	\$180.00
Darcy A. White	1.20 Hrs	225/hr	\$270.00
Jessi A. Adkins	30.70 Hrs	200/hr	\$6,140.00
Kristin A. McCloskey	17.90 Hrs	200/hr	\$3,580.00
Neil R. Lapinski	46.80 Hrs	375/hr	\$17,550.00
Phillip A. Giordano	0.80 Hrs	160/hr	\$128.00
Rafael X. Zahralddin-Aravena	13.50 Hrs	575/hr	\$7,762.50
Rafael X. Zahralddin-Aravena	0.10 Hrs	575/hr	No charge
Shelley A. Kinsella	10.00 Hrs	385/hr	\$3,850.00
Theodore A. Kittila	1.20 Hrs	385/hr	\$462.00
	136.40 Hrs		\$42,972.50

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

Through December 31, 2009

Postage

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel

Case No. 08-12229

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

Through December 31, 2009

Postage			
12/02/09		150.54	
12/03/09		150.54	
12/04/09		150.54	
12/09/09		115.36	
12/10/09		17.16	
12/10/09		24.46	
12/15/09		231.67	
12/16/09		181.04	
12/18/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017472 DTD	300.45	
	12/18/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: POSTAGE		
	DOMESTIC & INTERNATIONAL ON 12/18/09 FOR NRL		
12/23/09		139.63	
			\$1,461.39
Copying			
12/02/09		279.30	
12/04/09		294.00	
12/09/09		602.70	
12/10/09		38.00	
12/10/09		11.40	
12/11/09		108.00	
12/14/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017382 DTD	2,298.80	
	12/14/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: DUPLICATING -		
	CONVERT TO 2-SIDED: 28 SETS OF 821 ON 12/14/09		
	FOR NRL		
12/15/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017399 DTD	198.48	
	12/15/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: DUPLICATING -		
	AUTO FEED 3 SETS OF 827 ON 12/15/09 FOR JAA	4 0 4 0 6 0	
12/15/09		1,040.60	
12/16/09		386.40	

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel Case No. 08-12229

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

Through December 31, 2009

Copying 12/18/09 12/18/09 12/23/09		29.40 1,367.10 48.00	
12/23/09 12/30/09		141.50 7.10	
			\$6,850.78
Delivery/0	Courier Service		
12/02/09	RELIABLE COPY SERVICES (DE)INV #WL017185 DTD 12/02/09 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: HAND DELIVIERIES ON 12/02/09 FOR RXZ	187.50	
12/04/09		187.50	
12/09/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017304 DTD 12/09/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: 25 HAND DELIVERIES ON 12/09/09 FOR JAA	187.50	
12/10/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017330 DTD 12/10/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: 8 HAND DELIVERIES ON 12/10/09 FOR NRL	60.00	
12/11/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017345 DTD 12/11/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: 8 HAND DELIVERIES ON 12/11/09 FOR PAG	60.00	
12/11/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017347 DTD 12/11/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: 2 HAND DELIVERIES ON 12/11/09 FOR TAK	15.00	
12/14/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017382 DTD 12/14/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: DELIVERY OF BOXES AT 1:30 AM ON 12/14/09 FOR NRL	40.00	
12/15/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017404 DTD 12/15/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: 26 HAND DELIVERIES ON 12/15/09 FOR NRL	195.00	

Re: Special Debtors' Litigation Counsel

Case No. 08-12229

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

Through December 31, 2009

— ::			\sim	
Deliver	,,,,,	IFIAF	C. V	n 1100
		11 11-1		1 V II .

12/18/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017475 DTD 12/18/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: DELIVERY TO	7.50
	JUDGE WALRATH ON 12/18/09 FOR NRL	
12/18/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017472 DTD	187.50
	12/18/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: 25 HAND	
	DELIVERIES ON 12/18/09 FOR NRL	
12/23/09	RELIABLE WILMINGTON (DE)INV#WL017537 DTD	187.50
	12/23/09 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: 25 HAND	
	DELIVERIES ON 12/23/09 FOR NRL	

\$1,315.00

Computerized Legal Research

12/01/09	WEST GROUP(BB/HA/SC/DE)INV #819597345 DTD	4.35
	12/01/09 FOR WESTLAW LEGAL RESEARCH FOR THE	
	PERIOD: NOV 01, 2009 - NOV 30, 2009 BY NRL	

\$4.35

Total Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses \$9,631.52

TOTAL THIS BILL \$52,546.52

Task Billing Summary Page

Re: In re: Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.

File Number 60124-001

	Previous	Current	
	Billed	Bill	<u>Total</u>
Case Administration	8,289.00	40.00	8,329.00
Asset Analysis Recovery	346.50	0	346.50
Asset Disposition	526.00	0	526.00
Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection	2,960.00	60.00	3,020.00
Employment & Retention Application EGS	3,737.50	273.00	4,010.50
Employment & Retention Application Others	1,005.00	409.50	1,414.50
Fee Applications and Invoices – EGS	12,850.50	2,114.00	14,964.50
Fee Objections EGS	4,336.00	870.00	5,206.00
Fee Applications and Invoices – Others	9,817.50	617.50	10,435.00
Fee Objections Others	2,211.50	2,042.50	4,254.00
Other Contested Matters	16,551.50	77.00	16,628.50
Business Operations	172.50	0	172.50
Claims Administration and Objections	200.00	0	200.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement Matters	1,009.50	0	1,009.50
Court Hearings	18,704.50	2,196.00	20,900.50
Schedules and Statements	421.00	0	421.00
Litigation	354,925.00	34,215.50	389,140.50
Analysis/Strategy	2,471.00	0	2,471.00
Totals	440,534.50	42,915.00	483,449.50

Exhibit C

EXPENSE SUMMARY FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2009 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2009

Expense Category	Total Expenses
Postage	\$1,461.39
Copying ¹	\$6,850.78
Delivery/Courier Service	\$1,315.00
Computerized Legal Research	\$4.35

TOTAL THIS BILL:

\$9,631.52

¹ EG represents that its rates for duplication is \$0.10 per page, consistent with the Local Rules and Guidelines. Detailed copy charges are listed in Exhibit B.

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	X	
In re:	:	Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1	:	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
Debtors.	:	Jointly Administered Objection Deadline: 3/22/2010 @ 4 PM Hearing: TBD if Objections filed
	X	

NOTICE OF NINTH MONTHLY APPLICATION (DECEMBER 1, 2009 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2009) OF ELLIOTT GREENLEAF, SPECIAL LITIGATION AND CONFLICTS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS, FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES PURSUANT TO 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 AND 331

TO: The Notice Parties as defined in the Amended Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals ("Amended Interim Compensation Order") (Docket No. 302) and parties pursuant to Fed. R. Bankr. Pr. 2002(a)(6).

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that Elliott Greenleaf, Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors in the above-captioned cases, has filed the Ninth Monthly Application of Elliott Greenleaf, Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession, for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 and 331 (the "Application"). The Application seeks the allowance of fees in the amount of \$42,915.00 (80%, \$34,332.00) and expenses in the amount of \$9,631.52 for the period December 1, 2009 through and including December 31, 2009 and payment of 80% of fees in the amount of \$34,332.00 and 100% of the expenses in the amount of \$9,631.52 pursuant to the Amended Interim Compensation Order. The Application has been filed and served on the Notice Parties pursuant to the Amended Interim Compensation Order. Notice of the Application has been filed and served on all parties requesting notice pursuant to Fed. R. Bankr. Pr. 2002.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that Objections of the Notice Parties, if any, to the relief requested in the Application must be filed with the United States Bankruptcy Court, 824 N. Market Street, 6th Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, on or before March 22, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (prevailing Eastern Time).

¹ The Debtors in these Chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification numbers are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that the Notice Parties must also serve a copy of the objection upon the following parties so as to be received no later than 4:00 p.m. (prevailing Eastern Time) on March 22, 2010:

(i) the Debtors, Washington Mutual, Inc., 1301 Second Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98101; (ii) counsel to the Debtors, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges, LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10153 (Attention: Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq. and Brian S. Rosen, Esq.) and (b) Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A., One Rodney Square, 920 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801 (Attention: Mark D. Collins, Esq.); (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee, 844 King St., Suite 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, DE 19801; (iv) counsel to the Official Committees of Unsecured Creditors, Pepper Hamilton, LLP, Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100, 1313 North Market Street, Wilmington, DE 19899 (Attention: Evelyn J. Meltzer, Esq., David M. Fournier, Esq., David B. Stratton, Esq., James Carignan, Esq. and Leigh-Anne M. Raport, Esq.); and (iv) special litigation and conflicts counsel for the Debtors, (a) Quinn Emanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP, 51 Madison Avenue, 22nd Floor, New York, NY 10010 (Attention: Susheel Kirpalani) and (b) Elliott Greenleaf, 1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700, Wilmington, DE 19801 (Attention: Rafael X. Zahralddin-Aravena).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT PURSUANT TO THE INTERIM COMPENSATION ORDER, IF NO OBJECTIONS ARE FILED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURE, THE DEBTORS WILL BE AUTHORIZED TO PAY EIGHTY PERCENT (80%) OF REQUESTED FEES AND ONE HUNDRED (100%) OF REQUESTED EXPENSES WITHOUT FURTHER COURT ORDER.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT ONLY IF AN OBJECTION IS PROPERLY AND TIMELY FILED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROCEDURES SET FORTH PURSUANT TO THE INTERIM COMPENSATION ORDER WILL A HEARING BE HELD ON THE APPLICATION.

Dated: March 1, 2010 Wilmington, Delaware ELLIOTT GREENLEAF

Rafael X. Zahralddin-Aravena (DE Bar No. 4166)

Neil R. Lapinski (DE Bar No. 3645) Shelley A. Kinsella (DE Bar No. 4023)

1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700

Wilmington, Delaware 19801 Telephone: (302) 384-9400

Facsimile: (302) 384-9399 Email: rxza@elliottgreenleaf.com

Email: ri@elliottgreenleaf.com
Email: sak@elliottgreenleaf.com

Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel for

the Debtors

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	X
In re:	: Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1	: Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
Debtors.	: Jointly Administered
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC. AND WMI INVESTMENT CORP.,	x : : : Adv. Proc. No. 09-50934
Plaintiffs,	: Adv. Ploc. No. 09-30934
٧.	: :
JPMORGAN CHASE BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIATION,	· : :
Defendant.	; ;
	X

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, Neil R. Lapinski, Esquire, Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel for the Debtors, hereby certify that I caused a copy of the Ninth Monthly Application (December 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009) of Elliott Greenleaf, Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors, for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 and 331 to be served on all Notice Parties as defined in the Amended Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (Docket No. 302) on March 1, 2010. I have caused a copy of the Notice of the Ninth Monthly Application to be served on all remaining parties on March 1, 2010. All local parties were served via hand delivery and the remaining parties listed on the attached service list were served via U.S. First Class Mail or Foreign First Class Mail.

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF

Dated: March 1, 2010 Wilmington, Delaware

Rafael X Zahralddin-Aravena (DE Bar No. 4166)

Neil R. Lapinski (DE Bar No. 3645) Shelley A. Kinsella (DE Bar No. 4023) 1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700

Wilmington, Delaware 19801 Telephone: (302) 384-9400 Facsimile: (302) 384-9399 Fmail: ryza@elliottgreenleaf.c

Email: rxza@elliottgreenleaf.com
Email: nrl@elliottgreenleaf.com
Email: sak@elliottgreenleaf.com

Special Litigation and Conflicts Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession

The Debtors in these Chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification numbers are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395).

Archer & Greiner PC Charles J Brown III 300 Delaware Avenue, Suite 1370 Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Attorney Generals Office Joseph R Biden III Carvel State Office Building 820 N. French Street, 8th Floor Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Connolly Bove Lodge & Hutz LLP
Marc J Phillips
Jeffrey C Wisler
1007 N. Orange Street
P.O. Box 2207
Wilmington, DE 19899

Hand Delivery

Cross & Simon LLC Christopher P Simon 913 N. Market Street, 11th Floor Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Department of Labor
Division of Unemployment Insurance
4425 N. Market Street
Wilmington, DE 19802

Hand Delivery

Ashby & Geddes PA
Don A Beskrone
Amanda M Winfree
William P Bowden
500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor
P.O. Box 1150
Wilmington, DE 19899

Hand Delivery

Bayard PA
Jeffrey M Schlerf
P.O. Box 25130
Wilmington, DE 19899

Hand Delivery

Blank Rome LLP Michael DeBaecke 1201 Market Street, Suite 800 Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Delaware Dept of Justice Attn: Bankruptcy Department Division of Securities 820 N. French Street, 5th Floor Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Eckert Seamans Cherin & Mellot LLC Ronald S Gellert Tara L Lattomus 300 Delaware Avenue, Suite 1210 Wilmington, DE 19801

Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP
Craig R Martin
Stuart M Brown
919 N. Market Street, 15th Floor
Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Landis Rath & Cobb LLP
Adam G Landis
Matthew B McGuire
919 Market Street, Suite 600
Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery
Office of the United States Trustee Delaware
Joseph McMahon
844 King Street, Suite 2207
Lockbox 35
Wilmington, DE 19899-0035

Hand Delivery

Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor LLP M Blake Cleary Robert S Brady 1000 West Street, 17th Floor Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery
Richards Layton & Finger PA
Chun I Jang
Mark D Collins
One Rodney Square
920 N. King Street
Wilmington, DE 19899

Hand Delivery

Fox Rothschild LLP
Jeffrey M Schlerf
919 N. Market Street
Citizens Bank Center, Suite 1600
Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Morris James LLP
Brett D Fallon
500 Delaware Avenue, Suite 1500
P.O. Box 2306
Wilmington, DE 19899-2306

Hand Delivery

Pepper Hamilton LLP
David B Stratton
David M Fournier
Evelyn J Meltzer
Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100
1313 N. Market Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Reed Smith LLP J Cory Falgowski Kurt F Gwynne 1201 Market Street, Suite 1500 Wilmington, DE 19801

Hand Delivery

Saul Ewing LLP
Mark Minuti
222 Delaware Avenue, Suite 1200
P.O. Box 1266
Wilmington, DE 19899

State of Delaware Division of Revenue Randy R Weller MS No 25 820 N. French Street, 8th Floor Wilmington, DE 19801-0820

Hand Delivery

Werb & Sullivan
Duane D Werb
Matthew P Austria
300 Delaware Avenue, Suite 1300
P.O. Box 25046
Wilmington, DE 19899

First Class Mail

Acxiom Corporation CB Blackard III 301 E Dave Ward Drive PO Box 2000 Conway, AR 72033-2000

First Class Mail

Arent Fox LLP Andrew Silfen 1675 Broadway New York, NY 10019

First Class Mail

Angelo Gordon & Co Edward W Kressler 245 Park Avenue, 26th Floor New York, NY 10167

Hand Delivery

US Attorneys Office Ellen W Slights 1007 N. Orange Street, Suite 700 P.O. Box 2046 Wilmington, DE 19899-2046

First Class Mail

Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP
David P Simonds
Peter J Gurfein
2029 Century Park E, Suite 2400
Los Angeles, CA 90067-3012

First Class Mail

Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP Scott L Alberino 1333 New Hampshire Avenue, NW Washington, DC 20036

First Class Mail

Arapahoe County Attorneys Office George Rosenberg 5334 S Prince Street Littleton, CO 80166

First Class Mail

Arent Fox LLP Jeffrey N Rothleder 1050 Connecticut Ave NW Washington, DC 20036

Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP Fred S Hodara One Bryant Park New York, NY 10036

Alston & Brid LLP J William Boone

First Class Mail

1201 W Peachtree St Atlanta, GA 30309-3424

First Class Mail

Arnall Golden Gregory LLP Darryl S Laddin Michael F Holbein 171 17th St NW Ste 2100 Atlanta, GA 30363-1031

First Class Mail

Bank of New York Mellon Attn Gary S Bush Global Corporate Trust 101 Barclay St New York, NY 10286

First Class Mail

Bartlett Hackett Feinberg PC Frank F McGinn 155 Federal St 9th Fl Boston, MA 02110

First Class Mail

Bernstein Litowitz Berger & Grossmann LLP
Chad Johnson
Hannah Ross
Jerald Bien Willner
1285 Avenue of the Americas 38th Fl
New York, NY 10019

First Class Mail

Breslow & Walker LLP Roy H Carlin 767 Third Ave New York, NY 10017

First Class Mail

Bronwen Price
Gail B Price
2600 Mission St Ste 206
San Marion, CA 91108

First Class Mail

Brown & Connery LLP Donald K Ludman 6 N Broad St Ste 100 Woodbury, NJ 08096

First Class Mail

Buchalter Nemer PC Shawn M Christianson 333 Market St 25th Fl San Francisco, CA 94105-2126

Cairncross & Hempelmann PS John R Knapp Jr 542 2nd Ave Ste 500 Seattle, WA 98104-2323

First Class Mail

Centerbridge Capital Partners LP Vivek Melwani 375 Park Ave 12th Fl New York, NY 10152-0002

First Class Mail

City of Fort Worth Christopher B Mosley 1000 Throckmorton St Fort Worth, TX 76102

First Class Mail

County Attorneys Office Erica S Zaron Asst County Attorney 2810 Stephen P Clark Center 111 NW First St Miami, FL 33128-1993

First Class Mail

Curtis Mallet Prevost Colt & Mosle LLP Steven J Reisman 101 Park Ave New York, NY 10178-0061

First Class Mail

Capehart & Scatchard PA William G Wright 8000 Midlantic Dr Ste 300S Mt Laurel, NJ 08054

First Class Mail

City and County of Denver Eugene J Kottenstette Municipal Operations 201 W Colfax Ave Dept 1207 Denver, CO 80202-5332

First Class Mail

Cox Smith Matthew Inc Patrick L Huffstickler 112 E Pecan Ste 1800 San Antonio, TX 78205

First Class Mail

David D Lennon Asst Attorney General Revenue Section PO Box 629 Raleigh, NC 27602-0629

First Class Mail
Delaware Secretary of the Treasury
PO Box 7040
Dover, DE 19903

Delaware Secretary of the State Division of Corporations PO Box 898 Franchise Tax Division Dover, DE 19903

First Class Mail

Tannenbaum Helpern Syracuse & Hirschtritt LLP 900 Third Avenue, 13th Floor New York, NY 10022

First Class Mail

E Gaston Riou 110 SW Robin Rd Lees Summit, MO 64063

First Class Mail

Electronic Data Systems LLC Ayala A Hassell 5400 Legacy Dr MS H3 3A 05 Plano, TX 75024

First Class Mail

Federal Deposit Insuance Corp Donald McKinley Stephen J Pruss 1601 Bryan St PAC 04024 Dallas, TX 75201

First Class Mail

Dewey & LeBoeuf LLP
Andrew Z Lebwohl
Peter A Ivanick
1301 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10019

First Class Mail

DLA Piper LLP
Jeremy R Johnson
Thomas R Califano
1251 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10020-1104

First Class Mail

Friedlander Misler Robert E Greenberg 1101 17th St NW Ste 700 Washington, DC 20036-4704

First Class Mail

Entwistle & Cappucci LLP Andrew J Entwistle Johnston de F Whitman Jr Joshua K Porter 280 Park Ave 26th Fl New York, NY 10017

First Class Mail

First Pacific Bank of California Jame Burgess 9333 Genesee Ave Ste 300 San Diego, CA 92121

Fox Hefter Swibel Levin & Carroll LLP Margaret Peg M Anderson 200 W Madison St Ste 3000 Chicago, IL 60606

First Class Mail

Freshfields Bruckhaus Deringer US LLP Harvey Dychiao 520 Madison Ave New York, NY 10022

First Class Mail

Gay McCall Isaacks Gordon & Roberts
David McCall
777 E 15th St
Plano, TX 75074

First Class Mail

Greer Herz & Adams LLP
Tara B Annweiler
Frederick Black
One Moody Plz 18th Fl
Galveston, TX 77550

First Class Mail

Hagens Berman Sobol Shapiro LLP Andrew M Volk 1301 Fifth Ave Ste 2900 Seattle, WA 98101

Foreign First Class Mail

Freshfields Bruckhaus Deringer LLP
Will Higgs
65 Fleet St
London, EC4Y 1HS UK

First Class Mail

Fried Frank Harris Shriver & Jacobson LLP
Brian D Pfeiffer
Matthew M Roose
One New York Plaza
New York, NY 10004-1980

First Class Mail

Goulston & Storrs PC Christine D Lynch 400 Atlantic Ave Boston, MA 02110-333

First Class Mail

Gulf Group Holdings Acquisitions & Applications
Beatriz Agramonte
18305 Biscayne Blvd Ste 400
Aventura, FL 33160

First Class Mail

Hangley Aronchick Segal & Pudlin Ashley M Chan One Logan Square 27th Fl Philadelphia, PA 19103

Hennigan Bennet Dorman LLP Bennett J Murphy Michael C Schneidereit 865 S Figueroa St Ste 2900 Los Angeles, CA 90017

IBM Corporation Vicky Namken

First Class Mail

13800 Diplomat Dr Dallas, TX 75234

First Class Mail

Hewlett Packard Company Ken Higman 2125 E Katella Ave Ste 400 Anaheim, CA 92806

First Class Mail

Hodges and Associates A Clifton Hodges 4 E Holly St Ste 202 Pasadena, CA 91103-3900

First Class Mail

IBM Credit LLC Bill Dimos North Castle Dr MD 320 Armonk, NY 10504

First Class Mail

Internal Revenue Service **Insolvency Section** 31 Hopkins Plz Rm 1150 Baltimore, MD 21201

First Class Mail

Johnson Pope Bokor Ruppel & Burns LLP Angelina E Lim PO Box 1368 Clearwater, FL 33757

First Class Mail

Kasowitz Benson Torres & Friedman Daniel A Fliman David S Rosner Paul M Oconnor III Trevor J Welch 1633 Broadway New York, NY 10019

First Class Mail

Keller Rohrback LLP Derek W Loeser Lynn L. Sarko Karin B. Swope 1201 Third Ave Ste 3200 Seattle, WA 98101

First Class Mail

Kelley Drye & Warren LLP Eric R Wilson Howard S Steel 101 Park Ave New York, NY 10178

Law Debenture Trust Company of New York Jame Heaney 400 Madison Ave 4th Fl New York, NY 10017

First Class Mail

Law Offices of Robert E Luna PC
Andrea Sheehan
4411 N Central Expressway
Dallas, TX 75205

First Class Mail

Linebarger Goggan Blair & Sampson LLP Elizabeth Weller 2323 Bryan St Ste 1600 Dallas, TX 75201

First Class Mail

Lowenstein Sandler PC
Eric H Horn
Ira M Levee
Joseph M Yar
Michael S Etkin
Vincent A Dagostino
65 Livingston Ave
Roseland, NJ 07068

First Class Mail

Manatee County Tax Collector Ken Burton Michelle Leeson 819 US 301 Blvd W Bradenton, FL 34205

First Class Mail

Law Offices of Lippe & Associates Emil Lippe Jr 600 N Pearl St Ste S2460 Plaza of the Americas South Tower Dallas, TX 75201

First Class Mail

Leslie Stephen Wolfe 711 Van Nuys St San Diego, CA 92109

First Class Mail

Loeb & Loeb LLP Daniel B Besikof Vadim J Rubinstein Walter H Curchack 345 Park Ave New York, NY 10154

First Class Mail

Manatee County Tax Collector Ken Burton Michelle Leeson PO Box 25300 Bradenton, FL 34206-5300

First Class Mail

McCreary Veselka Bragg & Allen Michael Reed PO Box 1269 Round Rock, TX 78680

McDermott Will & Emery LLP
Gary O Ravert
Nava Hazan
340 Madison Ave
New York, NY 10173-1922

First Class Mail

McGuire Woods LLP Sally E Edison Nicholas E Meriwether 625 Liberty Ave 23rd Fl Pittsburgh, PA 15222

First Class Mail

Morrison & Foerster LLP
Brett H Miller
1290 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10104

First Class Mail

Office of Thrift Supervision Christopher A Sterbenz Trial Counsel Litigation Div 1700 G St NW Washington, DC 20552

First Class Mail

Oregon Dept of Justice Carolyn G Wade Senior Asst Attorney General 1162 Court St NE Salem, OR 97301-4096

First Class Mail

Miami Dade Bankruptcy Unit Alberto Burnstein 140 W Flagler St Ste 1403 Miami, FL 33130-1575

First Class Mail

Newstart Factors Inc Gregory Vadasdi 2 Stamford Plaza Ste 1501 281 Tresser Blvd Stamford, CT 06901

First Class Mail

O Melveny & Myers LLP Michael J Sage Jason Alderson Time Square Tower 7 Times Square New York, NY 10036

First Class Mail

Office of Thrift Supervision
Darrell W Dochow
Pacific Plaza
2001 Junipero Serra Blvd Ste 650
Daly City, CA 94014-1976

First Class Mail

Patterson Belknap Webb & Tyler Brian P Guiney Daniel A Lowenthal 1133 Avenue of the Americas New York, NY 10036-6710

Pension Benefit Guaranty Corp Joel W Ruderman Office of the Chief Counsel 1200 K St NW Washington, DC 20005-4026

First Class Mail

Perkins Coie LLP
Alan D Smith
Brian A Jennings
Ronald L Berenstain
1201 Third Ave 48th Fl
Seattle, WA 98101

First Class Mail

Phillips Goldman & Spence PA Stephen W Spence 1200 N Broom St Wilmington, DE 19806

First Class Mail

Pillsbury Winthrop Shaw Pittman LLP
Rick B Antonoff
Erica Carrig
1540 Broadway
New York, NY 10036-4039

First Class Mail

Platzer Sergold Karlin Levine Goldberg Jaslow LLP Sydney G Platzer 1065 Avenue of the Americas 18th Fl New York, NY 10018

First Class Mail

Perdue Brandon Fielder Collins & Mott LLP Elizabeth Banda PO Box 13430 Arlington, TX 76094-0430

First Class Mail

San Diego Treasurer Tax Collector of California
Bankruptcy Desk
Dan McAllister
1600 Pacific Hwy Rm 162
San Diego, CA 92101

First Class Mail

San Joaquin County Treasurer & Tax Collector Christine M Babb 500 E Mail St 1st Fl PO Box 2169 Stockton, CA 95201

First Class Mail

Plains Capital Bank Building Michael S Mitchell 18111 N Preston Rd Ste 810 Dallas, TX 75252

First Class Mail

Reed Smith LLP
J Andrew Rahl
James C McCarroll
599 Lexington Ave, 30th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Riddell Williams PS Joseph E Shickich Jr 1001 4th Ave Ste 4500 Seattle, WA 98154-1192 First Class Mail
Robert M Menar

700 S Lake Ave Ste 325 Pasadena, CA 91106

First Class Mail

Satterlee Stephens Burke & Burke LLP
Pamela A Bosswick
Christopher R Belmonte
230 Park Ave
New York, NY 10169

First Class Mail

Securities & Exchange Commission
Allen Maiza
Northeast Regional Office
3 World Financial Center Rm 4300
New York, NY 10281

First Class Mail

Securities & Exchange Commission
Daniel M Hawke
The Mellon Independence Ctr
701 Market St
Philadelphia, PA 19106-1532

First Class Mail

Kevin Dean Solonsky
Senior Counsel
Securities & Exchange Commission
100 F Street NE
Washington, DC 20549

First Class Mail

Securities & Exchange Commission 15th & Pennsylvania Ave NW Washington, DC 20020

First Class Mail

State of Washington Dept of Revenue Zachary Mosner Asst Attorney General 800 Fifth Ave Ste 2000 Seattle, WA 98104-3188

First Class Mail

Gary A. Gotto Keller Rohrback PLC 3101 North Central Avenue, Suite 1400 Phoenix, AZ 85012 First Class Mail
Shipman & Goodwin LLP

Julie A Manning One Constitution Plaza Hartford, CT 06103-1919

Singer & Levick PC Michelle E Shriro 16200 Addison Rd Ste 140 Addison, TX 75001

First Class Mail

Steckbauer Weinhart Jaffe LLP Barry S Glaser 333 S Hope St Ste 3600 Los Angeles, CA 90071

First Class Mail

Sullivan & Cromwell LLP Robinson B Lacy 125 Broad St New York, NY 10004-2498

First Class Mail

Treasurer Tax Collector
Dan McAllister Bankruptcy Desk
1600 Pacific Hwy Room 162
San Diego, CA 92101

First Class Mail

Unisys Corporation
Janet Fitzpatrick Legal Asst
Unisys Way
PO Box 500 MS E8 108
Blue Bell, PA 19424

First Class Mail

Sullivan & Cromwell LLP
Hydee R Feldstein
Robert R Urband
1888 Century Park E
Los Angeles, CA 90067-1725

First Class Mail

Tennessee Dept of Revenue
TN Attorney Generals Office Bankruptcy Div
PO Box 20207
Nashville, TN 37202-0207

First Class Mail

Tax Collector for Polk County
Office of Joe G Tedder
Bonnie Holly Delinquency & Enforcement
PO Box 2016
Bartow, FL 33831-2016

Hand Delivery

Carmella P. Keener Rosenthal, Monhait & Goddess, P.A. 919 N. Market Street, Suite 1401 P.O. Box 1070 Wilmington, DE 19899

First Class Mail

US Attorney General US Department of Justice Michael Mukasey 950 Pennsylvania Ave NW Washington, DC 20530-0001

US Department of Justice
Jan M Geht Trial Attorney Tax Division
PO Box 227
Washington, DC 20044

First Class Mail
Vedder Price PC
Douglas J Lipke
222 N LaSalle St Ste 2600
Chicago, IL 60601

First Class Mail

Verizon Services Corp William M Vermette 22001 Loudon County Parkway Room E1 3 113 Ashburn, VA 20147 First Class Mail
Walter R Holly Jr
10853 Garland Ave
Culver City, CA 90232

First Class Mail Washington Mutual Claims Processing c/o Kurtzman Carson Consultants 2335 Alaska Ave El Segundo, CA 90245

First Class Mail
Weil Gotshal & Manges LLP
Brian S Rosen
Marcia L Goldstein
Michael F Walsh
767 Fifth Ave
New York, NY 10153

First Class Mail Weiss Serota Helfman Douglas R Gonzales E Broward Blyd Ste 1900

200 E Broward Blvd Ste 1900 Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 First Class Mail
Wells Fargo Bank NA
Thomas M Korsman
625 Marquette Ave
Minneapolis, MN 55479

First Class Mail

White & Case LLP
Thomas E Lauria
Wachovia Financial Center
200 S Biscayne Blvd Ste 4900
Miami, FL 33131

First Class Mail
Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP
Shaunna D Jones
Shelley Chapman
Thomas H Golden
787 Seventh Ave
New York, NY 10019-6099

Wilmington Trust Company Jame McGinley 520 Madison Ave 33rd Fl New York, NY 10022

Hand Delivery

Ian Connor Bifferato
Thomas F. Driscoll III
Kevin G. Collins
Bifferato LLC
800 N. King Street, Plaza Level
Wilmington, DE 19801

First Class Mail
Washington Mutual, Inc.
1301 Second Avenue
Seattle, WA 98101

First Class Mail

Saverio M. Rocca, Esquire Assistant General Counsel ACE USA 436 Walnut Street, 4th Floor WA04J Philadelphia, PA 19106

First Class Mail

Jorian L. Rose, Esquire
Venable LLP
Rockefeller Center
2170 Avenue of the Americas, 25th Floor
New York, NY 10020

First Class Mail

Michael J. Bennett
Kathleen R. Dahlgren
Lichtsinn & Haensel, s.c.
111 East Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Milwaukee, WI 53202

First Class Mail

Jeffrey Isaacs Procopio, Cory, Hargreaves & Savitch LLP 530 B Street, Suite 2100 San Diego, CA 92101

First Class Mail

Deputy Attorney General Office of the Attorney General 300 South Spring Street, Suite 1702 Los Angeles, CA 90013

First Class Mail

Gregory A. Cross, Esquire Venable LLP 750 East Pratt Street, Suite 900 Baltimore, MD 21202

Hand Delivery

Bradford J. Sandler, Esquire Jennifer R. Hoover, Esquire Benesch, Friedlander, Coplan & Aronoff LLP 222 Delaware Avenue, Suite 801 Wilmington, DE 19801

Michael P. Morton, Esquire 1203 North Orange Street Wilmington, DE 19801

First Class Mail

David F. Heroy Ethan Ostrow Baker & McKenzie LLP One Prudential Plaza Suite 3600 Chicago, IL 60601

First Class Mail

Severson & Werson, P.C. Duane M. Geck, Esquire One Embarcadero Center, 26th Floor San Francisco, CA 9411