IN UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	X	
	:	Chapter 11
In re:	:	•
	:	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,1		Jointly Administered
	:	Objection deadline: April 6, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
	:	
Debtors.	:	
	:	
	X	

FIRST MONTHLY APPLICATION OF VENABLE LLP AS COUNSEL FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY SECURITY HOLDERS FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

Name of Applicant:	Venable LLP			
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	The Official Committee of Equity Security Holders			
Date of Retention:	February 22, 2010 [Docket No. 2403] (nunc pro tunc to January 11, 2010)			
Period for Which Compensation and Reimbursement is Sought:	January 11, 2010 through January 31, 2010			
Amount of Compensation Sought as Actual, Reasonable and Necessary:	\$138,919.00 (80% of \$173,648.75)			
Amount of Expense Reimbursement Sought as Actual, Reasonable and Necessary:	\$10,825.21			
This is a(n): X monthly interim fine	al application.			

The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395). The Debtors' principal offices are located at 1301 Second Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98101.

SUMMARY OF ATTORNEYS AND LEGAL ASSISTANTS RENDERING SERVICES DURING THE PERIOD JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

Name of Professional Person	Position of the Applicant, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Total Billed Hours ²	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Compensation Requested
Michael Schatzow	Partner for 21 years; Admitted in 1973; Litigation Division	19.00	\$725.00	\$13,231.25
Gregory A. Cross	Partner for 13 years; Admitted in 1987; Business Division	45.40	\$575.00	\$25,530.00
Andrew J. Currie	Partner for 2 years; Admitted in 1996; Business Division	0.20	\$575.00	\$115.00
Jorian L. Rose	Partner for 9 months; Admitted in 1998; Business Division	103.80	\$570.00	\$58,738.50
David E. Rice	Partner for 21 years; Admitted in 1980; Business Division	23.60	\$565.00	\$13,334.00
Michael MacWillliams	Partner for 7 years; Admitted in 1994; Litigation Division	20.80	\$550.00	\$11,027.50
Jason C. Rose	Partner for 1 year; Admitted in 1998; Litigation Division	0.70	\$495.00	\$346.50
Julia Karwowski	Associate for 2 years; Admitted in 2008; Business Division	68.10	\$310.00	\$21,111.00
Rishi Kapoor	Associate for 1 year; Admitted in 2009; Business Division	56.70	\$295.00	\$16,726.50
Donald Macdonald	Associate for 2 months; Admitted in 2010; Business Division	43.30	\$280.00	\$12,124.00

Pursuant to Del. Bankr. L.R. 2016-2(d)(viii), travel time during which no work is performed is billed at 50% of regularly hourly rates. In compliance with this rule, Mr. Schatzow had 1.5 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$362.50 per hour. Mr. Cross had 2 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$287.50 per hour. Mr. Jorian Rose had 1.5 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$285.00 per hour. Mr. MacWilliams had 1.5 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$275.00 per hour.

Ruth A. Lathe	Paralegal for 13 years	4.50	\$265.00	\$1,192.50
Youngsik Yoon	Paralegal for 6 months	0.80	\$215.00	\$172.00
TOTAL		386.90		\$173,648.75
BLENDED RATE			\$448.82	

COMPENSATION BY TASK CATEGORY JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

Task	Task Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Code			
B659	Equity Committee Administration	58.20	\$24,427.00
B705	Contested Matters and Uncategorized Adversary Proceedings	249.20	\$114,891.00
B707	Employment of Professionals	62.70	\$27,717.50
B710	Fee Applications	1.20	\$685.00
B712	General Operations	4.90	\$1,575.50
B716	Non-Working Travel	6.50	\$1,958.75
B721	Other Court Litigation	4.20	\$2,394.00
TOTAL		386.90	\$173,648.75

EXPENSE SUMMARY JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

Expense Category	Total Expenses
Conferencing Services	\$290.00
Internal Reproduction Costs	\$4.50
Legal Research	\$9,848.15
Long Distance Telephone	\$5.61
Travel Expense	\$676.95
TOTAL	\$10,825.21

IN UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	X	
	:	Chapter 11
In re:	:	•
	:	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1		Jointly Administered
		·
	:	Objection deadline: April 6, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
	:	
Debtors.	:	
	:	
	X	

FIRST MONTHLY APPLICATION OF VENABLE LLP AS COUNSEL FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY SECURITY HOLDERS FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

Venable LLP ("Venable"), counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders (the "Committee") appointed in the above-captioned chapter 11 case of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al. (the "Debtors"), hereby submits its first monthly application (the "Application") pursuant to (i) sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), (ii) Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), (iii) Rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure for the District of Delaware (the "Local Rules"), and (iv) the Amended Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals and Committee Members entered on November 17, 2008 (the "Administrative Fee Order") [Docket No. 302], for interim allowance of compensation for services rendered in the aggregate amount of \$173,648.75 and for reimbursement of actual and necessary

The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are:
(i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395). The Debtors' principal offices are located at 1301 Second Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98101.

expenses incurred by Venable in connection therewith in the amount of \$10,825.21 for the period from January 11, 2010 through January 31, 2010 (the "Compensation Period"). In support of this Application, Venable respectfully states as follows:

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

- 1. This Court has jurisdiction to consider this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue of this chapter 11 case in this district is proper under 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.
- 2. The statutory predicates for the relief requested herein are 11 U.S.C. §§ 1103 and 328(a) of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 2016.

BACKGROUND

- 3. On September 26, 2008 (the "Petition Date"), the Debtors filed voluntary petitions under chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"). The Debtors are authorized to continue to operate their businesses and manage their properties as debtors-in-possession pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. On October 3, 2008, the Court entered an order jointly administering these cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b) for procedural purposes only.
- 4. On January 11, 2010, the United States Trustee appointed the Committee [Docket No. 2130]. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these chapter 11 cases.
- 5. On January 11, 2010, pursuant to sections 328 and 1103(a) of the Bankruptcy Code, the Committee selected Venable to serve as counsel to the Committee. The Committee filed an application to employ Venable on January 27, 2010 (the "Application to Employ") [Docket No. 2250]. On February 22, 2010, this Court entered an order authorizing the retention of Venable as counsel to the Committee, *nunc pro tunc* to January 11, 2010 [Docket

RELIEF REQUESTED

- 1. By this Application, Venable seeks (i) allowance and authorization of payment of interim compensation for professional services rendered by Venable as attorneys for the Committee during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$173,648.75 representing 386.90 hours in professional services, and (ii) reimbursement of reasonable, necessary expenses incurred by Venable during the Compensation Period in connection with such services, in the aggregate amount of \$10,825.21.¹ The blended hourly billing rate for Venable's attorneys and paralegals during the Compensation Period is \$448.82.²
- 2. Pursuant to the Administrative Fee Order, Venable may file a monthly fee application with the Court on or before the 25th day of each calendar month, or as soon as practicable thereafter. The Court order authorizing Venable's retention was entered on February 22, 2010, and Venable presents this Application for the Compensation Period as soon as practicable after February 25, 2010. Venable is seeking payment of \$138,919.00 (80% of \$173,648.75) of fees and \$10,825.21 for reimbursement of expenses relating to services rendered during the Compensation Period.
- 3. Venable has received no payment and no promises for payment from any source for services rendered during the Compensation Period and addressed in this Application. There is no agreement or understanding between Venable and any other person (other than members of Venable) for the sharing of compensation to be received for the services rendered in these cases.

To the extent that professional services or expenses incurred during the Compensation Period have not been processed in Venable's billing and time-keeping system prior to the preparation of this Application, Venable reserves the right to request compensation for such services and reimbursement of such expenses by future application.

The blended hourly billing rate is derived by dividing the total requested fees of \$173,648.75 by the total hours of 386.90.

4. As stated in the Verification, annexed hereto as Exhibit A, all of the services for which interim compensation is sought herein were rendered for or on behalf of the Committee solely in connection with these cases.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

- 5. Venable has rendered professional and paraprofessional services during the Compensation Period in the interests of the Committee. The variety and complexity of the issues in these chapter 11 cases and the need to act or respond to issues on an expedited basis and in furtherance of the Committee's needs have required the expenditure of substantial time by Venable personnel from several legal disciplines.
- 6. In the ordinary course of its practice, Venable maintains written records of the time expended by attorneys and paraprofessionals in the rendition of their professional services. In accordance with the provisions of the Administrative Fee Order, a compilation showing the name of the attorney or paraprofessional, the date on which the services were performed, a description of the services rendered, and the amount of time spent in performing the services for the Committee during the Compensation Period is annexed hereto as Exhibit B.
- 7. In the ordinary course of its practice, Venable also maintains records of all actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of its professional and paraprofessional services, all of which are available for inspection. A schedule of the categories of expenses and amounts for which reimbursement is requested is annexed hereto as Exhibit C. A detailed summary of the expenses is attached hereto as Exhibit D.
- 8. Venable respectfully submits that the professional and paraprofessional services that it rendered on behalf of the Committee were necessary and appropriate and have directly contributed to the effective administration of these chapter 11 cases.

9. The following summary of services rendered during the Compensation Period is not intended to be a detailed description of the work performed, as those day-to-day services and the time expended in performing such services are fully set forth in Exhibit B. Rather, it is merely an attempt to highlight certain of those areas in which services were rendered to the Committee, as well as to identify some of the problems and issues that Venable was required to address.

B659 – Equity Committee Administration

This Task Category relates to services rendered to the Committee during the Compensation Period addressing the Committee's organizational and administrative needs. Following the Committee's formation, Venable attorneys spent time working with the Committee to develop bylaws for governance of the Committee's conduct throughout these cases. The services provided by Venable attorneys also include administering, managing and coordinating the provision of legal services to the Committee through monitoring the docket and all pleadings filed in these cases, maintaining case calendars, and regular calls, emails, and telephonic meetings with the Committee and individual Committee members. Other services include drafting of Committee meeting minutes and maintaining a Committee meeting contact list.

B705 - Contested Matters and Uncategorized Adversary Proceedings

This Task Category relates to preparation for and attendance at hearings and other proceedings before this Court. Venable attorneys were needed to appear at a hearing on January 28, 2010 on the Debtors' motion for an order disbanding the Committee, where they actively asserted the Committee's positions. Venable attorneys prepared for the hearing by reviewing

and analyzing issues, pleadings, and other documents; conducting research on relevant issues; and preparing, filing, and serving an Opposition to the Motion to Disband.

B707 – Employment of Professionals

12. This Task Category relates to services performed by Venable attorneys and paraprofessionals in connection with the preparation of the Committee's Application to Employ Venable as its counsel and the related disclosure affidavit. These services include drafting and editing of the Application to Employ and the affidavit as well as conducting and reviewing a conflicts check. This task category also relates to services performed by Venable attorneys in connection with interviewing potential financial advisors.

B710 – Fee Applications

13. This Task Category includes time worked by Venable attorneys analyzing issues regarding fee applications.

B712 – General Operations

14. This Task Category includes time worked by Venable attorneys and paraprofessionals in connection with matters relating to the operations of the Debtors, administrative matters with respect to Debtors' cases, and general corporate advice.

<u>B716 – Non-Working Travel (@ 50%)</u>

15. This Task Category includes time spent by Venable attorneys and paraprofessionals traveling in connection with representing the Committee, including travel to and from hearings before the Court. Venable's billing with respect to this Task Category was billed at 50% of each timekeeper's applicable billing rate.

B721 – Non-Bankruptcy Litigation (Other Court Litigation)

16. This Task Category includes time spent by Venable attorneys reviewing and analyzing various potential and actual litigation matters filed in or pending in courts other than the Bankruptcy Court.

BASIS FOR RELIEF

- 17. The factors to be considered in awarding attorneys' fees have been enumerated in In re First Colonial Corporation of America, 544 F.2d 1291, 1298-99 (5th Cir. 1977), cert. denied, 431 U.S. 904, which standards have been adopted by most courts. See, e.g., In re Lan Assoc., 192 F.3d 109, 123 n.8 (3d Cir. 1999) (suggesting First Colonial factors apply to § 330 compensation requests); In re Busy Beaver Building Centers, Inc., 19 F.3d 833, 850 (3d Cir. 1994). Venable respectfully submits that a consideration of these factors should result in this Court's allowance of the full compensation sought.
 - (1) The Time and Labor Required. The professional services rendered by Venable on behalf of the Committee has required the continuous expenditure of substantial time and effort, under time pressures. The services rendered required a high degree of professional competence and expertise.
 - (2) The Novelty and Difficulty of Questions. Novel and complex issues have already arisen in the course of the chapter 11 case of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al., and it can be anticipated that other such issues will be encountered. In these cases, as in many others in which the firm is involved, Venable's advocacy and methodology have helped clarify and resolve difficult issues.
 - (3) The Skill Requisite to Perform the Legal Services Properly. Venable believes that its recognized expertise in the area of bankruptcy related litigation and its methodology employed in these cases is beneficial to the Committee.
 - (4) The Preclusion of Other Employment by Applicant Due to Acceptance of the Case. The matters in which Venable's attorneys are involved need attention on a continuous basis and require many of Venable's attorneys to commit significant portions of their time to

these cases.

- (5) The Customary Fee. The compensation sought herein is based upon Venable's normal hourly rates for services of this kind. Venable respectfully submits that the compensation sought herein is not unusual given the magnitude and complexity of these cases and the time dedicated to the representation of the Committee. Such compensation is commensurate with fees charged by other attorneys of comparable experience.
- (6) Whether the Fee is Fixed or Contingent. Venable charges customary hourly rates for the time expended by its attorneys and paraprofessionals in representing the Committee and Venable's fee is not outcome dependent. Pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, all fees sought by professionals retained under sections 327 or 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code are contingent pending final approval by the Court.
- (7) <u>Time Limitation Imposed by Client or Other Circumstances</u>. As stated above, Venable has been required to attend to various issues as they have arisen in these cases. Venable has had to routinely perform those services under significant time constraints.
- (8) The Amount Involved and Results Obtained. The amount of time spent on various tasks has been judicious, and Venable believes that its efforts are benefiting the Committee.
- The Experience, Reputation and Ability of the Attorneys. Venable's attorneys involved in this representation have played a major role in numerous chapter 11 cases, including those of Alamo National Rental Car, General Growth Properties, Inc., Lehman Brothers Holdings, Inc., Magna Entertainment Corporation, DBSI, Inc., Kmart, Inc., Glasstech Holdings, Inphomation Communications, Inc., the operator of the Psychic Friends Network, Geonex Corporation, the Driggs Corporation, USA Floral Products, Inc., CRIIMI MAE, Inc., Thornburg Mortgage, Inc., Iridium Operating LLC, US Office Products Company, and Enron. Venable's experience enables it to perform the services described herein competently and expeditiously.
- (10) The "Undesirability" of the Case. Although not undesirable, these cases have required a significant commitment of time from several of Venable's attorneys and other professionals.

(11) Nature and Length of Professional Relationship. Venable was selected as counsel to the Committee on January 11, 2010, and was retained nunc pro tune to that date pursuant to an order of this court dated February 22, 2010.

ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION

- 18. The professional and paraprofessional services rendered by Venable required a high degree of professional competence and expertise so that the numerous issues requiring evaluation and determination by the Committee could be addressed with skill and have, therefore, required the expenditure of substantial time and effort. It is respectfully submitted that the services rendered to the Committee were performed efficiently, effectively and economically, and the results obtained to date have benefited not only the members of the Committee, but also the equity security holder body as a whole and the Debtors' estates.
- 19. The allowance of interim compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses in bankruptcy cases is expressly provided for in section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code:
 - ... any professional person ... may apply to the court not more than once every 120 days after an order for relief in a case under this title, or more often if the court permits, for such compensation for services rendered ... as is provided under section 330 of this title.
- 11 U.S.C. § 331. Moreover, this Court has authorized the filing of this Application in the Administrative Fee Order.
- 20. With respect to the level of compensation, 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1)(A) provides, in pertinent part, that the Court may award to a professional person "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered" 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1)(A). Section 330(a)(3), in turn, provides that:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded ... the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services,

taking into account all relevant factors, including —

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;
- (E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
- (F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.
- 11 U.S.C. §330(a)(3). The clear Congressional intent and policy expressed in this statute is to provide for adequate compensation in order to continue to attract qualified and competent bankruptcy practitioners to bankruptcy cases.
- 21. The total time spent by Venable attorneys and paraprofessionals during the Compensation Period was 386.90 hours. The work involved, and thus the time expended, was carefully assigned to the appropriate professional or paraprofessional in light of the experience and expertise required for a particular task.
- 22. As shown by this Application and supporting documents, Venable spent its time economically and without unnecessary duplication of efforts. Attached hereto as Exhibit E is a schedule of the hours expended by the attorneys and paraprofessionals during the Compensation Period, their normal hourly rates, and the value of their services. In addition, Venable incurred actual out-of-pocket expenses in connection with the rendition of the

professional services to the Committee in the sum of \$10,825.21 for which Venable respectfully requests reimbursement in full.

- 23. The disbursements and expenses have been incurred in accordance with Venable's normal practice of charging clients for expenses clearly related to and required by particular matters. Venable has endeavored to minimize these expenses to the fullest extent possible.
- 24. Venable's billing rates do not include charges for photocopying, telephone and facsimile charges, computerized research, travel expenses, "working meals," secretarial overtime, postage and certain other office services, since the needs of each client for such services differ. Venable believes that it is fairest to charge each client only for the services actually used in performing services for it. In these proceedings, Venable charges \$.10 per page for internal duplicating and does not charge for facsimile transmissions.
- 25. No prior application has been made in this or in any other Court for the relief requested herein for the Compensation Period.

WHEREFORE, Venable respectfully requests that this Court: (i) approve the allowance of \$173,648.75 for compensation for professional and paraprofessional services rendered to the Committee during the period from January 11, 2010 through and including January 31, 2010; (ii) approve the reimbursement of Venable's out-of-pocket expenses incurred in connection with the rendering of such services during the period January 11, 2010 through and including January 31, 2010 in the amount of \$10,825.21; and (iii) authorize and direct the Debtors to pay Venable the amount of \$149,744.21, which is equal to the sum of 80% of Venable's fees and 100% of Venable's expenses incurred during the Compensation Period.

Dated: March 16, 2010. VENABLE LLP

Jorian L Rose (Federal Bar No. JR 5518) 1270 Avenue of the Americas, 25th Floor New York, NY 10020 (212) 307-5500 (212) 307-5598 (fax)

Gregory A. Cross (Federal Bar No. 04571-G) 750 E. Pratt Street, Suite 900 Baltimore, Maryland 21202 (410) 244-7400 (410) 244-7742 (fax)

Counsel for the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

) Chapter 11
In re:) Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1)) (Jointly Administered)
Debtors.	Objection Deadline: April 6, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

NOTICE OF FIRST MONTHLY APPLICATION OF VENABLE LLP AS COUNSEL FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY SECURITY HOLDERS FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD OF JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

TO: FEE APPLICATION NOTICE PARTIES

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on March 16, 2010, the First Monthly Application of Venable LLP as Counsel for the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period of January 11, 2010 through January 31, 2010 (the "Application") was filed with the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 824 Market Street, 3rd Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 and was served in accordance with the Amended Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals entered on November 14, 2008 [Docket No. 302] (the "Administrative Fee Order").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that the Application requests allowance and payment of compensation in the amount of \$138,919.00 (80% of \$173,648.75) and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$10,825.21 for the period of January 11, 2010 through January 31, 2010.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that any objection to the Application must be made in accordance with the Administrative Fee Order and filed with the U.S. Bankruptcy Court, and served upon the following parties: (i) the Debtors, Washington Mutual, Inc., c/o Alvarez and Marsal, 1301 Second Avenue, WMC3301, Seattle, WA 98101 (Attn: John Maciel, Esq.); (ii) counsel to the Debtors, Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10153 (Attn: Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq. and Brian S. Rosen, Esq.) and Richards Layton & Finger, P.A., One Rodney Square, Wilmington, DE 19899 (Attn: Mark D. Collins, Esq.); (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee, J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, 844 King Street, Room 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Joseph J. McMahon, Jr., Esq.); (iv) counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, Akin, Gump, Strauss, Hauer & Feld LLP, One Bryant Park, New York, NY 10036 (Attn: Fred S. Hodora, Esq.), Akin, Gump,

The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725) and WMI Investment Corp. (5396). The Debtors' principal offices are located at 1301 Second Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98101.

Strauss, Hauer & Feld LLP, 1333 New Hampshire Avenue, N.W., Washington, DC 20036-1564 (Attn: Scott L. Alberino, Esq.), Akin, Gump, Strauss, Hauer & Feld LLP, 2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400, Los Angeles, CA 90067-3012 (Attn: Peter J. Gurfein, Esq. and David P. Simonds, Esq.) and Pepper Hamilton LLP, Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100, 1313 N. Market Street, Wilmington, DE 19899 (Attn: David B. Stratton, Esq. and Evelyn J. Meltzer, Esq. (v) counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders, Venable LLP, 750 East Pratt Street, Suite 900, Baltimore, MD 21202 (Attn: Gregory A. Cross, Esq.), Venable LLP, 1270 Avenue of the Americas, New York, NY 10020 (Attn: Jorian L. Rose, Esq.) and Ashby & Geddes, P.A., 500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor, P.O. Box 1150, Wilmington, Delaware 19899 (Attn: William P. Bowden, Esq. and Gregory A. Taylor, Esq.);, so as to be received by April 6, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (ET).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT IF AN OBJECTION IS FILED AND SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE AFOREMENTIONED PROCEDURE AND SUCH OBJECTION IS NOT OTHERWISE RESOLVED, A HEARING TO CONSIDER THE APPLICATION WILL BE SCHEDULED AT A DATE AND TIME CONVENIENT TO THE COURT, BEFORE THE HONORABLE MARY F. WALRATH, UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE, 824 MARKET STREET, 5TH FLOOR, COURTROOM #4, WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801.

Dated: March 16, 2010 Wilmington, Delaware AŞHBY & GEDDES, P.A.

William P. Bowden (No. 2553) Gregory A. Taylor (No. 4008) Benjamin Keenan (No. 4724) Stacy L. Newman (No. 5004) 500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor

P.O. Box 1150

Wilmington, Delaware 19899 Telephone: 302-654-1888 Facsimile: 302-654-2067

Proposed Co-Counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.

-and-

VENABLE LLP

Gregory A. Cross 750 East Pratt Street, Suite 900 Baltimore, MD 21202 Telephone: (410) 244-7400 Facsimile: (410) 244-7742

gacross@venable.com

Jorian L. Rose 1270 Avenue of the Americas New York, NY 10020 Telephone: (212) 307-5500 Facsimile: (212) 307-5598

jlrose@venable.com

Counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.

EXHIBIT A

IN UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

		X	
In re:		:	Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL	., INC., et al., ¹	:	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW) Jointly Administered
	Debtors.	: : : :	Objection deadline: April 6, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
	<u>VERI</u>	FICAT	CION
STATE OF NEW YORK CITY OF NEW YORK)) SS:)		

Jorian L. Rose, Esquire, being first duly sworn, deposes and declares under penalty of perjury:

- 1. I am a member of the law firm of Venable LLP ("Venable"). My firm maintains offices for the practice of law at, among other places, 750 East Pratt Street, Suite 900, Baltimore, Maryland 21202, and 1270 Avenue of the Americas, 25th Floor, New York, New York 10020. Venable has acted as counsel to and has rendered professional services on behalf of the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders (the "Committee") of Washington Mutual, Inc., *et al.* (collectively, the "Debtors").
- 2. This Verification is submitted pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2016-2 in support of Venable's application for an interim allowance of \$138,919.00 (80% of \$173,648.75) of fees and \$10,825.21 for reimbursement of expenses for services rendered during the period

The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395). The Debtors' principal offices are located at 1301 Second Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98101.

from January 1, 2010 through and including January 31, 2010.

- 3. I have reviewed the requirements of Rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware and submit that the Application substantially complies with such rule.
- 4. All services for which compensation is requested by Venable were professional services performed for and on behalf of the Committee and not on behalf of any other person.
- 5. I have reviewed the foregoing Application, and the facts set forth therein are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief.

Dated: March 16, 2010.

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED BEFORE ME, this 16 day of March, 2010.

My commission expires: 1/26/3013

tary Public MAXINE M. CHUCK

Notary Public, State of New York No. 01 CH6066870 Qualified in Westchester County

Commission Expires November 26, 2013

EXHIBIT B

JANUARY 2010		T. 01				
TIMEKEEPER	DATE	CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS / QTY	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
FEES						
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/11/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF	1.00	570.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH AND EMAILS REGARDING
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/12/2010	B707	PROFESSIONALS EMPLOYMENT OF	0.10	31.00	PREPARING RETENTION DOCUMENTS EMAIL M. MACWILLIAMS RE CONFLICT CHECK (.1)
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/13/2010	B707	PROFESSIONALS EMPLOYMENT OF	7.80	2 184 00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. ANELLI REGARDING DRAFTING AN
W (GGO) V LD, GG, W LD	1113/2010	8707	PROFESSIONALS	7.60	2,164.00	EQUITY COMMITTEE'S APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER APPROVING RETENTION IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE (.3); REVIEWED MODEL DELAWARE RETENTION APPLICATIONS (2.1); PUTTING TOGETHER AND DRAFTING A RETENTION APPLICATION (5.4)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/14/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.30	93.00	PULL INFO FOR CONFLICT CHECK (.2); EMAIL D. MCDONALD RE SAME (.1)
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/14/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	6.20	1,736.00	DRAFTED EQUITY COMMITTEE EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ROSE ABOUT SAME
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/15/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	3.00	840.00	DRAFTING EQUITY COMMITTEE EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION (2.9); SENT DRAFT TO J. ROSE (.1)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/15/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.10	55.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MR. SCHATZOW RE CONTACT WITH PJ SOLOMON
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/15/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.10	55.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MR. SCHATZOW RE
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/15/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.20	145.00	INITIATING CONTACT WITH PJ SOLOMON TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. MAXWELL RE: INTEREST
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/16/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.10	55.00	IN FINANCIAL ADVISOR ROLE E-MAILS RE FINANCIAL ADVISORS
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/20/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF	1.00	570.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WILLINGHAM REGARDING
			PROFESSIONALS			FINANCIAL ADVISORS FOR COMMITTEE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PROSPECTIVE ADVISORS
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/22/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.40	230.00	CONFERENCE WITH D. RICE RE: APPLICATION TO EMPLOY
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/22/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.40	124.00	EMAIL D. MACDONALD RE CONFLICT CHECK (.1); ATTENTION TO SAME (.3)
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/22/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF	4.30	1,204.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ROSE AND D. RICE REGARDING
			PROFESSIONALS			DRAFT OF OFFICIAL EQUITY COMMITTEE EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION (.1); EDITING OF EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION DRAFT (4.1); SENDING EDITED DRAFTS TO J. ROSE AND D. RICE (.1)
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/22/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	3.00	1,695.00	REVIEW DRAFT RETENTION APPLICATION (.6); REVIEW DOCS RE: SAME (1.2); CONFERENCES WITH G. A. CROSS, J. A. KARWOWSKI, MACDONALD AND ROSE RE: SAME (1.2)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/22/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	1.50	855.00	TELEPHONE CALLS AND INTERVIEW POTENTIAL COMMITTEE Financial ADVISORS (1.5)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/22/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.60	435.00	INTERVIEW POTENTIAL FINANCIAL ADVISORS AT PJ SOLOMON
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/22/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	1.30	741.00	REVIEW RETENTION APPLICATION AND COMMENT REGARDING SAME (1.3)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/23/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.10	55.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MR. RICE RE APPLICATION TO SERVE AS EC COUNSEL
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/23/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.20	113.00	CONFERENCE WITH M. MACWILLIAMS RE: DISCLOSURE ISSUES (.2)
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/23/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	1.70	960.50	REVIEW DOCS RE: DISCLOSURE AFFIDAVIT (1.7)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/25/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.40	230.00	CONFERENCE WITH D. RICE RE: APPLICATION TO EMPLOY
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/25/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	1.20	372.00	PROFESSIONALS CALL WITH J. ROSE RE CONFLICT CHECKS (.3); EMAIL TEAM RE SAME (.1); DRAFT EXHIBIT TO WAMU RETENTION APPLICATION
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/25/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	2.60	1,469.00	(.5); MEETING WITH D. RICE RE SAME (.3) REVIEW/REVISE AFFIDAVIT (.5); REVIEW DOCS RE: SAME (1.2); CONVERSATION WITH ROSE RE: SAME (.4); CONVERSATION WITH ROSE & AYRES RE: SAME (.3); CONVERSATION WITH G.A.
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/25/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF	4.60	2,622.00	CROSS RE: SAME (.2) REVIEW CONNECTIONS AND REVISE AFFIDAVIT (4.6)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/26/2010	B707	PROFESSIONALS EMPLOYMENT OF	0.40		CONFERENCE WITH D. RICE RE: APPLICATION TO EMPLOY
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/26/2010	B707	PROFESSIONALS EMPLOYMENT OF	3.80		EDITING OF OFFICIAL EQUITY COMMITTEE'S APPLICATION TO
			PROFESSIONALS		,	EMPLOY VENABLE (1.5); CONDENSING OF MULTIPLE VERSIONS OF CONFLICTS CHECK LIST INTO ONE FINAL LIST INCLUDING ALL NAMES FROM PREVIOUS LISTS (1.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ROSE REGARDING EQUITY COMMITTEE'S APPLICATION TO EMPLOY VENABLE AND THE CONFLICTS CHECK LIST (.4)
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/26/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	3.20	1,808.00	REVIEWREVISE VENABLE RETENTION APPLICATION (.7); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SAME (1.5); CONVERSATION WITH ROSE RE: SAME (.9); CONVERSATION WITH G.A. CROSS RE: SAME (.1)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/26/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	6.10	3,477.00	COMPLETE REVIEW OF CONNECTIONS AND REVIEW AND REVISE RETENTION AFFIDAVIT (4.8); REVIEW AND REVISE RETENTION APPLICATION (1.3)

JANUARY 2010		TACK	WORK CORE!	HOURS /		
TIMEKEEPER	DATE	CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS / QTY	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/27/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF	0.50	287.50	REVIEW APPLICATION TO EMPLOY
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/27/2010	B707	PROFESSIONALS EMPLOYMENT OF	1.00	280.00	EDITED EQUITY COMMITTEE'S APPLICATION TO EMPLOY
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/27/2010	B707	PROFESSIONALS EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	0.70	395.50	VENABLE (1) REVIEW/REVISE VENABLE RETENTION APPLICATION (.3); CONFERENCE WITH G. A. CROSS RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCES WITH J. ROSE RE: SAME (.2)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/27/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	2.30	1,311.00	DRAFT APPLICATION FOR RETENTION AND AFFIDAVIT (2.3)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/28/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	1.00	570.00	INTERVIEW CONFERENCE WITH POTENTIAL COMMITTEE FINANCIAL ADVISOR (1.0)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/29/2010	B707	EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	1.50	855.00	INTERVIEW AND PROVIDE INFORMATION FOR POTENTIAL FINANCIAL ADVISOR (1.5)
			TOTAL FOR EMPLOYMENT OF PROFESSIONALS	62.70	27,717.50	(10)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/11/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.50	275.00	ATTEND INITIAL OEC MEETING AND RESPOND TO QUESTIONS POSED BY COMMITTEE MEMBERS RE NEXT STEPS
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/11/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	3.60	2,052.00	FIRST COMMITTEE MEETING (1.5); DRAFT AND DISTRIBUTE BYLAWS (2.1)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/11/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.50	362.50	MEETING WITH OFFICIAL EQUITY HOLDERS COMMITTEE, FOLLOWING APPOINTMENT OF SAME BY U.S. TRUSTEE
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/12/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	2.50	1,425.00	REVISE BYLAWS (1.0); PREPARE INITIAL MINUTES FROM FIRST MEETING (1.5)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/12/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	55.00	E-MAIL TO MR. CROSS AND JORIAN ROSE RE COMMITTEE TELECON AGENDA ITEMS
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/12/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.20	110.00	PREPARATION FOR COMMITTEE TELECOM
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/12/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	55.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF E-MAIL FROM MR. CRISCIONE PROVIDING CONTACT INFORMATION FOR MR. SOLE
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/12/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	55.00	E-MAIL EXCHANGE RE COMMUNICATIONS WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/12/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.50	275.00	TELECON WITH MR. CRISCIONE AND MR. SOLE RE INITIAL MEETING WITH THE OEC, EXPLANATION OF FIDUCIARY DUTY STANDARDS, ETC., AND E-MAIL TO MR. CROSS, MR. SCHATZOW, AND JORIAN ROSE RE SAME
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.70	402.50	COMMITTEE MEETING (.7)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.20	372.00	EMAIL TO J. ROSE RE COMMITTEE CALL (.1); CALL FROM J. ROSE RE COMMITTEE CALL (.1); COMMITTEE CALL (1.0)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.40	220.00	PREP FOR OEC MEETING
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.30	165.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MR. CROSS AND JORIAN ROSE RE COMMITTEE TELECON
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.00	550.00	ATTEND TELEPHONIC COMMITTEE MEETING
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.20	110.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF MEMO FROM MS. BARR AND E-MAIL TO MR. WILLINGHAM RE SAME
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	55.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MS. BARR RE HER MEMO RE CUSIP CANCELLATION
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/13/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	3.30	1,881.00	PREPARE bylaws and minutes FOR COMMITTEE MEETING (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. WILLINGHAM REGARDING COMMITTEE MEETING AND COMMITTEE MEETING (1.1)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/14/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.20	115.00	CALL TO CREDITORS' COMMITTEE
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/14/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.60	345.00	CONFERENCE WITH M. MACWILLIAMS RE: GENERAL ADMINISTRATION (.6)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/14/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.70	217.00	CALL FROM J. ROSE RE BYLAWS (.2); CALL WITH R. KAPOOR RE SAME (.2); CALL FROM G. CROSS RE EQUITY COMMITTEE CONSTITUENCY (.1); RESEARCH SAME (.2)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/15/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.10	341.00	UPDATE CONTACT SHEET (.3); PREPARE MINUTES FROM 1.13 CALL (.3); EDIT AND DISTRIBUTE SAME (.1); EMAIL V. ENGER RE CONTACTS (.1); EMAIL J. ROSE RE BYLAWS (.1); SEARCH FOR SAME (.2)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/15/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	55.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF MINUTES OF 1/13/2010 COMMITTEE MEETING
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/16/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.20	115.00	EMAILS RE COMMITTEE ADMINSTRATION (.2)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/18/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.80	440.00	DRAFT LETTER TO DEBTORS' AND CREDITORS' COUNSEL RE REQUEST FOR BRIEFING MEETING AND CIRCULATE SAME TO MR. CROSS, JORIAN ROSE, AND MR. SCHATZOW
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/19/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	6.80	2,108.00	CALL FROM V. ENGER RE CONTACT SHEET (.1); EMAIL V. ENGER RE SAME (.1); ASSIST IN OPENING FILE AND RUNNING CONFLICT CHECK (.3); PULL AND EMAIL TEAM CITED AUTHORITIES (.5); RESEARCH AND PULL CASES WHERE EQUITY COMMITTEE APPROVED AND OTHER OPEN RESEARCH ISSUES (5.8)

JANUARY 2010		TASK	MODK CODE!	HOURS /		
TIMEKEEPER	DATE	CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	QTY	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/19/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE	0.40	228.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS REGARDING
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/20/2010	B659	ADMINISTRATION EQUITY COMMITTEE	0.20	110.00	COMMITTEE MEETING (.4) TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH MR. SCHATZOW AND MR.
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/21/2010	B659	ADMINISTRATION EQUITY COMMITTEE	2.10	1,207.50	MELLOTT RE STAFFING ISSUES COMMITTEE CALL (.8); EDIT RESPONSE (1.0); CONFERENCE
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/21/2010	B659	ADMINISTRATION EQUITY COMMITTEE	0.20	110.00	WITH M. SCHATZOW (.3) CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHATZOW RE STRATEGY IN RE LITIGATION MONITORING
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/22/2010	B659	ADMINISTRATION EQUITY COMMITTEE	0.10	55.00	E-MAIL TO MS. LATHE RE FILE MANAGEMENT
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/22/2010	B659	ADMINISTRATION EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.40	798.00	EMAILS TO COMMITTEE REGARDING FILINGS (1.4)
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/25/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	4.10	1,148.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ROSE REGARDING CALENDAR OF SCHEDULED HEARINGS FOR WAMU CHAPTER 11 CASE (.2); PUTTING TOGETHER CALENDAR OF SCHEDULED HEARINGS
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/25/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	2.70	756.00	(3.9) PULLED AND PRINTED VARIOUS BANKRUPTCY CODE SECTION 2019 STATEMENTS TO GIVE TO J. ROSE FOR REVIEW (1.1); CREATED LIST OF REPRESENTED PARTIES IN WAMU CHAPTER
ROSE, JASON C.	1/25/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE	0.20	99.00	11 CASE (1.6) CONFERENCE W/ R LATHE RE ESTABLISHMENT OF EROOM
LATHE, RUTH A.	1/26/2010	B659	ADMINISTRATION EQUITY COMMITTEE	0.50	132.50	FOR LITIGATION MATERIALS CREATE E-ROOM DATABASES
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/26/2010	B659	ADMINISTRATION EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	4.30	1,204.00	PUT TOGETHER CALENDAR OF SCHEDULED HEARINGS FOR WAMU CHAPTER 11 CASE (4.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J.
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/26/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	2.30	644.00	ROSE REGARDING CALENDAR (.2) CREATED LIST OF REPRESENTED PARTIES IN WAMU CHAPTER 11 CASE (2.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ROSE REGARDING LIST (.2)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/26/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	55.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF LETTER FROM DEBTOR'S COUNSEL DECLINING TO PROVIDE US WITH ANY INFORMATION
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/26/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	55.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS E-MAIL FROM MR. FELDMAN
ROSE, JASON C.	1/26/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.40	198.00	REVIEW OF PROPOSED STRUCTURE OF EROOM AND CORRESPONDENCE W/ R LATHE RE COMMENTS ON REVISING STRUCTURE
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/27/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.70	402.50	CONFERENCE WITH J. ROSE RE: GENERAL ADMINISTRATION (.7)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/27/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	31.00	EMAIL D. MACDONALD RE HEARING CALENDAR (.1)
LATHE, RUTH A.	1/27/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	2.70	715.50	EDIT E-ROOM STRUCTURE AND ORGANIZE PLEADINGS
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/27/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.40	392.00	CREATED CALENDAR OF SCHEDULED HEARINGS FOR WAMU CHAPTER 11 CASE (1.4)
ROSE, JASON C.	1/27/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.10	49.50	CONFERENCE W/R LATHE RE JP MORGAN AND AMERICAN NAT'L INS. LITIGATIONS AND THEIR INCLUSION IN THE EROOM
LATHE, RUTH A.	1/28/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.30	344.50	EDIT E-ROOM PLEADINGS
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/29/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.40	118.00	EQUITY COMMITTEE CALL (.3); CONFERENCE WITH J ROSE REGARDING STATUS OF SAME (.1)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/29/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.90	279.00	UPDATE AND REVIEW HEARING CALENDAR (.8); EMAIL D. MACDONALD RE SAME (.1)
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/29/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	0.40	112.00	COMMUNICATION WITH J. ROSE REGARDING CALENDAR OF SCHEDULED HEARINGS (.2); EMAIL COMMUNICATION WITH L. HEIN OF BENESCH FRIEDLANDER REGARDING CALENDAR OF SCHEDULED HEARINGS (.1); EMAIL COMMUNICATION WITH J. KARWOWSKI REGARDING CALENDAR OF SCHEDULED HEARINGS (.1)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/29/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.50	855.00	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN EQUITY COMMITTEE CALL (1.5)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/30/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	1.20	690.00	ADMINISTRATION AND ORGANIZATION OF TEAM
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/30/2010	B659	EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	2.60	•	PREPARE FOR MEETING ON MONDAY BY ASSEMBLING WORKPLAN (2.6)
			TOTAL FOR EQUITY COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION	58.20	24,427.00	
CURRIE, ANDREW J.	1/21/2010	B710	FEE APPLICATIONS	0.20	115.00	CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROSE AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: FEE ISSUES
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/29/2010	B710	FEE APPLICATIONS TOTAL FOR FEE APPLICATIONS	1.00 1.20	570.00 685.00	REVIEW AND REVISE Fee application email (1.0)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/14/2010	B712	GENERAL OPERATIONS	0.40	230.00	REVIEW WRITE-UP RE: STOCK RECOVERIES

WAMU - BANKRUPTCY (117429-284635)/LITIGATION (117429-284555) JANUARY 2010

JANUARY 2010 TIMEKEEPER	DATE	TASK CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS /	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/20/2010	B712	GENERAL OPERATIONS	0.50	155.00	REVIEW EQUITY COMMITTEE FORMATION RESEARCH AND FORWARD SAME TO TEAM (.4); EMAIL J. ROSE RE TOTAL
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/25/2010	B712	GENERAL OPERATIONS	3.30	973.50	PROFESSIONAL FEES (.1) CALL WITH J ROSE TO DISCUSS FURTHER RESEARCH (.2); FURTHER RESEARCH ON CONTINGENT FEES AND CONFLICTS
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/27/2010	B712	GENERAL OPERATIONS	0.70	217.00	OF INTEREST ARISING OUT OF SAME (3.1) RESEARCH AMOUNTS OF CASH IN DEBTORS HANDS (.4); CALL WITH J. ROSE RE SAME (.2); EMAIL G. CROSS RE SAME (.1)
			TOTAL FOR GENERAL OPERATIONS	4.90	1,575.50	
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/12/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	2.90	1,667.50	REVIEW MOTION TO DISBAND (.9); CALL WITH CRENSHAW RE: COMMITTEE PROCEDURE (.3); CONFERENCE WITH J. ROSE RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.3); CONFERENCE WITH COMMITTEE CHAIR RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.4); CALL FROM COMMITTEE MEMBER RE: FORMATION (.3)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/12/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	6.40	1,888.00	CONFERENCES WITH J ROSE REGARDING DEBTORS' MOTION TO DISBAND EQUITY COMMITTEE (.3); REVIEW OF SAME (.6); RESEARCH REGARDING DISCOVERY (1.6); RESEARCH REGARDING STANDARD OF REVIEW (2.0); RESEARCH RE CONFLICTS OF INTEREST (1.9):
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/12/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.00	930.00	EMAILS FROM TEAM RE MOTION TO DISBAND (.2); RESEARCH SAME (.5); MEETING WITH G. CROSS RE SAME (.1); CALL TO J. ROSE RE SAME (.1); CALL WITH R. KAPOOR AND J. ROSE RE RESPONSE TO SAME (.4); REVIEW ADDITIONAL LETTERS IN SUPPORT (.3); REVIEW MOTION TO DISBAND (1.4)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/12/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.30	165.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MR. SCHATZOW RE OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/12/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.20	110.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH JORIAN ROSE RE OPPOSITION TO DEBTOR'S MOTION TO DISBAND THE OEC
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/12/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	3.60	2,052.00	REVIEW MOTION TO DISSOLVE AND OUTLINE ISSUES (3.6)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/13/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	1.10	632.50	CONFERENCE WITH J. ROSE RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.4); REVIEW AND ANALYZE MOTION TO DISQUALIFY STRATEGY (.7)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/13/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.30	973.50	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM J ROSE AND G CROSS REGARDING DRAFTING BRIEF IN OBJECTION TO DEBTORS' MOTION (.3); RESEARCH ON APPROPRIATE STANDARD OF REVIEW AND LEGAL SHOWING (2.9); CONFERENCES WITH J KARWOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.1)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/13/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY BROCEEDINGS	0.50	155.00	(.3); CALL TO R. KAPOOR RE MOTION TO DISBAND RESEARCH
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/13/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.60	330.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MR. WILLINGHAM RE OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/14/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.10	57.50	PRO HAC PAPERS
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/14/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.70	402.50	CONFERENCE WITH MICHAEL WILLINGHAM RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.5); EMAILS RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.2)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/14/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	6.30	1,858.50	CONTINUED RESEARCH ISSUES REGARDING EQUITY COMMITTEE'S OBJECTION TO DEBTORS' MOTION (6.1); CONFERENCES WITH J KARWOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.2)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/14/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.70	217.00	CALL WITH R. KAPOOR RE OPPOSITION TO DEBTORS MOTION TO DISBAND (.2); CALL WITH E. SMITH RE SAME (.2); EMAIL TEAM RE PRO HACS (.1); EXECUTE SAME (.1); MEETING WITH
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/14/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.30	165.00	G. CROSS RE SAME (.1) CONFERENCE WITH MR. CROSS RE STRATEGY IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/14/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.50	275.00	E-MAIL TO MR. CROSS, JORIAN ROSE, AND MS. KARWOWSKI RE ARGUMENTS TO EXPLORE IN OPPOSING THE MOTION TO DISBAND

JANUARY 2010		~				
TIMEKEEPER	DATE	CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS / QTY	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/15/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.20	115.00	CLAIMS ANALYSIS
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/15/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.70	402,50	CONFERENCE WITH J. KARWOWSKI RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.3); CALL TO MICHAEL WILLINGHAM RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.4)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/15/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	5.90	1,740.50	CONTINUED RESEARCHING ISSUES REGARDING EQUITY COMMITTEE'S OBJECTION TO DEBTORS' MOTION (4.3); CONFERENCES WITH J KARWOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.2);
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/15/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	7.80	2,418.00	DRAFTED PORTIONS OF SAME (1.4) DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEBTORS MOTION TO DISBAND (7.8)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/15/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.60	2,052.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS REGARDING OBJECTION (1.2); RESEARCH REGARDING CLAIMS OF ESTATE (2.4)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/15/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.90	652.50	REVIEWING MOTION TO DISBAND (.6); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROSE RE: RESPONSE TO MOTION, AND E-MAIL TO VENABLE TEAM RE: SAME (.3)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/16/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.70	402.50	STRATEGY, ANALYSIS AND EMAILS TO TEAM RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.7)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/16/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	10.30	3,038.50	DRAFTED EQUITY COMMITTEES OBJECTION TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO DISBAND (7.0); CONFERENCES WITH J KARWOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.3); RESEARCH ON ISSUES
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/16/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	9.80	3,038.00	REGARDING SAME (3.0) DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEBTORS MOTION TO DISBAND (9.4); EMAIL WITH G. CROSS RE SAME (.1); CALLS WITH R. KAPOOR RE SAME (.3)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/17/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.80	1,178.00	EDITS TO EQUITY COMMITTEE'S OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND (3.6); EMAILS TO J. ROSE RE SAME (.2)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	2.10	1,207.50	REVIEW DRAFT OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND (1.3); TEAM CALL RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.8)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	6.70	1,976.50	FURTHER RESEARCH FOR ISSUES REGARDING OPPOSITION TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO DISBAND (6.3); CONFERENCES W J ROSE AND J KARWOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.4)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	8.20	2,542.00	REVIEW CHANGES MADE TO OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISMISS (.6); EMAIL J. ROSE RE SAME (.1); CALL WITH J. ROSE AND R. KAPOOR RE OUTSTANDING ISSUES TO RESEARCH (.4); RESEARCH DISBANDING 1102(A)(1) COMMITTEE AND OTHER OPEN RESEARCH ISSUES (6.3); CALLS WITH J. ROSE RE SAME (.3); CALLS WITH R. KAPOOR RE OPEN RESEARCH ISSUES (.5)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.10	55.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MR. SCHATZOW RE OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.60	880.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS AND PROPOSED REVISIONS TO DRAFT OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.70	385.00	TELECON WITH MR. CROSS, JORIAN ROSE, AND MR. SCHATZOW RE OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	8.80	5,016.00	DRAFT RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISBAND EQUITY COMMITTEE (8.8)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	10.60		DRAFT RESPONSE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING MOTION TO DISBAND (8.1); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (2.1)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/18/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.10		TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. MACWILLIAMS, CROSS AND ROSE RE: OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND (.6); REVIEWING DRAFT OPPOSITION TO MOTION, E-MAIL RE: SAME, AND REVIEWING E-MAILS RE: SAME (.4); REVIEWING DRAFT LETTER TO DEBTOR'S COUNSEL AND E-MAIL RE: REVISIONS TO SAME (.1)

WAMU - BANKRUPTCY (117429-284635)/LITIGATION (117429-284555) JANUARY 2010

JANUARY 2010		TACK	WORK CORE	HOUSE !		
TIMEKEEPER	DATE	TASK CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS / QTY	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/19/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	6.20	3,565.00	REVIEW OF AND REVISIONS TO OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/19/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.80	2,090.00	RESEARCH, ANALYSIS, AND REDRAFTING IN CONNECTION WITH OPPOSITION TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO DISBAND
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/19/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3,00	1,695.00	REVIEW/REVISE OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND EQUITY COMMITTEE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SAME; CONFERENCES WITH M. SCHATZOW, G. A. CROSS AND J. A. KARWOWSKI RE: SAME
ROSE, JORIAN L	1/19/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	6.30	3,591.00	DRAFT MOTION TO DISBAND COMMITTEE (4.2); RESEARCH REGARDING STANDARDS AND UST POWERS FOR RESPONSE (2.1)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/19/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.80	1,305.00	DRAFTING AND REVISING OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND .
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/19/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	6.10	4,422.50	DRAFTING AND REVISING OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	6.70	3,852.50	REVIEW CASE LAW AND REVISE OPPOSITION TO DISBAND (6.4); EMAILS TO COMMITTEE (.3)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.70	1,091.50	CONFERENCES WITH J ROSE REGARDING STATUS OF BRIEF (.2); RESEARCH REGARDING BURDEN OF PROOF (3.0); CONFERENCES WITH J KARWOWSKI REGARDING STATUS OF BRIEF (.2); UPDATES TO SAME (.3)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	5.00	1,550.00	MEETINGS WITH D. RICE RE OPPOSITION (.5); FINAL REVIEW OF OPPOSITION AND PERFORMING CLEAN UP AND OTHER EDITS (4.5)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	2.90	1,595.00	RESEARCH AND SYNTHESIS OF CASE LAW RE STANDARD OF REVIEW IN CONNECTION WITH MOTION TO DISBAND
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.30	715.00	REVIEW, ANALYSIS, AND SUGGESTIONS FOR REVISIONS OF DRAFT OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.50	1,977.50	REVIEW/REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION; CONFERENCES WITH G. A. CROSS, M. SCHATZOW, J. ROSE AND J. A. KARWOWSKI RE: SAME; REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SAME
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.10	1,767.00	REVIEW AND REVISE BRIEF RESPONDING TO MOTION TO DISBAND (3.1)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/20/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.80	1,305.00	ATTENTION TO OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND, INCLUDING REVIEWING AND REVISING DRAFT (1.1), CALL WITH MR. ROSE (.1), CALL WITH MR. MACWILLIAMS (.1); REVIEWING COMMENTS FROM COMMITTEE MEMBERS (.1); REVIEWING EDITS AND COMMENTS ON OPPOSITION (.4)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/21/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.20	354.00	ATTENTION TO REDLINE VERSION OF BRIEF (.2); CONFERENCES WITH J ROSE REGARDING EXHIBITS TO SAME (.6); PREPARATION OF SAME (.4)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/21/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	4.80	1,488.00	EDITS AND CLEAN UP OF OPPOSITION (3.1); MEETING WITH K. CAMUTI RE RESEARCH ON CREDITORS COMMITTEE FIDUCIARY DUTY (.1); REVIEW OF SAME (.2); REVIEW CALCULATIONS IN OPPOSITION (.2); PREPARE FOR FILING (.5); MONITOR DOCKET (.3); REVIEW BLACK HORSE FILING (.4)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/21/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.60	330.00	COMMITTEE CALL TO DISCUSS OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/21/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.30	1,864.50	REVIEW/REVIEW DRAFT OPPOSITION MEMO (1.8); CONFERENCES WITH J. A. KARWOWSKI RE: SAME (.8); CONFERENCES WITH G. A. CROSS RE: SAME (.5); REVIEW BLACKHORSE OPPOSITION (.2)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/21/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	4.60	2,622.00	RESEARCH AND REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO COMMITTEE DISBANDMENT AND CONFERENCES REGARDING SAME (4.6)

WAMU - BANKRUPTCY (117429-284635)/LITIGATION (117429-284555) JANUARY 2010

TIMEKEEPER	DATE	TASK CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS / QTY	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/21/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.50	1,087.50	REVIEWING DRAFTS AND COMMENTS RE: OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISBAND (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS RE: OPPOSITION (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. MACWILLIAMS AND MURNANE RE: STATUS AND ITEMS TO BE DONE (.2)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/22/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.90	517.50	PREVIEW MOTION TO REFORMULATE COMMITTEE (.5); CONFERENCE WITH J. ROSE RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.4)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/22/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	5.50	1,705.00	RESEARCH LARGEST EQUITY HOLDERS (.4); PREPARE HEARING BINDER (4.4); REVIEW ALL FILED RESPONSES (.7)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/22/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.10	55.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF USTEE'S FILING IN OPPOSITION TO THE MOTION TO DISBAND
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/22/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.30	165.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CREDITORS' MEMO IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISBAND
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/22/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.50	282.50	REVIEW DOCS RE: MOTION TO DISBAND COMMITTEE (.3); CONFERENCES WITH G. A. CROSS RE: SAME (.1); CONFERENCES WITH J. A. KARWOWSKI RE: SAME (.1)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/22/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	2.40	1,368.00	REVIEW ADDITIONAL RESPONSES TO DEBTOR'S MOTION TO DISBAND AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (2.4)
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/23/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.30	169.50	CONFERENCE WITH G. A. CROSS RE: HEARINGS ON MOTION TO DISBAND (.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SAME (.2)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/23/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.90	652.50	REVIEWING CREDITORS' COMMITTEE AND BLACKHORSE RESPONSES TO MOTION TO DISBAND (.8); E-MAIL TO VENABLE TEAM RE: SAME (.1)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/24/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	5.50	1,622.50	REVIEW OF BLACKHORSE RESPONSE (.4); ATTENTION TO EMAILS FROM J ROSE ABOUT ADDITIONAL RESEARCH (.1); RESEARCHED CONTINGENT FEE ARRANGEMENTS (1.7); RESEARCHED STANDARD FOR RECONSTITUTION OF EQUITY COMMITTEE (1.5); RESEARCHED PROCEDURAL ISSUE OF
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/24/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.50	855.00	SEEKING NEW RELIEF IN A RESPONSE (1.8) OUTLINE REPLY/ORAL ARGUMENT AND RESEARCH THE SAME (1.5)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/25/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.90	1,092.50	CALL WITH J. ROSE RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.4); REVIEW UNSECURED CREDITORS' MOTION RE: DISBAND (1.5)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/25/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.60	186.00	REVIEW BANK BONDHOLDERS OBJECTION (.6)
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/25/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.40	226.00	REVIEW BONDHOLDER RESPONSE (.2); CONVERSATION WITH G.A. CROSS RE: HEARINGS (.2)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/25/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	2.30		REVIEW RESPONSE FROM USJ TO MOTION TO DISBAND (.3); REVIEW BANK BONDHOLDERS REPLY (.5); REVIEW COMMITTEE STATEMENT AND RESEARCH SAME (1.5)
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/26/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.00	1,725.00	REVIEW DEBTOR AND BONDHOLDER'S REPLY (.3); PREPARE FOR ARGUMENT (2.7)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/26/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	2.20		CALL WITH J ROSE TO DISCUSS DEBTORS' REPLY (.2); REVIEW OF DEBTORS' REPLY (.4); CALL WITH J ROSE REGARDING DEBTORS' ARGUMENTS (.1); REVIEW OF LEGAL AUTHORITY CITED IN DEBTORS' REPLY BRIEF (1.5)
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/26/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.20	372.00	COMPILE NEEDED INFORMATION FOR WAMU HEARING (.6); CALL WITH J. ROSE RE SAME (.2); REVIEW TRUSTEE RESPONSE TO BLACKHORSE (.4)
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/26/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.20	110.00	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF USTEE'S OPPOSITION TO BLACK HORSE FILING

WAMU - BANKRUPTCY (117429-284635)/LITIGATION (117429-284555) JANUARY 2010

JANUARY 2010		TASK	WORK CORE	uoupo (
TIMEKEEPER	DATE	CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS / QTY	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/26/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.60	339.00	REVIEW MEMOS RE: MOTION TO DISBAND (.3); CONVERSATION WITH J.A. KARWOWSKI RE: SAME (.1); CONVERSATION WITH G. A. CROSS RE: SAME (.2)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/26/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.60	342.00	REVIEW RESPONSES TO DISBANDMENT MOTION (.6)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/26/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.50	362.50	REVIEWING FILINGS RE: MOTION TO DISBAND BY WAMU, BONDHOLDERS AND U.S. TRUSTEE
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/27/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	3.40	1,955.00	omnibus HEARING PREPARATION regarding motion to disband (3.4)
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/27/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.30	383.50	CONFERENCE WITH J ROSE REGARDING EVIDENTIARY SUPPORT FOR BOND PRICES (.1); CONFERENCES WITH J NIXDORF TO OBTAIN THE SAME (.7); RESEARCH TO OBTAIN QUOTES FOR SAME (.4); CONFERENCE WITH J ROSE TO
MACDONALD, DONALD	1/27/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	2.00	560.00	REPORT FINDINGS (.1) COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ROSE, J. NIXDORFF, AND R. KAPOOR REGARDING RESEARCH ON WAMU BOND PRICES IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING (.7); RESEARCHED WAMU BOND
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/27/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.20	113.00	PRICES (1.3) CONFERENCES WITH G. A. CROSS RE: HEARING PREPARATION
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/27/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	4.40	2,508.00	PREPARING AND RESEARCH FOR COMMITTEE DISBANDMENT ARGUMENT REGARDING TRADING ISSUES AND NEW CASE LAW (3.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. WILLINGHAM REGARDING TRADING HISTORY AND PREPARATION FOR
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/28/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	5.00	2,875.00	HEARING (.6) PREPARATION FOR AND ATTENDANCE AT HEARING ON MOTION TO DISBAND
KAPOOR, RISHI	1/28/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.20	59.00	ATTENTION TO EMAIL FROM J KARWOWSKI REGARDING STATUS OF HEARING ON MOTION TO DISBAND (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J KARWOWSKI REGARDING STANDARDS
KARWOWSKI, JULIA A.	1/28/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	3.20	992.00	OF APPROVING A SETTLEMENT (.1) PULL INFO FOR G. CROSS FOR HEARING (.5); EMAIL D. RICE RE SAME (.1); COURT CALL FOR WAMU HEARING (1.2); RESEARCH STANDARDS GOVERNING COURT APPROVAL OF COMPROMISE
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/28/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.10	55.00	(1.4) E-MAILS RE COURT'S RULING ON THE MOTION TO DISBAND
RICE, DAVID EUGENE	1/28/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.40	226.00	CONFERENCE WITH J. A. KARWOWSKI RE: HEARING PREPARATION (.2); CONFERENCE WITH G. A. CROSS RE: SAME (.2)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/28/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	6.60	3,762.00	TRAVEL TO DELAWARE AND PREPARE FOR HEARING EN ROUTE (3.2); OMNIBUS HEARING (3.4)
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/28/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	1.60	1,160.00	LISTEN BY TELEPHONE TO HEARING ON MOTION TO DISBAND
YOON, YOUNGSIK	1/28/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY	0.80	172.00	ORGANIZE COURT PAPERS PER J. ROSE
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/29/2010	B705	PROCEEDINGS CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.20	110.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH MR. CROSS RE HEARING ON MOTION TO DISBAND AND PREPARATIONS FOR EFFORTS GOING FORWARD
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/29/2010	B705	CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	3.10	1,767.00	ATTEND HEARING ON EMPLOYEE TRUST (3.1)
			TOTAL FOR CONTESTED MATTERS AND UNCATEGORIZED ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	249.20	114,891.00	

WAMU - BANKRUPTCY (117429-284635)/LITIGATION (117429-284555) JANUARY 2010

TIMEKEEPER	DATE	TASK CODE	WORK CODE/ COST TYPE	HOURS /	AMOUNT	NADDATIG
			5557 777 2	Q(I)	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
MACWILLIAMS, MICHAEL B.	1/11/2010	B716	NON-WORKING TRAVEL	1.50		RETURN TRAVEL FROM INITIAL MEETING OF OEC
SCHATZOW, MICHAEL	1/11/2010	B716	NONWORKING TRAVEL	1.50	543.75	NON-WORKING TRAVEL RETURN TO BALTIMORE FROM OFFICIAL EQUITY HOLDERS COMMITTEE MEETING
CROSS, GREGORY A.	1/28/2010	B716	NON-WORKING TRAVEL	2.00	575.00	TRAVEL TO AND FROM DELAWARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO DISBAND
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/28/2010	B716	NON-WORKING TRAVEL TOTAL FOR NON- WORKING TRAVEL	1.50 6.50	427.50 1,958.75	NONWORKING TRAVEL BACK FROM DELAWARE (1.5)
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/14/2010	B721	OTHER COURT	2.10	1,197.00	REVIEW COMPLAINTS REGARDING WAMU CLAIMS
ROSE, JORIAN L.	1/24/2010	B721	OTHER COURT LITIGATION	2.10	1,197.00	REVIEW LITIGATION COMPLAINTS REGARDING CLAIMS COMMENCED IN DC ACTION AND TX (2.1)
			TOTAL FOR OTHER COURT LITIGATION	4.20	2,394.00	COMMERCES IN SOMETION AND TAX (2.1)
FEE/HOUR TOTALS				386.90	173,648.75	

EXHIBIT C

EXPENSE SUMMARY JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

Expense Category	Total Expenses
Conferencing Services	\$290.00
Internal Reproduction Costs	\$4.50
Legal Research	\$9,848.15
Long Distance Telephone	\$5.61
Travel Expense	\$676.95
TOTAL	\$10,825.21

EXHIBIT D

DETAILED EXPENSE SUMMARY JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

DATE	EXPENSE	COST	DESCRIPTION
1/22/2010	CONFERENCING SERVICES	\$51.00	COURTCALL-J.ROSE 1/22/10
1/28/2010	CONFERENCING SERVICES	\$58.00	COURTCALL-J.ROSE 1/28/10
1/28/2010	CONFERENCING SERVICES	\$58.00	COURTCALL-J.ROSE 1/28/10
1/29/2010	CONFERENCING SERVICES	\$44.00	COURTCALL-C.CALLARI 1/29/10
1/29/2010	CONFERENCING SERVICES	\$79.00	COURTCALL - J.ROSE 1/29/10
1/29/2010	INTERNAL REPRODUCTION COSTS	\$4.50	PHOTOCOPIES MADE BY RICE, DAVID EUGENE
1/12/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$2,191.11	RISHI KAPOOR
1/13/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$309.48	RISHI KAPOOR
1/14/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$115.41	RISHI KAPOOR
1/15/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$13.61	RISHI KAPOOR
1/16/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$106.15	RISHI KAPOOR
1/18/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$725.92	RISHI KAPOOR
1/19/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$54.44	RISHI KAPOOR
1/19/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$227.50	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/20/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$292.33	RISHI KAPOOR
1/20/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$212.50	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/21/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$62.50	KENDALL CAMUTI
1/21/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$362.55	RISHI KAPOOR
1/21/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$87.50	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/22/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$62.50	JULIA KARWOWSKI

1/24/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$1,127.95	RISHI KAPOOR
1/25/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$13.61	RISHI KAPOOR
1/26/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS	\$346.77	RISHI KAPOOR
1/15/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$939.75	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/18/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$419.40	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/19/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$608.70	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/20/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$136.50	MICHAEL B. MACWILLIAMS
1/20/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$26.25	MICHAEL B. MACWILLIAMS
1/20/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$189.45	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/21/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$275.70	KENDALL A. CAMUTI
1/22/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$774.30	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/24/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$129.67	RISHI KAPOOR
1/28/2010	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW	\$36.60	JULIA KARWOWSKI
1/12/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.66	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY CROSS, GREGORY A.
1/25/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.88	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.
1/25/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.22	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.
1/27/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.33	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.
1/27/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.11	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.
1/27/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$1.32	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.
1/28/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.44	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.

·			\$12.00; TAXI \$10.00; TRAIN \$12.00; TIPS \$5.00)
1/29/2010	TRAVEL EXPENSE	\$61.95	GREGORY A. CROSS - TRAVEL TO WILMINGTON FOR HEARING ON 1/28/10 (FOOD \$22.95; PARKING
1/28/2010	TRAVEL EXPENSE	\$181.00	G.A.CROSS-WILMINGTON 1/28/10 TICKET #7715691131
1/26/2010	TRAVEL EXPENSE	\$248.00	J.L.ROSE-WILMINGTON 1/28/10 TICKET #0012613565
1/29/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.22	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.
1/29/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.44	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.
1/29/2010	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$0.99	LONG DISTANCE CALL MADE BY ROSE, JORIAN L.

EXHIBIT E

SUMMARY OF ATTORNEYS AND LEGAL ASSISTANTS RENDERING SERVICES DURING THE PERIOD JANUARY 11, 2010 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2010

Name of Professional Person	Position of the Applicant, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Total Billed Hours ¹	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Compensation Requested
Michael Schatzow	Partner for 21 years; Admitted in 1973; Litigation Division	19.00	\$725.00	\$13,231.25
Gregory A. Cross	Partner for 13 years; Admitted in 1987; Business Division	45.40	\$575.00	\$25,530.00
Andrew J. Currie	Partner for 2 years; Admitted in 1996; Business Division	0.20	\$575.00	\$115.00
Jorian L. Rose	Partner for 9 months; Admitted in 1998; Business Division	103.80	\$570.00	\$58,738.50
David E. Rice	Partner for 21 years; Admitted in 1980; Business Division	23.60	\$565.00	\$13,334.00
Michael MacWillliams	Partner for 7 years; Admitted in 1994; Litigation Division	20.80	\$550.00	\$11,027.50
Jason C. Rose	Partner for 1 year; Admitted in 1998; Litigation Division	0.70	\$495.00	\$346.50
Julia Karwowski	Associate for 2 years; Admitted in 2008; Business Division	68.10	\$310.00	\$21,111.00
Rishi Kapoor	Associate for 1 year; Admitted in 2009; Business Division	56.70	\$295.00	\$16,726.50
Donald Macdonald	Associate for 2 months; Admitted in 2010; Business Division	43.30	\$280.00	\$12,124.00

Pursuant to Del. Bankr. L.R. 2016-2(d)(viii), travel time during which no work is performed is billed at 50% of regular hourly rates. In compliance with this rule, Mr. Schatzow had 1.5 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$362.50. Mr. Cross had 2 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$287.50. Mr. Jorian Rose had 1.5 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$285.00. Mr. MacWilliams had 1.5 hours of non-working travel time billed at \$275.00.

BLENDED RATE			\$448.82	
TOTAL		386.90		\$173,648.75
Youngsik Yoon	Paralegal for 6 months	0.80	\$215.00	\$172.00
Ruth A. Lathe	Paralegal for 13 years	4.50	\$265.00	\$1,192.50

•

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, Stacy L. Newman, hereby certify that, on March 16, 2010, I caused one copy of the foregoing to be served upon the parties listed below in the manner indicated.

HAND DELIVERY

Mark D. Collins, Esq. Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A. One Rodney Square Wilmington, Delaware 19801 Joseph J. McMahon, Jr., Esq. Office of the United States Trustee for The District of Delaware 844 King Street, Suite 2207 Wilmington, Delaware 19801

David B. Stratton, Esq. Evelyn J. Meltzer, Esq. Pepper Hamilton LLP Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100 1313 N. Market Street Wilmington, DE 19801

OVERNIGHT COURIER

Washington Mutual, Inc. c/o Alvarez and Marsal 1301 Second Avenue, WMC3301 Seattle, WA 98101 Attn: John Marciel, Esq.

Fred S. Hodora, Esq. Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP One Bryant Park New York, NY 10036

Peter J. Gurfein, Esq. David P. Simonds, Esq. Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP 2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400 Los Angeles, CA 90067-3012 Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq. Brian S. Rosen, Esq. Weil Gotshal & Manges LLP 767 Fifth Avenue New York, NY 10153

Scott L. Alberino, Esq. Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP 1333 New Hampshire Avenue, NW Washington, DC 20036-1564

Stacy L. Newman (#5044)