# UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	X	
In re:	:	Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,1	:	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
	:	(Jointly Administered)
Debtors.	:	Objection Deadline: 7/14/10 at 4:00 p.m. (EDT)
	X	

SIXTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP, AS ATTORNEYS FOR THE DEBTORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FROM MARCH 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2010

Name of Applicant:	Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	Debtors and Debtors in Possession
Date of Retention:	October 30, 2008 nunc pro tunc to September 26, 2008
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	March 1, 2010 through March 31, 2010
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary	\$1,928,212.20 (80% of \$2,410,265.25)
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	<u>\$39,182.46</u>
This is a(n): X monthly interim final a	pplication.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395). The Debtors' principal offices are located at 925 Fourth Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98104.



## Prior Applications Filed:

Date Filed	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses
12/8/08	9/26/08 through 10/31/08	\$ 1,822,321.75	\$ 22,814.37
1/12/09	11/01/08 through 11/30/08	\$ 1,629,218.00	\$ 47,680.84
2/27/09	12/01/08 through 12/30/08	\$ 1,862,930.00	\$ 54,866.09
3/13/09	1/01/09 through 1/31/09	\$ 2,217,478.25	\$ 57,514.95
8/11/09	2/01/09 through 4/30/09	\$ 3,813,194.25	\$ 108,324.71
9/1/09	5/01/09 through 5/31/09	\$ 717,499.25	\$ 13,574.84
9/21/09	6/01/09 through 6/30/09	\$ 732,010.00	\$ 25,375.67
10/2/09	7/01/09 through 7/31/09	\$ 607,907.50	\$ 20,471.82
11/9/09	8/01/09 through 8/31/09	\$ 451,557.00	\$ 13,583.38
12/10/09	9/01/09 through 9/30/09	\$ 805,270.50	\$ 19,865.79
1/25/10	10/01/09 through 10/31/09	\$ 1,417,804.50	\$ 72,076.84
3/5/10	11/01/09 through 11/30/09	\$ 1,320,483.50	\$ 64,606.47
3/11/10	12/01/09 through 12/31/09	\$ 1,416,109.25	\$ 60,935.68
5/9/10	1/01/10 through 1/31/10	\$ 1,344,987.00	\$ 47,362.35
5/11/10	2/01/10 through 2/28/10	\$ 1,044,942.25	\$ 43,172.51

### COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL MARCH 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2010

NAME OF PROFESSIONAL PERSON	DEPARTMENT AND YEAR ADMITTED <sup>2</sup>	HOURLY BILLING RATE	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
PARTNERS & COUNSELS:	Position of the Applicant, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise			
Gold, Simeon	CORP – 1974	\$990.00	50.70	\$50,193.00
Goldring, Stuart J.	TAX – 1984	\$990.00	122.20	\$120,978.00
Rosen, Brian	BFR – 1985	\$975.00	331.90	\$322,286.25
Stangland, Elaine	CORP – 1978	\$900.00	9.50	\$8,550.00
Kam, Michael K.	TAX – 1987	\$900.00	3.50	\$3,150.00
Berz, David R.	LR – 1973	\$900.00	20.30	\$18,270.00
Horton Jr., William H.	TAX – 1977	\$865.00	94.30	\$81,569.50
DuPuy, Carolyn M.	TAX – 1983	\$845.00	4.00	\$3,380.00
Frongillo, Thomas C.	LR - 1982	\$845.00	80.60	\$68,107.00
Strochak, Adam P.	LR – 1993	\$845.00	2.90	\$2,450.50
Zalenski, Walter E.	LR – 1985	\$845.00	1.70	\$1,436.50
Mastando, III, John P.	LR – 1997	\$820.00	20.20	\$16,564.00
Albanese, Anthony J.	LR – 1997	\$820.00	4.40	\$3,608.00
Baer, Lawrence J. (Counsel)	LR – 1984	\$720.00	27.20	\$19,584.00
Margolis, Steven M. (Counsel)	TAX - 1990	\$720.00	104.80	\$75,456.00
Braun, Lynda M. (Counsel)	LR – 1992	\$700.00	2.30	\$1,610.00
Weinberg, Erika L. (Counsel)	CORP – 1997	\$700.00	8.50	\$5,950.00
Eskow, Lisa R. (Counsel)	LR – 1998	\$700.00	75.50	\$52,850.00
Bronson, Ardith (Counsel)	LR – 2000	\$700.00	57.80	\$40,460.00
O'Toole, Jr., Patrick J. (Counsel)	LR – 1991	\$700.00	164.60	\$115,220.00
Total Partners and Counsel			1,186.90	\$1,011,672.75

 $<sup>^2</sup>$  BFR – Business Finance & Restructuring, CORP – Corporate, LR – Litigation/Regulatory, TAX – Tax, \* Admission Pending.

NAME OF PROFESSIONAL PERSON	DEPARTMENT AND YEAR ADMITTED  Position of the Applicant,	HOURLY BILLING RATE	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
ASSOCIATES:	Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise			
Shiffman, Jonathan	LR – 2000	\$695.00	33.50	\$23,282.50
Law, Erin J.	LR - 2000	\$695.00	15.40	\$10,703.00
Sapeika, Tal S.	BFR - 2003	\$685.00	185.40	\$126,999.00
Johnson, Virginia H.	LR – 2003	\$685.00	86.40	\$59,184.00
Repash, Philip F.	LR - 2004	\$685.00	79.50	\$54,457.50
Coursant, Caroline S.	TAX - 2003	\$665.00	1.00	\$665.00
Petherbridge, Vaughan	CORP - 2003	\$665.00	57.10	\$37,971.50
DiBlasi, Kelly	BFR – 2005	\$630.00	261.80	\$164,587.50
Venditti, Daniel J.	LR - 2005	\$630.00	29.10	\$18,333.00
Wright, Miles J.	LR - 2005	\$630.00	20.60	\$12,978.00
Ng, Alexander W.	LR – 2006	\$595.00	33.70	\$20,051.50
Santillan, Aida P.	TAX - 2007	\$595.00	58.60	\$34,867.00
Levine, Alexander	LR – 2006	\$595.00	156.60	\$93,177.00
Wencelblat, Patricia	LR - 2006	\$595.00	8.40	\$4,998.00
Wine, Jennifer L.	LR - 2007	\$550.00	5.10	2,805.00
Gurdian, Julio C.	BFR - 2007	\$550.00	29.30	\$16,115.00
Mishkin, Jessie B.	LR – 2006	\$550.00	75.20	\$41,360.00
Chandis, Vanessa	LR - 2006	\$550.00	97.30	\$53,515.00
Pohl, Joshua	TAX - 2007	\$550.00	67.90	\$37,345.00
Kovacs, Eva	TAX – 2009	\$515.00	74.00	\$38,110.00
Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	LR - 2007	\$515.00	50.10	\$25,801.50
Quinn, Georgia D.	CORP - 2008	\$515.00	71.50	\$36,822.50
Cloutier, Lisa N.	LR - 2008	\$515.00	5.90	\$3,038.50
Miller, Brandon E.	LR - 2009	\$515.00	29.20	- \$15,038.00
Tang, Amie	CORP - 2008	\$515.00	25.90	\$13,338.50
Sagot, Jonathan L.	CORP - 2008	\$455.00	7.10	\$3,230.50
Castellani, Anne K.	LR – 2009	\$455.00	33.10	\$15,060.50
Coleman, Erica	BFR – 2009	\$455.00	106.90	\$48,639.50
Yates, Erin K.	LR - 2009	\$455.00	55.50	\$25,252.50

Total Associates			2,426.80	\$1,324,948.00
Mills, Marvin	BFR-*	\$395.00	98.60	\$38,947.00
Vaishnav, Neil H.	LR – *	\$395.00	90.60	\$35,787.00
Enayati, Robert	CORP – *	\$395.00	21.90	\$8,650.50
Costa, Jessica	LR - 2010	\$395.00	50.10	\$19,789.50
Sherman, Rachel B.	LR – 2009	\$455.00	51.70	\$23,523.50
Turner, Kim P.	LR - 2009	\$455.00	14.20	\$6,461.00
Veit, Cheri	LR - 2009	\$455.00	57.00	\$25,935.00
Desai, Kavita C.	LR – 2009	\$455.00	46.20	\$21,021.00
Sharma, Rahul K.	BFR - 2009	\$455.00	212.10	\$96,505.50
Hatcher, R. Todd T.	TAX - 2009	\$455.00	14.90	\$6,779.50
Benfield, Brianna	LR - 2009	\$455.00	8.40	\$3,822.00

NAME OF PROFESSIONAL  Paralegals, Clerks, Library Staff and Other Non-Legal Staff:	DEPARTMENT AND YEAR ADMITTED  Position of the Applicant, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	HOURLY BILLING RATE	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Lee, Kathleen	BFR	\$275.00	37.90	\$10,422.50
Fuller, Deidre E.	LR	\$260.00	1.50	\$390.00
Hausman, Jeffrie	LR	\$260.00	1.10	\$286.00
Roberts, Sarah B.	BFR	\$230.00	6.50	\$1,495.00
Maravilla, Mel C.	CORP	\$225.00	4.50	\$1,012.50
Chan, Herbert	LR	\$215.00	4.00	\$860.00
Aliseo, Nicole K.	BFR	\$210.00	5.60	\$1,176.00
Chettri, Anupama	LR	\$200.00	3.10	\$620.00
Potter, Lougran	LR	\$200.00	31.30	\$6,260.00
Amponsah, Duke	BFR	\$200.00	21.90	\$4,380.00
Leonard, Sarah A.	LR	\$200.00	51.20	\$10,240.00
Losick, Merill	Library	\$195.00	4.80	\$936.00
McLaughlin, Daniel F.	Library	\$195.00	3.80	\$741.00
Castillero, Francene S.	LR	\$190.00	36.70	\$6,973.00
Forrestier, Ashley R.	LR	\$180.00	6.50	\$1,170.00
Ialuna, Sabrina M.	LR	\$180.00	43.70	\$7,866.00

Total Paraprofessionals			369.80	\$73,644.50
Cruz, Luis	Library	\$135.00	1.50	\$202.50
Mulligan, Deidra M.	Library	\$140.00	1.10	\$154.00
Carmant, Marie J.	Library	\$145.00	2.80	\$406.00
Wilmer, Andrea	BFR	\$180.00	2.50	\$450.00
Axon, Hillary A.	LR	\$180.00	64.00	\$11,520.00
Swaney, Nicole	LR	\$180.00	26.30	\$4,734.00
Van Kampen, Allison L.	LR	\$180.00	7.50	\$1,350.00

PROFESSIONALS	BLENDED RATE	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	TOTAL COMPENSATION
TOTALS:			
Partners and Counsel	\$852.37	1,186.90	\$1,011,672.75
Associates	\$545.97	2,426.80	\$1,324,948.00
Paraprofessionals	\$199.15	369.80	\$73,644.50
Total Fees Incurred		3,983.50	\$2,410,265.25
Blended Attorney Rate	\$646.60		
Grand Total Fees Requested		3,983.50	\$2,410,265.25

# COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY MARCH 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2010

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	Bankruptcy-General Administration Issues		
11100	General Case Administration	49.00	\$12,046.00
11150	Statement of Financial Affairs/Schedules of		
	Assets and Liabilities	3.30	\$1,493.50
11160	Monthly Operating Reports	2.10	\$1,542.50
11170	Agenda Letter	5.00	\$2,669.50
11180	Internal Document Management	0.00	\$0.00
11190	Non-Working Travel	3.80	\$1,662.75
11200	General Case Strategy	30.10	\$18,870.00
	Bankruptcy Meetings and Communications		
12100	General Communications	1.60	\$1,120.00
12200	Creditors Committee		** * **
	Communications/Meetings	2.60	\$1,778.50
12250	Equity Committee Issues	3.80	\$3,609.50
12300	Bankruptcy Court Communication	0.00	\$0.00
12400	United States Trustee Communications	0.30	\$136.50
12500	WaMu Team Meetings	40.20	\$24,811.00
12600	General Hearing Attendance	6.00	\$1,455.50
	Bankruptcy – Retention and Compensation		
	Issues		
13200	Retention – WGM	4.70	\$1,292.50
13300	Retention - Other Professionals	4.70	\$2,234.50
13400	Billing/Fee Applications – WGM	63.00	\$23,988.00
13500	Billing/Fee Applications – Other Professionals	14.00	\$4,915.00
	Bankruptcy – Executory Contract Issues	0.00	\$0.00
14200	Real Property Leases	0.00	\$0.00
14400	Personal Property Leases	0.40	\$220.00
14500	Executory Contracts	20.70	\$11,422.00
	Bankruptcy – Claims Issues	0.00	\$0.00
15100	General Claims Matters	4.00	\$2,520.00
15200	Bar Date	0.00	\$0.00
15500	General Secured Claims Issues	0.00	\$0.00
15600	Claims Processing/Reconciliation	19.50	\$12,252.00
15700	Claims Determination/ Litigation	1,814.80	\$983,809.00
15800	Administrative Claim Matters	0.00	\$0.00
	Bankruptcy – Plan Issues	0.00	\$0.00
16100	General Plan Issues	0.00	\$0.00
16200	Exclusivity	0.00	\$0.00
16300	Business Plan	0.00	\$0.00
16400	Plan Formulation	452.40	\$323,767.50
16500	Disclosure Statement	395.10	\$243,873.00
16600	Solicitation Process/Ballots/Voting	17.90	\$8,294.50
16700	Confirmation Process	0.00	\$0.00
17200	General Litigation//Governmental Investigations	0.00	\$0.00

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	Litigation – Bankruptcy/Adversary		
	Proceedings		
18000	General Bankruptcy Litigation Issues	13.40	\$6,782.50
	Litigation – Non-Bankruptcy Litigation		
19000	General Non-Bankruptcy Litigation Issues	50.00	\$27,443.00
19100	BUUS Litigation	115.20	\$66,451.00
19200	Goodwill Litigation – General	0.00	\$0.00
19210	American Savings Litigation	2.90	\$1,638.00
19220	Anchor Savings Litigation	0.20	\$195.00
	J. P. Morgan Issues		A 10 1 0 10 TO
21000	General JPM Issues	546.20	\$436,968.50
21100	Deposit Account Issues	0.00	\$0.00
21200	Information Access	0.00	\$0.00
21400	Vendor Stipulation	0.30	\$292.50
21500	Rabbi Trust Analysis	0.00	\$0.00
21600	Setoff Analysis	0.00	\$0.00
	Assets Sales		
22100	General Asset Sales, Recovery and Analysis		***
	Issues	0.00	\$0.00
22200	Strategic Capital Fund Sales	0.00	\$0.00
22300	REIT Trust Preferred	0.00	\$0.00
	Governmental/Regulatory Issues	0.00	\$0.00
23100	General Governmental/Regulatory Issues	0.20	\$195.00
23200	Bankruptcy/Regulatory Interaction Issues	0.00	\$0.00
	Tax		
24100	General Tax Issues	56.20	\$42,724.00
24200	NOL and Claims Trading Motion	11.50	\$6,903.50
24400	Tax Structuring of Plan	21.30	\$16,405.00
24500	IRS Proof of Claim	0.80	\$504.00
	Employees		<u> </u>
25100	General Employee Issues	1.90	\$1,306.50
25200	Pension Plan Issues	1.40	\$975.00
25210	Cash Balance Plan	1.50	\$1,063.50
25220	Non-Qualified Plans	100.40	\$52,993.00
25230	401(K) Plan	0.00	\$0.00
25240	Employee Medical Plan	0.20	\$144.00
	Corporate Issues		ΦΕ C11 ΔΔ
26100	General Corporate Issues	10.30	\$5,641.00
26200	Securities Issues	10.20	\$7,924.50
26300	Corporate Governance and Board-Related		<b>#1.045.00</b>
	Issues	3.80	\$1,945.00
26400	Corporate Communications/Filings	7.50	\$2,419.50
	Insurance		A00 100 00
27100	General Insurance Matters	55.70	\$33,139.00
27200	D&O Insurance	11.70	\$5,553.50
27300	Aon Analysis	0.00	\$0.00
27400	BOLI/COLI Policies	0.00	\$0.00
	Other Matters		ΦΩΠΕ <b>Ε</b> Δ
28100	General Business Issues	1.70	\$875.50
28200	Non-Debtor Issues	0.00	\$0.00
28210	WM Mortgage Reinsurance Company, Inc.	0.00	\$0.00

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
28400	Automatic Stay Issues	0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL		3,983.50	\$2,410,265.25

### EXPENSE SUMMARY MARCH 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2010

EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Domestic Travel/Domestic Travel Meals	\$2,797.90
Local Transportation	\$2,084.58
Document Processing	\$0.00
Special Secretarial Services	\$0.00
Meals	\$2,751.24
Postage	\$55.19
Air Courier/Express Mail	\$252.89
Facsimile	\$0.00
Duplicating – Firm	\$5,764.90
Duplicating – Outside	\$1,608.94
Corporation Services	\$0.00
Filing Fees	\$0.00
Edgar Filings	\$270.00
Computerized Research	\$20,311.09
Court Reporting	\$0.00
Online News Monitoring/News Watch and Clipping Service	\$0.00
Outside Document Service Bureau	\$0.00
Business Meals	\$0.00
Meetings and Conference Meals	\$3,285.73
Total Expenses Requested	\$39,182.46

# UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	Х	
	*	
In re:		Chapter 11
	:	
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1	:	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
	:	
	:	(Jointly Administered)
Debtors.	:	
	:	Objection Deadline: 7/14/10 at 4:00 p.m. (EDT)
	Y	

SIXTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP, AS ATTORNEYS FOR THE DEBTORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FROM MARCH 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2010

Pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the "Local Rules"), the United States Trustee Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 issued by the Executive Office for United States Trustees (the "Guidelines"), the Court's Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Docket No. 204], and the Amended Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Docket No. 302] (the "Administrative Order"), Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP ("WG&M"), counsel for Washington Mutual, Inc. ("WMI") and

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395). The Debtors' principal offices are located at 925 Fourth Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98104.

WMI Investment Corp., as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "<u>Debtors</u>"), hereby files this sixteenth monthly application (the "<u>Application</u>") for allowance of compensation for professional services rendered and for reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection with WG&M's representation of the Debtors for the period commencing March 1, 2010 through and including March 31, 2010 (the "<u>Compensation Period</u>"). In support of this Application, WG&M respectfully represents as follows:

#### **Background**

- 1. On September 26, 2008 (the "Commencement Date"), each of the Debtors commenced with this Court a voluntary case pursuant to chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code.

  The Debtors are authorized to continue to operate their businesses and manage their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. On October 3, 2008, the Court entered an order, pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b), authorizing the joint administration of the Debtors' chapter 11 cases.
- 2. On October 15, 2008, the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware (the "<u>U.S. Trustee</u>") appointed an official committee of unsecured creditors (the "<u>Creditors'</u> Committee"). On January 11, 2010, the U.S. Trustee appointed an official committee of equity security holders (the "<u>Equity Committee</u>").
- 3. During the October 30, 2008 hearing before the Court, and by order, dated November 11, 2008 [Docket No. 244] (the "Retention Order"), the Court approved the Debtors' application to employ and retain WG&M as counsel for the Debtors <u>nunc pro tunc</u> to the Commencement Date. The Retention Order authorizes WG&M to be compensated on an hourly basis and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses, in accordance with

sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, the Guidelines, and the Administrative Order.

4. Similarly, by order, dated October 31, 2008 [Docket No. 203], the Court approved the employment and retention of Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A. ("RL&F") as cocounsel for the Debtors. WG&M and RL&F have divided responsibilities regarding representation of the Debtors and have made every effort to avoid and/or minimize unnecessary duplication of efforts in these chapter 11 cases.

# Summary of Professional Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Requested

- 5. By this Application, WG&M requests allowance of \$2,410,265.25 as compensation for professional services rendered during the Compensation Period and \$39,182.46 as reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred by WG&M during the Compensation Period. All services for which compensation is requested by WG&M were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.
- 6. WG&M has received no payment and no promise of payment from any source for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with the matters covered during the Compensation Period and addressed by this Application. There is no agreement or understanding between WG&M and any other person, other than members of the firm, for the sharing of compensation to be received for services rendered in these cases.
- 7. The fees charged by WG&M in these cases are billed in accordance with its existing billing rates and procedures in effect during the Compensation Period. The rates WG&M charges for the services rendered by its professionals and paraprofessionals in these chapter 11 cases are the same rates WG&M charges for professional and paraprofessional services rendered in comparable non-bankruptcy related matters. Such fees are reasonably based

on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in comparable nonbankruptcy cases in a competitive national legal market.

- 8. WG&M maintains computerized records of the time spent by all WG&M attorneys and paraprofessionals in connection with its representation of the Debtors. Subject to redaction where necessary to preserve the attorney-client privilege, annexed hereto as <a href="Exhibit">Exhibit "A"</a> are copies of WG&M's itemized time records for professionals and paraprofessionals who performed services for the Debtors during the Compensation Period. All entries itemized in WG&M's time records comply with the requirements set forth in Local Rule 2016-2 and the Guidelines, including the use of separate work codes for different project types, as hereinafter described.
- 9. Annexed hereto as <u>Exhibit "B"</u> are WG&M's itemized records detailing expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors during the Compensation Period. All entries itemized in WG&M's expense records comply with the requirements set forth in Local Rule 2016-2 and the Guidelines.
- 10. I have read this Application and, to the best of my knowledge, it complies with sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, and the applicable sections of the Bankruptcy Rules, Local Rule 2016-2, the Guidelines and the Administrative Order.

#### **Summary of Services**

11. The following is a summary of the significant professional services rendered by WG&M during the Compensation Period. This summary is organized in accordance with the internal system of work codes set up by WG&M at the outset of these chapter 11 cases, as reflected on pages vii-viii of this Application. Only those work codes for which ten or more hours of work was performed during the Compensation Period are listed below.

a. <u>General Case Administration (Task Code 11100)</u> Fees: \$12,046.00; Hours: 49.0

This category includes matters relating to, without limitation, maintenance of case calendars and task lists, circulation of recently filed pleadings and legal cases, review of and communications about pending issues, organization of files and case binders, and general document review.

b. <u>General Case Strategy (Task Code 11200)</u> Fees: \$18,870.00; Hours: 30.1

This category relates to meetings and other communications among WG&M employees, the Debtors, and Alvarez & Marsal ("A&M"), relating to overall case strategy, status, and pending issues.

c. WaMu Team Meetings (Task Code 12500) Fees: \$24,811.00; Hours: 40.2

This category relates to WG&M team meetings pertaining to ongoing issues and projects, case status and strategy updates.

d. <u>Billing/Fee Applications - WGM (Task Code 13400)</u> Fees: \$23,988.00; Hours: 63.0

This category includes the review of attorney and paraprofessional billing entries in accordance with the Guidelines and preparation of WG&M's twelfth, thirteenth, fourteenth, and fifteenth monthly fee applications, and third interim fee application.

e. <u>Billing/Fee Applications - Other Professionals (Task Code 13500)</u> Fees: \$4,915.00; Hours: 14.0

This category includes the review of other professionals' monthly fee applications, the preparation of an objection to the first and second fee applications of the counsel for the Equity Committee, and communications among WG&M employees, the Debtors, and A&M regarding the foregoing.

f. Executory Contract Issues - WGM (Task Code 14500) Fees: \$11,422.00; Hours: 20.7

This category relates to the review of the Debtors' executory contracts, the preparation of notices of rejection thereof, and related communications among WG&M employees, the Debtors, and A&M.

g. General Claims Matters (Task Code 15100) / Claims Processing/ Reconciliation (Task Code 15600) Fees: \$14,772.00; Hours: 23.50

These categories include the analysis of claims asserted by various creditors against the Debtors, particularly with respect to the application of legal and contractual subordination provisions.

h. <u>Claims Determination/Litigation (Task Code 15700)</u> Fees: \$983,809.00; Hours: 1,814.8

This category relates to the review and analysis of claims filed against the Debtors to which the Debtors filed or intend to file responsive pleadings; the review of documents related thereto; the research and drafting of various claims objections, stipulations, and responses in connection therewith; the preparation of discovery and declarations in support of and orders approving claims objections; the preparation for hearings on claims objections previously filed; as well as communications with WG&M employees, the Debtors, A&M, counsel for claimants, and the Creditors' Committee's professionals regarding the foregoing.

i. Plan Formulation (Task Code 16400) Fees: \$323,767.50; Hours: 452.4

This category includes numerous discussions with WG&M employees, the Debtors, A&M, the Creditors' Committee's professionals, and other parties in interest regarding the formulation of a chapter 11 plan, research of issues in connection therewith, and the preparation and filing of the Debtors' chapter 11 plan.

j. <u>Disclosure Statement (Task Code 16500)</u> Fees: \$243,873.00; Hours: 395.10

This category includes the preparation of a disclosure statement for the Debtors' chapter 11 plan and communications with WG&M employees, the Debtors, A&M, and various third parties regarding the foregoing.

k. <u>Solicitation Process/Ballots/Voting (Task Code 16600)</u> Fees: \$8,294.50; Hours: 17.9

This category includes matters relating to the preparation of ballots and exhibits to the Debtors' motion to approve their disclosure statement, reviewing and revising the notice of the hearing on the disclosure statement for the Debtors' chapter 11 plan, and communications regarding the foregoing with WG&M employees and the Debtors' noticing agent.

l. <u>General Bankruptcy Litigation Issues (Task Code 18000)</u> Fees: \$6,782.50; Hours: 13.4

This category includes matters relating to bankruptcy litigation and includes, without limitation, reviewing and analyzing issues related to pending adversary proceedings, and communications and meetings regarding the foregoing with WG&M employees, the Debtors, A&M, and co-counsel.

m. <u>General Non-Bankruptcy Litigation Issues (Task Code 19000)</u> Fees: \$27,443.00; Hours: 50.0

This category relates to communications and tasks regarding non-bankruptcy litigation involving the Debtors and includes, without limitation, reviewing and responding to documents served on the Debtors, advising the Debtors on issues related to stayed and non-stayed non-bankruptcy proceedings, and researching issues arising from the foregoing.

n. <u>Buus Litigation (Task Code 19100)</u> Fees: \$66,451.00; Hours: 115.2

This category relates to the Buus ERISA class action litigation pending in the United States District Court for the Western District of Washington and includes, without limitation, preparation of a settlement agreement relating to the litigation and a motion for approval thereof, research in connection with the payment of attorneys' fees, and communications regarding the foregoing with the Debtors' defense counsel at Sidley Austin LLP, counsel to the named plaintiffs in the Buus ERISA litigation, A&M, and counsel to the Creditors' Committee.

o. <u>General JPM Issues (Task Code 21000)</u> Fees: \$436,968.50; Hours: 546.2

This category relates to work performed in connection with a settlement agreement to resolve claims among the Debtors, JPMorgan Chase Bank, National Association ("JPMorgan"), the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation (the "FDIC"), and other key creditor constituencies, and includes the drafting and negotiation of a proposed settlement agreement and communications regarding the foregoing with WG&M employees, the Debtors, A&M, Quinn Emmanuel Urquhart Oliver & Hedges, LLP (the Debtors' special litigation counsel), counsel to the Creditors' Committee, counsel to JPMorgan, counsel to the FDIC, and counsel to other key creditor constituencies.

p. General Tax Issues (Task Code 24100) Fees: \$42,724.00; Hours: 56.2

This category includes matters relating to the analysis of general state and federal tax issues, and the review of documents in connection therewith. In connection with the foregoing, WG&M participated in numerous conferences with WG&M employees, the Debtors, A&M, and various other professionals.

q. NOL and Claims Trading Motion (Task Code 24200) Fees: \$6,903.50; Hours: 11.5

This category includes matters relating to the preservation of the Debtors' net operating losses and other tax attributes, and includes, without limitation, the research and analysis of certain tax issues.

r. <u>Tax Structuring of Plan (Task Code 24400)</u> Fees: \$16,405.00; Hours: 21.3

This category includes research and analysis of the tax law aspects of the preparation of the Debtors' chapter 11 plan, including communications with WG&M employees, the Debtors, A&M, counsel to the Creditors' Committee, and other professionals regarding the foregoing.

s. Non-Qualified Plans (Task Code 25220) Fees: \$52,993.00; Hours: 100.4

This category includes matters relating to the review and analysis of the Debtors' non-qualified employee benefit plans and insurance policies, primarily including efforts to liquidate assets related to certain deferred compensation plans and the preparation of documents with respect thereto, including but not limited to settlement agreements with certain plan participants and a motion seeking approval thereof.

t. General Corporate Issues (Task Code 26100) Fees: \$5,641.00; Hours: 10.3

This category includes work done in connection with general corporate issues, including the preparation and review of non-disclosure agreements and communications with WG&M employees and the financial advisor for the Equity Committee regarding the same.

u. Securities Issues (Task Code 26200) Fees: \$7,924.50; Hours: 10.2

This category relates to work performed in connection with securities transfer issues and communications among WG&M employees and other professionals regarding the same.

v. General Insurance Matters (Task Code 27100) Fees: \$33,139.00; Hours: 55.7

This category includes issues relating to insurance held by the Debtors, including, but not limited to, a review of the Debtors' various insurance policies, analysis of requests for advancement of funds, a review of insurance issues related to the BKK and ERISA litigations, and the negotiation of settlements with JPMorgan, Zurich Insurance Company and Old Republic Insurance Company.

w. <u>D&O Insurance (Task Code 27200)</u> Fees: \$5,553.50; Hours: 11.7

This category includes matters relating to the Debtors' directors and officers' liability insurance policies.

- 12. The foregoing professional services performed by WG&M were

  (a) necessary and appropriate to the administration of the Debtors' chapter 11 cases, (b) in the best interests of the Debtors and their estates, and (c) provided without unnecessary duplication of effort or expense incurred by professionals and paraprofessionals employed by RL&F.

  Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, issues, or tasks involved. The professional services were performed with expedition and in an efficient manner.
- 13. A significant percentage of services performed by members, counsel, and associates of WG&M were rendered by the Business Finance and Restructuring Department.

WG&M has a preeminent practice in this area and enjoys a national reputation for its expertise in financial reorganizations and restructurings of troubled entities, with approximately 80 attorneys specializing in this area of law. WG&M has been actively involved in major chapter 11 cases, and currently represents or has represented, among others, the following debtors: General Motors Corporation; Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc.; Enron Corp.; Uno Restaurant Holdings Corp.; BearingPoint, Inc.; SemGroup L.P.; Extended Stay Inc.; Magna Entertainment Group; Finlay Enterprises, Inc.; LandSource Communities Development LLC; Vertis Holdings, Inc.; PRC, LLC; Charys Holding Co., Inc. and Crochet & Borel Services, Inc.; Sharper Image Corporation; Silicon Graphics, Inc.; Atkins Nutritionals, Inc.; Footstar, Inc.; New World Pasta Company; Parmalat USA Corp.; Loral Space & Communications Ltd.; TL Administration Corporation; Republic Engineered Product Holdings; WestPoint Stevens Inc.; Worldcom, Inc.; Adelphia Business Solutions, Inc.; APW Ltd.; Agway, Inc.; Formica Corp.; and Global Crossing Ltd. As a consequence, WG&M brings to these cases a high level of expertise and experience that inures to the benefit of the Debtors and all parties in interest.

- 14. Professional services performed by WG&M on behalf of the Debtors during the Compensation Period required an aggregate expenditure of 3,983.5 recorded hours by WG&M's members, counsel, associates, and paraprofessionals. Of the aggregate time expended, 1,186.9 recorded hours were expended by partners and counsel of WG&M, 2,426.8 recorded hours were expended by associates, and 369.8 recorded hours were expended by paraprofessionals of WG&M.
- 15. During the Compensation Period, WG&M's hourly billing rates for attorneys ranged from \$395 to \$990 per hour. Allowance of compensation in the amount requested would result in a blended hourly rate for attorneys of approximately \$646.60 (based

upon 3,613.7 recorded hours at WG&M's regular billing rates in effect at the time of the performance of services).<sup>3</sup>

### Actual and Necessary Disbursements of WG&M

- 16. Annexed hereto as Exhibit "B" are WG&M's itemized records detailing expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors during the Compensation Period. WG&M requests allowance of actual and necessary expenses incurred by WG&M during the Compensation Period in the aggregate amount of \$39,182.46.
- actual cost or an estimated actual cost when the actual cost is difficult to determine. For example, with respect to duplication charges, WG&M will charge \$.10 per page because the actual cost is difficult to determine. Similarly, as it relates to computerized research, WG&M believes that it does not make a profit on that service as a whole although the cost of any particular search is difficult to ascertain. Other reimbursable expenses (whether the service is performed by WG&M in-house or through a third party vendor) include, but are not limited to, facsimiles, toll calls, overtime, overtime meals, deliveries, court costs, cost of food at meetings, transcript fees, travel, and clerk fees. Notably, WG&M charges all of its clients \$1.00/page for out-going facsimile transmissions and does not charge its clients for incoming facsimile transmissions, and all travel expenses are billed at coach fare rates.

#### Reservation

18. To the extent time or disbursement charges for services rendered or disbursements incurred relate to the Compensation Period but were not processed prior to the

 $<sup>^3</sup>$  The blended attorney rate was calculated using total attorney compensation of \$2,336,620.75 and total attorney hours billed of 3,613.7.

preparation of this Application, or WG&M has for any other reason not sought compensation or reimbursement of expenses herein with respect to any services rendered or expenses incurred during the Compensation Period, WG&M reserves the right to request additional compensation for such services and reimbursement of such expenses in a future application.

#### Notice

Notice of this Application has been provided to: (i) the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware; (ii) counsel for the Creditors' Committee; (iii) counsel for the Equity Committee; and (iv) parties entitled to receive notice in these chapter 11 cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2002. In light of the nature of the relief requested, the Debtors submit that no other or further notice need be provided.

#### Conclusion

WHEREFORE WG&M respectfully requests (i) allowance of compensation for professional services rendered to the Debtors during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$2,410,265.25 (80% of which equals \$1,928,212.20) and reimbursement for actual and necessary costs and expenses incurred by WG&M during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$39,182.46 for a total of \$2,449,447.71, (ii) that, in accordance with the Administrative Order, the Court direct the Debtors to pay WG&M \$1,967,394.66, representing 80% of the total amount of fees and 100% of the expenses allowed, (iii) that the allowance of such compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred be without prejudice to WG&M's right to seek such further compensation for the full value of services performed and expenses incurred, and (iv) that the Court grant WG&M such other and further relief as is just.

Dated: New York, New York June 23, 2010

Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq.

Brian S. Rosen, Esq.

WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP

767 Fifth Avenue

New York, NY 10153

Telephone: (212) 310-8000 Facsimile: (212) 310-8007

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

#### **VERIFICATION**

STATE OF NEW YORK

) s.s.:

COUNTY OF NEW YORK

Ś

Brian S. Rosen, after being duly sworn according to law, deposes and says as follows:

(a) I am a member with the applicant firm, Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, and have been admitted to appear before this Court.

(b) I have personally performed many of the legal services rendered by Weil,
Gotshal & Manges LLP, as counsel to the Debtors, and am thoroughly familiar with the other
work performed on behalf of the Debtors by the lawyers in the firm.

(c) I have reviewed the foregoing Application, and the facts set forth therein are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief. Moreover, I have reviewed Local Rule 2016-2 and submit that the Application substantially complies with such rule.

Brian S. Rosen, Esq.

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED before me this 24 th day of June, 2010

Notary Public

My Commission Expires:

KATHLEEN ANNE LEE
Notary Public, State of New York
No. 01LE6119251
Qualified in New York County
Commission Expires November 29, 2012

# IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	Х	
	:	
In re	•	Chapter 11
	:	
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al., 1	:	
	:	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
	:	
	:	
Debtors.	•	(Jointly Administered)
	:	
	X	Obj. Deadline: 7/14/10 at 4:00 p.m. (EDT)

#### NOTICE OF SIXTEENTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION OF WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (the "Debtors") have today filed the attached Sixteenth Monthly Application of Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP for Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and for Reimbursement of Actual and Necessary Expenses Incurred as Co-Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession for the Period from March 1, 2010 through March 31, 2010 (the "Application") with the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 824 Market Street, 3rd Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (the "Bankruptcy Court").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application must be made in accordance with the Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the "Administrative Order") dated October 30, 2008 [Docket No. 204] and the Revised Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals dated November 14, 2008 ("Revised Administrative Order") (the Administrative Order and Revised

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number are: (i) Washington Mutual, Inc. (3725); and (ii) WMI Investment Corp. (5395). The Debtors' principal offices are located at 925 Fourth Avenue, Seattle, Washington 98104.

Administrative Order are collectively, the "Administrative Order"), must be filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 824 North Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, and be served upon and received by: (i) the Debtors, Washington Mutual, Inc., c/o Alvarez and Marsal, 1301 Second Avenue, WMC3301, Seattle, WA 98101, (Attn: John Maciel, Esq.); (ii) counsel to the Debtors, Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153 (Attn: Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq. and Brian S. Rosen, Esq.); (iii) cocounsel to the Debtors, Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A., One Rodney Square, P.O. Box 551, Wilmington, Delaware 19899 (Attn: Mark D. Collins, Esq.); (iv) Office of the U.S. Trustee, District of Delaware, J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, 844 King Street, Suite 2313, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Joseph J. McMahon, Jr., Esq.); (v) the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP, One Bryant Park, New York, NY 10036, (Attn: Fred S. Hodara, Esq.); Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP, 1333 New Hampshire Avenue, N.W. (Attn: Scott L. Alberino, Esq.); Akin Grump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP, 2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400, Los Angeles, California 90067-3012 (Attn: Peter J. Gurfein, Esq. and David P. Simonds, Esq.); and Pepper Hamilton LLP, Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100, 1313 N. Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: David B. Stratton, Esq. and Evelyn J. Meltzer, Esq.) (collectively, the "Notice Parties") so as to be received no later than July 14, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (EDT) (the "Objection Deadline"). Only those objections that are timely filed, served, and received will be considered by the Court.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that if no objections are received by the Notice Parties prior to the Objection Deadline, in accordance with the Administrative Order the Applicant may be paid an amount equal to the lesser of (i) 80 percent of the fees and 100 percent of expenses requested in the Application or (ii) 80 percent of the fees and 100 percent of the

expenses not subject to an objection without the need for further order of the Bankruptcy Court.

If an objection is properly filed and served and such objection is not otherwise resolved, or the Court determines that a hearing should be held in respect of the Application, a hearing will be held at a time convenient to the Court. Only those objections made in writing and timely filed, served, and received in accordance with the Administrative Order will be considered by the

Court at the hearing.

Dated: June 24, 2010 Wilmington, Delaware Respectfully submitted,

Mark D. Collins (No. 2981)

Chun I. Jang (No. 4790)

Julie A. Finocchiaro (No. 5303)

RICHARDS, LAYTON & FINGER, P.A.

One Rodney Square 920 North King Street

Wilmington, DE 19801

Telephone: (302) 651-7700 Facsimile: (302) 651-7701

- and -

Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq. Brian S. Rosen, Esq. Michael F. Walsh, Esq. WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP 767 Fifth Avenue New York, New York 10153

Telephone: (212) 310-8000 Facsimile: (212) 310-8007

Attorneys for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

## Exhibit A

#### ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79831.0003 - PROJECT SONIC

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/01/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.50	\$ 100.00	11100	20130424
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/01/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.80	160.00	11100	20132450
SEND K	DIBLASI PLAN FILED IN CLASSIC CABLE	CASE.			
03/01/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.80	160.00	11100	20132458
UPDAT	E DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE TO TEAM (.3);	UPDATE CALENDAR	AND DISTRIBUTE	ETO TEAM (.5	).
03/02/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20130771
	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/02/10	Amponsah, Duke	1.10	220.00	11100	20163090
	N PLEADINGS FOR M. MILLS (.4); UPDATE D				
PLEADI	INGS FOR N. SWANEY (.3).				
03/03/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.10	72.00	11100	20270421
EMAIL	S TO/FROM P. REPASH RE: MOTION FOR AD	MISSION PRO HAC V	ICE.		
03/03/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.80	504.00	11100	20118840
EMAIL	S RE: PENDING ISSUES AND STATUS UPDA	TE.			
03/03/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.50	100.00	11100	20134114
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/03/10	Losick, Merill	0.40	78.00	11100	20131115
RESEA	RCH RE: TRACKING WARRANTS.				
03/04/10	Baer, Lawrence	0,30	216.00	11100	20272771
EMAIL	S FROM D. SLOAN RE: MOTIONS FOR ADMI		E (.2); EMAIL FROM	M P. REPASH	
RE: SAI	ME (.1).				
03/04/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	11100	20121367
REVIE	W DOCKET UPDATES.				
03/04/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.30	60.00	11100	20134115
CIRCU	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/04/10	McLaughlin, Daniel	1.00	195.00	11100	20259884
RESEA	RCH RE: VOLUNTARY PAYMENTS.				
03/04/10	McLaughlin, Daniel	1.40	273.00	11100	20259886
	RCH RE: INVOLUNT ARY FORECLOSURES.				
03/04/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	11100	20166215
	TE DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE TO TEAM.	V	54,40	~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~	
02/05/10	Loopard Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20134116
03/05/10 CIRCU	Leonard, Sarah  LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.	U.4U	80.00	11100	20134110
	,		100 50	11100	20124025
03/05/10	Turner, Kim	0.90	409.50	11100	20126032

#### ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79831.00 03 - PRO JECT SONIC

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEV	V NEW DOCKET ENTRIES AND CIRCULA'	TING ENTRIES.			
03/05/10 OBTAIN	Cruz, Luis N DOCKET AND DISMISSAL OF CLAIMS F	0.90 FOR S. LEONARD.	121.50	11100	20245566
03/05/10	Amponsah, Duke E DOCKET.	0.30	60.00	11100	20166330
03/06/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.50	945.00	11100	20127078
REVIEV 03/08/10	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS AND UPDA  DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	11100	20133328
REVIEV 03/08/10	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: PENDIN  Leonard, Sarah	O.70	140.00	11100	20159451
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM		136.50	11100	20149962
03/08/10 REVIEV	Turner, Kim W NEW DOCKET ENTRIES.	0.30	136.30	11100	20149902
03/08/10 RESEAL LAW.	McLaughlin, Daniel RCH AND LOCATE PRINCIPAL AND INTE	1.40 REST AND VOLUNTARY	273.00 PAYMENTS IN N	11100 EW YORK CA	20259892 SE
03/08/10 UPDAT	Amponsah, Duke TE DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE TO TEAM.	0.40	80.00	11100	20166336
03/08/10 CIRCU	Van Kampen, Allison LATE RECENT PLEADINGS AND UPDATE	1.20 E THE ELECTRONIC REC	216.00 ORD FILE.	11100	20140236
03/09/10 CIRCU	Leonard, Sarah LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM	0.40	80.00	11100	20277405
03/09/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.30	60.00	11100	20166347
03/10/10	DiBlasi, Kelly W PENDING ISSUES AND EMAILS.	0.30	189.00	11100	20142897
03/10/10	Leonard, Sarah LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM	0.40	80.00	11100	20159684
03/10/10	Amponsah, Duke TE DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE TO TEAM.	0.40	80.00	11100	20183886
03/11/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.50	315.00	11100	20144812
03/11/10	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: PENDI  Leonard, Sarah  ILATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAN	0.40	80.00	11100	20283739

#### ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79831.0003 - PRO JECT SONIC

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/11/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	11100	20184085
UPDAT	E AND CIRCULATE DOCKET.				
03/12/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20283744
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/12/10	Mulligan, Deidra	0.40	56.00	11100	20212938
OBTAIN	N CASES.				
03/12/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.80	160.00	11100	20184529
UPDAT	E DOCK ET AND DISTRIBUTE TO TEAM (.4	); UPDATE CALENDAR	AND DISTRIBUTE	E TO TEAM (.4	<b>i</b> ).
03/15/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.60	120.00	11100	20174884
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/16/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	11100	20160794
REVIEV	W DOCKET UPDATES.				
03/16/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20283362
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/16/10	Axon, Hillary	3.60	648.00	11100	20205711
MAINT	AIN ELECTRONIC DATABASES RE: BOND	HOLDERS LITIGATION.	,		
03/17/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.50	100.00	11100	20279264
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/17/10	Carmant, Marie	0.20	29.00	11100	20259151
OBTAI	N LIST OF FILINGS FOR WASHINGTON MU	TUAL BANK FOR V. JO	HNSON.		
03/17/10	Carmant, Marie	0.90	130.50	11100	20259148
OBTAI	N SEC FILINGS FOR WASHINGTON MUTUA	AL FOR S. LEONARD.			
03/17/10	Cruz, Luis	0.30	40.50	11100	20260442
CAL CI	V. CODE SECTION 1542. (WESTLAW).				
03/17/10	Van Kampen, Allison	0.60	108.00	11100	20175329
	RECENT PLEADINGS AS REQUESTED BY K RD FILE.	. TURNER AND UPLO A	D ON TO THE ELE	CTRONIC	
03/18/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20283121
CIRCU	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/18/10	Turner, Kim	0.10	45.50	11100	20283127
REVIE	W DOCKET ENTRIES.				
03/18/10	Carmant, Marie	1.70	246.50	11100	20259227
OBTAI	N SEC FILINGS FOR WASHINGTON MUTU.	ALFOR S. LEONARD.			
03/18/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.90	180.00	11100	20187657

#### ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79831.0003 - PRO JECT SONIC

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
UPDAT	E DOCK ET AND DISTRIBUTE TO TEAM (.4)	; UPDATE CALENDAR	AND DISTRIBUTE	TO TEAM (.5	).
03/22/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.50	100.00	11100	20281530
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/22/10	Roberts, Sarah	0.10	23.00	11100	20180727
PROVI	DE UPDATED DOCKET TO TEAM.				
03/22/10	Roberts, Sarah	1.50	345.00	11100	20180746
RESEA	RCH DOCKET AND COMPILE LIST OF POST	-PETITION AGREEMEN	NTS APPROVED B	Y COURT.	
03/23/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20283131
CIRCUI	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/23/10	Losick, Merill	1.40	273.00	11100	20184430
	N THRIFT FINANCIAL REPORTS FOR 2002-2 IET, WESTLAWBUSINESS.	005, 10-K, 10-Q'S, 8-K'S	FOR S. LEONARD	USING	
03/23/10 PROVII	Roberts, Sarah DE UPDATED DOCKET TO TEAM.	0.10	23.00	11100	20184579
03/23/10 PESEA1	Roberts, Sarah RCH DOCKET AND REVISE LIST OF POST-P	0.50	115.00	11100	20180558
KUSUAI					
03/24/10	Fuller, Deidre  E PLEADING AND CORRESPONDENCE IND	1.50	390.00	11100	20187901
Ordai	ET LEADING AND CORRESTONDENCE IND				
03/24/10	Leonard, Sarah  LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.	0.20	40.00	11100	20279262
CIRCO	LATE DOCKET OFDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/24/10	Roberts, Sarah DE UPDATED DOCKET TO TEAM.	0.10	23.00	11100	20191755
PROVI					
03/25/10	Mulligan, Deidra E ARTICLE PUBLISHED IN AMERICAN LAV	0.70	98.00	11100	20214324
LOCAT	E ARTICLE PUBLISHED IN AMERICAN LAV				
03/25/10	Roberts, Sarah	0.10	23.00	11100	20191965
PROVI	DE UPDATED DOCKET TO TEAM.				
03/26/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20290023
CIRCU	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/26/10	Cruz, Luis	0.30	40.50	11100	20265468
OBTAL	N CIVIL LIABILITIES SECTION 4:24 FOR S. I	JEUNARD.			
03/26/10	Amponsah, Duke	1.10	220.00	11100	20212723
UPDAT	E RECORD FILE.				
03/26/10	Roberts, Sarah	0.10	23.00	11100	20192625
PROVI	DE UPDATED DOCKET TO TEAM.				

#### ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79831.0003 - PROJECT SONIC

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/29/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	11100	20215188
OBTAI	N PRO HAC VICE APPLICATIONS.				
03/29/10	Roberts, Sarah	0.50	115.00	11100	20224332
PROVII RELATI	DE UPDATED DOCKET TO TEAM (.1); DOW ED FILINGS FOR TEAM AND REVIEW DOC	NLOAD PLAN AND D KET FOR HEARING D	ISCLOSURE STATE ATE OF SAME (.4).	MENT AND	
03/30/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.70	441.00	11100	20210260
REVIEV	W PENDING ISSUES AND REVIEW/RESPON	ID TO EMAILS.			
03/30/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.40	80.00	11100	20295526
CIRCU	LATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.				
03/30/10	Aliseo, Nicole	3.20	672.00	11100	20214379
MAILS	W DOCKET FOR UPDATES TO CASE CALE RE: SAME (.2); DISTRIBUTE E-MAIL INFO STED DOCUMENTS FOR K. DIBLASI (.3).	NDAR AND UPDATE C RMING TEAM OF DOC	ALENDAR WITH S. KET UPDATES (.2);	AME (2.5); E- RETRIEVE	
03/30/10	Roberts, Sarah	0.20	46.00	11100	20223311
PROVI	DE UPDATED DOCKET TO TEAM.				
03/31/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	11100	20276842
REVIE	W AND UPDATE TASK LIST.				
03/31/10	Amponsah, Duke	1.50	300.00	11100	20216852
UPDAT	E RECORD FILE.				
03/31/10	Aliseo, Nicole	0.70	147.00	11100	20295558
	BUTE E-MAIL INFORMING TEAM OF DOC TO BE HEARD AT APRIL 21, 2010 HEARIN		VIEW CASE CALE	NDAR FOR	
	L TASK CODE 11100 - GENERAL CASE TRATION:	49.00	\$ 12,046.00		
		***************************************	\$ 12,040.00	***************************************	
03/01/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.80	160.00	11150	20132449
SEND A	A. LEVINE AMENDED SCHEDULES AND ST	TATEMENTS.			
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	11150	20336568
MEMO!	RANDUM TO T. SAPEIKA RE: R. SHARMA	RESEARCH RE: SCHEI	OULES.		
03/04/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.40	274.00	11150	20273516
RESEA	RCH RE: SCHEDULES (.2) AND MEETING V	WITH R. SHARMA RE:	SAME (.2).		
03/04/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.90	864.50	11150	20127371
	RCH ON DUTY TO UPD ATE SCHEDULES ( MEMOR ANDUM RE: SAME (.6).	1.1); CONFER WITH T.	SAPEIKA RE: SAMI	E (.2); DRAFT	
FINANCIA	AL TASK CODE 11150 - STATEMENT OF AL AFFAIRS/SCHEDULES OF ASSETS				
AND LIAI	BILITIES:	3.30	\$ 1,493.50	·	

#### ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79831.0003 - PRO JECT SONIC

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	Goldring, Stuart W AND PROVIDE COMMENTS RE: RECENT	0.60 DRAFT OF MONTHLY	594.00 OPERATING REPO	11160 DRT ( <i>4</i> ) AND	20295522
FURTH	ER EMAIL EXCHANGES RE: SAME (.2).				
03/30/10 REVIEV	Petherbridge, Vaughan W EMAILS RELATING TO MONTHLY OPER	0.10 ATING REPORT.	66.50	11160	20295523
03/30/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.40	882.00	11160	20210074
REVIEV	W AND COMMENT ON MONTHLY OPERAT	ING REPORT AND ASS	IST WITH FILING	SAME.	
	L TASK CODE 11160 - MONTHLY NG REPORTS:	2.10	\$ 1,542.50	<u></u>	
03/01/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	189.00	11170	20107745
CALL	C. JANG RE: MARCH 4, 2010 HEARING AGE	NDA.			
03/02/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	11170	20336616
MEM O	RANDA TO C. GREER RE: AGENDA (.4); MI	EMORANDUM TO C. JU	NG RE: SAME (.1).		
03/02/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	11170	20270376
REVIE	W MARCH 4, 2010 AGENDA AND E-MAILS	FROM T. SAPEIKA AND	C. GREER RE: SA	ME.	
03/02/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.40	637.00	11170	20127354
	W AND REVISE MARCH 4, 2010 HEARING A W AND FINA LIZE AGENDA (.4).	AGENDA (.6); CALL WI	TH C. GREER RE: A	GENDA (.4);	
03/08/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	11170	20150397
REVIE'	W AGENDA FOR MARCH 15, 2010 HEARIN	G DATE.			
03/10/10	Van Kampen, Allison	0.50	90.00	11170	20175528
UPLOA	D PLEADINGS TO THE ELECTRONIC REC	ORD FILE.			
03/12/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.40	182.00	11170	20150586
REVIE	W AGENDA FOR 3/18 HEARING.				
03/15/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.60	273.00	11170	20170945
EMAIL AGENI	.S RE: 3/18 HEARING AGENDA (.1); REVIEV DA (.2).	V 3/18 HEARING AGENI	DA (.3); REVISE 3/1	8 HEARING	
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	11170	20345898
REVIE	W PROPOSED AGENDA (.1); MEMORANDU	M TO C. GREER RE: SA	ME (.1).		
03/16/10 REVIE	Sharma, Rahul W 3/18 HEARING AGENDA.	0.20	91.00	11170	20170938
03/19/10 REVIE	Rosen, Brian W AGENDA.	0.10	97.50	11170	20344738
03/23/10	Berz, David	0.10	90.00	11170	20281273
REVIE	W DRAFT AGENDA FOR 4/6/10 HEARING I	ROM C. GREER.			

#### ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79831.00 03 - PRO JECT SONIC

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/25/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.20	110.00	11170	20295651
CONFER	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: APRIL 6, 2010 AC	BENDA LETTER.			
03/25/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	11170	20193713
CONFER	R WITH J. GURDIAN RE: APRIL 6, 2010 HI	EARING AGENDA.			
SUBTOTAL LETTERS:	L TASK CODE 11170 - AGENDA	5.00	\$ 2,669.50		
					2000000
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	0.80	390.00	11190	20336565
RETURN	N TRAVEL TO NYC.				
03/10/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.10	346.50	11190	20142895
	L TO/FROM OFFICES OF SULLIVAN & CI ORS' PROFESSIONALS.	ROMWELL FOR MEETING	3 AMONG DEBTOI	RS, JPMC, ANI	)
03/11/10	Rosen, Brian	1.10	536.25	11190	20336641
TRAVE	L TO DC.				
03/12/10	Rosen, Brian	0.80	390.00	11190	20336709
	N TRAVEL TO NYC FROM MEETING WIT				
XCW X 0 2C2					
SUBTOTA TRAVEL:	L TASK CODE 11190 - NON-WORKING	3.80	\$ 1,662.75		
03/01/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	11200	20127348
	S RE: OPEN ISSUES AND CASE STATUS.				
			10,700	***	00200750
03/02/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	11200	20382658
CONFE	R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: CASE STATUS A	ND 2019 STATEMENTS F	ILED BY BUNDH	JLDEKS.	
03/02/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	11200	20200810
	R WITH B. ROSEN RE: CASE STATUS, IN S WITH B. ROTHSCHILD RE: SAME (.1).	CLUDING 2019 FILED BY	WMB BONDHOL	DERS (.2);	
03/03/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	11200	20127367
EMAIL (.5); RE	B. ROSEN RE: CASE STATUS AND OPEN VIEW EQUITY COMMITTEE'S COMPLAI	ISSUES (.2); EMAIL RE: ( NT AND DRAFT EMAIL T	CASE STATUS AN O B. ROSEN RE: S	D OPEN ISSUE AME (.3).	SS
03/04/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	11200	20127325
	S RE: CASE STATUS AND OPEN ISSUES.				
03/05/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	11200	20391554
	NG WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PENDING ISSU				
		A #A	215.00	11200	20126504
03/05/10	DiBlasi, Kelly NG WITH B. ROSEN RE: PENDING ISSUE	0.50	315.00	11200	20126504
	and with a brown of bit bit all the lexist				
MEELI	NG WITH B. ROSEN RE. LENDING ISSUE	5 (.4), KEVIE W SAME (.1)	•		

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
EMAILS	RE: CASE STATUS AND OPEN ISSUES.				
03/07/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	11200	20127781
	RE: OPEN ISSUES AND CASE STATUS.				
03/08/10	Rosen, Brian	1.10	1,072.50	11200	20391775
	RENCE CALL WITH WMI, JPMC, ALVAREZ &		ŕ	11,000	2000
02/02/10	PURIOR WOLL	0.20	100.00	11200	20120220
03/09/10 CONFFI	DiBlasi, Kelly R WITH R. SHARMA RE: CASE STATUS AND	0.30 PENDING ISSUES	189.00	11200	20139338
CONIDI	WITH R. BINKWIT RB. CHOD BITTOD INVE				
03/09/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	11200	20150387
	R WITH K. DIBLASI RE: CASE STATUS AND ARE LOCAL RULES (.2).	OPEN ISSUES (.3); RE	SEARCH AND EM	AIL RE:	
03/10/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	11200	20391778
CONFE	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: CASE STATUS.				
03/10/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.90	409.50	11200	20150393
EMAILS	RE: CASE STATUS AND OPEN ISSUES (.7);	CONFER WITH B. RO	SEN RE: CASE STA	TUS (.2).	
03/11/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	11200	20283738
	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: CASE STATUS.	0.20	120.00	11200	20203730
			21.22	1.200	20151100
03/11/10	Sharma, Rahul R WITH K. DIBLASI RE: CASE STATUS.	0.20	91.00	11200	20171102
CONFE	R WITH R. DIBLAST RE. CASE STATUS.				
03/12/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	378.00	11200	20148890
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: PENDING	ISSUES AND CASE U	PDATES.		
03/12/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.20	546.00	11200	20150559
	W UNION BANK ADVERSARY COMPLAINT A ND TO EMAILS RE: PENDING ISSUES AND C		TTEE MOTION (.8	); REVIEW AN	D
03/14/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	189.00	11200	20150583
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS.				
03/15/10	Sapeika, Tal	2.20	1,507.00	11200	20200753
	W NUMEROUS EMAILS RE: CASE STATUS.	2.20	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	11200	20200753
00/10/150	DIDL : W. II	1 70	1 071 00	11200	20157226
03/15/10 PEVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: PENDING	1.70	1,071.00	11200 YET UPDATE	20157236
(.3).	WAND KESTOND TO BRANDS KE.TEKETING	ISSOCIATION PROPERTY	(1.77), 100 1 10 11 10 00		, <u></u>
03/15/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.20	110.00	11200	20295649
CALL	VITH R. SHARMA RE: CASE STATUS.				
03/15/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.00	550.00	11200	20267037
	ID TEAM MEETING RE: PLAN.	2,00	220.00	11200	
0011 #15 0	CI DII	0.00	21.22	11000	20170010
03/15/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	11200	20170919

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CONFER	R WITH J. GURDIAN RE: CASE STATUS.				
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	0.80	780.00	11200	20345902
PARTIC STRATE	IPATE IN WEEKLY UPDATE CALL WITH EGY.	K. DIBLASI AND CLIEN	T RE: PENDING IS:	SUES AND	
03/16/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.00	630.00	11200	20160747
	PATE IN WEEKLY UPDATE CALL WITH GGY (.8); PREP ARE FOR SAME (.2).	B. ROSEN AND CLIENT	RE: PENDING ISS	UES AND	
03/16/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	11200	20247172
CONFEI	R WITH B. ROSEN RE: OPEN ISSUES.				
03/16/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	11200	20247855
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO INTERNAL CORRES	PONDENCE.			
03/17/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	11200	20163489
REVIEW	V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: PENDIN	IG ISSUES.			
03/18/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	11200	20170905
EMAILS	RE: CASE STATUS AND OPEN ISSUES.				
03/19/10	Rosen, Brian	0.90	877.50	11200	20392971
MEETIN	NG WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PENDING ISSUE	ES AND STATUS.			
03/19/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.10	1,323.00	11200	20170822
	S RE: PENDING ISSUES (.5); MEETING WI V PENDING ISSUES AND STATUS (.7).	TH B. ROSEN RE: PENDI	ING ISSUES AND S	T ATUS (.9);	
03/19/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	11200	20246621
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE	FROM T. SAPEIKA RE:	OPEN ISSUES.		
03/20/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	378.00	11200	20171107
REVIEV	W PENDING ISSUES AND UPDATE TASK	LIST.			
03/22/10	Rosen, Brian	0.90	877.50	11200	20360961
WGM T	EAM MEETING RE: OPEN ISSUES.				
03/22/10	Wine, Jennifer	0.20	110.00	11200	20250567
EMAIL INVEST LOANS	CORRESPONDENCE RE: ATTENDING HE FIGATIONS RE: WALL STREET AND THE	ARING OF PERMANENT FINANCIAL CRISIS: THI	T SUBCOMMITTEE E ROLE OF HIGH R	ON ISK HOME	
03/23/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	11200	20255101
	SPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI, S. ROBEI GAN AND THE FDIC.	RTS AND C. SMITH RE:	AGREEMENTS BET	TWEEN WMI,	
03/24/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	11200	20193573
EMAIL	S RE: CASE STATUS AND OPEN ISSUES.				
03/30/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.90	409.50	11200	20244793

	II BRILLIAN GERVICES	** / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / /	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		
DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CALL W	ITH C. MARTIN RE: CASE STATUS (.2); EMA	ILS RE: CASE STAT	US AND OPEN ISSU	JES (.7).	
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	11200	20295327
MEMOR	ANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: ASSIGNMENTS.				
03/31/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	3.80	2,394.00	11200	20216499
AND UF	RANDUM TO B. ROSEN RE: PENDING ISSUES PDATE TASK LIST (12); DRAFT MEMORAND IST (.8); CALL WITH R. SHARMA RE: CASE S	UM TO J. GURDIAN	DING ISSUES AND RE: WORK PLAN (	ASSIGNMENT .4); UPDATE	`S
03/31/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.60	273.00	11200	20245131
CALL W	ITH K. DIBLASI RE: CASE STATUS (.3); EMA	ILS RE: CASE STAT	US AND OPEN ISSU	JES (.3).	
SUBTOTA STRATEG	L TASK CODE 11200 - GENERAL CASE Y:	30.10	\$ 18,870.00		
03/06/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	12100	20336497
	ANDUM TO D. DAVIS RE: NOTICES.	0.10	77.50	12100	20330491
03/08/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	12100	20247599
	SPONDENCE WITH WG&M PERSONNEL RE:		39.30	12100	20241377
02/00/10	Oleman Patril	0.20	91.00	12100	20150428
03/08/10 CALLS	Sharma, Rahul WITH SHAREHOLDERS RE: CASE STATUS.	0.20	91.00	12100	20130428
03/12/10	Mills, Marvin	0.30	118.50	12100	20246171
REVIEV	V CASE CORREPONDENCE.				
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	12100	20344797
мемоі	RANDUM TO BUCKLEY RE: FDIC CLAIMS.				
03/29/10	Rosen, Brian	0.30	292.50	12100	20295369
MEMO	RANDA TO C. SMITH RE: PRESS COMMUNIC	ATION.			
03/29/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	12100	20244692
CALL V	VITH WMI BONDHOLDER RE: CASE STATUS				
03/30/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	12100	20295322
MEMO	RANDUM TO M. COLLINS RE: FILINGS.				
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	12100	20295325
MEMO) SAME (	RANDUM TO T. SAPEIKA AND M. MILLS RE: .1).	FILINGS (.1); MEM	ORANDUM TO R. S	HARMA RE:	
	L TASK CODE 12100 - GENERAL NICATIONS:	1.60	\$ 1,120.00		
02/05/10	DiDloci V aller	0.10	63.00	12200	20126702
03/05/10 VOICE	DiBlasi, K elly MAIL FOR P. GURFEIN.	0.10	63.00	12200	20120/02
		0.00	105.00	10000	20244700
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	12200	20344799

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	V DRAFT LETTER TO EQUITY COMMITTEE	(.1); MEMORANDUM	TO B. FINE STONE	RE: SAME (.1)	
03/19/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.90	616.50	12200	20201620
PARTIC	IPATE IN PROFESSIONALS' CALL WITH CO	MMITTEE PROFESSIO	NALS.		
03/19/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.00	630.00	12200	20170823
PARTIC	IPATE IN WEEKLY CALL WITH CREDITORS	S' COMMITTEE AND D	DEBTOR PROFESS	IONALS.	
03/20/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.40	274.00	12200	20255028
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH D. SIMONDS RE: WMB D	EBT DOCUMENTATI	ON.		
	L TASK CODE 12200 - CREDITORS	2.70	0 1 779 50		
COMMIT	TEE COMM UNICATIONS/MEETINGS:	2.60	\$ 1,778.50	***************************************	
03/03/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	12250	20336555
	RANDUM TO B. FINESTONE RE: EQUITY CO INN/VENABLE MEETING (.2).	MMITTEE MEETING	(.2); MEMORANDI	JM TO C. SMI	l' <b>H</b>
03/03/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	12250	20336561
	W EQUITY COMMITTEE COMPLAINT RE: SH RANDUM RE: SAME (.1).	(AREHOLDER MEETI)	NG (.4); REVIEW R	. SHARMA	
03/22/10	Gold, Simeon	1.90	1,881.00	12250	20511911
WORK MEETI	WITH CLIENTS, FRIED FRANK AND WEIL T NG.	EAM ON DEMAND FO	OR WAMU STOCK	HOLDERS	
03/22/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.10	66.50	12250	20194867
REVIE	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO	SHAREHOLDER MEI	ETING ISSUES.		
03/22/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.30	199.50	12250	20281519
ATTEN	D CALL RE: SHAREHOLDER MEETING ISSU	TES.			
03/29/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	12250	20295371
МЕМО	RANDUM TO B. FINESTONE RE: EQUITY CO	OMMITTEE MOTION.			
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	12250	20295326
MEMO SMITH	RANDUM TO G. CROSS RE: EQUITY COMMI AND B. KOSTUROS RE: SAME (.3).	TTEE MEETING (.2);	REVIEW MEMORA	ANDA FROM C	
	AL TASK CODE 12250 - EQUITY TEE ISSUES:	3.80	\$ 3,609.50		
03/26/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.30	136.50	12400	20193717
	LS AND CALLS RE: JANUARY 28, 2009 341 M		,		
	AL TASK CODE 12400 - UNITED STATES  COMMUNICATIONS:	0.30	\$ 136.50		
03/01/10	Rosen, Brian	1.20	1,170.00	12500	20336781
MEET	WITH WGM TEAM RE: OPEN ISSUES.				

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/01/10	Margolis, Steven	1.20	864.00	12500	20227784
	PIPATE IN TEAM MEETING WITH WGM TE S AND OPEN ISSUES.	EAM, B. KOSTUROS, J. M	MACIEL AND J. GO	ULDING RE:	
03/01/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.20	822.00	12500	20200719
	PIPATE IN TEAM MEETING WITH B. ROSE S, B. KOSTUROS, J. MACIEL AND J. GOUL			MARGOLIS, E.	,
03/01/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.40	882.00	12500	20107661
PREPAR	RE FOR (.2) AND PARTICIPATE IN WGM T	EAM MEETING RE: STA	TUS AND PENDIN	G ISSUES (1.2)	).
03/01/10	Kovacs, Eva	1.20	618.00	12500	20227294
PARTIC MILLS,	EPATE IN WAMU TEAM MEETING WITH B. KOSTUROS, J. GOULDING, J. MACIEL	B. ROSEN, K. DIBLASI, AND S. MARGOLIS RE: 0	T. SAPEIKA, R. SHA CASE STATUS ANI	ARMA, M. DUPDATE.	
03/01/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.20	546.00	12500	20127346
PARTIC	CIPATE IN BI-WEEKLY TEAM MEETING R	E: CASE STATUS.			
03/03/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	12500	20118792
PREPA	RE FOR WGM TEAM MEETING.				
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	12500	20382661
	D W GM TEAM MEETING RE: CASE STAT	US.			
03/04/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	12500	20230755
	D WGM TEAM MEETING RE: CASE STATE AN, R. SHARMA, T. SAPEIKA AND E. KOV		GUINN, P. O'TOOLE	E, K. DIBLASI,	J.
03/04/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.60	411.00	12500	20200711
	CIPATE IN TEAM MEETING RE: CASE STA DIAN, R. SHARMA AND E. KOVACS.	TUS WITH B. ROSEN, G	. QUINN, P. O'TOO	LE, K. DIBLAS	SI,
03/04/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	0.60	420.00	12500	20310014
	D TEAM MEETING WITH B. ROSEN, T. SA AN, S. MARGOLIS AND G. QUINN RE: STA		SHARMA, E. KOVA	CS, J.	
03/04/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	378.00	12500	20122040
PARTIC	CIPATE IN WGM TEAM MEETING RE: CAS	SE STATUS.			
03/04/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.60	309.00	12500	20226554
	D TEAM MEETING RE: CASE STATUS WI LE, J. GURDIAN, G. QUINN AND S. MARGO		EN, T. SAPEIKA, S.	RAHUL, P.	
03/04/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.60	330.00	12500	20262531
PARTIC	CIPATE IN TEAM MEETING RE: CASE STA	AT US.			
03/04/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.60	309.00	12500	20273518
	CIPATE IN TEAM MEETING RE: STATUS.				
03/04/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.60	273.00	12500	20127369

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
ATTENI	BI-WEEKLY TEAM MEETING RE: STATUS				
03/08/10	Margolis, Steven	0.40	288.00	12500	20231650
PARTIC	IPATE IN WGM TEAM MEETING RE: STATU	S.			
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.40	252.00	12500	20133304
ATTENI	O W GM TEAM MEETING RE: PENDING ISSU	ES AND STATUS.			
03/08/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.40	206.00	12500	20226684
ATTEN	D WGM TEAM MEETING.				
03/08/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.60	330.00	12500	20266890
ATTENI	D TEAM MEETING RE: STATUS.		•		
03/08/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.40	206.00	12500	20274987
ATTENI	D BI-WEEKLY TEAM MEETING RE: PROJEC	TS.			
03/08/10	Mills, Marvin	0.40	158.00	12500	20247597
PARTIC	SIPATE IN WG&M TEAM MEETING RE: PENI	DING ISSUES.			
03/08/10	Sharma, Rahui	0.40	182.00	12500	20150427
ATTEN	D TEAM MEETING RE: PROJECTS AND STA	TUS.			
03/15/10	Berz, David	1.00	900.00	12500	20319635
ATTEN STROC	D TEAM MEETING WITH K. DIBLASI, B. RO HAK, S. MARGOLIS, E. KOVACS AND S. GOI	SEN, L. BAEK, N. PAI LDRING RE: OPEN IS:	SUES AND PLAN.	Ales, A.	
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	12500	20392024
FOLLO	W-UP MEETING WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PENI	OING ISSUES.			
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	1.00	975.00	12500	20344790
ATTEN	D WGM TEAM MEETING RE: OPEN ISSUES	AND PLAN.			
03/15/10	Baer, Lawrence	1.00	720.00	12500	20252728
ATTEN	D TEAM MEETING RE: OPEN ISSUES AND I	PLAN.			
03/15/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.50	1,042.50	12500	20175305
ATTEN	TO TEAM STATUS MEETING RE: PLAN AND	SETTLEMENT (1.1); I	PREPARE FOR SAM	IE (.4).	
03/15/10	Yates, Erin	1.00	455.00	12500	20289183
	WITH WEIL WAMU TEAM TO DISCUSS SETT GANIZATION.	FLEMENT WITH JP M	ORGAN CHASE AN	ND PLAN OF	
03/15/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.00	685.00	12500	20289184
ATTEN	ID TEAM CONFERENCE CALL RE: STATUS/S	STRATEGY.			
03/15/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	12500	20200996
PARTI	CIPATE IN PART OF TEAM MEETING RE: CA	ASE STATUS.			
03/15/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	1.00	700.00	12500	20289335

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
PREPAR	E FOR AND ATTEND TEAM CALL.				
03/15/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.90	1,197.00	12500	20157352
PREPAR SAME (I	E FOR WGM TEAM MEETING RE: PENDII 1.1); FOLLOW-UP MEETING WITH B. ROS	NG ISSUES AND STATU EN RE: SAME (.5).	JS UPDATE (.3); PA	RTICIPAT E IN	
03/15/10	Ng, Alexander	1.00	595.00	12500	20278985
ATTENI	O TEAM MEETING RE: PLAN, DISCLOSUR	E STATEMENT AND C	LAIMS OBJECTION	S.	
03/15/10	Kovacs, Eva	1.40	721.00	12500	20225692
	D TEAM MEETING RE: PLAN AND SETTL AM MEETING (.4).	EMENT (1.0); REVIEW	MATERIAL IN PRE	PARATION FC	)R
03/15/10	Mishkin, Jessie	1.00	550.00	12500	20278986
PARTIC	CIPATE IN TEAM MEETING RE: UPDATES	ON SETTLEMENT, PLA	AN, AND POTENTIA	L LITIGATIO	N.
03/15/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	0.90	409.50	12500	20174407
ATTEN	D TEAM MEETING RE: PLAN STATUS.				
03/15/10	Mills, Marvin	1.00	395.00	12500	20247654
ATTEN	D TEAM MEETING RE: PLAN.				
03/15/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	12500	20170943
PARTIC	CIPATE IN ALL HANDS TEAM MEETING F	RE: PLAN.			
03/15/10	Veit, Cheri	1.00	455.00	12500	20166538
ATTEN	D TEAM STATUS AND STRATEGY MEET	ING RE: PLAN.			
03/22/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.40	266.00	12500	20281517
ATTEN	D CONFERENCE CALL RE: CURRENT ST	ATUS.			
03/22/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.40	252.00	12500	20281527
PARTI	CIPATE IN TEAM MEETING.				
03/22/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.40	206.00	12500	20226195
ATTEN UPDAT	ID TEAM MEETING WITH R. SHARMA, S. TE.	MARGOLIS, B. ROSEN	, E. COLEMAN AND	G. QUINN RE	<b>;</b>
03/22/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.40	206.00	12500	20282091
ATTEN	ND TEAM MEETING.				
03/22/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.60	273.00	12500	20193476
ATTE	ND TEAM MEETING (.4); PREPARE FOR SA	AME (.2).			
03/23/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.50	315.00	12500	20181191
PARTI	CIPATE IN WEEKLY UPDATE CALL.				
03/25/10	Strochak, Adam	0.30	253.50	12500	20211338
PARTI	AL PARTICIPATION IN WGM AND ALVA	REZ & MARSAL TEAM	CALL RE: CASE ST	ATUS.	
03/25/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.50	342.50	12500	20255319

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
PARTIC	IPATE IN TEAM MEETING RE: CASE STATU	S.			
03/25/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	0.80	560.00	12500	20290018
PREPAR STATUS	E FOR AND PARTIAL PARTICIPATION IN W	GM AND ALVAREZ	& MARSAL TEAM (	CALL RE: CASE	
03/25/10	Kovacs, Eva D WGM AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL TEAM M	0.80	412.00	12500	20235785
ATTEN	J WGW AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL IEAM M	EETING RE. CASES	AIOS OIDAIE.		
03/25/10	Mills, Marvin	0.80	316.00	12500	20246401
PARTIC	PATE IN WEEKLY TEAM MEETING.				
03/25/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.80	364.00	12500	20193574
PARTIC	PATE IN WEEKLY TEAM MEETING.				
SUBTOTA MEETING	L TASK CODE 12500 - WAMU TEAM S:	40.20	\$ 24,811.00		
03/01/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.40	274.00	12600	20200979
CORRE	SAPEIRA, 141 SPONDENCE WITH L. BAER, P. REPASH, D. A H AND 6TH OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS	AMPONSAH RE: MAR			20200777
00/00/10	5 5 11	0.10	00.00	12600	20250072
03/23/10 COMMI	Berz, David UNICATE WITH J. WINE RE: COURT HEARIN	0.10 IG THURSDAY.	90.00	12000	20250973
03/23/10	Wine, Jennifer	0.20	110.00	12600	20253838
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. ROSEN, A. STI			MENT OF	
nearii	NG BEFORE FERMANENT SUBCOMMITTEE	ON INVESTIGATION.	3.		
03/23/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.10	45.50	12600	20227719
EMAILS	S WITH J. WINE RE: ATTENDING SENATE CO	OM MITT EE HEARING	FOR WMI.		
03/26/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	5.20	936.00	12600	20198511
PREPA	RE AND ORGANIZE CASES AND STATUTES	CITED IN PREPARAT	TION OF HEARING.		
	L TASK CODE 12600 - GENERAL PREPARATION AND ATTENDANCE:	6.00	\$ 1,455.50		
**********					
03/24/10	Lee, Kathleen	1.50	412.50	13200	20186828
UPDAT CHECK	E LIST OF NOTICES OF APPEARANCES FILE LIST.	ED AND PLEADINGS	FILED FOR MASTE	R RETENTION	
03/25/10	Lee, Kathleen	3.20	880.00	13200	20190439
CONFL	ARE NEW PARTIES TO EXISTING MASTER RICTS NEW NAME TO RUN (.2); REVIEW CONDSED (2.).	ETENTION AND REM IFLICTS AND UPDAT	OVE DUPLICATES E LIST OF CLIENT	S (1.0); E-MAIL S TO BE	
SUBTOTA WGM:	L TASK CODE 13200 - RETENTION-	4.70	\$ 1,292.50		
77 33472.			~ ~,~~~~		
03/04/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.20	137.00	13300	20201229

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
EMAILS FINANC	S WITH M. MILLS RE: RESERVATION OF F CIAL ADVISOR RETENTION.	LIGHTS WITH RESPECT	T TO EQUITY COMM	MITTEE	
03/08/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	13300	20246170
PREPA	RE RESERVATION OF RIGHTS RE: EQUITY	COMMITTEE RETENT	TION APPLICATION	i.	
03/10/10	Mills, Marvin	0.40	158.00	13300	20247813
PREPAI ADVISO	RE RESERVATION OF RIGHTS RE: EQUITY ORS.	Y COMMITTEE'S APPLI	CATION TO RETAI	N FINANCIAL	
03/16/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	13300	20247697
ANALY	ZE RESERVATION OF RIGHTS ISSUES.				
03/17/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	13300	20247454
REVIEV	W AND RESPOND TO INTERNAL CORRESI	ONDENCE RE: RESERV	VATION OF RIGHTS	S.	
03/21/10	Desai, Kavita	0.40	182.00	13300	20279268
RESEA	RCH RETENTION UNDER WASHINGTON	STATE LAW.			
03/22/10	Desai, Kavita	3.00	1,365.00	13300	20178691
	RCH WA STATE RETENTION STATUTE, R	CW 20.10.430.	·		•
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	13300	20295332
	RANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: DEWEY RETE		2,2.00		
	AL TASK CODE 13300 - RETENTION- ROFESSIONALS:	4.70	\$ 2,234.50		
03/01/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.90	567.00	13400	20107568
	W DECEMBER TIME RECORDS FOR COMP		,		20107000
02/01/10	Y Yealthan	0.20	55,00	13400	20116022
03/01/10 CONFE	Lee, Kathleen ER WITH BILLING DEPARTMENT RE: BILI			1,5400	20110022
				10400	20200002
03/02/10	Sapeika, Tal WITH J. CHANG AND EMAILS WITH K. DI	1.40 RIASI R SHARMA ANI	959.00 D.M. MILLS RE: NO	13400 VEMBER AND	20200883
DECEM	MBER 2009 BILLS (.3); REVIEW AND REVIS	SE FEE APPLICATION F	OR NOVEMBER 20	09 (1.1).	
03/02/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.30	1,449.00	13400	20116132
REVIE	W DECEMBER 2009 TIME RECORDS FOR	COMPLAINCE WITH U.	s. trustee guide	LINES.	
03/02/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	13400	20246292
	W AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE				
03/02/10	Sharma, Rahul	4.00	1,820.00	13400	20127356
	Snarma, Kanul S R E: WGM'S NOVEMBER 2009 FEE APPL		•	15.00	
				13400	20117220
03/02/10 REVIS	Lee, Kathleen E FEE CHARTS FOR WGM'S NOVEMBER A	3.50 AND DECEMBER 2009 F	962.50 EE STATEMENT (3.		20117229
CONFE	ERENCE WITH BILLING DEPARTMENT RE	E: SAME (.3); E-MAIL TO	TEAM RE: SAME (	.ź).	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/04/10	Lee, Kathleen	6.70	1,842.50	13400	20124113
REVIEW GUIDEL	FEBRUARY 2010 BILLING SUMMARY REPO INES (6.5); CALL WITH BILLING DEPARTME	ORT FOR COMPLIAN INT RE: MISSING TIM	ICE WITH U.S. TRUS ME (.2).	TEE	
03/05/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.40	637.00	13400	20127341
REVISE FILING	NOVEMBER 2009 FEE APPLICATION (.2); CO NO VEMBER 2009 FEE APPLICATION (.3); RE	ONFER WITH K. LEE VISE DECEMBER 20	RE: SAME (3); ATT 09 FEE APPLICATIO	ENTION TO N (.6).	
03/05/10	Lee, Kathleen	8.80	2,420.00	13400	20154758
MISSIN WITH U	IG WITH R. SHARMA RE: FEE APPLICATION G ATTORNEY TIME (.2); CONTINUE TO REV.S. TRUSTEE GUIDELINES (7.9); PDF REVISIC WITH SAME (.2).	IEW BILLING SUMM	IARY REPORT FOR (	COMPLIANCE	
03/07/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.10	63.00	13400	20129693
EMAIL.	J. CHANG RE: JANUARY 2010 TIME RECORD	S.			
03/07/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.80	504.00	13400	20129879
REVIEV	V AND COMMENT ON DECEMBER 2010 FEE	APPLICATION.			
03/07/10	Sharma, Rahul	3.80	1,729.00	13400	20127746
REVIEV WGM D	V AND REVISE WGM FEBRUARY 2010 BILLI ECEMBER 2009 FEE APPLICATION (2.7); RE ATION (.6).	NG SUMMARY REPO VISE AND CIRCULA	ORT DISBURSEMEN TE WGM DECEMBE	TS (.5); REVISE R 2009 FEE	
03/08/10	Mills, Marvin	3.90	1,540.50	13400	20247240
REVIEV GUIDEI	V JANUARY 2010 BILLING SUMMARY REPO LINES.	RT FOR COMPLIAN	CE WITH U.S. TRUS	LEE	
03/09/10	Mills, Marvin	3.80	1,501.00	13400	20246712
REVIEV GUIDE	W DECEMBER 2009 BILLING SUMMARY REF LINES.	PORT FOR COMPLIA	NCE WITH U.S. TRU	STEE	
03/11/10	Mills, Marvin	1.30	513.50	13400	20247861
CONFE	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: INTERIM FEE APPL	ICATION (.2); PREPA	ARE SAME (1.1).		
03/11/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.60	273.00	13400	20171101
CONFE	R WITH M. MILLS RE: INTERIM FEE APPLIC IRCULATE FOR FILING (.4).	CATION (.2); REVISE	DECEMBER FEE AP	PLICATION	
03/12/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	13400	20247197
INTER	NAL CORRESPONDENCE RE: INTERIM FEE	APPLICATION.			
03/12/10 REVIE	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE WGM INTERIM FEE APPLIC.	0.50 ATION.	227.50	13400	20150588
03/15/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1,20	756.00	13400	20157359
	W JANUARY TIME RECORDS FOR COMPLIA				
03/15/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	13400	20246760
	MINS, MATVIN NAL CORRESPONDENCE RE: WGM'S THIRE				

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/16/10	Lee, Kathleen	5.00	1,375.00	13400	20163043
REVIEV	V AND REVISE FEBRUARY BILLING SUMM	ARY REPORT.			
03/17/10	Mills, Marvin	0.30	118.50	13400	20246670
PREPAR	E WGM'S THIRD INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	ON (.2); INTERNAL CO	RRE SPOND ENCE	RE: SAME (.1).	
03/17/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.10	45.50	13400	20170935
	R WITH K. LEE RE: FEBRUARY BILLING SU	MMARY REPORT.			
02/15/10	You Wathlann	0,20	55.00	13400	20167406
03/17/10 CONFE	Lee, Kathleen R WITH R. SHARMA RE: DISBURSEMENT F				
		0.50	315.00	13400	20167376
03/18/10	DiBlasi, Kelly V JANUARY TIME RECORD'S FOR COMPLIA			15400	2010/5/0
KEVIEV	JANOAR I TIME RECORDS FOR COM MA				201/2202
03/18/10	Lee, Kathleen	0.20	55.00	13400	20167505
	OAD FEE APPLICATIONS FILED BY WG&N OOD RE: SAME.	A FROM OCTOBER - L	DECEMBER AND E	WAIL L.	
03/19/10	Lee, Kathleen	6.00	1,650.00	13400	20176678
CONFE REVIEV	R WITH L. YEARWOOD RE: TIME RECORDS V TIME RECORDS (3.5); CREATE FEE CHAR	S (.2); REVIEW AND RI CTS FOR FEBRUARY F	EVISE SUM MARY EE STATEMENT (!	CHART (.8);	
03/22/10	Lee, Kathleen	0.50	137.50	13400	20184106
REVIEV	W TIME RECORDS (.4); E-MAIL L. YEAR WO	OD RE: SAME (.1).			
03/23/10	Lee, Kathleen	1.40	385.00	13400	20190566
	R WITH L. YEARWOOD RE: BILLING SUM	MARY REPORT (.2); R	EVIEW SAME (.6);	REVISE CHAR	TS
03/25/10	Lee, Kathleen	0.20	55.00	13400	20190560
	ER WITH B. GRANT RE: INTERIM FEE APPL	ICATION AND PROVI	DE DATE FILED.		
02/20/10	DiDlasi Valler	1.00	630.00	13400	20210116
03/29/10 REVIE	DiBlasi, K elly W JANUAR Y 2010 TIME RECORDS FOR CO			INES.	
			756.00	13400	20210049
03/30/10	DiBlasi, K elly W JANUARY 2010 TIME RECORDS FOR CO	1.20			20210049
KEVIE	W JANUAR 1 2010 HIME RECORDS FOR CO.	WILDINITED WITH 0.5.			
03/31/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	378.00	13400	20276841
REVIE	W AND COMMENT ON JANUARY 2010 TIM	E RECORDS.			
03/31/10	Lee, Kathleen	0.20	55.00	13400	20216237
CONF	ER WITH L. YEARWOOD RE: BILLING SUM	MARY REPORT.			
SUBTOT.	AL TASK CODE 13400 - BILLING/FEE ATIONS - WGM:	63.00	\$ 23,988.00		
111 1 10101			00.00	12500	20122462
03/01/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	13500	20132462

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
OBTAIN MARSA	N FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL PROFESSIO I	NALS AND SEND TO J	. TRUONG AT ALV	AREZ AND	
		0.40	90 nn	13500	20163112
	Amponsah, Duke I COPIES OF FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL EZ AND MARSAL.	0.40 PROFESSIONALS AND	80.00 SEND TO J. TRUON		20103112
03/04/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	13500	20166214
OBTAIN MARSA	N FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL PROFESSIO	NALS AND SEND TO J	TRUONG AT ALV	AREZ AND	
03/05/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	13500	20166332
OBTAIN MARSA	N FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL PROFESSIO	NALS AND SEND TO J	TRUONG AT ALV	AREZ AND	
03/08/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	13500	20166335
OBTAII MARSA	N FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL PROFESSIO L.	NALS AND SEND TO	.TRUONG AT ALV	AREZ AND	
03/10/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	13500	20183887
OBTAII MARSA	N FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL PROFESSIC L.	ONALS AND SEND TO	I. TRUONG AT ALV	AREZ AND	
03/12/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	13500	20184540
OBTAI MARSA	N FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL PROFESSIONL.	DNALS AND SEND TO	J. TRUONG AT ALV	AREZ AND	
03/18/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	13500	20187658
OBTAI MARSA	N FEE APPLICATIONS OF ALL PROFESSIONL.	DNALS AND SEND TO	J. TRUONG AT ALV	AREZ AND	
03/21/10	Mills, Marvin	0.70	276.50	13500	20247596
	W EQUITY COMMITTEE'S ATTORNEYS'F DURES (.4).	EE APPLICATION (.3);	REVIEW PROFESSI	ONALS FEE	
03/23/10	Mills, Marvin	2.50	987.50	13500	20246937
DRAFT	OBJECTION AND RESERVATION OF RIG	HTS RE: VENABLE FE	E APPLICATION.		
03/24/10	Mills, Marvin	2.00	790.00	13500	20247205
PREPA	RE LIMITED OBJECTION AND RESERVA	TION OF RIGHTS RE: V	'ENEBALE FEE APP	LICATION.	
03/25/10 PREPA	Mills, Marvin RE LIMITED OBJECTION AND RESERVA	1.80 TION OF RIGHTS RE: V	711.00 ENEBALE FEE APP	13500 LICATION.	20246402
03/26/10	Mills, Marvin	0.40	158.00	13500	20247406
	E LIMITED OBJECTION AND RESERVATI	ON OF RIGHTS RE: VE	NEBALE FEE APPL	CATION.	
03/26/10	Roberts, Sarah	1.00	230.00	13500	20290104
PROVI TO J. T	DE ALL RECENTLY FILED FEE APPLICAT RUONG AT ALVAREZ AND MARSAL.	TIONS AND CERTIFICA	ATES OF NO OBJEC	ΓΙΟΝ RE: SAM	E
03/29/10	Rosen, Brian	0.30	292.50	13500	20295372

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	Hours	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
14771401	ANDVIN TO W DIDLAGI DE VENADI E EE	PO / AN AMENAOD ANIDIUS		ODECTION	
TO SAM	RANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: VENABLE FE. 1E (.1).	es (.2); memorandom	I TO M. MILLS RE:	OBJECTION	
03/29/10	Mills, Marvin	0.40	158.00	13500	20246110
	SPONDENCE WITH C. SMITH (WMI), B. RO ATIONS (.2); REVIEW SAME (.2).	SEN, AND K. DIBLASI I	RE: VENABLE FEE		
03/30/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	13500	20246577
REVIE	W VENEBALE SECOND FEE APPLICATION.				
03/31/10	Mills, Marvin	1.50	592.50	13500	20246673
REVISE	E LIMITED OBJECTION AND RESERVATION	N OF RIGHTS RE: VENA	BLE SECOND FEE	APPLICATIO	N.
	L TASK CODE 13500 - BILLING/FEE FIONS - OTHER PROFESSIONALS:	14.00	\$ 4,915.00		
03/03/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.40	220.00	14400	20262547
REVISE	FREDDIE AGREEMENT.				
OXIDADORA	Y TACK CODE 14400 DEDCOMAY				
	L TASK CODE 14400 - PERSONAL Y LEASES:	0.40	\$ 220.00		
03/02/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.90	495.00	14500	20260597
	W FREDDIE MAC AGREEMENT.	0.50	470.00	14500	20200377
03/02/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.90	495.00	14500	20260599
DISCUS	SS FANNIE A GREEM ENT (.5); REVIEW DOC	.UMEN15 (.4).			
03/03/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.10	753.50	14500	20201053
	CIPATE IN CALL RE: EXECUTORY CONTRA DIAN AND K. DIBLASI.	ACTS WITH C. MARTIN	, C. SMITH, J. MAC	IEL, M. ARKO	),
03/03/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.30	819.00	14500	20118662
	RE FOR (.2) AND PARTICIPATE IN MEETIN N, C. SMITH, J. MACIEL, M. ARKO, J. GURD			ACTS WITH C	
03/03/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.10	605.00	14500	20262546
	D MEETING RE: EXECUTORY CONTRACT K. DIBLASI AND T. SAPEIKA.	CLAIMS WITH C. MAR	TIN, C. SMITH, J. M	MACIEL, M.	
03/05/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.60	330.00	14500	20262565
REVIE	W NORLEASE DOCUMENT.				
03/08/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.20	660.00	14500	20266893
	W NORLEASE DOCUMENTS.	1.20	000.00	14500	2020033
03/08/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.70	318.50	14500	20150399
DRAFI	NOTICE FOR CONTRACT REJECTION.				
03/10/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.20	110.00	14500	20266736
CORRE	SSPONDENCE RE: VENDOR CONTRACTS.				

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/11/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.10	693.00	14500	20145175
PARTIC	CIPATE IN EXECUTORY CONTRACTS CALL				
03/11/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.60	330.00	14500	20310572
PARTIA	L ATTENDANCE IN WEEKLY TEAM CALL	RE: CONTRACTS.			
03/11/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.70	385.00	14500	20266750
MEET I	RE: NORLEASE (.5); CORRESPOND RE: SAM	E (.2).			
03/11/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.30	591.50	14500	20283740
PARTIC	CIPATE IN WEEKLY TEAM CALL RE: TRADI RE FOR SAME (.2).	E AND EXECUTORY	CONTRACTS CLAIM	MS (1.1);	
03/12/10	Gurdian , Julio	0.10	55.00	14500	20266720
	SPOND RE: NORLEASE.				
03/15/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.70	385.00	14500	20267038
	RE: NORLEASE (.2); DRAFT NORLEASE NO				
03/15/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	14500	20170947
	E REJECTION NOTICE (NORLEASE) (.3); CO			21000	241.0317
02/16/10	Conding Inlin	0.90	495.00	14500	20266728
03/16/10 RESEA	Gurdian, Julio RCH RE: NORLEASE.	0.90	493.00	14500	20200720
		1.50	045.00	1.4500	20162504
03/17/10 PARTIO	DiBlasi, Kelly CIPATE IN WEEKLY EXECUTORY CONTRA	1.50 CTS CALL (1.0): REVI	945.00 (EW ISSUES RE: SA	14500 ME (.5).	20163584
LAKIK	SI ATE IN WEEKET EXECUTORY CONTING				
03/22/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.50	275.00	14500	20266940
REVIE	W ISSUES RE: NORLEASE EQUIPMENT REM	IOVAL.			
03/22/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	14500	20193480
EMAIL	S RE: NORLEASE REJECTION.				
03/23/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.00	550.00	14500	20266968
CALL	RE: NORLEASE (.5); PREPARE FOR SAME (.5	5).			
03/23/10	Sharma, Rabul	0.70	318.50	14500	20193482
EMAIL	S RE: NORLEASE (.2); CALL WITH TEAM RI	E: NORLEASE (.5).			
03/30/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.90	409.50	14500	20244795
	S AND CALLS RE: NORLEASE (.2); CONFER RE FOR SAME (.2).	ENCE CALL WITH NO	ORLEASE, JPM, AN	D W MI (.5);	
03/31/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.00	630.00	14500	20216542
	CIPATE IN CALL WITH R. SHARMA, ALVA RACTS CLAIMS.	REZ & MARSAL AND	CLIENT RE: EXECU	TORY	
03/31/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	14500	20322988

DATE TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT TASK TIME ID

CALL WITH K. DIBLASI, WMI, AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL RE: EXECUTORY CONTRACT AND TRADE CLAIMS.

CONTRAC	L TASK CODE 14500 - EXECUTORY TS:	20.70	\$ 11,422.00		
02 (00 /10	W. J. & Mil.	4.00	2,520.00	15100	20249086
03/08/10 DECEAD	Wright, Miles RCH RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS.	4.00	2,320.00	13100	20219000
RESEAR	CH RE. CEMING OBJECTIONS.				
	L TASK CODE 15100 - GENERAL	4.00	\$ 2,520.00		
CLAIMS M	IAIIERS:	7,00	<i>3 4,020</i>		.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
03/01/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.10	68.50	15600	20200679
CORRES	SPONDENCE WITH B. ROTHSCHILD RE: INDI	ENTURES FOR SEN	IOR SUBORD INATEI	NOTES.	
03/01/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.20	137.00	15600	20201090
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH G. QUINN RE: WMB NOT	ES.			
03/02/10	Sapeika, Tal	2,60	1,781.00	15600	20201220
PARTIC	TP ATE IN CALL RE: CONTRACTUAL SUBORI	DINATION WITH J.	GOULDING, J. MACI	EL, R. JAIN	
ANDD	SIM ONDS (2.2); CALL WITH AND EMAILS W SPONDENCE WITH J. GOULDING AND E. STA	ITH C. STAPEN RE:	CALL TO DISCUSS S	SAME (.2);	
CURRE	SPONDENCE WITH J. GOOLDING AND E. SEP	INGLAND RES. ESTA	<i>L</i> ().		
03/04/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.10	753.50	15600	20200655
EMAILS GOULD	S WITH C. STAPEN RE: SUBORDINATION ISS ING AND E. STANGLAND RE: SAME (.4); COI	UES AND CCB GUANFER WITH R. ENA	RANTEES (.4); EMA: YATI RE: SAME (.3).	ILS WITH J.	
03/04/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.30	165.00	15600	20262532
RESEA)	RCH AMENDED CLAIM ISSUE RE: CSC.				
03/04/10	Enayati, Robert	3.10	1,224.50	15600	2012136
	R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: SUBORDINATION IS	SSUES AND CCB GU	JARANTEES (3); RES	SEARCH SAM	Œ
(2.8).					
03/08/10	Stangland, Elaine	1.20	1,080.00	15600	2018751
REVIE	W SUBORDINATION PROVISIONS IN CCB GU	ARANTEES.			
03/08/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.30	205.50	15600	2031056
	W 510(B) SUBORD INATION OBJECTIONS.				
( (		2.00	1,145.50	15600	2013317
03/08/10	Enayati, Robert MEMORANDUM (.6); REVIEW E. STANGLAND	2.90	•		2013317
(1.3); R	EVISE MEMORANDUM (.6).	'S EDITS (A), COIN	JOCT ADDITIONAL		
03/09/10	Stangland, Elaine	0.60	540.00	15600	2018751
REVIE'	W MEMORANDUM RE: APPLICATION OF PA	YM ENTS.			
03/09/10	Stangland, Elaine	1.10	990.00	15600	2024013
TELEP	PHONE CALL WITH B. ROTHSCHILD RE: CCB LATED GUARANTEES AND INDENTURES (.3)	S AND PRIORITY (.	8); EMAIL RE: SAME	AND REVIEV	V
			585.00	15600	2039177
03/10/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	00.000	13000	20371//

DATE	TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CALL W	ITH J. SHIFFMAN RE 510B) OBJECTIONS.				
03/10/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.90	625.50	15600	20153012
CONFER RE: SAM	WITH V. JOHNSON AND K. DIBLASI RE: 5 IE (.6).	10(B) OBJECTIONS (.3	); PHONE CALL W	ITH B. ROSEN	
03/10/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.30	205.50	15600	20283125
	WITH J. SHIFFMAN AND K. DIBLASI RE:	STATUS OF 510(B) SUE	ORD INATION OB	JECTIONS.	
02/10/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.30	189.00	15600	20283129
03/10/10 CONFEI	R WITH J. SHIFFMAN AND V. JOHNSON RE				
			2 220 00	15600	20200721
03/17/10	Sapeika, Tal  R WITH B. ROTH SCHILD RE: CONTRACTU	3,40	2,329.00 SSUES (2.0): REVIE	*****	
CONFE	WITH B. ROTHSCHILD RE: CONTRACTOR	AL SOBORDINAL ION E	(2.0), 1	211 211111	
03/29/10	Yates, Erin	0.50	227.50	15600	20290156
NOTICE	VITH M. LEVITT (CHARTIS) RE: PROOFS OF OF WITHDRAWAL (.1); REVIEW CHARTIS FISH AND R. JAIN RE: SAME (.3).	F CLAIM (.1); DRAFT E S NOTICE OF WITHDRA	-MAIL TO M. LEVI AWAL AND CORRI	TT RE: FORM ESPONDENCE	
SUBT OTA PROCESS	L TASK CODE 15600 - CLAIMS ING/RECONCILIATION:	19.50	\$ 12,252.00		
03/01/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	15700	20430860
	R WITH J. SHIFFMAN, V. JOHNSON AND K	. DIBLASIRE: 510(B) S	UBORDINATION C	BJECTION.	
00/01/10	D. C. Delen	0.80	780.00	15700	20336783
03/01/10 MEETI	Rosen, Brian NG WITH A. STROCHAK, T. SAPEIKA AND		,		
MINI	Will M. Dittoolming 1. Dit amount				00000000
03/01/10	Rosen, Brian	1.30	1,267.50	15700	20336784
MEETI) CLAIM	NG WITH L. BAER, D. VENDITTI, P. REPAS S OBJECTIONS (.5); PARTICIPATE IN MEET	H, P. WENCELBLATT A	LUDING MARTIN RI	E; EMPLOTEE LAIM (.8).	
03/01/10	Baer, Lawrence	4.90	3,528.00	15700	20251155
ROSEN (SUBS) DRAFT SPREA CLAIM FROM SAPEII	P. REPASH RE: DEPOSITION NOTICE (.1); RE: STATUS (.1); ATTEND LITIGATION CITANTIVE) OBJECTION TO CLAIMS, WITNER OF DEBTORS' PRE-HEARING BRIEF; REVIDSHEET OF RESPONDING CLAIMANTS (.1) SHEARING (.7); EMAIL TO AND FROM T. SP. REPASH RE: COMMUNICATIONS WITH CARE: DEPOSITION (.1); REVIEW EMAILS ASH RE: 3/2/10 DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (CELBLAT AND C. MARTIN RE: EMPLOYER	LAIMS MEETING (.6); R SS DECLARATIONS, T IEW SAME (2.1); REVIE I); REVIEW POWERPOI SAPEIKA RE: EMPLOYI CLAIMANTS' COUNSE FROM P. REPASH RE: (.1); MEETING WITH B	LEVIEW 5TH OMN ESTIMONY OUTL: SW EMAIL FROM P NT PRESENT ATIO EE CLAIMS (.1) RE L (.1); REVIEW EM SAME (.1); REVIEV . ROSEN, D. VEND	IBUS INES AND 1. REPASH RE: N TO USE IN EVIEW EMAIL IAIL FROM T. V EMAIL FROM	1
03/01/10	Strochak, Adam	1.20	1,014.00	15700	20149788
REVIE	W FDIC PROOF OF CLAIM (.4); MEETING W RE: SAME (.8).	/ITH B. ROSEN, T. SAP	EIKA AND ALVAR	EZ & MARSAL	•
03/01/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.30	253.50	15700	20138640
CONE	ERENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: STATUS OF MAIL P. O'TOOLE AND J. MASTANDO RE: F	HEARING ON BONDH IEARING ON OBJECTIO	OLDERS CLAIMS A ON TO BONDHOLI	AND DISCOVE DERS' CLAIMS	RY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/01/10	Levine, Alexander	5.00	2,975.00	15700	20126678
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CI E: CLAIM OBJECTION STATUS (.8); RESEA	AIM (3.7); CONFEREI RCH RE: CLAIM OB JI	NCE CALL WITH LI ECTIONS (.5).	TIGATION	
03/01/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	2.30	1,184.50	15700	20127298
WITHP	OBJECTIONS TO S. BURR, HUDSON AND FOUTOOLE RE: SAME (2); CORRESPONDENTION TO DINAPLES PROOF OF CLAIM (.4);	CE WITH P. OTOOLE	, A. NG, AND K. DII	BLASI RE:	3
03/01/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.60	417.00	15700	20123701
ATTEND	LITIGATION CLAIMS MEETING RE: STA	rus.			
03/01/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.40	973.00	15700	20123792
REVISE	SECTION 510(B) OBJECTION TO ERISA/SE N AND K. DIBLASI RE 510(B) SUB ORDINA	CURITIES MDL CLAI TION OBJECTION (.6	M (.8); CONFER WIT ).	гн в. rosen,	V.
03/01/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.60	411.00	15700	20268167
CONFEI STATUS	R WITH B. ROSEN, K. DIBLASI AND J. SHIF	FMAN RE: 510(B) SUI	BORDINATION OBJ	ECTIONS AND	)
03/01/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.80	1,233.00	15700	20118462
PARTIC	IPATE IN MEETING RE: CLAIMS, INCLUDI	NG MARTA CLAIMS	(.8); REVIEW SAME	(1.0).	
03/01/10	Repash, Philip	10.30	7,055.50	15700	20138346
PRESEN REVISE REVIEV VENDI	RE FOR EMPLOYEE HEARING (1.6); TELEP ITATION AND POTENTIAL TESTIMONY (.2 EXHIBITS, PRESENTATION AND DECLAR V OF CHART (.3); FINALIZE DECLARATION TTI, P. WENCELBLAT AND C. MARTIN RE: VITH L. BAER RE: DEPOSITION NOTICE (.2	B); DRAFT PRE-HEAR LATIONS (4.8); EMAIL I (1.6); MEETING WIT EMPLOYEE CLAIMS	ING BRIEF (1.0); RE S WITH POTENTIA H B. ROSEN, L. BAI	VIEW AND L WITNESS AI ER, D.	ND
03/01/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.90	616.50	15700	20200845
CORRE B. ROSE	SPONDENCE WITH B. ROSEN AND A. STR EN, A. STROCHAK AND ALVAREZ & MARS	OCHAK RE: FDIC PRO AL TEAM RE: SAME	OF OF CLAIM (.1); (.8).	MEETING WIT	H
03/01/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	2.80	1,960.00	15700	20135734
CONFE REVISE OBJECT REVIEN	HONE CONFERENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD-BRENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY RESES.BURR AND HUDSON OBJECTIONS (1.1) CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SMW AND REVISE SAME (.9); TELEPHONE CONCLUDERS' CLAIM AND DISCOVERY (.2).	: S. BURR AND HUDS ); CORRESPONDENCE ITH AND C. MARTIN	ON OBJECTIONS (.2 WITH GOODWIN I RE: OBJECTION RE	2); REVIEW A1 RE: ALEXAND VISIONS (.1);	ND ER
03/01/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.60	378.00	15700	20309856
CONFE	R WITH B. ROSEN, V. JOHNSON AND J. SH	IFFMAN RE: 510(B) S	UBORDINATION OI	BJECTION.	
03/01/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.10	1,323.00	15700	20107573
ISSUES FOR FII FORW A OBJECT ISSUES	W AND COMMENT ON MEMORANDUM FRE: NOTICE OF BONDHOLDER CLAIM OF LING (.1); PARTICIPATE IN LITIGATION CLARD DRAFT CLAIM OBJECTION TO C. SMITION (.1); REVIEW ISSUES RE: MELLON ALTON (.2); CALL WITH P. GURFEIN RE: EMPLOYAN RE: CLAIMS (.2); ATTENTION TO SAMI	BJECTION AND FORW LAIMS MEETING WIT TH (.1); CALL WITH C ND CASSESE CLAIMS TEE CLAIMS (.1); CON	'ARD SAME TO LOG H WGM TEAM ANI :. JANG RE: 23RD OI (.2); REVIEW LITIO	CAL COUNSEI D CLIENT (.6); MNIBUS CLAI BATION CLAIN	M

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/01/10	Venditti, Daniel	10.70	6,741.00	15700	20120087
MEETING CLAIMS AT CLAI	NG/REVISING PRE-HEARING BRIEF (5.0); NG WITH B. ROSEN, L. BAER, P. REPASH, POBJECTIONS (.5); DRAFTING C. MARTIN MS OBJECTIONS HEARING (2.0); DRAFTING ATION (.7).	. WENCELBLAT, C. M DECLARATION (2.0);	ARTIN RE: STATUS DRAFTING POWERF	OF EMPLOYE:	E E
03/01/10	Ng, Alexander	0.10	59.50	15700	20116992
CONFER	ENCE CALL WITH P. GURFEIN RE: CLAIM	IS OBJECTIONS.			
03/01/10	Wencelblat, Patricia	2.40	1,428.00	15700	20216422
MEET W OBJECT	TTH B.ROSEN, L. BAER, P. REPASH, D. VE TONS (.5); MEET WITH D. VENDITTI TO DI	ENDITTI AND C. MAR' SCUSS BRIEF (.5); RES	TIN RE: EMPLOYEE SEARCH SAME (1.4).	CLAIMS	
03/01/10	Gurdian, Julio	2.80	1,540.00	15700	20260589
AND R. S	24TH AND 25TH OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJE SHARMA RE: SAME (.2); CONFER WITH R. SHARMA RE: SAME (.2).	CTIONS (2.1); CORRE SHARMA RE: SAME (	SPONDENCE WITH .3); CONFER WITH F	M. CURRO K. DIBLASI	
03/01/10	Mishkin, Jessie	0.90	495.00	15700	20124114
	S ADDITIONAL CITES AND REVISIONS TO MAN (.1); ATTEND LITIGATION CLAIMS N		LICING OBJECTION	DRAFT WITH	
03/01/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.90	1,319.50	15700	20127347
SAME (.: DIBLAS	TION TO OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTION IS 5); PARTIAL PARTICIPATION IN LITIGATI I AND J. GURDIAN RE: CLAIMS (.2); CONF MNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.6); REVIE	ON CLAIMS TEAM M ER WITH J. GURDIAN	EETING (3); CONFE RE: SAME (.3); REV	R WITH K. ISE 24TH AND	
03/01/10	Sherman, Rachel	2.30	1,046.50	15700	20125498
DRAFT/ LITIGAT OBJECT	REVISE CLAIM OBJECTION (1.2); REVIEW FION TEAM MEETING (.6); CALLS WITH J. ION (.1).	DOCKET AND RELEVISI	VANT ORDERS (.4); ONS TO DISCRETIO	ATTEND NARY PRICIN	G
03/01/10	Veit, Cheri	2.80	1,274.00	15700	20124507
RESEAR	CH RE: COLLATERAL EST OPPEL.				
03/01/10	Amponsah, Duke	1.20	240.00	15700	20132448
	I CLAIMS REGISTER FOR CLAIMS FILED . REPLIES TO 5TH AND 6TH OMNIBUS OB		E DUFF LITIGATION	(.4); SEND P.	
03/01/10	Swaney, Nicole	9.10	1,638.00	15700	20161825
UPCOM BONUS	', ORGANIZE AND COMPILE OMNIBUS OF ING FILING (6.1); REVIEW, ORGANIZE AN AGREEMENTS RELATED TO SPECIFIC CL IMANT JOHN H. MURPHY'S DOCUMENT F	D COMPILE CHANGE AIMANTS (1.5); PREP	IN CONTROL AND ARE DOCUMENTS I	RETENTION	
03/02/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	15700	20336618
MEMOR	ANDUM TO A. LEVINE RE: AGNES BASSI	MAN.			
03/02/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.70	504.00	15700	20250870
(.1); RE	V DECLARATION (.1); REVIEW EMAIL FRO VIEW REVISED DRAFT AFFIDAVIT (.2); EN CE TO BE PRESENTED AT HEARING ON (	MAIL FROM M. JOYCE	RE: DEPOSITIONS	AGREEMENT (.1); REVIEW	S

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/02/10	Strochak, Adam	0.20	169.00	15700	20149854
PHONE	CALL WITH A. LEVINE RE: TRANQUILITY C	CLAIMS.			
03/02/10	Levine, Alexander	6.60	3,927.00	15700	20126524
CALL W	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAVITH A. STROCHAK RE: TRANQUILITY CLAINON (.1).	AIM (4.3); RESEAR CH IMS (.2); CALL WITH	I RE: CLAIM OBJEC K. DIBLASI RE: CL	CTIONS (2.0); AIM	
03/02/10	Bosshar d-Blacke y, Elizabeth	0.80	412.00	15700	20127275
REVISE SAME (	E OBJECTIONS TO HUDSON AND S. BURR PR.1).	COOFS OF CLAIM (.7)	; CALL WITH P. OT	TOOLE RE:	
03/02/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	2.70	1,876.50	15700	20123796
REVISE JOHNSO	E SECTION 510(B) OBJECTION TO ERISA/SEC ON AND K. DIBLASI RE: 510(B) SUBORDINA?	CURITIES MDL CLAIN FION OBJECTION (.8	M (1.9); CONFER W ).	ITH V.	
03/02/10	Johnson, Virginia	2.20	1,507.00	15700	20118463
	W/REVISE 510(B) SUBORDINATION OBJECTI SI RE: SAME (.8).	ONS (1.4); CONFER V	WITH J. SHIFFMAN	AND K.	
03/02/10	Repash, Philip	7.40	5,069.00	15700	20154169
FOR DI BRIEF ( BAER I	SSION WITH M. JOYCE (MURPHY'S COUNSE SCUSSION WITH M. SPITTELL RE: HIS DECI (2.8); REVISE M. SPITTELL DECLARATION A RE: CHANGE IN CONTROL AGREEMENT, DE TTI AND M. SPITTELL RE: M. SPITTELL'S DE	ARATION (1.4); RES ND PREPARE EXHIB CLARATIONS AND F	EARCH AND EDIT SITS FOR SAME (1.2 EVIDENCE (.4); CAI	PRE-HEARING !); EMAILS TO	
03/02/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	0.80	560,00	15700	20270419
CONFE	R WITH J. SHIFFMAN AND V. JOHNSON RE:	510(B) SUBORDINA	TION OBJECTION.		
03/02/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	3.30	2,310.00	15700	20136069
CORRE WITH (	W S. BURR AND HUDSON DRAFTS (1.1); CAL SPONDENCE WITH Q&E RE: DISCOVERY RI GOODWIN RE: ALEXANDER OBJECTION (.1) RENCE WITH Q&E RE: DISCOVERY REQUES	ESPONSES (.2); REVI ; REVIEW ALEXAND	EW SAME (.7); COR	RESPONDENC	CE B
03/02/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.70	441.00	15700	20116469
	WITH A. LEVINE RE: CLAIM OBJECTION (.1) ERS (.1).	; REVIEW SAME (.5);	EMAIL WGM TEA!	M RE: CLAIM	
03/02/10	Venditti, Daniel	2.40	1,512.00	15700	20119876
DRAFT SPITTE	DIRECT EXAMINATION OF C. MARTIN (1.1 LL DECLARATION AND EXHIBITS (1.3).	); CALL WITH P. REF	PASH AND M. SPITT	TELL RE:	
03/02/10	Ng, Alexander	3.00	1,785.00	15700	20116993
DRAFT	CLAIMS OBJECTION.				
03/02/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.30	165.00	15700	20260596
CALL I	RE: NY C AGREEMENT (.2); CONFER WITH M	. MILLS RE: SAME (.	1).		
03/02/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.70	385.00	15700	20260595
CORRE	ESPONDENCE AND CALLS RE: VERIZON PRO	OOF OF CLAIM.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/02/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	15700	20246384
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH R. SHARMA RE: RELIZ	ON CLAIM.			
03/02/10	Mills, Marvin	0.40	158.00	15700	20246680
CONFE	R WITH B. BRENNAN (NYC) RE: NYC STIP AN RE: SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WIT	ULATION REDUCING ( TH B. BRENNAN RE: SA	CLAIM (.2); CONFE	R WITH J.	
03/02/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	15700	20127355
	V 24TH AND 25TH OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS ECTION TO FIRST AMERICAN CLAIM (.2)		. WITH M. ARKO A	ND M. CURRO	1
03/02/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	15700	20270420
2010 (.6	CT CLAIMANTS AND CONFIRM ADJOURN ); DRAFT LETTER TO C. NATHAN RE: ADJ TO APRIL 21, 2010 (.4).	NMENT OF HEARING O OURNMENT OF HEAR	ON THEIR CLAIMS ING ON OBJECTION	FO APRIL 21, N TO HIS	
03/02/10	Sherman, Rachel	2.20	1,001.00	15700	20125495
DRAFT	REVISE CLAIM OBJECTION (1.8); EMAILS	WITH J. MISHKIN ANI	D K. DIBLASI RE: S	SAME (.4).	
03/02/10	Swaney, Nicole	4.40	792.00	15700	20162056
REVIEV	W, ORGANIZE AND COMPILE OMNIBUS OF			O BE USED IN	
03/03/10	Levine, Alexander	6.00	3,570.00	15700	20126487
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF	CLAIM (5.3); RESEAR CH	H RE: SAME (.7).		
03/03/10	Bosshar d-Blackey, Elizabeth	0.10	51.50	15700	20127278
	E OBJECTIONS TO S. BURR AND HUDSON	PROOFS OF CLAIM.			
03/03/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	2,80	1,946.00	15700	20123799
REVISI	E SECTION 510(B) OBJECTION TO ERISA/S COSEN RE: SAME (2.1); CONFER WITH V. J	ECURITIES MDL CLAI	M AND DRAFT CO		
03/03/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.90	1,301.50	15700	20118464
	W/REVISE 510(B) SUBORDINATION OB JEC	CTIONS (1.2); CONFER	WITH J. SHIFFMAN	RE: SAME (.7	).
03/03/10	Repash, Philip	6.80	4,658.00	15700	20157197
	RE FOR EMPLOYEE CLAIMS OBJECTION		1,000.00		
			2 522 22	1.5700	20126074
03/03/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	3.60	2,520.00	15700	20136074
ALEX/ WITH	E DISCOVERY RESPONSES (1.1); REVIEW ANDER OBJECTION (1.1); CORRESPONDEN C. SMITH AND C. MARTIN RE: SAME (.1); PDATE LITIGATION CHARTS RE: STATUS	NCE WITH GOODWIN R CORRESPONDENCE W	LE: SAME (.1); COR	RESPONDENC	E
03/03/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.50	315.00	15700	20118695
	W AND COMMENT ON MEMORANDUM A ATION CLAIMS (.1).	NALYZING POTENTIA	L CLAIMS (4); RE	VIEW ISSUES I	RE:
03/03/10	Venditti, Daniel	1.50	945.00	15700	20126022
	WING AND COMMENTING ON PRE-HEAR	ING BRIEF.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/03/10	Ng, Alexander	8.90	5,295.50	15700	20131781
DRAFT (	CLAIMS OBJECTION.				
03/03/10	Wenc elblat, Patricia	0.10	59.50	15700	20218030
REVIEW	EMAILS RE: DISCOVERY.				
03/03/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.40	220.00	15700	20262548
REVIEW	CLAIM OBJECTIONS.				
03/03/10	Mishkin, Jessie	2.00	1,100.00	15700	20124132
DISCUS!	S AND REVISE DISCRETIONARY PRICING S EDITS TO DISCRETIONARY PRICING B	DECLARATION FOR C RIEF OBJECTION WITH	:. SMITH SIGNATU R. SHERMAN (1.0)	RE (1.0);	
03/03/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	15700	20246892
REVIEW	AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE	WITH B. BRENNAN (N)	(C) RE: SETTLEME	ENT.	
03/03/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	15700	20247238
CONFE	R WITH MICHIGAN COURT CLERK RE: DO	OYLE CLAIM.			
03/03/10	Sherman, Rachel	2.20	1,001.00	15700	20125493
DRAFT	AND REVISE CLAIM OBJECTION (1.2); CA	ALLS WITH J. MISHKIN	RE: SAME (1.0).		
03/03/10	Potter, Lougran	0.70	140.00	15700	20204391
REVIEV	OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAIM.				
03/03/10	Swaney, Nicole	4.90	882.00	15700	20162046
REVIEW UPCOM	, ORGANIZE AND COMPILE OMNIBUS O	BJE CTION MATERIALS	S AND EXHIBITS T	O BE USED IN	
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	15700	20336567
MEMO I CLARK SAME (	RANDUM TO B. FINESTONE RE: BANK BOE RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW B. FINESTONE (.1).	ONHO LDER EXTENSION REQUEST (.1); MEMOR.	N (.2); MEMORAND ANDUM TO B. FIN	OUM TO J. ESTONE RE:	
03/04/10	Baer, Lawrence	1.40	1,008.00	15700	20250744
REVIEV REPASI (.1).	W EMAIL TO AND FROM P. REPASH ATTA H RE: COORDINATING WITH WITNESSES	ACHING PRE-HEARING (.1); EMAIL TO AND FI	BRIEF (1.2); EMAI ROM P. REPASH RI	L FROM P. E: SUBPOENA	
03/04/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.80	1,557.00	15700	20273512
ASSIGN	IMENT OF CLAIMS ANALYSIS.				
03/04/10	Zalenski, Walter	1.70	1,436.50	15700	20249795
REVIE ALEXA	W REVISIONS TO ALEXANDER PROOF OF NOTE OF THE NEW PROOF OF THE NEW PROOF OF THE PROOF OF THE NEW PROOF OF TH	F CLAIM (1.5); TELEPHO	ONE CALL WITH P	. O'TOOLE RE:	
03/04/10	Mastando, III, John	0.40	328.00	15700	20237253
REVIE	W REVISED LITIGATION CLAIMS CHART	`.			
03/04/10	Levine, Alexander	6.50	3,867.50	15700	20126706

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ND REVISE OBJECTIONS TO PROOF OF CLAIM	1S (6.2); CONFER	ENCE WITH J. WRI	GHT RE:	
03/04/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	0.40	206.00	15700	20127283
OF DOCT	ONE CONFERENCE WITH P.O'TOOLE AND ATT IMENTS IN BONDHOLDER PROCEEDING (2); T ); UPDATING OF CLAIMS CHART TO REFLECT	'ELEPHONE CON	IFERENCE WITH P.	OTOOLE RE:	
03/04/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.50	347.50	15700	20123680
CONFER	WITH V. JOHNSON RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS.				
03/04/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.50	342.50	15700	20127508
	WITH J. SHIFFMAN RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS.				
03/04/10	Repash, Philip	10.10	6,918.50	15700	20157202
EMAILS	AND DISCUSSIONS WITH M. SPITTELL RE: DE L EXHIBITS (1.0); ADDITIONAL RESEARCH RE: E CROSS-EXAMINATIONS (2.1); CALL WITH LO	CLARATION (.8)	; REVISE SAME (1.6 BRIEF (1.6); REVISE	E SAME (1.6);	
03/04/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	2.20	1,540.00	15700	20135975
E. BOSSI	E FOR AND ATTEND TEAM CALL (.3); TELEPHO HARD-BLACKEY RE: DISCOVERY RESPONSES BY RE: SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WILLIAM (.6); REVISE S. E	(.2); TELEPHONI /ITH W. ZALENS	E CALL WITH E. BC KIRE: ALEXANDE	SSHARD- R OBJECTION	
03/04/10	Venditti, Daniel	6.00	3,780.00	15700	20125918
	OP DEFENSE TO EMPLOYEE CLAIMS PURSUAN AGREEMENTS.	T TO CHANGE I	N CONTROL AND I	RETENTION	
03/04/10	Wright, Miles	2.90	1,827.00	15700	20249084
EDIT TR	ANQUILITY OBJECTION (2.6); CONFERENCE W	ITH A. LEVINE	RE: SAME (.3).		
03/04/10	Ng, Alexander	1.10	654.50	15700	20131794
	CLAIMS OBJECTION (.8); CALL WITH J. GURDI.	AN RE: REPLIES	(.1); DRAFT EMAIL	S RE: REPLIES	
03/04/10	Wencelblat, Patricia	3.50	2,082.50	15700	20218084
REVIEW WEINST	ODOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION TO CLAIMA EIN (1.5); REVIEW DRAFT PRODUCTION (1.8);	NTS:ESCENBAC EMAILS WITH N	CH, GRAU-IVERSEN . SWANEY RE: DIS	I, AND COVERY (.2).	
03/04/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.70	385.00	15700	20262533
REVIEW	LITIGATION/WRONG PARTY CLAIMS (.6); CA	LL WITH A. NG	RE: SAME (.1).		
03/04/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	15700	20127326
EMAILS	RE: PROOF OF CLAIM FORM AND AMENDMEN	NTS TO CLAIMS			
03/04/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.90	864.50	15700	20127323
AND 25	V LITIGATION CLAIMS AND UPDATE LITIGATI THOMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.6); EMAII LDS LAYTON & FINGER RE: CLAIMS (.1).	ION CLAIMS STA LS RE: LITIGATIO	ATUS CHART (.7); R ON CLAIMS (.5); CA	EVISE 24TH ALL WITH	
03/04/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.30	60.00	15700	20166272
SEND P	. REPASH ALL WITNESS LISTS SUBMITTED BY	CLAIMANTS.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/04/10	Swaney, Nicole	7.50	1,350.00	15700	20161998
REQUES	RE DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO ESCHE STS (4.3); REVIEW, ORGANIZATION AND HIBITS TO BE USED IN UPCOMING FILIN	COMPILATION OF OM	ND GRAU-IVERSEI NIBUS OBJECTION	NS DOCUMEN MATERIALS	VT
03/05/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	15700	20336571
MEMOR	RANDUM TO J. CLARKE RE: EXTENSION	ON BANK BONHOLDE	R OBJECTION.		
03/05/10	Rosen, Brian	0.70	682.50	15700	20400816
CONFE	R WITH J. SHIFFMAN AND V. JOHNSON R	E: 510(B) SUBORDINAT	TION OBJECTIONS.		
03/05/10	Rosen, Brian	0.70	682.50	15700	20512906
MEETIN MASTA	IG RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS OBJECTION NDO.	WITH K. DIBLASI, R. SI	HARMA, J. GURDIA	N, A. NG AND	J.
03/05/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.30	297.00	15700	20274051
	R WITH W. HORTON RE: CLAIMS.				
03/05/10	Baer, Lawrence	4.90	3,528.00	15700	20250276
RE: SAN REVIEV	NG (.7); EMAIL FROM P. REPASH RE: PRE- ME (.4); REVIEW WITNESS LISTS (.2); REV W ASSIGNMENT AGREEMENT (.3); REVIE NSTRATIVE EXHIBIT (.5); CONFER WITH	TIEW LITIGATION CLA W WITNESS DECLARA P. REPASH RE: SAME (.	IMS SUMMARY CH. TION AND EXHIBE 5) AND BRIEF (.6).	ART (.2); FS (.6); REVIE	3 <b>W</b>
03/05/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.30	259.50	15700	20310016
CONFE	RENCE WITH S. GOLDRING RE: CLAIMS.				
03/05/10	Mastando, III, John	0.90	738.00	15700	20237682
ATTEN (.2).	D TEAM MEETING RE: LITIGATION CLA	IMS (.7); REVIEW REVI	SED LITIGATION C	LAIMS CHAR	Γ
03/05/10	Mastando, III, John	1.80	1,476.00	15700	20237683
REVIEV	W RESPONSES TO BONDHOLDER OBJECT	TIONS.			
03/05/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.20	169.00	15700	20138654
REVIE	W EM AILS RE: BONDHOLDERS' REPLY BI	RIEF.	•		
03/05/10	Levine, Alexander	7.00	4,165.00	15700	20126680
DRAFT OBJECT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF FION STATUS (.7); TELEPHONE CALL WI	CLAIM (6.0); ATTEND V TH J. MISHKIN RE: MA	V GM TEAM MEETI RTA CLAIMS (.3).	NG RE: CLAIN	1
03/05/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	2.20	1,133.00	15700	20127361
CORRE	W OF BARBER RESPONSE TO WMI'S OBJI SPONDENCE WITH A. NG RE: SAME (.2); TO BARBER'S RESPONSE (.7); REVISE OF	CONFERENCE WITH N	. VAISHNAV RE: PR	REPARATION (.6).	OF
03/05/10	Vaishnav, Neil	0.70	276.50	15700	20125944
	WITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY RE: PREP. S OBJECTION.	ARATION OF REPLY TO	D BARBER'S RESPO	NSE RE:	
03/05/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.70	486.50	15700	20274697

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CONFE	R WITH B. ROSEN AND V. JOHNSON RE:	510(B) SUBORDINATION	OBJECTIONS.		
03/05/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.00	695.00	15700	20153085
LITIGA	LITIGATION CLAIMS CHART FOR LITIC FION TEAM MEETING (.7); DRAFT AND F I RE: SAME (.1).	SATION CLAIMS MEETII LEVIEW CORRESPONDE	NG (.2); PARTICIPA NCE FROM V. JOH	ATE IN NSON AND K.	
03/05/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.70	479.50	15700	20310557
CONFE REVISIO	R WITH B. ROSEN AND J. SHIFFMAN RE: DNS.	510(B) SUBORDINATION	NOBJECTIONS/ST.	ATUS OF	
03/05/10	Johnson, Virginia	3.80	2,603.00	15700	20127476
P. OTO	V OPPOSITIONS TO OBJECTION TO BONI OLE RE: SAME (.8); REVISE LITIGATION I AND A. NG RE: SAME (.3).	DHOLDER CLAIMS (1.8); CLAIMS SUMMARY CHA	EMAIL CORRESP ARTS (.9); CONFER	ONDENCE WIT WITH K.	rH
03/05/10	Repash, Philip	9.60	6,576.00	15700	20157076
HEARIN BRIEF A DECLA	WITH C. MARTIN RE: PREPARATION FOR NG (1.8); CALLS WITH LOCAL COUNSEL A AND EXAMINATION OUTLINES (1.8); FIN RATION (2.0); CONFER WITH L. BAER RE R WITH L. BAER RE: DEMONSTRATIVE E	AND OPPOSING COUNSI ALIZE DECLARATION A : SAME (.4); ATTEND LI'	EL RE: SAME (1.0); ND EXHIBITS FOI FIGATION TEAM N	FINALIZE RM. SPITTELL	
03/05/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	3.90	2,730.00	15700	20135775
DISCO	IONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FINESTONE VERY REQUESTS (2.2); REVISE S. BURR A MEETING (.7).	RE: OBJECTIONS AND ND HUDSON OBJECTIO	DISCOVERY (.1); I NS (.9); ATTEND I	REVISE LITIGATION	
03/05/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.30	819.00	15700	20126550
PARTIC A. NG A	TPATE IN LITIGATION CLAIMS MEETING AND V. JOHNSON RE: LITIGATION CLAIM	G (.7); EMAIL WGM TEA IS SUMMARY CHARTS (	M RE: SAME (.1); ( .3); ATTENTION T	CONFER WITH O SAME (.2).	[
03/05/10	Venditti, Daniel	6.20	3,906.00	15700	20126935
	D. LOGAN DIRECT EXAMINATION (1.0); ZE EXHIBITS TO M. SPITTELL DECLARA		DISCOVERY RESPO	ONSES (2.0);	
03/05/10	Ng, Alexander	2.50	1,487.50	15700	20131871
SHARM	D MEETING RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS OF IA AND J. GURDIAN (.7); EMAIL A. LEVIN INFER WITH V. JOHNSON AND K. DIBLAS	IE RE: REPLIES (.2); REV	ISE LITIGATION C	CLAIMS CHAR'	Γ
03/05/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.00	550.00	15700	20262564
MEETI	NG WITH LITIGATION TEAM RE: LITIGA	TION CLAIMS (.7); UPDA	ATE RE: SAME (.3).		
03/05/10	Mishkin, Jessie	1.50	825.00	15700	20126009
ATTEN LEVINI	D WEEKLY LITIGATION TEAM MEETING E (.3); RE VIEW WMB NOTEHOLDER S' OP	G (.7); DISCUSS MARTA POSITION TO OBJECTIO	CLAIMS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS (.5).	ON WITH A.	
03/05/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.70	318.50	15700	20127344
	D BI-WEEKLY LITIGATION CLAIMS TEA	M MEETING.			
03/05/10	Sherman, Rachel	0.50	227.50	15700	20125307

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW (.2).	PLAINTIFF'S MOTION (3); EMAILS WITH	J. MASTANDO AND J.	. MISHKIN RE: CAS	E STRATEGY	
03/05/10	Veit, Cheri	0.70	318.50	15700	20126802
PREPAR	E FOR AND PARTICIAPTE IN WEEKLY LIT	GATION CLAIMS ME	EETING.		
03/05/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.10	45.50	15700	20149217
EMAILS	WITH A. LEVINE RE: AGNES AND BASSM	AN DOCKET UPD ATE	S.		
03/05/10	Castillero, Francene	0.90	171.00	15700	20204413
FINAL	FE-MAIL FROM S. LEONARD RE: FINAL CITE-CHECK OF WAMU BRIEFS (.2); COMMOITE-CHECK OF WAMU BRIEFS (.1); COMPACK AND BLUEBOOK OF BRIEFS AND CO	UNICATIONS WITH E	E, BOSSHARD-BLAG AND EDITS FROM I	CKEY KE: PRELIMINARY	
03/05/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.60	120.00	15700	20166333
OBTAIN CLAIMS	N RESPONSES TO DEBTORS CORRECTED T S AND SEND TO B. ROSEN AND OTHER IN	WENTIETH OMNIBU TERESTED PARTIES.	S (SUBSTANTIVE)	OBJECTIONS T	ro
03/05/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	1.20	216.00	15700	20129523
PROCU BOSSH	REMENT OF EXHIBITS TO OPPOSITION BE ARD-BLACKEY AND S. LEONARD ATTACE	RIEF (1.0); PREPARATI IING MODIFIED OPPO	ON OF E-MAIL TO SITION BRIEF ANI	P. OTOOLE, E EXHIBITS (.2	 2).
03/05/10	Van Kampen, Allison	0.80	144.00	15700	20204968
PREPAI DOCUM	RE DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO CLAIMA MENT REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION.	NTS WEINSTEIN, BEI	NNET AND GRAU-I	VERSEN'S	
03/05/10	Van Kampen, Allison	2.50	450.00	15700	20204967
REVIE	W, ORGANIZE AND COMPILE OMNIBUS OF	BJECTION MATERIAL	S AND EXHIBITS.		
03/05/10	Axon, Hillary	0.30	54.00	15700	20205370
REVIE	W EMAILS WITH S. LEONARD RE: OBJECT	ION TO HUDSON AND	S. BURR CLAIMS.		
03/06/10	Rosen, Brian	3.40	3,315.00	15700	20336496
	W OF BANK BONDHOLDER RESPONSES (3.	1); CALL WITH C. SM	ITH RE: SAME (.3).		
03/06/10	Mastando, III, John	2.60	2,132.00	15700	20237687
REVIE	W RESPONSES TO BONDHOLDER CLAIM ( HOLDER CLAIMS (.4).	OBJECTIONS (2.2); CA	LL WITH T. FRONG	HILLO RE:	
03/06/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.40	338.00	15700	20138660
TELEP CLAIM	HONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MASTANDO IS (.4).	RE: HEARING ON OB	ECTION TO BOND	HOLDERS'	
03/06/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	3.50	2,450.00	15700	20135779
REVIE	W BONDHOLDERS' CLAIM OBJECTIONS.				
03/06/10	Wright, Miles	3.50	2,205.00	15700	20132193
	E CLAIMS OBJECTIONS.				
03/07/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	15700	20336504

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
MEMOF SAME (	RANDUM TO L. BAER RE: EMPLOYEE CLA 3); MEMORANDUM TO L. BAER RE: ADJO	IMS (.1); MEMORANDU URNMENT (.1).	M TO B. KOSTURO	DS, ET. AL. RE	:
03/07/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.40	288.00	15700	20250778
ATTAC	S TO AND FROM B. ROSEN RE: HEARING S HING EMAILS FROM C. MARTIN RE: SAM NG (.1); EMAIL TO B. ROSEN RE: ADJOURN	E (.1); EMAIL TO TEAM	RE: ADJOURNMEN	REPASH NT OF	
03/07/10	Levine, Alexander	1.20	714.00	15700	20130610
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF C	LAIM.			
03/07/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	3.50	2,450.00	15700	20135780
	W BONDHOLDERS' OBJECTIONS.		,		
03/07/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.20	126.00	15700	20130061
	M. SPITTELL RE: LITIGATION CLAIM.	0.20			
		1.00	550.00	15700	20139285
03/07/10	Mishkin, Jessie ZE BANK BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITION E	1,00 DIEE TO PROOF OF CL.	550.00 AIM OBJECTION A		
	ARGUMENTS.	KIDI TOTKOOT OF ODA			
03/08/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	15700	20336621
REVIE	W MOODY'S LETTER.				
03/08/10	Baer, Lawrence	3.40	2,448.00	15700	20250784
TELEPI HEARI RE: SA ADJOU (.1); EN HEARI CLAIM	S TO AND FROM P. REPASH RE: ADJOURN HONE CALLS WITH P. REPASH RE: SAME ( NG (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH K. DIBLA ME (.7); EMAIL FROM P. REPASH RE: REIN FRNMENT (.1); EMAILS FROM P. REPASH A MAIL FROM P. REPASH TO M. BENNETT CO NG (.1); EMAIL FROM P. REPASH ATTACH IS HEARING AND REVIEW SAME (.1); CAL G RE: APPLICATION FOR ADJOURNMENT	(1.1) EMAILS TO AND FI ASI RE: SAME (.2); TELE MBURSING CLAIMANTS ATTACHING EMAILS FR ONFIRMING MR. ESCHE ING SCHEDULING ORD L WITH C. JANG RE: AD	ROM K. DIBLASI R PHONE CALL WIT FOR EXPENSES A OM M. IVERSEN R NBACH'S CONSEN DER FOR THE 3/15/1 DJOURNMENT (.3);	E: 3/15 H P. REPASH RISING FROM E: HEARING IT TO ADJOU! O EMPLOYEE	RN
03/08/10	Mastando, III, John	0.70	574.00	15700	2023758
CALL	WITH T. FRONGILLO AND P. O'TOOLE RE: W RESPONSES TO BONDHOLDER CLAIM	BONDHOLDER CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.4).	S AND REPLY BRIE	EFS (.3);	
03/08/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.60	507.00	15700	2013866
CONF	HONE CONFERENCE WITH P.O'TOOLE RIERENCE WITH J. MASTANDO AND P. OTO HOLDER CLAIM (.3).	E: BONDHOLDERS' OPP OLE RE: PREPARATION	OSITION BRIEF (.3 I OF REPLY BRIEF	); TELEPHON S AND	В
03/08/10	Levine, Alexander	7.20	4,284.00	15700	2013333
DRAF? (.3); CA	r and revise objection to proof of alls with d. Zielke re: Same (.4); Call	CLAIM (6.4); CONFEREN L WITH K. DIBLASI RE:	NCES WITH J. WRIG CLAIM OBJECTION	GHT RE: SAM N (.1).	E
03/08/10	Bosshar d-Blacke y, Elizabeth	0.50	257.50	15700	2013393
	W AND REVISE OBJECTIONS TO HUDSON S. IALUNA RE: SAME (.1).	AND S. BURR PROOFS	OF CLAIM (.4); CC	NFERENCE	
03/08/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.10	434.50	15700	2015310
	T BARBERS INSERT TO TWENTIETH OMN	IBUS (SUBSTANTIVE) (	DBJECTION TO CLA	AIMS.	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/08/10	Vaishnav, Neil	3.60	1,422.00	15700	20153444
ANALY	ZE BACKGROUND MATERIALS RE: HUDSON A	AND S. BURR PRO	OFS OF CLAIM.		
03/08/10	Chandis, Vanessa	5.00	2,750.00	15700	20171797
REVIEW BOND H	RESPONSES BY BONDHOLDERS, JPMC AND OLDERS PROOFS OF CLAIMS (CLAIMS 3710, 3	FDIC TO DEBTOR 711 AND 2480).	S'OBJECTION TO T	THE	
03/08/10	Johnson, Virginia	3.10	2,123.50	15700	20133238
REVIEW SAME (.	7 BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITIONS TO CLAIMS ( 7); CONFER WITH C. VEIT RE: COLLATERAL F	OBJECTION (1.9); ( EST OPPEL/AD VER	CONFER WITH P. O' SE INFERENCE RES	TOOLE RE: SEARCH (.5).	
03/08/10	Repash, Philip	8.30	5,685.50	15700	20138369
CLAIMS WENCE CALLS	ONE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH RESPONDING HEARING (2.5); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH L. LBLAT RE: ADJOURNMENT (.7); DRAFT EMEI AND EMAILS WITH C. MARTIN RE: STATUS OE: CLAIMS HEARING ADJOURNMENT (.7).	BAER RE: SAME ( RGENCY MOTION	1.1); MEETING WIT TO COURT (3.1); TE	H P. ELEPHONE	
03/08/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	5.80	4,060.00	15700	20239142
TELEPH TELEPH	IONE CONFERENCE WITH V. JOHNSON RE: REIONE CALL WITH T. FRONGILLO RE: SAME (.3 IONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MASTANDO AND BRIEFS (.3).	a: REVIEW CASES	(1.1): REVIEW SAN	4E (.7):	
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.50	315.00	15700	20133282
CALL V A. LEVI	VITH L. BAER RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIMS HEARI NE RE: CLAIM OBJECTION (.1); REVIEW ISSU	NG (.2); EMAIL C. S ES RE: LITIGATIO	SMITH RE: SAME (. N CLAIM OBJECTIO	I); CALL WITH ON (.1).	[
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.70	441.00	15700	20133305
	NG WITH M. MILLS RE: MEMORANDUM RE: G V ISSUES RE: CCB CLAIMS (.2).	OVERNMENTAL (	CLAIMS MEMORAN	TDUM (.5);	
03/08/10	Wright, Miles	3.50	2,205.00	15700	20147711
REVISE	CLAIMS OB JECTION S (3.2); CONFER WITH A	. LEVINE RE: SAM	E (.3).		
03/08/10	Wenc elblat, Patricia	2.30	1,368.50	15700	20218080
RESENI CALLS (.6).	D PRODUCTION TO M. GRAU-IVERSON (.2); M WITH CLAIMANTS RE: ADJOURNMENT (.8); I	EETING WITH P. F DRAFT EMAILS TO	REPASH RE: ADJOU CLAIMANTS RE: A	(RNMENT (.7); ADJOURNMEN	Т
03/08/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.60	120.00	15700	20274985
	MESSAGE TO F. CASTILLERO AND H. AXON OF CLAIMS BY HUDSON STREET.	RE: EXHIBITS CIT	TED IN DEBTORS' O	BJECTION TO	
03/08/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.20	110.00	15700	20266854
REVIE	W MOODY'S LETTER.				
03/08/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.60	330.00	15700	20266892
	W OBJECTION PROCESS.				
03/08/10	Mishkin, Jessie	3.40	1,870.00	15700	20139244

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
PRICINO	WITH P. OTOOLE RE: BONDHOLDERS REPLY ( B DRAFT (.1); REVIEW UNDERLYING DOCUMENT ION AND STRATEGIZE RE: BRIEFING (2.9).	(.4); EMAIL C. SM NTS IN PREPARA	ITH RE: DISCRETION FOR MARTA	ONARY CLAIM	
03/08/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20247488
CONFE	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: EQUITY CLAIMS.				
03/08/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	15700	20247598
CONFEI	R WITH K. DIBLASIRE: GOVERNMENT CLAIMS	MEMORANDUM	ſ.		
03/08/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	15700	20150400
CONFEI	R WITH M. MILLS RE: EQUITY CLAIMS.				
03/08/10	Veit, Cheri	0.50	227.50	15700	20144547
	VER, CHEFF VITH V. JOHNSON RE: COLLATERAL ESTOPPEL				20174347
03/08/10	Castillero, Francene	5.60	1,064.00	15700	20204616
CLAIM	CT FINAL CASE LAW CITE-CHECK AND REVIE NOS. 2333 & 2335" AND "OBJECTION TO PROOF ONIC DOCUMENT (5.4) AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO	FOF CLAIM NO. 2	201" AND COMPILE	EDITS ONTO	
03/08/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	1.60	288.00	15700	20158140
BY S. B S. LEON	REMENT OF DOCUMENTS CITED WITHIN THE URR (1.4); PREPARATION OF E-MAIL TO E. BOS IARD ATTACHING DOCUMENTS CITED WITHIN . BOSSARD-BLACKEY RE: SAME (.1).	SHARD-BLACKE	Y, F. CASTILLERO	H. AXON AND	·
03/08/10	Axon, Hillary	5.20	936.00	15700	20205365
HUDSO	V FINAL DRAFT CLAIMS OBJECTIONS FOR EDI N CLAIMS (2.9); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EN EY, F. CASTILLERO AND S. IALUNA RE: SAME (	MAILS WITH S. LI			
03/08/10	Swaney, Nicole	0.40	72.00	15700	20187293
PREPAR	RE EXHIBITS TO BE USED IN MARCH 10, 2010 P	RE-HEARING BR	IEF.		
03/09/10	Baer, Lawrence	3.40	2,448.00	15700	20250286
EMAILS FROM P. REPASH ATTACHING DRAFT MOTION REQUESTING TELEPHONIC CONFERENCE TO ADJOURN EMPLOYEE CLAIMS HEARING; REVIEW SAME (.4); EMAIL FROM P. REPASH TO S. WHITTAKER RE: REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES ARISING OUT OF ADJOURNMENT (.1); EMAILS TO AND FROM P. REPASH RE: S. WHITTAKER (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. REPASH RE: S. WHITTAKER (.4); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. WHITTAKER RE: ADJOURNMENT (.2); EMAIL TO AND FROM P. REPASH RE: CLAIMANTS' EXPENSES ASSOCIATED WITH ADJOURNMENT (.3); EMAIL FROM S. WHITTAKER RE: HEARING (.1); EMAIL FROM P. REPASH ATTACHING REQUEST FOR STATUS CONFERENCE; REVIEW SAME (.1); EMAIL TO P. REPASH ATTACHING DRAFT EMAILS TO CLAIMANTS FOR REVIEW AND REVISION (.3); EMAIL TO S. WHITTAKER RE: ADJOURNMENT (.1); EMAIL FROM P. REPASH ATTACHING EMAIL FROM J. WEINSTEIN RE: HEARING DATE (.1); EMAIL FROM P. REPASH TO J. WEINSTEIN RE: REIMBURSEMENT AND CONSENT TO ADJOURN HEARING DATE (.1); EMAIL TO AND FROM M. IVERSEN RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL TO P. REPASH RE: LIMIT REIMBURSEMENT TO NON-REFUNDABLE TICK ETS (.1); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH P. REPASH RE: MOTION AND ADJOURNMENT (.8), CALL WITH P. REPASH AND K. DIBLASI RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.1).					
03/09/10	Mastando, III, John	0.80	656.00	15700	20237596
REVIEV	V DRAFT/OBJECTIONS AND RESPONSES TO DIS	SCOVERY REQUI	ESTS.		
03/09/10	Mastando, III, John	0.90	738.00	15700	20237595

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS TO BONDH	OLDER CLAIMS.			
03/09/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.60	507.00	15700	20143820
TELEPH BRIEFS	ONE CONFERENCES WITH L. ESKOW (.4) TO BONDHOLDERS' RESPONSES; EMAIL A	AND P. O'TOOLE (.1) R A. ALBANESE RE: SECU	E: PREPARATION ( URITIES LAW ISSU	OF REPLY ES (.1).	
03/09/10	Levine, Alexander	6.70	3,986.50	15700	20247362
	AND REVISE OB JECTIONS TO PROOF OF MISHKIN (1.0).	CLAIMS (5.7); DISCUSS	MARTA PROOFS (	F CLAIM	
03/09/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	3.50	1,802.50	15700	20142946
PREPAI	REPLY TO BARBER'S RESPONSE TO 19TH RATION FOR FILING OF OBJECTION TO S. . O'TOOLE RE: SAME (.2).	I OMNIBUS OBJECTIO! BURR AND HUDSON P	N (1.8); REVISION A ROOFS OF CLAIM	AND (1.5); CONFER	
03/09/10	Vaishnav, Neil	2.90	1,145.50	15700	20153682
DRAFT	BARBERS INSERT TO TWENTIETH OMNII	BUS (SUBSTANTIVE) O	BJECTION TO CLA	IMS.	
03/09/10	Vaishnav, Neil	3.00	1,185.00	15700	20153506
REVIEV	V BACKGROUND MATERIALS AND ANAL	YZE CASE LAW RE: DE	ERIVATIVE STAND	ING ISSUE.	
03/09/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.00	695.00	15700	20153010
MATER	SPONDENCE WITH V. JOHNSON, K. DIBLA IALS RELATED TO SAME (.6); CONFER WI DINATION OBJECTION (.2).	ASI AND B. ROSEN RE: ITH V. JOHNSON RE: S	510(B) OBJECTION TATUS OF 510(B)	IS (.2); REVIEW	
03/09/10	Chandis, Vanessa	9.00	4,950.00	15700	20171662
3711 AI INTERI FOR BF WITH F	W BONDHOLDERS' RESPONSES TO DEBTO ND 2480) (1.5); REVIEW BONDHOLDERS'R. ROGATORIES (2.1); RESEARCH CASES RE: REACH OF FIDUCIARY SECTION IN REPLY P. OTOOLE RE: DISCOVERY AND BONDHO AN RE: BONDHOLDER CLAIM RESEARCH	ESPONSES TO DEBTOF BREACH OF FIDUCIAR TO BONDHOLDERS' R OLDERS'OBJECTION (.	RS' DOCUMENT RE LY DUTY (3.5); PRE ESPONSE (1.4); CO	QUESTS AND PARE OUTLIN NFERENCE	E
03/09/10	Cloutier, Lisa	0.80	412.00	15700	20146754
(.3); CO	NGE EMAILS WITH P. OTOOLE AND E.BO NDUCT LEGAL RESEARCH RELATED TO SHARD-BLACKEY AN ALYZING LEGAL ISS	DRAFT S.BURR OBJEC	CTION (.2); EMAIL I	OBJECTION P. OTOOLE AN	D
03/09/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.20	137.00	15700	20277403
CONFE	R WITH J. SHIFFMAN RE: STATUS OF 510(	B) SUBORDINATION O	BJECTIONS.		
03/09/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.70	479.50	15700	20140894
CONFE	R WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: RESPONSE TO BO	NDHOLDERS' OPPOSIT	TION BRIEFS.		
03/09/10	Repash, Philip	7.20	4,932.00	15700	20175182
(1.4); D RE: AD C. MAI	WITH S. WHITTAKER RE: TERMS OF CON RAFT AND EDIT MOTION FOR EMERGEN JOURNMENT AND MOTION (.8); CALLS W RTIN RE: SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WI . DIBLASI RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.1).	CY STATUS CONFERE! TTH S. WHITTAKER RI	NCE (4.0); CALLS W E: ADJOURNMENT	/ITH L. BAER (.4); CALL WI7	TH R
03/09/10	Eskow, Lisa	0.40	280.00	15700	20193872
CONFE	R WITH T. FRONGILLO RE: BONDHOLDE	RS REPLY BRIEF.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/09/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	6.60	4,620.00	15700	20239152
CORRES RÉ: REP AND BO BURR A RESPON MATER CORRES WITH L CONFEI	SPONDENCE WITH C. SMITH AND C. MART SPONDENCE WITH P. GURFEIN RE: SAME (LY AND DISCOVERY ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONDH OLDERS' OBJECTIONS (.1); TELEPHONND HUDSON OBJECTIONS (.2); REVIEW AND HUDSON OBJECTIONS (.2); REVIEW AND HUDSON OBJECTIONS (.1); TELEPHONE CONTROL OF SPONDENCE WITH R. DECICCA RE: SUBSTANCE WITH V. JOHNSON RE: SAME (.7); TEOLDERS' REPLY (.1).	1); TELEPHONE CON INE CONFERENCE WIT ID REVISE BARBER R PRAFT EMAIL RE: SAI ON FERENCE WITH J. ANTIVE CONSOLIDAT ONDHOLDERS'REPL	FERENCE WITH B. ITH V. CHANDIS R. TH E. BOSSHARD-B REPLY (.3); REVISE ME (.1); REVIEW MISHKIN RE: REP ITION (.1); CORRES RY (2.5); TELEPHON	E: DISCOVERY LACKEY RE: S S. BURR LEXANDER LY (.1); PONDENCE IE	
03/09/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	15700	20277404
EMAILS	TOB. ROTHSCHILD RE: DEBT QUESTION:	SAND LITIGATION C	LAIM.		
03/09/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	378.00	15700	20139216
REVIEW	LITIGATION CLAIMS (.5); CALL WITH L. I	BAER AND P. REPASH	I RE: EMPLOYEE C	LAIMS (.1).	
03/09/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.90	180.00	15700	20159454
DRAFT RULING	STATUS MEMORANDA FOR A. LEVINE (.4) ON 6TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.5).	; PREPARATION OF E	E-MAIL MESSAGE I	RE: COURTS	
03/09/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.20	110.00	15700	20266860
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: CLAIMS.				
03/09/10	Mishkin, Jessie	6.20	3,410.00	15700	20147160
BONDE	NE RESPONSES TO MARTA PROOFS OF CLA HOLDERS OBJECTION WITH P.O'TOOLE (.1) BOND HOLDERS REPLY (3.6).	IM (1.1) AND DISCUS AND FOLLOW UP EM	SS WITH A. LEVINI MAILS (.4); RESEAI	E (1.0); DISCUS RCH AND	S
03/09/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	15700	20247157
REVISI	E GOVERNMENT CLAIMS MEMORANDUM.				
03/09/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	15700	20150388
REVISI	24TH AND 25TH OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS.				
03/09/10	Sherman, Rachel	0.40	182.00	15700	20144830
EMAIL	S WITH V. CHANDIS AND C. VEIT RE: RESE	ARCH RE: BONDHOI	LDERS CLAIM.		
03/09/10	Veit, Cheri	1.10	500.50	15700	20144549
REVIE CHANI	W WMB NOTEHOLDERS'RESPONSE TO TH DIS AND R. SHERMAN RE: RESEARCH FOR	E 20TH OMNIBUS OB BONDHOLDER'S CLA	JECTION (.7); EMA IM (.4).	ILS WITH V.	
03/09/10	Losick, Merill	2.00	390.00	15700	20169699
OBTAI	N PROSPECTUSES FOUND IN BRIEFS FOR I	. MISHKIN USING WI	ESTLAW.		
03/09/10	Castillero, Francene	4.40	836.00	15700	20205278
FINAL EDITS	IZE CITE-CHECK AND BLUEBOOK REVIEW IN ELECTRONIC FORMAT TO SEND TO E. I	OF HUDSON AND S. BOSSAHRD-BLACKEY	BURR BRIEFS ANI Y FOR REVIEW.	O COMPILE	
03/09/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	15700	20166345

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
OBTAIN	DECLARATION OF N. MANZER AND SENI	O TO J. MISHKIN.			
03/09/10	Amponsah, Duke	1.00	200.00	15700	20166344
PREPAR	E BINDERS CONTAINING PROOF OF CLAIR	MS RELATING TO BO	ND AND EQUITY C	LAIMS.	
03/09/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	2.20	396.00	15700	20158143
CITE-CHECK AND MODIFY THE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAIM NO. 201 FILED BY S. BURR (2.0); PREPARE E-MAIL TO E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY ATTACHING OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAIM NOS. 2333 AND 2335 BY 145 HUDSON STREET ASSOCIATES AND S. SCOTT WITH EXHIBITS (.2).					
03/09/10	Axon, Hillary	4.90	882.00	15700	20205506
REVIEW AND COMPILE BINDER OF RESPONSES TO DEBTORS'TWENTIETH OMNIBUS SUBSTANTIVE OBJECTION TO CLAIMS FOR J. MASTANDO RE: BONDHOLDERS LITIGATION (1.8); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY, S. IALUNA, F. CASTILLERO AND S. LEONARD RE: DEBTORS'OBJECTION TO HUDSON AND S. BURR CLAIMS (.4) REVIEW CITATIONS IN PREPARATION FOR FILING RE: SAME (2.7).					
03/09/10	Wilmer, Andrea	2.50	450.00	15700	20160272
PREPAR	E FOR HEARING ON BOND HOLDERS OBJ	ECTIONS TO CLAIMS			
03/10/10	Baer, Lawrence	1.70	1,224.00	15700	20250692
(.1); EM DATE FO REPASH EMAIL I	C. JANG RE: CALL WITH CHAMBERS FOR ALL S. WHITTAKER RE: AVAILABILITY FOOR HEARING (.1); EMAIL FROM J. WEINSTONEL LOCAL COUNSEL COMMUNICATION FROM M. SPITTELL RE: DOCUMENT PROD G DATE (.2); CONFERENCES WITH P. REP	OR RESCHEDULED HE FEIN RE: HEARING (.1 S WITH COURT RE: RI DUCTION (.1); EMAILS	EARING (.1); EMAIL ); EMAIL TO AND E ESCHEDULED HEA	P. REPASH RE: FROM P. RIN G (.2);	
03/10/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.30	253.50	15700	20143824
ATTENT	TION TO SECURITIES CLAIMS (.2); EMAIL	J. MASTANDO AND P.	O'TO OLE RE: CAS	E STATUS (.1).	
03/10/10	Levine, Alexander	2,50	1,487.50	15700	20246620
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTIONS TO PROOF OF C EY AND A. NG RE: BARBERS' RESPONSE T	CLAIMS (2.2); CONFER O 19TH OMNIBUS CL	RENCE WITH E. BO AIMS OBJECTION (	SSHARD- .3).	
03/10/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	1.50	772.50	15700	20142786
REVISE OBJECTION TO S. BURR'S PROOF OF CLAIM (.5); REVISION TO REPLY TO BARBERS' RESPONSE TO 19TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. NG AND A. LEVINE RE: SAME (.3); PREPARE EMAIL MESSAGE TO A. LEVINE RE: SAME (.1); PREPARE REPLY TO BONDHOLDER RESPONSE TO 20TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.1).					
03/10/10	Vaishnav, Neil	6.90	2,725.50	15700	20153436
ANALY	ZE CASE LAW RE: DERIVATIVE STANDIN	G ISSUE.			
03/10/10	Chandis, Vanessa	8.90	4,895.00	15700	20171841
REVIEV	V CASES RE: BREACH OF FIDUCIARY DUT ALL WITH J. MISHKIN RE: SAME (1.0).		·	ERS' RESPONSE	
03/10/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.20	822.00	15700	20141731
	R WITH P. OTOOLE RE: BONDHOLDER CL				
03/10/10	Repash, Philip	5.60	3,836.00	15700	20175179

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
NEW DA	LE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH THE NINE F TE FOR EMPLOYEE HEARING (1.6); NEGO ENCES WITH L. BAER RE: SAME (.7).	RESPONDING CLAIMAN TIATIONS WITH S. WH	NTS AND LOCAL ITT AKER RE: SA	COUNSEL RE: ME (3.3);	
03/10/10	Eskow, Lisa	2.20	1,540.00	15700	20193754
REVIEW BRIEF.	BACK GROUND MATERIAL AND PLEADIN	NGS IN PREPARATION	FOR BONDHOLD	ERS REPLY	
03/10/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	7.00	4,900.00	15700	20240107
CORRES	SPONDENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: REPLY (. SPONDENCE WITH GOODWIN RE: ALEXA! RRESPONDENCE WITH C. MARTIN RE: DIS IALS RE: REPLY (3.0); CONFER WITH V. JO	NDER OBJECTION (.1); I SCOVERY AND ALEXAL	REVISE BARBER NDER OBJECTIOI	N (.2); REVIEW	
03/10/10	Ng, Alexander	0.40	238.00	15700	20144472
CONFEI OMN IBU	RENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY AN US CLAIMS OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW OBJE	D A. LEVINE RE: BARB CT ION (.1).	ER'S RESPONSE	го 19ТН	
03/10/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.10	55.00	15700	20266737
CONFE	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIO	ONS.			
00/10/10	0 1 11	0.10	55.00	15700	20266738
03/10/10	Gurdian, Julio /ITH M. MILLS RE: NYC CLAIM.	0.10	23.00	10,00	
CALL W	THI M. MEES RE. N. TO CERTAIN.				
03/10/10	Mishkin, Jessie	3.00	1,650.00	15700	20147352
RESEAF DISCUS	CCH AND DRAFT REPLY OBJECTION PORT S SAME WITH V. CHANDIS (1.0).	TIONS TO BONDHOLDE	ERS' PROOF OF CI	AIM (2.0);	
03/10/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	15700	20246934
CONFE	R WITH J. GURDIAN RE: NYC TAX SETTLE	EMENT.			
03/10/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	15700	20150394
	RCH AND REVIEW VISA INTERCHANGE IS				
					20150200
03/10/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.10	955.50	15700	20150389
OBJECT	R WITH J. GURDIAN RE: CLAIMS OBJECTI FIONS (.4); RESEARCH AND EMAIL RE: MC 24TH OBJECTION (.6).	ONS (.1); REVISE 24TH OODY'S CLAIM (.6); CAI	LLS RE: CLAIMS	BUS OBJECTIONS (.	4);
03/10/10	Veit, Cheri	1.00	455.00	15700	20145162
REVIE 20TH O	W AND ANALYZE LEGAL ARGUMENTS AN MNIBUS OBJECTION (.8); REVIEW BONDE	ND CASES CITED IN TH IOLDERS RESPONSE TO	IE NOTEHOLDER: O 20TH OMN IBUS	S'RESPONSE T S OB JECTION (	O .2).
03/10/10	Potter, Lougran	4.10	820.00	15700	20204551
	HECK AND FINALIZE EXHIBITS RE: CLAI	MS OBJECTION BRIEF.			
		1.10	198.00	15700	20205362
03/10/10	Axon, Hillary W AND PULL DOCKETS REFERENCED IN I				
AND R	ESPOND TO EMAILS FROM V. CHANDIS, F	RE: SAME (.1).	er and a sure for highly because the lates	(/),	
03/11/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	15700	20336638
мемо	RANDUM TO K. DIBLASIRE: MADISON SO	QUARE GARDEN CLAIN	м.		

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	Hours	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/11/10	Baer, Lawrence	1.70	1,224.00	15700	20251934
MEETIN EMPLO' SUMM A TO K. D' REVIEW	STO AND FROM P. REPASH RE: HEARING (.1); EMAIL FROM C. JANG ATTACHING (.1); EMAIL FROM C. JANG ATTACHING (.1); EMAIL RY CHART AND REVIEW SAME (.1); EMAIL FROM BLASI RE: 3/15 HEARING (.1); EMAIL FROM M. SPITTELL RE: ELECTRONIC IN	NG REVISED AGENDA AD , FROM A. NG ATTACHIN (AIL FROM M. IVERSEN R) ROM R. SHARMA RE: OBJE ONE CALLS WITH P. REPA	JOURNING 3/15 H G LITIGATION CI E: HEARING DAT ECTION TO KOCH ASH RE: SCHEDUL	EARING ON LAIMS E (.1); EMAIL I CLAIM (.1); JING (.4);	
03/11/10	Mastando, III, John	0.20	164.00	15700	20240084
REVIEV	V REVISED CLAIM CHART.				
03/11/10	Mastando, III, John	0.30	246.00	15700	20240085
STRATE	GGY RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS.				
03/11/10	Levine, Alexander	6.00	3,570.00	15700	20246808
AGNES	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO TRANQUIJ AND BASSMAN CLAIMS (1.5); CALL C. V ZIELKE RE: SAME (.5); TEAM CONFERE	VEIT RE: SAME (.1); EXCH	ANGE EMAILS W	ECTION TO ITH C. SMITH	
03/11/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.20	139.00	15700	20283735
CONFE	R WITH V. JOHNSON RE: 510(B) SUBORE	DINATION OBJECTIONS.			
03/11/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.20	834.00	15700	20153026
LITIGA	V LITIGATION CLAIMS CHART FOR LITI TION CLAIMS MEETING (4); DRAFT AN II ON SAME (.4).	GATION CLAIMS MEETIN D REVIEW CORRESPOND	IG (.4); PARTICIPA ENCE WITH V. JC	ATE IN OHNSON AND	K.
03/11/10	Chandis, Vanessa	8.90	4,895.00	15700	20171843
DUTY (	D TEAM CONFERENCE CALL RE: LITIG CASES FOR REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' I ON FOR REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' RESP	RESPONSE (3.0); DRAFT B	REACH OF FIDUO	HARY DUTY	
03/11/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.20	137.00	15700	20283737
CONFE	R WITH J. SHIFFMAN RE: STATUS OF 51	0(B) SUBORDINATION OF	BJECTIONS.		
03/11/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.40	274.00	15700	20155070
CONFE	R WITH P. OTOOLE RE: STATUS OF BO	NDHOLDER LITIGATION/	OBJECTION RESP	ONSE.	
03/11/10	Repash, Philip	3.80	2,603.00	15700	20175068
HEARI	PLE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH LOCAL ( NG (2.7); DISCUSSIONS WITH L. BAER RI TO D. DAVID RE: DECLARATION (.2).	COUNSEL AND CLAIMAN E: SAME (.4); EMAILS WIT	TS RE: RESCHED H M. SPITTELL R	ULING OF E: SAME (.5);	
03/11/10	Eskow, Lisa	0.50	350.00	15700	20193756
RESEA	RCH BOND HOLDERS REPLY BRIEF.				
03/11/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	6.80	4,760.00	15700	20238888

CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SMITH RE: STATUS AND DISCOVERY (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH LOCAL COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY REQUESTS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH S. LEONARD RE: REPLY MATERIALS (.1); UPDATE STATUS CHART RE: LITIGATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FINESTONE RE: STATUS (2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: STATUS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH B. FINESTONE RE: STRATEGY (.1); CONFERENCE WITH V. CHAND IS RE: DISCOVERY (.1); REVISE SAME (2.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH GOODWIN RE: ALEXANDER OBJECTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SMITH AND C. MARTIN RE: SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. GURFEIN RE: SAME (.1); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND LITIGATION TEAM CALL (.4); REVIEW MATERIALS RE: REPLY (2.6); CONFER WITH V. JOHNSON RE: BONDHOLDER LITIGATION (.4). 15700 20144761 567.00 0.90 03/11/10 DiBlasi, Kelly PARTICIPATE IN LITIGATION CLAIMS MEETING WITH C. MARTIN, M. ARKO, J. MACIEL, AND WGM TEAM (.4); EMAILS TO WGM TEAM RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS (.3); EMAIL P. GURFEIN RE: LITIGATION CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE (.1). 189.00 15700 20148514 0.30 03/11/10 Venditti, Daniel REVIEW EMAILS RE: ADJOURNED HEARING DATE (.1); REVIEW OF NEWLY RECEIVED DATA (.2). 535.50 15700 20147830 0.90 03/11/10 Ng, Alexander TEAM MEETING RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS OBJECTION (.4); REVIEW OBJECTIONS (.5). 15700 20219665 59.50 0.10 03/11/10 Wenc elblat, Patricia REVIEW EMAILS RE: ADJOURNED CLAIMS HEARING. 15700 20175251 620.00 3.10 03/11/10 Leonard, Sarah REVIEW MATERIALS CITED IN BANK BONDHOLDERS' PRELIMINARY RESPONSE TO THE LEGAL ISSUES SET FORTH IN DEBTORS' TWENTIETH OMNIBUS (SUBSTANTIVE) OBJECTIONS TO CLAIMS PER P. O'TOOLE (3.0); CONFER WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: SAME (.1). 20266748 0.10 55.00 15700 03/11/10 Gurdian, Julio CORRESPOND RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS. 20266749 220.00 15700 0.4003/11/10 Gurdian, Julio ATTEND TEAM MEETING RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS. 15700 20147382 0.60 330.00 03/11/10 Mishkin, Jessie EMAILS RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS AND UPDATE CHART (.1); PARTICIPATE IN LITIGATION CLAIMS MEETING (.4) AND FOLLOW UP EMAILS (.1). 0.20 79.00 15700 20247034 03/11/10 Mills, Marvin REVIEW NYC STIPULATION (.1); VOICEMAIL TO B. BRENNAN (NYC LEGAL DEPARTMENT) RE: SAME (.1).395.00 15700 20246242 1.00 03/11/10 Mills, Marvin REVISE GOVERNMENT CLAIMS MEMORANDUM. 20171105 500.50 15700 1.10 03/11/10 Sharma, Rahul PARTICIPATE IN TWICE-WEEKLY TEAM CALL RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS (.4); RESEARCH RE: HOOVER CLAIM FOR 19TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.1); REVISE LITIGATION CLAIMS STATUS CHART AND CIRCULATE (.6).

0.40

03/11/10

Veit, Cheri

PARTICIPATE IN WEEKLY LITIGATION TEAM STATUS CALL.

15700

182.00

20147991

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/11/10	Veit, Cheri	2.20	1,001.00	15700	20153212
CALL W	ITH A. LEVINE RE: AGNES AND BASSM	AN OBJECTION (.1); RESE.	ARCH RE: SAME	(2.1).	
03/11/10	Losick, Merill	1.00	195.00	15700	20169519
OBTAIN	PROSPECTUSES AND POOLING AGREE	MENTS FOR A. LEVINE.			
03/11/10	Potter, Lougran	6.60	1,320.00	15700	20204392
CITECH	HECK, AND PREPARE/REVIEW EXHIBITS	S FOR OBJECTION TO PRO	OF OF CLAIM.		
03/11/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	15700	20184086
SEND P	ROOFS OF CLAIMS TO K. DIBLASI.				
03/11/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	1.00	180.00	15700	20158024
GATHE	R SOURCES CITED IN THE BANK BOND SET FORTH IN DEBTORS'TWENTIETH (	HOLDERS' PRELIMINARY 20TH) OMNIBUS (SUBSTA	RESPONSE TO T ANTIVE) OBJECT	HE LEGAL IONS TO	
03/12/10	Baer, Lawrence	1.30	936.00	15700	20252127
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM R. SH .1); EMAILS TO AND FROM K. DIBLASI F FROM M. SPITTELL RE: DISCOVERY ISS	RE: TEAM MEETING (.1): R	EVIEW EMPLOY	EE CLAIMS (.4	-);
03/12/10	Levine, Alexander	7.50	4,462.50	15700	20247523
DRAFT AGNES	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO TRANQUI AND BASSMAN CLAIMS (3.5); EXCHAN	LITY CLAIM (3.5); DRAFT GE EMAILS WITH C. SMIT	AND REVISE OB H AND D. ZIELK	JECTION TO E RE: SAME (.:	5).
03/12/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.40	278.00	15700	20153160
CORRE LITIGA	SPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: DEV TION CLAIMS MEETINGS.	ELOPMENTS IN WMI BAN	IKRUPTCY AND	UPCOMING	
03/12/10	Chandis, Vanessa	3.10	1,705.00	15700	20171805
REVIEV DRAFT	W CASES RE: BREACH OF FIDUCIARY D BREACH OF FIDUCIARY DUTY SECTIO	UTY FOR REPLY TO BONI N FOR SAME (1.1).	DHOLD ERS' RESF	ONSE (2.0);	
03/12/10	Eskow, Lisa	1.90	1,330.00	15700	20193875
CONFE PREPA	R WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: BONDHOLDERS RATION FOR REPLY BRIEF (1.7).	S REPLY BRIEF (.2); REVIE	W CASE BACKG	ROUND IN	
03/12/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	7.10	4,970.00	15700	20239533
DRAFT	HONE CONFERENCE WITH GOODWIN R REPLY (3.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENC DRRESPONDENCE WITH CREDITORS CO ID CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS COM	E WITH J. MISHKIN RE: DI MMITTEE RE: ALEXANDI	ISCRETIONARY I ER (.1); PREPARA	PRICING CLAIR TION FOR AN	M
03/12/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	15700	20148978
REVIE	W ISSUES RE: CLAIM OBJECTION.				
03/12/10	Wright, Miles	1.00	630.00	15700	20147712
	E CLAIMS OBJECTIONS.				
03/12/10	Wright, Miles	4.00	2,520.00	15700	20248983

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
RESEAR	CH CLAIMS OBJECTIONS.				
03/12/10	Forrestier, Ashley	3.50	630.00	15700	20162262
REVIEW	DOCUMENTS CITED IN REPLY BRIEF.				
03/12/10	Leonard, Sarah	2.00	400.00	15700	20176006
FINALIZ LEGAL CLAIMS	ZE SOURCE MATERIALS CITED IN BANK E ISSUES SET FORTH IN DEBTORS'TWENTI S.	ONDHOLDERS'PREL ETH OMNIBUS (SUBS	IMINARY RESPONS TANTIVE) OBJECTI	E TO THE ONS TO	
03/12/10	Mishkin, Jessie	3.00	1,650.00	15700	20153460
RESEAI DISCRE	RCH AND DRAFT BONDHOLDERS'CLAIM I TIONARY PRICING CLAIM WITH P. GURFI	REPLY (2.7); EMAIL A EIN (.2); CONFER WITI	ND DISCUSS COMM H P. O'TOOLE RE: SA	IENTS TO AME (.1).	
03/12/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	15700	20247196
REVISE	GOVERNMENT CLAIMS MEMORANDUM.				
03/12/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	15700	20150561
REVIEV	V AND REVISE 24TH AND 25TH OMNIBUS	OBJECTIONS.			
03/12/10	Veit, Cheri	3.20	1,456.00	15700	20153215
REVIEV	W AND EDIT OBJECTION TO AGNES AND INDEAT SUPERIOR (2.0).	BASSMAN CLAIM (1.2	); RESEARCH RE: A	GENCY AND	
03/12/10	Enayati, Robert	0.50	197.50	15700	20153346
REVISE	MEMOR ANDUM RE: 510(B).				
03/12/10	Chettri, Anupama	0.50	100.00	15700	20236968
CITE C	HECK BASSMAN OBJECTION.				
03/12/10	Potter, Lougran	6.70	1,340.00	15700	20204398
	W, CITE CHECK, AND REVIEW EXHIBITS F	OR OBJECTION TO PI	ROOF OF CLAIM.		
02/12/10	Y Alamandan	3.00	1,785.00	15700	20246613
03/13/10 DRAFT	Levine, Alexander  AND REVISE OBJECTION TO TRANQUILI		•		
	AND BASSMAN CLAIMS (1.0).				
03/13/10	Mishkin, Jessie	4.50	2,475.00	15700	20153097
RESEA BEGIN	RCH AND DRAFT REPLY RE: ALTER EGO DRAFTING MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION (	TO BONDHOLDERS O 1.0).	BJECTION (3.5); RE	SEARCH AND	
03/13/10	Mills, Marvin	1.60	632.00	15700	20246616
REVIS!	E GOVERNMENT CLAIMS MEMORANDUM				
03/14/10	Mastando, III, John	0.40	328.00	15700	20241103
EDIT D	PRAFT REPLY RE: BONDHOLDERS' CLAIM	S.			
03/14/10	Levine, Alexander	9.00	5,355.00	15700	20247490
DRAFT DECL	FAND REVISE OBJECTION TO TRANQUILI ARATION IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.1 MAN CLAIMS (4.5); EXCHANGE EMAILS WI	): DRAFT AND REVISI	E OBJECTION TO A	GNES AND	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/14/10	Chandis, Vanessa	3.50	1,925.00	15700	20171937
REVIEW	AND EDIT BREACH OF FIDUCIARY SECTION	ON FOR REPLY TO B	ONDHOLDERS' RE	SPONSE.	
03/14/10	Eskow, Lisa	2.60	1,820.00	15700	20193867
DEVIEW	CASE BACKGROUND, OPPOSITION TO PROAFTING REPLY BRIEF (2.4); CONFER WITH .	OOFS OF CLAIMS, A I. COSTA RE: POTEN	ND RESPONSES IN TIAL RESEAR CH F	PREPARATION OR REPLY	
03/14/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	15700	20150450
CALL W	ITH A. LEVINE RE: DECLARATION IN CONTIEW SAME (.1).	NECTION WITH OBJ	ECTION TO TRANC	UILITY CLAIM	
03/14/10	Mishkin, Jessie	4.00	2,200.00	15700	20153232
RESEAR OUTLIN	CH AND DRAFT PORTIONS OF REPLY TO E E ARGUMENTS FOR MARTA OBJECTION (2	ONDHOLDERS OBJ .0).	ECTION (2.0); RESE	ARCH AND	
03/14/10	Mills, Marvin	2.00	790.00	15700	20247493
REVISE	GOVERNMENT CLAIMS MEMORANDUM.				
03/14/10	Potter, Lougran	2.80	560.00	15700	20204399
	V, CITE CHECK, AND CREATE EXHIBITS FO	R OBJECTION TO PE	ROOF OF CLAIM.		
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	15700	20392022
	VITH K. DIBLASI, A. NG, C. SMITH AND C. M	ARTIN RE: LITIGAT	ION CLAIMS.		
		1.00	975.00	15700	20344796
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian ALL/MEETING WITH WMI, ALVAREZ & MA				
CONF	ALL/MEETING WITH WMI, HE WAS SO WAY				00000
03/15/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.30	216.00	15700	20288557
EMAIL CALL W	FROM P. REPASH ATTACHING EMAIL FROM VITH R. SHARMA RE: KOCH CLAIM (.2).	M R. SHARMA RE: FO	OLLO W-UP RE: KO	CH CLAIMS (.1)	i
03/15/10	Stangland, Elaine	2.80	2,520.00	15700	20187510
PARTIC RE: SUI	CIPATE IN CALL WITH D. SIMONDS, B.ROT BORDINATION ISSUES (1.4); WORK ON SUB	HSCHILD, J. GOULD ORDINATION WATE	ING, J. HELLER AN ERFALL (1.4).	D T. SAPEIKA	
03/15/10	Levine, Alexander	12.00	7,140.00	15700	20247559
DRAFT OBJECT	, REVISE AND FILE OBJECTION TO TRANQ FION TO AGNES AND BASSMAN OMNIBUS	UILITY CLAIM (5.8); OBJECTION (6.2).	DRAFT, REVISE A	ND FILE	
03/15/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.30	513.50	15700	20174756
ANALY	ZE JURISPRUDENCE RE: STANDING OF TR PARTIES.	USTEES TO ASSERT	CLAIMS OF ESTA	TE AGAINST	
03/15/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.50	1,042.50	15700	20175307
EDIT B	USHANSKY 510(B) OBJECTION (.8) AND EX B. ROSEN (.3); CONFER WITH V. JOHNSON R	CHANGE CORRESP (CE: SAME (.4).	ONDENCE RELATE	D TO SAME	
03/15/10	Chandis, Vanessa	2.80	1,540.00	15700	20171941
REVIE	W CASES RE: STANDING FOR ALTER EGO ( HONE CALL WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: FIDUCIA	CLAIM IN REPLY TO RY DUTY (.1).	BONDHOLDERS' R	ESP ONSE (2.7);	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/15/10	Johnson, Virginia	3.30	2,260.50	15700	20157350
REVIEW SAME (.	V/REVISE 510(B) SUBORDINATION OBJECT 4).	TIONS (2.9); CONFER V	WITH J. SHIFFMAN	RE: FILING OI	?
03/15/10	Repash, Philip	0.70	479.50	15700	20157096
CALL W RESCHE	TTH MURPHY'S COUNSEL (.3); DRAFTING DULED DATE (.2); EMAILS RE: EXPENSE I	OF AND EMAIL TO LORE IMBUR SEMENT (.2)	OCAL COUNSEL RE ).	<b>:</b> :	
03/15/10	Sapeika, Tal	2.00	1,370.00	15700	20201163
HELLEI	IPATE IN CALL WITH E. STANGLAND, D. S R RE: SUBORDINATION ISSUES (1.4); REVI SPONDENCE RE: SAME WITH E. STANGLA	EW SUBORDINATION	MEMORANDUM A	.ND	
03/15/10	Eskow, Lisa	6.10	4,270.00	15700	20193861
BACKG	R WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: STRATEGY FOR BOROUND IN PREPARATION FOR REPLY BRIMENTS FOR REPLY BRIEF (.8); RESEARCH	EF (2.0); IDENTIFY AI	ND OUTLINE RESEA	W CASE ARCH	
03/15/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	5.00	3,500.00	15700	20237350
TELEPI (.5); TEI CORRE	R WITH L. ESKOW RE: BONDHOLDERS REI IONE CONFERENCE WITH V. CHANDIS RE LEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FINESTO SPONDENCE WITH A. NG RE: ALEXANDER OLDERS (3.1).	: FIDUCIARY DUTY (. NE RE: FRAUDULENT	.1); REVIEW MATEI ΓCONVEYANCE (.1	RIALS RE:SAN );	ИE
03/15/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	378.00	15700	20157341
REVIEV RE: SAN	/ ISSUES RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS (.2); CA ME (.4).	LL WITH B. ROSEN, A	a. NG, C. SMITH, AN	D C. MARTIN	
03/15/10	Ng, Alexander	3.50	2,082.50	15700	20160236
	NG RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS OBJECTION V LAIMS (2.9); DRAFT EMAIL RE: SAME (.2).	VITH B. ROSEN, K. DI	BLASIAND CLIENT	TS (4); REVIEV	V
03/15/10	Forrestier, Ashley	3.00	540.00	15700	20162277
OBTAI	N DOCUMENTS CITED IN BONDHOLDRS R	EPLY FOR L. ESKOW.			
03/15/10	Mishkin, Jessie	4.80	2,640.00	15700	20166534
	DISCRETIONARY PRICING CLAIMS OBJECTION (3.8).	CTION (1.0); RESEAR	CH AND DRAFT MA	ARTA CLAIMS	
03/15/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	15700	20246444
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH B. PEDERSEN (ALVAR	EZ & MARSAL) RE: O	REGON PROOF OF	CLAIM.	
03/15/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20246771
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH M. ALEXANDER (ALV.	AREZ & MARSAL) ET	AL. RE: NYC TAX O	CLAIM.	
03/15/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.50	227.50	15700	20170941
	RE: 24TH AND 25TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO KOCH (.1).	NS (.2); CALL WITH L.	BAER RE: KOCH C	LAIM (.2);	
03/15/10	Sherman, Rachel	0.80	364.00	15700	20160383
EMAIL	S WITH L. ESKOW, V. CHANDIS, AND J. MI	SHKIN RE: CLAIMS (.	4); REVIEW CLAIM	S (.4).	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/15/10	Turner, Kim	1.10	500.50	15700	20168170
PREPAR	E EXHIBITS FOR CLAIM OBJECTION.				
03/15/10	Veit, Cheri	2.30	1,046.50	15700	20166594
REVIEW	GENERAL AND SPECIFIC NOTICES FOR O BASSMAN AND AGNES OBJECTION (.3); IG CLAIM (.8); REVIEW NOTEHOLDER'S R	RESEAR CH STANDING	AND BASSMAN CL TO BRING ALTEI	AIMS (.6); R EGO/VEIL	
03/15/10	Costa, Jessica	0.70	276.50	15700	20160348
	CLAIM OBJECTION AND RESPONSE (.4): IONS AND CASES CITED (.3).	OBTAIN RELEVANT	BANKRUPTCY CO	DE	
03/15/10	Costa, Jessica	1.40	553.00	15700	20160339
RESEAR	CH RE: PRIMA FACIE VALIDITY OF CLAI	MS.			
03/15/10	Chettri, Ampama	2.50	500.00	15700	20237640
	BASSMAN OBJECTION (.5); UPDATE AU	THORITIES FOR SAME	E (2.0).		
02/15/10	Potton I overen	10.40	2,080.00	15700	20204400
03/15/10 REVIEW	Potter, Lougran  V, CITE CHECK, AND CREATE EXHIBITS F		. ,		
				1,550	20270261
	Amponsah, Duke RE EXHIBITS FOR SUBORDINATION OBJE NIFICATION IN THE MDL.	0.80 CTION TO UNDERWRI	160.00 TER PROOFS OF C	15700 LAIM FOR	20279261
03/15/10	Amponsah, Duke	1.80	360.00	15700	20187841
PREPAI E. YATE	RE VARIOUS PROOFS OF CLAIMS FOR A. 3 SS (.3).	NG (1.5); OBTAIN PROC	OF OF CLAIM AND	SEND SAME T	0
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	15700	20345897
MEMOR	RANDUM TO M. MILLS RE: PBGC CLAIMS	AND STIPULATION OF	WITH DRAWAL.		
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	3.20	3,120.00	15700	20345899
REVISE	E AND FINALIZE BLOMQUIST OBJECTION TOLDER REPLITES (2.5); MEMORANDUM T	(.5); MEMORANDUM T	TO A. NG RE: FILIN AME (.1).	NG (.1); REVIEV	V
03/16/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.10	72.00	15700	20252734
EMAIL	FROM P. REPASH RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIM	S HEARING.			
03/16/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.20	169.00	15700	20168747
TELEPI	HONE CONFERENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE RE	E: STATUS OF REPLY B	RIEFS.		
03/16/10	Levine, Alexander	6.00	3,570.00	15700	20246348
	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF	CLAIM (3.4); RESEAR CH	H RE: SAME (2.6).		
03/16/10	Vaishnav, Neil	3.50	1,382.50	15700	20174981
	REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS REPONSE.	5,00			
00/15/10	W. Salarana MII	3.90	1,540.50	15700	20174972
03/16/10 ANALY	Vaishnav, Neil ZE JURISPRUDENCE RE: STANDING OF F		·	15/00	20114912

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/16/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	2.30	1,598.50	15700	20175117
EDIT BU	JSHANSKY 510(B) OBJECTION AND EXCHAIL AND K. TURNER RELATED TO SAME.	ANGE CORRESPONDEI	NCE WITH LOCAL	COUNSEL, K.	
03/16/10	Chandis, Vanessa	5.40	2,970.00	15700	20171946
BONDH SHERM CLAIMS	RENCE CALL WITH L.ESKOW, C. VEIT, R.S OLDERS' RESPONSE (.8); CORRESPOND W AN, J. COSTA AND K. DESAI RE: SAME (.6); S (3.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. NFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: ADDTITIO	ITH P. O'TOOLE, L. ESI ; REVIEW CASES RE: S' O'TOOLE RE: REPLY T	KOW, J. MISHKIN, TANDING FOR AL O BONDHOLDER!	C. VEIT, R. TER EGO	
03/16/10	Yates, Erin	0.30	136.50	15700	20282654
CALL W NO. 219	TITH R. JAIN RE: CHART IS CLAIM (.1); CAL 1 (.1); DRAFT E-MAIL TO K. DIB LASI AND	L WITH M. LEVITT AN T. SAPEIKA RE: PROOI	D A. FISH RE: PRO F OF CLAIM NO. 2	OF OF CLAIM 191 (.1).	
03/16/10	Johnson, Virginia	2.20	1,507.00	15700	20162527
CONFE OF 510(	RENCE WITH J. SHIFFMAN RE: 510(B) OBJE B) SUBORDINATION OBJECTIONS (1.6).	ECTION (.6); CONFERE	NCE WITH C. JANG	RE: FILING	
03/16/10	Repash, Philip	1.40	959.00	15700	20175475
RELATI D. GRIF	RENCE CALL WITH M. SPITTELL RE: DISC ED TO CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.1); CONFERI FITH RE: ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY (.7); C RULES RE: EDISCOVERY (.2); CALL WITH	ENCE WITH D. VENDIT ALL WITH D. VENDIT	TI, M. SPITTELL, ( TI AND LOCAL CO	C. MARTIN AN	D
03/16/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.10	68.50	15700	20200682
CALL W	VITH P. REPASH RE: DISCOVERY RELATED	TO CLAIMS OBJECTION	ONS.		
03/16/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	15700	20200980
	S WITH B. ROTHSCHILD RE: CCB INDENTU S WITH C. STAPEN RE: SAME (.1).	URES (.1); EM AILS WIT	H E. STANGLAND	RE: SAME (.1);	
03/16/10	Eskow, Lisa	6.20	4,340.00	15700	20193858
RESEA! (.7); CO	CIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH V. CF RCH FOR BONDHOLDERS REPLY BRIEF (.8 NFER WITH V. CHANDIS RE: ADDITIONAL ING AND MISREPRE SENTATION ISSUES FO	); IDENTIFY AND OUT RESEARCH FOR REPL	LINE ADDITIONAL	L RESEARCH	
03/16/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	2.00	1,400.00	15700	20238840
CHANI	ROUS CORRESPONDENCE WITH L.ESKOW DIS RE: REPLY (.2); CONTINUE DRAFTING I (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH T. FRONGILI	REPLY (13); CORRESPO	ONDENCE WITH B	CE WITH V. ROSEN RE:	
03/16/10	Venditti, Daniel	1.00	630.00	15700	20164097
DISCO	RENCE CALL WITH P. REPASH, M. SPITTEI VERY (.7); CALL WITH P. REPASH AND LOC RENCE WITH P. REPASH RE: SAME (.1).	LL, C. MARTIN AND D. CAL COUNSEL RE: LOC	GRIFFITH, RE: EL CAL RU LES RE: ED	ECTRONIC ISCOVERY (.2	<b>)</b> ;
03/16/10	Ng, Alexander	3.30	1,963.50	15700	20160260
	E CLAIMS OB JECTION (.3); EMAIL DRAFT ( W CLAIMS (2.9).	DBJECTION TO CLIENT	AND EQUITY CO	MM ITTEE (.1);	
03/16/10	Leonard, Sarah	1.70	340.00	15700	20174726

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CONFE	V EXHIBITS CITED IN SOUTH FERRY AND RENCE WITH K. TURNER RE: PROOFS OF HING PROOFS OF CLAIMS FOR K. TURNER	CLAIMS (.3); PREPARAT			
03/16/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.60	330.00	15700	20266729
CALL R	E: OR ACLE (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (.3)	).			
03/16/10	Mishkin, Jessie	1.70	935.00	15700	20174495
	T. SAPEIKA RE: MARTA/BOILERMAKERS A CLAIMS OBJECTION (1.6).	(.1); DRAFT FACT AND	PROCEEDINGS SE	ECTIONS OF	
03/16/10	Desai, Kavita	10.00	4,550.00	15700	20160333
C.VEIT ON IQB	W CLAIM OBJECTION AND PLAINTIFF'S RI , R. SHERMAN AND V. CHANDIS RE: WMI' AL ANALYSIS OF WASHINGTON COMPLA ARY OF RESEARCH TO L. ESKOW (.3).	S REPLY TO BONHOLDI	ERS RESPONSE (.8	); RESEARCH	
03/16/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20247857
CORRE	SPONDENCE WTIH WITH K. TURNER RE:	SECURITIES PROOFS O	F CLAIMS.		
03/16/10	Mills, Marvin	1.80	711.00	15700	20247856
REVIE	W PBGC CLAIMS.				
03/16/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.40	182.00	15700	20170940
CALL V (.2).	VITH ALV AREZ & MARSAL RE: CLAIMS O	BJECTIONS (.2); CALL V	VITH CICCOTELL	RE: HIS CLAI	M
03/16/10	Sherman, Rachel	4.50	2,047.50	15700	20165022
CONFE BOND	ER WITH L. ESKOW, V. CHANDIS, C. VEIT, HOLDERS (.8); RESEARCH RE: FRCP RULE	K. DESAI, AND J. COSTA 12 AND BANKRUPT CY	A RE: RESEARCH I CONTESTED MAT	FOR REPLY TO TERS (3.7).	•
03/16/10	Turner, Kim	1.70	773.50	15700	20168216
	RE AND REVIEW EXHIBITS FOR CLAIM O $\lambda$ IM (.3).	BJECTION (1.4); CONFE	R WITH S. LEONA	RD RE: PROOF	'S
03/16/10	Veit, Cheri	5.60	2,548.00	15700	20166454
FOR W BRING	WITH L. ESKOW, R. SHERMAN, K. DESAI A MI'S REPLY TO BONDHOLDER RESPONSE ALTER EGO CLAIM (2.1); RESEARCH STA TATE SECURITIES FRAUD CLAIMS (2.7).	TO WMI'S OBJECTION	(.8); RESEARCH S	TANDING TO	
03/16/10	Costa, Jessica	0.30	118.50	15700	20160680
RESEA	RCH RE: INTERPLAY BETWEEN BANKRU	PT CY RULE 7009 AND F	RCP RULE 9.		
03/16/10	Costa, Jessica	1.90	750.50	15700	20160462
LEGAI	RESEARCH RE: BANK RUPTCY RULE 300	I (C).			
03/16/10	Costa, Jessica	7.70	3,041.50	15700	20160679
RESEA CONFI	ER WITH K. DESAI ON RESEARCH STRATE RCH RE: IQB AL AND MISREPRESENTATION ERENCE WITH L. ESKOW, C. VEIT, R. SHER LISSUES FOR WMI'S REPLY TO BONDHOL	ON CLAIMS (5.7); SUM M RMAN, K. DESAI AND V.	ARIZE RESEARCI	H(.3);	
03/16/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.30	60.00	15700	20187766

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
OBTAIN	WMI'S 19TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CLAI	MS AND SEND TO	A. NG.		
03/16/10	Van Kampen, Allison	1.90	342.00	15700	20175325
PREPAR	E EXHIBITS TO BE ATTACHED TO THE CLAI	M OBJECTION.			
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	15700	20345771
MEMOR	ANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: BONDHOLDERS	HEARING TIMING.			
03/17/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.10	72.00	15700	20253022
EMAILS	TO AND FROM R. SHARMA RE: STATUS OF I	KOCH MATTER.			
03/17/10	Levine, Alexander	6.60	3,927.00	15700	20247105
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAI	M (2.1); RESEARCI	HRE: SAME (3); CA	LL WITH	
TRANQ DIBLAS	UILITY'S COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY SCHEDU I RE: SAME (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J.	LE (.3); EXCHANGE WRIGHT RE: TRAN	E CALLS AND EMA QUILITY CLAIM (.	ILS WITH K. 7).	
03/17/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.20	474.00	15700	20174795
	ZE SUBSTANTIVE CONSOLIDATION JURISPR ANT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.	UDENCE IN PREPA	RATION FOR DRA	FTING	
03/17/10	Vaishnav, Neil	7.00	2,765.00	15700	20174794
DRAFT	SECTIONS OF REPLY BRIEF RE: DERIVATIVE	E VERSUS DIRECT S	STANDING.		
03/17/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	3.60	2,502.00	15700	20175532
BUSHA	C. SMITH DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF BU NSKY 510(B) OBJECTION (.8); CONFER WITH DNS TO OBJECTION (1.3).				3:
03/17/10	Chandis, Vanessa	8.80	4,840.00	15700	20171951
RE: STA	R WITH P. O'TOOLE AND C. VEIT RE: REPLY T ANDING FOR ALTER EGO CLAIMS (6.3); REVI RS' OBJECTION TO BONDHOLDERS' CLAIMS NDHOLDERS CLAIM (.7).	EW RESPONSES FIL	ED BY JP MORGA	N AND FDIC T	0
03/17/10	Johnson, Virginia	5.10	3,493.50	15700	20167679
RICHAF CONFO WITH L	DECLARATIONS TO ACCOMPANY 510(B) SURDS LAYTON & FINGER, K. DIBLASI AND J.S. RM TO OMNIBUS FORMAT (1.3); REVIEW/FIN. ESKOW AND P. O'TOOLE RE: PREPARATION TION/STRATEGY (.8).	HIFFMAN RE: REVI IALIZE MDL OBJEC	SIONS TO OBJECT TION (1.6); TELEC	IONS TO	
03/17/10	Repash, Philip	1.30	890.50	15700	20175453
EMAILS	S W ITH CLAIM ANTS RE: SCHEDULING (.3); W	ORK ON E-DISCOV	ERY (1.0).		
03/17/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.40	274.00	15700	20201106
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH B. FINESTONE RE: BOILE 1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. MISHKIN RE:	RMAKERS' CLAIMS			
03/17/10	Eskow, Lisa	6.30	4,410.00	15700	20193855

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

DATE

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

TIME ID

17/3/13	I IMERION BUILD CAME I I ON	<u> </u>	121120 0212		*******
RESEAR EMAIL I CALL W	IPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. VEIT, CH STATUS AND ADDITIONAL ASSIGNMEN' MEMORANDA RE: RESEARCH FINDINGS FOR ITH P. OTOOLE AND V. JOHNSON RE: POTEN SEARCH AND DRAFT REPLY BRIEF SECTION	rs for reply brie reply brief (.7); I stial securities a	F (.8); REVIEW ANI PARTICIPATE IN CO ARGUMENTS FOR I	O AN ALYZE ONFERENCE REPLY BRIEF	
03/17/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	8.70	6,090.00	15700	20238836
TELEPH BONDO	ONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FINESTONE RE: IONE CONFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW AND V. LDERS OPPOSITION/STRATEGY (.8); REVIEW OLDERS RESPONSE (5.9); CONFER WITH V. C. SE (.8).	JOHNSON RE: PREP MATERIALS (1.1); l	ARATIONS FOR RE DRAFT REPLY TO	SPONSE TO	
03/17/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.80	504.00	15700	20163571
TRANQ	AND CALLS TO WGM TEAM RE: CLAIM OBJUILITY CLAIM OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW ISSU. LEVINE AND J. WRIGHT RE: SAME (.1); EMA	ES RE: SAME (.2); C	ALL TRANQUILITY	RE: COUNSEL	
03/17/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.30	819.00	15700	20279260
CONFE	RENCE WITH J. SHIFFMAN, V. JOHNSON AND	LOCAL COUNSEL F	E: REVISIONS TO	OBJECTIONS.	
03/17/10	Wright, Miles	0.70	441.00	15700	20248118
CALL W	VITH A. LEVINE RE: TRANQUILITY OBJECTIO	N.			
03/17/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.90	180.00	15700	20174693
PREPA	RE EXHIBITS CITED IN SOUTH FERRY AND U	NDERWRITERS OB	ECTIONS PER V. JO	HNSON.	
FROM S	Leonard, Sarah RENCE WITH V. JOHNSON RE: REVIEW OF M SEC FILINGS (.4); REVIEW MDL COMPLAINT A DING STA TEMENTS CITED IN THE MDL COM	AND CREATE CHAR	520.00 D OBTAINING INFO T OF DEFENDANTS	15700 DRMATION S'FALSE AND	20279263
03/17/10	Mishkin, Jessie	0.70	385.00	15700	20166582
	S BONDHOLDERS' CLAIM OBJECTION REPLY	STRATEGIES WITH	ł V. CHANDIS.		
03/17/10	Desai, Kavita	6.60	3,003.00	15700	20174349
IQBAL/ STRATI	H FOR CASE LAW STATING POLICY REASON TWOMBLY (1.8); CALL WITH L. ESKOW, J. CO EGY (8); RESEARCH CASE LAW ON VICARIO IG TO LISA ESKOW (.3).	STA, C. VEIT, R. SH	ERMAN AND DISC	USS CASE	
03/17/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20247966
REVIEV TAX CI	W AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE WI	TH ALVAREZ & MA	RSALPROFESSION	ALS RE: NYC	
03/17/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.60	273.00	15700	20170932
CALL R	E: CLAIMS OBJECTION (.2); EMAILS AND CA	LLS RE: CLAIMS OB	JECTIONS (.4).		
03/17/10	Sherman, Rachel	4.40	2,002.00	15700	20165046
JAMES	R WITH L. ESKOW, C. VEIT, K. DESAI AND J. AND G. MORGAN RE: PROCEDURE FOR CON RS AND BANKRUPTCY RULE 9014 AND 7009	TESTED MATTERS			
03/17/10	Turner, K im	1.30	591.50	15700	20169953

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
DRAFT	CLAIM OBJECTION (.3); DRAFT DECLAR	ATION (1.0).			
03/17/10	Veit, Cheri	6.70	3,048.50	15700	20166642
WITH L FEDER	CALL RE: LEGAL ISSUES AND STRATEGY . ESKOW, K. DESAI, R. SHERMAN AND J. AL AND WASHINGTON LAW, STANDING TY FOR VIOLATIONS OF FEDERAL SECU	COSTA (.8); RESEARCH TO BRING SECURITIES	SECURITES CLAIM	AS UNDER	
03/17/10	Costa, Jessica	0.20	79.00	15700	20163481
RESEAI	RCH RE: VICARIOUS LIABILITY IN PAREN	NT/SUB RELATIONSHIPS	S.		
03/17/10	Costa, Jessica	0.20	79.00	15700	20163509
OBTAIR	N VICARIOUS LIABILITY CASES FOR L.E	skow.			
03/17/10	Costa, Jessica	0.20	79.00	15700	20163556
PROVII OF CLA	DE SUMMARY TO L. ESKOW OF CASE CIT	ring outside litigat	ION AS ATTACHM	ENT TO PROC	F
03/17/10	Costa, Jessica	0.80	316.00	15700	20163494
	RENCE CALL RE: OPPOSITION TO NOTER (AN AND C. VEIT.	HOLDER CLAIMS WITH	L. ESKOW, K. DESA	AI, R.	
03/17/10	Costa, Jessica	0.80	316.00	15700	20163604
	RCH RE; ATTACHING AN UNRELATED CO RCH TO R. SHERMAN (.2).	OMPLAINT TO A PROOF	OF CLAIM (.6); SU	MMARIZE	
03/18/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	15700	20344731
MEMOI	RANDUM TO P. O'TOOLE RE: NOTEHOLD	ERS CLAIMS.			
03/18/10	Rosen, Brian	0.30	292.50	15700	20344732
CONFE	R WITH C. SMITH RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIM	S.			
03/18/10	Albanese, Anthony	2.00	1,640.00	15700	20217584
CONFE ARGUM	RENCE WITH E. LAW, P. OTOOLE, L. ESK 1ENTS (1.3); FOLLOW UP WITH V. JOHNS	OW AND V. JOHNSON I ON RE: SAME (.7).	RE: POTENTIAL SE	CURITIES	
03/18/10	Mastando, III, John	0.40	328.00	15700	20240759
REVIEV	W SECURITIES ISSUES RE: BONDHOLDER	CLAIMS.			
03/18/10	Levine, Alexander	5.20	3,094.00	15700	20247817
DRAFT EMAIL	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF S WITH WAMU TEAM RE: DISCOVERY SO	CLAIM (12); RESEARCH CHEDULE FOR TRANQU	I RE: SAME (3.0); E ILLITY OBJECTION	XCHANGE (1.0).	
03/18/10	Vaishnav, Neil	6.00	2,370.00	15700	20174796
DRAFT	SECTIONS OF REPLY BRIEF RE: SUBSTA	ANTIVE CONSOLIDATIO	N.		
03/18/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.90	1,320.50	15700	20175538
	ND FINALIZE BUSHANSKY 510(B) OBJEC SEL, K. DIBLASI AND K. TURNER RELATE		CORRESPONDENC	CE WITH LOC	AL
03/18/10	Chandis, Vanessa	7.90	4,345.00	15700	20171987

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
(4.2); CO RESEAF	SECTION FOR REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' RESIONFER WITH P. O'TOOLE, J. MISHKIN, C. VEIT, I CCH FOR REPLY (1.0); DRAFT PRELIMINARY ST (SE (2.7).	R. SHERMAN, J. COS	STA AND K. DES.	AI RE:	
03/18/10	Yates, Erin	2.80	1,274.00	15700	20166041
CLAIM: ROSEN ELSBRI	PROOF OF CLAIM (.2); DRAFT E-MAILS TO A. (1); REVIEW POLICIES (1.5); EMAILS WITH K. RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW LIST OF CLAIMS NOTICE (.2); RECONCILE INVENTORY OF CLAIMS (.2); RE: SAME (.2).	DIBLASI RE: CLAIM CED TO THE 2007-20	4S (2); DRAFT E- 08 BLENDED PO	MAIL TO B. LICY FROM E.	
03/18/10	Law, Erin	3.50	2,432.50	15700	20174858
WITH P	PPATE IN CALL WITH WAMU TEAM TO DISCUS ROOFS OF CLAIM (.7); DISCUSS SAME WITH J. ZE (2.6).	SS SECURITIES ISSU COSTA AND K. DES	JES ARISING IN ( AI (.2); RESEAR(	CONNECTION CH AND	
03/18/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.20	822.00	15700	20282887
REVIEV	V REVISIONS TO 510(B) SUBORDINATION OBJE	ECTIONS TO CONFO	RM TO OMNIBU	S FORMAT.	
03/18/10	Johnson, Virginia	4.90	3,356.50	15700	20168900
WITH R RESPO	ZE OBJECTIONS AND PREPARE ACCOMPANYIN ICHARDS LAYTON & FINGER AND K. DIBLASI NSE TO BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITION/STRATEC AND P. O'TOOLE RE: SECURITIES ISSUES (1.3)	RE: SAME (.7); EMA 3Y (1.1); CALL WITH	AILS WITH A. AL I A. ALBANESE,	BANESE RE: E. LAW, L.	
03/18/10	Eskow, Lisa	12.60	8,820.00	15700	20193854
ALBAN	RCH AND DRAFT REPLY SECTION (6.1); PARTK ESE, P. O'TOOLE, V. JOHNSON AND E. LAW RE: R WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: BRIEFING STRATEGY (	POTENTIAL SECUE	RITIES ARGUME	NTS (1.3);	
03/18/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	7.80	5,460.00	15700	20240986
CORRE JOHNS (5.6); C	SPONDENCE WITH L. ESKOW AND V. JOHNS OF SPONDENCE WITH J. MISHKIN RE: ALTER EGO ON RE: SECURITIES LAW ISSUES (.1); CONTINU ONFERENCE CALL WITH L. ESKOW RE: BRIEFI IN, C. VEIT, R. SHERMAN, J. COSTA AND K. DES	) LAW ISSUES (.1); ( IE DRAFTING REPL NG STRATEGY (.9);	CORRESPONDEN Y RE: BONDHOL CONFER WITH V	DERS CLAIMS 7. CHAND IS, J.	
03/18/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	15700	20282890
CONFE	R WITH M. MILLS RE: OREGON CLAIM OBJECT	ION.			
03/18/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	15700	20166557
EMAIL	S RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS WITH E. YATES.				
03/18/10	Ng, Alexander	5.00	2,975.00	15700	20167601
REVISE	E OBJECTION (.2); REVIEW AND DRAFT BKK O	BJECTION (4.8).			
03/18/10	Leonard, Sarah	3.40	680.00	15700	20174684
REVIE	W MDL COMPLAINT (3.0); RESEARCH RE: SAMI	E (.4).			
03/18/10	Mishkin, Jessie	2.00	1,100.00	15700	20174751
RESEA O'TOO	RCH AND DRAFT INSERTS FOR BONDHOLDER LE, C. VEIT, R. SHERMAN, J. COSTA, AND K. DE	S'CLAIM OBJECTIC SAI RE: RESEARCH	ON REPLY (1.0); ( FOR REPLY (1.0	CONFER WITH I ).	•
03/18/10	Desai, Kavita	7.20	3,276.00	15700	20174389

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
ANALYZ WITH P.	E POSSIBLE DEFENSES TO RESPONSE TO O O'TOOLE, J. MISHKIN, C. VEIT, R. SHERMAN	BJECTION (2.7); AI AND J. COSTA RE	NALYZE PLEADING : RESEARCH FOR R	(3.5); CONFER EPLY (1.0).	
03/18/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20246762
CONFER (.1).	WITH K. DIBLASIRE: OREGON CLAIM OBJ	ECTION (.1); CONF	ER WITH B. PEDERS	SEN RE: SAME	
03/18/10	Sherman, Rachel	2.70	1,228.50	15700	20170063
RESEAR AND K. I	CH RE: CONTESTED MATTERS (1.7); CONFE DESAI RE: RESEARCH RE: REPLY (1.0).	R WITH P. O'TOOLI	E, C. VEIT, J. COSTA	, J. MISHKIN	
03/18/10	Turner, Kim	0.10	45.50	15700	20169939
REVIEW	CORRESPONDENCE RE: CLAIM OBJECTION	AND DECLARATI	ON.		
03/18/10	Veit, Cheri	7.60	3,458.00	15700	20192667
	CH RE: REPLY TO BANK BONDHOLDERS' RI O'TOOLE, J. MISHKIN, J. COSTA, R. SHERMA				
03/18/10	Costa, Jessica	0.20	79.00	15700	20166523
CORRES	PONDENCE WITH E. LAW AND K. DESAI RE	: CLAIMS RESEAR	CH.		
03/18/10	Costa, Jessica	2.10	829.50	15700	20166524
	CH RE: PARENT LIABILITY FOR SUBSIDIAR				201002
03/18/10	Costa, Jessica	3.80	1,501.00	15700	20166508
	G WITH C. VEIT, K. DESAI, J. MISHKIN, R. SI ALYZE AND ASSESS POSSIBLE ARGUMENT				Y
03/18/10	Costa, Jessica	5.20	2,054.00	15700	20166461
	DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH CLAIR KOW (.2).	M OBJECTION (5.0)	); SUMMARIZE SAM	E IN E-MAIL	
03/19/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	15700	20392972
TELEPH	ONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH RE: CLA	IM (.3); MEMOR AN	IDUM TO K. DIBLAS	SI RE: SAME (.1	).
03/19/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.10	72.00	15700	20253274
EMAILS	FROM P. REPASHRE: CLAIMANT'S REQUES	T FOR REIMBURS	EMENT.		
03/19/10	Albanese, Anthony	0.70	574.00	15700	20217592
CONFEI	RENCES WITH L. ESKOW, V. JOHNSON AND CH RE: SAME (.4).		ATTIES RESEARCH (.	3); REVIEW	
03/19/10	Mastando, III, John	1.20	984.00	15700	20240919
	DRAFT REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' CLAIMS				
03/19/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0,90	760.50	15700	20176560
REVIEV	V DRAFT REPLY BRIEF (4); REVIEW BONDH DLE RE: REPLY BRIEF (.2).				
03/19/10	Levine, Alexander	4.80	2,856.00	15700	20247465

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
AND REV	ONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MISHKIN AND VISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAIM (3.0 AMU TEAM RE: TRANQUILITY OBJECTION NQUILITY CLAIM (.2).	): RESEARCH RE: SAN	AE (.9); EXCHANGE	E EM AILS	
03/19/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.50	592.50	15700	20174612
REVISE 1	REPLY BRIEF.				
03/19/10	Vaishnav, Neil	6.10	2,409.50	15700	20174797
REVISE	REPLY BRIEF.				
03/19/10	Chandis, Vanessa	8.00	4,400.00	15700	20171931
R. SHER	AND EDIT REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' RES MAN, J. COSTA AND K. DESAI RE: SAME (1 OLDERS CLAIM (.2).	SPONSE (6.3): CONFE .5); CONFER WITH J.	R WITH P. OTOOLI MISHKIN RE: REPI	E, J. MISHKIN, LY BRIEF FOR	
03/19/10	Law, Erin	4.60	3,197.00	15700	20174859
(3.0); CO V. JOHN	CH AND ANALYZE SECURITIES LAW ISSUMED THE RENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI AND J. C. SON, P. O'TOOLE AND WA MDL COUNSEL ISE TO OBJECTION (.7); EMAILS WITH L. ESTIS (.5).	OSTA RE: SAME (.4);' RE: WMB BONDHOLI	TELEPHONE CONF DERS'PROOF OF C	ERENCE WITH LAIM AND	
03/19/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.70	479.50	15700	20175183
TELECO BONDH	ONFERENCES WITH S. CAPLOW, P. OTOOLI OLDERS' OPPOSITION/STRATEGY.	E AND E. LAW RE: PR	EPARATION OF RE	ESPONSE TO	
03/19/10	Johnson, Virginia	3.90	2,671.50	15700	20283135
	ZE OMNIBUS (SUBORDINATION) OBJECTIO DIBLASI RE: SAME (.7).	ONS (3.2); CONFER WI	TH RICHARDS LAY	YTON & FINGE	₹
03/19/10	Repash, Philip	2.10	1,438.50	15700	20175121
DISCOV	WITH CLAIMANTS RE: SCHEDULING (.8); ERY (.2); PREPARATION OF SEARCH TERM AND J. WEINSTEIN RE: REIMBURSABLE I	I FOR ELECTRONIC D	WITH D. VENDITTI ATA (.8); EMAILS	I RE: WITH C.	
03/19/10	Eskow, Lisa	3.50	2,450.00	15700	20193852
MEMOR AND AN	R WITH R. SHERM AN RE: REPLY BRIEF (.2) ANDUM TO B. ROSEN AND K. DIBLASI RE ALYZE RESEARCH MEMORAND A ON SEC R WITH A. ALBANESE, V. JOHNSON, AND E NG (.3).	: STRATEGY FOR REI URITIES ISSUES FOR	PLY ARGUMENT (I INCORPORATION	l.9); REVIEW IN REPLY (1.1)	
03/19/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	6.80	4,760.00	15700	20240989
O'Toole, Jr., Patick  O'Toole, Jr., Patick  ORAFT REPLY RE: BONDHOLDERS CLAIMS (4.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE RE: STATUS (.1); REVIEW MATERIALS RE: HUDSON OBJECTION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FINESTONE RE: STATUS AND STRATEGY (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. CAPLOW, V. JOHNSON AND E. LAW RE: PROOF OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTION (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. CHANDIS, J. MISHKIN, C. VEIT, R. SHERMAN, J. COSTA AND K. DESAI RE: REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS RESPONSE (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO RE: REPLY BRIEF (.2).					
03/19/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.70	441.00	15700	20170818

CALL WITH CLAIMANTS' COUNSEL RE: WITHDRAWAL OF CLAIMS (.1); EMAILS RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW ISSUES RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); CALL A. LEVINE RE: TRANQUILITY CLAIM (.2).

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/19/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.70	441.00	15700	20283248
CALL W	TITH RICHARDS LAYTON & FINGER AND	V. JOHNSON RE: SUBOR	DINATION OBJEC	CTIONS.	
03/19/10	Ng, Alexander	0.10	59.50	15700	20171136
REVIEV	OBJECTION.				
03/19/10	Mishkin, Jessie	2.30	1,265.00	15700	20174773
PORTIC	S REPLY BRIEF FOR BONDHOLDERS CLA INS OF SAME (1.6); DISCUSS MARTA OBJI IMAN (.5).	IM OBJECTION WITH V ECTION ARGUMENT STI	.CHANDIS (.2); RI RATEGIES WITH A	EVISE A. LEVINE AN	D
03/19/10	Desai, Kavita	8.60	3,913.00	15700	20174390
RESEAI COSTA	RCH IN CONNECTION WITH CLAIMS OBJI TO DISCUSS RESEARCH RESULTS (.4); DI	ECTION REPLY (2.5); CO RAFT SUMMARY OF SAI	NFER WITH E. LA ME (5.7).	W AND J.	
03/19/10	Mills, Marvin	2.10	829.50	15700	20246147
REVIEV	OREGON PROOF OF CLAIM OBJECTION	N (.3); REVISE SAME (1.8)	).		
03/19/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.70	773.50	15700	20170903
PREPA	RE OBJECTION TO CLAIM AND 31ST OMN	IIBUS OBJECTION.			
03/19/10	Sherman, Rachel	1.00	455.00	15700	20174081
	REVISE B. ROSEN DECLARATION (.5); CATION (.5).	ALL WITH A. LEVINE AN	ID J. MISHKIN RE	: MARTA	
03/19/10	Sherman, Rachel	3.30	1,501.50	15700	20173752
AND K.	RCH RE: CONTESTED MATTERS (1.6); CO DESAI RE: REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS RE ANALYSIS (.2).	nfer with L. eskow, ` esponse (1.5); confer	V. CHANDIS, C. V. WITH L. ESKOW I	EIT, J. COSTA, RE: REPLY	
03/19/10	Veit, Cheri	1.80	819.00	15700	20191842
DRAFT	SECTION OF THE REPLY TO THE NOTEH	IOLDERS' RESPONSE.			
03/19/10	Costa, Jessica	0.40	158.00	15700	20170720
MEETI	NG WITH E. LAW AND K. DESAI RE: SECU	JRITIES RESEARCH.			
03/19/10	Costa, Jessica	2.30	908.50	15700	20170696
RESEA RESEA	RCH RE: SECURITIES LAWS ISSUES IN CO	NNECTION WITH REPL	Y BRIEF AND SU	MMARIZE	
03/19/10	Costa, Jessica	3.70	1,461.50	15700	20170704
RESEA	RCH RE: SECURITIES ACT.				
03/19/10	Costa, Jessica	6.30	2,488.50	15700	20170726
	RESEARCH RE: SECURITIES LAWS IN CO	ONNECTION WITH REPL	Y BRIEF.		
03/19/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	0.10	18.00	15700	20278988
	W BOILERMAKERS ACTION.				
03/20/10	Vaishnav, Neil	2.00	790.00	15700	20174791

REVISE REPLY BRIEF FOR WMB BONDHOLDERS OBJECTION.  03/20/10	DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
3.10   2.154.50   15700   20174860   TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH AND BRIEF (-7); EMAILS WITH L. ESKOW AND BRIEFING TEAM RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH AND RELATED LISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH BRIEF AND RELATED LEGAL ANALYSIS (2.4).	DATE	I IMEREEFER/DESCRIFTION	HOUKS	ANJULIT	AFINAL	A AA1AE2 AE2
3.10   2.154.50   15700   20174860   TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH AND BRIEF (-7); EMAILS WITH L. ESKOW AND BRIEFING TEAM RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH AND RELATED LISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH BRIEF AND RELATED LEGAL ANALYSIS (2.4).						
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH AND BRIEF (.7); EMAILS WITH L. ESKOW AND BRIEFING TEAM RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH AND RELATED LISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH BRIEF AND RELATED LEGAL ANALYSIS (2.4).  03/20/10 Johnson, Virginia 1.70 1,164.50 15700 20175600 EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. ESKOW, E. LAW AND P. O'TOOLE RE RESEARCH (.4); RESEARCH RESPONSE TO BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITION/STRATEGY (1.3).  03/20/10 Eskow, Lisa 4.80 3,360.00 15700 20193748 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, K. DESAI, AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES RESEARCH AND DRAFT ING STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF (.7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES AROUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (.7); CONFER WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: 2:005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (.2); REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESEARCH MEMORANDA ON SECURITIES ISSUES (.7).  03/20/10 O'Toole, Jr., Patrick 4.00 2,800.00 15700 20240991 REVIEW AND REVISE REPLY (2.3); REVIEW MATERIALS RE: SECURITIES ISSUES (1.5): TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (.2):  03/20/10 Mishkin, Jessie 5.50 3,025.00 15700 20174482 RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Dessi, Kavita 5.30 2,411.50 15700 20174492 CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7): REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171070 CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR HALLURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR	REVISE	REPLY BRIEF FOR WMB BONDHOLDERS	SOBJECTION.			
AND BRIEF (-7); EMAILS WITH L. ESKOW AND BRIEFING TEAM RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH AND RELATED LEGAL ANALYSIS (2.4).  03/20/10 Johnson, Virginia 1.70 1.164.50 15700 20175600 EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. ESKOW, E. LAW AND P. O'TOOLE RE RESEARCH (-4); RESEARCH RESEARCH (-4); RESEARCH RESEARCH (-4); RESEARCH RESEARCH (-5); REVIEW AND SETO BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITION/STRATEGY (1.3).  03/20/10 Eskow, Lisa 4.80 3.360.00 15700 20193748 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, K. DESAI, AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES RESEARCH AND DRAFTING STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (-7); REVIEW AND REVISE REPLY (-7); REVIEW AND RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLABMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Desai, Kavita 5.30 2.411.50 15700 20174482 CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (-7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (-6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARRATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (-4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070 CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068 KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (-1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (	03/20/10	Law, Erin	3.10	2,154.50	15700	20174860
EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. BSKOW, E. LAW AND P. O'TOOLE RE RESEARCH (.4); RESEARCH RESPONSE TO BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITION/STRATEGY (1.3).  03/20/10 Eskow, Lisa	AND BR	IEF (.7); EMAILS WITH L. ESKOW AND B	RIEFING TEAM RE: SEC	URITIES LAW RES	V RESEARCH EARCH AND	
EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. ESKOW, E. LAW AND P. O'TOOLE RE RESEARCH (.4); RESEARCH RESPONSE TO BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITION/STRATEGY (1.3).  03/20/10 Eskow, Lisa 4.80 3.360.00 15700 20193748  PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, R. DESAI, AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES RESEARCH AND DRAFTING STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF (.7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (3.2); CONFER WITH P. O'TO OLE RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIR CULAR (.2); REVIEW AND AND ANALYZE RESEARCH MEMORANDA ON SECURITIES ISSUES (.7).  03/20/10 O'Toole, Jr., Patrick 4.00 2,800.00 15700 20240991  REVIEW AND REVIEW ENELY (2.3); REVIEW MATERIALS RE: SECURITIES ISSUES (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (.2).  03/20/10 Misbkin, Jessie 5.50 3.025.00 15700 20174482  RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Desai, Kavita 5.30 2,411.50 15700 20174392  CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070  CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067  REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068  KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068  KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).	03/20/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.70	1,164.50	15700	20175600
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, K. DESAI, AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES RESEARCH AND DRAFTING STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF (7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SECURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (22); CONFER WITH P. OTOOLE RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROG RAM CIRCULAR (.2); REVIEW AND AN ALYZE RESEARCH MEMORANDA ON SECURITIES ISSUES (.7).  03/20/10 O'Toole, Jr., Patrick 4.00 2,800.00 15700 20240991  REVIEW AND REVISE REPLY (2.3); REVIEW MATERIALS RE: SECURITIES ISSUES (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (.2).  03/20/10 Misbkin, Jessie 5.50 3,025.00 15700 20174482  RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Desai, Kavita 5.30 2,411.50 15700 20174392  CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON B RIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070  CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067  REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171067  KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071  DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.	EMAIL ( RESPON	CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. ESKOW, E. I SE TO BONDHOLDERS' OPPOSITION/STR	LAW AND P. O'TOOLE R RATEGY (1.3).	E RESEARCH (.4); I	RESEARCH	
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, K. DESAI, AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES RESEARCH AND DRAFTING STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF (7,7); RESEARCH AND DRAFT SCURITIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (3,2); CONFER WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: 2005 GLOB AL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (2); REVIEW AND AN ALYZE RESEARCH MEMORANDA ON SECURITIES ISSUES (7).  03/20/10 O'Toole, Jr., Patrick 4.00 2,800.00 15700 20240991 REVIEW AND REVIEW AND REVIEW MATERIALS RE: SECURITIES ISSUES (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (2).  03/20/10 Mishkin, Jessie 5.50 3,025.00 15700 20174482 RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Desai, Kavita 5.30 2,411.50 15700 20174392 CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070 CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068 KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071 DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071 DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.	03/20/10	Eskow, Lisa	4.80	3,360.00	15700	20193748
REVIEW AND REVISE REPLY (2.3); REVIEW MATERIALS RE: SECURITIES ISSUES (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (.2).  03/20/10 Mishkin, Jessie 5.50 3,025.00 15700 20174482 RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Desai, Kavita 5.30 2,411.50 15700 20174392 CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON B RIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070 CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068 KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071 DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853 REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	PARTIC AND DR	IPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. L. LAFTING STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF ( PLY BRIEF (3.2): CONFER WITH P. O'TOO	.7); RESEARCH AND DR LE RE: 2005 GLOBAL NO	AFT SECURITIES A OTE PROGRAM CIR	RGUMENT	СН
CONFERENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE: 2005 GLOBAL NOTE PROGRAM CIRCULAR (2).   03/20/10   Mishkin, Jessie   5.50   3,025.00   15700   20174482     RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION.     03/20/10   Desai, Kavita   5.30   2,411.50   15700   20174392     CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).     03/20/10   Costa, Jessica   0.70   276.50   15700   20171070     CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.     03/20/10   Costa, Jessica   0.80   316.00   15700   20171067     REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.     03/20/10   Costa, Jessica   0.90   355.50   15700   20171068     KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).     03/20/10   Costa, Jessica   4.60   1,817.00   15700   20171071     DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.     03/21/10   Berz, David   0.50   450.00   15700   20250853     REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	03/20/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	4.00	2,800.00	15700	20240991
RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Desai, Kavita 5.30 2,411.50 15700 20174392  CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070  CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067  REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068  KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071  DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853  REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	REVIEV CONFEI	V AND REVISE REPLY (2.3); REVIEW MAT	TERIALS RE: SECURITIE L NOTE PROGRAM CIR	ES ISSUES (1.5); TEI CULAR (.2).	LEPHONE	
RESEARCH AND DRAFT ARGUMENT SECTIONS FOR MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION.  03/20/10 Desai, Kavita 5.30 2,411.50 15700 20174392  CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON B RIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070  CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067  REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068  KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071  DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853  REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	03/20/10	Mishkin, Jessie	5.50	3,025.00	15700	20174482
CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. LAW, L. ESKOW AND J. COSTA RE: SECURITIES LAW RESEARCH (.7); REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070 CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068 KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071 DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853 REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.			FOR MARTA CLAIMS O	BJECTION.		
REVIEW PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OFFERING DOCUMENTS (.6); REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE MARATHON BRIEFING AND OUR RESPONSE (4.0).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.70 276.50 15700 20171070 CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068 KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071 DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853 REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	03/20/10	Desai, Kavita	5.30	2,411.50	15700	20174392
CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, AND E. LAW RE: DRAFTING BRIEF SECTION FOR FAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067 REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068 KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071 DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853 REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASI RE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	REVIEV	V PLEADINGS FOR INFORMATION ON OF	FERING DOCUMENTS (	ITIES LAW RESEA .6); REVIEW AND S	RCH (.7); SUMMARIZE	
PAILURE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.80 316.00 15700 20171067  REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068  KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071  DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853  REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	03/20/10	Costa, Jessica	0.70	276.50	15700	20171070
REVIEW MARATHON CREDIT CLAIMANTS PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RESPONSE TO OPPOSITION FOR MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 0.90 355.50 15700 20171068  KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071  DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853  REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	CONFE FAILUR	RENCE CALL WITH K. DESAI, L. ESKOW, LE TO STATE SECURITIES CLAIMS.	AND E. LAW RE: DRAF	TING BRIEF SECTI	ON FOR	
MISREPRESENTATION CLAIMS.         03/20/10 Costa, Jessica       0.90       355.50       15700       20171068         KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).       03/20/10       Costa, Jessica       4.60       1,817.00       15700       20171071         DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.       03/21/10       Berz, David       0.50       450.00       15700       20250853         REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	03/20/10	Costa, Jessica	0.80	316.00	15700	20171067
KEYCITE CASES REFERENCED IN BRIEF (.1); REVIEW COMPLAINT, OFFERING DOCUMENTS, AND OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10 Costa, Jessica 4.60 1,817.00 15700 20171071 DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853 REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.			OFS OF CLAIM AND RE	SPONSE TO OPPOS	SITION FOR	
OPPOSITION RE: SAME (.8).  03/20/10	03/20/10	Costa, Jessica	0.90	355.50	15700	20171068
DRAFT SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.  03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853 REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.			VIEW COMPLAINT, OF	FERING DOCUMEN	NTS, AND	
03/21/10 Berz, David 0.50 450.00 15700 20250853 REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	03/20/10	Costa, Jessica	4.60	1,817.00	15700	20171071
REVIEW SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BKK AND ANALYZE EACH.	DRAFT	SECTION OF REPLY BRIEF.				
	03/21/10	Berz, David	0.50	450.00	15700	20250853
02/21/10 Albanaca Anthony 0.50 410.00 15700 20217505	REVIE	W SEVEN PROOF OF CLAIMS FROM K.DI	BLASIRE: BKK AND A	NALYZE EACH.		
05/21/10 Albanese, Anthony 0.50 410.00 15/00 2021/595	03/21/10	Albanese, Anthony	0.50	410.00	15700	20217595
CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH E. LAW, V. JOHNSON, L. ESKOW AND P. O'TOOLE RE: BONDHOLDERS OPPOSITION.			ohnson, L. eskow at	ND P. O'TOOLE RE:	BONDHOLDI	BRS
03/21/10 Mastando, III, John 0.40 328.00 15700 20240925	03/21/10	Mastando, III, John	0.40	328.00	15700	20240925
REVIEW REVISED DRAFT REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' CLAIMS.	REVIE		DERS' CLAIMS.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/21/10	Levine, Alexander	3.00	1,785.00	15700	20247477
DRAFT .	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CL	AIM (1.6); RESEAR CH	I RE: SAME (1.4).		
03/21/10	Law, Erin	2.90	2,015.50	15700	20174861
ESKOW CONFE F	DRAFT SECURITIES LAW SECTION FOR EIN CONNECTION WITH BRIEF AND SECURIENCES AND EMAILS WITH V. JOHNSON, ACTION WITH SAME (.5).	RITIES LAW ISSUES (.:	5); RESEARCH RE:	SAME (1.4);	
03/21/10	Johnson, Virginia	4.60	3,151.00	15700	20175609
	7 DRAFT RESPONSE TO BONDHOLDERS' O ESE, L. ESKOW, E. LAW, P. O'TOOLE RE: BO				
03/21/10	Eskow, Lisa	8.10	5,670.00	15700	20193774
SECURI RESEAR	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. COSTA RE: BE TIES ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF (6.0); CCH POTENTIAL LOSS CAUSATION ARGUN ESE, P. O'TOOLE, E. LAW, AND V. JOHNSON	EMAIL WITH E. LAW MENT (.2); CONFEREN	RE: SECURITIES AND EMAILS	RGUMENTS (.5	;);
03/21/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	2.50	1,750.00	15700	20240992
	V AND REVISE REPLY (2.0); CONFERENCES ON AND L. ESKOW RE; BONDHOLDERS OPI		A. ALBANESE, E. L	AW, V.	
03/21/10	Desai, Kavita	4.90	2,229.50	15700	20174393
REVIEW	EMAILS AND RESPOND TO QUESTIONS I	RE: BRIEF AND PLEAI	DINGS.		
03/21/10	Sherman, Rachel	0.80	364.00	15700	20173923
EMAILS	WITH L. ESKOW RE: CASE STRATEGY (.4	); REVIEW DRAFT OF	CLAIM OBJECTION	N (.4).	
03/21/10	Costa, Jessica	0.50	197.50	15700	20174151
REVISE	SECTION 15 ANALYSIS FOR BRIEF.				
03/21/10	Costa, Jessica	0.90	355.50	15700	20173872
E-MAIL	CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. ESKOW RE:	REVISIONS TO BRIEF			
03/21/10	Costa, Jessica	1.80	711.00	15700	20173682
RESEAI	RCH RE: REPLY BRIEF.				
03/22/10	Albanese, Anthony	1.20	984.00	15700	20217596
	V/REVISE REPLY BRIEF (.8); CALL WITH E.				
03/22/10	Mastando, III, John	2.40	1,968.00	15700	20239613
CONFE REPLY	RENCE CALL WITH T. FRONGILLO RE: BO TO BONDHOLDERS' CLAIMS (1.8).	NDH OLDERS' HEARIN	NG (.6); EDIT REVIS	ED DRAFT	
03/22/10	Frongillo, Thomas	7.60	6,422.00	15700	20182324
CONFE HEARIN TELEPI	V OF DRAFT REPLY BRIEF (1.0); REVIEW O RENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY, S. NG (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE R HONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MASTANDO I E LAW ON STANDING AND DERIVATIVE (	(ALUNA AND S. LEON .E: REPLY BRIEF (.2); RE: HEARING ON BON	IARD RE: PREPARA REVISE REPLY BR	ATION FOR IEF (2.5);	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/22/10	Levine, Alexander	2.80	1,666.00	15700	20246414
DRAFT . TRANQI	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAI UILITY'S COUNSEL RE: CLAIM OBJECTION DI	M (2.4); EXCHANG SCO VERY SCHED	E CALLS AND EMA ULE (.4).	ILS WITH	
03/22/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	4.10	2,111.50	15700	20191852
DINAPL PREPAR RE: SAM WITH T. PREPAR	ONE CONFERENCES WITH P. OTOOLE RE: RE PROOF OF CLAIM (.2); REVIEW OF FILING ATION FOR CALL WITH OPPOSING COUNSEIME (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE BONDHOLDERS FRONGILLO, S. LEONARD, AND S. IALUNA IN LE MATERIALS FOR APRIL 6 HEARING (1.8); CE IN PREPARATION FOR APRIL 6 HEARING ()	S AND CORRESPO L (.2); TELEPHONE ''RESPONSES AND N PREPARATION F CONFERENCE WITI	NDENCE IN DIN AP CONFERENCE WIT OUR REPLY (.7); C OR APRIL 6 HEARI	LES IN TH J. GURDIAN ONFERENCES NG (1.0);	
03/22/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.40	553.00	15700	20218421
CONFEI HEARIN	RENCE WITH E.BOSSHARD-BLACKEY RE: RE G (.1); RESEARCH AND REVIEW STANDING (	SEARCH IN PREPA CASES (1.3).	ARATION FOR APR	IL 6TH	
03/22/10	Vaishnav, Neil	2.50	987.50	15700	20218642
ANALY	ZE BACKGROUND MATERIALS NECESSARY	FOR DRAFT OF RE	PLY.		
03/22/10	Vaishnav, Neil	3.10	1,224.50	15700	20218420
RESEAF	RCH RE: DERIVATIVE VERSUS DIRECT STAN	DING.			
03/22/10	Law, Erin	1.30	903.50	15700	20182992
WITH A	V AND ANALYZE REVISED SECURITIES SECT . ALBANESE (.4); EMAILS RE: BRIEF WITH V. SPONDENCE RELATING TO BRIEF (.2).	ION OF BRIEF (.4); JOHNSON (.2); EM	DISCUSSION RE: F AIL L. ESKOW RE:	REVISED BRIEF SAME (.1);	
03/22/10	Johnson, Virginia	4.90	3,356.50	15700	20179724
TELECO CORRE	V REVISED RESPONSE TO BONDHOLDERS'OF ONFERENCES WITH P. O'TOOLE, E. LAW, L. ES SPONDENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE AND S. CAPLO RENCE WITH S. CAPLOW, L. ESKOW, AND P. O	SKOW, S. CAPLOW OW RE: SECURITE	AND C. VEIT RE: S S ISSUES (.1); TELE	AME (1.9);	
03/22/10	Repash, Philip	1.40	959.00	15700	20233241
	V AND CREATION OF ESISEARCH TERMS FO DITTI RE: SAME (.2).	R JPM DATA (1.2);	EMAILS AND DISC	USSIONS WITH	
03/22/10	Eskow, Lisa	3.70	2,590.00	15700	20188807
PROOF ACTION MISREN JOHNSO CONFE EMAIL SOURC DRAFT	V RESEARCH ON WASHINGTON SECURITIES SOF CLAIM, RESPONSES, AND MDL COMPLAN AND POTENTIAL IMPLICATIONS FOR REPLICATIONS FOR REPLICATION CLAIMS AGAINST WMI (2.0); ON, AND S. CAPLOW RE: SECURITIES ISSUES RENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE, V. JOHNSON, AND MEMORANDUM FROM C. VEIT RE: BONDHOE OF BOND PURCHASE (.1); RESEARCH SECUOF MISREPRESENTATION SECTION OF REPLICATION OF REPLICATION SECTION OF SONDS	INT TO DETERMINY ARGUMENTS FOR DRAFT EMAIL ME IN MDL (.2); PART S. CAPLOW RE: RE LDERS' ALLEGATI RITIES ARGUMEN Y BRIEF (.4); REVI	NE SECURITIES AT OR DISMISSAL OF MORANDUM TO P ICIPATE IN TELEP! EPLY STRATEGY (.4 IONS CONCERNING ITS FOR REPLY BRI	ISSUE IN MDL . OTOOLE, V. HONE 6); REVIEW TIMING AND IEF (.2); REVISE	
03/22/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	6.60	4,620.00	15700	20238799
B. FINE JOHNS JOHNS	RENCE WITH T.FRONGILLO RE: STATUS AN STONE RE: STATUS AND STRATEGY (.1); TEI ON RE: SECURITIES ISSUE (.1); TELEPHONE C ON RE: SECURITIES (.6); REVIEW AND REVIS ARD-BLACKEY RE: REPLY TO BONDHOLDER	LEPHONE CONFER CONFERENCE WITH E DRAFT REPLY (	ENCE WITH S. CAF H S. CAPLOW, L. ES 5.4); CONFERENCE	PLOW AND V. SKOW, V. WITH E.	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	Hours	AMOUNT	TASK	· TIME ID
03/22/10	Venditti, Daniel	1.00	630.00	15700	20181025
REVIEV DISCUS	V EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.4); DRAFT SEARCI SIONS WITH P. REPASH RE: SAME (.2).	H TERMS FOR DISCOV	TERY (A); E-MAILS	AND	
03/22/10	Wright, Miles	0.50	315.00	15700	20248984
CALL W	VITH LOCAL COUNSEL ON DISCOVERY IS	SUES.			
03/22/10	Leonard, Sarah	6.50	1,300.00	15700	20211219
CONFE DOCUM	RENCES WITH T. FRONGILLO, E. BOSSHA IENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING (1	RD-BLACKEY AND S .0); PREPARATION FO	LEONARD RE: ORG R UPCOMING HEAD	ANIZATION ( RING (5.5).	OF
03/22/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.10	55.00	15700	20295650
CONFE	RENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY RE	: DINAPLES PROOF OF	F CLAIM.		·
03/22/10	Mishkin, Jessie	1.30	715.00	15700	20190418
FOR MA	SS DISCOVERY REQUEST WITH R. SHERM ARTA OBJECTION (.7); EMAIL A. LEVINE & II AND C. SMITH RE: DUFF STIPULATIONS	& V.JOHNSON RE: SAN	ND DRAFT ARGUM ME (.2); EMAIL R. So	ENT SECTION OBIECKL K.	IS
03/22/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20246614
	W AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE SSIONALS RE: CLAIMS.	WITH J. GURDIAN ANI	D ALVAREZ & MAR	RSAL	
03/22/10	Mills, Marvin	0.90	355.50	15700	20247483
PREPA	RE STIPULATION RE: PBGC.				
03/22/10	Sherman, Rachel	6.50	2,957.50	15700	20180905
DRAFT	R CH RE: SECURITIES FRAUD ELEMENTS ( /REVISE DIS COVERY REQUESTS (1.5); CO W CLAIM OBJECTION AND RELATED MAT	NFER WITH J. MISHKI	ESKOW RE: CASE N RE: DISCOVERY	STRATEGY (. REQUESTS (.2	2); 2);
03/22/10	Turner, Kim	1.30	591.50	15700	20193133
REVIEV	W DOCKET ENTRIES (.1); REVIEW FILED (	BJECTION (1.2).			
03/22/10	Veit, Cheri	7.10	3,230.50	15700	20191859
RESEA ALLEG	RCH WASHINGTON STATE SECURITIES A ATIONS PRO OF OF CLAIMS AND OBJECT	CT (2.4); REVIEW AND IONS (4.7).	O ANALYZE FACTU	AL	
03/22/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.40	80.00	15700	20188069
SEND 2	29TH AND 30TH OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS T	O V. JOHNSON.			
03/22/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	7.40	1,332.00	15700	20190424
DOCUI	ERENCES WITH T. FRONGILLO, E. BOSSHAMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ( R ATION FOR HEARING (6.4).	ARD-BLACKEY AND S. 1.0); PREPARE AND OR	LEONARD RE: ORG GANIZE CASES/ST	GANIZATION ATUTES IN	OF
03/22/10	Roberts, Sarah	0.30	69.00	15700	20180690
OBTAI	N MORGAN STANLEY CLAIM 2584 AND O	BJECTION TO SAME A	S REQUESTED BY	K. DIBLASI.	
03/23/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.70	504.00	15700	20253736
EMAIL EMAIL	FR OM P. REPASH RE: HEARINGS RE: EMI FR OM P. REPASH RE: DISCOVERY ISSUE	PLOYEE CLAIMS - RES S (.1); CONFER WITH P	CHEDULING AND P. REPASH RE: FOR	STA TUS (.1); EGOIN G (.5).	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/23/10	Mastando, III, John	0.20	164.00	15700	20239620
MEETIN	G WITH J. MISHKIN AND R. SHERMAN RE	: DISCRETIONARY PR	ICING CLAIMS.		
03/23/10	Mastando, III, John	0.40	328.00	15700	20239619
MEETIN	G WITH J. MISHKIN AND V. CHANDIS RE:	OBJECTION TO BONE	HOLDERS' CLAIM	S.	
03/23/10	Mastando, III, John	0.60	492.00	15700	20239621
REVIEW	DRAFT DISCOVERY REQUESTS RE: DISC	RETIONARY PRICING	CLAIMS.		
03/23/10	Mastando, III, John	0.90	738.00	15700	20239241
	OBJECTION TO BONDHOLDERS' CLAIMS		•		
03/23/10	Frongillo, Thomas	9.70	8,196.50	15700	20185982
REVIEV (2.5); TI BONDH	V BONDHOLDERS' BRIEFS (1.5); RESEARCI ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. OTOOL OLDERS' CLAIMS, INCLUDING REVIEW O RENCE WITH N. VAISHNAU RE: TREATISE	HRE: STANDING ISSU ERE: REPLY BRIEF (2 FSTATUTES AND CA	E AND DERIVATIVE); PREPARE FOR H	EARING ON	
03/23/10	Levine, Alexander	3.40	2,023.00	15700	20246744
DRAFT COUNS (.2).	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF C EL RE: SETTING DISCOVERY SCHEDULE I	LAIM (2.9); EXCHANG N TRANQUILITY OBJ	E EMAILS WITH O ECTION (3); RESE	PPOSING ARCH RE: SAM	<b>1</b> E
03/23/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	3.20	1,648.00	15700	20191800
BONDH COUNS AND U	RE MATERIALS FOR APRIL 6 HEARING (.5) IOLDERS'RESPONSE (1.8); TELEPHONE CO EL RE: DINAPLES CLAIM (.2); PREPARE EN PDATING CLAIMS CHART RE: SAME (.2); C RATION FOR APRIL 6 HEARING (.5).	NFERENCES WITH K. AAIL MESSAGE TO P.	. DIBLASI AND OPI O'TOOLE RE: DINA	POSING PLES CLAIM	
03/23/10	Vaishnav, Neil	0.40	158.00	15700	20218795
DISCUS	SS ORAL ARGUMENT AND NARROWED SC	OPE OF RESEARCH W	VITH T. FRONGILL	Э.	
03/23/10	Vaishnav, Neil	5.10	2,014.50	15700	20218794
RESEA	RCH STANDING TO ASSERT DERIVATIVE	CLAIMS.			
03/23/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.50	347.50	15700	20231812
CORRE	SPONDENCE RELATED TO ERISA AND SE	CURITIES OMNIBUS (	CLAIMS OBJECTIO	NS.	
03/23/10	Chandis, Vanessa	1.20	660.00	15700	20230852
MEET V	WITH J. MASTANDO AND J. MISHKIN RE: I MNIBUS OBJECTION (.4); REVIEW CASES	PREPARATION FOR OFF FOR SAME (.8).	RAL ARGUMENT R	E: DEBTORS'	
03/23/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	15700	20283126
E-MAI	L WITH R. JAIN RE: CHARTIS' PROOF OF C	LAIM.			
03/23/10	Johnson, Virginia	4.80	3,288.00	15700	20200480
TELEC UNDEI	W REVISED RESPONSE TO BONDHOLDER: CONFERENCES WITH P. OTOOLE, L. ESKOV RWRITER PROOF OF CLAIM FOR INDEMNI SI RE: SAME (.8).	V. S. CAPLOW AND C.	VEIT RE: SAME (	7), REVIEW ICE WITH K.	
03/23/10	Repash, Philip	1.50	1,027.50	15700	20233857

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW LOCAL (	AND DRAFT DISCOVERY SEARCH TER COUNSEL RE: RESCHEDULING (.1); CON	MS AND PRIVILEGED K FER WITH L. BAER RE: \$	EY WORDS (.9); EM SAME (.5).	1AILS TO	
03/23/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	15700	20254749
CORRES	PONDENCE WITH M. MCQUIRE RE: OBJ	ECTION DEADLINE FOR	HUDSON AND S.	BURR CLAIMS	
03/23/10	Eskow, Lisa	1.90	1,330.00	15700	20188693
TELEPH STRATE	MISREPRESENTATION SECTION OF BOIL ONE CONFERENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE, V GY (.7); UPDATE P. O'TOOLE AND V. JOI FIONS ARGUMENTS (.1).	'. JOHNSON, C. VEIT, AN	D S. CAPLOW RE:	BKEFING	
03/23/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	7.80	5,460.00	15700	20239830
PREPAR	DRAFT REPLY (4.5); REVIEW STANDING E FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONF V (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH	ERENCE WITH V. JOHN	SON, L. ESKOW, C.	AME (.9); VEIT AND S.	
03/23/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.20	126.00	15700	20283128
TELEPH CLAIM.	IONE CONFERENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD	-BLACKEY AND OPPOS	ING COUNSEL RE:	DINAPLES	
03/23/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.00	630.00	15700	20181219
EMAIL (.8).	V. JOHNSON RE: SECURITIES LITIGATIO	ON CLAIM (.2); REVIEW	ISSUES RE: LITIGA	TION CLAIMS	;
03/23/10	Wright, Miles	0,40	252.00	15700	20248117
MEETIN	NG WITH A. LEVINE RE: TRANQUILITY	OBJECTION.			
03/23/10	Leonard, Sarah	7.40	1,480.00	15700	20211222
OBTAIN IN OFFE	N SOURCE MATERIALS CITED IN OFFER ERING CIRCULAR (.5); PREPARE FOR UP	ING CIRCULAR (1.9); RE COMING HEARING (5.0)	VIEW SOURCE MA	TERIALS CIT	ED
03/23/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.70	385.00	15700	20266969
CALL R	E: NY C CLAIM (.5); PRE PARE FOR SAME	(.1); CALL WITH M. MI	LLS RE: SAME (.1).		
03/23/10	Mishkin, Jessie	2.00	1,100.00	15700	20190428
PREPAI	NG WITH J. MASTANDO AND V. CHAND RE BONDHOLDERS ORAL ARGUMENT N NDO AND R. SHERMAN RE: DISCRETIO	IATERIALS FOR J. MAST	「ANDO (1.4); MEET	AIMS (.4); 'ING WITH J.	
03/23/10	Desai, Kavita	0.20	91.00	15700	20184143
REVIE	W CASES IN CONNECTION WITH REPLY	TO BONDHOLDERS'CL	AIM OBJECTION.		
03/23/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20246748
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITHNYC COUNSEL AND	J. GURDIAN RE: NYC C	LAIM.		
03/23/10	Mills, Marvin	0.30	118.50	15700	20246593
CONFE	R WITH B. BRENNAN (.2) AND J. GURDI	AN (.1) RE: NYC CLAIM.			
03/23/10 PREPA	Mills, Marvin RE PBGC WITHDRAWAL STIPULATION	3.50 AND ORDER.	1,382.50	15700	20246580
03/23/10	Sherman, Rachel	1.70	773.50	15700	20183410

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ANNUAL AND	n. njagneriov (pv se	TOTAL OF A THE CO	. 10 10 17 11 12 12 17 17 17 17 17 17 17 17 17 17 17 17 17	
CONFER INSURA	WITH J. MASTANDO AND J. MISHKIN R NCE POLICIES RELATED TO CLAIM OBJ	E: DISCRETIONARY PR ECTION (1.5).	ICING CLAIMS (.2)	; REVIEW	
03/23/10	Turner, Kim	0.20	91.00	15700	20193289
REVIEW	OF CORRESPONDENCE RE: SUBPOENA	AND PENDING ISSUES.			
03/23/10	Veit, Cheri	1.00	455.00	15700	20192850
RESEAR JOHNSO	CCH STANDING TO BRING SECTION 11 C N, AND S. CAPLOW RE: LEGAL ISSUES I	LAIM (.3); CALL WITH I N THE REPLY TO THE N	P. OTOOLE, L. ESK NOTEHOLDERS' RE	OW, V. SPONSE (.7).	
03/23/10	Castillero, Francene	5.10	969.00	15700	20205049
CONDU( (2.2).	CT SEARCH FOR CASES CITED IN REPLY	BRIEF AND OPPOSITION	ON BRIEF (2.9); CO	MPILE BINDE	RS
03/23/10	Amponsah, Duke	0.30	60.00	15700	20188129
OBTAIN	OBJECTIONS TO CLAIMS 2889-2900.				
03/23/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	7.20	1,296.00	15700	20190482
PREPAR	E AND ORGANIZE CASES/STATUTES CI	TED IN PREPARATION (	OF HEARING (7.2).		
03/23/10	Roberts, Sarah	1.50	345.00	15700	20180658
	AND COMPARE MORGAN STANLEY CL CH 28TH, 29TH, 30TH OMN IBUS CLAIMS			BJECTION (.5	);
03/23/10	Axon, Hillary	8.00	1,440.00	15700	20204996
TO CLA	V AND COMPILE CASES REFERENCED IN IMS, BONDHOLDERS'RESPONSE AND D AL ARGUMENT.	DEPTORS'20TH SUBS' EBTORS'REPLY RE: AL	FANTIVE OMNIBU TER EGO ISSUE IN	S OBJECTION I PREPARATIO	ON
03/24/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.20	144.00	15700	20254027
EMAIL SAME (.	FROM P. REPASH RE: CLAIMANT EXPEN 1).	SE REIMBURSEMENT (	.1); CONFER WITH	P. REPASH RI	Ε:
03/24/10	Strochak, Adam	0.20	169.00	15700	20219172
PHONE	CALL FROM M. ETKIN (LOWEN STEIN) R	E: SECURITIES LITIGA	TION CLAIMS.		
03/24/10	Frongillo, Thomas	11.50	9,717.50	15700	20190701
REVIEV REPLY	V OFFERING CIRCULAR AND EXHIBITS ( BRIEF (1.0); REVIEW OF CASE LAW AND	(3.0); CONFERENCE WII REVISE REPLY BRIEF	TH P. OTOOLE RE: (7.5).	REVISION OF	
03/24/10	Miller, Brandon	0.20	103.00	15700	20190752
RESEAI	RCH RE: CASE LAW FOR REPLY BRIEF.				
03/24/10	Levine, Alexander	4.30	2,558.50	15700	20246305
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF	CLAIM (2.3); RESEAR C	H RE: SAME (2).		
03/24/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	6.60	3,399.00	15700	20191929
HEARI	RENCES WITH S. LEONARD AND S. IALU NG (.5); REVIEW AND REVISE REPLY TO RENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE RE: SAME (.1).	NA RE: PREPARATION BONDHOLDERS' RESPO	OF MATERIALS FO ONSE (6.0); TELEPI	OR APRIL 6 HONE	
03/24/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.00	395.00	15700	20218370

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	Hours	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	CITING REFERENCES TO MAJOR STAND	ING CASES.			
03/24/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.40	553.00	15700	20218372
RESEAF	RCH RIGHT OF ACTION.				
03/24/10	Vaishnav, Neil	2.40	948.00	15700	20218371
CONDU	CT FURTHER TREATISE RESEARCH RE: D	ERIVATIVE CLAIMS.			
03/24/10	Chandis, Vanessa	3.10	1,705.00	15700	20230909
REVIEV	V CASES FOR PREPARATION OF ORAL AR ONFER WITH H. AXON RE: SAME (.3).		•		
03/24/10	Bronson, Ardith	7.50	5,250.00	15700	20242750
	V OF DRAFT REPLY RE: DEBTORS'TWENT 6 (2.5); REVISE SAME (5.0).	TIETH OMNIBUS (SUBS	STANTIVE) OBJECT	TION TO	
03/24/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.60	1,096.00	15700	20200427
SUBOR	CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. STROCHAK, DINATION OBJECTION/STATUS (.4); EMAI E AND S. CAPLOW RE: RESPONSE TO BOI	IL CORRESPONDENCE	AND CALLS WITH	L.ESKOW, P.	
03/24/10	Repash, Philip	1.10	753.50	15700	20233248
REVIEV SAME (	V OF AND EMAIL TO CLAIMANT RE: CLAI 1).	(M REIMBURSEMENT (	(1.0); CONFER WITI	H L. BAER RE	:
03/24/10	Eskow, Lisa	3.60	2,520.00	15700	20186247
REVIEV	RCH AND REVISE MISREPRESENTATION A WEMAIL MEMORANDUM FROM C. VEIT R OLE AND S. CAPLOW RE: RESPONSE TO B	E: SECTION 11 RESEA	RCH (.1); CALL WI	Y BRIEF (2.3); TH V. JOHNSO	ON,
03/24/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	7.60	5,320.00	15700	20239839
TELEPH	RENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO RE: REPLY B HONE CALL WITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKE ESKOW, V. JOHNSON AND S. CAPLOW R	Y RE: REPLY TO BONI	DHOLDERS RESPO	NSE (.1); CALI	.s
03/24/10	Leonard, Sarah	5.00	1,000.00	15700	20211224
PERTA	RENCE WITH E.BOSSHARD-BLACKEY AN INING TO PLEADING STANDARD FOR UPO IN TO PLEADING STANDARD FOR T.FROM	COMING HEARING (.5)	; PREPARE DOCUM	CUMENTS IENTS THAT	
03/24/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.50	275.00	15700	20266973
CONFE	R WITH M. MILLS RE: NYC STIPULATION	,			
03/24/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.80	440.00	15700	20266972
	FREDDIE MAC LETTER.				
03/24/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.30	715.00	15700	20266974
	W LITIGATION CLAIMS.	x.2 v	, , , , , ,	22.00	
00/04/10	Medition Years	2.00	1 505 00	15700	20100574
03/24/10 PREPA	Mishkin, Jessie RE ORAL ARGUMENT MATERIALS FOR B	2.90 ONDHO LDERS CLAIM	1,595.00 OBJECTION HEAR	15700 ING FOR J.	20190574
MAST	ANDO (1.7); REVIEW MARTA INSURANCE	CLAIMS (.7); DRAFT M	IARTA OBJECTION	SECTIONS (.5	).

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/24/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20246290
EMAIL	M. ALEXANDER AND J. GURDIAN RE: NY	CSTIPULATION.			
03/24/10	Mills, Marvin	0.40	158.00	15700	20246102
PREPA	RE PBGC WITHDRAW AL STIPULATION A	ND ORDER.			
03/24/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	15700	20246103
	R WITH J. GURDIAN RE: NYC STIPULATION	ON.			
03/24/10	Mills, Marvin	4.70	1,856.50	15700	20247492
	RE OREGON PROOF OF CLAIM OBJECTIO		1,020.00	10,00	204., (2
		2.20	1 450 00	15700	20101070
03/24/10 RESEA	Veit, Cheri RCH STANDING REQUIREMENT FOR SEC	3.20 TION 11 CLAIMS	1,456.00	15700	20191878
KLOLA.	Refi STAND ING REGULEMENT FOR SEC	mon in oblation.			
03/24/10	Castillero, Francene	0.90	171.00	15700	20205054
ASSIST	WITH COMPILATION CASES CITED FOR	J. MASTANDO REVIEW	•		
03/24/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	4.30	774.00	15700	20190614
PREPA	RENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY A RATION FOR HEARING (.5); PREPARE AN RATION OF HEARING (3.8).				
03/24/10	Chan, Herbert	2.90	623.50	15700	20193140
CITE C CLAIM	HECK PORTIONS OF DEBTORS' REPLY TO S.	O TWENTIETH OMNIBU	S (SUBSTANTIVE)	OBJECTION 1	го
03/24/10	Axon, Hillary	9.50	1,710.00	15700	20204945
DEBTO	W, ORGANIZE, AND COMPILE IMPORTAN DR'S 20TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION, MISREP DRS' REPLY INTO BINDERS (9.2); CONFER	RESENTATION AND MA	RATHON RESPON	MENTS FROM ISES AND	
03/25/10	Strochak, Adam	0.10	84.50	15700	20211339
PHONI	E CALL TO A. LEVINE RE: TRANQUILITY	CLAIMS OBJECTION.			
03/25/10	Mastando, III, John	0.80	656.00	15700	20236812
	W REPLY BRIEF RE: FRAUDULENT TRAN	SFER CLAIMS.			
03/25/10	Mastando, III, John	1.80	1,476.00	15700	20236811
	W REVISED DRAFT REPLY RE: BOND HOL		1,470.00	15700	2020011
03/25/10	Frongillo, Thomas E REPLY BRIEF ON BONDHOLDERS' CLA	13.40	11,323.00	15700	20198337 ON
AND L	E REPLY BRIEF ON BONDHOLDERS CLA ESKOW RE: REVISION OF REPLY BRIEF	ON BONDHOLDERS' CL	AIMS (2.5).	man, ex. DECORTO	~^1
03/25/10	Levine, Alexander	3.70	2,201.50	15700	20246924
DR AFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF SEL RE: DISCOVERY SCHEDULE (.3); TEL	CLAIM (3.3); EXCHANG	EEMAILS WITH T	RANQUILITY	'S
03/25/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	1.40	721.00	15700	20191930

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

DATE

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

TIME ID

S. IALUN WITH P.	AND REVISE REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' RES A RE: PREPARATION OF MATERIALS FOR AP OTOOLE, K. DIBLASI, S. PULLMAN, AND OPP RESPOND TO OBJECTION TO ALEXANDER P	RIL 6, 2010 HEARIN OSING COUNSEL R	IG (.5); CORRESPON E: POTENTIAL EXT	DENCE	D
03/25/10	Vaishnav, Neil	0.90	355.50	15700	20218693
	E BACKGROUND MATERIALS NECESSARY F	OR FIRST DRAFT O	F REPLY TO BONDI	HOLDERS'	
03/25/10	Pohl, Joshua	1.20	660.00	15700	20230232
REVIEW	OREGON CLAIM OBJECTION.				
03/25/10	Chandis, Vanessa	1.70	935.00	15700	20230754
REVIEW	AND REVISE DEBTORS' REPLY TO BONDHO	LDERS' RESPONSE '	TO DEBTORS' OBJE	CTION.	
03/25/10	Bronson, Ardith	9.00	6,300.00	15700	20242817
	REPLY BRIEF (6.5); CONFERENCES WITH T. F NS TO REPLY BRIEF (2.5).	RONGILLO, L. ESKO	OW AND P. O'TOOL	E RE:	
03/25/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.30	205.50	15700	20200481
	PONDENCE WITH A. ALBANESE RE: SUBORE FFS' CLAIMS.	DINATION OBJECTION	ON TO MDL SECUR	ITIES	
03/25/10	Repash, Philip	0.30	205.50	15700	20232903
CALL W	ITH CLAIM ANT'S COUNSEL (ESCHENBACH).				
03/25/10	Eskow, Lisa	5.10	3,570.00	15700	20188747
ON STAI RESEAR ARGUM	CREDITOR COMMITTEE'S COMMENTS ON R NDING FOR POTENTIAL IN CORPORATIONS O CH AND DRAFT EMAIL MEMORANDUM TO S ENT (1.3); REVIEW AND EDIT STANDING ARC SON AND P. O'TOOLE RE: REVISIONS AND RI	F ARGUMENTS INT . CAPLOW RE: POT GUMENT (.3); CONF	O SECURITIES SEC ENTIAL SECTION I	TION (.9); 1 STANDINC	<b>)</b>
03/25/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	13.50	9,450.00	15700	20237915
CORRES FRONGI	PONDENCE RE: ALEXANDER CLAIM (.1); RE LLO, A. BRONSON AND L. ESKOW RE: REVISI	VISE REPLY BRIEF ( CONS AND REPLY (2	(10.9); CONFERENC (1.5).	ES WITH T.	
03/25/10	Ng, Alexander	0.40	238.00	15700	20193172
REVISE	CLAIM OBJECTION.				
03/25/10	Leonard, Sarah	4.20	840.00	15700	20211322
RELATI UPDATE	ENCE WITH E.BOSSHARD-BLACKEY AND S. NG TO SECURITIES CLAIMS FOR UPCOMING SS TO CASE TEAM (.2); PREPARE DOCUMENT RONGILLO'S REVIEW (3.5).	APRIL 6, 2010 HEAR	RING (.5); CIRCULA'	TE DOCKET	
03/25/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.10	55.00	15700	20295652
	WITH M. MILLS RE: IRS PROOF OF CLAIM.				
03/25/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.20	110.00	15700	20322644
	WITH M. MILLS RE: NYC TAX CLAIM (.1); C	ONFER WITH M. MI	LLS AND B. PEDER	SEN RE: SAN	ИE
03/25/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.00	550.00	15700	20266976

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	TAX CLAIMS.				
03/25/10	Mishkin, Jessie	6.30	3,465.00	15700	20190805
BOND H DISCUS	C. SMITH AND CALL R. SOBIECKI RE: FI OLDERS OBJECTION REPLY (.6); RESEA S INSURANCE CLAIMANT CLAIMS AND ENT OUTLINE FOR BONDHOLDERS' OB	RCH (1 .2) AND PREPARE INSERTS WITH R. SHER	MARTA OBJECTIO MAN (.2); DRAFT O	ON (2.3);	
03/25/10	Castellani, Anne	4.50	2,047.50	15700	20197813
REVIEW	PROOF OF CLAIM (.8); PREPARE OBJECT	CT ION (3.7).			
03/25/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20247804
	SPONDENCE WITH M. ALEXANDER RE:	IRS PROOF OF CLAIM (.1	); CONFER WITH J	. GURDIAN R	Ε:
03/25/10	Mills, Marvin	0.30	118.50	15700	20246179
REVIEV SAME (.	V AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE 1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GURDIA	E RE: NYC TAX CLAIM (. AN AND B. PEDERSEN RI	1); CONFER WITH . 3: SAME (.1).	J. GURDIAN R	E:
03/25/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	15700	20246757
	OBJECTION TO OREGON PROOF OF CL. SPONDENCE (.2).	AIM (.3); REVIEW AND R	ESPOND TO RELA	TED	
03/25/10	Sherman, Rachel	6.10	2,775.50	15700	20192817
	V INSURANCE POLICY PROVISIONS IN R TION (5.1); CONFER WITH J. MISHKIN RE		JECT ION (.8); PREI	PARE CLAIM	
03/25/10	Costa, Jessica	0.30	118.50	15700	20191777
CITECH	IECK CASE FOR BRIEF.				
03/25/10	Castillero, Francene	13.00	2,470.00	15700	20204913
REVIEV DEBTO	W AND CITE-CHECK/BLUEBOOK REPLY R'S TWENTIETH OMNIBUS OBJECTION.	TO THE VARIOUS PREL	IMINARY RESPON	SES TO	
03/25/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	6.20	1,116.00	15700	20198545
CONFE	RE AND ORGANIZE CASES AND STATUT RENCES WITH S. LEONARD AND E. BOS 5, 2010 HEARING (.5).	ES CITED IN PREPARA T SHARD-BLACKEY RE: P	TON OF HEARING REPARATION OF M	(5.7); MATERIALS F	OR
03/25/10	Chan, Herbert	1.10	236.50	15700	20193257
CITE C	HECK PORTIONS OF DEBTORS' REPLY T	O RESPONSES TO TWEN	TIETH OMNIBUS	OBJECTION.	
03/25/10	Axon, Hillary	14.50	2,610.00	15700	20204944
REVISI	E DEBTORS' REPLY TO 20TH SUBSTANT	IVE OMNIBUS CLAIMS C	BJECTION.		
03/26/10	Strochak, Adam	0.20	169.00	15700	20211051
CONFE	RENCE CALL WITH V. JOHNSON RE: SE	CURITIES FRAUD CLAIM	IS.		
03/26/10	Frongillo, Thomas	7.30	6,168.50	15700	20204081
FILING	E REPLY BRIEF RE: BONDHOLDERS'CLA FOF REPLY BRIEF (.5); CONFER WITH P. HOLDER REPLY BRIEF (.7).	AIMS (6.1); EXCHANGE O O'TOOLE AND L. ESKOW	FEMAILS WITH P V RE: STRATEGY F	. OTOOLE RE OR	:

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/26/10	Levine, Alexander	4.90	2,915.50	15700	20247246
	E OBJECTIONS TO PROOF OF CLAIM (4.5); I ION (.4).	REVIEW RESPONSE	TO AGNES/BASSMA	N OMNIBUS	
03/26/10	Bosshar d-Blackey, Elizabeth	0.70	360.50	15700	20226228
CORRES	ONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PULLMAN RE: SPONDENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE, K. DIBLASI . EDING (.5).	ALEXANDER PROOF AND OPPOSING COU	OF CLAIM (.2); NSEL RE: ALEXAN	DER	
03/26/10	Vaishnav, Neil	0.10	39.50	15700	20218781
ANALY	ZE MATERIALS FOR REPLY.				
03/26/10	Chandis, Vanessa	6.20	3,410.00	15700	20230181
REVISE	DEBTORS' REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS' RES	PONSE TO DEBTORS	OBJECTION.		
03/26/10	Bronson, Ardith	9.20	6,440.00	15700	20243585
REVISE	REPLY BRIEF (9.0); CORRESPONDENCE WI	TH P. O'TO OLE ON ST	TATUS OF FILING R	EPLY (.2).	
03/26/10	Johnson, Virginia	0.20	137.00	15700	20290021
TELECO CLAIMS	ONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK RE: SUBC S.	ORDINATION OBJECT	TION TO MDL PLAT	NTIFFS'	
03/26/10	Johnson, Virginia	6.00	4,110.00	15700	20214010
REVIEW	V REVISED REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF O	BJECTION TO BOND	HOLDERS' PROOFS	OF CLAIM.	
03/26/10	Eskow, Lisa	5.90	4,130.00	15700	20193805
PREPAR	R WITH T. FRONGILLO AND P. O'TOOLE RE: E PRELIMINARY STATEMENT FOR REPLY CH ADDITIONAL AUTHORITY FOR REPLY	BRIEF (2.2); REVIEW			
03/26/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	9.80	6,860.00	15700	20239542
RE: COI FOR FII (.2); CO	REPLY BRIEF RE: BONDHOLDERS CLAIMS MMENTS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W LING BONDHOLDER REPLY BRIEF (.7); CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO RE: FRENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: FILM	ITH T. FRONGILLO A RESPONDENCE WITI FILING AND REVISIN	ND L. ESKOW RE: H A. BRONSON RE:	STRATEGY REPLY BRIEF	
03/26/10	Leonard, Sarah	3.60	720.00	15700	20211043
REVIEV OB JECT REVIEV	W BANKRUPTCY DOCKET IN REGARDS TO ( TION (.8); PREPARE DOCUMENTS RE: SECUL V (2.8).	ORDERS ISSUED PER RITIES CLAIMS AR GU	TAINING TO SEVE JMENT FOR T. FRO	NTH OMNIBUS NGILLO'S	
03/26/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.90	495.00	15700	20267013
REVIEV	V EMPLOYEE PLAN STIPULATION.				
03/26/10	Gurdian, Julio	1.50	825.00	15700	20267012
	V TAX OBJECTIONS (1.1); CONFER WITH B. NFER WITH B. PEDERSEN AND M. MILLS RI		MILLS RE: OREGON	TAX CLAIM	
03/26/10	Mishkin, Jessie	3.70	2,035.00	15700	20235339
	V FINAL STIPULATIONS FOR DISMISSAL OF TO OBJECTION TO BONDHOLDERS' CLAIM S		REVISE AND FINA	LIZE REPLY	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/26/10	Mills, Marvin	3.70	1,461.50	15700	20246925
CONFER	OBJECTION TO OREGON TAX CLAIM AND PI WITH J. GURDIAN RE: SAME (.1); CORRESPO ); CALL WITH M. ALEXANDER RE: CLAIMS I ENCE CALL WITH J. GURDIAN AND B. PEDE	ONDENCE WITH AL SSUES (.1); REVISE	ND CALL TO B. PED 3 PBGC STIPULATIO	ERSEN RE: )N (.5);	
03/26/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.40	182.00	15700	20193716
REVIEW	AND REVISE OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTION	IS.			
03/26/10	Sherman, Rachel	1.60	728.00	15700	20195299
	CLAIM OBJECTION (1.1); EMAILS WITH J. MIRE: RESEARCH (.3).	SHKIN RE: SAME (	(2); EMAILS WITH L	. ESKOW AND	
03/26/10	Veit, Cheri	2.10	955.50	15700	20217692
RESEAR	CH RE: PLEADING REQUIREMENTS.				
03/26/10	Costa, Jessica	1.40	553.00	15700	20194548
RESEAR	CH RE: PLEADING DEFECT (1.1); REVISE BR	EF TO INCORPORA	ATE NEW RESEARC	H (.3).	
03/26/10	Castillero, Francene	6.80	1,292.00	15700	20205010
REVIEW	OF REPLY TO BONDHOLDERS PRELIMINAR RITIES RE: SAME.	RY RESPONSE BRII	EF AND EDIT TABLI	3 OF	
03/26/10	Axon, Hillary	6.10	1,098.00	15700	20204941
REVISE TO CLA	TABLE OF AUTHORITIES RE: DEBTORS' REFIMS.	LY TO 20TH SUBS	TANTIVE OMNIBUS	OBJECTION	
03/27/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	15700	20295366
MEMOR	ANDUM TO T. FRONGILLO RE: BANK BOND	HOLDER HEARING	3.		
03/27/10	Frongillo, Thomas	1.00	845.00	15700	20204239
CONFEI ESKOW	TO J. MISHKIN AND V. CHANDIS RE: HEARIN RENCE WITH V. CHANDIS AND J. MISHKIN R AND V. JOHNSON RE: ORAL ARGUMENT (.1 RGUMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE V	E: ORAL ARGUME ); TELEPHONE CO	NT (.5); EMAIL TO A NFERENCE WITH A	BRONSON, L.	
03/27/10	Levine, Alexander	2.50	1,487.50	15700	20195457
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLA	IM.			
03/27/10	Chandis, Vanessa	0.50	275.00	15700	20231488
CONFE	RENCE CALL WITH T. FRONGILLO AND J. M	SHKIN RE: ORAL	ARGUMENT PREPAI	RATION.	
03/27/10	Bronson, Ardith	3.30	2,310.00	15700	20243594
WITH P FOR HE AND PA COMPI	HONE CONFERENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO ON COTOOLE ON DRAFTING ORAL ARGUMENT GARING (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. FROM ARTICIPATION IN PREPARATION FOR HEARI LATION OF BRIEFS FOR USE IN ORAL ARGUITALS FOR USE IN ORAL ARGUITALS FOR USE IN DRAFTING OUT	' OUTLINE AND PA ONGILLO ON DRAI NG (.2); CORRESPO MENT OUTLINE (.1	ARTICIPATION IN PI FTING ORAL ARGUM ONDENCE TO J. MIS	REPARATION MENT OUTLINE HKIN ON	
03/27/10	Eskow, Lisa	0.10	70.00	15700	20208344
CONFE	R WITH T. FRONGILLO RE: PREPARATION O	RAL ARGUMENT.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/27/10	Mishkin, Jessie	1.00	550.00	15700	20236463
	E MARTA CLAIMS OBJECTION FACT SEC IS RE: ORAL ARGUMENT PREP (.5).	TION (.5); CONFERENC	CE WITH T. FRONG	ILLO AND V.	
03/27/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20247475
REVISE	31ST OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS.				
03/28/10	Frongillo, Thomas	0.20	169.00	15700	20204241
CONFE	R WITH A. BRONSON RE: OUTLINE FOR C	DRAL ARGUMENT.			
03/28/10	Levine, Alexander	4.00	2,380.00	15700	20195292
DRAFT.	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF (IN RE: SAME (.4).	CLAIM (3.6); CALLS AN	ID CORREPSONDEN	NCE WITH J.	
03/28/10	Vaishnav, Neil	3.00	1,185.00	15700	20218787
PREPAI	RE SUMMARY OF SUBSTANTIVE CONSOI	LIDATION ORAL ARGU	JMENT.		
03/28/10	Chandis, Vanessa	1.20	660.00	15700	20231212
PREPAI	RE OUTLINE RE: BREACH OF FIDUCIARY	DUTY FOR ORAL ARC	GUMENT.		
03/28/10	Bronson, Ardith	7.50	5,250.00	15700	20243587
PREPAR	RE SECTION OF ORAL ARGUMENT PER T. ILINE FOR ORAL ARGUMENT (.2).	. FRONGILLO (7.3); CO	NFERENCE WITH I	r. FRONGILLO	
03/28/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	2.10	1,470.00	15700	20239543
REVIEV	W MATERIALS RE: HEARING.				
03/28/10	Mishkin, Jessie	5.70	3,135.00	15700	20236310
	AND EMAIL WITH A. LEVINE RE: MARTA I ENT MATERIALS FOR HEARING ON BAN			EPARE ORAL	
03/29/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	15700	20295367
MEM OF	RANDUM TO E. CIOLKO RE: ALEX ANDER	CLAIM (.1); SECOND	MEMORANDUM RE	E: SAME (.1).	
03/29/10	Frongillo, Thomas	7.10	5,999.50	15700	20213949
LAW (6	RE FOR HEARING ON BONDHOLDERS' OF 3.3); EMAILS TO E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY SHN AV AND B. MILLER RE: CASE SUMMA	RE: CHRONOLOGY (.2	); CONFERENCE WI		Ε,
03/29/10	Miller, Brandon	11.20	5,768.00	15700	2020498
ARGUM VAISHI BOSSH JOHNSO CONFE	RENCES WITH A. BRONSON RE: ORAL AI MENT OF BANK BONDHOLDERS' RESPON NAV AND P OTOOLE RE: CASE SUMMAR ARD-BLACKEY AND N. VAISHNAV RE: C ON RE: KEY CASES ON MISREPRESENT A' RENCE WITH E. BOSSHARD BLACKEY RI LE, E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY AND N. VAIS	SE (4.5); CONFERENCE IES FOR ORAL ARGUN ASE SUMMARY OUTL TION (.1); PREPARE CA E: CASE SUMMARIES (	E WITH T. FRONGIL MENT (.6); CONFERI INES (.7); CONFERI ASE SUMMARIES (4 (.1); CONFERENCE '	LO, N. ENCE WITH E. ENCE WITH V. .6);	
03/29/10	Levine, Alexander	6.00	3,570.00	15700	2021953
			NICE PRACTIC AND	O 4 T Y O 13170077	
	RE AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF O ING COUNSEL RE: TRANQUILITY OBJECT		INGE EMAILS AND	CALLS WITH	

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

DATE

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

TIME ID

SUMMAI AND OPI B. MILLI	E CHRONOLOGY OF KEY EVENTS IN PREPARATION FOR BONDHOLDER HEARI POSING COUNSEL RE: EXTENSION OF TIME IN ALER AND N. VAISHNAV RE: CASE SUMMARY OUTLIFER WITH P. O'TOOLE, B. MILLER AND N. VAISHN	NG (3.8); CORRESPC EXANDER MATTER INES (.7); CONFER W	NDENCE WITH (.4); CONFERE	K. DIBLASI NCE WITH	
03/29/10	Vaishnav, Neil	0.60	237.00	15700	20218367
	ENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO, P. OTOOLE, AND B. M CCASE SUMM ARY ASSIGNMENTS.	IILLER TO DISCUSS	ORAL ARGUM	ENTS AND	
03/29/10	Vaishnav, Neil	0.70	276.50	15700	20218366
MEET W BRIEF.	ITH E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY AND B. MILLER RE:	CASE SUMMARY AS	SSIGNMENTS R	E: REPLY	
03/29/10	Vaishnav, Neil	2.40	948.00	15700	20218369
REVISE	SUBSTANTIVE CONSOLIDATION OUTLINE.				
03/29/10	Vaishnav, Neil	3.40	1,343.00	15700	20218368
	CASE SUMMARIES RE: SUBSTANTIVE CONSOLIDA AND E. BOSSHARD-BLACKEY RE: SAME (.2).	ATION (3.2); CONFER	WITH P. OTO	OLE, B.	
03/29/10	Chandis, Vanessa	5.40	2,970.00	15700	20230579
PREPARE OUTLINE IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON ISSUES RE: DEBTORS' 20TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION.					
03/29/10	Cloutier, Lisa	4.10	2,111.50	15700	20243766
FOR HE	EMAIL FROM P. OTOOLE RE: PREPARING DRAFT ARING ON 20TH OBJECTION (.1); DRAFT OUTLINE ATION FOR HEARING ON 20TH OBJECTION (4.0).			EPARATION	
03/29/10	Bronson, Ardith	8.20	5,740.00	15700	20243153
PREPARE SECTION OF ORAL ARGUMENT PER T. FRONGILLO (7.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH V. JOHNSON ON DRAFTING ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLINE FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO DISMISS (.3); CONFERENCE WITH B. MILLER RE: ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLINE (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH V. JOHNSON AND P. O'TOOLE ON ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLINE ISSUES (.2); CORRESPONDENCE IN RESPONSE TO T. FRONGILLO ON SUNRISE AND ATTACHING SAME (.1); LEGAL RESEARCH RE: DERIVATIVE CASES (.2).					
03/29/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.70	1,164.50	15700	20212590
	NFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WG IFFS RE: SUBORDINATION OBJECTION TO MDL SI		ISEL FOR MDL	SECURITIES	
03/29/10	Johnson, Virginia	6.30	4,315.50	15700	20295479
TO BON	E SUMMARY/OUTLINE OF MISREPRESENTATION DHOLDERS' CLAIMS (6.2); CONFERENCE WITH B. RESENT ATION (.1).			BJECTION	
03/29/10	Repash, Philip	0.60	411.00	15700	20234209
	TITH CLAIMANT (IVERSEN) (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAOURT (.4).	AM RE: RESCHEDUL	ED DATE OF H	EARING	
03/29/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	6.60	4,620.00	15700	20236663

DATE

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

OUTLINE RE: BANK BONDHOLDERS' RESPONSE (1.3).

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

TIME ID

D / X X X X	A ALIKADEDAL AMENANO O MENANO A A CONT.			····	
PULLMA (.1); TEL MATERI CONFER ARGUM	PONDENCE WITH V. JOHNSON RE: ORAL AN RE: ALEXANDER CLAIM (.1); CORRESP EPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FINESTO LALS RE: HEARING (5.3); CORRESPONDEN LENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO, B. MILLER A ENTS (.6); CONFERENCE WITH B. MILLER RIES (.2).	ONDENCE WITH E. BOSS NE RE: STATUS AND STA CE WITH L. CLOUTIER RE ND N. VAISHNAV RE: CA	HARD-BLACKEY .NDING (.1); REV B: 12(B)6 ISSUES ( SE SUMMARIES F	RE: SAME IEW (.1); FOR ORAL	Е
03/29/10	Mishkin, Jessie	2.30	1,265.00	15700	20236314
PREPAR	E ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLINES FOR HEA	RING ON BONDHOLDERS	CLAIMS.		
03/29/10	Castellani, Anne	0.10	45.50	15700	20251150
CORRES	SPOND WITH A. NG RE: OBJECTION TO CL	AIMS.			
03/29/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.80	819.00	15700	20244688
REVISE INTERN	LITIGATION CLAIMS SUMMARY AND CIE AL LITIGATION CLAIMS SUMMARY CHA S OF CLAIMS AT UP COMING HEARINGS (.4	RCULATE TO ALVAREZ & RT (4); DRAFT EMAIL TO	MARSAL (.6); RI ALVAREZ & MA	EVISE	
03/29/10	Sherman, Rachel	0.30	136.50	15700	20217192
EMAILS	WITH J. MASTANDO AND J. MISHKIN RE	: CLAIM OBJECTION.			
03/29/10	Turner, K im	0.10	45.50	15700	20226795
	/ COMMUNICATION FROM V. JOHNSON R	E: CLAIMS.			
03/29/10	Veit, Cheri	6.70	3,048.50	15700	20228584
REVIEV EGO/VE	V CASES CITED IN WMI'S OBJECTION ANI ILL PIERCING AND PLEADING REQUIREM IENT BINDERS.	REPLY RE: SUBSTANTIV	/E CONSOLIDAT	ION, ALTER	
03/29/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	5.40	972.00	15700	20210448
PREPAI	RE AND ORGANIZE CASES AND STATUTE	s cited in preparation	N OF HEARING.		
03/29/10	Axon, Hillary	7.60	1,368.00	15700	20204785
	V AND COMPILE CASES AND OTHER IMPORATION RE: BONDHOLDER'S LITIGATION		: ORAL ARGUME	ENT	
03/30/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	15700	20295321
МЕМОЕ	RANDUM TO A. MARTINEZ RE: CHANGE C	F CONTROL ANALYSIS.			
03/30/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.20	144.00	15700	20254009
	FROM P. REPASH RE: SCHEDULING OF ENARING DATE (.1).	MPLOYEE CLAIMS HEARI	NG (.1); EMAIL F	ROM C. JANG	ì
03/30/10	Frongillo, Thomas	7.80	6,591.00	15700	20213947
BRIEFS	RE FOR HEARING ON BONDHOLDERS' OB. (6.5); REVIEW ARGUMENT OUTLINES (1. IOLDERS' CLAIMS (.2).	JECTION INCLUDING REV 1); CONFERENCE WITH P.	/IEW OF CASELA OTOOLE RE: HE	AW AND EARING ON	
03/30/10	Miller, Brandon	7.90	4,068.50	15700	20227016
CONFE	CASE SUM MARIES RE: MISREPRESENTA' RENCE WITH A. BRONSON RE: ORAL ARC	GUMENT OUTLINES (.5); D	OR ORAL ARGUN PRAFT ORAL ARG	MENT (6.1); GUMENT	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/30/10	Levine, Alexander	4.70	2,796.50	15700	20219740
DRAFT	AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF C	LAIM.			
03/30/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	7.50	3,862.50	15700	20232891
O'TOOL	RE SUMMARIES OF KEY CASES FOR BONI LE RE: POWERPOINT FOR BONDHOLDER I UMMARIES (.3); PREPARE POWERPOINT I	IEARING (2); CONFER	ENCE WITH P. OTO	OOLE RE: KEY	
03/30/10	Vaishnav, Neil	0.30	118.50	15700	20218593
EMAIL	P. O'TOOLE RE: CASE SUMMARIES.				
03/30/10	Vaishnav, Neil	6.00	2,370.00	15700	20218592
SUMMA	ARIZE CASES RE: SUBSTANTIVE CONSOL	IDATION.			
03/30/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.50	1,042.50	15700	20235526
	W AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE ATION WITH RESPECT TO SECURITIES C		MENT OF ERISA C	LAIMS AND	
03/30/10	Chandis, Vanessa	5.60	3,080.00	15700	20230582
	OUTLINE AND REVIEW CASES IN PREPA MNIBUS OBJECTION.	RATION FOR HEARING	ON LEGAL ISSUE	S RE: DEBTOR	S'
03/30/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	15700	20295524
	W CHARTIS NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF O C. GREER RE: SAME.	PROOFS OF CLAIM NO	OS. 2191 AND 2193	AND DRAFT E	<u>.</u>
03/30/10	Bronson, Ardith	8.90	6,230.00	15700	20243089
REVISI SECUR WITH T CORRE	RE ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLINE PER T. FR ONS TO DRAFT ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLI ITIES SECTION OF ORAL ARGUMENT OU' T. FRONGILLO ATTACHING DRAFT ORAL SPONDENCE WITH P. O'TOOLE FOR WARI RENCE WITH V. JOHNSON AND P. O'TOOI	NE (.5); CORRESPOND TLINE FOR MOTION TO ARGUMENT OUTLINE DING ORAL ARGUMEN	ENCE WITH V. JOH DISMISS (.2); COI ON STANDING (.1) TOUTLINE ON ST	INSON ON RRESPONDEN( ); ANDING (.1);	CE
03/30/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.20	822.00	15700	20295525
EMAIL	CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI AN	ID J. SHIFFMAN RE: SU	BORDINATION OF	JECTIONS.	
03/30/10	Johnson, Virginia	7.00	4,795.00	15700	20212836
TO BO	RE AND REVISE OUTLINE OF MISREPRES NDHOLDERS' CLAIMS (5.8); CONFER WITH ONFERENCE WITH S. CAPLOW RE: BOND	I A. BRONS ON AND P.	O'TOOLE RE: SAMI		N
03/30/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	7.20	5,040.00	15700	20240766
S. CAP SECUR E. BOS FOR SE AND V	HONE CONFERENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO LOW RE: SECURITIES ISSUES (.1); TELEPH LITIES (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH V. JO SHARD-BLACKEY RE: BONDHOLDER HEA ECURITIES AND BREACH OF FIDUCIARY I L. JOHNSON RE: MISREPRESENTATION AR ARD-BLACKEY RE: KEY CASE SUMMARI	IONE CONFERENCE W DHNSON RE: SAME (.1) ARING PRESENTATION DUTY CLAIMS (5.4); CO LGUMENT (.7); TELEPH	ITH S. CAPLOW RE ; TELEPHONE CON I (.2); HEARING PR ONFERENCE WITH	: MDL FERENCE WIT EPARATION A. BRONSON	•
03/30/10	DiBlasi, K elly	1.30	819.00	15700	20210227
	W ISSUES REALITICATION CLAIMS (1.1).				

REVIEW ISSUES RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS (1.1); CALL R. SHARMA RE: STIPULATION (.2).

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
			100.00	1.5000	20240246
03/30/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.60	120.00	15700	20240245
PREPAI	RE EXHIBITS CITED IN DEBTORS OBJECT	ION.			
03/30/10	Mishkin, Jessie	0.20	110.00	15700	20234915
EMAIL: STIPUL	S WITH J. GURDIAN RE: MARTA INSURAN ATIONS OF DISMISSAL ON DUFF/SLOAN	NCE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.1).	ONS (.1); EMAILS RI	E: FINAL	
03/30/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.30	591.50	15700	20244729
ATTEN	TION TO CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (1.1); CAL	L WITH K. DIBLASI RE	: STIPULATION (.2)		
	a	0.40	182.00	15700	20217701
03/30/10	Sherman, Rachel S WITH A. LEVINE AND J. MISHKIN RE: C		162.00	15700	20217701
EMAIL	5 WITH A. LEVINE AND J. MISHKIN RE. C	LAIM OBJECTION.			
03/30/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	1.00	180.00	15700	20210643
PREPA	RE AND ORGANIZE CASES AND STATUT	ES CITED IN PREPARA	TION OF HEARING	•	
03/30/10	Axon, Hillary	0.70	126.00	15700	20217107
	W ORAL ARGUMENT MATERIALS.	****			
1 1 1 1					
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.30	292.50	15700	20295333
MEMO (.1).	RANDUM TO COHEN RE: BANK BONHOL	DER HEARING (2); ME	MORANDUM TO T	EAM RE: SAM	E
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	15700	20295324
	RANDUM TO A. LEVINE RE: TRANQUILIT EMORANDUM TO A. LEVINE RE: SAME (.1		T MEMORANDUM T	O COUNSEL	
03/31/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.10	72.00	15700	20254803
REVIE	W/RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM K. DIBLAS	I RE: CLAIMS.			
		11.50	9,717.50	15700	2023019
BRIEF:	Frongillo, Thomas  RE FOR HEARING ON BONDHOLDERS'O  S (5.5); PREPARE OUTLINE FOR ARGUME  BRONSON (.5) RE: LEGAL ISSUES FOR H  FINESTONE RE: STANDING ISSUE (.2); P	NT (3.5); INTERNAL CO EARING: TELEPHONE	REVIEW OF CASE INFERENCES WITH CONFERENCE WIT	LAW AND P. O'TOOLE (	.3)
03/31/10	Miller, Brandon	9.90	5,098.50	15700	20227017
DRAF	T CASE SUMMARIES RE: MISREPRESENT.	ATION IN PREPARATIO	ON OF ORAL ARGU	MENT.	
02/21/10	Tavina Alamandan	8.50	5,057.50	15700	2021903
03/31/10	Levine, Alexander  AND REVISE OBJECTION TO PROOF OF		•		2021300
EXCH	ANGE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH OPPOSI	NG COUNSEL RE: OB JI	ECTIONS TO PROOF	F OF CLAIMS	(.5).
03/31/10	Bosshard-Blackey, Elizabeth	6.20	3,193.00	15700	2024138
PREPA AFFID	RE KEY CASE SUMMARIES FOR THE BOI AVIT AND DECLARATION IN PREPARAT	ND HOLDER HEARING ION FOR BOND HOLDE	(5.5); REVIEW D. LO R HEARING (.7).	OGAN	
03/31/10	Vaishnav, Neil	1.50	592.50	15700	2021844
	YZE CASES RE: STATUS OF ARTIFICIALL	Y INFLATED BOND CL	AIMS.		
03/31/10	Vaishnav, Neil	3.70	1,461.50	15700	2021869

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
SUMMA	RIZE CASE LAW TO BE USED DURING OF	CAL ARGUMENT.			
03/31/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.60	1,112.00	15700	20236299
	AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RELAT ATION WITH RESPECT TO SECURITIES CI		OF ERISA CLAIMS	AND	
03/31/10	Cloutier, Lisa	1.00	515.00	15700	20243769
DRAFT	OUTLINE OF RULE 12(B)(6) ARGUMENTS	IN PREPARATION FOR	HEARING ON 20TI	H OBJECTION	•
03/31/10	Bronson, Ardith	4.20	2,940.00	15700	20243906
DISCUSS	PONDENCE WITH V. JOHNSON ON SECU- SION WITH T. FRONGILLO ON DRAFTING ALS FOR USE IN CHARTS (2.0); PREP ARE	CHARTS FOR USE AT	HEARING (.5); REV		M
03/31/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.00	685.00	15700	20322987
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH K.DIBLASIAN IONS, REINSTATEMENT OF UNDERWRIT		ENT OF SUBORDIN	IATION	
03/31/10	Johnson, Virginia	3.90	2,671.50	15700	20214656
	LE AND REVISE OUTLINE OF MISREPRESI DHOLDERS' CLAIMS (2.5); UPDATE LITIG			ON OBJECTION	Ŋ
03/31/10	O'Toole, Jr., Patrick	7.20	5,040.00	15700	20240771
WITH B AND T.	ONE CONFERENCE WITH T. FRONGILLO . FINESTONE RE: FRAUDULENT TRANSFI FRONGILLO RE: STANDING ISSUE (.2); PF DUCIARY DUTY CLAIMS (6.6).	ER (.1); TELEPHONE CO	DNFERENCE WITH	B. FINESTON	E 4S
03/31/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	15700	20217154
CONFER	R WITH M. MILLS RE: LITIGATION CLAIM	S.			
03/31/10	Ng, Alexander	3.20	1,904.00	15700	20256071
DRAFT	BKK OBJECTION.				
03/31/10	Leonard, Sarah	0.50	100.00	15700	20239870
	ATE DOCKET UPDATES TO CASE TEAM.	0.00	100,00	20.00	2020,0,0
02/21/10	Michiga Tagain	0.50	275.00	15700	20235803
03/31/10 CALLS	Mishkin, Jessie WITH A. LEVINE RE: MARTA CLAIM.	0.50	213.00	13700	20233803
03/31/10	Castellani, Anne	9.90	4,504.50	15700	20251315
KEVIEW	CLAIMS (3.2); DRAFT OBJECTION (6.7).				
03/31/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20246197
	SPONDENCE WITH B. PEDERSEN (ALVAR SAME (.1).	EZ & MARSAL) RE: OR	EGON CLAIM OB JI	ECTION (.1);	
03/31/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	15700	20246870
CONFE	R WITH K. DIBLASI RE: LITIGATION CLAI	MS.			
03/31/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	15700	20246607

HOURS AMOUNT TASK TIME ID DATE TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION CALL TO B. BRENNAN RE: NYC STIPULATION (.1); EMAIL J. GURDIAN RE: SAME (.1); REVISE STIPULATED AGREEMENT AND CIRCULATE (.3). 1,092.00 15700 20244985 2.40 03/31/10 Sharma, Rahul REVISE 31 ST CLAIMS OBJECTION AND CIRCULATE FOR FILING (.7); CALL WITH M. ARKO RE: IRS CLAIM (.1); CALL WITH J. GURDIAN AND C. MARTIN RE: NORLEASE, SUMMIT, AND OTHER CLAIMS ISSUES (.4); ATTENTION TO CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.6); CONFER WITH N. ALISEO RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS AND RESPONSES (.2); EMAILS RE: CLAIMS (.4). 0.30 82,50 15700 20215821 03/31/10 Lee, Kathleen CONFER WITH N. ALISEO RE: CLAIMS PROJECT. 357.00 15700 20217988 03/31/10 Aliseo, Nicole 1.70 COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. ROBERTS RE: CLAIMS PROJECT (.5); MEETING WITH R. SHARMA RE: RESPONSE TO CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW DOCKET FOR RESPONSES TO CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.4); SEND E-MAIL TO A. NG AND R. SHARMA RE: SAME (.3); CONFER WITH K. LEE RE: CLAIMS PROJECT (.3). 03/31/10 Roberts, Sarah 0.50 115.00 15700 20223600 DISCUSS PROJECT FOR PREPARING FOR UPCOMING CLAIMS OBJECTION HEARING WITH N. ALISEO. 20217101 03/31/10 2.50 Axon, Hillary FILE CASES PULLED RE: 20TH OMNIBUS FILINGS USED IN PREPARATION FOR ORAL ARGUMENT (2.1); MAINT AIN ELECTRONIC DATA BASES RE: FILINGS RELATED TO BONDHOLDERS LITIGATION (.4). SUBTOTAL TASK CODE 15700 - CLAIMS DETERMINATION/LITIGATION: 1,814.80 \$ 983,809.00 03/01/10 Gold. Simeon 1.60 1,584.00 16400 20118147 DRAFT OPERATING TRUST AGREEMENTS CALLED FOR BY WMI PLAN (.7); ATTEND MEETING WITH B. KOSTUROS, J. MACIEL, V. PETHERBRIDGE AND B. ROSEN RE: PLAN STRUCTURE ISSUES (8); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM K. DIBLASI RE: SECURITIES ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH PLAN (.1). 7,020.00 16400 20336782 7.20 03/01/10 Rosen, Brian MEETING WITH WMI AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL TEAMS RE: PLAN FORMULATION (2.4); MEETING WITH JPMC AND FRIED FRANK AT JPMC RE: SAME (1.4); REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.1); MEMORANDUM TO C. SMITH AND A. FISHMAN RE: TALKING POINTS (.1); MEETING WITH B. KOSTUROS AND TEAM RE: PLAN ISSUES (1.4); MEETING WITH S. GOLD, B. KOSTUROS, J. MACIEL AND V. PETHERBRIDGE RE: PLAN STRUCTURE ISSUES (.8). 03/01/10 0.90 598.50 16400 20130600 Petherbridge, Vaughan REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: PLAN (.1); ATTEND MEETING WITH B. KOSTUROS, J. MACIEL, J. GOULDING, S. GOLD AND B. ROSEN RE: PLAN STRUCTURE ISSUES (.8). 03/01/10 Sapeika, Tal 2.40 1.644.00 16400 20200736 PARTICIPATE IN MEETING RE: PLAN FORMULATION, JP MORGAN NEGOTIATIONS, AND FDIC CLAIM WITH ALVAREZ TEAM. 1,008.00 16400 20107774 1.60 03/01/10 DiBlasi, Kelly EMAIL S. GOLD RE: SECURITIES ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH THE PLAN (.3); PARTICIPATE IN (PARTIAL ATTENDANCE) MEETING WITH WGM TEAM AND CLIENT RE: SECURITIES ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH THE PLAN (.5); MEETING WITH WGM TEAM AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL RE: PLAN ISSUES (.8). 1.40 1,386.00 16400 20118192 03/02/10 Gold, Simeon

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	X 211 A 2 A 1 A 1 A 1 A 1 A 1 A 1 A 1 A 1				
DRAFT	OPERATING TRUST AGREEMENTS CALLE	D FOR BY WMI PLAN			
03/02/10	Rosen, Brian	10.00	9,750.00	16400	20336615
WITH B SUMMA SAME ( KOSTU	RANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: PLAN SETTLEM  . KOSTUROS RE: PLAN/SETTLEMENT DISC  LRY JUDGMENT (.2); MEMORANDUM TO TI  .2); MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: S  ROS, T. SAPEIKA, K. DIBLASI (PARTIAL), V  N RE: DRAFT PLAN (1.5).	CUSSIONS (6.7); MEMO EAM RE: SAME (.3); C TATUS (.4); MEETING	ORANDUM TO S. FR CALL WITH P. CALA G WITH S. GOLDRIN	LIEDMAN RE: MARI RE: IG, B.	<b>1</b> G
03/02/10	Goldring, Stuart	3.10	3,069.00	16400	20206956
RE: DRA	NG WITH B. ROSEN, B. KOSTUROS, T. SAPE AFT PLAN (1.5); DISCUSS DRAFT PLAN WIT R WITH W. HORTON AND M. SILBERBERG S WITH W. HORTON RE: SAME (.5).	H W. HORTON, K. KE	EYES AND A. SANTI	LLAN (.5);	,
03/02/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.50	432.50	16400	20309859
TELEPI	HONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING R	E: TAX REFUND.			
03/02/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.60	2,249.00	16400	20232674
AND S.	NG WITH B. ROSEN, B. KOSTUROS, T. SAPE GOLDRING RE: DRAFT PLAN (1.5); CONFE (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL WITH (.5).	RENCES WITH S. GOI	LDRING AND M. SIL	BERBERG RE	<b>:</b> :
03/02/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	1.60	1,064.00	16400	20130617
PREPAI SANTIL	RE FOR (.1) AND ATTEND MEETING WITH I LAN, J. MACIEL AND W. HORTON RE: DRA	B. ROSEN, B. KOSTUI .FT PLAN (1.5).	ROS, T. SAPEIKA, S.	GOLDRING,	Α.
03/02/10	Santillan, Aida	4.60	2,737.00	16400	20184715
RE: STA SAPEIK	W TAX ISSUES INVOLVED IN FRIED FRANK ARS TRANSACTION (1.0); ATTEND MEETIN (A, V. PETHERBRIDGE, J. MACIEL AND B. K ING, K. KEYES AND W. HORTON RE: DRAF	G WITH S. GOLDRIN COSTUROS RE: PLAN	G, B. ROSEN, W. HO	RTON, T.	
03/02/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.50	1,027.50	16400	20200943
PARTIO GOLDE	CIPATE IN MEETING WITH B. ROSEN, V. PE RING, A. SANTILLAN AND ALVAREZ TEAM	THERBRIDGE, K. DIE RE: PLAN FORMULA	BLASI (PARTIAL), W TION.	. HORTON, S.	
03/02/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.70	441.00	16400	20115622
	CIPATE (PARTIAL) IN MEETING WITH W GN JLATION (.5); REVIEW EMAILS RE: SAME (.			PLAN	
03/04/10	Gold, Simeon	0.80	792.00	16400	20140915
WORK	ON W MI SECURITIES TRADING (.4); W ORK	ON SECURITIES/TA	X ISSUES IN PLAN (	.4).	
03/04/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.10	2,079.00	16400	20207083
CONFE RE: SA	RENCE CALL WITH T. SAPIEKA, K. DIBLA: ME (.8); CONFERENCE WITH W. HORTON A	SI, W. HORTON AND . ND J. POHL RE: SAM	J. POHL RE: PLAN (. E (.4).	9); RESEARC	H
03/04/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.30	1,124.50	16400	20235334
	RENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, T. SAPE RENCE WITH S. GOLDRING AND J. POHL R		J. POHL RE: PLAN	(.9);	
03/04/10	Pohl, Joshua	3.40	1,870.00	16400	20130714

DATE

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

TIME ID

ANALYZE LIQUIDATING TRUST AND OTHER PLAN ISSUES (2.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GOLDRING, W. HORTON, T. SAPEIKA AND K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN (.9); CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING AND W. HORTON RE: SAME (.4). 1.20 714.00 16400 20184693 03/04/10 Santillan, Aida REVIEW DIFFERENCES IN TAX RELATED ISSUES INVOLVED IN FRIED FRANK TERM SHEET. 822.00 16400 20200806 03/04/10 Sapeika, Tal 1.20 PARTICIPATE IN CALL WITH K. DIBLASI, S. GOLDRING, W. HORTON AND J. POHL RE: PLAN STRUCTURE (.9); CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME (.3). 1,323.00 16400 20122567 03/04/10 DiBlasi, Kelly 2.10 CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, W. HORTON, T. SAPEIKA AND J. POHL RE: TAX ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH THE PLAN (.9); REVIEW ISSUES RE: SAME (.4); DRAFT PLAN (.8). 03/04/10 Amponsah, Duke 0.80 160.00 16400 20166131 SEND K. DIBLASI PLAN FILED IN CLASSIC CABLE CASE. 03/05/10 Rosen, Brian 1.00 975.00 16400 20336495 DEVELOP AND DISTRIBUTE PLAN CALENDAR. 0.20 198.00 16400 20208536 03/05/10 Goldring, Stuart CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN. 20126490 5.80 3,654.00 16400 03/05/10 DiBlasi, Kelly DRAFT PLAN. 03/06/10 DiBlasi, Kelly 0.10 63.00 16400 20127080 REVIEW CONFIRMATION TIMELINE. 03/06/10 DiBlasi, Kelly 1.80 1,134.00 16400 20127071 DRAFT AND REVISE PLAN. 03/07/10 Rosen, Brian 2.80 2,730.00 16400 20336503 REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN. 4.10 3,997.50 16400 20336507 03/08/10 Rosen, Brian REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN (3.5); MEMORANDUM TO K. DIBLASIRE: SAME (.1); MEMORANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: RELATIONSHIP TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2); MEMORANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: ALVAREZ & MARSAL COMMENTS (.3). 03/08/10 0.20 198.00 16400 20274973 Goldring, Stuart CALL WITH K. DIBLASIRE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND PLAN. 126.00 16400 20274983 03/08/10 DiBlasi, Kelly 0.20 CALL WITH S. GOLDRING RE: SETTLEMENT AND PLAN. 5.30 3,339.00 16400 20133165 03/08/10 DiBlasi, Kelly REVISE PLAN TO INCLUDE COMMENTS FROM B. ROSEN. 0.50 275.00 16400 20266891 03/08/10 Gurdian, Julio

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEV	V COMMENTS TO PLAN.				
03/09/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	16400	20391776
CONFE	RENCE CALL WITH WMI, JPMC, ALVAREZ N RE: COMMENTS TO PLAN (.3).	2 & MARSAL RE: OPEN	ITEMS (.3); CALL V	VITH K.	
RODDE	, ,			16100	00075070
03/09/10	Goldring, Stuart  W AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DRAFT I	3.20 PLAN	3,168.00	16400	20275279
REVIEV	WAND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DRAFT	LAN.			
03/09/10	Margolis, Steven	0.50	360.00	16400	20231652
CONFE	R WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN OF REORGA	NIZATION AND BENEF	II PLAN ISSUES.		
03/09/10	DiBlasi, K elly	9.90	6,237.00	16400	20139344
CALL V	PLAN TO INCLUDE COMMENTS FROM B VITH B. ROSEN RE: SAME (.3); VOICEMAII DLIS RE: PLAN OF REORGANIZATION AN I	. FROM B. ROSEN RE: P	LAN (.1); CONFER	WITH S.	
03/09/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.50	257.50	16400	20226616
REVIEV PLANS	V CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MARGOLIS IN THE CHAPTER 11 PLAN (.2); REVIEW L	S, K. DIBLASI AND M. : IST SENT BY D. FRIESE	SPITTELL RE: LIST EN (.3).	OF BENEFIT	
03/09/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.40	206.00	16400	20277406
REVIE	W PLAN OF REORGANIZATION.				
03/10/10	Santillan, Aida	2.10	1,249.50	16400	20184599
REVIE'STATE	W ISSUES TO BE ADDRESSED IN THE TAX MENT.	DISCLOSURE SECTION	N OF WMI DISCLOS	SURE	
03/10/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	16400	20142905
REVIS	E PLAN.				
03/11/10	Gold, Simeon	0.60	594.00	16400	20283674
WORK	ON PLAN.				
03/11/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	16400	20336639
TELEP	HONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE	: PLAN STATUS.			
03/11/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	16400	20234615
	W ISSUES FROM K. DIBLASIRE: BENEFIT	PLANS FOR PLAN OF F	REORGANIZATION	AND RESPON	ĬD.
03/11/10	Santillan, Aida	2.00	1,190.00	16400	20184718
REVIE	W ISSUES TO BE ADDRESSED IN TAX DIS	CLOSURE RE: WMI CH	APTER 11 PLAN.		
03/11/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	5.10	3,213.00	16400	20144818
	E PLAN (4.7); CONFER WITH B. ROSEN RE				
03/12/10	Gold, Simeon	0.60	594.00	16400	20283741
WORK	ON PLAN.				
03/12/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	16400	20336707

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
мемог	RANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN.				
03/12/10	Rosen, Brian	0.70	682.50	16400	20391940
MEETIN	NG WITH K. DIBLASIRE: PLAN.				
03/12/10	Margolis, Steven	1.60	1,152.00	16400	20232330
	V MOST RECENT DRAFTS OF PLAN OF REEMENT AGREEMENT.	ORGANIZATION, DISCL	OSURE STATEME	NT AND JPMO	C
03/12/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	9.90	6,237.00	16400	20148947
REVISE	PLAN (9.0); MEETING WITH B. ROSEN RE	: SAME (.7); EMAIL WGN	M TEAM RE: SAM	E (.2).	
03/12/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.20	110.00	16400	20266719
	SPOND RE: FDIC SETTLEMENT.	0.20	110.00	***************************************	20200119
		0.00	165.00	16400	2027/210
03/12/10	Gurdian, Julio W PLAN.	0.30	165.00	16400	20266718
KEVIE	W FLAN.				
03/13/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.10	1,323.00	16400	20149692
REVISE	E PLAN.				
03/14/10	Berz, David	1.10	990.00	16400	20250737
DISCLO TOWER COMM RESPO	W COMMUNICATIONS FROM B. ROSEN REDSURE STATEMENT AND REVIEW OF THE RINSURANCE POLICY AND RESPOND WITUNICATIONS FROM B. KOSTUROS RE: SCIND WITH COMMENTS (.1); REVIEW AON PESPOND WITH COMMENTS TO SAME (.4).	: PLAN OF REORGANIZA TH COMMENTS RE: SAM HEDULING A CONFERE!	ATION PERTAININ E, ANALYZE (.6); NCE CALL RE: SA	IG TO THE REVIEW ME AND	ZS
03/14/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	16400	20336713
	RANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: REIT CLASS.				
03/14/10	DiBlasi, K elly	6.80	4,284.00	16400	20150516
	W B. ROSEN COMMENTS TO PLAN (.5); RE		**,201.00	10100	20100010
				1.6400	20161526
03/15/10	Gold, Simeon RENCE WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE, B. ROSE	4.50	4,455.00	16400 NRF PLAN	20161536
DOCUI	MENTS (.6); MEETING WITH E. WEINBERG ING DOCUMENTS (1.3); CONFER WITH B.	RE: PLAN (1.6); WORK (	ON PLAN (.8) ANI	RIGHTS	
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	3.10	3,022.50	16400	20344795
CONFI SCHEL CONFE	RANDUM TO J. GOULDING RE: PLAN AND RMATION SCHEDULE (.8); CALL WITH M. ER RE: SAME (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE P. ERENCE WITH S. GOLD AND J. SAGOT RE: S. GOLD, V. PETHERBRIDGE, E. WEINBERG	ROOSE RE: BACK-STOP LAN (.7); MEMORANDU SETTLEMENT AND PLA	AGREEMENT (2) M TO R. SACKS R N REVIEW (.2); C	); CALL WITH E: SAME (.1); ONFERENCE	
•					
03/15/10	Goldring, Stuart	6.80	6,732.00	16400	20513326
REVIE REVISI	W AND REVISE DRAFT PLAN, INCLUDING E DRAFT TAX DISCLOSURE TO DISCLOSU	DISCUSSION WITH C. I TRE STATEMENT (3.5).	3KOUWER (3.3); R	EVIEW AND	
03/15/10	Margolis, Steven	2.60	1,872.00	16400	20224035

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	RENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH WANIZATION AND JPMC SETTLEMENT AGI		SAL AND WGM RE	: PLAN OF	
03/15/10	Weinberg, Erika	2.20	1,540.00	16400	20159012
	SURE STATEMENT AND PLAN MEETING BRIDGE, S. GOLD, J. SAGOT AND G. QUIN		ONFERENCE WITH	V.	
03/15/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	1.00	665.00	16400	20174654
REVIEW S. GOLD (.6).	V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING T D, B. ROSEN, E. WEINBERG, J. SAGOT AND	O PLAN AND RELATE OG. QUINN RE: CORPO	D ISSUES (.4); CON RATE DOCUMENT	FERENCE WI' S FOR PLAN	TH
03/15/10	Pohl, Joshua	6.40	3,520.00	16400	20319636
DRAFT	AND REVISE TAX DISCLOSURE RE: PLAN	Į.			
03/15/10	Santillan, Aida	1.10	654.50	16400	20289180
	O WMI TEAM MEETING RE: CHAPTER 11 AX, CORPORATE AND BANKRUPTCY TEA		ID ACTIONS (PART	CICIPANTS:	
03/15/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.50	315.00	16400	20157338
EMAIL '	W GM TEAM AND CLIENT RE: PLAN ISSUI	ES (.4); CALL WITH T. S	SAPEIKA RE: SAME	3 (.1).	
03/15/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.60	309.00	16400	20218832
CONFE	RENCE WITH S. GOLD, V. PETHERBRIDGE	, E. WEINBERG AND J	. SAGOT RE: PLAN	DO CUMENT S	<b>3.</b>
03/15/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	3.00	1,365.00	16400	20174740
REVIEV	V DRAFT PLAN.				
03/15/10	Sagot, Jonathan	1.50	682.50	16400	20157228
WITH S	RENCE WITH B. ROSEN AND S. GOLD RE: L. GOLD, B. ROSEN, E. WEINBERG, V. PETI MENT'S FOR PLAN (.6); REVIEW PLAN AND	HERBRIDGE AND G. QU	JINN RE: CORPORA	); CONFEREN ATE	CE
03/16/10	Gold, Simeon	3.70	3,663.00	16400	20165801
	ON PLAN (1.2); WORK ON RIGHTS OFFER RBRIDGE RE: PLAN (.2).	ING DOCUMENTATION	N (2.3); CONFER WI	TH V.	
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	1.70	1,657.50	16400	20345901
CALL V	VITH K. DIBLASI, C. SMITH, C. BROUWER	J. GOULDING AND J.	MACIEL RE: PLAN	COMMENTS.	
03/16/10	Goldring, Stuart	3.60	3,564.00	16400	20282372
(.3); CA	W AND REVISE DRAFT PLAN (2.3); CALL V LL WITH K. DIBLASI RE: DRAFT PLAN (.7 SSION (.3).	WITH C. BROUWER AN ); PROVIDE COMMENT	D J. CARREON RE: IS TO FRIED FRAN	DRAFT PLAN K RE: DRAFT	ſ
03/16/10	Margolis, Steven	1.40	1,008.00	16400	20228419
CONFE TREAT	RENCE WITH M. SPITTELL, K. DIBLASI, E MENT OF VARIOUS BENEFIT PLANS.	. KOVACS AND D. FRII	ESEN ON CHAPTER	11	
03/16/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	1.80	1,197.00	16400	20174973

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

DATE

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

TIME ID

CONFE REVIEW	V DRAFT PLAN AND COMMENTS AND EMAILS REL RENCE WITH M. ROOSE AT FRIED FRANK RE: SAM V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO PLAN ( ARB AT FRIED FRANK RE: SAME (.1).	E (.1); DISCUSS SAN	1E WITH A. TA	NG (.4);	
03/16/10	DiBlasi, K elly	6.10	3,843.00	16400	20160456
AND D. CALL W	TAX ISSUES RELATED TO THE PLAN (.6); CALL V FRIESEN RE: EMPLOYEE BENEFIT PLANS (1.4); CA TITH B. ROSEN, C. SMITH, C. BROUWER, J. GOULDI PLAN TO INCLUDE COMMENTS FROM WGM TEAN	LL WITH S. GOLDR NG AND J. MACIEL	ING RE: DRAF RE: PLAN CON	$\Gamma$ PLAN (.7);	
03/16/10	Kovacs, Eva	2.00	1,030.00	16400	20225540
ATTENI	O TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MARGOLIS, TS-RELATED SECTIONS OF THE CHAPTER 11 PLAN	K. DIBLASI, M. SPIT N (1.4); REVIEW PLA	TTELL AND D. I AN (.6).	FRIESEN RE:	
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	16400	20344725
MEMOR	RANDUM TO M. ROOSE RE: BACKSTOP.				
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	2.10	2,047.50	16400	20345907
TIMING	RANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: PLANNING (.2); TELEF /SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.4); MEMORANDUM RANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: CONTINGENT RECOVER	TO B. KOSTUROS R	E: SAME (.2);		
03/17/10	Margolis, Steven	0.40	288.00	16400	20228420
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH E. KOVACS RE: JPMC SETTLEM SURE SCHEDULES.	IENT ISSUES, PLAN	OF REORGAN	IZATION AND	ı
03/17/10	Weinberg, Erika	0.40	280.00	16400	20191444
CALL V	VITH FRIED FRANK RE: BACKSTOP COMMITMENT	AGREEMENT.			
03/17/10	Tang, Amie	3.80	1,957.00	16400	20242135
UPDAT	E DRAFT BACKSTOP COMMITTMENT AGREEMEN	Т.			
03/17/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.40	274.00	16400	20201231
CONFE	R WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN ISSUES.				
03/17/10	DiBlasi, K elly	8.50	5,355.00	16400	20163471
REVISE	PLAN (8.1); CONFER WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: SAME	(.4).			
03/18/10	Gold, Simeon	7.70	7,623.00	16400	20176827
CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. ROSEN, V. PETHERBRIDGE, K. DIBLASI RE: RIGHTS OFFERING ISSUES (.4); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE, B. ROSEN AND C. SMITH RE: PLAN ISSUE (.5); CONFERENCE WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE, E. WEINBERG, A. TANG AND FRIED FRANK RE: BACK-STOP AGREEMENT (.7); WORK WITH CLIENTS, ALVAREZ AND WEIL TEAM ON JPM SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, PLAN OF REORGANIZATION AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, WEIL DRAFT OF BACK-STOP COMMITMENT AGREEMENT, ANALYSIS OF SECURITIES LAW ISSUES (5.7); CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, FRIED FRANK AND W. HORTON RE: TRANSFERABILITY OF LIQUIDATING TRUST INTEREST (.2); CONFER WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE RE: RIGHTS OFFERING (.2).					
03/18/10	Rosen, Brian	6.80	6,630.00	16400	20344729

DATE TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

REVISE PLAN (1.0); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: TIMING (2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH FRIED FRANK RE: PLAN STRUCTURE (1.0); REVIEW TERM SHEET RE: SAME (.3); MEMORANDUM TO M. ROOSE RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WMI, ALVAREZ & MARSALRE: PLAN (1.2); REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN (1.9); MEMORANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: DISTRIBUTION (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, V. PETHERBRIDGE AND K. DIBLASI RE: RIGHTS OFFERING ISSUES (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, V. PETHERBRIDGE, C. SMITH AND B. ROSEN RE: PLAN ISSUES (.5).

03/18/10 Goldring, Stuart

1.20

1,188.00

16400 202

TASK

20289502

TIME ID

CALL WITH CLIENT AND WGM TEAM RE: DRAFT SETTLEMENT AND DRAFT PLAN (1.0); CALL WITH S. GOLD, FRIED FRANK AND W. HORTON RE: TRANSFERABILITY OF LIQUIDATING TRUST INTEREST S (.2).

03/18/10 Horton, Jr., William

0.50

432.50

16400 20511325

REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3); CALL WITH S. GOLD, S. GOLDRING AND FRIED FRANK RE: TRANSFERABILITY OF LIQUIDATING TRUST INTEREST (.2).

03/18/10 Weinberg, Erika

1.10

770.00

16400 20191442

CALL RE: BACKSTOP AGREEMENT (.4); ATTEND TEAM CALL (S. GOLD, A. TANG AND V. PETHERBRIDGE) WITH FRIED FRANK RE: BACKSTOP AGREEMENT (.7).

03/18/10 Tang, Amie

5 40

2,781.00

20243808

UPDATE THE BACKSTOP COMMITMENT AGREEMENT (3.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE, S. GOLD, FRIED FRANK AND E. WEINBERG RE: BACKSTOP (.7); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCES RELATING TO BACKSTOP COMMITMENT AGREEMENT (1.3).

03/18/10 Petherbridge, Vaughan

8.30

5.519.50

16400 20

16400

20174460

DISCUSS RIGHTS OFFERING AND RELATED ISSUES WITH S. GOLD (.2); DISCUSS PLAN WITH K. DIBLASI (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. ROSEN, K. DIBLASI AND S. GOLD RE: RIGHTS OFFERING ISSUES (.4); CONTINUE DRAFTING AND REVISING BACKSTOP AGREEMENT FOLLOWING REVIEW OF FRIED FRANK MARK-UP OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND TERM SHEET (2.3); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT RESOLUTIONS FOR WMI RE: PLAN AND RELATED ISSUES (.6); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, B. ROSEN, C. SMITH AND OTHERS RE: PLAN ISSUES (.5); REVIEW FURTHER REVISED DRAFT OF PLAN AS DISTRIBUTED BY K. DIBLASI AND PROVIDE COMMENTS (.3); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH FRIED FRANK (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD AND FRIED FRANK RE: BACKSTOP AGREEMENT AND PREPARE FURTHER REVISED DRAFT (2.1); CONFER WITH E. WEINBERG, S. GOLD, AND FRIED FRANK RE: BACKSTOP AGREEMENT (.6).

03/18/10 Pohl, Joshua

0.60

330.00

20176230

CALL WITH ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND WEIL WAMU TEAM RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND RIGHTS OFFERING.

03/18/10 DiBlasi, Kelly

9.10

5,733.00

16400

16400

20166494

REVISE PLAN (3.7); CALL WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE RE: SAME (.1); PARTICIPATE (PARTIAL) IN CALL WITH WGM TEAM AND CLIENT RE: PLAN AND SETTLEMENT ISSUES (.9); CONTINUE TO REVISE PLAN (4.4).

03/19/10 Gold, Simeon

5.00

4,950.00

16400

20179327

REVIEW LATEST DRAFT OF PLAN OF REOR GANIZATION AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SAME (2.4); REVISE DRAFT OF BACKSTOP COMMITMENT AGREEMENT (2.2); DISCUSS BACKSTOP WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE (.2); CONFERENCE WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE AND M. GOLDFARB RE: SAME (.2).

03/19/10 Rosen, Brian

4.30

4,192.50

16400

20344735

MEMORANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN MEETING (.1); REVIEW REVISED PLAN (2.4); CONFER WITH A. LANDIS RE: BALLOTS (.4); REVIEW MATERIALS RE: SAME (.5); REVIEW MEMORANDUM AND MATERIALS RE: PLAN SUPPORT (.7); CONFER WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: REVISIONS TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2).

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/19/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.50	495.00	16400	20320443
CONFE	RENCE WITH W. HORTON RE: PLAN.				
03/19/10	Margolis, Steven	1.00	720.00	16400	20511907
REVIEV	V NEW DRAFT OF PLAN OF REORGANIZAT	TION AND PROVIDE CO	OMMENTS TO SAM	ſE.	
03/19/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.70	605.50	16400	20320445
REVIEV	V PLAN.				
03/19/10	Tang, Amie	1.60	824.00	16400	20242638
	W REVISED PLAN (1.0); REVISE BACKSTOP 7. PETHERBRIDGE RE: SAME (.1).	COMMITMENT AGRE	EMENT (.5); COMN	MUNICATE	
03/19/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	3.10	2,061.50	16400	20174929
REVISE PREPAI (.1); DIS	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING T D DRAFT OF PLAN (.5); CONSIDER FURTH RE FURTHER REVISED DRAFT OF BACKST SCUSS SAME WITH S. GOLD (.2); PARTIAL ARB AND S. GOLD RE: BACK STOP A GREED RE FURTHER REVISED DRAFT OF PLAN FO .6).	ER REVISIONS TO BA OP AGREEMENT (.5); ATTENDANCE AT TEL MENT (.1): DISCUSS SA	CKSTOP AGREEME DISCUSSSAME WI LEPHONE CALL WI AME WITH T. SAPE	ENT (.5); TH A. TANG TH M. IKA (.1);	
03/19/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.10	68.50	16400	20511909
CONFE	R WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE RE: BACKSTO	P AGREEMENT.			
03/19/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.70	441.00	16400	20170824
REVISI	E PLAN.				
03/19/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.80	1,134.00	16400	20170821
	CIPATE IN CALL RE: EMPLOYEE BENEFIT : EVIEW ISSUES RE: SAME (.5).	PLANS WITH ALVARE	Z & MARSAL AND	S. MARGOLIS	
03/19/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.50	257.50	16400	20225563
REVIE	W CORRESPONDENCE RE: SETTLEMENT A	GREEMENT AND CHA	APTER 11 PLAN.		
03/19/10	Mills, Marvin	0.40	158.00	16400	20247391
REVIE	W CASE LAW RE: RESERVATION OF RIGHT	rs.			
03/19/10	Mills, Marvin	1.10	434.50	16400	20247829
PREPA	RE MEMORANDUM FOR B. ROSEN RE: PLA	AN RESEARCH.			
03/20/10 REVIE	Rosen, Brian W AND REVISE PLAN.	2.10	2,047.50	16400	20360953
03/20/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.50	1,575.00	16400	20171106
	E PLAN (1.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON			EEMENT (1.0).	
03/21/10	Rosen, Brian	2.60	2,535.00	16400	20360956
CONF	ER WITH K. DIBLASI SPACE RE: PLAN CON JROS RE: SAME (.1).		ŕ	RANDUM TO	В.
03/21/10	Tang, A mie	0.40	206.00	16400	20243567

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE	RELATING TO THE PL	AN.		
03/21/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.20	133.00	16400	20174732
REVIEV	V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: PLAN.				
03/21/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	13.00	8,190.00	16400	20171880
REVIEV COMM I	V AND COMMENT ON DRAFT BACKSTOP ENTS FROM JPMC AND CREDITOR GROUD	AGREEMENT (1.0); RE PS (12.0).	EVISE PLAN TO INC	ORPORATE	
03/22/10	Gold, Simeon	4.60	4,554.00	16400	20205757
PURCH (.1); CO	V DRAFTS OF PLAN OF REORGANIZATIO ASE AGREEMENT AND SECURITIES LAW NFERENCE CALL WITH V. PETHERBRIDG NG RE: PLAN AND SETTLEMENT AGREEM	ISSUES (2.6); DISCUSS E AND FRIED FRANK	S PLAN WITH V. PE'	THERBRIDGE	
03/22/10	Rosen, Brian	1.00	975.00	16400	20360958
	V PLAN (.8); MEMORANDUM TO G. UZZII OMMENTS (.1).	RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW	G. UZZI MEMORA	NDUM RE:	
03/22/10	Rosen, Brian	2.20	2,145.00	16400	20360962
CONFE	R WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN CHANGES (	1.4); REVISE PLAN (.8)			
03/22/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.60	594.00	16400	20320449
FURTH	ER CALL WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN (.5); E: PLAN (.1).	FOLLOW-UP DISCUSS	ION WITH A. SANT	ILLAN AND J.	
03/22/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.80	792.00	16400	20281189
DISCUS	SS PLAN WITH K. DIBLASI.				
03/22/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	3.60	2,394.00	16400	20194843
ATTEN LIST (2	V AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING D MEETING RE: PLAN AND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD AN OF BACK STOP A GREEM ENT (.6).	r agreement (1.7); R	EVIEW AND MARK	-UP DOCUME	NT
03/22/10	Pohl, Joshua	1.50	825.00	16400	20178689
INTERI SANTII	NAL DISCUSSION RE: PLAN AND DISCLO LLAN (.1); REVIEW PLAN (1.0); REVISE PL	SURE STATEMENT WI AN AND DISCLOSURE	TH S. GOLDRING A STATEMENT (.4).	ND A.	
03/22/10	Santillan, Aida	0.40	238.00	16400	20184644
REVIE	W DRAFT OF WMI CHAPTER 11 PLAN.				
03/22/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.90	1,301.50	16400	20254818
PARTIO	CIPATE IN PARTS OF MEETING RE: PLAN	AND SUBORDINATIO	N ISSUES.		
03/22/10	DiBlasi, K elly	13.40	8,442.00	16400	20177933
IN MEI WITH I	E PLAN TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS F ETING WITH WGM TEAM, CLIENT, AND C B. ROSEN (1.4); REVISE PLAN TO INCORP CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING RE: PLAN (1.3	REDITOR GROUPS RE ORATE FURTHER COM	: SAME (4.1); REVIE	EW PLAN ISSU	JES
03/22/10	Kovacs, Eva	1.60	824.00	16400	20226197
REVIE	W REVISED DRAFT OF THE CHAPTER 11	PLAN.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/22/10	Quinn, Georgia	2.00	1,030.00	16400	20321352
REVIEV	SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND PLAN OF	REORGANIZATION			
03/23/10	Kam, Michael	2.20	1,980.00	16400	20205532
CONFEI BENEFI	RENCE WITH M. SPITTELL, K. KLINKHAMME T PLANS AND TREATMENT IN PLAN OF REC	ER, K. DIBLASI, S. M ORGANIZATION.	ARGOLIS AND E. I	COVACS RE:	
03/23/10	Rosen, Brian	1.20	1,170.00	16400	20362058
CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN CHA	ANGES (.4); REVIEW	SAME (.8).		
03/23/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.40	1,386.00	16400	20511915
REVIEV	V BACKSTOP AGREEMENT REPRESENTATIO	NS AND PROVIDE O	COMMENTS.		
03/23/10	Margolis, Steven	3.20	2,304.00	16400	20228907
TREAT	R WITH M. SPITTELL, K. DIBLASI, M. KAM A MENT IN PLAN OF REORGANIZATION (2.2); I TELL AND J. SCHRAG RE: BENEFIT PLANS N RD (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SCHRAG	PREPARE FOR SAMI MAINTAINED FOR W	E (.4); CORRESPON MI EMPLOYEES G	DENCE WITH	
03/23/10	Stangland, Elaine	1.20	1,080.00	16400	20239480
CONFE PLAN A	RENCE CALL WITH FRIED FRANK, ALVAREZ AND SUBORDINATION ISSUES.	Z & MARSAL TEAM,	B. ROSEN AND T.	SAPEIKA RE:	
03/23/10	Weinberg, Erika	0.40	280.00	16400	20192566
	D CONFERENCE CALL WITH WEIL TEAM (S. CKSTOP AGREEMENT.	GOLD, V. PETHERB	RIDGE, A. TANG A	ND K. DIBLAS	SI)
03/23/10	Tang, Amie	5.50	2,832.50	16400	20242427
E. WEI PETHE	RE FOR (.2) AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CAL NBERG TO DISCUSS THE BACKSTOP COMMI RBRIDGE ABOUT THE CHANGES TO BE MAI VISE THE AGREEMENT ACCORDINGLY (4.7)	ITMENT AGREEMEN DE TO THE BACKST	VT (.4); CONFER W	ITH V.	
03/23/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	5.30	3,524.50	16400	20194865
ISSUES OF BAC PREPA CONFE AGREE (.2); DI REVIS	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO S (.7); REVIEW K. DIBLASI MARK-UP OF BACK STOP A GREEM ENT (1.6); DISC USS BACKS' RE REVISED DRAFT OF RESOLUTIONS RE: PERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, E. WEINBERG, EMENT AND RELATED ISSUES (.4); CONSIDE SCUSS FURTHER BACKSTOP AGREEMENT RED DRAFTS OF PLAN, MARK-UP BY HAND, A EVIEW AND RESPOND TO FURTHER COMMI	KSTOP AGREEMEN' TOP AGREEMENT R LAN AND RELATED K. DIBLASI, AND A R FURTHER REVISION LEVISIONS WITH K. AND PROVIDE ADDI	T AND PREPARE H E VISIONS WITH A D ISSUES (.2); ATTE . TANG RE: BACKS ONS TO BACKSTO! DIBLASI (.2); REVI TIONAL COMMEN	AND MARK-U . TANG (.2); IND TOP P AGREEMEN' EW FURTHER TS TO A. TANG	г
03/23/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.80	1,233.00	16400	20254944
AND S	CIPATE IN CALL WITH FRIED FRANK, ALVA UBORDINATION ISSUES (1.2); REVIEW DRAF WITH J. GOULDING AND E. STANGLAND (.3)	T ANALYSIS RE: SA	N AND E. STANGL AME (.3); CORRESP	AND RE: PLAN ONDENCE RE	N :
03/23/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.40	882.00	16400	20181272
REVIE RE: SA	W BACKSTOP AGREEMENT (.8); CONFER WI ME WITH S. GOLD, E. WEINBERG, V. PETHEI	TH V. PETHERBRID RBRID GE AND A. TA	GE RE: SAME (.2); ANG (.4).	CONFERENCE	,
03/23/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	9.80	6,174.00	16400	20181217

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVISE KLINKI	E PLAN (7.6); CONFERENCE WITH M. KAM, HAMMER RE: BENEFIT PLANS AND TREAT	S. MARGOLIS, E. KOVA MENT IN PLAN OF REC	.CS, M. SPITTELL OR GANIZATION (2	AND K. 2.2).	
03/23/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.80	412.00	16400	20232723
REVIEV	W COMMENTS FROM FRIED FRANK TO THE	E CHAPTER 11 PLAN.			
03/23/10	Kovacs, Eva	2.70	1,390.50	16400	20233107
M. SPIT RESEA OUALI	D TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. KAI TELL RE: TERMINATION OF WMI BENEFIT RCH RE: SCOPE OF SECTION 1114 OF THE F FIED DEFERRED COMPENSATION PLANS A NING WITH WMI, SENT BY M. SPITTELL (.3	PLANS UNDER THE C BANKRUPTCY CODE (.: AND ARRANGEMENTS :	HAPTER 11 PLAN 2): REVIEW LIST (	(2.2); OF NON-	
03/24/10	Kam, Michael	0.70	630.00	16400	20205425
DISCUS	SS ISSUES WITH E. KOVACS RE: 1114.				
03/24/10	Rosen, Brian	0.90	877.50	16400	20362065
CONFE	RENCES WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN CHAN	IGES (.4); REVIEW SAM	E (.5).		
03/24/10	Weinberg, Erika	1.20	840.00	16400	20192732
CALL	WITH FRIED FRANK RE: ISSUES ON BACKS (.5); EMAIL TO GROUP RE: ISSUES (.1).	TOP AGREEMENT (.6);	REVIEW BACKST	OP REVISED	
03/24/10	Tang, Amie	0.20	103.00	16400	20242901
	ESPONDENCE WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE AB IQUIDATING TRUST AGREEMENT.	OUT THE BACKSTOP C	COMMITMENT AC	GREEMENT AN	VD.
03/24/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	1.30	864.50	16400	20194842
TO FU	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING T RTHER COMMENTS RE: BACKSTOP AGREE ED DRAFT (.5).	O BACKSTOP AGREEM EMENT AND PREPARE	IENT (.8); REVIEV AND CIRCULATE	V AND RESPO	ND
03/24/10	Santillan, Aida	1.50	892.50	16400	20278318
REVIE	W DRAFT OF DEBTORS PLAN.				
03/24/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	16400	20255181
	ESPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI AND J. MA SECURITIES.	CIEL RE: TREATMENT	OF COMMON AN	D PREFERREI	)
03/24/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.80	548.00	16400	20254910
PART	CIPATE IN PART OF MEETING RE: PLAN A	ND SETTLEMENT AGR	EEMENT.		
03/24/10	DìBlasi, K elly	14.30	9,009.00	16400	20184879
NEGO	TIATE AND REVISE PLAN TERMS (13.9); CO	ONFERENCE WITH B. R	O SEN RE: SAME (	(.4).	
03/24/10	Kovacs, Eva	8.20	4,223.00	16400	20232721
MARC	ARCH RE: SCOPE OF SECTION 1114 OF THE GOLIS RE: SAME (.4); INTERNAL DISCUSSIC RNAL DISCUSSION WITH M. KAM AND S. M RUPTCY CODE (2.3); SEND E-MAIL TO M. S	NS WITH M. KAM RE: ARGOLIS SEPARATEL	SAME (.7); RESEA Y RE: SECTION 1:	RCH AND	
03/25/10	Rosen, Brian	1.80	1,755.00	16400	20362069
CORR	ESPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN	CHANGES (.7); REVIEW	CHANGES (1.1).		

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID		
03/25/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.50	2,475.00	16400	20289702		
REVIEW	AND REVISE PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEM	IENT AND SETTLEM	ENT AGREEMENT				
03/25/10	Weinberg, Erika	2.10	1,470.00	16400	20192880		
	ATE BACKSTOP PURCHASE AGREEMENT	(1.6); DISCUSS SAME	WITH V. PETHERI	BRIDGE AND K	•		
03/25/10	Tang, A mie	5.80	2,987.00	16400	20242900		
PREPAR	E BACKSTOP COMMITMENT AGREEMENT	<b>`.</b>					
03/25/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	7.00	4,655.00	16400	20194870		
TO EMA TO EMA SUZUKI RELATE REVIEW DRAFT DISCUS	AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT OF I ILS RELATING THERETO (1.3); REVIEW RE ILS RELATING TO PLAN AND RELATED IS (.3); DISCUSS SAME WITH K. DIBLASI AND ID ISSUES WITH WMI TEAM (.6); REVIEW R OF FRIED FRANK COMMENTS AND REVIS WRITTEN CONSENT FOR WMI INVESTMEN S RESOLUTIONS WITH C. SMITH AND REV FOP AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING	EVISED DRAFT OF PL SUES (1.4); DISCUSS DE. WEINBERG (.5); I EVISED DRAFT OF E SE DRAFT OF BACKS IT CORP. (.3); REVISE ISE (.2); FURTHER RI	AN AND REVEW A BACKSTOP AGREI DISCUSS BACKSTO ACKSTOP FROM A TOP RE: SAME (.3) RESOLUTIONS FO	AND RESPOND EMENT WITH I OP AND A. TANG (.3); I; PREPARE OR WMI (.3);	)		
03/25/10	Pohl, Joshua	2.10	1,155.00	16400	20289896		
REVIEW	V REVISED PLAN.						
03/25/10	Santillan, Aida	2.50	1,487.50	16400	20224156		
REVIEV	V DRAFT OF PLAN.						
03/25/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	13.70	8,631.00	16400	20188645		
REVISE WEINB	PLAN (13.0); CALL WITH S. NAGLE RE: SA ERG RE: BACKSTOP AGREEMENT (.5).	ME (.2); CONFERENC	E WITH V. PETHEI	RBRIDGE AND	E.		
03/25/10	Kovacs, Eva	2.70	1,390.50	16400	20235784		
REVIEV	W REVISED CHAPTER 11 PLAN.						
03/26/10	Margolis, Steven	5.20	3,744.00	16400	20228702		
GLOBA	V DOCUMENTATION FOR PLAN OF REORG L SETTLEMENT (2.7); CORRESPONDENCE . SCHACHTER RE: SAME (2.0); CORRESPON	AND CONFERENCES	WITH WMI, ALVA	REZ & MARSA	L		
03/26/10	Tang, Amie	3.20	1,648.00	16400	20242899		
	UNICATE WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE ABOUT ESAME (3.1).	THE BACK STOP CO	MM ITMENT AGRE	EMENT (.1);			
03/26/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	3.80	2,527.00	16400	20199008		
PROPO REVIE' MARK- SUZUK	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO PLAN AND BACKSTOP (.3); REVIEW COMMENTS AND PROPOSED REVISIONS TO BACKSTOP (.3), AND PREPARE SUCCESSIVE REVISED DRAFTS FOLLOWING REVIEW OF SUCCESSIVE REVISED DRAFTS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN AND FRIED FRANK MARK-UPS OF BACKSTOP (2.3); DISCUSS MATTER WITH A. TANG (.1); DISCUSS BACKSTOP WITH D. SUZUKI (.2); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF BACKSTOP (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING THERETO (.5).						
03/26/10	Pohl, Joshua	0.70	385.00	16400	20230235		

REVIEW REVISED PLAN.

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT .	TASK	TIME ID
03/26/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	19.20	12,096.00	16400	20193589
REVISE	PLAN.				
03/26/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.50	257.50	16400	20235715
REVIEV	V CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MARGOLIS	RE: FURTHER COMM	IENTS TO THE CHA	APTER 11 PLAI	<b>N</b> .
03/29/10	Gold, Simeon	1.50	1,485.00	16400	20205921
REVIEV	W BACKSTOP AND COMMITMENT AGREEM	ENT.			
03/29/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.80	532.00	16400	20239178
REVIEV AGREE	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO	PLAN, DISCLOSURI	E STATEMENT ANI	D BACKSTOP	
03/29/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.10	45.50	16400	20244689
EMAIL	RE: PLAN.				
03/30/10	Rosen, Brian	0.80	780.00	16400	20295375
SAME (	RANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: FDIC/EQUITY CO1); MEMORANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: SAME RANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: SAME (.1).	DMMITTEE (.2); MEM (.1); MEMORANDUI	MORANDUM TO B. : M TO G. CROSS RE:	KOSTUROS RE WMI PLAN (.3	E: 5);
03/30/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.20	133.00	16400	20236905
REVIEV	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO	PLAN AND BACKST	TOP AGREEMENT	SSUES.	
03/30/10	Turner, K im	0.20	91.00	16400	20225812
REVIE	W ARTICLES FROM V. JOHNSON RE: CHAPT	TER 11 PLAN.			
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.30	292.50	16400	20295339
мемо	RANDUM TO J. GOULDING RE: VALUATION	٧.			
				·····························	
SUBTOTA FORMUL	AL TASK CODE 16400 - PLAN ATION:	452.40	\$ 323,767.50		
03/01/10	Sapeika, Tal	2.30	1,575.50	16500	20201133
	ESPONDENCE WITH G. QUINN AND E. WEIN		URE STATEMENT (	2); REVIEW A	ND
REVISI	E SAME (2.1).				
03/02/10	Sapeika, Tal	3.60	2,466.00	16500	20200777
REVIE	W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/02/10	Quinn, Georgia	1.50	772.50	16500	20218945
REVIE	W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/03/10	Gold, Simeon	1.50	1,485.00	16500	20122360
DRAF	F SECURITIES LAW PORTIONS OF WMI PLA WITH C. SMITH RE: DEMAND FOR SHARE	N AND DISCLOSURE	E STATEMENT (1.2)	; EXCHANGE	E-
03/03/10	Margolis, Steven	1.70	1,224.00	16500	20231760
CONFI CONFI	ER WITH E. KOVACS RE: ERISA RELATED P ER WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: SAME (.2).	ROVISIONS OF THE	DISCLOSURE STAT	TEMENT (1.5);	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
					•
03/03/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.30	199.50	16500	20130464
CONSIL	DER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT LANGUAG FO (.1).	E AND REVIEW (.2); R	ESPOND TO EMAII	LS RELATING	
03/03/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.00	695.00	16500	20123800
DRAFT	AND EDIT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE:	ERISA/SECURITIES M	DL LITIGATION.		
03/03/10	Johnson, Virginia	1.00	685.00	16500	20270424
CONFE	R WITH K. TURNER RE: DISCLOSURE STA	TEMENT LANGUAGE	RE: SECURITIES A	ND ERISA	
03/03/10	Sapeika, Tal	10.70	7,329.50	16500	20200699
MARGO	S WITH S. MARGOLIS AND E. KOVACS RE: DLIS RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE RE: SAME (.7); CALLS AND CORRESPOND	DISCLOSURE STATEM	(ENT (9.4); MEETIN	WITH S. G WITH G.	
03/03/10	Kovacs, Eva	3.40	1,751.00	16500	20226181
REVISE MARGO	E ERISA-RELATED PROVISIONS OF THE DI DLIS RE: SAME (1.5); CALLS AND CORREST	SCLOSURE STATEME PONDENCE WITH T. SA	NT (1.6); DISCUSSI APEIKA RE: SAME	ON WITH S. (.3).	
03/03/10	Mishkin, Jessie	0.50	275.00	16500	20272280
EMAIL STATE	COMMENTS TO T. SAPEIKA RE: DESCRIP' MENT.	TION OF MARTA CLAI	MS FOR DISCLOSU	JRE	
03/03/10	Quinn, Georgia	4.60	2,369.00	16500	20218949
REVISE	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.9); MEETIN	G WITH T. SAPEIKA R	E: SAME (.7).		
03/03/10	Turner, Kim	5.50	2,502.50	16500	20125736
DISCLO	UNICATION WITH T. SAPEIKA AND D. SPI OSURE STATEMENT FOR J. SHIFFMAN AN CONFER WITH V. JOHNSON RE: DISCLOSUR S (1.0).	D T. SAPEIKA AND FO	LLOW-UP COMMU	NICATIONS	
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	1.50	1,462.50	16500	20336564
MEM O	RANDUM TO T. SAPEIKA RE: DISCLOSURI	E STATEMENT DISTRI	BUTION (.2); REVI	EW SAME (1.3	).
03/04/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.30	259.50	16500	20273513
	W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/04/10	Mastando, III, John	1.20	984.00	16500	20239735
	W DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	<b></b>			
03/04/10	Yates, Erin	1.10	500.50	16500	20273515
REVIE	W DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: 1 KA ET AL. RE: SAME (.1).	INSURANCE SECTION	(1.0) AND DRAFT I	E-MAIL TO T.	
03/04/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.80	1,233.00	16500	20201052
GURD	ESPONDENCE WITH E. YATES, J. MASTAN IAN RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); CO IENTS FROM D. LOGAN AND REVISE ACC CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. YATES, J. GUI	ONFER WITH R. SHAR! ORDINGLY (.6): REVIE	MA RE: SAME (.4); EW COMMENTS FR	REVIEW	
03/04/10	Quinn, Georgia	2.00	1,030.00	16500	20219308

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	V DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND SETTLE	MENT AGREEMENT.			
03/04/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.40	182.00	16500	20127322
CONFE	R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: DISCLOSURE STA	TEMENT.			
03/05/10	Pohl, Joshua	2.40	1,320.00	16500	20274698
REVISE	TAX DISCLOSURE.				
03/05/10	Quinn, Georgia	3.60	1,854.00	16500	20219514
	V SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND DRAFT	r riders for disclos	URE STATEMENT	•	
03/06/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.70	1,071.00	16500	20127079
REVIEV	V AND COMMENT ON DISCLOSURE STAT	EMENT INSERT (.3); RE	•	ENT ON	
DRAFT	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT APPROVAL M	OTION (1.4).			
03/07/10	Quinn, Georgia	2.30	1,184.50	16500	20219518
DRAFT	RIDERS FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/08/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	16500	20336623
МЕМОІ	RANDUM TO R. SHARMA RE: DISCLOSUR	E STATEMENT UPDATE	ē.		
03/08/10	Pohl, Joshua	2.10	1,155.00	16500	20274977
REVIEV	W PLAN DISCLOSURE AND DRAFT TAX SE	ECTION RE: SAME.			
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	16500	20274984
CONFE	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: MOTION TO APPI	ROVE DISCLOSURE STA	ATEMENT.		
03/08/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.80	412.00	16500	20219519
DRAFT	RIDERS FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/08/10	Quinn, Georgia	2.40	1,236.00	16500	20274986
REVIE	W PLAN OF REORGANIZATION AND COM	MENTS THERETO (2.2);	REVIEW PUBLIC	DISCLOSURE	
RE: INT	ER CHANGE LITIGATION (.2).				
03/08/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.40	182.00	16500	20150398
	W MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE ST PROVE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1).	ATEMENT (.3); CONFE	R WITH K. DIBLAS	SIRE: MOTION	1
03/09/10	Gurdian, Julio	0.30	165.00	16500	20266859
	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: DISCLO	SURE STATEMENT.			
03/09/10	Quinn, Georgia	1.20	618.00	16500	20219376
	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/10/10	Quinn, Georgia	2.50	1,287.50	16500	20219041
	T AND REVISE REGISTRATION RIGHTS SE		·		
03/11/10	Pohl Joshua	3,80	2,090.00	16500	20173993
03/11/10 DRAF	Pohl, Joshua  T DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	5.00	2,070.00	* 64.44	
00/11/10	Owing Gaorgia	0.30	154.50	16500	20219011
03/11/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.50	154.50	10300	2021/011

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/11/10	Coleman, Erica	1.70	773.50	16500	20243777
REVIEW PURSUA	SECTIONS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEM	NT RELEVANT TO LITIGATIENT.	TION CLAIMS BE	ING SETTLED	
03/12/10	Berz, David	1.20	1,080.00	16500	20250824
RESPON	V FROM B. ROSEN WASHINGTON MUTU. ND WITH COMMENTS (.2); REVIEW STAT PPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL ON MON	TUS OF THE DISCLOSURE	THE SETTLEMEN STATEMENT FRO	IT AND OM G. QUINN	
03/12/10	Pohl, Joshua	1.10	605.00	16500	20173954
DRAFT	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/12/10	Santillan, Aida	5.80	3,451.00	16500	20184696
REVISE	WMI CHAPTER 11 PLAN TAX DISCLOSU	JRE.			
03/12/10	Quinn, Georgia	1.60	824.00	16500	20219278
REVIEV	W PLAN AND REVISE RIDERS FOR DISCL	OSURE STATEMENT.			
03/12/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.50	1,137.50	16500	20150589
REVIEV	W AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE D	ISCLOSURE STATEMENT.			
03/13/10	DiBlasi, K elly	5.20	3,276.00	16500	20149685
	W AND COMMENT ON DISCLOSURE STA	TEMENT MOTION.			
03/13/10	Sharma, Rahul	5.70	2,593.50	16500	20150417
	MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE ST	TATEMENT.			
03/14/10	Pohl, Joshua	3.10	1,705.00	16500	20173710
DRAFT	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/14/10	DiBlasi, K elly	2.40	1,512.00	16500	20150509
	W AND COMMENT ON MOTION TO APPE DER TO APPROVE SAME (.8).	ROVE DISCLOSURE STATE	EMENT (1.6); CAL	L R. SHARMA	
03/14/10	Sharma, Rahul	7.00	3,185.00	16500	20170920
MOTIO	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER (1.9 N (.8); CALL WITH K. DIBLASI RE: DISC DSURE STATEMENT (.3); REVISE DISCLO	LOSURE STATEMENT MOT	ΓΙΟΝ (.8); EMAIL	TATEMENT S RE:	
03/15/10	Gold, Simeon	1.00	990.00	16500	20319634
WORK	ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	16500	20392025
CONFE	ER WITH R. SHARMA AND K. DIBLASIRI	B: DATES FOR DISCLOSUR	E STATEMENT H	IEARING.	
03/15/10	Sapeika, Tal	5.50	3,767.50	16500	20200689
DISCLO	WITH G. QUINN RE: DISCLOSURE STATE OSURE STATEMENT (.5); CORRESPOND I W DRAFT PLAN AND REVIEW AND REV	ENCE WITH K. DIBLASI, R.	, SHARMA RE: BA	O R. SHARMA I ALLOTS (.1);	RE:

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/15/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	16500	20513328
CONFE	R WITH B. ROSEN AND R. SHARMA RE: DIS	CLOSURE STATEMEN	IT AND SCHEDULI	₹.	
03/15/10	Quinn, Georgia	8.00	4,120.00	16500	20278987
CALL W SHARM	/ITH T. SAPEIKA RE: DISCLOSURE STATEM A RE: SAME (.5); REVISE DISCLOSURE STA	fENT (.3); MEETING W TEMENT (7.2).	VITH T. SAPEIKA	AND R.	
03/15/10	Sharma, Rahul	7.50	3,412.50	16500	20170942
RE: DA' (1.7); RI	V AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT I TESFOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MOTIC EVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); MEE' SURE STATEMENT (.5); REVISE DISCLOSU	ON (.2); REVISE DISCLO FING WITH T. SAPEIK	OSURE STATEMEN A AND G. QUINN I	IT MOTION	SI
03/16/10	Gold, Simeon	1.80	1,782.00	16500	20319644
WORK	ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	16500	20392778
CONFE	R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: DISCLOSURE STA	ГЕМЕНТ.			
03/16/10	Goldring, Stuart	4.50	4,455.00	16500	20282373
REVIE	W AND REVISE DRAFT TAX DISCLOSURE T	O DISCLOSURE STAT	EMENT.		
03/16/10	Margolis, Steven	2.20	1,584.00	16500	20227654
REVIEV	W NEW DRAFT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENTS RE: SAME (1.9); CORRESPONDENCE V	NT AND JPMC SETTLE WITH ALVAREZ & MA	EMENT AGREEME RSAL, WMI AND V	NT AND VGM TEAM RI	E:
03/16/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	1.00	665.00	16500	20282385
REVIE	W DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND	EMAILS AND COMME	NTS RELATING TI	HERETO.	
03/16/10	Pohl, Joshua	2.30	1,265.00	16500	20176072
REVIEV	W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.7); DRAFT	TAX DISCLOSURE RE:	SAME (.6).		
03/16/10	Santillan, Aida	7.40	4,403.00	16500	20184728
REVIE	W DRAFT OF WMI CHAPTER 11 PLAN DISC RANDUM (1.5); REVIEW U.S. TAX DISCLOS	LOSURE (3.4); REVIEV URE ISSUES (2.5).	V PRE-SUBMISSIO	N CONFEREN	CE
03/16/10	Sapeika, Tal	7.00	4,795.00	16500	20200681
CONFE REVISI (5.9).	R WITH B. ROSEN RE: DISCLOSURE STATIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.7); RE	EMENT AND BUUS (.4) VIEW AND REVISE SA	; CALLS WITH G. AME AND CIRCUL	QUINN RE: ATE TO WMI	
03/16/10	Quinn, Georgia	5.60	2,884.00	16500	20219274
REVISI	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.9); CALL W	ITH T. SAPEIKA RE: RI	EVISIONS TO SAM	E (.7).	
03/16/10	Sharma, Rahul	5.90	2,684.50	16500	20170937
	E EXHIBITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT		•		
03/17/10	Gold, Simeon	4.90	4,851.00	16500	20169021

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
DRAFT O	VITH FRIED FRANK AND WEIL TEAM ON I OF BALLOTS AND COMMENTS ON SAME ( SURE STATEMENT REVISIONS (1.6); CALL ENT (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. SAI	.8); FOLLOW-UP ON F WITH V. PETHERBRI	LAN OF REORGAN DGE RE: DISCLOSU	IZATION AND	)
03/17/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.40	2,376.00	16500	20292173
DISCUSS DISCLOS	S DRAFT TAX DISCLOSURE WITH W. HOR'SURE OF CREDITOR TREATMENT (2.0).	ron (.4); review an	D REVISE DRAFT T	`AX	
03/17/10	Margolis, Steven	0.90	648.00	16500	20228314
	NEW DRAFT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMEN A RE: SAME (.2).	NT (.7); CORRESPOND	ENCE WITH E.KOV	VACS AND T.	
03/17/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.30	1,124.50	16500	20235855
REVIEW	AND COMMENT ON TAX DISCLOSURE (.	9); CONFER ENCE WIT	H S. GOLDRING RE	E: SAME (.4).	
03/17/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	8.70	5,785.50	16500	20174650
STATEM FURTHE	AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO MENT AND NEXT STEPS WITH S. GOLD (.1) R REVIEW OF DRAFT PLAN AND DISCLOSIFIED FRANK RE: PLAN AND RELATED ISS	); DRAFT BACKSTOP. SURE STATEMENT (7	AGREEMENT FOLL	OWING	
03/17/10	Pohl, Joshua	5,30	2,915.00	16500	20176140
DRAFT	AND REVISE TAX SECTION OF DISCLOSU	RE STATEMENT.			
03/17/10	Santillan, Aida	7.00	4,165.00	16500	20184740
REVIEW (2.3).	WMI DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.7); RE	VIEW TAX ISSUES IN	CLUDED IN TAX D	ISCLOSURE	
03/17/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.20	822.00	16500	20201044
RE. RAI	WITH G. QUINN RE: DISCLOSURE STATEM LOTS (.1); REVIEW D. LOGAN COMMENTS SPONDENCE RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW AND	S TO DISCLOSURE ST	ATEMENT (.1);	FROM S. GOLE	)
03/17/10	Kovacs, Eva	1.10	566.50	16500	20225537
REVIEV SAME (.	V AND COMMENT ON DISCLOSURE STATI 2); INTERNAL DISCUSSION WITH S. MARC	EMENT (.7); CORRESP GOLIS RE: SAME (.2).	ONDENCE WITH T	. SAPEIKA RE	:
03/17/10	Quinn, Georgia	2.50	1,287.50	16500	20219129
REVISE	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.1); CALL W	ITH T. SAPEIKA RE: S	AME (.4).		
03/17/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.30	136.50	16500	20170933
RESEAF	RCH RE: ISSUANCE DATE OF WMI DEBT S	ECURITIES (FOR TAX	DISCLOSURE).		
03/18/10	Goldring, Stuart	5.20	5,148.00	16500	20248064
HORTO	V AND REVISE DRAFT TAX DISCLOSURE : N RE: DRAFT TAX DISCLOSURE (.7); FURT COMMENTS RECEIVED (.8).	IN DISCLOSURE STAT THER REVISISIONS TO	rement (3.7); con o tax disclosur	FER WITH W. E STATEMEN'	r
03/18/10	Margolis, Steven	0.50	360.00	16500	20228942
REVIE	W COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEME	NT.			
03/18/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.10	951.50	16500	20236271

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ENCE CALLS WITH K. KEYES (.4); CONFERI SURE (.7).	ENCES WITH S. GOL	DRING RE: DRAFT	TAX	
03/18/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.60	1,384.00	16500	20289505
REVIEW	AND COMMENT ON TAX DISCLOSURE.				
03/18/10	Pohi, Joshua	2.20	1,210.00	16500	20511326
REVIEW	AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO TAX SECTI	ON OF DISCLOSURI	E STATEMENT.		
03/18/10	Santillan, Aida	2.90	1,725.50	16500	20184725
REVISE	TAX DISCLOSURE.				
03/18/10	Sapeika, Tal	6.40	4,384.00	16500	20200854
REVIEW	COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	Γ AND REVISE SAM	E.		
03/18/10	Sharma, Rahul	7.40	3,367.00	16500	20170904
REVISE	MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE STATE SURE STATEMENT (1.9).	EMENT (5.5); REVIS	E ORDER APPROVI	NG	
03/19/10	Margolis, Steven	1,10	792.00	16500	20229328
REVIEW CORRES	NEW DRAFT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT SPONDENCE WITH T. SAPEIKA AND E. KOV	T AND PROVIDE CO ACS RE: SAME (.2).	MMENTS TO SAM	E (.9);	
03/19/10	Pohl, Joshua	0.40	220.00	16500	20231104
REVIEV	V DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/19/10	Sapeika, Tal	4.80	3,288.00	16500	20201818
REVIEV RE: SAM	W REVISIONS TO PLAN AND UPDATE DISCL ME (.2).	OSURE STATEMEN	T (4.6); CONFER WI	TH B. ROSEN	
03/19/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.70	1,228.50	16500	20170900
REVISE MOTIO	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MOTION AND $\Omega$ N (.5).	ORDER (2.2); EMAIL	S RE: DISCLOSURE	STATEMENT	
03/20/10	Sapeika, Tal	4.70	3,219.50	16500	20254642
REVIEV ALVAR	W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, I EZ & MARSAL AND WEIL TEAM.	INCLUDING CORRE	SPONDENCE RE: S.	AME WITH	
03/21/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.50	1,485.00	16500	20279259
REVIEV STATE	W AND REVISED DRAFT OF TAX CLAIMS AND MENT.	ND TAX REFUND SE	ECTION OF DISCLO	SURE	
03/21/10	Sapeika, Tal	7.50	5,137.50	16500	20255027
REVIE	W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/21/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	16500	20193474
	SRE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/22/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.20	1,188.00	16500	20320450
CONFE (1.0); R	ER WITH T. SAPIEKA AND E. COLEMAN RE: EVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO C. BI SSION FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2).	DISCLOSURE STAT	EMENT DESCRIPTI	ON OF TAXES LAIM	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/22/10	Weinberg, Erika	1.10	770.00	16500	20191437
REVIEW	DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/22/10	Santillan, Aida	0.10	59.50	16500	20511912
	ENCE WITH S. GOLDRING AND J. POHL I	RE: PLAN TAX DICLOS	URE.		
03/22/10	Sapeika, Tal	12.50	8,562.50	16500	20255571
CONFER WITH S.	WITH G. QUINN RE: DISCLOSURE STATE GOLDRING AND E. COLEMAN RE: SAME MENT (.2).	EMENT (.3); REVIEW A (1.0); CONFER WITH K	ND REVISE SAME L DIBLASI RE: DIS	(11.0); CALL CLOSURE	
03/22/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	16500	20177885
CONFE	RENCE WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: DISCLOSUR	E STATEMENT.			
03/22/10	Quinn, Georgia	4.50	2,317.50	16500	20218960
REVISE	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.2); CONFER	ENCE WITH T. SAPEIK	(A RE: SAME (.3).		
03/22/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.10	500.50	16500	20193478
REVISE	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/22/10	Sharma, Rahul	3.80	1,729.00	16500	20193479
REVISE	ORDER TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MEVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MOTION	OTION (.8); REVISE DE NAND ORDER (1.4).	SCLOSURE STATE	MENT MOTIO	N
03/23/10	Margolis, Steven	0.80	576.00	16500	20228911
REVIEV	V NEW DRAFT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMI	ENT.			
03/23/10	Mastando, III, John	0.90	738.00	16500	20239242
REVIEV	W REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/23/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.20	133.00	16500	20283124
	W LATEST DRAFT OF DISCLOSURE STAT	EMENT.			
03/23/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.20	133.00	16500	20511916
	W LATEST DRAFT OF DISCLOSURE STAT:				
02/02/10	Dalil Tashua	3.70	2,035.00	16500	20230767
03/23/10 REVISE	Pohl, Joshua E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	3.70	2,033.00	2000	
		1.00	685.00	16500	20255008
03/23/10 NUMEI (.5); RE	Sapeika, Tal ROUS CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH VIEW COMMENTS RE: SAME (.5).	1.00 G. QUINN RE: DISCLO			
03/23/10	Kovacs, Eva	2.20	1,133.00	16500	20234041
	W AND COMMENT ON DISCLOSURE STA	FEMENT (2.0); SEND E-	-MAIL TO T. SAPEI	KARE: SAME	
03/23/10	Quinn, Georgia	5.10	2,626.50	16500	20219457
	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.6); CORRE	SPONDENCE WITH T.	SAPEIKA RE: COM	MENTS TO	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/24/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	16500	20362066
CORRES	SPONDENCE WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: DISCL	OSURE STATEMENT CH	ianges and sta	TUS.	
03/24/10	Pohl, Joshua	4.10	2,255.00	16500	20230966
REVIEV	V AND REVISE TAX SECTION OF DISCLOS	SURE STATEMENT.			
03/24/10	Santillan, Aida	1.50	892.50	16500	20184712
REVIEV	V DRAFT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/24/10	Chandis, Vanessa	0.50	275.00	16500	20512351
DRAFT	SUMMARY RE: ALEXANDER LITIGATION	FOR DISCLOSURE STA	ATEMENT.		
03/24/10	Sapeika, Tal	11.90	8,151.50	16500	20254168
REVIEV MEMBE	W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ERS OF ALVAREZ AND WMI TEAMS AND	', INCORPORATING CO MULTIPLE EMAILS RE:	MMENTS FROM V SAME.	ARIOUS	
03/24/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.50	257.50	16500	20232896
REVIEV	W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/24/10	Quinn, Georgia	0.90	463.50	16500	20219456
REVISE	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/24/10	Coleman, Erica	2.00	910.00	16500	20279265
REVIEV AND GI	W AND REVISE SECTIONS OF DISCLOSUR LOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.9);	E STATEMENT APPLIC DRAFT MEMORANDUM	ABLE TO JPMORO 11 TO T. SAPEIKA F	GAN LITIGATIONE: SAME (.1).	ON
03/24/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.40	637.00	16500	20193572
REVIE	W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MOTION, OF	RDER, AND EXHIBITS.			
03/25/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	16500	20362071
CONFE	RENCES WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: DISCLOSU	IRE STATEM ENT CHAN	GES.		
03/25/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.50	2,475.00	16500	20289703
REVISI	E TAX DISCLOSURE TO DISCLOSURE STA	TEMENT (2.0); DISCUS:	S SAME WITH J. P	OHL (.5).	
03/25/10	Pohl, Joshua	1.30	715.00	16500	20289895
REVISI	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.2); CONFE	R WITH S. GOLDRING F	RE: SAME (.1).		
03/25/10	Sapeika, Tal	13.30	9,110.50	16500	20254785
INPAR	W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMEN RT OF MEETING RE: PLAN AND OPEN SET OSURE STATEMENT (8.8); CONFER WITH	TLEMENT ISSUES (.8);	REVIEW AND REV	i); PARTICIPA VISE	TE
03/25/10	Quinn, Georgia	10.80	5,562.00	16500	20219570
REVIS	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/25/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.10	500.50	16500	20193711
REVIE	W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT IN PREPAR	ATION FOR FILING.			
03/25/10	Sharma, Rahul	10.50	4,777.50	16500	20193739

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MOTION AND	EXHIBITS (2.3); REV	IEW AND REVISE S	SAME (8.2).	
03/26/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.20	173.00	16500	20290019
CONFE	RENCE WITH J. POHL RE: DISCLOSURE ST	ATEMENT.			
03/26/10	Pohl, Joshua	2.20	1,210.00	16500	20290020
REVIEW CONFE	V COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEME RENCE WITH W. HORTON RE: SAME (.2).	NT (.5); REVISE DISCL	O SURE STATEMEN	NT (1.5);	
03/26/10	Santillan, Aida	4.30	2,558.50	16500	20223632
REVIEV	W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CHAPT	ER II PLAN.			
03/26/10	Sapeika, Tal	20.60	14,111.00	16500	20255517
	W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT LUPTCY COURT.	IN PREPARATION FO	R FILING WITH TH	E	
03/26/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	189.00	16500	20290022
REVIEV	W AND COMMENT ON DISCLOSURE STAT	EMENT NOTICE.			
03/26/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.50	257.50	16500	20235716
	W CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN S. MARG DSURE STATEMENT.	OLIS AND T. SAPEIKA	RE: COMMENTS T	TO THE	
03/26/10	Quinn, Georgia	5.20	2,678.00	16500	20219255
REVISE	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
03/29/10	Yates, Erin	1.20	546.00	16500	20290155
REORG	W AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM E. ELS SANIZATION (.1); REVIEW TERMS OF DISC ED INFORMATION (1.1).	BREE RE: DISCLOSUR LOSURE STATEMENT	RE STATEMENT AN AND PLAN FOR IN	ID PLAN OF NSURANCE-	
03/29/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	16500	20254878
	ESPONDENCE WITH C. STAPEN, V.PETHEI DSURE STATEMENT.	RBRIDGE AND B. GLU	EKSTEIN RE: FILEI	D PLAN AND	
03/29/10	Sharma, Rahul	3.70	1,683.50	16500	20244327
REVIE	W MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE ST	ATEMENT, ORDER, A	ND EXHIBITS.		
03/30/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	16500	20244794
	E DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MOTION.				
03/31/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.80	504,00	16500	20216717
	W AND COMMENT ON DRAFT ORDER API	PROVING DISCLOSUR	E STATEMENT ANI	D RELATED	
SUBTOTA STATEM	AL TASK CODE 16500 - DISCLOSURE ENT:	395.10	\$ 243,873.00		
03/17/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.30 F MOTION	1,046.50	16600	20170922
03/18/10	E EXHIBITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Sharma, Rahul	1.30	591.50	16600	20511333

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVISE	E EXHIBITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT I	MOTION.			
03/19/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.30	1,046.50	16600	20511910
EMAIL MOTIO	S RE: 3RD PARTY RELEASES (FOR BALLOT N (2.1).	S) (.2); REVISE EXHIB	ITS TO DISCLOSUI	RE STATEMEN	T
03/21/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	16600	20435088
	S RE: BALLOTS.	V.2V	, 2, 2		
03/22/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	16600	20193475
	W CONFIRMATION DOCUMENT LIST.				
03/22/10	Sharma, Rahul	6.80	3,094.00	16600	20511913
REVISE RE: BA	E EXHIBITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT I LLOTS (.3); CALL WITH KCC RE: SAME (.6);	MOTION (5.4); CORRE CALL WITH KCC RE:	SPONDENCE WITH SAME (.5).	K. DIBLASI	
03/23/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.50	342.50	16600	20511917
EMAIL	S WITH J. MACIEL RE: TREATMENT OF DIS			OCESS (.3);	
CONFE	R WITH K. DIBLASI RE: SAME (.2).				
03/23/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.20	126.00	16600	20511918
	R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: TREATMENT OF D	ISPUTED CLAIMS AN	ID SOLICITATION F	PROCESS.	
	R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: TREATMENT OF D Sharma, Rahul	SISPUTED CLAIMS AN 4.10	ID SOLICITATION F	PROCESS. 16600	20193715
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME A1	16600	
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE	Sharma, Rahul	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME A1	16600	
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME A1	16600	
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS SUBTOTA PROCESS	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION 6/BALLOTS/VOTING:	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMEN 1 17.90	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AN MOTION (2.4). \$ 8,294.50	16600 ND EMAILS AN	ND
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS SUBTOTA PROCESS 03/01/10	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMEN I	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AI MOTION (2.4).	16600	ND
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS SUBTOTA PROCESS 03/01/10 RESEA	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION 6/BALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT 17.90 5.80	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AND MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00	16600 ND EMAILS AN	20135741
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS SUBTOTA PROCESS 03/01/10 RESEA 03/02/10	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION SBALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AN MOTION (2.4). \$ 8,294.50	16600 ND EMAILS AN	20135741
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS SUBTOTA PROCESS 03/01/10 RESEA 03/02/10 RESEA	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC. AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION SBALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne ARCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AND MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000	20135741 20136026
03/26/10 REVIE CALLS SUBTOTA PROCESS 03/01/10 RESEA 03/02/10 RESEA	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION 6/BALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AND MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00	16600 ND EMAILS AN	20135741 20136026
CONFE  03/26/10  REVIE CALLS  SUBTOTA PROCESS  03/01/10  RESEA  03/02/10  RESEA  03/02/10  DISCU	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCI AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION SBALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne RCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P Benfield, Brianna RSSN. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY WITH E. H	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20 REN.	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AR MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00  273.00  91.00	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000	20135741 20136026 20127750
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS  SUBTOTA PROCESS  03/01/10 RESEA  03/02/10 RESEA  03/02/10 DISCU  03/03/10	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC. AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION 6/BALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne RCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P Benfield, Brianna	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20 REN.  1.40	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AR MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00  273.00  91.00	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000	20135741 20136026 20127750
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS  SUBTOTA PROCESS  03/01/10 RESEA  03/02/10 RESEA  03/02/10 DISCU  03/03/10	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION 6/BALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne RCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P Benfield, Brianna SSN. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY WITH E. H Wine, Jennifer	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20 REN.  1.40	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AR MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00  273.00  91.00	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000	20135741 20136026 20127750 20248258
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS  SUBTOTA PROCESS  03/01/10 RESEA  03/02/10 RESEA  03/02/10 DISCU  03/03/10 TELEP	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC. AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION SBALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne RCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P Benfield, Brianna ISS N. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY WITH E. H Wine, Jennifer CHONE CONFERENCE WITH QUINN EMANU	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20 REN.  1.40 JEL AND EQUITY CON  0.30	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AR MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00  273.00  91.00  770.00  MMITTEE.	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000 18000	20135741 20136026 20127750 20248258
CONFE 03/26/10 REVIE CALLS  SUBTOTA PROCESS  03/01/10 RESEA  03/02/10 RESEA  03/02/10 DISCU  03/03/10 TELEP	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCI AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION SBALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne RCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P Benfield, Brianna RSS N. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY WITH E. H Wine, Jennifer CHONE CONFERENCE WITH QUINN EMANU Benfield, Brianna	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20 REN.  1.40 JEL AND EQUITY CON  0.30	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AR MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00  273.00  91.00  770.00  MMITTEE.	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000 18000	20135741 20136026
CONFE  03/26/10 REVIE CALLS  SUBTOTA PROCESS  03/01/10 RESEA  03/02/10 RESEA  03/02/10 DISCU  03/03/10 TELEP  03/03/10 REVIE  03/04/10 REVIE	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC. AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION SBALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne ARCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne ARCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P Benfield, Brianna SSN. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY WITH E. H Wine, Jennifer CHONE CONFERENCE WITH QUINN EMANU Benfield, Brianna W N. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY (.2); EMAIL	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20 REN.  1.40 UEL AND EQUITY COMMAND EQUITY	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AND MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00  273.00  91.00  770.00  MMITTEE.  136.50  AME (.1).	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000 18000 18000	20135741 20136026 20127750 20248258 20127804
CONFE  03/26/10 REVIE CALLS  SUBTOTA PROCESS  03/01/10 RESEA  03/02/10 RESEA  03/02/10 DISCU  03/03/10 TELEP  03/03/10 REVIE  03/04/10 REVIE	Sharma, Rahul W AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE DISC. AL TASK CODE 16600 - SOLICITATION SBALLOTS/VOTING:  Castellani, Anne RCH RE: ISSUE PRECLUSION.  Castellani, Anne RCH AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: ISSUE P Benfield, Brianna SSN. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY WITH E. H Wine, Jennifer CHONE CONFERENCE WITH QUINN EMANU Benfield, Brianna W N. YOUKELSONE SURREPLY (.2); EMAIL Petherbridge, Vaughan CW EQUITY COMMITTEE COMPLAINT RE: S	4.10 HEARING NOTICE (.8 LOSURE STATEMENT  17.90  5.80  0.60 RECLUSION.  0.20 REN.  1.40 UEL AND EQUITY COMMAND EQUITY	1,865.50 ); REVISE SAME AND MOTION (2.4).  \$ 8,294.50  2,639.00  273.00  91.00  770.00  MMITTEE.  136.50  AME (.1).	16600 ND EMAILS AN 18000 18000 18000 18000	20135741 20136026 20127750 20248258 20127804

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/04/10	Benfield, Brianna	1.20	546.00	18000	20149180
SURRE	SS N. YOUK ELSONE'S SURREPLY WITH J. PLY AND EMAIL A. STROCHAK RE: ANAL ELSONE COMPLETION OF BRIEFING (.1).	WRIGHT (.1); REVIEW A YSIS (1.0); EMAIL W. K	AND ANALYZE N. Y AUFMAN RE: FILII	Y OU KE LSO NE NG N.	'S
03/07/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.10	45.50	18000	20149219
EMAIL	R. SHARMA UPDATE AND ANALYSIS OF	N. YOUKELSONE ADVI	ERSARY PROCEED	ING.	
03/07/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.80	364.00	18000	20149220
RESEA	RCH STATUS OF AGNES AND BASSMAN (	CASES (.6) AND EMAIL	A. LEVINE UPDATI	E R E: SAME (.:	2).
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	18000	20392023
CALL	WITH T. SAPEIKA, K. DIBLASI, C. SMITH, S ITTEE ADVERSARY PROCEEDING.	S. LANDEFELD AND QU	JINN EMANUEL TE	AM RE: EQUI	ΓY
03/15/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.50	342.50	18000	20200848
PARTIC TEAM	CIPATE IN CALL WITH B. ROSEN, K. DIBA RE: EQUITY COMMITTEE ADVERSARY P	.SI, C. SMITH, S. LANDE ROCEEDING.	FELD AND QUINN	EMANUEL	
03/15/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.50	315.00	18000	20157304
CALL	WITH B. ROSEN, T. SAPEIKA, CLIENT AND	CO-COUNSEL RE: EQU	JITY COMMITTEE	COMPLAINT.	
03/17/10	Chettri, Anupama	0.10	20.00	18000	20237645
MONIT	OR DOCKET FOR N. YOUKELSONE.				
03/21/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.20	126.00	18000	20279266
CONFI	ER WITH R. SHARMA RE: UNION BANK CO	OMPLAINT.			
03/21/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.80	364.00	18000	20193473
CALL	WITH K. DIBLASIRE: UNION BANK COMI ARIZE (.6).	PLAINT (.2); REVIEW UI	NION BANK COMP	LAINT AND	
	AL TASK CODE 18000 - GENERAL PTCY LITIGATION ISSUES:	13.40	\$ 6,782.50		
03/01/10	Braun, Lynda	2.00	1,400.00	19000	20125192
	W REPLIES TO OBJECTIONS (.5); REVIEW		.5).		
03/02/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.20	91.00	19000	20149210
	LS WITH W. BURDETTE AND M. CAPALDO				7.
WMI.					
03/04/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.20	91.00	19000	20149176
EMAII	LS W. BURDETTE AND Y. HIRATA RE: CAS	SE AGAINST WMI.			
03/05/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	19000	20336494
CONF	ERENCE CALL WITH A. STROCHAK, P. CALICAN NATIONAL LITIGATION STRATEGY	LAMARI, D. ELSBERG, 7.	B. FINESTONE AN	D C. SMITH R	E:
03/05/10	Braun, Lynda	0.30	210.00	19000	20154761

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
READ I	ETTER FROM PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL TO	JUDGE SPATT.			
03/05/10	Strochak, Adam	0.60	507.00	19000	20149796
CONFE	RENCE CALL WITH B. ROSEN, P. CALAMA	ARI, D. ELSBERG AND B	3. FINE STONE (QUI	NN EMANUE	L),
C. SMIT	H (WMI) RE: AMERICAN NATIONAL LITI	GATION STRATEGY.			
03/05/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	1.80	1,251.00	19000	20153086
REVIEV	V RECENT FILINGS IN JUDGE PECHMAN	WMI ERISA MDL.			
03/05/10	Wine, Jennifer	0.20	110.00	19000	20248016
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. ABENSOHN		ONAL HEARING.		
				10000	20240262
03/08/10	Wine, Jennifer	0.10	55.00	19000	20248363
CALL V	WITH A. ABENSOHN RE: AMERICAN NAT	ONAL HEARING.			
03/12/10	Chandis, Vanessa	0.60	330.00	19000	20283742
CONFE	R WITH R. SHERMAN RE: VICARIOUS LIA	ABILITY.			
03/12/10	Sherman, Rachel	4.30	1,956.50	19000	20154435
	R CH RE: VICARIOUS LIABILITY (3.7); CO	NFER WITH V. CHANDIS	S RE: SAME (.6).		
				19000	20288072
03/13/10	Coleman, Erica BACKGROUND MATERIALS RE: LITIGAT	3.50	1,592.50 OF COLUMBIA AND		
PROCE	EDINGS IN THE BANKRUPTCY COURT (3	(.1); DISCUSS SAME WIT	TH B. FINESTONE (	.4).	
03/15/10	Yates, Erin	0.60	273.00	19000	20289181
CALLY	WITH B RENFIELD RE: MULTIDISTRICT I	LITIGATION (.2); CALL	WITH R. PFISTER A	AND A.	
BRETT DEFEN	LER RE: ERISA AND THE MULTI-DISTRIC IDANTS IN THE BOILERMAKERS LITIGAT SI RE: SAME (.1).	CT LITIGATION (.2): DRA	AFT E-MAIL TO A.	JETER RE:	
03/15/10	Wine, Jennifer	0.10	55.00	19000	20249798
	. CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. COLEMAN	RE: SUMMARY OF DC	ACTION.		
02/15/10	D. C. I. Dulama	0.20	91.00	19000	20211966
03/15/10 CORRI	Benfield, Brianna ESPONDENCE WITH E. YATES RE: MULTI			1,000	
COKKI	501 011551105 11111 51 11115 115. 110 511				
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	2.00	1,950.00	19000	20345900
RE: SA CONFI	ERENCE CALL WITH C. SMITH AND R. PF .ME (.3); CONFER WITH L. SARKO RE: PRO ER WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME (3); REVIEV GILLO RE: SAME (.1).	) POSAL (.3): CONFER W	/ ITH L. SARKO RE:	RESPONSE (	3);
03/16/10	Ng, Alexander	0.30	178.50	19000	20282885
MEET	ING WITH A. CASTELLANI RE: ABILITY T DIARY.	O BIND A PARENT TO	AN AGREEMENT S	IGNED BY	
03/16/10	Castellani, Anne	0.30	136.50	19000	20176947
MEET	Castellani, Anne WITH A. NG TO DISCUSS RESEARCH REED BY A SUBSIDIARY.				20176947

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	DOCUMENTS SERVED ON WMI AND EM	IAIL COUNSEL RE: SAM	E.		
03/16/10	Hausman, Jeffrie	0.40	104.00	19000	20191038
	AND INDEX PLEADINGS FOR RECORD	FILE DATABASE (.2); PR	EPARE AND CIRC	ULATE	
DOCKET	TUPD ATES (.2).				
03/17/10	Castellani, Anne	0.70	318.50	19000	20180836
RESEAR	CH ABILITY TO BIND A PARENT TO AN	AGREEMENT SIGNED B	Y A SUBSIDIARY.	•	
03/17/10	Hausman, Jeffrie	0.40	104.00	19000	20191598
	AND INDEX PLEADINGS FOR RECORD	FILE DATABASE (.2); PR	EPARE AND CIRC	ULATE	
DOCKE	T UPD ATES (.2).				
03/18/10	Castellani, Anne	11.20	5,096.00	19000	20180943
RESEAR	CH CONTRACT ISSUES (10.0); DRAFT SU	MMARIES AND EMAIL	TO A. NG (1.2).		
03/18/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.60	273.00	19000	20223335
RESPON	ID TO QUESTION FROM C. SMITH RE: SU	BPOENA SERVED ON W	MI (.2); REVIEW D	OCKET IN	
ONTAR	IO TEACHER'S CASE AND EMAIL A. LEVI	NE UPDATE RE: SAME (	(,4).		
03/19/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	19000	20227678
CONFE LITIGA	R WITH R.PFISTER, R.SCHACHTER AND TION.	M. SPITTELL RE: UPDA	TE RE: ERISA STO	CK DROP	
03/19/10	Yates, Er in	0.20	91.00	19000	20283133
CALL V	VITH B. BENFIELD RE: ERISA LAWSUIT.				
03/19/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.20	91.00	19000	20224841
	ND TO QUESTION RE: IN RE: ERISA LAW	SUIT FROM E. YATES.			
00/10/10	Volume Galarina	0.40	72.00	19000	20173755
03/19/10 PEVIE	Ialuna, Sabrina W PLEADINGS RE: ACTIONS IN THE WES				20110100
NLS V ILS	WIDENDINGS ID, HOTTONS IN THE WAR				~~~~~
03/21/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	0.50	347.50	19000	20175164
CORRE	SPONDENCE RELATED TO BUSHANSKY	SUBPOENA ON GIBSON	N DUNN.		
03/21/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.20	91.00	19000	20223373
EMAIL	S WITH WEIL TEAM RE: ERISA SUBPOEN	IA SERVED ON GIBSON	DUNN.		
03/22/10	Rosen, Brian	. 0.30	292.50	19000	20360960
МЕМО	RANDUM TO L. SARKO RE: ERISA LITIG. AING (.1).	ATION/TOWER POLICY	(.2); MEMORANDI	JM TO L. SARI	ΚO
03/22/10	Shiffman, Jonathan	2.40	1,668.00	19000	20206627
CORRE	ESPONDENCE AND PHONE CALLS RELAT W AND ANALYZE BUSHANSKY SUBPOE	ED TO BUSHANSKY SU NA SERVED ON GIBSON	BPOENA ON GIBS DUNN (1.2).	ON DUNN (1.2	);
03/22/10	Turner, K im	1.30	591.50	19000	20511914
	W AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE RE: S		SUBPOENA (1.0).		
03/22/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.80	364.00	19000	20223776

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
EMAILS MAIL SE	WITH WEIL TEAM RE: SUBPOENA SERV RVED ON WMI RE: LINDSAY CASE (.3); F	ED ON GIBSON DUNN MAILS RE: PSI HEA RII	(.4); REVIEW AND NG (.1).	RESPOND TO	
03/23/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	19000	20362059
CONFE	RENCE CALL WITH E. YATES, R. BERENS	TEIN, D. STEIN, C. SMI	TH RE: ERISA INSU	RANCE.	
02/02/10	Danfield Deigner	0.20	91.00	19000	20225438
03/23/10	Benfield, Brianna . ABERNATHY RE: J. LIND SAY V. W MI (.1				
CALLA	ABERNATHI RE. V. ENDERT V. W.M. (	,, <i></i>			
03/24/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	19000	20362063
MEMOR	RANDUM TO C. SMITH, ET. AL. RE: ERISA	LITIGATION.			
03/25/10	Rosen, Brian	0.80	780.00	19000	20362070
	RENCE CALL WITH C. SMITH, BERENSTE ERENSTEIN RE: SAME (.2).	IN, CARRIERS RE: ERIS	SA (.6); TELEPHON	E CONFERENC	E
03/25/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	19000	20228699
REVIEV	V ERISA STOCK DROPLITIGATION.				
02/06/10	Pages Brian	0.40	390.00	19000	20344945
03/26/10 CONFE	Rosen, Brian RENCE CALL WITH C. SMIITH AND R. BE	****	<i></i>	.,	
CONTE	REMODE CARDE WITH C. SEALER AND ALL 2011				
03/26/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.90	409.50	19000	20232169
REVIEV V. WMI	W AND RESPOND TO DOCUMENTS SERVI (.7).	ED ON WMI (.2); REVIE	W DOCUMENTS FI	LED RE: GIVE	NS
03/29/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	19000	20295373
MEMOI SAME (	RANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: ERISA LITIGA .1); MEMORANDUM TO L. SARKO RE: SA	TION (.1); TELEPHONE ME (.3); MEMOR ANDU	CONFERENCE WI'M TO C. SMITH RE	TH L. SARKO I : SUBPOENA (	RE: .1).
03/29/10	Wine, Jennifer	0.20	110.00	19000	20276156
	W EMAIL FROM MEDIATOR AND EMAIL 1 RE: SAME (.2).	B. FINESTONE, A. ABE	NSOHN, D. ELSBER	lG AND C.	
03/29/10	Mills, Marvin	0.10	39.50	19000	20246095
	WITH S. DIXON (MILLER CHEVALIER) RE (WMI) RE: SAME.	: APPELLATE BRIEF A	ND CORRESPONDE	NCE WITH C.	
03/29/10	Turner, Kim	0.10	45.50	19000	20295480
REVIE	W DOCKETS.				
03/29/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.10	45.50	19000	20231613
	WITH A. STOUT RE: B. TAYLOR CASE.				
0,100					00007401
03/29/10	Ialuna, Sabrina	0.50	90.00	19000	20295481
PREPA DISTR	RE E-MAIL TO V. JOHNSON ATTACHING ICT OF WASHINGTON STATE.	DOCKET UPDATES OF	N ACTIONS IN THE	WESTERN	
03/30/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.10	45.50	19000	20230560
EMAIL	, Y , HIRATA AND C. PAGLIOCCHINI RE : R	ESPONDING TO SUBP	OENA SERVED ON	WMI.	
03/30/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.80	364.00	19000	20232174

CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. STROCHAK RE: STATUS REPORT DUE IN 9TH CIRCUIT LATE FEE APPEAL
( 1) DRAFT STATUS REPORTS FOR TWO CASES AGAINST WMI AND EMAIL K. DIBLASI AND A.
STROCHAK RE: SAME (.6); REVIEW EMAILS RE: CASES AGAINST WMI AND UPDATE CASE TRACKING
SPREAD SHEET RE: SAME (.1).

STROCE SPREAD	HAK RE: SAME (.6); REVIEW EMAILS RE SSHEET RE: SAME (.1).	: CASES AGAINST WMI AN	D UPDATE CASE	TRACKING	
03/30/10	Hausman, Jeffrie	0.30	78.00	19000	20223744
REVIEW	DOCKET FOR NEW ENTRIES (.2); UPD	ATE INDEX (.1).			
03/31/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	19000	20216715
REVIEW	V DRAFT STATUS REPORT LETTER.				
03/31/10	Mills, Marvin	0.20	79.00	19000	20246237
	ND CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. DIXON NKRUPTCY APPELLATE BRIEF.	(MILLER) RE: CORPORATI	E DISCLOSURE RI	ELATING TO	
03/31/10	Sherman, Rachel	4.20	1,911.00	19000	20235307
RESEAF	RCH RE: SECURITIES FRAUD ELEMENTS	S (3.4); DRAFT SUMMARY C	OF RESEARCH (.8)	١.	
03/31/10	Benfield, Brianna	0.80	364.00	19000	20232178
REVIEV	W AND FINALIZE LATE FEE STATUS RE	PORTS (.6); DRAFT, REVIEV	V AND EXECUTE	LETTER RE:	

REVIEW AND FINALIZE LATE FEE STATUS REPORTS (.6); DRAFT, REVIEW AND EXECUTE LETTER RE:
SUBPOENA SER VED ON WMI (.1) AND EMAIL Y. HIRATA RE: SAME (.1).

SUBTOTAL BANKRUP	TASK CODE 19000 - GENERAL NON- CCY LITIGATION ISSUES:	50.00	\$ 27,443.00		
03/01/10	Berz, David	0.20	180.00	19100	20267043
	D WITH COMMENTS TO E. YATES RE: BUUS SE				
KEOT OIL					
03/01/10	Margolis, Steven	0.30	216.00	19100	20227785
CONFER	WITH A. REA, R. NIEWOEHNER AND E. KOVAC	CS RE: BUUS LI	TIGATION SETTLEMEN	IT.	
03/01/10	Yates, Erin	0.50	227.50	19100	20125268
E-MAIL SMITH A AGREEN	E-MAIL FROM J. LERMOND AND CALL WITH J FROM J. LERMOND RE: AIG'S CONSENT TO THE AND B. ROSEN RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW LETTER MENT AND E-MAIL WITH D. BERZ RE: SAME (.2 TAIN AND D. SPRAGG RE: INSURANCE ITEMS	E BUUS SETTLE FROM CHUBB I ); REVIEW AND	EMENT AND DRAFT E-N RE: BUUS SETTLEMEN	MAIL TO C. T	,
03/01/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.30	154.50	19100	20227296
	ONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MARGOLIS, A. REA MENT AMOUNT.	A AND R. NIEW	DEHNER RE: ALLOCAT	ION OF	
03/02/10	Berz, David	0.40	360.00	19100	20250895
ON ORD	NICATE WITH E. ELSBREE RE: WAMU BUUS L DER OF PAYMENTS UNDER POLICIES (.3); REVI DOMMENTS TO E. ELSBREE (.1).	ITIGATION ISS EW CORRESPO	UES AND OUTSTANDIN NDENCE RE: SAME AN	NG POSITIO D RESPOND	N
03/02/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	19100	20336583
MEMOR	ANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: SIDLEY FEES.				
03/02/10	Margolis, Steven	0.90	648.00	19100	20229641
CONFE	R WITH E. KOVACS AND A. REA RE: BUUS SETT	CLEMENT ISSU	ES (.6); DRAFT CORRES	PONDENCE	

CONFER WITH E. KOVACS AND A. REA RE: BUUS SETTLEMENT ISSUES (.6); DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO WGM TEAM RE: SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.1); CONFER WITH M. SPITTELL RE: SAME (.2).

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/02/10	Yates, Erin	0.20	91.00	19100	20270377
CALL W SAME (.	VITH A. REA RE: BUUS DEFENSE COSTS (.1) 1).	; DRAFT E-MAIL TO	S. MARGOLIS AND	B. ROSEN RE	:
03/02/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	19100	20200889
CORRE: RELATE	SPONDENCE WITH S. MARGOLIS AND E. Y ED ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH M. MILLS RE	ATES RE: ALLOCATION (C.2).	ON AND OTHER SE	TTLEMENT	
03/02/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.60	309.00	19100	20225839
	HONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MARGOLIS, A STEPS TO IMPLEMENT THE SETTLEMENT.		RE: ALLOCATION C	F SETTLEME	NT
03/02/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	19100	20246279
CONFE	R W. T. SAPEIKA RE: BUUS SETTLEMENT N	OTIONS (.2); REVIEV	W RELATED DOCU	MENTS (.3).	
03/03/10	Berz, David	0.40	360.00	19100	20250840
REVIEV YATES	V COMMUNICATIONS FROM C. WELLS RE: RE: BUUS SETTLEMENT (.1).	SIDLEY AUSTIN ISSU	UES (.3); DISCUSSIO	ONS WITH E.	
03/03/10	Yates, Erin	0.70	318.50	19100	20125836
DRAFT C. WEL RE: MO FOR J. (	W E-MAIL AND LETTER FROM SEDGWICK, E-MAIL TO D. BERZ RE: SAME (.1); CALL W.LS RE: BUUS AND SIDLEY'S OUTSTANDING TION TO ADVANCE DEFENSE COSTS UND GUNCHICK AT CHUBB RE: BUUS SETTLEMEMENT (.1).	VITH D. BERZ RE: BU' G FEES AND EXPENS ER THE BLENDED PO	US SETTLEMENT ( ES (2); E-MAIL WIT DLICIES (.1); LEAVE	.1); CALL WIT TH T. SAPEIKA E MESSAGES	H A
03/03/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.20	137.00	19100	20513228
CONFE	R WITH M. MILLS RE: BUUS SETTLEMENT	•			
03/03/10	Mills, Marvin	0.80	316.00	19100	20246987
REVIEV CONFE	W DOCUMENTS RELATED TO BUUS LITIGA R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: SAME (.2).	ATION RE: MOTION T	O APPROVE SETTL	EMENT (.6);	
03/04/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	19100	20273514
	MESSAGE WITH J. GUNCHICK RE: CHUBB EMENT.	'S POSITION WITH RI	ESPECT TO THE BU	JUS	
03/05/10	Berz, David	0.60	540.00	19100	20250670
	SSIONS WITH S. MARGOLIS AND M. KAM R EGY TO SAME (.3).	RE: BUUS SETTLEMEN	NT ISSUES (.3); AN	ALYZE	
03/05/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	19100	20336570
мемо	RANDUM TO D.BERZ RE: BUUS SETTLEM	ENT.			
03/05/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	19100	20230843
	ER WITH D.BERZ RE: BUUS LITIGATION (3 EMENT AGREEMENT STATUS ISSUES (.3).	3); CONFER WITH R. S	SCHACHTER RE: BU	JUS	
03/05/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	19100	20274699
REVIE	W LETTER FROM AND LEAVE MESSAGE F	OR J. GUNCHICK AT	CHUBB RE: BUUS S	SETTLEMENT	
03/08/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	19100	20336625

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
MEMOR	ANDUM TO L. SARKO RE: STATUS OF B	UUS SETTLEMENT.			
03/08/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	19100	20231649
CONFE	R WITH A. REA RE: BUUS SETTLEMENT	AND PROPOSED TIMELI	NE.		
03/08/10	Yates, Erin	0.30	136.50	19100	20434798
	VITH E. KOVACS RE: BUUS SETTLEMENT	(.2); EMAIL S. MARGOL	.IS AND E. KOVAC	S RE: BUUS (	.1).
02/00/110	Y Erre	0.60	309.00	19100	20226685
REVIEW	Kovacs, Eva -MAIL TO SIDLEY RE: ACTION PLAN RE V E-MAIL FROM A. REA RE: SAME (.1); TI MAIL TO S. MARGOLIS RE: FOLLOW-UP (	THE IMPLEMENTATION	N OF THE SETTLE	MENT (.1);	
03/09/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.30	154.50	19100	20227187
REVIEV	V ACTION PLAN SENT BY A. RAE.				
03/10/10	Margolis, Steven	2.10	1,512.00	19100	20234537
CONFE	R WITH A. REA, E. OEHLER, S. BARTLING AND PREPARE FOR SAME (1.5); DRAFT R WITH E. KOVACS RE: SAME (.3).	G, M. SPITTELL AND E. I SUMMARY MEMORAND	KOVACS RE: BUUS DUM TO B. ROSEN	S SETTLEMEN (.3) AND	VT.
03/10/10	Yates, Erin	0.40	182.00	19100	20283123
RE: SAI	W BUUS INVOICES FORWARDED BY R. J. ME (.2); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM E. ELSBR ME (.2).	AIN AND DRAFT E-MAII EE, RESPOND TO SAME	L TO E. ELSBREE A AND DRAFT E-MA	AT SEDGWICK AIL TO R. JAIN	C.
03/10/10	Kovacs, Eva	2.10	1,081.50	19100	20225271
PERRII	D CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. REA E. C N, M. SPITTELL AND S. MARGOLIS RE: II E SETTLEMENT FUND AND OTHER RELA ARY OF THE DISCUSSION (.3); CONFER V	ENTIFICATION OF THE ATED ISSUES (1.5); DRAF	CLASS MEMBERS TE-MAIL TO B. R	S, ALLOCATIC	)N
03/10/10	Mills, Marvin	1.40	553.00	19100	20247815
	RE MOT ION TO APPROVE BUUS SETTLE NGS RE: SAME (.1).	MENT (1.3); CORRESPO	NDENCE WITH T.	SAPEIKA ANI	) S.
03/11/10	Yates, Erin	0.30	136.50	19100	20147979
CONFE SAME	ER WITH A. REA AT SIDLEY AUSTIN RE: (.1).	BUUS SETTLEMENT (.2)	); DRAFT E-MAIL T	TO D. BERZ R	E:
03/11/10	Mills, Marvin	0.80	316.00	19100	20246574
PREPA	RE MOTIONS TO APPROVE BUUS SETTI	LEMENT.			
03/15/10	Margolis, Steven	1.20	864.00	19100	20224284
CORRI	ESPONDENCE AND CONFERENCES WITH EMENT ISSUES (.6); REVIEW TIMELINE	I E. KOVACS, A. REA AN	ID M. SPITTELL RI TATION FOR SAM	E: BUUS E (.6).	
03/15/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.20	137.00	19100	20200824
REVIE	W EMAIL FROM E. KOVACS RE: BUUS S R. SCHACHTER (.1).	ETTLEMENT (.1); EMAIL	B. ROSEN RE: SA	ME AND EMA	IL
03/15/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.60	309.00	19100	20226362

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS.	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CORRES SETTLE	PONDENCE AND CONFERENCE WITH S.M MENT.	ARGOLIS, A. REA AN	D M. SPITTELL RE	:BUUS	
03/15/10	Mills, Marvin	3.00	1,185.00	19100	20246368
	E MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF BUUS SET	TLEMENT.			
03/16/10	Margolis, Steven	1.60	1,152.00	19100	20228300
REVIEW	VISSUES RE: BUUS AND COORDINATION ( A AND E. KO VACS RE: SAME (.5).		A (1.1); CONFEREN	CES WITH T.	
03/16/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.80	548.00	19100	20200981
CONFER	R WITH M. MILLS RE: BUUS DOCUMENT (.) WITH S. MARGOLIS AND E. KOVACS RE: S.	i); REVIEW COMMEN AME (.5).	TS TO SAME FROM	1 B. ROSEN (.2);	
03/16/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.70	360.50	19100	20225539
	COMMENTS TO BUUS DOCUMENT (.2); TILIS RE: SAME (.5).	ELEPHONE CONFERE	NCE WITH T. SAPI	EIKA AND S.	
03/16/10	Mills, Marvin	1.80	711.00	19100	20247173
	V REVISED BUUS DOCUMENT (.4); PREPAR A RE: SAME (.1).	E PLEADING RE: SAM	ME (1.3); CONFER W	VITH T.	
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	19100	20345909
REVIEW CONFE	7 T. SAPEIKA MEMORANDUM RE: BUUS (. R WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: SAME (.2).	i); MEMORANDUM T	O T. SAPEIKA RE: S	SAME (.1);	
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	19100	20344726
CONFE	R WITH K. SWOPE RE: SIDLEY FEES (.2); Co	ONFER WITH C. SMIT	H RE: SAME (.3).		
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	19100	20345908
MEMOI SAME (	RANDUM TO L. SARKO RE: PENDING ISSU 3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SM	ES (.1); TELEPHONE C MITH RE: SAME (.2).	CONFERENCE WITE	H L. SARKO RE:	
03/17/10	Margolis, Steven	3.20	2,304.00	19100	20228356
PREPAI CORRE COMM	RENCE WITH A. REA, R. NIEW OEHNER, M. RE FOR SAME (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITS SPONDENCE WITH C. SMITH RE: BUUS ISSENTS TO BUUS DOCUMENT (.4); PROVIDE FROM R. SCHACHTER (.7).	TH B. ROSEN AND T. : SUES (.4): CONFER WI	SAPEIKA RE: BUUS TH T. SAPEIKA RE	: B. ROSEN	
03/17/10	Sapeika, Tal	5.30	3,630.50	19100	20200697
REVIE' ROSEN	W AND REVISE BUUS DOCUMENT (4.6); CARE: SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH	ALL WITH S. MARGOI S. MARGOLIS AND B.	LIS RE: SAME (4); C ROSEN RE: SAME	CONFER WITH I (.2).	3.
03/17/10	Kovacs, Eva	1.10	566.50	19100	20226762
ATTEN DOCUM	D TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MA MENTATION AND STRATEGIC ISSUES (.6); ATION (.5).	RGOLIS, A. REA, R. N DISCUSSION WITH K	IEWOEHNER, M. S ELLER RORHBACI	PITTELL RE: C RE: THE	
03/17/10	Mills, Marvin	2.10	829.50	19100	20247107
PREPA	RE PRELIMINARY BUUS DOCUMENT.				
03/18/10	Kam, Michael	0.60	540.00	19100	20205511

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CONFER	ENCE WITH B. ROSEN, C. SMITH AND S. M	AARGOLIS RE: BUUS	AND SIDLEY FEE IS	SUES.	
03/18/10	Rosen, Brian	0.60	585.00	19100	20392970
CONFER	RENCE WITH M. KAM, C. SMITH AND S. MA	ARGOLIS RE: BUUS A	ND SIDLEY FEE ISS	UES.	
03/18/10	Margolis, Steven	4.40	3,168.00	19100	20228941
CONFER WITH A SWOPE SPITTEI T. SAPE	RENCE WITH B. ROSEN, C. SMITH AND M. REARE: SIDLEY FEE ISSUES (.5); CONFEI (KELLER ROHRBACK) RE: BUUS (.2): CON LL, T. SAPEIKA AND E. KOVACS RE: BUUS IKA AND E. KOVACS RE: PROPOSALS OF A ROHRBACK (.5); RESEARCH RE: LEGAL I HTER COMMENTS RE: BUUS DOCUMENT (	R WITH N. PAPPAS RE FER WITH K. SWOPE, UPDATE (.8); CONFE ALLOCATION AND SU SSUES RELATED TO I	E SAME (.4); CONFE A. REA, R. NIEWOE R WITH A. REA, R. N IMMARY OF DISCUS BUUS ACTION AND	R WITH K. HNER, M. IEWOEHNER, SSIONS WITH REVIEW R.	
03/18/10	Sapeika, Tal	2.60	1,781.00	19100	20200855
M. SPIT	EPATE IN CALL RE: BUUS MATTER WITH TELL (.8); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH A. REA W UP WITH B. ROSEN RE: SAME (.4); CALL IENT AND FORWARD SAME TO A. REA AN	, R. NIEWOEHNER AN WITH S. MARGOLIS	ID S. MARGOLIS RE RE: SAME (.4); REVI	: SAME (.5);	
03/18/10	Mills, Marvin	4.20	1,659.00	19100	20246488
PREPAR	RE DOCUMENTS WITH RESPECT TO BUUS				
03/19/10	Rosen, Brian	0.70	682.50	19100	20344937
CONFE	R WITH R. PFISTER RE: ERISA DISCUSSION L. SCHACTER RE: UPDATE (.2); CONFER W	N (.2); CONFER WITH ITH T. SAPEIKA RE: B	L. SARKO RE: SAME UUS (.1).	(.2); CONFER	
03/19/10	Margolis, Steven	2.40	1,728.00	19100	20227677
REVIEV SAME (	W COMMENTS FROM A. REA RE: BUUS DO .2); DISCUSSION WITH R. SCHACHTER RE:	CUMENT (1.3); DISCU SAME (.2); RESEARC	SSIONS WITH T. SA H RE: SAME (.7).	PEIKA RE:	
03/19/10	Sapeika, Tal	3.00	2,055.00	19100	20201570
REVISE	W COMMENTS TO BUUS DOCUMENT FROM SAME (2.1); CALL WITH A. REA RE: SAME R WITH B. ROSEN RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL TO	E (.3); CONFER WITH S	S, MARGOLIS RE: SA	IEW AND ME (.2);	
03/19/10	Mills, Marvin	0.30	118.50	19100	20246622
PREPA	RE MEMORANDUM RE: BUUS.				
03/20/10	Berz, David	1.60	1,440.00	19100	20250843
COMM OF SAI COMM	UNICATE WITH C. SMITH RE: SCHEDULIN ME (.9); REVIEW ARTICLE FROM K. DIBLA ENTS TO B. ROSEN (.3); REVIEW COMMUN CES (.4).	SIRE: WASHINGTON	MUTUAL AND RESI	POND WITH	
03/20/10	Mills, Marvin	3.70	1,461.50	19100	20246454
PREPA	RE MEMORANDUM IN CONNECTION WIT	H BUUS LITIGATION.			
03/21/10	Mills, Marvin	4.30	1,698.50	19100	20246534
	RE MEMORANDUM WITH RESPECT TO BU	JUS LITIGATION.			
03/22/10	Mills, Marvin	4.40	1,738.00	19100	20247883
	RE MEMORANDUM RE: BUUS LITIGATIO		.,		

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/23/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.30	154.50	19100	20232725
REVIEW	V CHAIN OF E-MAILS SENT BY A. REA FROI	M SIDLEY RE: JOINT	STATUS REPORT.		
03/24/10	Margolis, Steven	1.30	936.00	19100	20229358
E. KOVA	RENCE WITH A. REA, R. NIEWOEHNER, S. B ACS RE: BUUS ISSUES , CLASS MEMBER IDE .E FOR SAME (.2).	ARTLING, E. OEHLE ENTIFICATION AND C	R, M. SPITTELL, T. S SENERAL STATUS	SAPEIKA AND UPDATE (1.1);	
03/24/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.10	753.50	19100	20254394
PARTIC ALLOCA	IPATE IN CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS, A. REA ATION AND OTHER ISSUES RE: BUUS.	A, TOWERS WATSON	AND EHRO RE: PL	AN	
03/24/10	Kovacs, Eva	1.60	824.00	19100	20232726
UPDAT!	D TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MAR E ON THE STATUS OF MEMBER IDENTIFIC SPONDENCE RE: SAME (.3).	GOLIS, A.REA, R.NII ATION, METHOD OF	EWOEHNER AND M ALLOCATION (1.3)	I. SPITTELL RE; ; REVIEW	:
03/25/10	Rosen, Brian	1.00	975.00	19100	20362068
REVIEV MEM OF	V COMMENTS TO BUUS DOCUMENT (.5); C RANDUM TO L. SARKO RE: STATUS (.2).	ONFER WITH T. SAPI	EIKA RE: SAME (.3)		
03/25/10	Margolis, Steven	3.10	2,232.00	19100	20228700
SINGLE	RENCES WITH A. REARE: KELLER ROHRB. E PER CAPITA ALLOCATION METHOD (.4); I INFERENCE WITH K. SWOPE, D. LOESER, G. ME (1.0); REVISE DOCUMENT RE: SAME (.4)	PREPARE FOR DISCU GOTTO, A. REA, R. N	SSION WITH KELLI NEWOEHNER AND	ER ROHRBACK M. SPITTELL	
03/25/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	19100	20435503
CONFE	R WITH B. ROSEN RE: BUUS.				
03/25/10	Kovacs, Eva	3.80	1,957.00	19100	20235786
RE: SA	W AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT OF ME (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. SAPEI ARIES TO M. MILLS RE: BUUS LITIGATION	KA RE: SAME (.3); SE	2.7); CONFER WITH ND E-MAIL AND C	S. MARGOLIS ASE	
03/25/10	Mills, Marvin	4.60	1,817.00	19100	20246439
PREPA	RE MEMORANDUM RE: BUUS LITIGATION	•			
03/26/10	Margolis, Steven	1.60	1,152.00	19100	20228703
REVIEV CORRE	W MARK-UP OF BUUS DOCUMENT FROM K SPONDENCE WITH A. REA RE: ISSUES REL	ELLER ROHRBACK A ATED TO SAME (.4).	AND SUMMARY OF	SAME (1.2);	
03/26/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.70	360.50	19100	20235717
REVIE REPOR	W E-MAIL FROM K. HOLTHAUSE (FROM SII T AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE BETV	DLEY) RE: BUUS DOO WEEN S. MARGOLIS	CUMENT (.3); REVII AND A. REA (.4).	EW STATUS	
03/29/10	Margolis, Steven	2.30	1,656.00	19100	20224908
RE: SA SWOPI	W ISSUES RE: BUUS SETTLEMENT AGREEN ME (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTATION FROM E MARK-UP (.4); REVIEW AND COMMENT R ME (.2).	A. REA RE: FEE ARR	ANGEMENTS (.4) A	ND REVIEW K.	
03/29/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.80	548.00	19100	20253986

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW COURT	AND REVISE JOINT STATUS REPORT RE	: BUUS SETTLEMENT F	FOR FILING WITH	DISTRICT	
03/29/10	Mills, Marvin	1.20	474.00	19100	20246096
RESEAR	CH RE: CLASS ACTION SETTLEMENTS.				
03/30/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	19100	20295376
MEMOR	ANDUM TO GATTO RE: BUUS HEARING.				
03/30/10	Margolis, Steven	1.30	936.00	19100	20224623
ISSUES	RENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH A (.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. SWOPE INATE RE: SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS	RE: SETTLEMENT AGE	HNER RE: BUUS S REEMENT ISSUES (	ETTLEMENT (.4);	
03/30/10	Mills, Marvin	6.70	2,646.50	19100	20247638
PREPAI SETTLE	RE MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTI EMENT (2.6); RESEARCH RE: ERISA SECTION	ON FOR PRELIMINARY ON 204 (4.1).	APPROVAL OF B	uus	
03/31/10	Berz, David	0.10	90.00	19100	20295527
REVIEV	V JOINT STATUS REPORT FILED IN THE B	UUS MATTER AND EM	AIL A. REA COMM	MENTS.	
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	19100	20295331
	V MEMORANDA RE: BUUS STATUS (.3); M	EMORANDUM TO T. S.	APEIKA RE: SAME	(.1).	
03/31/10	Margolis, Steven	0.30	216.00	19100	20224615
	W JOINT STATUS REPORT FROM A. REA.				
03/31/10	Margolis, Steven	3.10	2,232.00	19100	20224380
CONFE NIEWC IDENT (.4); RE	RENCE WITH M. MILLS RE: BUUS SETTLE DEHNER, K. HOLTHAUS, M. SPITTELL AND IFICATION (1.0) AND REVIEW OF KELLER EVIEW KELLER ROHRBACK AGREEMENT AND E. KO VACS RE: SAME (.7).	) E.KOVACS RE: BUUS ROHRBACK MARK-UF	SETTLEMENT, CL OF SETTLEMENT	.ASS MEMBER [ AGREEMEN]	
03/31/10	Kovacs, Eva	3.60	1,854.00	19100	20235095
M. SPI	ID TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. RETTELL RE: UPDATE ON THE IDENTIFICAT HONE CONFERENCE WITH SAME RE: SIDEMENT (.7); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. M. (1.7).	'ION OF THE CLASSME LEY'S COMMENTS TO	MBERS (1.0); ATT THE DRAFT BUUS	END SETTLEMEN	Γ
03/31/10	Mills, Marvin	2.90	1,145.50	19100	20247481
DDEDA	RE MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOT EMENT (1.3); RESEARCH RE: SECTION 204	ION FOR PRELIMINAR 4 OF ERISA (1.2); CONF	Y APPROVAL OF E ER WITH S. MARG	BUUS BOLIS RE: SAM	Œ
SUBTOT.	AL TASK CODE 19100 - BUUS ION:	115.20	\$ 66,451.00		
		0.10	84.50	19210	20149781
03/09/10	Strochak, Adam	0.10		2,210	

2.70

20248375

1,485.00 19210

PHONE CALL TO J. WINE RE: HEARING IN AMERICAN NATIONAL CASE.

03/09/10

Wine, Jennifer

AMOUNT TIME ID TASK TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION HOURS DATE ATTEND HEARING ON MOTIONS TO DISMISS IN AMERICAN NATIONAL (2.0); CALL WITH A. ABENSOHN RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH A. STROCHAK RE: SAME (.1); DRAFT SUMMARY OF HEARING AND EMAIL TO D. ELSBERG, A. ABENSOHN, A. STROCHAK AND B. FINESTONE (.5). 19210 20200997 68.50 Sapeika, Tal 03/17/10 EMAILS WITH B. FINESTONE RE: AMERICAN SAVINGS LITIGATION. SUBTOTAL TASK CODE 19210 - AMERICAN \$ 1,638.00 2.90 SAVINGS LITIGATION: 20336620 19220 0.20 195.00 03/02/10 Rosen, Brian MEMORANDUM TO T. SAPEIKA RE: ANCHOR SAVINGS. SUBTOTAL TASK CODE 19220 - ANCHOR \$ 195.00 0.20 SAVINGS LITIGATION: 3,315.00 21000 20400815 3.40 03/02/10 Rosen, Brian CONFERENCE CALL RE: TAX ISSUES ON SETTLEMENT (.2); CALL WITH B. SCHELER RE: SAME (.3); MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: INDEMNITY ISSUE (2); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: SETTLEMENT PROVISION (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH F. HODARA RE: SAME (.5); MEMORANDUM TO F. HODARA RE: SAME (2); MEMORANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: SAME (4); FOLLOW UP MEETING WITH T. SAPEIKA, ALVAREZ & MARSAL TEAM, QUINN EMANUEL TEAM, F. HODARA AND B. SCHELER RE: SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (1.4). 20201135 137.00 21000 0.20 03/02/10 Sapeika, Tal REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. ROSEN, B. SCHELER RE: JPM SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS AND 3/4/10 HEARING. 20431042 959.00 21000 1.40 03/02/10 Sapeika, Tal MEETING WITH B. ROSEN, ALVAREZ TEAM, F. HODARA, B. SCHELER, QUINN EMANUEL TEAM RE: SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS. 21000 20336556 11.70 11,407.50 03/03/10 Rosen, Brian PARTICIPATE IN CALL RE: PLAN FORMULATION AND SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS WITH T. SAPEIKA, K. DIBLASI, C. SMITH AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL TEAM (.9); CALL WITH K. DIBLASIRE: PLAN STRUCTURE (.3); DEVELOP PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TIMETABLE AND DISTRIBUTE (4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. SCHELER RE: HEARING APPROACH (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. HODARA RE: SAME (.4); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. CLARKE AND S. FRIEDMAN RE: 9.5 (4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WMI AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL RE: SAME (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. FRIEDMAN RE: POSITION (.4); MEETING WITH B. KOSTUROS ET. AL. RE: PLAN/AGREEMENT (1.4); MEMORANDUM TO F. HODARA RE: HEARING POSITION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. FRIEDMAN RE: HEARING (.4); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCE CALL RE: HEARING WITH WMI TEAM (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. SCHELER RE: SAME (.3); REVIEW TERM SHEET AND DISTRIBUTE TO F. HODARA (.3); MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: TERM SHEET (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. CLARKE AND FRIEDMAN RE: ADJOURNMENT (.4); MEMORANDUM TO TEAM RE: SAME (.2); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: INDEMNITY (.3); REVIEW REVISED TERM SHEET (.3); MÉMORANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: SAME (2); TELEPHÓNE CONFERENCE WITH B. KOSTÜRÓS RE: SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. FRIEDMAN RE: SAME (.3); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: SAME (2); MEMORANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: SAME (.2); MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: EVENTS (.3); MEMORANDUM TO B. SCHELER AND F. HODARA RE: SAME (.3); MEMORANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: SAME (.2). 20231352

CONFERENCE WITH E. KOVACS RE: CHANGES AND COMMENTS TO JPMC GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2); REVIEW SAME (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: SAME (.1).

Margolis, Steven

03/03/10

0.70

21000

504.00

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/03/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.90	616.50	21000	20200850
PARTIC DIBLAS	CIPATE IN CALL RE: PLAN FORMULATIOI SI, C.SMITH AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL T	N AND SETTLEMENT DIS EAM.	SCUSSIONS WITH	B. ROSEN, K.	
03/03/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.40	882.00	21000	20118825
MEETI	VITH B. ROSEN RE: PLAN STRUCTURE (.3 NG WITH B. ROSEN, T. SAPEIKA, C. SMIT ET TLEMENT DISCUSSION (.9).	); EMAIL J. GOULDING R H AND ALVAREZ & MAR	RE: SAME (.2); PAR RSAL RE: PLAN FO	TTICIPATE IN DRMULATION	
03/03/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.50	257.50	21000	20226681
	W AND COMMENT ON GLOBAL SETTLEM OLIS RE: SAME (.2).	IENT AGREEMENT (.3); I	NTERNAL DISCUS	SSION WITH S	•
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	0.80	780.00	21000	20336569
REVIS	E SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	6.20	6,045.00	21000	20336563
SUBOR MEMO RE: ST SMITH MEMO	NG AT RICHARDS, LAYTON & FINGER W. DINATED DEBT AND PROFESSIONALS (2 RANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: INDEMNI ATUS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WI'RE: B. SCHELER POSITION (.1); REVIEW RANDUM TO R. SACKS RE: SAME (.1); HERANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: MEETING (	2.5); MEMOR ANDUM TO FICATION ISSUES (.3); M TH B. SCHELER RE: SAM R. SACKS MEMORANDU CARING RE: SUMM ARY J	C. SMITH RE: HEA IEMORANDUM TO IE (.3); MEMORAN M RE: ASSUMPTIO	ARING (.2); DB. SCHELER DUM TO C. ON (.2);	
03/04/10	Mills, Marvin	0.50	197.50	21000	20246491
REVIE	W SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
03/05/10	Rosen, Brian	8.30	8,092.50	21000	20336572
ERISA MEM C REVIE CONFI	W LOAN LIST FOR SETTLEMENT AGREE, CHANGES (.2); REVISE AGREEMENT (.5); DRAND UM TO F. HOD ARA RE: MEETING ( W TAX CHANGES (.3); REVISE AGREEME ER WITH S. GOLDRING RE: EDITS TO DRAMAN RE: GLOBAL SETTLEMENT (.4).	CONFER WITH B. KOST 1); MEMORANDUM TO I NT (4): REVISE AND DIS	UROS RE: JPMC/A M. DELEEUW RE: TRIBUTE AGREE	.GREEMENT (.º MEETING (.2); MENT (1.0);	4);
03/05/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.60	2,574.00	21000	20274052
REVIE ROSEN	W AND COMMENT ON CHANGES TO DRA N RE: SAME (.2); DISCUSS SETTLEMENT A	AFT SETTLEMENT AGRE GREEMENT WITH C. BR	EMENT (1.9); CON OUWER (.5).	NFER WITH B.	
03/05/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.40	346.00	21000	20274696
REVIE	W AND COMMENT ON SETTLEMENT AG	REEMENT PROVISIONS.			
03/05/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	21000	20434791
CONF	ER WITH E. COLEMAN RE: GLOBAL SETT	LEMENT AGREEMENT.			
03/05/10	Coleman, Erica	0.90	409.50	21000	20240803
MEET DIBLA	WITH B. ROSEN TO DISCUSS ISSUES RE: ASI TO DISCUSS SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCU	GLOBAL SETTLEMENT JMENTS RELATED TO SA	AGREEMENT (.4): AME (.3).	MEET WITH I	ζ.
03/06/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	21000	20336499
MEMO	DRANDUM TO T. SAPEIKA RE: MOODY A	NALYTICS.			
03/06/10	Rosen, Brian	0.40	390.00	21000	20336498

MEMOF CALLS					
	RANDUM TO M. DELEEUW RE: MEETING (.2).	(.2); MEMORANDUM TO	) B. KOSTUROS RI	E: MCCREE	
03/06/10	Margolis, Steven	0.80	576.00	21000	20231644
REVIEV	W JPMC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
03/06/10	Enayati, Robert	5.90	2,330.50	21000	20127473
ADDITI	ONAL RESEARCH RE: DIRECTION OF PAY	MENTS (3.0); DRAFT M	EMOR ANDUM RE	:: SAME (2.9).	
03/07/10	Rosen, Brian	6.20	6,045.00	21000	20336506
TAX CA MEETII (.1); ME RE: AG	W JPMC REVISIONS TO SETTLEMENT AGI ALL (2); MEMORANDUM TO S. GOLDRING NG (2); REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMEN MORANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: AGREE REEMENT AMOUNT (.2); CALL WITH S. FI ROS RE: SAME (.2).	FRE: SAME (.1); MEMO NT (1.9); MEMORANDUI MENT AND PROCESS (.	RANDUM TO B. K M TO C. SMITH RE 2); MEMORANDUI	OSTUROS RE: : REVISIONS M TO J. MACIF	EL
03/07/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.50	1,485.00	21000	20208866
REVIE	W AND COMMENT ON JPMC CHANGES TO	SETTLEMENT AGREE	MENT.		
03/07/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.20	1,038.00	21000	20235337
	W JPMC REVISIONS OF SETTLEMENT AGI		,		
03/07/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.10	63.00	21000	20129862
	W EMAILS RE: IPMC DOCUMENT.	<b></b>			
03/07/10	Enayati, Robert	2.80	1,106.00	21000	20127854
REVISI	E MEMORANDUM.				
03/08/10	Rosen, Brian	4.50	4,387.50	21000	20336580
CLAIM SMITH MEMO BILAT	RANDUM TO F. HODARA RE: MEETING/C S CALL/JPMC (2); MEMORANDUM TO C. RE: DISCUSSIONS (.4); MEMORANDUM T RANDA TO V. JOHNSON AND P. GURFEIN ERAL AGREEMENT (2); REVIEW C. WELL ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH	SMITH RE: TERM SHEE OB. SCHELER AND F. I RE: COMMENTS (.2); I S COMMENTS (.4); REV	T FOR G. UZZI (.2) HODARA RE: MEE' MEMORANDUM TO TEW FRIED FRAN	; CALL WITH ( FINGS (.2); D C. SMITH RE K COMMENTS	3:
03/08/10	Goldring, Stuart	4.60	4,554.00	21000	20208712
AGREE CROMV CARRE AND C	RE FOR CALL WITH WMI AND SULLIVAN EMENT (.3); CALL WITH WMI AND CREDI' WELL, JPMC AND CREDITORS' COUNSEL SON AND CREDITORS' TAX ADVISORS RE . SMITH RE: SAME (.4); CALL WITH C. SMI A. MASON OF SULLIVAN & CROMWELL R	ΓORS' ADVISORS RE: SA RE: SAME (1.8); FOLLO' : SAME (.4); DRAFT ANI [TH AND C. BROUWER	AME (.6); CALL WI W-UP CALL WITH D SEND EMAILS T RE: SAME (.5); FU	TH SULLIVAN C. BROUWER, O B. ROSEN (.:	I & , J.
03/08/10	Margolis, Steven	2.60	1,872.00	21000	20231645
(1.0); C	W JPMC GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEM CONFER WITH E. KOVACS RE: SUMMARY CORRESPONDENCE WITH WMI AND ALVA	OF CHANGES AND REV	/IEW MEMORAND	K-UP OF SAM UM RE: SAME	E
03/08/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.80	1,557.00	21000	2027497
	WITH SULLIVAN & CROMWELL, IPMC AN EMENT.	ND COMMITTEE COUNS	SEL RE: SETTLEM	ENT	
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	189.00	21000	2027498:

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CALL R	SHARMA RE: VISA LITIGATION.				
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.10	693.00	21000	20133202
REVIEW	V ISSUES RE: JPMC SET TLEMENT (.3); RE	VIEW DRAFT AGREEM	ENT (.8).		
03/08/10	Kovacs, Eva	5.60	2,884.00	21000	20226686
REVIEV SUMM A	V NEW VERSION OF GLOBAL SETTLEME ARY OF CHANGED TERMS (3.5); INTERNA	NT AGREEMENT (1.1); F AL DISCUSSION WITH S.	REPARE BULLET MARGOLIS RE: S.	POINT AME (1.0).	
03/08/10	Coleman, Erica	1.10	500.50	21000	20237954
REVIEV AGREE	W BACKGROUND INFORMATION TO PRE MENT WITH JPMORGAN (1.0); DISCUSS S	PARE DOCUMENT IN CO SAME WITH B. FINESTO	ONNECTION WITH NE (QUINN EM AN	I SETTLEMENT UEL) (.1).	
03/08/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.30	1,046.50	21000	20150396
	RCH RE: VISA INTERCHANGE ISSUES (1.1 NTERCHANGE ISSUES (.9).	1); CALL WITH K. DIBLA	ASI RE: SAME (.3);	RESEARCH RE:	
03/09/10	Rosen, Brian	9.00	8,775.00	21000	20336629
ATTEN POSITI SENIOI	RANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: SAME (.1); DEES (.2); MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDM ON (.2); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTURO R NOTES MEETING (.2); CALL WITH S. TU RANDUM RE: NEGOTIATIONS (.2); REVIS	IAN RE: SAME (.1); CALI  S RE: SAME (.1); MEMO  RSCHWELL RE: SAME (.	L WITH B. KOSTUI RANDUM TO B. KO I); REVIEW B. KO	OS RE: JPMC OSTUROS RE:	
03/09/10	Goldring, Stuart	4.00	3,960.00	21000	20209126
SAME A KADEN DRAFT CALL V AUDIT EMAIL	EXCHANGES WITH C. BROUWER AND J. AND W. HORTON RE: SAME (.5); DISCUSS AND W. HORTON (.6), AND FOLLOW-UF AND SEND EMAIL TO SULLIVAN & CROWITH W. HORTON, JPM, SULLIVAN & CROSTATUS (1.0); CALL WITH A. MASON RED. TO ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND OTHERS UTATIONS IN SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT	S JPM SETTLEMENT AG PEMAIL TO SULLIVAN & PMW ELL RE: SETTLEME OMWELL, ALVAREZ & 1 : SETTLEMENT AGREE RE: SAME (.3); CALL WI	REEMENT WITH K & CROMWELL RE: NT RELATED DOO MARSAL AND WG! MENT (.3), AND DR	KEYES, A. SAME (.2); CUMENTS (.4); M TAX RE: AAFT AND SEND	) F
03/09/10	DuPuy, Carolyn	0.40	338.00	21000	20227817
CONFE	ERENCE WITH W. HORTON RE: SALE OF	TAX REFUND.			•
03/09/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.30	1,124.50	21000	20236104
CONF	RENCES WITH S. GOLDRING, C. BROUW BRENCE CALL WITH FRIED FRANK AND EMENT (.2).	ER AND J. CARREON RE S. GOLDRING RE: SAME	: JPM NEGOTIATI (.6); REVIEW SET	ONS (.5); TLEMENT	
03/09/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.40	1,211.00	21000	20277102
CONFE AND V (.4).	ERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, JPMC VGM TAX TEAM RE: AUDIT SALES (1.0); (	TAX, SULLIVAN & CRO CONFERENCE WITH C. I	OMWELL, ALVARE DUPUY RE: SALE (	ZZ & MARSAL OF TAX REFUNI	)
03/10/10	Rosen, Brian	11.60	11,310.00	21000	20336634
MEETI	ING AT SULLIVAN & CROMWELL RE: SE EMENT (2.8); REVIEW FDIC TERM SHEET JROS RE: SAME (.3); MEMORANDUM TO	' (.4); CALL WITH C. SMI	TH RE: SAME (.3);	CALL WITH B.	
03/10/10	Goldring, Stuart	5.70	5,643.00	21000	2020917

CALLS WITH H. JACOBSON RE: JPM NEGOTIATIONS (1.4); FURTHER NEGOTIATIONS WITH SULLIVAN & CROMWELL (.4); UPDATE CALL WITH C. BROUWER, J. CARREON AND H. JACOBSON RE: SAME (.4); REVIEW AND DISCUSS FURTHER CHANGES TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH WMI TAX (FOR PART) AND CREDITORS' TAX ADVISORS (FOR PART) (1.8) AND MARK-UP CHANGES (.7); FURTHER SULLIVAN & CROMWELL DISCUSSIONS (.5); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO B. ROSEN RE: STATUS (.2); CALL WITH C. BROUWER RE: TAX AUDITS (.3).

03/10/10 Horton, Jr., William

8.10

7,006.50

21000

20234921

MEETING AT SULLIVAN & CROMWELL RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (7.3); REVIEW REVISED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.8).

03/10/10 DiBlasi, Kelly

7.50

4,725.00

21000

20142907

PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEBTORS, JPMC, AND CREDITORS' PROFESSIONALS RE: SETTLEMENT (.5); PARTICIPATE IN SAME (7.0).

03/11/10 Rosen, Brian

16.00

15,600.00

21000

20336637

MEETING WITH B. KOSTUROS AND C. SMITH RE: PREPARATION FOR FDIC MEETING (4.5); REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (3.8); MEMORANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: RIGHTS OFFERING (.1); REVIEW S. FRIEDMAN ALTERNATIVE TERM SHEET (.2); REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.1); MEETING WITH FDIC AND JPMC (2.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WMI TEAM, ALVAREZ & MARSAL, B. SCHELER RE: STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS (.6); MEETING WITH ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND C. SMITH RE: UPDATE (1.7); MEMORANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: UPDATE (.1); MEMORANDUM TO G. UZZI RE: UPDATE (.3); REVIEW TAX SECTION CHANGES (.4); MEMORANDUM TO S. GOLDRING RE: SAME (.2); MEMORANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: PROPOSAL (.2).

03/11/10 Horton, Jr., William

2.80

2,422.00

21000 20235340

CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING (.8); REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (2.0).

03/12/10 Rosen, Brian

10.30

10,042.50

21000

20336706

MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: TOWER POLICY (.2); MEMORANDUM TO MCCREE RE: OPEN ITEMS (.1); MEMORANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: AGREEMENT (.2); REVISE TERM SHEET RE: SAME (.3); MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH F. HODARA RE: SAME (.4); MEMORANDUM TO MCCREE RE: CHANGES (.1); MEMORANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: ANICO LITIGATION (.2); MEMORANDUM TO TEAM RE: AGREEMENT (.3); MEMORANDUM TO G. UZZI RE: AGREEMENT (.1); ATTEND MEETING AT RICHARDS, LAYTON & FINGER WITH CREDITOR GROUPS RE: AGREEMENT (2.1); HEARING RE: AGREEMENT (2.5); MEMORANDUM TO R. CHASE RE: AGREEMENT (.2); MEMORANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: AGREEMENT (.2); MEMORANDUM TO C. MARTIN RE: INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY SECTION (.2); MEMORANDUM TO NORCROSS RE: AGREEMENT POINTS (.2); CALL WITH B. KOSTUROS RE: FDIC ISSUES (.5); MEMORANDUM TO A. SHAKOOR RE: AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH RE: FDIC ISSUES (.3); MEETING WITH C. SMITH AND J. MACIEL RE: NEXT STEPS (1.3); MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING AND W. HORTON RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2).

03/12/10 Goldring, Stuart

4.00

3,960.00

21000 2

20247485

MEETING WITH B. ROSEN AND W. HORTON RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3); EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH C. BROUWER, C. SMITH AND OTHERS RE: INFORMATION REQUEST (.3); CALL WITH C. BROUWER RE: DRAFT SETTLEMENT (.2); DISCUSS SETTLEMENT WITH W. HORTON (.6); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT TO INCORPORATE FDIC (2.6).

03/12/10 Horton, Jr., William

7.20

6,228.00

21000

20250220

CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. ROSEN AND S. GOLDRING RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE TAX PORTIONS OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (6.3); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING RE: SAME (.6).

03/12/10 Yates, Erin

0.20

91.00

21000

20165629

REVIEW E-MAILS RE: SETTLEMENT WITH JPMORGAN CHASE AND ACTION ITEMS.

03/12/10 O'Toole, Jr., Patrick

0.10

70.00

21000

20283743

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	•				
REVIEV	W EMAILS RE: SETTLEMENT.				
03/12/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.10	63.00	21000	20148977
CALL E	BANK BONDHOLDER RE: QUESTION ABOU	JT SETTLEMENT.			
03/12/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.50	257.50	21000	20227043
REVIEV	V SETT LEMENT EM AILS.				
03/12/10	Coleman, Erica	3.30	1,501.50	21000	20242273
READ A	AND ANALY ZE SETTLEMEN T AGREEMEN WITH B. FINE STONE (.4).	T (2.7); DISCUSS SAME	E WITH B. ROSEN (.	2); DISCUSS	
03/13/10	Rosen, Brian	4.70	4,582.50	21000	20336710
REVIE' SAME (	W B. KOSTUROS AND M. BRADFIELD MEM (.1); REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (4	IORANDA (.2); MEMOI 1.4).	RANDUM TO B. KO	STUROS RE:	
03/13/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.00	990.00	21000	20182646
CONSI SETTL SAME (	DER AND RESPOND TO COMMENTS FROM EMENT AGREEMENT (.6); FURTHER EMAI (.4).	I C. BROUWER, H. JAC L EXCHANGES WITH	OBSON AND K. KE W. HORTON AND C	YES RE: DRAFT OTHERS RE:	
03/13/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.30	1,989.50	21000	20235887
	W AND RESPOND TO SETTLEMENT AGRE RE: SAME (.5).	EMENT COMMENTS (	1.8); CONFERENCE	CALL WITH K.	
03/14/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	21000	20336714
МЕМО	RANDUM TO K. STARKE RE: SETTLEMEN	IT.			
03/14/10	Rosen, Brian	12.20	11,895.00	21000	20336712
INPUT TELEP ISSUES	W AND REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMEN (.2); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: HONE CALL WITH B. KOSTUROS RE: SAM S (.2); REVIEW S. GOLDRING'S TAX COM M ISA COMMENTS (.2); MEMORAND A TO S.	E: COMPLETION OF SE IE (2); MEMORANDUM ENTS TO SAME (.4); M	TT LEMENT AGREI 1 TO S. GOLDRING IEMORANDUM TO	EMENT (.3); RE: TOWER S. MARGOLIS	
03/14/10	Margolis, Steven	3.10	2,232.00	21000	20224910
	W JPMC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (2.6) ME (.5).	AND CONFERENCES V	WITH E. KOVACS A	ND REVISIONS	<b>,</b>
03/14/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.30	199.50	21000	20156822
REVIE	W SUMMARIES OF 3/12/10 SETTLEMENT I	DISCUSSIONS.			
03/14/10	Kovacs, Eva	4.30	2,214.50	21000	20225711
WITH	EW AND COMMENT ON ERISA-RELATED S JPM (1.6) AND PREPARE MARK-UP (2.1); T END E-MAIL AND MARK-UP TO B. ROSEN	ELEPHONE DISCUSSIO	DBAL SETTLEMENT ON WITH S. MARG	r agreement olis re: same	
03/14/10	Coleman, Erica	9.30	4,231.50	21000	20242095
DRAF (3.3).	T DOCUMENT RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEM	IENT (6.0); REVIEW RE	LATED PLEADING	S AND DOCKE	rs
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	21000	20392026
MEET	ING WITH E. COLEMAN RE: SETTLEMENT	r agreement.			

D 4 ፕሮጀ	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
DATE	I MERELI ER/DESCRIFTION	ALO CAS			
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	9.20	8,970.00	21000	20344788
MEMOF SETTLE SETTLE RE: SAN	VERISA SECTIONS OF SETTLEMENT AGE RANDUM TO P. CALAMARI RE: SETTLEM EMENT AGREEMENT AND DISTRIBUTE (2 EMENT AGREEMENT (.2); MEMORANDUM ME (.3); MEMORANDUM TO R. SACKS RE: RANDUM (.2); MEMORANDUM TO NORCE	ENT/BANK BONHOLDE 2.1); REVIEW M. BRADFI 4 TO B. KOSTUROS RE: 5 : VISA AGREEMENT (.2);	R (.2); FURTHER R ELD LETTER REG SAME (.1); CALL W REVIEW NORCRO	EVISIONS TO ARDING /ITH C. SMITH OSS	
03/15/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.10	1,089.00	21000	20247097
CONFE MEET IN	R WITH E. COLEMAN RE: BACKGROUND NG WITH ALL HANDS (.6).	TO SETTLEMENT (.5); A	ATTEND INTERNA	L PLAN	
03/15/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.10	72.00	21000	20288558
EMAIL	FROM K. DIBLASI RE: SETTLEMENT WIT	TH JPM/FDIC.			
03/15/10	Coleman, Erica	2.20	1,001.00	21000	20243054
MEET V DOCUM	WITH B. ROSEN TO DISCUSS GLOBAL SE MENT RE: SAME (1.5); CONFER WITH S. G	TTLEMENT AGREEMEN OLDRING RE: SAME (.5).	T (2); CONTINUE	DRAFTING	
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	2.60	2,535.00	21000	20345895
E. COL	R WITH B. SCHELER RE: SETTLEMENT A EMAN RE: SAME (.2); MEMORANDUM TO 3. KOSTUROS RE: SAME (.3); REVIEW BK MENT (.8); CONFER WITH C. SMITH RE: S	) B. KOSTUROS RE: M. B K MATERIALS AND PRO	RADFIELD LETTE	$\mathbb{R}$ (.1); CONFER	ξ
03/16/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.70	441.00	21000	20160802
	WITH C. MARTIN RE: TRANSFER OF INTE RE: SAME (.2).	LLECTUAL PROPERTY	TO JPMORGAN (.5	); REVIEW	
03/16/10	Coleman, Erica	5.70	2,593.50	21000	20253374
DRAFT PLEAD	DOCUMENT RE: GLOBAL SETTLEMENT INGS AND OTHER DOCUMENTS (3.4).	AGREEMENT (23); REV	EW AND ANALY	ZE RELATED	
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	0.30	292.50	21000	20392779
MEMO	RANDUM TO J. MACIEL RE: HOLDING (.1	); CALL WITH J. MACIEI	L RE: SAME (.2).		
03/17/10	Rosen, Brian	7.20	7,020.00	21000	20345770
REVIS S. FRIE TO M. RE: SA PROCE RE: UF	W AND REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEME E SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (3.9); CONFEDMAN RE: FDIC TERM SHEET (.3); MEMOBRADELD RE: SAME (.2); CONFER WIT ME (.2); MEMORANDUM TO T. CALIFANOBES (.3); MEMORANDUM TO B. KOSTURO POATE/CALL (.3); MEMORANDUM TO PORMED LIABILITY (.2).	FER WITH T. SAPEIKA RI ORANDUM TO C. SMITH H C. SMITH RE: SAME (.2 O RE: SAME (.1); CONFEI IS RE: MCCREE POSITIO	E: SAME (.1); MEM RE: SAME (.2); MI 3); CONFER WITH R WITH T. CALIFA N (2); CONFER WI	ORANDUM TO EMORANDUM B. KOSTUROS NO RE: TH B. SCHELE	.R
03/17/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.60	594.00	21000	20182665
EMAIL PROVI	. EXCHANGES WITH C. BROUWER AND C DE COMMENTS TO SULLIVAN & CROMV	THERS RE: DRAFT SET WELL (.3).	TLEMENT AGREE	MENT (.3);	
03/17/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	21000	20201149
	ER WITH E. COLEMAN RE: SETTLEMENT	AGREEMENT (.2); CONF	ER WITH B. ROSE	N RE: SAME (.	1).
03/17/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.60	1,008.00	21000	20163583

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
PREPAR	E FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CALL WITH	I JPMC RE: INTELLECT	JAL PROPERTY IS	SUES.	
03/17/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.70	360.50	21000	20225538
REVIEV	V COMMENTS ON SETTLEMENT AGREEM	MENT.			
03/17/10	Coleman, Erica	8.90	4,049.50	21000	20253464
REVIEW SETTLE	V PLEADINGS FROM MULTIPLE LITIGAT. EMENT AGREEMENT (8.7); CONFER WITH	IONS AND DRAFT DOCU T. SAPEIKA RE: SAME	JMENT RE: GLOBA (.2).	AL	
03/18/10	Rosen, Brian	5.40	5,265.00	21000	20344727
REVIEV REVISI EMAIL RE: UPI MEMOR	RANDUM TO T. CALIFANO RE: COMMEN' V F. HODARA RESPONSE (.1); MEMORAN ONS TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.9); RE: SAME (.2); MEMORANDUM TO J. MA DATES (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. RANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: COMMEN A RE: JPMORGAN SETTLEMENT MOTION	DUM TO F. HODARA (.1 REVIEW JPMC COMME CIEL ET. AL. RE: SAME KOSTUROS, M. BRADFI TS (.1); REVIEW FDIC C	); REVIEW FRIED I NTS (1.7); REVIEW (.1); CONFER WITI ELD RE: SAME (.4)	FRANK J. MACIEL HB. KOSTURO	
03/18/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.80	792.00	21000	20289500
REVIEV	V FDIC COMMENTS RE: SETTLEMENT AC	GREEMENT (.3) AND EM	IAIL EX CHANGES	RE: SAME (.5)	
03/18/10	Margolis, Steven	3,30	2,376.00	21000	20228940
IN JPM(	W NEW DRAFT OF JPMC SETTLEMENT ACC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.2); DRAINFER WITH M. SPITTELL RE: JPMC CHAINTY FOR AMOUNTS AFTER 9/25/2008 AND	FT SUMMARY OF ISSUE NGES AND NONQUALIF	S RE: BENEFIT PL IED DEFERRED CO	AN PROVISIOI	NS
03/18/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.60	519.00	21000	20289506
CONFE	RENCE CALL RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEM	MENT.			
03/18/10	Santillan, Aida	0.60	357.00	21000	20184756
ATTEN WITH J	D TEAM WMI CONFERENCE CALL WITH PMC.	ALVAREZ & MARSAL	RE: SETTLEMENT	AGREEMENT	
03/18/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	21000	20200754
PARTIC	CIPATE IN PART OF CALL WITH B. ROSE EMENT.	N AND K. DIBLASI RE: J	PMORGAN SETTL	EMENT	
03/18/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.60	411.00	21000	20201015
MEETI	NG WITH B. ROSEN RE: SETTLEMENT W	ITH JPMORGAN.			
03/18/10	Sapeika, Tal	3.40	2,329.00	21000	20200752
REVIE' SAME (	W AND REVISE DOCUMENT RE: SETTLE! (.6).	MENT AGREEMENT (2.8	3); CONFER WITH I	E. COLEMAN I	RE:
03/18/10	Coleman, Erica	9.20	4,186.00	21000	20253285
	W PLEADINGS FROM MULTIPLE LITIGAT EMENT AGREEMENT (8.6); CONFER WIT)			BAL	
03/19/10	Berz, David	0.40	360.00	21000	20250285
CORRI	ESPONDENCE WITH B. ROSEN AND E. YA ETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	ATES RE: ANALYSIS AN	D THE PROPOSED	CHANGES TO	
03/19/10	Rosen, Brian	3.00	2,925.00	21000	20344734

DATE

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

TIME ID

MEETING RE: BKK BENEFIT BENEFIT	C. SMITH MEMORANDUM RE: DRAFTING (.1); M. G/BKK (.1); CONFER WITH B. SCHELER RE: COMM (.1); MEMORANDUM TO S. GOLDRING RE: FDIC S CALLS (.3); REVIEW MEMORANDUM TO SAME S COMMENTS (.1); MEMORANDUM TO TEAM RE KOSTUROS RE: FDIC UPDATE (.3); CONFER WITH	AENTS (.4); MEM TAX (.2); CONFEF (.2); MEMORANI : AGREEMENT D	ORANDUM TO S. FR R WITH J. MACIEL R DUM TO S. FRIEDM. ISTRIBUTION (.1); C	IEDMAN E: AN RE: CONFER	
03/19/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.60	1,584.00	21000	20320444
CONFER SETTLEM (.6).	ENCE CALL WITH SULLIVAN & CROMWELL, DLA MENT AGREEMENT (1.0); FOLLOW-UP DISCUSSION	A PIPER AND WG ON WITH SULLIV	M TAX TEAM RE: D AN & CROMWELL I	RAFT RE: SAME	
03/19/10	Margolis, Steven	2.60	1,872.00	21000	20227676
MARSAI COMPEN SPITTEI	CH RE: DEFERRED COMPENSATION PLAN CLAIM L AND WGM RE: SAME (1.3); CORRESPONDENCE ISATION OBLIGATIONS UNDER JPMC SETTLEMI L RE: SAME (.8); REVIEW ISSUES RE: RELEASES TS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. DIBLASI AN	RE: NONQUALIF) ENT AGREEMENT SIGNED BY PART	IED DEFERRED I AND CONFERENC LICIPANTS IN ACCE	ES WITH M.	
03/19/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.50	2,162.50	21000	20234809
BROHW'	ENCES WITH S. GOLDRING RE: SETTLEMENT ACER RE: SAME (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH DLADRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.0); CONFEE (.3).	A PIPER, SULLIVA	N & CROMWELL, A	ND WGM	
03/19/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.10	68.50	21000	20201819
CONFER	WITH E. COLEMAN RE: SETTLEMENT WITH JPM	IORGAN.			
03/19/10	Coleman, Erica	4.10	1,865.50	21000	20253381
REVIEW SETTLE	PLEADINGS FROM MULTIPLE LITIGATIONS AN MENT AGREEMENT (4.0); CALL WITH T. SAPEIKA	D DRAFT DOCUM A RE: SAME (.1).	MENT FOR GLOBAL		
03/20/10	Rosen, Brian	3.30	3,217.50	21000	20360951
TELEPH	ANDUM TO PARTIES RE: MONDAY MEETING (.2) ONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME (.3 INDEMNITY SECTION (.2); MEMORANDUM TO I	); REVIEW JPMC	BENEFITS SECTION	T (2.1); I (.3);	
03/20/10	Coleman, Erica	7.40	3,367.00	21000	20253521
DRAFT FROM M	DOCUMENT FOR GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREE. MULT IPLE LITIGATIONS (3.0).	MENT (4.4); REVI	EW RELATED PLEA	DINGS	
03/21/10	Rosen, Brian	11.50	11,212.50	21000	20360954
TELEPH KOSTUI (.4); ME WITH B	AND REVISE SET TLEMENT AGREEMENT (9.1); IONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MACIEL RE: BENEFI ROS RE: UPDATE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE MORANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: EXECUTION OF SCHELER RE: SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERE IONE CONFERENCE WITH B. KOSTUROS RE: CHA	TS (.2); TELEPHO WITH C. SMITH FAGREEMENT (.) NCE WITH C. SM	NE CONFERENCE V RE: COMMENTS/DI I); TELEPHONE CON ITH RE: CHANGES (	VITH B. STRIBUTION IFERENCE	
03/21/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.20	1,188.00	21000	20208604
REVIEV SETTLE	V AND RESPOND TO EMAIL INQUIRIES FROM FR MENT AGREEMENT(.8); FOLLOW-UP WITH SULL RANDUM FOR FDIC AND REVISIONS TO SETTLE	JIVAN & CROMW	'ELL RE: DRAFT TA	AND X	
03/21/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.30	259.50	21000	20235030

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPON	NDENCE RE: SETTLEME	NT AGREEMENT.		
03/21/10	Sapeika, Tal	4.80	3,288.00	21000	20254496
REVIEW	AND REVISE DOCUMENT FOR SETTLE	MENT (4.4); CONFER WI	TH E. COLEMAN F	RE: SAME (.4).	
03/21/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	189.00	21000	20279267
	R WITH E. COLEMAN RE: SETTLEMENT				
			4 005 00	21000	20253522
03/21/10	Coleman, Erica  DOCUMENT FOR GLOBAL SETTLEMENT	9.00 CACREEMENT (5.0) DEV	4,095.00 IEW DELATED PL	21000 FADINGS (3.3)	
DISCUS	S SAME WITH T. SAPEIKA (.4); DISCUSS	SAME WITH K. DIBLASI	(.3).	DADING (3.3)	,
03/22/10	Rosen, Brian	11.00	10,725.00	21000	20360959
CREDIT AGREE	RE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH FITORS COMMITTEE, ET. AL. RE: SETTLEM MENT (3.8); CONFERENCES WITH B. KOS (ANDUM TO E. COLEMAN RE: SAME (.1)	ENT AGREEMENT (5.9); STUROS, C. SMITH, ET. A	REVISE SETTLEM	1ENT	
03/22/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.20	198.00	21000	20320448
PROVII	DE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS TO SULLIV	AN & CROMWELL RE: S	ETTLEMENT AGE	REEMENT.	
03/22/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.80	792.00	21000	20248402
	W FURTHER REVISIONS TO DRAFT SETT				
			4 1 50 00	21000	20201100
03/22/10	Goldring, Stuart W AND REVISE DRAFT SETTLEMENT AG	4.20	4,158.00	21000 H SHI I IVAN 8	20281188
CROMV CREDIT	W AND REVISE DRAFT SETTLEMENT AN WELL AND OTHERS RE: SETTLEMENT NO FORS' ADVISORS AND CLIENT RE: SETT) VAN & CROMWELL RE: DRAFT SETTLEM	EGOTIATIONS (1.0); TAX LEMENT NEGOTIATION	DISCUSSION WI	TH W. HORTOI	Ň,
03/22/10	Margolis, Steven	2.20	1,584.00	21000	20229315
AND D	W AND COMMENT ON NEW DRAFTS OF ISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CORRESP E. COLEMAN RE: PENSION PLAN ISSUES	ONDENCE WITH WGM T	ENT, PLAN OF REFEAM RE: SAME (	ORGANIZATIO 1.8); CONFER	N
03/22/10	Margolis, Steven	4.80	3,456.00	21000	20229314
MEETI CROMV	NG AND NEGOTIATIONS RE: JPMC SETT WELL.	LEMENT AGREEMENT	WITH JPMC AND S	SULLIVAN &	
03/22/10	Horton, Jr., William	3.90	3,373.50	21000	20235197
MEETI CROMV SETTLI	NG AT WGM RE SETTLEMENT NEGOTIA WELL AND THE FDIC RE DRAFT SETTLE EMENT NEGOTIATIONS (1.3); PARTICIPA ITTEE, ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND CLIEN	ATIONS (.7); PARTICIPAT EMENT AGREEMENT (1.2 ATE IN TAX CONFERENC	E IN CALL WITH DEXCHANGE EM CE CALL WITH CR	AILS RE: EDITORS	
03/22/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.90	616.50	21000	20255572
CONFE	R. WITH E. COLEMAN AND R. SHARMA D. SIMONDS RE: SET TLEMENT AGREEM	RE: JPMORGAN SETTLEI	MENT AGREEMEN E. COLEMAN RE:	NT (.5); EMAILS SAME (.2).	S
03/22/10	Kovacs, Eva	2.50	1,287.50	21000	20226196
ATTEN	ND WAMU MEETING RE: DRAFTING SES: EMENT.	SION IN CONNECTION W	VITH THE GLOBA	L SETTLEMEN	T
03/22/10	Coleman, Erica	11.10	5,050.50	21000	20253375

HOURS

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

DATE

TASK

AMOUNT

TIME ID

PLAN AT MARGO (7.6) AN TAX REI	O WGM TEAM MEETING RE: STATUS OF PREPAID GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.4); I LIS (.4); DISCUSS SAME WITH T. SAPEIKA ANI D REVIEW PROVISIONS IN GLOBAL SETTLEM FUNDS AND DRAFT SUMMARY OF SAME (1.0) ITH S. GOLDRING AND T. SAPEIKA (1.0).	DISCUSS PENSION D WITH R. SHARM. ENT AGREEMENT	PLAN ISSUES WITH A (.5); DRAFT DOCU DEDICATED TO TR	S. MENT FOR EATMENT OF	•
03/22/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	21000	20193477
	PONDENCE WITH E. COLEMAN RE: APPROVA WITH E. COLEMAN AND T. SAPEIKA RE: SAM		TLEMENT AGREEM	ENT (.5);	
03/23/10	Gold, Simeon	3.80	3,762.00	21000	20205941
TEAM W	FRIED FRANK MARK-UP OF BACKSTOP PURI VITH COMMENTS ON SAME (.4); ATTEND CON BRIDGE, E. WEINBERG, A. TANG AND K. DIB MU STOCKHOLDERS MEETING AND ANALYZ (2.6).	FERENCE CALL W LASIRE: SAME (.4	'ITH WEIL TEAM (V. ); REVIEW ISSUES R	E: DEMAND	
03/23/10	Rosen, Brian	10.70	10,432.50	21000	20361283
CONFER SAME (.	SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (9.2); REVIEW BK RENCE WITH C. SMITH RE: STATUS (.2); TELEI 3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. MART RING RE: TAX COMMENTS (.2); CONFER WITH	PHONE CONFEREN IN RE: CONTRACT	CE WITH B. KOSTUI 'S (.3); CORRESPOND	ROS RE:	
03/23/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.50	2,475.00	21000	20248173
SETTLE	CHANGES TO DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEM MENT AGREEMENT (.2); DISCUSS SAME WITH PRRESPONDENCE RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEM	1 W. HORTON (.5);	EXCHANGES RE: DRA FURTHER EMAIL EX	AFT KCHANGES	
03/23/10	Margolis, Steven	0.30	216.00	21000	20282889
CORRES AGREE	SPONDENCE WITH R. SCHACHTER, J. GOULDI MENT.	NG AND B. ROSEN	RE: JPM GLOBAL SI	ETTLEMENT	
03/23/10	Horton, Jr., William	5.50	4,757.50	21000	20235258
REVISE SAME (. SAME (.	TAX PORTION OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT 2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. KEYES RE: S. 5).	r (4.6); CONFEREN AME (.2); CONFER!	CE CALL WITH A.M ENCES WITH S.GOL	ASON RE: DRING RE:	
03/23/10	Sapeika, Tal	5.70	3,904.50	21000	20254941
REVIEV COLEM	V AND REVISE DOCUMENT FOR SETTLEMENT AN RE: SAME (.4).	WITH JPMORGAN	N (53); CONFER WIT	н Е.	
03/23/10	Coleman, Erica	10.20	4,641.00	21000	20253286
	W GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND R IKA RE: SAME (.4).	EVISE DOCUMEN	Г RE: SAME (9.8); СО	NFER WITH	
03/23/10	Mills, Marvin	1.70	671.50	21000	20246747
REVIEV	V JPM SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
03/23/10	Sharma, Rahul	9.60	4,368.00	21000	20193484
	DOCUMENT IN CONNECTION WITH GLOBAL	SETTLEMENT AG	REEMENT.		
03/24/10	Rosen, Brian	15.40	15,015.00	21000	20362060

DATE TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT TASK TIME ID

REVIEW DOCUMENT IN CONNECTION WITH SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (2.3); MEETING WITH M. BRADFIELD RE: STATUS/JPMC/INDEMNIFICATION (1.4); MEETING WITH TEAM AND CREDITORS RE: PLAN AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (5.3); REVISE SAME (4.3); MEMORANDUM TO J. CLARKE RE: MEETING (.2); MEMORANDUM TO C. STAPEN RE: HOLDINGS (.2); MEMORANDUM TO B. SCHELER RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW FDIC COMMENTS TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.4).

03/24/10 Goldring, Stuart

7.10 7.029.00 21000 20248072

FOLLOW-UP RE: RECENT RE VISIONS TO DRAFT SETTLE MENT AGREEMENT (.3); REVIEW FDIC PROPOSAL (.2); CALL WITH C. BROUWER, W. HORTON AND CREDITORS' ADVISORS RE: SAME (1.1); REVIEW, REVISE AND DISTRIBUTE DRAFT STOCK ESCROW LANGUAGE (.9); CALL WITH SULLIVAN & CROMWELL RE: DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.7); FURTHER EMAIL EXCHANGES RE: DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH SAME (.6); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.5); CALL WITH CREDITORS' ADVISORS AND CLIENT RE: SAME (.8); CALL WITH SULLIVAN & CROM WELL AND W. HORTON RE: SAME (1.6); CONFERENCE WITH C. BROUWER AND W. HORTON RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.4).

03/24/10 Margolis, Steven

5.20 3,744.00 21000 20229325

REVIEW ISSUES AND NEW DRAFT OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN OF REORGANIZATION (3.0); CONFERENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH WMI, ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND R. SCHACHTER RE: ISSUES FOR SAME (1.0); CONFER WITH E. KOVACS RE: BANKRUPTCY SECTION 1114 (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. KOVACS RE: COMMENTS TO SULLIVAN AND CROMWELL COMMENTS TO GLOBAL SETTLEMENT (.8).

03/24/10 Horton, Jr., William

9.40

8.131.00

21000

20236340

CONFERENCE S WITH S. GOLDRING AND C. BROUWER RE: DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE (.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING AND C. BROUWER RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH SULLIVAN & CROMWELL AND S. GOLDRING RE: SAME (1.6); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL (1.1); REVISE AND NEGOTIATE TAX PORTIONS OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (4.3); REVIEW PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: SAME (.3).

03/24/10 Kovacs, Eva

0.80

412.00

21000 20233022

DISCUSSION WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: OUR COMMENTS TO SULLIVAN'S COMMENTS TO THE GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.

03/24/10 Coleman, Erica

7.50

3,412,50

20207341

REVISE DOCUMENT IN CONNECTION WITH GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH JPMORGAN (3.5); REVIEW REVISIONS TO GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND UPDATE DOCUMENT RE: SAME (4.0).

03/24/10 Sharma, Rahul

4.70

2,138.50

21000

21000

20193563

REVISE DOCUMENT IN CONNECTION WITH GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.

03/25/10 Rosen, Brian

15.40

15,015.00

21000

20362067

REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND MEETINGS WITH TEAMS, JPMC, CREDITORS RE: SAME.

03/25/10 Goldring, Stuart

6.40

6,336.00

21000

20248390

NEGOTIATE AND REVISED DRAFT TAX PROVISIONS OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.

03/25/10 Margolis, Steven

3.80

2,736.00

21000

20228698

REVIEW DRAFTS OF PLAN OF REORGANIZATION, JPMC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CONFERENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH ALVAREZ & MARSAL, WMI AND WGM TEAMS RE: SAME AND NEGOTIATIONS (3.5); CONFER WITH E. KOVACS RE: GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3).

03/25/10 Horton, Jr., William

9.60

8.304.00

21000

20234961

TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION

DATE

03/08/10

Rosen, Brian

HOURS

AMOUNT

TASK

TIME ID

CONFER CROMW	ENCE CALL WITH SULLIVAN & CROMWELL ENCE CALL WITH H. JACOBSON RE: SAME (. ELL AND CREDITORS COMMITTEE RE: SAM MENT AGREEMENT (6.9).	4); CONFERENCE (	CALL WITH SULLIVA	4N &	7
03/25/10	Yates, Erin	0.60	273.00	21000	20289897
REVIEW AND TH	DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AMONG E FDIC.	WASHINGT ON MU	JTU AL, INC., JPMOR	GAN CHASE	
03/25/10	Kovacs, Eva	3.30	1,699.50	21000	20235783
SETTLE: SPITTEL SCHEDU	COMMENTS FROM C. STAPEN FROM FRIED MENT AGREEMENT (.3); TELEPHONE CONFELLE: BENEFITS RELATED SECTIONS OF THUSES (.9); REVISE BENEFITS RELATED SECTIONFER WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: SAME (.3).	RENCES AND COR EGLOBAL SETTLE	RESPONDENCE WIT MENT AGREEMENT	'H WITHM. ' AND CLAIM	S
03/26/10	Rosen, Brian	21.20	20,670.00	21000	20344944
AGREEN ALVARI (.5); COI WITH B	IGS WITH S. FRIEDMAN, R. SACKS AND B. GIMENT, PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EZ & MARSAL AND WGM RE: SAME (5.0); CONFER WITH G. UZZI RE: SAME (.2); CALL WITH G. WITH G. WITH T. CALIFANO RE: SAME (.6); CONFER WITH T. CALIFANO RE: SAME (.6);	(1.0); REVISE SAM NFER WITH B. SCH H J. CLARKE RE: S. OING (3.5); CONFE	E (6.9); MEETINGS W ELER AND M.ROOS AME (.5); CONFEREN	VITH WMI, E RE:SAME NCE CALLS	
03/26/10	Goldring, Stuart	3.30	3,267.00	21000	20248406
DISCLO CALL R	EXCHANGES RE: DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGRE SURE IN SAME (1.5); CONFER WITH A. KADE E: SAME (.4); CALL WITH H. JACOBSON RE: S MENT AGREEMENT AND TAX DISCLOSURE	N RE: SETTLEMEN ETTLEMENT AGRE	T AGREEMENT (.3); EEMENT (.1); DISCU:	FOLLOW-UP	
03/26/10	Horton, Jr., William	5.50	4,757.50	21000	20235367
REVIEW RE: SAM	V AND REVISE TAX PORTIONS OF SETTLEME ME (.5); REVIEW TAX DISCLOSURE (1.2); CON	ENT AGREEMENT ( FERENCE RE: SAM	3.3); CONFER WITH E (.5).	S. GOLDRING	ì
03/27/10	Rosen, Brian	1.00	975.00	21000	20295363
MEMOR POSITIO	RANDUM TO S. GOLDRING RE: FDIC POSITIO DNS/DISCUSSIONS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFER	N (3); MEMORAND ENCE WITH C. SMI	OUM TO B. KOSTURO TH RE: SAME (.4).	OS RE:	
03/28/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	21000	20295354
МЕМОГ	RANDUM TO B. KOSTUROS RE: SETTLEMENT	r agreement.			
03/30/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.20	91.00	21000	20244695
	W ISSUES RE: GLOBAL SETTLEMENT.				
03/31/10	Rosen, Brian	0.80	780.00	21000	20295330
MEM OI	RANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: SETTLEMENT UPI	DATE (.5); REVIEW	REPLIES (.3).		
03/31/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.70	318.50	21000	20245011
REVIEV	W ISSUES RELATED TO OBJECTIONS TO SETTENTION TO SAME (.3) AND EMAIL TO B. RO			ITY HOLDER	S
SUBTOTA ISSUES:	L TASK CODE 21000 - GENERAL JPM	546.20	\$ 436,968.50		

0.10

97.50

21400

20336624

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEV	V VENDOR NOTICE.				
03/14/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	21400	20391941
MEMO	RANDUM TO S. FRIEDMAN RE: VISA TRA	NSITION AGREEMENT.			
SURTOTA	L TASK CODE 21400 - VENDOR				
STIPULA		0.30	\$ 292.50		
03/22/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	23100	20360966
	RANDUM TO D.BERZ AND A. STROCHAK TH RE: SAME (.1).	RE: PSI HEARING (.1); TI	ELEPHONE CONF	ERENCE WITH	ł
SUBTOTA GOVERNI	L TASK CODE 23100 - GENERAL MENTAL/REGULATORY ISSUES:	0.20	\$ 195.00		
00404140		1.50	1,485.00	24100	20267044
03/01/10 MEETI SANTII	Goldring, Stuart NG WITH AKIN GUMP, FTI, BINGHAM MC LLAN RE: SETTLEMENT WITH IRS RE: STA	CUTCHEN, ALVAREZ & 1	MARSAL, C. BRO		
03/01/10	DuPuy, Carolyn	0.80	676.00	24100	20228521
RESEA	RCH RE: TAX REFUND.				
03/01/10	Santillan, Aida	1.50	892.50	24100	20184646
MEETI ISSUE. GOLDF	NG WITH WMI CREDITORS COMMITTEE I PARTICIPANTS: AKIN GUMP, FTI, BINGH LING).	RE: POTENTIAL SETTLEM AM, ALVAREZ & MARSA	MENT WITH IRS L, WMI (C. BROU	RE: THE STAR! IWER), WGM (	S S.
03/01/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	1.50	682.50	24100	20130132
REVIE	W PRESUBMISSION MEMORANDUM.				
03/02/10	DuPuy, Carolyn	0.60	507.00	24100	20228519
CALLS	WITH W. HORTON RE: TAX REFUNDS.				
03/02/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.10	1,816.50	24100	20270375
TELEP TAX P (1.0).	HONE CONFERENCE CALLS WITH C. DUP ORTION OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (	PUY RE: WITHHOLDING I .5); REVIEW AND RESEA	SSUES (.6); REVI RCH RE: WITHHO	EW AND REVI: OLDING ISSUE:	SE S
03/05/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.50	2,162.50	24100	20235332
RESEA	ARCH AND ANALYSIS OF TAX REFUND CI	LAIMS.			
03/08/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.30	1,287.00	24100	20274974
PART! HATC	CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CALL WITH C. I HER, K. DIBLASI AND J. MACIEL (1.0); CO	BROUWER, J. CARREON, NFER WITH K. HEITNER	W. HORTON, J. P RE: TAX REFUNI	OHL, T. O CLAIMS (.3).	
03/08/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.50	2,162.50	24100	20234920
ANAL GOLD	YSIS OF TAX REFUND TREATMENT (1.5); RING, J. POHL, J. CARREON, C. BROUWER	PARTICIPATE IN WEEKL , K. DIBLASI AND J. MAC	Y TAX CALL WI CIEL (1.0).	TH S.	
03/08/10	Pohl, Joshua	1.40	770.00	24100	20144285
CALL SALES	WITH ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND WEIL W STRANSACTION (.4).	AMU TEAM RE: TAX ISS	UES (1.0); ANAL	YZE POSSIBLE	

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.00	630.00	24100	20133327
PARTIC	IPATE IN WEEKLY TAX TEAM CALL.				
03/08/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	1.00	455.00	24100	20152647
PARTIC	IPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CALL WITH C. BR L, K. DIBLASI AND J. POHL.	OUWER, S. GOLDRING	, J. CARREON, W.	HORT ON, J.	
03/08/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	1.50	682.50	24100	20152391
RESEAR	RCH RE: REFUND ISSUE.				
03/09/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.80	2,772.00	24100	20275280
	RCH RE: TAX REFUNDS.				
03/09/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	0.50	227.50	24100	20152390
	RCH TAX REFUND ISSUE.				
		1.50	682.50	24100	20152477
03/10/10	Hatcher, R. Todd RCH TAX REFUND ISSUE.	1.50	062.30	24100	20172411
RESEA	RCH TAX REFUND ISSUE.				
03/11/10	Goldring, Stuart	4.70	4,653.00	24100	20247047
AGREE CONSII SULLIV	W AND COMMENT ON DRAFT SULLIVAN & MENT (1.0); FURTHER EMAIL EXCHANGE DER FURTHER CHANGES TO SAME (1.4); FORN & CROMWELL RE: SAME (.7); CONFERMENT (.8).	S AND REVISIONS TO S URTHER EMAIL EXCH	SAME (.8); REVIEV ANGES ON OUR S	V AND IDE AND WITI	Н
03/11/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	2.10	955.50	24100	20152779
RESEA	RCH TAX REFUND ISSUE.				
03/12/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	1.00	455.00	24100	20152614
	RCH TAX REFUND ISSUE.				
***************************************				0.1100	00047004
03/15/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.60	2,574.00	24100	20247224
PARTIC FOLLO HORTO	W FRIED FRANK DRAFT PRESUBMISSION CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CALL WITH C. BI W-UP WITH A. SANTILLAN AND J. POHLE ON RE: FRIED FRANK SUBMISSION (.3); CA ON AND W. HORTON RE: IRS AUDITS (.3).	ROUWER, J. CARREON E: TAX DISCLOSURE ( LL WITH H. JACOBSON	AND WEIL TAX T .3); FOLLOW-UP V	EAM (1.0); VITH W.	
03/15/10	Horton, Jr., William	1.60	1,384.00	24100	20235386
CONFE	CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CALL WITH C. B RENCE CALL WITH H. JACOBSON, A. KAI DITS (.3); CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRIN	EN, C. BROUWER, J. C	ARREON AND S. (	EAM (1.0); GOLDRING RE	:
03/15/10	Pohl, Joshua	0.30	165.00	24100	20513327
	ER WITH S. GOLDRING AND A. SANTILLA	NRE: TAX DISCLOSUR	E.		
02/15/10	Pohl Tochya	1.00	550.00	24100	20176154
03/15/10 PARTI	Pohl, Joshua CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX TEAM MEETING		220.00	- 1244	· · · · · ·
03/15/10	Santillan, Aida	0.30	178.50	24100	20184595

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CONFE	R WITH S. GOLDRING AND J. POHL RE: T	AX DISCLOSURE.			
03/15/10	Santillan, Aida	1.00	595.00	24100	20184689
	EEKLY TAX CALL WITH ALVAREZ & MA	RSAL, WMI (C. BROUW	ER) AND WGM TA	X TEAM (S.	
GOLDR	ING, J. POHL AND W. HORTON).	•			
03/15/10	Santillan, Aida	2.80	1,666.00	24100	20184610
	W FRIED FRANK DRAFT RE: SUBMISSION DED IN TAX DISCLOSURE (1.8).	I LETTER TO THE IRS (I	.0); REVIEW ISSUE	ES TO BE	
03/15/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.00	630.00	24100	20157327
PARTIC	CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CALL.				
03/15/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	1.00	455.00	24100	20174890
	CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CALL WITH C. I			HORTON.	
1,1,1,1					20240054
03/16/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.50	495.00	24100	20248054
CALL V IRS AU	WITH C. BROUWER, ALVAREZ & MARSA DITS (.4); FOLLOW-UP WITH C. BROUWE	L, SULLIVAN & CROMW R RE: SAME (.1).	ELL AND J.P.MOR	GAN CHASE F	CE:
03/18/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.00	1,980.00	24100	20289501
REVIS	E AND PROVIDE COMMENTS RE: TAX CI	AIM AND REFUND DISC	CUSSION.		
03/19/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.40	396.00	24100	20182602
	EXCHANGE WITH A. KADEN RE: TAX R	EFUNDS.			
02/20/10	California Charact	2.00	1,980.00	24100	20248157
03/22/10	Goldring, Stuart WITH SULLIVAN & CROMWELL IN PREP.		•		_,
WEEK	LY TAX CALL WITH C. BROUWER, J. CAI	RREON AND WGM TAX	TEAM (1.0).		
03/22/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.00	1,730.00	24100	20281279
	CIPATE IN DLA PIPER TAX CONFERENCE RENCE CALL (1.0).	E CALL (1.0); PARTICIPA	ATE IN WEEKLY TA	ΑX	
03/22/10	Pohl, Joshua	1.00	550.00	24100	20281522
CALL	WITH ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND WEIL T	AX RE: TAX ISSUES.			
03/22/10	Santillan, Aida	1.00	595.00	24100	20184643
ATTEI	ND WMI WEEKLY TAX CALL WITH ALVA V. HORTON).			PRING, J. POH	L
03/29/10	Goldring, Stuart	1.00	990.00	24100	20207003
	CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CALL WITH A	LVAREZ & MARSAL ANI	D WGM TAX TEAM	1.	
		1.10	051.50	24100	20236181
03/29/10	Horton, Jr., William CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX CONFERENCE	1.10	951.50 WARSALAND W		
	PREPARE FOR SAME (.1).	CALL WITH ALVANDE	Z MILLOUID ANNO W		
03/29/10	Pohl, Joshua	0.90	495.00	24100	20231335
PART	CIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX MEETING WIT	H ALVAREZ & MARSAL	, AND WGM TAX T	EAM.	
03/29/10	Hatcher, R. Todd	0.90	409.50	24100	20255100

DATE TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT TASK TIME ID

PARTICIPATE IN WEEKLY TAX MEETING WITH C. BROUWER, J. CARREON, B. PEDERSEN, J. MACIEL AND WGM TAX TEAM.

SUBTOTAL	TASK CODE 24100 - GENERAL TAX				
ISSUES:		56.20	\$ 42,724.00		
03/05/10	Pohl, Joshua	0.90	495.00	24200	20130447
	LETTER OF TRANSMITTAL.				
03/08/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.50	495.00	24200	20274972
	ITH INVESTOR RE: STOCK TRADING ORDER	•			
03/09/10	Pohl, Joshua	4.50	2,475.00	24200	20145974
	CH LIQUIDATING TRUST ISSUES (.6); ANAL	YZE EFFECT OF PO	FENTIAL SALE OF V	VMI STOCK	
03/10/10	Pohl, Joshua	4.70	2,585.00	24200	20174037
ANALYZ	ZE 382 ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO POTENTIA	L SALES.			
03/30/10	Goldring, Stuart	0.60	594.00	24200	20208677
REVIEW	J. CARREON DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSE TO I	RS AUDIT QUESTIC	N AND PROVIDE RI	EVISIONS.	
03/30/10	Horton, Jr., William	0.30	259.50	24200	20250307
	AND COMMENT ON J. CARREON'S EMAIL/N		RESPONSE TO IRS A	UDIT	
SUBTOTA	L TASK CODE 24200 - NOL AND CLAIMS				
TRADING		11.50	\$ 6,903.50		
03/01/10	Goldring, Stuart	2.50	2,475.00	24400	20182478
HORTO	NG WITH FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFF N RE: FRIED FRANK'S PROPOSED TERM SHE	E, J. CARREON, C. E	BROUWER, A. SANT	ILLAN AND W.	
	N RE: SAME (.3).	ET RE: CHAPTER II	PLAN (2.2); CONFE	K WIIII W.	
03/01/10		ET RE: CHAPTER 11	3,546.50	24400	20233632
REVIEV WITH S MEETIN	N RE: SAME (.3).	4.10 W SETTLEMENT AG E LIQUID ATING TRU FE, J. CARREON, C. I	3,546.50 REEMENT (.6); CON JST TAX STRUCTUI BROUWER, A. SANT	24400 IFERENCES RE (.8);	20233632
REVIEV WITH S MEETIN	N RE: SAME (.3).  Horton, Jr., William  V REVISED TAX MEMORANDUM (.2); REVIE  . GOLDRING RE: TERM SHEET (.3); ANALY ZI  NG WITH FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFF	4.10 W SETTLEMENT AG E LIQUID ATING TRU FE, J. CARREON, C. I	3,546.50 REEMENT (.6); CON JST TAX STRUCTUI BROUWER, A. SANT	24400 IFERENCES RE (.8);	20233632
REVIEV WITH S MEETIN GOLDR 03/01/10 MEETIN	N RE: SAME (.3).  Horton, Jr., William  V REVISED TAX MEMORANDUM (.2); REVIEV  . GOLDRING RE: TERM SHEET (.3); ANALY ZI  NG WITH FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFF  ING RE: FRIED FRANK'S PROPOSED CHAPTE	4.10 W SETTLEMENT AGE LIQUID ATING TRUFE, J. CARREON, C. HR 11 TERM SHEET ( 2.20 J. CARREON, C. BR	3,546.50 REEMENT (.6); CON JST TAX STRUCTUI BROUWER, A. SANT 2.2).  1,309.00 OUWER, S. GOLDRI	24400 UFERENCES RE (.8); ILLAN AND S. 24400	
REVIEV WITH S MEETIN GOLDR 03/01/10 MEETIN	N RE: SAME (.3).  Horton, Jr., William  V REVISED TAX MEMORANDUM (.2); REVIEV . GOLDRING RE: TERM SHEET (.3); ANALY ZI NG WITH FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFF ING RE: FRIED FRANK'S PROPOSED CHAPTE  Santillan, Aida NG RE: FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFFE	4.10 W SETTLEMENT AGE LIQUID ATING TRUFE, J. CARREON, C. HR 11 TERM SHEET ( 2.20 J. CARREON, C. BR	3,546.50 REEMENT (.6); CON JST TAX STRUCTUI BROUWER, A. SANT 2.2).  1,309.00 OUWER, S. GOLDRI	24400 UFERENCES RE (.8); ILLAN AND S. 24400	
REVIEW WITH S MEETIN GOLDR  03/01/10 MEETIN HORTO  03/01/10 REVISE TERM S TO BE	N RE: SAME (.3).  Horton, Jr., William  V REVISED TAX MEMORANDUM (.2); REVIEV. GOLDRING RE: TERM SHEET (.3); ANALY ZING WITH FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFFING RE: FRIED FRANK'S PROPOSED CHAPTE  Santillan, Aida  NG RE: FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFFE, N RE: FRIED FRANK PROPOSED TERM SHEE	4.10 W SETTLEMENT AGE LIQUID ATING TRUE, J. CARREON, C. IF R 11 TERM SHEET ( 2.20 J. CARREON, C. BR T RE: WMI CHAPTE 3.50 ED ISSUES INVOLV STARS WITHHOLD MEETING (1.2); REV	3,546.50 REEMENT (.6); CON JST TAX STRUCTUI BROUWER, A. SANT 2.2).  1,309.00 OUWER, S. GOLDRI R 11 PLAN.  2,082.50 RED IN FRIED FRANI PING TAX TRANSACTIEW TREATMENT OF	24400  IFERENCES RE (.8); ILLAN AND S.  24400  NG AND W.  24400  K PROPOSED CTION SLIDES	20184645
REVIEW WITH S MEETIN GOLDR  03/01/10 MEETIN HORTO  03/01/10 REVISE TERM S TO BE	N RE: SAME (.3).  Horton, Jr., William  V REVISED TAX MEMORANDUM (.2); REVIEV. GOLDRING RE: TERM SHEET (.3); ANALY ZI NG WITH FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFF ING RE: FRIED FRANK'S PROPOSED CHAPTE  Santillan, Aida NG RE: FRIED FRANK, AKIN GUMP, S. JOFFE, N RE: FRIED FRANK PROPOSED TERM SHEE  Santillan, Aida E AND SUBMIT TO S. GOLDRING TAX RELAT SHEET FOR CHAPTER 11 PLAN (1.2); REVIEW ADDRESSED WITH THE CREDITORS IN THE	4.10 W SETTLEMENT AGE LIQUID ATING TRUE, J. CARREON, C. IF R 11 TERM SHEET ( 2.20 J. CARREON, C. BR T RE: WMI CHAPTE 3.50 ED ISSUES INVOLV STARS WITHHOLD MEETING (1.2); REV	3,546.50 REEMENT (.6); CON JST TAX STRUCTUI BROUWER, A. SANT 2.2).  1,309.00 OUWER, S. GOLDRI R 11 PLAN.  2,082.50 RED IN FRIED FRANI PING TAX TRANSACTIEW TREATMENT OF	24400  IFERENCES RE (.8); ILLAN AND S.  24400  NG AND W.  24400  K PROPOSED CTION SLIDES	20184645

RESEARCH LIQUIDATING TRUST STRUCTURE (1.5); CONFER WITH W. HORTON RE: SAME (.7).

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/03/10	DuPuy, Carolyn	1.20	1,014.00	24400	20228517
CALL W	VITH W. HORTON RE: TAX CLAIM ANALY OLDING ISSUE RE: TAX REFUNDS (.8).	SIS (.4); DISCUSSION W	VITH D. BOWER RE	:	
03/03/10	Horton, Jr., William	2.10	1,816.50	24400	20236476
CONFE ANALY	RENCES WITH S. GOLDRING RE: LIQUIDA SIS RE: TAX CLAIMS (1.0); CONFER WITH	TING TRUST STRUCTUC. DUPUY RE: SAME (	JRE (.7); RESEARC: .4).	H AND	
03/03/10	Pohl, Joshua	0.90	495.00	24400	20130296
ANALY	ZE ISSUES RE: TERM SHEET.				
3/03/10	Santillan, Aida	1.30	773.50	24400	20184575
	ELIST OF TAX RELATED ISSUES INVOLVE ER 11 PLAN.	ED IN FRIED FRANK PR	ROPOSED TERM SH	EET RE: WMI	
03/08/10	Pohl, Joshua	1.30	715.00	24400	20274976
	W AND RESEARCH TERM SHEET TAX ISSU	JES.			
	L TASK CODE 24400 - TAX URING OF PLAN:	21.30	\$ 16,405.00		
03/01/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.50	315.00	24500	20107571
	W ISSUES RE: STIPULATION TO WITHDRA	W OBJECTION TO IRS	PROOF OF CLAIM		
03/03/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.20	126.00	24500	20118765
	ZE STIPULATION RE: IRS PROOF OF CLAI	M (.1) AND FORW ARD	SAME TO J. GEHT	(.1).	
03/04/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.10	63.00	24500	20121506
	W ORDER APPROVING STIPULATION.				
SUBTOTA CLAIM:	AL TASK CODE 24500 - IRS PROOF OF	0.80	\$ 504.00		
03/03/10	Baer, Lawrence	0.10	72.00	25100	20250768
	FROM P. REPASH RE: WASHINGTON MU	TUAL'S SEVERANCE PI	LAN.		
03/17/10	Margolis, Steven	1.10	792.00	25100	20228422
REVIE	W CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. MACIEL R M. SPITTELL RE: SAME AND TREATMENT	E: COMMON EQUITY I	NTERESTS (.5); CO	NFERENCES	
03/23/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.30	154.50	25100	20232724
REVIE EMPLO	W CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN S. MAR DYEES IN COBRA, EXPIRATION OF COBR	GOLIS AND M. SPITTEI A PERIOD.	LL RE: PARTICIPAT	TION OF WMI	
03/31/10	Margolis, Steven	0.40	288.00	25100	20224622
	ER WITH M. SPITTELL RE: BANKRUPTCY	CODE 502(B)(7) CAP A	ND RELATED ISSU	ES AND	
	AL TASK CODE 25100 - GENERAL	1 00	£ 1 20.2 E0		
EMPLOY	YEE ISSUES:	1.90	\$ 1,306.50		

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/11/10	Margolis, Steven	0.80	576.00	25200	20232424
REVIEV FOR LA	V EHRO ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURES KEVIEW PENSION PLAN (.3).	FORWARDED FROM M.	SPITTELL (.5); RI	EVIEW SAME	
03/16/10	Coursant, Caroline	0.60	399.00	25200	20245984
REVIEW	V DOCUMENT RE: PLAN AMENDMENT (	3); PRO VIDE COMMENTS	S TO M. SPITTELL	(.3).	
	L TASK CODE 25200 - PENSION PLAN	1.40	\$ 975.00		
ISSUES:		1.70	φ / / σ.σσ		
03/05/10	Margolis, Steven	0.70	504.00	25210	20231354
PLAN (	R WITH M. SPITTELL RE: IRS EXTENSION .2); REVIEW PROPOSAL RE: ANNUAL FUI DN (.3); CONFER WITH C. COURSANT RE:	NDING NOTICE FROM M.	ATION FOR WAM SPITTELL VIA TO	U PENSION OWERS	
03/05/10-	Coursant, Caroline	0.30	199.50	25210	20244986
CONFE CORRE	R WITH S. MARGOLIS AND M. SPITTELL SPOND WITH M. SPITTELL RE: SAME (.1)	RE: REQUEST ANNUAL I	FUNDING NOTICE	3 (.2);	
03/31/10	Margolis, Steven	0.50	360.00	25210	20224381
	W ISSUES RE: WAMU PENSION PLAN AND TELL RE: SAME (.2).	NUAL FUNDING NOTICE	(.3); CORRESPON	DENCE WITH	
SUBTOTA PLAN:	AL TASK CODE 25210 - CASH BALANCE	1.50	\$ 1,063.50		
03/01/10	Margolis, Steven	0.40	288.00	25220	20229100
REVIE'SETTLI	W ISSUES FROM AND CORRESPONDENCE EMENT AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL.	E WITH K. KLINKHAMM	ER RE: SELIP SSE	RP	
03/01/10	Margolis, Steven	0.70	504.00	25220	20229672
	W PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMEN	T AND PROVIDE COMM	ENTS TO R. SHAR	MA RE: SAME	,
03/01/10	Sharma, Rahul	3.30	1,501.50	25220	20127350
REVIE	W SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.0); REV EN AND S. MARGOLIS RE: SELIP-SSERP	ISE SELIP-SSERP SETT LE AGREEMENT (.4).	EMENT AGREEME	NT (1.9); EMA	IL
03/02/10	Margolis, Steven	0.40	288.00	25220	20227825
	W AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCY RTICIPANT AND SELIP BENEFIT.	E FROM K. DIBLASI AND	K. KLINKHAMM	ER RE: LETTE	R
03/02/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	126.00	25220	20115746
REVIE	W DRAFT COMMUNICATION TO SELIP P	ARTICIPANT.			
03/03/10	Margolis, Steven	0.90	648.00	25220	20231281
CONFE REVIE	ERENCE WITH ALVAREZ & MARSAL, R. S W AND REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEME	SHARMA, E. KOVACS AN ENT (.4).	D W MI RE: SET TI	LEMENT (.5);	
03/03/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	189.00	25220	20118768
	ING WITH R. SHARMA RE: SELIP DOCUM	ENT.			

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID	
CONFE	RENCES WITH S. MARGOLIS, R. SHARMA,	ALVAREZ & MARSAL	AND WMI RE: SET	TLEMENT.		
03/03/10	Sharma, Rahul	5.00	2,275.00	25220	20127364	
REVISE SELIP-SSERP AGREEMENT (2.8); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS, E. KOVACS, WMI, AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL RE: AGREEMENT (.5); PREPARE FOR SAME (.2); CONFER WITH K. DIBLASI RE: SAME (.3); REVISE AGREEMENT (.8); EMAIL TO AKIN GUMP RE: AGREEMENT (.4).						
03/04/10	Rosen, Brian	1.20	1,170.00	25220	20336566	
REVIE	W SSERP/SELIP AGREEMENT.					
03/04/10	Margolis, Steven	1.00	720.00	25220	20231214	
LIMITA	W ISSUES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH MATIONS (.2) AND REVIEW IRS CORRESPONDENCES WATSON RE: 2010 ANNUAL FUNDANA.3).	DENCE RE: SAME (.3);	REVIEW CORRESP	ONDENCE		
03/04/10	Coursant, Caroline	0.10	66.50	25220	20244981	
REVIE	W ANNUAL PENSION PLAN FUNDING NOT	ICE REQUEST.				
03/04/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.60	378.00	25220	20121797	
REVIE	W ISSUES RE: SELIP SETTLEMENT.					
03/04/10	Kovacs, Eva	2.70	1,390.50	25220	20226555	
REVIE AGREE	W CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. KLINKHAM MENT (.9); REVIEW 11 PARTICIPANTS SET DENTIALITY AGREEMENT RE: THE ANNU	TLEMENT AGREEME	R. SHARMA RE: SE NT (.9); REVIEW AI	ETTLEMENT ND REVISE		
03/04/10	Sharma, Rahul	4.50	2,047.50	25220	20127374	
REVISE SELIP-SSERP AGREEMENT (.9); EMAILS RE: SAME (.3); REVISE SAME AND CIRCULATE (.7); REVISE AGREEMENT (.3); EMAIL TO PARTICIPANT'S COUNSEL (.2); REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS (.7); CALL WITH AKIN GUMP RE: AGREEMENT (.2); EMAIL AKIN GUMP'S COMMENTS TO WGM TEAM AND WMI AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL (.3); REVISE AGREEMENT (.4); REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO AGREEMENT AND AKIN GUMP COMMENTS (.5).						
03/05/10	Margolis, Steven	2.70	1,944.00	25220	20231355	
VARIOUS CONFERENCES WITH R. SCHACHTER, ALVAREZ & MARSAL AND WMI RE: SELIP SSERP SETTLEMENT (.6) AND INDIVIDUAL PARTICIPANT SETTLEMENT (.5); REVEW AND COMMENT RE: DOCUMENTATION FOR SAME, REVIEW ISSUES RE: PAYROLL WITHHOLDING (.5); CONFER WITH R. SHARMA AND K. DIBLASI RE: 9019 MOTION FOR SELIP SETTLEMENTS (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WMI, ALVAREZ & MARSAL, K. DIBLASI AND R. SHARMA RE: SELIP-SSERP AGREEMENTS (1.0).						
03/05/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.30	1,449.00	25220	20126503	
WITH PARTI RE: SE (.1); C. RESPO	W AND COMMENT ON NOTICE OF COMPL B. ROTH SCHILD RE: SELIP DO CUMENT (.1) CIPANTS' COUNSEL DRAFT NOTICE OF COLIP DOCUMENT (.1); CONFERENCE WITH ALL WITH COUNSEL TO SELIP/SSERP PARTOND TO EMAIL FROM K. KLINKHAMMER FOLIP DOCUMENT (.5); CALL WITH S. MARG LIP/SSERP ISSUES (1.0).	); EMAIL WGM TEAM )MPLETION OF BRIEFI S. MARGOLIS AND R. : FICIPANTS RE: PENDII (E: SAME (.1); CALL W	RE: SAME (.1); EMA ING (.1); EMAIL B. 1 SHARMA RE: SELII NG ISSUES (.1); RE' ITH AKIN GUMP A	AIL ROTHSCHILD PASSERP ISSUES VIEW AND ND WGM TEAN	S	
03/05/10	Sharma, Rahul	6.70	3,048.50	25220	20127340	

SETTLEM RE: SAMI DIBLASI,	019 MOTION FOR SELIP SETTLEMENTS (2.2); CAL ENT (.3); PREPARE FOR (.1) AND PARTICIPATE IN 3 (.1); REVISE AGREEMENT AND CIRCULATE (.6); AND S. MARGOLIS RE: SELIP-SSERP AGREEMEN' 10 WMI RE: SAME (.5).	I CALL WITH K. DIB! CALL WITH WMI. A	LASI AND S. M LVAREZ & MA	RSAL, K.	
03/06/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.00	910.00	25220	20127337
REVISE 9	019 MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SELIP AGREEMI	ENTS.			
03/07/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.50	945.00	25220	20129641
REVIEW	AND COMMENT ON MOTION IN CONNECTION W	ITH SELIP/SSERP ISS	SUES.		
03/07/10	Sharma, Rahul	3.90	1,774.50	25220	20127825
REVISE 9 PARTICII	019 MOTION TO APPROVE SELIP SETTLEMENT APANT SELIP SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.5); EM	GREEMENTS (1.9); I AILS RE: 9019 MOTIO	ORAFT INDIVII ON (.5).	DUAL	
03/08/10	Margolis, Steven	1.20	864.00	25220	20231646
	AND COMMENT RE: SELIP AND SSERP SETTLEM AMMER RE: SAME (.2).	ENT AGREEMENTS	(1.0); CONFER '	WITH K.	
03/08/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	189.00	25220	20133378
REVIEW	ISSUES RE: MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT	(.1); MEETING WITH	I R. SHARM A R	E: SAME (.2)	
03/08/10	Sharma, Rahul	4.20	1,911.00	25220	20150431
MARSAI SETTLEI INDIVID CALL W	WITH K. DIBLASI RE: 9019 MOTION FOR SELIP SI L RE: SELIP SETTLEMENTS (.4); REVISE 9019 MOT MENT (.9); CALL WITH WMI RE: INDIVIDUAL PAR UAL PARTICIPANT SETTLE MENT (1.3); REVISE IN ITH WMI RE: INDIVIDUAL PARTICIPANT SETTLE: MENTS (.2).	ION AND INDIVIDUA TICIPANT SETTLEM IDIVIDUAL PARTICI	AL PARTICIPAI ENT (.3); REVI PANT SETTLEI	NT SE MENT (.7);	
03/09/10	Rosen, Brian	0.10	97.50	25220	20336630
MEMOR	ANDUM TO K. DIBLASI RE: SELIP AGREEMENT.				
03/09/10	Margolis, Steven	0.70	504.00	25220	20231654
REVIEW KOVAC	NEW DRAFTS OF SELIP AND SSERP AGREEMEN'S AND R. SHARMA RE: SAME (.3).	TS (4) AND CORRES	PONDENCE WI	ттн Е.	·
03/09/10	Margolis, Steven	0.70	504.00	25220	20275282
CONFER COMPE	R WITH M. SPITTELL RE: BENEFIT PLAN ISSUES A NSATION PLANS (.4); REVIEW DOCUMENTATION	AND LISTS, NONQUA FROM D. FRIESEN R	LFIED DEFERF E: SAME (.3).	RED	
03/09/10	Kovacs, Eva	1.40	721.00	25220	20227034
INDIVIT	/ SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE: 10 PARTICIPAN OU AL PARTICIPANT (.4); REVIEW MOTION FOR A R. SHARMA RE: COMMENTS TO THE SETTLEMEN	PPROVAL OF SETTL	EM ENT AG REE	EEMENT RE MENTS (.4);	:
03/09/10	Sharma, Rahul	3.30	1,501.50	25220	20150386
REVIEV SETTLE	V SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.5); REVISE INDIVI MENTS AND CIRCULATE (1.8); REVISE SAME (1.0	DUAL PARTICIPANT ).	AND 10 PART	ICIPANT	

0.30

216.00

25220

20232316

CONFER WITH K. KLINKHAMMER RE: SELIP SSERP ISSUES.

Margolis, Steven

03/10/10

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/10/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.70	441.00	25220	20283673
CONFE	R WITH R. SHARMA RE: SELIP SETTLEME	NTS (.5); REVIEW ISSUE	ES RELATED TO S	AME (.2).	
03/10/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.80	1,274.00	25220	20150390
CALL W CIRCUL	VITH COUNSEL (2); EMAILS RE: SELIP SE ATE TO INSURERS (1.4); CALL WITH K. D	TTLEMENTS (.5); REVIS DIBLASI RE: SAME (.5); C	E SELIP SETTLEM ALL WITH WMI R	ENTS AND E: SAME (.2).	
03/11/10	Margolis, Steven	1.70	1,224.00	25220	20234612
CORRE	SSUES, DRAFTS OF AGREEMENTS, PROPOSPONDENCE WITH K. KLINKHAMMER, C SPONDENCE WITH E. KOVACS RE: SELIP	. WELLS AND K. DIBLAS	AND RATE LOCK SIRE: SAME (.4);	SS (1.2);	
03/11/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.90	567.00	25220	20144769
REVIEW	V ISSUES RE: SELIP/SSERP (.8); CALL WIT	H R. SHARMA RE: SELIP	CLAIM (.1).		
03/11/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.40	206.00	25220	20225999
PLANS'	V CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. DIBLASI A ' (2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AMON FER OF BENEFIT PLANS (.2).	AND S. MARGOLIS RE: D IG S. MARGOLIS, K. DIB	DEFINITION OF "I LASI AND M. SPIT	BENEFIT TTELL RE:	
03/11/10	Kovacs, Eva	0.80	412.00	25220	20226342
RE: RE' MAIL T EXPLA	W CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. KLINKHA VIEW AND COMMENTS ON CORPORATE O D. TALERICO RE: SELIP/SSERP SETTLE NATION OF THE RATE LOCK (2); REVIEW GOLIS RE: SAME (.1).	VERIFICATION FORM F. EMENT (.1): REVIEW AM	ROM PRUDENTIA ERICAN GENERA	.L (.2); DRAFT I L'S FORMAL	
03/11/10	Sharma, Rahul	5.30	2,411.50	25220	20171100
SAME (	TION TO SELIP AGREEMENT ISSUES, INC (4.5); CALL WITH K. DIBLASI RE: SELIP C (TICIPANT'S CLAIM (.7).	CLUDING EMAILS RE: SA LAIM (.1); REVIEW REJE	AME AND REVIEV ECTION ORDERS V	V AND REVISE WITH RESPECT	
03/12/10	Margolis, Steven	0.90	648.00	25220	20232665
CORRE	W AND RESPOND TO ISSUES AND DRAFT ESPONDENCE AND CONFERENCES WITH SED OR DER FOR SAME (.3).	S OF AGREEMENTS RE: K. KLINKHAMMER RE:	SELIP AND SSER SAME (.3); REVIE	P ISSUES (.3); W CHANGES T	О
03/12/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.90	1,197.00	25220	20148854
ANDR	E DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER WITH RESPE . SHARMA RE: SELIP/SSERP ISSUES (.5); C HAMMER AND R. SHARMA RE: SAME (.2)	CALL WITH D. TALERICO	O RE: SAME (.3); C	CALL WITH K.	8
03/12/10	Sharma, Rahul	3.00	1,365.00	25220	20150560
WITH	W SELIP-SSERP AGREEMENTS (.2); CONF K. DIBLASI AND K. KLINKHAMMER RE: S SI RE: SAME (.2); REVISE SELIP AGREEM WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL AND W MI R	SSERP AGREEMENTS (.5 ENTS (.7): CONFER WITI	); CALL WITH WM H K. DIBLASI RE:	II AND K. SAME (.2);	L
03/13/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	25220	20149684
REVIE	W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM R. S.	HARMA RE: SELIP/SSER	P.		
03/13/10	Coleman, Erica	9.80	4,459.00	25220	20242158

	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
SHMMA	W AND ANALYZE SETTLEMENT AGREEM ARIZING THE TERMS OF THE SETTLEME ARIZING BACKGROUND INFORMATION	NT AGREEMENT (4.2); I	DRAFT SECTION O	ON F 9019 MOTIO	N
03/13/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.20	546.00	25220	20150470
EMAILS TO CRE	S RE: 9019 MOTION AND SELIP SETTLEM DITORS COMMITTEE RE: SETTLEMENT	ENTS (.4); EM AILS RE: S S (.4).	SELIP SETTLEMEN	TS (.4); EMAIL	,
03/14/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.40	182.00	25220	20170921
EMAILS	S RE: SELIP AGREEMENTS.				
03/15/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	25220	20224285
CONFE	RENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH EMENT.	K. KLINKHAMMER AN	D K. DIBLASI RE: S	ELIP SSERP	
03/15/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.50	315.00	25220	20157374
REVIE	W ISSUES RE: SELIP/SSERP SETTLEMEN	Γ.			
03/15/10	DiBlasi, K elly	0.60	378.00	25220	2029950
	ESPONDENCE AND CONFERENCE WITH SEMENT.	S. MARGOLIS AND K. K.	LINKHAMMER ON	SELIP SSERP	
03/15/10	Sharma, Rahul	2.00	910.00	25220	2017094
EMAIL	S RE: SELIP AGREEMENTS (.3); REVISE S	SELIP AGREEMENTS AN	ID 9019 MOTION (1	.7).	
03/16/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	25220	2034590
MEMO: WITH I	RANDUM TO C. SMITH RE: SELIP ISSUES K. DIBLASI AND R. SHARMA RE: SELIP/S	S (.1); CALL WITH C. SM SERP A GREEMENTS (.3)	ITH RE: SAME (.1); ).	CONFERENCE	3
03/16/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.60	1,638.00	25220	2016040
CONFE COMM	ERENCE WITH R. SHARMA AND B. ROSE ENT ON REVISED VERSIONS OF SAME (	N RE: SELIP/SSERP AGR 1.0); REVIEW ISSUES RE	EEMENTS (.3); REVE: SAME (1.3).	VIEW AND	
03/16/10	Sharma, Rahul	6.00	2,730.00	25220	2017093
AGREE AGREI	ER WITH K. DIBLASI AND B. ROSEN RE: S EMENTS AND 9019 MOTION (1.1); EMAIL EMENTS AND CALLS AND EMAILS RE: S AL AND FILE ALL MOTIONS AND AGREE	S RE: SELIP AGREEMEN AME (2.6); EMAILS RE: :	ITS (.5); REV ISE SE	LIP	ON
03/17/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.30	136.50	25220	2017093
EMAII	LS RE: SELIP AGREEMENTS AND MOTIO	N.			
03/19/10	Rosen, Brian	0.20	195.00	25220	2034494
	W HFA/SELIP MEMORANDUM (.1); MEM	ORANDUM TO S. MARG	OLIS RE: SAME (.1	).	
03/22/10	Margolis, Steven	0.30	216.00	25220	202293
	EW SELIP SSERP DOCUMENT FROM K. K.				
02/02/10	Manualia Stavan	0.40	288.00	25220	202293
03/23/10 CORR	Margolis, Steven ESPONDENCE WITH K. KLINKHAMMER			20220	2022
JORG	Kovacs, Eva	1.40	721.00	25220	202327

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW (.9); REV	CORRESPONDENCE AND SUMMARY FROM IEW E-MAIL SENT BY S. MARGOLIS RE: SA	M K. KLINKHAMMER ME (.3); REVIEW REV	RE: SELIP/SSERP ISED SUMMARY	SETTLEMENT SHEET (.2).	
03/25/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.30	136.50	25220	20193714
CALL W	ITH ALVAREZ & MARSAL RE: SELIP WITH	HOLDING.			
03/29/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.60	273.00	25220	20244686
EMAILS	RE: SELIP 9019 MOTION.				
03/30/10	Margolis, Steven	0.80	576.00	25220	20224619
	SPONDENCE WITH M. SPITTELL RE: ANNUA ES TO SAME (.6).	AL FUNDING NOTICE	(.2); RESEARCH A	ND DRAFT	
03/30/10	Sharma, Rahul	0.30	136.50	25220	20244676
EMAILS	AND CALLS RE: 9019 FOR SELIPS.				
SUBTOTAL PLANS:	L TASK CODE 25220 - NON-QUALIFIED	100.40	\$ 52,993.00		
03/04/10	Margolis, Steven	0.20	144.00	25240	20231213
REVIEW	/ ISSUES RE: TRANSFER OF AD&D PREMIU R WITH M. SPITTELL RE: SAME (.1).	M RESERVE STABILIZ	ZAT ION FUND FR	OM UNUM (.I)	<b>;</b>
SUBTOTA MEDICAL	L TASK CODE 25240 - EMPLOYEE	0.20	\$ 144.00		
		2.50	987.50	26100	20105897
03/01/10 RESEA1	Enayati, Robert RCH RE: DIRECTION OF PAYMENT RIGHTS.		707.50	20100	
		4.20	1,659.00	26100	20118711
03/03/10 DRAFT	Enayati, Robert MEMORANDUM RE: DIRECTING PAYMEN		,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		
		0.10	66.50	26100	20130709
03/07/10 REVIE	Petherbridge, Vaughan WEMAILS RELATING TO NON-DISCLOSUR				
		0.30	189.00	26100	20129988
03/07/10 REVISI COMM	DiBlasi, Kelly E NON-DISCLOSURE AGREEMENT WITH EC ENTS FROM J. SAGOT (.2) AND FORWARD S	OUITY COMMITTEE F	INANCIAL ADVIS		DE
03/10/10	Stangland, Elaine	2.60	2,340.00	26100	20187552
	ERENCE CALL WITH CREDITORS COMMITT	EE AND FRIED FRAN	K RE: PRIORITY I	SSUES.	
03/26/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.60	399.00	26100	20198160
	RE FORM OF NON-DISCLOSURE AGREEME		BY FINANCIAL A	DVISOR.	
	AT TANK CODE 1/100 CENTED AT				
CORPOR	AL TASK CODE 26100 - GENERAL ATE ISSUES:	10.30	\$ 5,641.00		
03/05/10	Gold, Simeon	0.70	693.00	26200	20141063
WORK	ON WMI SECURITIES TRADING.				

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/08/10	Gold, Simeon	0.50	495.00	26200	20140907
WORK	ON WMI SECURITIES TRADING.				
03/10/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.20	133.00	26200	20156925
RESPO GOLDM	ND TO EMAIL RE: PREFERRED STOCK (.1) . (AN SACHS AND U.S. BANK RE: REMOVAL	AND REVIEW AND RES OF RESTRICTIVE LEGI	POND TO VOICE END FROM WMI S	MAILS FROM SECURITIES (.	1).
03/11/10	Gold, Simeon	0.70	693.00	26200	20156603
WORK	ON WMI SECURITIES TRANSFER ISSUES.				
03/11/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.20	133.00	26200	20156932
	SS REMOVAL OF RESTRICTIVE LEGEND W	ITH REPRESENTATIVE	S FROM GOLDMA	AN SACHS AN	D
03/12/10	Gold, Simeon	0.60	594.00	26200	20156605
WORK	ON WMI SECURITIES TRANSFER ISSUES.				
03/15/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.40	266.00	26200	20174484
	D TO TRANSFER REQUEST FROM FBR.				
03/16/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	1.40	931.00	26200	20174614
ATTEN	ID TO REQUESTS FROM SECURITYHOLDE. ICTIVE LEGEND, INCLUDING REVIEW OF ECTION WITH REQUEST AND PREPARATION	ALL REP LETTERS AND	SHARE CERTIFI	EMOVE CATES IN	
03/17/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.30	199.50	26200	20174308
REVIE	W AND RESPOND TO REQUESTS FROM SE	CURITYHOLDERS RE: F	REMOVAL OF LEG	BENDS.	
03/18/10	Margolis, Steven	0.60	432.00	26200	20228164
CONFE CONTI	R WITH M. SPITTELL RE: TREATMENT OF ROL (.4); REVIEW DOCUMENTATION RE: S.	RESTRICTED STOCK A AME (.2).	ND IMPACT OF C	CH ANGE IN	
03/19/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.60	399.00	26200	20174787
REVIE REVIE	W REQUESTS TO REMOVE RESTRICTIVE I W AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING I	LEGEND (.2); PREPARE I THERETO (.2).	NO OBJECTION L	ETTERS (.2);	
03/26/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.20	133.00	26200	20198227
REVIE	W AND RESPOND TO REQUESTS FROM SE	CURITYHOLDERS TO F	REMOVE RESTRIC	CTIVE LEGENI	Э.
03/29/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.70	465.50	26200	20237457
ATTEI LEGEI	ND TO REQUESTS FROM WMI SECURITYH ND AND PREPARE NO OBJECTION LETTER	OLDERS AND BROKER: S.	S TO REMOVE RE	ESTRICTIVE	
03/30/10	Petherbridge, Vaughan	0.70	465.50	26200	20237234
REVIE TO EM	EW AND RESPOND TO REQUESTS TO REMO I AILS RELATING TO ANNUAL MEETING Q	OVE RESTRICTIVE LEG UESTIONS (.3).	END (.4); REVIEW	V AND RESPON	ND
03/30/10	Pohl, Joshua	1,10	605.00	26200	20231336
REVIE	EW TRANSACTION LOG AND SEC FILINGS.				
03/31/10	Gold, Simeon	1.30	1,287.00	26200	20238440

TASK TIME ID HOURS AMOUNT DATE TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION WORK ON WEIL NO-OBJECTION LETTERS FOR WMI SECURITIES TRANSFERS. SUBTOTAL TASK CODE 26200 - SECURITIES 10.20 \$7,924.50 ISSUES: 20130463 0.70 465.50 26300 03/03/10 Petherbridge, Vaughan DISCUSS SETTLEMENT RELATED BOARD RESOLUTIONS WITH T. SAPEIKA AND J. SAGOT (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO RESOLUTIONS (.4). 205.50 26300 20200853 0.30 03/03/10 Sapeika, Tal CONFER WITH J. SAGOT AND V. PETHERBRIDGE RE: BOARD RESOLUTIONS RELATING TO POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT. 20125738 1.60 728.00 26300 03/03/10 Sagot, Jonathan TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH V. PETHERBRIDGE AND T. SAPEIKA RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT BOARD RESOLUTIONS (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM V. PETHERBRIDGE RE: BOARD RESOLUTION PRECEDENT (.2); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM T. SAPEIKA RE: WMI'S CURRENT REPORTING OBLIGATIONS UNDER THE EXCHANGE ACT (2); DRAFT BOARD RESOLUTIONS APPROVING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.9). 20125550 546.00 26300 03/04/10 Sagot, Jonathan 1.20 REVIEW AND REVISE BOARD RESOLUTIONS APPROVING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.1); EMAIL V. PETHERBRID GE RE: DRAFT OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RESOLUTIONS (.1). SUBTOTAL TASK CODE 26300 - CORPORATE GOVERNANCE AND BOARD-RELATED ISSUES: 3.80 \$ 1,945.00 0.20 133 00 26400 20237164 03/29/10 Petherbridge, Vaughan REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT AND ACCOMPANYING 8-K. 20216222 91.00 26400 03/29/10 Sagot, Jonathan REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM K. DIBLASI RE: MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FILING (.1); EMAIL V. PETHERBRIDGE RE: FORM 8-K FOR MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (.1). 26400 20216151 0.40 182.00 03/30/10 Sagot, Jonathan REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM K. DIBLASI AND J. MACIEL RE: FORM 8-K AND MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (.3); DRAFT FORM 8-K (.1). 1,001.00 26400 20218618 2.20 03/31/10 Sagot, Jonathan REVIEW AND COMMENT ON EDGARIZED FORM 8-K AND MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (1.6); EMAILS TO M. MARAVILLA RE: COMMENTS TO FORM 8-K AND MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (.4); EMAILS TO K. DIBLASI RE: MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FILING (.1); EMAIL TO J. MACIEL, C. JANG AND K. DIBLASI RE: MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT AND 8-K FILING (.1). 26400 20241525 1,012.50 4.50 03/31/10 Maravilla, Mel PREPARE/FILE FORM 8-K AND MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT EXHIBIT WITH THE SEC VIA EDGAR (3.9); CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SAGOT RE: SAME (.4); PROVIDE FILING CONFIRMATION (.2). SUBTOTAL TASK CODE 26400 - CORPORATE 7.50 \$ 2,419.50 COMMUNICATIONS/FILINGS: 27100 20250684 0.10 90.00 03/01/10 Berz, David

DAŢE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	Hours	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW	SUPPLEMENTAL COVERAGE LETTER R	E: A CLAIM FILED.			
03/01/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.30	205.50	27100	20201083
REVIEW	AND REVISE MOTION TO AMEND COM	FORT ORDER FOR BLEN	NDED POLICY.		
03/02/10	DuPuy, Carolyn	1.00	845.00	27100	20309857
	CH RE: FDAP AND INSURANCE.				
02/02/10	Voton Enin	0.40	182.00	27100	20125456
03/02/10 PREPAR	Yates, Erin E FOR CALL WITH D. SPRAGG RE: INVE	NTORY OF INSURANCE	CLAIMS (.1); CALI	WITH D.	
SPRAGO INSURE	RE: INVENTORY OF INSURANCE CLAIM R CONTACTS AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO D.	MS (.1); PULL TOGETHE SPRAGG RE: SAME (.2).	R CONTACT INFOR	MATION FUR	
03/02/10	Sapeika, Tal	0.40	274.00	27100	20200761
CALL W C. GREE SAME (.	/ITH P. ANDERSON RE: ZURICH AND OLI ER AND E. YATES RE: SAME (.1); CALL W 1).	D REPUBLIC SETTLEME ITH C. JANG RE: SAME	NT AGREEMENT ( (.1); CONFER WITH	.1); EMAIL TO I A. LANDIS R	E:
03/03/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	27100	20270422
DRAFT	E-MAIL TO C. SMITH AND B. ROSEN RE:	DAVIS WRIGHT TREMA	INE AND AON'S I	NVOICES.	
03/04/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	27100	20310013
	/ E-MAILS FROM P. AND ERSON AND A. I		AND RESTATED O	LD REPUBLIC	
	URICH SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS.		•		
03/05/10	Yates, Erin	0.30	136.50	27100	20125635
(1) PR	VITH R. SHARMA RE: MOTION TO ADVA EPARE EXHIBITS TO MOTION TO ADVA MAIL SAME TO R. SHARMA (.1); CIRCUL	NCE DEFENSE COSTS U	NDER THE BLEND	ED POLICIES	
03/05/10	Sharma, Rahul	1.00	455.00	27100	20127343
REVISE ATTEN	MOTION FOR INSURANCE COMFORT OF TION TO FILING OF INSURANCE MOTION	RDER (.6); CALL WITH E N (.3).	B. YATES RE: SAMI	E (.1);	
03/08/10	Berz, David	0.20	180.00	27100	20250515
	NG WITH E. YATES RE: INSURANCE ITEM	AS.			
03/08/10	Yates, Erin	1.40	637.00	27100	20165078
MEET V AND D CALL ( INSURA E-MAIL	WITH D. BERZ RE: INSURANCE ITEMS (.2) RAFT E-MAIL TO A. JETER RE: A. FISHMA. 2); CALL WITH C. SMITH, C. WELLS, J. G ANCE ITEMS (.3); CALL WITH R. JAIN RE: L. WITH R. JAIN RE: INSURANCE CALL AG AND NOTES RE: SAME (.3).	AN'S DEFENSE COSTS (. OULDING, R. JAIN, D. S : AON CONSULTING INV	2); PREPARE FOR I PRAGG AND R. HO OICES AND CHAR	INSURANCE SKINS RE: TIS CLAIM (.1	);
03/10/10	Berz, David	0.20	180.00	27100	20251039
сомм	UNICATE WITH A. REA RE: ERISA ISSUE	S.			
03/10/10	Yates, Erin	0.20	91.00	27100	20148044
	w and respond to e-mails from D. I		TEM S.		
03/10/10	Yates, Erin	0.30	136.50	27100	20165500

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
DALE	X ATAD ELDE A DAID AUGUSTA A LON				
REVIEW SAME (.)	INSURANCE POLICIES RELATED TO TH	E BKK LIABILITIES (.2)	AND E-MAIL WITI	H D. BERZ RE:	
03/11/10	Berz, David	1.80	1,620.00	27100	20250512
CORRES	MULTIPLE INSURANCE POLICIES FROM SPONDENCE AND MEMOS RE: ORDER OF BILITY OF CRIME COVERAGE (.8).	C. SMITH AND ANALY PAYMENTS UNDER BL	ZE EA CH (1.0); RE ENDED POLICY A	VIEW LATEST ND	
03/15/10	Berz, David	1.80	1,620.00	27100	20250665
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. ROSEN AND E. YATES RE: INSURABLE CLAIMS AGAINST THE ESTATE (.3); DISCUSSIONS WITH E. YATES AND B. ROSEN RE: TOWER INSURANCE POLICY ISSUES (.2); CALL WITH B. ROSEN, K. DIBLASI, C. SMITH, T. SAPEIKA, E. YATES AND ALVAREZ & MARSAL TEAM RE: INSURANCE POLICIES (1.3).					
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	0.50	487.50	27100	20344793
CALL W BERZ A	VITH D. BERZ AND E. YATES RE: INSURA ND E. YATES RE: TOWER INSURANCE PO	BLE CLAIMS AGAINST DLICY ISSUES (.2).	THE ESTATE (.3); (	CALL WITH D.	
03/15/10	Rosen, Brian	1.30	1,267.50	27100	20344800
	VITH C. SMITH, D. BERZ, E. YATES, K. DI NCE POLICIES.	BLASI, T. SAPEIKA AND	ALVAREZ & MAR	SAL RE:	
03/15/10	Yates, Er in	5.50	2,502.50	27100	20165488
CALL W WITH C SWEEN WITH E MAILS CLAIM C. WEL GOULD AND R. REVIEV	CT AND REVIEW INFORMATION RE: CLAIMS ITH D. BERZ AND B. ROSEN RE: CLAIMS IT. WELLS RE: BLENDED INSURANCE TOWN EY AT AON RE: INVENTORY OF CLAIMS IT. ELSBREE RE: CLAIMS NOTICED AGAINST OD. BERZ, B. ROSEN AND E. ELSBREE IS NOTICED AGAINST THE BLENDED INSULA LICENSE LS AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO C. WELLS RE ING, B. ROSEN, D. BERZ, T. SAPEIKA, C. HOSKINS (1.3); CALL WITH D. BERZ AND WETHER CRIME PROOFS OF LOSS, THE 200 ED MEMOS FROM 2009 (1.9); DRAFT E-MENTS PROVISION IN THE 2007-2008 BLENGE.	S AGAINST THE BLENDI VER (.1); LEAVE MESSA AGAINST THE BLENDE IST THE BLENDED INSU RE: SAME (.2); COMMUI URANCE TOWER (.2); R : SAME (.2); INSURANCE WELLS, R. JAIN, B. KOS OB. ROSEN RE: BLENDI 7-2008 BLENDED POLIC AIL TO D. BERZ RE: SAM	ED INSURANCE IC GE FOR AND CALI ED INSURANCE TO JRANCE TOWER ( NICATIONS WITH E VIEW PROOFS OI E CALL WITH C. SN TUROS, D. SPRAGG ED INSURANCE TO LY AND THE CRIM ME (.2); REVIEW OI	JWER (.2); CAL L WITH D. JWER (.2); CALI 3); DRAFT E- D. BERZRE: F LOSS SENT BY MITH, J. G, K. DIBLASI JWER (.3); E BOND- RDER OF	
03/15/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.50	1,027.50	27100	20200735
CALL V INSURA ISSUES	WITH B. ROSEN, K. DIBLASI, C. SMITH, D ANCE POLICIES (1.3); CORRESPONDENCI (.2).	. BERZ,E. YATES, ALVA E WITH E. YATES RE: ZU	AREZ & MARSAL T URICH AND OTHEI	EAM RE: R INSURANCE	
03/15/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	378.00	27100	20289336
PARTI	AL PARTICIPATION IN CALL WITH CLIE	NT AND WGM TEAM RE	: TOWER INSURA	NCE.	
03/16/10	Yates, Erin	0.30	136.50	27100	20165433
REVIE R. JAIN	W AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM D. B I RE: SAME AND THE OLD REPUBLIC AN EMENTS (.1).	ERZ RE: CRIME PROOFS	S OF LOSS (.2); DRA ND RESTATED SE	AFT E-MAILS TO TTLEMENT	)
03/16/10	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	63.00	27100	20160461
	W ISSUES RE: INSURANCE DOCUMENTS				
03/17/10	Berz, David	1.50	1,350.00	27100	20250680

TIME ID TASK AMOUNT HOURS TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION DATE CONFERENCE WITH E. YATES RE: 2007-2008 BLENDED INSURANCE POLICY AND THE INSURANCE POLICIES RELATING TO THE BKK LITIGATION (.4); REVIEW OF BKK MATTER AND RELATED INSURANCE COVERAGE (1.1). 20165857 27100 1.70 773.50 Yates, Erin 03/17/10 DISCUSS THE 2007-2008 BLENDED INSURANCE POLICY AND THE INSURANCE POLICIES RELATING TO THE BKK LITIGATION WITH D. BERZ (.4); CALL WITH K. DIBLASI RE: BKK LITIGATION AND RELATED INSURANCE POLICIES (.1); REVIEW THE BLENDED POLICY FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS' BOND PROVISIONS AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO C. SMITH ET AL. RE: BLENDED POLICY (6); DRAFT E-MAIL TO D. BERZ RE: BKK LIABILITIES (.1); REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO THE BKK LIABILITIES AND THE RELATED INSURANCE POLICIES (.5). 20163534 189.00 27100 0.30 03/17/10 DiBlasi, Kelly CALL WITH E. YATES RE: BKK INSURANCE (.1); REVIEW ISSUES RE: SAME (.2). 136.50 27100 20170024 0.30 03/19/10 Yates, Erin COMMUNICATE WITH P. ANDERSON RE: OLD REPUBLIC AND ZURICH AMENDED AND RESTATED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS (.1); CALL WITH P. ANDERSON RE: KEMPER NOVATION (.1); CALL WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: SAME (.1). 68.50 27100 20283247 0.10 Sapeika, Tal 03/19/10 CONFER WITH E. YATES RE: KEMPER NOVATION. 318.50 27100 20192340 0.70 03/20/10 Yates, Erin REVIEW INSURANCE POLICIES RELATING TO THE BKK LIABILITIES (.4); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS RE: SAME (.3). 27100 20250471 90.00 0.10 03/22/10 Berz, David MEET WITH E. YATES RE: BKK LIABILITIES AND RELATED INSURANCE POLICIES. 20192877 27100 819.00 03/22/10 Yates, Erin REVIEW INSURANCE POLICIES RELATING TO THE BKK LIABILITIES (.5); CONFER WITH D. BERZ RE: BKK LIABILITIES AND RELATED INSURANCE POLICIES (.1); CHECK FOR OBJECTIONS TO DOCKET NO. 2473 AND COORDINATE FILING OF A CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: DOCKET NO. 2473 AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO A. REA RE: SAME (.4); CALL WITH C. SMITH RE: ERISA LITIGATION (.1): DRAFT E-MAIL TO A. JETER RE: CARRIER NOTICE ADDRESSES (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM B. ROSEN AND T. SAPEIKA RE: KEMPER / LUMB ERMENS' SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.1); CALL WITH D. STEIN RE: COMMENTS ON NOTICE LETTER TO INSURANCE CARRIERS (.2); È-MAIL WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME (.2). 27100 20192899 2,411.50 5.30 03/23/10 Yates, Erin CALL WITH P. ANDERSON RE: KEMPER NOVATION (.2); CALL WITH C. SMITH, R. BERENSTAIN, B. ROSEN, A. BRETTLER AND D. STEIN RE: DRAFT NOTICE (.4); REVISE SAME AND SEND TO C. SMITH AND B. ROSEN (.6); CALL WITH R. BERENSTAIN AND D. STEIN RE: ERISA LITIGATION(.2); E-MAIL C. SMITH RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH A. REA RE: SUPPLEMENTAL MOTION TO ADVANCE DEFENSE COSTS UNDER THE BLENDED POLICIES AND DRAFT E-MAILS TO A. REA RE: RELATED CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION (.2); REVIEW CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION FOR THE MOTION TO ADVANCE DEFENSE COSTS UNDER THE BLENDED POLICIES (.1); CALL WITH R. BERENSTAIN AND D. STEIN RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT NOTICE LETTER (.3); REVISE NOTICE LETTER AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO C. SMITH AND B. ROSEN RE: SAME (.5); CALL WITH T. SAPEIKA RE: INSURANCE ITEMS (.4); CALL WITH C. SMITH, B. ROSEN, D. STEIN AND R. BERNSTEIN RE: ERISA LITIGATION (.4); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM A. KELLY RE: NOTICE PARTIES (.1); PREPARE FINAL LIST OF NOTICE PARTIES, REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE LETTER, COORDINATE EXECUTION, MAILING AND DELIVERY OF SAME, AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO NOTICE PARTIÉS RE: SAME (1.7); E-MAIL T. SAPEIKA RE: LATEST VERSION OF THE OLD REPUBLIC AND ZURICH AMENDED AND RESTATED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS (.1).

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CALL W SETTLE	ITH E. YATES RE: CERTAIN INSURANCI MENTS, AND EMAILS WITH C. SMITH R	B M ATTERS, INCLUDIN E: SAME.	IG ZURICH AND OLI	O REPUBLIC	
03/24/10	Yates, Erin	2.40	1,092.00	27100	20193395
REVIEW INSURA	/ NOTES RE: CHARTIS CLAIM AND LEA N CE CARRIERS RE: ERISA (.8); DRAFT, 1	VE MESSAGE FOR M.L REVIEW AND RESPONI	EVITT RE: SAME (.1 ) TO E-MAILS RE: S	); CALL WITH AME (1.5).	
03/24/10	Mishkin, Jessie	0.70	385.00	27100	20322642
CONFER	R WITH R. SHERMAN RE: INSURANCE PO	LICIES.			
03/24/10	Sherman, Rachel	1.50	682.50	27100	20186061
	INSURANCE POLICIES (.8); CALLS WIT	H J. MISHKIN RE: SAM	E (.7).		
03/25/10	Yates, Erin	4.20	1,911.00	27100	20193559
GUNCH (.1); CA: FROM S REA RE ERISA I CHART GEYER BLEND	TRANSCRIPT FROM MARCH 12, 2010 HICK RE: ERISA LITIGATION (.5); CALL ALL WITH A. TURKI RE: ERISA DAMAGE MARGOLIS AND R. BERENSTAIN RE: I SIDLEY AUSTIN'S ENGAGEMENT (.2); LITIGATION (.3); LEAVE MESSAGE FOR IS' CLAIM (.2); REVIEW DOCKET REPOR (.1); REVIEW E-MAILS FROM THE INSUED POLICY PROVISIONS RE: SETTLEMEND TO E-MAILS FROM C. SMITH RE: SAME	.ND CORRESPONDENC S ANALYSIS (.8); REVII DAMAGES ANALYSIS C REVIEW E-MAILS AND M. LEVITT AT CHARTI; TS (.2); REVIEW AND R RANCE CARRIERS RE: INT AND DRAFT RESPO	E WITH A. BRETTLI EW AND RESPOND T CALL (.1); REVIEW L LETTERS FROM C. S AND E-MAIL WITI ESPOND TO E-MAII ERISA LITIGATION.	ER RE: SAME TO E-MAILS ETTER FROM A LEMLEY RE: H A. NG RE: L FROM T. REVIEW	Α.
03/26/10	Berz, David	0.40	360.00	27100	20250328
REVIEV	V CHUBB INSURANCE ISSUES.				
03/26/10	Yates, Erin	0.60	273.00	27100	20193593
RE: SAN WITH C	V E-MAILS FROM G. ELSBREE AND C. S ME (.1); REVIEW LETTER FROM D. HENS C. SMITH RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW E-MAIL V E-MAIL FROM T. GEYER RE: ERISA LI	LER RE: FEDERAL INS S FROM R. BERENSTA	URANCE COMPANY	' (.1); CALL	
03/27/10	Berz, David	1.30	1,170.00	27100	20250508
RE: DIS DEMAN SETTLI	ON SETTLEMENT RE: INSURANCE PRO SPUTE WITH CARRIER UPDATES (.2) AN NDING PARTICIPATION (.5); REVIEW PR EMENT TERMS (.2); REVIEW CORRESPO EMAND LETTERS (.2).	D PROVIDE OUTLINE F IOR CORRESPONDENC	OR LETTER TO CH E FROM CARRIERS	UBB RE: PROPOSEI	)
03/27/10	Yates, Erin	2.20	1,001.00	27100	20205577
RE: ER	W COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE INSUITS ASETTLEMENT (1.9); CALL WITH D. F.C. SMITH AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO R. BE	BERZ RE: SAME (.2); RE	VIEW AND RESPON	D.HENSLER D TO E-MAIL	
03/28/10	Berz, David	2.30	2,070.00	27100	20250510
(.5); PR RE: SA DEMA) COMM ERISA BEREN	W CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEFENSE OF EPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON COMME (.7); REVIEW AND REVISE DEFENSE ND LETTER TO CHUBB (.2); REVIEW EN ENT RE: SAME (.2); COMMENT ON PERICASE INCLUDING REVISION RE: NOTICE (STEIN, E. YATES, D. STEIN, A. BRETTLIE, YATES RE: SAME (.1).	IFERENCE CALL WITH COUNSEL'S PROPOSEI GAGEMENT LETTER F KINS DEMAND LETTER E ISSUE (.2); CONFERE	DEFENSE COUNSE D LETTER TO CHUB ROM A. REA TO C. S TO CHUBB RE: SE NCE CALL WITH C.	L AND C. SMIT: B (.2); FINALIZ SMITH AND TTLEMENT OF SMITH, R.	H E

03/28/10

TIME ID

HOURS AMOUNT TASK TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION DATE REVIEW E-MAILS RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT AND MARK-UPS OF LETTER TO D. HENSLER (.6); REVISE SAME AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO D. HENSLER RE: SAME (.3); CALL WITH C. SMITH, R. BERENSTAIN, D. BERZ, D. STEIN, K. VAUGHN AND A. BRETTLER RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT (2); CALL WITH D. BERZ RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW LETTER RE: SAME DRAFTED BY PERKINS COIE AND E-MAIL COMMENTS TO D. BERZ RE: SAME (.2). 27100 20250511 1.20 1.080.00 03/29/10 Berz, David REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. HENSLER RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT (.1); REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM R. BERENSTAIN RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT LITIGATION ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH E. YATES RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW DRAFT LETTERS FROM E. YATES AND RESPOND WITH COMMENTS TO SAME ACCEPTING SETTLEMENT OFFER (.1); MEET WITH E. YATES RE: FEDERAL INSURANCE COMPANY AND RELATED ISSUES (.4); MEET WITH E. YATES RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH E. YATES AND C. SMITH RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT AND SIDLEY FEES (2); DISCUSS SAME WITH E. YATES (.1). 1,365.00 27100 20216232 3.00 03/29/10 Yates, Erin REVIEW INSURANCE MATERIALS (4); MEET WITH D. BERZ RE: FEDERAL INSURANCE COMPANY AND RELATED INSURANCE ISSUES (.4); REVIEW LETTER AGREEMENT WITH THE FDIC-RECEIVER (.1) AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO C. SMITH, B. ROSEN AND D. BERZ RE: SAME (.2); MEET WITH D. BERZ RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH D. BERZ AND C. SMITH RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT AND SIDLEY FEES (.2); DISCUSS SAME WITH D. BERZ (.2); CALL WITH R. BERENSTAIN RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT (.1); DISCUSS SAME WITH D. BERZ (.1); REVIÈW LETTER FROM D. HENSLER RE: FEDERAL AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO SAME (.4); E-MAIL WITH C. SMITH AND D. BERZ RE: SAME (.1); DRAFT LETTER TO J. CLARKE RE: ERISA SETTLÈMENT AND E-MAIL SAME TO D. BERZ (.5); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM E. ELSBREE RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT (.1); DISCUSS SAME WITH D. BERZ (.1). 0.30 270.00 27100 20251177 Berz, David 03/30/10 REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO FDIC FROM E. YATES RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT AND RESPOND WITH COMMENTS. 20250284 03/30/10 Berz, David 0.70 630.00 27100 DISCUSSIONS WITH E. YATES RE: REVISIONS TO LETTER TO D. HENSLER RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT (.2); DISCUSSIONS WITH C. SMITH RE: XL SPECIALITY RESPONSE (2); FINALIZE ERISA SETTLEMENT LETTER TO D. HENSLER (.1); REVIEW JOINT STATUS REPORT FROM A. REA AND RESPOND WITH COMMENTS (.2). 27100 20216291 318.50 0.70 03/30/10 Yates, Er in DISCUSS DRAFT LETTER TO THE FDIC WITH D. BERZ (.2); REVISE SAME AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO C. SMITH AND B. ROSEN RE: SAME (2); REVIEW LETTER, DATED MARCH 24, 2010, FROM WILEY REIN TO B. LEHMAN (.1); CALL WITH S. CAPLOW RE: DAVIS WRIGHT TREMAINE'S INVOICES (.1); REVIEW SAME AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO C. SMITH RE: SAME (.1). 27100 20251262 0.70630.00 03/31/10 Berz, David TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. YATES RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT ISSUES (.2); REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM D. HENSLER RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT DRAFTS CONCERNING THE WASHINGTON MUTUAL ERISA LITIGATION AND RESPOND WITH COMMENTS (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM E. ELSBREE RE: ERISA LITIGATION AND COMMENT TO E YATES (.3). 0.20 91.00 27100 20228705 03/31/10 Yates, Erin CALL WITH D. BERZ RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT ISSUES. 27100 20216692 136.50 0.30 03/31/10 Yates, Erin E-MAIL WITH R. JAIN RE: CHARTIS NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF PROOFS OF CLAIM NOS. 2191 AND 2193 (.1); LEAVE MESSAGES FOR A. JETER AND C. SMITH RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW LETTER FROM R. BERENSTAIN RE: ERISA SETTLEMENT AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO D. BERZ RE: SAME (.1).

55.70

\$ 33,139.00

SUBTOTAL TASK CODE 27100 - GENERAL

**INSURANCE MATTERS:** 

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/02/10	Yates, Erin	2.20	1,001.00	27200	20270378
REVIEW DIRECT	PERKINS COIE'S COMMENTS ON THE M OR AND OFFICER INSURANCE POLICIES	OTION TO ADVANCE I AND REVISE SAME.	DEFENSE COSTS U	NDER THE	
03/03/10	Yates, Erin	1.50	682.50	27200	20270423
REVIEV DIRECT (.2).	PERKINS COIES COMMENTS ON THE M OR AND OFFICER LIABILITY POLICIES (.	(OTION TO ADVANCE 1 7); REVISE SAME (.6); I	DEFENSE COSTS U E-MAIL MARKUP T	NDER THE O T. SPAEIKA	
03/04/10	Yates, Erin	1.50	682.50	27200	20125869
AGREE	VITH T. SAPEIKA RE: AMENDED AND RESMENTS AND THE MOTIONS TO ADVANCE INTS TO MOTION TO ADVANCE DEFENSES (.3); REVISE SAME (.6) AND E-MAIL DR.ES (.2).	E DEFENSE COSTS (.4); E COSTS UNDER DIREC	REVIEW S. KNOLV CTOR AND OFFICE	WES' R INSURANCE	
03/04/10	Sapeika, Tal	1.00	685.00	27200	20200720
	MOTION TO AMEND DIRECTOR AND O R WITH E. YATES RE: SAME (.4).	FFICER COMFORT ORI	DER PREPARED BY	E. YATES (.6);	
03/08/10	Yates, Erin	0.20	91.00	27200	20274980
DIRECT	VITH S. KNOWLES AT PERKINS COE RE: FOR AND OFFICER INSURANCE POLICIES O C. SMITH RE: DIRECTORS AND OFFICE	AND REVIEW COMME	ENTS RE: SAME (.1)	UNDER THE ); DRAFT E-	
03/09/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	27200	20165393
REVIEV PURSU	V AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM S. KN ANT TO DIRECTOR AND OFFICER INSUR	OWLES RE: MOTION T ANCE POLICIES.	O ADVANCE DEFE	INSE COSTS	
03/10/10	Yates, Erin	0.40	182.00	27200	20283122
PURSU	W AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM S. KN ANT TO DIRECTOR AND OFFICER INSUR ME, REVISE SAME AND DRAFT E-MAIL T	ANCE POLICIES $(.1)$ ; $R$ J	EVIEW S. KNOWLE	ENSE COSTS ES' COMMENTS	
03/11/10	Yates, Erin	0.40	182.00	27200	20283736
RESPO	ND TO INQUIRY FROM J. MISHKIN RE: DI	RECTOR AND OFFICE	R INSURANCE POL	ICIES.	
03/15/10	Yates, Erin	0.10	45.50	27200	20289182
DRAFT	E-MAILS TO A. JETER RE: DIRECTOR AN	ID OFFICER INSURANC	CE.		
03/19/10	Yates, Erin	0.20	91.00	27200	20283134
REVIE DRAFT	W AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM A. JE E-MAIL TO K. DIBLASI ET AL. RE: SAME SON AND A. LANDIS (.1).	TER RE: DIRECTOR AN	ID OFFICER COVER AND AGREEMEN	RAGE AND IS SENT BY P.	
03/22/10	Yates, Erin	4.10	1,865.50	27200	20281523
PROVI	W BLENDED AND DIRECTOR AND OFFIC SIONS, DRAFT AND REVISE LETTER TO I E PARTIES (3.7); REVIEW AND RESPOND	NSURANCE CARRIERS	RE: SAME AND CO	OMPILE LIST OF	
CHETAT	L TASK CODE 27200 - D&O INSURANC	E: 11.70	\$ 5,553.50		
PORTOTA	L IASK CODE 2/200 - DEO INSURANC	2). II./V	φ J <sub>9</sub> JJJJJJU		

875.50

28100

20218966

1.70

03/01/10

Quinn, Georgia

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIE	W WMB CAPITAL STRUCTURE AND DEBT	ISSUANCES.			
	AL TASK CODE 28100 - GENERAL S ISSUES:	1.70	\$ 875.50		
GRAND I	rotal:	3,983,50	\$ 2,410,265.25		

# Exhibit B

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/03/10	CURRO, MATTHEW L. LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/3/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 03/ HOME, 02/10, 02/17, 02/21, 02/23/10	011 NY; INVOICE#: 20 01/10. M.CURRO	15768843 9100301; - TAXIS	65.00
03/03/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/3/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 03/ HOME, 02/21, 02/11, 02/17/10			40.84
03/03/10	CURRO, MATTHEW L. LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/3/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 03/ HOME, 01/25, 02/16/10	011 NY; INVOICE#: 20 /01/10. M.CURRO	15768845 0100301; - TAXIS	27.00
03/08/10	HORTON, JR., WILLIAM H. LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/8/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 03, HOME, 02/22/10			25.00
03/08/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/8/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 03/HOME, 03/01, 03/02, 03/04/10			30.00
03/10/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/10/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 HOME, 02/24/10			10.00
03/12/10	HORTON, JR., WILLIAM H. LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/12/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 HOME, 03/02/10			25.00
03/17/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/17/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 HOME, 03/15, 03/16/10	011 NY; INVOICE#: 20 3/17/10. V.CHANE	15802022 0100317; DIS - TAXIS	22.00
03/18/10	VEIT, CHERI	011	15802861	20.92

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/18/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 03 HOME, 03/18, 03/16/10	NY; INVOICE#: 20 3/18/10.C.VEIT - T	0100318; AXIS	
03/22/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B.	011	15805428	26.00
	LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/22/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 TAXIS HOME, 03/16, 03/18/10	NY; INVOICE#: 20 3/22/10. R.SHERM	)100322; AN -	
03/25/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B. LOCAL TRANSPORTATION	011	15815229	9.87
	VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/25/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 3. TAXI HOME, 1/22/10	NY; INVOICE#: 20 /25/10 - JESSIE B.	010325; MISHKIN-	•
03/26/10	WINE, JENNIFER L.	011	15822256	15.00
	LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - DC PETTY CA DATE: 3/1/2010 - REPLENISH PETTY 3/26/2010 - TAXI WGM/COURT RE:HE	CASH BATCH 3/1		
03/29/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K.	011	15822703	79.80
	LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/29/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 HOME, 02/19, 02/23, 03/05, 03/12, 03/17,	3/29/10.R.SHARM	0100329; A - TAXIS	
03/31/10	QUINN, GEORGIA D.	011	15831645	22.60
	LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/31/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 HOME, 03/15, 03/26, 03/23/10	NY; INVOICE#: 20 3/3 1/10. G.QUINN	0100331; - TAXIS	
03/31/10	MILLS, MARVIN	011	15831701	100.00
	LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/31/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 HOME, 03/21, 03/22, 03/18, 03/11, 03/09, 03/23, 03/24/10	3/3 1/10. M.MILLS -	- TAXIS	
03/31/10	DIBLASI, KELLY	011	15831706	10.00
	LOCAL TRANSPORTATION VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/31/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 HOME, 03/21/10	NY; INVOICE#: 2 3/31/10. K.BLAS -	0100331; TAXI	
03/04/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	012	15769871	40.00

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT	
	TRAVEL VENDOR: ROSEN, BRIAN INVOICE#: CREX0026247903042104 DATE: 3/4/2010 AGENCY FEE'S, TICKET:8900520891450, FEB 04, 2010 - HEARINGS.				
03/04/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TRAVEL VENDOR: ROSEN, BRIAN INVOICE#: O DATE: 3/4/2010 RAIL, TICKET:0364319238598, FEB 05, FROM/TO: WILMINGTON/NYPENN			15.00	
03/04/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TRAVEL VENDOR: ROSEN, BRIAN INVOICE#: O DATE: 3/4/2010 RAIL, TICKET:5547733747400, FEB 04, FROM/TO: NYPENN/DE/NY PENN			283.00	
03/04/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TRAVEL VENDOR: ROSEN, BRIAN INVOICE#: 0 DATE: 3/4/2010 ROOM AND TAX FEB 05, 2010 - HEAR		15769876 042104	438.90	
03/04/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TRAVEL VENDOR: ROSEN, BRIAN INVOICE#: 0 DATE: 3/4/2010 TAXI/CAR SERVICE FEB 05, 2010 - HE HOTEL/AMTRAK			11.00	
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y DATE: 3/2/2010 TRAVEL AGENCY FEE FOR MARTIN/ 0520853066		15805279 03022010A E TICKET #:	40.00	
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y DATE: 3/2/2010 TRAVEL AGENCY FEE FOR LOGAN/I 0520853067		15805280 03022010A E TICKET #:	40.00	
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	012D	15805281	40.00	

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT		
	DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y E DATE: 3/2/2010 TRAVEL AGENCY FEE FOR SMITH/CE 0520891451		E#: 03022010A E TICKET #:			
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	012D	15805303	40.00		
	DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y BTA) INVOICE#: 03022010A DATE: 3/2/2010 TRAVEL AGENCY FEE FOR KOSTUROS/WILLIAM FEE TICKET #: 0521406743					
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	012D	15805304	40.00		
	DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y	BTA) INVOIC	E#: 03022010A			
	DATE: 3/2/2010 TRAVEL AGENCY FEE FOR MACIEL/3 0521406744	OHN FE	E TICKET #:			
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	012D	15805305	40.00		
	DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y BTA) INVOICE#: 03022010A					
	DATE: 3/2/2010 TRAVEL AGENCY FEE FOR GOULDIN 0521406746	IG/JOHN ]	FEE TICKET #:			
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN DOMESTIC TRAVEL	012D	15805317	252.00		
	VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y BTA) INVOICE#: 03022010A DATE: 3/2/2010 AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR MARTIN/COLLEEN ON 02/04/2010 ROUTING: NYP.WIL STM CLASS: COACH TICKET #: 7733747391					
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	012D	15805318	253.00		
	DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y BTA) INVOICE#: 03022010A DATE: 3/2/2010					
	AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR LOGAN/DOREEN ON 02/04/2010 ROUTING: NYP.WIL NWK CLASS: COACH TICKET #: 7733747392					
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	012D	15805319	268.00		
	DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y DATE: 3/2/2010 AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL EXPE 02/04/2010 ROUTING: NYP.WIL NWK #: 7733747401	NSES FOR SM	//ITH/CHAD ON			

<b>DATE</b>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y.) DATE: 3/2/2010 AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL EXPEN KOSTUROS/WILLIAM ON 02/24/2010 I CLASS: COACH TICKET #: 77381562	ISES FOR ROUTING: NYP.W		315.00
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y. DATE: 3/2/2010 AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL EXPEN 02/24/2010 ROUTING: NYP.WAS NYP #: 7738156205	NSES FOR MACIE	L/JOHN ON	315.00
03/02/10	ROSEN, BRIAN DOMESTIC TRAVEL VENDOR: AMERICAN EXPRESS (N.Y DATE: 3/2/2010 AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL EXPEN ON 02/24/2010 ROUTING: NYP.WAS N TICKET #: 7738156207	NSES FOR GOULE	OING/JOHN	315.00
03/08/10	DIBLASI, KELLY TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1378202 DA XYZ 8057774 80 RODDEN KELLY 4004 FROM: M NEW YORK 767 5 AVE TO: I	RIDE DATE: 2010	15802095 0-01-28 8: 02:07	112.43
03/08/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: ONE PLATINUM LIMOUSIN DATE: 2/19/2010 PLATINUM T 15752 5 BRIAN ROSEN* 01-12 FROM: M 100 E 63 ST TO: HOM	VIP 0183 RIDE DA	TE: 2010-	117.42
03/08/10	DIBLASI, KELLY TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1378203 DA XYZ 1010217824 209 KELLY DIBLASI FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RIDE	4004 RIDE DATE:	15804050 2010-02-16	106.33
03/08/10	SANTILLAN, AIDA P. TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1378973 DA XYZ 1010218148 303 PILAR SANTILLA 18 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RI	AN 1490 RIDE DAT	15805491 ГЕ: 2010-02-	20.96
03/08/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	014	15805684	117.42

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT	
	TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1378973 DATE: 3/3/2010 XYZ 1010218759 311 BRIAN ROSEN 0183 RIDE DATE: 2010-02-23 FROM: M 151 E 58 ST TO: HOME RIDE TIME: 21:20				
03/08/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1378973 DA XYZ 1010218944 28 BRIAN ROSEN 018 FROM: M 2 W 60 ST TO: HOME RIDE	3 RIDE DATE: 201	15805747	124.07	
03/18/10	FRONGILLO, THOMAS C. TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: BOSTON'S BEST TRANSPORT 1579; DATE: 3/10/2010 - CAR SERVICE FROM WGM TO HOME 2/12/10	014 RTATION, INC.; IN E T. FRONGILLO I	15802044 IVOICE#: PACKAGE	106.20	
03/24/10	SANTILLAN, AIDA P. TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379600 DA XYZ 1010219118 371 PILAR SANTILLA 25 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RII	N 1490 RIDE DAT	15882867 E: 2010-02-	20.96	
03/24/10	SANTILLAN, AIDA P. TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379600 DA XYZ 1010218935 180 PILAR SANTILLA 24 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RII	N 1490 RIDE DAT	15882872 TE: 2010-02-	20.96	
03/24/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379600 DA XYZ 1010219286 32 BRIAN ROSEN 018 FROM: M 23 VANDERBILT AVE TO: I	3 RIDE DATE: 20		117.42	
03/24/10	ROSEN, BRIAN TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379600 DA XYZ 1010219373 274 BRIAN ROSEN 01 FROM: NY MANHATTAN 767 5 AVE T	83 RIDE DATE: 20		117.42	
03/24/10	VENDITTI, DANIEL J. TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379600 DA XYZ 1010219501 151 DANIEL VENDIT 01 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RI	TI 4038 RIDE DAT	15883049 TE: 2010-03-	99.68	
03/24/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	014	15883119	120.75	

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT	
	TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379600 DATE: 3/10/2010 XYZ 1010219651 342 BRIAN ROSEN 0183 RIDE DATE: 2010-03-02 FROM: M 152 W 52 ST TO: HOME RIDE TIME: 20:52				
03/24/10	SANTILLAN, AIDA P. TAXI SERVICE - LEGAL VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379600 DA XYZ 1010219708 210 PILAR SANTILLA 02 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RI	N 1490 RIDE DAT	15883145 TE: 2010-03-	20.96	
03/24/10	WU, EDWARD SKYLINE TAXI - LEGAL VENDOR: SKYLINE CREDIT RIDE, IN 1/29/2010 SKYLINE 1010215554 281 WU EDWAR 27 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RID	RD 5380 RIDE DAT		55.33	
03/24/10	HINES, NICHOLE SKYLINE TAXI - LEGAL VENDOR: SKYLINE CREDIT RIDE, IN 1/29/2010 SKYLINE 1010214766 202 HINES NICH 01-20 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME	IOLE 5280 RIDE D	DATE: 2010-	64.24	
03/24/10	TURNER, KIM P. SKYLINE TAXI - LEGAL VENDOR: SKYLINE CREDIT RIDE, IN- 1/29/2010 SKYLINE 1010214664 84 TURNER KIN 20 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RI	1 5528 RIDE DATI		38.70	
03/08/10	SWANEY, NICOLE TAXI SERVICE - SUPPORT STAFF VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1378973 DA XYZ 1010219496 71 NICOLE SWANEY FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RIDE	7403 RIDE DATE	15805827 : 2010-03-01	88.59	
03/08/10	SWANEY, NICOLE TAXI SERVICE - SUPPORT STAFF VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1378973 DA XYZ 1010218939 340 NICOLE SWANE 24 FROM: M 767 5 AVE TO: HOME RI	Y 7403 RIDE DATI	15805744 E: 2010-02-	45.90	
03/24/10	SWANEY, NICOLE TAXI SERVICE - SUPPORT STAFF VENDOR: XYZ INVOICE#: 1379599 DA XYZ 8077411 213 SWANEY NICOLE 74 FROM: M NEW YORK 767 5 AVE TO: 1	403 RIDE DATE: 2		39.81	

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/26/10	HENDRICKSON, LEISLENE SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH I DATE: 3/26/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 3/ HENDRICKSON - MEAL ALLOWANCE	26/10 LEISLENE	15816920 10326;	15.00
03/15/10	SWANEY, NICOLE SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/01/10 A	019A AT 20:22	15792543	25.88
03/15/10	SWANEY, NICOLE SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/03/10 A	019A AT 20:22	15792844	25.88
03/30/10	HENDRICKSON, LEISLENE SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10 A	019A AT 21:03	15827302	25.80
03/30/10	JACKSON, CHARISSE V. SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/14/10 A	019A AT 14:27	15826963	15.52
03/31/10	AXON, HILLARY A. SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10	019A AT 19:18	15833699	25.83
03/31/10	CASTILLERO, FRANCENE S. SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10 A	019A AT 19:18	15833638	25.83
03/15/10	SWANEY, NICOLE SUPPORT STAFF O/T MEALS 03/04/2010 DINNER NICOLE SWANEY	019G // LITIGATION-PA	15818402 ARALEGAL	11.93
03/10/10	WINE, JENNIFER L. ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: SEAMLESSWEB PROFESSION INVOICE#: 629812; DATE: 1/31/2010 - 1/31/10	020 DNAL SOLUTIONS SEAMLESSWEB	15784512 S, LLC; 1/16/10 -	14.40
03/10/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: WG&M LLP - PETTY CASH DATE: 3/10/2010 - NY PETTY CASH 0 WORKING MEAL, 02/27/10			12.89
03/10/10	HREN, EILEEN	020	15780514	12.97

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: SEAMLESSWEB PROFESSION INVOICE#: 629812; DATE: 1/31/2010 - 1/31/10	ONAL SOLUTIONS SEAMLESSWEB	S, LLC; 1/16/10 -	
03/10/10	BENFIELD, BRIANNA N	020	15780515	12.97
	ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: SEAMLESSWEB PROFESSION INVOICE#: 629812; DATE: 1/31/2010 - 1/31/10	ONAL SOLUTIONS SEAMLESSWEB	S, LLC; 1/16/10 -	
03/17/10	VAISHNAV, NEIL H.	020	15797637	23.65
	ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: SEAMLESSWEB PROFESSION INVOICE#: 648531; DATE: 3/7/2010 - 13/7/10 N. VAISHNAV DINNER 3/5/10	ONAL SOLUTIONS MEAL EXPENSES	S, LLC; 3/1/10-	
03/24/10	VAISHNAV, NEIL H.	020	15813051	25.09
	ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: SEAMLESSWEB PROFESSI- INVOICE#: 650031; DATE: 3/14/2010 - 3/14/10 N. VAISHNAV DINNER 3/10/10	MEAL EXPENSES	S, LLC; S 3/8/10-	
03/24/10	VAISHNAV, NEIL H.	020	15813127	27.43
	ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: SEAMLESSWEB PROFESSI INVOICE#: 650031; DATE: 3/14/2010 - 3/14/10 N. VAISHNAV DINNER 3/8/10	ONAL SOLUTION: MEAL EXPENSE:	S, LLC; S 3/8/10-	
03/31/10	VAISHNAV, NEIL H.	020	15831485	8.34
	ATTORNEY MEALS VENDOR: WG&M LLP - BOSTON OFF INVOICE#: 20100312; DATE: 3/31/2010 CASH 3/12/10-3/31/10 N. VAISHNAV L	- REIMBURSE P	; ETTY	
03/05/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	020A	15772674	11.61
	ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 02/27/10	AT 14:26		
03/05/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15772682	14.18
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 02/27/10	AT 16:32		
03/05/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15772764	32.40
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 02/24/10	AT 19:11		
03/05/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15772952	30.30
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 02/22/10	AT 19:24		

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/05/10	CURRO, MATTHEW L. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 02/23/10	020A AT 18:50	15772966	35.00
03/05/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 02/25/10	020A AT 18:49	15773036	23.06
03/15/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/06/10	020A AT 19:09	15792432	26.20
03/15/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/04/10	020A AT 20:19	15792459	30.64
03/15/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/03/10	020A AT 15:09	15792927	35.00
03/15/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/02/10	020A AT 17:55	15792570	35.00
03/15/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/03/10	020A AT 18:17	15792612	35.00
03/15/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/03/10	020A AT 18:46	15792634	33.93
03/15/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/01/10	020A AT 18:45	15792718	35.00
03/15/10	VENDITTI, DANIEL J. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/01/10	020A AT 18:51	15792722	20.90
03/15/10	CASTELLANI, ANNE K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/01/10	020A AT 19:20	15792741	19.54
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA	020A	15826969	35.00

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT	
ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/14/10 AT 13:44					
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A AT 0:14	15827079	16.09	
03/30/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A	15827106	33.96	
03/30/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/16/10	020A	15827113	24.60	
03/30/10	DIBLASI, KELLY ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/16/10	020A AT 20:26	15827155	28.32	
03/30/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A AT 18:54	15827183	29.01	
03/30/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A AT 19:24	15827189	19.41	
03/30/10	CASTELLANI, ANNE K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A AT 19:01	15827194	17.16	
03/30/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A AT 19:06	15827206	30.58	
03/30/10	PETHERBRIDGE, VAUGHAN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A ) AT 19:12	15827213	32.40	
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A 0 AT 19:29	15827224	31.38	
03/30/10	ROSEN, BRIAN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/18/10	020A	15827237	29.23	
03/30/10	MILLS, MARVIN	020A	15827253	14.92	

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/20/10	AT 12:44		
03/30/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827260	14.56
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/20/10	AT 15:21		
03/30/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827279	14.92
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 13:04		
03/30/10	ROSEN, BRIAN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827280	31.64
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 13:45		
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827281	23.48
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 13:41		
03/30/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827285	14.37
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 14:14		
03/30/10	DIBLASI, KELLY ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827299	29.81
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 20:23		
03/30/10	ROSEN, BRIAN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827300	29.80
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 20:23		
03/30/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827301	29.81
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 20:23		
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827303	20.95
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/21/10	AT 22:23		
03/30/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827342	30.58
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/15/10	AT 18:48		
03/30/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15827344	32.40
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/15/10	AT 18:45		
03/30/10	SAPEIKA, TALS.	020A	15827358	19.42

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/16/10	AT 18:39		
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/16/10	020A AT 18:22	15827365	34.49
03/30/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/16/10	020A	15827367	28.70
03/30/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/16/10	020A	15827418	33.51
03/30/10	DIBLASI, KELLY ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/17/10	020A	15827504	26.06
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/17/10	020A AT 18:19	15827517	31.65
03/30/10	VEIT, CHERI ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/17/10	020A AT 19:14	15827562	33.12
03/30/10	COSTA, JESSICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/19/10	020A AT 20:47	15827627	15.60
03/30/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/19/10	020A AT 21:22	15827633	18.81
03/30/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/20/10	020A AT 12:27	15827641	13.34
03/30/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/09/10	020A	15826436	32.96
03/30/10	DIBLASI, KELLY ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/12/10	020A	15826593	33.61
03/30/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B.	020A	15826650	10.81

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/13/10 A	AT 17:10		
03/30/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/11/10 A	020A	15826822	32.40
03/30/10	DIBLASI, KELLY	020A	15826913	28.93
	ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/11/10 A	AT 20:42		
03/31/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B. ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833704	33.95
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10	AT 18:10		
03/31/10	PETHERBRIDGE, VAUGHAN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833731	32.40
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10.	AT 19:19		
03/31/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10.	020A AT 20:01	15833756	35.00
00/01/10		020A	15833763	33.32
03/31/10	QUINN, GEORGIA D. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10		13633703	33.32
03/31/10	ROSEN, BRIAN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833768	77.51
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10 FOR MULTIPLE PARTIES DURING SE			
03/31/10	DIBLASI, KELLY ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833769	77.52
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10 FOR MULTIPLE PARTIES DURING SE	AT 20:31, NOTE: 0 TTLEMENT NEGO	ORDERED OTIATIONS	
03/31/10	TANG, AMIE ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833770	34.66
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10	AT 20:30		
03/31/10	QUINN, GEORGIA D. ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833183	32.26
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10	A1 19:40		
03/31/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10	020A AT 20:19	15833208	13.28
	THE PARTY AND THE STATE STATE OF A COLUMN TO			

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/31/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10 A	020A AT 23:12	15833227	17.42
03/31/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10 A	020A	15833228	17.41
03/31/10	DIBLASI, KELLY ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10 A	020A	15833229	17.42
03/31/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10 A	020A AT 18:17	15833319	34.52
03/31/10	POHL, JOSHUA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10 A	020A AT 20:25	15833402	31.44
03/31/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10 A	020A AT 20:36	15833404	33.94
03/31/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10	020A AT 18:15	15833426	33.23
03/31/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/23/10	020A AT 19:01	15833452	31.08
03/31/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10.	020A AT 18:34	15833478	35.00
03/31/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10	020A AT 18:38	15833482	34.83
03/31/10	DIBLASI, KELLY ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10	020A AT 18:50	15833487	31.59
03/31/10	ROSEN, BRIAN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10	020A AT 18:50	15833488	31.57

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/31/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833491	30.58
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/22/10 A	A1 18:41		
03/31/10	COLEMAN, ERICA ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/24/10 A	020A AT 18:37	15833571	27.85
03/31/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS	020A	15833579	30.58
	SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/24/10 A	AT 18:43		
03/31/10	MILLS, MARVIN ATTORNEY MEALS SEAMLESS WEB MEALS ON 03/25/10 A	020A	15833666	31.50
03/15/10	VENDITTI, DANIEL J. ATTORNEY MEALS 03/03/2010 DINNER DANIEL J VENDI	020G FTI LITIGATION	15818554	15.88
03/15/10	SAPEIKA, TAL S. ATTORNEY MEALS	020G	15818653	16.70
	03/02/2010 DINNER TAL SAPEIKA BU RESTRUCTURING	JSINESS FINANC	E &	
03/15/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	020G	15818680	27.12
	ATTORNEY MEALS 03/02/2010 LUNCH BRIAN ROSEN BU RESTRUCTURING	JSINESS FINANC	E &	
03/15/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	020G	15818782	13.79
	ATTORNEY MEALS 03/01/2010 LUNCH BRIAN ROSEN BU RESTRUCTURING	JSINESS FINANC	E &	
03/15/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B. ATTORNEY MEALS	020G	15819036	6.95
	03/09/2010 DINNER JESSIE B MISHKI	N LITIGATION		
03/15/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B. ATTORNEY MEALS	020G	15819166	4.62
	03/08/2010 DINNER JESSIE B MISHKI	N LITIGATION		
03/15/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT	020G	15819178	9.90
	ATTORNEY MEALS 03/08/2010 DINNER ROBERT ENAYA	TI CORPORATE		

<b>DATE</b>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/29/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA ATTORNEY MEALS 03/17/2010 DINNER VANESSA CHAND	020G DIS LITIGATION	15820010	16.41
03/29/10	MARGOLIS, STEVEN M. ATTORNEY MEALS 03/16/2010 DINNER STEVEN MARGOI	020G LIS TAX	15820068	12.50
03/29/10	COSTA, JESSICA ATTORNEY MEALS 03/16/2010 DINNER JESSICA COSTA I	020G LITIGATION	15820093	7.12
03/29/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. ATTORNEY MEALS 03/15/2010 DINNER TAL SAPEIKA BU RESTRUCTURING	020G USINESS FINANCE	15820189 E &	15.73
03/29/10	SANTILLAN, AIDA P. ATTORNEY MEALS 03/12/2010 DINNER PILAR SANTILLA	020G N TAX	15820263	11.05
03/29/10	VEIT, CHERI ATTORNEY MEALS 03/22/2010 DINNER CHERI VEIT LITIO	020G GATION	15820527	18.65
03/22/10	SHMALO, ROBERT C. POSTAGE POSTAGE NY DISK 03/02/2010 NUMBI	022 ER OF PIECE(S): 1	15806893	18.30
03/23/10	O'TOOLE, JR., PATRICK J. POSTAGE POSTAGE IN BOSTON 03/09/10	022	15811939	17.30
03/23/10	O'TOOLE, JR., PATRICK J. POSTAGE POSTAGE IN BOSTON 03/09/10	022	15811940	16.30
03/31/10	DIBLASI, KELLY POSTAGE POSTAGE NY DISK 03/24/2010 NUMBI	022 ER OF PIECE(S): 1	15835897	2.41
03/31/10	DIBLASI, KELLY POSTAGE POSTAGE NY DISK 03/29/2010 NUMBI	022 ER OF PIECE(S): 1	15836110	0.88
03/23/10	SWANEY, NICOLE	023X	15808450	6.35

<b>DATE</b>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/5/2010 TRACKING #: 791258182464 SHIPMEN' NICOLE SWANEY WEIL GOTSHAL & I AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 JOYCE, CROSS & SIMON, LLC, WILMI	T DATE: 20100301 MANGES, 767 FIF SHIP TO: MICHA	SENDER: TH EL J	
03/23/10	MANDEL, GARETH M AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/5/2010 TRACKING #: 941946577201 SHIPMEN RAYMOND CHURNEFTSKY WEIL GO FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, N WRIGHT, WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES W, WASHINGTON, DC 20005	T DATE: 20100224 TSHAL & MANGI Y 10153 SHIP TO: .	4 SENDER: ES, 767 JARRAD	23.93
03/23/10	MANDEL, GARETH M AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/5/2010 TRACKING #: 941946577212 SHIPMEN RAYMOND CHURNEFTSKY WEIL GC FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, N WRIGHT, WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES W, WASHINGTON, DC 20005	T DATE: 2010022 TSHAL & MANG Y 10153 SHIP TO:	4 SENDER: ES, 767 JARRAD	23.39
03/23/10	MANDEL, GARETH M AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/5/2010 TRACKING #: 941946577223 SHIPMEN RAYMOND CHURNEFTSKY WEIL GO FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, N WRIGHT, WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGE W, WASHINGTON, DC 20005	IT DATE: 2010022 DTSHAL & MANG Y 10153 SHIP TO:	4 SENDER: ES, 767 JARRAD	20.98
03/23/10	ROSEN, BRIAN AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/5/2010 TRACKING #: 790696871288 SHIPMEN BRIAN ROSEN WEIL GOTSHAL & MANEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO ESQ, SATTERLEE STEPHENS BURKE 1130, NEW YORK, NY 10169	NT DATE: 2010022 ANGES, 767 FIFTH : CHRISTOPHER I	25 SENDER: I AVENUE, BELMONTE,	5.86
03/29/10	VAN KAMPEN, ALLISON L.	023X	15823094	7.97

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/12/2010 TRACKING #: 790697769400 SHIPMEN ALLISON VAN KAMPEN WEIL GOTSH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 BENNETT, LICHTSIIN & HAENSEL, SO STE 1800, MILWAUKEE, WI 53202	T DATE: 20100305 IAL & MANGES, 1 SHIP TO: MICHA	SENDER: 767 FIFTH EL	
03/29/10	VAN KAMPEN, ALLISON L. AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/12/2010 TRACKING #: 790697769947 SHIPMEN ALLISON VAN KAMPEN WEIL GOTSH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 IVERSEN	T DATE: 20100305 IAL & MANGES, '	S SENDER: 767 FIFTH	22.63
03/29/10	VAN KAMPEN, ALLISON L. AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/12/2010 TRACKING #: 791258741931 SHIPMEN ALLISON VAN KAMPEN WEIL GOTSH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 WEINSTEIN	T DATE: 2010030: IAL & MANGES,	5 SENDER: 767 FIFTH	8.94
03/30/10	ESKOW, LISA R. AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/19/2010 TRACKING #: 720015262924 SHIPMEN MAIL SERVICES WEIL, GOTSHAL & N LOUISIANA, HOUSTON, TX 77002 SHIPMEN	T DATE: 20100313 MANGES LLP, 700	2 SENDER:	33.90
03/30/10	ESKOW, LISA R. AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS-EDI IN 3/19/2010 TRACKING #: 720015262957 SHIPMEN MAIL SERVICES WEIL, GOTSHAL & N LOUISIANA, HOUSTON, TX 77002 SH	T DATE: 2010031 MANGES LLP, 700	5 SENDER:	16.34
03/05/10	WGM, FIRM DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN NEW YORK 3/1/2010	024 BETWEEN 2/22/2	15771062 2010 TO	1652.40
03/12/10	WGM, FIRM	024	15791194	36.20

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT		
	DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 2/18/2010 TO 2/25/2010					
03/12/10	WGM, FIRM DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN NEW YORK 1 3/8/2010	024 BETWEEN 3/1/201	15791195 0 TO	341.20		
03/15/10	WGM, FIRM DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN NEW YORK 3/15/2010	024 BETWEEN 3/8/201	15794388 10 TO	156.00		
03/15/10	BOSTON, OFFICE DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN BOSTON BE 3/15/2010	024 FWEEN 3/8/2010 T	15794389	83.80		
03/26/10	WGM, FIRM DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN NEW YORK 3/22/2010	024 BETWEEN 3/15/20	15817458 010 TO	904.00		
03/31/10	WGM, FIRM DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN NEW YORK 3/29/2010	024 BETWEEN 3/22/20	15831048 010 TO	305.90		
03/31/10	BOSTON, OFFICE DUPLICATING (FIRM) PHOTOCOPIES MADE IN BOSTON BE 3/29/2010	024 TWEEN 3/22/2010	15831049 TO	580.20		
03/10/10	WGM, FIRM DUPLICATING (FIRM) 7803 PAGES PRINTED IN NEW YORK 02/28/2010	024D BETWEEN 02/01/2	15783701 2010 TO	780.30		
03/10/10	BOSTON, OFFICE DUPLICATING (FIRM) 1651 PAGES PRINTED IN BOSTON BE 02/26/2010	024D TWEEN 02/02/201	15783703 0 TO	165.10		
03/10/10	WASH, DC DUPLICATING (FIRM) 126 PAGES PRINTED IN WASHINGTO TO 02/26/2010	024D N DC BETWEEN (	15783704 02/01/2010	12.60		
03/10/10	DALLAS, OFFICE	024D	15783705	2.50		

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	DUPLICATING (FIRM) 25 PAGES PRINTED IN DALLAS BETW 02/23/2010	EEN 02/23/2010 T	0	
03/10/10	SILICON VALLEY, WGM DUPLICATING (FIRM) 5 PAGES PRINTED IN SILICON VALLE 02/04/2010	024D Y BETWEEN 02/0	15783706 4/2010 TO	0.50
03/10/10	WGM, FIRM DUPLICATING (FIRM) 1804 PAGES SCANNED IN NEW YORK 02/27/2010	024I BETWEEN 02/02/	15785858 /2010 TO	270.60
03/10/10	BOSTON, OFFICE DUPLICATING (FIRM) 2546 PAGES SCANNED IN BOSTON BE 02/26/2010	024I TWEEN 02/04/201	15785859 10 TO	381.90
03/26/10	NG, ALEXANDER W. DUPLICATING DUPLICATING CD/DVD IN NEW YORK 7 BINDING(S) FROM UNIT 10	024K CITY ON 03/15/1	15817873 10 12:05PM	0.70
03/31/10	AMPONSAH, DUKE PRINTING & PHOTOSTATS (OUTSIDE) VENDOR: DTI SKYLINE; INVOICE#: 51 BLOWBACK PRINTING,TABS, TECH T OBJECTIONS	.6966; DATE: 3/22		1608.94
03/24/10	MASTANDO, III, JOHN P. O/S MESSENGER - COURIER & TAXI VENDOR: SKYLINE CREDIT RIDE, INC 1/29/2010 SKYLINE 1010215029 367 PACKAGE*V DATE: 2010-01-22 FROM: M 767 5 AVE 01:17	VIP PACKAGE 050	66 RIDE	82.60
03/08/10	VIOLA, MATTHEW SERVICE FEES-EDGAR FILINGS FEBRUARY 2010 EDGAR FILING - ACC 0000909518-10-000136,SEC FILING DAT			110.00
03/08/10	VIOLA, MATTHEW SERVICE FEES-EDGAR FILINGS FEBRUARY 2010 EDGAR FILING - ACC 0000909518-10-000060,SEC FILING DAT			160.00
03/25/10	FORRESTIER, ASHLEY R.	072C	15816206	841.90

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	WESTLAW-COMPUTERIZED RESEAR HOUSTON WESTLAW - FORRESTIER, CONNECT TIME: 1:23:37 DOC/LINE(S	ASHLEÝ 03/12/20	010 IONS: 38	
03/25/10	FORRESTIER, ASHLEY R. WESTLAW-COMPUTERIZED RESEAR HOUSTON WESTLAW - MULLIGAN,D CONNECT TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S	IEDŘA 03/12/2010	15816207 ) ONS: 1	18.12
03/25/10	FORRESTIER, ASHLEY R. WESTLAW-COMPUTERIZED RESEAR HOUSTON WESTLAW - FORRESTIER, CONNECT TIME: 0:33:47 DOC/LINE(S	ASHLEÝ 03/15/20	15816208 010 IONS: 24	411.58
03/25/10	BOSSHARD-BLACKEY, ELIZABETH WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAU BOSTON WESTLAW - BOSSHARD-BL 03/09/2010 CONNECT TIME: 0:00:00 D TRANSACTIONS: 4	ACKÈY,ELIZÁBE	15815443 TH	23.50
03/25/10	VAISHNAV, NEIL H. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAR BOSTON WESTLAW - VAISHNAV,NEI TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANS	IL 03/10/2010 ĆOI	15815444 NNECT	93.50
03/25/10	VAISHNAV, NEIL H. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAI BOSTON WESTLAW - VAISHNAV,NEI TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 2 TRANS	IL 03/09/2010 ĆOI	15815445 NNECT	32.00
03/25/10	GHACHEM, MALICK W. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAU BOSTON WESTLAW - GHACHEM, MA TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	LICK 02/17/2010	15815446 CONNECT	376.04
03/25/10	GHACHEM, MALICK W. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAU BOSTON WESTLAW - GHACHEM, MA TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	LICK 02/18/2010	15815447 CONNECT	96.36
03/25/10	GHACHEM, MALICK W. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAT BOSTON WESTLAW - GHACHEM, MA TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANS	LICK 02/16/2010	15815448 CONNECT	62.21
03/25/10	CLOUTIER, LISA N. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAUBOSTON WESTLAW - CLOUTIER, LISA TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	A 03/09/2010 CON	15815449 INECT	12.50

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/25/10	O'TOOLE, JR., PATRICK J. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAR BOSTON WESTLAW - OTOOLE,PATRIC TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 13 TRANS	CK 03/15/2010 CC	15815450 DNNECT	221.86
03/25/10	LEONARD, SARAH A. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAR BOSTON WESTLAW - LEONARD, SARA TIME: 2:03:25 DOC/LINE(S): 133 TRAN	AH 03/11/2010 CC	15815451 DNNECT	1900.82
03/25/10	IALUNA, SABRINA M. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAR BOSTON WESTLAW - IALUNA, SABRIT TIME: 0:50:37 DOC/LINE(S): 1490 TRA	NA 03/11/2010 CC	15815452 ONNECT	306.86
03/25/10	IALUNA, SABRINA M. WESTLAW- COMPUTERIZED RESEAR BOSTON WESTLAW - IALUNA, SABRI TIME: 0:14:41 DOC/LINE(S): 993 TRAN	NA 03/08/2010 CC	15815453 ONNECT	79.00
03/19/10	CARMANT, MARIE J. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER MORNING STAR USE ON 2/2/2010 BY: MARIE.CARMANT@WEIL.COM		15803756	15.00
03/19/10	CURRO, MATTHEW L. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY GLOBAL SECURITIES INC - LIVED MINUTES USER ID: 63 54423 CARMAN	OGAR 02/02/10 0:0-	15804705 4:56 0	33.55
03/22/10	AMPONSAH, DUKE COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) ED 02/01/10-02/28	15807408 2/10	0.16
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG		15807481 3/10	21.04
03/22/10	BOSSHARD-BLACKEY, ELIZABETH COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) SED 02/01/10-02/28	15807503 3/10	30.72
03/22/10	LEONARD, SARAH A.  COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) FED 02/01/10-02/28	15807504 8/10	216.96
03/22/10	IALUNA, SABRINA M. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG		15807505 3/10	12.16

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/22/10	TURNER, KIM P. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG		15807562 /10	6.40
03/22/10	VAN KAMPEN, ALLISON L. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG		15807563 7/10	7.60
03/22/10	SWANEY, NICOLE COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) ED 02/01/10-02/28	15807564 7/10	7.28
03/22/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) ED 02/01/10-02/28	15807574 5/10	9.76
03/22/10	AMPONSAH, DUKE COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) ED 02/01/10-02/28	15807580 3/10	30.64
03/22/10	CURRO, MATTHEW L. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG		15807602 3/10	13.84
03/22/10	MILLS, MARVIN COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG		15807635 3/10	47.44
03/22/10	HAUSMAN, JEFFRIE COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) BED 02/01/10-02/28	15807655 3/10	4.24
03/22/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) BED 02/01/10-02/28	15807692 3/10	2.24
03/22/10	NG, ALEXANDER W. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) BED 02/01/10-02/28	15807695 8/10	12.40
03/22/10	DIBLASI, KELLY COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 R (NY) BED 02/01/10-02/28	15807724 3/10	41.84
03/22/10	GEORGE, CAMILLE A. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARC	075 R (NY) GED 02/01/10-02/28	15807728 3/10	23.36

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/22/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 C(NY) ED 02/01/10-02/28	15807741 /10	2.00
03/22/10	SAPEIKA, TALS. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 C(NY) ED 02/01/10-02/28	15807744 /10	26.96
03/22/10	ALISEO, NICOLE K. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	075 C(NY) ED 02/01/10-02/28	15807756 /10	11.28
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CHANDIS, VANESSA 03/1	075B ARCH (NY) 1/2010 ACCOUNTS	15806534 S: 100248	13.61
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CHANDIS, VANESSA 02/2:	075B ARCH (NY) 5/2010 ACCOUNTS	15806535 S: 100248	242.80
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CHANDIS, VANESSA 03/14		15806536 S: 100248	44.78
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CHANDIS, VANESSA 03/09		15806537 S: 100248	90.64
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CHANDIS, VANESSA 02/20		15806538 S: 100248	267.84
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CHANDIS, VANESSA 02/2	075B ARCH (NY) 4/2010 ACCOUNT	15806539 S: 100248	181.56
03/22/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CHANDIS, VANESSA 03/14		15806540 S: 100248	461.52
03/22/10	NG, ALEXANDER W. LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - NG, ALEXANDER 03/03/20		15806541 00248	167.40
03/22/10	NG, ALEXANDER W. LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - NG, ALEXANDER 02/25/20		15806542 00248	72.13

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/22/10	CURRO, MATTHEW L. LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CURRO, MATTHEW 02/17/		15806543	13.61
03/22/10	CASTELLANI, ANNE K. LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CASTELLANI, ANNE 03/01	075B ARCH (NY)	15806544	151.75
03/22/10	CASTELLANI, ANNE K. LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - CASTELLANI, ANNE 03/02		15806545 3: 100248	222.39
03/22/10	HATCHER, R. TODD LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - HATCHER, TODD 03/10/20	075B ARCH (NY) 10 ACCOUNTS: 10	15806546 00248	10.75
03/22/10	MILLS, MARVIN LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - MILLS, MARVIN 03/13/201	075B ARCH (NY) 0 ACCOUNTS: 100	15806547 0248	27.22
03/22/10	MILLS, MARVIN LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - MILLS, MARVIN 02/19/201	075B ARCH (NY) 0 ACCOUNTS: 10	15806548 0248	142.09
03/22/10	MILLS, MARVIN LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - MILLS, MARVIN 02/22/201	075B ARCH (NY) 0 ACCOUNTS: 10	15806549 0248	27.22
03/22/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B. LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - SHERMAN, RACHEL 02/23	075B ARCH (NY) 8/2010 ACCOUNTS	15806550 S: 100248	76.76
03/22/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B. LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - SHERMAN, RACHEL 03/12	075B ARCH (NY) 2/2010 ACCOUNTS	15806551 S: 100248	427.76
03/22/10	VEIT, CHERI LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - VEIT, CHERI 03/01/2010 AG	075B ARCH (NY) CCOUNTS: 100248	15806552	444.50
03/22/10	VEIT, CHERI LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - VEIT, CHERI 03/15/2010 A0		15806553	37.97
03/22/10	VEIT, CHERI LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - VEIT, CHERI 03/11/2010 AG	075B ARCH (NY) CCOUNTS: 100248	15806554	141.14

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/22/10	VEIT, CHERI LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY LEXIS - VEIT, CHERI 03/12/2010 AC		15806555 48	13.61
03/23/10	SHIFFMAN, JONATHAN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAF NY WESTLAW - SHIFFMAN, JONATHA TIME: 0:45:21 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANS	N 02/22/2010 C	15811036 ONNECT	337.19
03/23/10	SANTILLAN, AIDA P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAI NY WESTLAW - SANTILLAN,AIDA P 0 0:02:14 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	2/24/2010 CONI	15811037 NECT TIME:	8.70
03/23/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - CHANDIS, VANESSA 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	02/26/2010 CON	15811038 NECT TIME:	153.64
03/23/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAR NY WESTLAW - CHANDIS, VANESSA 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 2 TRANSACTIO	02/25/2010 CON	15811039 NECT TIME:	40.28
03/23/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAI NY WESTLAW - CHANDIS, VANESSA 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANSACTIO	03/09/2010 CON	15811040 NECT TIME:	57.06
03/23/10	CHANDIS, VANESSA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - CHANDIS, VANESSA 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 5 TRANSACTIO	03/08/2010 CON	15811041 NECT TIME:	68.05
03/23/10	DIBLASI, KELLY WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - RODDEN,KELLY 02/1 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	7/2010 CONNEC	15811042 CT TIME:	19.05
03/23/10	VENDITTI, DANIEL J. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAL NY WESTLAW - VENDITTI, DANIEL 02 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANSACTIO	2/23/2010 CONN	15811043 ECT TIME:	704.43
03/23/10	VENDITTI, DANIEL J. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - VENDITTI, DANIEL 030:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANSACTIO	3/01/2010 CONN	15811044 ECT TIME:	344.59

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/23/10	NG, ALEXANDER W. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - NG, ALEXANDER F. 00:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTION	3/03/2010 CONNI	15811045 ECT TIME:	170.50
03/23/10	NG, ALEXANDER W. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAUNY WESTLAW - NG, ALEXANDER F. 00:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTION	2/26/2010 CONNI	15811046 ECT TIME:	61.73
03/23/10	WENCELBLAT, PATRICIA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - WENCELBLAT, PATRIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	ICIA 03/01/2010 (	15811047 CONNECT	150.35
03/23/10	WENCELBLAT, PATRICIA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - WENCELBLAT,PATR TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	ICIA 02/20/2010 (	15811048 CONNECT	52.26
03/23/10	LEONARD, SARAH A. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEANY WESTLAW - HWANG,EDITH 03/110:11:34 DOC/LINE(S): 3 TRANSACTION	/2010 CÓNNECT	15811049 TIME:	82.50
03/23/10	CURRO, MATTHEW L. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - CURRO, MATTHEW 00:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTION	2/18/2010 CONNI	15811050 ECT TIME:	28.74
03/23/10	MISHKIN, JESSIE B. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - MISHKIN, JESSIE 03/1 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	4/2010 CONNEC	15811051 T TIME:	54.44
03/23/10	CASTELLANI, ANNE K. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - CASTELLANI,ANNE 4:59:44 DOC/LINE(S): 2 TRANSACTIO	03/01/2010 CONN	15811052 ECT TIME:	1927.61
03/23/10	CASTELLANI, ANNE K. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - CASTELLANI,ANNE 0:08:58 DOC/LINE(S): 3 TRANSACTIO	03/02/2010 CONN	15811053 IECT TIME:	85.31
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 02/2: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 2 TRANSACTIO	3/2010 CÓNNECT	15811054 TTIME:	291.68

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAL NY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 02/22 1:14:29 DOC/LINE(S): 8 TRANSACTIO	/2010 CÓNNECT	15811055 TIME:	490.93
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAUNY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 03/100:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANSACTIO	/2010 CÓNNECT	15811056 TIME:	20.14
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 02/27 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANSACTIO	1/2010 CÓNNECT	15811057 TIME:	115.96
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 02/26 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANSACTIO	5/2010 CÓNNECT	15811058 TIME:	197.50
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING NY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 03/15 0:37:57 DOC/LINE(S): 3 TRANSACTION	5/2010 CÓNNECT	15811059 TIME:	187.58
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 02/28 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANSACTIO	3/2010 CÓNNECT	15811060 TIME:	41.92
03/23/10	MILLS, MARVIN WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - MILLS, MARVIN 02/19 0:01:51 DOC/LINE(S): 3 TRANSACTIO	9/2010 CÓNNECT	15811061 TIME:	135.79
03/23/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - SHARMA,RAHUL 02/ 1:22:58 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	18/2010 ĆONNEC	15811062 CT TIME:	544.58
03/23/10	SHARMA, RAHUL K. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - SHARMA,RAHUL 03/ 0:54:06 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	04/2010 ĆONNEC	15811063 CT TIME:	341.89
03/23/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - SHERMAN, RACHEL 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	02/23/2010 CONN	15811064 ECT TIME:	5.44

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/23/10	SHERMAN, RACHEL B. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAR NY WESTLAW - SHERMAN, RACHEL ( 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	)2/28/2010 CONNI	15811065 ECT TIME:	54.44
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 02/20:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	25/2010 CONNEC	15811066 Г ТІМЕ:	10.45
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAUNY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 02/20:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 8 TRANSACTION	17/2010 ĆONNEC'	15811067 Г ТІМЕ:	27.87
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - FREDRICK, FRAN 03/00:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 2 TRANSACTION	03/2010 ĆONNEC'	15811068 T TIME:	14.81
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - FREDRICK, FRAN 02/20:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTION	19/20Ì0 ĆONNEC'	15811069 T TIME:	10.45
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 8 TRANSACTIC	15/2010 ĆONNEC'	15811070 T TIME:	27.87
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - FREDRICK, FRAN 03/0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANSACTIO	10/2010 ĆONNEC	15811071 T TIME:	19.16
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - FREDRICK, FRAN 02/20:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANSACTIO	23/2010 ĆONNEC	15811072 T TIME:	19.16
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	09/2010 ĆONNEC	15811073 T TIME:	10.45
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	04/2010 ĆONNEC	15811074 T TIME:	10.45

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAI NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/0 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 2 TRANSACTIO	08/2010 CONNECT	15811075 Γ TIME:	14.81
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAINY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/10:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANSACTIO	1/2010 CONNECT	15811076 Γ TIME:	19.16
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAD NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/0 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	)1/2010 CONNECT	15811077 Г ТІМЕ:	10.45
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - FREDRICK, FRAN 03/00:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 6 TRANSACTIO	05/2010 CONNECT	15811078 Г ТІМЕ:	23.52
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - FREDRICK, FRAN 02/20:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANSACTION	22/2010 CONNEC	15811079 Г ТІМЕ:	19.16
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - FREDRICK, FRAN 02/0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANSACTION	16/2010 ĆONNEC'	15811080 Г ТІМЕ:	17.86
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEANY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 02/0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 2 TRANSACTIO	18/2010 ĆONNEC'	15811081 T TIME:	14.81
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 02/2 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 6 TRANSACTIO	26/2010 ĆONNEC'	15811082 T TIME:	23.52
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 02/0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	24/2010 ĆONNEC	15811083 T TIME:	10.45
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/ 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTION	12/2010 CONNEC	15811085 T TIME:	10.45

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/23/10	TURNER, KIM P. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAR NY WESTLAW - FREDRICK,FRAN 03/0 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	2/2010 CONNEC	15811086 Г ТІМЕ:	10.45
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAR NY WESTLAW - MCLAUGHLIN,DANIE TIME: 1:18:57 DOC/LINE(S): 10 TRANS	EL 03/04/2010 CO	15811087 NNECT	540.26
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAR NY WESTLAW - MCLAUGHLIN,DANIE TIME: 0:29:07 DOC/LINE(S): 3 TRANS	EL 03/08/2010 CO	15811088 NNECT	148.87
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAI NY WESTLAW - ENAYATI,ROBERT 03 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	3/07/2010 CONNE	15811089 CT TIME:	34.30
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAI NY WESTLAW - MCLAUGHLIN,DANII TIME: 0:38:25 DOC/LINE(S): 4 TRANS	EL 02/26/2010 CO	15811090 NNECT	337.99
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAL NY WESTLAW - ENAYATI, ROBERT 03 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 3 TRANSACTIO	3/08/2010 CONNE	15811091 CT TIME:	86.02
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - ENAYATI,ROBERT 03 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 5 TRANSACTIO	3/06/2010 CONNE	15811092 ECT TIME:	98.00
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATION NY WESTLAW - ENAYATI, ROBERT 00:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 13 TRANSACTI	3/04/2010 CONNE	15811093 ECT TIME:	158.43
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - ENAYATI, ROBERT 0:0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	3/03/2010 CONNE	15811094 ECT TIME:	77.31
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - ENAYATI,ROBERT 0: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 18 TRANSACTI	3/01/2010 CONNE	15811095 ECT TIME:	348.53

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/23/10	ENAYATI, ROBERT WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - ENAYATI,ROBERT 02 0:56:47 DOC/LINE(S): 15 TRANSACTION	2/26/2010 CONNE	15811096 CT TIME:	581.78
03/23/10	SIMSON, SYLVIA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT NY WESTLAW - MCLAUGHLIN, DANII TIME: 0:25:37 DOC/LINE(S): 5 TRANS	EL 02/26/2010 CO	15811097 NNECT	227.96
03/23/10	CASTILLERO, FRANCENE S. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATINY WESTLAW - HARTMAN, CATHERITIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	NE 02/23/2010 CO	15811098 DNNECT	817.44
03/23/10	CASTILLERO, FRANCENE S. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - HARTMAN, CATHERITIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	NE 03/08/2010 CO	15811099 ONNECT	5.44
03/23/10	CASTILLERO, FRANCENE S. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEATING WESTLAW - HARTMAN, CATHERITIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	INE 02/24/2010 CO	15811100 ONNECT	1067.84
03/23/10	AXON, HILLARY A. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - AXON, HILLARY 02/2 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	4/2010 CONNECT	15811101 Г ТІМЕ:	16.33
03/23/10	AXON, HILLARY A. WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEA NY WESTLAW - AXON,HILLARY 02/2 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	3/2010 CONNECT	15811102 Г ТІМЕ:	190.54
03/22/10	YATES, ERIN K. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHEI D.C. PACER SERVICE CENTER CHAR	076 R (DC) GED 02/01/10-02/2	15807171 28/10	0.24
03/22/10	WINE, JENNIFER L. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHEI D.C. PACER SERVICE CENTER CHAR		15807172 28/10	3.44
03/22/10	BURDETTE, LESLIE A COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHE D.C. PACER SERVICE CENTER CHAR	076 R (DC) GED 02/01/10-02//	15807173 28/10	2.64
03/22/10	BENFIELD, BRIANNA N	076	15807174	4.16

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT		
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER (DC) D.C. PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARGED 02/01/10-02/28/10					
03/22/10	POTTER, LOUGRAN COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER D.C. PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARC	076 (DC) GED 02/01/10-02/2	15807175 8/10	10.72		
03/22/10	FLINN, DEBORAH C. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER D.C. PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARC		15807176 8/10	4.80		
03/22/10	FLINN, DEBORAH C. COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH - OTHER D.C. PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARG	076 (DC) GED 02/01/10-02/2	15807177 8/10	3.04		
03/25/10	LEVINE, ALEXANDER LEXIS/NEXIS COMPUTERIZED RESEA DC LEXIS - LEVINE, ALEXANDER 03/0		15815739 TS: 100248	6.61		
03/25/10	LEVINE, ALEXANDER WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAT DC WESTLAW - LEVINE, ALEXANDER TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	C03/09/2010 CON	15815877 NECT	10.60		
03/25/10	LEVINE, ALEXANDER WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAU DC WESTLAW - LEVINE, ALEXANDER TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 1 TRANS	C 03/08/2010 CON	15815878 NECT	35.51		
03/25/10	LEVINE, ALEXANDER WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAUTE DC WESTLAW - LEVINE, ALEXANDER TIME: 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANS	R 03/15/2010 CON	15815879 NECT	23.85		
03/25/10	CHETTRI, ANUPAMA WESTLAW - COMPUTERIZED RESEAU DC WESTLAW - CHETRI, ANUPAMA 0 0:00:00 DOC/LINE(S): 0 TRANSACTIO	3/15/2010 CONNI	15815880 ECT TIME:	36.68		
03/05/10	SWANEY, NICOLE DUPLICATING SERVICES - SPIRAL SPIRAL BINDING IN NEW YORK CITY BINDING(S) FROM UNIT 14	082 YON 02/24/10 05:1	15771543 4PM 8	28.00		
03/05/10	SWANEY, NICOLE DUPLICATING SERVICES - SPIRAL SPIRAL BINDING IN NEW YORK CITY BINDING(S) FROM UNIT 14	082 Y ON 02/23/10 05:5	15771544 52AM 6	21.00		

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
03/17/10	SWANEY, NICOLE DUPLICATING SERVICES - VELOBINI VELOBINDING IN NEW YORK CITY O BINDING(S) FROM UNIT 03		15799956 M 12	18.00
03/17/10	SWANEY, NICOLE DUPLICATING SERVICES - VELOBINI VELOBINDING IN NEW YORK CITY O BINDING(S) FROM UNIT 15	085 DING N 03/01/10 02:59P	15799957 M 4	6.00
03/10/10	BOSTON, OFFICE COLOR COPIES 18 PAGES PRINTED IN BOSTON BETW 02/26/2010	094D VEEN 02/02/2010 T	15783702 O	18.00
03/29/10	GOLDRING, STUART J. MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/1/2010 GOLDR #PEOPLE: 15 MEAL CODE LU1 INV# 09	ING, STUART 12:		374.80
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/1/2010 ROSEN, MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 09925 RE: PRO	, BRIAN 9:30 #PEC	15819701 OPLE: 8	30.49
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/1/2010 ROSEN, MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 09946 RE: PLA	, BRIAN 1:45 #PEC		57.16
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/2/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 09967 RE: PLA	, BRIAN 10:00 #PE	15819726 COPLE: 12	45.73
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/2/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 09968 RE: PLA SHEET	, BRIAN 2:00 #PEC	15819727 DPLE: 12 ND TERM	45.73
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/3/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 09990 RE: PLA	, BRIAN 7:45 #PE0	15819744 OPLE: 8	30.49
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/3/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 09992 RE: PLA	, BRIAN 11:30 #PF	15819745 EOPLE: 8	30.49

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/3/2010 ROSEN, MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 09994 RE: PLA	BRIAN 3:00 #PE	15819747 OPLE: 8	30.49
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/3/2010 ROSEN, MEAL CODE SN4 INV# 10024 RE: PLAN	BRIAN 4:00 #PE	15819760 COPLE: 5	71.59
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/22/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 10473 RE: SETT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	I. BRIAN 9:00 #P	15821242 EOPLE: 10 PLAN AND	38.11
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/22/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE2 INV# 10474 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	I, BRIAN 9:30 #P	15821243 EOPLE: 25 PLAN AND	189.17
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/22/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE LU1 INV# 10475 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N. BRIAN 12:30 #	15821244 PEOPLE: 25 PLAN AND	624.67
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/22/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE SN3 INV# 10476 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	J. BRIAN 2:30 #F	15821245 PEOPLE: 25 PLAN AND	175.56
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/23/2010 ROSEI MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 10478 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N. BRIAN 9:00 #F	15821247 PEOPLE: 10 PLAN AND	38.11
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/24/2010 ROSEI MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 10479 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N. BRIAN 9:00 #I	15821248 PEOPLE: 10 PLAN AND	38.11
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	109	15821249	38.11

DATE	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
	MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/25/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 10480 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	I, BRIAN 9:00 #PE	COPLE: 10 LAN AND	
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/23/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE SN3 INV# 10538 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 4:00 #PE	15821290 COPLE: 10 LAN AND	70.22
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/23/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE SN3 INV# 10548 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 9:00 #PE	15821293 COPLE: 10 LAN AND	97.44
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/24/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE LU6 INV# 10550 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 12:00 #P	15821294 EOPLE: 10 LAN AND	566.80
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/24/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 10551 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 9:30 #PE	15821295 COPLE: 10 LAN AND	38.11
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/24/2010 ROSEM MEAL CODE SN4 INV# 10552 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 1:15 #PE	15821296 EOPLE: 20 LAN AND	286.34
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/24/2010 ROSEI MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 10564 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 4:00 #PE	15821304 EOPLE: 10 LAN AND	65.33
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/25/2010 ROSEI MEAL CODE LU6 INV# 10588 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 12:45 #P	15821313 PEOPLE: 6 LAN AND	237.35
03/29/10	ROSEN, BRIAN	109	15821316	65.33

<u>DATE</u>	NAME/ DESCRIPTION	DISB <u>TYPE</u>	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
	MEALS-MEETINGS/CONFERENCE CO CONFERENCE MEAL 3/25/2010 ROSEN MEAL CODE BE3 INV# 10592 RE: SET DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	N, BRIAN 2:4		
03/04/10	ROSEN, BRIAN DOMESTIC TRAVEL-MEALS VENDOR: ROSEN, BRIAN INVOICE#: 0 DATE: 3/4/2010	112 CREX002624	15769873 47903042104	52.00
	DINNER FEB 04, 2010 - HEARINGS.			

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

<u>\$39,182.46</u>