# IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:	Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
Debtors.	Jointly Administered
) ) )	Objection Deadline: August 23, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. Hearing Date: TBD if necessary
AS DELAWARE COUNSEL TO TH SECURITY HOLDERS OF WASH ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSA AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPE	APPLICATION OF ASHBY & GEDDES, P.A., E OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY INGTON MUTUAL, INC. ET AL., FOR ATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED NSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD OF ROUGH JUNE 30, 2010
Name of Applicant:	Ashby & Geddes, P.A.
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to	: Delaware Counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.
Date of Retention:	April 8, 2010 effective as of March 4, 2010
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	June 1, 2010 through June 30, 2010
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$169,379.50
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$18,383.00
This is a: Monthly <u>x</u> Interim	Final Fee Application.
	Application in connection with preparing this application is in preparing this Fourth Monthly Application will

 $\{00428743;v1\}$ 



0812229100803000000000011

### If this is not the first application filed, disclose the following for each prior application:

		Re	equested		Approved
Date Filed	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses
4/29/10 #3598	3/4/10-3/31/10	\$36,074.50	\$3,821.80	\$28,859.60	\$3,821.80
5/28/10 #4432	4/1/10-4/30/10	\$71,921.00	\$9,908.59	\$57,536.80	\$9,908.59
7/2/10 #4864	5/1/10-5/31/10	\$181,434.00	\$13,285.36	\$145,147.20	\$13,285.36

### **SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONALS**

<u>Name</u>	<b>Position</b>	Hourly Rate	Hours	<u>Value</u>
William P. Bowden (WPB)	Member 18+ years	\$590.00	70.50	\$41,595.00
Steven T. Margolin (STM)	Member 6+ years	\$515.00	40.40	\$20,806.00
Gregory A. Taylor (GAT)	Member 1+ years	\$425.00	132.10	\$56,142.50
Amanda M. Winfree (AW)	Associate 6+ years	\$345.00	23.80	\$8,211.00
Benjamin W. Keenan (BK)	Associate 5+ years	\$295.00	8.40	\$2,478.00
Stacy L. Newman (SNL)	Associate 3+ years	\$245.00	101.40	\$24,843.00
Leigh-Anne Raport (LMR)	Associate 3+ years	\$260.00	15.20	\$3,952.00
Caroline Hong (CXH)	Associate 2+ years	\$230.00	15.10	\$3,473.00
F. Troupe Mickler, IV (FTM)	Associate <1 year	\$215.00	15.80	\$3,397.00
Cathie J. Boyer (CJB)	Paralegal	\$180.00	22.10	\$3,978.00
Chris Warnick (CW)	Paralegal	\$180.00	2.80	\$504.00
Totals/Average Hourly Rate		Blended Rate: \$378.00	447.60	\$169,379.50

### SCHEDULE OF COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

TASK	HOURS	FEES
Asset Analysis and Recovery	19.70	\$6,187.00
Asset Disposition	1.70	\$722.50
Case Administration	66.50	\$18,944.50
Claims Administration & Objections	53.40	\$19,515.50
Employee Benefits	1.20	\$510.00
Fee/Employment Applications	8.30	\$1,667.00
Fee/Employment Objections	0.20	\$118.00
Litigation	103.00	\$35,920.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement	155.40	\$68,658.00
Valuation	1.70	\$913.00
Committee Administration	35.70	\$16,027.50
Litigation/Adversary Proceeding	0.80	\$196.00
GRAND TOTAL	<u>447.60</u>	<u>\$169,379.50</u>

### **SCHEDULE OF EXPENSES**

Category of Expenses	Amount
Blue Marble Logistics, LLC (document	\$210.76
duplication/delivery service)	
Parcels, Inc. (document duplication/delivery	\$11,744.70
service)	
Working Meal – lunch for 2 on 6/2/10	\$29.00
(Washington Street Ale House)	
Working Meal – lunch for 3 on 6/2/10	\$28.24
(Purebread Deli delivery)	
Working Meal – lunch for 8+ on 6/3/10	\$102.00
(Purebread Deli delivery)	
Transportation (Amtrak) (Wilmington to	\$289.00
NYC and return on 6/14/10 for G. Taylor)	
Transportation (Amtrak) (Wilmington to	\$182.00
NYC and return on 6/10/10 for W. Bowden)	
Travel Expenses: Train station parking, taxis,	\$132.40
ticket change fees for 6/10/10 and 6/14/10	
trips to NYC and return	•
Transportation (B's Shuttle Service) 6/3/10	\$180.00
and 6/17/10	<b>*</b>
Telephonic Court Conference – 6/3/10 and	\$544.00
6/17/10 (CourtCall, LLC)	001015
Legal Research (Westlaw)	\$313.15
Federal Express	\$199.50
Pacer	\$428.16
Long Distance Telephone	\$106.69
Photocopies (\$.10 per page)	\$2,630.20
Postage	\$1,263.20
Total	\$18,383.00

# IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	Objection Deadline: August 3, 2010 at 4:00 p.m Hearing Date: TBD if necessary
Debtors.	) Jointly Administered
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,	) Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
In re:	) Chapter 11

FOURTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF ASHBY & GEDDES, P.A., AS DELAWARE COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY SECURITY HOLDERS OF WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC. ET AL., FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD OF JUNE 1, 2010 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2010

Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 and 331, Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and the Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated October 30, 2008 [Docket No. 204] (the "Original Administrative Order") and the Revised Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated November 14, 2008 [Docket No. 302] (the "Revised Administrative Order" and together with the Original Administrative Order, the "Administrative Order"), the law firm of Ashby & Geddes, P.A. ("Ashby & Geddes") hereby submits this fourth monthly application ("Fourth Monthly Application") for compensation of professional legal services rendered as Delaware counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al. (the "Equity Committee") seeking approval and payment of professional fees in the amount of \$135,503.60 (80% of \$169,379.50) together with reimbursement of Ashby & Geddes' actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$18,383.00 for the period commencing June 1,

2010 through and including June 30, 2010 (the "Compensation Period"). In support of this Fourth Monthly Application, Ashby & Geddes respectfully represents as follows:

#### I. JURISDICTION

1. This Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to the provisions of 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. Venue is proper in this District pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§1408 and 1409. The statutory predicates for the relief sought herein are Section 328(a) of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 2014.

#### II. BACKGROUND

- 2. On September 26, 2008 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), the above-captioned debtors and debtors-in-possession (collectively, the "<u>Debtors</u>") filed voluntary petitions for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. On October 3, 2008, the Court entered an order jointly administering these cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b) for procedural purposes only.
- 3. From the Petition Date through the date of this Fourth Monthly Application, the Debtors have remained in possession of their respective properties and estates and continue to operate and manage their respective businesses, as debtors-in-possession, pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 4. On January 11, 2010, the United States Trustee appointed the Equity Committee [Docket No. 2130]. On August 3, 2010, the United States Trustee filed the First Amended Notice of Appointment of Committee of Equity Security Holders [Docket No. 5206].
- 5. On July 28, 2010, the Court approved the appointment of Joshua R. Hochberg, Esquire as Examiner in these chapter 11 cases [Docket No. 5162].

- 6. On March 4, 2010, the parties filed a Notice of Substitution of Counsel [Docket No. 2460] whereby Benesch, Friedlander withdrew its appearance as Delaware counsel to the Equity Committee, and Ashby & Geddes entered its appearance as proposed Delaware counsel to the Equity Committee.
- 7. On March 15, 2010, the Equity Committee filed the Application for an Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 328, 330 and 1103 and Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2014 Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Ashby & Geddes, P.A. as Delaware Counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al. Nunc Pro Tunc to March 4, 2010 [Docket No. 2523] (the "Employment Application"). On April 8, 2010, the Court entered an order authorizing the employment of Ashby & Geddes as counsel to the Equity Committee, effective as March 4, 2010 [Docket No. 3123].
- 8. Pursuant to the Administrative Order, each Professional may file on or following the 15<sup>th</sup> day of each calendar month a Monthly Fee Application (as defined in the Administrative Order) seeking interim approval and allowance of compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the immediately preceding month. If no objections are raised prior to the expiration of the applicable Objection Deadline (as defined in the Administrative Order), the Debtors are authorized to pay each Professional an amount equal to the lesser of (i) 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the Monthly Fee Application or (ii) 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses not subject to an objection.

### III. RELIEF REQUESTED

9. Through this Fourth Monthly Application, in accordance with the Administrative Order, Ashby & Geddes seeks interim allowance of \$169,379.50 and payment of \$135,503.60

(80% of \$169,379.50) in fees for services rendered on behalf of the Equity Committee during the Compensation Period, and reimbursement of \$18,383.00 in reasonable and necessary expenses incurred during the Compensation Period. Thus, Ashby & Geddes seeks interim allowance of fees and expenses during the Compensation Period in the total amount of \$187,762.50 and payment of \$153,886.60 (\$135,503.60 in fees plus \$18,383.00 in expenses).

- 10. Ashby & Geddes has received no payment and no promises for payment from any source other than the Equity Committee for services rendered during the Compensation Period in connection with the Debtors' cases. There exists no agreement or understanding between Ashby & Geddes and any other person for the sharing of any compensation to be received for services rendered by Ashby & Geddes in the Debtors' cases.
- 11. All services for which compensation is requested by Ashby & Geddes pursuant to this Application were performed for or on behalf of the Equity Committee in these cases.
  - 12. This is Ashby & Geddes' Fourth Monthly Application.

#### IV. SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

13. Ashby & Geddes has maintained detailed records of the time spent in the rendition of professional services to the Equity Committee during the Compensation Period. Attached hereto as Exhibit A and incorporated herein by reference is a true and correct copy of the monthly billing statement prepared for the services rendered in these cases by Ashby & Geddes (the "Billing Statement"). The Billing Statement is in the same form regularly used by Ashby & Geddes to bill its clients for services rendered and includes the date that the services were rendered, a detailed, contemporaneous narrative description of the services provided, the amount of time spent for each service and the designation of the professional who performed the service.

{00428743;v1}

- 14. As set forth in the Billing Statement, Ashby & Geddes rendered 447.60 hours of professional services during the Compensation Period, resulting in legal fees totaling \$169,379.50 and incurred associated reasonable and necessary expenses totaling \$18,383.00. The total value of the services rendered by Ashby & Geddes is shown in the Summary section of this Fourth Monthly Application.
- 15. Set forth below are the rates for the expenses incurred by Ashby & Geddes for which reimbursement is requested pursuant to this Fourth Monthly Application, as well as the basis for such rates for the identified expense items:
- a) Copy charges: Ashby & Geddes charges 10 cents per page for copies and such charge is based on an analysis of the cost to Ashby & Geddes to make a copy;
- b) Computer research charges: Ashby & Geddes passes through on an exact cost basis all computer-assisted research charges; and
- c) Out-going facsimile charges: Ashby & Geddes charges \$0.50 for each page. These charges are based on an analysis of the cost to Ashby & Geddes to send facsimile transmissions. Ashby & Geddes does not pass through to its client's expenses or charges related to incoming facsimile transmissions.

In the Billing Statement and incorporated herein by reference is a summary by category of the expenses incurred by Ashby & Geddes for which reimbursement is requested. Further supporting documentation is available upon request.

16. The general areas in which Ashby & Geddes has rendered professional services to the Equity Committee during the Compensation Period may be broadly characterized as follows:

- a. providing legal advice regarding the rules and practices of this Court applicable to the Equity Committee's powers and duties as an official committee appointed under section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code;
- b. preparing and reviewing applications, motions, complaints, answers, orders, agreements and other legal papers filed on behalf of the Equity Committee for compliance with the rules and practices of this Court;
- c. appearing in Court to present necessary motions, applications and pleadings and otherwise protecting the interests of the Equity Committee and unsecured creditors of the Debtors; and
- d. performing such other legal services for the Equity Committee as the Equity Committee believes may be necessary and proper in these Chapter 11 cases.

The generality of the foregoing description is amplified on a day-to-day basis by the Billing Statement.

17. Pursuant to the Administrative Order, professionals are entitled to compensation from the Debtors' estates and may be paid 80% of their allowed monthly fees and 100% of allowed expenses. The Administrative Order specifically provides that all fees and expenses received remain subject to the Court's final approval and allowance. Thus, through this Fourth Monthly Application, Ashby & Geddes seeks payment of \$135,503.60 (80% of \$169,379.50) in fees and \$18,383.00 in expenses.

-Remainder of Page Left Intentionally Blank-

WHEREFORE, Ashby & Geddes, P.A. respectfully requests interim allowance of its fees for services rendered during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$169,379.50, payment for services rendered during the Compensation Period in the amount \$135,503.60 (80% of \$169,379.50), and allowance and reimbursement of \$18,383.00 in actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Compensation Period.

Dated: August 3, 2010

**ASHBY & GEDDES, P.A.** 

William P. Bowden (I.D. No. 2553)

Gregory A. Taylor (I.D. No. 4008)

Benjamin W. Keenan (I.D. No. 4724)

Stacy L. Newman (I.D. No. 5044)

500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor

Wilmington, Delaware 19899

Telephone: (302) 654-1888 Facsimile: (302) 654-2067

Delaware Counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.

# IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:	)	Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,	)	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
Debtors.	)	Jointly Administered

### **CERTIFICATION**

Gregory A. Taylor, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, states as follows:

- (a) I am a member of the applicant firm, Ashby & Geddes, and have been admitted to appear before this Court.
- (b) I have personally performed some of the legal services rendered by Ashby & Geddes as counsel to the Equity Committee and am generally familiar with the other work performed on behalf of the Equity Committee by the lawyers and staff in the firm.
- (c) I have reviewed the foregoing Application and the facts set forth therein are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief. Moreover, I have reviewed Del. Bankr. L.R. 2016-2, and submit that the Application substantially complies with such Rule.

I certify, under penalty of perjury, that the foregoing statements made by me are true to the best of my knowledge, information and belief.

Dated: August 3, 2010

Gregory A. Taylor (#4008)

# IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:	Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,	) Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
Debtors.	) Jointly Administered
	Objection Deadline: August 23, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. Hearing Date: TBD if necessary

NOTICE OF FOURTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF ASHBY & GEDDES, P.A.
AS DELAWARE COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY SECURITY
HOLDERS OF WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC. ET AL., FOR ALLOWANCE OF
COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD OF
JUNE 1, 2010 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2010

TO: FEE APPLICATION NOTICE PARTIES

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on August 3, 2010, the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al., (the "Equity Committee"), filed the Fourth Monthly Application of Ashby & Geddes, P.A., as Delaware Counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al., for Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period of June 1, 2010 through June 30, 2010 (the "Application") with the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 824 Market Street, 3<sup>rd</sup> Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (the "Bankruptcy Court") and was served in accordance with the Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated October 30, 2008 [Docket No. 204] (the "Original Administrative Order") and the Revised Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated November 14, 2008 [Docket No. 302] (the "Revised Administrative Order" and together with the Original Administrative Order, the "Administrative Order").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that the Application requests allowance of fees in the amount of \$169,379.50 and expenses in the amount of \$18,383.00 and payment of compensation in the amount of \$135,503.60 (80% of \$169,379.50) and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$18,383.00 for the period of June 1, 2010 through June 30, 2010.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that any objection to the Application must be made in accordance with the Administrative Order, filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, and served upon the following parties (i) the Debtors, Washington Mutual, Inc., c/o Alvarez and Marsal, 1301 Second Avenue, WMC3301, Seattle, WA 98101 (Attn: John Maciel, Esq.); (ii) counsel to the Debtors, Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10153 (Attn: Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq. and Brian S. Rosen, Esq.) and Richards Layton & Finger, P.A., One Rodney Square, Wilmington, DE 19899 (Attn: Mark D. Collins, Esq.); (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee, J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, 844 King Street, Room 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Joseph J. McMahon, Jr., Esq.); (iv) counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, Akin, Gump, Strauss, Hauer & Feld LLP, One Bryant Park, New York, NY 10036 (Attn: Fred S. Hodora, Esq.), Akin, Gump, Strauss, Hauer & Feld LLP, 1333 New Hampshire Avenue, N.W., Washington, DC 20036-1564 (Attn: Scott L. Alberino, Esq.), Akin, Gump, Strauss, Hauer & Feld LLP, 2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400, Los Angeles, CA 90067-3012 (Attn: Peter J. Gurfein, Esq. and David P. Simonds, Esq.) and Pepper Hamilton LLP, Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100, 1313 N. Market Street, Wilmington, DE 19899 (Attn: David B. Stratton, Esq. and Evelyn J. Meltzer, Esq. (v) counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders, Susman Godfrey LLP, 1000 Louisiana, Suite 5100, Houston, Texas 77002-5096 (Attn: Stephen D. Susman, Esq.), and Ashby & Geddes, P.A., 500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor, P.O. Box 1150, Wilmington, Delaware 19899 (Attn: William P. Bowden, Esq. and Gregory A. Taylor, Esq.); so as to be received by August 23, 2010 at 4:00 p.m. (ET).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT IF AN OBJECTION IS FILED AND SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE AFOREMENTIONED PROCEDURE AND SUCH OBJECTION IS NOT OTHERWISE RESOLVED, A HEARING TO CONSIDER THE APPLICATION WILL BE SCHEDULED AT A DATE AND TIME CONVENIENT TO THE COURT, BEFORE THE HONORABLE MARY F. WALRATH, UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE, 824 MARKET STREET, 5<sup>TH</sup> FLOOR, COURTROOM #4, WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801.

### ASHBY & GEDDES, P.A.

William P. Bowden (No. 2553) Gregory A. Taylor (No. 4008) Benjamin Keenan (No. 4724) Stacy L. Newman (No. 5004)

500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor

P.O. Box 1150

Wilmington, Delaware 19899 Telephone: 302-654-1888 Facsimile: 302-654-2067

-and-

#### SUSMAN GODFREY LLP

Stephen D. Susman, Esq. 1000 Louisiana Suite 5100 Houston, Texas 77002-5096 Telephone: 713-651-9366

Telephone: 713-651-9366 Facsimile: 713-654-6666

Parker C. Folse III, Esq.
Edgar G. Sargent, Esq.
Justin A. Nelson, Esq.
1201 Third Avenue
Suite 3800
Seattle, Washington 98101-3000
Talankara 206 516 3880

Telephone: 206-516-3880 Facsimile: 206-516-3883

Seth Ard, Esq. 654 Madison Avenue, 5th Floor New York, New York 10065-8404 Telephone: 212-336-8330

Facsimile: 212-336-8340

Co-Counsel to the Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.

Dated: August 3, 2010

## **EXHIBIT A**

### ASHBY & GEDDES

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELLORS AT LAW

TELEPHONE 302-654-1888

## 500 DELAWARE AVENUE

FED ID#23-2193414

P. O. BOX 1150

WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899

July 9, 2010

Billed through 06/30/10

Account: OFFCL -00043 - WPB 46058

Official Committee of Equity Security Holders

Official Committee of Equity Security Holders of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al. (In re: Washington Mutual, Inc.)

### PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

06/01/10 CXH 01

STATEMENT

Correspondence from Steven Margolin regarding research regarding investigation into claims for purposes of settlement and office conference with Steven Margolin regarding same (0.3); research regarding what constitutes reversible error in bankruptcy judge's management of discovery and email exchange with Steven Margolin regarding same (0.4);

06/01/10 CJB 04

> Download, organize and review orders shortening notice regarding FDIC 2004 motion and motion for expedited discovery (.2); email exchange with Gregory Taylor regarding preparation of notices of hearing (.1); prepare notices of hearing (.6); revisions to same (.1); prepare certificates of service and service lists (.2); file and coordinate service of notices (.5);

06/01/10 GAT

> Review of agenda for 6/3/10 hearing and emails with Equity Committee regarding same (.3);

06/01/10 SLN 05

Review of Debtors' 33rd, 34th, 35th and 36th

0.70

1.70

Bill number OFFCL 46058

omnibus objections to claims and analysis of same (2.1);

06/01/10 CJB 07

Email exchange and office conference with Gregory Taylor regarding Peter J. Solomon fee applications (.2); review billing statements and email exchange with E. Buyon regarding same (.2);

06/01/10 GAT 10

Review of order shortening time regarding FDIC 2004 motion and notice of hearing regarding same (.1);

06/01/10 SLN 10

Review of case law regarding disapproval of settlement (1.4); legal research regarding approval of a settlement without giving objectors an opportunity to investigate (1.3); draft insert for Equity Committee's objection to Debtors' discovery procedures motion (.3); legal research regarding whether assertion of reliance of counsel defense constitutes waiver of the attorney-client privilege (2.8); draft email memo summarizing same (1.6);

06/01/10 GAT 11

Review of FDIC's reservation of rights regarding disclosure statement (.1); review of draft response to Debtors' discovery procedures motion and telephone conference with S. Margolin regarding same (1.5); office conference with S. Margolin regarding same and legal research regarding issues regarding same (3.0); preparation for 6/3/10 hearing (1.8);

06/01/10 STM 11

Communications with financial experts regarding valuation/discovery matters and related document review (1.6); discussions among counsel regarding legal research and strategy regarding Committee motions/response and related review/edit of draft response to discovery procedure motion (4.7); initial drafting of requested insert regarding

2.10

0.10

0.40

7.40

3

privilege arguments and discussion of legal research regarding same; (1.9); work on revised expert discovery and related insert for motion response 8.90 06/01/10 WPB 11 Correspondence (6x) with Greg Taylor and Committee members regarding hearings on approval of Disclosure Statement, Committee and Debtors' discovery motions (.2); 0.20 06/01/10 AW11 Review of notice of agenda for June 3 hearing (.1); review of orders shortening notice re various discovery motions (.1); review of FDIC-Receiver's reservation of rights re disclosure statement (.1); review of draft objection to debtors' discovery procedures order (.5); 0.80 06/02/10 CXH 01 Office conference with Steven Margolin and Stacy L. Newman regarding creditors committee's objection to equity committee's discovery motion (0.1); legal research and memo regarding cases cited in same (2.5); review of correspondence from Stacy L. Newman regarding same (0.1); legal research regarding application of Garner exception to attorney-client privilege 1.6); 4.30 06/02/10 CJB 04 Download and organize objections to 2004 motions and other responses and documents (.6); arrange for duplication of same (.2); download and organize order shortening notice regarding JPMorgan Chase 2004 motion (.1); prepare notice of hearing (.3); prepare certificate of service and service list (.1); file and coordinate service of notice (.3); 1.60 06/02/10 FTM05 Reviewing and summarizing objections to claims; 1.30 06/02/10 SLN

Review of claims analysis prepared by F.

Bill number OFFCL 46058

Troupe Mickler, IV (.4);

06/02/10 SLN 10

Legal research regarding "at issue" waiver (1.7); review of draft insert to Equity Committee's objection to Debtors' discovery procedures motion sent by Steven Margolin (.3); legal research regarding scope of "at issue" waiver (.9); review of Equity Committee's objection to Debtors' discovery procedures motion (.8); review of Creditor Committee's objection to Equity Committee's motion for expedited discovery (.2); review of cases cited in Creditor Committee's objection (1.4); legal research regarding the fiduciary exception from Garner (3.2);

06/02/10 CJB 11

Office conference with Gregory Taylor regarding Equity Committee's objection to discovery motion (.1); finalize objection and organize for filing (.1); prepare certificate of service and specialized service list (.4); file and serve objection (.4); download and organize notice of filing proposed disclosure statement order (.5); forward same to co-counsel, Committee members and Peter J. Solomon (.2);

06/02/10 GAT 11

Preparation for hearing on 6/3/10 including review of disclosure statement and related submissions (11.7);

06/02/10 WPB 11

Review/comment on revised drafts of objection to Debtors' discovery motion and correspondence to co-counsel regarding same (1.3); review Debtors' objection to Equity Committee objection discovery motion (.3); review of Debtors' response to objections to Disclosure Statement (.3); review JPM objection to Equity Committee 2004 motion (.3); conference with Greg Taylor and co-counsel regarding approach of June 3, 2010 hearing regarding same; review Bankruptcy bondholder objection to Debtors; discovery motion (.3);

0.40

8.50

1.70

3.40 06/02/10 AW 11 Review of comments from co-counsel re designation of issues/record on appeal (.1): draft redline and circulate same to co-counsel (.2); review of additional comments and revise same (.1); office conference with Cathie J. Boyer re materials for delivery to clerk and attention to review/filing/service of appellant designations (.3); review of additional orders shortening notice on discovery motions (.1); review of second amended notice of agenda for June 3 hearing (.1); review of notice of appeal filed by office of the united states trustee (.1); review of notice of filing third amended plan (.1); 1.10 06/02/10 STM 10 Continued work on response to Debtors' discovery motion, including legal research, drafting/editing of motion (4.3); communications with experts (1.1); call with co-counsel in preparation for June 3 hearing (2.2);7.60 06/03/10 CJB 04 Download and organize numerous documents for hearing (.8); prepare 2004 orders and expedited discovery orders for the Court (.3); general hearing preparation (1.5); download and organize settlement agreement and exhibits and forward to G. Vose and E. Sargent (.6); research notice of appeal forms, download same and forward to Stacy L. Newman (.3); 3.50 06/03/10 GAT 06 Review of draft revised order and COC regarding examiner certification order (.2); emails with J. Nelson and R. Silberglied regarding same (.2); 0.40 06/03/10 GAT 11 Preparation for hearing on disclosure statement and related discovery motion (1.5); attendance at hearing regarding same (3.7);

office conference with J. Nelson and call

with E. Sargent regarding same (.5); office conference with W. Bowden and S. Margolin regarding strategy issues (.6);

06/03/10 WPB 11

Review FDIC and additional objections to third party rule 2004 motion (.4); meeting with co-counsel and Committee members following June 3, 2010 hearing on Disclosure Statement and discovery issues regarding strategy and next steps (.6); conference with Steven Margolin and Greg Taylor regarding discovery, examiner and Plan related issues (1.2); review DC Court opinion in American National v. JPM decision (.2); correspondence with co-counsel regarding same (.1);

06/03/10 AW 11

Review of correspondence from co-counsel re summary of hearing (.1); office conference with Greg Taylor and co-counsel re court's ruling and certification of counsel for revised proposed order (.2); drafting of certification of counsel and redline order (.3); circulate same and review of Greq Taylor's comments on draft certification (.1); revise same and circulate same to opposing counsel (.2); multiple email correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel regarding opposing counsels' comments (.2); revise certification to reflect disagreement (.2); drafting of redline competing order and circulate same to co-counsel (.1);

06/03/10 GAT 15

Participation in Committee call regarding 6/3/10 hearing and issues going forward (0.9);

06/03/10 WPB 15

Call with co-counsel and Committee regarding same (.9);

06/03/10 SLN 15

Assist Greg Taylor with preparation for hearing, including gathering pleadings and transcripts (.2); legal research regarding

6.30

2.50

1.40

0.90

Bill numbe	er OFFCL 46058	PAGE 7
	claim Washington Mutual Inc. filed in Washington Mutual Bank receivership (.8);	
06/03/10	STM 10 Attendance at hearing/argument before Judge Walrath (3.7); communications with Committee and counsel regarding hearing results and strategic options (2.0);	1.00
06/04/10	WPB 01 Correspondence with co-counsel regarding WMI claim in WMB receivership proceedings (.2); conference with Stacy L. Newman regarding same (.1);	5.70
06/04/10	CXH 01 Legal research regarding bankruptcy examiner's access to privileged or work product material (7.2);	0.30
06/04/10	GAT 02 Legal research regarding Debtors' deadline to submit claim vs. FDIC (1.7);	7.20
06/04/10	Review notices of depositions filed by debtors with respect to equity committee members (.2); office conference with William Bowden concerning same and inclusion of resigned equity committee members with respect to same (.2); call with former equity committee member with respect to same (.3);	1.70
06/04/10	CJB 04 Office conference with Gregory Taylor regarding COC for certification for direct appeal to Third Circuit (.1); prepare certificate of service and service list (.3); file and serve COC (.3); prepare COC and proposed order and forward to Judge Walrath's Chambers (.1); email exchanges with William P. Bowden and Gregory Taylor regarding discovery notices (.1); download, organize and distribute same (.5);	0.70
06/04/10	GAT 04 Review of Debtors' response to request for	1.30

	argument on SJ motion (.3); correspondence to Equity Committee forwarding same (.1); attention to COC regarding certification orders (.6); review of Debtors' competing COC regarding same (.2); correspondence to Equity Committee forwarding 6/3 hearing transcript (.1);	
06/04/10	SLN 04 Legal research regarding affect of refiling examiner motion bankruptcy court jurisdiction (5.3); draft email to William Bowden regarding Keene case from Southern District of New York (.3);	1.30
06/04/10	WPB 05 Review U.S. Trustee notice of appeal of examiner order (.1); correspondence with co-counsel and Amanda Winfree (3x) regarding certification of counsel on order granting due date on appeal (.1); correspondence with Debtors' counsel regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence (7x) with co-counsel and Committee regarding examiner related issues (.4);	5.60
06/04/10	SLN 05 Search for claim that Washington Mutual Inc. filed in Washington Mutual Bank receivership proceeding, including telephone calls to FDIC and review of docket in receivership case pending in District Court for the District of Columbia (1.9);	0.70
06/04/10	GAT 06 Review of research regarding Examiner appeal (.2);	1.90
06/04/10	GAT 10 Review of Debtors' deposition notices to Equity Committee (.3);	0.20
06/04/10	WPB 10 Attention to WaMu notices of deposition and document production directed to Equity Committee and related correspondence (.3); correspondence (.1) and call (.1) with WaMu	0.30

0.50

5.30

1.30

### counsel regarding same;

06/04/10 STM 11

Initial research, strategy discussions among counsel and document review related to developments at 6/3/10 hearing, including preparations for renewed examiner motion, disclosure statement issues raised by financial experts, and discovery-related strategy at upcoming meet & confer with Debtors (2.4); preparations for, participation in, and follow-up on teleconference with Susman team regarding same (1.5); discussions with legal research team regarding procedural issues raised by renewed examiner motion and pending appeal in Third Circuit (.9); initial review of hearing transcript and email to counsel regarding same (.5)

06/04/10 WPB 11

Call with co-counsel regarding issues to address following June 3, 2010 hearing including 2004 discovery, examiner and related issues (.9); review American National objection to amended Disclosure Statement (.1); review WMB Bondholder objections to Amended Disclosure Statement (.2); motion to temporarily allow claims (.1);

06/04/10 AW 11

Review of comments on draft certification of counsel/competing orders from William Bowden and co-counsel and multiple email correspondence re same (.3); revise and circulate same to opposing counsel and multiple email correspondence re same (.3); attention to filing and service of same (.2); review of debtors' document requests and email correspondence from co-counsel re same (.4);

06/04/10 GAT 15

Multiple emails with Equity Committee members and professionals regarding strategy (1.4); telephone conference with Equity Committee professionals regarding strategy (1.1);

2.50

Bill numbe	er OFFCL 46058	PAGE 10
06/05/10	SLN 04 Legal research regarding whether appeal of examiner order divests the bankruptcy court of jurisdiction (3.1);	
06/05/10	GAT 11 Review of JPM and FDIC 2004 discovery requests and correspondence to E. Sargent regarding same (.7);	3.10
06/05/10	WPB 11 Correspondence with (5x) with co-counsel regarding recovery (.4);	0.70
06/05/10	GAT 15 Telephone conference with Committee regarding issues and strategy (.8);	0.40
06/05/10	WPB 15 Call with Committee members and co-counsel regarding examiner issues, discovery, Plan and related matters (.9);	0.80
06/06/10	CXH 01 Legal research regarding bankruptcy examiner's access to privileged or work product material and procedural posture of filing a new motion for appointment of fee examiner during pendency of appeal (2.9);	0.90
06/06/10	SLN 04 Legal research regarding affect of appeal on bankruptcy court jurisdiction (5.2); draft memo regarding research results (1.9);	2.90
06/06/10	STM 11 Initial case review and drafting of summary for co-counsel (1.2);	7.10
06/07/10	CJB 04 Download and organize certification of direct appeal (.1); distribute to co-counsel, Committee Members and Peter J. Solomon (.2);	1.50
06/07/10	GAT 04 Legal research regarding motion for	0.30

04

8.20

0.30

appointment of an examiner (3.7); revise and drafting of same (2.4); telephone conference with P. Folse and J. Nelson regarding same (.3); review of transcript from 6/3/10 hearing (.5); attention to obtaining P&A Agreement with schedules (.8); review of order certifying direct appeal and attention to next steps (.5);

06/07/10 CW

Review omnibus objections to claims (.3);

06/07/10 SLN 04

Legal research regarding bankruptcy court jurisdiction to consider second examiner motion (1.8); review of draft motion to appoint examiner circulated by Susan Godfrey, including Ashby & geddes' revisions thereto (.8); draft motion to shorten with regard to same (.6); legal research regarding orders appointing examiner, especially orders with privilege provisions (1.7); legal research regarding indicative ruling procedure and Federal Rule of Appellate Procedure 12.1, including whether lower court has jurisdiction to consider Rule 60(b) motion after notice of appeal is filed but before appeal is docketed (3.1); office conference regarding examiner motion (.2); legal research regarding whether the operative event for divestiture of jurisdiction is the filing of the notice of appeal or the docketing of the appeal, and whether the lower court has jurisdiction during the interim period (1.9);

06/07/10 WPB 05

Review/comment on draft motion to appoint examiner (.9); review revised draft of examiner motion and comment (.7); conference with Greg Taylor and Stacy L. Newman regarding appeal issues (.5); correspondence with co-counsel regarding same (.4); meeting with Steven Margolin, Greg Taylor and Stacy L. Newman regarding examiner motion, open issues and approach (.6);

3.10

06/07/10

06/07/10

06/07/10

06/07/10

06/08/10

06/08/10

Telephone conference with E. Sargent and JPM's counsel regarding 2004 document requests (1.0); review of multiple emails with E. Sargent and JPM Counsel regarding 2004 discovery (.6); review of correspondence from P. Folse regarding Debtors' depositions of EC members and follow up emails (.3); office conference with T. Mickler regarding research (.2); 2.10 WPB 10 Multiple correspondence with co-counsel regarding work product and privilege issues (.4);0.40 FTM 10 Office conference with Greg Taylor (.3); legal research remedies for intimidation or harassment of committee members (1.6); 1.90 STM 0.5 Review and comment on renewed Examiner motion (.9); related discussions with counsel (1.2); 2.10 AW 11 Review of draft renewed motion for an examiner (.4); review of William Bowden's comments on same (.1); review of correspondence from co-counsel re case strategy (.1); review of federal rules and office conference with Greg Taylor and Stacy L. Newman re third circuit motion for permission to appeal (.3); 0.90 GAT 04 Continued revisions to motion to appoint an examiner (2.4); review of Debtors' objection to motion to shorten and forward to Equity Committee (.3); drafting reply to same (1.0); 3.70 CW prepare notice of motion to appoint examiner (.3); attention to second motion to appoint examiner (.7); attention to motion to shorten notice regarding motion to appoint examiner

(.3); attention to reply in support of motion to shorten notice regarding motion to appoint

06/08/10

FTM

10

Legal research regarding discovery directed at equity committee members (3.1); office conference with Greg Taylor (.3); legal

	research regarding discovery directed at equity committee members and designed to harass or intimidate (2.3);	
06/08/10	GAT 11 Review of multiple emails regarding Debtors' production of documents (.6);	5.70
06/08/10	WPB 11 Multiple correspondence with co-counsel and CEE regarding discovery proposals and responses (.5); correspondence with PJS regarding recoveries (.1);	0.60
06/08/10	AW 11 Review of motion to shorten notice on renewed examiner motion (.1); review of debtors' opposition to same (.2); review of equity holders committee's reply to same (.2);	0.60
06/09/10	CJB 04 Download, review and organize order shortening notice regarding 2nd examiner motion (.2); prepare notice of hearing regarding same (.3); prepare certificate of service and service list (.1); file and coordinate service of notice (.4);	0.50
06/09/10	WPB 05 Review of motion to appoint examiner and proposal form of order (.4); review of order scheduling hearing on motion (.1); correspondence regarding same (.1);	1.00
06/09/10	CJB 07 Email exchanges with B. Berg and P. Croci regarding billing statements for fee applications and personnel descriptions (.2); email to B. Berg and P. Croci regarding February billing statement (.2); prepare draft fee application and notice (.8);	0.60
06/09/10	<pre>WPB 08 Correspondence regarding tax professionals (.2);</pre>	1.20
06/09/10	WPB 10	0.20

	Review of reply briefs in support of and in opposition to remand of shareholder action (.3);	
06/09/10	STM 11	0.30
00709710	Review of as-filed papers (.4); review of research summary and discuss same (.3); communications among counsel regarding meet & confer and related strategic issues (.4);	
06/09/10	WPB 11	1.10
	Call with PJS regarding assets and recoveries (.3); correspondence with G. Taylor and co-counsel regarding same (.1); review of correspondence regarding meet and confer with JPM (.2); multiple correspondence regarding Debtors discovery proposal (.3); review of 3rd amended POR (black-line) (.4); correspondence regarding recovery for preferences (.2); correspondence with CEE regarding JPM/Bank Bondholder issues (.2);	
06/09/10	AW 11	1.70
, ,	Review of order shortening notice on second motion to appoint examiner and notice of hearing on same (.1);	
06/10/10	GAT 04	0.10
00, 10, 10	Telephone conference with Debtors counsel regarding Examiner appeal (.1); review of docketing of items on appeal (.1);	
06/10/10	CJB 07	0.20
, 22, 10	Continue preparation of Peter J. Solomon fee applications (.4); review revised February billing statement (.1); prepare draft CNO for Venable's final fee application and forward to Gregory Taylor for review (.3);	
06/10/10	DV 10	0.80
00,10,10	Review docketing of appeal and related documents in district court (.2); review affect of same under FRBP 8001 and 28 USC 158(d)(2) on period for filing petition in Third Circuit to have direct appeal heard and e-mail correspondence to Greg Taylor with respect to same (.7);	

0.90

1.10

06/10/10 GAT 10

Review of pleadi

Review of pleadings filed in WA State Court action (.8); review of multiple correspondence regarding meet and confer meeting with Debtors (.3);

06/10/10 STM 11

Participation in Committee call and related discussion among counsel (1.0); communication regarding meet & confer with Debtor (.2); discuss valuation issues (.3)

06/10/10 WPB 11

Correspondence with co-counsel and PJS regarding recovery scenarios (.2); review correspondence regarding meeting/conference with FDIC (.1); prepare for meeting of Debtors' professionals and others regarding confirmation schedule and discovery (.6); working on travel (Wilmington to New York) for meeting/conference regarding confirmation including review of discovery requests directed to Committee and June 3, 2010 transcript (.8); meeting with Debtors professionals regarding document production and related Plan/settlement issues (.8); correspondence with Debtors' counsel regarding same (.1); and review 502(d) order (.1); meeting with Debtor's professionals and counsel to other parties-in-interest regarding confirmation discovery (1.2); follow up meeting with Debtors' counsel (.8); meeting with co-counsel (Susman) regarding same, open issues and next steps (.5); multiple correspondence (9x) with Committee and counsel regarding same (.8); non-working travel New York to Wilmington (1.8 x.5) =(.9);

06/10/10 GAT 15

Telephone conference with Committee regarding strategy (.6); multiple emails with Equity Committee regarding strategy (1.0); telephone conference with A. Maxwell regarding strategy (.5);

06/10/10 WPB 15

1.50

6.90

	Call with Committee and professionals regarding meeting.conference and path forward (.7);	
06/11/10	GAT 04 Review of correspondence from E. Sargent regarding Tacoma hearing on shareholder action (.1);	0.70
06/11/10	Review debtors 39th, 40th, 41st, 42nd omnibus objection to claims filed by equity holders (.8); review bar date order provisions with respect to equity interests (.2);	0.10
06/11/10	GAT 10 Review of correspondence regarding meet and confer emails from E. Sargent and JPMC counsel (.2);	1.00
06/11/10	Legal research regarding instances in which deposition of committee members was at issue (3.1); legal research regarding instances in which debtor/debtor's counsel have been sanctioned for harassment or intimidation of committee members (2.1); drafting summaries of legal research (.7);	0.20
06/11/10	SLN 10 Review of Debtors' counter-statement of issue and counter-designation of record on appeal (.2);	5.90
06/11/10	GAT 11 Legal research and review of material regarding gift plans (3.3.); review of several supplemental objections to D/S (.8);	0.20
06/11/10	WPB 11 Correspondence with co-counsel regarding alternative methods/structures for recoveries (.2); review correspondence regarding next conference with FDIC (.2); correspondence with Greg Taylor and Stacy L. Newman regarding alternative plan structures/recoveries (.2); multiple	4.10

	correspondence with co-counsel and Committee regarding issues to address with Debtors (.9); correspondence with co-counsel regarding materials addressing Plan structures (.4);	
	(.1),	1.90
06/11/10	SLN 11	1.90
	Review of shareholders' second supplemental objection to disclosure statement (.2);	
06/11/10	STM 10	0.20
	Prepare for and participation in teleconference with Committee and co-counsel regarding settlement approach and related issues (1.0); review of communications regarding financial discovery (.2);	
05/55/55		1.20
06/11/10	GAT 15	
	Telephone conference with SG and PJS teams regarding strategy (.5); telephone conference with PJS regarding same (.2); telephone conference with Equity Committee regarding issues and strategy (1.0);	
06/11/10	WDD 15	1.70
06/11/10	WPB 15 Call with Committee professionals regarding open issues and next steps (.5); call with Committee professionals regarding examiner, Plan and related issues (1.0);	
06/11/10	SLN 15	1.50
00/11/10	Equity Committee call (1.0);	
	=quio, committee call (1.0);	1.00
06/12/10	BK 10	1.00
	Research procedures for taking direct direct appeal of bankruptcy court order and Delaware opinions with respect to same;	
06/12/10	WPB 11	2.10
, ==, 10	Multiple correspondence with co-counsel and members regarding same (.9); review PJS material and comment (.6); correspondence with co-counsel and PJS regarding same (.8); correspondence with PJS regarding approach, value and next steps (.4);	
06/12/10	GAT 15	2.70

2.50

(.5);

11

WPB

06/14/10

Bill number OFFCL 46058

	Correspondence with co-counsel and Debtors' counsel regarding rule 502(d) order (.2); review revised drafts of same (.1); correspondence (multiple) with co-counsel and Greg Taylor regarding meeting with Debtors (.6);	
06/14/10	Review of lead plaintiff's supplemental objection to disclosure statement (.2); review of WMB Noteholder Group's supplemental objection to disclosure statement (.2); review of plan and global settlement to find definition of "excluded parties" for Greg Taylor (.2);	0.90
06/14/10	GAT 15 Travel to and from New York for Committee meeting with Debtors (2.0 x .5 = 1.0); office conference with Equity Committee regarding strategy (3.5);	0.60
06/14/10	SLN 15 Review of summary of meeting with the debtors sent by Greg Taylor (.1);	4.50
06/15/10	Office conference with Greg Taylor concerning 38th through 42nd omnibus objections to equity claims (.2); draft e-mail correspondence to equity committee reviewing same omnibus objections and legal issues with respect same and forward to Greg Taylor review (1.7);	0.10
06/15/10	CJB 04 Download and organize June 17th agenda notice and distribute same to co-counsel, Committee members and Peter J. Solomon (.2); prepare sets of all objections/responses to Examiner motion and forward same (.4);	1.90
06/15/10	SLN 04 Review of Objecting Creditors' objection to Equity Committee's motion to appoint examiner (.3); review of JPMC's objection to Equity	0.60

(.3); review of JPMC's objection to Equity Committee's motion to appoint examiner (.1);

06/15/10

06/15/10

06/15/10

06/15/10

06/15/10

review of WMI Noteholders' objection to Equity Committee's motion to appoint examiner (.2); review of Creditors' Committee objection to Equity Committee's motion to appoint examiner (.4); review of FDIC-Receiver's objection to Equity Committee's motion to appoint examiner (.3); review of Debtors' objection to Equity Committee's motion to appoint examiner (.9); 2.20 CJB 07 Review agenda notice for Venable final fee application and email exchanges with Gregory Taylor regarding same (.3); review email exchanges with Debtors' counsel regarding same (.1); review omnibus hearing dates and email to Debtors' counsel regarding which August hearing date is scheduled as interim fee hearing (.1); 0.50 SLN 07 Review of email exchange between Greg Taylor and Debtors' counsel regarding whether Venable's fee application will be heard at the June 17, 2010 omnibus hearing (.2); telephone call to chambers regarding same (.2);0.40 GAT 10 Attention to finalizing 502(d) order and telephone conference with N. Lipinski regarding submission of same (.3); 0.30 SLN 10 Telephone conference with Debtors' counsel regarding third party claims (.8); draft summary of call for William Bowden and Greg Taylor (.2); multiple telephone calls to Elliot Greenleaf regarding certification of counsel submitting FRE 502(d) order (.3); 1.30 GAT 11 Review of and revise draft settlement term sheet and telephone conference with PJS regarding same (.8); review of correspondence from J. Nelson regarding response from

Debtors (.1); telephone conference with Equity Committee regarding strategy (1.0);

telephone conference with B. Rosen regarding settlement issues (.3); 2.20 06/15/10 WPB 11 Call with Committee and professionals regarding proposals/scenarios (.9); multiple correspondence with Committee and professionals regarding same (.6); multiple correspondence with Committee professionals regarding same (.8); call with PJS regarding same (.3); review fourth amended Disclosure Statements and Plan (redlines) (1.2); correspondence with Committee professionals regarding same (.3); 4.10 06/15/10 FTM11 Review of blackline disclosure statement and proposed plan of reorganization regarding material changes (.8); correspondence to William Bowden, Greg Taylor, Susman Godfrey and Peter J. Solomon (.2); 1.00 06/15/10 SLN 11 Review of email from William Bowden regarding changes in Fourth Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement (.1); email to Debtors' local counsel for blackline of Global Settlement (.1); review of Fourth Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.1); office conference with F. Troupe Mickler, IV regarding same (.2);1.50 06/15/10 STM Communications among counsel regarding settlement status/strategy and upcoming hearing (.4); review of 502(d) order and provide comments on same (.3); initial review of proposed discovery order (.5); 1.20 06/15/10 SLN 15 Legal research regarding Touch America case on claim subordination under section 510(b) of the Bankruptcy Code (.2); Committee conference call (1.5); 1.70 06/16/10 WPB 01

Review claims analysis (.6);

06/16/10

CJB

07

of CNO (.2);

Prepare certificate of service and service list for CNO regarding Venable's final fee application (.1); file and coordinate service

0.30 06/16/10 STM 10 Review/comment upon revised discovery procedures order proposed by WaMu and communications among counsel regarding same (.7); follow up on expert / valuation matters (.3); communications among counsel regarding hearing/motion status and preparations (.3); 1.30 06/16/10 WPB 10 Review correspondence regarding JPM meeting and conference (.3); review correspondence regarding FDIC meeting and conference (.1); call with counsel to Bank Bondholders regarding Plan discovery order (.1); correspondence with counsel regarding same (.2); correspondence with co-counsel regarding rule 502(d) order (.1); correspondence with Stacy L. Newman regarding statute of limitations issue (.1); 0.90 06/16/10 SLN 10 Legal research regarding whether 2 year bankruptcy statute of limitations applies to third party claims (3.6); 3.60 06/16/10 GAT 11 Participation in conference call with Debtors and others regarding discovery procedures (.7); telephone conference with A. Maxwell regarding strategy (.4); office conference with W. Bowden regarding 6/14 meeting with Debtors and strategy (.4); telephone conference with B. Rosen regarding settlement (.3);1.80 06/16/10 WPB 11 Conference with Greg Taylor regarding meeting with Debtors' on June 15, 2010 and related Committee responses (.4); call with Committee, Committee professionals and Debtors regarding open issues (.4); multiple correspondence with Committee members and co-counsel regarding same (.8); multiple correspondence with co-counsel regarding

Committee position and path forward (.7);

discovery (.1); correspondence with

correspondence with co-counsel regarding Plan

	co-counsel regarding same (.1); review summary of June 15, 2010 call with Debtors' (.2); multiple correspondence with co-counsel regarding same (.5);	
06/16/10	GAT 15 Multiple conference calls with Committee regarding strategy and 6/17 hearing (3.4);	3.20
06/16/10	WPB 15 Committee call regarding response to Debtors (.3); call with Committee professionals regarding bid/ask and path forward (.7);	3.40
06/17/10	WPB 01 Review and comment on Stacy L. Newman memorandum regarding Section 108 of Bankruptcy Code (.7);	1.00
06/17/10	GAT 05 Review of pleadings regarding Dime Warrants (.4);	0.70
06/17/10	WPB 05 Review materials regarding classification and objection to claims (.4);	0.40
06/17/10	SLN 05 Review of 38th omnibus objection to claims (.2); review of 39th omnibus objection to claims (.1); review of 40th omnibus objection to claims (.1); review of 41st omnibus objection to claims (.1); review of 42nd omnibus objection to claims (.1); review of objection to claim filed by Principal Financial Group, Inc. (.4); review of objection to proof of claim filed by plaintiffs in Visa Antitrust Action, and supporting declaration (.6); draft summary of claims for William Bowden and Greg Taylor (.5);	0.40
06/17/10	GAT 10 Office conference with W. Bowden and S. Newman regarding motion for standing to bring estate causes of action (.7); review of memo from S. Newman regarding section 108 (.2);	2.10

06/17/10	STM 10 Drafting of memorandum regarding revised discovery proposal (1.5); communications among counsel regarding hearing results and next steps (.3);	0.90
06/17/10	WPB 10 Correspondence with members and counsel regarding ruling by WA Bankruptcy Court on remand issues (.2);	1.80
06/17/10	Review of JPMC's supplemental response to Equity Committee's motion for new 2004 investigation, opposition to TPS Consortium's motion to compel the production of documents and motion for a protective order with respect to plan objectors' discovery requests (.5); review of motion to shorten notice regarding same (.1); review of TPS Consortiums' motion to compel JPMC to produce documents (.4); legal research regarding whether section 108 of the Bankruptcy Code applies to third party claims asserted by the Equity Committee (2.8); draft memo (2.4); revisions to summary (.2); correspondence to co-counsel regarding same (.1);	0.20
06/17/10	GAT 11 Office conference with J. Nelson and M. Willingham preparing for hearing (1.5); attendance at hearing regarding disclosure statement and related discovery (1.7); office conference with Debtors' counsel regarding solvency and litigation items (1.8); office conference with J. Nelson and W. Bowden regarding same and strategy (1.4);	6.50
06/17/10	WPB 11 Review amended agenda for June 17, 2010 hearing (.1); correspondence with co-counsel and members regarding hearing outcome (.3); conference with Greg Taylor regarding issues with REITS and Dime Warrants (.5);	6.40
06/17/10	LMR 11	0.90

Review emails from Greg Taylor (0.2); review

		FAGE 2
	documents regarding rights and obligations regarding preferred trust securities (0.8);	
06/17/10	GAT 15 Telephone conference with Committee regarding hearing and strategy (.7);	1.00
06/17/10	WPB 15 Call with Committee professionals regarding same, next steps and strategy moving forward (.8); call with members and professionals regarding same (.8); meeting with co-counsel regarding tasks to achieve pending July 8, 2010 (.4);	0.70
06/18/10	WPB 01 Follow up correspondence with co-counsel and Stacy L. Newman regarding section 108 and statute of limitations (.1); review materials regarding trust preference securities and exchange exert and analysis (.5); review engagement letter for FA's engages pre-seizure (.3);	2.00
06/18/10	CJB 04 Calendar omnibus hearing dates (.2);	1.20
06/18/10	GAT 05 Review of pleadings regarding status of claims asserted by Dime Warrant claimants (1.6); office conference with L. Raport regarding research regarding status of REIT claimants (.3);	0.20
06/18/10	CJB 07  Email exchange with P. Croci regarding pro rata fees for February (.1); office conference with Gregory Taylor regarding same (.1); finalize Solomon February fee application and notice (.2); prepare Solomon applications and notices for March and April (1.0); forward to P. Croci, A. Maxwell and E. Buyon for review and signature (.2);	1.90
06/18/10	GAT 10 Review of correspondence from E. Sargent regarding Debtors' discovery to Equity	1.60

Bill numbe	er OFFCL 46058	PAGE 28
	Committee (.2);	
06/18/10	STM 10 Work regarding discovery memorandum, revisions of same and related communications with co-counsel (.8);	0.20
06/18/10	WPB 10 Correspondence with co-counsel (4x) regarding notices of depositions of Committee members, U.S. Trustee view and next steps (.3);	0.80
06/18/10	SLN 10 Follow-up legal research regarding the application of section 108 of the Bankruptcy Code (.5); email to Equity Committee counsel regarding same (.1);	0.30
06/18/10	WPB 11 Review JPM objection to discovery requests and related motion for protective order (.4);	0.60
06/18/10	LMR 11 Research regarding trust preferreds;	0.40
06/18/10	WPB 14 Review PJS analysis (.5);	1.40
06/21/10	GAT 05 Continued review of Dime Warrant claims and related legal research (5.1); emails with co-counsel regarding Trust Preferred claims (.3); review of letter from same to Debtors regarding classification (.1);	0.50
06/21/10	WPB 05 Review U.S. Trustee designation of record items on appeal from examiner order (.2);	5.50
06/21/10	CJB 07 Prepare CNO for Ashby's April fee application (.3); file and serve same (.2);	0.20
06/21/10	GAT 10 Telephone conference with E. Sargent	0.50

	regarding Debtors' discovery to Equity Committee (.2); review of correspondence regarding order transferring shareholder action to Bankruptcy Court (.2);	
06/21/10	CITIM 10	0.40
06/21/10	STM 10 Review and comment on draft order regarding confirmation schedules and discovery procedures (0.4);	
06/21/10	WPB 11	0.40
00,21,10	Review correspondence from Trust preferred to Debtors regarding representation issues (.1); multiple correspondence with members and co-counsel regarding same (.4);	
06/21/10	AW 11	0.50
00/21/10	Review of FDIC's response to motion to appoint examiner (.2); review of meeting summary from Greg Taylor (.1); review of amended notice of agenda (.1); review of objection to debtors' fee application (.1); review of reply in support of second motion to appoint examiner (.2); review of UST's response in support of same (.2); review of UST designation of record/issues on appeal (.2); office conference with Greg Taylor redrafting of third circuit petition for permission to appeal (.1);	
06/21/10	LMR 11	1.20
00/21/10	Research regarding trust preferreds;	
	preferreds,	4.90
06/22/10	CW 04	
	Review omnibus objections to claims;	
06/22/10	GAT 05	0.20
	Exchange emails with C. Jang regarding deadline for Debtors' reply regarding Broadbill litigation (.1); continued review of pleadings regarding Dime Warrants (1.1);	
06/22/10	WPB 05	1.20
·	Review notice of docketing appeal of examiner order (.1); correspondence with co-counsel and Greg Taylor regarding same (.1);	
		0.20

Bill number OFFCL 46058 PAGE 30

06/22/10	SLN 05 Office conference with Greg Taylor (.1); legal research regarding whether recipient of actual fraudulent transfer can get claim against estate (2.1);	
06/22/10	GAT 06 Correspondence to SG regarding docketing of Examiner appeal in District Court (.2); follow up emails regarding same (.2);	2.20
06/22/10	Emails among PJS, SG and AG regarding Debtors' insolvency report (.3); telephone conference with same regarding same (.7); office conference with S. Newman regarding research regarding claims resulting from actual fraudulent transfers (.3); office conference with W. Bowden regarding Dime Warrant adversary action and strategy regarding same (.5); review of multiple emails with JPMC counsel regarding 2004 meet and confer (.4); review of draft objection to Debtors' depo notice and emails with E. Sargent regarding same (.4); draft notice of submission of Washington transfer order (2.7);	0.40
06/22/10	SLN 10 Legal research for derivative standing motion (4.8);	5.30
06/22/10	WPB 11 Review and analysis of ISR (2.2); review correspondence with Committee members regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence with Committee professionals regarding same (.3); call with Committee professionals regarding same (.7); review materials regarding dime warrants (.8); conference with Greg Taylor regarding intervention in Broadbill litigation (.2);	4.80
06/22/10	AW 11 Review of notice of docketing of pleadings in district court appeal (.1); multiple email correspondence with Greg Taylor and co-counsel re same and third circuit	4.40

Bill numbe	er OFFCL 46058	PAGE 31
	appellate pleadings (.1);	0.20
06/22/10	AW 11 Review of local third circuit rules and federal rules of appellate procedure (.6); begin drafting third circuit petition for permission to appeal (1.6);	0.20
06/22/10	LMR 11 Legal research regarding treatment of preferred stockholders (3.8);	2.20
06/22/10	GAT 15 Correspondence to Equity Committee forwarding transcript from 6/17 hearing (.1);	3.80
06/23/10	GAT 05 Drafting of memo regarding Dime Warrants status and strategy (3.3); legal research regarding subordination under 510(b) (.9);	0.10
06/23/10	SLN 05 Legal research regarding whether recipient of actual fraudulent transfer receives claim against estate (6.2);	4.20
06/23/10	Participation in meet and confer call with JPMC's counsel (.6); review of draft objection to Debtors' deposition notice of Equity Committee members and revise same (.8); emails with E. Sargent regarding same (.2); telephone conference with same regarding same (.2); revise same further and forward to E. Sargent (.4); emails with SG regarding notice of submission of WA transfer order (.2);	6.20
06/23/10	GAT 11 Review of Wilmington Trust's notice of appeal (.1);	2.40
06/23/10	WPB 11 Review PJS analysis of PISR (.2); multiple correspondence with PJS and co-counsel regarding same and open issues (.5); review briefs on dime warrant litigation (.5);	0.10

Bill numbe	er OFFCL 46058	PAGE 32
	review American National discovery requests directed to Debtors (.1); review materials regarding unimpairment under section (.8);	
06/23/10	AW 11 Review of UST appellate designations and update calendar of critical dates re UST appeal from order denying appointment of examiner (.2);	2.10
06/23/10	LMR 11 Draft memo to William Bowden and Greg Taylor regarding trust preferred securities (4.1);	0.20
06/23/10	SLN 17 Review of draft notice of submission of the Washington transfer order circulated by Greg Taylor (.2);	4.10
06/24/10	WPB 01 Review summary of pre-petition transfers (.2);	0.20
06/24/10	WPB 05 Review FDIC proof of claim (.3); review/comment on memorandum addressing 502(d) issues (.4);	0.20
06/24/10	SLN 05 Legal research regarding whether recipient of fraudulent transfer has a 502(h) claim against the estate and related issues (4.9); memo regarding same (1.3);	0.70
06/24/10	CJB 07 Prepare draft re-notice of hearing for Venable's final fee application (.4); file and coordinate service of same (.2);	6.20
06/24/10	CJB 10 Office conference with Gregory Taylor regarding filing and service of notice of submission of SH transfer order (.1); prepare certificate of service and service list (.1); file and serve notice (.4): forward same to	0.60

file and serve notice (.4); forward same to

Chambers (.1);

06/24/10	GAT 10	0.70
	Telephone conference with A. Sole regarding Equity Committee's action to compel shareholder meeting (.2); review of Debtors' answer and counterclaim and responsive brief regarding motion for summary judgment (1.0); correspondence to SG team regarding same (.4); office conference with S. Newman regarding research regarding derivative standing (.2); review of Debtors' preference analysis (.6); review of and comment on draft memo by S. Newman regarding fraudulent transfers and 502(b) (.3); emails with S. Newman and SG regarding JPMC's motion for protective order (.2);	
06/24/10	WPB 10	2.90
	Multiple correspondence (6x) regarding shareholder action, remand issues and approach (.4); review /analysis of Debtors' turnover complaint against JPM (.6); review/analysis of JPM complaint against Debtors regarding claims arising from WPB transaction (1.2); review/analysis of Debtors' claim against FDIC receivership and complaint against FDIC (.6);	
06/24/10	GAT 11	2.80
	Emails and telephone conference with E. Buyon regarding analysis of assets to be contributed to Liquidating Trust (.3); review of same (.3);	
06/24/10	WPB 11	0.60
	Review Leigh-Anne Raport memorandum regarding TPS (.2); review Greg Taylor memorandum regarding dime warrants (.2);	
06/24/10	AW 11	0.40
	Drafting of third circuit petition for permission to appeal (1.5);	
06/24/10	GAT 15	1.50
	Participation in Equity Committee call (.7); review of QE work product index (.2); correspondence to E. Sargent regarding EC resignations (.2); emails with J. Rose	

Bill numbe	r OFFCL 46058	PAGE 34
	regarding same (.1);	
06/24/10	WPB 15 Call with Committee and professionals regarding open issues and approach going forward (.7);	1.20
06/24/10	SLN 15 Committee call (.8);	0.70
06/24/10	SLN 17 Review of derivative standing article in ABI Journal (.2); legal research regarding derivative standing where the underlying litigation is proposed to be settled (.4);	0.80
06/25/10	WPB 01 Review/comment on memorandum addressing claims and related issues (.9);	0.60
06/25/10	GAT 04 Review of asset recovery analysis (.4);	0.90
06/25/10	CJB 07 Email exchange with E. Buyon regarding draft Solomon fee applications (.3);	0.40
06/25/10	GAT 07 Review of WGM's March monthly fee application (.2);	0.30
06/25/10	GAT 10 Review of memo regarding third party litigation (1.0); review of multiple correspondence regarding meet and confer correspondence between Equity Committee and JPMC (.4);	0.20
06/25/10	WPB 10 Multiple correspondence with co-counsel (6x) regarding dime warrant claims objections and related issues (.2);	1.40
06/25/10	SLN 10 Legal research regarding derivative standing to pursue claims that the debtors have	0.20

Bill number	OFFCL 46058	PAGE	35
	proposed to settle (5.1); review of memo from Susman Godfrey on claims (.7);		
I I	AW 11 Drafting of third circuit petition for permission to appeal (1.4); review of task list and email correspondence from William Bowden and Greg Taylor re same (.1);	5.8	0
F C V	Review debtors 43rd and 44th omnibus objections to claims relating to "dime warrant equity interest claims" (.4): e-mail correspondence to William Bowden and Greg Taylor concerning same (.3);	1.5	0
E r	GAT 04 Emails with A. Winfree and J. Nelson regarding Examiner appeal (.2); attention to certification regarding AT&T claim objections (.9);	0.7	0
C	WPB 05 Conference with Greg Taylor regarding ATT's confidential materials (.2); and review notice regarding same (.1);	1.1	0
E	GAT 10 Emails with E. Sargent regarding privilege Essues (.3);	0.3	0
C T C	OPB 10 Correspondence regarding record items on U.S. Crustee examiner appeal (.2); review Correspondence regarding production of work Oroduct and open issues (.2);	0.3	0
06/28/10 G	SAT 11	0.4	0

06/28/10 GAT 11

Review of GSA Worksheet (.7); review of work product material from Debtors (2.0);

06/28/10 AW 11

Circulate appellant designation re UST appeal and multiple email correspondence with co-counsel re additional designations (.2); e-mail correspondence/office conference with Cathie J. Boyer re coordination of filing of

supplemental designation (.1); drafting of supplemental designation for UST appeal (.7); drafting of third circuit petition for permission to appeal (1.5); 2.50 06/29/10 GAT 06 Review of draft supplemental designation of record regarding UST's appeal regarding examiner (.1); correspondence to J. Nelson regarding same (.1); 0.20 06/29/10 WPB Review/comment on draft letter regarding work product materials (.3); correspondence with Amanda Winfree and co-counsel regarding supplemental designation of U.S. Trustee appeal of examiner order (.2); review of claims analysis (.3); 0.80 06/29/10 SLN 10 Email exchange with Cathie Boyer regarding filing notice of service for document requests and notice of deposition (.1); review of Equity Committee's draft supplemental designation circulated by Amanda Winfree (.1); 0.20 06/29/10 GAT 11 Review of letter agreement for release of Milliman work product and forward comments to PJS (.2); continued review of Debtors' work product regarding GSA and Plan (3.4); review of correspondence regarding settlement offer and correspondence to J. Nelson regarding same (.2); emails with J. Nelson and PJS regarding subordinated claims under Plan (.3); telephone conference with A. Maxwell regarding settlement (.2); telephone conference with Debtors' regarding settlement worksheet (.8); 5.10 06/29/10 WPB 11 Correspondence (multiple) with co-counsel and members regarding settlement bid/ask and go forward issues (.4); 0.40 06/29/10 AW11

		TAGE 5
	Circulate draft supplemental designation regarding UST appeal (.1); drafting of third circuit petition for permission to appeal (3.7); review of correspondence from co-counsel re case status (.1);	
06/30/10	WPB 01 Correspondence regarding access to Millman materials (.2);	3.90
06/30/10	GAT 04 Emails with J. Nelson and A. Winfree regarding counter designation regarding UST's appeal of examiner order (.2); review of and revise draft application for direct appeal (.6);	0.20
06/30/10	WPB 05 Review/comment on draft petition to Third Circuit directed to appeal of examiner order (.7);	0.80
06/30/10	SLN 05 Review of Debtors' 43rd claims objection (.6); review of Debtors' 44th claims objection (.2); review of Debtors' 45th claims objection (.3); draft chart of claims objections (.3);	0.70
06/30/10	GAT 10 Telephone conference with E. Sargent regarding response to JPMC motion for protective order (.2);	1.40
06/30/10	SLN 10 Review of draft petition for permission to appeal (.9); revisions to same (.6);	0.20
06/30/10	GAT 11 Continued review of Debtors' work product regarding GSA and POR (3.0);	1.50
06/30/10	AW 11 Multiple email correspondence with co-counsel re supplemental designation on UST appeal (.1); review of debtors' counter designation of record on UST appeal (.2); finish drafting	3.00

third circuit petition for permission to appeal/circulate same with comments/issues (3.3); review of multiple draft revisions from William Bowden, Greg Taylor, and Stacy L. Newman (.3); office conference with Greg Taylor re additional issues (.1); revise draft petition (.5); circulate revised draft petition to co-counsel (1)

	petition to co-counsel (.1);	
		4.60
	Total fees	\$169,379.50
DISBURSEM	ENTS	
06/05/10	Blue Marble Logistics, LLC - Delivery and Copy Service (6/2/10 Deliveries)	45.08
06/05/10	Blue Marble Logistics, LLC - Delivery and Copy Service (6/3/10 Delivery)	6.44
06/05/10	Blue Marble Logistics, LLC - Delivery and Copy Service (6/4/10 Deliveries)	25.76
06/05/10	Parcels Inc Delivery & Copy Service (6/1/10 Deliveries)	174.00
06/05/10	Parcels Inc Delivery & Copy Service (Inv. No. 250589, 6/2/10 Document Duplication and Mail-Out)	569.65
06/05/10	Parcels Inc Delivery & Copy Service (Inv. No. 249908, 5/28/10 Document Duplication and Mail-Out)	5,584.13
06/05/10	Parcels Inc Delivery & Copy Service (Inv. No. 249915, 6/1/10 Document Duplication and Mail-Out)	865.66
06/07/10	Costs Advanced (Washington Street Ale House 6/2/10)	29.00
06/10/10	Parcels Inc Delivery & Copy Service (Inv. No. 251471, 6/8/10 Document Duplication and Service Mail-Out)	4,551.26
06/12/10	Blue Marble Logistics, LLC - Delivery and Copy Service (6/8/10 Deliveries)	83.48
06/14/10	Costs Advanced (G. Taylor - reimbursement for Taxis and Train Station Parking)	32.40
06/18/10	Costs Advanced (W. Bowden - Reimbursment for Taxis and Train ticket change fees, 6/10/10, New York)	100.00
06/24/10	Costs Advanced (B's Shuttle Service - 6/3/10)	90.00
06/24/10	Costs Advanced (Amtrak - Wilmington to New York and Return 6/14/10 C Taylor)	289.00

York and Return, 6/14/10, G. Taylor)

Bill numbe	er OFFCL 46058			PAGE 39
06/24/10	Costs Advanced (B's Sh	uttle Service	e - 6/17/10)	90.00
06/24/10	Costs Advanced (B's Shuttle Service - 6/17/10) Costs Advanced (Amtrak - Wilmington to New York and Return, 6/10/10, W. Bowden)		182.00	
06/26/10			22.50	
06/26/10	Blue Marble Logistics, LLC - Delivery and Copy Service (6/24/10 Deliveries)		27.50	
06/30/10	Costs Advanced (Purebread Deli - Lunches 6/2/10 (3) )		28.24	
06/30/10	Costs Advanced (Purebread Deli - Lunches 6/3/10)		102.00	
06/30/10			470.00	
06/30/10			74.00	
06/30/10	Computerized Research		. 2010)	313.15
06/30/10	Federal Express	,	,	199.50
06/30/10	Photocopies			2,630.20
06/30/10	Pacer Service - Court Charges	On-Line Docke	t System	428.16
06/30/10	Postage			1,263.20
06/30/10	Long Distance Telephone	е		106.69
	Total disbursements			\$18,383.00
BILLING SUMMARY				
В	owden, William P.	70.50 hrs	590.00 /hr	\$41,595.00
	argolin, Steven T.		515.00 /hr	\$20,806.00
Taylor, Gregory A. 132.10 hrs 425.00 /hr		\$56,142.50		
Winfree, Amanda 23.80 hrs 345.00 /hr			\$8,211.00	
	eenan, Benjamin	8.40 hrs	295.00 /hr	\$2,478.00
	ewman, Stacy L.	101.40 hrs	245.00 /hr	\$24,843.00
	aport, Leigh-Anne	15.20 hrs	260.00 /hr	\$3,952.00
	ong, Caroline		230.00 /hr	\$3,473.00
	ickler IV, F. Troupe		215.00 /hr	\$3,397.00
	oyer, Cathie J.		180.00 /hr	\$3,978.00
W	arnick, Chris	2.80 hrs	180.00 /hr	\$504.00
	TOTAL FEES	447.60 hrs		\$169,379.50
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS			\$18,383.00

Bill number OFFCL 46058 PAGE 40

	TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BI	LL		\$187,762.50	
	PAST DUE BALANCE			\$216,318.46	
	TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE FOR	THIS MATTER		\$404,080.96	
RECAP BY TIMEKEEPER					
WPB STM GAT AW BK SLN LMR CXH FTM CJB CW	Bowden, William P. Margolin, Steven T. Taylor, Gregory A. Winfree, Amanda Keenan, Benjamin Newman, Stacy L. Raport, Leigh-Anne Hong, Caroline Mickler IV, F. Troupe Boyer, Cathie J. Warnick, Chris	70.50 hrs 40.40 hrs 132.10 hrs 23.80 hrs 8.40 hrs 101.40 hrs 15.20 hrs 15.10 hrs 22.10 hrs 2.80 hrs	590 /hr 515 /hr 425 /hr 345 /hr 295 /hr 245 /hr 260 /hr 230 /hr 215 /hr 180 /hr TOTAL	\$41,595.00 \$20,806.00 \$56,142.50 \$8,211.00 \$2,478.00 \$24,843.00 \$3,952.00 \$3,473.00 \$3,397.00 \$3,978.00 \$504.00 \$169,379.50	
RECAP BY TASK					
01 02 04 05 06 07 08 10 11 14 15	Asset Analysis and Recovery Asset Disposition Case Administration Claims Administration and Obje Employee Benefits Fee/Employment Applications Fee/Employment Objections Litigation Plan and Disclosure Statement Valuation Committee Administration Litigation/Adversary Proceedin	1.70 66.50 53.40 1.20 8.30 0.20 103.00 155.40		\$6,187.00 \$722.50 \$18,944.50 \$19,515.50 \$510.00 \$1,667.00 \$118.00 \$35,920.50 \$68,658.00 \$913.00 \$16,027.50 \$196.00	

## RECAP BY EXPENSE CODE

$\mathtt{BL}$	Blue Marble	210.76	\$210.76
CA	Costs Advanced	1486.64	\$1,486.64
CRS	Computerized Research	313.15	\$313.15
FX	Federal Express	199.50	\$199.50
PC	Photocopies	26302.00	\$2,630.20
PCR	Pacer Service - Court On-Line	428.16	\$428.16
ΡI	Parcels Inc Delivery Servi	11744.70	\$11,744.70
POS	Postage	1263.20	\$1,263.20
TP	Long Distance Telephone	106.69	\$106.69

## **CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE**

I, Gregory A. Taylor, hereby certify that, on August 3, 2010, I caused one copy of the foregoing to be served upon the parties listed below in the manner indicated.

## HAND DELIVERY

Mark D. Collins, Esq. Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A. One Rodney Square Wilmington, Delaware 19801 Joseph J. McMahon, Jr., Esq. Office of the United States Trustee for The District of Delaware 844 King Street, Suite 2207 Wilmington, Delaware 19801

David B. Stratton, Esq. Evelyn J. Meltzer, Esq. Pepper Hamilton LLP Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100 1313 N. Market Street Wilmington, DE 19801

## **OVERNIGHT COURIER**

Washington Mutual, Inc. c/o Alvarez and Marsal 1301 Second Avenue, WMC3301 Seattle, WA 98101 Attn: John Marciel, Esq.

Fred S. Hodara, Esq.
Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP
One Bryant Park
New York, NY 10036

Peter J. Gurfein, Esq.
David P. Simonds, Esq.
Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP
2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400
Los Angeles, CA 90067-3012

Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq. Brian S. Rosen, Esq. Weil Gotshal & Manges LLP 767 Fifth Avenue New York, NY 10153

Scott L. Alberino, Esq. Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP 1333 New Hampshire Avenue, NW Washington, DC 20036-1564

Gregory A. Taylor (#4008)