

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

-----X

In re: Chapter 11
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,¹ Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
(Jointly Administered)
Debtors.

-----X

**THIRTY-SIXTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC, FINANCIAL
ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS,
FOR INTERIM ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF
EXPENSES FOR SERVICES RENDERED DURING THE PERIOD
OCTOBER 1, 2011 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2011**

Name of Applicant: FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to Provide Services to: Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Date of Retention: Retention order entered December 16, 2008
Effective as of October 15, 2008
Period for which Compensation/
Reimbursement is Sought: October 1, 2011 through October 31, 2011
Compensation Sought as Actual,
Reasonable and Necessary: \$203,073.00
Expense Reimbursement Sought as
Actual, Reasonable and Necessary: \$3,193.90

This is a: X monthly ____ interim ____ final application

¹ The Debtors in these cases include Washington Mutual, Inc. and WMI Investment Corp.



Prior Fee Applications:

<u>Time Period</u>	<u>Fees Requested</u>	<u>Expenses Requested</u>	<u>Status</u>
10/15/08 - 11/30/08 (First Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$537,698.60	\$11,750.72	Certificate of No Objection (Revised) Filed (Docket # 595)
12/01/08 - 12/31/08 (Second Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$258,997.20	\$3,294.01	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 689)
01/01/09 - 01/31/09 (Third Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$320,173.00	\$1,615.12	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 803)
10/15/08 - 01/31/09 (First Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$279,217.20	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket # 947)
02/01/09 - 02/28/09 (Fourth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$191,285.20	\$2,580.00	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 912)
03/01/09 - 03/31/09 (Fifth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$166,663.60	\$226.50	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 1058)
04/01/09 - 04/30/09 (Sixth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$198,773.20	\$1,535.90	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 1130)
05/01/09 - 05/31/09 (Seventh Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$198,264.00	\$167.36	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 1355)
02/1/09 - 05/31/09 (Second Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$188,742.50	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket # 1550)
06/01/09 - 06/30/09 (Eighth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$203,757.20	\$7,386.54	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 1513)
07/01/09 - 07/31/09 (Ninth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$260,536.00	\$1,367.50	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 1621)
08/01/09 - 08/31/09 (Tenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$201,210.00	\$423.34	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 1740)
09/01/09 - 09/30/09 (Eleventh Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$187,454.40	\$217.30	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 1907)
06/01/09 - 09/30/09 (Third Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$213,239.40	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket # 1882)
10/01/09 - 10/31/09 (Twelfth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$327,472.80	\$722.80	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 2024)
11/01/09 - 11/30/09 (Thirteenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$203,116.40	\$4,611.31	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 2150)
12/01/09 - 12/31/09 (Fourteenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$63,430.00	\$144.19	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 2385)
01/01/10 - 01/31/10 (Fifteenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$139,596.80	\$537.11	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket # 2600)
10/01/09 - 01/31/10 (Fourth Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$183,404.00	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket # 2538)
02/01/10 - 02/28/10 (Sixteenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$136,418.00	\$389.42	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #3650)
03/01/10 - 03/31/10 (Seventeenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$248,494.00	\$579.96	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #3795)
04/01/10 - 04/30/10 (Eighteenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$114,743.20	\$216.70	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #4791)
05/01/10 - 05/31/10 (Nineteenth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$192,341.80	\$1,339.62	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #5181)
02/01/10 - 05/31/10 (Fifth Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$172,999.25	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket #5059)
06/01/10 - 06/30/10 (Twentieth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$151,320.40	\$14,649.91	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #5355)
07/01/10 - 07/31/10 (Twenty-First Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$142,773.60	\$5,014.84	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #5505)
08/01/10 - 08/31/10 (Twenty-Second Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$132,989.80	\$1,231.43	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #5703)
09/01/10 - 09/30/10 (Twenty-Third Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$120,711.20	\$724.99	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #6109)
06/01/10 - 09/30/10 (Sixth Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$136,948.75	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket #5895)
10/01/10 - 10/31/10 (Twenty-Fourth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$113,497.60	\$7,779.07	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #6569)
11/01/10 - 11/30/10 (Twenty-Fifth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$227,894.40	\$5,141.64	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #6571)
12/01/10 - 12/31/10 (Twenty-Sixth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$148,203.80	\$5,383.06	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #6800)
01/01/11 - 01/31/11 (Twenty-Seventh Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$119,210.40	\$5,589.52	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #7070)
10/1/10 - 01/31/11 (Seventh Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$152,201.55	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket #6973)
02/01/11 - 02/28/11 (Twenty-Eighth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$87,530.40	\$2,648.64	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #7226)
03/01/11 - 03/31/11 (Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$124,433.80	\$3,389.22	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #7823)
04/01/11 - 04/30/11 (Thirtieth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$155,204.40	\$2,855.17	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #8156)
05/01/11 - 05/31/11 (Thirty-First Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$191,722.40	\$3,002.42	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #8400)
02/01/11 - 05/31/11 (Eighth Quarterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$139,722.75	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket #8261)
06/01/11 - 06/30/11 (Thirty-Second Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$418,110.40	\$4,123.70	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #8541)
07/01/11 - 07/31/11 (Thirty-Third Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$270,321.20	\$17,210.90	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #8594)
08/01/11 - 08/31/11 (Thirty-Forth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$117,369.80	\$3,337.00	Certificate of No Objection Filed (Docket #8959)
09/01/11 - 09/30/11 (Thirty-Fifth Monthly Fee Application) ⁽¹⁾	\$123,431.20	\$2,633.60	Certificate of No Objection Not Filed Yet.
06/01/11-09/30/11 (Ninth Quaterly Fee Application) ⁽²⁾	\$232,308.15	\$0.00	Order Filed (Docket #8995)

(1) Fees Requested associated with Monthly Fee Applications represent 80% of the total Fees and 100% of the Expenses Requested in the Monthly Applications.

(2) Fees Requested associated with Quarterly Fee Applications represent the Amount of Holdback Fees requested in the Quarterly Applications.

EXHIBIT D
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Joffe, Steven	Senior Managing Director	\$895	0.5	\$447.50
Scruton, Andrew	Senior Managing Director	895	87.2	78,044.00
Simms, Steven	Senior Managing Director	895	40.7	36,426.50
Cordasco, Michael	Managing Director	745	84.8	63,176.00
McDonagh, Timothy	Managing Director	695	1.4	973.00
Hofstad, Ivo J	Director	450	1.5	675.00
Pace, Kathryn	Director	605	16.2	9,801.00
Hamilton, Christopher	Senior Consultant	460	5.5	2,530.00
Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	380	24.0	9,120.00
Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	250	4.8	1,200.00
Moore, Teresa	Associate	200	3.4	680.00
GRAND TOTAL			270.0	\$203,073.00

Average Hourly Rate

\$752.12

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Analyze Cash Flow Systems (Debtor, Non-Debtor, Other Affiliates)	1.2	\$894.00
2	Current Operating Results and Related Matters	0.6	228.00
10	Claims Assessment, Analysis and Adjudication	2.0	1,097.50
13	Formulation of Plan of Liquidation / Disc. Statement	114.3	84,791.50
18	Debt Related Analysis	6.5	4,288.00
19	Review and Assessment of Tax Issues	1.6	1,267.00
23	Planning, Supervision and Review	2.7	2,159.00
24	Preparation for and Attendance at Court Hearings	33.1	27,224.50
27	Prep/Part in Calls Mtg w/Debtor	20.1	15,796.00
28	Prep/Part in Calls Mtg w/UCC	43.6	33,517.00
29	Prep/Part in Calls Mtg w/Counsel	28.5	24,438.50
30	Meetings with Other Parties	2.6	2,327.00
32	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications	13.2	5,045.00
GRAND TOTAL		270.0	\$203,073.00

EXHIBIT F
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
SUMMARY OF EXPENSES BY CATEGORY
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

Expense Type	Expense Total
Computerized Research & Corporate Services Fees	\$2,613.60
Working Meals	26.45
Ground Transportation	553.85
Total	\$3,193.90

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

-----X

In re:

Chapter 11

WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,

Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)

(Jointly Administered)

Debtors.

-----X

**THIRTY-SIXTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC., FINANCIAL
ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR
INTERIM ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF
EXPENSES FOR SERVICES RENDERED DURING THE
PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2011**

For its Thirty-Sixth Monthly Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses (the “Application”) FTI Consulting, Inc. (“FTI” or the “Applicant”), Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”), respectfully represents as follows:

I. INTRODUCTION

1. Applicant, as financial advisor to the Committee, makes this the Thirty-Sixth Fee Application for payment of professional services rendered and expenses incurred in its representation of the Committee as provided under Section 330 of Title 11 of the United States Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”) and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”).

2. Applicant, for this Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period, seeks an award of compensation in the amount of \$203,073.00 for 270.0 hours of professional services rendered and reimbursement of disbursements actually and necessarily incurred in the amount of \$3,193.90. These services were rendered, and disbursements recorded, from October 1, 2011 through October 31, 2011. The average hourly rate for the professional services rendered during this time period was \$752.12.

II. BACKGROUND

3. On September 26, 2008 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtors filed with this Court their voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”). Pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Debtors are continuing to operate their businesses and manage their properties and assets as debtors in possession.

4. On October 15, 2008, the United States Trustee appointed the Committee, consisting of the following five members: (i) The Bank of New York Mellon, (ii) Law Debenture Trust Company of New York, (iii) Wells Fargo Bank, N.A., (iv) Wilmington Trust Company, and (v) Verizon Services Corp.

5. On October 15, 2008, the Committee selected the law firms of Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP and Pepper Hamilton LLP to serve as co-counsel to the Committee in connection with the Debtor’s Chapter 11 proceedings. On October 15, 2008 the Committee selected FTI as its financial advisor.

6. On December 16, 2008, the Court entered an Order Pursuant to section 1103 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”) Authorizing the Retention of FTI Consulting as Financial Advisors for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (Docket No. 456; the “Retention Order”). A copy of the Retention Order is attached hereto as Exhibit A.

III. PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

7. In accordance with Local Rule 2016.2 and the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the “Compensation Procedures Order”), and to assist the Court, the Debtors, the United States Trustee and other parties in interest in evaluating this Application for compensation, the primary services performed by Applicant during the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period are summarized in the Summary attached hereto as Exhibit C. The Summary reflects certain services of major importance which required the special attention, efforts and skill of Applicant. Applicant’s services throughout the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period have enhanced the Committee’s understanding of many issues critical to these cases. Furthermore, Applicant’s efforts have enabled the Committee to act in an informed, efficient manner and to actively participate in these cases and to significantly assist in the maximization of value to the estates.

8. A summary sheet of the professionals and the number of hours incurred by each during the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period is annexed hereto as Exhibit D. A summary sheet which includes identification of services performed by the professionals, categorized by Applicant into “project codes” in order to group related time entries in a certain subject area, is annexed hereto as Exhibit E. In addition, detail of Professional Fees by project codes, including detailed time entry by professional with description of tasks performed, is annexed hereto as

Exhibit E.1.

9. A summary of Out-of-Pocket Expenses by Category is annexed hereto as Exhibit F. In addition, detail of expenses by Category is annexed here to as Exhibit F.1.

10. Applicant has worked closely with the Debtors' financial advisors, the other case professionals and the Committee to avoid unnecessary duplication of services charged to the Debtors' estates.

IV. CONCLUSION

11. Applicant has necessarily and properly expended 270.0 hours of services in performance of its duties as financial advisor to the Committee during the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period. Applicant respectfully requests a fee allowance for professional services rendered in the amount of \$203,073.00 during the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period. Pursuant to the Compensation Procedures Order, Applicant requests that upon the expiration of the applicable objection period, the Debtors remit to the Applicant eighty (80%) percent of the fees, or \$162,458.40. Applicant has also necessarily incurred disbursements in the amount of \$3,193.90 in the performance of Applicant's duties to the Committee during the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period. Applicant respectfully requests reimbursement of disbursements in the sum of \$3,193.90.

12. As stated in the Affidavit of Steven Simms, annexed hereto as Exhibit B, Applicant has not agreed to share any compensation to be received herein with any other person.

WHEREFORE, Applicant respectfully requests compensation for professional services rendered as financial advisor to the Committee during the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period in the sum of \$162,458.40, together with reimbursement of disbursements in the amount of \$3,193.90; and for such other and further relief as this Court deems just and proper.

Dated: New York, New York
December 13, 2011

FTI CONSULTING, INC

By:



Steven Simms
Senior Managing Director
Financial Advisor for the Official
Committee of Unsecured
Creditors of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.
3 Times Square New York, New York 10036

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re: : Chapter 11
: :
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., *et al.* : Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
: (Jointly Administered)
: :
Debtors. : **Hearing Date: TBD**
: **Objection Deadline: January 3, 2012 at 4:00 p.m.**

NOTICE OF APPLICATION

TO: U.S. Trustee; Debtors, and Counsel to the Debtors.

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that FTI Consulting, Inc. (“FTI”) (the “Applicant”), financial advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) of Washington Mutual, Inc., et al. (the “Debtors”) has filed its **Thirty-Sixth Monthly Application of FTI Consulting, Inc., Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, for Interim Allowance of Compensation and for Reimbursement of Expenses for Services Rendered During the Period From October 1, 2011 through October 31, 2011** (the “Application”).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application must be filed with the Clerk of the Court on or before **January 3, 2012 at 4:00 p.m. (Prevailing Eastern Time)**.

At the same time, you must also serve a copy of the response upon the following parties:

David B. Stratton, Esq.
Evelyn J. Meltzer, Esq.
PEPPER HAMILTON LLP
Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100
1313 Market Street,
P.O. Box 1709
Wilmington, DE 19899-1709

Fred S. Hodara, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
One Bryant Park
New York, NY 10036

Scott L. Alberino, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
1333 New Hampshire Avenue, N.W.
Washington, D.C. 20036

Peter J. Gurfein, Esq.
David P. Simonds, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400
Los Angeles, CA 90067-3012

Chad Smith
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
925 Fourth Avenue, Suite 2500
Seattle, WA 98104

Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq.
Brian S. Rosen, Esq.
WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES, LLP
767 Fifth Avenue
New York, NY 10153

Mark D. Collins, Esq.
RICHARDS LAYTON & FINGER, P.A.
One Rodney Square
920 North King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Jane M. Leamy, Esq.
OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE
844 King Street
Suite 2207, Lockbox 35
Wilmington, DE 19801

Andrew Scruntion
Senior Managing Director
FTI CONSULTING, INC.
3 Times Square
New York, New York 10036

William P. Bowden, Esq.
Gregory A. Taylor, Esq.
Stacy L. Newman, Esq.
ASHBY & GEDDES, P.A.
500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor
P.O. Box 1150
Wilmington, DE 19801

Stephen D. Susman, Esq.
Seth D. Ard, Esq.
SUSMAN GODFREY, L.L.P.
654 Madison Avenue, 5th Floor
New York, NY 10065

Parker C. Folse, III, Esq.
Edgar Sargent, Esq.
Justin A. Nelson, Esq.
SUSMAN GODFREY, L.L.P.
1201 Third Avenue, Suite 3800
Seattle, WA 98101

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION WILL BE SCHEDULED at the Court's convenience before the Honorable Mary F. Walrath, United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 5th Floor, Courtroom #4, 824 Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF DEMANDED IN THE APPLICATION WITHOUT FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

Date: December 13, 2011
Wilmington, Delaware

PEPPER HAMILTON LLP

/s/ Evelyn J. Meltzer
David B. Stratton (DE No. 960)
David M. Fournier (DE No. 2812)
Evelyn J. Meltzer (DE No. 4581)
John H. Schanne, II (DE No. 5260)
Hercules Plaza, Suite 5100
1313 N. Market Street
Wilmington, Delaware 19801
Tel: (302) 777-6500
Fax: (302) 421-8390

Fred S. Hodara, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
One Bryant Park
New York, NY 10036
Tel: (212) 872-1000
Fax: (212) 872-1002

Scott L. Alberino, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
1333 New Hampshire Avenue, N.W.
Washington, D.C. 20036
Tel: (202) 887-4027
Fax: (202) 887-4288

Peter J. Gurfein, Esq.
David P. Simonds, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400
Los Angeles, California 90067-3012
Tel: (310) 229-1000
Fax: (310) 229-1001

*Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured
Creditors*

EXHIBIT

A

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:)	
)	Chapter 11
Washington Mutual, Inc., et al.,¹)	
)	Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)
)	(Jointly Administered)
Debtors.)	Related Docket No. 303

**ORDER AUTHORIZING RETENTION OF
FTI CONSULTING, INC.
AS FINANCIAL ADVISORS
FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

Upon the application (the "Application") of the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") of the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors"), for an order pursuant to section 1103 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), authorizing them to retain FTI Consulting, Inc. and its wholly owned subsidiaries (collectively "FTI") as financial advisors; and upon the Affidavit of Michael Eisenband in support of the Application; and due and adequate notice of the Application having been given; and it appearing that no other notice need be given; and it appearing that FTI is not representing any adverse interest in connection with these cases; and it appearing that the relief requested in the Application is in the best interest of the Committee; after due deliberation and sufficient cause appearing therefore, it is hereby

ORDERED that the Application be, and it hereby is, granted; and it is further

ORDERED that the capitalized terms not defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Application.

ORDERED that in accordance with section 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Committee is authorized to employ and retain FTI as of October 15, 2008 as their financial advisors on the terms set forth in the Application; and it is further

ORDERED that FTI shall be compensated in accordance with the procedures set forth in sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code and such Bankruptcy Rules as may then be applicable, from time to time, and such procedures as may be fixed by order of this Court.

¹ The Debtors in these cases include Washington Mutual, Inc. and WMI Investment Corp.

ORDERED that this court shall retain jurisdiction with respect to all matters arising or related to the implementation of this order.

Dated: Dec. 16, 2008



THE HONORABLE MARY F. WALRATH
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

EXHIBIT

B

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

-----X

In re:

Chapter 11

WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al.,

Case No. 08-12229 (MFW)

(Jointly Administered)

Debtors.

-----X

**AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF THE THIRTY-SIXTH MONTHLY APPLICATION
OF FTI CONSULTING, INC, FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL
COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR INTERIM ALLOWANCE
OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
SERVICES RENDERED DURING THE PERIOD
OCTOBER 1, 2011 THROUGH OCTOBER 30, 2011**

STATE OF NEW YORK)

ss:

COUNTY OF NEW YORK)

STEVEN SIMMS, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

1. I am a Senior Managing Director of FTI Consulting, Inc. (“FTI”) as financial advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (“Committee”).


2. I have read the foregoing Thirty-Sixth Monthly Application of FTI for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Committee and know the contents thereof. The same are true to the best of my knowledge, except as to matters therein alleged to be upon information and belief, and as to those matters, I believe them to be true. I have personally performed many of the services rendered by FTI, and I am thoroughly familiar with all other work performed on behalf of the Committee by the FTI professionals.

3. In accordance with Bankruptcy Rule 2016(a) and § 504 of the Bankruptcy Code, no agreement or understanding exists between the Applicant and any other person for the sharing of compensation to be received in connection with these cases.



Steven Simms

Sworn to before me this
13th day of December, 2011



Notary Public

YOLANDA LaGUERRA
Notary Public, State of New York
No. 01LA4977093 New York
Certificate Filed in New York County
Commission Expires January 28, 2015

EXHIBIT

C

FTI CONSULTING, INC
FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
UNSECURED CREDITORS OF WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., ET AL.,
SUMMARY OF PRINCIPAL SERVICES BY TASK CODES PERFORMED FOR THE
PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2011

The following is not intended to be a complete statement of all professional services rendered, but serves only to list certain of the services of major task codes rendered by Applicant during the Thirty-Sixth Monthly Period.

PCD 13 – Formulation of Plan of Liquidation / Disc. Statement / Settlement Discussions (114.3 hours)

FTI continued to review and analyze the potential impact of the Judge’s confirmation opinion and participated in numerous discussions with Counsel, the Committee, and the Debtors regarding the same. FTI assisted Counsel in reviewing and analyzing outstanding confirmation issues and determining the go-forward strategy. FTI prepared illustrative recovery scenarios including federal judgment rate changes, varying emergence dates, ranges of claims, disallowance, and a potential set aside plan. Such analysis was presented and discussed with the Committee and other constituents.

PCD 24 – Preparation for and Attendance at Court Hearings (33.1 hours)

FTI participated in the court ordered mediation and conference calls related to the same. FTI’s attendance at the mediation was integral to take steps forward toward confirmation and ensuring that the best interest of the Committee was being considered.

PCD 27 – Prepare for and Participate in Calls and Meetings with the Debtor (20.1 hours)

FTI participated in several calls with the Debtor to discuss the progress of mediation, potential settlement structures and next steps.

PCD 28 – Prepare for and Participate in Calls and Meetings with the Committee (43.6 hours)

FTI participated in several calls with the UCC to discuss the status of mediation, potential revised recoveries, potential appeals, appeal strategy, and go-forward strategy. In addition, FTI kept the Committee apprised of other relevant case issues.

PCD 29 – Prepare for and Participate in Calls and Meetings with Counsel (28.5 hours)

FTI participated in multiple conference calls with Counsel to discuss the status of mediation and go-forward strategy. FTI also discussed with Counsel the updated illustrative recovery scenarios and the impact of the confirmation opinion on the various creditor classes.

EXHIBIT D
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Joffe, Steven	Senior Managing Director	\$895	0.5	\$447.50
Scruton, Andrew	Senior Managing Director	895	87.2	78,044.00
Simms, Steven	Senior Managing Director	895	40.7	36,426.50
Cordasco, Michael	Managing Director	745	84.8	63,176.00
McDonagh, Timothy	Managing Director	695	1.4	973.00
Hofstad, Ivo J	Director	450	1.5	675.00
Pace, Kathryn	Director	605	16.2	9,801.00
Hamilton, Christopher	Senior Consultant	460	5.5	2,530.00
Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	380	24.0	9,120.00
Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	250	4.8	1,200.00
Moore, Teresa	Associate	200	3.4	680.00
GRAND TOTAL			270.0	\$203,073.00

Average Hourly Rate

\$752.12

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Analyze Cash Flow Systems (Debtor, Non-Debtor, Other Affiliates)	1.2	\$894.00
2	Current Operating Results and Related Matters	0.6	228.00
10	Claims Assessment, Analysis and Adjudication	2.0	1,097.50
13	Formulation of Plan of Liquidation / Disc. Statement	114.3	84,791.50
18	Debt Related Analysis	6.5	4,288.00
19	Review and Assessment of Tax Issues	1.6	1,267.00
23	Planning, Supervision and Review	2.7	2,159.00
24	Preparation for and Attendance at Court Hearings	33.1	27,224.50
27	Prep/Part in Calls Mtg w/Debtor	20.1	15,796.00
28	Prep/Part in Calls Mtg w/UCC	43.6	33,517.00
29	Prep/Part in Calls Mtg w/Counsel	28.5	24,438.50
30	Meetings with Other Parties	2.6	2,327.00
32	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications	13.2	5,045.00
GRAND TOTAL		270.0	\$203,073.00

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	1	0.3	Review updated 13 week cash flow forecast.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	1	0.2	Review updated cash flow analysis.
10/12/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	1	0.2	Review updated cash flow analysis.
10/20/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	1	0.2	Review updated 13 week cash flow forecast.
10/26/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	1	0.3	Review budget to actual cash flows.
			1 Total	1.2	
10/27/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	2	0.6	Review Monthly Operating Report (MOR).
			2 Total	0.6	
10/20/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	10	0.3	Coordinate with Counsel re: call on avoidance actions.
10/20/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	10	0.6	Participate in call with professionals re: employee avoidance actions.
10/20/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	10	0.6	Review detail provided re: employee avoidance actions.
10/24/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	10	0.5	Review claims.
			10 Total	2.0	
10/1/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.9	Update recovery scenario analysis.
10/1/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Reconcile recoveries to Debtor analysis.
10/1/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.9	Correspond re: mediation issues.
10/3/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Update recovery model.
10/3/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.9	Prepare scenario analysis for Committee.
10/3/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Prepare summary of liquidation analysis for Committee.
10/3/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review draft liquidating trust agreement.
10/3/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review draft appeal prepared by Counsel.
10/3/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	2.1	Review revised draft filings.
10/3/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.4	Review and update draft related to appeal and mediation.
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Prepare package of summary Plan documentation.
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	1.2	Review and update day 1 recovery analysis.
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.3	Review Debtors' proposed liquidation analysis.
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review filed mediation statement prepared by Debtors.
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Review Committee member comments on proposed filings.
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review revised draft Committee appeal.
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.3	Review revised draft Committee mediation statement.
10/4/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	2.1	Review court filings and updated recovery analyses.

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/4/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review draft pleadings.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review recovery waterfalls.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.3	Review filed mediation statements.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Participate in call re: recovery model changes.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Summarize relevant waterfall report to Committee.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Quantify and recalculate interest and caps included in mediation statements.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.3	Respond to inquiries from Counsel re: court pleadings.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review EC mediation statement.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review final mediation statement and appeal filed by Committee.
10/5/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Review TPS mediation statement.
10/5/2011	Hamilton, Christopher	Sr Consultant	13	1.0	Review waterfall for revised GUC amounts.
10/5/2011	Hamilton, Christopher	Sr Consultant	13	2.0	Review waterfall model for 2012 exits.
10/5/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review day 1 recovery analysis.
10/6/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	0.4	Review Plan documents.
10/6/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review recovery analysis.
10/6/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Prepare and update shortfall distribution analysis.
10/6/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Participate in call re: potential Plan 7 issues.
10/6/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Review and update draft recovery analysis.
10/6/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.1	Participate in call re: hearing and next steps.
10/7/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	0.5	Review waterfall claims model.
10/7/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	0.5	Review Plan documents.
10/7/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review recovery analysis.
10/7/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Prepare and update breakeven analysis.
10/7/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.3	Review draft mediation order.
10/7/2011	Hamilton, Christopher	Sr Consultant	13	0.8	Review waterfall model.
10/7/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.8	Review Plan issues and alternative structures.
10/9/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review draft of pleading for filing.
10/10/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review final mediation order.
10/10/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Review responses to filed mediation order.
10/10/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.8	Prepare potential Plan settlement structures.
10/10/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review draft pleadings.

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/10/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.7	Review prior Plan settlement issues in preparation for meeting.
10/11/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	1.7	Build out claims model.
10/11/2011	Hamilton, Christopher	Sr Consultant	13	0.7	Revise recovery model.
10/11/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.4	Review recovery analyses.
10/12/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Review mediation process outline.
10/12/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review filed pleadings.
10/13/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.9	Review draft recovery analysis chart.
10/13/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.1	Review draft pleadings.
10/14/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Prepare analysis for inclusion in mediation statement.
10/14/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Research re: preferred liquidation preferences for mediation statement.
10/14/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review Committee mediation statement.
10/14/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	2.8	Review draft mediation statements.
10/14/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.4	Review and revise Committee pleadings.
10/15/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Prepare analysis to support mediation statement.
10/15/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review and provide comments re: mediation demonstrative.
10/15/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review correspondence re: mediation statement.
10/16/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review revised draft of mediation statement.
10/16/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	2.8	Finalize mediation statement.
10/17/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	0.7	Update reconvert model.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	1.4	Review modifications to recovery model.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Review EC's objection re: leave of appeal.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review mediation statements re: Debtor and EC.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	1.2	Review other parties' mediation statements.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	1.3	Review SNH mediation statements.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Review summary of mediation statements.
10/17/2011	Hamilton, Christopher	Sr Consultant	13	0.6	Review recovery model.
10/17/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	2.5	Review prep for mediation with Counsel.
10/17/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.6	Review mediation Statements.
10/17/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review prior plans for mediation items.
10/18/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	0.9	Update recovery model.
10/18/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Review and update recovery model.

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/18/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	13	0.9	Review summary of mediation briefs.
10/18/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	2.1	Review updated recovery analyses.
10/18/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.1	Review issues relating to mediation.
10/19/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	3.9	Prepare models re: trading history analysis.
10/19/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	2.3	Review mediation statements.
10/19/2011	Hamilton, Christopher	Sr Consultant	13	0.4	Review recovery model.
10/19/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review mediation items analysis.
10/20/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.4	Review correspondence re: mediation items.
10/20/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review update re: mediation issues.
10/20/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review proposed settlement alternatives.
10/21/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	0.3	Participate in discussion re: mediation.
10/21/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Participate in meeting to discuss revised recovery analysis.
10/21/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	1.6	Prepare and edit updated recovery analysis.
10/21/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Respond to inquiries re: recovery analysis.
10/21/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.9	Review Plan settlement term sheet.
10/21/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review waterfall items.
10/24/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	1.1	Build out claims model.
10/24/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Respond to inquiries from Counsel re: term sheet.
10/24/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review correspondence re: term sheet.
10/24/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Review draft response to opposition motion.
10/24/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.6	Review revised plan term sheet.
10/24/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review update re: mediation items.
10/25/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review and edit of recovery analysis.
10/25/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review Equity Committee response to term sheet.
10/26/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	1.0	Review Plan objections.
10/26/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Review correspondence from Counsel re: mediation.

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/26/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.7	Review Committee filings re: appeal.
10/26/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	13	0.8	Review correspondence re: mediation update.
10/26/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	1.2	Review update re: Plan term sheet.
10/27/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	13	0.4	Review various term sheets.
10/27/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	13	2.1	Prepare Plan settlement term sheet.
10/27/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.7	Correspond re: Plan items.
10/28/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	0.4	Review term sheets.
10/28/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Correspond with Counsel re: mediation.
10/28/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.8	Review draft Plan term sheet proposed by Debtor.
10/28/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.4	Review side by side term sheet comparison prepared by Counsel.
10/28/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	13	1.5	Review various term sheets and comparison of same.
10/28/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.3	Review correspondence re: settlement issues.
10/30/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.3	Correspond re: settlement issues.
10/31/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	13	2.0	Review term sheet.
10/31/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	13	0.5	Review side by side Plan comparison.
10/31/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.4	Participate in call re: mediation issues.
10/31/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.4	Correspond re: settlement items.
10/31/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	13	0.6	Review items re: Plan issues.
13 Total				114.3	
10/4/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	18	0.4	Research lock up provisions re: debt trading.
10/4/2011	McDonagh, Timothy	Managing Dir	18	1.4	Prepare summary analysis of trading profit for various creditors.
10/7/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	18	0.5	Review research re: holdings data.
10/7/2011	Hofstad, Ivo J	Director	18	0.5	Research bond holders for preferred equity securities.
10/19/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	18	2.4	Prepare and edit creditor profit analysis.
10/28/2011	Hofstad, Ivo J	Director	18	1.0	Research most recent performance reports re: WaMu securities.
10/28/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	18	0.3	Coordinate re: Bloomberg search of MARTA mortgage backed securities.
18 Total				6.5	
10/21/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	19	0.5	Participate in call with tax professionals re: NOL preservation.
10/26/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	19	0.6	Participate in call re: tax issues related to reorganization.
10/26/2011	Joffe, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	19	0.5	Participate in call with Akin re: tax regulations.
19 Total				1.6	

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/6/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	23	0.5	Participate in discussion re: planning issues.
10/7/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	23	1.1	Participate in call re: case issues.
10/7/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	23	0.7	Review update re: case issues.
10/13/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	23	0.4	Correspondence on case issues.
23 Total				2.7	
10/5/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	24	0.8	Participate in call re: hearing issues.
10/6/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	24	1.6	Participate in court conference call re: mediation scope.
10/6/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	24	1.7	Participate in court conference call re: mediation scope.
10/6/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	24	1.5	Prepare for and participate in hearing.
10/7/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	24	0.4	Review court transcript from hearing.
10/19/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	24	7.1	Participate in court ordered mediation.
10/19/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	24	7.8	Attend court ordered mediation.
10/20/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	24	6.9	Attend court ordered mediation.
10/20/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	24	5.3	Attend court ordered mediation.
24 Total				33.1	
10/7/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	27	0.5	Participate in weekly Debtor call re: status updates.
10/7/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	27	0.7	Participate in call with Debtor re: mediation order.
10/7/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	27	0.6	Participate in weekly Debtor call re: status updates.
10/11/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	27	3.7	Participate in meeting with Debtors and Equity Committee.
10/11/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	27	3.5	Participate in meeting with Debtor re: mediation and potential EC settlement.
10/11/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	27	2.8	Participate in meeting with Debtor and EC re: case issue.
10/17/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	27	1.0	Participate in call with Debtor re: mediation.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	27	0.6	Participate in call with Debtor re: mediation.
10/17/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	27	0.7	Participate in call with Debtors re: upcoming mediation and strategy.
10/17/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	27	1.0	Participate in call with Debtor re: mediation statements.
10/17/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	27	0.3	Participate in call with Debtors re: mediation.
10/21/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	27	0.5	Participate in call with A&M re: Plan settlement term sheet.
10/21/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	27	0.6	Participate in call with A&M re: Plan settlement term sheet.
10/28/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	27	0.8	Participate in call with Debtors re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	27	0.3	Distribute agenda for professional's call.
10/28/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	27	0.9	Participate in professional's call with Debtor re: latest settlement discussions.

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/28/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	27	0.6	Participate in weekly Debtor call re: status updates.
10/28/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	27	0.6	Participate in call with Debtor re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	27	0.4	Correspond with Debtor on case issues.
27 Total				20.1	
10/3/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	1.5	Participate in Committee call re: appeal motion and mediation statement.
10/3/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.5	Participate in Committee call re: Appeal Motion and mediation Statement.
10/5/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	0.5	Participate in call with Committee members re: status update.
10/11/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	1.5	Participate in call with Committee re: update on settlement discussions.
10/11/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.5	Participate in call with Committee re: update on settlement discussions.
10/11/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	28	0.9	Prepare for and participate in Committee call re: EC meeting and related topics.
10/12/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.1	Participate in call with Committee members re: status update.
10/14/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	1.0	Participate in status update call with Committee re: mediation.
10/14/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.5	Participate in call with Committee re: review mediation statements.
10/14/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.3	Prepare for and participate in Committee call.
10/18/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	28	1.0	Participate in Committee call re: upcoming mediation.
10/18/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	1.1	Participate in Committee call re: upcoming mediation.
10/18/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	28	1.0	Participate in Committee call re: upcoming mediation.
10/18/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.7	Participate in weekly Committee call.
10/18/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	28	0.8	Participate in Committee call re: upcoming mediation.
10/19/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	2.1	Attend sessions with Committee re: mediation.
10/19/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	3.5	Participate in Committee meetings during mediation.
10/20/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	2.5	Participate in meeting with Committee during mediation.
10/21/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	28	0.8	Participate in call with Committee member re: Committee proposal.
10/21/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	0.8	Participate in call with Committee re: Plan settlement.
10/21/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	0.9	Participate in call with Committee member re: Committee proposal.
10/21/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	0.8	Participate in call with Committee member re: Committee proposal.
10/21/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	28	0.8	Participate in Committee call re: Plan settlement term sheet.
10/21/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.5	Participate in meeting with Committee re: Plan settlement term sheet.
10/21/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	28	0.9	Participate in call with Committee re: case issues and next steps.
10/25/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	28	1.0	Participate in call with Committee re: mediation.
10/25/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	0.9	Participate in call with Committee re: mediation update.

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/25/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	28	0.9	Participate in Committee call re: term sheet and litigation issues.
10/25/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.3	Participate in call with Committee re: mediation.
10/28/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	28	2.0	Participate in call with Committee re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	28	1.5	Participate in call with Committee re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	28	1.5	Participate in Committee call re: settlement discussions.
10/28/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	28	1.2	Participate in call with Committee re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	28	0.8	Participate in call with Committee re: Plan term sheet.
			28 Total	43.6	
10/1/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	29	0.3	Respond to inquiries from Counsel re: recoveries.
10/3/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	2.3	Participate in call with Counsel re: proposed filings.
10/4/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	2.1	Participate in meeting with Counsel re: court filings.
10/5/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	1.1	Participate in discussion with Counsel re: mediation conference.
10/6/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	29	0.5	Participate in call with Counsel re: mediation scope.
10/6/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	2.7	Participate in calls with Counsel re: update on court conference and mediation.
10/7/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	29	1.5	Participate in call with Counsel re: mediation.
10/7/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	2.5	Participate in discussion with Counsel re: mediator process.
10/10/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	1.6	Participate in meeting with Counsel re: Plan discussions ahead of mediation.
10/11/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	2.1	Participate in discussion with Counsel re: settlement strategies.
10/11/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	29	0.8	Participate in call with Counsel re: hearing issues.
10/12/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	0.9	Participate in call with Counsel re: draft mediation statements.
10/13/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	1.4	Participate in meeting with Counsel re: mediation statements.
10/14/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	29	0.7	Participate in call with Counsel re: mediation statement.
10/14/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	2.1	Participate in discussion with Counsel re: mediation statements.
10/17/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Consultant	29	0.4	Participate in call with Counsel re: mediation.
10/17/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	29	0.7	Participate in call with Counsel re: mediation.
10/17/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	29	0.3	Participate in call with Counsel re: mediation.
10/17/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	29	0.4	Participate in call with Counsel re: mediation.
10/28/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	29	0.7	Participate in call with Counsel re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	29	0.4	Participate in call with Counsel re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	1.1	Participate in meeting with Counsel re: Plan term sheet.
10/28/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	29	0.9	Participate in call with Counsel re: Plan term sheet.

EXHIBIT E
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>POSITION</u>	<u>CODE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF HOURS</u>
10/31/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Sr Managing Dir	29	1.0	Participate in meeting with Counsel re: update on negotiations.
29 Total				28.5	
10/3/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	30	1.2	Correspond with creditors re: case issues.
10/12/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	30	0.4	Participate in call with Creditor re: case issues.
10/18/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	30	0.6	Participate in discussion with creditor re: case issues.
10/25/2011	Simms, Steven	Sr Managing Dir	30	0.4	Correspond with creditor re: case issues.
30 Total				2.6	
10/4/2011	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	32	0.8	Update August fee application and process invoice.
10/4/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	32	1.4	Update August fee application.
10/6/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	32	0.5	Review August fee application.
10/10/2011	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	32	0.7	Update and finalize August fee application.
10/11/2011	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	32	0.4	Review September time for fee estimate.
10/11/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	32	0.4	Provide fee estimate to A&M.
10/12/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	32	0.7	Finalize August fee application.
10/13/2011	Moore, Teresa	Associate	32	1.3	Prepare September fee application.
10/13/2011	Moore, Teresa	Associate	32	2.1	Continue to prepare September fee application.
10/19/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	32	0.3	Respond to various inquiries re: billing.
10/27/2011	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	32	0.9	Review and update September fee application.
10/27/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	32	0.6	Review September fee application.
10/28/2011	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	32	1.3	Review and update September fee application.
10/31/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Managing Dir	32	0.5	Review draft September fee application.
10/31/2011	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	32	0.7	Update September fee application.
10/31/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	32	0.3	Coordinate with local Counsel re: quarterly fee application.
10/31/2011	Pace, Kathryn	Director	32	0.3	Review September fee application.
32 Total				13.2	
Grand Total				270.0	

EXHIBIT F
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
SUMMARY OF EXPENSES BY CATEGORY
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

Expense Type	Expense Total
Computerized Research & Corporate Services Fees	\$2,613.60
Working Meals	26.45
Ground Transportation	553.85
Total	\$3,193.90

EXHIBIT F
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
DETAIL OF EXPENSES
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2011 TO OCTOBER 31, 2011

Date	Professional	Expense Detail	Amount
10/31/2011	Briggi, Lawrence	Online Hosting Fees for document discovery.	\$2,613.60
Computerized Research & Corporate Services Fees Total			2,613.60
8/9/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to home after working late.	19.56
9/13/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to meeting.	24.48
10/1/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to home after working late.	12.70
10/6/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to meeting.	19.08
10/9/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to meeting.	11.00
10/13/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to meeting.	17.04
10/13/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to meeting.	15.84
10/19/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Taxi from Weil to home.	127.30
10/20/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Taxi from office to meeting.	19.10
8/23/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Train Coach - NY - Wilmington DE, 8/23/11 - 8/23/11.	157.00
8/24/2011	Scruton, Andrew	Train Coach - Wilmington DE - NY, 8/24/11 - 8/24/11.	124.00
10/19/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Oneway subway from office to mediation.	2.25
10/20/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Roundtrip subway from office to Weil's office.	4.50
Transportation Total			553.85
10/19/2011	Bekker, Andrew	Dinner in the office while working late.	17.20
10/19/2011	Cordasco, Michael	Dinner while traveling to Delaware for mediation.	9.25
Working Meals Total			26.45
Grand Total			\$3,193.90

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, Evelyn J. Meltzer, hereby certify that on the 13th day of December, 2011, I did serve a copy of the foregoing **Thirty-Sixth Monthly Application of FTI Consulting, Inc., Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, for Interim Allowance of Compensation and for Reimbursement of Expenses for Services Rendered During the Period from October 1, 2011 through October 31, 2011** by causing a copy thereof to be served upon those parties and in the manner indicated on the attached service list.

/s/ Evelyn J. Meltzer
Evelyn J. Meltzer (DE No. 4581)

SERVICE LIST

Chad Smith
WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC.
925 Fourth Avenue, Suite 2500
Seattle, Washington 98104
VIA FEDEX

Mark D. Collins, Esq.
RICHARDS LAYTON & FINGER, P.A.
One Rodney Square
920 North King Street
Wilmington, Delaware 19801
VIA HAND DELIVERY

Fred S. Hodara, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
One Bryant Park
New York, NY 10036
VIA FEDEX

Peter J. Gurfein, Esq.
David P. Simonds, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
2029 Century Park East, Suite 2400
Los Angeles, California 90067-3012
VIA FEDEX

Stephen D. Susman, Esq.
Seth D. Ard, Esq.
SUSMAN GODFREY, L.L.P.
654 Madison Avenue, 5th Floor
New York, NY 10065
VIA FEDEX

Marcia L. Goldstein, Esq.
WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES, LLP
767 Fifth Avenue
New York, New York, 10153
VIA FEDEX

Jane M. Leamy, Esq.
OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE
844 King Street
Suite 2207, Lockbox 35
Wilmington, Delaware 19801
VIA HAND DELIVERY

Scott L. Alberino, Esq.
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
1333 New Hampshire Avenue, N.W.
Washington, D.C. 20036
VIA FEDEX

William P. Bowden, Esq.
Gregory A. Taylor, Esq.
Stacy L. Newman, Esq.
ASHBY & GEDDES, P.A.
500 Delaware Avenue, 8th Floor
P.O. Box 1150
Wilmington, DE 19801
VIA HAND DELIVERY

Parker C. Folse, III, Esq.
Edgar Sargent, Esq.
Justin A. Nelson, Esq.
SUSMAN GODFREY, L.L.P.
1201 Third Avenue, Suite 3800
Seattle, WA 98101
VIA FEDEX