UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

_) Chapter 11
In re:) Cose No. 20 12212 (MEW)
GARRETT MOTION INC., et al., 1) Case No. 20-12212 (MEW)
, ,) Jointly Administered
Debtors.)
)

NOTICE OF FEE STATEMENT

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on the date hereof, MAEVA Group, LLC (together with its affiliates, wholly owned subsidiaries, and each of their respective agents, independent contractors, and employees, "MAEVA"), filed the Second Monthly Fee Statement of MAEVA Group, LLC for Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Equity Securities Holders for the Period of January 1, 2021 through January 31, 2021 (the "Monthly Fee Statement")² with the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the "Court").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that any responses or objections (the "Objections") to the Monthly Fee Statement shall (i) be made in writing, (ii) conform to the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and the Local Bankruptcy Rules for the Southern District of New York, (iii) be filed with the Clerk of the Court in accordance with the customary practices of the Court and General Order M-399, and (iv) be served upon and received by Glenn Agre Bergman & Fuentes LLP, 55 Hudson Yards, 20th Floor, New York, NY 10001 (Attn: Andrew K. Glenn, Jed

² Capitalized terms used but not otherwise defined herein shall have the meaning ascribed to them in the Monthly Fee Statement.



The last four digits of Garrett Motion Inc.'s tax identification number are 3189. Due to the large number of debtor entities in these Chapter 11 Cases, which are being jointly administered, a complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at http://www.kccllc.net/garrettmotion. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at La Pièce 16, Rolle, Switzerland.

I. Bergman, and Shai Schmidt) and MAEVA Group, LLC, 360 Hamilton Avenue, 4th Floor, White Plains, NY 10601 (Attn: Harry J. Wilson), in accordance with General Order M-399, no later than **March 5, 2021** (the "Objection Deadline").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that in accordance with the *Order Pursuant to*Sections 105(a) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2016 and Local Rule 2016-1

Establishing Procedures for Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. No. 291] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), if no Objection to the Monthly Fee Statement is filed and served by the Objection Deadline, MAEVA shall be promptly paid eighty percent (80%) of the fees and one hundred percent (100%) of the expenses requested in the Monthly Fee Statement.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that if an Objection to the Monthly Fee Statement is filed and served by the Objection Deadline, MAEVA shall not be paid that portion of the requested fees or expenses to which such Objection is directed but shall be promptly paid the remainder of the fees and expenses in the percentages set forth above, unless MAEVA seeks an order from the Court, upon notice and a hearing, directing such payment to be made. If MAEVA and the objecting party are able to resolve their dispute and MAEVA files a statement indicating that the Objection is withdrawn and describing in detail the terms of the resolution, then MAEVA shall be promptly paid that portion of the Monthly Fee Statement which is no longer subject to an Objection. All Objections that are not resolved by the parties or Court order shall be preserved and presented to the Court at the next interim or final fee application hearing.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that copies of the Monthly Fee Statement may be obtained from the Court's website, https://ecf.nysb.uscourts.gov, for a nominal fee or obtained free

of charge by accessing the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent, http://www.kccllc.net/garrettmotion.

Dated: February 19, 2021

White Plains, New York

By: <u>/s/ Harry J. Wilson</u> Harry J. Wilson

Founder and CEO

MAEVA Group, LLC

360 Hamilton Avenue, 4th Floor

White Plains, NY 10601

Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Equity Securities Holders

Objection Deadline: March 5, 2021

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:) Chapter 11
GARRETT MOTION INC., et al.,1) Case No. 20-12212 (MEW)
Debtors.) Jointly Administered
)

SECOND MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF MAEVA GROUP, LLC FOR COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY SECURITIES HOLDERS FOR THE PERIOD OF JANUARY 1, 2021 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2021

Name of Applicant:	MAEVA Group, LLC
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	Official Committee of Equity Securities Holders of Debtor Garrett Motion Inc.
Date of Retention:	Nunc Pro Tunc to November 24, 2020 [Dkt. No. 817]
Period for which Compensation and/or Reimbursement is Sought:	January 1, 2021 through January 31, 2021
Total Amount of Fees Requested:	\$175,000.00
Less 20% Holdback:	(\$35,000.00)
Total Compensation Less Holdback:	\$140,000.00
Total Amount of Expenses Requested:	\$840.00
Total Fees and Expenses Due:	\$140,840.00
This is a: _X_ Monthly Interim Fi	nal Application

The last four digits of Garrett Motion Inc.'s tax identification number are 3189. Due to the large number of debtor entities in these Chapter 11 Cases, which are being jointly administered, a complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' proposed claims and noticing agent at http://www.kccllc.net/garrettmotion. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at La Pièce 16, Rolle, Switzerland.

Pursuant to Sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the "Local Rules"), and in accordance with the Order Pursuant to Sections 105(a) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2016 and Local Rule 2016-1 Establishing Procedures for Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. No. 291] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), MAEVA Group, LLC (together with its affiliates, wholly owned subsidiaries, and each of their respective agents, independent contractors, and employees, "MAEVA"), financial advisor to the Official Committee of Equity Securities Holders (the "Equity Committee") of Debtor Garrett Motion Inc. (collectively with its debtor affiliates as debtors in possession, the "Debtors"), hereby submits its statement of fees for compensation of professional services rendered and necessary and actual expenses incurred (the "Monthly Fee Statement") for the period of January 1, 2021 through January 31, 2021 (the "Compensation Period"). Specifically, MAEVA requests interim payment of \$140,840.00 as compensation for actual and necessary services and expenses rendered to the Equity Committee for the Compensation Period. In support of this Monthly Fee Statement, MAEVA states as follows:

SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED

1. For the Compensation Period, MAEVA earned monthly fees in the amount of \$175,000.00. An invoice detailing the monthly fees earned by MAEVA during the Compensation Period is attached hereto as **Exhibit A**. A schedule of MAEVA's professionals who performed services during the Compensation Period, including their respective titles and the number of hours

spent by each professional and by category, is attached hereto as **Exhibit B**.² The time records maintained by each of these professionals during the Compensation Period are attached hereto as **Exhibit C**.

2. During the Compensation Period, MAEVA incurred expenses in the total amount of \$840.00, for which reimbursement is sought. A schedule of expenses by category and the expense report detailing these expenses are attached hereto as **Exhibit D**.

REPRESENTATIONS

3. Although MAEVA has used its reasonable best efforts to include all fees and expenses incurred in the Compensation Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this Monthly Fee Statement due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Compensation Period. MAEVA reserves the right to seek payment of such fees and expenses not included herein. Subsequent monthly fee statements will be submitted in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the Interim Compensation Order.

NOTICE

4. Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement will be provided to the Notice Parties (as defined in the Interim Compensation Order) in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, any party-in-interest has until the date that is 14 days following the filing of this Monthly Fee Statement to object to the fees and expenses requested herein.

MAEVA does not bill its clients based on the number of hours expended by its professionals and therefore does not have hourly rates for its professionals.

20-12212-mew Doc 944 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Main Document Pg 7 of 7

Dated: February 19, 2021 By: /s/ Harry J. Wilson

White Plains, New York
Harry J. Wilson
Founder and CEO
MAEVA Group, LLC

360 Hamilton Avenue, 4th Floor

White Plains, NY 10601

Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Equity Securities Holders

EXHIBIT A

MAEVA Group, LLC's Invoice for Compensation Period of January 1 - 31, 2021



INVOICE

360 Hamilton Avenue 4th Floor White Plains, NY 10601 Phone 914-623-8211 | Fax 914-358-1268 INVOICE #GTX002

DATE February 1, 2021

TO

Garrett Motion Inc. 251 Little Falls Drive Wilmington, DE 19808 USA

Description	Amount
Fees	
Advisory Services Monthly Fee for January 1, 2021 to January 31, 2021	\$175,000.00
Subtotal before Fee Hold Back	\$175,000.00
Less: 20% Fee Hold Back	(\$35,000.00)
Subtotal after Fee Hold Back	\$140,000.00
Out of Pocket Expenses 1	
Legal	\$0.00
Other	\$840.00
Subtotal	\$840.00
Total	\$140,840.00

¹ Expenses incurred by MAEVA but not yet processed due to timing differences may be billed at a later date.

PAYMENT IS DUE UPON RECEIPT OF THIS INVOICE

Please remit via wire transfer to:

MAEVA Group, LLC Chase Bank, N.A. Routing # 021000021 Account # 522551022

If you have questions, please contact Long Pham | 914-219-4665 | LONG@maevagroupllc.com

EXHIBIT B

Summary of Hours Expended by MAEVA Group, LLC's Professionals for Compensation Period of January 1 - 31, 2021

SUMMARY OF HOURS EXPENDED BY PROFESSIONAL JANUARY 1, 2021 – JANUARY 31, 2021

Name	Position	Total Hours
Harry Wilson	Chief Executive Officer	244.5
Bob McGuire	Senior Managing Director	115.5
Long Pham	Vice President	276.0
Jose Alvarez	Associate	201.5
	Total Hours	837.5

SUMMARY OF HOURS EXPENDED BY CATEGORY JANUARY 1, 2021 – JANUARY 31, 2021

Category	Total Hours
Business Diligence & Analysis	315.0
Document Preparation & Review	56.5
Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	302.0
General and Administrative	124.5
Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	39.5
Travel	0.0
Total Hours	837.5

EXHIBIT C

Time Records Maintained by MAEVA Group, LLC's Professionals for Compensation Period of January 1 - 31, 2021

MAEVA Group, LLC Case Hours Details - Garrett Motion

Name: Harry Wilson

January 1, 2021 - January 31, 2021 244.5 Period:

Total Hours:

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Code
1/1/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Review modeling	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Review of next steps with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/2/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021		0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
	Call with Committee member		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/2/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5		3
1/2/2021	Call with Debtor Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Review of modeling scenarios	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Call with Debtor Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Review of communication with Debtors	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/3/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Review of communication with Debtors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Review of revised proposal	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
		0.5		3
1/3/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/3/2021	Consulting Professionals update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Email discussion of auction bids with Debtor Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/3/2021	Review of analysis	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Auction	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with Debtors Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Consulting Professionals update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	ÿ ,	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
	Call with stakeholder group			4
1/4/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/5/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Call with Debtors Professionals	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/6/2021	Review of bids	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with Debtors Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
	Call with stakeholder group			
1/6/2021	5 1	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Equity committee meeting and update	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Consulting Professionals update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Review of next steps with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Review of claims	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/6/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Call with Debtors Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021		0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
4/7/2004		US	Cherry Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Call with stakeholder group			
1/7/2021 1/7/2021 1/7/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals Call with stakeholder group	0.5 1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 3 of 13

Date	Description	Hours	Category	С
1/7/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/7/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
/8/2021	Review of capital structure	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/8/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/8/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/8/2021	Call with Debtors Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/8/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/8/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/8/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/8/2021	Review of analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/9/2021	DIP forecast review call	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Cash forecast analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
1/9/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/9/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/9/2021	Consulting Professionals update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/9/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/9/2021	Litigation review	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/9/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/9/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/10/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
	•			
1/10/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Review of modeling scenarios	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/10/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5		
1/11/2021	•		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Debtors Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Review of bids	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/11/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Shareholder town hall	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/11/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/12/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Call with Committee member and EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Equity committee meeting and update	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Review of modeling scenarios	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/12/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/13/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	1.0		
1/13/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/13/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/13/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/13/2021	Review of modeling scenarios	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/13/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/13/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/14/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/14/2021	Hearing	2.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/14/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/14/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/14/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/14/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/14/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/15/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/15/2021	Equity committee meeting and update	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
		1.0		
1/15/2021	Call with Atlantic Park		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/15/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/16/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021				
	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/16/2021 1/16/2021 1/16/2021	Call with stakeholder group Email review/reply	1.0 1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions General and Administrative	

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 4 of 13

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Co
1/17/2021	Review of modeling scenarios	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/17/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/17/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/17/2021	Call with Atlantic Park, EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/17/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/18/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/18/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/18/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/18/2021	Scheduling emails	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/18/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	2
1/18/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/19/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/19/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/19/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/19/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
				;
1/19/2021	Call with UBS	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/19/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/19/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/20/2021	Call with PJT	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/20/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/20/2021	Call with Equity Committee professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/20/2021	Call with lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/20/2021	Call with lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/20/2021	Call with lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/20/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/20/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/21/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/21/2021	Management diligence session with Atlantic Park	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/21/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
		0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/21/2021	Call with stakeholder group			
1/21/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/21/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/21/2021	Call with lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/21/2021	Call with lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/21/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/21/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/21/2021	Call with Atlantic Park, EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/21/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/22/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/22/2021	Call with KPMG	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/22/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/22/2021	Call with lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/22/2021	Call with lender	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/22/2021	Call with EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/22/2021	Call with EC professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/22/2021	Call with committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/22/2021	Call with committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/22/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	·
1/22/2021	• •	1.0		•
	Review of analysis		Business Diligence & Analysis Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/23/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0		
1/23/2021	Call with EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/23/2021	Review of Plan, Disclosure Statement	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/23/2021	Review of Plan Term Sheet	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/23/2021	Review of Lender Proposal	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/23/2021	Review of Lender Diligence	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/23/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/23/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/23/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/23/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/23/2021	Call with Lender	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/23/2021	Review of analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/23/2021	Review of Motion to terminate	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/23/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/24/2021	Call with Lender	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021	Review of analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/24/2021	Review of Motion to terminate	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/24/2021	KPMG review	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/24/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021	Call with Lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021	Call with Lender	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/24/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/24/2021	Call with Lender	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
				;
	Paview of lander documentation	4 //		
1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/25/2021	Review of lender documentation KPMG review	1.0 1.0	Document Preparation & Review Business Diligence & Analysis	

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 5 of 13

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Co
1/25/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/25/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/25/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/25/2021	Review of Motion to terminate, supporting analysis	4.0	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/25/2021	Call with Lender	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/25/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/25/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/25/2021	Call with Committee member	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/25/2021	Review of analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/25/2021	•	1.5	General and Administrative	
	Email review/reply	1.0		;
1/26/2021	Call with EC Professionals		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/26/2021	Hearing	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/26/2021	Call with Debtor Professionals	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/26/2021	Review of docket	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	,
1/26/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Call with committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Fee application review	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/26/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/26/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Review analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/27/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/27/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/27/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/27/2021	Review letter to Debtors	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/27/2021	Review letter to stakeholder group	2.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/27/2021	Review analysis	1.0		
	•		Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/27/2021	Equity committee meeting and update	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/27/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/27/2021	Call with stakeholder group	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/27/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/27/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/28/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/28/2021	Call with Debtor Professionals	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/28/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/28/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/28/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/28/2021	Review analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/28/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/28/2021	Review bank diligence materials	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/29/2021	Call with Committee member	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/29/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/29/2021	Hearing	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/29/2021	Call with stakeholder group	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/29/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
		0.5		:
1/29/2021	Call with Atlantic Park		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/29/2021	Review bank diligence materials	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/29/2021	Call with bank team	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/29/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/30/2021	Call with EC professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/30/2021	Review legal docs	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/30/2021	Review analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/30/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
	Call with Debtors Professionals	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/30/2021	Call With Debtors 1 folessionals			

MAEVA Group, LLC Case Hours Details - Garrett Motion

Name: Bob McGuire

Period: January 1, 2021 - January 31, 2021

Total Hours: 115.5

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Code
1/1/2021	Review of financial analysis	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/1/2021	Email review and reply	1.5	General and Administrative	4
1/2/2021	Proposal review	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Consulting Professionals Update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/4/2021	Call with HON	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Auction	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with KBT re Auction	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Internal call re HON claims	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with QE re discount rate and IO	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Auction Update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Consulting Professionals Update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Review of IO/tax agreeement	4.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/5/2021	Email review and reply	1.5	General and Administrative	4
1/5/2021	Bid review with Cowen	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	HON Liabilities Analysis	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Calls with Debtor Advisors	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Internal team discussion	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/6/2021	Consulting Professionals Update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Review of HON Liabilities Analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Internal team discussion	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/7/2021	Call with EC	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Pre call with Cowen	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Call with Debtor advisors	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Review of proposals	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Review of Documents to go to Debtor BoD	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/7/2021	China sub transfer document review	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	HON Liabilities Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Internal team discussion	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/8/2021	Auction Update	0.5		3
	•	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	3
1/8/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/8/2021	Internal team discussion		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3 4
1/8/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/8/2021	Review of financial analysis	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/9/2021	Call re DIP Forecast	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/9/2021	Call re HON Litigation	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/9/2021	Consulting Professionals Update	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/9/2021	Review of analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/9/2021	Email review and reply	1.5	General and Administrative	4
1/10/2021	Call with EC	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/10/2021	Follow up call with advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/10/2021	Call with EC	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/10/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/10/2021	Email review and reply	1.5	General and Administrative	4
1/11/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Call with EC Professionals	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Call with Debtor Advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Call with EC	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Review of Town Hall Materials	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/11/2021	Town Hall	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/12/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/12/2021	Call with EC	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/12/2021	Calll re HON Liabilites w Cowen	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/12/2021	Review of proposals	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/12/2021	Internall team discussion	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/12/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/13/2021	Call with EC Professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/13/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/13/2021	Preparation and finalization of motion	10.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/14/2021	Expense reimbursement hearing	2.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/14/2021	Internal team discussion	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/14/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/14/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/15/2021	Call with EC	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/15/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	3 4
	* *	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/16/2021	Email review and reply			
1/17/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/17/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/18/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/19/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	4

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 7 of 13

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Co
1/19/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/20/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/20/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/20/2021	Update of time log	2.0	General and Administrative	4
1/21/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/21/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	(
1/22/2021	EV research for EC member	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	•
1/22/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/22/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/22/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/23/2021	EV research for EC member	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/23/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/24/2021	Call with UBS and Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/24/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/25/2021	Review of Motion to terminatre exclusivity	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/25/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/26/2021	Call with PWP re Stand-Alone Plan	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/26/2021	Retention Application Hearing	2.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/26/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/27/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/27/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/28/2021	Review of shareholder analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/28/2021	Review of EV materials for EC member	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/28/2021	Email review and reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/29/2021	Court Hearing	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/29/2021	Call with HON advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/29/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/30/2021	Call with potential lending bank	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/30/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/31/2021	Update of time log	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/31/2021	Review of EV materials for EC member	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/31/2021	Email review and reply	0.5	General and Administrative	

MAEVA Group, LLC Case Hours Details - Garrett Motion

Long Pham Name:

January 1, 2021 - January 31, 2021 276.0 Period:

Total Hours:

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Code
1/1/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Preparation of alternative scenarios for financial projections	6.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/1/2021	Preparation of analysis for potential financing provider	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/1/2021	Review of comments to draft memo of understanding	0.5	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/1/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/2/2021	Preparation of analysis for potential financing provider	0.5	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/2/2021	Review of updated proposal from bidder	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/2/2021	Review of Honeywell documents	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/2/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/3/2021	Review of revised proposal terms from bidder	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/3/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5		3
			Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Consulting professionals update call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Preparation of financial model	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/3/2021	Review of cash flow reconciliation analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/3/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/3/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/4/2021	Conference call with Equity Committee and Honeywell	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Auction	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Review of COH and OWJ proposal documents	0.5	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/4/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Review of Honeywell documents	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021	Call with NERA and Quinn Emmanuel	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021	Consulting professionals update call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021		1.0		4
	Email review/reply		General and Administrative	3
1/5/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/5/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/5/2021	Review of business diligence files	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/5/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/5/2021	Discussion with the company's advisors regarding current proposals	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/5/2021	Review of court filings	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/5/2021	Review of updated analysis of bids	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/5/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/5/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/6/2021	Review of revised proposals from investor groups	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Update call with Equity Committee professionals	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Review of updated analysis of bids	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Modeling discussion with Cowen and Perella Weinberg	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021		0.5		3
	Consulting professionals update call		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/6/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/7/2021	Review of updated analysis of bids	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Review of China subsidiary transfer documents and related emails	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Review of DIP forecast update	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Review of draft letter to the company's board	0.5	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/7/2021	Call with Cowen and Kasowitz teams	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Review of draft letter and exhibit for the company's board	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/7/2021	Financial projections variance analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Review of SEC filing and court filings	1.5		1
		0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis Conoral and Administrative	1
1/7/2021	Email review/reply Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors		General and Administrative	4
1/0/2024	Follow up correspondence with combany's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/8/2021			D D''' 0 A /	
1/8/2021 1/8/2021 1/8/2021	Financial projections variance analysis Internal team discussion	0.5 0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	1 3

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 9 of 13

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Co
1/8/2021	Standalone financing plan discussion with Cowen	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/8/2021	Financial projections variance analysis	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/8/2021	Historical quarterly financial peformance trends analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/8/2021	Call with the company's counsel and financial advisors	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/8/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/8/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/8/2021		1.0		2
	Email review/reply		General and Administrative	
1/8/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/9/2021	Analysis of actual and projected weekly cash flows	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Cash flow projections review with the company's advisors	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/9/2021	Review of current bank debt holders	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Review of business diligence files and responses from debtors	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Consulting professionals update call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
	•			;
1/9/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/9/2021	Preparation of Honeywell liabilities analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Honeywell claims discussion with debtor's advisors	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/9/2021	Review of court filings	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Review of updated analysis of bids	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/9/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/10/2021	• •	0.5		
	Updates to financial model		Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/10/2021	Review of updated bidder term sheet	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/10/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Discussion with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Analysis of debt comparables	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/10/2021	Review of court filings	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/10/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/10/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/10/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/11/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Preparation of COH proposal analysis	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/11/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Review of equity holdings	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/11/2021	Strategy discussion with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Discussion with potential financing provider	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Call with the company's counsel and financial advisors	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Preparation of COH proposal analysis	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/11/2021	Call with Kasowitz on COH proposal analysis	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Follow up call with Kasowitz on COH proposal analysis	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Preparation of COH proposal analysis	0.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/11/2021	Review of court filings	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/11/2021	Shareholders town hall discussion	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/11/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/11/2021	Review of debt documentation	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/11/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/12/2021	Follow up correspondence with Cowen	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Preparation of alternate projections scenario	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
			·	
1/12/2021	Strategy discussion with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Financial projections discussion with Cowen	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Preparation of alternate projections scenario	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/12/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Review of updated analysis of proposals	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/12/2021	Follow up call with Kasowitz on preparation for upcoming court hearing	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/12/2021	Preparation of COH proposal analysis	0.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/12/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Preparation of alternate projections scenario	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/12/2021	Call with Cowen about projected Honeywell payments	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/12/2021	Preparation of court filings	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/12/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/13/2021	Preparation of court filings	4.0	Document Preparation & Review	
			•	
1/13/2021	Document review session with Equity Committee advisors	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/13/2021	Preparation of court filings	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/13/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/13/2021	Follow up discussion with Equity Committee advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/13/2021	Preparation of alternate projections scenario	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/13/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/13/2021	Review of court filings	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
	Hayrow at undated analysis of proposals	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/13/2021	Review of updated analysis of proposals	1.0	Dusiness Diligenee & Analysis	
1/13/2021 1/13/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 10 of 13

4 /4 0 /0 00 0	Description	Hours	Category	C
1/13/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	•
1/14/2021	Court hearing	1.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/14/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/14/2021	Review of updated cash flow projections	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
	. ,			
1/14/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/14/2021	Review of court filings	1.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/14/2021	Call with Kasowitz	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/14/2021	Legal precedent research	3.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
	• .			
1/14/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/15/2021	Preparation of financial models	3.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/15/2021	Review of court filings	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/15/2021	Strategy discussion with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/15/2021		2.0		
	Preparation of financial models		Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/15/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/15/2021	Review of business diligence files	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/15/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/17/2021		0.5		
	Review of COH transaction terms		Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/17/2021	Call with Equity Committee advisors and Atlantic Park team	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/17/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/18/2021	Review of team expenses, compensation filings preparation	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/18/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/18/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/19/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
	Review of business diligence files			
1/19/2021	ů .	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/19/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/19/2021	Review of team expenses, compensation filings preparation	2.0	General and Administrative	
1/19/2021	Review of court filings	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
	•			
1/19/2021	Review of team expenses, compensation filings preparation	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/19/2021	Review of alternative proposal from OWJ group	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/19/2021	Preparation of financial projections	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/19/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/20/2021	Preparation of financial projections	6.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/20/2021	Preparation of returns analysis	4.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/20/2021	Call with Kasowitz	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/20/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/20/2021	Review of team expenses, compensation filings preparation	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/20/2021	Preparation of financial projections	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/20/2021	Email review/reply	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/21/2021	Preparation of returns analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/21/2021	Financial projections variance analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/21/2021	Review of team expenses, compensation filings preparation	2.0	General and Administrative	
1/21/2021	Update of time log	1.0	General and Administrative	
	,			
1/21/2021	Update call with Equity Committee	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/21/2021	Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender	4.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/21/2021	Review of DIP update	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
	·			
1/21/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/21/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/22/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/22/2021	Review of team expenses, compensation filings preparation	2.5	General and Administrative	
1/22/2021	Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender	3.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/22/2021	Follow up correspondence with Kasowitz	0.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/22/2021	Calls with potential lenders	2.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/22/2021	Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender	2.5	Document Preparation & Review	
			•	
1/23/2021	Preparation of monthly invoice	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/23/2021	Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender	5.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/23/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
		1.0		
1/23/2021	Email review/reply		General and Administrative	
1/23/2021	Review of court filings	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/23/2021	Review of draft term sheet	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	
1/24/2021	Review of court filings	1.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/24/2021	Call with potential lender	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021	Review of returns analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021	•	0.5		
1/24/2021	Call with Cowen	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021	Call with Cowen		Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/24/2021	Call with Cowen Industry research for client	1.0	Dusiness Diligenee & Analysis	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021		1.0 1.5	General and Administrative	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021	Industry research for client Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021	Industry research for client Email review/reply Review of financing terms	1.5 0.5	General and Administrative Document Preparation & Review	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021	Industry research for client Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021	Industry research for client Email review/reply Review of financing terms	1.5 0.5	General and Administrative Document Preparation & Review	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/25/2021	Industry research for client Email review/reply Review of financing terms Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender Review of motion draft	1.5 0.5 1.5 1.0	General and Administrative Document Preparation & Review Document Preparation & Review Document Preparation & Review	
1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021 1/24/2021	Industry research for client Email review/reply Review of financing terms Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender	1.5 0.5 1.5	General and Administrative Document Preparation & Review Document Preparation & Review	

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 11 of 13

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Co
1/25/2021	Industry research for client	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/25/2021	Email review/reply	2.0	General and Administrative	4
1/25/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/26/2021	Preparation of court filings	1.0	Document Preparation & Review	2
1/26/2021	Call with potential financing provider	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/26/2021	Call with KPMG	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/26/2021	Court hearing	1.0	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/26/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	•	;
1/26/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
			Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	:
1/26/2021	Call with potential financing provider	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/26/2021	Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/26/2021	Preparation of December monthly fee and expenses statement	1.0	General and Administrative	•
1/26/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/26/2021	Industry research for client	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/27/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	;
1/27/2021	Review of court filings	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/27/2021	Call with potential financing provider	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/27/2021	Industry research for client	4.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/27/2021	Call with Kasowitz	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/27/2021	Equity Committee update call	2.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/27/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/27/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/28/2021	Coordination of upcoming calls	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/28/2021	Preparation of returns analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/28/2021	Follow up correspondence with company's financial advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/28/2021	Review of DIP forecast update	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/28/2021	Call with AlixPartners	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/28/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/28/2021	Analysis of disclosure statement financial projections	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/28/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/28/2021	Industry research for client	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/28/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/29/2021	KPMG diligence session with the company	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/29/2021	Call with KPMG	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/29/2021	Call with Perella Weinberg on updated financial projections	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/29/2021	Preparation of diligence responses for potential lender	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/29/2021	Analysis of disclosure statement financial projections	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/29/2021	Court hearing	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	
1/29/2021	Call with Honeywell advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/29/2021	•	0.5		
1/29/2021	Internal team discussion	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
	Email review/reply		General and Administrative	
1/29/2021	Preparation of financial projections	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/29/2021	Preparation of monthly fee and expenses statement	0.5	General and Administrative	
1/30/2021	Industry research for client	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/30/2021	Preparation of financial projections	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/30/2021	Internal team discussion	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/30/2021	Call with BNP	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	
1/30/2021	Email review/reply	1.5	General and Administrative	
1/31/2021	Industry research for client	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/31/2021	Preparation of financial projections	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/31/2021	Review of interim fee application	1.5	Document Preparation & Review	
1/31/2021	Email review/reply	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/31/2021	Update of time log	0.5	General and Administrative	_

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 12 of 13

MAEVA Group, LLC Case Hours Details - Garrett Motion

Name: Jose Alvarez

Period: January 1, 2021 - January 31, 2021

Total Hours: 201.5

Date	Description	Hours	Category	Code
1/1/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	10.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/1/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/1/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/2/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/2/2020	Preparation of Financial Projections	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/3/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/3/2021	Consulting Professionals Call	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/3/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Auction Hearing	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/4/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/4/2021	Honeywell Claims Analysis	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021	Call with Honeywell	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021	Call with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	Call with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/4/2021	PWP Emails	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/4/2021	Update of Time Sheet	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/5/2021	Email Correspondence	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/5/2021	Call with Company's Advisors	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Bid Analysis	4.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/5/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/5/2021	Honeywell Claims Analysis	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Sources & Uses Analysis	2.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Email PWP	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Question List for PWP	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Email Correspondence	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/6/2021	Trading Volume Analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/6/2021	Call with PWP	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/6/2021	Consulting Professionals Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Advisors Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2021	Individual Shareholders Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Bids Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/7/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/7/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/7/2020	Update of Time Sheet	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/7/2020	DIP Forecast Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/8/2021	Update of Time Sheet	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/8/2021	Auction Update Call	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/8/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/8/2021	Historical Financials Analysis	5.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/8/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/9/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/9/2021	DIP Forecast Analysis	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/9/2021	Honeywell Litigation Call	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/9/2021	Consulting Professionals Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/10/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/10/2021	Capital Structure Analysis	4.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/10/2021	Internal Call	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/10/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/11/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/11/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/11/2021	Docket Documents Download	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/11/2021	DIP Forecast Analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/11/2021	Shareholders Analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/11/2021	Comparison of Bids	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/11/2021	Call with Equity Holders	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Call with Company's Advisors	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/11/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/12/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/12/2021	Shareholders Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
	Email Correspondence	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/12/2021	•			
	Review of Analysis	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/12/2021	•	1.5 1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	1 3
	Review of Analysis Equity Committee's Advisors Call Internal Call	1.5 1.0 0.5	•	

20-12212-mew Doc 944-3 Filed 02/19/21 Entered 02/19/21 19:04:27 Exhibit C Pg 13 of 13

1/13/2021 1/13/2021	Description Reard Analysis	Hours	Category	Co
1/13/2021	Board Analysis	4.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/13/2021	Equity Committee's Advisors Call	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/13/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/13/2021	Bids Analysis	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/13/2021	Honeywell Indemnity Agreement Review	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/13/2021	Email Correspondence	1.0	General and Administrative	4
	•			-
1/14/2021	Email Correspondence	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/14/2021	Court Hearing	1.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/14/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/14/2021	Precedent Cases Search	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/14/2021	Shareholders Analysis	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		•	
1/15/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/15/2021	Shareholders Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/15/2021	Call with Equity Committee	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/15/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/18/2021	Update of Time Sheet	1.0	General and Administrative	4
	·	0.5		
1/19/2021	Internal Call		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/19/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/19/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/20/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/20/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
				1
1/20/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	7.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/20/2021	Bids Comparison Analysis	4.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/21/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/21/2021	Update of Time Sheet	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/21/2021	Call with Equity Committee	2.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
	Materials Review			1
1/21/2021		1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/21/2021	OEM Electric Vehicle Strategy Research	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/21/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/22/2021	Lenders Dilligence Call	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/22/2021	Lenders Dilligence Call	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/22/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/22/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/22/2021	Lenders Dilligence Request	6.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/22/2021	Dataroom Download	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/23/2021	Returns Analyis	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/23/2021	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	3.0		1
	OEM Electric Vehicle Strategy Research		Business Diligence & Analysis	
1/23/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/23/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/23/2021	Shareholders Analysis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/24/2021	Returns Analyis	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/24/2021	Shareholders Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
	· ·	0.5	•	
1/24/2021	Internal Call		Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/24/2021	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/24/2021	OEM Electric Vehicle Strategy Research	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/25/2021	Returns Analyis	0.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/25/2021	Email Correspondence	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/25/2021	Internal Call	1.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/25/2021	Analysis Review	3.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/25/2021	Motion Review	1.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/25/2021	OEM Electric Vehicle Strategy Research	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/26/2021	Call with Equity Committee	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/26/2021	Court Hearing	1.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/26/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	4.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/26/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/26/2021	Dataroom Download	0.5	General and Administrative	4
1/26/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
				4
1/26/2021	Email Correspondence	1.0	General and Administrative	
1/27/2021	OEM Electric Vehicle Strategy Research	5.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/27/2021	Shareholders Analysis	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/27/2021	Update of Time Sheet	1.0	General and Administrative	4
1/27/2021	Internal Call	1.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/27/2021		2.0	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
	Call with Equity Committee			
1/28/2021	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/28/2021	Financial Projections Bridge	3.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/28/2021	Returns Analyis	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/28/2021	Call with Atlantic Park	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/29/2021				
1/29/2021	Court Hearing	0.5	Court Hearings, Case Administration & Other Legal	5
1/29/2021	Financial Projections Bridge	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/29/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	2.5	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/30/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	2.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/30/2021	· · ·		•	
	Email Correspondence	0.5	General and Administrative	4
	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
	Internal Call	0.5	Client / Internal / Professionals Discussions	3
1/30/2021	internal Call			
1/30/2021 1/31/2021			Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/30/2021 1/31/2021 1/31/2021	Preparation of Financial Projections	1.0	Business Diligence & Analysis	1
1/30/2021 1/30/2021 1/31/2021 1/31/2021 1/31/2021 1/31/2021			Business Diligence & Analysis Business Diligence & Analysis General and Administrative	1 1 4

EXHIBIT D

MAEVA Group, LLC's Summary of Expenses and Expense Report for Compensation Period of January 1 - 31, 2021

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES BY CATEGORY JANUARY 1, 2021 – JANUARY 31, 2021

Category	Amount
Airfare	\$0.00
Hotel	0.00
Ground Transportation	0.00
Meals	0.00
Legal Expenses	0.00
Other	840.00
Total Amount	\$840.00

MAEVA GROUP, LLC PROJECT TURBO EXPENSES REPORT JANUARY 1, 2021 - JANUARY 31, 2021

ate	Description	Amoui	nt Category	Dates of Travel	Details
1/14/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Long Pham
1/14/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Harry Wilson
1/14/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Jose Alvarez
1/14/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Bob McGuire
1/26/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Long Pham
1/26/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Harry Wilson
1/26/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Jose Alvarez
1/26/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Bob McGuire
1/29/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Long Pham
1/29/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Harry Wilson
1/29/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Jose Alvarez
1/29/2021	CourtSolutions	\$ 70	0.00 Other	N/A	Telephonic court appearance fee for Bob McGuire

TOTAL \$ 840.00