20-10418-mew Doc 840 Filed 09/11/20 Entered 09/11/20 21:17:26 Main Document
Pull 10 70 Docket #0840 Date Filed: 09/11/2020

Objection Deadline: September 26, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (Prevailing Eastern Time)

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re : Chapter 11

JCK LEGACY COMPANY, et al., : Case No. 20-10418 (MEW)

:

Debtors.¹ : (Jointly Administered)

· ------ X

NOTICE OF SEVENTH MONTHLY STATEMENT OF SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM AUGUST 1, 2020 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2020

Name of Applicant: Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP

Authorized to Provide Services to: JCK Legacy Company, et al.

Date of Retention: March 26, 2020, *nunc pro tunc* to February

13, 2020

Period for Which Compensation and Expense August 1, 2020 through August 31, 2020

Reimbursement is Sought:

Amount of Compensation Requested: \$689,002.00

Less 20% Holdback: \$137,800.40

Net of Holdback: \$551,201.60

Amount of Expense Reimbursement \$6,527.35

Requested:

Total Compensation (Net of Holdback) and \$557,728.95

Expense Reimbursement Requested:

The last four digits of Debtor JCK Legacy Company's tax identification number are 0478. Due to the large number of debtor entities in these jointly administered chapter 11 cases, a complete list of the debtor entities and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at http://www.kccllc.net/McClatchy. The location of the Debtors' service address for purposes of these chapter 11

cases is: 2100 Q Street, Sacramento, California 95816.



In accordance with the *Order Granting Debtors' Motion for Order Pursuant to*Bankruptcy Code Sections 105(a) and 331, Bankruptcy Rule 2016, and Local Bankruptcy Rule

2016-1 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of

Professionals, dated March 11, 2020 [Docket No. 176] (the "Interim Compensation Order"),²

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP ("Skadden") hereby submits this seventh monthly

statement (the "Seventh Monthly Statement"), seeking compensation for services rendered and
reimbursement of expenses incurred as counsel to the Debtors, for the period from August 1,

2020 through August 31, 2020 (the "Seventh Monthly Period"). By this Seventh Monthly

Statement, and after taking into account certain voluntary discounts and reductions,³ Skadden

seeks payment in the amount of \$557,728.95, which comprises (i) 80% of the total amount of

compensation sought for actual and necessary services rendered during the Seventh Monthly

Period and (ii) reimbursement of 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection
with such services.

SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED

1. Attached hereto as **Exhibit A** is a summary of Skadden professionals by individual, setting forth the (a) name and title of each individual who provided services for the Seventh Monthly Period, (b) aggregate hours spent by each individual, (c) hourly billing rate for each such individual at Skadden's current billing rates, (d) amount of fees earned by each Skadden professional, and (e) year of bar admission for each attorney. The blended hourly

Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to such terms in the Interim Compensation Order.

The total amount sought for fees and expenses (\$695,529.35) reflects voluntary reductions for this period of \$38,103.50 in fees and expenses, for an overall voluntary reduction of 5.48%. Skadden reserves the right to request these amounts.

billing rate of Skadden timekeepers during the Seventh Monthly Period is approximately \$1,020.74.4

- 2. Attached hereto as **Exhibit B** is a summary of the services rendered and compensation sought, by project category, for the Seventh Monthly Period.
- 3. Attached hereto as **Exhibit** C is a summary of expenses incurred and reimbursement sought, by expense type, for the Seventh Monthly Period.
- 4. Attached hereto as **Exhibit D** is itemized time records of Skadden professionals for the Seventh Monthly Period and summary materials related thereto.
- Attached hereto as Exhibit E is an itemized record of all expenses for the Seventh Monthly Period.

NOTICE AND OBJECTION PROCEDURES

6. Notice of this Seventh Monthly Statement shall be given by hand or overnight delivery upon the following parties (the "Notice Parties"): (i) counsel to the Debtors, Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP, 300 South Grand Avenue, Suite 3400, Los Angeles, CA 90071, Attn.: Van C. Durrer, II (Van.Durrer@skadden.com) and Destiny N. Almogue (Destiny.Almogue@skadden.com); (ii) Benjamin J. Higgins, United States Trustee for Region 2, United States Department of Justice, Office of the United States Trustee, 201 Varick Street, Suite 1006, New York, New York 10014, Attn.: Benjamin J. Higgins (Benjamin.J.Higgins@usdoj.gov) and Brian Masumoto (Brian.Masumoto@usdoj.gov); (iii) counsel to the administrative agent under the Debtors' DIP Facility, Choate, Hall & Stewart LLP, Two International Place, Boston, MA 02110, Attn.: Jonathan D. Marshall

The blended rate is comprised of all Skadden timekeepers who provided services during the Seventh Monthly Period.

(jmarshall@choate.com) and Kevin Simard (ksimard@choate.com); (iv) counsel to Chatham Asset Management, Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison LLP, 1285 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10019, Attn.: Andrew Rosenberg (arosenberg@paulweiss.com), Elizabeth McColm (emccolm@paulweiss.com), and John Weber (jweber@paulweiss.com); (v) counsel to the Committee, Stroock & Stroock & Lavan LLP, 180 Maiden Lane, New York, NY 10038, Attn.: Daniel Fliman (dfliman@stroock.com); and (vi) to the extent not listed herein, those parties requesting notice pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2002.

- 7. Objections to this Seventh Monthly Statement, if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, and by email, hand, or overnight delivery upon Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP, One Manhattan West, New York, NY 10001, Attn.: Shana A. Elberg (shana.elberg@skadden.com) and Bram A. Strochlic (bram.strochlic@skadden.com); 300 S. Grand Avenue, Suite 3400, Los Angeles, CA 90071-3144, Attn.: Van C. Durrer, II (van.durrer@skadden.com) and Destiny N. Almogue (destiny.almogue@skadden.com); and 525 University Avenue, Palo Alto, CA 94301, Attn.: Jennifer Madden (jennifer.madden@skadden.com) no later than September 26, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (Prevailing Eastern Time) (the "Objection Deadline"), setting forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 8. If no objections to this Seventh Monthly Statement are received by the Objection Deadline, the Debtors shall promptly pay Skadden 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses identified in this Seventh Monthly Statement.
- 9. To the extent that an objection to this Seventh Monthly Statement is received on or before the Objection Deadline, the Debtors shall withhold payment of that portion of this Seventh Monthly Statement to which the objection is directed and promptly pay the remainder of

the fees and expenses in the percentages set forth above. To the extent such objection is not resolved, it shall be preserved and scheduled for consideration at the next interim fee application hearing.

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK]

Dated: New York, New York September 11, 2020

SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP

/s/ Van C. Durrer, II

Fax: (212) 735-2000

Shana A. Elberg Bram A. Strochlic One Manhattan West New York, New York 10001 Telephone: (212) 735-3000

- and -

Van C. Durrer, II Destiny N. Almogue (admitted *pro hac vice*) 300 S. Grand Avenue, Suite 3400 Los Angeles, California 90071-3144 Telephone: (213) 687-5000 Fax: (213) 687-5600

- and -

Jennifer Madden (admitted *pro hac vice*) 525 University Avenue Palo Alto, California 94301 Telephone: (650) 470-4500 Fax: (650) 470-4570

- and -

TOGUT, SEGAL & SEGAL LLP Albert Togut Kyle J. Ortiz Amy Oden One Penn Plaza, Suite 3335 New York, New York 10119 Telephone: (212) 594-5000 Fax: (212) 967-4258

Counsel to Debtors and Debtors in Possession

EXHIBIT A

COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL PERSON

SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP $\underline{AUGUST\ 1\ -\ 31,2020}$

Bill No: 1823277

	YEAR OF			
<u>NAME</u>	<u>ADMISSION</u>	RATE	<u>HOURS</u>	AMOUN ^T
PARTNER PARTNER				
Kenneth J. Betts	1991	\$1,565.00	46.10	\$ 72,146.50
Van C. Durrer II	1993	1,565.00	54.10	84,666.50
Thomas J. Ivey	1993	1,565.00	22.40	35,056.00
Paul Schockett	2006	1,275.00	31.00	39,525.00
	TOTAL PARTN	ER	153.60	\$231,394.00
ASSOCIATE				, - ,
Destiny N. Almogue	2017	\$825.00	25.20	\$ 20,790.00
Alison E. Bloch	2015	995.00	80.90	80,495.50
Jackie Dakin	2019	575.00	28.50	16,387.50
Leonard I. Greenberg	2018	825.00	42.20	34,815.00
Moshe S. Jacob	2019	695.00	80.80	56,156.00
Jennifer Madden	2010	1,120.00	118.10	132,272.00
	2015	1,030.00	83.40	85,902.00
Bram A. Strochlic	2013			,
Bram A. Strochlic Catherine Yuh	2020	575.00	20.90	12,017.50
		575.00	20.90	12,017.50
		1	20.90 480.00	,
Catherine Yuh PARAPROFESSIONALS	TOTAL ASSOC	IATE	480.00	\$438,835.50
Catherine Yuh PARAPROFESSIONALS Tracy S. Baker	TOTAL ASSOC	\$390.00	480.00 1.00	\$438,835.50 \$ 390.00
PARAPROFESSIONALS Tracy S. Baker Andrea T. Bates	TOTAL ASSOC N/A N/A	\$390.00 450.00	1.00 29.50	\$438,835.50 \$ 390.00 13,275.00
PARAPROFESSIONALS Tracy S. Baker Andrea T. Bates Christopher M. Heaney	2020 TOTAL ASSOC N/A N/A N/A N/A	\$390.00 450.00 450.00	1.00 29.50 0.60	\$438,835.50 \$ 390.00 13,275.00 270.00
PARAPROFESSIONALS Tracy S. Baker Andrea T. Bates Christopher M. Heaney Wendy K. LaManna	2020 TOTAL ASSOC N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A	\$390.00 450.00 450.00 450.00	1.00 29.50 0.60 5.30	\$ 390.00 13,275.00 270.00 2,385.00
PARAPROFESSIONALS Tracy S. Baker Andrea T. Bates Christopher M. Heaney Wendy K. LaManna Catherine D. Ledyard	2020 TOTAL ASSOC N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A	\$390.00 450.00 450.00 450.00 450.00 495.00	1.00 29.50 0.60 5.30 4.50	\$ 390.00 13,275.00 270.00 2,385.00 2,227.50
PARAPROFESSIONALS Tracy S. Baker Andrea T. Bates Christopher M. Heaney Wendy K. LaManna	2020 TOTAL ASSOC N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A	\$390.00 450.00 450.00 450.00	1.00 29.50 0.60 5.30	\$438,835.50 \$ 390.00
PARAPROFESSIONALS Tracy S. Baker Andrea T. Bates Christopher M. Heaney Wendy K. LaManna Catherine D. Ledyard	2020 TOTAL ASSOC N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/	\$390.00 450.00 450.00 450.00 450.00 495.00	1.00 29.50 0.60 5.30 4.50	\$ 390.00 13,275.00 270.00 2,385.00 2,227.50

EXHIBIT B

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP

PROJECT CATEGORY SUMMARY (AUGUST 1, 2020 - AUGUST 31, 2020)

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
General Corporate Advice	10.70	\$12,009.50
Asset Dispositions (General)	159.80	\$179,583.50
Asset Dispositions (Real Property)	1.30	\$1,456.00
Automatic Stay (Relief Actions)	3.30	\$4,452.50
Business Operations / Strategic Planning	3.50	\$4,231.50
Case Administration	48.40	\$25,453.50
Claims Admin. (General)	1.10	\$687.00
Disclosure Statement / Voting Issues	91.80	\$70,164.00
Employee Matters (General)	13.90	\$16,614.00
Executory Contracts (Personalty)	10.60	\$11,961.00
Insurance	1.40	\$1,701.50
Leases (Real Property)	4.20	\$4,748.50
Litigation (General)	2.10	\$2,574.50
Real Estate (Owned)	1.20	\$1,344.00
Regulatory and SEC Matters	0.70	\$1,095.50
Reorganization Plan / Plan Sponsors	180.70	\$184,651.50
Retention / Fee Matters (SASM&F)	8.70	\$7,135.50
Retention / Fee Matters / Objections (Others)	5.50	\$4,457.50
Secured Claims	0.50	\$560.00
Tax Matters	125.20	\$153,628.50
Vendor Matters	0.40	\$492.50
TOTAL	675.00	\$689,002.00

EXHIBIT C

EXPENSE SUMMARY

As of 09/11/2020

Sort	Disbursements	Amount
1	Computer Legal Research	690.77
3	Long Distance Telephone	109.99
7	Outside eDiscovery Services	4,435.65
8	Outside Research	108.69
9	Filing/Court Fees	910.00
10	Court Reporting	272.25
		6,527.35

EXHIBIT D

TIME DETAIL

Pg 14 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20 Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) General Corporate Advice

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/12/20	0.80	REVISE BOARD PRESENTATION REGARDING PLAN AND UPCOMING BANKRUPTCY PROCEEDINGS.
DURRER II VC	08/30/20	0.10	REVIEW C. FORMAN MEMO TO BOARD.
		0.90	
Total Partner		0.90	
BLOCH AE	08/03/20	2.00	REVIEW AND REVISE 10-Q.
BLOCH AE	08/05/20	1.00	ANALYZE 8-K FILING REQUIREMENTS.
		3.00	
MADDEN J	08/01/20	0.60	REVIEW/COMMENT ON COMMUNICATIONS PACKAGE REGARDING SALE (0.6).
MADDEN J	08/06/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PRESS RELEASE (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/11/20	0.60	CALL WITH COMMUNICATIONS TEAM REGARDING CASE UPDATES (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. KOHN REGARDING COMMS RELATED TO INVOLUNTARY TERMINATION (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING FOUNDATION (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/12/20	1.80	PREPARE AND REVISE BOARD MATERIALS (1.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/14/20	2.20	ATTEND BOARD MEETING (1.5) AND PREPARE MINUTES REGARDING SAME (0.7) .
MADDEN J	08/14/20	0.20	STRATEGIZE REGARDING COMMUNICATIONS ISSUES REGARDING DS/PLAN (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/18/20	0.50	CALL WITH COMMUNICATIONS TEAM REGARDING COMMUNICATIONS FOR SALE AND PLAN DOCUMENTS (0.5).
MADDEN J	08/20/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE WITH FTI REGARDING PR INQUIRY REGARDING D&O CLAIMS (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH BOARD REGARDING FILINGS (0.1).

Pg 15 of 78
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates
ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

MADDEN J 08/25/20 0.40 CALL WITH COMMUNICATIONS TEAM REGARDING SALE CLOSING AND PLAN MATTERS (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING REFUND POLICY

(0.1).

6.80

9.80 Total Associate

MATTER TOTAL 10.70

Pg 16 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Asset Dispositions (General)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/01/20	0.40	CORRESPOND WITH A. ROSENBERG REGARDING SCHEDULES AND REMAINING ITEMS TO COMPLETE APA (.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING SAME (.1); FOLLOW UP REGARDING SALE ORDER (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/02/20	0.60	CALL WITH PAUL WEISS REGARDING FINAL APA ISSUES (.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING SAME (.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING GLC FEE STATUS RELATIVE TO APA (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. ORTIZ REGARDING HEARING ISSUES REGARDING SALE (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/03/20	3.70	CALL WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING FILING OF UCC SETTLEMENT AS COMPONENT OF SALE ORDER (.1); PREPARE FOR SALE HEARING AND RELATED STATUS REPORT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH I. SASSON REGARDING APA/SALE ORDER ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. HANSEN REGARDING SAME (.1); ATTEND COURT STATUS CONFERENCE REGARDING SALE HEARING (.5); FOLLOW UP REGARDING UCC SETTLEMENT STIPULATION (.2); CALL WITH A. TOGUT REGARDING SALE HEARING (.1); FINALIZE APA APPROVAL DOCUMENTATION FOR HEARING (.5); CALL WITH K. SIMARD REGARDING SALE (.1); ADDRESS PRESS INQUIRY REGARDING SALE (.1); ADDRESS PRESS INQUIRY REGARDING SALE (.1); FINALIZE AGENDA FOR SALE HEARING (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH E. GILAD REGARDING SALE APPROVAL (.1); CALL WITH STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING FINAL COMMENTS TO SALE DOCUMENTATION (.5); CALL WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING SAME (.2); CONTINUE TO FINALIZE COMMENTS ON SALE APPROVAL DOCUMENTS (.4); CORRESPOND WITH B. WELLER REGARDING TEXAS TAX OBJECTION (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/04/20	2.40	PREPARE FOR SALE HEARING (.5); CONDUCT SALE HEARING (1.0); FOLLOW UP WITH C. FORMAN AND B. MCCONKEY REGARDING SAME (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH JUDGE COMMENTS ON SALE ORDER (.6).

Pg 17 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

				PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
DURRER II	VC	08/05/20	0.80	FOLLOW UP REGARDING VARIOUS COMMENTS TO SALE ORDER (INCLUDING FROM JUDGE WILES) (.3); ANALYSIS REGARDING WELLER LANGUAGE REGARDING SAME (.1); CALL WITH S. HARDING AND E. BROWN REGARDING WIND DOWN BUDGET (.3); ANALYSIS REGARDING FINALIZATION OF SALE ORDER (.1).
DURRER II	VC	08/06/20	0.30	FOLLOW UP REGARDING FINAL COMMENTS TO SALE ORDER (.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING NDA FOR INTERESTED PARTY (.1).
DURRER II	VC	08/14/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING EXCLUDED LIABILITIES SCHEDULE UNDER SALE TRANSACTION.
DURRER II	VC	08/17/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING FEE SCHEDULE FOR CLOSING ESCROWS.
DURRER II	VC	08/20/20	0.10	CORRESPOND WITH PAUL WEISS REGARDING APPROACH TO HCP ISSUES UNDER SALE.
DURRER II	VC	08/25/20	0.40	ANALYSIS REGARDING TRANSITION ISSUES INCLUDING WEBSITE (.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING FEE ESCROWS REQUIRED AT CLOSING (.2).
DURRER II	VC	08/26/20	1.20	CALL WITH FTI REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.8); ANALYSIS REGARDING SALE ORDER (.1); REVIEW CLOSING CHECKLIST (.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING NAME CHANGE REQUIRED AT CLOSING (.1).
DURRER II	VC	08/27/20	1.30	CALL WITH FTI REGARDING FUNDS FLOW FOR SALE CLOSING (.8); FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME (.5).
DURRER II	VC	08/28/20	0.50	CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES AND FUNDS FLOW (.3); PREPARE MEMO TO PARTIES REGARDING CLOSING CHECKLIST (.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING CURE PAYMENT ISSUE (.1).
DURRER II	VC	08/29/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING 8-K FOR SALE CLOSING (.1); FOLLOW UP WITH FTI REGARDING FEE ISSUES AT CLOSING (.1).

Pg 18 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

DURRER II VC	08/31/20	1.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMARD REGARDING EXTENSION OF AUGUST 31 CLOSING MILESTONE (.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING WELLS FARGO ACCOUNT ISSUES (.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING TRANSFER OF CITIZENS LC FACILITY (.1); ALL HANDS CALL WITH STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING CLOSING MECHANICS (.6).
		13.30	
IVEY TJ	08/01/20	1.20	REVIEW AND REVISE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT TO REFLECT UCC SETTLEMENT (0.9); AND REVIEW PRESS RELEASE (0.3).
IVEY TJ	08/02/20	1.10	REVIEW AND REVISE SEVERAL DRAFTS OF SCHEDULE 5.01B(VIII) TO THE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (0.8); REVIEW APA PER NEW CHANGES TO SETTLEMENT (0.1); FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISE SCHEDULE 5.01(B)(VIII) TO REFLECT SETTLEMENT (0.2).
IVEY TJ	08/03/20	1.90	FINALIZE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR FILING WITH COURT (MULTIPLE DRAFTS) (0.5); ATTEND CALL WITH ALL PARTIES TO FINALIZE APA (0.4); CALL WITH C. FORMAN AND V. DURRER (0.2); CALL WITH S. HARDING, E. BROWN, A. BLOCH AND V. DURRER TO FINALIZE SCHEDULE 5.01B(VIII) (0.3); EMAILS REGARDING FINAL APA (0.1); ATTEND COURT HEARING REGARDING APA (0.4).
IVEY TJ	08/04/20	1.30	ATTEND HEARING TO APPROVE THE APA (1.0); EMAILS REGARDING COMMUNICATIONS MATERIALS (0.2); AND INTEGRATION PLANNING (0.1).
IVEY TJ	08/05/20	1.10	SUPERVISE INTEGRATION ISSUES REGARDING EMPLOYEE NOTICES (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE INTEGRATION CHECKLIST (0.4); EMAILS REGARDING CONSENTS WITH A. BLOCH (0.2); ATTEND CALL REGARDING STATUS UPDATE WITH C. FORMAN, B. MCCONKEY (0.3); CALL WITH V. DURRER REGARDING INTEGRATION PLANNING (0.1).
IVEY TJ	08/06/20	0.60	REVIEW AND REVISE PRESS RELEASE (0.3); COORDINATE HSR FILING (0.2); CALL WITH V. DURRER REGARDING RELEASING NDA PARTIES (0.1).

Pg 19 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

				PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
IVEY	TJ	08/07/20	0.50	CALL WITH C. FORMAN, B. MCCONKEY AND VAN DURRER REGARDING STATUS UPDATE (0.5) .
IVEY	TJ	08/08/20	0.10	COORDINATE CLOSING MECHANICS (0.1).
IVEY	TJ	08/11/20	0.40	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS REGARDING ASSETS BEING TRANSFERRED (0.1); ANSWER QUESTIONS FROM P. FARR REGARDING SOCIAL SECURITY TAX ROLL OVER (0.2); EMAILS WITH A. BLOCH REGARDING MOONLIGHTING (0.1).
IVEY	TJ	08/12/20	0.10	EMAILS WITH B. MCCONKEY REGARDING FOUNDATION (0.1).
IVEY	TJ	08/13/20	0.60	CALL WITH B. MCCONKEY, C. FORMAN AND V. DURRER REGARDING INTEGRATION PLANNING (0.6).
IVEY	TJ	08/14/20	2.10	ATTEND BOARD MEETING TO REPORT ON ASSET TRANSFER (1.3); PREPARE FOR BOARD PRESENTATION (0.4); CALL WITH V. DURRER REGARDING FOLLOW UP WITH PAUL WEISS (0.1); DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR 10-Q REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (0.3).
IVEY	TJ	08/17/20	0.30	CALL WITH A. BLOCH REGARDING PRE-CLOSING CONSENTS (0.2); EMAILS WITH S. ALBERTSON REGARDING STATUS UPDATE ON ANTITRUST FILING (0.1).
IVEY	TJ	08/18/20	0.30	ANALYSIS REGARDING STOCK CANCELLATION (0.1); EMAILS WITH PAUL WEISS REGARDING ESCROW (0.1); EMAILS REGARDING APA INTERIM OPERATING COVENANT QUESTION (0.1).
IVEY	TJ	08/19/20	0.40	SUPERVISE CLOSING PROCESS (0.4).
IVEY	TJ	08/20/20	0.90	RESOLVE QUESTIONS AROUND TRANSFERRED ASSETS FROM PAUL WEISS (0.1); EMAILS INTERNALLY AND WITH PAUL WEISS REGARDING CLEARING HSR (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE ESCROW (0.7).
IVEY	TJ	08/21/20	0.20	REVIEW STRUCTURAL CHANGE SUGGESTION TO APA FROM PAUL WEISS.
IVEY	TJ	08/24/20	0.10	EMAILS WITH DAVID D'URSO OF AKIN GUMP REGARDING CLOSING AND SECURITY DEPOSIT (0.1) .

Pg 20 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

IVEY TJ	08/25/20	1.20	CALL WITH B. MCCONKEY, C. FORMAN AND V. DURRER REGARDING CLOSING MECHANICS AND TRANSITION SERVICES AGREEMENT TO FACILITATE OPERATION OF PENSION UNTIL PBGC CAN TAKE IT OVER (0.5); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (0.4); RESPOND TO WEBSITE QUESTION POST INTEGRATION (0.3).
IVEY TJ	08/26/20	0.30	COORDINATE CLOSING MATTERS (0.3).
IVEY TJ	08/27/20	3.40	CALL WITH C. FORMAN, A. BLOCH, S. HARDING, STEPHANIE ZARATE AND P. FARR REGARDING CLOSING FUNDS FLOW (1.0); CALL WITH P. FARR, S. ZARATE AND V. DURRER REGARDING FORM 15 AND CANCELLING STOCK (0.5); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH A. BLOCH TO COORDINATE CLOSING (0.5); CALL WITH A. BLOCK AND E. BROWN TO REVIEW FUNDS FLOW MEMO (0.8); REVIEW AND REVISE ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.6).
IVEY TJ	08/28/20	1.60	REVIEW AND REVISE TRANSITION SERVICES AGREEMENT (0.6); COORDINATE CLOSING (0.4); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF THE TSA (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.3).
IVEY TJ	08/29/20	0.40	ANSWER QUESTIONS FROM FTI REGARDING OWNERSHIP OF DEPOSITS (0.3); EMAILS WITH A. BLOCH TO COORDINATE 8-K AND FORM 15 FILINGS (0.1).
IVEY TJ	08/30/20	0.20	EMAILS WITH A. BLOCH REGARDING OWNERSHIP OF DEPOSITS (0.1); EMAILS WITH J. MADDEN TO COORDINATE CLOSING (0.1).
IVEY TJ	08/31/20	1.40	EMAILS WITH J. MADDEN TO COORDINATE CLOSING (0.1); EMAIL WITH RACHAEL AT FTI REGARDING TIMING OF CLOSING (0.1); REVIEW AGENDA FOR NOON CALL (0.1); EMAILS WITH P. FARR REGARDING WELLS FARGO ACCOUNTS (0.1); CALL WITH WORKING GROUP (DUCERA, PAUL WEISS, SKADDEN, FTI, STROOCK AND THE COMPANY) TO DISCUSS CLOSING (0.6); CALL WITH A. BLOCH TO SUPERVISE CLOSING (0.3); ANSWER QUESTION FROM B. MCCONKEY REGARDING GOVERNANCE (0.1).

21.70

35.00 Total Partner

Pg 21 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

ALMOGUE DN	08/03/20	0.50	TELEPHONIC ATTENDANCE AT SALE STATUS CONFERENCE.
ALMOGUE DN	08/04/20	1.00	VIRTUAL ATTENDANCE AT SALE HEARING.
		1.50	
BLOCH AE	08/01/20	3.00	REVIEW AND REVISE PR DOCUMENTS (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE APA AND RELATED DOCUMENTS (2.0).
BLOCH AE	08/02/20	2.00	REVIEW AND REVISE APA AND RELATED DOCUMENTS.
BLOCH AE	08/03/20	5.00	REVIEW AND REVISE PR DOCUMENTS (0.5); DISCUSS FINAL ISSUES BEFORE FILING WITH WORKING GROUP (0.5); DISCUSS UPDATES TO APA AND SALE ORDER WITH WORKING GROUP (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE APA (1.5); FINALIZE APA NOTICE DOCUMENTS FOR FILING (2.0).
BLOCH AE	08/04/20	4.40	ATTEND SALE HEARING (1.0); RESPOND TO QUESTIONS RELATED TO HSR FILING (2.0); REVIEW OF CONTRACTS TO BE ASSIGNED (0.7); COORDINATE ON OWNERSHIP TRANSITION MATTERS (0.7).
BLOCH AE	08/05/20	7.90	REVIEW AND REVISE CLOSING CHECKLIST (1.7); DISCUSS MINORITY INTERESTS WITH PW (0.5); DISCUSS EMPLOYEE MATTERS (1.0); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING OFFERS (1.0); ANALYZE GUARANTEE MATTERS (1.0); ANALYZE REAL ESTATE PSA MATTER (1.2); DRAFT ROFO WAIVER (1.5).
BLOCH AE	08/06/20	9.70	DISCUSS INVISIBLY WITH CLIENT (0.5); DISCUSS HSR MATTERS WITH WORKING GROUP (0.4); UPDATE CLOSING CHECKLIST (0.5); DRAFT AND REVISE VARIOUS CONSENT, NOTICE AND WAIVER LETTERS IN CONNECTION WITH OWNERSHIP TRANSFERS (8.0); REVIEW NDA PROVISIONS (0.3).
BLOCH AE	08/07/20	6.30	REVISE AND FINALIZE VARIOUS CONSENT, NOTICE AND WAIVER LETTERS IN CONNECTION WITH OWNERSHIP TRANSFERS (5.5); UPDATE CLOSING CHECKLIST (0.3); PROVIDE DOCUMENTS TO CLIENT IN RESPONSE TO REQUEST (0.3); COORDINATE ON IP MATTERS (0.2).

20-10418-mew Doc 840 Filed 09/11/20 Entered 09/11/20 21:17:26 Main Document Pg 22 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			FRIVILLADED AND CONTIDENTIAL
BLOCH AE	08/17/20	2.10	ANALYZE RETIREE PLAN TREATMENT (0.5); COORDINATE ON REAL ESTATE MATTERS (0.3); COORDINATE ON OWNERSHIP TRANSFERS (1.0); REVIEW OPERATING AGREEMENT FOR EQUITY INVESTMENT (0.3).
BLOCH AE	08/19/20	4.50	ATTEND WORKING GROUP CALL (0.9); DRAFT TRANSFER LETTERS (1.5); COORDINATE ON INSURANCE MATTER (0.5); COORDINATE ON REAL ESTATE MATTERS (0.6); COORDINATE ON INVESTOR DOCUMENTS (1.0);.
BLOCH AE	08/21/20	3.60	COORDINATE ON ESCROWS (0.4); COORDINATE ON LEASE REJECTIONS (0.3); REVIEW EMPLOYEE MATTERS (0.9); DRAFT TRANSFER LETTER (1.0); COORDINATE ON ASSIGNED CONTRACTS (1.0).
BLOCH AE	08/24/20	4.60	ATTEND WORKING GROUP CALL (0.5); COORDINATE ON CORPORATE MATTERS WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL (0.5); REVIEW REAL ESTATE MATTERS (0.8); REVIEW QUESTION ON INTERIM OPERATING COVENANTS (0.5); REVIEW PENSION MATTER (0.3); DRAFT LETTERS TO COUNTERPARTIES FOR CONTRACT ASSIGNMENTS (1.0); REVIEW NAME CHANGE MATTERS (0.6); REVIEW W-9 MATTER (0.4).
BLOCH AE	08/25/20	5.00	ATTEND CALL WITH FTI AND THE COMPANY REGARDING TAX CLAIMS AND REFUNDS (1.0); COORDINATE REGARDING TAX CLAIMS (0.3); ATTEND CALL WITH PURCHASER'S COUNSEL ON CLOSING CHECKLIST (0.7); FOLLOW-UPS ON CLOSING MATTERS (1.5); COORDINATE ON BANK ACCOUNT TRANSFER MATTERS (1.0); REVIEW BILL OF SALE (0.5).
BLOCH AE	08/26/20	3.00	COORDINATE ON TAX MATTERS (0.7); ORGANIZE CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.5); COORDINATE ON ASSUMED CONTRACTS (0.5); COORDINATE ON PAYOFF MATTER (0.3).
BLOCH AE	08/27/20	4.60	DISCUSS FUNDS FLOW WITH THE COMPANY (1.0); DISCUSS FUNDS FLOW WITH FTI (0.8); DISCUSS OWNERSHIP TRANSITION WITH WORKING GROUP (0.8); FOLLOW-UPS FROM WORKING GROUP CALL (0.5); DISCUSS PAYOFF (0.5); DISCUSS CLOSING MECHANICS (0.5); COORDINATE ON TRANSFER REQUESTS FROM COMPANY (0.5).

Pg 23 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
BLOCH AE	08/28/20	5.30	REVIEW AND REVISE TSA (1.0); DISCUSS CLOSING MECHANICS (0.8); PROCESS NAME CHANGE MATTERS (1.0): REVIEW AND REVISE ANCILLARY AGREEMENTS (2.5).
BLOCH AE	08/31/20	6.90	COORDINATE ON BANK ACCOUNT MATTERS (1.0); ATTEND OWNERSHIP TRANSITION CALL (0.6); ADDRESS LETTERS OF CREDIT MATTERS (1.0); DISCUSS EQUITY OWNERSHIP TRANSFER MATTERS (1.4); ATTEND CLOSING CHECK-IN CALL (0.6); DRAFT CLOSING DELIVERABLES (1.5); FOLLOW UP ON INVOICE MATTERS (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE AMENDMENT (0.5).
	•	77.90	
JACOB MS	08/03/20	0.90	ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE REGARDING SALE (0.5); REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR SAME (0.2); REVIEW REVISED SALE ORDER (0.2).
JACOB MS	08/04/20	1.50	ATTEND SALE HEARING VIA TELEPHONE (1.0); REVIEW REVISED SALE DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING (0.5).
		2.40	
MADDEN J	08/01/20	1.50	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING APA/SALE ORDER WITH TEAM (0.4); REVISE SALE ORDER (0.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CONSTITUENTS REGARDING SAME (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH OBJECTOR REGARDING SALE ORDER LANGUAGE (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/02/20	2.60	COORDINATE WITH TEAM REGARDING SALE HEARING (0.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH PW AND TEAM REGARDING STATUS OF SALE/CURE OBJECTIONS (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH OBJECTOR REGARDING SALE ORDER LANGUAGE (0.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT REGARDING POTENTIAL OBJECTION (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH LEASE COUNTERPARTY REGARDING CURE OBJECTION (0.1); CALL WITH TEAM REGARDING REVISIONS TO SALE ORDER AND APA (0.3) AND REVIEW/CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING APA/SETTLEMENT SCHEDULES (0.9); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SALE SETTLEMENT (0.3).

20-10418-mew Doc 840 Filed 09/11/20 Entered 09/11/20 21:17:26 Main Document Pg 24 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

MADDEN J	08/03/20	4.90	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING STATUS UPDATE (0.3); CHAMBERS CONFERENCE REGARDING SALE UPDATE (0.6); REVIEW COMMENTS TO AND REVISE SALE ORDER (1.1) AND RELATED FILINGS (1.8); CALL WITH CONSTITUENTS REGARDING SAME (0.5); FURTHER COMMUNICATIONS WITH CONSTITUENTS REGARDING SAME (0.6).
MADDEN J	08/04/20	5.80	PREPARE FOR (1.0) AND ATTEND SALE HEARING (1.1); REVISE SALE ORDER (0.9) AND ANALYSIS REGARDING ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM (0.2) AND CONSTITUENTS (0.2) REGARDING SAME; REVIEW UCC COMMENTS REGARDING SAME (0.2); TEAM CALL REGARDING SAME/NEXT STEPS (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH ADVISOR TEAM REGARDING PRESS INQUIRIES REGARDING SALE AND ANALYSIS REGARDING SAME (0.3); ANALYSIS REGARDING RELEASE OF DEPOSITS RELATED TO SALE (0.2); RESEARCH REGARDING BUYER REQUEST REGARDING CREDIT AGREEMENTS (0.3); ANALYSIS REGARDING TRANSITION MATTERS (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/05/20	1.80	COMMUNICATIONS WITH UCC AND PW REGARDING SALE ORDER (0.6); COMMUNICATION WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING (0.4) AND CALL WITH B. WELLER (0.5) REGARDING TEXAS COMMENTS TO SALE ORDER; COORDINATE WITH CIGNA REGARDING TRANSITION MATTERS (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/06/20	1.60	REVIEW COURT COMMENTS TO SALE ORDER (0.6); COORDINATE WITH UCC AND PW REGARDING COMMENTS TO SAME (0.2); FOLLOW UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH COURT REGARDING SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENTS (0.3); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/07/20	0.40	EMAIL TO CLIENT REGARDING SALE ORDER (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING BACKUP BID (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/11/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE WITH PW REGARDING NEWCO/OLDCO CREDIT DOCUMENTS (0.3).

Pg 25 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

				I KIVILLOLD AND CONTIDENTIAL
MADDEN	J	08/12/20	1.10	CALL WITH PW, DUCERA, COMPANY, FTI, SKADDEN REGARDING TRANSITION MATTERS (0.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH KCC REGARDING ESCROW ACCOUNTS (0.4).
MADDEN	J	08/13/20	0.50	CALL REGARDING ESCROW ACCOUNTS WITH KCC (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/14/20	0.20	CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING ESCROW ACCOUNTS (0.1) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN	J	08/18/20	2.50	CALL WITH FTI AND SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING FEE TRACKER (0.6) AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING FEE CAP ISSUE (0.3); CALL WITH A. BLOCH REGARDING STATUS OF CLOSING (0.5); RESEARCH REGARDING PREPETITION FINANCING DOCUMENTS FOR PW/NEWCO (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CAM AND KCC REGARDING ESCROW ACCOUNTS (0.3); CALL WITH KCC REGARDING SAME (0.4).
MADDEN	J	08/20/20	0.90	MARKUP ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARTIES REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/21/20	1.70	CALL WITH S. ZARATE REGARDING BANK ACCOUNTS AND SALE (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (0.2); CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND REVISE ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.9); CORRESPONDENCE WITH SKADDEN TEAM AND CONSTITUENTS REGARDING SAME (0.3).
MADDEN	J	08/24/20	0.70	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADVISOR TEAM AND STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING ESCROW ACCOUNTS (0.4); ANALYSIS REGARDING ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT REGARDING CLOSING TIMELINE/ISSUES (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/25/20	0.50	CORRESPONDENCE WITH KCC REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENTS (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH FTI, SKADDEN TEAM, AND CONSTITUENTS REGARDING ESCROW FUNDS FLOW MATTERS (0.4).

Pg 26 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

MADDEN J	08/26/20	1.30	REVIEW COMMENTS TO ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.2); REVISE SAME (0.5); FURTHER CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARTIES REGARDING SAME (0.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CLOSING TASKS (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/27/20	2.90	CALL WITH TEAM REGARDING FUNDS FLOW (1.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH STROOCK REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.1); REVIEW FUNDS FLOW AND ESCROW CALCULATIONS AND CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.6); DISCUSS SAME WITH SKADDEN TEAM AND FTI (0.3); CONTINUE TO WORK ON/FINALIZE ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.6); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME WITH KCC AND CLIENT (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/28/20	1.10	CORRESPONDENCE WITH SKADDEN AND FTI REGARDING CLOSING ITEMS (0.3); REVIEW FUNDS FLOW AND CONSIDER QUESTIONS REGARDING SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH COMPANY, KCC, AND UCC REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.3); CALL WITH S. MARTIN REGARDING SAME (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING SALE NOTICING (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/31/20	2.70	CALL WITH A. BLOCH REGARDING LC TRANSFER/INQUIRY (0.4); CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.3); CALL WITH A. BLOCH AND S. ZARATE REGARDING SAME (0.2); CALL WITH PW REGARDING LC TRANSFER (0.3); CALL WITH STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING SALE CLOSING (0.6); CALL WITH S. MARTIN REGARDING SAME (0.1); FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING RECORD DATE AND 1L PAYMENT FROM FUNDS FLOW (0.3); CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING FUNDS FLOW (0.2); REVIEW/CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING LC ASSIGNMENT NOTICE (0.2).
		35.00	
STROCHLIC BA	08/03/20	1.10	CORRESPONDENCE INTERNALLY REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE RELATING TO SALE HEARING (0.2); REVIEW TAX COMMENTS TO HARDING DECLARATION (0.4); ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE REGARDING SALE HEARING (0.5).

Pg 27 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
STROCHLIC BA	08/04/20	1.20	ATTEND TELEPHONIC SALE HEARING (1.0); ATTEND FOLLOW-UP INTERNAL CALL REGARDING NEXT STEPS RELATING TO SAME (0.2).
STROCHLIC BA	08/05/20	0.20	EMAILS WITH SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING CENTURYLINK CURE ISSUE (0.2).
		2.50	
Total Associate		119.30	
BAKER TS	08/24/20	0.50	PROCESSED REQUEST TO REVIEW THE STATUS FOR THE MCCLATCHY COMPANY AND MCCLATCHY SHARED SERVICES, INC. WITH THE SECRETARY OF STATE OFFICES FOR UPCOMING NAME AMENDMENTS PER ALLISON BLOCH (PAL).
BAKER TS	08/28/20	0.50	PROCESSED REQUEST TO RESERVE THE NAME JCK LEGACY COMPANY WITH THE DELAWARE SECRETARY OF STATE PER ALLISON BLOCH (PAL).
		1.00	
LEDYARD CD	08/24/20	1.50	SECRETARY OF STATE FILINGS MISCELLANEOUS COMMUNICATION REGARDING PENDING NAME AMENDMENTS FOR MCCLATCHY ENTITIES IN DELAWARE AND FLORIDA.
LEDYARD CD	08/26/20	1.50	SECRETARY OF STATE FILINGS MISCELLANEOUS COMMUNICATION REGARDING CALL TO FL TO ARRANGE FOR FILINGS/POST EFFECTIVE DATE/WITHDRAWAL/TERMINATION PROCEDURES.
LEDYARD CD	08/28/20	1.00	SECRETARY OF STATE FILINGS MISCELLANEOUS COMMUNICATION REGARDING FILINGS IN DE AND FL.
LEDYARD CD	08/31/20	0.50	SECRETARY OF STATE FILINGS MISCELLANEOUS COMMUNICATION REGARDING FLORIDA AMENDMENT FILING, EDITS AND SUBMISSION.
		4.50	
Total Legal Assistan	t Specialist	5.50	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>159.80</u>	

Pg 28 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Asset Dispositions (Real Property)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
MADDEN J	08/20/20	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING TEXAS TAX AUTHORITY ISSUES REGARDING SALE OF REAL ESTATE IN TEXAS WITH CLIENT AND TEAM (0.2) AND CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/21/20	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE WITH TOGUT AND SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING TEXAS REQUEST FOR SEGREGATED ACCOUNT (0.4).
MADDEN J	08/23/20	0.20	FURTHER ANALYSIS REGARDING TEXAS SEGREGATED ACCOUNT (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/27/20	0.30	ANALYSIS REGARDING ISSUES REGARDING TEXAS PROPERTY SALE (0.3).
		1.30	
Total Associate		1.30	
MATTER TOTAL		1.30	

Pg 29 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Automatic Stay (Relief Actions)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/16/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING DESMOND RULING.
DURRER II VC	08/19/20	0.30	ANALYSIS REGARDING APPROACH TO NC DESMOND RULING.
DURRER II VC	08/20/20	0.80	CALL WITH CLIENT AND LOCAL ADVISORS REGARDING APPROACH TO DESMOND LITIGATION RULING.
DURRER II VC	08/26/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING STAY RELIEF FOR DESMOND PETITION FOR REHEARING.
DURRER II VC	08/28/20	0.20	CALL WITH K. ORTIZ REGARDING STAY RELIEF IN DESMOND LITIGATION (.2).
DURRER II VC	08/31/20	0.10	CORRESPOND WITH KUTROW REGARDING DESMOND STAY RELIEF.
		1.70	
Total Partner		1.70	
MADDEN J	08/01/20	0.50	REVISE STIPULATED STAY ORDER (0.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CONSTITUENTS REGARDING SAME (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/03/20	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CONSTITUENTS REGARDING LIFT-STAY ORDER FOR TRUSTEE LITIGATION (0.4).
MADDEN J	08/04/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE WITH UCC REGARDING LIFT-STAY RELIEF (0.2); COORDINATE FILING REGARDING SALE (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/10/20	0.10	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING LIFT-STAY STIPULATION.
MADDEN J	08/12/20	0.10	PRESENTMENT TO CHAMBERS OF LIFT-STAY STIP (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/17/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING LIFT-STAY ORDER (0.2).
		1.60	
Total Associate		1.60	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>3.30</u>	

Pg 30 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Business Operations / Strategic Planning

_	_		
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/06/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING CHARITY ISSUES.
DURRER II VC	08/07/20	0.20	PREPARE MEMO REGARDING CHARITY ISSUES.
DURRER II VC	08/10/20	0.40	CALL WITH MANAGEMENT REGARDING CHARITY ISSUES (.2); CALL WITH MANAGEMENT REGARDING ACCOUNTING TREATMENT OF LIABILITIES SUBJECT TO COMPROMISE (.2).
		0.70	
Total Partner		0.70	
MADDEN J	08/04/20	1.40	CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING QUAD COUNTY WIND DOWN (0.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE AND ANALYSIS REGARDING WIND DOWN OF CERTAIN DEBTOR ENTITIES (1.1).
MADDEN J	08/05/20	0.30	REVISE QUAD COUNTY ORDER (0.2) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/07/20	0.50	PREPARE ANALYSIS REGARDING FOUNDATIONS (0.5).
MADDEN J	08/20/20	0.30	CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING BANK ACCOUNTS (0.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH V. DURRER REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/24/20	0.30	CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING BUSINESS WIND-DOWN ISSUES (0.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.1).
		2.80	
Total Associate		2.80	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>3.50</u>	

Pg 31 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Case Administration

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/24/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING CANCELLATION OF HEARING.
		0.10	
Total Partner		0.10	
ALMOGUE DN	08/28/20	0.20	REVIEW MULTIPLE INQUIRIES FROM CREDITORS REGARDING NOTICES RECEIVED.
		0.20	
DAKIN J	08/03/20	1.20	STATUS CONFERENCE (0.5); REVISE STIPULATED ORDER AND NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF THE SAME (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE SAME (0.2); ASSIST WITH DRAFTING NOTICE OF REVISED SALE ORDER (0.1).
DAKIN J	08/28/20	1.30	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING MOTION TO CHANGE CAPTION (0.1) ; DRAFT THE SAME (1.2) .
DAKIN J	08/31/20	2.30	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO CHANGE CAPTION (2.2); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE SAME (0.1).
		4.80	
MADDEN J	08/19/20	0.30	REVIEW AGENDA (0.2); PREPARE FOR 8/26 HEARING (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/24/20	0.60	COORDINATE REGARDING 8/26 HEARING WITH SKADDEN TEAM (0.1), CO-COUNSEL (0.2) AND CHAMBERS (0.2); REVIEW ADJOURNMENT NOTICE (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/25/20	0.20	COORDINATE REGARDING CANCELLATION OF HEARING.
		1.10	
YUH C	08/05/20	0.90	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.70); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).

Pg 32 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			I THE COLD THE COMMISSION IN
УИН С	08/06/20	0.80	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.60); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
YUН C	08/13/20	0.80	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.60); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
УИН С	08/17/20	1.00	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.80); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
УИН С	08/18/20	0.70	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.50); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
УИН С	08/19/20	0.60	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.40); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
УИН С	08/21/20	0.70	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.50); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
УИН С	08/24/20	0.60	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.40); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
YUН С	08/26/20	1.70	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE (1.50); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
YUН C	08/27/20	2.10	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE (1.90); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
YUН С	08/28/20	4.00	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE (3.80); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).

20-10418-mew Doc 840 Filed 09/11/20 Entered 09/11/20 21:17:26 Main Document Pg 33 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
YUH C	08/29/20	0.60	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE AND CLAIMS NOTICES (0.60).
YUН С	08/30/20	0.40	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE (0.40) .
ҮИН С	08/31/20	2.30	CORRESPOND WITH NOTICE PARTIES REGARDING INQUIRIES ABOUT NOTICE OF SALE (2.10); COORDINATE WITH FTI FOR FOLLOW-UP CALLS (0.20).
		17.20	
Total Associate		23.30	
BATES AT	08/03/20	8.40	DRAFT HEARING AGENDA (.6); REVISE SAME (.5); REVISE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT AND FORMAT STIPULATION FOR FILING (.8); PREPARE NOTICE OF FILING FOR REVISED SALE ORDER (.7); REVISE SAME (.4); DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED APA (.7); REVISE SAME (.4); FORMAT EXHIBITS TO SAME FOR FILING (.8); FILE (.7) AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF SAME (.4); REVIEW DOCKET FOR CURE OBJECTIONS (.7); PREPARE ELECTRONIC COPIES OF FILINGS FOR E-BINDER (1.2); DRAFT TABLE OF CONTENTS (.5).
BATES AT	08/04/20	1.00	HEARING PREPARATION, INCLUDING REVISING E-BINDERS.
BATES AT	08/05/20	0.80	REVISE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT $(.4)$; FILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF PRESENTMENT $(.4)$.
BATES AT	08/06/20	1.00	REVIEW DOCKET (.3); INITIAL DRAFT OF 8/19 HEARING AGENDA (.7).
BATES AT	08/10/20	1.30	DRAFT 8/19 FEE HEARING AGENDA.
BATES AT	08/18/20	1.50	BOOK LIVE COURT LINES AND PREP FOR FEE HEARING.
BATES AT	08/19/20	2.90	REVISE CONFIRMATION HEARING AGENDA (.6); DRAFT NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL FOR DT MOTION (.3); UPDATE 8/26 HEARING AGENDA (1.4); FILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION MOTION (.6).

20-10418-mew Doc 840 Filed 09/11/20 Entered 09/11/20 21:17:26 Main Document Pg 34 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

BATES AT	08/21/20	2.90	FILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF DISTRESS TERMINATION (.7); DRAFT CNO FOR CIP FINAL ORDER (.5); EMAILS WITH J. MADDEN FOR REVIEW AND COMMENTS (.3); DRAFT HEARING AGENDA (.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM AND TOGUT REGARDING STATUS OF CERTAIN MATTERS (.4); REVISE AGENDA (.5).
BATES AT	08/24/20	0.60	FILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF ADJOURNMENT NOTICE FOR CULLEN LIFT STAY MOTION.
BATES AT	08/25/20	0.80	DRAFT, FILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF CANCELLATION OF HEARING.
		21.20	
HEANEY CM	08/03/20	0.60	REVIEW DOCKETS REGARDING UPDATES TO HEARING MATTERS (.2); ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF HEARING AGENDA AND RELATED DOCUMENTS (.4).
		0.60	
LAMANNA WK	08/03/20	0.20	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR.
LAMANNA WK	08/05/20	0.20	REVIEW SALE HEARING TRANSCRIPT FOR STATUS OF MOTIONS (0.1) ; UPDATE CASE CALENDAR (0.1) .
LAMANNA WK	08/06/20	0.10	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR.
LAMANNA WK	08/07/20	0.30	REVIEW COURT DOCKET AND CALENDAR CRITICAL DATES (0.2) ; PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE CASE CALENDAR TO TEAM (0.1) .
LAMANNA WK	08/12/20	0.20	REVIEW COURT DOCUMENTS AND UPDATE CASE CALENDAR.
LAMANNA WK	08/17/20	0.20	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR.
LAMANNA WK	08/18/20	0.30	REVIEW COURT DOCKET AND CALENDAR CRITICAL DATES (0.2) ; PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE CASE CALENDAR TO TEAM (0.1) .
LAMANNA WK	08/19/20	0.30	REVIEW COURT DOCUMENTS AND UPDATE CASE CALENDAR.
LAMANNA WK	08/24/20	0.70	REVIEW COURT DOCUMENTS AND CALENDAR CRITICAL DATES.
LAMANNA WK	08/25/20	0.20	REVIEW COURT DOCKET AND CALENDAR CRITICAL DATES.

Pg 35 of 78
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates
ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT
PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

LAMANNA WK	08/26/20	0.30	REVIEW COURT DOCKET AND CALENDAR CRITICAL DATES (0.2); PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE CASE CALENDAR TO TEAM (0.1).
LAMANNA WK	08/31/20	0.20	REVIEW COURT DOCKET AND CALENDAR CRITICAL DATES.
		3.20	
Total Legal Ass	istant	25.00	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>48.40</u>	

Pg 36 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Claims Admin. (General)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
MADDEN J	08/10/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING CLAIMS RECONCILIATION INQUIRY (0.1).
		0.10	
YUH C	08/03/20	0.50	UPDATE CURE OBJECTION TRACKER BASED ON REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM SEAGIS, MICROSOFT, AND TRAVELERS.
YUH C	08/07/20	0.50	UPDATE CURE TRACKER WITH FURTHER RESOLUTIONS TO FILED OBJECTIONS.
		1.00	
Total Associate		1.10	
MATTER TOTAL		1.10	

Pg 37 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Disclosure Statement / Voting Issues

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DAKIN J	08/14/20	2.60	REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.3); CALL TO DISCUSS NOTICES AND BALLOT (0.2); DRAFT THE SAME (1.7); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE SAME (0.2); REVISE THE SAME (0.2).
DAKIN J	08/15/20	2.00	FURTHER REVISE BALLOT FOR VOTING ON PLAN (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.9).
DAKIN J	08/16/20	2.10	CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.
DAKIN J	08/17/20	5.60	REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.5); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE SAME (0.4); DRAFT MOTION FOR COMBINED HEARING AND SHORTENED NOTICE(1.6); DRAFTED RELATED NOTICE AND ORDER (0.9); CALL REGARDING THE SAME (0.2).
		12.30	
JACOB MS	08/10/20	7.30	RESEARCH REGARDING LIQUIDATION DISCLOSURE STATEMENTS (2.1); BEGIN TO DRAFT SUMMARY OF PLAN SECTION (3.1); REVIEW MATERIALS IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (0.2); CONTINUE TO DRAFT SUMMARY SECTION OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.9).
JACOB MS	08/11/20	12.10	DRAFT PRELIMINARY STATEMENT FOR DS (2.2); REVIEW MATERIALS IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (0.8); DRAFT RISK FACTORS SECTION (1.8); REVIEW PRECEDENT DSS FOR SAME (0.7); DRAFT CASE SUMMARY SECTION (2.6); CONTINUE TO DRAFT SUMMARY OF PLAN SECTION (3.6); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (0.4).
JACOB MS	08/12/20	7.60	CONTINUE TO DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.4); REVIEW AND REVISE INCLUDING BASED ON COMMENTS FROM B. STROCHLIC (2.2); DRAFT SUMMARY OF RELIEF SINCE PETITION DATE FOR DS (1.4); RESEARCH REGARDING DISCLOSURE ISSUES (0.6).

Pg 38 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

JACOB	MS	08/13/20	2.90	REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND INCORPORATE J. MADDEN'S COMMENTS (1.4); REVISE MOTION REGARDING COMBINED DS AND CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.4); CORRESPOND WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING SAME (0.1).
JACOB	MS	08/14/20	0.80	EDIT DS BASED ON INTERNAL COMMENTS (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH INTERNAL WORKING GROUP REGARDING SAME (0.2).
JACOB	MS	08/16/20	0.50	INCORPORATE EDITS TO DS BASED ON COMMENTS FROM SKADDEN TAX TEAM (0.4); REVIEW SAME (0.1).
JACOB	MS	08/17/20	7.60	REVISE DS BASED ON INTERNAL COMMENTS AND COMMENTS FROM UCC AND CHATHAM (2.5); CALL WITH B. STROCHLIC AND KCC REGARDING SOLICITATION ISSUES (0.1); REVIEW DS MOTION PRECEDENTS AND FOLLOW UPS REGARDING SAME (0.6); CALL WITH V. DURRER, J. MADDEN, AND B. STROCHLIC REGARDING DS AND PLAN (0.5); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH B. STROCHLIC AND J. DAKIN REGARDING SAME (0.3); DRAFT PLEADINGS REGARDING COMBINED DS SCHEDULING HEARING (2.4); CORRESPOND WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING DS ISSUES (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE SCHEDULING MOTION INCLUDING BASED ON J. MADDEN COMMENTS (0.9).
JACOB	MS	08/18/20	6.30	EDIT DS INCLUDING BASED ON CLIENT AND INTERNAL COMMENTS (1.4); REVISE DS/CONFIRMATION SCHEDULING MOTION (1.3); COORDINATE REGARDING SAME (0.1); DISCUSS SAME WITH V. DURRER AND B. STROCHLIC (0.1); PREPARE AND REVISE HARDING DECLARATION IN SUPPORT (0.9); DISCUSS AND PREPARE DS MOTION AND RELATED MATERIALS (2.5).
JACOB	MS	08/19/20	8.80	DRAFT DS MOTION (3.1); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (2.3); EDIT DS TO INCORPORATE CHATHAM COMMENTS (0.5); EDIT DS FOR UCC COMMENTS (1.1); ADDITIONAL EDITS TO DS AND DS MOTION (1.0); EDIT DS TO INCORPORATE SKADDEN TAX COMMENTS AND REVIEW SAME (0.8).
JACOB	MS	08/20/20	1.10	EDIT DS BASED ON COMMENTS FROM FTI AND TAX (1.1).

Pg 39 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			I KIVILLOLD AND COM IDLIMIAL
JACOB MS	08/21/20	2.90	REVISE DS INCLUDING BASED ON CLIENT AND CHATHAM COMMENTS (1.3); FINAL REVIEW OF DS AND PREPARE FOR FILING (1.2); COORDINATE REGARDING NOTICE AND FILING OF SAME (0.4).
		57.90	
MADDEN J	08/13/20	1.10	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.1) .
MADDEN J	08/14/20	0.90	REVIEW SOLICITATION MATERIALS (0.7) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/15/20	0.90	REVIEW/COMMENT ON SOLICITATION/NOTICING MATERIALS FOR DS AND PLAN (0.9).
MADDEN J	08/16/20	0.50	CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.5).
MADDEN J	08/17/20	1.80	DISCUSS SOLICITATION AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES WITH TEAM (0.7); REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING SAME (0.9); CALL WITH TOGUT REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/19/20	1.20	PREPARE SOLICITATION/NOTICING MATERIALS (0.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.4); ANALYSIS REGARDING RECOVERY ANALYSIS (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/20/20	0.30	CALL WITH M. YOSHIMURA REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RECOVERIES (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (0.2).
		6.70	
STROCHLIC BA	08/12/20	2.20	REVIEW AND REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO BE FILED IN CONNECTION WITH PLAN (2.2).
STROCHLIC BA	08/13/20	1.40	REVIEW EDITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.5); SEND UPDATED DRAFT OF SAME TO TAX TEAM (0.3); REVIEW EDITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER J. MADDEN COMMENTS (0.6);.
STROCHLIC BA	08/15/20	1.60	REVIEW AND REVISE BALLOT (0.3); SEND NOTICES AND BALLOT TO KCC TEAM (0.2); REVISE DS TO INCORPORATE CONFORMING CHANGES BASED ON UPDATES TO PLAN (1.1).

Pg 40 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

STROCHLIC BA	08/17/20	1.50	REVIEW SUGGESTED EDITS TO DS FROM J. DAKIN AND RELATED REVISIONS (0.6) CALL WITH KCC REGARDING SOLICITATION QUESTIONS (0.1); REVIEW V. DURRER COMMENTS TO DS (0.6); SEND UPDATED DS TO CLIENT AND S. HARDING (0.2).
STROCHLIC BA	08/18/20	1.30	REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO INCORPORATE VARIOUS COMMENTS (0.8); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING SAME (0.3).
STROCHLIC BA	08/19/20	0.90	EMAIL FTI TEAM REGARDING DS UPDATES (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE UCC COMMENTS TO DS (0.7).
STROCHLIC BA	08/20/20	1.00	REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS RECEIVED AND CONFORMING CHANGES BASED ON PLAN UPDATES (0.9); REVISE EXEC COMP DISCLOSURE PER CLIENT COMMENTS (0.1).
STROCHLIC BA	08/21/20	5.00	FINALIZE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR FILING (1.1); REVIEW AND REVISE BALLOT TO UPDATE RELEASE LANGUAGE AND MECHANICS (0.4); FURTHER REVISE NOTICES REGARDING COMBINED HEARING (1.1); FURTHER REVISE BALLOT IN PREPARATION FOR SOLICITATION (0.8); PREPARE SOLICITATION MATERIALS FOR DISTRIBUTION AND DRAFT VOTING INSTRUCTIONS/COVER LETTER (1.4); SEND OUT SOLICITATION MATERIALS (0.2).
		14.90	
Total Associate		91.80	

91.80

MATTER TOTAL

Pg 41 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Employee Matters (General)

Employee Maccels	(General)		BIII Number: 10232//
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/12/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING UPCOMING DECLARATION REGARDING EMPLOYEE INCENTIVE PLAN.
DURRER II VC	08/24/20	0.90	RESEARCH REGARDING TRANSITION OF PENSION (.9).
DURRER II VC	08/25/20	0.80	CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING PENSION TRANSITION (.4); CALL WITH K. KOHN REGARDING SAME (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH S. HARDING REGARDING SAME (.2).
DURRER II VC	08/26/20	1.00	CALL WITH CLIENT AND GROOM REGARDING APPROACH TO PENSION TRANSITION (.8); CALL WITH A. ROSENBERG REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/27/20	0.20	CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING PENSION TRANSITION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/28/20	0.50	CALL WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING PENSION ISSUES (.1); REVIEW PROPOSED PENSION AMENDMENT AND TSA (.3); CALL WITH D. LEVINE REGARDING SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/31/20	0.70	CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING SEVERANCE ISSUES (.1); FOLLOW UP WITH P. FARR AND B. MCCONKEY REGARDING SAME (.6).
		4.30	
Total Partner		4.30	
DAKIN J	08/19/20	1.00	DRAFT ORDER APPROVING CORPORATE INCENTIVE PLAN (0.9) ; CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE SAME (0.1) .
DAKIN J	08/26/20	0.10	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CIP ORDER.
		1.10	
MADDEN J	08/01/20	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PBGC/INVOLUNTARY TERM (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/03/20	2.70	REVIEW COMMENTS TO/REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT/STIPULATION (1.3) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH CONSTITUENTS REGARDING SAME (1.4).

Pg 42 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

				I KITILLOLD THIS CONTINUE
MADDEN	J	08/04/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CIP (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING PBGC/PENSION PLAN TERMINATION (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/05/20	0.40	CALL WITH COMPANY REGARDING EMPLOYEE-TRANSITION MATTERS (0.4).
MADDEN	J	08/06/20	0.10	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMPLOYEE CONSIDERATIONS (0.1).
MADDEN	J	08/07/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING EXCLUDED EMPLOYEE BENEFIT OBLIGATIONS (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/11/20	0.50	REVIEW COMMENTS TO CIP DECLARATION (0.2); REVISE AND CONSIDER OPEN ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.3).
MADDEN	J	08/12/20	0.80	COORDINATE FILING OF CIP DECLARATION (0.2); CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING ORG CHART (0.2); REVISE MATERIALS RELATED TO ORG CHART CHANGES (0.4).
MADDEN	J	08/17/20	0.20	CORRESP. WITH CLIENT REGARDING EMPLOYEE ISSUES (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/19/20	0.50	PREPARE MATERIALS REGARDING ORDER/CNO FOR CIP (0.3); COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING DT MOTION WITHDRAWAL (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/20/20	0.30	REVIEW/REVISE CNO REGARDING CIP (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN	J	08/21/20	0.40	COORDINATE REGARDING FILING OF WITHDRAWAL OF DISTRESS TERMINATION MOTION (0.1); REVIEW/COORDINATE FILING OF CNO REGARDING CIP (0.3).
MADDEN	J	08/24/20	0.40	COORDINATE REGARDING CNO REGARDING CIP (0.3); CALL WITH UST REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN	J	08/26/20	0.80	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING CIP ORDER (0.4); ANALYSIS REGARDING PENSION PLAN AND TRANSITION MATTERS (0.4).
MADDEN	J	08/27/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PBGC TRANSITION ISSUES (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/31/20	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PENSION PLAN TRANSITION (0.2).

8.10

Pg 43 of 78
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates
ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT
PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

Total Associate		9.20	
BATES AT	08/12/20	0.40	FORMAT (.1); FILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF HARDING DECLARATION (.3).
		0.40	
Total Legal Assistar	nt	0.40	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>13.90</u>	

Pg 44 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Executory Contracts (Personalty)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/08/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING REJECTION ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING SAME (.1).
		0.20	
Total Partner		0.20	
MADDEN J	08/03/20	1.20	CORRESPONDENCE WITH PW REGARDING OUTSTANDING CURE OBJECTIONS (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH OBJECTORS REGARDING SAME (0.7).
MADDEN J	08/05/20	0.90	ANALYSIS REGARDING POTENTIAL OBJECTION TO CURE (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH LEVEL 3 REGARDING SAME (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING ASSIGNMENT OF GUARANTEES (0.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING REJECTION DATE OF CONTRACTS (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/06/20	0.80	CORRESPONDENCE/ANALYSIS REGARDING ADDITIONS/SUBTRACTIONS FROM ASSUMED LEASE/CONTRACT SCHEDULE (0.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH LEVEL3 COUNSEL REGARDING CURE OBJECTION (0.3); COORDINATE WITH ADVISOR TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/07/20	0.70	COORDINATE WITH FTI AND TOGUT REGARDING AMENDMENTS TO ASSIGNMENT SCHEDULE AND CURE NOTICES (0.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH PW REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/08/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE WITH TOGUT REGARDING AD2PRO (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/10/20	0.70	ANALYSIS REGARDING ISSUES RELATED TO TAX REBATEMENT CONTRACT REJECTION (0.4) AND REJECTION NOTICE (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/12/20	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR CENTURYLINK REGARDING ASSUMPTION (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING MODIFICATION OF ASSUMPTION/ASSIGNMENT EXHIBIT (0.3).

Pg 45 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

				PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
MADDEN	J	08/13/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REJECTION/ASSUMPTION OF VENDOR CONTRACT (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/17/20	0.30	CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING CURE ISSUES (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH FTI/TOGUT REGARDING CONTRACT SCHEDULE (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/18/20	0.40	ANALYSIS REGARDING REJECTION DEADLINE FOR CONTRACT (0.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING LEASE REJECTION OBJECTION (0.3).
MADDEN	J	08/19/20	0.30	CALL WITH DUANE MORRIS REGARDING CHUBB ASSUMPTION AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME (0.2); CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN	J	08/20/20	0.70	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EXECUTORY CONTRACT ADDITIONS/REJECTIONS (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING NOTICES REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/21/20	0.80	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING REJECTION DEADLINES FOR LEASES AND CONTRACTS (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH PW REGARDING PREVIOUSLY OMITTED CONTRACTS AND CONTRACT REMOVALS FROM ASSIGNMENT SCHEDULE (0.2); COORDINATE WITH TOGUT AND FTI REGARDING NOTICES FOR SAME (0.2); REVIEW/COMMENT ON PREVIOUSLY OMITTED CONTRACT NOTICES (0.3).
MADDEN	J	08/22/20	0.20	CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING SERVICE OF PREVIOUSLY OMITTED CONTRACTS NOTICE (0.2).
MADDEN	J	08/23/20	0.10	FURTHER ANALYSIS REGARDING PREVIOUSLY OMITTED CONTRACT NOTICE (0.1).
MADDEN	J	08/24/20	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING REJECTION DEADLINES (0.4).
MADDEN	J	08/25/20	0.90	ANALYSIS REGARDING CURE DISPUTE (0.3); COORDINATE WITH TOGUT, FTI, AND CLIENT REGARDING PREVIOUSLY OMITTED CONTRACTS AND REJECTIONS (0.4); REVIEW NOTICE (0.2).

Pg 46 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

MADDEN J	08/26/20	1.00	CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM (0.7) AND PW (0.1) REGARDING ADDITIONAL ASSIGNED CONTRACTS AND REJECTED CONTRACTS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/28/20	0.20	REVIEW PREVIOUSLY OMITTED CONTRACT NOTICE (0.2).
		10.40	
Total Associate		10.40	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>10.60</u>	

Pg 47 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Bill Date: 09/11/20 Bill Number: 1823277 Insurance

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/01/20	0.10	CORRESPOND WITH BOARD MEMBER REGARDING STIPULATION TO ACCESS INSURANCE PROCEEDS FOR PRUITT LITIGATION DEFENSE.
DURRER II VC	08/03/20	0.20	FINALIZE STIPULATION TO ACCESS INSURANCE FOR PRUITT LITIGATION DEFENSE (.2).
		0.30	
Total Partner		0.30	
MADDEN J	08/05/20	0.30	COORDINATE FILING OF LIFT-STAY STIPULATION (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH INTERESTED PARTIES REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/06/20	0.30	COORDINATE TRANSITION LOGISTICS REGARDING INSURANCE (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/07/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND COUNTERPARTY COUNSEL REGARDING ASSUMPTION OF INSURANCE POLICY (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/26/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES (0.2).
		1.10	
Total Associate		1.10	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>1.40</u>	

Pg 48 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Leases (Real Property)

NAME	DATE	HOIIDG	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC			CORRESPOND WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING
			LEASE EXTENSION ISSUE.
		0.10	
Total Partner		0.10	
MADDEN J	08/03/20	0.70	CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING LEASE ISSUE (0.2); CALL WITH LEASE COUNTERPARTY REGARDING SAME (0.2); COMMUNICATIONS RELATED TO SALE ORDER REGARDING SAME (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/11/20	0.30	ANALYSIS REGARDING HQ LEASE ISSUES (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/12/20	1.20	CORRESPONDENCE WITH PW REGARDING HQ LEASE (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING LEASE REJECTION DEADLINES (0.2); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (0.1); CALL WITH CHIQUITA SUBLEASE PARTY REGARDING ASSUMPTION/REJECTION ISSUES (0.2); CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (0.2); FOLLOW UP RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (0.1); FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/14/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING HQ LEASE WITH CLIENT (0.2) .
MADDEN J	08/23/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING LEASE REJECTIONS WITH COMPANY AND TOGUT (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/25/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING LEASE GUARANTY ISSUE (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/27/20	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE WITH TOGUT/CLIENT REGARDING LEASE REJECTION DEADLINES (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE/ANALYSIS REGARDING HQ LEASE (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/28/20	0.50	CORRESPONDENCE (0.3) AND CALL WITH COMPANY, TOGUT REGARDING HQ LEASE (0.2) .
MADDEN J	08/31/20	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING LEASE REJECTION (0.2) AND ANALYSIS REGARDING ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.2).

Pg 49 of 78
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates
ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT
PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

4.10

Total Associate 4.10

4.20 MATTER TOTAL

Pg 50 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Litigation (General)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/11/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING SAWIN LITIGATION STATUS REPORT.
DURRER II VC	08/12/20	0.20	CALL WITH J. CORNEJO REGARDING OPEN LITIGATION ISSUES.
DURRER II VC	08/18/20	0.10	FOLLOW UP REGARDING RESPONSE TO DESMOND RULING.
DURRER II VC	08/28/20	0.10	REVISE PROPOSED STATUS REPORT IN ONGOING LITIGATION MATTER.
		0.50	
Total Partner		0.50	
MADDEN J	08/11/20	0.60	DRAFT CASE STATUS REPORT FOR PENDING LITIGATION (0.6).
MADDEN J	08/14/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING LITIGATION STATUS (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/27/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING POST-SALE LITIGATION (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/28/20	0.50	UPDATE CASE STATUS REPORT (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (0.1).
		1.60	
Total Associate		1.60	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>2.10</u>	

Pg 51 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Real Estate (Owned)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
MADDEN J	08/06/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REAL ESTATE SALES (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/26/20	0.50	ANALYSIS REGARDING MORTGAGE RELEASE (0.5).
MADDEN J	08/27/20	0.40	ANALYSIS REGARDING TRANSFER TO BUYER OF REAL PROPERTY (0.4).
		1.20	
Total Associate		1.20	
MATTER TOTAL		1.20	

Pg 52 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Regulatory and SEC Matters

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
IVEY TJ	08/02/20	0.60	REVIEW AND REVISED 10-Q (0.6).
IVEY TJ	08/03/20	0.10	REVIEW 10-Q DESCRIPTION OF ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (0.1).
		0.70	
Total Partner		0.70	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>0.70</u>	

Pg 53 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Reorganization Plan / Plan Sponsors

	_		
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/07/20	0.90	REVISE PLAN OF DISTRIBUTION (.5); CALL WITH C. FORMAN AND B. MCCONKEY REGARDING BOARD APPROVAL REGARDING SAME (.4).
DURRER II VC	08/08/20	0.70	CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING WIND DOWN ISSUES FOR PLAN (.4); REVISE PLAN (.3).
DURRER II VC	08/10/20	2.00	ANALYSIS REGARDING WIND DOWN BUDGET (.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING PLAN PRESENTATION FOR BOARD (.1); CALL REGARDING BUDGET WITH FTI (.6); REVISE PLAN (.2); CALL REGARDING WIND DOWN BUDGET WITH MANAGEMENT (.9); FOLLOW UP WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/11/20	1.50	CALL WITH J. WEBER REGARDING PLAN COMMENTS (.3); CALL WITH B. SILVERBERG REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN (.3); CORRESPOND WITH UCC REGARDING PLAN (.1); PREPARE BOARD PRESENTATION REGARDING PLAN (.6).
DURRER II VC	08/12/20	0.60	CALL WITH B. SILVERBERG REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); REVISE PLAN (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARTIN REGARDING PLAN CHANGES (.2).
DURRER II VC	08/13/20	2.70	CORRESPOND WITH STROOCK REGARDING UCC COMMENTS TO PLAN (.3); CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING PLAN COMMENTS AND RESPONSIBILITIES (.2); CALL WITH C. FORMAN AND B. MCCONKEY REGARDING SAME (.6); FOLLOW UP WITH S. HARDING REGARDING SAME (.2); REVISE PLAN (.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING TAX COMMENTS TO PLAN (.2); CALL WITH TAX ADVISORS REGARDING SAME (1.1).
DURRER II VC	08/14/20	2.40	CALL WITH UCC ADVISORS REGARDING PLAN COMMENTS AND CONSTRUCT (.7); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH TAX ADVISORS REGARDING COMMENTS TO PLAN (.8); REVISE PLAN (.5); ANALYSIS REGARDING WIND DOWN BUDGET (.2); CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING SAME (.2).
DURRER II VC	08/15/20	0.90	CONTINUE TO REVISE PLAN.

Pg 54 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
DURRER II VC	08/16/20	0.10	COMMUNICATE WITH S. MARTIN REGARDING TAX ISSUES ARISING UNDER PLAN.
DURRER II VC	08/17/20	1.10	REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.6); FOLLOW UP WITH TAX ADVISORS REGARDING COMMENTS TO SAME (.4); ANALYSIS REGARDING WIND DOWN BUDGET (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/18/20	3.20	CALL WITH MANAGEMENT TEAM REGARDING WIND DOWN BUDGET AND RELATED ISSUES (.6); ANALYSIS REGARDING TAX COMMENTS REGARDING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); COMMUNICATE WITH BRIGADE COUNSEL REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.7); ANALYSIS REGARDING MOTION TO SCHEDULE CONFIRMATION HEARING (.3); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH TAX ADVISORS TO CONFIRM PLAN COMMENTS (.9); REVISE SCHEDULING MOTION (.3).
DURRER II VC	08/19/20	5.90	ANALYSIS REGARDING CONFIRMATION HEARING DATE (.3); CALL WITH K. HANSEN REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); CALL WITH A. ROSENBERG REGARDING SAME (.1); CALL WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING SAME (.1); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.0); PREPARE MEMO TO A. ROSENBERG REGARDING DISCLOSURE ISSUES (.3); CALL WITH K. ORTIZ REGARDING HEARING AND EX PARTE MOTION (.1); CONTINUE TO FINALIZE PLAN (1.4); CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING SAME (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH P. FARR REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW UCC COMMENTS TO PLAN (.5); REVISE MOTION TO SCHEDULE CONFIRMATION HEARING (.3).
DURRER II VC	08/20/20	3.70	ANALYSIS REGARDING PLAN COMMENTS AND RECONCILE SAME (1.4); CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. ORTIZ AND R. HOWARD REGARDING HEARING DATE FOR CONFIRMATION (.1); CALL WITH B. MCCONKEY REGARDING SAME (.2); CALL WITH C. FORMAN (.2); CATCH UP WITH T. KRELLER REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (.3); CALL WITH ALL STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (.8); ANALYSIS REGARDING OPEN TAX ISSUES UNDER PLAN (.1); CONTINUE TO REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4).

Pg 55 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

DURRER II VC	08/21/20	1.70	CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH C. FORMAN REGARDING SAME (.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING PLAN CONFIRMATION DATE (.2); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); ANALYSIS REGARDING WIND DOWN BUDGET (.1); ALL HANDS CALL WITH ALL STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING FINAL PLAN CHANGES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.1); CALL WITH C. FORMAN AND B. MCCONKEY REGARDING SAME (.3); PREPARE MEMO TO BOARD REGARDING SAME (.2); MAKE FINAL CHANGES REGARDING PLAN (.3).
DURRER II VC	08/24/20	0.10	CORRESPOND WITH BOKF COUNSEL REGARDING PLAN ISSUES.
DURRER II VC	08/27/20	0.40	ANALYSIS REGARDING STOCK CANCELLATION ISSUE UNDER PLAN (.4).
DURRER II VC	08/28/20	0.10	CORRESPOND WITH REED SMITH REGARDING CONFIRMATION ISSUE (.1).
DURRER II VC	08/29/20	0.10	CORRESPOND WITH BOKF COUNSEL REGARDING PLAN ISSUES.
DURRER II VC	08/31/20	0.50	ANALYSIS REGARDING PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND CHECKLIST REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH T. PITTA REGARDING PROPOSED PLAN CHANGE (.1).
		28.60	
Total Partner		28.60	
ALMOGUE DN	08/04/20	0.40	ANALYSIS REGARDING MODIFIED PLAN.
ALMOGUE DN	08/05/20	0.20	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH TOGUT REGARDING MODIFIED PLAN.
ALMOGUE DN	08/10/20	0.20	ANALYSIS REGARDING UPDATED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.
ALMOGUE DN	08/21/20	0.20	ALL-HANDS CALL REGARDING FINALIZING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.
ALMOGUE DN	08/25/20	1.90	CALL WITH J. MADDEN AND B. STROCHLIC REGARDING OUTSTANDING PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND CONFIRMATION ORDER ISSUES (.4); BEGIN RESEARCH REGARDING CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PLAN SUPPLEMENT MATERIALS (1.5).

Pg 56 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

				I KITIELOED TIKD GOKKIDEKTITE
ALMOGUE	DN	08/26/20	5.70	CONTINUE RESEARCH REGARDING CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PLAN SUPPLEMENT MATERIALS (3.1); BEGIN DRAFTING CONFIRMATION ORDER (2.6).
ALMOGUE	DN	08/27/20	2.50	BEGIN DRAFTING CONFIRMATION ORDER.
ALMOGUE	DN	08/28/20	5.10	CONTINUE DRAFTING CONFIRMATION ORDER (4.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH 3L AGENT REGARDING FEES UNDER PLAN (.2).
ALMOGUE	DN	08/31/20	4.60	CONTINUE DRAFTING CONFIRMATION ORDER (4.2); CALL WITH CORE RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND RELATED ISSUES (0.4).
			20.80	
DAKIN J		08/10/20	1.20	CALL TO DISCUSS MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE (0.3); RESEARCH REGARDING COMBINED HEARINGS ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN (0.9).
DAKIN J		08/11/20	6.70	RESEARCH ON COMBINED HEARINGS ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENTS AND CONFIRMATION OF PLAN (2.2); DRAFT MOTION REQUESTING COMBINED HEARING AND SHORTENED NOTICE (4.5).
DAKIN J		08/12/20	0.30	REVISE MOTION FOR COMBINED HEARING AND TO SHORTEN NOTICE (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE SAME (0.1).
DAKIN J		08/19/20	0.60	ANALYSIS REGARDING REQUESTED PBGC LANGUAGE IN PLAN.
DAKIN J		08/25/20	0.50	CALL TO DISCUSS PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.1); DRAFT PLAN SUPPLEMENT CHECKLIST (0.4).
DAKIN J		08/28/20	0.80	REVIEW PARTIES SERVED WITH NOTICE OF CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.8).
			10.10	
JACOB MS	5	08/06/20	3.30	REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE SALE AND SETTLEMENT UPDATES.
JACOB MS	5	08/07/20	2.80	REVIEW COMMENTS AND PLAN MATERIALS FOR UPDATES TO PLAN OF REORGANIZATION.

Pg 57 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
JACOB MS	08/10/20	0.60	DISCUSS PLAN WITH B. STROCHLIC AND J. DAKIN (0.3); REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING SAME (0.3).
JACOB MS	08/12/20	0.40	REVIEW AND DISCUSS WITH WORKING GROUP EDITS TO PLAN.
JACOB MS	08/13/20	0.30	REVIEW PLAN EDITS FROM TAX TEAM.
JACOB MS	08/14/20	4.30	INCORPORATE EDITS TO PLAN BASED ON INTERNAL COMMENTS FROM TAX TEAM AND COMMENTS FROM UCC (3.4); REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO SAME (0.9).
JACOB MS	08/16/20	0.60	REVIEW CHANGES TO PLAN BASED ON COMMENTS FROM UCC.
JACOB MS	08/17/20	0.20	DISCUSS PLAN UPDATES WITH INTERNAL WORKING GROUP BASED ON TAX COMMENTS.
JACOB MS	08/19/20	4.40	EDITS TO PLAN AND REVIEW COMMENTS TO SAME BASED ON CHATHAM AND UCC COMMENTS (2.7); ATTEND CALL WITH UCC, PW, AND SKADDEN REGARDING PLAN OPEN ITEMS (1.7).
JACOB MS	08/20/20	1.80	ATTEND ALL HANDS PLAN CALL WITH UCC, SKADDEN, AND PW (PARTIAL) (0.4); REVIEW AND DISCUSS INTERNALLY PLAN EDITS (0.5); ATTEND SECOND ALL HANDS PLAN CALL WITH SKADDEN, UCC, AND PW (0.9).
JACOB MS	08/21/20	0.30	REVIEW FINAL PLAN COMMENTS.
		19.00	
MADDEN J	08/05/20	0.70	ANALYSIS REGARDING PLAN TIMELINE (0.2); CALL WITH FTI AND SKADDEN REGARDING PLAN ADMINISTRATION MATTERS (0.5).
MADDEN J	08/06/20	0.20	COORDINATE REGARDING PLAN (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/10/20	1.10	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING WIND-DOWN ISSUES (0.3); CALL WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.5); WEEKLY TEAM CALL REGARDING STATUS OF PLAN/DS PAPERS AND CASE UPDATES (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/11/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (0.2).

Pg 58 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

MADDEN J	08/14/20	1.90	COMMUNICATIONS WITH SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING PLAN EDITS (0.5); ATTEND UCC CALL REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEW COMMENTS TO PLAN (0.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING PLAN (0.7).
MADDEN J	08/17/20	1.20	CALL WITH STROOCK REGARDING TAX ISSUES AND OTHER ISSUES REGARDING PLAN (0.5); FOLLOW UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE/COMMENTS TO MATERIALS REGARDING SAME (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/18/20	4.70	CORRESPONDENCE WITH COMMUNICATIONS TEAM REGARDING NOTICES OF CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.2); REVIEW/FINALIZE MATERIALS REGARDING COMBINED HEARING (0.6) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSTITUENTS REGARDING FILING (0.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. MARTIN REGARDING CONFIRMATION TIMELINE (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.3); CONTINUE TO WORK ON AND FINALIZE CONFIRMATION HEARING MATERIALS (2.9).
MADDEN J	08/19/20	5.30	ATTEND HEARING RELATED TO PLAN/EX PARTE SCHEDULING MATTERS (0.3); PREPARE EX PARTE MOTION FOR FILING (0.3); REVIEW COMMENTS/MATERIALS REGARDING PLAN AND DS (1.8) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM AND STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING SAME (0.9); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (0.4); CALL WITH STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING PLAN (1.6).

Pg 59 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

MADDEN J	08/20/20	5.60	ANALYSIS REGARDING PLAN/SETTLEMENT ISSUE (0.2); FOLLOW UP (0.3); CALL WITH STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING PLAN CHANGES (0.9); FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PBGC LANGUAGE (0.2); CALL WITH PBGC COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (0.1); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH STAKEHOLDERS REGARDING PLAN COMMENTS (0.9); ANALYSIS REGARDING WIND-DOWN DEBTOR ISSUE (0.1); PREPARE NOTICE MATERIALS REGARDING PLAN/DS AND PLAN/DS HEARING (0.5); FINALIZE PLAN MATERIALS/NOTICES/MOTION FOR FILING (1.6); CONSIDERATIONS REGARDING NOTICE ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL AND TEAM REGARDING SCHEDULING AND SCHEDULING ORDER (0.5).
MADDEN J	08/21/20	4.20	CALL WITH CONSTITUENTS REGARDING FINALIZING PLAN AND DS (0.3); FINALIZE CONFIRMATION TIMELINE AND RELATED DOCUMENTS FOR FILING (1.3) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.3); COORDINATE SERVICE REGARDING PLAN MATERIALS (0.9); COORDINATE WITH TOGUT REGARDING ENTRY OF COMBINED HEARING ORDER (0.5); COMMUNICATION WITH BOARD REGARDING CONFIRMATION (0.1); COORDINATE WITH TEAM REGARDING FILING OF DOCUMENTS AND NOTICES (0.8).
MADDEN J	08/23/20	0.10	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SERVICE OF PLAN NOTICES (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/24/20	0.60	COORDINATE REGARDING PLAN DELIVERABLES (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING PLAN (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/25/20	0.40	CALL REGARDING PLAN SUPPLEMENT DELIVERABLES, CONFIRMATION ORDER (0.3) AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/27/20	1.30	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SCHEDULING ORDER (0.1); CALL REGARDING STOCK CANCELLATION WITH CLIENT (0.4); CALL WITH FTI AND TEAM REGARDING WIND-DOWN MATTERS (0.8).

Pg 60 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

MADDEN J	08/31/20	1.90	CALL WITH TEAM REGARDING STATUS UPDATE REGARDING CONFIRMATION MATTERS (0.6); ANALYSIS/RESEARCH REGARDING 1L NOTES CANCELLATION/SURRENDER (0.7); CORRESPONDENCE WITH PW REGARDING SAME (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH FTI, SKADDEN, AND COMPANY REGARDING SAME (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH TAX TEAM REGARDING TIMING OF PLAN/CONFIRMATION (0.1).
		29.40	
STROCHLIC BA	08/05/20	0.40	REVIEW SETTLEMENT IN ORDER TO INCORPORATE SAME INTO PLAN (0.4).
STROCHLIC BA	08/06/20	6.80	DRAFT AND REVISE PLAN OF REORGANIZATION TO BE CONSUMMATED IN CONNECTION WITH SALE (4.3); REVIEW MATERIALS IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (1.4); DISCUSS SAME WITH WORKING GROUP (1.1).
STROCHLIC BA	08/07/20	2.50	REVISE PLAN (2.5).
STROCHLIC BA	08/08/20	0.30	CIRCULATE PLAN TO STROOCK, PAUL WEISS, KRAMER LEVIN, AND CHOATE (0.3).
STROCHLIC BA	08/09/20	0.20	EMAIL PAUL WEISS REGARDING TIMING FOR PLAN FILING AND CONFIRMATION (0.1); EMAIL EY REGARDING SAME (0.1).
STROCHLIC BA	08/10/20	1.70	REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE TAX COMMENTS (0.3); CALL WITH V. DURRER, J. MADDEN, K. ORTIZ, AND S. HARDING TO DISCUSS WIND-DOWN BUDGET AND PLAN (0.6); CALL WITH SKADDEN TEAM TO DISCUSS PLAN DRAFTING AND TIMING (0.3); DISCUSS DRAFTING OF MOTION TO SCHEDULE COMBINED CONFIRMATION HEARING AND SUPPLEMENTAL DISCLOSURE WITH M. JACOB AND J. DAKIN (0.5).
STROCHLIC BA	08/11/20	2.40	INCORPORATE AND CONSIDER TAX COMMENTS TO PLAN (0.9); ATTEND CALL WITH PAUL WEISS TEAM REGARDING PLAN EDIT (0.3); FURTHER PLAN EDITS BASED ON CALL AND OTHER COMMENTS RECEIVED (1.2).

Pg 61 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

STROCHLIC BA	08/12/20	3.90	REVIEW CAM COMMENTS TO PLAN AND RELATED MATERIALS (0.6); REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE CAM COMMENTS (0.7); FURTHER REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE ADDITIONAL CAM COMMENTS (1.6); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING UPDATED PLAN WITH V. DURRER (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME WITH TAX TEAM (0.1); REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATOR LANGUAGE IN DRAFT PLAN (0.5).
STROCHLIC BA	08/13/20	2.70	CALL WITH S. HARDING REGARDING PLAN (0.1); ATTEND CALL WITH SKADDEN TAX TEAM TO DISCUSS PLAN UPDATES AND STRUCTURE (0.8); REVISE PLAN PER TAX CALL (0.4); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SCHEDULE COMBINED PLAN AND DS HEARING (1.3); UPDATE PLAN PER FURTHER TAX COMMENTS (0.1).
STROCHLIC BA	08/14/20	12.20	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING PLAN AND DS AND MOTION WITH SKADDEN RESTRUCTURING AND TAX TEAMS (0.2); CALL WITH UCC AND BRG TO DISCUSS PLAN ISSUES (0.5); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH V. DURRER REGARDING PLAN EDITS (0.2); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH J. MADDEN REGARDING SAME (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS FROM CALLS (1.9); ATTEND EY TAX CALL TO DISCUSS PLAN MECHANICS AND TAX ISSUES (0.8); FOLLOW UP WITH STROOCK ON PLAN EDITS (0.1); FOLLOW UP WITH SKADDEN TAX TEAM ON TAX COMMENTS (0.1); FURTHER REVISE PLAN BASED ON COMMENTS DISCUSSED DURING CALLS (3.1); REVIEW COMMENTS TO PLAN FROM UCC (0.6); SUBSTANTIALLY REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE UCC EDITS, INCLUDING GLOBAL COMMENTS AND CONFORMING CHANGES TO INCORPORATE NEW TRUST MECHANICS (4.1); DISCUSS DRAFTING OF PLAN NOTICES WITH J. DAKIN (0.2); REVIEW DRAFTS OF SAME (0.2).
STROCHLIC BA	08/15/20	1.90	FURTHER REVISE PLAN FOR EXTERNAL CIRCULATION (1.4); CIRCULATE PLAN DOCUMENTS TO STROOCK, PW, CHOATE, SKADDEN TAX TEAM, FTI, MILBANK, AND KCC (0.5).
STROCHLIC BA	08/16/20	0.50	FURTHER REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS FROM SKADDEN TAX TEAM (0.5).

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates
ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT
PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

STROCHLIC BA	08/17/20	6.00	ATTEND CALL WITH SKADDEN TAX AND
			STROOCK TEAMS TO DISCUSS PLAN EDITS
			(0.4); SEND TAX TEAM UPDATED PLAN TO

S AN TO BE SHARED WITH EY (0.2); EMAILS WITH TOGUT AND KCC REGARDING PLAN ISSUES AND COMMENTS (0.4); INCORPORATE PAUL WEISS COMMENTS TO PLAN (0.7); CALL WITH V. DURRER AND J. MADDEN REGARDING PLAN PROCESS AND STRATEGY (0.5); CONFER WITH J. DAKIN ABOUT REVISIONS TO SCHEDULING MOTION (0.2); CONFER WITH L. GREENBURG ABOUT TAX EDITS TO PLAN AND PROCESS (0.1); CONTINUE TO INCORPORATE PW COMMENTS TO PLAN (0.4); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. MADDEN AND TAX TEAM REGARDING PLAN FOLLOW-UPS (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SCHEDULING MOTION (1.5); REVIEW AND REVISE SCHEDULING ORDER (0.4); REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (0.5); FURTHER REVISE

SAME (0.5); FURTHER REVISE
SCHEDULING MOTION/ORDER/NOTICE PER
J. MADDEN COMMENTS (0.5).

4.60 INCORPORATE MILBANK AND KRAMER
COMMENTS TO PLAN (0.5); ATTEND TAX
CALL WITH EY AND STROOCK TEAMS
(0.8); REVISE SCHEDULING MOTION PER
COMMENTS FROM V. DURRER (0.5); DRAFT
AND REVISE HARDING DECLARATION IN
SUPPORT OF SCHEDULING MOTION (0.7);
DRAFT AND REVISE CONFIRMATION
MOTION (1.6); INTERNAL DISCUSSIONS
WITH SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING SAME

9.80 FINALIZE AND COORDINATE FILING OF

(0.5).

SCHEDULING MOTION (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION MOTION (1.7); CONFER WITH SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING PLAN FILING (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE UPDATES TO CONFIRMATION MOTION BASED ON COMMENTS FROM V. DURRER (0.4); REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE UCC COMMENTS (2.1); ATTEND CALL WITH STROOCK, PAUL WEISS, KRAMER, MILBANK, AND CHOATE TEAM CALL TO DISCUSS PLAN EDITS (1.7); FURTHER REVISE PLAN BASED ON COMMENTS DISCUSSED DURING GROUP CALL (2.2); REVIEW UPDATES TO CONFIRMATION MOTION RELATING TO SAME (0.1); FURTHER REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS FROM SKADDEN TAX TEAM (0.6).

STROCHLIC BA 08/18/20

STROCHLIC BA 08/19/20

Pg 63 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

STROCHLIC BA	08/20/20	5.40	REVISE SECTION 6.3 OF THE PLAN (0.7); CONFER WITH SKADDEN RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW STROOCK COMMENTS TO PLAN (0.4); ATTEND ADDITIONAL CALL WITH STROOCK, PAUL WEISS, KRAMER, FTI, AND MILBANK TO DISCUSS RECENT TURNS OF PLAN AND FURTHER UPDATES (1.0); FURTHER REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS FROM CALL (1.2); REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE TAX COMMENTS (0.3); INCORPORATE MILBANK, PAUL WEISS, AND SKADDEN TAX COMMENTS TO PLAN (0.4); FOLLOW-UP GROUP CALL WITH STROOCK, PAUL WEISS, KRAMER, FTI, AND MILBANK TO DISCUSS FURTHER CHANGES TO PLAN (0.8); SEND FOLLOW-UP PLAN COMMENT TO J. WEBER FOLLOWING CALL (0.2).
STROCHLIC BA	08/21/20	3.00	REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS RECEIVED (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING PLAN AND DS CHANGES (0.5); ATTEND FINAL GROUP CALL WITH STROOCK, PAUL WEISS, KRAMER, CHOATE, FTI, AND MILBANK TO DISCUSS PLAN UPDATES AND FILING (0.3); FINALIZE PLAN FOR FILING (1.2); REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE CONFIRMATION MOTION (0.8).
STROCHLIC BA	08/25/20	0.40	CALL WITH J. MADDEN AND D. ALMOGUE REGARDING CONFIRMATION FOLLOW-UPS (0.4) .
STROCHLIC BA	08/31/20	0.70	CALL WITH V. DURRER, J. MADDEN AND D. ALMOGUE TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION ISSUES (0.3); RESPOND TO EMMETT MARVIN QUESTION RELATING TO CANCELLATION OF SECURITIES UNDER PLAN (0.4).
		65.40	
УИН С	08/21/20	0.80	REVIEW PLAN OF REORGANIZATION TO ADDRESS NOTICE PARTY INQUIRY REGARDING CLAIMS PAYOUT AND TREATMENTS OF CLAIMS.
		0.80	
Total Associate		145.50	
BATES AT	08/18/20	4.50	PREPARING TO FILE EX PARTE MOTION.
		4.50	

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates
ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT
PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

LAMANNA WK 08/21/20 2.10 PREPARE FOR FILING AND

FILE/SERVE/DISTRIBUTE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.6); PREPARE FOR FILING AND FILE/SERVE/DISTRIBUTE MOTION TO SET

COMBINED HEARING (1.2); PREPARE FOR FILING AND FILE/SERVE/DISTRIBUTE NOTICE OF COMBINED HEARING (0.3).

2.10

Total Legal Assistant 6.60

MATTER TOTAL 180.70

Pg 65 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Retention / Fee Matters (SASM&F)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/03/20	0.10	CALL WITH UST REGARDING SKADDEN FIRST FEE APPLICATION.
DURRER II VC	08/19/20	0.30	ATTEND FEE APPROVAL HEARING.
DURRER II VC	08/26/20	0.20	BEGIN WORK ON JULY FEE STATEMENT.
DURRER II VC	08/31/20	1.20	PREPARE JULY FEE STATEMENT.
		1.80	
Total Partner		1.80	
ALMOGUE DN	08/05/20	0.50	BEGIN PREPARING OMNIBUS ORDER GRANTING FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ALL PROFESSIONALS.
ALMOGUE DN	08/12/20	0.70	REVISE OMNIBUS ORDER GRANTING ALL PROFESSIONAL FEE APPLICATIONS.
ALMOGUE DN	08/19/20	0.10	TELEPHONIC ATTENDANCE AT OMNIBUS FEE HEARING.
ALMOGUE DN	08/21/20	0.30	COMMUNICATIONS WITH FTI REGARDING DIP CARVEOUT ACCRUALS.
ALMOGUE DN	08/28/20	0.30	COMMUNICATIONS WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM (0.2) AND FTI (0.1) REGARDING DIP CARVEOUT ACCRUALS.
ALMOGUE DN	08/31/20	0.80	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND OVERSEE FILING OF SKADDEN'S SIXTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.
		2.70	
MADDEN J	08/31/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING JULY MONTHLY (0.2); COORDINATE FILING REGARDING SAME (0.1).
		0.30	
Total Associate		3.00	
BATES AT	08/17/20	0.90	COORDINATE WITH TOGUT REGARDING FEE HEARING PREP.
BATES AT	08/18/20	0.50	REVIEW FEE ORDER; EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.5).
BATES AT	08/31/20	2.00	PREPARING FOR FILING (1.6); FILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF JULY MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT (.4).

Pg 66 of 78
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates
ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT
PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

		3.40	
Total Legal Assistant		3.40	
SARGEANT G	08/06/20	0.50	RESEARCH REGARDING INTERIM FEE DOCUMENTATION ON OR AROUND JUNE 30TH FOR MCCLATCHY.
		0.50	
Total Legal Assistant Specialist		0.50	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>8.70</u>	

Pg 67 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Retention / Fee Matters / Objections (Others)

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/06/20	0.20	FOLLOW UP REGARDING MEDIATOR FEES.
DURRER II VC	08/13/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING TIMING OF PAYMENT OF BANKER FEES.
		0.30	
Total Partner		0.30	
DAKIN J	08/19/20	0.20	FEE APPLICATION HEARING.
		0.20	
JACOB MS	08/18/20	1.20	COORDINATE WITH WORKING GROUP, TOGUT, AND COURT SOLUTIONS REGARDING HEARING MATTERS.
JACOB MS	08/19/20	0.30	ATTEND FEE APP HEARING (0.1); COORDINATE REGARDING MATERIALS AND DIAL IN FOR SAME (0.2).
		1.50	
MADDEN J	08/01/20	0.10	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL REGARDING FEE ISSUE (0.1).
MADDEN J	08/04/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING FEE HEARING ISSUES (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/17/20	0.30	DISCUSS FEE HEARING WITH TOGUT (0.1); REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING SAME (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/19/20	0.20	CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING FEE MATTERS (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/25/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING FEE ORDER (0.1); FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME (0.1).
		1.00	
STROCHLIC BA	08/18/20	0.50	DISCUSS FEE HEARING PREP WITH M. JACOB AND A. BATES (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT GROUP REGARDING SAME (0.2).
STROCHLIC BA	08/19/20	0.10	ATTEND TELEPHONIC OMNIBUS FEE APPLICATION HEARING (0.1).
		0.60	

Pg 68 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

УИН С	08/07/20	0.40	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FREE TRACKER BASED ON WEEKLY COURT FILINGS AND INFORM CLIENT.
YUН С	08/14/20	0.30	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FREE TRACKER BASED ON WEEKLY COURT FILINGS AND INFORM CLIENT.
YUH C	08/17/20	0.30	ADDRESS CLIENT INQUIRIES REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO FILED FEE STATEMENTS PRIOR TO PAYOUT.
YUH C	08/21/20	0.30	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FREE TRACKER BASED ON WEEKLY COURT FILINGS AND INFORM CLIENT.
YUН С	08/24/20	0.20	ADDRESS CLIENT INQUIRY REGARDING OBJECTIONS ON DOCKET TO PROFESSIONAL FEE FILINGS PRIOR TO PAYOUT.
YUН С	08/28/20	0.40	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FREE TRACKER BASED ON WEEKLY COURT FILINGS AND INFORM CLIENT.
		1.90	
Total Associate		5.20	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>5.50</u>	

Pg 69 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Bill Date: 09/11/20 Secured Claims Bill Number: 1823277

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
MADDEN J	08/28/20	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 1L AP PAYMENTS (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/31/20	0.30	ANALYSIS REGARDING 1L AP PAYMENTS (0.3).
		0.50	
Total Associate		0.50	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>0.50</u>	

Pg 70 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

Bill Date: 09/11/20 Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Tax Matters

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
BETTS KJ	08/03/20	2.60	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN.
BETTS KJ	08/08/20	5.20	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PLAN OF LIQUIDATION.
BETTS KJ	08/12/20	2.90	TAX ANALYSIS REGARDING PLAN.
BETTS KJ	08/13/20	1.50	TAX ANALYSIS REGARDING PROPOSED CHANGES TO PLAN.
BETTS KJ	08/14/20	2.00	CALL WITH EY AND SKADDEN BANKRUPTCY TEAM $(.9)$; TAX ANALYSIS ON PLAN (1.1) .
BETTS KJ	08/15/20	5.50	REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.
BETTS KJ	08/16/20	6.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING PLAN.
BETTS KJ	08/17/20	1.10	CORRESPONDENCE WITH UCC AND EY REGARDING TAX ASPECTS OF PLAN (.5); REVIEW REVISED PLAN (.6).
BETTS KJ	08/18/20	1.10	CALL WITH UCC TAX ADVISOR, EY AND SKADDEN BANKRUPTCY (.9); CORRESPONDENCE WITH UCC TAX ADVISOR REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2).
BETTS KJ	08/19/20	8.40	CONFERENCE CALL WITH UCC, CHATHAM AND SKADDEN BANKRUPTCY REGARDING PLAN (.7); REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENTS (7.7).
BETTS KJ	08/20/20	8.60	CALL REGARDING PLAN WITH UCC, CHATHAM AND SKADDEN BANKRUPTCY (.5); REVIEW COMMENTS TO PLAN FROM CHATHAM AND UCC (3.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY AND UCC REGARDING TAX REFUND (.6); REVIEW COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND REVISE (4.5).
BETTS KJ	08/21/20	1.20	CALL REGARDING PLAN WITH UCC, CHATHAM AND SKADDEN BANKRUPTCY (.4); REVIEW COMMENTS TO REVISED PLAN (.8).
		46.10	
DURRER II VC	08/10/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING EY PURSUIT OF TAX REFUND.

Pg 71 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			FRIVILLADED AND CONTIDENTIAL
DURRER II VC	08/11/20	0.10	FOLLOW UP WITH S. HARDING REGARDING EY INQUIRY REGARDING PRIORITY TAX CLAIMS.
DURRER II VC	08/12/20	0.10	UPDATE REGARDING TAX ANALYSIS.
DURRER II VC	08/25/20	0.90	ANALYSIS REGARDING OPEN TAX PRIORITY CLAIMS.
		1.20	
SCHOCKETT P	08/03/20	2.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GUC COUNSEL (0.4); TAX WORK REGARDING SALE ORDER AND SETTLEMENT TERM SHEET (1.9).
SCHOCKETT P	08/04/20	0.50	REVIEW REVISED TRANSACTION DOCUMENTS (0.5).
SCHOCKETT P	08/08/20	2.10	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT PLAN (2.1).
SCHOCKETT P	08/09/20	0.70	TAX WORK REGARDING PLAN (0.7).
SCHOCKETT P	08/10/20	0.20	REVIEW REVISED DRAFT PLAN (0.2).
SCHOCKETT P	08/12/20	1.20	WORK REGARDING DRAFT PLAN (1.2).
SCHOCKETT P	08/13/20	3.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING PLAN (1.4); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN (2.1).
SCHOCKETT P	08/14/20	2.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH EY (0.8); TAX WORK REGARDING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.1).
SCHOCKETT P	08/15/20	1.00	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.0).
SCHOCKETT P	08/16/20	0.80	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING TRUSTEE RIGHTS AND OBLIGATIONS (0.2).
SCHOCKETT P	08/17/20	0.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UCC COUNSEL (0.3); WORK REGARDING PLAN (0.6).
SCHOCKETT P	08/18/20	1.60	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH EY AND UCC COUNSEL (0.9); TAX WORK REGARDING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.7).
SCHOCKETT P	08/19/20	8.00	REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (6.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING PLAN (1.7).

Pg 72 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

			PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
SCHOCKETT P	08/20/20	4.80	REVISE DRAFT PLAN AND TAX DISCLOSURE (3.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORKING GROUP (1.4).
SCHOCKETT P	08/21/20	0.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING PLAN (0.2) ; REVIEW REVISED DRAFT FILINGS (0.3) .
		31.00	
Total Partner		78.30	
GREENBERG LI	08/03/20	1.90	E-MAILS WITH P. SCHOCKETT AND B. STROCHLIC REGARDING STATUS OF COURT FILINGS (0.2); E-MAILS WITH K. BETTS, P. SHOCKETT, AND J. MADDEN REGARDING SALE ORDER AND SETTLEMENT (0.4); REVIEW SALE ORDER AND SETTLEMENT (0.3); PHONE CALLS WITH P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING SALE ORDER AND SETTLEMENT (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH STROOCK REGARDING SALE ORDER AND SETTLEMENT (0.5).
GREENBERG LI	08/04/20	0.40	REVIEW FINAL APA.
GREENBERG LI	08/08/20	4.00	REVIEW AND MARK UP LIQUIDATION PLAN.
GREENBERG LI	08/09/20	1.90	FURTHER REVISE LIQUIDATION PLAN.
GREENBERG LI	08/12/20	2.10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH SKADDEN TAX AND J. MADDEN (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. BETTS AND P. SCHOCKETT (0.5); REVIEW REVISED LIQUIDATION PLAN (0.5); E-MAILS WITH P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING LIQUIDATION PLAN (0.1).
GREENBERG LI	08/13/20	5.60	CONFERENCE CALL WITH SKADDEN TAX AND BANKRUPTCY TEAMS (1.2); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.6); REVIEW REVISED LIQUIDATION PLAN (0.2); PHONE CALL WITH P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.5); E-MAILS WITH EY AND SKADDEN TEAM REGARDING CALL SCHEDULING (0.1).
GREENBERG LI	08/14/20	2.60	CONFERENCE CALL WITH SKADDEN AND EY REGARDING TAX ISSUES (0.9); PHONE CALL AND E-MAILS WITH B. STROCHLIC REGARDING REVISIONS TO LIQUIDATION PLAN (0.2); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.5).
GREENBERG LI	08/15/20	0.90	REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.

Pg 73 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

GREENBERG LI	08/16/20	4.00	REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN OF LIQUIDATION (1.5); E-MAILS WITH P. SCHOCKETT, K. BETTS, AND B. STROCHLIC REGARDING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. STULTS AND P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING PLAN (0.3).
GREENBERG LI	08/17/20	2.80	RESEARCH REGARDING PROCEDURAL TAX ISSUES (0.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH STROOCK REGARDING PROCEDURAL TAX ISSUES (0.2); E-MAILS WITH P. SCHOCKETT, K. BETTS, B. STROCHLIC, AND EY REGARDING OPEN TAX ISSUES (1.0); PHONE CALLS WITH P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING TAX ISSUES (0.3); PHONE CALL WITH B. STROCHLIC REGARDING TIMING (0.1); RESEARCH REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.4).
GREENBERG LI	08/18/20	1.10	REVIEW REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DRAFT (0.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH STROOCK, EY AND SKADDEN REGARDING TAX ISSUES (0.9).
GREENBERG LI	08/19/20	9.30	REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.1); PHONE CALL WITH P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING REVISIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.3); PHONE CALL WITH K. BETTS REGARDING PLAN (0.1); E-MAILS WITH K. BETTS AND P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES (1.1); REVIEW REVISED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENTS (1.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALL COUNSEL REGARDING PLAN (1.7); CALL WITH P. SCHOCKETT AND K. BETTS REGARDING PLAN AND DS (0.7).
GREENBERG LI	08/20/20	4.70	PHONE CALLS WITH P. SCHOCKETT REGARDING COMMENTS TO THE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.4); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH ALL COUNSEL REGARDING COMMENTS TO PLAN (1.9); E-MAILS WITH P. SCHOCKETT, K. BETTS AND B. STROCHLIC REGARDING COMMENTS TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.9); REVIEW REVISED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.5); REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.0).
GREENBERG LI	08/21/20	0.90	REVIEW REVISIONS TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALL COUNSEL REGARDING PLAN (0.3).

20-10418-mew Doc 840 Filed 09/11/20 Entered 09/11/20 21:17:26 Main Document Pg 74 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

		42.20	
MADDEN J	08/03/20	0.80	ANALYSIS REGARDING TAX ISSUES RELATED TO SALE ORDER AND SETTLEMENT (0.8).
MADDEN J	08/09/20	0.30	CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING EY/TAX REFUND/PLAN (0.3).
MADDEN J	08/10/20	0.40	ANALYSIS REGARDING CLIENT INQUIRY REGARDING PROPERTY TAXES (0.2); ANALYSIS REGARDING TAX REFUND/EY WORK (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/12/20	1.20	CALL WITH TAX TEAM REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (1.0); FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING TAX DS/PLAN ISSUES (0.2).
MADDEN J	08/13/20	1.30	CALL WITH TAX TEAM REGARDING PLAN/DS (1.1) ; CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING TAX IMPLICATIONS OF PLAN (0.2) .
MADDEN J	08/14/20	0.70	CALL WITH EY REGARDING PLAN MECHANICS (0.7).
		4.70	
Total Associate		46.90	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>125.20</u>	

Pg 75 of 78 Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT **PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL**

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Bill Date: 09/11/20 Vendor Matters Bill Number: 1823277

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	08/17/20	0.10	ANALYSIS REGARDING COMPANY INQUIRY REGARDING PAYMENT OF SMALL VENDOR.
		0.10	
Total Partner		0.10	
MADDEN J	08/17/20	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING VENDOR ISSUE (0.3).
		0.30	
Total Associate		0.30	
MATTER TOTAL		0.40	
CLIENT TOTAL		<u>675.00</u>	

EXHIBIT E

EXPENSE DETAIL

skadden, arps, slate, meagher & flom IIp and affiliates

Bill Date: 09/11/20

Bill Number: 1823277

The McClatchy Company (DIP) Disbursements

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/	Qty.	Amount	Narrative
Delaware Databas	se08/24/20	Baker TS	2.00	100.00	
Delaware Databa	se08/28/20	Baker TS	2.00	100.00	
		TOTAL DELAWARE DATABASE		\$200.00	
Westlaw	08/06/20	Sargeant G	0.00	244.02	
Westlaw	08/11/20	Dakin J	0.00	246.75	
		TOTAL WESTLAW		\$490.77	
Outside eDiscovery Services	07/31/20	Consilio LLC	0.00	4,435.65	
		TOTAL OUTSIDE EDISCOVERY SERVICES		\$4,435.65	
Vendor Hosted Teleconferencin	,, -	Teleconferencin g Services, LLC	796.00	29.21	
Vendor Hosted Teleconferencin	08/04/20 ag	Teleconferencin g Services, LLC	1,855. 00	68.08	
Vendor Hosted Teleconferencin	08/10/20 ag	Teleconferencin g Services, LLC	201.00	7.39	
Vendor Hosted Teleconferencin	08/11/20 ag	Teleconferencin g Services, LLC	13.00	0.49	
Vendor Hosted Teleconferencin	08/11/20 ag	Teleconferencin g Services, LLC	60.00	2.22	
Vendor Hosted Teleconferencin	08/14/20 ag	Teleconferencin g Services, LLC	354.00	13.02	
Vendor Hosted Teleconferencin		Teleconferencin g Services, LLC	0.00	-10.42	
		TOTAL VENDOR HOSTED TELECONFERENCING		\$109.99	
Filing/Court Fee	es08/03/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fee	es08/03/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fee	es08/03/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	

skadden, arps, slate, meagher & flom IIp and affiliates

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/ Dept.	Qty.	Amount	Narrative
Filing/Court Fees	s08/03/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	s08/04/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	s08/04/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	308/04/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	s08/04/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	308/04/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	s08/19/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	s08/19/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	s08/19/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
Filing/Court Fees	s08/19/20	Court Solutions	0.00	70.00	
		TOTAL FILING/COURT FEES		\$910.00	
Court Reporting	08/04/20	eScribers, LLC	0.00	193.60	
Court Reporting	08/20/20	eScribers, LLC	0.00	78.65	
		TOTAL COURT REPORTING		\$272.25	
Outside Research	08/03/20	Factset Research Systems, Inc.	0.00	108.69	
		TOTAL OUTSIDE RESEARCH		\$108.69	
		TOTAL MATTER		\$6,527.35	
		TOTAL CLIENT		\$6,527.35	