Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242 Docket #0242 Date Filed: 05/31/2019

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:) Chapter 11
SOUTHCROSS ENERGY PARTNERS, L.P., et al.,) Case No. 19-10702 (MFW)
Debtors. 1) Jointly Administered
2 60 (612)	Objection Deadline: June 14, 2019 at 4:00 p.m.

FIRST MONTHLY APPLICATION OF MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP, AS DELAWARE BANKRUPTCY CO-COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION, FOR ALLOWANCE OF MONTHLY COMPENSATION AND FOR MONTHLY REIMBURSEMENT OF ALL ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2019 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 30, 2019

Name of Applicant: MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

Authorized to Provide

Professional Services to: Debtor

Date of Retention: May 3, 2019 nunc pro tunc to April 1, 2019

Period for which

Compensation and April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

reimbursement is sought:

Amount of compensation

sought as actual,

reasonable and necessary: \$177,788.00

¹ The debtors and debtors in possession in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of their respective Employer Identification Numbers, are as follows: Southcross Energy Partners, L.P. (5230); Southcross Energy Partners GP, LLC (5141); Southcross Energy Finance Corp. (2225); Southcross Energy Operating, LLC (9605); Southcross Energy GP LLC (4246); Southcross Energy LP LLC (4304); Southcross Gathering Ltd. (7233); Southcross CCNG Gathering Ltd. (9553); Southcross CCNG Transmission Ltd. (4531); Southcross Marketing Company Ltd. (3313); Southcross NGL Pipeline Ltd. (3214); Southcross Midstream Services, L.P. (5932); Southcross Mississippi Industrial Gas Sales, L.P. (7519); Southcross Mississippi Pipeline, L.P. (7499); Southcross Gulf Coast Transmission Ltd. (0546); Southcross Mississippi Gathering, L.P. (2994); Southcross Delta Pipeline LLC (6804); Southcross Alabama Pipeline LLC (7180); Southcross Nueces Pipelines LLC (7034); Southcross Processing LLC (0672); FL Rich Gas Services GP, LLC (5172); FL Rich Gas Services, LP (0219); FL Rich Gas Utility GP, LLC (3280); FL Rich Gas Utility, LP (3644); Southcross Transmission, LP (6432); T2 EF Cogeneration Holdings LLC (0613); and T2 EF Cogeneration LLC (4976). The debtors' mailing address is 1717 Main Street, Suite 5300, Dallas, TX 75201.

Amount of reimbursement	
sought as actual,	
reasonable and necessary:	\$10,186.43
This is a <u>x</u> monthly	_ final application

The total time expended for fee application preparation is approximately 4.0 hours and the corresponding compensation requested is approximately \$1,500.00.

If this is not the first application filed, disclose the following for each prior application:

DATE FILED	PERIOD COVERED	REQUESTED FEES/EXPENSES	APPROVED FEES/EXPENSES

Allowance for compensation for such time is not requested in this application, but will be sought in a subsequent fee application.

COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P., et al. (Case No. 19-10702 (MFW)) April 1, 2019 Through April 30, 2019

	Position of the Applicant	Hourly Billing Rate (including changes)	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
Robert J. Dehney	Partner/Bankruptcy	1,100	15.7	\$17,270.00
Donna L. Culver	Partner/Bankruptcy	850	.8	680.00
Gregory W. Werkheiser	Partner/Bankruptcy	825	.3	247.50
Curtis Miller	Partner/Bankruptcy	800	.3	240.00
Jason Russell	Partner/Corporate	775	2.0	1,550.00
Andrew R. Remming	Partner/Bankruptcy	750	36.9	27,675.00
Matthew B. Harvey	Associate/Bankruptcy	695	1.0	695.00
Daniel B. Butz	Special Counsel	675	.8	540.00
Joseph Barsalona	Associate/Bankruptcy	595	119.1	70,864.50
Sean Sullivan	Associate/Commercial	495	1.7	841.50
Eric Moats	Associate/Bankruptcy	465	97.7	45,430.50
Marisa Maddox	Paralegal	305	2.5	762.50
Renae M. Fusco	Paralegal	305	32.9	10,034.50
Theresa M. Naimoli	Case Clerk	165	5.8	957.00
Total			317.50	\$177,788.00
GRAND TOTAL:	\$177,788.00		ı	
BLENDED RATE:	\$560.00			

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P., et al. (Case No. 19-10702 (MFW)) April 1, 2019 Through April 30, 2019

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Case Administration	61.5	\$33,511.50
Asset Dispositions/363 Sales	8.2	4,332.00
Automatic Stay Matters	7.0	4,293.00
Creditor Communications and Meetings	17.7	10,552.00
Fee Applications (Others – Filing)	9.1	4,984.50
Fee Applications (Others- Objections)	.1	30.50
Executory Contracts/Unexpired Leases	4.1	2,502.50
Other Contested Matters	8.5	5,942.50
Employee Matters	20.6	12,925.50
Financing Matters/ Cash Collateral	8.3	4,350.00
Tax Matters	1.1	451.50
Insurance Matters	.9	303.50
Utility Matters	6.6	3,064.00
Vendor/Supplier Matters	3.3	1,799.50
Court Hearings	50.2	27,501.00
Claims Objections and Administration	1.1	685.50
Litigation/Adversary Proceedings	6.2	4,642.00
Professional Retention (MNAT-Filing)	22.5	11,934.50
Professional Retention (MNAT-Objections)	10.1	4,732.50
Professional Retention (Others-Filing)	28.6	14,625.50
Professional Retention (Others-Objections)	6.6	3,634.50
General Corporate Matters	2.1	1,609.50
General Case Strategy	14.9	9,519.50
Schedules/SOFA/U.S. Trustee Reports	18.2	9,861.00
TOTAL	317.5	\$177,788.00

EXPENSE SUMMARY

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P., et al. (Case No. 19-10702 (MFW)) April 1, 2019 Through April 30, 2019

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	Total Expenses
Photos/Art/Spec. Duplicating	Out of Office	\$2,545.64
Transcripts		1,027.85
Courier/Delivery Service		457.29
In House Duplicating	Black and White	1,151.80
In House Printing	Black and White	1,361.70
Paralegal Overtime*		332.28
In House Printing	Color	945.60
Computer Research	Westlaw	2,118.90
Messenger Service		15.00
Secretarial Overtime^		65.99
Meals		164.38
Total Expenses		\$10,186.43

^{*}Time spent working outside of normal business hours for Renae Fusco.

[^]For time spent working outside of normal business hours for Mary Hall.

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	_)
In re:) Chapter 11
SOUTHCROSS ENERGY PARTNERS, L.P.,) Case No. 19-10702 (MFW)
et al.,) Jointly Administered
Debtors. ¹) Objection Deadline: June 13, 2019 at 4:00 p.m.

FIRST MONTHLY APPLICATION OF MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP, AS DELAWARE BANKRUPTCY CO-COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION, FOR ALLOWANCE OF MONTHLY COMPENSATION AND FOR MONTHLY REIMBURSEMENT OF ALL ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2019 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 30, 2019

Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP ("Morris Nichols"), Delaware bankruptcy co-counsel to the debtors and debtors in possession in the above-captioned cases (collectively, the "Debtors"), submits this application (the "Application") for monthly allowance of compensation for professional services rendered by Morris Nichols to the Debtors for the period April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019 (the "Application Period") and reimbursement of actual

¹ The debtors and debtors in possession in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of their respective Employer Identification Numbers, are as follows: Southcross Energy Partners, L.P. (5230); Southcross Energy Partners GP, LLC (5141); Southcross Energy Finance Corp. (2225); Southcross Energy Operating, LLC (9605); Southcross Energy GP LLC (4246); Southcross Energy LP LLC (4304); Southcross Gathering Ltd. (7233); Southcross CCNG Gathering Ltd. (9553); Southcross CCNG Transmission Ltd. (4531); Southcross Marketing Company Ltd. (3313); Southcross NGL Pipeline Ltd. (3214); Southcross Midstream Services, L.P. (5932); Southcross Mississippi Industrial Gas Sales, L.P. (7519); Southcross Mississippi Pipeline, L.P. (7499); Southcross Gulf Coast Transmission Ltd. (0546); Southcross Mississippi Gathering, L.P. (2994); Southcross Delta Pipeline LLC (6804); Southcross Alabama Pipeline LLC (7180); Southcross Nueces Pipelines LLC (7034); Southcross Processing LLC (0672); FL Rich Gas Services GP, LLC (5172); FL Rich Gas Services, LP (0219); FL Rich Gas Utility GP, LLC (3280); FL Rich Gas Utility, LP (3644); Southcross Transmission, LP (6432); T2 EF Cogeneration Holdings LLC (0613); and T2 EF Cogeneration LLC (4976). The debtors' mailing address is 1717 Main Street, Suite 5300, Dallas, TX 75201.

and necessary expenses incurred by Morris Nichols during the Application Period under sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court of the District of Delaware (the "Local Rules"), the United States Trustee's Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330, effective January 30, 1996 (the "U.S. Trustee Guidelines") and the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals* (D.I. 191) (the "Interim Compensation Procedures Order").² In support of this Application, Morris Nichols represents as follows:

JURISDICTION

1. This Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue in this district is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

BACKGROUND

2. On April 1, 2019 (the "**Petition Date**"), the Debtors filed voluntary petitions for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors continue to operate their businesses and manage their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these bankruptcy cases.

² Terms used but not otherwise defined herein have the meanings ascribed to them in the Interim Compensation Procedures Order.

3. No Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors has been appointed in these cases.

MORRIS NICHOLS' RETENTION

4. Prior to the Petition Date, the Debtors engaged Morris Nichols as Delaware bankruptcy co-counsel in connection with these bankruptcy cases. On May 3, 2019, this Court entered the *Order Granting Debtors' Application for Entry of an Order Under 11 U.S.C.* §§ 327(a), 328(a), and 1107(b), Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2014 and 2016, and Del. Bankr. L.R. 2014-1 and 2016-1, Authorizing Retention and Employment of Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP as Delaware Bankruptcy Co-Counsel for the Debtors, Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date (D.I. 183).

FEE PROCEDURES ORDER

- 5. On May 6, 2019, the Court entered the Interim Compensation Procedures Order, which sets forth the procedures for interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses for all professionals in these cases.
- 6. In particular, the Interim Compensation Procedures Order provides that a Professional may file and serve a Monthly Fee Application with the Court no earlier than the 15th day of each month following the month or months for which compensation is sought. Provided that there are no objections to such Monthly Fee Application filed within 14 days after the service of a Monthly Fee Application, the Professional may file a certificate of no objection with the Court, after which the Debtors are authorized to pay such Professional 80 percent of the fees and 100 percent of the expenses requested in such Monthly Fee Application. If a partial objection to the Monthly Fee Application is filed, then the Debtors are authorized to pay 80 percent of the fees and 100 percent of the expenses not subject to an objection.

RELIEF REQUESTED

- 7. Morris Nichols submits this Application (a) for allowance of reasonable compensation for the actual, reasonable and necessary professional services that it has rendered as bankruptcy counsel for the Debtors in this case for the period from April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019, and (b) for reimbursement of actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred in representing the Debtors during that same period.
- 8. During the period covered by this Application, Morris Nichols incurred fees in the amount of \$177,788.00. For the same period, Morris Nichols incurred actual, reasonable and necessary expenses totaling \$10,186.43. With respect to these amounts, as of the date of this Application, Morris Nichols has received no payments. Morris Nichols' fees for the Compensation Period are based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled professionals in cases other than cases under Title 11.
- 9. Set forth on the foregoing "Compensation by Project Category" is a summary by subject matter categories of the time expended by timekeepers billing time to these cases.
- 10. Exhibit A attached hereto contains logs, sorted by case project category, which show the time recorded by professionals, paraprofessionals and other support staff and descriptions of the services provided.
- 11. <u>Exhibit B</u> attached hereto contains a breakdown of disbursements incurred by Morris Nichols during the Application Period.
- 12. Morris Nichols charges \$.10 per page for black and white photocopying and \$.80 per page for color photocopying.
 - 13. Morris Nichols charges \$.25 per page for outgoing domestic facsimiles

and does not charge for incoming facsimiles.

- 14. In accordance with Local Rule 2016-2, Morris Nichols has reduced its request for compensation for non-working travel, if any, to 50% of its normal rate.
- 15. Morris Nichols has endeavored to represent the Debtors in the most expeditious and economical manner possible. Tasks have been assigned to attorneys, paralegals, and other support staff at Morris Nichols so that work has been performed by those most familiar with the particular matter or task and, where attorney or paralegal involvement was required, by the lowest hourly rate professional appropriate for a particular matter. Moreover, Morris Nichols has endeavored to coordinate with the other professionals involved in this case so as to minimize any duplication of effort and to minimize attorneys' fees and expenses to the Debtors. We believe we have been successful in this regard.
- 16. No agreement or understanding exists between Morris Nichols and any other person for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with these cases.
- 17. The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies to the best of his information, knowledge and belief that this Application complies with that Rule.

WHEREFORE, Morris Nichols respectfully requests that this Court: (a) allow Morris Nichols (i) monthly compensation in the amount of \$177,788.00 for actual, reasonable and necessary professional services rendered on behalf of the Debtor during the period April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019, and (ii) monthly reimbursement in the amount of \$10,186.43 for actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred during the same period; (b) authorize and direct the Debtors to pay to Morris Nichols the amount of \$152,416.83 which is equal to the sum

of 80% (\$142,230.40) of Morris Nichols' allowed monthly compensation and 100% (\$10,186.43) of Morris Nichols' allowed expense reimbursement; and (c) grant such other and further relief as is just and proper.

May 31, 2019 Wilmington, Delaware MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

/s/ Eric W. Moats

Robert J. Dehney (No. 3578)
Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120)
Joseph C. Barsalona II (No. 6102)
Eric W. Moats (No. 6441)
1201 N. Market St., 16th Floor
PO Box 1347
Wilmington, DE 19899-1347
Telephone: (302) 658-9200
Facsimile: (302) 658-3989
rdehney@mnat.com

rdehney@mnat.com aremming@mnat.com jbarsalona@mnat.com emoats@mnat.com

Co-Counsel for Debtors and Debtors in Possession

12775623.1

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	_)
In re:) Chapter 11
SOUTHCROSS ENERGY PARTNERS, L.P.,) Case No. 19-10702 (MFW)
et al.,) Jointly Administered
Debtors. ¹) Objection Deadline: June 14, 2019 at 4:00 p.m.

NOTICE OF FIRST MONTHLY APPLICATION OF MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP, AS DELAWARE BANKRUPTCY CO-COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION, FOR ALLOWANCE OF MONTHLY COMPENSATION AND FOR MONTHLY REIMBURSEMENT OF ALL ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2019 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 30, 2019

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that today, Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP as counsel to the Debtors in the above-captioned case (the "Debtors"), filed the attached First Monthly Application of Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, as Delaware Bankruptcy Co-Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession, for Allowance of Monthly Compensation and for Monthly Reimbursement of All Actual and Necessary Expenses Incurred for the Period April 1, 2019 Through and Including April 30, 2019 (the "Application").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application, must: (a) be filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3rd Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, on or before <u>June 14, 2019 at 4:00 p.m. (Eastern Time)</u> (the "Objection Deadline"); and (b) be served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

¹ The debtors and debtors in possession in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of their respective Employer Identification Numbers, are as follows: Southcross Energy Partners, L.P. (5230); Southcross Energy Partners GP, LLC (5141); Southcross Energy Finance Corp. (2225); Southcross Energy Operating, LLC (9605); Southcross Energy GP LLC (4246); Southcross Energy LP LLC (4304); Southcross Gathering Ltd. (7233); Southcross CCNG Gathering Ltd. (9553); Southcross CCNG Transmission Ltd. (4531); Southcross Marketing Company Ltd. (3313); Southcross NGL Pipeline Ltd. (3214); Southcross Midstream Services, L.P. (5932); Southcross Mississippi Industrial Gas Sales, L.P. (7519); Southcross Mississippi Pipeline, L.P. (7499); Southcross Gulf Coast Transmission Ltd. (0546); Southcross Mississippi Gathering, L.P. (2994); Southcross Delta Pipeline LLC (6804); Southcross Alabama Pipeline LLC (7180); Southcross Nueces Pipelines LLC (7034); Southcross Processing LLC (0672); FL Rich Gas Services GP, LLC (5172); FL Rich Gas Services, LP (0219); FL Rich Gas Utility GP, LLC (3280); FL Rich Gas Utility, LP (3644); Southcross Transmission, LP (6432); T2 EF Cogeneration Holdings LLC (0613); and T2 EF Cogeneration LLC (4976). The debtors' mailing address is 1717 Main Street, Suite 5300, Dallas, TX 75201.

- (i) <u>the Debtors</u>, 1717 Main Street, Suite 5300, Dallas, TX 75201 (Attn: Michael B. Howe);
- counsel for the Debtors, (a) Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington (ii) Avenue, New York, Darren NY 10017. Attn: S. darren.klein@davispolk.com; Steven Z. Szanzer, steven.szanzer@davispolk.com; and Benjamin Schak. M. benjamin.schak@davispolk.com and (b) Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 North Market Street, 16th Floor, P.O. Box 1347, Wilmington, DE 19899, Attn: Robert J. Dehney, rdehney@mnat.com; Andrew R. Remming, aremming@mnat.com; and Joseph C. Barsalona II, jbarsalona@mnat.com;
- (iii) counsel to any official committee appointed in the Chapter 11 Cases;
- (iv) counsel to the post-petition lenders and an ad hoc group of prepetition lenders, (a) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, NY 10019-6099, Attn: Paul V. Shalhoub, pshalhoub@willkie.com; Joseph G. Minias, jminias@willkie.com; and James H. Burbage, jburbage@wilkie.com and (b) Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Matthew B. Lunn, mlunn@ycst.com;
- (v) <u>counsel to Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. as administrative agent, Vinson & Elkins LLP, 2001 Ross Avenue, suite 3900, Dallas, TX 75201, Attn: William Wallander, bwallander@velaw.com; Bradley Foxman, bfoxman@velaw.com; and Matthew Pyeatt, mpyeatt@velaw.com; and</u>
- (vi) the Office of United States Trustee for the District of Delaware appointed in the Chapter 11 Cases, Caleb Boggs Federal Building, 844 King Street, Suite 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Richard L. Schepacarter, Richard. Schepacarter@usdoj.gov.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT ONLY OBJECTIONS MADE IN WRITING AND TIMELY FILED AND RECEIVED, IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROCEDURES ABOVE, WILL BE CONSIDERED BY THE BANKRUPTCY COURT AT SUCH HEARING.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

May 31, 2019 Wilmington, Delaware

MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

/s/ Eric W. Moats

Robert J. Dehney (No. 3578)
Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120)
Joseph C. Barsalona II (No. 6102)
Eric W. Moats (No. 6441)
1201 N. Market St., 16th Floor
PO Box 1347
Wilmington, DE 19899-1347
Telephone: (302) 658-9200
Facsimile: (302) 658-3989
rdehney@mnat.com
aremming@mnat.com
jbarsalona@mnat.com
emoats@mnat.com

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

Marshall S. Huebner (admitted pro hac vice)
Darren S. Klein (admitted pro hac vice)
Steven Z. Szanzer (admitted pro hac vice)
Benjamin M. Schak (admitted pro hac vice)
450 Lexington Avenue
New York, New York 10017
Tel.: (212) 450-4000
Fax: (212) 701-5800
marshall.huebner@davispolk.com
darren.klein@davispolk.com
steven.szanzer@davispolk.com

benjamin.schak@davispolk.com

Co-Counsel for Debtors and Debtors in Possession

EXHIBIT A COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P., et al. (Case No. 19-10702 (MFW))
April 1, 2019 Through April 30, 2019

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Case Administration	61.5	\$33,511.50
Asset Dispositions/363 Sales	8.2	4,332.00
Automatic Stay Matters	7.0	4,293.00
Creditor Communications and Meetings	17.7	10,552.00
Fee Applications (Others – Filing)	9.1	4,984.50
Fee Applications (Others- Objections)	.1	30.50
Executory Contracts/Unexpired Leases	4.1	2,502.50
Other Contested Matters	8.5	5,942.50
Employee Matters	20.6	12,925.50
Financing Matters/ Cash Collateral	8.3	4,350.00
Tax Matters	1.1	451.50
Insurance Matters	.9	303.50
Utility Matters	6.6	3,064.00
Vendor/Supplier Matters	3.3	1,799.50
Court Hearings	50.2	27,501.00
Claims Objections and Administration	1.1	685.50
Litigation/Adversary Proceedings	6.2	4,642.00
Professional Retention (MNAT-Filing)	22.5	11,934.50
Professional Retention (MNAT-Objections)	10.1	4,732.50
Professional Retention (Others-Filing)	28.6	14,625.50
Professional Retention (Others-Objections)	6.6	3,634.50
General Corporate Matters	2.1	1,609.50
General Case Strategy	14.9	9,519.50
Schedules/SOFA/U.S. Trustee Reports	18.2	9,861.00
TOTAL	317.5	\$177,788.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 2 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Time Detail

Task Code: B110 Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
03/25/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re first day motions	0.1	75.00
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Draft notice of filing of creditor matrix.	0.1	46.50
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Finalize and file creditor matrix	0.2	119.00
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise and finalize petitions and ancillary documents (3.3); Correspondence with KCC re: filing (.1); Correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal team re: same (.1); Revise pro hac vice motions (.2); Finalize letter to clerk of court (.1); Correspondence with L. Scott re: claims agent website (.1); Correspondence with E. Moats re: notice of creditor matrix (.1); Revise same (.1); Correspondence with R. Fusco re: filing issues (.1); Correspondence with R. Dehney re: filing status (.1); Correspondence with S. Szanzer, B. Schak and D. Meyer re: agenda (.1)	4.4	2,618.00
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Coordinate with R. Fusco for filing of petitions and first day motions.	0.5	232.50
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Create redlines against previously filed motions for UST review.	0.7	325.50
04/01/19	Remming, Andrew	participate in call w/ UST re first day motions; office conf. w/ R. Dehney, JB and A&M	1.0	750.00
04/01/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Pro Hac Vice Motion re Darren S. Klein of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP	0.2	33.00
04/01/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Pro Hac Vice Motion re Steven Z. Szanzer of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP	0.2	33.00
04/01/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile petitions & first day docs (3.0); put together first day binders (1.9)	4.9	1,494.50
04/01/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with J. Barsalona re call/first day motion comment.	0.1	110.00
04/01/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email to court re resolution of trustee issues.	0.1	110.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 3 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
04/01/19	Fusco, Renae M.	tel call w J Barsalona re tasks	0.1	30.50
04/01/19	Fusco, Renae M.	tel call w C Hare re tasks	0.1	30.50
04/01/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Prepare for and attend conference call with US Trustee re first day motions; office conference with A. Remming, J. Barsalona and co-counsel.	1.0	1,100.00
04/01/19	Butz, Daniel B.	pull first day research for J Barsalona	0.8	540.00
04/01/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Pro Hac Vice Motion re Benjamin M. Schak of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP	0.2	33.00
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Dehney re: first day motion comment call	0.1	59.50
04/01/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from J. Barsalona re filing of motions (.1); Prepare & efile Pro Hac Vice Motion re Marshall S. Huebner of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP (.1)	0.2	33.00
04/01/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Pro Hac Vice Motion re Elliot Moskowitz of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP	0.1	16.50
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for comments call with US Trustee (.2); Attend call with US Trustee, Davis Polk team and A&M team (.8)	1.0	595.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: service of equityholders interim order	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: equity holders relief.	0.3	139.50
04/02/19	Moats, Eric	Draft COC re: equity holder order re: Court comments and coordinate for the filing of same.	1.1	511.50
04/02/19	Moats, Eric	Email exchange w/ DPW re: equity holder order.	0.2	93.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Fusco re 2019 statement	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Fusco re filings	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re revised orders; review email from R. Fusco re second day hearing; review email from S. Szanzer re revised orders	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 4 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	confer w J Barsalona, E Moats re revised orders	0.7	213.50
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile delivery of goods notice of hrg	0.1	30.50
04/02/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from R. Fusco with Willkie/Young Conaway 2019 statement; review.	0.1	110.00
04/02/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails from J. Barsalona (.1), trustee (.1), E. Mosley (.1), D. Klein (.1) and S. Szanzer (.1) re first day motions.	0.5	550.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	download & save orders	0.8	244.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re delivery of goods motion	0.2	61.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile lienholder motion notice	0.1	30.50
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	email to SXE team attaching signed orders	0.3	91.50
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re equity holder motion	0.1	30.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with L. Scott re: service of interim orders (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and revise notices of entry of interim order (.1); Revise notice of entry of interim order regarding equity holder waiver (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research regarding equityholders motion and interim order issue (.4); Correspondence with S. Szanzer, B. Schak and D. Meyer re: same (.1); Correspondence with court re: same (.1); Discussion with R. Dehney re: same (.1)	0.7	416.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with L. Scott re: service of interim orders	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise equityholder order (.3); Calls with S. Szanzer re: same (.2); Revise certificate of counsel regarding same (.1); Correspondence (x6) with B. Schak and D. Meyer re: same (.2)	0.8	476.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 5 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/02/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from E. Moats re filing of COC (.1); Prepare & efile Certificate of Counsel Re: Equity Security Holders Motion (.4)	0.5	82.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with E. Moats and R. Fusco re: notices of entry of interim order	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moats re: notice of entry of interim order regarding consolidated creditor list motion	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Fusco re: service issues, case calendar and other administrative tasks	0.3	178.50
04/03/19	Moats, Eric	Update notice of Equity Holders motion to reflect order entered re: COC and coordinate with R. Fusco re: filing and service of same.	0.4	186.00
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (3x) re UST issues	0.1	75.00
04/03/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/03/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send out daily docket update	0.3	91.50
04/03/19	Fusco, Renae M.	download filed docs & save to iManage for distribution	0.8	244.00
04/03/19	Fusco, Renae M.	coordinate service of equity security docs	0.1	30.50
04/03/19	Fusco, Renae M.	rvw dkt re equity order upload & email to J Barsalona re same	0.1	30.50
04/03/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile equity security holders motion notice of hearing	0.2	61.00
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Niemerg reservice on equity holders	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with B. Schak re: docket updates (.1); Correspondence with R. Briggs re: docket updates (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Fusco re: daily docket distributions	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moats re: as-entered interim order waiving service on equity holders	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 6 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with R. Fusco and L. Scott of KCC re: service of notice of entry of interim order related to equity holder motion	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with R. Niemerg re: equity holder list	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/04/19	Fusco, Renae M.	save filed docs to iManage	0.2	61.00
04/04/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.2	61.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Briggs re: docket distributions to co-counsel	0.1	59.50
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x9) with R. Briggs and A. Remming re: docket distributions (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Niemerg re: equity holder motion and order	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Briggs re: document distribution	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding information sharing (.1); Discussions with service providers regarding same (.7); Discussion with C. Hare re: same (.1)	0.9	535.50
04/05/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (2x) re UST comments motions	0.1	75.00
04/05/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re comments to second day motions	0.1	75.00
04/05/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/05/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails re edits to first day motions.	0.1	110.00
04/05/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send out daily dkt email	0.4	122.00
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: dissemination of information to Davis Polk team	0.1	59.50
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Fusco re filings	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 7 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	Review email from E. Moats re critical dates memo	0.1	75.00
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Review recent court decisions regarding motions to seal creditor matrix.	0.3	139.50
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ R. Fusco re filings	0.1	75.00
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re creditor matrix	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Fusco re filings	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/10/19	Fusco, Renae M.	download & save docs to iManage	0.1	30.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer and D. Hartie re: order waiving service on equity holders (.1); Draft final order regarding same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with A. Wahi re: administrative issues	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Frank re comments from UST to first day motions	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re motion to seal creditor matrix	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from UST re equity motion	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and R. Schepacarter re: equity holder order	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Fusco re filings	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re equity motion	0.1	75.00
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: motion to seal creditor matrix	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Harvey, Matthew B.	Assist J. Barsalona w/ service/notice issues.	0.3	208.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: second day motions	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Fusco re: second day motion service	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 8 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: motion to seal creditor matrix	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with R. Niemerg re: creditor matrix	0.1	59.50
04/15/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Calls with D. Meyer re: equity holder order (.3); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.2); Revise amended final order (.3)	0.8	476.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re equity holder order	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Huebner re UST comments	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re filing second day motions	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research for sealing motion (.1); Correspondence with S. Szanzer and D. Meyer re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with US Trustee re: motion to seal	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Draft motion to seal creditor matrix.	3.1	1,441.50
04/16/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	download & save filed docs	0.7	213.50
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re equity service order	0.3	225.00
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further discussion with A. Remming re: potential equity committee	0.2	119.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (3x) re CNOs for final orders	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re blacklined final orders	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Draft COC for list of equity holders motion.	0.5	232.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming and E. Moats re: potential equity committee	0.3	178.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare task list for certificates of counsel and certificates of no objection necessary for final orders for second day hearing	0.3	178.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 9 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona and E. Moats re equity holder motion and COCs for second day motions	0.2	150.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	further tele w/B. Fallon re equity motion	0.2	150.00
04/17/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Phone call with A. Remming re equity list motion.	0.1	110.00
04/17/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	calendar obj deadlines of pleadings filed 4/16	0.1	30.50
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ R. Dehney re equity list motion	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	download & save filed docs	0.6	183.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re CNOs for final orders	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Fusco re docket update	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ A. Remming re: requirement of listing holders under rule 1007(a)(3).	0.2	93.00
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer re: motion to seal creditor matrix	0.1	59.50
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Edit motion to seal creditor matrix and email to DPW for review.	0.3	139.50
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Research requirement of equity security holders to be listed under beneficial holder or individual holder.	2.3	1,069.50
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Dehney and A. Remming re: equity committee issues (.4); Call with potential counsel to equity committee (.4)	0.8	476.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ E. Moats re equity service list motion	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	download & save filed docs	0.2	61.00
04/18/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/18/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Prepare for and attend conference calls with: (i) A. Remming and S. Szanzer re equity waiver motion, and (ii) A. Remming K. Lee and S. Szanzer and others re same.	0.6	660.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 10 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re motion to seal creditor matrix	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	upload final post-petition delivery of goods order & prep docs for sending to MFW chambers	0.1	30.50
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x5) with A. Remming re: ad hoc committee requests	0.1	59.50
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from D. Meyer re motion to seal creditor matrix	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re pro hac motion; review email from A. Mehes re same	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Moats, Eric	Draft pro hac motion and order for DPW.	0.1	46.50
04/21/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with S. Szanzer and R. Dehney re: affidavit of service of equity holder list	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with M. Maddox re: daily docket distributions	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review presentation on equity holder research	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: equity holder research	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Maddox re filings	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Edit email memo re: equity security holder list requirements.	0.4	186.00
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to analysis of equity issues	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: equity security list email/research.	0.1	46.50
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Dehney and A. Remming re: equity holder list	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Draft emails memo for MNAT and DPW re: equity security holder list requirements.	1.6	744.00
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: equity holder order (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: research re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/22/19	Maddox, Marisa	retrieve pleadings and circulate	0.1	30.50
04/22/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from M. Maddox.	0.1	110.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 11 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	Name	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/22/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from E. Moats with research re equity list (.1); review (.2); email to S. Szanzer re same (.1)	0.4	440.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	edit memo re equity holder list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re equity list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Maddox, Marisa	call with J Barsalona re daily docket distribution	0.1	30.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Finalize COC for equity security holders final order.	0.5	232.50
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with S. Szanzer re: equity holder motion	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Coordinate for filing and service of motion to seal creditor matrix.	0.3	139.50
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: motion to seal issues (.3); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Review and finalize motion to seal creditor matrix.	0.8	372.00
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Maddox re filings	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re schedules and sofa motion and motion to seal	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: motion to seal (.1); Call with S. Szanzer re: same (.1); Correspondence (x10) with M. Huebner, S. Szanzer and R. Dehney re: same (.1); Call with R. Schepacarter re: same (.4); Correspondence (x5) with Davis Polk team re: same (.2); Comment to correspondence response to US Trustee (.2); Correspondence with KCC re: service of motions (.1)	1.2	714.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise motion to seal creditor matrix (.5); Correspondence with Davis Polk team re: same (.1); Call with S. Szanzer re: same (.1)	0.7	416.50
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: equity holders and general case updates	0.2	119.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 12 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u> 04/23/19	Name Barsalona, Joseph	Description Revise certificate of counsel regarding equityholder order (.5); Correspondence	<u>Hours</u> 0.7	<u>Amount</u> 416.50
		with E. Moats re: same (.1); Correspondence with US Trustee re: same (.1)		
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further revisions to seal motion	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with US Trustee re: equity holder order and potential unsecured creditors committee	0.2	119.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and finalize redlines of orders for purposes of equity holder certificate of counsel (.1); Revise and finalize same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/23/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from E. Moats re filing and service of motion (.1); Prepare & efile Motion to File under Seal Portions of the Creditor Matrix Containing Certain Individual Creditor Information (.3)	0.4	66.00
04/23/19	Maddox, Marisa	file COC re Regarding Motion Of Debtors For Entry Of An Order (I) Waiving The Requirements To File Equity Lists And To Provide Notice To Equity Security Holders And (II) Authorizing Debtors To File A Consolidated List Of Debtors' 20 Largest Unsecured Creditors	0.1	30.50
04/23/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from M. Maddox.	0.1	110.00
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re creditor matrix	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Maddox, Marisa	draft notice of hearing re Motion to File Under Seal Portions of the Creditor Matrix Containing Certain Individual Creditor Information	0.1	30.50
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from JCB re sealing motion	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call to S. Szanzer re: motion to seal issues	0.1	59.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: motion to seal issues	0.2	119.00
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call /w B. Schak re: letter to holdings equity holders.	0.1	46.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 13 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from JCB re UST comments to second day motions	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with B. Schak re: equity holders list (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1); Correspondence with R. Dehney re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: equity holder letter issues	0.1	59.50
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: equity holders list to run for conflicts for letter to equity holders.	0.4	186.00
04/24/19	Maddox, Marisa	serve Amended Final Order APPROVING (A) Waiving the Requirement to File Equity Lists and (B) Authorizing Debtors to File a Consolidated List of Debtors 20 Largest Unsecured Creditors Order	0.1	30.50
04/24/19	Maddox, Marisa	retrieve documents from docket (.1); daily docket circulation (.1)	0.2	61.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf w/ J. Barsalona re equity holders	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Maddox re filings	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from UST re comments to second day motions	0.1	75.00
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Review equity holders list.	1.1	511.50
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to email from JCB re UST comments to second day motions	0.1	75.00
04/26/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re UST comments to second day motions	0.1	75.00
04/29/19	Fusco, Renae M.	download & save filed docs	0.5	152.50
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from R. Schepacarter re 2nd day motion/application comments.	0.1	110.00
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from J. Barsalona with update re second day motions/applications.	0.1	110.00
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from S. Szanzer re second day motions/applications.	0.1	110.00
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 14 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	tele SXE re: second day motions	0.3	225.00	
		Total	61.5		33,511.50
Task Code	B130	Asset Dispositions/363 Sales			
<u>Date</u>	Name	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount	
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with potential asset solicitation professional	0.1	59.50	
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with J. Russell re: potential sale process	0.1	59.50	
04/10/19	Moats, Eric	Review recent de minimis sale motions in Delaware.	0.5	232.50	
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Analysis of de minimis asset sale procedures questions (.1); Correspondence with T. Green re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from T. Green re de minimis asset sale motion	0.1	75.00	
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re asset sales motion	0.1	75.00	
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with A. Remming and B. Schak re: declarations in support of sale	0.1	59.50	
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from T. Green re de minimis sale procedures	0.1	75.00	
04/11/19	Moats, Eric	Edit de minimis asset sale motion.	1.0	465.00	
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to email from B. Schak re declaration	0.1	75.00	
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised de minimis asset sale motion (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: de minimis sale asset motion.	0.3	139.50	
04/12/19	Remming, Andrew	review emails from B. Schak and E. Moats re draft declaration in support of sale	0.1	75.00	
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Edit de minimis sale motion.	1.8	837.00	
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with S. Szanzer re: de minimis asset sale motion	0.1	59.50	
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer re: de minimis asset sales motion	0.1	59.50	

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 15 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: de minimis sale procedures motion (.1); Comment to same and research regarding same (1.0)	1.1	654.50	
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from B. Schak re declaration	0.1	75.00	
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: de minimis sale motion issues (.2); Legal research re: same (.3); Call with M. Lunn re: same (.1)	0.6	357.00	
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for call with counsel to lenders (.1); Call with M. Lunn re: de minimis asset sale motion (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: status of assumption motion	0.1	59.50	
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from E. Moats re filing and service of motions (.1); Prepare & efile Motion for Approval of Procedures Re: the Sale of De Minimis Assets Free and Clear of Liens, Claims, Interests, and Encumbrances, and Abandonment of Certain of the Debtors' Property (.4)	0.5	82.50	
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Dehney and M. Huebner re: Hilco interest in assets	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: de minimis sale order	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from R. Schepacarter re interim compensation and de minimis sales (.1); email from J. Barsalona re with comments to same (.1).	0.2	220.00	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re de minimis sale motion	0.2	61.00	
		Total	8.2		4,332.00
Task Code	• B140	Automatic Stay Matters			

Task Code: B140 Automatic Stay Matters

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from K. Mann re stay relief motion	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re objection to stay relief motion	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 16 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (2x) re motion to shorten notice re stay relief motion	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with chambers re: objection to motion to shorten (.1); Correspondence with A. Mehes re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Mehes re: stay relief issues	0.2	119.00
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with A. Mehes re: stay relief motion (.1); Calls with chambers re: same (.1); Correspondence with chambers re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review motion to shorten relief from stay motion (.1); Correspondence with D. Klein, S. Szanzer, B. Schak and D. Meyer re: same (.1); Review stay relief motion (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re stay motion; review email from D. Klein re same	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from A. Mehes re list stay motion to shorten; review email from J. Barsalona re same	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review motion for stay relief	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Manage, coordinate and assist with filing of objection to motion to shorten notice re: stay relief motions (.9); Revise and finalize objection to motion to shorten notice of stay relief motions and related pro hac vice motion (.5); Correspondence (x7) with co-counsel and counsel to stay relief movants re: same (.2)	1.6	952.00
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with A. Mehes re: objection to motion to shorten with respect to automatic stay relief	0.1	59.50
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with L. Marzorati re: objection to motion to shorten with respect to automatic stay relief	0.1	59.50
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with L. Marzorati re: objection to motion to shorten notice on stay relief motions (.1); Comment to objection to motion to shorten notice on stay relief motions (.6)	0.7	416.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 17 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review objection to motion to shorten notice re lift stay motion	0.2	150.00
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with M. Hall re: potential filing of response to motion notice with respect to stay relief motions	0.1	59.50
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from L. Marzorati re objection to stay motion to shorten; review email from J. Barsalona re same	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ J. Barsalona re edits to objection to motion to shorten re stay motion	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with M. Hall re: service of objection to motion to shorten notice with respect to automatic stay relief	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review order shortening notice and correspondence with E. Moskowitz and A. Mehes re: same	0.1	59.50
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review order granting motion to shorten notice re stay	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review notice of hearing of stay relief motions	0.1	59.50
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with L. Marzorati re: objection to motions for relief from stay	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with L. Marzorati re: objection to motion for relief from stay (.1); Discussions with M. Maddox and R. Fusco re: filing of same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Comment to Objection to Stay Relief Motion	1.0	595.00
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with P. Romero reservice of objection to relief from stay motions	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Finalize objection to motions for relief from stay (.2); Coordinate filing of same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/30/19	Maddox, Marisa	file Debtors' Limited Objection to Motions for Relief from Automatic Stay Pursuant to Section 362(d) of the Bankruptcy Code [D.I. 113 & 116] (.1); emails with B Springart; R Fusco and J Barsalona re same (.1)	0.2	61.00
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re response to stay relief motion	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 18 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Total 7.0 4,293.00

Task Code:	B150	Creditor Communications and Meetings
I ask Couc.	D150	Creditor Communications and Weetings

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: 341 meeting (.1); Factual investigation regarding dates (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with Davis Polk team re: tentative 341 meeting dates	0.1	59.50
04/01/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from J. Barsalona re filing of matrix (.1); Prepare & efile Creditor Matrix (.1)	0.2	33.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with U.S. Trustee regarding 341 meeting	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re 341 meeting	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	Further review of email from J. Barsalona re 341 meeting	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review emails from UST re 341 meeting	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with M. Huebner, D. Klein and S. Szanzer re: 341 meeting scheduling	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for IDI preparations call with M. Howe and K. Jameson (.1); Attend conference call on IDI preparations with M. Howe and K. Jameson (.3); Correspondence with E. Moats re: IDI Memo (.1)	0.5	297.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with Davis Polk team and US Trustee regarding scheduling of telephonic IDI	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise IDI memo	0.3	178.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with US Trustee re: IDI information (.1); Correspondence with R. Olson and Davis Polk re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/03/19	Moats, Eric	Draft initial debtor interview memo.	0.4	186.00
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	call w/ DPW and client and A&M re IDI meeting	0.5	375.00
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Olson re IDI	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 19 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re IDI materials; correspondence with J. Barsalona and M. Frank re same	0.1	75.00
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re IDI memo	0.1	75.00
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re schedules and SOFAs; review emails from D. Klein and S. Szanzer re IDI information	0.1	75.00
04/03/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails from J. Barsalona (.1), D. Klein (.1) and S. Szanzer (.1) re IDI.	0.3	330.00
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with D. Klein and A. Remming re: creditor inquiries	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Olson re: IDI materials (.1); Correspondence (x2) with U.S. Trustee re: same (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review Notice to Counsel Regarding Scheduling of 341 Meeting	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: IDI memo	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re IDI information	0.1	75.00
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with D. Klein and S. Szanzer re: IDI information and conference call	0.1	59.50
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Olson and S. Szanzer re: IDI materials	0.1	59.50
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with M. West re: IDI scheduling (.1); Correspondence with M. Howe re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: IDI issues	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Coordinate Initial Debtor Interview conference call	0.2	119.00
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with M. West re: Initial Debtor Interview	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re IDI	0.1	75.00
04/07/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review IDI materials	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 20 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/08/19	Moats, Eric	Review notice of commencement of case.	0.3	139.50
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Transmittal of IDI Materials to U.S. Trustee (.1); Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer and R. Olson re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Comment to notice of commencement (.1); Legal Research re: same (.2)	0.3	178.50
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research on notice of commencement filing date (.2); Discussion with M. Maddox re: same (.1); Discussion with R. Fusco re: same (.1); Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer and R. Niemerg re: same (.1)	0.5	297.50
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and R. Niemerg re: notice of commencement	0.1	59.50
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re IDI materials	0.1	75.00
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Transmittal of notice of commencement to S. Szanzer and R. Niemerg	0.1	59.50
04/08/19	Maddox, Marisa	call with J Barsalona re notice of commencement (.1); research deadline for same (.1)	0.2	61.00
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re notice of commencement	0.1	75.00
04/08/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice of commencement	1.6	488.00
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (2x) re notice of commencement	0.1	75.00
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re notice of commencement; review email from J. Barsalona re IDI materials	0.1	75.00
04/08/19	Harvey, Matthew B.	Research question re: 341 meeting and timing.	0.6	417.00
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re IDI list	0.1	75.00
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (2x) re notice of commencement and interim comp motion	0.1	75.00
04/08/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from J. Barsalona with IDI materials.	0.1	110.00
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review notice of appearance for Corpus Christi Liquefaction, LLC	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 21 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: IDI materials	0.2	119.00
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with R. Olson and S. Szanzer re: IDI materials	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with L. Scott and A. Palash re: notice of commencement service	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Further review notice of commencement.	0.2	93.00
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ E. Moats re contact from creditor	0.1	75.00
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x6) with R. Niemerg and L. Scott re: notice of commencement (.1); Factual investigation regarding comments to same (.2)	0.3	178.50
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Analysis of notice of commencement service issue (.1); Correspondence with KCC and Davis Polk re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with L. Scott re: notice of commencement	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review correspondence with US Bank re: copier rental and correspondence with S. Szanzer re: same	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Finalize notice of commencement (.1); Correspondence with L. Scott re: service of same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with R. Jordan re: notice of commencement issues (.2); Legal research re: same (.2)	0.4	238.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from KCC Re notice of commencement	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re notice of commencement	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile notice of commencement	0.2	61.00
04/10/19	Fusco, Renae M.	coordinate service of notice of commencement	0.1	30.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with D. Meyer re: notice of commencement	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review correspondence from creditor (.1); Correspondence (x2) with D. Klein, S. Szanzer, B. Schak and D. Meyer re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 22 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with B. Schak re: creditor call	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with creditor regarding lease agreements	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with M. Howe, K. Jameson and S. Szanzer re: Initial Debtor Interview	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: IDI preparation call and IDI	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with M. Howe re: IDI materials	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Attend and participate in initial debtor interview	0.7	416.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming and IDI preparations (.1); Prepare for IDI preparations call (.2); Attend IDI preparations call (.5); Transmission of IDI documents to M. Howe for IDI Meeting (.3)	1.1	654.50
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	participate in IDI with UST	0.7	525.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	prep and attend call re IDI prep	0.7	525.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re IDI materials	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with creditor and KCC re: removal from service list	0.1	59.50
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re notice to creditor	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from B. Gorman re BK notice	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from V. Gleeson re removal from mailing list	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with D. Klein, S. Szanzer, B. Schak and D. Meyer re: creditor correspondence	0.1	59.50
04/29/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ P. Autry (counsel to gas vendor) re: lienholder interim and final order language.	0.2	93.00
04/29/19	Moats, Eric	Emails re: lienholder questions from P. Autry.	0.3	139.50
		Total	17.7	

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Task Code: B165 Fee Applications (Others - Filing)

		11 (8)		
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
03/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from D. Klein re fee guidelines	0.1	75.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: interim compensation issues (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Draft interim compensation motion (1.6); Legal research re: same (.4); Correspondence with E. Moats re: same (.1)	2.1	1,249.50
04/04/19	Moats, Eric	Review and edit interim comp motion.	1.7	790.50
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer re: interim compensation motion	0.1	59.50
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: revised interim compensation procedures	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: interim compensation motion (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/05/19	Moats, Eric	Review comments by S. Szanzer re: interim comp. motion and edit to reflect same.	1.1	511.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review comments to interim compensation motion (.2); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1); Call to S. Szanzer re: same (.3)	0.6	357.00
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised version of interim compensation motion (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: comments (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review additional comments to interim compensation procedures motion (.1); Correspondence with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: changes to interim compensation procedures motion	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: interim compensation procedures motion	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review further comments to interim compensation procedures motion	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 24 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
04/11/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ D. Meyer re: fee applications.	0.1	46.50	
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with D. Meyer re: fee application issues	0.1	59.50	
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding fee application issues	0.3	178.50	
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with M. Harvey and D. Butz re: service of interim compensation procedures motion	0.2	119.00	
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research regarding interim compensation procedures motion	0.4	238.00	
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review comments to interim compensation motion	0.1	59.50	
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Email DPW re: updated OCP, interim comp, and MNAT retention app documents.	0.2	93.00	
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re interim comp motion	0.2	61.00	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: revised interim compensation procedures order	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: interim compensation procedures motion	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and revise Interim Compensation Procedures Order	0.2	119.00	
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	review revised version of interim comp order	0.1	75.00	
		Total	9.1		4,984.50
Task Code:	B175	Fee Applications (Other - Objections)			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re interim comp motion	0.1	30.50	
		Total	0.1		30.50
Task Code:	B185	Executory Contracts/Unexpired Leases			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with M. Held of Jackson Walker re: unexpired leases	0.1	59.50	

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 25 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with S. Szanzer re: rejection motion (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re USBank	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research re: service deadline for Section 365(d)(4) motion (.1); Correspondence with D. Meyer re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to Motion to Enter Into Assumption/Assignment Agreement	0.1	59.50
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further correspondence (x4) with A. Remming re: Assumption/Assignment Agreement (.1); Revise same (.2)	0.3	178.50
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Edit motion to enter into Assumption/Assignment Agreement	0.4	186.00
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re contract motion	0.1	75.00
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and revise modified version of Assumption/Assignment Agreement motion	0.8	476.00
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with A. Remming and B. Schak re: Assumption/Assignment Agreement	0.1	59.50
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	review draft of Assumption/Assignment Agreement (.4); email to B. Schak re same (.1)	0.5	375.00
04/15/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from J. Barsalona with revisions to draft Assumption/Assignment Agreement; review.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Fusco re: service of Assumption/Assignment Agreement	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Fusco re: Assumption/Assignment Agreement	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re Assumption/Assignment Agreement	0.3	91.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review letter from US Bank (.1) Discussion with R. Fusco re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review letter from U.S. Bank re executory contracts (.1); email from M. Frank re same (.1).	0.2	220.00
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	email to Davis Polk & MNAT attys re US Bank letter	0.2	61.00

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Total 4.1 2,502.50

Task Code: B190 Other Contested Matters

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research on potential comments to first day motions	0.4	238.00
04/09/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with J. Barsalona re Chubb settlement.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moskowitz re litigation update	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails from D. Culver and E. Moskowitz re TRO.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Culver, Donna L.	Call w/Moskowitz re TRO (.5); follow up w/sample papers re same (.2)	0.7	595.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from K. Lee re equity holders	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to email from B. Fallon re equity holders	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ S. Szanzer re equity holders	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ B. Fallon and S. Szanzer re equity motion	0.2	150.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from B. Fallon re objection deadline; emails w/ S. Szanzer re same	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from K. Lee re equity holders	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from K. Lee re equity holders	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to email from S. Szanzer re research; emails w/ JCM re same	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re sealing motion	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from K. Lee re equity holders	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re opposition to motion to shorten	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	further emails w/ J. Barsalona re equity motion	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 27 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/19/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with A. Remming re equity committee motion.	0.1	110.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review UST objection to sealing motion	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review vmail from B. Keelson re equity issues	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ J. Barsalona re equity committee motion; emails w/ R. Dehney re same	0.1	75.00
04/21/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (3x) re equity list	0.1	75.00
04/21/19	Remming, Andrew	review emails from B. Keelson and S. Szanzer re equity list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Dehney re equity holder list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	further email from R. Dehney re equity list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ E. Moats re research re equity list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with A. Remming re equity holder list.	0.2	220.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to further email from E. Moats re equity list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to email from E. Moats re equity list; edit email memo re same	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from K. Lee re CNO	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (7x) re UST comments to motion to seal	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ R. Dehney re litigation issue	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from B. Schak re litigation issue; review email from JCB Re same	0.1	75.00
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re Holdings; office conf. w/ E. Moats re same	0.2	150.00
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf w/ J. Barsalona re research re LP issues	0.1	75.00
04/25/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from C. Hines with letter from E. Moskowitz to N. Labovitz re Frio LaSalle/fraudulent transfers; review.	0.1	110.00
04/25/19	Sullivan, Sean	OC with J. Russell re DE LLC issue	0.3	148.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 28 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/25/19	Sullivan, Sean	E-mail correspondence re dividend issue	0.2	99.00	
04/25/19	Sullivan, Sean	Prepare solvency analysis	0.9	445.50	
04/25/19	Sullivan, Sean	Review draft letter re dividend issue	0.3	148.50	
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (3x) re litigation issue	0.1	75.00	
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ R. Dehney, JCB and J. Russel (10x) re litigation research issue	0.2	150.00	
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Dehney re litigation issue	0.1	75.00	
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ J. Russell and E. Moats re LP issue	0.2	150.00	
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from B. Schak re litigation issue	0.1	75.00	
04/26/19	Maddox, Marisa	call and emails with J Barsalona re Trade CNO (.1); draft Trade motion CNO (.3)	0.4	122.00	
04/26/19	Maddox, Marisa	file CNO re Trade motion (.1); upload order and coordinate copy to chambers (.1)	0.2	61.00	
04/26/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re litigation research	0.1	75.00	
04/26/19	Miller, Curtis	Discuss TRO with J. Barsalona	0.3	240.00	
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ R. Dehney re potential litigation issue	0.1	75.00	
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with A. Remming re potential litigation issue.	0.1	110.00	
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re potential litigation issue	0.1	75.00	
		Total	8.5		5,942.50
Task Code:	B220	Employee Matters			
.	N .T		**		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Conference call on employee issues with United States Trustee and Davis Polk	1.4	833.00
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Conference call with M. Huebner and D. Klein re: employee wages motion issues	0.4	238.00
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ A. Remming re: wages interim order employee plan language additions.	0.2	93.00

04/01/19 Moats, Eric Research interim language for employee 0.5 232.50 programs re: comments from UST.

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 29 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/01/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ E. Moats re wages order	0.1	75.00
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: employee motion	0.1	59.50
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research on bonus programs on interim orders	0.5	297.50
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer and D. Meyer re: Wages Motion	0.2	119.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised wages interim order (.1); Correspondence with US Trustee re: wages motion (.1); Discussion with D. Klein, S. Szanzer, E. Mosley and M. Frank re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: payments under interim wages order	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence with S. Szanzer, M. Huebner and J. Barsalona re employee severance	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile wages notice of hearing	0.2	61.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re Wage motion	0.1	30.50
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review further email from UST re comment to wages motion	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review emails from E. Mosley and J. Barsalona re: UST comments to wages motion	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Negotiate final points on Wages interim order with UST (.1); Discussion with A&M and Davis Polk re: same (.2); Call with US Trustee re: same (.3); Discussion with M. Huebner and S. Szanzer re: same (.2); Revise interim wages order (.2)	1.0	595.00
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: Final Wages Order issues	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from D. Klein re employee communications	0.1	75.00
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with D. Klein and A. Remming re: cover letter to employees	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 30 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review correspondence with S. Szanzer and U.S. Trustee regarding Non-Insider Retention Plan and Incentive Plan (.1); Review data regarding same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and M. Frank re: wages motion issues	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Schepacarter, M. Huebner, S. Szanzer and E. Mosley re: STIP (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.2); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Huebner re UST comments to wages motion; review email from E. Mosley re same	0.1	75.00
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from UST re wages motion; review email from E. Mosely re same	0.1	75.00
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with L. Scott re: employee cover letter	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from KCC re employee cover letter; review email from J. Barsalona re same	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from N. Theriot re employee cover letter	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: issues for wages call	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for call on Wages motion issues (.4); Call on wages issues (.8)	1.2	714.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	further office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re sealing creditor matrix	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review cover letter to be sent to employees with notice of commencement	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re employee address information	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	attend call w/ A&M, DPW re UST comments to wages motion	0.8	600.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Schepacarter and M. Huebner re: wages motion issues	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with M. Huebner and R. Schepacarter re: wages issues (.1); Correspondence with R. Fusco re: wages objection deadline extension (.1)	0.2	119.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 31 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review emails from UST and M. Huebner re comments to wages motion	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re wages motion and responding to UST comments	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re UST comments to wages	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with S. Szanzer re: conference call on wages	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review final deck for wages call	0.4	238.00
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review documents prepared for purposes of call with US Trustee on wages (.3); Legal research regarding same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for call with US Trustee (.2); Attend call with US Trustee (.5)	0.7	416.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with R. Dehney re: wages issues	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with U.S. Trustee re: wages conference call	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with S. Szanzer re: wages motion issues	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised materials for call related to wages motion call with US Trustee	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Remming, Andrew	participate in call re employee wages	0.4	300.00
04/15/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from S. Szanzer re wages declaration.	0.1	110.00
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re wages motion	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer re: certificate of counsel for final wages order	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Dehney re: wages motion issues	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: wages declarations issues	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re wages declaration; review email from R. Dehney re same	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 32 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review comments by US Trustee to supplemental declaration (.1); Correspondence (x3) with S. Szanzer and D. Meyer re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with M. Huebner, S. Szanzer and R. Dehney re: transmittal of supplemental declaration	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to supplemental declaration relating to wages motion (.5); Correspondence with R. Dehney and A. Remming re: same (.1)	0.6	357.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with M. Huebner and S. Szanzer re: supplemental declaration (.1); Finalize and file same (.2)	0.3	178.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised version of wages declaration	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Dehney re: wages declaration (.1); Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with M. Huebner re: wages declaration (.1); Correspondence (x2) with D. Meyer re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails from D. Meyer and S. Szanzer re edits to wages declaration.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	coordinate service of Howe supplemental declaration	0.1	30.50
04/16/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with J. Barsalona re edits to wages declaration (.2); review (.1).	0.3	330.00
04/16/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from D. Meyer with revised wages order; review.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with J. Barsalona re wages motion.	0.1	110.00
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile Howe suppl declaration	0.2	61.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	emails (3x) w/ S. Szanzer re wages declaration	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review further emails from J. Barsalona re wages declaration	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	emails (2x) w/ UST re wages declaration	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re wages order	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 33 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from D. Meyer re wages order	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: final wages order	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ S. Szanzer re equity list motion, KEIP/KERP issues	0.3	225.00
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re wage motion	0.2	61.00
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Finalize wages order with E. Moats	0.1	59.50
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence w/ E. Moats re wages order and comments from DPW re same	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to email from S. Szanzer re wages order	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Emails re: wages COC and edits to final order.	0.5	232.50
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised final wages order	0.1	59.50
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Finalize wages order re: comments from UST and circulate for final review.	0.2	93.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	Tele with E. Moats re wages order.	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ S. Szanzer and R. Dehney re equity waiver motion; tele w/ K. Lee, S. Szanzer and R. Dehney and others re same; tele w/ S. Szanzer re wages motion	0.8	600.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ S. Szanzer and R. Schepacarter re wages motion	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence re wages order w/ E. Moats	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re UST comments to wages order	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	further emails with E. Moats wages order	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re wages order	0.1	75.00
04/19/19	Moats, Eric	Email exchange w/ UST re: wages revised final order.	0.2	93.00
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from UST re final wages order; review email from J. Barsalona re same	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 34 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

04/01/19

Barsalona,

Joseph

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with U.S. Trustee and co-counsel re: final wages order	0.1	59.50	
04/19/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moats re: final wages order	0.1	59.50	
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (2x) re revised wages order	0.1	75.00	
04/19/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re final wage order	0.1	75.00	
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Finalize COC re: wages final order and coordinate w/ M. Maddox for filing of same.	0.2	93.00	
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: certification of counsel regarding wages order	0.1	59.50	
04/22/19	Maddox, Marisa	file and upload Certification of Counsel Regarding Proposed Final Order Authorizing (I) Debtors to (A) Pay Prepetition Employee Obligations and (B) Maintain Employee Benefits Programs and Pay Related Administrative Obligations (II) Current and Former Employees to Proceed With Outstanding Workers' Compensation Claims, and (III) Financial Institutions to Honor and Process Related Checks and Transfers (.2); emails with E Moats re same (.1)	0.3	91.50	
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re motion to seal; review email from S. Szanzer re schedule/sofa motion; review email from E. Moats re same	0.1	75.00	
		Total	20.6		12,925.50
Task Code	: B230	Financing Matters/Cash Collateral			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Review DIP first day motion.	0.3	139.50	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise and finalize DIP Motion (.4); Call with D. Klein and S. Szanzer re: same (.2); Review comments to DIP Order (.1)	0.7	416.50	

Discussion with S. Szanzer re: cash

management motion

119.00

0.2

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 35 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with W. Wallander re: DIP documents	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review correspondence from FINRA	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review Willkie Farr's 2019 statement	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised cash management order (.1); Comment to same (.1); Correspondence with Court re: objection deadline for cash management order (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile DIP notice	0.1	30.50
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re cash management motion	0.2	61.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	pull Willkie 2019 statement & email to SXE team	0.2	61.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re DIP motion	0.3	91.50
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile cash mgmt notice of hearing	0.2	61.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x8) with R. Olson and M. Frank re: cash management order and correspondence with Wells	0.2	119.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moats re: DIP Credit Agreement	0.1	59.50
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from D. Klein re DIP credit agreement; review email from J. Barsalona re UST comments to first day motions	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review objection to DIP by Texas Taxing Jurisdictions	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with S. Szanzer and D. Meyer re: final cash management motion (.1); Analysis of issues relating thereto (.2); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer cash management	0.1	75.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with S. Szanzer re: final cash management order	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: US Trustee comments to cash management final order	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 36 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised cash management final order (.1); Legal research regarding same (.1); Correspondence with R. Fusco and E. Moats re: hearing on same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review Objection of Caterpillar Financial Services to DIP Motion	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further correspondence with S. Szanzer re: cash management motion	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revised cash management final order (.3); Correspondence with US Trustee re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Draft COC re: cash management motion.	0.6	279.00
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with United States Trustee regarding cash management motion	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re cash management order	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise certificate of counsel for final cash management order	0.3	178.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: cash management final order	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	edit cash mgmt COC	0.4	122.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re UST response on cash management order	0.1	75.00
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise certificate of counsel regarding final cash management order	0.1	59.50
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise final cash management order (.1); Correspondence with E. Moats resame (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	upload final cash mgmt order & send does to MFW chambers	0.2	61.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile COC re cash management	0.3	91.50
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re cash management order	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with S. Szanzer re: DIP negotiations	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Maddox, Marisa	serve Final Order Authorizing (I) Debtors to Continue to Maintain Existing Cash Management	0.1	30.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 37 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

M.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

		Matter	Number:		54512-0002
<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with M. Frank re: DIP Reply	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: DIP order	0.2	119.00	
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	review draft of final DIP order	0.2	150.00	
		Total	8.3		4,350.00
Task Code	e: B240	Tax Matters			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re tax motion	0.1	30.50	
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile tax notice of hearing	0.1	30.50	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with City Clerk's Office of the City of Jackson regarding tax matters	0.1	59.50	
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with Southcrest Consulting regarding tax issues	0.1	59.50	
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review secured claim submitted by La Salle County (.1); Discussion with R. Fusco re: circulation of same (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft CNO re tax motion	0.1	30.50	
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	upload final tax order & prep docs for sending to MFW chambers	0.2	61.00	
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile CNO re tax motion	0.2	61.00	
		Total	1.1		451.50
Task Code	e: B260	Insurance Matters			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re insurance motion	0.2	61.00	
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile insurance notice of hearing	0.1	30.50	
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise final insurance order CNO	0.1	59.50	
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae	draft CNO re insurance motion	0.3	91.50	

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 38 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile CNO re insurance	0.1	30.50	
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	upload final insurance order & prep docs for sending to MFW chambers	0.1	30.50	
		Total	0.9		303.50

Task Code: B280 Utility Matters

Tusk Couc	B200	ounty matters		
<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile utility notice of hearing	0.2	61.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re final utility	0.3	91.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with Karnes Electrical re: utility motion	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with Reliant re: utility service list issues	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding Utilities List	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft CNO re utilities motion	0.2	61.00
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Draft COC for utilities motion.	0.4	186.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	edit utility COC	0.1	30.50
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	upload final utility order & send docs to MFW chambers	0.2	61.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	prep utilities COC for review	0.3	91.50
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile COC re utility	0.2	61.00
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further discussion with E. Moats re: utilities notice	0.2	119.00
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Email DPW re: notice of amended utility list.	0.3	139.50
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re utilities list	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from B. Schak re utility notice	0.1	75.00
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Draft notice of filing of amended list of utilities.	0.6	279.00
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Review utility motion and orders re: objection dates for utility providers.	0.3	139.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 39 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount	
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further discussion with E. Moats re: revised utility list notice	0.1	59.50	
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Edit notice of amended utility list.	0.9	418.50	
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: utility notice, motion, and order.	0.2	93.00	
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: comments to Utility List (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Comment to Notice of Amendment of Utilities List	0.1	59.50	
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: notice of revised Utility List	0.1	59.50	
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: comments to utilities notice	0.1	59.50	
04/22/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ D. Meyer re: utilities order and rule 2015.3 motion.	0.1	46.50	
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from B. Schak re utilities	0.1	75.00	
04/22/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re utilities list	0.1	75.00	
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Finalize notice of amended utility list and coordinate for filing and service of same.	0.3	139.50	
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: utility list	0.1	59.50	
04/23/19	Maddox, Marisa	emails with E Moats re filing (.1); prep file and serve Notice of Filing of Amended Utilities List (.2)	0.3	91.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with utility provider re: issues	0.1	59.50	
		Total	6.6		3,064.00
Task Code	B290	Vendor/Supplier Matters			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with M. Frank re: first day interim order payments	0.4	238.00	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with A. Remming and U.S. Trustee regarding payments under	0.1	59.50	

all trade motion

vendor payments

04/03/19

Barsalona,

Joseph

Correspondence (x2) with M. Frank re:

59.50

0.1

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 40 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: gas vendor question	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ S. Szanzer re: gas vendor question from D. Ross (counsel for Tellus Operating Group).	0.1	46.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ S. Szanzer re: gas vendor question from D. Ross (counsel for Tellus Operating Group).	0.1	46.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ to D. Ross (counsel for Tellus Operating Group) re: gas vendor motion and order.	0.2	93.00
04/12/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from counsel to Southrock	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise certificate of no objection regarding final shippers order	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft CNO re shippers motion	0.1	30.50
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	upload final vendor order and prep docs for sending to MFW chambers	0.2	61.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile CNO re vendor motion	0.1	30.50
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile CNO re post-petition goods motion	0.2	61.00
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ J. Barsalona re vendor	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	emails w/ J. Barsalona and D. Klein re vendor inquiry	0.1	75.00
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from vendor	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with potential supplier to the Debtors	0.1	59.50
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with D. Klein re: withdrawal of all trade objection (.1); Correspondence (x4) with M. Maddox and E. Moats re: certificate of counsel and revised order regarding same (.1); Revise final order (.2); Revise certificate of no objection regarding same (.1)	0.5	297.50
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review correspondence from E. Moats re: vendor issue (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1); Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer and B. Schak re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 41 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

		Matter .	Number:		54512-0002
<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with chambers re: all trade motion and correspondence with R. Fusco re: same	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with P. Romero re: service of final order regarding prepetition trade claims	0.1	59.50	
		Total	3.3		1,799.50
Task Code	e: B300	Court Hearings			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Review recent Delaware first days hearings.	0.1	46.50	
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Review interim order drafts of first day motions.	0.4	186.00	
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Edit and update first day agenda and notice of hearing.	0.4	186.00	
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call re: first day hearing.	0.6	279.00	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Coordinate conference call on first day hearing comments	0.1	59.50	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with J. Paul re: hearing preparations (.1); Correspondence with E. Levine re: CourtCall appearance (.1); Attention to service of notice of first day hearing and agenda (.1)	0.3	178.50	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for first day hearing (.7); Correspondence with E. Moats re: hearing preparations for same (.2)	0.9	535.50	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Assist M. Frank and E. Mosley with preparing for first day hearing	0.1	59.50	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for hearing	0.2	119.00	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with M. Huebner, D. Klein, S. Szanzer and R. Dehney re: first day hearing time (.1); Correspondence with US Trustee re: same (.1); Revise notice of first day hearing (.2); Finalize and file same (.1)	0.5	297.50	
04/01/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Conference with A. Remming, J. Barsalona and A&M re call with Trustee	0.2	220.00	

re first day motions.

first day hearing status.

04/01/19

Dehney,

Robert J.

Office conference with J. Barsalona re

110.00

0.1

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 42 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to agenda for first day hearing (.1); Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: same (.1); Finalize same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further correspondence with US Trustee regarding comments to first day motions	0.1	59.50
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Dehney re: first day hearing status	0.1	59.50
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding first day hearing (.2); First day hearing strategy call with M. Huebner, D. Klein, S. Szanzer and R. Dehney (.4); Correspondence (x3) with B. Schak and E. Levine re: CourtCall appearance (.1); Correspondence (x5) with R. Schepacarter re: first day hearing (.1)	0.8	476.00
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with clerk re: scheduling of first day hearing (.1); Correspondence with R. Dehney re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Attend and assist counsel during first day hearing	2.5	1,487.50
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for first day hearing (2.1); Email correspondence (x25) with R. Fusco and E. Moats re: same (.3); Call with S. Szanzer re: hearing preparations (.2); Meeting with A. Remming and E. Moats re: hearing prep (.5); Discussion with M. Frank and E. Mosley re: hearing preparations (.3); Correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: first day hearing (.2)	3.6	2,142.00
04/02/19	Moats, Eric	Attend (in part) first day hearing.	1.8	837.00
04/02/19	Moats, Eric	Prep for first day hearing.	4.2	1,953.00
04/02/19	Moats, Eric	Review and edit notices of hearing for first day motions.	1.3	604.50
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf w/ J. Barsalona and E. Moats re prep for first day hearing	0.5	375.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	meeting w/ DPW re prep for first day hearing	0.3	225.00
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re transcript	0.1	75.00
04/02/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with D. Klein (.1), S. Szanzer (.1), M. Huebner (.1) and court (.1) re scheduling second day hearing.	0.4	440.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 43 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/02/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Prepare for first day hearing; attend first day hearing.	2.5	2,750.00
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	first day hrg prep	2.8	854.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x10) with M. Huebner, D. Klein, S. Szanzer and R. Dehney re: scheduling second day hearing	0.2	119.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with L. Scott re: affidavit of service of agenda and notice of first day hearing	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with B. Schak re: hearing transcripts	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: final orders for second day hearing	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with B. Schak re: second day motions	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with D. Klein re: omnibus hearing dates	0.1	59.50
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with A. Remming re: second day motion issues	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with S. Szanzer re: second day motions for filing (.3); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: filing plan for second day motions	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with T. Green re: second day pleadings	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review, revise, and manage filing process of second day papers (1.5); Correspondence (x84) with S. Szanzer, T. Green, KCC team and E. Moats re: same (.5)	2.0	1,190.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding motions for service (.1); Discussion with R. Fusco re: second day motions (.2)	0.3	178.50
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Prep second day orders for review and redline.	0.4	186.00
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Review notices for various second day motions to be filed.	0.4	186.00
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona and A. Remming (in part) re: CNO's and COC's for final orders of first day motions.	0.5	232.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 44 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: CoC's and CNO's for second day papers (.2); Discussion with R. Fusco re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: comments to final orders for second day hearing	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Comment to correspondence regarding final orders for second day papers	0.1	59.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and revise final orders for second day hearing (.2); Correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Review and edit proposed final orders of first day motions.	1.1	511.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer re: revised final orders (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ R. Fusco re: drafting and filing of COC's and CNO's.	0.3	139.50
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Edit CNO's re: comments from DPW.	0.3	139.50
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Review CNO's and COC's for final orders of first day motions.	0.9	418.50
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Email DPW re: review of changes to final orders and any comments re: same.	0.3	139.50
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: CoC's and CNO's for second day papers (.2); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ D. Meyer re: final orders.	0.1	46.50
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft CNO re post-petition goods motion	0.2	61.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re CNOs	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re final orders for first day motions; review email from B. Schak re same	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	confer w J Barsalona re CNO's	0.2	61.00
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	confer w E Moats re CNO's & COC's	0.3	91.50
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Finalize COCs and CNOs and coordinate w/ R. Fusco for the filing and service of same.	0.5	232.50
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: filing of CNO's and COCs.	0.1	46.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 45 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Email MNAT and DPW re: entry of COC and CNO final orders.	0.1	46.50
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with M. Maddox re: second day motions	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with M. Maddox re: service of final orders	0.1	59.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: second day hearing issues	0.4	238.00
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review US Trustee's comments to second day motions (.2); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.1); Discussion with A. Remming and E. Moats re: same (.2)	0.5	297.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: second day motion issues	0.2	119.00
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Prepare for second day motion call with A. Remming (.5); Call with S. Szanzer and T. Green re: comments to second day motions (1.0)	1.5	892.50
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Dehney and A. Remming re: second day hearing issues	0.1	59.50
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Coordinate conference call with US Trustee on second day issues	0.1	59.50
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: second day order comment issues	0.3	178.50
04/25/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review emails from J. Barsalona and R. Schepacarter re second day hearing issues.	0.1	110.00
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with T. Green re: comments to second day papers (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with T. Green re: comments to second day papers	0.1	59.50
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with US Trustee re: second day motion comments	0.1	59.50
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: call on second day comments	0.1	59.50
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: comments to second day papers	0.1	59.50
04/27/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: conference call on second day comments	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 46 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

<u>Date</u> 04/29/19	<u>Name</u> Barsalona,	<u>Description</u> Prepare for call with US Trustee re:	<u>Hours</u> 2.3	Amount 1,368.50	
V 11 257 15	Joseph	second day comments (.5); Correspondence with S. Szanzer (1.3); Call with S. Szanzer re: same (.5)	2.5	1,500.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Fusco re: agenda for May 7 hearing	0.2	119.00	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Schepacarter re: conference call on second day comments	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with M. Huebner, D. Klein. S. Szanzer and B. Schak re: debrief of call with US Trustee on second day comments	1.3	773.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with T. Green re: call with US Trustee on second day comments	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: revised second day orders	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft 5/7 agenda	2.4	732.00	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with US Trustee re: upcoming hearing dates	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Review and edit second day agenda.	0.5	232.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Provisions of second day orders to Davis Polk team for review and comment	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ R. Fusco re: agenda, CNOs, and COCs for second day hearing.	0.2	93.00	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with US Trustee and S. Szanzer re: omnibus hearing dates	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	drafting 5/7 agenda	2.1	640.50	
		Total	50.2		27,501.00
Task Code	B310	Claims Objections and Administration			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/02/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re trade claims motion	0.2	61.00	

Fusco, Renae efile trade claims notice

04/02/19

M.

30.50

0.1

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 47 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

		Matter	Nullioci.		J - J12-0002
<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	save POC's received from Linebarger	0.2	61.00	
04/25/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Phone call with E. Moskowitz re FLP/Holdings potential claims; emails re same.	0.4	440.00	
04/26/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona and M. Maddox re: trade claims final order.	0.2	93.00	
		Total	1.1		685.50
Task Code	B330	Litigation/Adversary Proceedings			
Date	Name	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with J. Russell re: LP litigation issues	0.1	59.50	
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research on injunctive relief (.3); Correspondence with K. Cheng re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00	
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Revise memo on potential litigation issues	0.7	416.50	
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: litigation issues	0.2	119.00	
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: litigation issues (.2); Discussion with R. Dehney re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50	
04/25/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with J. Barsalona re litigation issues.	0.1	110.00	
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: litigation issues	0.1	59.50	
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with C. Miller re: verified vs unverified complaints (.2); Legal research re: same (1.1)	1.3	773.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with K. Cheng, R. Dehney and A. Remming re: litigation matters	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review email from K. Cheng re litigation issues	0.1	110.00	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with chambers re: emergency relief (.1); Discussion with R. Dehney and A. Remming re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review litigation agreement (.2); Correspondence (x2) with R. Dehney	0.3	178.50	

and D. Culver re: same (.1)

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 48 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Dehney and E. Moskowitz re: emergency relief	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Dehney re: need for emergency relief (.1); Call with chambers re: same (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50	
04/30/19	Culver, Donna L.	Email w/Dehney re TRO	0.1	85.00	
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with J. Barsalona re call to chambers re emergency relief.	0.1	110.00	
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with J. Barsalona and D. Culver re litigation issues	0.2	220.00	
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with J. Barsalona (.1) and E. Moskowitz (.2) re emergency relief.	0.3	330.00	
04/30/19	Werkheiser, Gregory W.	Emails with R Dehney, D Abbott and others re standstill agreement issues.	0.3	247.50	
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with J. Barsalona re emergency relief.	0.1	110.00	
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Phone call with E. Moskowitz re litigation strategy.	0.8	880.00	
		Total	6.2		4,642.00

Task Code: B340 Professional Retention (MNAT - Filing)

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/01/19	Moats, Eric	Draft MNAT retention app.	1.2	558.00
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with C. O'Neill re: retention issue	0.1	59.50
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Dehney re: retention issues (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: retention issues	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: retention application and conflicts.	0.2	93.00
04/05/19	Moats, Eric	Review MNAT conflicts list.	0.5	232.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Dehney re: retention issues	0.2	119.00
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: retention issues	0.3	178.50
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: retention issues	0.2	119.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 49 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: retention application issues	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Review of MNAT retention matters.	0.9	418.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Further review of MNAT retention matters.	0.3	139.50
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with A. Remming and E. Moats re: retention issues	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re 2014 disclosures	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: retention issues	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona (in part) and A. Remming (in part) re: retention application.	0.2	93.00
04/11/19	Moats, Eric	Edit MNAT retention app.	1.8	837.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re MNAT retention app	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Harvey, Matthew B.	Confer with E. Moats re: MNAT retention app.	0.1	69.50
04/11/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email re MNAT retention application.	0.1	110.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x6) with E. Moats, K. Head, and B. Sedita re: retention issues	0.2	119.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: retention application issues (.1); Review and comment to retention application (1.3)	1.4	833.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: retention issues	0.2	119.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review US Trustee Large Case Fee Guideline materials and information provided by V. Ramona	0.2	119.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review further email from E. Moats re MNAT retention app	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: retention application and related issues	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moats and J. Ung re: retention issues	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re MNAT retention app	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Dehney re MNAT retention app	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 50 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	Name	Description	Hours	Amount
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: comments to retention application	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ R. Niemerg re: retention matters	0.1	46.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with L. Hering re: retention issue	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Email DPW re: MNAT retention application.	0.1	46.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised retention application	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: MNAT retention app.	0.2	93.00
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Email exchange w/ R. Niemerg re: retention matters.	0.1	46.50
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Further edits of MNAT retention app.	0.9	418.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: issues relating to retention application	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x10) with A. Remming and E. Moats re: retention issues	0.2	119.00
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with E. Moats, J. Ung and K. Head re: retention issues	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding retention issues	0.4	238.00
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x11) with D. Cline re: retention issues	0.2	119.00
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Factual investigation regarding retention matters	0.4	186.00
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Review w/ A. Remming MNAT retention app.	1.1	511.50
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: exhibits to retention application	0.1	59.50
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Further updates of MNAT retention app re: A. Remming comments.	0.6	279.00
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Update MNAT retention app.	1.5	697.50
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ E. Moats re MNAT retention app	1.1	825.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x15) with D. Cline re: retention issues (.2); Correspondence with A. Johnston re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Attn re: retention app issues.	0.3	139.50
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Finalize MNAT retention app.	1.0	465.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 51 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ A. Remming re: MNAT retention app.	0.3	139.50	
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: outstanding retention issues	0.1	59.50	
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: retention application issues	0.1	59.50	
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: changes to OCP motion	0.1	59.50	
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Emails re: MNAT retention app.	0.6	279.00	
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from E. Moats re filing and service of applications (.1); Prepare & efile Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP Retention Application (.4)	0.5	82.50	
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review draft of MNAT retention application	0.1	75.00	
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re MNAT retention app	0.2	61.00	
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review and edit MNAT retention app	1.1	825.00	
04/16/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re MNAT retention app	0.1	75.00	
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Email exchange w/ Conflicts re: MNAT retention app.	0.2	93.00	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with A. Remming re: retention issue	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Moats, Eric	Inquiry into MNAT retention matters.	0.2	93.00	
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Inquiry into MNAT retention matters.	0.3	139.50	
		Total	22.5		11,934.50

Task Code: B350 Professional Retention (MNAT - Objections)

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Draft email memo re: research of retainers in recent Delaware cases.	2.1	976.50
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Review comments from UST re: retention applications and motion.	0.1	46.50
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Research re: retainer standards in Delaware and recent rulings in cases.	1.3	604.50
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona and A. Remming (in part) re: UST comments to MNAT retention application.	0.4	186.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 52 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

04/04/19

04/04/19

Moats, Eric

Moats, Eric

motions.

motion.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Review clients that derive significant financial revenues for MNAT and compare to potential parties in interest list.	0.2	93.00	
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona and A. Remming (in part) re: UST comments to retention apps.	0.8	372.00	
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Review retention apps filed re: comments from the UST.	0.3	139.50	
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moats and A. Remming re: response to objections	0.1	59.50	
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Research previously filed MNAT retention apps and approval of same.	1.1	511.50	
04/29/19	Moats, Eric	Edit fee apps re: UST comments.	1.7	790.50	
04/29/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: edits to retention applications and UST recommended changes.	0.2	93.00	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: revised MNAT retention order	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Emails re: UST comments and revisions to retention applications.	0.6	279.00	
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Further edits re: retention applications.	0.8	372.00	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and revise MNAT retention order	0.2	119.00	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re MNAT retention app	0.1	30.50	
		Total	10.1		4,732.50
Task Code	B360	Professional Retention (Others - Filing)			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/03/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with J. Barsalona re retention issues.	0.1	110.00	
04/04/19	Moats, Eric	Research re: OCP requirements.	1.4	651.00	
04/04/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: interim comp and OCP motions.	0.5	232.50	

Email DPW re: interim comp and OCP

Draft ordinary course professional

93.00

1,116.00

0.2

2.4

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 53 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with S. Szanzer re: OCP Motion (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ E. Moats re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: OCP motion comments (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: OCP caps	0.1	59.50
04/04/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence w/ S. Szanzer re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/04/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/04/19	Remming, Andrew	further emails w/ J. Barsalona and E. Moats re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/04/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re OCP and interim comp motions	0.2	150.00
04/04/19	Remming, Andrew	review revised version of OCP motion; emails to E. Moats re same	0.2	150.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further correspondence with A. Remming re: OCP motion (.1); Legal research re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence (3x) re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with M. Schirle re: OCP Motion (.1); Revise OCP Motion (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: OCP motion precedent	0.2	119.00
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with A&M and Davis Polk re: OCP Motion	0.1	59.50
04/04/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with S. Szanzer re: ordinary course professional motion	0.1	59.50
04/05/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and analysis of OCP data (.1); Legal research re: same (.3)	0.4	238.00
04/05/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Mattie re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/05/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Office conference with J. Barsalona re retention issues.	0.2	220.00
04/08/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ A. Remming and J. Barsalona (in part) re: conflicts issues and retention apps.	0.2	93.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 54 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with M. Frank and S. Szanzer re: OCP Motion	0.1	59.50
04/08/19	Moats, Eric	Edit OCP motion re comments from S. Szanzer.	0.4	186.00
04/08/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ E. Moats re retention apps	0.1	75.00
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised OCP list from M. Schirle	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Update notice parties on interim comp and OCP motions.	0.5	232.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Update OCP list re: comments from A&M.	0.2	93.00
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: OCP Motion comments	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Moats, Eric	Edit OCP motion re: comments from S. Szanzer.	1.8	837.00
04/09/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: Evercore and A&M retention application issues	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Moats, Eric	Edit MNAT retention app.	0.1	46.50
04/10/19	Moats, Eric	Edit OCP and Interim Comp motions and send to DPW for review.	1.1	511.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moats re: revised OCP Motion	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review further comments to OCP Motion	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re OCP list	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from K. Jameson re OCPs	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with K. Jameson and S. Szanzer re: additional OCP	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: OCP issues	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Schirle re OCP; review email from E. Moats re same	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised OCP Motion and exhibit (.1); Correspondence (x4) with M. Schirle and E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with M. Schirle re: OCP list	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 55 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from M. Schirle re OCPs; review email from J. Barsalona re IMOR	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re OCP list	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Moats, Eric	Emails w/ accounting re: prepetition payments in case.	0.2	93.00
04/11/19	Moats, Eric	Edit OCP motion	0.2	93.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: Foley Gardere as OCP	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review and respond to email from S. Szanzer re retention apps	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with A. Remming and S. Szanzer re: retention application precedent	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re OCP motion	0.1	75.00
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with T. Green and S. Jensen re: A&M retention application	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Moats, Eric	Emails exchange w/ A. Remming re: retention issues	0.2	93.00
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with T. Green re: retention application comments	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with T. Green re: A&M retention application	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research regarding Alvarez & Marsal retention application issues (.6); Correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Scott re: same (.1)	0.7	416.50
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Edit OCP and Interim Comp motions re: Willkie comments.	0.6	279.00
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ D. Meyer re: notice parties in OCP and interim comp.	0.1	46.50
04/15/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ S. Szanzer re: OCP and Interim Comp motion edits.	0.1	46.50
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with T. Green and S. Szanzer re: retention issues	0.2	119.00
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re OCP/Interim Comp motions	0.1	75.00
04/15/19	Remming, Andrew	Tele with J Barsalona re comments to OCP and de minimizes assets, assumption motion sale.	0.2	150.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 56 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding retention information for T. Green	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Review DPW retention app.	0.1	46.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to PwC retention application (.2); Legal research re: same (.3); Discussion with E. Moats re: retention applications (.1)	0.6	357.00
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Final review of applications and second day motions, and coordinate for filing and service of same.	3.0	1,395.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review comments to OCP motion	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Edit OCP motion re: Willkie and YCST comments.	0.3	139.50
04/16/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: OCP and de minimis sale amount edits.	0.1	46.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with D. Meyer and A. Clark re: revised version of PwC retention application	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Motion for an Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals	0.4	66.00
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Motion for an Order Approving Procedures for the Retention and Compensation of Ordinary Course Professionals	0.3	49.50
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Alvarez & Marsal North America, LLC Retention Application	0.4	66.00
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Evercore Group L.L.C. Retention Application	0.4	66.00
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP Retention Application	0.4	66.00
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re PWC retention app	0.2	61.00
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re OCP motion	0.1	30.50
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft notice re Davis Polk retention app	0.2	61.00
04/16/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Prepare & efile PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP Retention Application	0.4	66.00
04/18/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from P. Topper re OCP motion	0.1	75.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 57 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming and E. Moats re: retention issues	0.3	178.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: retention issues (.1); Discussion with E. Moats re: legal research regarding same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re retention apps	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from EWM re retainer research	0.1	75.00
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ DPW re: UST comments to retention applications.	0.8	372.00
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Edit memo re: evergreen retainer research.	1.2	558.00
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to legal research on retention issues	0.3	178.50
04/25/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research on OCP relief	0.5	297.50
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re research re evergreen retainer; review and respond to email from JCB re same	0.1	75.00
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from J. Barsalona re Evercore retention.	0.1	110.00
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from M. Grillo re Evercore.	0.1	110.00
04/29/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from J. Barsalona re A&M disclosures.	0.1	110.00
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	teles w/ JCS, UST and M. Grillo re UST comments to retention apps	0.5	375.00
		Total	28.6	

Task Code: B370 Professional Retention (Others - Objections)

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
04/02/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised KCC claims agent retention order	0.1	59.50
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Calls with R. Schepacarter re: Davis Polk retention (.4); Call with S. Szanzer re: same (.3)	0.7	416.50
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Schepacarter re: A&M disclosures	0.1	59.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 58 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with M. Grillo re: Evercore retention issues	0.4	238.00
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: revisions to OCP order	0.2	119.00
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Coordinate conference call with E. Grillo and US Trustee re: Evercore retention issues	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with E. Moseley and M. Frank re: supplemental declaration for A&M retention	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with US Trustee and E. Grillo re: comments to Evercore retention application	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moseley re: A&M supplemental declaration	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: disclosure questions from US Trustee with respect to certain retention applications (.1); Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: OCP comments	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: Davis Polk retention issues (.2); Conference call with S. Szanzer re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with S. Szanzer re: OCP factual investigation (.1); Correspondence with A&M re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with US Trustee and S. Szanzer re: comments to Davis Polk retention	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with T. Green and E. Moats re: revised OCP order	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Review as filed retention orders and email DPW re: same.	0.4	186.00
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x4) with M. Frank and S. Szanzer re: supplemental declaration	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: Davis Polk retention issues	0.1	59.50
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Draft correspondence with US Trustee regarding resolution of DPW issues	0.2	119.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 59 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with counsel to Evercore and US Trustee regarding comments to Evercore retention order	0.5	297.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with E. Moats re: OCP order revisions	0.1	59.50	
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Draft supplemental declaration for A&M retention application.	0.9	418.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Draft correspondence to provide to US Trustee regarding Davis Polk retention issues (.4); Correspondence with S. Szanzer re: same (.1)	0.5	297.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding OCP order (.1); Correspondence (x2) with T. Green re: comments to OCP order (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re Alvarez retention app	0.1	30.50	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re Evercore retention app	0.1	30.50	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re OCP motion	0.1	30.50	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re PWC retention app	0.1	30.50	
04/30/19	Fusco, Renae M.	draft COC re Davis Polk retention app	0.2	61.00	
04/30/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from US Trustee re Evercore retention order.	0.1	110.00	
		Total	6.6		3,634.50

Task Code: B400 General Corporate Matters (including Corporate Governance)

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review most recent 10-k	0.1	59.50
04/25/19	Russell, Jason	Review issue concerning unlawful distributions for potential claims (.2); pull research and memos concerning the same (1.0); email correspondence with analysis for A. Remming (.3)	1.5	1,162.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 60 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
04/25/19	Russell, Jason	Correspondence with R. Dehney concerning considerations by board in making distribution (.2); research concerning the same (.3)	0.5	387.50	
		Total	2.1		1,609.50
Task Code	: B410	General Case Strategy			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/01/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Prepare for and attend conference call with J. Barsalona and Davis Polk re strategy.	0.4	440.00	
04/01/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Prepare for and attend conference call with J. Barsalona, M. Huebner, D. Klein and S. Szanzer re strategy/first day hearing.	0.4	440.00	
04/01/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Emails with J. Barsalona re strategy/first day hearing.	0.5	550.00	
04/01/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Dehney and A. Remming re: first day hearing strategy (.2); Correspondence with Davis Polk team re: same (.1)	0.3	178.50	
04/02/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Review docket update from R. Fusco.	0.1	110.00	
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence with E. Mosley, D. Klein and R. Dehney re UST comments to first day motions	0.1	75.00	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and E. Moats re: case calendar	0.1	59.50	
04/03/19	Moats, Eric	Draft critical dates memo.	3.0	1,395.00	
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from D. Klein re UST questions	0.1	75.00	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: case calendar issues	0.2	119.00	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: critical dates	0.1	59.50	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding critical dates	0.1	59.50	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and revise critical dates memo	0.7	416.50	
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with A. Remming and E. Moats re: critical dates	0.1	59.50	
04/08/19	Moats, Eric	Update critical dates memo.	0.3	139.50	

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 61 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/08/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.2	61.00
04/08/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: case calendar memo and distribution	0.1	59.50
04/09/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.1	30.50
04/10/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.1	30.50
04/10/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Prepare for and attend conference call re strategy.	0.6	660.00
04/11/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.1	30.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Calendar critical dates	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Prepare for and attend conference call re strategy.	0.5	550.00
04/12/19	Dehney, Robert J.	Email from R. Fusco with revised critical dates memo; review.	0.1	110.00
04/12/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.1	30.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review case calendar and make preparations for same (.1); Revise critical dates calendar (.2); Correspondence with R. Fusco re: distribution of same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/15/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.2	61.00
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with E. Moats recritical dates memo	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update email	0.2	61.00
04/17/19	Moats, Eric	Update critical dates memo.	0.9	418.50
04/17/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt update	0.2	61.00
04/18/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily dkt email	0.2	61.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re UST comments to second day motions	0.3	225.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re UST comments to second day motions	0.1	75.00
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ A. Remming and J. Russell re: research for dividends of LP questions.	0.3	139.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 62 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

04/03/19

04/03/19

04/08/19

Remming,

Barsalona,

Remming,

Andrew

Joseph

Andrew

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Date	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount	
04/25/19	Moats, Eric	Attn re: critical dates issue	0.2	93.00	
04/25/19	Remming, Andrew	prepare for (meeting w/ E. Moats and J. Barsalona) and attend call re UST comments to second day motions and call w/ DPW re same	1.5	1,125.00	
04/26/19	Moats, Eric	Update critical dates memo.	0.6	279.00	
04/26/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding critical dates memo	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Attention to critical dates	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Remming, Andrew	teles w/ UST and J. Barsalona re second day motions (.4); tele w/s J. Barsalona and S. Szanzer re same (.3)	0.7	525.00	
04/29/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re UST comments to retention apps and second day motions	0.1	75.00	
04/29/19	Fusco, Renae M.	send daily docket email	0.1	30.50	
04/30/19	Remming, Andrew	Office conf with J Barsalona re comments from UST re second day motions.	0.1	75.00	
		Total	14.9		9,519.50
Task Code	: B420	Schedules/SOFA/U.S. Trustee Reports			
Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/02/19	Remming, Andrew	numerous emails w/ UST, J. Barsalona and B. Schak re UST comments to motions	0.1	75.00	
04/03/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with S. Szanzer and A. Remming re: motion to extend deadline to file schedules and statements	0.1	59.50	
04/03/19	Remming, Andrew	correspondence with J. Barsalona and UST and top 20 list; review and respond to email from S. Szanzer re schedules and SOFAs	0.1	75.00	

review email from S. Szanzer re UST

compliance questions; review email from J. Barsalona re e-notifications

Call with D. Klein re: schedules and

Email from R. Olson re IDI materials

statements hearing

75.00

59.50

75.00

0.1

0.1

0.1

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 63 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
04/09/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re matrix	0.1	75.00
04/10/19	Moats, Eric	Review draft of motion to extend time to file SOFAs/SOALs.	0.2	93.00
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with E. Moats re: schedules and statements issues	0.1	59.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Comment to Schedules and Statements Extension Motion (.2); Legal research re: same (.2); Correspondence with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.5	297.50
04/10/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence with R. Niemerg re: Schedules and SOFAs	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from R. Olson re form 26 report	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re IMOR comments	0.1	75.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Further call with B. Schak re: initial operating report (.1); Correspondence with A. Remming and B. Schak re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with B. Schak and R. Olson re: initial operating report comments	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research regarding IOR data (.3); Correspondence with R. Olson re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research re: 2015.3 reports (.4); Correspondence with R. Olson re: same (.1)	0.5	297.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to draft of initial operating report	0.1	59.50
04/11/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with B. Schak re: initial operating report	0.1	59.50
04/12/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Olson and B. Schak re: revised IOR (.1); Review same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/15/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with R. Niemerg re: Schedules and SOFAs call	0.1	59.50
04/16/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to final initial operating report (.1); Correspondence with M. Howe re: same (.1)	0.2	119.00
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	coordinate service of initial operating report	0.1	30.50

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 64 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/16/19	Fusco, Renae M.	efile initial operating report	0.2	61.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from S. Szanzer re status of final orders	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from J. Barsalona re draft final orders	0.1	75.00
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with R. Olson re: monthly operating reports and 2015.3 reports	0.2	119.00
04/17/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with A. Remming re: 2015.3 issue	0.1	59.50
04/18/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ DPW and A&M re: SOFAs/SOALs.	0.7	325.50
04/18/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Conference call with S. Szanzer, T. Behnke and R. Niemerg re: schedules and statements preparation	0.5	297.50
04/22/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with D. Meyer and R. Olson re: Rule 2015.3 Reports	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Review and edit notices for motion to extend time to file SOFAs/SOALs extension and motion to seal.	0.3	139.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Emails re: comments from UST to recently filed motions.	0.2	93.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review 2015.3 research (.1); Discussion with A. Remming re: same (.2); Discussion with E. Moats re: same (.1)	0.4	238.00
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Review motion to extend time to file SOFAs/SOALs.	0.8	372.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Comment to schedules and statements extension motion	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Emails re: motion to extend time to file SOFAs/SOALs.	0.4	186.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with S. Szanzer re: schedules and statements motion	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Coordinate for filing and service of motion to extend time to file SOFAs/SOALs.	0.3	139.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: motion to seal and motion to extend time to file SOFAs/SOALs.	0.2	93.00
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona re: rule 2015.3 research.	0.2	93.00
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Legal research on Bankruptcy Rule 2015.3	0.2	119.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 65 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
04/23/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review revised schedules and statements motion	0.1	59.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Research recent Delaware cases re: relief given for motion to extend time to file SOFAs/SOALs.	0.9	418.50
04/23/19	Moats, Eric	Research report requirements under rule 2015.3.	0.8	372.00
04/23/19	Maddox, Marisa	draft notice of Motion of Debtors for Extension of Time to File (I) Schedules of Assets and Liabilities, (II) Schedules of Current Income and Expenditures, (III) Schedules or Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases, and (IV) Statements of Financial Affairs	0.1	30.50
04/23/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona re 2015.3 reports	0.2	150.00
04/23/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from E. Moats re filing and service of motion (.1); Prepare & efile Motion of Debtors for Extension of Time to File Schedules (.2)	0.3	49.50
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Confer w/ J. Barsalona and A. Remming re: Rule 2015.3 research.	0.3	139.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Call with S. Szanzer re: 2015.3 reports	0.4	238.00
04/24/19	Moats, Eric	Further research of Rule 2015.3 requirements.	2.6	1,209.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona and E. Moats re UST comments to second day motions	0.2	150.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from JCB re research re UST report	0.1	75.00
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review 2015.3 research (.1); Comment to same (.2); Discussion with A. Remming and E. Moats re: same (.2)	0.5	297.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Discussion with R. Olson re: 2015.3 reports	0.1	59.50
04/24/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Factual investigation regarding 2015.3 reports	0.1	59.50
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	tele w/ S. Szanzer and J. Barsalona re 2015.3 reports	0.4	300.00
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona (E. Moats in part) re 2015.3	0.3	225.00

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-2 Filed 05/31/19 Page 66 of 66

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	<u>Name</u>	Description	Hours	Amount	
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	office conf. w/ J. Barsalona and E. Moats re 2015.3 reports	0.3	225.00	
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from E. Moats re UST reports	0.1	75.00	
04/24/19	Remming, Andrew	review email from EWM re UST report	0.1	75.00	
04/28/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x2) with R. Olson and B. Schak re: 2015.3 reports	0.1	59.50	
04/29/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and comment to 2015.3 reports	0.4	238.00	
04/30/19	Moats, Eric	Phone call w/ R. Niemerg re: SOFAs/SOALs.	0.1	46.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Review and revise filing version of 2015.3 report (.1); Coordinate filing of same (.2)	0.3	178.50	
04/30/19	Barsalona, Joseph	Correspondence (x3) with S. Szanzer and R. Olson re: 2015.3 reports (.1); Review same (.1)	0.2	119.00	
04/30/19	Naimoli, Theresa M.	Review and respond to email from J. Barsalona re filing and service of report (.1); Prepare & efile Periodic Report Regarding (.1)	0.2	33.00	
		Total	18.2		9,861.00

<u>Exhibit B</u> EXPENSE SUMMARY

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P., et al. (Case No. 19-10702 (MFW)) April 1, 2019 Through April 30, 2019

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	Total Expenses
Photos/Art/Spec. Duplicating	Out of Office	\$2,545.64
Transcripts		1,027.85
Courier/Delivery Service		457.29
In House Duplicating	Black and White	1,151.80
In House Printing	Black and White	1,361.70
Paralegal Overtime*		332.28
In House Printing	Color	945.60
Computer Research	Westlaw	2,118.90
Messenger Service		15.00
Secretarial Overtime^		65.99
Meals		164.38
Total Expenses		\$10,186.43

^{*}Time spent working outside of normal business hours for Renae Fusco.

[^]For time spent working outside of normal business hours for Mary Hall.

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-3 Filed 05/31/19 Page 2 of 3

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

Cost Detail

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
04/01/19	In-House Printing - black & white	3,568.0	356.80
04/01/19	In-House Duplicating	10,450.0	1,045.00
04/01/19	Messenger Service - Trustee - 4/1/2019	2.0	10.00
04/01/19	Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - 1 1/2" binder, printing spines and covers, punch paper, 2" binder, copy medium litigation, tabs - 04/01/2019	1.0	1,156.24
04/01/19	Meals - Reimbursement of expenses for working breakfast $\ensuremath{\mathrm{W}}/DPW$ - $04/01/2019$	1.0	14.50
04/02/19	In-House Printing - black & white	8,403.0	840.30
04/02/19	In-House Printing - color	912.0	729.60
04/02/19	Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - 3" binder, slipsheet, print B/W, rush hand delivery - 04/02/2019	1.0	1,389.40
04/02/19	Transcripts - Hourly transcript - 04/02/2019	1.0	471.25
04/02/19	Meals - Breakfast for 10 people - DPW, A&M and client - 04/02/2019	1.0	149.88
04/02/19	Courier/Delivery Service - BLUE MARBLE	2.0	457.29
04/02/19	Paralegal Overtime - R. Fusco	2.0	174.06
04/03/19	Paralegal Overtime - R. Fusco	2.0	79.11
04/03/19	Messenger Service - USBC - 4/3/2019	1.0	5.00
04/04/19	In-House Printing - black & white	33.0	3.30
04/05/19	Paralegal Overtime - R. Fusco	1.0	15.82
04/08/19	In-House Printing - color	42.0	33.60
04/09/19	Transcripts - Transcript - 19-10760-KG - 04/09/2019	1.0	556.60
04/10/19	In-House Printing - black & white	62.0	6.20
04/10/19	In-House Printing - color	6.0	4.80
04/11/19	In-House Printing - black & white	39.0	3.90
04/12/19	In-House Printing - color	39.0	31.20
04/15/19	In-House Printing - black & white	388.0	38.80
04/16/19	In-House Printing - black & white	468.0	46.80
04/16/19	In-House Printing - color	8.0	6.40

Case 19-10702-MFW Doc 242-3 Filed 05/31/19 Page 3 of 3

Southcross Energy Partners, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: May 14, 2019 1904684 54512-0002

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
04/16/19	Computer Research - Westlaw	1.0	80.75
04/17/19	In-House Printing - color	64.0	51.20
04/17/19	In-House Duplicating	1,068.0	106.80
04/18/19	In-House Printing - black & white	74.0	7.40
04/18/19	Computer Research - Westlaw	1.0	1,530.85
04/19/19	Secretarial Overtime - M. Hall	1.0	65.99
04/22/19	Computer Research - Westlaw	1.0	162.45
04/22/19	In-House Printing - black & white	201.0	20.10
04/22/19	In-House Printing - color	60.0	48.00
04/23/19	In-House Printing - color	9.0	7.20
04/23/19	In-House Printing - black & white	174.0	17.40
04/23/19	Computer Research - Westlaw	2.0	195.70
04/24/19	In-House Printing - color	10.0	8.00
04/24/19	Computer Research - Westlaw	1.0	121.98
04/25/19	In-House Printing - black & white	112.0	11.20
04/25/19	Computer Research - Westlaw	1.0	27.17
04/29/19	In-House Printing - black & white	43.0	4.30
04/29/19	In-House Printing - color	32.0	25.60
04/29/19	Paralegal Overtime - R. Fusco	1.0	63.29
04/30/19	In-House Printing - black & white	52.0	5.20

Total \$10,186.43