Case	2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filc 104 Main Document	Page 1 of 35
1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8	GREGORY A. BRAY (Bar No. 115367) gbray@milbank.com MARK SHINDERMAN (Bar No. 136644) mshinderman@milbank.com JAMES C. BEHRENS (Bar No. 280365) jbehrens@milbank.com MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLO 2029 Century Park East, 33rd Floor Los Angeles, CA 90067 Telephone: (424) 386-4000/Facsimile: (213) Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Verity Health Syste California, Inc., et al.	OY LLP 3) 629-5063
9	CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CAI	LIFORNIA - LOS ANGELES DIVISION
10	In re	Lead Case No. 2:18-bk-20151-ER
11	VERITY HEALTH SYSTEM OF	Jointly Administered With:
12	CALIFORNIA, INC., et al.,	Case No. 2:18-bk-20162-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20163-ER
13	Debtors and Debtors In Possession.	Case No. 2:18-bk-20164-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20165-ER
14	✓ Affects All Debtors	Case No. 2:18-bk-20167-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20168-ER
15	☐ Affects Verity Health System of	Case No. 2:18-bk-20169-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20171-ER
16	California, Inc.  ☐ Affects O'Connor Hospital	Case No. 2:18-bk-20172-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20173-ER
17	☐ Affects Saint Louise Regional Hospital ☐ Affects St. Francis Medical Center	Case No. 2:18-bk-20175-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20176-ER
18	☐ Affects St. Vincent Medical Center ☐ Affects Seton Medical Center ☐ Affects O'Common Hamital Foundation	Case No. 2:18-bk-20178-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20179-ER
19	☐ Affects O'Connor Hospital Foundation ☐ Affects Saint Louise Regional Hospital	Case No. 2:18-bk-20180-ER Case No. 2:18-bk-20181-ER
20	Foundation  ☐ Affects St. Francis Medical Center of	Chantan 11 Casas
21	Lynwood Foundation  ☐ Affects St. Vincent Foundation	Chapter 11 Cases Judge: Hon. Ernest M. Robles
22	☐ Affects St. Vincent Dialysis Center, Inc. ☐ Affects Seton Medical Center	
23	Foundation  ☐ Affects Verity Business Services	FTI CONSULTING, INC.'S SEVENTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR
24	☐ Affects Verity Medical Foundation ☐ Affects Verity Holdings, LLC	ALLOWANCE AND PAYMENT OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND
25 26	☐ Affects De Paul Ventures, LLC ☐ Affects De Paul Ventures - San Jose Dialysis, LLC	REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD OF MARCH 1, 2019 – MARCH 31, 2019
27	Debtors and Debtors In Possession.	
,		

#### Case 2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc Main Document Page 2 of 35

1. FTI Consulting, Inc. (the "Firm") submits its Monthly Fee Application (the "Application") for Allowance and Payment of Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period March 1, 2019 – March 31, 2019 (the "Application Period") for work performed for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors. In support of the Application, the Firm respectfully represents as follows:

- 2. The Firm is Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors. The Firm hereby applies to the Court for allowance and payment of interim compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the Application Period.
- 3. The Firm billed a total of \$271,741.83 in fees and expenses during the Application Period. The total fees represent 415.0 hours expended during the period covered by this Application. These fees and expenses break down as follows:

Period	Fees	Expenses	Total
March 1 - 31, 2019	\$271,079.50	\$662.33	\$271,741.83

4. Accordingly, the Firm seeks allowance of interim compensation in the amount of a total of \$217,525.93 at this time. This total is comprised as follows: \$216,863 (80% of the fees for services rendered) plus \$662.33 (100% of the expenses incurred).

5. For the postpetition period, the Firm has been paid to date as follows:

Application Period	Amount	Description
First (September 14 – 30, 2018)	\$269,747.46	100% of fees and expenses
Second (October 1 – 31, 2018)	\$408,376.63	100% of fees and expenses
Third (November 1 – 30, 2018)	\$202,253.20	100% of fees and expenses
Fourth (December 1 – 31, 2018)	\$218,865.50	100% of fees and expenses
Fifth (January 1 – 31, 2019)	\$203,072.67	80% of fees and 100% of expenses
Sixth (February 1 – 28, 2019)	\$178,861.70	80% of fees and 100% of expenses
Seventh (March 1 – 31, 2019)	\$0	
Total Paid to the Firm to Date	\$1,481,177.16	

6. To date, the Firm is owed as follows (excluding amounts owed pursuant to this Application):

Application Period	Amount	Description
Fifth (January 1 – 31, 2019)	\$50,718.40	20% of fees
Sixth (February 1 – 28, 2019)	\$44,687.30	20% of fees
<b>Total Owed to the Firm to Date</b>	\$95,405.70	

#### Case 2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc Main Document Page 3 of 35

- 7. Attached as **Exhibit A** hereto is the name of each professional who performed services in connection with these cases during the period covered by this Application and the hourly rate and total fees for each such professional. Attached hereto as **Exhibit B** is a summary of hours by task. Attached hereto as **Exhibit C** are the detailed time entries for the Applicable Period. Attached hereto as **Exhibit D** is a summary of expenses. Attached hereto as **Exhibit E** are the detailed expense entries for the Applicable Period.
- 8. The Firm has served a copy of this Application on the Office of the United States Trustee, the above-captioned debtors (the "Debtors"), counsel to the Debtors, the United States of America, the State of California, and parties who have requested special notice. Notice of the filing of this Application will be given by counsel for the Debtors to the Notice Parties pursuant to the terms of the Interim Compensation Order (defined below).
- 9. Pursuant to this Court's Amended Order Authorizing Interim Fee Procedures that was entered on or about November 16, 2018 [Docket No. 826] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the Debtors are authorized to make the payment requested herein without a further hearing or order of this Court unless an objection to this Application is filed with the Court and served upon the Notice Parties within ten (10) calendar days after the date of mailing of the Notice of this Application. If such an objection is filed, the Debtors are authorized to pay 80% of the uncontested fees and 100% of the uncontested expenses without further order of the Court. If no objection is filed, the Debtors are authorized to pay 80% of all fees requested in the Application and 100% of the uncontested expenses without further order of the Court.
- 10. The interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses sought in this Application is not final. Upon the conclusion of these cases, the Firm will seek fees and reimbursement of the expenses incurred for the totality of the services rendered in these cases. Any interim fees or reimbursement of expenses approved by this Court and received by the Firm (along with any retainer) will be credited against such final fees and expenses as may be allowed by this Court.

**WHEREFORE**, the Firm respectfully requests that the Debtors pay compensation to the Firm as requested herein pursuant to and in accordance with the terms of the Interim Compensation Order.

Case	2:18-bk-20151-ER	Doc 2272 Filed 04 Main Document	/26/19 Page 4	Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 4 of 35	Desc
1	Dated: April 26, 201	19	FT	TI CONSULTING, INC.	
2			Ry	s /s/Cliff Zucker	
3			Бу	/s/ Cliff Zucker CLIFF ZUCKER	
4					
5					
6					
7					
8					
9					
10					
11					
12					
13					
14					
15					
16					
17					
18					
19					
20					
21					
22					
23					
24					
<ul><li>25</li><li>26</li></ul>					
26 27					
28					
28					
			- 4 -		

Case 2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc Main Document Page 5 of 35

EXHIBIT A
VERITY HEALTH SYSTEM OF CALIFORNIA, INC. - CASE NO. 2:18-bk-20151-ER
SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2019 TO MARCH 31, 2019

1	
4	

3

1

2

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Benton, Jeffrey	Senior Managing Director	\$895.00	2.0	\$1,790.0
Joffe, Steven	Senior Managing Director	1,095.00	3.4	3,723.0
Nelson, Cynthia A	Senior Managing Director	1,050.00	9.3	9,765.0
Star, Samuel	Senior Managing Director	1,095.00	7.4	8,103.0
Wrynn, James	Senior Managing Director	940.00	2.3	2,162.0
Zucker, Clifford	Senior Managing Director	960.00	46.5	44,640.0
MacDonald, Charlene	Managing Director	700.00	11.0	7,700.0
Cavanaugh, Lauren	Managing Director	730.00	3.8	2,774.0
Flaharty, William	Managing Director	730.00	10.5	7,665.0
Ganti, Narendra	Managing Director	800.00	59.1	47,280.0
Kaufman, Allan	Managing Director	730.00	4.2	3,066.0
Whitney, John	Managing Director	390.00	8.2	3,198.0
Caves, Jefferson	Senior Consultant	250.00	2.9	725.0
Chang, Chi San	Senior Consultant	610.00	6.4	3,904.0
Saltzman, Adam	Senior Consultant	610.00	150.5	91,805.0
Smolko, Aleksey	Senior Consultant	505.00	2.9	1,464.5
Kaneb, Blair	Consultant	400.00	83.6	33,440.0
Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Associate	275.00	1.0	275.0
SUBTOTAL			415.0	\$273,479.5
	Less: 50% discount for non-we time	orking travel		(2,400.00
GRAND TOTAL			415.0	\$271,079.5

26

27

Case 2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc Main Document Page 6 of 35

# EXHIBIT B VERITY HEALTH SYSTEM OF CALIFORNIA, INC. - CASE NO. 2:18-bk-20151-ER SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2019 TO MARCH 31, 2019

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	14.1	\$8,713.00
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	26.1	16,611.00
3	Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other)	3.4	3,184.00
4	Trade Vendor Issues	2.0	1,639.00
5	Real Estate Issues	2.9	2,784.00
6	Asset Sales	96.5	71,057.50
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	3.4	3,723.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	1.7	1,492.00
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	124.9	65,002.00
15	Analysis of Interco. Claims, Related Party Transactions	20.8	13,061.00
18	Negotiation and Settlement of Case Issues	13.6	12,963.50
19	Case Management	12.1	7,143.50
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	24.0	20,994.50
22	Meetings with Other Parties	39.9	25,900.50
24	Preparation of Fee Application	23.6	14,411.00
25	Travel Time	6.0	4,800.00
	SUBTOTAL	415.0	\$273,479.50
	Less: 50% discount for non-working travel time		(2,400.00)
	GRAND TOTAL	415.0	\$271,079.50
	Code  1 2 3 4 5 6 10 13 14 15 18 19 21 22 24	Code Task Description  Current Operating Results & Events  Cash & Liquidity Analysis  Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other)  Trade Vendor Issues  Real Estate Issues  Asset Sales  Analysis of Tax Issues  Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions  Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise  Analysis of Interco. Claims, Related Party Transactions  Negotiation and Settlement of Case Issues  Case Management  General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel  Meetings with Other Parties  Preparation of Fee Application  Travel Time  SUBTOTAL  Less: 50% discount for non-working travel time	Code         Task Description         Hours           1         Current Operating Results & Events         14.1           2         Cash & Liquidity Analysis         26.1           3         Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other)         3.4           4         Trade Vendor Issues         2.0           5         Real Estate Issues         2.9           6         Asset Sales         96.5           10         Analysis of Tax Issues         3.4           13         Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions         1.7           14         Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise         124.9           15         Analysis of Interco. Claims, Related Party Transactions         20.8           18         Negotiation and Settlement of Case Issues         13.6           19         Case Management         12.1           21         General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel         24.0           22         Meetings with Other Parties         39.9           24         Preparation of Fee Application         23.6           25         Travel Time         6.0           SUBTOTAL         415.0           Less: 50% discount for non-working travel time

1
 2
 3

# EXHIBIT C VERITY HEALTH SYSTEM OF CALIFORNIA, INC. - CASE NO. 2:18-bk-20151-ER

DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2019 TO MARCH 31, 2019

4 Task Date **Professional** Hours **Activity** Category 5 3/1/2019 Zucker, Clifford 1.2 Review and analysis of 1/19 monthly operating report. 6 1 3/1/2019 Ganti, Narendra 0.6 Review January MOR. 7 1 3/4/2019 Kaneb, Blair 3.7 Analyze and update materials re: MOR. 8 1 3/4/2019 Saltzman, Adam 1.0 Prepare for meeting with BRG. Meet with BRG on operation, 1 3/4/2019 Zucker, Clifford 2.5 9 wind down, waterfall. Analyze and update materials re: 1 3/5/2019 Kaneb, Blair 0.6 10 MOR. 0.8 Review monthly metrics for 1 3/15/2019 Ganti, Narendra 11 Verity related to admissions and census. 12 Create summary comparing post-1 3/15/2019 Kaneb, Blair 2.6 petition financial results year-13 over-year. 14 1 3/18/2019 Saltzman, Adam 1.1 Review and analyze January 2019 MOR. 15 1 Total 14.1 2 3/1/2019 1.8 Prepare DIP questions in advance Saltzman, Adam 16 of meeting with BRG. Meeting with BRG to review and 2 3/4/2019 Saltzman, Adam 3.0 17 discuss updated DIP Budget and other case items. 18 2 3/7/2019 Review weekly reporting package Saltzman, Adam 0.4 for the week ending 3/2/19. 19 Review updated DIP budget 2 3/7/2019 Ganti, Narendra 1.0 20 reporting and review actuals. 2 1.2 Analyze budget to actuals for the 3/7/2019 Saltzman, Adam 21 week ending 3/2/19. 2 3/11/2019 Kaneb, Blair 1.6 Update exhibits and tables re: 22 weekly UCC update. Review and analyze liquidity 2 Saltzman, Adam 3/13/2019 1.8 23 forecast to support hurdle analysis. 24 Review and analysis of weekly 2 3/14/2019 Zucker, Clifford 0.5 budget to actual results. 25 2 Review and analyze weekly 3/14/2019 Saltzman, Adam 3.2 operating reports budget to 26 actuals and DIP Budget forecast. 2 3/14/2019 Ganti, Narendra 0.7 Review updated DIP Budget for 27 Debtors and analyze budget to actuals. 28

Case	2:18-bk-2015		c 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Main Document Page	Entered ( e 8 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	2	3/18/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.3	Review and analysis of post
2	2	3/18/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	petition admin costs. Analyze ADC trends for UCC
3	2	3/20/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.9	presentation.  Review and reconcile bridge to
4	2	3/21/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.1	DIP liquidity forecast. Update UCC materials per the latest weekly reporting package.
5	2	3/21/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.8	Review updated budget to actuals.
6	2	3/22/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	Analyze 13-Week DIP Budget as
U			,		of week ending 3/16/19.
7	2	3/22/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.8	Analyze budget to actuals for the week ending 3/16/19.
8	2	3/26/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.8	Review and discuss DIP bridge with BRG.
9	2	3/27/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.8	Review updated budget to actuals for Verity.
10	2	3/28/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	Analyze 13-Week DIP Budget as of week ending 3/23/19.
11	2	3/29/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	Discussion with N. Ganti re cash burn.
12	2	3/29/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.4	Review borrowing base and ADC as of 3/25/19.
13 14	2	3/29/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.9	Analyze budget to actuals for the week ending 3/23/19.
17	2 Total			26.1	
15	3	3/12/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Review DIP objection pleading.
16	3	3/12/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.8	Review comments to UCC appellants brief on DIP appeal.
17	3	3/14/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Review and analysis of Nant promissory note.
18	3	3/14/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.7	Review and analysis of verity promissory note.
19	3	3/14/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.8	Review and analysis of DOT loan and security agreement.
20	3 Total			3.4	
21	4	3/1/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Review and analysis of Medline critical vendor agreement.
22	4	3/15/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	Review payments to critical vendors and patient refunds.
23	4	3/22/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.1	Review critical vendor listing for week ending 3/16/19.
24	4	3/28/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.2	Review critical vendor listing for week ending 3/23/19.
25	4	3/29/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Review patient refund and critical vendor payments.
26	4 Total			2.0	
27	5	3/11/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.1	Review and analysis of Daly City executory contract.
28					
			- 8	-	

Case	2:18-bk-2015		c 2272 Filed 04/2 Main Document	26/19 Entered Page 9 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	5	3/11/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Review and analysis of Daly City motion to reject lease and
3	5	3/11/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.2	contract.  Review and analysis of Daly City lease agreement.
4	5 Total			2.9	
	6	3/1/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.5	Review and analysis of LA
5 6	6	3/1/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.1	county presentation. Analyze assets involved in Santa Clara sale.
7	6	3/1/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.7	Review Debtors methodology of allocation of Santa Clara assets
8	6	3/1/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	purchase price. Calls with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis, purchase price
9	6	3/4/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.3	allocation, and sale process.  Analyze the asset allocation re: Santa Clara Sale.
11	6	3/4/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Call with counsel on pending matters: sale, waterfall,
12	6	3/4/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.4	operations. Review OTA Settlement and
13	6	3/4/2019	Ganti, Narendra	3.6	APA motion. Continue to prepare for and attend
14	O	3/ 1/2019	Gunn, Purcharu	5.0	meeting with C. Kearns, D.
15					Galfus, and J. Schlant of BRG to discuss proceeds analysis, purchase price allocation and
16					other issues.
17	6	3/4/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.4	Prepare for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis,
18					purchase price allocation and other issues.
19	6	3/5/2019	Flaharty, William	0.4	Review of current outstanding insurance issues. Development of
20	6	3/5/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.4	follow up activities. Review Final SCC closing
21	6	3/5/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	statement. Review and compile questions for
22	-		,		BRG re Settlement and APA diligence.
23	6	3/5/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.0	Perform due diligence on SJMG Settlement and APA.
24	6	3/5/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.3	Draft email summarizing due diligence procedures performed
25	6	3/5/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.8	and key deal points. Perform due diligence on OTA
26	6	3/5/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.1	Settlement and APA.  Due diligence re: OTA purchase
27					agreement.
28	6	3/5/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.4	Review and analysis of San Jose Medical Group financial support.
				- 9 -	

Case	2:18-bk-201		c 2272 Filed 04/ Iain Document	26/19 Entered Page 10 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	6	3/5/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.8	Review and analysis of Santa Clara closing statement asset
2 3	6	3/5/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.3	allocation. Review and analysis of Breastlink
4	6	3/5/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.7	financial support. Review and analysis of bid handle
5	6	3/5/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.9	analysis.  Review Santa Clara County purchase price allocation
6 7	6	3/5/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.8	methodology. Review San Jose Medical Group and Oncological Technology Associates summary of sale of
8 9	6	3/5/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.2	medical groups. Obtain an understanding of outcome of UCC counsel meeting with Debtors' counsel re sale.
10	6	3/6/2019	Flaharty, William	1.0	Call with FTI team and drafting of follow-up issues and questions
11 12	6	3/6/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	for call with Dentons law firm.  Draft and send email to BRG re due diligence questions on SJMG
13	6	3/7/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.4	and OTA.  Draft and send email to Milbank
14 15	6	3/7/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	re due diligence results. Call with Verity and BRG re SJMG and OTA due diligence questions.
16	6	3/7/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.1	Continue review and due diligence on OTA and SJMG
17 18	6	3/7/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Settlement and APA. Review emails related to SJMG and OTA severance related to
19	6	3/7/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	physicians and employees. Emails and phone calls related to
20	6	3/8/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Marillac Insurance Company. Review Daly City lease rejection motion.
21	6	3/8/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with BRG to discuss SJMG and OTA follow up questions re:
22					severance, tail insurance, and benefits.
23	6	3/11/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.2	Call with PBGC on case status and sale.
24	6	3/11/2019	Wrynn, James	0.4	Preparation for tomorrow's conference call with Counsel,
<ul><li>25</li><li>26</li></ul>					including internal meeting with Mike Flaharty and review of relevant documentation.
27	6	3/12/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.8	Review and analysis of creditor objection to settlement and APA
28					on San Jose.

Case	2:18-bk-201		c 2272    Filed 04/26/19 Iain Document     Page	Entered ( 11 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
			_		
1	6	3/12/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.0	Call with Dentons to discuss Marillac Insurance.
2	6	3/12/2019	Wrynn, James	0.8	Participation on Conference Call with Counsel to discuss insurance
3					issues, including those pertaining to the Workers' Compensation,
4					professional liability and excess policies.
5	6	3/12/2019	Wrynn, James	0.5	Continued preparation for
6					Conference Call with Jodi Adolph, Esq. of Denton's to
7	6	3/12/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.7	discuss insurance issues. Call with debtor counsel on
8	6	3/12/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	insurance cell.
9	6	3/12/2019	Zucker, Cilliord	0.0	Review and analysis of Marillac acquisition proposal.
10	6	3/13/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.8	Review and analysis of broker opinion of values on excess
11	6	3/13/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.7	property. Review and analysis of SMC
12	6	3/13/2019	Flaharty, William	2.6	appraisal.  Preparation for call with Denton's
13					attorney. Call regarding insurance issues. Drafting of follow-up work-plan.
14	6	3/13/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Review motion to sell SOAR.
15	6	3/13/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.5	Review and analysis of motion to
		2/12/2010	7 1 01:00 1	0.0	approve SOAR settlement.
16	6	3/13/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.8	Review and analysis of SOAR asset purchase agreement.
17	6	3/13/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.0	Review motion to approve SOAR settlement and APA.
18	6	3/13/2019	Cavanaugh, Lauren	0.9	Review and discuss next steps to provide options on Marillac;
19					review/edit additional document
20	6	3/14/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.2	request list. Call with investment banker on
21	6	3/14/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.1	dib status and diligence. Obtain update on any changes
22	6	3/14/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.4	with respect to asset sale process. Call with Cain Brothers to discuss
23	6	3/15/2019	Flaharty, William	0.4	sale process. Review of workers' compensation
24	6	3/15/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.4	policy conditions and exclusions.  Discuss status of SOAR deal and
25	6	3/15/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.3	convey the same to Milbank. Review email and correspondence
26	6	3/18/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.7	related to SOAR asset sale failure. Review asset sale for SJMG to
27		5, 10, 2017	Cann, marchara	0.7	understand treatment of severance.
28					severance.

Case	2:18-bk-2015			Entered (2) 12 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	6	3/18/2019	Benton, Jeffrey	1.5	Review and consider process, timelines and costs to close
2				4.0	facilities.
3	6	3/19/2019	Flaharty, William	1.0	Follow-up on meeting with Dentons. Identification and
4					review of outstanding due diligence and preparation of
5	6	3/19/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	questions to brokers. Review income statement for
6					SJMG to determine potential
7	6	3/19/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	severance payments to physicians. Evaluate SJMG income statement.
8	6	3/20/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.3	Analyze SJMG clinic for unusual
9	6	3/20/2019	Flaharty, William	0.7	revenues/expenses. Review of materials received
10					from Dentons. Compare to previously received documents.
	6	3/20/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.3	Review and diligence SJMG
11	6	3/20/2019	Smolko, Aleksey	0.5	income statement. Review and discuss with team
12			, ,		new documents related to
13	6	3/20/2019	Wrynn, James	0.6	Marillac. Review of email from Counsel,
14					review of documentation
15					forwarded, including the updated financials.
	6	3/20/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.8	Review Marillac files received from Dentons.
16	6	3/21/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	Call with Cain re sale update.
17	6	3/21/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.7	Review San Jose Medical Group historical financial statements and
18					analyze for unusual expenses.
19	6	3/21/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.0	Review additional documents related to Marillac provided by
20					Dentons, including 2018 audited
	6	3/21/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.7	financials.  Draft and submit summary of
21	6	3/21/2019	Caltaman Adam	2.4	SJMG diligence observations. Review documents received for
22	O	3/21/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2. <del>4</del>	Marillac.
23	6	3/21/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.9	Draft summary of Marillac insurance documents received for
24					FTI team.
	6	3/21/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with Cain Brothers to discuss sale process.
25	6	3/21/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	Call with D. Galfus to discuss
26	6	3/22/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.5	Marillac and shutdown analysis. Review and analysis of sales
27	6	3/22/2019			status update.
28	υ	3/44/4019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.3	Obtain update on outcome of certain contract settlements in

Case	2:18-bk-201		c 2272 Filed 04/2 lain Document	26/19 Entered Page 13 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1					connection with sale to Santa Clara County.
2	6	3/22/2019	Smolko, Aleksey	0.6	Review new documents related to
3	6	3/25/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Marillac. Review Marillac documents and
4					identity outstanding document requests and follow-u with FTI
5	6	3/25/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	insurance team. Review San Jose Medical Group
6		0,20,2015		0.0	income statement and review
7	6	3/25/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.4	outstanding issues.  Meet with team on work plan for bid analysis.
8	6	3/26/2019	Flaharty, William	1.6	Review of newly received data
9					and scheduling with Dentons for call with brokers and Verity.
10	6	3/26/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.3	Call counsel on sale proceeds
	6	3/26/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.4	waterfall analysis. Review and analysis of sale
11	6	2/26/2010	Zualran Cliffond	0.2	proceeds waterfall analysis. Call with counsel on sale
12	6	3/26/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.2	proceeds assumptions.
13	6	3/26/2019	Cavanaugh, Lauren	0.2	Review responses provided from Dentons on Marillac and
14		2 (2 2 (2 2 4 2	77 0 411		insurance liabilities.
15	6	3/28/2019	Kaufman, Allan	2.5	Review documents on insurance captive; Consider alternatives and
16	6	3/28/2019	Flaharty, William	2.8	related issues. Meet with A. Kaufman and
17					follow up analysis. Preparation of questions for Dentons and
18	6	2/29/2010	Caltaman Adam	0.2	Lockton.
10	6	3/28/2019 3/28/2019	Saltzman, Adam Zucker, Clifford	0.2 0.2	Call with Cain re sale update. Call Cain on status of bids.
19	6	3/28/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Email correspondence with
20		3/20/2019	Gainti, I tarendia	0.3	Dentons and FTI team re:
21					Marillac and offer to purchase Marillac.
	6	3/28/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Review prior versions of bid
22 23					analysis prepared by Cain to determine categories and items
	6	3/28/2019	Smolko, Aleksey	1.3	for FTI analysis. Review and analysis of Marillac
24					documents and follow-up on open items.
25	6	3/28/2019	Cavanaugh, Lauren	0.8	Discuss internally the analysis of Marillac.
26	6	3/28/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with Cain Brothers to discuss
27	6	3/29/2019	Kaufman, Allan	1.7	partial bids and sale process. Review documents on insurance
28			,		captive; Consider alternative strategies and related issues.

Case	2:18-bk-201		c 2272 Filed 04/2 Iain Document	26/19 Entered Page 14 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	6	3/29/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.0	Review bid by AHMC for St.
2	6	3/29/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.9	Francis Medical Center. Review LA County bid for St.
3					Vincent hospital.
	6	3/29/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.0	Review Prime bid for St. Francis Medical Center.
4	6	3/29/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.3	Call with team on bid analysis work plan.
5	6	3/29/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.5	Call bondholder advisor on bid
6	6	3/29/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.6	analysis. Review and perform analysis on
7	6	3/29/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.6	bids received. Confer with FTI team regarding
8			- · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		process for reviewing bids
9	6	3/29/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.4	received and next steps. Confer with FTI team regarding
10					bids received and implications for partial auction.
	6	3/29/2019	Smolko, Aleksey	0.5	Review Marillac findings and FTI
11	6	3/29/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	work with Allan Kaufman. Review preliminary bid analysis.
12	6	3/29/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with FTI team to discuss
13					work streams, sale process, AG
1.4	6	3/29/2019	Star, Samuel	0.7	meeting, and next steps.  Meet with team re: analysis of
14			,		partial bids, substantive
15					consolidation arguments and creditor recovery model by entity.
16	6	3/31/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.3	Review and perform analysis on
17	6	3/31/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.8	bids received. Call with N. Ganti re Bid
		3/31/2019	Suitzinan, Maain	0.0	Analysis.
18	6 Total			96.5	
19	10	3/4/2019	Joffe, Steven	0.8	Discussion with David Galfus regarding UBTI and sales tax
20					exposure on sale of hospitals to
	10	3/5/2019	Joffe, Steven	2.6	Santa Clara. Review of partnership agreement
21	10	3/3/2017	Jone, Steven	2.0	for real estate holdings, research
22					regarding California casual/occasional sale rules,
23					taxability of sales to state.
	10 Total			3.4	
24	13	3/8/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.4	Review Debtors' Motion to (I) Reject Lease and Executory
25					Contract and (II) Abandon
26	13	3/18/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Personal Property (Dkt 1729). Review and analysis of stipulation
27					with CHHS.
28	13	3/18/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.7	Review and analysis of stipulations on assumption of
20					Medicare provider agreement.
				- 14 -	

# Case 2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc Main Document Page 15 of 35

13 Total			1.7	
14	3/1/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.1	Review and analyze claims
1.4	2/4/2010	C-14 A 1	1 /	register.
14	3/4/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.4	Prepare and distribute follow-up
				questions to BRG re hurdle analysis.
14	3/6/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.1	Review and update proceeds
14	3/0/2017	Sanzman, Adam	2.1	analysis.
14	3/6/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.2	Review and update claims
	5. o. <b>=</b> 0 1 y	2 11 12 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11	1.2	reconciliation.
14	3/7/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.3	Review and update proceeds
				analysis.
14	3/8/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.8	Review and update proceeds
				analysis.
14	3/11/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.4	Map out deconsolidated claims: r
	_ , _ , _ ,	~ .		deconsolidated waterfall.
14	3/12/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.0	Review and analyze proceeds
1 4	2/12/2012	G 1, A 1		analysis.
14	3/12/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.4	Review responses received from
14	2/12/2010	Vanah Dlair	2.1	BRG re hurdle analysis follow-up
14	3/12/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.1	Continue to map out deconsolidated claims re:
				deconsolidated waterfall.
14	3/12/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.1	Revise and continue to map out
17	3/12/2017	Kanco, Dian	1.1	deconsolidated claims re:
				deconsolidated waterfall.
14	3/12/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.8	Model out potential recoveries re
		,		deconsolidated waterfall model.
14	3/13/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.1	Analysis and review of waterfall.
14	3/13/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.9	Call with B. Kaneb and A.
		,		Saltzman to discuss waterfall
				analysis on a de-consolidated
				basis.
14	3/13/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	Review proceeds analysis in
				anticipation of de-consolidation
			_	waterfall analysis.
14	3/13/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.5	Review and discussion of
1.4	2/12/2010	V 1 D1. '	2.4	waterfall assumptions.
14	3/13/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.4	Continue to model deconsolidate
14	3/13/2019	Vanah Dlair	3.4	waterfall recoveries.  Model deconsolidated waterfall
14	3/13/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.4	recoveries.
14	3/13/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.8	Analyze post-petition
17	3/13/2017	Raileo, Dian	1.0	intercompany activity re:
				deconsolidated waterfall.
14	3/14/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.8	Analysis and review of waterfall.
14	3/14/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.7	Review and edit claims re:
11	5/11/2017	Tanto, Dian	2.1	deconsolidated waterfall model.
14	3/14/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.4	Review and revise deconsolidated
	2.12019		J. 1	waterfall assumptions.
				1

Case	2:18-bk-2015			Entered ( 16 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	14	3/14/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.2	Analyze differences between
2					deconsolidated and consolidated
2	14	3/14/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.6	waterfall recoveries. Begin to model low and high
3		3/11/2019	ranco, Blan	1.0	scenarios re: deconsolidated
4	1.4	2/15/2010	C 1, A 1	2.2	waterfall.
	14	3/15/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.2	Review and analysis of proceeds analysis model.
5	14	3/15/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.4	Continue to model low and high
6					scenarios re: deconsolidated
7	14	3/18/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.9	waterfall. Analyze creditors that serve
7					multiple debtor entities.
8	14	3/18/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.8	Analyze creditors that are unique to Debtor entities.
9	14	3/18/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.9	Review and update decon model.
	14	3/19/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.7	Continue to analyze creditors
10	1.4	2/10/2010	G 1, A 1	1.0	across Debtor entities.
11	14	3/19/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.8	Review hospital shut-down procedures for scenario analysis.
12	14	3/20/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.3	Review and update
12	1.4	2/20/2010	Wt. Dist.	2.2	deconsolidated waterfall model.
13	14	3/20/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.3	Update deconsolidated waterfall model.
14	14	3/21/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.5	Review and update
	14	3/21/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.1	deconsolidated waterfall model.
15	14	3/21/2019	Kaneo, Dian	2.1	Update deconsolidated waterfall model.
16	14	3/22/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.6	Review and update
17	14	3/22/2019	Ganti, Narendra	2.5	deconsolidated waterfall model. Review de-consolidated waterfall
1 /	17	3/22/2017	Gainti, Narchara	2.5	analysis.
18	14	3/22/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.1	Make edits to deconsolidated
19					waterfall model per suggestions from team members.
	14	3/25/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.2	Review financing documents for
20	1.4	2/25/2010	W 1 D1 '	2.2	waterfall analysis.
21	14	3/25/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.2	Model alternative DIP allocation methods for deconsolidated
22					waterfall.
22	14	3/26/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.5	Prepare consolidated model for creditor committee member.
23	14	3/26/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.1	Review and revise proceeds
24			,		analysis based on updated
					information, include assumptions, and limitations.
25	14	3/26/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	Review and discuss
26					deconsolidated waterfall with B.
27	14	3/26/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.1	Kaneb. Continue preparation of
		5,20,2017	~ ~~~	2.1	consolidated model for creditor
28					committee member.

Case	e 2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc Main Document Page 17 of 35						
1	14	3/26/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.1	Incorporate changes re: secured debt in deconsolidated waterfall.		
2	14	3/27/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	Review Wahidi claim filed with the court.		
3	14	3/27/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.2	Review and analyze decon		
4	14	3/27/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.5	waterfall model. Review updated De-Consolidated		
5	14	3/27/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.2	model for Verity Debtors. Review and edit deconsolidated		
6	14	3/28/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.6	waterfall model. Review and address questions re		
7	14	3/28/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.0	waterfall.  Decon waterfall discussion with		
8	14	3/28/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.5	FTI team. Call with B. Kaneb and A.		
9	17	3/20/2017	Gainti, Ivai Chara	1.3	Saltzman to discuss recovery		
10					analysis on a de-consolidated basis.		
11	14	3/28/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.5	Review deconsolidated waterfall with team members.		
12	14	3/29/2019	Kaneb, Blair	3.4	Create summary of assumptions page for deconsolidated waterfall.		
13	14 Total			124.9	page for deconsortance waterian.		
13	15	3/4/2019	Chang, Chi San	0.2	Review Daly City meeting notes.		
14	15	3/6/2019	Chang, Chi San	1.2	Sub-con analysis review.		
15	15	3/6/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.2	Address next steps on subcon analysis.		
16	15	3/6/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.2	Review and analyze SubCon factors.		
17	15	3/7/2019	Chang, Chi San	0.6	Discuss sub-con issues with Narendra & Adam.		
18	15	3/7/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	Call with N. Ganti and X. Chang		
19	15	3/7/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	re SubCon analysis. Call with A. Saltzman and X.		
20					Chang to discuss substantive consolidation issues.		
21	15	3/8/2019	Chang, Chi San	2.0	Review CIM and docket to fill out Sub-Con analysis.		
22	15	3/8/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.9	Review and draft notes on information for deconsolidated		
23	15	3/11/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.8	proceeds analysis. Review intercompany detail		
24	15	3/15/2019	Chang, Chi San	2.4	matrix. Review docket documents to fill		
25			<u>.</u>		out Sub-con analysis.		
26	15	3/15/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.7	Review and analyze docket information for analysis of		
27	15	3/18/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.0	SubCon factors. SubCon factors review and		
28	15	3/19/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	analysis. SubCon factors review.		
20							
				- 17 -			

Case	2:18-bk-201		c 2272 Filed 04/2 Iain Document	26/19 Entered Page 18 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	15	3/20/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.2	Review creditor analysis for
2	15	3/27/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.0	SubCon factors. Review summary of substantive
3					consolidation factors for Ninth Circuit and identify them for Verity.
4	15	3/28/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.8	Review and analyze subcon factors.
5	15 Total			20.8	
6 7	18	3/6/2019	Star, Samuel	0.5	Discussions with team re: sub con vs decon and POR analysis and preparation for asset sale auction.
8	18	3/22/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	High level review of BASM documents.
9	18	3/25/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	High level review of documents provided and reply to Milbank.
10	18	3/25/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.3	Review and analysis of 4/16 - 5/16 regular session minutes on litigation.
11 12	18	3/25/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.0	Review and analysis of 2/16 - 3/16 regular session minutes on
13	18	3/25/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.0	financing.  Review and analysis of 12/15 - 1/16 regular session minutes on
14 15	18	3/27/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.0	Blue Mountain. Review and analysis of obligated / non-obligated group financials
16	18	3/27/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.2	FY17. Review and analysis of obligated / non-obligated group financials
17 18	18	3/27/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.8	FY16. Review and analysis of 4/18 - 5/18 executive session minutes.
19	18	3/27/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.3	Review and analysis of obligated / non-obligated group financials FY18.
20	18	3/28/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.4	Review and analysis of purchase agreement with Radnet and
22	18	3/28/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.6	support. Review and analysis of next
23	18	3/28/2019	Zucker, Clifford	1.5	Works master lease and subleases. Review and analysis of 6/17-8/17 BOD minutes.
24	18 Total			13.6	
25	19	3/4/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.2	Address resources to complete various analyses.
26	19	3/4/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	Coordinate administrative matters in anticipation of meeting with
27 28	19	3/8/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.1	BRG. Confer with team members regarding work stream coordination meeting.
				- 18 -	

Case	2:18-bk-201			26/19 Entered Page 19 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	19	3/8/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	Compile workstream information for team review.
2	19	3/11/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with A. Saltzman to discuss
3					interim fee application, work streams and responsibilities, and AG analysis.
4	19	3/18/2019	Benton, Jeffrey	0.5	Review Merrill website updates
5	19	3/22/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	on all documents.  Meeting to discuss case status
6	19	3/25/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	with N. Ganti and C. Zucker. Update and revise current
7			,		workstreams, primarily
8					responsibilities, and status of each workstream.
9	19	3/25/2019	Star, Samuel	0.8	Meet with team re: status of workstreams.
	19	3/26/2019	Kaneb, Blair	2.8	Review documents made
10					available in the data room in March.
11	19	3/26/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.6	Continue review of documents made available in the data room
12					in March.
13	19	3/27/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.1	Review datasite document activity.
14	19	3/27/2019	Kaneb, Blair	1.3	Review docket for important
15	19	3/28/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.2	filings. Confer with colleagues regarding
16	19	3/28/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.8	outstanding work streams. Update case workplan and
	19	3/29/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.2	availability. Coordinate access to dataroom.
17	19 Total	3/29/2019	Sattzman, Adam	12.1	Coordinate access to dataroom.
18	21	3/1/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	Review update to Committee on
19					DIP budget, sale process, and borrowing base.
20	21	3/4/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with Creditors Committee to
21					discuss DIP Budget, sale process, and settlements.
	21	3/4/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with Milbank to discuss
22					outstanding issues, including AG, investigation, committee meeting
23	21	3/4/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.3	with Debtors and other issues. Committee call on financial and
24					legal update.
25	21	3/4/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.5	Review comments to report to committee on operation.
26	21	3/4/2019	Star, Samuel	0.2	Call with UCC re: pending motions, Santa Clara sale closing
27					and latest liquidity project and
					census levels.
28					
				- 19 -	
	Ī			1 / T	

Case	2:18-bk-2015:			26/19 Entered Page 20 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	21	3/4/2019	Star, Samuel	0.5	Call with Milbank re: AG
2					outreach asset sale issues,
					including purchase price asset sale issues, including purchase
3					price allocation, investigations,
4					union severance discussion and
	21	3/4/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.3	agenda for UCC call. Participate in weekly call with
5			, <b>3</b>		UCC along with UCC counsel
6					regarding status of case and sales
7	21	3/4/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.5	process. Participate in weekly call with
,			•		UCC counsel regarding case
8					issues including proposed sale of remaining assets and status of
9					investigations and information
	2.1	2/4/2010	G 1:	0.6	from Debtors.
10	21	3/4/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	Review UCC update presentation prior to distribution.
11	21	3/4/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.4	UCC Update call.
12	21	3/4/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	Call with Milbank re status on various case issues.
13	21	3/4/2019	MacDonald,	0.6	Participated in internal weekly
	21	3/6/2019	Charlene Ganti, Narendra	0.5	advisors call. Call with Milbank to discuss work
14	21	3/0/2019	Ganu, Narendra	0.3	streams and prioritize issues,
15					including investigation, sale
1.6	21	3/6/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	process, and DIP budget. Call with counsel on case issues,
16	21	3/0/2019	Zucker, Chinord	0.0	debtor call.
17	21	3/6/2019	Star, Samuel	0.4	Call with Milbank re: open issues
18					regarding allocation of sales proceeds, sub con vs decon POR,
					AD outreach and next steps.
19	21	3/6/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.7	Participate in call with UCC
20					counsel to obtain download of meeting with Debtors' counsel
21					regarding sale process, claims,
21					meetings with AG and other case matters.
22	21	3/6/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.3	Confer with UCC counsel
23			·		regarding outcome of meeting
	21	3/6/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	with Debtors. Call with Milbank re meeting
24		5/0/2019	Sanzinan, Maani	0.5	with Dentons and case update.
25	21	3/15/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.7	Review updated presentation to Committee and make revisions.
26	21	3/15/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.4	Call with Milbank to discuss
					upcoming committee meeting,
27	21	3/15/2019	Star, Samuel	0.5	AG meeting, and other issues. Call with Milbank re: open issues
28		5, 15, 2017	2331, 24111401	0.3	including physician practice sales,

Case 2:18-bk-20151-ER	Doc 2272	Filed 04/26/19	Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15	Desc
	Main Doo	cument Page 2	21 of 35	

1					AG outreach and pending motions.
2	21	3/15/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	Review UCC update presentation prior to distribution.
3	21	3/18/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Committee call on financial and legal update.
4	21	3/18/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	Update call with UCC.
5	21	3/18/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.5	Review comments to report to committee on financial results.
6	21	3/18/2019	Star, Samuel	0.2	Call with Milbank re: AG
7					outreach, agenda for UCC call and bar date exceptions.
8	21	3/18/2019	Star, Samuel	0.4	Call with UCC re: AG outreach, pending motions and sales
9					process.
	21	3/18/2019	Star, Samuel	0.1	Call with UCC member re: AG outreach timing and agenda.
10	21	3/18/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.3	Call with counsel on case status;
11	21	3/18/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.7	sales, operation. Participate in weekly call with
12					UCC along with UCC counsel regarding status of case and sales
13	2.1	2/10/2010		0.2	process.
14	21	3/18/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.3	Participate in pre-call with UCC counsel regarding next steps with
15	21	3/18/2019	Canti Navandra	0.5	AG and other case matters.
			Ganti, Narendra		Review FTI presentation update to Committee in advance of call.
16	21	3/18/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.3	Call with Milbank to discuss AG meeting and next steps.
17	21	3/18/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.3	Review Agenda prepared by
18	21	3/18/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	Milbank and provide comments. Call with Committee to discuss
19					sale process, DIP budget, and AG Meeting.
20	21	3/18/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	Call with Milbank prior to UCC
21	21	3/22/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	update call. Call with Milbank re case issues.
	21	3/22/2019	Star, Samuel	0.4	Call with Milbank re: revised
22					draft of letter to AG on UCC position re: asset sales and status
23	21	3/22/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.6	of sales process. Call with Milbank to discuss AG
24			ŕ		meeting and sale process.
25	21	3/22/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.3	Confer via email with FTI colleagues regarding schedule for
26					various meetings and calls and outstanding issues to be
27		<b>-</b> 10 - 1- 1 1 1			addressed.
	21	3/22/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.5	Participate in weekly call with UCC counsel to discuss status of
28					

Case	2:18-bk-201		c 2272 Filed 04/2 Iain Document	26/19 Entered Page 22 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1					case and sales and confer on meeting with CA AG.
2 3	21	3/25/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with Committee to discuss cash flow, AG meeting, and sale
4	21	3/25/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	process.  Review agenda and AG letter prior to committee call.
5	21	3/25/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.3	Committee call on financial and legal update.
6	21	3/25/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.5	UCC Update call.
7 8	21	3/25/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.5	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with UCC along with UCC counsel including in connection with sales process
9	21	3/25/2019	Star, Samuel	0.2	update and meeting with CA AG. Weekly Committee call re: letter to AG and status of sales process.
10 11	21	3/26/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with Milbank to discuss AG meeting and creditor issues around recoveries.
12	21	3/29/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Call with counsel on case issues, bid, auction, AG meeting.
13 14	21	3/29/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Call with Milbank to discuss partial bids, sale process, and AG meeting.
15	21	3/29/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	Call with Milbank to discuss case matters.
16	21	3/29/2019	Star, Samuel	0.4	Call with Milbank re: analysis of partial bids, meeting with AG and agenda for UCC call.
17 18	21	3/29/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.4	Participate in weekly call with UCC counsel to review case status, bids received and next
19					steps with CA AG.
	21 Total			24.0	
20	22	3/1/2019	Whitney, John	3.5	Revise org charts for AG meeting.
21	22	3/1/2019	Caves, Jefferson	1.6	Coordinate with digital team on stakeholder map for local and state officials.
22   23	22	3/1/2019	Caves, Jefferson	1.3	Prepare stakeholder map for local and state officials.
23	22	3/2/2019	Whitney, John	3.7	Revise charts for AG analysis.
24	22	3/2/2019	Whitney, John	1.0	Continue preparation of charts for AG analysis.
25 26	22	3/4/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	1.3	Prepared memo on proposed public affairs strategy for Verity UCC and sent to Sam Star and
27 28	22	3/6/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	0.4	Cynthia Nelson. Call with FTI Corp Fin and Milbank discuss meeting with the Attorney General.
-				- 22 -	

Case	2:18-bk-201		c 2272 Filed 04/20 Iain Document F	6/19 Entered Page 23 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
1	22	3/11/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.6	Continue analysis of financial and time impact related to AG
3	22	3/11/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.1	conditions.  Prepare analysis of financial and time impact related to AG conditions.
4 5	22	3/11/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Prepare for and participate in call with Creditor to discuss meeting
6	22	3/11/2019	Star, Samuel	0.1	with AG and related issues. Call with UCC members re: AG outreach and asset sale process.
7	22	3/11/2019	Star, Samuel	0.4	Draft emails to UCC member and Counsel re: potential AG impact on KPC asset sale.
8 9	22	3/11/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.4	Continue analysis of financial and time impact related to AG
10	22	3/11/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.1	conditions.  Obtain update on timing of meeting with CA AG.
11	22	3/11/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.2	Call with creditor party.
12	22	3/11/2019	Cavanaugh, Lauren	0.3	Prepare for call with Dentons.
	22	3/12/2019	Cavanaugh, Lauren	1.6	Prepare for and participate on call with Dentons.
13 14	22	3/18/2019	Star, Samuel	0.1	Draft email to team re: call with UCC member re: AG outreach
15 16	22	3/19/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.3	timing and agenda. Coordinate with FTI team members and UCC counsel timing of draft statement of UCC
17 18	22	3/19/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	0.4	position. Emails with Milbank and Corp Fin regarding strategy for letter and meeting with AG Becerra.
19	22	3/20/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.4	Review comments to draft letter to AG.
20	22	3/20/2019	Star, Samuel	0.8	Review Milbank draft communication to AG and
21 22	22	3/20/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	0.4	provide comments to team.  Reviewed and provided feedback on draft letter to Attorney
23	22	3/20/2019	MacDonald,	2.2	General. Worked on letter to attorney
24			Charlene		general Becerra regarding conditions placed on potential sale of verity assets.
25	22	3/20/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.5	Review and respond to comments regarding proposed UCC
26		0.10 - 10			statement/letter to CA AG.
27	22	3/21/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.4	Research LA County Board of Supervisors website and identify
28					agenda related to Board vote on St. Vincent acquisition.

ase	2:18-bk-201		c 2272 Filed 04/26/1 Nain Document Pag	9 Entered e 24 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc		
1		D (D.1 (D.0.1.0)					
1	22	3/21/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	1.4	Edited draft letter to AG Becerra.		
2	22	3/21/2019	MacDonald,	0.2	Requested meeting with Sean		
3	22	3/22/2019	Charlene Saltzman, Adam	0.2	McCluskie (AG Becerra). Review proposed AG letter.		
4	22	3/22/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.4	Call with counsel on case status and AG discussions.		
5	22	3/22/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.4	Call with team on AG response letter.		
6	22	3/22/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.0	Review draft versions of AG		
7	22	3/22/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	letter and provide comments. Call with FTI team to discuss A		
8	22	3/22/2019	MacDonald,	1.9	letter. Work on letter to the attorney		
9	22	3/22/2019	Charlene Star, Samuel	0.7	general.  Review and comment on revised		
10					draft of letter to AG on UCC position re: asset sales.		
11	22	3/22/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.4	Review draft letter to CA AG and		
12	22	3/22/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.2	provide comments to FTI. Finalize and send draft letter for CA AG to UCC counsel for		
13	22	3/22/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.4	review and circulation. Confer with FTI team regarding		
14	22	3/26/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	letter to CA AG. Review final version of AG letter		
15	22	3/20/2017	Ganti, Ivarentia	0.3	and correspondence related to AG meeting.		
16	22	3/26/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	0.4	Calls and emails regarding UCC meeting with the AG's office.		
17	22	3/26/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.3	Confer with counsel and FTI colleagues regarding meeting with		
18					CA AG.		
19	22	3/26/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	0.2	Called Attorney General Becerra office to discuss meeting with Verity UCC.		
20	22	3/27/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.2	Confer with colleagues regarding meeting with CA AG.		
21	22	3/28/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.3	Review comments to revised letter to AG.		
22	22	3/28/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Review final version of letter to		
23	22	3/28/2019	MacDonald,	0.9	AG of CA. Work with Milbank on letter to		
24	22	3/29/2019	Charlene MacDonald,	0.5	AG and scheduling meeting. Participated in weekly call with		
25			Charlene		Milbank to discuss meeting with AG.		
26	22	3/29/2019	MacDonald, Charlene	0.2	Scheduled meeting with Verity UCC and AG's office.		
27	22	3/31/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.6	Perform analysis on claims for AG meeting.		
28	22 Total			39.9			

Case	2:18-bk-2015			Entered 25 of 35	04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc
			idiii Doodiiioiti — i ago	20 01 00	
1	24	3/11/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.3	Prepare First Interim Fee Application.
2	24	3/11/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.7	Continue preparation of First
3	24	3/12/2019	Kaneb, Blair	0.9	Interim Fee Application. Compile team bios re: interim fee
4	24	3/12/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.6	application. Continue Preparation of First Interim Fee Application.
5	24	3/12/2019	Saltzman, Adam	3.7	Continue Preparation of First
6	24	3/13/2019	Zucker, Clifford	0.6	Interim Fee Application. Review and analysis of first interim fee applications.
7	24	3/13/2019	Saltzman, Adam	0.3	Prepare First Interim Fee Application.
8	24	3/13/2019	Ganti, Narendra	0.5	Review FTI's first interim fee application.
10	24	3/13/2019	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	0.5	Generate February proforma in connection with the fee
11	24	3/14/2019	Hellmund-Mora, Marili	0.5	application. Finalize the January fee application.
12	24	3/19/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.0	Prepare February 2019 Fee App.
13	24	3/21/2019	Ganti, Narendra	1.0	Review February fee application.
1.4	24	3/21/2019	Saltzman, Adam	2.0	Prepare February Fee App.
14	24	3/22/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.8	Prepare February Fee App.
15	24	3/25/2019	Saltzman, Adam	1.1	Finalize February 2019 Fee App.
16	24	3/29/2019	Nelson, Cynthia A	0.1	Confer with FTI colleagues regarding fee application hearing attendance.
17	24 Total			23.6	attendance.
18	25	3/4/2019	Ganti, Narendra	3.0	Travel time from DC to New York on Amtrak.
19	25	3/4/2019	Ganti, Narendra	3.0	Travel time from New York to DC on Amtrak.
20	25 Total			6.0	
21	GRAND TO	)TAL		415.0	
22					
23					
24					
25					
26					
27					
28					
			25		

Case	2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 I Main Document Page 26 of 35	Desc							
1 2	EXHIBIT D VERITY HEALTH SYSTEM OF CALIFORNIA, INC CASE NO. 2:18-bk-20151	1-ER							
3	SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2019 TO MARCH 31, 2019								
4	TOR THE PERIOD NAMED I, 2017 TO NAMED OI, 2017								
5									
6	Expense Type  Mileage	\$11.60							
7	Transportation	549.62							
8	Working Meals	101.11							
9	Total	\$662.33							
10	1 otal								
11									
12									
13									
14									
15									
16									
17									
18									
19									
20									
21									
22									
23									
24									
25									
26									
27									
28									
	- 26 -								

Case 2:18-bk-20151-ER Doc 2272 Filed 04/26/19 Entered 04/26/19 15:08:15 Desc Main Document Page 27 of 35

## EXHIBIT E VERITY HEALTH SYSTEM OF CALIFORNIA, INC. - CASE NO. 2:18-bk-20151-ER

1

2

3

26

27

28

# **EXPENSE DETAIL**FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2019 TO MARCH 31, 2019

Ganti, Narendra Ganti, Narendra	Mileage Total Transportation	Mileage to Union Station (60.00). Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.	\$11.60
Ganti, Narendra			011 (1
Ganti, Narendra	Transportation		\$11.60
		Rail - Coach/Economy - 03/04/2019 - 03/04/2019. Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.	372.00
Ganti, Narendra	Transportation	Travel Agent Fees - Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.	12.50
Ganti, Narendra	Transportation	Rail - change fee. Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.	95.00
Ganti, Narendra	Transportation	Parking - Union Station for trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.	24.0
Ganti, Narendra	Transportation	Taxi to FTI Office from Penn Station. Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.	10.0
Kaneb, Blair	Transportation	Taxi home after staying late on case work.	17.7
Kaneb, Blair	Transportation	Taxi home after staying late on case work.	18.30
	Transportation T		\$549.62
Ganti, Narendra	Working Meals	Meals - Working Lunch in New York. Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis	11.5
Saltzman, Adam	Working Meals	Meals - For meeting with BRG.	89.5
	Working Meals	Γotal	\$101.1
	Grand Total		\$662.3
	Ganti, Narendra Ganti, Narendra Ganti, Narendra Kaneb, Blair Kaneb, Blair Ganti, Narendra	Ganti, Narendra  Transportation  Ganti, Narendra  Transportation  Transportation  Kaneb, Blair  Transportation  Transportation  Transportation  Transportation  Working Meals  Working Meals  Working Meals	Ganti, Narendra Transportation Travel Agent Fees - Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.  Ganti, Narendra Transportation Rail - change fee. Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.  Ganti, Narendra Transportation Parking - Union Station for trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.  Ganti, Narendra Transportation Taxi to FTI Office from Penn Station. Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.  Kaneb, Blair Transportation Taxi home after staying late on case work.  Transportation Total  Ganti, Narendra Working Meals Meals - Working Lunch in New York. Trip to New York for meeting with BRG to discuss proceeds analysis.  Saltzman, Adam Working Meals Meals - For meeting with BRG.

## PROOF OF SERVICE OF DOCUMENT

I am over the age of 18 and not a party to this bankruptcy case or adversary proceeding. My business address is:

2029 Century Park E, 33rd Floor, Los Angeles, CA 90067.

A true and correct copy of the foregoing document entitled (specify): CONSULTING, ıs d

<u>MONTHLY FEE APPLICA</u>	<u>TION FOR ALLOWANCE AND </u>	PAYMENT OF	INTERIM CO	<u>OMPENSATION AN</u>
	ENSES FOR THE PERIOD OF MAR nambers in the form and manner re			
Orders and LBR, the foregoin April 26, 2019, I checked the	COURT VIA NOTICE OF ELECTRO g document will be served by the cor CM/ECF docket for this bankruptcy of Electronic Mail Notice List to receive	urt via NEF and hy case or adversary p	perlink to the do proceeding and	ocument. On ( <i>date</i> ) determined that the
		Service info     ■     Service info     Service info	ormation continu	ued on attached page
case or adversary proceeding first class, postage prepaid, a	ATES MAIL:  ved the following persons and/or ento by placing a true and correct copy the distribution of t	hereof in a sealed i judge here constitu	envelope in the	United States mail,
		Service info	ormation contin	ued on attached page
for each person or entity serv following persons and/or entit such service method), by face	DELIVERY, OVERNIGHT MAIL, FA ed): Pursuant to F.R.Civ.P. 5 and/or ies by personal delivery, overnight m simile transmission and/or email as fo overnight mail to, the judge will be con	controlling LBR, on all service, or (for the collows. Listing the	n ( <i>date</i> ) <u>April 20</u> those who cons judge here cons	6, 2019, I served the tented in writing to stitutes a declaration
		Service info	ormation contin	ued on attached page
I declare under penalty of per	jury under the laws of the United Sta			
	es C. Behrens		nes C. Behre	
	nted Name	Signatu		

(Via NEF)

- Melinda Alonzo ml7829@att.com
- Robert N Amkraut ramkraut@foxrothschild.com
- **Kyra E Andrassy** kandrassy@swelawfirm.com, lgarrett@swelawfirm.com;gcruz@swelawfirm.com;jchung@swelawfirm.com
- Simon Aron saron@wrslawyers.com
- Lauren T Attard lattard@bakerlaw.com, abalian@bakerlaw.com
- Allison R Axenrod allison@claimsrecoveryllc.com
- **Keith Patrick Banner** kbanner@greenbergglusker.com, sharper@greenbergglusker.com;calendar@greenbergglusker.com
- Cristina E Bautista cristina.bautista@kattenlaw.com, ecf.lax.docket@kattenlaw.com
- James Cornell Behrens jbehrens@milbank.com, gbray@milbank.com;mshinderman@milbank.com;hmaghakian@milbank.com;dodonnell@milbank.com;jbrewste r@milbank.com;JWeber@milbank.com
- Ron Bender rb@lnbyb.com
- Bruce Bennett bbennett@jonesday.com
- Peter J Benvenutti pbenvenutti@kellerbenvenutti.com, pjbenven74@yahoo.com
- Steven M Berman sberman@slk-law.com
- Alicia K Berry Alicia.Berry@doj.ca.gov
- Stephen F Biegenzahn efile@sfblaw.com
- Karl E Block kblock@loeb.com, jvazquez@loeb.com;ladocket@loeb.com;kblock@ecf.courtdrive.com
- Dustin P Branch branchd@ballardspahr.com, carolod@ballardspahr.com;hubenb@ballardspahr.com
- **Michael D Breslauer** mbreslauer@swsslaw.com, wyones@swsslaw.com;mbreslauer@ecf.courtdrive.com;wyones@ecf.courtdrive.com
- Chane Buck cbuck@jonesday.com
- **Damarr M Butler** butler.damarr@pbgc.gov, efile@pbgc.gov
- Lori A Butler butler.lori@pbgc.gov, efile@pbgc.gov
- Howard Camhi hcamhi@ecjlaw.com, tcastelli@ecjlaw.com;amatsuoka@ecjlaw.com
- Shirley Cho scho@pszjlaw.com
- Shawn M Christianson cmcintire@buchalter.com, schristianson@buchalter.com
- Louis J. Cisz lcisz@nixonpeabody.com, jzic@nixonpeabody.com
- Leslie A Cohen leslie@lesliecohenlaw.com, jaime@lesliecohenlaw.com;odalys@lesliecohenlaw.com
- Kevin Collins kevin.collins@btlaw.com, Kathleen.lytle@btlaw.com
- David N Crapo dcrapo@gibbonslaw.com, elrosen@gibbonslaw.com
- Mariam Danielyan md@danielyanlawoffice.com, danielyan.mar@gmail.com
- **Brian** L **Davidoff** bdavidoff@greenbergglusker.com, calendar@greenbergglusker.com;jking@greenbergglusker.com
- Aaron Davis aaron.davis@bryancave.com, kat.flaherty@bryancave.com
- Anthony Dutra adutra@hansonbridgett.com
- Kevin M Eckhardt kevin.eckhardt@gmail.com, keckhardt@hunton.com
- Lei Lei Wang Ekvall lekvall@swelawfirm.com, lgarrett@swelawfirm.com;gcruz@swelawfirm.com;jchung@swelawfirm.com
- Andy J Epstein taxcpaesq@gmail.com
- Christine R Etheridge christine.etheridge@ikonfin.com
- M Douglas Flahaut flahaut.douglas@arentfox.com
- Michael G Fletcher mfletcher@frandzel.com, sking@frandzel.com
- Joseph D Frank jfrank@fgllp.com,
  - mmatlock@fgllp.com;csmith@fgllp.com;jkleinman@fgllp.com;csucic@fgllp.com
- William B Freeman william.freeman@kattenlaw.com, nicole.jones@kattenlaw.com,ecf.lax.docket@kattenlaw.com
- Eric J Fromme efromme@tocounsel.com, lchapman@tocounsel.com;sschuster@tocounsel.com

- Amir Gamliel amir-gamliel-9554@ecf.pacerpro.com, cmallahi@perkinscoie.com;DocketLA@perkinscoie.com
- Jeffrey K Garfinkle jgarfinkle@buchalter.com, docket@buchalter.com;dcyrankowski@buchalter.com
- Lawrence B Gill lgill@nelsonhardiman.com, rrange@nelsonhardiman.com
- Paul R. Glassman pglassman@sycr.com
- Eric D Goldberg eric.goldberg@dlapiper.com, eric-goldberg-1103@ecf.pacerpro.com
- Marshall F Goldberg mgoldberg@glassgoldberg.com, jbailey@glassgoldberg.com
- David Guess dguess@bienertkatzman.com, 4579179420@filings.docketbird.com
- Anna Gumport agumport@sidley.com
- Mary H Haas maryhaas@dwt.com, melissastrobel@dwt.com;laxdocket@dwt.com;vanessapalma@dwt.com
- James A Haves jhayes@jamesahayesaplc.com
- Michael S Held mheld@jw.com
- Lawrence J Hilton lhilton@onellp.com,

lthomas@onellp.com;info@onellp.com;evescance@onellp.com;nlichtenberger@onellp.com;rgolder@onellp.com

- Robert M Hirsh Robert.Hirsh@arentfox.com
- Florice Hoffman fhoffman@socal.rr.com, floricehoffman@gmail.com
- Michael Hogue hoguem@gtlaw.com, fernandezc@gtlaw.com;SFOLitDock@gtlaw.com
- Matthew B Holbrook mholbrook@sheppardmullin.com, mmanns@sheppardmullin.com
- David I Horowitz david.horowitz@kirkland.com,

keith. catuara@kirkland.com; terry.ellis@kirkland.com; elsa. banuelos@kirkland.com; ivon.granados@kirkland.com; terry.ellis@kirkland.com; terry.el

- Marsha A Houston mhouston@reedsmith.com
- Brian D Huben hubenb@ballardspahr.com, carolod@ballardspahr.com
- Lawrence A Jacobson laj@cohenandjacobson.com
- John Mark Jennings johnmark.jennings@kutakrock.com
- Monique D Jewett-Brewster mjb@hopkinscarley.com, eamaro@hopkinscarley.com
- Crystal Johnson M46380@ATT.COM
- Gregory R Jones gjones@mwe.com, rnhunter@mwe.com
- Lance N Jurich ljurich@loeb.com, karnote@loeb.com;ladocket@loeb.com;ljurich@ecf.courtdrive.com
- **Jeff D Kahane** ikahane@duanemorris.com, dmartinez@duanemorris.com
- Steven J Kahn skahn@pszyjw.com
- Cameo M Kaisler salembier.cameo@pbgc.gov, efile@pbgc.gov
- Ivan L Kallick ikallick@manatt.com, ihernandez@manatt.com
- Ori Katz okatz@sheppardmullin.com, cshulman@sheppardmullin.com;ezisholtz@sheppardmullin.com
- Payam Khodadadi pkhodadadi@mcguirewoods.com, dkiker@mcguirewoods.com
- Christian T Kim ckim@dumas-law.com, ckim@ecf.inforuptcy.com
- Jane Kim jkim@kellerbenvenutti.com
- Monica Y Kim myk@lnbrb.com, myk@ecf.inforuptcy.com
- Gary E Klausner gek@lnbyb.com
- Joseph A Kohanski jkohanski@bushgottlieb.com, kprestegard@bushgottlieb.com
- **Jeffrey C Krause** jkrause@gibsondunn.com, dtrujillo@gibsondunn.com;jstern@gibsondunn.com
- Darryl S Laddin bkrfilings@agg.com
- Robert S Lampl advocate45@aol.com, rlisarobinsonr@aol.com
- Richard A Lapping richard@lappinglegal.com
- Paul J Laurin plaurin@btlaw.com, slmoore@btlaw.com;jboustani@btlaw.com
- David E Lemke david.lemke@wallerlaw.com,
  - chris.cronk@wallerlaw.com;Melissa.jones@wallerlaw.com;cathy.thomas@wallerlaw.com
- Carmen Leon carmen.leon@nlrb.gov
- Elan S Levey elan.levey@usdoj.gov, louisa.lin@usdoj.gov
- Tracy L Mainguy bankruptcycourtnotices@unioncounsel.net, tmainguy@unioncounsel.net
- Samuel R Maizel samuel.maizel@dentons.com, alicia.aguilar@dentons.com;docket.general.lit.LOS@dentons.com;tania.moyron@dentons.com;kathryn.howard@dentons.com;joan.mack@dentons.com;derry.kalve@dentons.com
- Alvin Mar alvin.mar@usdoj.gov

- Craig G Margulies Craig@MarguliesFaithlaw.com,
  - Victoria@MarguliesFaithlaw.com;David@MarguliesFaithLaw.com;Helen@MarguliesFaithlaw.com
- Hutchison B Meltzer hutchison.meltzer@doj.ca.gov, Alicia.Berry@doj.ca.gov
- Christopher Minier becky@ringstadlaw.com, arlene@ringstadlaw.com
- John A Moe john.moe@dentons.com,
  - glenda.spratt@dentons.com,derry.kalve@dentons.com,andy.jinnah@dentons.com
- Susan I Montgomery susan@simontgomerylaw.com,
  - assistant@simontgomerylaw.com;simontgomerylawecf.com@gmail.com;montgomerysr71631@notify.bestcase.com
- Monserrat Morales mmorales@marguliesfaithlaw.com,
  - Victoria@marguliesfaithlaw.com; David@MarguliesFaithLaw.com; Helen@marguliesfaithlaw.com; Annual Communication (Communication of the Communication of the
- Kevin H Morse kevin.morse@saul.com, rmarcus@AttorneyMM.com;sean.williams@saul.com
- Marianne S Mortimer mmortimer@sycr.com, tingman@sycr.com
- Tania M Moyron tania.moyron@dentons.com, chris.omeara@dentons.com
- Alan I Nahmias anahmias@mbnlawyers.com, jdale@mbnlawyers.com
- Jennifer L Nassiri jennifernassiri@quinnemanuel.com
- Charles E Nelson nelsonc@ballardspahr.com, wassweilerw@ballardspahr.com
- Sheila Gropper Nelson shedoesbklaw@aol.com
- Mark A Neubauer mneubauer@carltonfields.com,
  - mlrodriguez@carltonfields.com; smcloughlin@carltonfields.com; schau@carltonfields.com; NDunn@carltonfields.com; com; ecfla@carltonfields.com
- - ajackson@hansonbridgett.com;calendarclerk@hansonbridgett.com
- Bryan L Ngo bngo@fortislaw.com,
  - BNgo@bluecapitallaw.com; SPicariello@fortislaw.com; JNguyen@fortislaw.com; JNguyen@bluecapitallaw.com; JNguyen@b
- Melissa T Ngo ngo.melissa@pbgc.gov, efile@pbgc.gov
- Abigail V O'Brient avobrient@mintz.com,
  - docketing@mintz.com;DEHashimoto@mintz.com;nleali@mintz.com;ABLevin@mintz.com;GJLeon@mintz.com
- John R OKeefe jokeefe@metzlewis.com, slohr@metzlewis.com
- **Scott H Olson** solson@vedderprice.com, jcano@vedderprice.com,jparker@vedderprice.com;scott-olson-2161@ecf.pacerpro.com,ecfsfdocket@vedderprice.com
- Aram Ordubegian ordubegian.aram@arentfox.com
- **Keith C Owens** kowens@venable.com, khoang@venable.com
- R Gibson Pagter gibson@ppilawyers.com, ecf@ppilawyers.com;pagterrr51779@notify.bestcase.com
- Paul J Pascuzzi ppascuzzi@ffwplaw.com, lnlasley@ffwplaw.com
- Lisa M Peters lisa.peters@kutakrock.com, marybeth.brukner@kutakrock.com
- Christopher J Petersen cjpetersen@blankrome.com, gsolis@blankrome.com
- Mark D Plevin mplevin@crowell.com, cromo@crowell.com
- **David M Poitras** dpoitras@wedgewood-inc.com, dpoitras@jmbm.com;dmarcus@wedgewood-inc.com;aguisinger@wedgewood-inc.com
- Steven G. Polard spolard@ch-law.com, cborrayo@ch-law.com
- **David M Powlen** david.powlen@btlaw.com, pgroff@btlaw.com
- Christopher E Prince cprince@lesnickprince.com,
  - jmack@lesnickprince.com;mlampton@lesnickprince.com;cprince@ecf.courtdrive.com
- Lori L Purkey bareham@purkeyandassociates.com
- William M Rathbone wrathbone@grsm.com, jmydlandevans@grsm.com
- Jason M Reed Jason.Reed@Maslon.com
- Michael B Reynolds mreynolds@swlaw.com, kcollins@swlaw.com
- J. Alexandra Rhim arhim@hrhlaw.com
- Emily P Rich erich@unioncounsel.net, bankruptcycourtnotices@unioncounsel.net
- Lesley A Riis lriis@dpmclaw.com, sscialpi@dpmclaw.com
- **Debra Riley** driley@allenmatkins.com
- Christopher O Rivas crivas@reedsmith.com, chris-rivas-8658@ecf.pacerpro.com

- Julie H Rome-Banks julie@bindermalter.com
- Mary H Rose mrose@buchalter.com
- Megan A Rowe mrowe@dsrhealthlaw.com, lwestoby@dsrhealthlaw.com
- Nathan A Schultz nschultz@foxrothschild.com
- William Schumacher wschumacher@jonesday.com
- Mark A Serlin ms@swllplaw.com, mor@swllplaw.com
- Seth B Shapiro seth.shapiro@usdoj.gov
- David B Shemano dshemano@shemanolaw.com
- Joseph Shickich jshickich@riddellwilliams.com
- Rosa A Shirley rshirley@nelsonhardiman.com, ksherry@nelsonhardiman.com;lgill@nelsonhardiman.com;jwilson@nelsonhardiman.com;rrange@nelsonhardiman.com
- Kyrsten Skogstad kskogstad@calnurses.org, rcraven@calnurses.org
- Michael St James ecf@stjames-law.com
- Andrew Still astill@swlaw.com, kcollins@swlaw.com
- Jason D Strabo jstrabo@mwe.com, ahoneycutt@mwe.com
- Sabrina L Streusand Streusand@slollp.com
- Ralph J Swanson ralph.swanson@berliner.com, sabina.hall@berliner.com
- Gary F Torrell gft@vrmlaw.com
- United States Trustee (LA) ustpregion16.la.ecf@usdoj.gov
- Cecelia Valentine cecelia.valentine@nlrb.gov
- Matthew S Walker matthew.walker@pillsburylaw.com, candy.kleiner@pillsburylaw.com
- Jason Wallach jwallach@ghplaw.com, g33404@notify.cincompass.com
- Kenneth K Wang kenneth.wang@doj.ca.gov,
  - Jennifer.Kim@doj.ca.gov;Stacy.McKellar@doj.ca.gov;yesenia.caro@doj.ca.gov
- Phillip K Wang phillip.wang@rimonlaw.com, david.kline@rimonlaw.com
- Adam G Wentland awentland@tocounsel.com, lkwon@tocounsel.com
- Latonia Williams lwilliams@goodwin.com, bankruptcy@goodwin.com
- Michael S Winsten mike@winsten.com
- **Jeffrey C Wisler** jwisler@connollygallagher.com, dperkins@connollygallagher.com
- Neal L Wolf nwolf@hansonbridgett.com, calendarclerk@hansonbridgett.com,lchappell@hansonbridgett.com
- Hatty K Yip hatty.yip@usdoj.gov
- Andrew J Ziaja aziaja@leonardcarder.com,
  - sgroff@leonardcarder.com; msimons@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leonardcarder.com; lbadar@leon
- Rose Zimmerman rzimmerman@dalycity.org

(Via First Class Mail)

#### Verity Health System of California, Inc.

2040 E. Mariposa Avenue El Segundo, CA 90245

#### Samuel R. Maizel

Dentons US LLP 601 South Figueroa Street Suite 2500 Los Angeles, CA 90017

#### **Attorney General of California**

Xavier Becerra California Department of Justice 1300 "I" Street Sacramento, CA 95814

#### U.S. Dept. of Health & Human Services

Angela M. Belgrove, Esq. 90 7th Street, Suite 4-500 San Francisco, CA 94103-6705

#### **United States Department of Justice**

Ben Franklin Station PO Box 683 Washington DC 20044

#### **United States Attorney's Office**

Federal Building, Room 7516 300 North Los Angeles Street Los Angeles, CA 90012

#### **Office of the United States Trustee**

915 Wilshire Blvd, Suite 1850 Los Angeles, CA 90017

(Via FedEx Overnight)

#### The Honorable Ernest M. Robles

United States Bankruptcy Court Central District of California Edward R. Roybal Federal Building and Courthouse 255 E. Temple Street, Suite 1560/Courtroom 1568 Los Angeles, CA 90012-3300

(Via Email)

# **Attorneys for Chapter 11 Debtors and Debtors in Possession**

Samuel R. Maizel – <u>samuel.maizel@dentons.com</u>
John A. Moe, II – <u>john.moe@dentons.com</u>
Tania M. Moyron – <u>tania.moyron@dentons.com</u>

#### Attorneys for the Office of the United States Trustee

Hatty K. Yip – <u>hatty.yip@usdoj.gov</u>