WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP

767 Avenue

New York, New York 10153 Telephone: (212) 310-8000 Facsimile: (212) 310-8007

Gary T. Holtzer Robert J. Lemons Kelly DiBlasi

Attorneys for Debtors and Debtors In Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

-----X

In re : Chapter 11

WAYPOINT LEASING : Case No. 18-13648 (SMB)

HOLDINGS LTD., et al.,

: (Jointly Administered)

Debtors.*

SIXTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2019 THROUGH MAY 31, 2019

Name of Applicant: Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP,

Attorneys for Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Date of Retention: January 9, 2019 *nunc pro tunc* to November 25, 2018

Period for Which Fees and

Expenses are Incurred: May 1, 2019 through May 31, 2019

Monthly Fees Incurred: \$801,010.50

Less 20% Holdback: \$160,202.10

Monthly Expenses Incurred: \$22,018.43

Total Fees and Expenses Due: \$662,826.83

This is a ______ Monthly ____ Interim ____ Final Fee Application

^{*} A list of the Debtors in these Chapter 11 Cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, is attached hereto as **Exhibit A**.



18-13648-smb Doc 847 Filed 06/27/19 Entered 06/27/19 17:23:18 Main Document Pg 2 of 138

SUMMARY OF MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP FOR SERVICES RENDERED FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2019 THROUGH MAY 31, 2019

NAME OF PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS AND COUNSEL:	DEPARTMENT†	YEAR ADMITTED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Soto, Edward	LIT	1978 (FL)	\$1,325.00	4.00	\$5,300.00
Goldring, Stuart J.	TAX	1984	\$1,600.00	2.00	\$3,200.00
Holtzer, Gary T.	BFR	1991	\$1,600.00	4.10	\$6,560.00
Lemons, Robert J.	BFR	2001	\$1,400.00	135.90	\$190,260.00
DiBlasi, Kelly	BFR	2005	\$1,200.00	83.60	\$98,160.00
Gershowitz, Gabriel (Counsel)	CORP	2010	\$1,050.00	4.00	\$4,200.00
Total Partners and Counsel:				233.60	\$307,680.00

[†] BFR – Business Finance & Restructuring; CORP – Corporate; LIT – Litigation

NAME OF PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATES:	DEPARTMENT*	YEAR ADMITTED§	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Friedman, Julie T.	BFR	2003	\$600.00	29.80	\$17,880.00
Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulis	LIT	2008 (FL)	\$995.00	19.40	\$19,303.00
Carson, Candice M.	BFR	2010 (TX)	\$995.00	13.30	\$13,233.50
Cruz, Mariel E.	CORP	2010	\$995.00	4.00	\$3,980.00
Ivanova, Iliana Z.	CORP	2014	\$875.00	11.80	\$10,325.00
Podzius, Bryan R.	BFR	2015	\$875.00	101.20	\$88,550.00
Moreland, Vernell Henry	CORP	2018	\$790.00	1.80	\$1,422.00
Foust, Rachael L.	BFR	2018	\$690.00	78.30	\$54,027.00
Chelesnik, Alexandra Garcia	CORP	2019	\$560.00	3.60	\$2,016.00
Fang, Weiru	BFR	2019	\$560.00	79.50	\$43,904.00
Berger, Ryan Alexander	BFR	*	\$690.00	281.60	\$193,786.50
Son, Seung Wook	CORP	*	\$560.00	5.50	\$3,080.00
Total Associates:				629.80	\$451,507.00

 $^{^{\}ddag}$ BFR – Business Finance & Restructuring; CORP – Corporate; LIT – Litigation § * – Not yet Admitted

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONALS	DEPARTMENT**	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Lee, Kathleen	BFR	\$420.00	10.50	\$4,410.00
Arias, Juan C.	CORP	\$405.00	1.00	\$405.00
Stauble, Christopher A.	BFR	\$405.00	5.70	\$2,308.50
Ellsworth, John A.	CORP	\$385.00	8.00	\$3,080.00
Inglis, Suzanne	LIT	\$385.00	1.60	\$616.00
Fabsik, Paul	BFR	\$375.00	69.60	\$26,100.00
Gilmartin, Justin	CORP	\$355.00	2.00	\$710.00
Karkat, Sakina	CORP	\$355.00	1.20	\$426.00
Kleissler, Matthew	BFR	\$240.00	6.50	\$1,560.00
Peene, Travis J.	BFR	\$240.00	7.60	\$1,824.00
Pero, Jake Henry	LIT	\$240.00	1.60	\$384.00
Total Paraprofessionals:			115.30	\$41,823.50

PROFESSIONALS	BLENDED RATE	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	TOTAL COMPENSATION
TOTALS:		BILLED	COMI ENSATION
Partners and Counsel	\$1,317.12	233.60	\$307,680.00
Associates	\$716.91	629.80	\$451,507.00
Paraprofessionals	\$362.74	115.30	\$41,823.50
Blended Attorney Rate	\$879.30		
Total Fees Incurred:		978.70	\$801,010.50

 $^{^{**}\,}BFR-Business$ Finance & Restructuring; LIT – Litigation; CORP – Corporate

COMPENSATION BY WORK TASK CODE FOR SERVICES RENDERED BY WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2019 THROUGH MAY 31, 2019

TASK CODE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
001	363 Asset Sales	31.30	\$26,876.00
009	Bar Date/Claims Reconciliation Issues	19.10	\$17,675.00
010	Case Administration/WIP List and Case Calendar	11.30	\$6,524.00
011	Corporate/Securities/Governance	79.50	\$72,515.00
013	DIP Financing/Cash Management/Cash Collateral	0.50	\$558.00
014	Disclosure Statement/Solicitation/Voting	184.50	\$153,226.50
015	Employee Issues	5.20	\$4,564.00
020	General Case Strategy/Team Meetings	55.90	\$50,979.00
021	Hearings and Court Matters	98.40	\$67,508.50
022	Insurance Issues	8.60	\$7,377.00
025	Non-Working Travel	7.30	\$3,293.50
026	Plan of Reorganization/Plan Confirmation/Plan Implementation	135.90	\$133,236.50
027	Retention/Fee Applications: Other Professionals	121.90	\$95,370.50
028	Retention/Fee Applications: Ordinary Course Professionals	5.20	\$3,310.00
030	Secured Creditors Issues/Meetings/Communications	1.50	\$1,234.00
031	Tax Issues	1.00	\$1,600.00
032	Unsecured Creditors Issues/Meetings/Communications	0.70	\$483.00
033	US Trustee Issues/Meetings/Communications	70.30	\$48,707.50
035	WG&M Retention/Billing/Fee Applications	98.20	\$62,840.50
036	WAC 1	0.40	\$350.00
037	WAC 2	2.70	\$2,281.50
039	WAC 6	0.50	\$558.00
040	WAC 7	16.40	\$19,795.00
041	WAC 8	0.30	\$420.00
042	WAC 9	4.60	\$2,797.50
043	WAC 10	15.50	\$15,771.00
044	WAC 12	2.00	\$1,159.00
Total:		978.70	\$801,010.50

EXPENSE SUMMARY FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2019 THROUGH MAY 31, 2019

EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Computerized Research	\$990.79
Meals	\$690.50
Corporation Services	\$1,816.50
Transportation	\$1,729.46
Duplicating	\$16,458.21
Mail/Messenger	\$272.97
CourtCall	\$60.00
Total Expenses Requested:	\$22,018.43

Notice Parties

Waypoint Leasing Holdings Ltd. c/o William Transier 12128 Madeleine Circle Dallas, Texas 75230

The Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York 201 Varick Street, Room 1006 New York, New York 10014 Attn: Andrea B. Schwartz, Esq.

Alston & Bird LLP 1201 West Peachtree Street Atlanta, GA 30309 Attn: David Wender, Esq.

Mayer Brown LLP
1221 Avenue of the Americas
New York, New York 10020-1001
Attn: Bryan Trust, Esq.
Scott Zemser, Esq.

Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP 1301 Avenue of the Americas New York, New York 10019-6022 Attn: Howard Beltzer, Esq.

Sullivan & Cromwell LLP
125 Broad Street
New York, New York 10004
Attn: Andrew G. Dietderich, Esq.
Brian D. Glueckstein, Esq.

Clifford Chance LLP 31 West 52nd Street New York, New York 10019-6131 Attn: Jennifer DeMarco, Esq.

Duane Morris LLP 1540 Broadway New York, NY 10036-4086 Attn: Frederick Hyman, Esq.

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
COMF SELIA	Ivanova, Iliana Z. ESPOND WITH R. LIKELY RE: RECEIPT OF FUN PLETE TRANSFER (.2); REVIEW TRANSACTION INKINA REGARDING LOCAL COUNSEL INVOIC MACQUARIE REGARDING THE POST-CLOSING	UPDATE FE	ROM R. BERGER (.1) NDS FLOW (.1); COI	; CORRESPON	D WITH A.
05/01/19 ATTE	Cruz, Mariel E. NTION TO POST-CLOSING OBLIGATIONS OF CO	0.20 OMPANY A	199.00 ND MACQUARIE.	001	56443666
05/01/19 CONF	Gilmartin, Justin ER WITH THIRD-PARTY SERVICE COMPANY R	1.00 E: CLOSINO	355.00 G SETS AND REVIEV	001 W AND REVISI	56458871 E DRAFT.
05/02/19 ATTE	Carson, Candice M. NTION TO WAC 11 AIRCRAFT SALE.	0.20	199.00	001	56442761
05/03/19 REVII	Ivanova, Iliana Z. EW POST-CLOSING ESCROW ACCOUNT INSTRU	0.10 UCTIONS.	87.50	001	56439992
05/03/19 COOR	Cruz, Mariel E. DINATE RELEASE OF POST-CLOSING ADJUSTI	0.20 MENT ESCR	199.00 COW.	001	56443656
05/03/19 EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. LS TO R. GRAHAM RE: CHC CURE SETTLEMEN	0.20 TT (.1); CALI	175.00 WITH W. FANG RE	001 E: SAME (.1).	56442623
	Gilmartin, Justin ER WITH THIRD-PARTY SERVICE COMPANY R IONS ACCORDINGLY (.7).	1.00 E: CLOSINO	355.00 G SET (.3); REVIEW	001 AND REVISE I	56458878 DRAFT
05/05/19 EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. LS TO D. KOKINI RE: POST-CLOSING ESCROW.	0.30	262.50	001	56470928
05/06/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	720.00	001	56745409

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index		
	PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH T. WOLYNSKI, B. TRANSIER, B. PODZIUS AND FTI RE: TSA SERVICES AND RELATED ISSUES, AND FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE WITH B. PODZIUS RE: SAME.						
05/06/19 CORR	Ivanova, Iliana Z. ESPOND WITH R. BERGER AND C. CARSON RE	0.20 E: POST-CLOS	175.00 ING TRANSFERR	001 ED AIRCRAFT.	56477372		
	Cruz, Mariel E. OND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM FTI RE DEL OWED FUNDS (0.1).	0.20 AYED ASSET	199.00 CLOSINGS (0.1);	001 CORRESPOND	56479432 DENCE RE		
05/06/19 DISCU	Fang, Weiru USS 2905 SALE (0.3).	0.30	168.00	001	56471191		
	Podzius, Bryan R. ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH W OYEES RE: TSA.	0.60 ÆIL, B. TRAN	525.00 SIER AND FORM	001 ER WAYPOINT	56471013		
	Podzius, Bryan R. EW APA AND POST-CLOSING ESCROW ADJUST ERS RE: POST-CLOSING ADJUSTMENTS (.2).	0.60 FMENTS (.4); I	525.00 EMAILS TO D. WE	001 ENDER AND W	56675030 AC 8		
05/07/19 RESE	Fang, Weiru ARCH RE: MOTION TO SELL MSN 2905.	1.50	840.00	001	56471041		
05/08/19 EMAI	Goldring, Stuart J. L EXCHANGE WITH B. PODZIUS REGARDING	0.10 ΓRANSFER T <i>e</i>	160.00 AX REFUNDS.	001	56486144		
05/08/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH WEIL TEAM, FTI, AND LENDER COUN	0.40 NSEL RE ESCE	560.00 ROWED SALE PRO	001 OCEEDS.	56601782		
05/08/19 EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. LS TO/FROM D. LIGNON AND T. WOLYNSKI RE	0.20 E: WINDDOW	175.00 N AND TSA ITEM	001 S.	56492608		

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	Goldring, Stuart J. L EXCHANGE WITH K. BLANCHARD (.1), ANI NDS AND PLAN TREATMENT.	0.20 O CALL WITH	320.00 B. PODZIUS (.1), R	001 E TRANSFER T	56486267 TAX
	Ivanova, Iliana Z. ESPOND WITH T. KELLY RE: MALAYSIAN ST DUNT AND REVIEW SAPA REGARDING QUES	_		001 T OF THE ESCI	56477484 ROW
05/10/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH B. PODZIUS AND A. SELIANKINA RE:	0.10 WAC 11 AIRCI	99.50 RAFT SALE.	001	56674178
05/10/19 CORR PAYM	Ivanova, Iliana Z. ESPOND WITH T. KELLY AND W. LYNCH REMENT.	0.20 GARDING TH	175.00 E MALAYSIAN TRA	001 ANSFER TAXE	56477166 S
05/13/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH D. WENDER AND WEIL TEAM RE ES	1.00 SCROWED SAI	1,400.00 LE PROCEEDS.	001	56496219
05/13/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW TSA INVOICE FROM MACQUARIE AND EI	0.20 MAIL WEIL TE	240.00 EAM RE: SAME.	001	56489816
	Ivanova, Iliana Z. EESPOND WITH M. CASEY AND S. SON RE: EX AND T. KELLY RE: MALAYSIAN TAXES (.2); R		*	* *	
05/13/19 REVII	Cruz, Mariel E. EW AND RESPOND TO QUERIES FROM B. POI	0.20 OZIUS AND R.	199.00 BERGER RE APA.	001	56523125
05/13/19 REVII	Son, Seung Wook EW SIGNATURE PAGES TO CLOSING DOCUM	0.10 ENTS.	56.00	001	56513615

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/13/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	0.40	350.00	001	56755801
PART	CIPATE ON TSA CALL WITH W. TRANSIER, V	WEIL, FTI ANI	D MACQUARIE (.4).		
05/14/19	Ivanova, Iliana Z.	1.00	875.00	001	56517528
	EW DOCUMENTATION FROM MACQUARIE IN				20217020
05/15/19	Ivanova, Iliana Z.	0.40	350.00	001	56517453
	EW TSA IN CONNECTION WITH INVOICE FOR RDING THE PAYMENT DEADLINES (.3); CON				
REGA	RDING THE LATMENT DEADLINES (.3), CON	TERENCE WI	III M. CRUZ REGA	KDING INVOIC	LS (.1).
05/16/19	Ivanova, Iliana Z.	2.20	1,925.00	001	56517376
	W AND ANALYZE REPORT FROM MACQUAI				
. ,,	CONFERENCE WITH M. CRUZ REGARDING TS	SA INVOICE (.2); PREPARE SUM	MARY AND PR	OPOSED
ACTI	ONS EMAIL RE: SAME (.5).				
05/16/19	Cruz, Mariel E.	0.40	398.00	001	56520165
REVIE	EW TSA INVOICE (.2); CONFERENCE WITH I. I	VANOVA RE	SAME (.2).		
05/17/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.50	700.00	001	56523566
EMAI	LS WITH I. IVANOVA RE TRANSITION SERVI	CES.			
05/17/19	Cruz, Mariel E.	0.20	199.00	001	56519197
	ESPOND WITH I. IVANOVA RE TSA AND PRE				30319197
05/17/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.50	345.00	001	56512027
	T M. CASEY WITH OBTAINING KEY DOCUMI	ENTATION NI	EEDED FROM WHI	ΓE & CASE TEA	AM FOR
CLOS	INGS.				
05/20/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	360.00	001	56531405
	WITH B. TRANSIER, T. WOLYNSKI AND WEI				
	TED UPDATES.				

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
MACO	Ivanova, Iliana Z. WITH W. TRANSIER REGARDING THE T QUARIE (.3); CALL WITH D. KOKINI REG ERENCE WITH M. CRUZ REGARDING TS	ARDING THE TSA I			
05/20/19 CONF	Cruz, Mariel E. ERENCE CALL WITH B. TRANSIER RE T	1.00 SA (0.5); CONFEREN	995.00 NCE CALL WITH N	001 MACQUARIE RI	56564151 E TSA (0.5).
	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH G. KASS (VEDDER) RE: MACQUA CALL WITH M. CRUZ RE: SAME (0.1).	0.30 RIE/WAYPOINT ISS	360.00 UES TO RESOLVE	001 E OPEN POINTS	56537824 ON APA
	Ivanova, Iliana Z. EW INVOICE FROM MACQUARIE (2); PRI ICE AMOUNTS (.4); REVISE LETTER PER			001 ERTING DISPU	56548754 TE OF
05/21/19 CALL	Cruz, Mariel E. WITH K. DIBLASI RE: MACQUARIE OPE	0.10 N ISSUES UNDER S	99.50 APA.	001	56563865
05/21/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP ON OBTAINING SALE CLOSING I	0.30 DOCUMENTS FOR M	207.00 Л. CASEY.	001	56729157
05/21/19 REVII	Son, Seung Wook EW MACQUARIE CLOSING SET.	0.10	56.00	001	56552949
05/22/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH I. ILANOVA RE TSA INVOICE.	0.40	560.00	001	56561913
MACO	Ivanova, Iliana Z. EW COMMENTS TO TSA INVOICE LETTE QUARIE REGARDING TSA INVOICE AND ISIER REGARDING LETTER (.1).		,	* *	

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index	
05/22/19 REVII	Cruz, Mariel E. EW AND COMMENT ON TSA DISPUTE LETTER	0.50 R.	497.50	001	56563916	
05/22/19 REVII	Son, Seung Wook EW MACQUARIE CLOSING SET.	0.20	112.00	001	56552937	
05/23/19 REVI	Son, Seung Wook EW MACQUARIE CLOSING SET.	2.20	1,232.00	001	56552908	
	Ivanova, Iliana Z. TI JOINT WRITTEN INSTRUCTIONS FOR RELE. ISFER TAXES.	0.20 ASE OF FUNI	175.00 OS FROM ESCROW	001 FOR THE MAL	56569663 .AYSIAN	
05/24/19 REVI	Cruz, Mariel E. EW AND RESPOND TO TSA INQUIRIES FROM I	0.10 R. BERGER.	99.50	001	56563389	
05/28/19 CALL	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH WEIL, B. TRANSIER, FTI AND T. WOLY	0.30 NSKI RE: TSA	360.00 A SERVICES UPDA	001 ГЕ.	56575389	
05/28/19 Ivanova, Iliana Z. 0.50 437.50 001 56574815 FINALIZE EXECUTED JOINT WRITTEN INSTRUCTIONS FOR THE MALAYSIA TAXES (.1); COORDINATE JOINT WRITTEN INSTRUCTIONS AND RELEASE OF FUNDS FROM TRANSFER TAX ESCROW ACCOUNT BETWEEN MACQUARIE AND WAYPOINT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH R. LEMONS RE: MACQUARIE TSA INVOICE LETTER (.1).						
05/28/19 REVII	Son, Seung Wook EW MACQUARIE CLOSING SET.	2.00	1,120.00	001	56597458	
	Goldring, Stuart J. L EXCHANGE WITH T. KELLY AND M. CRUZ I Z REGARDING SAME (.2).	0.50 REGARDING	800.00 TRANSFER TAXES	001 5 (.3); CALL WI	56613304 ГН М.	

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/31/19 CALL	Ivanova, Iliana Z. WITH T. WOLYNSKI RE: TSA INVOICE FR	0.30 OM MACQUARI	262.50 E.	001	56594803
05/31/19 ADDR	Berger, Ryan Alexander ESS INQUIRY FROM D. LIGNON RE PAYM	0.30 IENT OF TRANSI	207.00 FER FEE AND CHAI	001 RGE BACK UN	56680877 DER TSA.
SUBTOTA	L TASK 001 - 363 Asset Sales:	31.30	\$26,876.00		
05/01/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly EW FTI CLAIMS ANALYSIS.	0.10	120.00	009	56427264
05/03/19 EMAII	DiBlasi, Kelly L MEMO TO WEIL TEAM RE: CLAIM AND	0.50 RECOVERY ANA	600.00 ALYSIS.	009	56438341
05/03/19 REVIE	Carson, Candice M. EW ISSUES RE: WASCHEKA CLAIM.	1.40	1,393.00	009	56442715
05/03/19 DRAF	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos T WASHECKA CLAIM OBJECTION.	4.90	4,875.50	009	56443713
05/06/19 REVIE	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos EW WASHECKA EMPLOYMENT AGREEME	1.20 ENTS IN CONNEC	1,194.00 CTION WITH CLAIN	009 1 OBJECTION.	56484591
	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS WASHECKA CLAIM OBJECTION ASSIGNMENT (12).	0.30 Gnment with i	207.00 3. PODZIUS (.1); RE	009 VIEW AND RE	56451078 VISE
05/06/19 CONF	Podzius, Bryan R. ER WITH L. ALEXANDER RE: CLAIM OBJE	0.10 ECTIONS.	87.50	009	56729166
05/07/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.80	1,242.00	009	56454448

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
DRAI	FT PROPOSED ORDER FOR WASHECKA PR	ROOF OF CLAIM O	BJECTION.		
05/08/19 DISC	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS MARKUP OF WASHECKA CLAIM OBJ	1.20 IECTION WITH B. I	828.00 PODZIUS (1): REV	009 TEW AND REV	56458734 ISE
	HECKA CLAIM OBJECTION PER COMMEN				
05/08/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. EW AND REVISE WASHECKA CLAIM OBJ	0.60 ECTION.	525.00	009	56492620
05/09/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.30	207.00	009	56464846
REVI	EW AND REVISE WASHECKA CLAIM OBJ	ECTION AND CIRC	CULATE TO L. ALI	EXANDER FOR	REVIEW.
05/10/19 REVI	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos EW AND REVISE OBJECTION TO WASHEO	1.90 CKA PROOF OF CL	1,890.50 AIM.	009	56484308
05/10/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO QUERIES FROM L.	0.30 ALEXANDER RE	207.00 WASHECKA CLAI	009 M OBJECTION.	56469303
	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos L WITH B. PODZIUS AND T. WOLYNSKI RE M OBJECTION (.5).	0.60 E: WASHECKA CLA	597.00 AIM OBJECTION (.	009 1); REVISE WA	56525195 SHECKA
05/13/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT	0.20 CLAIMS OBJECTION	138.00 ON.	009	56487237
05/13/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. EW PROOF OF CLAIM ISSUE.	0.20	175.00	009	56569869
	Podzius, Bryan R. L WITH L. ALEXANDER RE: CLAIM OBJEC YNSKI AND L. ALEXANDER RE: SAME (.1)	* /-	262.50 CLAIM OBJECTION	009 ON (.1); CALL V	56570106 WITH T.

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/14/19 REVII	Lemons, Robert J. EW DRAFT OBJECTION TO WASHECKA CLA	0.30 AIM.	420.00	009	56496238
05/14/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH B. TRANSIER RE: PROOFS OF CLAIM	0.10 1 .	87.50	009	56674434
	Gershowitz, Gabriel LS AND CALLS WITH DIRECTORS/OFFICER DLINE AND D&O INSURANCE CLAIMS MAT				
05/16/19 ADDF	Berger, Ryan Alexander RESS PROOF OF CLAIM AND SEVERANCE II	0.30 NQUIRIES FROM	207.00 I FORMER EMPLO	009 YEE.	56500452
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND ADDRESS NON-DEBTOR SERVICE PANY.	0.50 ENTITY PROOF	345.00 OF CLAIM ISSUES	009 S WITH B. POD	56512012 ZIUS AND
05/21/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH L. ALEXANDER RE WASHECKA C	0.40 CLAIM OBJECTIO	560.00 DN.	009	56561903
)5/21/19 EMAI	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos LS WITH R. BERGER AND R. LEMONS RE: V	0.20 WASHECKA CLA	199.00 IM OBJECTION.	009	56572875
05/21/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS WASHECKA CLAIM OBJECTION ISSUE	0.30 S WITH L. ALEX	207.00 ANDER AND CON	009 SIDER ISSUES	56536160 RE: SAME.
05/22/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH W. TRANSIER AND L. ALEXANDE	0.20 ER RE WASHECK	280.00 A CLAIM OBJECT	009 ION.	56562231
05/22/19	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos	0.30	298.50	009	56572433

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	L CORRESPONDENCE WITH BILL TRANSIER, M OBJECTION.	R. LEMONS,	E. SOTO, AND R. BE	ERGER RE: WA	SHECKA
05/22/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander JSS WASHECKA CLAIM OBJECTION WITH L. A	0.10 ALEXANDER	69.00	009	56540583
05/23/19 ADDF	Berger, Ryan Alexander RESS PROOF OF CLAIM INQUIRIES FOR COMP.	0.10 ANY.	69.00	009	56545417
05/31/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH B. PODZIUS RE FILING OF WASF	0.10 HECKA CLAI	69.00 M OBJECTION.	009	56595067
	AL TASK 009 - Bar Date/Claims tion Issues:	19.10	\$17,675.00		
05/01/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND UPDATE WORK IN PROCESS LIST.	0.10	120.00	010	56428401
PRIOI COMI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE PRIORITY TASK LIST PER A RITY TASK LIST AND CIRCULATE TO TEAM F MENTS TO TRACKER PER TEAM COMMENTS A SE TASK TRACKER PER PARTNERS AND CIRC	OR COMMEN AND CIRCUI	NT (.2); REVIEW AND LATE TO PARTNERS	D INCORPOR <i>A</i> S FOR REVIEW	ATE (.3);
05/01/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. SE FTI TASK LIST (.2).	0.20	175.00	010	56753496
05/02/19 REVII	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE ADVISORS PRIORITY TASK	0.20 LIST PER AD	138.00 OVISORS CALL.	010	56428639
05/03/19 PREP	Fabsik, Paul ARE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE AND DISTRIBU	0.40 TE TO TEAM	150.00	010	56440547

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/05/19 REVIE	Berger, Ryan Alexander W AND UPDATE ADVISORS PRIORITY TASK	0.10 LIST.	69.00	010	56437033
	Berger, Ryan Alexander W AND UPDATE PRIORITY TASK LIST AND O DINATE FILINGS WITH P. FABSIK (.1).	0.30 CIRCULATE T	207.00 TO TEAM FOR COM	010 IMENT (.2);	56451088
	Berger, Ryan Alexander W AND REVISE PRIORITY TASK LIST AND C COMMENTS INTO PRIORITY TASK LIST AND			010 MENT (.4); INC	56458749 ORPORATE
05/09/19 PREPA	Fabsik, Paul Are Daily Docket Update and Distribu	0.40 TE TO TEAM	150.00	010	56487700
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND REVISE PRIORITY TASK TRACKER A RPORATE TEAM COMMENTS TO PRIORITY TA			` '	
05/13/19 UPDA	Foust, Rachael L. TE CASE CALENDAR.	0.80	552.00	010	56628273
05/15/19 REVIE	Berger, Ryan Alexander W AND UPDATE PRIORITY TASK LIST.	0.30	207.00	010	56497303
05/17/19 PREPA	Fabsik, Paul ARE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE AND DISTRIBU	0.40 TE TO TEAM	150.00	010	56528525
05/19/19 REVIE	Berger, Ryan Alexander W AND UPDATE ADVISORS PRIORITY TASK	0.20 LIST.	138.00	010	56514095
05/20/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.80	552.00	010	56531262

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
TEA	IEW ISSUE RE: PREPAYMENT (.2); REVIEW AND M FOR COMMENT (.3); REVISE ADVISORS TASK PREP FOR UPCOMING ADVISORS MEETING (.3	LIST PER T			
	Berger, Ryan Alexander L WITH B. PODZIUS RE STATUS OF PRIORITY T K LIST PER COMMENTS FROM ADVISORS ON C		207.00 EMS (.1); REVIEW	010 AND REVISE F	56536177 PRIORITY
	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND UPDATE PRIORITY TASK LIST AND C PRITY TASK LIST PER TEAM REVIEW AND CIRC			010 IMENT (.4); RE	56540590 VISE
05/23/19 REV	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND UPDATE PRIORITY TASK TRACKER I	0.20 PER ADVISO	138.00 R COMMENTS.	010	56545359
05/27/19 REV	Lemons, Robert J. IEW PRIORITY TASK TRACKER.	0.20	280.00	010	56562187
INCO	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND UPDATE PRIORITY TASK LIST AND C ORPORATE COMMENTS TO TASK TRACKER AN ORITY TASK MEETING WITH ADVISORS (.2).			· //	56559492 REP FOR
05/29/19 ASSI	Kleissler, Matthew ST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS FOR H	2.50 IEARING ON	600.00 MAY 30, 2019.	010	56669139
05/30/19 REV	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND UPDATE ADVISORS PRIORITY TASK	0.20 LIST PER LA	138.00 TEST DEVELOPME	010 ENTS.	56588190
05/31/19 REV	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND UPDATE PRIORITY TASK TRACKER.	0.20	138.00	010	56594940

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CAL TASK 010 - Case Administration/WIP Case Calendar:	11.30	\$6,524.00		
05/01/19 CON	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH C. CARSON RE WAC 10 BOARD M	0.10 IEETING.	69.00	011	56427259
	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW EXECUTED MEETING MINUTES FOR CO STANDING SIGNATURES FOR MINUTES (.1).		207.00 RDS (.2); FOLLOW	011 UP WITH DIRE	56428655 CTORS RE
	Berger, Ryan Alexander CUSS BOARD REQUIREMENTS WITH B. TRAI MUS RE DIRECTOR RESIGNATION ISSUE (.2).		276.00 RDINATE WITH CO	011 OMPANY AND	56435134 ALTER
	Berger, Ryan Alexander FT PROPOSED JOINT BOARD MEETING AGE RD MEETING AND BOARD REQUIREMENTS	* / *			56451054 IING
COM	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH B. TRANSIER AND COMPANY RE IPANY RE DIRECTOR RESIGNATION (.1); DIS ECTOR (.1).		,	. //	
	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND FILE EXECUTED SETS OF MEETIN TUS OF COMPANY MINUTE BOOK AND EXE	` '		011 H CAYMAN CO	56458798 DUNSEL RE
(.5);	Berger, Ryan Alexander RK WITH CAYMAN COUNSEL AND COMPAN REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SPONSOR QUER RDS RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTI	IES FROM R. LE			
05/10/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	2.10	1,449.00	011	56469300

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
COM COOI STAT REQU MEE	RDINATE COMPLETION OF OPEN ITEMS PANY (.2); DISCUSS UPCOMING BOARE RDINATE AND ARRANGE GLOBAL BOATEMENT AND PLAN (.6); CONFER WITH JIREMENTS (.4); REVIEW BOARD COMITING (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH TEAM AFT ISTEPS RE BOARD APPROVALS WITH IS	D REQUIREMENTS AN ARD MEETING FOR A DIRECTORS RE UPCO POSITIONS TO ENSUR ER REVIEWING QUO	ID BOARD MEET: PPROVAL OF AM DMING BOARD M RE QUORUMS FOI	INGS WITH TEA ENDED DISCLO IEETING AND F R GLOBAL BOA	AM (.2); OSURE BOARD ARD
	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH DIRECTORS RE UPCOMING E RESPONDENCE RE UPCOMING BOARD		276.00 ITS (.2); REVIEW	011 AND RESPOND	56469679 TO CASE
	Berger, Ryan Alexander FT SETS OF MEETING MINUTES (.9); AD ITING (.1).	1.00 DRESS CASE CORRE	690.00 SPONDENCE RE I	011 UPCOMING BO	56471343 ARD
05/13/19 EMA	Lemons, Robert J. ILS WITH R. BERGER RE BOARD MEETI	0.40 ING AND AGENDA.	560.00	011	56496249
UPCC CLOS REVI BOAI MEE ^T BOAI B. PO	Berger, Ryan Alexander RDINATE AND ARRANGE UPCOMING G OMING BOARD REQUIREMENTS (.3); FO SING DOCUMENTS (.3); DRAFT PROPOS. SE PROPOSED AGENDA PER COMMENT RD MEETING (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH D. FING (.2); REVISE BOARD MEETING AG RD MEETING ISSUES WITH TEAM (.2); P ODZIUS, AND R. LEMONS RE PLAN/DISC USSION WITH B. PODZIUS WITH RESPE	ELOW UP ON COMPA ED GLOBAL BOARD I IS FROM R. LEMONS CARO RE QUESTION ENDA PER TEAM AN PREPARE FOR BOARD CLOSURE STATEMEN	ANY REQUEST REMEETING AGENI (.1); PREPARE FO S IN ADVANCE O D B. TRANSIER C D MEETING (.5); C	E PULLING EXE DA (.3); REVIEW OR UPCOMING OF GLOBAL BO. COMMENTS (.2) ALL WITH H. Y	ECUTED V AND GLOBAL ARD ; DISCUSS V AZHARI,
05/13/19 PREP	Podzius, Bryan R. PARE FOR BOARD MEETING RE: PLAN N	1.80 NEGOTIATIONS (1.8).	1,575.00	011	56755803
05/14/19	Lemons, Robert J.	6.40	8,960.00	011	56496245

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	END BOARD MEETING (1.1); CONFER WITH WEILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE SAME (.7); CALLS WI		(//		· //
	DiBlasi, Kelly FICIPATE ON BOARD CALL RE: REVISED PROPO LOW-UP DISCUSSION WITH WEIL TEAM RE: SA		1,560.00 AND DISCLOSURE	011 E STATEMENT (56492637 (1.1);
UPCC MISS UPCC REQU UPCC AME REVI DISC (.6); I STAT FOLI DIST RE U CIRC	Berger, Ryan Alexander PARE BOARD DISTRIBUTIONS FOR ALL DIRECT DMING GLOBAL BOARD MEETING (.5); WORK ING DIRECTORS FOR QUORUM PURPOSES (.3); DMING GLOBAL BOARD MEETING (.5); CONFER- JIREMENTS (.3); WORK ON APPOINTMENTS OF DMING GLOBAL BOARD MEETING (.3); DRAFT INDED CHAPTER 11 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE ST EW (1.3); PREP FOR UPCOMING BOARD MEETING USS GOVERNANCE ISSUES, RELEASES, AND CONFAFT ADDITIONAL BOARD RESOLUTIONS FOR TEMENT (.5); PREP FOR, ATTEND, AND TAKE MOW UP DISCUSSION WITH TEAM ON NEXT STORIBUTION FOR GLOBAL BOARDS FOR UPCOMING RECONVENED GLOBAL BOARD MEETING ULATE TO DIRECTORS FOR SIGNATURE (.3); R ESCROW (.1).	WITH COMPA PREPARE T. WITH DIRE ALTERNAT WRITTEN RI FATEMENT A NG (.4); CAL LAIM OBJEC R OTHER BO EETING NOT EPS (1.5); PR NG BOARD ETING (.5); R	ANY ON APPOINTS FALKING POINTS FECTORS RE UPCOMES FOR QUORUM ESOLUTIONS APPEAND CIRCULATE TO A WITH B. PODZIUCTION IN ADVANCO ARDS APPROVINTES FOR GLOBAL EPARE STATUS UPEVISE BOARD RESERVISE BOARD RESERVISE BOARD RESERVISE PARE STATUS UPEVISE BOARD RESERVISE BOARD RESERVISE POINTES FOR GLOBAL EPARE STATUS UPEVISE BOARD RESERVISE BOARD RESERVISE POINTES FOR GLOBAL EPARE STATUS UPEVISE BOARD RESERVISE BOARD RESERVISE POINTES FOR GLOBAL EVISE BOARD RESERVISE POINTES FOR GLOBAL EVIS EVIS EVIS EVIS EVIS EVIS EVIS EVIS	ING ALTERNATOR R. LEMONS MING BOARD PURPOSES FOIR OVING SECONTO R. LEMONS IS AND A. JENK IS OF BOARD M IS OF BOARD M IS OF BOARD M IS PLAN/DISCL BOARD MEETI POATE AND INFER WITH DIIS SOLUTIONS AN	TES FOR S FOR R ND FOR LINS TO MEETING OSURE NG AND RECTORS
05/14/19 CALI TEAM	Berger, Ryan Alexander L WITH H. YAZHARI RE BOARD MEETING/RELE M.	0.30 EASE ISSUES	207.00 S AND FOLLOW UP	011 P DISCUSSION	56745541 WITH WEIL
	Podzius, Bryan R. L WITH A. JENKINS RE: BOARD MEETING (.7); R FICIPATE ON BOARD CALL RE: PLAN (1.6).	3.00 EVISE TALK	2,625.00 KING POINTS FOR	011 BOARD MEETI	56674436 NG (.7);
05/15/19	Lemons, Robert J.	1.70	2,380.00	011	56523473

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
PREP.	ARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD MEE	ETING (1.5); FOLLOW U	P CALL RE SAME	WITH WEIL TE	AM (.2).
05/15/19 PART	DiBlasi, Kelly ICIPATE ON BOARD CALL RE: PLAN	0.80 I AND DISCLOSURE ST	960.00 ATEMENT.	011	56496918
PREP PREP STAT NEGO	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH DIRECTORS RE UPCOMING ARE FOR GLOBAL BOARD MEETING ARE FOR AND ATTEND AND TAKE N US UPDATE FOR DIRECTORS (.2); FO DITIATIONS AND CONSEQUENCES (.2) PLAN (.5); DRAFT SETS OF MEETING	G (.2); GATHER AND RE MEETING NOTES FOR (DLLOW UP ON DIRECTO); PREPARE RESPONSE	VIEW EXECUTED GLOBAL BOARD M OR INQUIRIES RE	SIGNATURE PA MEETING (.9); PA STATUS OF	AGES (.4); REPARE
05/15/19 REVII	Podzius, Bryan R. EW AND RESPOND TO CORPORATE	0.20 GOVERNANCE INQUIR	175.00 LIES RE: LUXENBO	011 DURG ENTITY.	56569987
05/15/19 PART	Podzius, Bryan R. ICIPATE ON BOARD CALL RE: APPR	1.10 OVAL OF CHAPTER 11	962.50 PLAN.	011	56570235
5/16/19 DRAF	Berger, Ryan Alexander T OUTSTANDING SETS OF MEETING	1.30 G MINUTES.	897.00	011	56500409
5/16/19 DRAF	Podzius, Bryan R. T UPDATE TO DIRECTORS RE: CHA	1.30 PTER 11 PLAN.	1,137.50	011	56569980
05/20/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS AND DISCUSSION WITH W. TRAN	0.50 NSIER AND T. WOLYNS	700.00 SKI RE DIRECTOR	011 ISSUES.	56562165
05/20/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.00	690.00	011	56531118

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index			
JOIN AND ISLE	LOW UP WITH MALTA DIRECTOR RE QUERIES T BOARD MEETING AGENDA (.2); REVIEW AN CIRCULATE TO B. TRANSIER FOR REVIEW (.3 I (.1); CONFER WITH DIRECTORS RE UPCOMIN RD MEETING (.1).	D REVISE DE); DISCUSS D	RAFT AGENDA PER DIRECTOR RESIGNA	PARTNER COL ATION ISSUES	MMENT WITH T.			
REPI R. LI	Berger, Ryan Alexander LOW UP ON OBTAINING SALE CLOSING DOCU LACEMENT ISSUES WITH COMPANY (.2); DISC EMONS (.1); CONFER WITH DIRECTORS RE UPC PREPARE BOARD MATERIALS (.5); PREPARE S	USS GOVERN OMING BOA	NANCE AND BOAR ARD MEETING AND	D REQUIREME BOARD REQU	NTS WITH			
05/22/19 PREI	Lemons, Robert J. PARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD MEETING RE	1.50 PLAN.	2,100.00	011	56561981			
FOR, ARR ISSU	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD MEETING RE PLAN. 05/22/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 2.20 1,518.00 011 56540699 CONFER WITH DIRECTORS RE UPCOMING BOARD MEETING AND BOARD REQUIREMENTS (.5); PREPARE FOR, ATTEND AND TAKE MEETING NOTES FOR GLOBAL BOARD MEETING (.5); COORDINATE AND ARRANGE UPCOMING GLOBAL BOARD MEETING WITH DIRECTORS AND ADVISORS (.6); DISCUSS BOARD ISSUES WITH R. LEMONS (.1); FOLLOW UP ON LUXEMBOURG DIRECTOR QUERIES WITH B. PODZIUS AND G. GERSHOWITZ (.2); PREPARE STATUS UPDATE FOR DIRECTORS (.3).							
05/23/19 DRA	Lemons, Robert J. FT AND REVIEW EMAIL MEMOS TO DIRECTOR	3.80 RS RE PLAN I	5,320.00 REVISIONS.	011	56561900			
05/23/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	4.90	3,381.00	011	56545406			

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
GLO CIRO	PARE FOR UPCOMING GLOBAL BOARI BBAL BOARD MEETING (.3); DRAFT RES CULATE TO B. PODZIUS AND G. GERSE	SPONSES TO LUXEMB HOWITZ FOR REVIEW	OURG MANAGER (.4); REVIEW SHA	QUESTIONS A	ND
NEG UPD DIRI REV	O ANALYZE TO DETERMINE SHARE DIS GOTIATION (.7); REVIEW CHANGES TO PATE AND CREATE SUMMARY ANALY ECTORS REVIEW (.8); DISCUSS BOARD TIEW AND REVISE DRAFT STATUS UPD	PLAN AND DISCLOSU SIS OF CHANGES TO A MEETING AND BOAR DATE FOR DIRECTORS	RE STATEMENT A LUTHORIZED DOO D REQUIREMENT	AND PREPARE CUMENTS FOR IS WITH WEIL	ГЕАМ (.1);
05/24/19 PRE	REVIEW RE: CARTESIAN SHAREHOLDI Lemons, Robert J. PARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD CALL TRANSIER AND WEIL TEAM (1.0); FOLL	5.40 RE PLAN REVISIONS	* /*		56562147 AME WITH
05/24/19 PAR	DiBlasi, Kelly TICIPATE (PARTIAL) ON BOARD CALL	0.60 (0.5); EMAIL R. LEMO	720.00 NS RE: SAME (0.1	011	56552638
QUC RESO DIRI MEN LEM ADD MEN	Berger, Ryan Alexander PARE AND REVIEW ATTENDANCE LISTORUMS FOR ALL BOARDS (.2); DRAFT SOLUTION FOR SERVICES LLC APPROVECTORS/SPONSORS RE UPCOMING BOMBER'S RESOLUTION AND DISCLOSUR HONS (.2); PREPARE FOR, ATTEND, AND DISCLOS UP ISSUES FROM BOAIMBER'S RESOLUTION PER COMMENTS TING SHARES TO ADDRESS CARTESIAN	SETS OF MEETING MIN AL OF PLAN/DISCLOS ARD MEETING AND B E STATEMENT APPRO D TAKE MEETING NOT RD CALL RE DIRECTO FROM R. LEMONS (.6)	OUTES (.6); DRAF URE STATEMENT OARD REQUIREN OVAL GOVERNAN ES FOR GLOBAL R QUERIES (.4); R	F MEMBER'S F (.8); CONFER MENTS (.6); DISO ICE ISSUES WI' BOARD MEETI EVIEW AND RI	WITH CUSS IH R. ING (1); EVISE
05/27/19 EMA	Lemons, Robert J. AILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE BOARD ME	0.30 ETING.	420.00	011	56562295
05/27/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.90	1,311.00	011	56559587

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index	
REVIEW AND DRAFT PROPOSED JOINT BOARD AGENDA FOR BOARD MEETING (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH R. LEMONS RE SERVICES LLC AUTHORIZATION OF PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); DISCUSS UPCOMING BOARD REQUIREMENTS WITH TEAM (.1); REVISE MEMBER'S RESOLUTION PER COMMENTS FROM R. LEMONS AND CIRCULATE TO DIRECTORS FOR EXECUTION (.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH INTO 506(C) CLAIMANTS ENTITLEMENTS TO CONFIRM FOR CORPORATE GOVERNANCE PURPOSES (.3); REVISE AND CIRCULATE JOINT BOARD AGENDA FOR PARTNER SIGNOFF (.2); REVIEW AND GATHER RESOLUTION SIGNATURE PAGES (.1); COORDINATE AND ARRANGE BOARD MEETING (.4).						
05/28/19 PREP	DiBlasi, Kelly PARE FOR BOARD MEETING.	0.40	480.00	011	56575413	
RE U AND	05/28/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 1.90 1,311.00 011 56574685 REVIEW AND GATHER SIGNATURE PAGES FOR EXECUTED RESOLUTIONS (.2); CONFER WITH DIRECTORS RE UPCOMING BOARD REQUIREMENTS (.5); REVIEW AND CONSIDER BOARD DILIGENCE (.1); PREPARE FOR AND ARRANGE JOINT BOARD MEETING (.3); PREPARE STATUS UPDATE FOR DIRECTORS RE FILINGS (.4); DRAFT AGENDA AND BOARD MATERIALS FOR UPCOMING BOARD MEETING (.4).					
05/29/19 PREP	DiBlasi, Kelly PARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON BOARD CALL	1.00 RE: WAC10 SE	1,200.00 TTLEMENT.	011	56584746	
05/29/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 1.60 1,104.00 011 56584482 PREPARE FOR UPCOMING BOARD MEETING, INCLUDING ALL BOARD MATERIALS (.4); REVIEW AND GATHER SIGNATURE PAGES FOR PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RESOLUTION (.2); CONFER WITH DIRECTORS RE UPCOMING BOARD MEETING AND BOARD REQUIREMENTS (.4); PREPARE FOR, ATTEND, AND TAKE MEETING NOTES FOR JOINT BOARD MEETING (.6).						
05/30/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 2.00 1,380.00 011 56588182 PREPARE STATUS UPDATE FOR DIRECTORS RE UPCOMING COURT HEARING AND LATEST FILINGS (.4); DRAFT SETS OF MEETING MINUTES FOR BOARD MEETINGS (.9); COMPILE AND PREPARE EXECUTED COPY OF MEMBER'S RESOLUTION FOR PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AUTHORIZATION AND SEND TO COMPANY RECORDS (.3); CONFER WITH DIRECTORS RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.4).						
05/31/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.80	552.00	011	56595014	

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	W AND MAIL ORIGINAL SIGNATURES RECEI' OF MEETING MINUTES (.6).	VED TO CO	MPANY RECORDS (.2); CONTINUE	E DRAFTING
	L TASK 011 - Securities/Governance:	79.50	\$72,515.00		
05/09/19 EMAII	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH C. CARSON RE BANK ACCOUNTS.	0.30	420.00	013	56602233
05/16/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander ISS INTEREST BEARING ACCOUNT ISSUES WI	0.20 TH D. LIGN	138.00 ON AND TEAM.	013	56500441
	L TASK 013 - DIP Financing/Cash nt/Cash Collateral:	0.50	\$558.00		
05/01/19 REVIE	Lemons, Robert J. W REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND F	2.30 EXHIBITS.	3,220.00	014	56439654
05/01/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly W FURTHER REVISED DRAFT DISCLOSURE S	0.80 TATEMENT	960.00	014	56427460
05/01/19 REVIE (1.0).	Carson, Candice M. W AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.5)	1.50 ; CALL WIT	1,492.50 H R. BERGER RE: D	014 ISCLOSURE ST	56442681 FATEMENT
COMM DISCL WITH ALL C	Berger, Ryan Alexander W PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGENOMENTS INTO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.5); OSURE STATEMENT AND LIQUIDATION ANA C. CHENG AND FOLLOW UP WITH K. DIBLASIOMMENTS RECEIVED (1.4); REVIEW, REVISE, JANT TO COMMENTS FROM R. LEMONS AND	CONFER WI' LYSIS (.4); I I (.3); REVIS AND UPDA	TH C. CARSON ANE DISCUSS STATUS O E AMENDED DISCL TE AMENDED DISC	DB. PODZIUS F F GUC POOL A OSURE STATE CLOSURE STAT	RE ANALYSIS EMENT PER FEMENT

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/02/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON ADDITIONAL	0.20 ISSUES RE: DISCLOS	240.00 URE STATEMENT	014	56430037
	Carson, Candice M. WITH R. BERGER RE: DISCLOSURE ST EMENT (1.0); CALL WITH R. BERGER A				56442721
COMN DISCI COMN LIQUI DISCI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEME MENTS (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE AME LOSURE STATEMENT (.3); REVIEW AN MENTS TO DATE AND SEND TO K. DIB IDATION ANALYSIS WITH FTI AND C. LOSURE STATEMENT AND PREPARE DE MENT FOR B. TRANSIER AND U.S. TR	ENDED DISCLOSURE D REVISE DISCLOSU LASI AND R. LEMON CARSON (.2); FOLLO DISTRIBUTIONS AND	STATEMENT (.4); RE STATEMENT T IS FOR REVIEW (1 W UP WITH WEIL SUMMARIES OF I	REVISE COMM TO INCORPORA .7); DISCUSS UI TEAM RE: PLA PLAN AND DISC	IENTS TO TE ALL PDATED N AND
05/03/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON ADDITIONAL	0.30 REVISIONS TO DRAF	360.00 T DISCLOSURE S	014 ΓΑΤΕΜΕΝΤ.	56438522
05/03/19 DRAF	Carson, Candice M. T CHANGES TO DISCLOSURE STATEM	0.30 MENT.	298.50	014	56442917
	Berger, Ryan Alexander ER WITH TEAM RE DISCLOSURE STA' OSURE STATEMENT PER K. DIBLASI		414.00 S (.2); REVIEW AND	014 D REVISE AME	56435137 NDED
05/06/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON ADDITIONAL	0.10 PROPOSED REVISION	120.00 NS TO THE DISCLO	014 OSURE STATEN	56451157 ИЕNТ.
	Carson, Candice M. T CHANGES TO DISCLOSURE STATEM EMENT (0.1).	0.30 MENT (0.2); CALL WIT	298.50 TH R. BERGER RE:	014 DISCLOSURE	56460871

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index		
DISCI REVIS CONS	05/06/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 1.70 1,173.00 014 56451060 DISCUSS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REVISIONS WITH C. CARSON (.1); REVIEW TRANSFERRED AIRCRAFT DISCLOSURE (.2); REVIEW AND CONSIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGENCE (.1); FURTHER REVISE THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CIRCULATE TO TEAM FOR REVIEW (.6); REVIEW AND CONSIDER REVISIONS TO VARIOUS ANALYSES PREPARED BY FTI BASED ON CERTAIN CASE ACTIONS AND MAKE CORRESPONDING EDITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.7).						
05/06/19 REVII	Podzius, Bryan R. EW SOLICITATION PROCEDURES MOTION.	0.10	87.50	014	56729165		
05/07/19 REVII	Lemons, Robert J. EW EMAILS FROM FTI RE RECOVERY ANALY	0.60 SES.	840.00	014	56601955		
05/07/19 REVII	Carson, Candice M. EW ISSUES RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	0.20	199.00	014	56460887		
WITH DISCI UPDA	05/07/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 2.00 1,380.00 014 56454394 PARTICIPATE ON ADVISORS PRE-CALL RE PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH ADVISORS RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN COMMENTS (1); REVIEW ISSUES RE POTENTIAL DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (.2); CALL WITH C. CHENG RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT UPDATED ANALYSES (.2); REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGENCE AND MAKE CORRESPONDING EDITS (.2).						
	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH C. CARSON AND R. BERGER RE: DISCL E (.1);CALL WITH R. FOUST AND L. SANCHEZ (* / *				
05/07/19 REVII	Foust, Rachael L. EW SOLICITATION MATERIALS AND COORDII	0.40 NATE WITH 1	276.00 KCC.	014	56627663		
05/08/19 REVII	Carson, Candice M. EW ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH WASHECK.	0.30 A DISCLOSU	298.50 RE STATEMENT O	014 BJECTION.	56460874		

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index			
STATI DISCL	05/08/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 1.60 1,104.00 014 56458839 REVIEW AND CONSIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGENCE (.1); REVIEW ISSUES RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.2); DISCUSS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EDITS WITH C. CARSON (.1); DRAFT OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (1.2).							
05/08/19 CALLS	Foust, Rachael L. S WITH KCC REGARDING SOLICITATION PRO	0.60 OCESS (0.4); R	414.00 EVIEW SOLICITAT	014 TION MATERIA	56627652 LS (0.2).			
05/08/19 RESEA	Lee, Kathleen ARCH RESPONSES TO DISCLOSURE STATEM	0.50 ENT OBJECTI	210.00 ONS.	014	56474420			
05/08/19 RESEA	Fabsik, Paul ARCH DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION	1.10 RESPONSES	412.50 PER R. BERGER.	014	56458722			
(1.5); H	05/09/19 Lemons, Robert J. 2.50 3,500.00 014 56602114 CALL WITH A. SCHWARTZ RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN AND REVISE BOTH ACCORDINGLY (1.5); REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS AND EMAILS WITH WEIL TEAM AND CLIENT RE SAME (1.0).							
05/09/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly EW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION FI	0.10 LED BY WASI	120.00 HECKA.	014	56464433			
05/09/19 ATTEI (0.2).	Carson, Candice M. NTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.2); CA	0.40 ALL WITH R. I	398.00 BERGER RE: DISCI	014 LOSURE STATE	56480580 EMENT			
05/09/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	5.00	3,450.00	014	56464837			

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index	
DISCUSS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT WITH C. CARSON (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH B. PODZIUS RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING AND OBJECTION DEADLINE ISSUES (.3); DRAFT EDITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR RECOVERIES CHANGES AND CIRCULATE TO C. CARSON AND B. PODZIUS FOR COMMENT (1.0); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT BASED ON COMMENTS FROM C. CARSON AND FTI (.4); CONFER WITH R. LEMONS RE U.S. TRUSTEE COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); REVIEW AND CONSIDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS AND PROVIDE SUMMARY FOR TEAM (.4); INCORPORATE PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT COMMENTS FROM R. LEMONS PER U.S. TRUSTEE COMMENTS (.4); PROVIDE STATUS UPDATE TO B. TRANSIER RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (.1); DAFT RESPONSE TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (2.1).						
	Berger, Ryan Alexander WITH B. PODZIUS TO DISCUSS DISCLOSURE S OVAL NEEDED, AND OTHER ISSUES TO ADDRI		276.00 OBJECTIONS RES	014 PONSE, BOARI	56745435 D	
05/10/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH K. DIBLASI, C. CARSON, AND R. BERC	0.80 GER RE DISC	1,120.00 CLOSURE STATEM	014 ENT OBJECTIC	56477962 ON ISSUES.	
05/10/19 REVII SAME	DiBlasi, Kelly EW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS AN	1.90 ND DRAFT C	2,280.00 OUTLINE RE: PROPO	014 OSED RESPONS	56469921 SES TO	
DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS W USS DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY A LOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS REPLY (.8).		`	**		
05/12/19 WORI	Berger, Ryan Alexander K ON PRELIMINARY STATEMENT FOR DISCLO	0.20 SURE STAT	138.00 EMENT OBJECTIO	014 NS REPLY.	56471369	
	Carson, Candice M. WITH R. BERGER RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMEN BERG RE: RESOLUTION OF WASHECKA DISCL				56510139 AND J.	
05/13/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	6.30	4,347.00	014	56487416	

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
AMEN WITH STATI ANAL OBJEC DISCI DILIG REVIS	ISS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION RESIDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO CONFORMA. JENKINS RE PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER RECEIVED EDITS (1.9); FOLLOW UYSIS FOR WASHECKA OBJECTION DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.2); CALL WIOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.2); REVIEW ENCE (.2); PREPARE SUMMARY ANALYSIS FOR ED DRAFT OF FURTHER AMENDED DISCLOSURE (2.0).	M WITH PLANT CHANGE P AND DISC RE STATEM TH WASHE AND INCO R TEAM FO	AN WITH B. PODZIUSS QUERIES (.1); RECUSS WITH FTI TEA ENT RESPONSE (.5) CKA COUNSEL ANI RPORATE PLAN/DIS R RESOLVING OBJI	US (.1); FOLLOW VISE DISCLOS M RE NEEDEE ; DISCUSS WA D C. CARSON F SCLOSURE STA ECTION (.7); UI	W UP URE O SHECKA RE ATEMENT PDATE
05/13/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS ADDRESS/MAIL ISSUES WITH KCC FOR DIS	0.20 SCLOSURE	138.00 STATEMENT/SOLIC	014 CITATION.	56745540
05/13/19 UPDA	Foust, Rachael L. TE SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS.	0.70	483.00	014	56628288
05/14/19 REVIE	Lemons, Robert J. EW AND REVISE REPLY TO DISCLOSURE STAT	4.40 EMENT OB	6,160.00 JECTIONS.	014	56496239
05/14/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: STRATEGY IN CONNECTION WI	0.20 ITH HEARIN	240.00 NG TO APPROVE DI	014 SCLOSURE ST.	56492634 ATEMENT.
05/14/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH R. BERGER RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMEN	0.50 NT (.1); REV	497.50 TEW DISCLOSURE S	014 STATEMENT (.	56510172 4).
05/14/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	6.90	4,761.00	014	56492654

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index	
REVISE AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); REVIEW AND CONSIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGENCE (.5); REVIEW PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES AND POTENTIAL SOLUTIONS (.4); DRAFT PROPOSED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT LANGUAGE TO RESOLVE WASHECKA DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.5); DISCUSS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION REPLY WITH B. PODZIUS (.2); PREPARE REVISED PROPOSED LANGUAGE TO RESOLVE WASHECKA OBJECTION AND DISCUSS WITH WASHECKA COUNSEL (.6); DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OMNIBUS REPLY TO OBJECTIONS AND CIRCULATE TO R. LEMONS FOR REVIEW (3); PARTICIPATE ON CALL TO DISCUSS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN ISSUES AND NEXT STEPS (.8); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY PURSUANT TO COMMENTS FROM R. LEMONS (.5).						
05/14/19 CALI	Berger, Ryan Alexander ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING OPE	0.10 N ITEMS WI	69.00 TH C. STAUBLE.	014	56747757	
05/14/19 CONI	Podzius, Bryan R. FER WITH R. BERGER RE: DISCLOSURE STATE	0.30 MENT REPL	262.50 Y.	014	56674435	
05/14/19 REVI	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TI	1.50 MELINE AN	1,035.00 D SOLICITATION M	014 IATERIALS.	56628882	
STAT	Lemons, Robert J. ILS WITH W. TRANSIER, WEIL TEAM AND LEN EMENT APPROVAL HEARING (1.1); CONFER W LOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.5).				56523381 RE:	
OF D	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM WEIL TE ISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (0.3); REVII TIAL) AND R. LEMONS RE: DISCLOSURE STAT	EW ISSUES I	RE: SAME (0.7); CON	NFER WITH B.	TRANSIER	
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	3.80	2,622.00	014	56497285	

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index		
REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS OMNIBUS REPLY AND CIRCULATE REVISED DRAFT TO TEAM FOR REVIEW (1.6); DISCUSS REVISED DRAFT REPLY WITH TEAM (.1); REVIEW AND CONSIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGENCE (.2); REVIEW ISSUES RE NEXT STEPS FOR RESOLVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN ISSUES AND HEARING (.3); WORK ON ADJOURNMENT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING AND COORDINATE WITH OBJECTING PARTIES (.3); REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION REPLY AND REVISE (.3); CONFORM DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO PLAN EDITS (1).							
05/15/19 REVIS	Foust, Rachael L. SE SOLICITATION MATERIALS (1.3); CORRESPO	1.60 OND WITH	1,104.00 KCC RE: SAME (.3).	014	56628370		
05/16/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: STRATEGY IN CONNECTION W	0.60 ITH DISCLO	720.00 OSURE STATEMENT	014	56500406		
REVII DISCI	05/16/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 2.60 1,794.00 014 56500423 REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING ISSUES AND FOLLOW UP WITH R. LEMONS AND KCC (.4); REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN RESEARCH ISSUES (.4); FOLLOW UP WITH R. LEMONS RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RESEARCH ISSUES (.1); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1); REVIEW AND REVISE OMNIBUS REPLY TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.7).						
FOR I	05/17/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 2.40 1,656.00 014 56512014 UPDATE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT INSERT PER DATA PREPARED BY FTI (.4); REVIEW RESEARCH ISSUES FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT INSERT (.5); REVIEW AND REVISE OMNIBUS REPLY TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (1.5).						
05/20/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH R. BERGER RE DISCLOSURE STATEM	0.50 ENT EDITS	700.00	014	56562091		
05/20/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	3.40	2,346.00	014	56531052		

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index	
WORK ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN RELEASES/EXCULPATION RESEARCH QUESTIONS (.3); WORK ON CHART WITH FTI FOR AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE REMAINING ASSETS OF DEBTORS FOR INSERT (.8); FOLLOW UP WITH C. CHENG AND REVISE AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER R. LEMONS COMMENTS (.8); DISCUSS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TIMELINE AND SOLICITATION ISSUES WITH KCC (.2); REVIEW AND UPDATE FURTHER AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OMNIBUS REPLY PER B. TRANSIER COMMENTS (1.0); RESEARCH SPONSOR INQUIRY RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN INQUIRY (.1).						
	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH B. TRANSIER RE: DISCLOSURE STATEM DW-UP CONFERENCE WITH R. LEMONS RE: SA		720.00 NG AND RELATED	014 PLAN ISSUES	56537767 (0.5);	
DISCU DISCL	Berger, Ryan Alexander W AND CONSIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATE ISS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION RE OSURE STATEMENT REPLY WITH RESPECT T MENT (.9).	PLY (.4); RE	VIEW AND REVISE	AND SUPPLEM	MENT	
05/22/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 4.50 3,105.00 014 56540616 REIVEW ISSUES RE: PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RELEASE NEGOTIATIONS (.3); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH B. PODZIUS RE DRAFTING PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AMENDMENTS (.2); DRAFT PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AMENDMENTS PURSUANT TO AGREEMENT WITH LENDERS RE RELEASES AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OVERSIGHT BOARD (1.1); CALL FROM LITIGATION TEAM RE UPDATE ON RELEASE NEGOTIATIONS (.1); REVIEW ISSUES RE: AMENDED PLAN RELEASES (.3); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER SAME (.5); WORK WITH C. CHENG ON UPDATING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REMAINING ASSETS CHART (.3); DISCUSS REVISIONS TO RELEASES WITH R. LEMONS (.2); MAKE FURTHER REVISIONS TO THE RELEASES PER COMMENTS FROM R. LEMONS (.8); REVIEW AND MAKE CONFORMING REVISIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER PLAN NEGOTIATIONS (.7).						
05/23/19 REVIE	Lemons, Robert J. W DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.1); DISCUSS S	1.50 SAME WITH	2,100.00 R. BERGER (.4).	014	56562288	
05/23/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	2.20	1,518.00	014	56545307	

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index	
AND LEM	K ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RESEARCH IS CONSIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DI ONS RE UPDATED VERSIONS OF PLAN AND DIS K WITH FTI ON ADDRESSING ESCROWED FUN	ILIGENCE (.4 SCLOSURE S	4); FOLLOW UP AN STATEMENT AND I	D DISCUSS WI	TH R.	
CON	Berger, Ryan Alexander EK WITH FTI TO UPDATE DISCLOSURE STATEM SIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGE EARCH AND DRAFT RELATED MEMO AND CIRC	NCE (.1); CO	NDUCT DISCLOSU	JRE STATEMEN		
05/25/19 EMA	Lemons, Robert J. ILS WITH D. WENDER AND WEIL TEAM RE DIS	0.70 CLOSURE S	980.00 FATEMENT OBJEC	014 CTION.	56561972	
FOLI RELI LEM	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND CONSIDER COMMENTS TO DISCLOSU LOW UP WITH TEAM AND T. WOLYNSKI WITH I EASES/EXCULPATION AND OTHER DISCLOSUR ONS AND K. DIBLASI (1.2); CONFORM DISCLOS H LENDERS, AND ADD INSERT TO DISCLOSURE	RESPECT TH E STATEME URE STATE!	IERETO (.8); FOLLO NT ISSUES PER CO MENT TO PLAN TO	OW UP RESEAR OMMENTS FRO O INCORPORAT	RCH RE M R. TE DEAL	
	Lemons, Robert J. L WITH R. BERGER RE DISCLOSURE STATEMEN LOSURE STATEMENT (3.0).	3.60 NT MOTION	5,040.00 REPLY (.6); REVIE	014 W AND REVISE	56562201	
STAT DISC MAR REV	05/26/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 6.30 4,347.00 014 56553273 CALL WITH R. LEMONS TO DISCUSS RESEARCH AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND REVISIONS AND NEXT STEPS (.6); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.7); DISCUSS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN DILIGENCE QUERIES WITH KCC (.3); REVIEW AND CONSIDER MARKUP OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PROVIDE RESPONSES/FOLLOW UP TO R. LEMONS (.5); REVIEW, REVISE, AND SUPPLEMENT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY FOLLOWING DEAL REACHED WITH OBJECTORS AND OTHER MATERIAL CHANGES (4.2).					
05/26/19	Foust, Rachael L.	0.50	345.00	014	56628254	

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
REVIS	SE SOLICITATION/CONFIRMATION TIME	ELINE AND CIRCUL	ATE SAME.		
05/27/19	Lemons, Robert J.	5.50	7,700.00	014	56562178
REVII	EW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEM	ENT REPLY.			
05/27/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	5.80	4,002.00	014	56559613
DISCU	USS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY C	COMMENTS WITH R	. LEMONS (.1); WO	ORK WITH FTI	ТО
	TE DISCLOSED REMAINING ASSETS AM		* **		
REVIS	SE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY PE	R COMMENTS FRO	M R. LEMONS (.9)	FOLLOW UP V	WITH FTI,
KCC,	AND M&A TEAM ON COMMENTS TO A	MENDED DISCLOSU	JRE STATEMENT ((.4); REVIEW, R	EVISE,
AND	COMMENT ON UPDATED DRAFT OF DIS	SCLOSURE STATEM	ENT REPLY (1.1);	REVISE DRAFT	ΓOF
	LOSURE STATEMENT REPLY TO OBJECT				W (2.2);
REVII	EW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMI	ENT PER COMMENT	ΓS FROM R. LEMO	NS (.8).	
05/28/19	Lemons, Robert J.	5.30	7,420.00	014	56601827
	EW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEM	` '.		SE DISCLOSUR	E
STAT	EMENT AND PLAN AND EMAILS WITH I	R. BERGER RE SAM	E (4.3).		
05/28/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.70	3,240.00	014	56575414
REVII	EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT REPLY T	TO DISCLOSURE ST.	ATEMENT OBJEC	ΓΙΟΝS (1.4); CC	NFERENCE
	R. BERGER RE: SAME (0.2); REVIEW AN				
	EXHIBITS (0.7); CONFERENCE WITH R. F	OUST RE: SAME (0.	3); REVIEW ISSUE	S IN CONNECT	TION WITH
DISCI	LOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (0.1).				
05/28/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	11.50	7,935.00	014	56574751

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index			
INCORPORATE UPDATED DATA FROM FTI INTO AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3); REVIEW, REVISE AND COMMENT ON REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY (2); SUPPLEMENT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY WITH ADDITIONAL SUPPORT AND TABLE OF CHANGES MADE (1); REVISE DRAFT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY AND CIRCULATE TO TEAM FOR REVIEW (.7); WORK ON FURTHER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY EDITS (.6); CALL WITH C. CHENG RE ISSUES RAISED BY COMPANY RE CURRENT CASH BALANCES (.4); REVIEW, SUPPLEMENT AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY PER TEAM COMMENTS AND ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FROM ADVISORS TO INCORPORATE (3.5); WORK ON REVISED VERSION OF FURTHER AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO GET READY FOR FILING (1); WORK WITH C. CHENG TO PREPARE AND REVIEW FINAL DATA FOR INCLUSION IN AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND REVISED FILING (.8); CONFER WITH K. DIBLASI RE: REPLY (1.2).								
05/28/19 CALLS	Berger, Ryan Alexander S WITH B. PODZIUS AND C. CHENG RE DISCLO	0.50 DSURE STATEM	345.00 IENT/DISCLOSURE	014 STATEMENT	56747164 REPLY.			
	Berger, Ryan Alexander TE REVISED DRAFTS OF DISCLOSURE STATE S WITH COVER LETTER FOR B. TRANSIER RE		345.00 ND PREPARE CLEA	014 AN AND REDL	56758826 INE			
05/28/19 REVIE	Podzius, Bryan R. EW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY.	0.50	437.50	014	56683297			
05/28/19 REVII	Podzius, Bryan R. EW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY.	0.50	437.50	014	56758827			
	05/28/19 Foust, Rachael L. 4.50 3,105.00 014 56628843 REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS (3.9); PREPARE NOTICE OF FILING (0.3); CONFER WITH K. DIBLASI RE: ORDER AND EXHIBITS (.3).							
05/29/19 REVIE PROCI	Holtzer, Gary T. SW INCOMING MATERIALS ON DISCLOSURE S ESS.	0.30 STATEMENT AN	480.00 ND RELATED WIP M	014 MATTERS ON F	56585505 PLAN			
05/29/19	Lemons, Robert J.	3.50	4,900.00	014	56602086			

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
REVI	EW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STAT	EMENT AND DISCLOS	URE STATEMENT	MOTION REPL	Y.
05/29/19 PREP	DiBlasi, Kelly ARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	0.10 HEARING.	120.00	014	56584744
PLAN TABI COM STAT REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND REVISE REPLY AND CIRCUMISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGEN LE PER UPDATED INFORMATION AND MENT ON ANALYSES PREPARED BY TEMENT HEARING (.5); WORK WITH A EW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT BALA LOSURE STATEMENT REPLY AND PROCESSED	NCE (.4); REVIEW AND I D DATA FROM FTI ANI KCC FOR DISCLOSURI ADVISORS RE PREPAR NCE ISSUES (1.1); REV	REVISE REMAINII D COMPANY (.4); I E STATEMENT AN ATION OF FINAL	NG MATERIAL REVIEW AND ND DISCLOSUR ITEMS FOR FIL	ASSETS E INGS (.2);
	Inglis, Suzanne ST WITH PREPARATION OF HEARING 2019 AND SUBMIT TO U.S. TRUSTEE.	1.60 G MATERIALS FOR DIS	616.00 CLOSURE STATEI	014 MENT HEARIN	56594921 G ON
05/29/19 ASSI: 5/30/2	Stauble, Christopher A. ST WITH PREPARATION OF HEARING 2019.	4.90 G MATERIALS FOR DIS	1,984.50 CLOSURE STATEI	014 MENT HEARIN	56585721 G ON
	Karkat, Sakina ST WITH PREPARATION OF HEARING 2019 AND SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS.	1.20 G MATERIALS FOR DIS	426.00 CLOSURE STATE	014 MENT HEARIN	56619265 G ON
05/29/19 ASSIS	Peene, Travis J. ST WITH PREPARATION OF THE MAY	5.20 7 30, 2019 HEARING MA	1,248.00 ATERIALS RE: DIS	014 CLOSURE STA	56597501 TEMENT.
05/29/19	Fabsik, Paul	3.00	1,125.00	014	56585725

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index			
REVISE AND FILE DEBTORS' OMNIBUS REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DEBTORS' DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.6); REVISE AND FILE SECOND AMENDED CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF LIQUIDATION OF WAYPOINT LEASING HOLDINGS LTD. AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS (.6); REVISE AND FILE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR SECOND AMENDED CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF LIQUIDATION OF WAYPOINT LEASING HOLDINGS LTD. AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS (.6); REVISE AND FILE NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED PROPOSED ORDER (I) APPROVING (A) PROPOSED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, (B) SOLICITATION AND VOTING PROCEDURES, (C) NOTICE AND OBJECTION PROCEDURES FOR CONFIRMATION OF DEBTORS' PLAN, AND (II) GRANTING RELATED RELIEF (.6); PREPARE NOTICE OF FILING OF REDLINES FOR SECOND AMENDED CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF LIQUIDATION AND NEWLY-FILED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.6).								
05/30/19 REVI	Goldring, Stuart J. EW EMAILS FROM WEIL TEAM REGARDING I	0.20	320.00	014	56749531			
KL VI	EW EMPALS TROW WELE TEAM REGARDING	DISCLOSURI		M110 (.2).				
05/30/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.30	2,760.00	014	56589833			
	ARE FOR HEARING ON SOLICITATION PROCI	, ,	•					
	SIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, PLAN A							
	OLTZER AND R. LEMONS RE: SAME (0.3); CAL EW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DISCLOSUR				E (0.1);			
KE VI	LW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DISCESSOR	CL STATEWIL	IVI ORDER AND EA	.IIIDI13 (0.3).				
05/30/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	3.20	2,208.00	014	56588168			
REVI	EW ISSUES RE: PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEME	ENT DILIGEN	CE AND PLAN/DISC	CLOSURE STAT	EMENT			
	MENTS (1.0); REVIEW, REVISE AND INCORPO							
STAT	EMENT (1.6); PREPARE REVISED DRAFT OF D	DISCLOSURE	STATEMENT FOR U	J.S. TRUSTEE R	EVIEW (.6).			
05/30/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.70	483.00	014	56588251			
	WITH WEIL TEAM TO DISCUSS CHANGES/E							
	EMENT FOLLOWING DISCLOSURE STATEME RPORATION INTO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT		i (.6); REVIEW PLAI	N DILIGENCE F	OR			
INCO	RI ORATION INTO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	(.1).						
05/31/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.40	560.00	014	56601990			
	ILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE A. SCHWARTZ PLA							
					-			
05/31/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	2.30	1,587.00	014	56595076			
-			*					

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index				
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/SOLICITATION QUERIES FROM KCC AND FTI (.8); ADDRESS FOLLOW UP INQUIRIES FROM C. CHENG RE PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/SOLICITATION (.2); REVIEW, REVISE AND PREPARE CLEAN AND MARKED COPIES OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR COURT (.5); DISCUSS DISTRIBUTION OF ESCROW FEES PER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT WITH B. PODZIUS AND FTI (.1); REVIEW AND CONSIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT COMMENTS FROM U.S. TRUSTEE AND DISCUSS WITH TEAM (.3); REVIEW AND ANALYZE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING TRANSCRIPT IN LIGHT OF U.S. TRUSTEE COMMENTS (.3); DISCUSS TIMELINE AND NEXT STEPS WITH TEAM (.1).									
05/31/19 REV	Foust, Rachael L. ISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT SOLICIT	0.80 ATION DOCUMENT	552.00 FS.	014	56628422				
	AL TASK 014 - Disclosure t/Solicitation/Voting:	184.50	\$153,226.50						
05/01/19 DISC	Berger, Ryan Alexander CUSS WITH D. LIGNON RE SEVERANCE	0.40 ISSUE (.3); REVIEW	276.00 ISSUES RE: SAME (015	56427739				
05/02/19 DISC	Berger, Ryan Alexander CUSS REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES	0.20 WITH FTI.	138.00	015	56732022				
05/05/19 FOLI	Berger, Ryan Alexander LOW UP WITH D. LIGNON RE AUSTRAL	0.10 IAN SEVERANCE I	69.00 SSUE.	015	56437056				
05/07/19 DISC	Berger, Ryan Alexander CUSS STATUS OF SEVERANCE ISSUE W	0.10 ITH D. LIGNON.	69.00	015	56754433				
05/08/19 EMA	Lemons, Robert J. ILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE SEVERANCE	0.50 ISSUE.	700.00	015	56602059				
	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW SEVERANCE ISSUES WITH D. LIGN DLUTION FOR WEIL TEAM (.5).	0.70 ION AND AUDITOR	483.00 (.2); DRAFT AND A	015 NALYSIS OF SI	56754694 EVERANCE				

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/09/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH WEIL TEAM RE SEVERANCE QUEST	0.30 ΓΙΟΝ.	420.00	015	56602018
05/10/19 REVI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: EMPLOYEE SEVERANCE AND	0.10 EMAIL WEIL	120.00 TEAM RE: SAME.	015	56469946
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND ANALYZE EMPLOYEE EXPENSE REI D. LIGNON RE EMPLOYEE EXPENSE ISSUES I			015 OW UP WITH 0	56492685 C. CARSON
05/15/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP RE SEVERANCE ISSUE.	0.20	138.00	015	56497289
05/16/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP RE EMPLOYEE EXPENSE REIMBURSE	0.40 EMENT ISSUE.	276.00	015	56500435
05/17/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH D. LIGNON RE EMPLOYEE PREI	0.20 PETITION EXP	138.00 ENSE REIMBURSE	015 EMENT ISSUES	56512005
05/21/19 ADDF	Berger, Ryan Alexander RESS ISSUE WITH R. LIKELY RE; ESTATE EXP	0.20 PENSE REIMBU	138.00 JRSEMENT.	015	56732062
05/22/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW ISSUES RE: FORMER EMPLOYEE REIMBU	0.10 IRSEMENT.	69.00	015	56732065
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIM (0.1); DRAI B. TRANSIER RE: SEVERANCE CLAIM (.1).	0.70 FT EMAIL MEN	840.00 MO TO B. TRANSII	015 ER RE: SAME (0	56552646 0.5); CALL
05/24/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP ON AND ADDRESS SEVERANCE ISSU	0.30 E WITH WEIL	207.00 TEAM AND COMP	015 ANY (.3).	56552549

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/31/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH FORMER EMPLOYEE RE EXP	0.20 ENSE REIMBUR	138.00 SEMENT.	015	56680876
SUBTOTA	AL TASK 015 - Employee Issues:	5.20	\$4,564.00		
05/01/19 REVI	Holtzer, Gary T. EW WIP MATERIALS.	0.20	320.00	020	56427383
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIE ES AND UPDATES.	0.40 NT, TEAM AND	480.00 OTHER PROFESSIO	020 ONALS RE: PEN	56428195 NDING
FEE A WITH	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONE APPLICATIONS, 341 MEETING, DISCLOSURI I TEAM RE OPEN WORK STREAMS AND PR IK RE U.S. TRUSTEE SERVICE AND NEWES	E STATEMENT, A OGRESS (.5); AD	AND OTHER PEND	ING ISSUES (.5); CONFER
	Lemons, Robert J. CICIPATE ON COORDINATION AND STRATE RDINATION AND STRATEGY CALL WITH W		,	020 ARTIAL) (.3);	56439583
05/02/19 COOF	DiBlasi, Kelly RDINATION CALL WITH B. TRANSIER, WEI	0.80 L AND FTI.	960.00	020	56430017
CORF MEET	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORK STREAMS RESPONDENCE WITH TEAM RE LATEST FII FINGS (.4); UPDATE EXHIBIT A LIST OF DEI REFERENCE (.1); ADDRESS NOTICING ISSU (.2).	LINGS, DISCLOS BTORS PER CAS	URE STATEMENT/ E DISMISSAL AND	PLAN, AND BO CIRCULATE T	OARD O TEAM
05/02/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.50	345.00	020	56732011

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index		
PREP	FOR AND ATTEND ADVISORS PRIORITY TASI	K CALL ANI	FOLLOW UP INTE	RNAL WEIL M	EETING.		
05/02/19 PART	Podzius, Bryan R. ICIPATE ON WEEKLY COORDINATION CALL	0.80 WITH WEIL,	700.00 FTI AND W. TRANS	020 SIER.	56674490		
05/02/19 PART	Podzius, Bryan R. ICIPATE ON WEEKLY COORDINATION CALL	0.80 WITH WEIL,	700.00 FTI AND B. TRANS	020 IER.	56753499		
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, ES AND UPDATES (0.7); CALL WITH B. TRANSI						
MEET WORI AND I (.4); M	05/03/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 1.60 1,104.00 020 56435118 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, 341 MEETING, ESTATE REIMBURSEMENT, AND U.S. TRUSTEE FEES (.4); CONFER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORKSTREAMS AND STATUS THEREOF (.4); DISCUSS ESTATE REIMBURSEMENT WITH B. TRANSIER AND FOLLOW UP WITH TEAM, FTI, AND FORMER EMPLOYEE TO COORDINATE WITH RESPECT THERETO (.4); MEET WITH B. PODZIUS RE TASKS TO COMPLETE (.2); REVIEW AND CONSIDER DOCKET UPDATE AND LATEST FILINGS (.1); ADDRESS SERVICE ISSUE WITH KCC RE U.S. TRUSTEE NOTICE (.1).						
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, ES AND UPDATES.	1.30 TEAM AND	1,560.00 OTHER PROFESSIO	020 ONALS RE: PEN	56451053 NDING		
CASE	05/06/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 0.70 483.00 020 56451074 CONFER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORK STREAMS AND PROGRESS THEREOF (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. LEMONS AND THE PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT WEIL TEAM RE UPCOMING BOARD REQUIREMENTS AND PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT DILIGENCE (.4).						
05/07/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	2.00	2,400.00	020	56455092		

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index			
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, TEAM AND OTHER PROFESSIONALS RE: PENDING ISSUES AND UPDATES (0.2); REVIEW ISSUES RE: CASE STATUS AND GO FORWARD LEGAL STRATEGY (0.4); CONFERENCE WITH WEIL TEAM RE: PLAN ISSUES, PROFESSIONAL FEE ISSUES, AND OTHER PENDING MATTERS (0.8); CALL WITH B. TRANSIER RE: SAME (0.5); EMAIL B. TRANSIER RE: SAME (0.1).								
STAT	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPOND EMENT WEIL TEAM RE PAYMENT RUN, DI CONFER WITH TEAM RE OPEN ITEMS AND O	SCLOSURE STAT	ΓΕΜΕΝΤ ISSUES, A					
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIE DDOWN ISSUES, AND OTHER RELATED ANI			020 ONALS RE: PLA	56458706 AN ISSUES,			
APPL	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPOND ICATIONS, AND ORDINARY COURSE PROF FER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORK STREAMS	ESSIONAL ISSUE	ES AND UPCOMIN		*			
05/09/19 COOI	Lemons, Robert J. RDINATION CALL WITH WEIL, W. TRANSIE	0.60 R AND FTI (.6).	840.00	020	56602174			
ISSU	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIE ES AND UPDATES (0.6); CALL WITH WEIL, I DMING HEARINGS AND OTHER PENDING M	FTI AND B. TRAN						
CORI ISSUI	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH TEAM RE OPEN ITEMS AND STAT RESPONDENCE WITH TEAM AND COMPAN' E AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN ISS EST FILINGS (.1).	Y RE PAYMENT I	RUN AND BANK A	ACCOUNTS CL	OSING			
05/10/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.20	240.00	020	56469932			

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, LOSURE STATEMENT, AND OTHER PENDING N		OTHER PROFESSION	ONALS RE: PLA	AN,
RESP	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORK STREAMS AN OND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM LOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES (.5).				
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, ES, ONGOING WORK STREAMS AND OTHER M.		120.00 OTHER PROFESSION	020 ONALS RE: PEN	56474905 NDING
05/13/19 COOF	Lemons, Robert J. RDINATION CALL WITH W. TRANSIER, FTI, AN	0.30 D HOULIHA	420.00 N.	020	56496250
UPCC PEND PROF	DiBlasi, Kelly ICIPATE (PARTIAL) ON CALL WITH MACQUAI MING SERVICES UNDER THE TSA (0.2); COMM ING ISSUES (0.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO I ESSIONALS RE: PENDING ISSUES, UPCOMING IERS (0.6).	IUNICATE W EMAILS FRO	VITH R. LEMONS R OM CLIENT, TEAM	E: STATUS UPI AND OTHER	DATE AND
RESP	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH TEAM AND FTI RE ONGOING WORK OND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. PO TEAM RE U.S. TRUSTEE FEES AND DISCLOSU	DZIUS, FTI,	AND THE PLAN/DI	SCLOSURE ST.	
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, ES AND OTHER UPDATES AND MATTERS.	0.60 TEAM AND	720.00 OTHER PARTIES R	020 EE: FILINGS, PE	56492672 NDING
05/14/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.60	1,104.00	020	56492725

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index				
SATI DISC STAT	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM AND ADVISORS AND COMPANY RE SATISFIED CLAIMS, INTEREST BEARING ACCOUNTS, BOARD PRESENTATION MATERIALS, AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN ISSUES (.6); CONFER WITH TEAM RE ONGOING WORK STREAMS AND STATUS THEREOF (.6); ASSIST COMPANY WITH PULLING BANKRUPTCY DOCUMENTATION TO PROVIDE FOR EARLY CONTRACT TERMINATION (.2); ADDRESS NOTICING QUERIES FROM KCC (.2).								
FOR	EARLY CONTRACT TERMINATION (.2); ADL	DRESS NOTICING	J QUERIES FROM	KCC (.2).					
	DiBlasi, Kelly IEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIEN ES AND UPDATES.	0.50 NT, TEAM AND (600.00 OTHER PROFESSIO	020 ONALS RE: PEN	56497036 NDING				
DISC (.5); (DISC	Berger, Ryan Alexander IEW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPOND: CLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING ADJOURNA CONFER WITH TEAM RE ONGOING WORK S' CUSS WORK STREAMS GOING FORWARD AN JIRIES FOR C. CARSON (.7).	MENT, UPCOMIN TREAMS AND P	IG COURT ITEMS, ROGRESS (.6); ME	AND FEE APPI ET WITH B. PO	LICATIONS DZIUS TO				
05/15/19 DISC	Fang, Weiru CUSS WITH TEAM RE: CONTACT INFORMATI	0.20 ION FOR LENDE	112.00 RS PER WAC.	020	56521757				
05/15/19 CON	Podzius, Bryan R. FER WITH R. BERGER RE: CASE UPDATE AN	0.40 ID OPEN ITEMS.	350.00	020	56570080				
RE O	Berger, Ryan Alexander PRESS NOTICING ISSUE FROM T. WOLYNSKI PPEN ITEMS AND STATUS OF ONGOING WOR RESPONDENCE RE ORDINARY COURSE PRO ESTATE REIMBURSEMENT ISSUES (.5).	RKSTREAMS (.5)	; REVIEW AND RI	ESPOND TO CA	SE				
05/17/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.40	966.00	020	56511997				

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index			
DISCI DISCI CONF	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM RE FOREIGN DIRECTOR QUERIES, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN ISSUES, AND NOTICING ISSUES (.3); REVIEW ISSUES RE: WINDDOWN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, COMPANY INQUIRIES, AND OTHER OPEN ISSUES TO BE ADDRESSED (.4); CONFER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORK STREAMS AND ONGOING STATUS (.5); REVIEW AND CONSIDER DOCKET UPDATE AND LATEST FILINGS (.2).							
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND ADDRESS ESTATE QUERIES RAISED E ES WITH B. PODZIUS AND D. LIGNON (.2).	0.50 BY D. LIGNON (.	345.00 3); DISCUSS NON-	020 DEBTOR EXPE	56512138 ENSE			
05/18/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENC	0.10 CE WITH ADVIS	69.00 ORS RE LATEST F	020 ILINGS.	56513827			
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENC 1 DIRECTOR.	0.20 CE RE UPCOMIN	138.00 IG HEARING AND	020 BAR DATE QU	56514116 ERY			
05/20/19 COOF	Lemons, Robert J. RDINATION CALL WITH K. DIPLASI, W. TRANSI	0.60 IER AND FTI (.3	840.00); REVIEW FTI PRI	020 ORITY TRACK	56562145 ER (.3).			
TO EN	05/20/19 DiBlasi, Kelly 0.70 840.00 020 56531180 PARTICIPATE ON COORDINATION CALL WITH B. TRANSIER, WEIL AND FTI (0.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, TEAM AND OTHER PROFESSIONALS RE: FILINGS, PENDING ISSUES AND STATUS UPDATES (0.4).							
ISSUI ONGO	05/20/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander 0.90 621.00 020 56531095 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN ISSUES, RETAINED PROFESSIONALS ISSUES, AND UPCOMING HEARING (.4); CONFER WITH TEAM RE ONGOING WORKSTREAMS AND STATUS (.4); ADDRESS SERVICE INQUIRY FROM KCC RE LATEST FILINGS TO BE NOTICED (.1).							
05/21/19 CONF	Lemons, Robert J. FER WITH K. DIBLASI RE: KPMG RETENTION A	0.30 ND DISCLOSUR	420.00 E STATEMENT HE	020 EARING.	56562133			

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DiBlasi, Kelly ERENCE WITH R. LEMONS RE: KPMG RETEN EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM WEIL T				
CORR ISSUE	Berger, Ryan Alexander ER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORKSTREAMS A ESPONDENCE WITH TEAM AND COMPANY SS, AND BOARD MEETING ISSUES (.5); PREPA FTI (.5).	RE U.S. TRUST	TEE FEES, PLAN/DI	SCLOSURE ST.	ATEMENT
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM WEIL T TED ISSUES.	0.20 ΓΕΑΜ RE: BOA	240.00 ARD MEETING, UPO	020 COMING FILING	56544021 GS, AND
PART CORR PAYM BOAR INCLU	Berger, Ryan Alexander ER WITH TEAM RE ONGOING WORK STREA Y NOTICE INQUIRY FOR COMPANY WITH KE ESPONDENCE WITH TEAM AND COMPANY MENT RUN INQUIRIES, WASHECKA CLAIM O AD MEETING REQUIREMENTS AND 341 MEET JUING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT, DISC MENT RUN, U.S. TRUSTEE INVOICES (.5).	CC (.4); REVIE RE SATISFAC BJECTION, PL TING ISSUES (.	W AND RESPOND FION OF U.S. TRUS AN/DISCLOSURE S 6); REVIEW PENDI	TO CASE STEE FEES, ADI STATEMENT IS NG ITEMS ANI	DRESSING SUES, D STATUS,
05/23/19 CONF	Lemons, Robert J. ER WITH K. DIBLASI RE: DISCLOSURE STAT	0.20 EMENT AND I	280.00 REVISED RETENTI	020 ON ORDERS.	56561934
05/23/19 CONF	DiBlasi, Kelly ERENCE WITH R. LEMONS RE: DISCLOSURE	0.20 ESTATEMENT	240.00 AND REVISED RE	020 FENTION ORDI	56545058 ERS.
05/23/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	2.10	1,449.00	020	56545327

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
ORDI STAT PREP	EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCE NARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL ISSUES, UPCOR EMENT ISSUES (.5); CONFER WITH TEAM RE OF ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON PRIORITY TAS UESTIONS ARISING OUT OF PRIORITY TASK C.	MING BOAR PEN WORK SK CALL WI	D MEETING, AND F STREAMS AND PRO TH FTI (.5); FOLLO	PLAN/DISCLOS OGRESS THER W UP WITH W	SURE ETO (.6); EIL TEAM
CORF	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORK STREAMS AN RESPONDENCE WITH TEAM AND COMPANY RI ATING REPORT, LUX MANAGER INQUIRIES, P.	E PLAN/DIS	CLOSURE STATEM	ENT ISSUES, M	IONTHLY
05/25/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH K. DIBLASI RE COORDINATION AND	0.60 STRATEGY	840.00	020	56562151
05/25/19 REVI ISSUE	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENCES.	0.10 CE RE RELE	69.00 ASES AND DISCLOS	020 SURE STATEM	56552906 IENT/PLAN
05/26/19 COOF	Lemons, Robert J. RDINATION CALL WITH K. DIBLASI (.4); EMAIL	0.70 S WITH K. I	980.00 DIBLASI RE: SAME (020 (.3).	56562098
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW, ANALYZE, AND RESPOND TO R. LEMONS HEARINGS (0.8); CALL WITH R. LEMONS RE: SA				
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDENC TING (.3); CONFER WITH TEAM RE OPEN ITEMS			020 ΓΕΜΕΝΤ ISSUI	56553400 ES AND 341
05/27/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.50	600.00	020	56562569

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM WEIL TE TING, AND OTHER PENDING MATTERS.	EAM RE: PLA	N, DISCLOSURE S	ΓATEMENT, 34	1
PLAN TEAN	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDEN I/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES, 341 MEET I/ RE OPEN WORKSTREAMS AND ONGOING ST I'US (.3).	TING AND BO	ARD REQUIREME	NTS (.5); CONF	
05/28/19 REVI	Holtzer, Gary T. EW INCOMING MATERIALS AND COORDINAT	0.40 E WITH TEA	640.00 M.	020	56575779
	Lemons, Robert J. RDINATION CALL WITH FTI AND WEIL RE: PER RDINATION MEETING WITH WEIL TEAM (.5).	0.80 NDING WORI	1,120.00 K STREAMS AND U	020 JPCOMING FIL	56601899 INGS (.3);
CONI	DiBlasi, Kelly L WITH FTI AND WEIL RE: PENDING WORK ST FERENCE RE: PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM WEIL TE	Γ, REPLY, AN	D OTHER PENDIN	G WORK STRE	AMS (0.6);
05/28/19 PREP	Berger, Ryan Alexander ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON PRIORITY TA	0.40 SK CALL WI	276.00 TH WEIL AND FTI	020 (.4).	56574832
STAT STRE	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONDEN EMENT, 341 MEETING, AND GOVERNANCE IS AMS AND STATUS (.5); CALL WITH WEIL TEA ES/AIRBUS (.6).	SUES (.6); CO	NFER WITH TEAM	I RE OPEN WO	
05/28/19 PART	Podzius, Bryan R. TICIPATE ON WORKSTREAM CALL WITH WEII	0.40 L AND FTI.	350.00	020	56683298

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/29/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.20	828.00	020	56584445
CONI	FER WITH TEAM RE OPEN WORKSTREAMS	S AND PROGRESS	(.6); REVIEW ANI	D RESPOND TO)
CORE	RESPONDENCE WITH TEAM AND ADVISOR	RS RE UPCOMING	BOARD REQUIRI	EMENTS, 341 M	IEETING,
PLAN	/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES, AND I	HEARING PREP (.	6).		
05/30/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.10	759.00	020	56588268
REVI	EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONI	DENCE WITH TEA	M, CLIENT, AND	ADVISORS RE	
PLAN	/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES, DISCI	OSURE STATEM	ENT HEARING, A	ND MONTHLY	
OPER	ATING REPORT (.5); CONFER WITH TEAM	RE OPEN WORKS	STREAMS AND ST	ATUS (.6).	
05/31/19	DiDlasi Walls	0.50	600.00	020	56595830
	DiBlasi, Kelly	****			
	EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CLIE OR PENDING MATTERS.	ENT AND TEAM R	E; HEARING UPD	ATE, FILINGS	AND
01111					
05/31/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.40	966.00	020	56594950
REVI	EW AND RESPOND TO CASE CORRESPONI	DENCE WITH TEA	M AND ADVISOR	S RE PLAN/DIS	SCLOSURE
STAT	EMENT ISSUES, U.S. TRUSTEE FEES, AND	MONTHLY OPER	ATING REPORT (.	6); CONFER WI	TH TEAM
	PEN WORKSTREAMS AND STATUS (.6); RE		PDATE AND LATI	EST FILINGS (1);
ADDI	RESS SERVICING ISSUE RE NOTICE WITH I	KCC (.1).			

	AL TASK 020 - General Case eam Meetings:	55.90	\$50,979.00		
	Berger, Ryan Alexander DINATE WITH P. FABSIK RE U.S. TRUSTER MBERS TO DISCUSS RETENTION APPLICAT	,	`	,,	
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT NOTICE OF ICATIONS.	0.10 F ADJOURNMEN	120.00 T OF HEARING ON	021 I RETENTION	56438385
05/03/19 REVII	Foust, Rachael L. EW, REVISE, AND FILE NOTICE OF ADJOUI	0.90 RNMENT FOR RI	621.00 ETENTION APPLIC	021 ATIONS.	56451097

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/03/19	Fabsik, Paul	0.60	225.00	021	56440584
REVIS	E AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE NOTICE OF A	DJOURNME	NT OF CERTAIN MA	ATTERS.	
05/07/19	Fabsik, Paul	2.30	862.50	021	56457252
PREPA (1.7).	RE AGENDA FOR MAY 16, 2019 HEARING (.6)	; PREPARE I	DOCUMENTS FOR M	IAY 16, 2019 H	EARING
(1.7).					
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.10	69.00	021	56458743
	SS AND COORDINATE HEARING/AGENDA PR				30130713
05/13/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.20	828.00	021	56487385
DISCU	SS AND COORDINATE HEARING AND AGENE	DA AND FILI	ING ISSUES WITH P.	FABSIK AND	R. FOUST
(.5); RI	EVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT HEARING AGEND	OA AND CIRC	CULATE TO R. LEM	ONS FOR SIGN	OFF (.7).
05/13/19	Fabsik, Paul	5.30	1,987.50	021	56491750
	E AND PREPARE AGENDA FOR MAY 16TH HE NG (4.2).	EARING (1.1)	; PREPARE DOCUM	ENTS FOR MA	Y 16TH
IILAK	NG (4.2).				
05/14/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.70	483.00	021	56492664
COOR	DINATE HEARING AND FILING PREP WITH P.		; REVIEW CASE MA	NAGEMENT C	ORDER
	HAMBER RULES TO CONFIRM VARIOUS FILI	NG/ADJOUI	RNMENT ISSUES AN	ID REPORT TO	TEAM
(.4).					
05/44/40		4.50	4.242.70	224	
05/14/19	Podzius, Bryan R. F LETTER TO CHAMBERS RE: DISCLOSURE ST	1.50	1,312.50	021 SIMENT	56674433
DKAI	LETTER TO CHAMBERS RE. DISCLOSURE ST	IAIEMENI	HEARING ADJOURI	NIVILZIN I .	
05/14/19	Ellsworth, John A.	2.00	770.00	021	56590633
	Γ WITH PREPARATION OF MAY 16TH HEARIN	_,,,,			
				`	,
05/14/19	Fabsik, Paul	4.80	1,800.00	021	56509864
REVIS	E AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE MAY 16TH HE	EARING AGI	ENDA (.8); ASSIST W	ITH PREPARA	ATION OF
DOCU:	MENTS FOR CHAMBERS REVIEW AND FOR A	TTORNEY R	EEVIEW (4.0).		

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/15/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.90	1,260.00	021	56523355
PREP	PARE FOR HEARING AND REVIEW A	GENDAS AND NOTICES	RE SAME.		
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.90	1,311.00	021	56497269
	L WITH CHAMBERS AND FOLLOW U DURNMENT (.3); DRAFT NOTICE OF A				IG.
	TERS WITH P. FABSIK (.3); REVISE A	* **			
	NDA (.4).		<i>、</i>		
05/15/10	Standala Chairteadh an A	0.60	242.00	021	5(524220
05/15/19	Stauble, Christopher A. ST WITH PREPARATION OF HEARING	0.60 C MATERIAI S FOR MA	243.00 V 15 2010 EOP CH		56534320
Assi	ST WITH FREFARATION OF HEARING	J MATERIALS FOR MA	1 13, 2019 FOR CH	IAMBERS.	
05/15/19	Arias, Juan C.	1.00	405.00	021	56541522
ASSI	ST WITH PREPARATION OF HEARING	G MATERIALS FOR MA	Y 15, 2019 AND SU	JBMIT TO CHA	MBERS.
05/15/10	E.1.3 D. 1	0.00	227.50	021	57500020
05/15/19 REVI	Fabsik, Paul SE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE NO	0.90 TICE OF ADJOURNMEN	337.50 IT OF HEARING	021	56509839
TCL VI	SETTING ELBETHONICITEET TILE NO	THEE OF THE CONTRACTOR	or incrimento.		
05/16/19	Lemons, Robert J.	2.60	3,640.00	021	56523358
PREP	PARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING.				
05/16/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.30	207.00	021	56500456
001-01-2	RDINATE COURT/AGENDA FILINGS	***			
	MONS (.1).	(),			
05/16/19	Fabsik, Paul	3.30	1,237.50	021	56528861
REVI	SE MAY 21ST HEARING AGENDA (.9); PREPARE DOCUMEN	18 FOR MAY 2181	HEARING (2.4).
05/17/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.10	759.00	021	56511950

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
FABS: AMEN	DINATE PREPARATION OF AMENDED AGEND IK (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE HEARING AGEND IDED AGENDA WITH K. DIBLASI AND COORD GS (.3); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON AMENDE	DA AND PRE INATE WITH	PARE FOR FILING P. FABSIK AND R	(.4); DISCUSS U	JPDATED
05/17/19 REVIS	Fabsik, Paul SE AND FILE MAY 21ST HEARING AGENDA (.6)	3.60); PREPARE I	1,350.00 DOCUMENTS FOR	021 MAY 21ST HEA	56528960 ARING (3.).
05/20/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT AMENDED HEA	0.10 ARING AGEN	120.00 NDA.	021	56531083
AGEN	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND COORDINATE PREPARATION OF CHA IDA WITH P. FABSIK (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE DFF (.3); ASSIST WITH PREP FOR UPCOMING H	E AMENDED	AGENDA AND SE	ND FOR PARTN	IER
05/20/19 CONT	Fang, Weiru ACT CHAMBERS RE: HEARING DATE.	0.20	112.00	021	56752229
05/20/19 PREP	Fabsik, Paul ARE DOCUMENTS FOR MAY 21ST HEARING.	1.40	525.00	021	56531205
05/20/19 ASSIS	Pero, Jake Henry T WITH PREPARATION OF MAY 21ST HEARIN	1.60 G BINDERS A	384.00 AND SUBMIT TO C	021 HAMBERS.	56571067
05/21/19 PREPA	DiBlasi, Kelly ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN HEARING ON F	0.70 E&Y RETENT	840.00 TION APPLICATION	021 N.	56537908
05/21/19 DISCU	Fang, Weiru USS OMNIBUS HEARING DATE WITH CHAMBE	0.40 RS (0.1); DR	224.00 AFT OMNIBUS HEA	021 ARING EMAIL (56683231 (0.3).
05/23/19	Fang, Weiru	0.20	112.00	021	56752246

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
REVI	EW ISSUES RE: HEARING DATES (0.2).				
05/23/19 REVI	Fabsik, Paul SE MAY 30TH HEARING AGENDA.	0.90	337.50	021	56551162
05/27/19 REVI	Lemons, Robert J. EW HEARING AGENDA AND EMAILS RE SA	0.40 ME WITH R. BE	560.00 RGER AND LENDI	021 ER COUNSEL.	56561919
AGEN	Berger, Ryan Alexander RDINATE WITH P. FABSIK RE AGENDA AND NDA FOR UPCOMING HEARING (.9); UPDATE MR. LEMONS AND CIRCULATE FOR SIGNOF	E HEARING AGI	. ,,		
05/27/19 RESE (.9).	Fabsik, Paul ARCH VARIOUS PLEADINGS AND OBJECTION	2.80 ON DEADLINES	1,050.00 5 (1.9); REVISE MA	021 Y 30TH HEARIN	56574804 NG AGENDA
	Fabsik, Paul SE NOTICE OF AGENDA (1.0); ELECTRONICA ARATION OF DOCUMENTS FOR MAY 31ST I		1,950.00 TICE OF AGENDA (021 .6); ASSIST WIT	56585295 ГН
	Lemons, Robert J. EW COURT FILINGS AND COMMUNICATE V HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AN			021 E SAME (1.0).	56601777 PREPARE
BIND SAMI CHAI DISC PREP	Berger, Ryan Alexander ATE CALL WITH CHAMBERS RE FILING DOO ER PREP (.6); REVIEW AND REVISE AMEND E (.2); DRAFT NOTICE OF FILED REDLINES A MBERS AND U.S. TRUSTEE FOR DISTRIBUTI LOSURE STATEMENT HEARING AND COOR ARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARI ONS (.6).	ED AGENDA (.6 AND PREPARE F ON (.3); PREPAI DINATE OTHEF	O) REVISE AMENDI REDLINES (.7); REV RE MATERIALS FO R HEARING ARRAI	ED AGENDA AI /IEW BINDERS OR PARTNERS I NGEMENTS (1.:	ND FILE FOR FOR 1);

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/29/19 ASSIS	Foust, Rachael L. T IN PREPARING MATERIALS FOR DISCI	3.90 LOSURE STATEME	2,691.00 ENT AND KPMG H	021 EARING.	56628744
05/29/19 ASSIS	Lee, Kathleen T P. FABSIK WITH PREPARATION OF DIS	5.60 CLOSURE STATE	2,352.00 MENT HEARING.	021	56592659
	Fabsik, Paul SE AND FILE NOTICE OF AMENDED AGEI .6); ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF DOC			021 OR HEARING O	56585677 N MAY 30,
	Lemons, Robert J. ARE FOR AND ATTEND DISCLOSURE STA USSIONS RE SAME WITH WEIL TEAM AN				
	DiBlasi, Kelly ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN HEARING EDURES.	2.60 G ON DISCLOSURE	3,120.00 STATEMENT AND	021 D SOLICITATIO	56589860 DN
	Berger, Ryan Alexander ARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEA OVAL OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.8)		1,932.00 O AND ASSIST AT	021 HEARING FOR	56588176
	Foust, Rachael L. ARE FOR AND ATTEND WAYPOINT DISC ARATION OF MATERIALS FOR DISCLOSU		,	* *	56628439
05/30/19 ASSIS	Fabsik, Paul T WITH PREPARATION OF DOCUMENTS	2.30 FOR MAY 30, 2019	862.50 HEARING.	021	56619544
	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS RESULTS OF COURT HEARING WITH IBERS DISTRIBUTION OF MATERIALS FO	* / *		021 NT ON PROPOS	56594914 SED

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
SUBTOTA Matters:	L TASK 021 - Hearings and Court	98.40	\$67,508.50		
05/01/19 EMAII	Gershowitz, Gabriel S WITH R. YELLEN REGARDING ISSUED D	0.10 &O POLICIES.	105.00	022	56601645
05/02/19 REVIE	Berger, Ryan Alexander W WINDDOWN INSURANCE ISSUES AND F	0.20 OLLOW UP W	138.00 ITH G. GERSHOWIT	022 TZ (.2).	56428611
05/03/19 REVIE	Gershowitz, Gabriel W RUNOFF ENDORSEMENTS (.4); DISCUSS	0.60 COVERAGE Q	630.00 UESTIONS WITH R	022 BERGER (.2).	56603093
05/03/19 FOLLO	Berger, Ryan Alexander DW UP WITH G. GERSHOWITZ RE D&O INSU	0.20 JRANCE ISSUE	138.00 E.	022	56435125
05/07/19 EMAII	Gershowitz, Gabriel .S WITH R. BERGER REGARDING D&O INSU	0.20 JRANCE COVE	210.00 ERAGE QUESTIONS	022	56604971
	Berger, Ryan Alexander W D&O POLICY DOCUMENTS (.2); REVIEW RSHOWITZ ON QUERIES (.4).	0.60 D&O POLICY	414.00 DOCUMENTATION	022 N AND FOLLOW	56454410 V UP WITH
05/07/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH R. BERGER RE: D&O COVERAGE.	0.10	87.50	022	56755526
	Berger, Ryan Alexander SS D&O INSURANCE ISSUES WITH B. PODZ EVIEW INSURANCE MOTION AND BOARD		414.00 OW UP WITH G. GI	022 ERSHOWITZ RI	56458725 E: SAME
05/08/19 DISCU	Podzius, Bryan R. SS D&O INSURANCE POLICIES WITH R. BE	0.20 RGER.	175.00	022	56492601

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/10/19 REVII	Podzius, Bryan R. EW D&O COVERAGE.	0.30	262.50	022	56755540
05/14/19 EMAI	Gershowitz, Gabriel LS WITH R. LEMONS REGARDING DIREC	0.20 CTOR QUESTIONS (210.00 ON D&O INSURAN	022 ICE COVERAG	56605770 E SCOPE.
INSUI	Berger, Ryan Alexander ARCH AND CONSIDER D&O COVERAGE RANCE QUERIES AND OTHER RELATED ECT THERETO (.3).	•	*	* *	
05/22/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS D&O INSURANCE ISSUES WITH R. L	0.10 EMONS AND G. GE	69.00 RSHOWITZ (.1).	022	56540673
	Gershowitz, Gabriel LS AND CALLS WITH R. BERGER REGAI RANCE SUMMARY OF COVERAGE CHAI		1,785.00 QUESTIONS (.6);	022 DRAFT AND R	56611494 EVISE D&O
	Berger, Ryan Alexander WITH G. GERSHOWITZ RE D&O QUERII EW RELATED MATERIALS (.2).	0.80 ES (.5); DISCUSS D&	552.00 O ISSUES WITH C	022 G. GERSHOWIT	56545372 Z (.1);
	Gershowitz, Gabriel LS WITH WTW AND WEIL TEAM REGAR CTOR QUESTIONS RE: SAME.	0.90 RDING COVERAGE S	945.00 SCOPE OF D&O IN	022 ISURANCE ANI	56612463 O
RESPO	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND ANALYZE D&O POLICIES RE D ONSES TO LUX MANAGERS RE D&O AN JLATE TO R. LEMONS (.2); RESEARCH D	D OTHER INSURAN	ICE COVERAGE L	IABILITY QUE	
SUBTOTA	L TASK 022 - Insurance Issues:	8.60	\$7,377.00		

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/10/19	Fang, Weiru	2.20	616.00	025	56470846
REVIS	SE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (1.7);	CIRCULATE DRAFT T	O K. DIBLASI RE: S	SAME (0.5).	
05/16/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.10	34.50	025	56674500
REVII	EW AND UPDATE ORDINARY COURS	E PROFESSIONAL FEI	E TRACKER.		
05/21/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.00	600.00	025	56537775
TRAV	TEL TO (0.5) AND FROM (0.5) COURT I	FOR HEARING ON E&	Y APPLICATION.		
05/29/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.60	960.00	025	56584753
TRAV	EL TO AND FROM SECTION 341 MEE	TING.			
05/30/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.00	600.00	025	56589850
NON-	WORKING TRAVEL TO AND FROM C	OURT FOR HEARING.			
05/30/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.40	483.00	025	56588244
	TEL TO BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR DI CRUPTCY COURT FOR DISCLOSURE S		· /·	TRAVEL FROM	1
SUBTOTA	AL TASK 025 - Non-working Travel:	7.30	\$3,293.50		
05/01/19	Lemons, Robert J.	2.30	3,220.00	026	56439387
	EW CASE LAW RE RELEASES AND EX WEIL TEAM RE: PLAN ISSUES (.8).	CULPATION (.5); REV	/IEW REVISED PLA	AN (1.0); CONFI	ERENCE
05/01/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.80	1,120.00	026	56674485
CALL	WITH WEIL TEAM RE BOARD AND I				
OF PR	COPOSED RELEASES (.5); FOLLOW UP	DISCUSSION RE SAN	IE WITH K. DIBLA	SI AND B. FOD.	ZIUS (.3).

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EW AND COMMENT ON FURTHER REVISED DI ASE ANALYSIS AND OTHER PLAN ISSUES (0.8				
RELE	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos EW AND ANALYZE WAYPOINT LENDER PRES ASE OF CLAIMS IN PLAN (6.2); CALL (PARTIA) POINT CLAIMS AND CAUSES OF ACTION (.5); (L PARTICIPA	ATION) WITH WEIL	TEAM RE: AN	
05/01/19 CONF	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH B. PODZIUS RE: PLAN.	0.40	276.00	026	56674486
	Fang, Weiru ARCHED PLAN CASES RE: PREPETITION EXCU JMENTS (1.3).	3.30 JLPATION (2	1,848.00 2.0); GATHERED PL	026 AN AND RELA	56436646 TED
CALI THE I (2.0);	Podzius, Bryan R. SE PLAN (.3); CALL WITH M. COGHLAN RE: PL WITH WEIL TEAM RE: RELEASES (.8); REVIEV PLAN (.4); REVIEW COMMENTS TO PLAN FROM REVIEW CLAIMS RECOVERY ANALYSIS (.5); E T TALKING POINTS FOR LENDER CALL RE: PI	W ISSUES RE M D. WENDE EMAILS AND	E: SAME (.2); CONFI ER (.3); CONDUCT R	ER WITH R. BE RESEARCH RE:	RGER RE: RELEASES
(.2); P	Soto, Edward EW DOCUMENTS RE: POTENTIAL ISSUES REG REPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WI' RESPONDENCE WITH WEIL TEAM REGARDING	TH WEIL-TE			
05/02/19 CALI	Holtzer, Gary T. . WITH B. TRANSIER ON PLAN PROCESS (.2); C	1.20 ONFERENCI	1,920.00 E WITH WEIL TEAN	026 M ON PLAN PRO	56441525 OCESS (1.0).
05/02/19	Lemons, Robert J.	1.60	2,240.00	026	56439305

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	LS WITH K. DIBLASI AND B. PODZIUS RE PLA MENTS (1.2).	N VOTING (.	4); MEET WITH WE	IL TEAM RE P	LAN
RESP	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH WEIL AND FTI RE: PLAN AND WINDDO OND TO EMAILS FROM CLIENT, TEAM AND O' T PLAN DOCUMENTS (0.2).			. //	
	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos EW AND ANALYZE WAYPOINT LENDER PRESI NECTION WITH PROPOSED RELEASE OF CLAIN				
05/02/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH D. LIGNON RE WINDDOWN ISSU	0.10 ES.	69.00	026	56428630
RE: R REVII	Podzius, Bryan R. EW AND REVISE CHAPTER 11 PLAN (2.9); REVI ELEASES (.1); EMAIL WITH K. DIBLASI RE: SA EW RELEASE RELATED DOCUMENTS (1.5); EM CICIPATE ON COORDINATION CALL WITH WEI	ME (.1); EMA IAILS WITH	AIL WITH M. COGH FTI RE: THE PLAN	LAN RE: SAME	E(.1);
REGA	Soto, Edward ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH V ARDING PROPOSED CONSENTED TO RELEASES CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING S	S IN PLAN (.			
05/03/19 CONF	DiBlasi, Kelly FER WITH B. PODZIUS RE: PLAN REVISIONS.	0.20	240.00	026	56438467
05/03/19 PREP	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH V	0.90 VEIL AND A	895.50 LG RE: RELEASE O	026 F CLAIMS IN P	56443753 LAN.
05/03/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	4.10	3,587.50	026	56442570

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
L. AL DIBL FLOV 3 (MU	TIPLE EMAILS TO LENDERS RE: PLAN COMMEI EXANDER RE: RELEASES (.6); REVIEW MATER ASI RE: PLAN (.2): CONFER WITH K. DIBLASI RIV (.2); CALL WITH M. CRUZ RE: SAME (.1); CALI JFG) RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW ISSUES RE: SAME (.EW WINDDOWN BUDGET (.1).	IAL FROM CO E: PLAN (.2); C L WITH WAC 8	MPANY RE: SAM ALL WITH D. KO ((AKIN) RE: SAM	E (1.1); EMAIL KINI (FTI) RE: E (.2); CALL W	S TO K. FUNDS ITH WAC
WEIL	Soto, Edward EW DOCUMENTS AND ANALYSIS BY ALG IN PI -TEAM, FTI, ALG AND LENDERS' COUNSEL RE SENTED TO RELEASES IN PLAN (.4); CORRESPO	: POTENTIAL	ISSUES REGARD	ING PROPOSEI	
05/06/19 CALI	Carson, Candice M. WITH B. PODZIUS RE: PLAN.	0.10	99.50	026	56460869
	Fang, Weiru DUCT RESEARCH RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMEN ULATE SAME (0.5).	2.00 T, PLAN, AND	1,120.00 HEARING TRAN	026 SCRIPTS (1.5);	56470947
K. DI	Podzius, Bryan R. L B. TRANSIER RE: PLAN (.1); EMAIL B. TRANS BLASI RE: PLAN (.2); EMAIL C. CHENG AND D. I OS FLOW (.4); EMAIL K. DIBLASI RE: SAME (.2); L (.3).	KOKINI RE: SA	AME (.1); CALL W	TTH D. KOKINI	I RE:
MAT PART	Soto, Edward ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATEN ON CALL WITH THE FORE INCLUDING ISSUES RELATED TO THE PROTOPATE ON CALL WITH WEIL-TEAM, ALG, FTOE (.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM REGARD	OPOSED RELE I, AND COUNS	EASES (.3); PREPA EL FOR THE LEN	ARE FOR AND	
	Holtzer, Gary T. CICIPATE ON LENDER CALL WITH WEIL, ALG A ASES (.5); FOLLOW UP WITH TEAM (.3); FURTH				

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
WEIL	Lemons, Robert J. ICIPATE ON PRECALL FOR LENDER PLAN , ALG AND FTI RE SAME (.5); FOLLOW UP ES RE: SAME (.5).			/ ·	
	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH B. PODZIUS RE: COMMENTS FROM YSIS RE: SAME (0.3).	0.40 LENDERS ON OF	480.00 PEN PLAN ISSUES	026 (0.1); REVIEW	56455095 FTI
	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WI' ALL WITH WEIL, FTI, ALG AND WAC 7 AN				
	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH B. PODZIUS AND TEAM RE V LOSURE.	0.10 VINDDOWN ANA	69.00 LYSIS CHART FO	026 R WAC LENDE	56454430 RS
FTI A (1.2); I TRAN	Podzius, Bryan R. ARE FOR CALL ON CHAPTER 11 PLAN ANI ND ALG RE: SAME (.5); PARTICIPATE ON C REVIEW WINDDOWN BUDGET (.3); CONFE ISIER RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH C. CARSO WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN (.2).	CALL WITH LENE ER WITH WEIL TE	DERS, WEIL, FTI A EAM RE: PLAN (1.0	ND ALG RE: RE)); CALL WITH	ELEASES B.
	Soto, Edward EW FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS BETV ASES (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH TEAM			026 COUNSEL RE: P	56467973 ROPOSED
	Holtzer, Gary T. EW MATERIALS ON GOVERNANCE AND P RDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.50 LAN ADMINISTR	800.00 ATION FROM LEN	026 NDERS AND	56459517
05/08/19	Lemons, Robert J.	1.60	2,240.00	026	56601988

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	LS WITH B. PODZIUS, K. DIBLASI, AND T. LOM IUS AND K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN PROPOSAL (.2).		PLAN REVISIONS (1	.4); CALL WIT	Н В.
	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH B. PODZIUS AND R. LEMONS RE: PLAN OSAL TO RESOLVE PLAN ISSUES AND EMAIL			026 ES RE: CREDI	56458750 ΓORS'
05/08/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW ISSUES RE: SERVICING ENTITIES WINDDO	0.30 OWN (.3).	207.00	026	56458764
EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. LS TO D. LIGNON RE: PLAN (.1); EMAIL T. LOM LS WITH K. DIBLASI AND R. LEMONS (.3); REV K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN PROPOSAL (.2); EMAILS T	ISE CHAPT	ER 11 PLAN (1.3); C	ALL WITH R. I	
	Lemons, Robert J. USSIONS AND EMAILS WITH B. PODZIUS RE PI FERENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: PLAN, DISCLOS				56601879 DNS (.3);
05/09/19 CONF	DiBlasi, Kelly FERENCE WITH R. LEMONS RE: PLAN, DISCLOS	0.50 SURE STATI	600.00 EMENT HEARING, A	026 AND RELATED	56745434 DISSUES.
R. LE	Podzius, Bryan R. EW COMMENTS RE: CHAPTER 11 PLAN (.8); CA MONS RE: SAME (.5); REVIEW ISSUES RE: SAM I UPDATE (.6); REVIEW CHAPTER 11 PLAN (3.7)	E (.4); PART			
05/10/19 CALL	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH B. PODZIUS RE: PLAN PROVISIONS.	0.10	120.00	026	56469907
05/10/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH B. PODZIUS RE: PLAN.	0.20	199.00	026	56480604

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	Podzius, Bryan R. EW AND REVISE CHAPTER 11 PLAN (3.8); CAI SIER RE: PLAN (.2); EMAILS TO WAC LENDER				
05/13/19 REVIE	Lemons, Robert J. W PLAN REVISIONS (1.6); DISCUSS SAME WI	1.80 TH B. PODZI	2,520.00 US (.2).	026	56755810
	Berger, Ryan Alexander W AND DISCUSS WINDDOWN ISSUES ON JUI DEBTOR SERVICING ENTITIES.	0.50 RISDICTION.	345.00 AL BASES WITH D.	026 LIGNON RE	56487657
CALL RE: DI	Podzius, Bryan R. E CHAPTER 11 PLAN (3.8); PARTICIPATE IN C WITH B. TRANSIER RE: SAME (.1); CONFER W SCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN UPDATE ER COMMENTS TO PLAN (.5); REVIEW ISSUES	VITH R. FOUS S (.2); CONF	ST RE: SAME (.1); C ER WITH R. LEMON	ONFER WITH F	R. BERGER
05/14/19 REVIE	Lemons, Robert J. W AND REVISE PLAN (1.0).	1.00	1,400.00	026	56496241
05/14/19 COND	Berger, Ryan Alexander UCT EXCULPATION/RELEASE RESEARCH.	0.70	483.00	026	56492641
(.4); CA EMAII CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. E CHAPTER 11 PLAN (1.5); CALL WITH B. TRA ALL WITH A. JENKINS RE: SAME (.2).; CONFE L TO DIRECTORS RE: SAME (.1); DRAFT EMAI WITH T. WOLYNSKI RE: PLAN (.5); CALL WIT TORS RE: PLAN (1.0).	R WITH K. D IL TO SUBSII	IBLASI AND R. LEN DIARY BOARD MEN	MONS RE: SAM MBERS RE: THE	E (.3);
	Podzius, Bryan R. IPLE CALLS WITH B. TRANSIER RE: PLAN (.6 ERS RE: ADJOURNMENTS (.3); REVIEW AND I	* *	,		56569871 VAC

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/16/19 REVII	Lemons, Robert J. EW CASES RE RELEASE AND EXCULPATION P	2.00 ROVISIONS.	2,800.00	026	56523574
	Berger, Ryan Alexander OND TO WINDDOWN QUERIES FROM D. LIGNO DOWN AND RELEASES (.2).	0.60 ON (.4); LOO	414.00 K INTO LUXCO ISS	026 UES FROM DIF	56500350 RECTOR RE
05/16/19 CONE	Fang, Weiru DUCT RESEARCH RE: LIQUIDATION PLANS.	2.00	1,120.00	026	56534017
05/16/19 REVII	Podzius, Bryan R. EW AND REVISE CHAPTER 11 PLAN.	1.90	1,662.50	026	56569859
ENTIT FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander DOOWN CALL WITH D. LIGNON AND T. WOLYI FIES (.6);RESEARCH INQUIRIES FOR D. LIGNON OW UP WITH M&A AND KPMG RE: SAME (.5); DISSOLUTION AND FOLLOW UP WITH LOCAL	N RE AUDIT REVIEW CO	REQUIREMENTS P MPLETED ACCOUN	OST-WAC 9 CL NTS OF FRENC	OSING AND
05/17/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH R. BERGER RE: WINDDOWN BUDGET.	0.50	437.50	026	56569906
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND ADDRESS QUERIES FROM D. LIGNON ESS (.3).	0.30 RE LUXEM	207.00 BOURG ACCOUNT	026 S FOR WINDDO	56531210 DWN PREP
05/21/19 CALL	Lemons, Robert J. WITH B. TRANSIER RE PLAN ISSUES (.6); EMA	1.50 AILS WITH M	2,100.00 ISD RE PLAN NEGO	026 OTIATIONS (.9)	56562159
05/21/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.00	690.00	026	56536110

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79984.0004 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
WITH ENTIT WITH	TER WITH FRENCH LOCAL COUNSEL RE FRENCE LOCAL COUNSELS FOR D. LIGNON RE WINDING THES PROCESS (.3); DISCUSS AND CONSIDER M. D. LIGNON (.2); DISCUSS ACCOUNT PREPARA RISEL (.3) AND FOLLOW UP WITH D. LIGNON W	DOWN OF SO IALTA AUD ATION AND	OUTH AFRICA, CAY ITOR ACCOUNT GU WINDDOWN QUEST	MAN, AND BE JARANTEE RE	ERMUDA QUEST
05/21/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH R. BERGER RE: PLAN WORKSTREAMS.	0.10	87.50	026	56569825
05/22/19 UPDA	Berger, Ryan Alexander TE CALL WITH FRENCH LOCAL COUNSEL RE	0.10 FRENCH EN	69.00 NTITY WINDDOWN	026	56540702
05/22/19 REVII	Podzius, Bryan R. EW ISSUES RE: PLAN WORKSTREAMS (.9); REV	1.30 VISE PLAN I	1,137.50 ANGUAGE (.4).	026	56570077
05/23/19 REVII	Lemons, Robert J. EW AND REVISE PLAN.	2.70	3,780.00	026	56562301
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM R. FOUST REVISIONS (0.2).	0.30 RE: REVISE	360.00 D CONFIRMATION	026 DATES (0.1); R	56545041 REVIEW
TEAM WITH FOLL QUER	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS ACCOUNTS REQUIREMENTS AND WINDD 1 (.4); DISCUSS ACCOUNTS REQUIREMENTS AND LOCAL COUNSEL AND REVERT TO D. LIGNOOM UP AND ADDRESS WITH D. LIGNON RE CASTES (.3); DISCUSS CHANGES TO CHAPTER 11 PROMMENTS FROM R. LEMONS (1).	ND WINDDO N (.5); DISCU AYMAN ENT	OWN QUERIES FOR USS FRENCH ENTIT TITY STATUTORY A	SOUTH AFRIC Y WINDDOWN ACCOUNTS WI	A ENTITY V (.2); NDDOWN
05/24/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.40	276.00	026	56552542

CALL WITH FRENCH LOCAL COUNSEL RE UPCOMING WINDDOWN AND FOLLOW UP WITH D. LIGNON.

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/24/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.50	345.00	026	56552543
PREP	ARE AND CIRCULATE AMENDED PLAN	N AND REDLINES TO	LENDERS WITH	COVER LETTE	R TO
RESO	DLVE OPEN OBJECTIONS.				
05/24/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	0.30	262.50	026	56570227
EMA	ILS TO R. BERGER RE: PLAN STATUS.				
05/25/19	Lemons, Robert J.	3.90	5,460.00	026	56562163
	ILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE PLAN ISSUES		· ·		
05/25/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	1.00	1,200.00	026	56552966
REVI	EW AND ANALYZE RESEARCH MEMO	RE: RELEASES AND	EXCULPATION.		
05/25/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	5.00	3,450.00	026	56552898
	EW RELEASE COMMENTS FROM LEND			ME (.3); COND	UCT
	ARCH AND PREPARE E-MAIL MEMO A ASE/EXCULPATION/JURISDICTION (4.7		TEAM RE		
REEL	ALGERTAL CONTROL OF THE PROPERTY (I.A.).			
05/26/19	Lemons, Robert J.	1.30	1,820.00	026	56562081
EMA	ILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE PLAN RESEAI	RCH AND ISSUES.	•		
05/26/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.60	720.00	026	56562365
REVI	EW AND ANALYZE UPDATED RESEAR	CH AND ANALYSIS	RE: RELEASES AN	D EXCULPATION	ON.
05/26/10	Daniel Daniel Alexandra	1.00	600.00	026	5(552270
05/26/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND CONSIDER COMMENTS TO PL	1.00	690.00	026	56553378
	EW AND CONSIDER COMMENTS TO FL I TEAM WITH RESPECT THERETO (.5); (
	ARCH ON ISSUES BASED ON TEAM CO				
05/05/10	T D.1 . T	2.10	2040.00	00 1	5/5/210/
05/27/19	Lemons, Robert J.	2.10	2,940.00	026	56562101
SAMI	EW CASE LAW RE PLAN AND DISCLOS E.	UKE STATEMENT IS	SOUES AND EMAIL	S WIIH K. BER	OEK KE
<i>₩</i> 111111					

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/27/19 REVII	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW WINDDOWN DOCUMENTS FOR NON-	0.30 DEBTOR ENTITY A	207.00	026	56559463 WITH
TEAM		DEDICK ENTITY	AND DISCUSS KEI	LATED ISSUES	WIIII
05/27/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.10	69.00	026	56559499
FOLL	OW UP WITH ALG RE: ANALYSIS OF POT	ENTIAL DEBTOR (CLAIMS IN CONN	ECTION WITH	RELEASES.
05/27/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.80	552.00	026	56559690
DISCU	SE PLAN PER CORRESPONDING COMMEN USS EDITS/COMMENTS TO PLAN/DISCLO IUS RE: PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEN	SURE STATEMEN			
05/27/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	0.50	437.50	026	56631950
CALL	WITH R. BERGER RE: PLAN AND DISCLO	OSURE STATEMEN	IT UPDATE.		
05/28/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.30	207.00	026	56574726
	JSS NON-DEBTOR SERVICE ENTITY WIN YNSKI RE NON-DEBTOR WIND DOWN ISS		/ITH D. LIGNON (.	2); FOLLOW UF	WITH T.
05/28/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.50	1,035.00	026	56574778
	DUCT ADDITIONAL PLAN/EXCULPATION MENTS FROM R. LEMONS (.6).	/INJUNCTION RES	EARCH (.9); REVIS	SE AMENDED I	PLAN PER
05/28/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.20	138.00	026	56729162
CONF	ER WITH B. TRANSIER RE PLAN/DISCLO	SURE STATEMENT	T/REPLY DOCUMI	ENTATION.	
05/28/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	1.90	1,662.50	026	56631907
TRAN	EW ISSUES RE: NEXT STEPS FOR PLAN A ISIER RE: UPCOMING WORKSTREAMS (.4 INDDOWN AMOUNTS (.2); EMAILS WITH	; REVISE CHAPT	ER 11 PLAN (.5); C		
05/29/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.70	1,173.00	026	56584426

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
REVI CON	USS NON-DEBTOR SERVICE ENTITY SE PLAN-RELATED DOCUMENTS AN SIDER PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEME	ND CIRCULATE TO R. ENT DILIGENCE ITEMS	LEMONS FOR SIGN S (.4); DISCUSS PLA	OFF (.4); REVII N/DISCLOSURI	EW AND
STAT	TEMENT EDITS WITH B. PODZIUS AN	ID R. LEMONS (.2); RE	VISE INTO PLAN A	ND PREP FOR F	FILING (.6).
05/29/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. SE CHAPTER 11 PLAN.	0.60	525.00	026	56631889
05/30/19 REVI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON FURTHER R	0.20 EVISED DRAFT PLAN	240.00 I.	026	56589863
PRIO LIKE	Berger, Ryan Alexander LOW UP FOR D. LIGNON WITH SOUTI R TO WINDDOWN INSTITUTION (.2); LY AND D. LIGNON AND FOLLOW U H B. PODZIUS RE: PLAN (.2).	REVIEW WINDDOWN	N ACCOUNT ISSUES	WITH FTI ANI	OR.
	Podzius, Bryan R. FER WITH WEIL TEAM RE: CHAPTER I R. BERGER RE: SAME (.2).	2.50 3.11 PLAN EDITS (.5); I	2,187.50 REVISE CHAPTER 1	026 1 PLAN (1.8); Co	56631932 Onfer
05/31/19 PREP	Podzius, Bryan R. PARE FILING VERSIONS OF PLAN AN	1.20 D DISCLOSURE STAT	1,050.00 EMENT.	026	56631986
	AL TASK 026 - Plan of zation/Plan Confirmation/Plan atation:	135.90	\$133,236.50		
	Lemons, Robert J. L WITH CLIENT AND R. FOUST RE KE E (.5); MEETING WITH R. FOUST RE S	. , , .	1,820.00 EMAILS WITH CLIE	027 ENT AND R. FO	56439311 UST RE
05/01/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.60	414.00	027	56427762

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
STAT	EW AND UPDATE PROFESSIONALS FEE TRA EMENTS FOR COMPANY REVIEW AND SATI ICATION QUERIES FOR SEABURY (.2).				
05/01/19 COM	Fang, Weiru PILE PROFESSIONAL FEE STATEMENTS.	0.90	504.00	027	56436757
WITH	Foust, Rachael L. L WITH B. TRANSIER, T. KELLY, AND R. LEMI I R. LEMONS (0.4); DRAFT AND REVISE E&Y RE: SAME (0.1).				
05/02/19 CALI	Holtzer, Gary T. L WITH CLIENT, R. LEMONS AND R. FOUST R	0.50 E: KPMG.	800.00	027	56441529
05/02/19 CALI	Lemons, Robert J. L WITH W. TRANSIER, T. KELLY, G. HOLTZEF	0.50 R, AND R. FOUS	700.00 ST RE KPMG RETE	027 NTION.	56439719
05/02/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH HOULIHAN RE EXPENSE BACK	0.10 CUP REQUEST	69.00 UPDATE.	027	56428654
05/02/19 REVI	Fang, Weiru SE FEE STATEMENTS PER B. PODZIUS COMN	0.30 MENTS (0.2); SE	168.00 END TO R. LEMON	027 S FOR REVIEW	56436512 (0.1).
05/02/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. EW AND REVISE ALG AND HOULIHAN FEE S	0.50 STATEMENTS.	437.50	027	56442625
	Foust, Rachael L. OW-UP CALL WITH COMPANY, G. HOLTZER. SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION (1.4).	1.80 , AND R. LEMO	1,242.00 DNS RE: KPMG (0.4	027 (); DRAFT AND	56451038 REVISE
05/02/19	Fabsik, Paul	1.20	450.00	027	56428565

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	SE AND PREPARE FOR ELECTRONIC FIL ARE FOR ELECTRONIC FILING HOULIH.			ENT (.6); REVISI	E AND
05/03/19 CALL	Lemons, Robert J. WITH A. SCHWARTZ AND R. FOUST RE	0.90 EKPMG RETENTION	1,260.00	027	56439557
APPL	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS WITH E& ICATION (0.2); REVIEW ISSUES RE: SAM LEMENTAL DECLARATION REVISIONS	E AND EMAIL R. FO	`		56438528 DN
ORDI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE FEE TRACKER FOR AI NARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS TO BE NSEL INVOICES TO BE SATISFIED.				
05/03/19 EMAI	Fang, Weiru L ADVISORS REGARDING FEE STATEM	0.20 ENT.	112.00	027	56436461
KPMO	Foust, Rachael L. WITH U.S. TRUSTEE REGARDING KPM G RE: SAME (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SE E&Y SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION	KPMG SUPPLEMEN	* **		
05/05/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE PROFESSIONALS FEE	0.10 TRACKER.	69.00	027	56437186
05/06/19 REVII	Carson, Candice M. EW ISSUES RE: PROFESSIONAL FEES.	0.20	199.00	027	56460861
05/06/19	Foust, Rachael L.	0.90	621.00	027	56451426

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	L WITH KPMG REGARDING RETENTION PROC PLEMENTAL DECLARATION (0.3).	ESS AND UP	DATES (0.6); REVIE	W AND REVISI	E E&Y
PROF RE: S	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW PROPOSED PAYMENT RUN NUMBERS FOR FESSIONALS AND CROSS CHECK AGAINST TR FAME (.2); REVIEW AND CONFIRM ACCURACY NO QUESTIONS WITH D. LIGNON (.6); REVISE AT	ACKER AND OF REVISEI	DISCUSS WITH TE DPROPOSED PAYM	AM (.4); REVIE IENT RUN AND	W ISSUES D DISCUSS
05/07/19 DISC	Fang, Weiru USS FEE APPLICATION WITH ALG.	0.10	56.00	027	56471449
05/07/19 REVI	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KPMG AND E&Y RETENTION	1.60 N DOCUMEN	1,104.00 ГЅ.	027	56627650
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT SUPPLEMENT ER RE: SAME.	1.80 AL E&Y DEC	2,160.00 CLARATION AND R	027 EVISED PROPO	56458739 OSED
05/08/19 REVI RUN	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW INVOICES FOR PROCESSING ON PAYMEN (.1).	0.20 T RUN (.1); F	138.00 OLLOW UP WITH C	027 COMPANY RE F	56458799 PAYMENT
05/08/19 DISC	Fang, Weiru USS WITH FTI RE: FEE APPLICATION.	0.30	168.00	027	56750506
05/08/19 DRA	Foust, Rachael L. FT AND REVISE E&Y (2.1) AND KPMG (3.0) SUI	5.10 PPLEMENTAI	3,519.00 L DECLARATIONS	027 AND PROPOSE	56627659 D ORDERS.
05/09/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.60	414.00	027	56464755

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
UPDA	EW AND RESPOND TO FEE APPLICATION ATE PROFESSIONAL FEE AND ORDINAL MENT RUN (.3).	•		. , .	
05/09/19 DISC (0.5).	Fang, Weiru USS WITH ALG RE: FEE APPLICATION (1.00 (0.5); CIRCULATE DO	560.00 OCUMENTS FOR A	027 LG FEE APPLIC	56470892 Cation
05/09/19 REVI	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KPMG RETENTION M.	2.20 ATERIALS (1.6) AND	1,518.00 E&Y RETENTION	027 MATERIALS (0	56628038 0.6).
05/10/19 EMA	Lemons, Robert J. ILS WITH R. FOUST RE KPMG RETENTION	0.20 ON.	280.00	027	56477418
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW E&Y COMMENTS TO REVISED SUP MENTS, AND RESPOND TO E&Y RE: SA		240.00 RATION ADDRES	027 SING U.S. TRUS	56469937 STEE
05/10/19 REVI	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KPMG AND E&Y RETI	1.80 ENTION MATERIALS	1,242.00	027	56627969
05/12/19 REVI	Lemons, Robert J. EW REVISED KPMG DISCLOSURE.	1.20	1,680.00	027	56496221
05/12/19 REVI	Fang, Weiru SE ALG FEE APPLICATION.	1.00	560.00	027	56471022
	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH A. SCHWARTZ RE KPMG AND R. FOUST (.3); REVIEW KPMG REVISED	,	,,	027 ME WITH K. DI	56496234 IBLASI
05/13/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.30	207.00	027	56487616

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	USS PAYMENT RUN ISSUES WITH D. LIGNON A SURY QUERIES RE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	,	.1); RESPOND TO H	IOULIHAN ANI)
HOUI	Fang, Weiru EW ALG FEE APPLICATION (0.1); DISCUSS WIT LIHAN RE: SAME (0.5); DISCUSS WITH TEAM R CH FEE STATEMENT (0.6); FILE FTI'S MARCH F	E: HOULIHA	N FEE APPLICATION	* /*	
05/13/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. EW ISSUES RE: FEE APPLICATIONS.	0.20	175.00	027	56570001
	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KPMG RETENTION MATERIA ERIALS (1.7).	5.30 LS (3.6); REV	3,657.00 YIEW AND REVISE	027 E&Y RETENTI	56628293 On
05/13/19 PREP	Fabsik, Paul ARE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE FTI FEE AP	0.50 PLICATION.	187.50	027	56491747
05/13/19 PREP	Fabsik, Paul ARE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE NOTICE OF	0.30 CHANGE OF	112.50 F FIRM ADDRESS.	027	56747756
	Lemons, Robert J. EW UPDATED KPMG DISCLOSURE AND EMAIL G RETENTION ORDER (.4); CALL WITH HOULIF E (.5).		*	**	
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: E&Y RETENTION RAISED BY C OSED RESPONSES RE: SAME.	0.20 COUNSEL TO	240.00 THE U.S. TRUSTE	027 E AND ANALY?	56492683 ZE
05/14/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.50	345.00	027	56492668

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
CIRCU	EW PAYMENT RUN ISSUES(.1); REVIEW AND U ULATE MONTHLY INVOICES TO AP TEAM FOI ESSIONALS RE GETTING RETAINED AND SAT	R PROCESSI	NG (.2); RESPOND T		
	Fang, Weiru SE ALG FEE APPLICATION (1.5); DISCUSS WITH FTI (0.3); REVIEW FEE APPLICATION (0.7); DIS				56521576 ICATION
FOLL	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KPMG SUPPLEMENTAL DECI OW-UP INTERNALLY RE: OPEN ISSUES (0.6); R ICATIONS FOR KCC (0.6) AND SEABURY (2.3);	REVIEW ANI	COORDINATE FIL	ING OF FEE	
05/15/19 REVII FOUS	DiBlasi, Kelly EW EMAIL FROM COUNSEL TO U.S. TRUSTEE T.	0.20 RE: E&Y RE	240.00 FENTION AND DIS	027 CUSS SAME W	56749976 ITH R.
DISCU TO HO	Fang, Weiru L/CALL ALG RE: INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF USS WITH FTI RE: INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OULIHAN RE: SAME (0.1); DISCUSS WITH TEAL WITH SAME (0.4); DISCUSS WITH FTI RE: S	(0.4); EMAII M RE: SAME	TO U.S. TRUSTEE PER U.S.T. REQUE	RE: SAME (0.2 STS (0.6); DISC); EMAIL USS WITH
05/15/19 EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. L M. HEALY RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE PAYMEN	0.10 NTS.	87.50	027	56570237
05/15/19 REVII	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KPMG AND E&Y RETENTION	3.20 DOCUMEN	2,208.00 FS.	027	56628326
05/15/19	Fabsik, Paul	5.60	2,100.00	027	56509872

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
ASSI: WITH	ST WITH PREPARATION, FILING AND SERVICEST WITH PREPARATION, FILING AND SERVICE OF HEARATION, FILING AND SERVICE OF HEARATION, FILING AND SERVICE OF FTI CON	CE OF KCC INT OULIHAN INTE	ERIM FEE APPLIC ERIM FEE APPLICA	ATION (1.4); AS ATION (1.4); AS	SSIST
	Lemons, Robert J. L WITH A. SCHWARTZ AND R. FOUST RE KPM AME (.6).	2.10 IG RETENTION	2,940.00 N (1.5); FOLLOW U	027 P EMAILS WITI	56523608 H KPMG
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW FURTHER REVISED ORDER APPROVING NSEL TO THE U.S. TRUSTEE.	0.10 E&Y RETENTI	120.00 ON TO ADDRESS I	027 SSUES RAISED	56500410 O BY
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE PROFESSIONALS FEES TRA ESSIONALS ON INVOICES AND CIRCULATE	. , , .			56500453
	Fang, Weiru EW ISSUES RE: ALG FIRST INTERIM FEE APP USS WITH TEAM RE: SAME (0.1); DISCUSS WI				56533941 (0.2);
05/16/19 REVI	Foust, Rachael L. SE KPMG RETENTION DOCUMENTS (4.3); RE	5.70 VISE RETENTI	3,933.00 ON DOCUMENTS (027 (1.4).	56628319
05/17/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH COMPANY RE INVOICES FOR F	0.10 RETAINED PRO	69.00 DFESSIONALS.	027	56512025
05/17/19 REVI	Fang, Weiru EW ISSUES RE: ALG INTERIM FEE APPLICAT	0.50 ION (0.3); CAL	280.00 L WITH ALG RE: S	027 AME (0.2).	56533988
05/17/19	Foust, Rachael L.	1.20	828.00	027	56628346

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	WITH KPMG REGARDING STATUS, TIMING, JMENTS (0.6).	AND DISCLOS	SURES (0.6); REVIS	SE RETENTION	
05/19/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION	0.10 FOR RETENTION	120.00 ON APPLICATION	027	56513527
05/19/19 REVII	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE PROFESSIONALS FEE TRAC	0.10 CKER.	69.00	027	56514092
05/19/19 REVIS	Foust, Rachael L. SE KPMG RETENTION MATERIALS.	0.20	138.00	027	56628292
05/20/19 PREP	DiBlasi, Kelly ARE FOR HEARING ON RETENTION.	0.10	120.00	027	56531160
COOF	Berger, Ryan Alexander TE PROFESSIONALS FEE TRACKER AND OR RDINATE UPCOMING PAYMENT RUN WITH D I RETAINED PROFESSIONALS FOR COMPANY	. LIGNON (.3);		_	
05/20/19 FILE A	Fang, Weiru ALG INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (0.3); DISCU	0.40 SS WITH R. LE	224.00 EMONS RE: SAME	027 (0.1).	56533952
	Foust, Rachael L. T CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION FOR E&Y NTION MATERIALS AND FOLLOW-UP RE: OU			027); REVISE KPM	56628337 IG
05/20/19	Fabsik, Paul	1.20	450.00	027	56531100

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
CHAF BANK RETA LIQU ELEC 1746 I 2016, CHAF	ARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND ASSIST WITTELL AND ASSIST WITTELL AND SUPPORT OF THE APPLICATION OF KR. P. 2014(A) AND 2016, AND LOCAL RULES 20 IN ERNST & YOUNG CHARTERED ACCOUNTAIDATORS FOR THE DEBTORS NUNC PRO TUNC TRONICALLY FILE AND ASSIST WITH SERVIC REGARDING APPLICATION OF DEBTORS PURS AND LOCAL RULES 2014-1 AND 2016-1 AUTHOR REFED ACCOUNTANTS AS IRISH WIND DOWN COME PRO TUNC TO THE PETITION DATE (.6).	DEBTORS PUT 14-1 AND 2016 NTS AS IRISH TO THE PETIT E CERTIFICAT UANT TO 11 URIZING DEBTO	RSUANT TO 11 U.S1 FOR AUTHORITY WIND DOWN ADV. FION DATE (.6); PRI E OF NO OBJECTIC .S.C. § 327, FED. R. DRS TO RETAIN ER	C. § 327, FED. Y TO EMPLOY ISORS AND EPARE, ON UNDER 28 U BANKR. P. 201 NST & YOUNG	R. AND J.S.C. § 4(A) AND G
	Fabsik, Paul ARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE FIR: ARE, FILE AND ASSIST WITH SERVICE RE: ER!				
05/21/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH WEIL TEAM RE K	1.20 PMG RETENTI	1,680.00 ON.	027	56561886
AND SCHV	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: KPMG RETENTION (.3); CONFEI REVISIONS TO E&Y RETENTION PAPERS TO A VARTZ RE: SAME (0.2); REVIEW REVISED PROF E (0.5).	DDRESS COUR	T COMMENTS (0.5); EMAIL A.	
LIGN	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND CONFIRM OBJECTION DEADLINES FO ON ON COMPLETING PAYMENT RUN (.3); FOLI RIES AND MACQUARIE/WAYPOINT ESTATE EX	LOW UP FOR D	,	* ·	
REVI	Foust, Rachael L. SE ORDER AND FILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJ EW AND REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATI FERENCE WITH K. DIBLASI RE: REVISIONS TO	ON FOR KPMC	AND REVISED PR	`	/ *
05/22/19	Lemons, Robert J.	1.00	1,400.00	027	56562245

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79984.0004 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
REVII	EW AND REVISE KPMG DECLARATION (.8); EM	MAILS WITH	KPMG RE SAME (.2	2).	
	DiBlasi, Kelly L A. SCHWARTZ RE: SECOND SUPPLEMENTAI OSED ORDER.	0.10 L E&Y DECL	120.00 ARATION AND FUI	027 RTHER REVISE	56544058 ED
PROF LIGNO	Berger, Ryan Alexander RESS QUERIES FROM D. LIGNON TO WORK TO ESSIONALS/VENDORS (.5); REVIEW AND COM ON (.9); ADDRESS FOLLOW-UP COMMENTS AN MENT RUN (.4).	MENT ON P	ROPOSED PAYMEN	T RUN PREPA	RED BY D.
05/22/19 REVII	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KMPG RETENTION DECLARA	3.60 ATION AND I	2,484.00 PROPOSED ORDER.	027	56628770
	Lemons, Robert J. S WITH A. SCHWARTZ AND J. O'MARA RE KPI LEMENTAL DECLARATION AND ORDER (2.0).	4.40 MG RETENT	6,160.00 ION (2.4); REVIEW	027 AND REVISE K	56561888 IPMG
05/23/19 WORI	Berger, Ryan Alexander K ON FINALIZATION OF PAYMENT RUN WITH	0.20 D. LIGNON.	138.00	027	56545332
ACCO FEE T MON	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP ON REQUEST FOR COMPANY FINANCE DUNT BALANCING FOR ALL RETAINED PROFE RACKER AND ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSION THLY FEE STATEMENTS TO COMPANY FOR PICE THEIR FEE APPLICATION REQUEST FROM I	ESSIONALS (ONAL FEE T ROCESSING	.6); REVIEW AND U RACKER AND GAT (.5); REVIEW AND A	PDATE PROFE HER AND CIRO	ESSIONALS CULATE
05/23/19 REVII	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE E&Y PROPOSED ORDER AND	0.60 SUPPLEME	414.00 NTAL DECLARATIO	027 ON (0.3); REVIE	56628892 EW AND

REVISE KPMG PROPOSED ORDER AND DISCLOSURE SCHEDULE (0.3).

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/24/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.40	560.00	027	56561891
CALL	S AND EMAILS WITH A. SCHWARTZ RE R	KPMG RETENTION	١.		
05/24/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	360.00	027	56552642
FURT	HER REVISE E&Y RETENTION ORDER AN	ND EMAIL SAME T	TO A. SCHWARTZ.		
05/24/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.30	207.00	027	56552527
FINAI	LIZIE PAYMENT RUN OF ALL FEES.				
05/24/19	Foust, Rachael L.	3.10	2,139.00	027	56628705
REVIS	SE KPMG RETENTION SUPPLEMENTAL D	ECLARATION AN	D FOLLOW-UP RE	GARDING OPE	N ISSUES.
05/26/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.80	1,120.00	027	56562043
EMAI	LS WITH A. SCHWARTZ AND KPMG RE K	PMG SUPPLEMEN	ITAL DECLARATIO	ON AND ORDE	R.
05/26/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.10	120.00	027	56562359
FURT TRUS	HER REVISE E&Y RETENTION ORDER WI TEE.	TH ADDITIONAL	COMMENTS FROM	M COUNSEL TO	OU.S.
05/26/19	Fang, Weiru	0.10	56.00	027	56574759
	EW KPMG FEE STATEMENT EMAIL FROM	I K. DIBLASI.			
05/27/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.40	560.00	027	56561942
EMAI	LS WITH A. SCHWARTZ AND KPMG RE K	PMG RETENTION			
05/27/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.10	69.00	027	56559472
REVII	EW AND UPDATE PROFESSIONALS FEE T	RACKER.			
05/28/19	Lemons, Robert J.	1.10	1,540.00	027	56602050
	WITH A. SCHWARTZ AND J. O'MARA RE ARATION (.5).	KPMG SUPPLEMI	ENTAL AFFIDAVI	Γ (.6); REVIEW	REVISED

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/28/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS PAYMENT RUN QUERIES WITH R.	0.10 LIKELY.	69.00	027	56574756
05/28/19 REVII	Fang, Weiru EW FTI FEE STATEMENT (1.0); EMAIL A	1.20 ALG RE: U.S. TRUSTE	672.00 EE REQUESTS FOR	027 R FEE APPLICA	56574930 TION (0.2).
05/28/19 REVII	Foust, Rachael L. EW AND REVISE KPMG SUPPLEMENTA	1.30 AL DECLARATION A	897.00 ND FOLLOW-UP C	027 ON OPEN ISSUE	56628862 S.
05/29/19 CALL	Lemons, Robert J. S AND EMAILS WITH A. SCHWARTZ, F	1.20 KPMG, AND R. FOUS	1,680.00 FRE KPMG RETEN	027 NTION.	56601866
05/29/19 REVI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT FEE AF	0.60 PPLICATION.	720.00	027	56584758
05/29/19 ADDF	Berger, Ryan Alexander RESS ESTATE PAYMENT RUN AND REI	0.30 LATED QUERIES FOR	207.00 d. D. LIGNON.	027	56584434
	Fang, Weiru TT KPMG FEE STATEMENT (1.0); EMAII SE KPMG FEE STATEMENT (1.5).	2.70 L ALG RE: U.S. TRUS	1,512.00 FEE REQUESTS FO	027 OR FEE APPLIC	56590694 ATION (0.2);
05/29/19 REVIS	Foust, Rachael L. SE AND FILE REVISE PROPOSED ORDE	0.80 ER FOR KPMG.	552.00	027	56628430
	Fabsik, Paul SE AND FILE SUPPLEMENTAL DECLAF NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED PROPO				
05/30/19 EMAI	DiBlasi, Kelly L W. FANG RE: DRAFT FEE STATEMEN	0.10 VT.	120.00	027	56589837

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
)5/30/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE PROFESSIONALS FEES TR	0.20 ACKER.	138.00	027	56588170
05/30/19 REVI	Foust, Rachael L. SE KMPG AND E&Y PROPOSED ORDERS.	0.10	69.00	027	56628411
05/31/19 REVI	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FEES TRA	0.10 ACKER.	69.00	027	56595054
05/31/19 REVI	Foust, Rachael L. SE KPMG AND E&Y DOCUMENTS PER JUDO	0.30 SE'S COMMENT	207.00 °S.	027	56628400
	Kleissler, Matthew ST WITH PREPARATION, FILE AND SERVE S ETENTION APPLICATION.	0.50 ECOND SUPPL	120.00 EMENTAL DECLAI	027 RATION IN SUF	56669100 PPORT OF
	AL TASK 027 - Retention/Fee Applications: fessionals:	121.90	\$95,370.50		
Other Pro		0.20	138.00	028 ND PAYMENT.	56627662
Other Pro 05/08/19 CORF 05/09/19	Foust, Rachael L. RESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFE Foust, Rachael L. RESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFE	0.20 SSIONAL REGA 0.20	138.00 ARDING STATUS A 138.00	ND PAYMENT.	56627981
Other Pro 05/08/19 CORF 05/09/19 CORF PROC 05/14/19 DISCUPROF	Foust, Rachael L. RESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFE Foust, Rachael L. RESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFE	0.20 SSIONAL REGA 0.20 SSIONALS REC 0.40 SUES WITH R. 3 5 FEE TRACKEI	138.00 ARDING STATUS A 138.00 GARDING STATUS (276.00 FOUST (.1); UPDAT	028 OF PAYMENT A 028 CE ORDINARY O	56627981 AND 56674299 COURSE

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	T AND FILE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSION FER RE: SAME (.1).	NAL SUPPLEN	MENTAL NOTICE (0.6); CONFER V	VITH R.
	Fabsik, Paul SE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE NOTICE OF S ESSIONALS USED IN THE ORDINARY COURS			028 ICATION TO E	56492633 MPLOY
05/15/19 CORR	Foust, Rachael L. ESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFESS	0.20 SIONAL RE: T	138.00 IMING OF PAYMEI	028 NT.	56628324
05/16/19 CORR	Foust, Rachael L. ESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFESS	0.20 SIONALS REG	138.00 ARDING STATUS A	028 AND PAYMEN	56628328 Γ (0.2).
05/20/19 REVII	Foust, Rachael L. EW ISSUES RE: ORDINARY COURSE PROFESS	0.50 IONAL.	345.00	028	56628333
	Fabsik, Paul ARE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE NOTICE OF ESSIONALS USED IN THE ORDINARY COURS			028 ICATION TO EN	56531208 MPLOY
05/21/19 CORR PROC	Foust, Rachael L. ESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFESS ESS.	0.30 SIONALS REG	207.00 ARDING TIMING (028 OF PAYMENTS	56628719 AND
	Berger, Ryan Alexander K WITH LEE AND LI ON ORDINARY COURSE I OW UP WITH KCC AND WEIL TEAM RE LEE A			028 RELATED ISSU	56545291 JES (.6);
05/23/19 EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. LS TO R. BERGER RE: ORDINARY COURSE PR	0.20 ROFESSIONAL	175.00 .S.	028	56569919
05/23/19	Foust, Rachael L.	0.20	138.00	028	56628886

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
CORR	RESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFE	SSIONAL REGA	ARDING PAYMENT	OF INVOICES	
05/28/19 Corr	Foust, Rachael L. RESPOND WITH ORDINARY COURSE PROFE	0.10 SSIONAL REGA	69.00 ARDING INVOICING	028 G.	56628709
05/31/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH R. FOUST RE NEW ORDINARY	0.10 COURSE PROI	69.00 FESSIONAL ISSUE.	028	56594988
	AL TASK 028 - Retention/Fee Applications: Course Professionals:	5.20	\$3,310.00		
	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH D. KOKINI RE: LENDER PRESENTATI OW UP EMAIL TO LENDERS RE: HOLDBACI	` '		030 RSON RE: SAN	56675102 ME (.3);
5/21/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM WAC L	0.10 ENDER RE: ST	120.00 ATUS.	030	56537745
5/21/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP ON LENDER COST ALLOCATION QU	0.30 JERIES FOR D. I	207.00 LIGNON.	030	56536183
05/30/19 RESE SWAI	Berger, Ryan Alexander ARCH AND ADDRESS QUERIES FROM D. LIOPS.	0.30 GNON RE RECE	207.00 EIPT OF PAYMENT	030 FOR TERMINA	56680770 ATED
	AL TASK 030 - Secured Creditors etings/Communications:	1.50	\$1,234.00		
	Goldring, Stuart J. L EXCHANGES WITH C. CARSON AND K. DI KELLY REGARDING SAME (.2).	0.60 IBLASI REGAR	960.00 DING NOLS (.4); DR	031 AFT AND SEN	56446275 ID EMAIL
05/30/19	Goldring, Stuart J.	0.40	640.00	031	56613510

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	IEW LETTER FROM PENNSYLVANIA DE ISOR REGARDING SAME (.4).	PT. OF REVENUE, A	ND EMAIL EXCH	ANGE WITH T.	KELLY AND
SUBTOT	AL TASK 031 - Tax Issues:	1.00	\$1,600.00		
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EARCH CREDITOR EXTENDED CREDIT I VITH TEAM AND M&A WITH RESPECT T		483.00 SEMENT ISSUES FO	032 DR D. LIGNON	56500469 (.4); FOLLOW
	CAL TASK 032 - Unsecured Creditors eetings/Communications:	0.70	\$483.00		
	Berger, Ryan Alexander LOW UP WITH R. LEMONS AND U.S. TRU PARE REVISED 341 RESCHEDULED MEE				
PREI	Berger, Ryan Alexander LOW UP WITH R. LIKELY AND B. PODZI PARE STATUS UPDATE FOR COMPANY A WITH K. DOWLING RE MONTHLY OPERA	AND TEAM RE MON			
05/01/19 DRA	Fang, Weiru FT NOTICE OF DISBURSEMENTS FOR M	0.20 ACQUARIE TRUST	112.00 DISMISSAL.	033	56436643
05/02/19 PREI	Berger, Ryan Alexander PARE MATERIALS FOR 341 MEETING FO	0.70 R COMPANY REPRI	483.00 ESENTATIVES (.7).	033	56428577
05/02/19 COO	Berger, Ryan Alexander RDINATE WITH M. KLIESSLER RE: PREF	0.20 PARATION OF FILIN	138.00 GS FOR U.S. TRUS	033 TEE REVIEW.	56428592
05/02/19 DRA	Fang, Weiru FT NOTICE OF DISBURSEMENTS RE: DIS	1.50 SMISSAL OF MSN 92	840.00 20022 TRUST.	033	56436924

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	Kleissler, Matthew ST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS RE: A RUSTEE.	2.00 AMENDED PL	480.00 AN AND DISCLOSU	033 JRE STATEMEI	56497856 NT FOR
	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS 341 MEETING ISSUES WITH B. PODZIUS (ERIALS FOR DECLARANTS (.7).	0.90 (.2); CONTINU	621.00 E PREPARATION C	033 0F 341 MEETING	56435130 G
05/03/19 COOF	Berger, Ryan Alexander RDINATE WITH P. FABSIK RE U.S. TRUSTEE A	0.10 AND COURT FI	69.00 ILINGS.	033	56435138
05/03/19 REVIS	Fang, Weiru SE NOTICE OF DISBURSEMENTS PER B. PODZ	0.40 ZIUS' COMME	224.00 NTS.	033	56436486
05/03/19 ASSIS	Fabsik, Paul ST WITH COMPILING DOCUMENTS FOR U.S. 7	0.40 FRUSTEE REV	150.00 TEW.	033	56732025
05/04/19 PREP	Berger, Ryan Alexander ARE 341 MEETING MATERIALS FOR K. DOWI	0.20 LING.	138.00	033	56435581
05/05/19 REVII	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW U.S. TRUSTEE INVOICE FEE RECONCILIA	0.20 TION WITH F	138.00 II AND FOLLOW U	033 IP WITH B. POD	56437179 DZIUS.
	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW, REVISE, AND PREPARE 341 MEETING QU DZIUS FOR REVIEW.	2.20 JESTIONS ANI	1,518.00 O PREPARE PACKA	033 AGE AND CIRC	56451036 ULATE TO
05/06/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS U.S. TRUSTEE FEES ISSUE WITH B. PODZ	0.10 IIUS.	69.00	033	56451115
05/06/19	Fang, Weiru	0.50	280.00	033	56471257

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
REVI	SE NOTICE OF DISBURSEMENTS (0.3); (CIRCULATE SAME (0	.2).		
	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH D. KOKINI RE: U.S. TRUSTEE FE. EER RE: SAME (.4); REVIEW DISBURSEN	* /:		. , , .	
05/07/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS U.S. TRUSTEE INVOICES WITH U.S.	0.10 TRUSTEE ANALYST	69.00 Г.	033	56454400
05/07/19 PREP. PODZ	Berger, Ryan Alexander ARE, REVIEW AND REVISE 341 MEETIN IIUS.	0.30 IG PREPARATION M.	207.00 ATERIALS PER CO	033 DMMENTS FRO	56454479 OM B.
05/07/19 REVIS	Podzius, Bryan R. SE 341 MEETING MEMO (.2); SEND COM	0.30 IMENTS TO R. BERG	262.50 ER (.1).	033	56492609
05/07/19 EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. L J. NADKARNI RE: U.S. TRUSTEE FEES	0.10 S.	87.50	033	56492612
	DiBlasi, Kelly FERENCE WITH J. FRIEDMAN RE: REQU JMENTATION IN CONNECTION WITH E		120.00 L TO THE U.S. TRI	033 USTEE FOR	56458875
DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander SE 341 MEETING TALKING POINTS ANI USS 341 MEETING AND TALKING POIN' IS AND CIRCULATE TO R. LEMONS FO	TS WITH B. PODZIUS			
05/08/19 REVIS	Podzius, Bryan R. SE 341 MEMO (0.6); DISCUSS SAME WIT	0.90 TH R. BERGER (.3).	787.50	033	56492606
05/10/19	Foust, Rachael L.	0.20	138.00	033	56758998

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
PREP	ARE BINDER FOR U.S. TRUSTEE WITH PRO	OFESSOINAL RET	ENTION MATERL	ALS.	
05/13/19 FILE	Fang, Weiru NOTICE OF DISBURSEMENT.	0.30	168.00	033	56758999
05/13/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. EW U.S. TRUSTEE FEE ESTIMATES.	0.10	87.50	033	56569854
05/13/19	Fabsik, Paul	0.60	225.00	033	56747755
PREP	ARE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE NOTICE	E OF DISBURSEM	ENTS OF MSN 920	0022 TRUST.	
05/14/19 ASSIS	Ellsworth, John A. ST WITH PREPARATION OF MAY 16TH HE.	2.50 ARING DOCUMEN	962.50 NTS FOR U.S. TRU	033 STEE REVIEW.	56747766
05/14/19 ASSIS REVI	Fabsik, Paul ST WITH PREPARATION OF KPMG SUPPLE EW.	0.90 MENTAL DECLA	337.50 RATION DOCUME	033 ENTS FOR U.S. 7	56752801 TRUSTEE
05/15/19 UPDA	Lemons, Robert J. ATE CALL WITH A. SCHWARTZ.	0.20	280.00	033	56523605
	DiBlasi, Kelly FERENCE WITH R. LEMONS RE: FEEDBACI LOSURE STATEMENT HEARING ADJOURN				
05/15/19 ASSIS	Ellsworth, John A. ST WITH PREPARATION OF MAY 16TH HE.	1.50 ARING DOCUMEN	577.50 NTS FOR U.S. TRU	033 STEE REVIEW.	56590689
	Peene, Travis J. ST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS R CHWARTZ).	0.60 E: KPMG RETENT	144.00 TON APPLICATIO	033 N FOR THE U.S	56520414 TRUSTEE

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/15/19 PREPA	Fabsik, Paul ARE PLEADINGS FOR REVIEW BY U.S.	0.90 TRUSTEE.	337.50	033	56747790
05/16/19 ASSIS	Ellsworth, John A. T WITH PREPARATION OF MAY 16TH	2.00 HEARING DOCUME	770.00 NTS FOR U.S. TRUS	033 STEE REVIEW.	56590543
05/16/19 ASSIS	Fabsik, Paul T WITH ASSEMBLY OF DOCUMENTS I	0.90 FOR DELIVERY TO U	337.50 J.S. TRUSTEE.	033	56528252
05/17/19 REVII	Friedman, Julie T. EW MATERIALS FOR U.S. TRUSTEE RE	2.50 :: FIRST INTERIM FEI	1,500.00 E APPLICATION.	033	56524801
05/20/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH WEIL TEAM RE 341 MEETING	0.40 G PREP.	560.00	033	56562119
05/20/19 REVII	Friedman, Julie T. EW MATERIALS FOR U.S. TRUSTEE RE	2.70 :: FIRST INTERIM FEI	1,620.00 E APPLICATION.	033	56561277
05/20/19 DISCU	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS 341 MEETING PREP ISSUES WITH I	0.30 K. DOWLING.	207.00	033	56531057
	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS PREPARATION OF APRIL MONTHI EVIEW AND ADDRESS MONTHLY OPE				
05/21/19 REVII	Lemons, Robert J. EW AND REVISE PREP MATERIALS FO	0.40 R 341 MEETING.	560.00	033	56561931
05/21/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	1.60	1,104.00	033	56536095

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
MON	USS MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT IS ITHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR COMF IEW (1.4).		* **		
TALI RESI	Berger, Ryan Alexander CUSS 341 MEETING ISSUES WITH K. DO' KING POINTS FOR K. DOWLING PER R. PECT THERETO (.1); CALL WITH M. HEA SUPPLEMENT TALKING POINTS AND	LEMONS COMMENTS ALY TO DISCUSS 341	S (.5) AND FOLLO MEETING TALKIN	W UP WITH FT NG POINTS (.2);	I WITH
05/21/19 RESO	Berger, Ryan Alexander DLVE PAYMENT OF U.S. TRUSTEE FEES	0.40 S ISSUES WITH R. LIK	276.00 ELY AND FTI.	033	56536201
05/21/19 SENI	Fang, Weiru DEMAIL TO U.S. TRUSTEE RE: OMNIBU	0.20 US HEARING DATES.	112.00	033	56538176
05/22/19 REV	Lemons, Robert J. IEW 341 MEETING MEMO.	0.70	980.00	033	56562157
	DiBlasi, Kelly FERENCE WITH J. FRIEDMAN RE: EXPE NSEL TO U.S. TRUSTEE (0.3); EMAIL A.			033 ATION REQUES	56544080 STED BY
	Friedman, Julie T. FER WITH K. DIBLASI RE: EXPENSE BA I.S. TRUSTEE.	0.30 CK-UP FOR WEIL FE	180.00 E APPLICATION R	033 EQUESTED BY	56751599 COUNSEL
POD	Berger, Ryan Alexander ISE DRAFT MONTHLY OPERATING REF ZIUS AND CIRCULATE TO D. LIGNON F STION RE INSURANCE WITH T. WOLYN	OR REVIEW (.4); DISC			
05/22/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.60	414.00	033	56540700

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	K WITH U.S. TRUSTEE ANALYST, R. LIKELY, A OLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS WITH B. PODZIUS A			-	LY FEES
LEM(LEM(Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND REVISE 341 MEETING TALKING POIN ONS FOR REVIEW (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE TA ONS AND CIRCULATE TO FTI FOR REVIEW (.6): ULATE WITH COVER LETTER TO K. DOWLING	ALKING POII ; REVISE TAI	NTS PURSUANT TO LKING POINTS PEF	COMMENTS I	FROM R.
05/23/19 DISC	Berger, Ryan Alexander USS 341 MEETING ISSUES WITH FTI.	0.20	138.00	033	56545288
	Berger, Ryan Alexander K WITH COMPANY AND FTI ON REVISING/UPI THLY OPERATING REPORT 7.	0.40 DATING MON	276.00 NTHLY OPERATING	033 G REPORT 6 AN	56545289 ND
	Fang, Weiru USS WITH J. FRIEDMAN RE: U.S. TRUSTEE BIN USS WITH P. FABSIK RE: WEIL INTERIM FEE A				
	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH D. LIGNON RE MONTHLY OPERATIN S. TRUSTEE FEES SATISFACTION (.1).	0.20 NG REPORT S	138.00 STATUS (.1); FOLLO	033 DW UP WITH D	56552518 . KOKINI
ON C	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT MON ALCULATING U.S. TRUSTEE QUARTERLY FEE ECT THERETO (.1); ADDRESS FOLLOW UP QUE	S (.2) AND FO	OLLOW UP WITH E	B. PODZIUS WI	ГН
05/26/19 CONI	Berger, Ryan Alexander FER WITH D. KOKINI AND B. PODZIUS RE SATI	0.20 SFACTION C	138.00 DF U.S. TRUSTEE FI	033 EES.	56553360
05/26/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	0.50	345.00	033	56553570

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
DISC	USS 341 MEETING PREP WITH K. DIBLASI	(.1); PREPARE FO	R 341 MEETING (.4	4).	
	DiBlasi, Kelly IL COUNSEL TO U.S. TRUSTEE RE: OMNIB ARE FOR SECTION 341 MEETING (0.1).	0.20 US HEARING DA	240.00 FES AND E&Y RET	033 TENTION PAPE	56575399 RS (0.1);
	Berger, Ryan Alexander ARE FOR UPCOMING 341 MEETING (.2); C MEETING (.6); REVIEW ISSUES RE:341 MEE		621.00 /OLYNSKI AND K	033 . DOWLING RE	56574847 UPCOMING
05/28/19 REVI	Podzius, Bryan R. EW SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS AND	1.30 OTHER PLEADIN	1,137.50 GS TO PREPARE F	033 OR 341 MEETIN	56631870 NG.
	DiBlasi, Kelly F WITH B. PODZIUS (PARTIAL), K. DOWLII FING (1.8); PREPARE FOR (0.5) AND ATTEN	*		033 PARE FOR SEC	56584751 ПОN 341
ADV	Berger, Ryan Alexander END TO 341 MEETING PREPARATIONS (.3) ANCE OF MEETING PER UPDATED DATA (2) ZIUS (.2).				
	Podzius, Bryan R. ARE FOR (4.8) AND PARTICIPATE IN 341 N YNSKI, C. CHANG AND M. HEALY (1.5).	6.30 MEETING OF CREI	5,512.50 DITORS WITH K. D	033 DIBLASI, K. DOV	56631961 WLING, T.
05/30/19 REVI	Friedman, Julie T. EW BACK UP REQUESTED BY U.S. TRUST	2.30 EE RE: FEE APPLI	1,380.00 CATION.	033	56607784
	Berger, Ryan Alexander L FROM U.S. TRUSTEE RE LATEST FILINGS THLY OPERATING REPORT FOR FILING (.	` ''	138.00 WITH D. LIGNON	033 I RE FINALIZIN	56588210 G

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DiBlasi, Kelly ILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE: A. SCHWARTZ RE JMENTS (0.2); CALL WITH A. SCHWARTZ RE				
05/31/19 PREP	Friedman, Julie T. ARE U.S. TRUSTEE INFORMATION RE: FEE A	3.40 APPLICATION.	2,040.00	033	56608083
COMI BE SE DISM THEN DRAF R. LIF OPER MON REPC	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW AND RESEARCH ISSUES OF RECONCILIT PANY AND FTI (.3); PREPARE BACKUP FILE ENT TO U.S. TRUSTEE ANALYST ALONG WI ISSED CASES (.1); CROSS CHECK FEES TO B IPREP FOR PAYMENT (.3); REVIEW, REVISE ET TO PREPARE FOR FILING (.9); ADDRESS F KELY RE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (.5 LATING REPORT AND PREPARE FILING (.4); THLY OPERATING REPORT WITH D. KOKIN DET WITH B. PODZIUS (.2); REVIEW AND REV ARE FOR FILING (1.2).	FOR FEE PAYM TH CHECK (.6); I SE PAID AGAINS S, AND COMMEN FOLLOW UP QUI S); REVIEW AND DISCUSS AND A I AND D. LIGNO	ENT SUPPORT OF FOLLOW UP WITH IT U.S. TRUSTEE FOR MONTHLY ERIES FROM T. KIND COMMENT ON RALYZE NEEDEIN (.8); DISCUSS M.	U.S. TRUSTEE H D. KOKINI RE BACKUP INVOLO OPERATING RI ELLY AND D. L REVISED MONT D DATA FOR FI IONTHLY OPER	FEES TO CE, AND EPORT IGNON AND THLY LING RATING
	Podzius, Bryan R. EW MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (.2); RE FER WITH R. BERGER RE: SAME (.2).	0.70 VIEW U.S. TRUS	612.50 STEE FEE PAYME	033 NTS AND INVO	56631876 ICES (.3);
SAMI	Podzius, Bryan R. IL A. SCHWARTZ RE: PLAN AND DISCLOSUI E (.2); CONFER WITH K. DIBLASI RE: SAME (ET RE: SAME (.1).		, ,,		
	Peene, Travis J. ST WITH PREPARATION, FILING AND SERVI DD OF APRIL 1, 2019 THROUGH APRIL 30, 20		72.00 NTHLY OPERATIN	033 NG REPORT FOI	56597426 R THE

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	AL TASK 033 - US Trustee etings/Communications:	70.30	\$48,707.50		
FOR S	Stauble, Christopher A. TE FOURTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMEN SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURS THE PERIOD FROM MARCH 1, 2019 TH	SEMENT OF EXPENS	ES INCURRED AS A		
04/30/19 ASSIS	Kleissler, Matthew ST WITH PREPARATION OF MONTHLY	1.50 FEE STATEMENT FO	360.00 OR MARCH 2019.	035	56497756
05/01/19 REVIS	Fang, Weiru SE DRAFT OF INTERIM FEE APPLICAT	4.60 ION IN ACCORDANG	2,576.00 CE WITH MARCH F	035 EE STATEMEN	56674488 T.
DECL SUPP	Fabsik, Paul SE AND FILE NOTICE OF ADJOURNME ARATION IN SUPPORT OF CHAPTER 1 ORT OF CHAPTER 11 PETITIONS (.6); R PTER 11 PETITIONS (.6).	1 PETITIONS (.6); RE	VISE AND FILE AL	THOFF DECLA	
05/02/19 REVIS	Fang, Weiru SE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.20	112.00	035	56758997
05/02/19 REVI	Fabsik, Paul SE FOURTH MONTHLY FEE STATEME	1.00 NT.	375.00	035	56428593
05/03/19 REVII	Friedman, Julie T. EW FEE APPLICATION AND COMMEN	0.40 T ON SAME.	240.00	035	56450194
05/03/19 REVII	Fang, Weiru EW INTERIM FEE APPLICATION WITH	3.90 MARCH FEE STATE	2,184.00 MENTS.	035	56674491
05/03/19	Lee, Kathleen	1.40	588.00	035	56443773

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index					
ASSIS	ASSIST P. FABSIK WITH FEE APPLICATION.									
05/06/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT FIRST INTERIN	1.20 M FEE APPLI	1,440.00 CATION.	035	56451121					
05/06/19 REVIS	Fang, Weiru SE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION WITH MARCH	1.50 NUMBERS.	840.00	035	56471465					
05/07/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICAT	2.60 ION (0.9); RE	3,120.00 EVIEW AND COMM	035 ENT ON SAME	56455162 (1.7).					
	Fang, Weiru USS INTERIM FEE APPLICATION WITH K. DIBL RIM FEE APPLICATION DRAFT PER K. DIBLAS	, , , ,		035 SAME (0.2); RE	56471240 VISE					
05/07/19 REVIE	Lee, Kathleen EW DOCKET AND UPDATE RETENTION CHECK	0.50 KLIST.	210.00	035	56495347					
05/07/19 REVIS	Fabsik, Paul SE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.90	712.50	035	56457240					
	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH J. FRIEDMAN AND W. FANG RE: FEE AI W. FANG RE: FEE APPLICATION COMMENTS		1,440.00 (0.5); REVIEW ISSU	035 JES RE: SAME (56458864 (0.1); MEET					
	Friedman, Julie T. EW AND REVISE FEE APPLICATION AND CONI ASI AND W. FANG RE: SAME (.5).	3.00 DUCT RESEA	1,800.00 ARCH RE: SAME (2.	035 5); MEET WITH	56488402 I K.					
05/08/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH W. FANG RE: FEE APPLICATION.	0.20	199.00	035	56460855					

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
DISCU PER J. CARS	Fang, Weiru JSS INTERIM FEE APPLICATION WITH P. FA JSS WITH K. DIBLASI AND J. FRIEDMAN FE FRIEDMAN COMMENTS (1.0); DISCUSS WI ON FEE APPLICATION (0.3); REVISE FEE AI NDING OF FEE APPLICATIONS (0.2).	EE APPLICATION TH K. DIBLASI	N (0.5); REVISE INT FEE APPLICATION	TERIM FEE APP (0.3); DISCUSS	PLICATION S WITH C.
	Lee, Kathleen T P. FABSIK WITH REVISING FIRST INTERI AME (.2).	2.00 IM FEE APPLICA	840.00 ation (1.8); Corri	035 ESPOND WITH	56474342 P. FABSIK
05/08/19 REVIS	Fabsik, Paul SE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (.9); C	1.20 CONFER WITH W	450.00 V. FANG RE: SAME	035 (.3).	56458788
05/09/19 ATTE	Ivanova, Iliana Z. NTION TO FEE APPLICATION REQUEST FR	0.50 OM W. FANG.	437.50	035	56675104
05/09/19 REVIS	Fang, Weiru SE WEIL'S FEE APPLICATION (4.4); DISCUSS	4.80 S SAME WITH V	2,688.00 ARIOUS MEMBER	035 S OF THE TEAM	56675105 M (0.4).
05/09/19 CONF	Podzius, Bryan R. ER WITH W. FANG RE: FEE APPLICATION.	0.10	87.50	035	56471215
05/10/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT FI	2.40 EE APPLICATIO	2,880.00 N.	035	56469939
05/10/19 REVII	Friedman, Julie T. EW FEE APPLICATION AND COMMENT ON	1.10 SAME.	660.00	035	56488398
05/11/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT FI	1.00 EE APPLICATIO	1,200.00 N.	035	56469912

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	Fang, Weiru USS WEIL'S FEE BUDGET WITH FTI (MENTS (3.4).	3.90 0.5); REVISE INTERIM I	2,184.00 FEE APPLICATION	035 I PER K.DIBLA	56470855 SI
05/12/19 REVI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON FURTHER R	0.80 EVISED DRAFT FEE AP	960.00 PPLICATION.	035	56475037
CALC	Fang, Weiru SE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION PER CULATION (0.4); RESEARCH RE: BUD ICATION FOR REVIEW (0.5).		. ,,		
05/13/19 REVI (4.2).	Fang, Weiru SE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION PER	4.20 K. DIBLASI COMMENT	2,352.00 S AND CIRCULAT	035 E SAME FOR R	56674263 EVIEW
05/14/19 REVI FANC	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON FURTHER R G (.2).	1.10 EVISED DRAFT FEE AP	1,320.00 PPLICATION (.9); D	035 DISCUSS SAME	56492684 WITH W.
05/14/19 CALI	Friedman, Julie T. S WITH W. FANG RE: FEE APPLICAT	0.50 TION AND EMAILS RE S	300.00 SAME.	035	56495141
05/14/19 DISC	Fang, Weiru USS FEE APPLICATION WITH J. FRIE	0.70 DMAN (0.5); DISCUSS F	392.00 FEE APPLICATION	035 WITH K. DIBL	56674300 ASI (0.2).
05/14/19 UPD	Fang, Weiru ATE AND CIRCULATE WEIL'S INTERI	0.50 M FEE APPLICATION F	280.00 FOR REVIEW (0.5).	035	56751842
05/15/19 REVI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW REVISED VERSION OF FEE APPL	0.30 ICATION FOR FILING.	360.00	035	56496913

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
(0.1);	Fang, Weiru EW WEIL INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (0 ASSIST PARALEGAL IN FILING WEIL'S I AME (0.1); DISCUSS WITH K. DIBLASI RE	NTERIM FEE APPL			
05/15/19 PREP	Fabsik, Paul ARE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE FIRST	0.80 TINTERIM FEE API	300.00 PLICATION.	035	56509874
05/17/19 REVI	Friedman, Julie T. EW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH U	3.50 .S. TRUSTEE GUID	2,100.00 ELINES.	035	56524951
05/20/19 CONI	DiBlasi, Kelly FERENCE WITH W. FANG RE: HEARING O	0.10 ON FEE APPLICATION	120.00 ONS.	035	56531242
05/20/19 DISC	Fang, Weiru USS WITH K. DIBLASI RE: INTERIM FEE	0.10 APPLICATION.	56.00	035	56680986
05/21/19 REVI	Friedman, Julie T. EW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH U	0.50 .S. TRUSTEE GUID	300.00 ELINES.	035	56561178
05/21/19 UPD	Lee, Kathleen ATE RETENTION CHECKLIST (.4); CORRE	0.50 SPOND WITH CON	210.00 FLICTS DEPARTM	035 IENT RE: SAME	56564176 E(.1).
05/22/19 REVI	Friedman, Julie T. EW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH U	1.70 .S. TRUSTEE GUID	1,020.00 ELINES.	035	56561252
05/23/19 REVI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: FEE APPLICATION BACK	0.10 UP.	120.00	035	56545056
05/23/19 REVI	Friedman, Julie T. EW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH U	1.70 .S. TRUSTEE GUID	1,020.00 ELINES.	035	56561097

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW APRIL MONTHLY TIME RECORDS FOR C ELINES.	3.50 ONFIDENTIAL	4,200.00 ITY AND COMPLL	035 ANCE WITH U.	56575408 S. TRUSTEE
05/28/19 REVII	Friedman, Julie T. EW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH U.S. T	4.60 RUSTEE GUIDI	2,760.00 ELINES.	035	56608016
	DiBlasi, Kelly EW APRIL TIME RECORDS FOR CONFIDENTI ELINES.	1.50 ALITY AND CO	1,800.00 DMPLIANCE WITH	035 I U.S. TRUSTEE	56584745
05/29/19 REVII	Friedman, Julie T. EW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH U.S. T	0.60 RUSTEE GUIDI	360.00 ELINES.	035	56608033
05/29/19 PREPA	Fabsik, Paul ARE FIFTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	1.40	525.00	035	56585712
05/30/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MONTHLY F	0.20 EE STATEMEN	240.00 T.	035	56589826
05/30/19 REVII	Friedman, Julie T. EW FEE STATEMENT AND COMMENT ON SA	1.00 ME AND EMA	600.00 ILS RE: SAME.	035	56607831
05/30/19 PREPA	Fabsik, Paul Are Fifth Monthly Fee Application.	1.40	525.00	035	56619567
05/31/19 REVII	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT FEI	0.10 E STATEMENT	120.00	035	56595828
05/31/19 ADVI	Fang, Weiru SE ON SERVICE PROCEDURES RE: WEIL FIF	0.20 TH MONTHLY	112.00 FEE STATEMENT.	035	56595637

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	Peene, Travis J. T WITH PREPARATION, FILING AND HAL AND MANGES.	1.50 D SERVICE OF THE FIF	360.00 TH MONTHLY FEE	035 STATEMENT (56597433 OF WEIL,
	AL TASK 035 - WG&M Billing/Fee Applications:	98.20	\$62,840.50		
05/08/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH WAC 1 AGENT COUNSEL RE	0.30 : ESCROWED FUNDS (.	262.50 2); EMAIL WAC 1 L	036 ENDERS RE: SA	56492607 AME (.1).
05/08/19 EMAI	Podzius, Bryan R. L TO WAC 1 RE: PLAN.	0.10	87.50	036	56754947
SUBTOTA	L TASK 036 - WAC 1:	0.40	\$350.00		
05/07/19 CORR	Moreland, Vernell Henry ESPONDENCE WITH T. KELLY (MA	0.60 CQUARIE) AND R. HY!	474.00 MAN RE: VAT PAYN	037 MENTS.	56482770
05/08/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH WAC 2 AGENT COUNSEL RE	0.30 : SAME (.2); EMAIL K. I	262.50 DIBLASI RE: SAME	037	56729171
	Cruz, Mariel E. ESPONDENCE RE WAC 2 TAX UPDA ERS (0.1).	0.20 ATES (0.1); REVIEW AP	199.00 A RE POST-CLOSIN	037 IG RIGHTS OF	56613400 WAC 2
05/29/19 CORR	Moreland, Vernell Henry ESPONDENCE WITH M. CRUZ RE: R	0.80 EVERSIONARY INTER	632.00 EST WIND DOWN A	037 ACCOUNT ISSU	56611798 JES.
05/30/19 CORR	Moreland, Vernell Henry ESPONDENCE WITH T. KELLY RE: 1	0.40 NORWEGIAN TAX ISSU	316.00 JE.	037	56611638
05/31/19	Cruz, Mariel E.	0.40	398.00	037	56603044

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
CONF	ERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING I	RE TRANSFER TAX ISS	UES IN NORWAY.		
SUBTOTA	AL TASK 037 - WAC 2:	2.70	\$2,281.50		
05/10/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH WEIL TEAM RE WAC6 DER	0.30 IVATIVES TERMINATI	420.00 ON.	039	56477823
5/31/19 REVII	Berger, Ryan Alexander EW ISSUES RE: CLOSING OF POSITIC	0.20 ON IN WAC6 SWAPS.	138.00	039	56594965
SUBTOTA	AL TASK 039 - WAC 6:	0.50	\$558.00		
	DiBlasi, Kelly YZE LEGAL ISSUES AND STRATEGY OSED PLAN RELEASES.	0.70 Y IN CONNECTION WI	840.00 ГН WAC7 LENDER	040 S' COMMENTS	56427640 TO
5/02/19 WEIL	DiBlasi, Kelly TEAM MEETING RE: PLAN ISSUES R	1.30 AAISED BY WAC 7 LEN	1,560.00 DERS.	040	56430067
5/03/19 CALL	DiBlasi, Kelly WITH WEIL TEAM AND ALG RE: CC	0.40 OMMENTS TO RELEAS!	480.00 ES RAISED BY WA	040 C7 LENDERS.	56438502
05/07/19 REVII WENI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND COMMENT ON SLIDES PREI DER.	0.10 PARED BY FTI IN RESE	120.00 PONSE TO DILIGEN	040 NCE REQUESTS	56455082 5 FROM D.
COMN	DiBlasi, Kelly ERENCE WITH B. PODZIUS RE: POTE MENTS (.2); REVIEW PROPOSED REV CTIONS (0.3); MEET WITH B. PODZIU	VISIONS TO PLAN PRO			
5/09/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	1.00	875.00	040	56755028

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	WITH D. WENDER RE: SAME (.6); CONFEREN MENTS (.4).	ICES WITH K.	DIBLASI RE: WAC	7 LENDER PL	AN
05/10/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH D. WENDER RE: PLAN.	0.30	262.50	040	56755538
TRAN	Lemons, Robert J. EW EMAIL FROM D. WENDER RE SAME (.2); C ISIER RE SAME (1.3); CALL WITH D. WENDER I RE SAME (1.2); CALL WITH H. YAZHARI ANI	AND B. PODZ	ZIUS RE SAME (.4);		
R. LE	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: PLAN COUNTERPROPOSAL FF MONS RE: SAME (0.8); REVIEW AND RESPONI OSAL (0.5).				
	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH R. LEMONS RE: CHAPTER 11 PLAN (.8) WITH H. YAZHARI AND R. LEMONS RE: WAC				
REVI SAMI WAC LEMO	DiBlasi, Kelly EW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS WITH WEIL THEW PROPOSED REVISIONS RE: SAME (0.1); CAE (0.7); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM THE PLAN OBJECTIONS (0.2); CALL WITH R. LEMONS (0.1), AND R. LEMONS AND H. YAZHARI (OSAL; CONFERENCE WITH R. LEMONS AND H.	ALL WITH B. T ROM WEIL TE. IONS RE: SAM (0.2) RE: WAC	TRANSIER, R. LEM AM RE: STRATEGY IE (0.4); CALLS WI 7 COMMENTS TO I	ONS AND B. PO Y FOR ADDRES TH G. HOLTZE	DDZIUS RE: SSING R (0.2), R.
RELE	Soto, Edward ARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH ASES AND WAC-7'S PROPOSALS RELATED TO RESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).				56499384 OPOSED
05/15/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	360.00	040	56496999

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	WITH R. LEMONS, B. PODZIUS AND R RING TO ADDRESS OBJECTIONS RAISE			CLOSURE STAT	ΓΕΜΕΝΤ
05/22/19 REVII	Lemons, Robert J. EW REVISED PLAN AND EMAILS WITH	1.00 HD. WENDER RE SA	1,400.00 ME.	040	56562150
SUBTOTA	AL TASK 040 - WAC 7:	16.40	\$19,795.00		
05/09/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH WEIL TEAM RE WAC8 PROOF	0.30 F OF CLAIM INQUIR	420.00 Y.	041	56601928
SUBTOTA	AL TASK 041 - WAC 8:	0.30	\$420.00		
05/09/19 PREP	Chelesnik, Alexandra Garcia ARE CLOSING SET FOR WAC 9 TRANS	3.30 ACTION.	1,848.00	042	56465721
05/15/19 PREP.	Chelesnik, Alexandra Garcia ARE AND DISTRIBUTE CLOSING SET.	0.30	168.00	042	56496489
05/17/19 REVII	Cruz, Mariel E. EW AND ANALYZE OBLIGATIONS UNI	0.20 DER WAC 9 PURCHA	199.00 SE AGREEMENT.	042	56519699
	Cruz, Mariel E. RESPONDENCE WITH R. BERGER RE W PHASE AGREEMENT.	0.10 AC 9 AUDITOR RIGI	99.50 HTS UNDER MACQ	042 UARIE TSA AN	56766321 ID WAC 9
05/20/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH M&A AND ALG TEAM FO	0.60 DR AUDIT PAPERS R	414.00 EQUEST.	042	56531285
05/21/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP WITH M. COGHLAN RE AUDIT	0.10 TURNOVER INQUIR	69.00 Y.	042	56536166

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
SUBTOTA	AL TASK 042 - WAC 9:	4.60	\$2,797.50		
05/01/19 REVI	DiBlasi, Kelly EW ISSUES RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT WIT	0.10 H WAC10 LE	120.00 NDER.	043	56427343
05/01/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH L. WHIDDEN RE: WAC 10 SETTLEMEN	0.60 Γ (0.1); ATTE	597.00 NTION TO WAC 10	043 ISSUES (0.5).	56442766
05/03/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH L. WHIDDEN RE: 506(C) SETTLEMENT.	0.10	99.50	043	56442661
05/06/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH L. WHIDDEN RE: 506(C) (0.1); ATTENTI	0.20 ON TO WAC	199.00 10 LENDER 506(C) I	043 ISSUES (0.1).	56460862
05/07/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH C. CARSON RE WAC 10 SETTLEMEN	0.40 T.	560.00	043	56601788
05/07/19 COMI	Carson, Candice M. MENT ON WAC 10 AGENT LETTER.	0.90	895.50	043	56460882
05/08/19 EMAI	Lemons, Robert J. LS WITH C. CARSON RE WAC10 SETTLEMEN	0.40 Γ.	560.00	043	56602162
05/08/19 ATTE	Carson, Candice M. NTION TO WAC 10 SETTLEMENT.	0.70	696.50	043	56460898
05/09/19 COMI	Lemons, Robert J. MUNICATE WITH C. CARSON AND B. PODZIU	0.40 S RE WAC10	560.00 NEGOTIATIONS.	043	56602004
05/09/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH B. TRANSIER AND B. PODZIUS RE: AIR	0.20 BUS SETTLE	199.00 MENT.	043	56480430

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	Carson, Candice M. WITH L. WHIDDEN AND B. PODZIUS RE: WAC 0 SETTLEMENT (1.4).	1.70 2 10 SETTLEM	1,691.50 MENT (0.3); DRAFT	043 PLAN PROVIS	56480544 ION FOR
05/10/19 CALL	Podzius, Bryan R. WITH L. WHIDDEN RE: PLAN.	0.30	262.50	043	56755539
05/13/19 EMAII	Lemons, Robert J. S WITH B. PODZIUS RE WAC10 SETTLEMENT	0.40 AND THE C	560.00 HAPTER 11 PLAN.	043	56496246
05/13/19 REVIE	Carson, Candice M. W ISSUES RE: WAC10 SETTLEMENT.	0.30	298.50	043	56510114
05/13/19 EMAII	Podzius, Bryan R. S WITH L. WHIDDEN RE: AIRBUS.	0.20	175.00	043	56569923
05/15/19 CALL	Carson, Candice M. WITH L. WHIDDEN RE: WAC10 SETTLEMENT	0.60 (.4); ATTN T	597.00 O WAC10 SETTLEN	043 MENT (.2).	56510170
05/15/19 REVIE	Podzius, Bryan R. W AND REVISE WAC 10 SETTLEMENT PLAN I	0.90 LANGUAGE	787.50 (.9).	043	56755543
05/23/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly W ISSUES RE: WAC10 AIRCRAFT (0.1); CALL T	0.20 Г. WOLYNSK	240.00 XI RE: SAME (0.1).	043	56545052
05/26/19 REVIE	DiBlasi, Kelly W ISSUES RE: PROPOSED AIRBUS SETTLEME	0.20 NT (0.1); EM	240.00 AIL B. PODZIUS RE	043 E: SAME (0.1).	56562947
05/26/19 REVIE	Podzius, Bryan R. W AGENT LETTER RE: AIRBUS SETTLEMENT	0.40	350.00	043	56631944

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
05/27/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.30	420.00	043	56562313
EMAI	LS WITH WEIL TEAM RE AIRBUS SETTLEME	ENT.			
05/28/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	0.30	360.00	043	56575386
	EW DRAFT EMAIL MEMO TO LENDERS RE: P MENT ON DRAFT PROPOSED PLAN LANGUA				AND
05/28/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	0.60	525.00	043	56631834
REVIS	SE AIRBUS AGENCY LETTER.				
05/28/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	2.90	2,537.50	043	56758828
	LS WITH L. WHIDDEN RE: AIRBUS PLAN LAI UAGE (2.2); CONFER WITH T. KELLY RE: TR.				
(.2).	ONGE (2.2), CONTER WITH I. REEL FRE. IR.	MINOI EKO ITAN	E5 (.2), COM ER V	VIIII IX. DIDEA	of RE. Stavie
05/29/19	Lemons, Robert J.	0.60	840.00	043	56602078
EMAI	LS WITH DENTONS AND B. PODZIUS RE 506((C) SETTLEME	NT.		
05/29/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	1.60	1,400.00	043	56631885
	EW AND SUMMARIZE TERMS OF AIRBUS SE LEMENT (.4); CONFER WITH R. BERGER RE: S	`	0); DRAFT EMAIL	TO LENDERS F	RE: AIRBUS

SUBTOTA	AL TASK 043 - WAC 10:	15.50	\$15,771.00		
05/03/19 FOLL	Berger, Ryan Alexander OW UP ON MUFG BAR DATE QUERIES W	0.30 ITH B. PODZIUS.	207.00	044	56435106
05/13/19 REVII	Son, Seung Wook EW AND COMPILE ORIGINAL SIGNATUR	0.90 ES TO THE WAC 1	504.00 2 CLOSING.	044	56513597
05/21/19 REVII	Fang, Weiru EW EMAILS RE: WAC 12 KPMG.	0.80	448.00	044	56683232

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 79984.0004 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index	
SUBTOT	ΓAL TASK 044 - WAC 12:	2.00	\$1,159.00			
Total Fe	es Due	978.70	\$801,010.50			
1044110	es Duc	710110	ψοσ1,σ1σ.2σ			

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>NAME</u>			
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/23/19	Son, Seung Wook DUPLICATING	H025	39721950	140.83
	PAYEE: CLOSINGBINDERS.COM (40866-01); INVOICE#: PRODUCTION OF ENCRYPTED CLOSING SET DOCUME	,		SSIONAL
05/23/19	Son, Seung Wook	H025	39721964	396.98
	DUPLICATING			
	PAYEE: CLOSINGBINDERS.COM (40866-01); INVOICE#: PRODUCTION OF ENCRYPTED CLOSING SET DOCUME	*		SSIONAL
05/23/19	Fabsik, Paul	H071	39723968	19.58
	AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL			
	PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 6548	14367; DATE: 5/	10/2019 - FEDEX II	NVOICE:

PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 654814367; DATE: 5/10/2019 - FEDEX INVOICE 654814367 INVOICE DATE:190510TRACKING #: 786976810680 SHIPMENT DATE: 20190501 SENDER: PAUL FABSIK WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: HON STUART BERNSTEIN, UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT, 1 BOWLING GRN, NEW YORK, NY 10004

05/23/19 Zaslav, Benjamin

H071 39724277

13.56

AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL

PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 655571453; DATE: 5/17/2019 - FEDEX INVOICE: 655571453 INVOICE DATE:190517TRACKING #: 787179403567 SHIPMENT DATE: 20190510 SENDER: BENJAMIN ZASLAV WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: ANDREA SCHWARTZ, OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES TR, U S FEDERAL BUILDING 201 VARIC, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10014

05/23/19 Fabsik, Paul

H071

39724355

18.09

AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL

PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 655571453; DATE: 5/17/2019 - FEDEX INVOICE: 655571453 INVOICE DATE:190517TRACKING #: 787241641996 SHIPMENT DATE: 20190514 SENDER: PAUL FABSIK WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: HON STUART BERNSTEIN, UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT, 1 BOWLING GRN, NEW YORK, NY 10004

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

N	A	M	E

 DATE
 DESCRIPTION
 DISB TYPE
 DISB ID#
 AMOUNT

 05/23/19
 Fabsik, Paul
 H071
 39724387
 19.58

AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL

PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 654139526; DATE: 5/3/2019 - FEDEX INVOICE: 654139526 INVOICE DATE:190503TRACKING #: 786922389923 SHIPMENT DATE: 20190429 SENDER: PAUL FABSIK WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: HON STUART BERNSTEIN, UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT, 1 BOWLING GRN, NEW YORK, NY 10004

05/23/19 Fabsik, Paul H071 39724434 19.58

AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL

PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 654139526; DATE: 5/3/2019 - FEDEX INVOICE: 654139526 INVOICE DATE:190503TRACKING #: 786922664641 SHIPMENT DATE: 20190429 SENDER: PAUL FABSIK WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: HON STUART BERNSTEIN, UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT, 1 BOWLING GRN, NEW YORK, NY 10004

05/23/19 Fabsik, Paul H071 39724534 19.58

AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL

PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 654139526; DATE: 5/3/2019 - FEDEX INVOICE: 654139526 INVOICE DATE:190503TRACKING #: 786897220864 SHIPMENT DATE: 20190426 SENDER: PAUL FABSIK WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: ANDREA SCHWARTZ, OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES TR, 201 VARICK ST, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10014

05/23/19 Fabsik, Paul H071 39724545 19.58

AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL

PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 654139526; DATE: 5/3/2019 - FEDEX INVOICE: 654139526 INVOICE DATE: 190503TRACKING #: 786936014967 SHIPMENT DATE: 20190429 SENDER: PAUL FABSIK WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: SCHWARTZ ANDREA, OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES TR, 201 VARICK ST, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10014

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

NAME DATE **DESCRIPTION DISB TYPE** DISB ID# **AMOUNT** Stauble, Christopher A. 05/10/19 H073 39700656 43.18 FIRM MESSENGER SERVICE PAYEE: XYZ (37976-01); INVOICE#: 1682382; DATE: 5/8/2019 - TAXI CHARGES FOR 2019-05-08 INVOICE #16823829042627464 PAUL FABSIK E489 RIDE DATE: 2019-04-26 FROM: 767 5 AVE. MANHATTAN, NY TO: MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME: 17:43 05/15/19 Fabsik, Paul H073 39707108 43.24 FIRM MESSENGER SERVICE PAYEE: SKYLINE CREDIT RIDE, INC. (12217-01); INVOICE#: 853810; DATE: 5/10/2019 - TAXI CHARGES FOR 2019-05-10 INVOICE #853810831602 PAUL FABSIK E489 RIDE DATE: 2019-05-03 FROM: GENERAL MOTORS BUILDING, 767 5TH AVENUE, MANHATTAN, NY TO: MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME: 09:25 05/17/19 Fabsik, Paul H073 39710686 7.88 FIRM MESSENGER SERVICE PAYEE: DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS, INC. (29245-01); INVOICE#: 265968; DATE: 5/5/2019 -COURIER SERVICE DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS ORDER #265968 5/3/2019 09:16 AM FROM: 767 5TH AVENUE NEW YORK NY TO: 201 VARICK STREET NEW YORK NY 05/17/19 Fabsik, Paul H073 39710688 7.88 FIRM MESSENGER SERVICE PAYEE: DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS, INC. (29245-01); INVOICE#: 265968; DATE: 5/5/2019 -COURIER SERVICE DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS ORDER #265968 5/1/2019 01:29 PM FROM: 767 5TH AVENUE NEW YORK NY TO: 201 VARICK STREET NEW YORK NY 05/17/19 Fabsik, Paul H073 39710695 7.88

FIRM MESSENGER SERVICE

PAYEE: DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS, INC. (29245-01); INVOICE#: 265968; DATE: 5/5/2019 - COURIER SERVICE DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS ORDER #265968 5/1/2019 09:58 AM FROM: 767 5TH AVENUE NEW YORK NY TO: 201 VARICK STREET NEW YORK NY

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID# A	MOUNT	
05/30/19	Fabsik, Paul	Н073	39732242	7.88	
	FIRM MESSENGER SERVICE PAYEE: DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS, INC. (29245-01); INVOICE#: 266374; DATE: 5/26/2019 - COURIER SERVICE DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS ORDER #266374 5/24/2019 10:14 AM FROM: 767 5TH AVENUE NEW YORK NY TO: 201 VARICK STREET NEW YORK NY				
05/30/19	Fabsik, Paul	H073	39732245	7.88	
	FIRM MESSENGER SERVICE PAYEE: DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS, INC. (29245-01); COURIER SERVICE DELUXE DELIVERY SYSTEMS ORD 5TH AVENUE NEW YORK NY TO : 201 VARICK STREET	ER #266374 5/20	0/2019 12:49 PM FROM		
05/01/19	Fang, Weiru	H080	39692332	20.00	
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3123724; DATE: 5/5/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTH FANG ON 05/01/19 AT 5:40	I MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED BY WEI	RU	
05/02/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39692337	20.00	
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T				
	INVOICE#: 3123724; DATE: 5/5/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTH BERGER ON 05/02/19 AT 7:05	I MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED BY RYA	AN A	
05/02/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39692426	20.00	
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3123724; DATE: 5/5/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTH R PODZIUS ON 05/02/19 AT 6:12	I MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED BY BRY	'AN	
05/06/19	Lewitt, Alexander G.	H080	39690005	20.00	
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T				

INVOICE#: CREX3296314205061325; DATE: 5/6/2019 - DINNER, MAY 01, 2019

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	NAME					
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>		
05/06/19	Fang, Weiru	H080	39736451	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3127301; DATE: 5/12/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT FANG ON 05/06/19 AT 6:11	H MEAL EXPEN	ISE ORDERED BY	WEIRU		
05/07/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39736196	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3127301; DATE: 5/12/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT R PODZIUS ON 05/07/19 AT 6:26	H MEAL EXPEN	ISE ORDERED BY	BRYAN		
05/07/19	Fang, Weiru	H080	39736405	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3127301; DATE: 5/12/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT FANG ON 05/07/19 AT 6:20	H MEAL EXPEN	ISE ORDERED BY	WEIRU		
05/09/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39736258	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3127301; DATE: 5/12/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT R PODZIUS ON 05/09/19 AT 6:06	H MEAL EXPEN	ISE ORDERED BY	BRYAN		
05/13/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39701689	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: CREX3315216505131316; DATE: 5/13/2019 - DI	INNER, MAY 07	, 2019			
05/13/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39701709	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: CREX3315216505131316; DATE: 5/13/2019 - DI	INNER, MAY 07	, 2019			
05/13/19	Fang, Weiru	H080	39701714	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					

INVOICE#: CREX3315216505131316; DATE: 5/13/2019 - DINNER, MAY 07, 2019

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/13/19	Fang, Weiru	H080	39736803	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTE FANG ON 05/13/19 AT 6:18	H MEAL EXPEN	NSE ORDERED BY	WEIRU
05/13/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander MEALS - LEGAL O/T	H080	39736994	20.00
	INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTE A BERGER ON 05/13/19 AT 6:22	H MEAL EXPEN	ISE ORDERED BY	RYAN
05/13/19	Foust, Rachael L.	H080	39737217	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTE RACHAEL L FOUST ON 05/13/19 AT 6:04	H MEAL EXPEN	ISE ORDERED BY	
05/14/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39736847	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTE R PODZIUS ON 05/14/19 AT 6:05	H MEAL EXPEN	NSE ORDERED BY	BRYAN
05/14/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39736962	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTE A BERGER ON 05/14/19 AT 7:07	H MEAL EXPEN	NSE ORDERED BY	RYAN
05/14/19	Fang, Weiru	H080	39736985	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTE FANG ON 05/14/19 AT 7:10	H MEAL EXPEN	ISE ORDERED BY	WEIRU

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/16/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39736968	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT BY RYAN A BERGER ON 05/16/19 AT 6:07	TH MEAL EXPE	NSE PERIOD ORD	ERED
05/17/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737214	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3129140; DATE: 5/19/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/17/19 AT 6:11	'H MEAL EXPEÌ	NSE ORDERED BY	Y RYAN
05/20/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737552	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/20/19 AT 6:01	'H MEAL EXPE	NSE ORDERED BY	Y RYAN
05/21/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39713724	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: CREX3332074005211346; DATE: 5/21/2019 DIN	NNER, MAY 16,	2019	
05/21/19	Foust, Rachael L.	H080	39713728	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: CREX3332074005211346; DATE: 5/21/2019 - D	INNER, MAY 16	5, 2019	
05/21/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737391	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/21/19 AT 5:39	'H MEAL EXPE	NSE ORDERED BY	Y RYAN
05/23/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	Н080	39737403	20.00
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT	'H MEAL EXPEI	NSE ORDERED BY	Y RYAN

A BERGER ON 05/23/19 AT 8:33

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>		
05/24/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737475	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/24/19 AT 7:13	H MEAL EXPE	NSE ORDERED BY	RYAN		
05/25/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737754	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/25/19 AT 1:16	H MEAL EXPEÌ	NSE ORDERED BY	RYAN		
05/25/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737763	-9.50		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/25/19 AT 5:40	H MEAL EXPE	NSE ORDERED BY	RYAN		
05/25/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737780	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/25/19 AT 7:18	H MEAL EXPEÌ	NSE ORDERED BY	RYAN		
05/26/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737627	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORT A BERGER ON 05/26/19 AT 12:57	H MEAL EXPE	NSE ORDERED BY	RYAN		
05/26/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39737764	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3132463; DATE: 5/26/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTH MEAL EXPENSE ORDERED BY RYAN					

A BERGER ON 05/26/19 AT 7:08

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	NAME					
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT		
05/27/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39774788	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3138049; DATE: 6/2/2019 - SEAMLESS NOR'BERGER ON 05/27/19 AT 6:24	TH MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED B	Y RYAN A		
05/28/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39774617	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3138049; DATE: 6/2/2019 - SEAMLESS NOR BERGER ON 05/28/19 AT 10:44	TH MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED B	Y RYAN A		
05/28/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39774877	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3138049; DATE: 6/2/2019 - SEAMLESS NOR'R PODZIUS ON 05/28/19 AT 6:17	TH MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED B	Y BRYAN		
05/30/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H080	39774593	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3138049; DATE: 6/2/2019 - SEAMLESS NOR'R PODZIUS ON 05/30/19 AT 6:53	TH MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED BY	Y BRYAN		
05/30/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H080	39774594	20.00		
	MEALS - LEGAL O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3138049; DATE: 6/2/2019 - SEAMLESS NOR BERGER ON 05/30/19 AT 7:37	TH MEAL EXPEN	SE ORDERED B	Y RYAN A		
05/02/19	Kleissler, Matthew	H083	39692712	20.00		
	MEALS - SUPPORT O/T					
	INVOICE#: 3123724; DATE: 5/5/2019 - SEAMLESS NORTH MEAL EXPENSE ORDERED BY					

MATTHEW KLEISSLER ON 05/02/19 AT 8:01

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

DATE	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/24/19	Joffrion, Karen A CORPORATION SERVICES	H100	39723556	1,816.50
	PAYEE: COGENCY GLOBAL INC. (10307-02); INVOICE#: DOCUMENT SEARCHES OR FILINGS FROM COGENCY	•	ГЕ: 11/19/2018 -	
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696498	23.94
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE#: 100046; DATE: 5/1/2019 - TAXI CHARGES RID NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 22:26	DE DATE: 2019-0	03-31 FROM: NEW	YORK,
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696504	25.34
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE#: 100046; DATE: 5/1/2019 - TAXI CHARGES FOI A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-04-02 FROM: 767 5TH NY RIDE TIME: 23:07			
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696512	24.09
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000464209 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:37	E: 2019-04-25 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	, NY TO:
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696524	26.39
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000464229 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 22:51	E: 2019-04-29 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	, NY TO:
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696529	24.63
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000464173 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-04-16 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:

NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 22:50

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	NAME					
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>		
05/08/19	Foust, Rachael L.	H163	39696547	25.20		
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME					
	INVOICE #1000464108 RACHAEL L FOUST E088 RIDE D NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 01:32		FROM: 767 5TH	AVE,		
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696561	23.41		
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME					
	INVOICE #1000464130 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DA , NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:07	TE: 2019-04-09 F	ROM:, NEW YOR	K, NY TO:		
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696593	24.68		
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME					
	INVOICE #1000464135 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DA NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 21:09	TE: 2019-04-09 F	ROM: NEW YOR	K, NY TO:		
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696600	24.63		
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME					
	INVOICE #1000464101 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DA NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 22:54	TE: 2019-04-03 F	ROM: NEW YOR	K, NY TO:		
05/08/19	Foust, Rachael L.	H163	39696612	24.70		
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME					
	INVOICE #1000464095 RACHAEL L FOUST E088 RIDE D TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 02:40	OATE: 2019-04-03	FROM: NEW YO	ORK, NY		
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39696613	24.39		
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME					
	INVOICE #1000464197 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-04-22 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO:					

NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 23:04

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>NAME</u>			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/08/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME	H163	39696618	25.03
	INVOICE #1000464202 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-04-24 FI	ROM: NEW YORK	X, NY TO:
	NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:18			

 05/08/19
 Berger, Ryan Alexander
 H163
 39696619
 25.00

TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME
INVOICE #1000464187 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-04-17 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 22:02

05/08/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39696624 24.72

TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME

INVOICE #1000464078 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-04-01 FROM: 761 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 21:42

05/08/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39696627 23.46

TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME

INVOICE #1000464123 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-04-08 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 00:27

05/10/19 Podzius, Bryan R. H163 39700531 33.10

TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME

PAYEE: XYZ (37976-01); INVOICE#: 1682382; DATE: 5/8/2019 - TAXI CHARGES FOR 2019-05-08 INVOICE #16823829050101243 BRYAN R PODZIUS D872 RIDE DATE: 2019-05-01 FROM: 767 5 AVE, MANHATTAN, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 21:28

05/10/19 Lemons, Robert J. H163 39700611 43.12

TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME

PAYEE: XYZ (37976-01); INVOICE#: 1682382; DATE: 5/8/2019 - TAXI CHARGES FOR 2019-05-08 INVOICE #16823829050100935 ROBERT J LEMONS 3102 RIDE DATE: 2019-05-01 FROM: 767 5 AVE, MANHATTAN, NY TO: , MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME: 20:03

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

DATE	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/14/19	Podzius, Bryan R. TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME	H163	39703707	17.29
	INVOICE#: CREX3321468105141209; DATE: 5/14/2019 - L	EGAL O/T TAXI	, MAY 07, 2019	
05/15/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H163	39705487	27.55
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE#: CREX3324010405151221; DATE: 5/15/2019 - L	EGAL O/T TAXI	, MAY 13, 2019	
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706859	20.01
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443941 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:19	ГЕ: 2019-03-10 F	ROM: 767 5TH AV	E, NEW
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706870	23.70
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444023 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 01:13	ГЕ: 2019-03-22 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706875	32.04
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444030 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 16:01	ГЕ: 2019-03-23 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706878	24.92
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443945 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:40	ГЕ: 2019-03-11 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443935 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	H163 TE: 2019-03-08 F	39706884 ROM: NEW YORK	22.96 , NY TO:

NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 04:26

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	NAME			
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706887	22.98
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #1000443898 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:19	ГЕ: 2019-03-03 F	ROM: NEW YORK	X, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706897	23.44
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #1000444036 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 23:23	ГЕ: 2019-03-24 F	ROM: NEW YORK	X, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706910	23.07
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #1000443894 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 02:54	ГЕ: 2019-03-02 F	ROM: NEW YORK	X, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706921	24.41
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #1000444057 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 06:03	ΓΕ: 2019-03-28 FI	ROM: NEW YORK	K, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706923	30.15
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #1000443897 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:18	ΓΕ: 2019-03-02 F	ROM: NEW YORK	X, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706926	23.13
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME	FE. 2010 02 24 F	DOM. NEW YORK	NWTO
	INVOICE #1000444033 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	1E: 2019-03-24 F	KOM: NEW YORK	L, NY 10:

NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:00

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME	H163	39706929	23.41
	INVOICE #1000443912 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 04:04	E: 2019-03-05 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706944	30.35
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444072 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 16:46	E: 2019-03-31 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
05/15/19	Foust, Rachael L.	H163	39706945	24.72
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443944 RACHAEL L FOUST E088 RIDE DA TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 01:20	ATE: 2019-03-11	FROM: NEW YOR	RK, NY
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706969	23.35
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444029 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:18	TE: 2019-03-23 F	ROM: NEW YORK	TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706971	29.85
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443942 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 17:19	E: 2019-03-10 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706978	22.96
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443891 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-03-01 F	ROM: 767 5TH AV	E, NEW

YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 04:59

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706984 24.35 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444063 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-29 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 06:05 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706990 23.03 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443961 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-12 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:29 H163 39706991 28.51 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 H163 39706995 23.44	DATE	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444063 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-29 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 06:05 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706990 23.03 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443961 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-12 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:29 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706991 28.51 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45					
INVOICE #1000444063 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-29 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 06:05 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander	05/15/19		H163	39/06984	24.35
NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 06:05 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706990 23.03 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443961 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-12 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:29 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706991 28.51 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44			TE. 2010 02 20 E	DOM, NEW YORK	NV TO.
TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443961 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-12 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:29 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706991 28.51 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44			E: 2019-03-29 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
INVOICE #1000443961 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-12 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:29 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706991 28.51 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44	05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706990	23.03
05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706991 28.51 TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44		TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44			E: 2019-03-12 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-03 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO: 767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44	05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706991	28.51
767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45 05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44		TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706995 23.44		INVOICE #1000443899 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-03-03 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
		767 5TH AVE, NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 13:45			
	05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706995	23.44
		TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
INVOICE #1000443973 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-13 FROM: 767 5TH AVE, NEW		INVOICE #1000443973 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-03-13 F	ROM: 767 5TH AV	E, NEW
YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:59		YORK, NY TO: NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:59			
05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39706996 23.38	05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39706996	23.38
TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME		TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
INVOICE #1000444067 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-30 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO:		INVOICE #1000444067 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-03-30 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:
NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:07		NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 03:07			
05/15/19 Berger, Ryan Alexander H163 39707004 23.55	05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707004	23.55
TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME		TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
INVOICE #1000444007 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DATE: 2019-03-20 FROM: NEW YORK, NY TO:		INVOICE #1000444007 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-03-20 F	ROM: NEW YORK	, NY TO:

NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 00:38

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME	H163	39707007	23.04
	INVOICE #1000443938 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 04:25	E: 2019-03-09 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707008	23.31
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444041 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 04:45	E: 2019-03-26 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707016	28.80
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444068 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 20:13	E: 2019-03-30 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707021	24.01
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443998 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 20:52	E: 2019-03-18 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707022	24.07
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444016 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:43	E: 2019-03-21 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707028	32.20
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000443939 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT	E: 2019-03-09 F	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:

NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 14:09

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707036	23.56
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME INVOICE #1000444070 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:22	E: 2019-03-31 FI	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:
05/15/19	Berger, Ryan Alexander	H163	39707038	23.87
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #1000443921 RYAN A BERGER C817 RIDE DAT NEW YORK, NY RIDE TIME: 05:36	E: 2019-03-06 FI	ROM: NEW YORK,	NY TO:
05/15/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H163	39707080	34.52
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #853810566429 BRYAN R PODZIUS D872 RIDE MOTORS BUILDING, 767 5TH AVENUE, MANHATTAN, 1 20:01			
05/15/19	Fang, Weiru	H163	39707101	31.18
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #853810869460 WEIRU FANG D778 RIDE DATE BUILDING, 767 5TH AVENUE, MANHATTAN, NY TO: MA			
05/22/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H163	39714543	33.40
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #853927869484 BRYAN R PODZIUS D872 RIDE MOTORS BUILDING, 767 5TH AVENUE, MANHATTAN, 1 01:18			
05/22/19	Fang, Weiru	H163	39714563	31.18
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #853927862531 WEIRU FANG D778 RIDE DATE BUILDING, 767 5TH AVENUE, MANHATTAN, NY TO: MA			

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	NAME			
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/23/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H163	39722235	33.10
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #16828999050816248 BRYAN R PODZIUS D872 MANHATTAN, NY TO: MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME: 2		19-05-08 FROM: 76	7 5 AVE,
05/24/19	DiBlasi, Kelly	H163	39725359	138.88
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #16836529051426717 KELLY DIBLASI 4004 RIE TO: MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME: 05:00	DE DATE: 2019-0	5-15 FROM: SEAFO	ORD, NY
05/24/19	Lemons, Robert J.	H163	39725438	43.12
	TRANSPORTATION - LEGAL/OVERTIME			
	INVOICE #16836529051428436 ROBERT J LEMONS 3102 MANHATTAN, NY TO:, MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME:		9-05-14 FROM: 767	7 5 AVE,
05/10/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	H165	39700283	38.66
	TRANSPORTATION - LOCAL MEETING			
	PAYEE: XYZ (37976-01); INVOICE#: 1681885; DATE: 5/1/			
	INVOICE #16818859042218877 BRYAN R PODZIUS D872 ST, MANHATTAN, NY TO: 1 BOWLING GREEN, MANHA		.,	7 E 28
	SI, MANHATTAN, NT TO. I BOWLING GREEN, MANHA	ATTAN, NT KID	E 11ME. 08.13	
05/22/19	Fabsik, Paul	H165	39714569	40.09
	TRANSPORTATION - LOCAL MEETING			
	PAYEE: SKYLINE CREDIT RIDE, INC. (12217-01); INVOI	CE#: 853927; DA	TE: 5/17/2019 - TA	XI

CHARGES FOR 2019-05-17 INVOICE #853927779766 PAUL FABSIK E489 RIDE DATE: 2019-05-14 FROM: GENERAL MOTORS BUILDING, 767 5TH AVENUE, MANHATTAN, NY TO: 201 VARICK

ST M, MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME: 15:16

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

	40.09
05/28/19 Fabsik, Paul H165 39727219	
TRANSPORTATION - LOCAL MEETING	
PAYEE: SKYLINE CREDIT RIDE, INC. (12217-01); INVOICE#: 854248; DATE: 5/24/2019 - TAXI CHARGES FOR 2019-05-24 INVOICE #854248846514 PAUL FABSIK E489 RIDE DATE: 2019-05-3 FROM: GENERAL MOTORS BUILDING, 767 5TH AVENUE, MANHATTAN, NY TO: 1 BOWLING GREEN M, MANHATTAN, NY RIDE TIME: 12:08	
05/01/19 WGM, Firm S011 39693048	1,417.00
DUPLICATING	
2834 COLOR PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 04/26/2019 TO 04/30/2019	
05/15/19 WGM, Firm S011 39706554	8,374.50
DUPLICATING	
16749 COLOR PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 05/08/2019 TO 05/14/2019	
05/22/19 WGM, Firm S011 39715434	1,210.50
DUPLICATING	
2421 COLOR PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 05/15/2019 TO 05/21/2019	
05/22/19 Kocher, Marlon S011 39716129	2,530.00
DUPLICATING	
5060 PRINTING - COLOR IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/15/2019 13:44PM FROM UNIT 61	
05/29/19 Fabsik, Paul S011 39730122	225.00
DUPLICATING	
450 PRINTING - COLOR IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/28/2019 15:11PM FROM UNIT 15	
05/29/19 WGM, Firm S011 39730699	4.00
DUPLICATING	

8 COLOR PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 05/22/2019 TO 05/29/2019

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/07/19	WGM, Firm	S016	39692039	9.70
	DOCUMENT SCANNING			
	97 PAGES SCANNED IN NEW YORK CITY BETWEEN 04/	30/2019 TO 05/0	01/2019	
05/14/19	WGM, Firm	S016	39717226	4.80
	DOCUMENT SCANNING			
	48 PAGES SCANNED IN NEW YORK CITY BETWEEN 05/	07/2019 TO 05/0	08/2019	
05/21/19	WGM, Firm	S016	39715100	4.00
	DOCUMENT SCANNING			
	40 PAGES SCANNED IN NEW YORK CITY BETWEEN 05/	13/2019 TO 05/1	4/2019	
05/28/19	WGM, Firm	S016	39727721	2.80
	DOCUMENT SCANNING			
	28 PAGES SCANNED IN NEW YORK CITY BETWEEN 05/	22/2019 TO 05/2	22/2019	
05/06/19	WGM, Firm	S017	39690269	70.00
	DUPLICATING			
	700 PHOTOCOPY(S) MADE IN NEW YORK CITY BETWEE	EN 04/30/2019 T	O 04/30/2019	
05/20/19	WGM, Firm	S017	39715185	485.20
	DUPLICATING			
	4852 PHOTOCOPY(S) MADE IN NEW YORK CITY BETWI	EEN 05/13/2019	TO 05/17/2019	
05/27/19	WGM, Firm	S017	39727414	22.30
	DUPLICATING			
	223 PHOTOCOPY(S) MADE IN NEW YORK CITY BETWEE	EN 05/21/2019 T	O 05/21/2019	
05/01/19	Fabsik, Paul	S018	39688631	6.80
	DOCUMENT BINDING			
	4 DOCUMENT BINDING IN NEW YORK CITY ON 04/30/20	019 11:44AM FF	ROM UNIT 12	

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/01/19	Fabsik, Paul 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3"	S019	39688634	9.00
	3 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3" IN NEW YORK CITY ON 04/30	0/2019 22:09PM l	FROM UNIT 16	
05/15/19	Fabsik, Paul 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3"	S019	39705967	6.00
	2 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3" IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/14	4/2019 22:15PM I	FROM UNIT 16	
05/22/19	Friedman, Julie T. 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3"	S019	39715965	3.00
	1 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3" IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/21	1/2019 12:22PM 1	FROM UNIT 03	
05/22/19	Friedman, Julie T. 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3"	S019	39715995	3.00
	1 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3" IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/21	1/2019 12:03PM	FROM UNIT 15	
05/22/19	Fabsik, Paul 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3"	S019	39716062	6.00
	2 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3" IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/17	7/2019 12:50PM	FROM UNIT 11	
05/22/19	Friedman, Julie T. 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3"	S019	39716095	3.00
	1 3 RING BINDER 1" TO 3" IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/21	1/2019 13:35PM	FROM UNIT 16	
05/22/19	Fang, Weiru COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH	S061	39720837	502.31
	NY WESTLAW - FANG, WEIRU 04/30/2019 CONNECT TIN TRANSACTIONS: 47	ИЕ: 0:00:00 DOC	/LINE(S): 0	

	<u>NAME</u>			
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/22/19	Foust, Rachael L.	S061	39720838	183.11
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH			
	NY WESTLAW - FOUST,RACHAEL 04/29/2019 CONNECT TRANSACTIONS: 11	TIME: 0:00:00 I	DOC/LINE(S): 0	
05/22/19	Foust, Rachael L.	S061	39720839	78.47
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH			
	NY WESTLAW - FOUST,RACHAEL 04/07/2019 CONNECT TRANSACTIONS: 6	TIME: 0:00:00 I	DOC/LINE(S): 0	
05/24/19	Kleissler, Matthew	S061	39728428	4.30
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH			
	NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARGED 04/01/19-04/30/	19		
05/24/19	Stauble, Christopher A.	S061	39728444	3.10
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH	10		
	NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARGED 04/01/19-04/30/	19		
05/24/19	Fabsik, Paul	S061	39728481	116.50
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH			
	NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARGED 04/01/19-04/30/	19		
05/24/19	Lee, Kathleen	S061	39728576	28.50
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH	10		
	NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARGED 04/01/19-04/30/	19		
05/24/19	Podzius, Bryan R.	S061	39728622	65.50
	COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH			
	NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARGED 04/01/19-04/30/	19		

<u>DATE</u>	NAME DESCRIPTION	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/24/19	Keschner, Jason COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH NY PACER SERVICE CENTER CHARGED 04/01/19-04/30/	S061 719	39728830	9.00
05/20/19	Fabsik, Paul POSTAGE NY POSTAGE 05/01/2019 NUMBER OF PIECES(S): 1	S075	39712008	1.60
05/20/19	Fabsik, Paul POSTAGE NY POSTAGE 05/01/2019 NUMBER OF PIECES(S): 1	S075	39712024	7.35
05/20/19	Fabsik, Paul POSTAGE NY POSTAGE 05/02/2019 NUMBER OF PIECES(S): 1	S075	39712034	7.35
05/20/19	Fabsik, Paul POSTAGE NY POSTAGE 05/03/2019 NUMBER OF PIECES(S): 1	S075	39712058	1.30
05/01/19	WGM, Firm DUPLICATING 1315 PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 04/26/20	S117 919 TO 04/30/201	39693047 9	131.50
05/08/19	Dallas, Office DUPLICATING 88 PRINT(S) MADE IN DALLAS BETWEEN 05/03/2019 TO	S117 0 05/03/2019	39694871	8.80
05/08/19	WGM, Firm DUPLICATING 6142 PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 05/01/20	S117 919 TO 05/07/201	39695168 9	614.20

	<u>NAME</u>			
DATE	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	DISB TYPE	DISB ID#	AMOUNT
05/15/19	WGM, Firm	S117	39706074	299.00
	DUPLICATING			
	2990 PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 05/08/20	19 TO 05/14/201	9	
05/22/19	WGM, Firm	S117	39715517	351.80
	DUPLICATING			
	3518 PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 05/15/20	19 TO 05/21/201	9	
05/29/19	WGM, Firm	S117	39730260	88.50
	DUPLICATING			
	885 PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 05/22/201	9 TO 05/29/2019		
05/24/19	Stauble, Christopher A.	S149	39732415	30.00
	TELEPHONE			
	COURTCALL APPEARANCE - APP DATE - 04/09/2019 - C004/02/2019 THROUGH 05/01/2019	OURT CALL DE	EBIT LEDGER FOR	
05/24/19	Stauble, Christopher A.	S149	39732425	30.00
	TELEPHONE			
	COURTCALL APPEARANCE - APP DATE - 04/23/2019 - C0 04/02/2019 THROUGH 05/01/2019	OURT CALL DE	EBIT LEDGER FOR	
05/29/19	Fabsik, Paul	S220	39730149	30.00
	3 RING BINDER 5"			
	2 BINDING 3 RING (5") IN NEW YORK CITY ON 05/28/20	19 15:30PM FRC	M UNIT 15	
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS			\$22,018.43

18-13648-smb Doc 847 Filed 06/27/19 Entered 06/27/19 17:23:18 Main Document Pg 135 of 138

Exhibit A

Debtors

Debtor	Last 4 Digits of Tax ID Number	Debtor	Last 4 Digits of Tax ID Number
Waypoint Leasing Holdings Ltd.	2899	MSN 760682 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing (Luxembourg) S.à r.l.	7041	MSN 920022 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing (Ireland) Limited	6600	MSN 920062 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 10 Limited	2503	MSN 920125 Trust	N/A
MSN 2826 Trust	N/A	MSN 9229 AS	7652
MSN 2879 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 3A Limited	6687
Waypoint Asset Co 11 Limited	3073	MSN 41371 Trust	N/A
MSN 2905 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Euro 1A Limited	9804
Waypoint Asset Co 14 Limited	1585	MSN 4466 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 15 Limited	1776	MSN 4469 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 3 Limited	3471	MSN 6655 Trust	N/A
AE Helicopter (5) Limited	N/A	Waypoint Leasing (Luxembourg) Euro S.à r.l.	8928
AE Helicopter (6) Limited	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1A Limited	1208
MSN 31141 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Leasing Labuan 1A Limited	2299
MSN 31492 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1C Limited	0827
MSN 36458 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1D Limited	7018
MSN 760543 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1F Limited	6345
MSN 760551 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1G Limited	6494
MSN 760581 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1H Limited	7349
MSN 760628 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1J Limited	7729

Debtor	Last 4 Digits of Tax ID Number	Debtor	Last 4 Digits of Tax ID Number
MSN 760631 Trust	N/A	MSN 20159 Trust	N/A
MSN 6658 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Funding 6 LLC	4964
Waypoint 760626 Business Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 7 Limited	9689
MSN 7152 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Euro 7A Limited	2406
MSN 7172 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 8 Limited	2532
Waypoint Asset Funding 3 LLC	4960	MSN 31041 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Malta Ltd	5348	MSN 31203 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing Labuan 3A Limited	8120	MSN 31578 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing UK 3A Limited	0702	MSN 760617 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 4 Limited	0301	MSN 760624 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 5 Limited	7128	MSN 760626 Trust	N/A
MSN 1251 Trust	N/A	MSN 760765 Trust	N/A
MSN 14786 Trust	N/A	MSN 920063 Trust	N/A
MSN 2047 Trust	N/A	MSN 920112 Trust	N/A
MSN 2057 Trust	N/A	Waypoint 206 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 5B Limited	2242	Waypoint 407 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing UK 5A Limited	1970	Waypoint Asset Euro 1B Limited	3512
Waypoint Asset Co 6 Limited	8790	Waypoint Asset Euro 1C Limited	1060
MSN 31042 Trust	N/A	MSN 20012 Trust	N/A
MSN 31295 Trust	N/A	MSN 20022 Trust	N/A
MSN 31308 Trust	N/A	MSN 20025 Trust	N/A
MSN 920119 Trust	N/A	MSN 920113 Trust	N/A

Debtor	Last 4 Digits of Tax ID Number	Debtor	Last 4 Digits of Tax ID Number
Waypoint Asset Funding 8 LLC	4776	Waypoint Asset Co Germany Limited	5557
Waypoint Leasing UK 8A Limited	2906	MSN 31046 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing US 8A LLC	8080	MSN 41511 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Company Number 1 (Ireland) Limited	6861	MSN 760608 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Euro 1D Limited	1360	MSN 89007 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 1L Limited	2360	MSN 920141 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 1M Limited	5855	MSN 920152 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Co 1N Limited	3701	MSN 920153 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Euro 1G Limited	4786	MSN 920273 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Funding 1 LLC	7392	MSN 920281 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing UK 1B Limited	0592	MSN 9205 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Leasing UK 1C Limited	0840	MSN 9229 Trust	N/A
Waypoint Asset Company Number 2 (Ireland) Limited	7847	MSN 920030 Trust	N/A
Waypoint 2916 Business Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Funding 2 LLC	7783
MSN 31431 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Asset Co 1K Limited	2087
MSN 760734 Trust	N/A	Waypoint Leasing Services LLC	8965
MSN 920024 Trust	N/A		