Docket #0957 Date Filed: 08/21/2019 Case 18-12378-KG Doc 9⁻⁷

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:) Chapter 11
WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al., 1) Case No. 18-12378 (KG)
Debtors.) (Jointly Administered)
	Objection Deadline: September 10, 2019 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SUMMARY OF NINTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 1, 2019 THROUGH JULY 31, 2019

Name of Applicant:	Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	Debtors and Debtors in Possession
Effective Date of Retention:	October 22, 2018
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	July 1, 2019 through July 31, 2019
Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$459,922.50
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$8,298.95
This is an: X monthly final application	

This monthly application includes 2.80 hours with a value of \$1,201.00 incurred in connection with the preparation of Fee Applications.

¹ The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is 26933 Eckel Road, Perrysburg, OH 43551.



Prior applications:

		Requested		Approved	
Date Filed;	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses
Docket No.					
12/20/18	10/22/18-11/30/18	\$629,570.50	\$5,815.10	\$629,570.50	\$5,815.10
D.I. 347	10/22/10 11/50/10	Ψ023,370.30	Ψ5,015.10	Ψ023,370.30	Ψ5,015.10
1/15/19	12/1/18-12/31/18	\$443,598.00	\$14,545.93	\$443,598.00	\$14,545.93
D.I. 420	12/1/18-12/31/18	φττ3,376.00	Ψ1¬,5¬5.75	Ψ113,376.00	Ψ1+,5+5.75
2/21/19	1/1/19–1/31/19	\$530,368,50	\$13,191.07	\$424,294.80	\$13,191.07
D.I. 513	1/1/15-1/31/15	\$330,300,30	Ψ15,171.07	Ψτ2τ,27τ.00	Ψ15,171.07
3/18/16	2/1/19-2/28/19	\$493,838.50	\$6,472.15	\$395,070.80	\$6,472.15
D.I. 566	2/1/19-2/20/19	ψτ/3,030.30	Φ0,472.13	\$575,070.00	ψ0,472.13
4/18/19	3/1/19-3/31/19	\$477,160.50	\$1,962.33	\$376,541.40 ¹	\$1,962.33
D.I. 656	3/1/19-3/31/19	\$477,100.50	\$1,902.55	\$570,541.40	Φ1,902.55
5/23/19	4/1/19-4/30/19	\$486,070.00	\$4,101.19	\$388,856.00	\$4,101.19
D.I. 746	4/1/17-4/30/19	\$460,070.00	φ4,101.19	\$500,050.00	Φ4,101.19
6/17/19	5/1/19 – 5/31/19	\$381,814.50	\$3,315.52	\$305,451.60	\$3,315.52
D.I. 799	3/1/19 - 3/31/19	\$361,614.30	\$5,515.52		φ5,515.52
7/23/19	6/1/19 - 6/30/19	\$511,859.00	\$10,592.72	\$409,487.20	\$10,592.72
D.I885	0/1/17 - 0/30/19	φ511,059.00	φ10,392.72	φ409,407.20	φ10,392.72
	Total	\$3,954,329.00	\$59,996.01	\$1,103,794.80	\$59,996.01

¹ This amount reflects an agreed to reduction between Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP and the Office of the United States Trustee in the amount of \$5,187.00 for fees for the second interim period [see order D.I. 785]

COMPENSATION BY INDIVIDUAL

Name of Professional Person	Position of the Applicant, Number of Years in that Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate (including changes)	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
Sean M. Beach	Partner since 2009. Joined firm as an associate in 2000. Member of DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar since 2007.	\$785.00	122.60	\$96,241.00
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner since 2010. Joined firm as an associate in 2001. Member of DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar since 2009.	\$745.00	29.70	\$22,126.50
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner since 2019. Joined firm in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2001	\$725.00	27.60	\$20,010.00
Erin D. Edwards	Partner since 2014. Joined firm as an associate in 2003. Member of DE Bar since 2003.	\$655.00	17.80	\$11,659.00
Kenneth J. Enos	Partner since 2015. Joined firm as an associate in 2004. Member of DE Bar since 2004.	\$645.00	2.80	\$1,806.00
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr.	Partner since 2018. Joined firm as associate in 2007. Member of DE Bar since 2007 and NY Bar since 2015.	\$625.00	93.80	\$58,625.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Counsel since 2019. Joined firm as an associate in 2008. Member of DE Bar since 2009.	\$600.00	51.60	\$30,960.00
Timothy J. Snyder	Partner since 1991. Joined firm as an associate in 1985. Member of DE Bar since 1985.	\$550.00	18.60	\$10,230.00
Pilar G. Kraman	Partner. Joined firm as an associate in 2008. Member of DE Bar since 2008	\$530.00	0.50	\$265.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Joined firm as an associate in 2011. Member of DE and NY Bars since 2011.	\$530.00	41.20	\$21,836.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Joined the firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2014 and PA Bar since 2015.	\$460.00	53.00	\$24,380.00
Allison S. Mielke	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2013.	\$415.00	163.50	\$67,852.50
Tara C. Pakrouh	Joined firm as associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2015.	\$400.00	44.40	\$17,760.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957 Filed 08/21/19 Page 4 of 12

Blended Rate:		\$507.19		T-72
Grand Total:			906.80	\$459,922.50
Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	\$175.00	7.20	\$1,260.00
Melissa Romano	Paralegal	\$285.00	0.20	\$57.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	\$285.00	1.70	\$484.50
Chad A. Corazza	Paralegal	\$285.00	1.00	\$285.00
Beth Olivere	Paralegal	\$285.00	34.60	\$9,861.00
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	\$295.00	8.20	\$2,419.00
Debbie Laskin	Paralegal	\$295.00	1.40	\$413.00
Titus Kabega	Summer Associate	\$220.00	12.60	\$2,772.00
Andrew Kim	Summer Associate	\$220.00	1.10	\$242.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2017.	\$340.00	171.70	\$58,378.00

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Case Administration (B001)	19.10	\$6,420.00
Court Hearings (B002)	13.60	\$4,803.00
Cash Collateral/DIP Financing (B003)	0.30	\$235.50
Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports (B004)	5.30	\$2,139.50
Lease/Executory Contract Issues (B005)	21.70	\$11,810.50
Use, Sale or Lease Property (363 Issues) (B006)	86.50	\$48,228.50
Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions (B007)	227.80	\$113,886.00
Meetings (B008)	49.20	\$28,909.50
Stay Relief Matters (B009)	7.50	\$4,263.50
Other Adversary Proceedings (B011)	119.10	\$57,693.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement (B012)	59.90	\$31,117.00
Creditor Inquiries (B013)	0.90	\$669.50
General Corporate Matters (B014)	5.90	\$4,060.50
Employee Matters (B015)	22.00	\$12,421.00
Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues (B017)	8.60	\$3,375.00
Fee Application Preparation (B018)	2.80	\$1,201.00
Williams Litigation (B768)	256.60	\$128,689.00
TOTALS	906.80	\$459,922.50

EXPENSE SUMMARY

Expenses Category (Examples)	Total Expenses
Air/Rail Travel	\$968.60
Car/Bus/Subway Travel	\$518.93
Computerized Legal Research	\$3,733.40
Court Reporter	\$160.05
Delivery/Courier	\$35.00
Docket Retrieval/Search	\$412.60
Federal Express	\$112.25
Hotel/Lodging	\$732.23
Parking	\$26.24
Reproduction Charges	\$852.10
Teleconference/Video Conference	\$319.74
Working Meals	\$427.81
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$8,298.95

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:) Chapter 11
WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al., 1) Case No. 18-12378 (KG)
Debtors.) (Jointly Administered)
	Objection Deadline: September 10, 2019 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
)

NINTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY
STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION
FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR
THE PERIOD FROM JULY 1, 2019 THROUGH JULY 31, 2019

Pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101 et seq. (the "Bankruptcy Code"), and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and in accordance with that certain Order Pursuant to Section 327(a) of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2014, and Local Rule 2014-1, Authorizing the Retention of Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP as Counsel for the Debtors, Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [Docket No. 234] (the "Retention Order") and that certain Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals [Docket No. 230] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (hereinafter "YCS&T") hereby moves this Court for reasonable compensation for professional legal services rendered as counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors") in the amount of \$459,922.50, together with reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred in the

¹ The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is 26933 Eckel Road, Perrysburg, OH 43551.

amount of \$8,298.95 for the period commencing July 1, 2019 through and including July 31, 2019 (the "Fee Period"). In support of its Application, YCS&T respectfully represents as follows:

- 1. Pursuant to the Retention Order, YCS&T was employed to represent the Debtors as bankruptcy counsel in connection with these chapter 11 cases, *nunc pro tunc* to October 22, 2018. The Retention Order authorized YCS&T to be compensated on an hourly basis and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses.
- 2. All services for which compensation is requested by YCS&T were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

- 3. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is a detailed statement of fees incurred during the Fee Period showing the amount of \$459,922.50 due for fees.
- 4. The services rendered by YCS&T during the Fee Period are grouped into the categories set forth in Exhibit A. The attorneys and paralegals who rendered services relating to each category are identified, along with the number of hours for each individual and the total compensation sought for each category, in the attachments hereto.

DISBURSEMENTS

5. YCS&T has incurred out-of-pocket disbursements during the Fee Period in the amount of \$8,298.95. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a detailed statement of expenses paid during the Fee Period. This disbursement sum is broken down into categories of charges, including, among other things, telephone and telecopier toll and other charges, mail and express mail charges, special or hand delivery charges, document processing, photocopying charges, charges for mailing supplies (including, without limitation, envelopes and labels) provided by the

Firm to outside copying services for use in mass mailings, travel expenses, expenses for "working meals," computerized research, transcription costs, as well as non-ordinary overhead expenses such as secretarial and other overtime. A complete review by category of the expenses incurred for the Fee Period may be found attached hereto as Exhibit B. To the extent such itemization is insufficient to satisfy the requirements of Rule 2016-2(e)(ii) of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the "Local Rules"), YCS&T respectfully requests that the Court waive strict compliance with such Local Rule.

6. Costs incurred for overtime and computer assisted research are not included in YCS&T's normal hourly billing rates and, therefore, are itemized and included in YCS&T's disbursements. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-2, YCS&T represents that its rate for duplication is \$.10 per page, its rate for outgoing telecopier transmissions is \$.25 per page (excluding related long distance transmission charges), there is no charge for incoming telecopier transmissions and there is no surcharge for computerized research.

VALUATION OF SERVICES

- 7. Attorneys and paraprofessionals of YCS&T have expended a total of 906.80 hours in connection with this matter during the Fee Period.
- 8. The amount of time spent by each of these persons providing services to the Debtors for the Fee Period is fully set forth in the detail attached hereto as Exhibit A. These are YCS&T's normal hourly rates of compensation for work of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by YCS&T for the Fee Period as counsel for the Debtors in these cases is \$459,922.50.

9. YCS&T believes that the time entries included in <u>Exhibit A</u> attached hereto and the expense breakdown set forth in <u>Exhibit B</u> hereto are in compliance with the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2.

10. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under chapter 11.

11. This Application covers the Fee Period July 1, 2019 through and including July 31, 2019. YCS&T has and will continue to perform additional necessary services subsequent to July 31, 2019, for which YCS&T will file subsequent fee applications.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, YCS&T requests that allowance be made to it in the sum of \$459,922.50 as compensation for necessary professional services rendered to the Debtors for the Fee Period, and the sum of \$8,298.95 for reimbursement of actual necessary costs and expenses incurred during that period, and further requests such other and further relief as this Court may deem just and proper.

Dated: August 21, 2019 Wilmington, Delaware

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

/s/ Sean M. Beach

M. Blake Cleary (No. 3614)
Sean M. Beach (No. 4070)
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. (No. 5052)
Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934)
Betsy L. Feldman (No. 6410)
Rodney Square
1000 North King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801
Telephone: (302) 571-6600
Facsimile: (302) 571-1256

Counsel to the Debtors

VER	IFICA	TION

STATE OF DELAWARE)	
)	SS
NEW CASTLE COUNTY)	

Sean M. Beach, Esquire, after being duly sworn according to law, hereby deposes and says:

- 1. I am a Partner in the applicant firm, Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, and have been admitted to the bar of the Supreme Court of Delaware since 2001.
- 2. I have personally performed many of the legal services rendered by Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, as counsel for the Debtors, and am familiar with all other work performed on behalf of the Debtors by the lawyers and paraprofessionals in the firm.
- 3. The facts set forth in the foregoing Application are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief.

SEAN-M. BEACH

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED before me this 2/ day of August, 2019.

Notary Public

My Commission Expires:
DEBBIE ELLEN LASKIN

NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE OF DELAWARE

My Commission Expires October 31, 2020

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

the state of the s	\
In re:) Chapter 11
WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al., 1) Case No. 18-12378 (KG)
Debtors.) (Jointly Administered)
	Objection Deadline: September 10, 2019 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
)

NOTICE OF NINTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION

TO: (I) THE DEBTORS; (II) THE U.S. TRUSTEE; (III) COUNSEL FOR THE DIP LENDER; AND (IV) COUNSEL FOR THE COMMITTEE

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (the "Applicant") has filed its *Ninth Monthly Application for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession for Services Rendered for the Period from July 1, 2019 Through July 31, 2019 (the "Application") with the Court. The Application seeks allowance of interim fees in the amount of \$459,922.50 and interim expenses in the amount of \$8,298.95.*

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections to the Application, if any, are required to be filed on or before September 10, 2019 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) (the "Objection Deadline") with the Clerk of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 3rd Floor, 824 N. Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801. You must also serve any such objection so as to be received by the following on or before the Objection Deadline: (i) the Debtors, 26933 Eckel Road, Perrysburg, OH 43551 (Attn: Frank A. Pometti, Chief Restructuring Officer); (ii) counsel to the Debtors, Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801 (Attn: Tara C. Pakrouh, Esq.); (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware, J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, Room 2207, 844 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, (Attn: Jaclyn Weissgerber, Esq. and Jane M. Leamy, Esq.); (iv) counsel for the DIP Lender, Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher LLP, 200 Park Avenue, New York, NY 10166 (Attn: Michael A. Rosenthal, Esq. and Matthew K. Kelsey, Esq.); and (v) counsel for the Committee, Blank Rome LLP, 130 North 18th Street, Philadelphia, PA 19103 (Attn: John E. Lucian, Esq. and Michael B. Schaedle, Esq.).

¹ The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is 26933 Eckel Road, Perrysburg, OH 43551.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT PURSUANT TO THE ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR RETAINED PROFESSIONALS [DOCKET NO. 230], IF NO OBJECTIONS ARE FILED AND SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES, THE DEBTORS WILL BE AUTHORIZED TO PAY 80% OF REQUESTED INTERIM FEES AND 100% OF REQUESTED INTERIM EXPENSES, WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER OF THE COURT.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT ONLY IF AN OBJECTION IS PROPERLY AND TIMELY FILED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES AND CANNOT BE CONSENSUALLY RESOLVED WILL A HEARING BE HELD ON THE APPLICATION.

Dated: August 21, 2019 Wilmington, Delaware YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

/s/ Sean M. Beach

M. Blake Cleary (No. 3614)
Sean M. Beach (No. 4070)
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. (No. 5052)
Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934)
Betsy L. Feldman (No. 6410)
Rodney Square
1000 North King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801
Telephone: (302) 571-6600
Facsimile: (302) 571-1256

Counsel to the Debtors

EXHIBIT A

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATTA TAYLOR, LLP

RODNEY SQUARE 1000 NORTH KING STREET WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391 WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600 (800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial (302) 571-6621

Writer's E-Mail sbeach@yest.com

Stephen Hawkins 26933 Eckel Rd. Perrysburg, OH 43551 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Re: Debtor Representation

CURRENT INVOICE

Professional Services	\$ 459,922.50
Disbursements	\$ 8,298.95
Total Due This Invoice	\$ 468,221.45
Previous Balance Due	\$ 701,215.62
Amount Due	\$ 1,169,437.07

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 3 of 102 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/01/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.10	28.50
07/02/19	SBEAC	Read email from Lunn, Matthew: RE: Welded committee call	B001	0.10	78.50
07/03/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.10	28.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg, S. Beach, F. Pometti, and S. Hawkins re: pleadings	B001	0.10	41.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: critical date deadlines	B001	0.10	41.50
07/08/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to cocounsel	B001	0.30	85.50
07/08/19	BOLIV	Update critical dates	B001	1.80	513.00
07/08/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.20	57.00
07/08/19	BOLIV	Draft COC re omnibus hearing date [9/23/19]	B001	0.20	57.00
07/08/19	MLUNN	Review recently filed pleadings, including Sun Belt stay relief matters and Blank Rome fee app	B001	0.30	223.50
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: pleadings filed on the docket	B001	0.10	41.50
07/09/19	AMIEL	Review/update critical dates	B001	0.20	83.00
07/09/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.20	57.00
07/09/19	BOLIV	Update critical dates	B001	1.20	342.00
07/11/19	BOLIV	Update critical dates	B001	0.30	85.50
07/12/19	AMIEL	Review critical dates	B001	0.30	124.50
07/12/19	BFELD	Review critical dates calendar	B001	0.60	204.00
07/12/19	BOLIV	Research, locate and forward SOFAs to requesting counsel	B001	0.10	28.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 4 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

		iviauei 1	Number:		0/6850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/15/19	AMIEL	Update task list (0.6); emails with R. Poppiti, S. Beach, B. Feldman, T. Pakrouh, and M. Neiburg re: same (0.2)	B001	0.80	332.00
07/15/19	BOLIV	Circulate finalized critical dates to working group	B001	0.10	28.50
07/16/19	MLUNN	Review updated task list	B001	0.10	74.50
07/16/19	TBOLL	Prepare docket update for the working group and download related pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
07/17/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.10	28.50
07/17/19	BOLIV	Set up data room folder request	B001	0.20	57.00
07/17/19	MLUNN	Review updated critical dates memo	B001	0.10	74.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards and D. McDowell re: Andy Mack	B001	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Review docket for pleadings to send to S. Beach	B001	0.20	83.00
07/18/19	BOLIV	Downloading of material to ftp site [.8]; prepare sub folders and organize per request of AMIEL [.4]	B001	1.20	342.00
07/18/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.20	57.00
07/22/19	AMIEL	Confer with J. Mintz re: weekly meeting	B001	0.20	83.00
07/22/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.10	28.50
07/23/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.20	57.00
07/23/19	BOLIV	Email to B. Feldman re status of CNO/COC for 3rd and 4th omnibus objection to claims	B001	0.10	28.50
07/23/19	BOLIV	Update critical dates	B001	1.10	313.50
07/24/19	BOLIV	Coordinate service of order re third omnibus objection	B001	0.10	28.50
07/26/19	BFELD	Review critical dates re: upcoming case deadlines	B001	0.30	102.00
07/26/19	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.10	28.50

 Welded Construction, L.P.
 Case 18-12378-KG
 Doc 957-2
 Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: 50007805
 Page 5 of 102 August 12, 2019

 Invoice Number: Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/29/19	BFELD	Meet with M. Neiburg re: committee diligence document review (.1); research re: same (.5) follow-up emails with M. Neiburg and D. McDowell re: same (.1)	B001	0.70	238.00
07/29/19	BWALT	Emails from/to B. Feldman, review, update, and circulate critical dates	B001	1.20	354.00
07/29/19	BWALT	Update and circulate docket	B001	0.20	59.00
07/29/19	RFPOP	Emails from E. Edwards, M. Neiburg and B. Feldman re: informal discovery from committee re: committee investigation	B001	0.20	125.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Revise list of search terms and custodians re: committee diligence requests	B001	0.20	68.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Prepare draft memo re: committee diligence document review	B001	3.30	1,122.00
07/30/19	BWALT	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to counsel	B001	0.30	88.50
07/30/19	MLUNN	Review critical deadline memorandum	B001	0.10	74.50
07/31/19	BWALT	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.90	265.50
07/31/19	BWALT	Emails with T. Pakrouh; research regarding EARTH Pipeline Services, Inc.	B001	0.30	88.50
07/02/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Scaruzzi re: cancellation of omnibus hearing (0.1); emails with R. Poppiti and B. Olivere re: same (0.1); confer with B. Feldman re: same (0.1); review docket in connection with same (0.3)	B002	0.60	249.00
07/02/19	BFELD	Call with A. Mielke re: matters going forward at upcoming hearing	B002	0.10	34.00
07/02/19	BOLIV	Draft notice of cancelled hearing for July 10, 2019	B002	0.30	85.50
07/02/19	BOLIV	Draft agenda for July 10, 2019	B002	0.30	85.50
07/02/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke and Chambers and discussion with A. Mielke re: July 10th hearing	B002	0.20	125.00
07/03/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere and R. Poppiti re: agenda canceling omnibus hearing	B002	0.10	41.50
07/03/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of agenda cancelling July 10, 2019 hearing	B002	0.30	85.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 6 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805

	Invoice Number: Matter Number:				076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
07/08/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and B. Olivere re: hearing dates	B002	0.10	41.50	
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: scheduling oral argument (0.1); emails with E. Edwards and S. Scaruzzi re: same (0.1)	B002	0.20	83.00	
07/08/19	BOLIV	Draft agenda for July 16, 2019 hearing	B002	0.40	114.00	
07/08/19	MLUNN	Attention to omnibus hearings	B002	0.10	74.50	
07/08/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach, A. Mielke and R. Poppiti re: omnibus hearing issues	B002	0.10	60.00	
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with S. Hawkins re: Oral Argumen Scheduled for 8/8/19 on Partial Motion to Dismiss		0.10	78.50	
07/09/19	AMIEL	Review/revise agenda for July 12th hearing	B002	0.20	83.00	
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards re: agenda for status conference	B002	0.10	41.50	
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: hearing dates in connection with Sunbelt's motions to shorten/relief from automatic stay (0.1); confer with B. Olivere re: same (0.1)	B002	0.20	83.00	
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Scaruzzi re: omnibus hearing dates (0.1); emails with S. Beach R. Poppiti, M. Lunn, and B. Olivere re: same (0.1); revise COC re: omnibus hearing dates to include same (0.1)	B002	0.30	124.50	
07/09/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of COC re omnibus hearing dates	B002	0.20	57.00	
07/09/19	BOLIV	Begin draft of agenda for July 19th pre trial conference	B002	0.30	8 5.50	
07/09/19	BOLIV	Draft agenda for July 12, 2019	B002	0.30	85.50	
07/09/19	BOLIV	Update agenda for July 16, 2019	B002	0.20	57.00	
07/09/19	MLUNN	Correspondence with A. Mielke re: omnibus hearings	B002	0.10	74.50	
07/09/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and E. Edwards re omnibus hearing date issues	e: B002	0.20	120.00	
07/09/19	SBEAC	Email with M. Lunn, B. Olivere, A. Mielke, and R. Poppiti re: 7/10/19 hearin	B002 g	0.10	78.50	
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: hearing on motions for relief from stay	B002	0.10	41.50	
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: agenda for hearing	B002	0.10	41.50	

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 7 of 102 August 12, 2019

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/10/19	AMIEL	Revise agenda in connection with hearing on motion for relief from stay (0.2); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B002	0.30	124.50
07/10/19	BOLIV	Coordinate delivery of hearing binder to Judge Gross' chambers for 7/12/19 hearing	B002	0.20	57.00
07/10/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of agenda for July 12, 2019 hearing	B002	0.30	85.50
07/10/19	BOLIV	Prepare hearing binder for Judge Gross re July 12, 2019 hearing	B002	0.40	114.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: hearing preparation and stay relief issues	B002	0.10	78.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: hearing	B002	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	BOLIV	Draft agenda for 8/7/19 hearing including various extensions re 2nd objection to claims	B002	0.60	171.00
07/11/19	BOLIV	Draft amended agenda for 7/12/19 hearing	B002	0.20	57.00
07/11/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of amended agenda for 7/12/19	B002	0.30	85.50
07/11/19	BOLIV	Finalize agenda for 7/16/19 hearing; circulate for comments	B002	0.10	28.50
07/12/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: agenda (0.1); emails with D. Candeub re: same (0.1)	B002	0.20	83.00
07/12/19	BOLIV	Prepare hearing binder for July 16, 2019 hearing	B002	0.40	114.00
07/12/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of agenda for 7/16/19	B002	0.30	85.50
07/15/19	AMIEL	Emails with D. Candeub re: hearing on motions for relief from stay (0.1); review amended agenda in connection with same (0.1); draft summary email re: same to S. Beach (0.2); and F. Pometti (0.1); emails from D. Candeub re: status of hearing (0.1); emails to S. Beach and F. Pometti re: same (0.1)	B002	0.70	290.50
07/15/19	BOLIV	Draft amended agenda canceling 7/16/19 hearing	B002	0.30	85.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Review amended agenda prior to filing same (0.1); emails with T. Bollman re: same (0.1)	B002	0.20	83.00
07/16/19	TBOLL	Update and finalize for filing amended agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on July 16, 2019	B002	0.40	114.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 8 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 8 of 102

Invoice Date: August 12, 2019

Invoice Number: 50007805

Matter Number: 076850.1001

		Iviauer iv	umber.		0/0830.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/18/19	AMIEL	Update task list in preparation for team meeting	B002	0.30	124.50
07/19/19	BOLIV	Update agenda for August 7, 2019	B002	0.20	57.00
07/23/19	BOLIV	Draft agenda for August 7, 2019 hearing	B002	0.90	256.50
07/24/19	BOLIV	Update agenda for 8/7/19 hearing	B002	0.20	57.00
07/25/19	BOLIV	Draft agenda for oral argument in Prime NDT adversary matter on August 8, 2019	B002	0.50	142.50
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails re: notice of hearing	B002	0.10	41.50
07/31/19	BWALT	Prepare, finalize, file, and coordinate service of notice of change of August 22 hearing time, including multiple emails with B. Feldman re: same	B002	1.00	295.00
07/11/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: DIP Lender Invoices	B003	0.10	78.50
07/15/19	SBEAC	Emails with F. Pometti, A. Magaziner, A. Ralph, and W. Bowden re: lender invoices	B003	0.20	157.00
07/02/19	BFELD	Review exhibit re: amended schedules	B004	1.30	442.00
07/03/19	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman re: filing amended schedules (.1); review exhibit re: same (.1)	B004	0.20	83.00
07/03/19	BFELD	Emails with R. Poppiti and A. Ralph re: revisions to schedules amendment (.3); emails with KCC re: service of same (.2)	B004	0.50	170.00
07/03/19	BFELD	Finalize amended schedules for filing	B004	0.30	102.00
07/03/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of amended schedule E/F	B004	0.40	114.00
07/03/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft_proposed schedules amendments and notice of filing of same (.5), and emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) (.2) re: same	B004	0.70	437.50
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with D. Laskin re: Schedules and SOFAs	B004	0.10	78.50
07/26/19	BFELD	Review documents re: June MOR	B004	0.60	204.00
07/28/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft June 2019 monthly operating report, and emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Nishat Jabin) re: same	B004	0.20	125.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 9 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805

•			ter Number:	076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/29/19	BFELD	Calls and emails with N. Jabin (AlixPartners) re: June MOR (.4); revi and comment re: same (.1)	B004	0.50	170.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on revised draft June 2019 monthly operating report, a email to and from Zolfo (Nishat Jabin) same	nd	0.20	125.00
07/31/19	BWALT	Emails with B. Feldman; file June monthly operating report	B004	0.30	88.50
07/01/19	BFELD	Emails with counterparty to rejected agreement re: sixth omnibus rejection motion	B005	0.20	68.00
07/01/19	RFPOP	Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Southerian) re: second rejection motion	ujay B005	0.20	125.00
07/01/19	RFPOP	Review various materials from B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of Michigan CAT and MacAllister resport to second rejection motion (.4), and ca with B. Feldman (.3) re: same		0.70	437.50
07/02/19	AMIEL	Confer with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendo payments	or B005	0.60	249.00
07/02/19	BFELD	Emails with R. Poppiti and M. Lunn re rejected equipment in 6th omnibus rejection motion	e: B005	0.10	34.00
07/02/19	MLUNN	Correspondence with B. Feldman re: additional rejection issues	B005	0.10	74.50
07/02/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Z. (Sujay Cherian) re: equipment lease rejection issues	olfo B005	0.20	125.00
07/02/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman and Zolfo (And Ralph and Sujay Cherian) re: various equipment lease issues (.8), and follow call with B. Feldman (.2) and review materials from Andrew Ralph and Suj Cherian in preparation for same (.4)	v-up	1.40	875.00
07/03/19	BFELD	Emails with S. Cherian re: supplemen sixth omnibus rejection motion	t to B005	0.10	34.00
07/03/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) Precision surety bond claim, and revie materials from surety re: same		0.20	125.00
07/03/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Z (Andrew Ralph) re: proposed resolution of Michigan CAT and MacAllister responses to second rejection motion, review and comment on summary analysis from Andrew Ralph re: same	on and	0.30	187.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 10 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

		, united in		0,000011001
<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: proposed resolution of Yak Mat response to first rejection motion	B005	0.20	125.00
MLUNN	Correspondence with B. Feldman re: rejection motion	B005	0.10	74.50
RFPOP	Call from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: equipment lease issues	B005	0.50	312.50
BFELD	Call with F. Pometti re: Modspace/Williams Scotsman rejected equipment	B005	0.20	68.00
BFELD	Calls with S. Cherian (AlixPartners) re: rejected CRC-Evans equipment	B005	0.40	136.00
BOLIV	Email order re Sunbelt Tractor's order shortening notice to A. Mielke	B005	0.10	28.50
RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke, B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: Barco equipment lease issues	B005	0.30	187.50
RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment lease and rejection issues	B005	0.30	187.50
RFPOP	Emails to and from (.2) and call with (.4) client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Robell Wondwosen) re: Precision equipment lease issues, and review materials in preparation for same (.3)	B005	0.90	562.50
RFPOP	Call to counsel for Precision (Steve Wirth) and emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: various Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.40	250.00
RFPOP	Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues	B005	0.10	62.50
BFELD	Review rejection damages claims and administrative expense claims re: various objecting parties to second omnibus rejection motion	B005	1.40	476.00
BOLIV	Circulate order re Sunbelt Tractor Equipment relief from automatic stay	B005	0.10	28.50
RFPOP	Call to and email from B. Feldman and email from client (Dean McDowell) re: Barco equipment lease issues	B005	0.20	125.00
RFPOP	Email to and fro B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of various responses to second rejection motion	B005	0.20	125.00
	MLUNN RFPOP BFELD BOLIV RFPOP RFPOP RFPOP BFELD BOLIV RFPOP	RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: proposed resolution of Yak Mat response to first rejection motion MLUNN Correspondence with B. Feldman re: rejection motion RFPOP Call from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: equipment lease issues BFELD Call with F. Pometti re: Modspace/Williams Scotsman rejected equipment BFELD Calls with S. Cherian (AlixPartners) re: rejected CRC-Evans equipment BOLIV Email order re Sunbelt Tractor's order shortening notice to A. Mielke RFPOP Emails to and from A. Mielke, B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: Barco equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment lease and rejection issues RFPOP Emails to and from (.2) and call with (.4) client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Robell Wondwosen) re: Precision equipment lease issues, and review materials in preparation for same (.3) RFPOP Call to counsel for Precision (Steve Wirth) and emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: various Precision equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues	RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: proposed resolution of Yak Mat response to first rejection motion MLUNN Correspondence with B. Feldman re: B005 rejection motion RFPOP Call from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: equipment lease issues BFELD Call with F. Pometti re: B005 Modspace/Williams Scotsman rejected equipment BFELD Calls with S. Cherian (AlixPartners) re: rejected CRC-Evans equipment BOLIV Email order re Sunbelt Tractor's order shortening notice to A. Mielke RFPOP Emails to and from A. Mielke, B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: Barco equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment lease and rejection issues RFPOP Emails to and from (.2) and call with (.4) client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Robell Wondwosen) re: Precision equipment lease issues, and review materials in preparation for same (.3) RFPOP Call to counsel for Precision (Steve Wirth) and emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: various Precision equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Call to counsel for Precision equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and B005 Equipment relief from automatic stay RFPOP Call to and email from B. Feldman and email from client (Dean McDowell) re: Barco equipment lease issues RFPOP Email to and from B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of various responses to second	RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: proposed resolution of Yak Mat response to first rejection motion MLUNN Correspondence with B. Feldman re: B005 0.10 rejection motion RFPOP Call from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: equipment lease issues BFELD Call with F. Pometti re: B005 0.20 Modspace/Williams Scotsman rejected equipment BFELD Calls with S. Cherian (AlixPartners) re: B005 0.40 rejected CRC-Evans equipment BOLIV Email order re Sunbelt Tractor's order shortening notice to A. Mielke RFPOP Emails to and from A. Mielke, B. B005 0.30 Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: Barco equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment lease and rejection issues RFPOP Emails to and from (.2) and call with (.4) client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Robell Wondwosen) re: Precision equipment lease issues, and review materials in preparation for same (.3) RFPOP Call to counsel for Precision (Steve Wirth) and emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: various Precision equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment lease issues RFPOP Call to counsel for Precision equipment lease issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment issues RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: CRC equipment relien from sutomatic stay RFPOP Emails from B. Feldman and B005 0.10 Circulate order re Sunbelt Tractor B005 0.20 RFPOP Call to and email from B. Feldman and email from client (Dean McDowell) re: Barco equipment lease issues RFPOP Email to and From B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of various responses to second

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 11 of 1 Invoice Date: A

Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

Page 11 of 102 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/11/19	RFPOP	Call from counsel for Precision (Brett Marks) (.2) and emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) (.2) re: various Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.40	250.00
07/12/19	RFPOP	Call to B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of various responses to second rejection motion	B005	0.30	187.50
07/12/19	RFPOP	Emails to (.2) and from (.2) Zolfo (Frank Pometti), client (Dean McDowell and Kelly Colborn) and counsel for Precision (Brett Marks), email to and discussion with A. Mielke (.1), and call to Brett Marks (.2) re: various Precision equipment lease issues, and review materials from Frank Pometti (.2) re: same	B005	0.90	562.50
07/15/19	BFELD	Call (.1) and emails (.1) with R. Poppiti re: revised order for first omnibus rejection motion in relation to Yak Mat lease (.1); revise same (.2) and emails with counsel to Yak Mat re: same (.1)	B005	0.60	204.00
07/15/19	BFELD	Call with S. Cherian (AlixPartners) re: sixth omnibus rejection motion (.1); follow-up email with R. Poppiti re: CNO for same (.1)	B005	0.20	68.00
07/15/19	RFPOP	Call with client (Dean McDowell), Zolfo (Frank Pometti) and counsel for Precision (Brett Marks) (.3), calls with Frank Pometti (.2 and .1), and email to and Frank Pometti and email to Brett Marks (.3) re: various Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.90	562.50
07/15/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft proposed order resolving objection of various equipment lessors to second rejection motion (.5), and emails to and from and call to B. Feldman (.2) re: same	B005	0.70	437.50
07/15/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman, Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) and counsel for Michigan CAT and MacAllister (Lauren Beslow) re: proposed resolution of Michigan CAT and MacAllister responses to second rejection motion	B005	0.20	125.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Draft COC re: resolution of Yak Mat objection to rejection motion and administrative claim motion	B005	0.60	204.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Review docket and finalize for filing CNO re: sixth omnibus rejection motion	B005	0.10	34.00

Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 12 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date:	August 12, 2019
		Invoice Number:	50007805
		Matter Number:	076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	Hours	Amount
07/16/19	RFPOP	Email from B. Feldman re: Verizon Connect lease	B005	0.10	62.50
07/16/19	TBOLL	Finalize for filing certification of counsel for order approving first omnibus rejection motion re: YakMat contract, and submitted related order thereto	B005	0.40	114.00
07/16/19	TBOLL	Prepare and finalize for filing (.2) certificate of no objection re: sixth omnibus rejection motion, and finalize and submit order related thereto (.2)	B005	0.40	114.00
07/17/19	BOLIV	Coordinate service of orders re 6th rejection motion and first rejection motion	B005	0.10	28.50
07/17/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian) re: various equipment lease issues	B005	0.70	437.50
07/17/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman, client (Dean McDowell), Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian), counsel for Barco (Matt Harvey) and Barco re: various Barco equipment lease issues	B005	0.50	312.50
07/17/19	RFPOP	Email to and from counsel for Precision (Brett Marks) re: various Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.10	62.50
07/18/19	RFPOP	Email to and from counsel for Precision (Brett Marks) re: Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.10	62.50
07/19/19	BFELD	Call with A. Mielke re: Beaver Valley rejection damages claims	B005	0.10	34.00
07/19/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke re: Beaver Valley Slag equipment lease issues	B005	0.20	125.00
07/19/19	RFPOP	Call with counsel for Barco (Matt Harvey) re: various Barco equipment lease issues	B005	0.50	312.50
07/19/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian) re: various equipment lease issues	B005	0.40	250.00
07/21/19	RFPOP	Email from B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of responses to second rejection motion	B005	0.10	62.50
07/21/19	RFPOP	Email from counsel for Precision (Brett Marks) and emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: various Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.20	125.00
07/22/19	RFPOP	Email to counsel for Precision (Brett Marks) re: various Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.10	62.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 13 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/23/19	BOLIV	Prepare letter for central states pension fund to be delivered via FedEx	B005	0.40	114.00
07/23/19	RFPOP	Review materials from Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: Barco lease issues	B005	0.10	62.50
07/23/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Sujay Cherian) re: Enterprise lease issues	B005	0.10	62.50
07/23/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Dean McDowell), Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) and counsel for Precision (Brett Marks) re: various Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.20	125.00
07/24/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian) re: various equipment lease issues (.3), and review materials in preparation for same (.1)	B005	0.40	250.00
07/26/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian) re: various equipment lease issues (.7), and review materials in preparation for same (.3)	B005	1.00	625.00
07/29/19	RFPOP	Call from client (Dean McDowell) re: equipment lease insurance claims	B005	0.20	125.00
07/31/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Lunn, client (Dean McDowell), and client's insurance re: D&O policy renewal	B005	0.10	62.50
07/31/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian) re: various equipment lease issues (.4), and review materials from Sujay Cherian in preparation for same (.3)	B005	0.70	437.50
07/31/19	RFPOP	Email from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: Precision equipment lease issues	B005	0.10	62.50
07/01/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Wondwosen re: vendor payment analysis (0.1); emails with A. Ralph re: same (0.1)	B006	0.20	83.00
07/01/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Wondwosen re: vendor payment analysis (0.1); review spreadsheet in connection with same (0.2)	B006	0.30	124.50
07/01/19	MLUNN	Review schedule to POA and related correspondence with F. Pometti re: POA for vehicle title transfer (.2); and correspondence with R. Walsh (.1)	B006	0.30	223.50
07/01/19	MLUNN	Attention to release of escrow for guaranteed amount repayment per second amendment to agency agreement, including correspondence with M. Shea	B006	0.20	149.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 14 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 14 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

		Matter 1	vuinber.		070830.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/01/19	MLUNN	Confer with S. Beach re: auction results and anticipated recoveries	B006	0.30	223.50
07/01/19	SBEAC	Call with M. Lunn re: committee investigation issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.2)	B006	0.30	235.50
07/01/19	SBEAC	Emails with F. Pometti re: advisor call issues	B006	0.10	78.50
07/02/19	AMIEL	Emails from R. Wondwosen re: Custom Truck vendor payment	B006	0.10	41.50
07/02/19	BFELD	Emails with J. Spoonster (lien counsel to Ohio CAT) and S. Beach re: Sunoco customer completion agreement	B006	0.20	68.00
07/02/19	BFELD	Participate in call with R. Poppiti, A. Ralph, S. Cherian, N. Jabin, and R. Wondwosen (AlixPartners) re: various equipment and rejection issues(.8); follow-up call with R. Poppiti re: same (.2)	B006	1.00	340.00
07/02/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: Ohio CAT settlement	B006	0.10	78.50
07/03/19	BFELD	Call with S. Beach (.2) and email with J. Spoonster (.4) re: Sunoco settlement agreement	B006	0.60	204.00
07/03/19	SBEAC	Review Columbia Gas Agreement	B006	0.30	235.50
07/03/19	SBEAC	Email with R. Poppiti re: Gopher settlement (.1) edit same (.2); Review documents re: same (.3); Work with R. Poppiti re: same (.2); Call with C. Kelley re: same (.4); Call with F. Pometti re: same (.3); Review lien claim issues (.4); Review and revise Ohio CAT global settlement documents (.5)	B006	2.40	1,884.00
07/03/19	SBEAC	Emails with S. Hawkins re: case strategy issues	B006	0.10	78.50
07/03/19	SBEAC	Emails with M. Collins re: Ritchie Auction Results	B006	0.20	157.00
07/05/19	AMIEL	Emails to J. Stiff re: vendor settlement (.1); emails to S. Beach and F. Pometti re: same (.4)	B006	0.50	207.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Email to J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendor payment settlement	B006	0.10	41.50
07/08/19	SBEAC	Review CAT Financial claim issues	B006	0.60	471.00
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with M. Lunn re: D&O insurance	B006	0.10	78.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 15 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 15 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Omnibus Hearing (.1); Work with A. Mielke re: Central States and Ohio CAT issues (.4); Review and revise documents re: same (.7); Work with M. Lunn, R. Poppiti re Plan and committee investigation issues (.8); Review documents re: same (1.1)	B006	3.10	2,433.50
07/08/19	SBEAC	Call with M. Lunn re: D&O insurance issues	B006	0.20	157.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: Beaver Valley insurance claim	B006	0.10	41.50
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendor payment settlement	B006	0.10	41.50
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: project completion agreement (0.1); review same (0.2)	B006	0.30	124.50
07/09/19	BFELD	Emails with A. Mielke re: Columbia Gas critical vendor list	B006	0.10	34.00
07/09/19	RFPOP	Review Williams motion to compel and motion for adequate protection (.4), and meet with M. Lunn (.3) re: same	B006	0.70	437.50
07/09/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Lunn, client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: D&O insurance issues	B006	0.20	125.00
07/09/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: hearing update and case strategy open issues (.2); Review documents re: same (.3)	B006	0.50	392.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: Ohio Cat Settlement (0.2); email to A. Ralph and F. Pometti re: same (0.1); draft analysis of settlement proceeds (1.1); confer with A. Ralph re: same (0.5)	B006	1.90	788.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: settlement counterproposal	B006	0.10	41.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Email with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendor settlement (0.1); emails with S. Beach and F. Pometti re: same (0.2); confer with S. Beach re: same (0.2)	B006	0.50	207.50
07/10/19	BFELD	Emails with K. Cushing (.1) and counsel to ETP subcontractor (.1) re: resolving claim relating to work on ETP project; follow-up with AlixPartners re: same (.1)	B006	0.30	102.00
07/10/19	BFELD	Participate in call with R. Poppiti and A. Ralph (AlixPartners) re: various equipment and rejection issues	B006	0.40	136.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 16 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

		Triattoi I.	dinoci.		070050.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/10/19	BFELD	Call with counsel to subcontractor on ETP project re: resolution of claimed amounts relating to that project	B006	0.20	68.00
07/10/19	MLUNN	Attention to sale/contract issue and related correspondence with F. Pometti	B006	0.10	74.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Revise settlement agreement in connection with Ohio Cat vendor payments (2.3); emails to S. Beach and F. Pometti re: same (0.1); further revisions to settlement agreement in connection with comments from S. Beach to same (0.4)	B006	2.80	1,162.00
07/11/19	AMIEL	Confer with counsel for Ohio Cat re: settlement proposal	B006	1.00	415.00
07/11/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: summary of settlement agreement terms	B006	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: Ohio Cat settlement discussion	B006	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Review emails re: Ohio Cat settlement and draft notes in preparation for teleconference re: same	B006	0.50	207.50
07/11/19	BFELD	Emails with A. Ralph (AlixPartners) and counsel to subcontractor on ETP project re: resolution of claimed amounts relating to that project	B006	0.20	68.00
07/11/19	MLUNN	Update call with company and advisors (portion)	B006	0.50	372.50
07/11/19	MLUNN	Review sale report from GBRB and analyze unsold assets (.4) and call with F. Pometti, R. Poppiti and company (.5)	B006	0.90	670.50
07/11/19	RFPOP	Call with M. Lunn, Zolfo (Frank Pometti) and client's insurance broker re: D&O insurance issues	B006	0.40	250.00
07/11/19	RFPOP	Call with M. Lunn, client (Dean McDowell and Jackie Krzysztofik), and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Sujay Cherian) (.5) and email from Frank Pometti (.2) resale issues	B006	0.70	437.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti and S. Hawkins re: TC Energy Call	B006	0.20	157.00
07/11/19	SBEAC	Attend call with client and professionals to discuss owners reports and unsold assets	B006	0.40	314.00
07/11/19	SBEAC	Call with C. Kelley re: lien and case closeout issues	B006	0.70	549.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 17 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 17 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/11/19	SBEAC	Call to and email to and from (.1) and meet with (.3 and .3) R. Poppiti and call with R. Poppiti and counsel for TransCanada (Charles Kelly) (.7) re: proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes and other outstanding issues re: TransCanada	B006	1.40	1,099.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Draft certification of counsel and proposed order in connection with Ohio Cat settlement	B006	0.80	332.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendor settlement	B006	0.10	41.50
07/12/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Poppiti re: critical vendor procedure in connection with Precision pipeline settlement	B006	0.10	41.50
07/12/19	AMIEL	Emails to J. Stiff and counsel for the committee re: certification of counsel and proposed orders in connection with settlement agreement	B006	0.10	41.50
07/12/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: KEIP milestones	B006	0.10	34.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Emails with S. Soule re: adequate protection and motion to compel issues (.1); Review documents re same (.5)	B006	0.60	471.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Review Columbia Gas settlement agreement, claim and open issues (1.4); Call with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti and R. Wondwossen re: same (1.1); Draft agenda for meeting re: same (.3); Review documents re: followup strategy issues on lien, Ohio CAT and other issues (.4); Emails its C. Kelley re: same (.1)	B006	3.30	2,590.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Review Litigation Funding and Cooperation Agreement	B006	0.10	78.50
07/12/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with R. Poppiti and A. Mielke re: Transcanada critical vendor issues	B006	0.10	40.00
07/13/19	BFELD	Revise rejection order re: second omnibus rejection order for adjourned lease counterparties	B006	0.30	102.00
07/13/19	BFELD	Revise rejection order re: Yak Mat lease	B006	0.30	102.00
07/15/19	AMIEL	Emails from J. Regueiro, S. Bellner, and R. Wondwosen re: Custom Truck insurance claim	B006	0.20	83.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 18 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/15/19	AMIEL	Confer with J. Mintz re: Ohio Cat vendor agreement (0.2); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1); emails with J. Stiff re: same (0.1); revise agreement in connection with same (0.2)	B006	0.60	249.00
07/15/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Poppiti re: update on Precision vendor issues	B006	0.10	41.50
07/15/19	BFELD	Review and revise draft re: Gopher 9019 settlement motion in light of changes to settlement agreement	B006	0.20	68.00
07/15/19	MLUNN	Review status of title issues re: auctioned assets and unsold assets	B006	0.10	74.50
07/15/19	MLUNN	Correspondence with F. Pometti re: sale termination / abandonment issues for unsold assets in Perrysburg	B006	0.20	149.00
07/15/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft proposed endorsement for D&O insurance renewal (.4), and email from insurance broker and discussion with M. Lunn (.1) re: same	B006	0.50	312.50
07/15/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from S. Beach and A. Mielke and call to B. Feldman re: joint defense agreement issues	B006	0.20	125.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke, T. Snyder, and R. Poppiti re: common interest agreement with Bechtel (.1); Emails with M. Kelsey re: same (.1); Review documents re: same (.4)	B006	0.60	471.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Williams Commitment Letters (.1); Review documents re: same in connection with adequate protection and motion to compel (.9);	B006	1.00	785.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Email with R. Poppiti re: Common Interest Agreement	B006	0.10	78.50
07/15/19	SBEAC	Call to C. Kelley re: liens, open claims and closeout issues	B006	0.10	78.50
07/15/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with A. Mielke, E. Edwards, and M. Neiburg re: Betchel JDA (.1); research same (.1)	B006	0.20	80.00
07/15/19	TPAKR	Review correspondence form A. Mielke re: misc open case issues (.1); review task list for same (.1)	B006	0.20	80.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Confer with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendor claim settlement (0.6); email with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B006	0.70	290.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 19 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 19 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

-					070050.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/16/19	AMIEL	Confer with B. Olivere re: share file in connection with Beaver Valley insurance claim information	B006	0.10	41.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: Beaver Valley Slag insurance claims	B006	0.20	83.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails from J. Weissgerber and J. Leamy re: Ohio Cat settlement (0.1); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B006	0.20	83.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Email to J. Weissgerber re: Ohio Cat vendor settlement	B006	0.30	124.50
07/16/19	BFELD	Call with S. Beach, J. Carroll and K. Cushing (counsel to Sunoco) re: release of funds agreement	B006	0.20	68.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Finalize for filing re: Gopher 9019 motion and settlement agreement	B006	0.60	204.00
07/16/19	MLUNN	Call with F. Pometti re: reimbursed costs under agency agreement and sale of real estate	B006	0.40	298.00
07/16/19	RFPOP	Emails from M. Lunn and client's insurance broker re: draft proposed endorsement for D&O insurance policy, and review revised draft re: same	B006	0.20	125.00
07/16/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with A. Mielke, E. Edwards and M. Lunn re: meeting re: misc. open case issues	B006	0.10	40.00
07/17/19	AMIEL	Email from B. Olivere re: data room for Beaver Valley Slag equipment invoices in connection with insurance claim	B006	0.10	41.50
07/17/19	BFELD	Call with L. Beslow (counsel to MI CAT) re: resolution of administrative and rejection damages claims	B006	0.40	136.00
07/17/19	BFELD	Prepare for (.1) and participate in (.7) call with R. Poppiti and A. Ralph (AlixPartners) re: various equipment and rejection issues	B006	0.80	272.00
07/17/19	BFELD	Call with S. Beach re: ETP release agreement	B006	0.20	68.00
07/17/19	BOLIV	Circulate incoming orders	B006	0.10	28.50
07/17/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 9019 motion approving settlement with Gopher, Debtors, Committee and Columbia Gas	B006	0.40	114.00
07/17/19	MLUNN	Analyze issue re: sale of CRC equipment and related correspondence with B. Feldman	B006	0.20	149.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 20 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/17/19	MLUNN	Review status/summary of sale report/reconciliation and reimbursement of amounts under agency agreement	B006	0.10	74.50
07/17/19	RFPOP	Call to M. Lunn re: D&O insurance renewal issues	B006	0.10	62.50
07/17/19	SBEAC	Call with F. Pometti re: Sunoco settlement issues (.3); Review and revise settlement documents re: same (.5)	B006	0.80	628.00
07/17/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Sunoco funds release agreement (.7); Emails with F. Pometti, A. Ralph, D. McDowell and B. Feldman re: same (.2); Work with B. Feldman re: same (.2)	B006	1.10	863.50
07/17/19	SBEAC	Call with B. Feldman re: Sunoco release issues	B006	0.20	157.00
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: documents in support of insurance claim	B006	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: insurance claims (0.1); emails with D. McDowell re: same (0.1)	B006	0.20	83.00
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: vendor settlement agreement status	B006	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	BFELD	Participate in advisor call re: status of various workstreams and general case management	B006	0.50	170.00
07/18/19	BFELD	Call with S. Beach, F. Pometti and A. Ralph (AlixPartners), and D. McDowell (Welded) re: revised	B006	0.60	204.00
07/18/19	BFELD	Revise release agreement re: Sunoco settlement	B006	1.50	510.00
07/18/19	MLUNN	Call with F. Pometti re: real estate sale	B006	0.30	223.50
07/18/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Sunoco release agreements, settlement agreement, motion and related documents re: closeout and funds release issues	B006	1.80	1,413.00
07/18/19	SBEAC	Review and revise documents re: low value vendors and Sunoco release issues (.7); Emails with F. Pometti, B. Feldman and A. Ralph re: same (.1)	B006	0.80	628.00
07/18/19	SBEAC	Call with F. Pometti, B. Feldman, D. McDowell and A. Ralph re: Sunoco release settlement issues (.5); Review documents re: same (.2)	B006	0.70	549.50
07/18/19	SBEAC	Emails with K. Cushing re: Sunoco release documents (.1); Review modified documents re: same (.3)	B006	0.40	314.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 21 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/18/19	TPAKR	Correspondence from A. Mielke re: open case issues list	B006	0.10	40.00
07/19/19	AMIEL	Email to K. Morales re: Cleveland Brothers insurance claims	B006	0.10	41.50
07/19/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: Beaver Valley Slag insurance claim (0.1); emails with R. Poppiti re: same (0.1); draft email to counsel for Beaver Valley re: same (0.2)	B006	0.40	166.00
07/19/19	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman re: equipment issues	B006	0.20	83.00
07/19/19	BFELD	Prepare for (.1) and participate in (.4) call with R. Poppiti and A. Ralph (AlixPartners) re: various equipment and rejection issues	B006	0.50	170.00
07/19/19	BFELD	Call with A. Ralph (AlixPartners), D. McDowell (Welded) and T. Buchanan red data for response to Transco's motion to compel	B006	0.50	170.00
07/19/19	BFELD	Circulate settlement proposal re: administrative claim for various creditors	B006	0.20	68.00
07/19/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) re: insurance premium issues, and review materials from Dean McDowell re: same	B006	0.40	250.00
07/19/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Williams litigation budget (.3); Emails with A. Mielke, A. Ralph, M. Neiburg and F. Pometti re: same (.2)	B006	0.50	392.50
07/19/19	SBEAC	Emails with B. Feldman and K. Cushing re: release agreement and related issues	B006	0.10	78.50
07/20/19	SBEAC	Review and revise case strategy memo	B006	1.10	863.50
07/21/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) re: insurance premium issues	B006	0.10	62.50
07/22/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: status of Central States request for review	B006	0.60	249.00
07/22/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Balram re: Ohio Cat surety claim	B006	0.10	41.50
07/22/19	BFELD	Research and revise re: Sunoco Release of Funds Agreement	B006	0.50	170.00
07/22/19	BFELD	Call with S. Beach, K. Cushing, and J. Carroll re: Sunoco Release of Funds Agreement (.3); follow-up call with S. Beach re: same (.1)	B006	0.40	136.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 22 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 22 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
07/22/19	RFPOP	Call with Lunn re: insurance issues	B006	0.20	125.00	
07/22/19	SBEAC	Emails with K. Cushing, B. Feldman, F. Pometti and A. Ralph re: ETP closeout issues (.2); Review documents re: same (.2)	B006	0.40	314.00	
07/22/19	SBEAC	Review documents re: preparation for call with ETP counsel re: closeout issues (.7); Calls with K. Cushing and B. Feldman re: same (.3); Call with B. Feldman re: same (.1)	B006	1.10	863.50	
07/22/19	TPAKR	Review OCP report (.1); correspondence with N. Jabin re: revising same (.1)	B006	0.20	80.00	
07/23/19	BFELD	Call with F. Pometti re: Williams Scotsman pre-petition invoices in light of customer completion agreement orders	B006	0.20	68.00	
07/23/19	MLUNN	Attention to open sale and title issues	B006	0.10	74.50	
07/23/19	MLUNN	Correspondence with S. Hawkins re: sale of real estate	B006	0.10	74.50	
07/23/19	RFPOP	Call with client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) re: insurance issues (.3), and review materials in preparation for same (.1)	B006	0.40	250.00	
07/24/19	AMIEL	Review/revise settlement agreement (1.2); confer with J. Stiff re: same (0.5)	B006	1.70	705.50	
07/24/19	BFELD	Participate in call with R. Poppiti and S. Cherian and A. Ralph (AlixPartners) re: various equipment and rejection issues	B006	0.30	102.00	
07/24/19	MLUNN	Review and attention to issues re: titles and reimbursement of expenses under agency agreement	B006	0.40	298.00	
07/24/19	SBEAC	Emails with F. Pometti and S. Hawkins re: real estate broker and sale issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.2)	B006	0.30	235.50	
07/24/19	SBEAC	Emails with J. Krystofik, F. Pometti, S. Hawkins re: owner reports and close out sale issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.2)	B006	0.30	235.50	
07/24/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with N. Jabin re: OCP report	B006	0.10	40.00	
07/24/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with B. Olivere re: OCP report filing issues	B006	0.10	40.00	
07/26/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: Ohio Cat vendor payment settlement negotiations	B006	0.10	41.50	

	Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 23 of 102
Welded Construction	, L.P.		Invoice Date:	August 12, 2019
			Invoice Number:	50007805
			Matter Number:	076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/26/19	BFELD	Prep call with T. Xu re: call for Lowes settlement	B006	0.10	34.00
07/26/19	BFELD	Call with Syncrony re: Lowes settlement (.4); follow-up call with K. Cushing re: same (.1); follow-up email to call participants re: same (.2)	B006	0.70	238.00
07/26/19	BFELD	Emails with M. Neiburg re: Gopher 9019 motion	B006	0.10	34.00
07/26/19	BFELD	Participate in call with R. Poppiti and S. Cherian and A. Ralph (AlixPartners) revarious equipment and rejection issues	B006	0.70	238.00
07/26/19	MLUNN	Call with F. Pometti re: real estate sale process / selection of broker	B006	0.50	372.50
07/26/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and client's insurance broker re: D&O policy renewal	B006	0.20	125.00
07/26/19	SBEAC	Emails with M. Neiburg and K. Guerke re: Hood consulting agreement (.1); Emails with A. Mielke re: Seyfarth engagement letter (.1); Multiple emails with C. Kelley and A. Mielke re: Sunbelt and other issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.3); Review and revise supplemental Common Interest Agreement with Bechtel re: claims issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.3)	B006	1.00	785.00
07/26/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, R. Poppiti and A. Mielke re: Kofke proof of claim (.1); Emails with S. Hawkins and F. Pometti re: Columbia Gas issues (.2)	B006	0.30	235.50
07/28/19	SBEAC	Emails with B Feldman and F Pometti re ETP closeout issues.	B006	0.20	157.00
07/28/19	SBEAC	Emails with K Guerke re Hood consulting agreement.	B006	0.10	78.50
07/29/19	BFELD	Draft COC and proposed order re: first reconciliation agreement between Agent and Debtors	B006	0.80	272.00
07/29/19	BFELD	Emails with C. Elliott (Synchrony - Lowes) re: amounts owed relating to ETP project	B006	0.10	34.00
07/29/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, A. Ralph (AlixPartners) and D. McDowell (Welded) re: Transco response to Gopher 9019 motion	B006	0.50	170.00
07/29/19	JMULV	Drafting Plan	B006	2.40	1,104.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 24 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 24 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/29/19	MLUNN	Review, analyze, provide comments to draft reconciliation agreement, including review of agency agreement and revise same; correspondence and call with S. Tonkovich; correspondence with F. Pometti	B006	1.60	1,192.00
07/29/19	RFPOP	Emails from M. Lunn, client (Dean McDowell), client's insurance broker and board re: D&O policy renewal	B006	0.20	125.00
07/29/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with S Hawkins, K Guerke, M Rosenthal and M Kelsey re Hood consulting agreement issues (.1); Review revised agreement re same (.1); Emails with B Feldman and K Cushing re finalizing release agreement (.1); Review documents re same (.2)	B006	0.50	392.50
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: Beaver Valley insurance claim	B006	0.10	41.50
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Neuroth re: vendor payments (0.2); emails with R. Wondwosen re: same (0.1)	B006	0.30	124.50
07/30/19	AMIEL	Review and revise Ohio Cat settlement agreement (0.7); review ETP release in connection with same (0.2); confer with B. Feldman and R. Poppiti re: same (0.1)	B006	1.00	415.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Draft COC and proposed order re: first reconciliation agreement between Agent and Debtors	B006	0.20	68.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Review spreadsheet re: Lowes invoices (.3); correspond with counsel at Synchrony and counsel to Sunoco re: same in connection with Sunoco settlement agreement (.5)	B006	0.80	272.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Calls with K. Cushing re: finalizing release agreement for Sunoco settlement agreement	B006	0.20	68.00
07/30/19	MLUNN	Correspondence with Choate re: first reconciliation agreement and review and provide comments to order approving first reconciliation agreement and related COC (.4); review revised reconciliation agreement and correspondence with F. Pometti and correspondence with Choate (.3); further revise reconciliation agreement and correspondence with M. Schaedle (.3)	B006	1.00	745.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 25 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

	- Andreaded	With the second	umoor.		070050.1001	
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount	
07/31/19	AMIEL	Revise Ohio Cat Vendor Settlement Agreement (1.3); send email to S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B006	1.40	581.00	
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: Beaver Valley insurance claim (0.1); emails with S. Edison re: same (0.1)	B006	0.20	83.00	
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Wondwosen re: vendor payments (0.1); emails with B. Feldman re: same (0.1)	B006	0.20	83.00	
07/31/19	BFELD	Revise order approving 9019 motion re: Gopher Mats settlement (.2); emails with R. Poppiti and various interested parties re: same (.4)	B006	0.60	204.00	
07/31/19	BFELD	Revise and proofread (5.4) disclosure statement re: comments from R. Poppiti and M. Lunn; confer with J. Mulvihill (.1) and M. Lunn (.1) re: same	B006	5.60	1,904.00	
07/31/19	BFELD	Participate in call with R. Poppiti and S. Cherian and A. Ralph (AlixPartners) re: various equipment and rejection issues	B006	0.50	170.00	
07/31/19	BFELD	Draft COC re: revised rule 9019 order relating to Gopher Mats settlement agreement	B006	0.50	170.00	
07/31/19	MLUNN	Review exhibit to reconciliation agreement; correspondence with Choate; correspondence with M. Schaedle; and correspondence with J. Leamy re: approval of reconciliation agreement and related order	B006	0.50	372.50	
07/31/19	MLUNN	Correspondence with D. McDowell re: account information for sale proceeds	B006	0.10	74.50	
07/31/19	RFPOP	Email from A. Mielke re: Sunbelt litigation	B006	0.10	62.50	
06/27/19	AKIM	Update third certification of counsel for stipulation to extend general bar date for sureties	B007	1.10	242.00	
07/01/19	AMIEL	Confer with M. LeVan and S. Balram re: vendor claim	B007	0.30	124.50	
07/01/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Balram re: surety claim	B007	0.10	41.50	
07/01/19	AMIEL	Confer with D. McDowell and J. Krzysztofik re: union claim issues	B007	0.60	249.00	
07/01/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Poppiti re: Express 4x4 administrative claims	B007	0.20	83.00	
07/01/19	BFELD	Call with A. Ralph re: claims reconciliation	B007	0.20	68.00	

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 26 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 26 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/01/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: resolutions of various claims	B007	0.30	102.00
07/01/19	BFELD	Call with A. Mielke, J. Krzysztofik and D. McDowell re: various union issues in light of claims filed	B007	0.50	170.00
07/01/19	BFELD	Review administrative claims re: various creditors in preparation for resolution of same	B007	0.20	68.00
07/01/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: claims reconciliation and schedules amendment issues	B007	0.20	125.00
07/01/19	RFPOP	Call from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) (.1) and email to and from counsel for Gopher (Vanessa Power) (.1) re: draft proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin and related issues and disputes	B007	0.20	125.00
07/01/19	RFPOP	Call from counsel for Express 4x4 (Todd Sable and Larry Lichtman) (.2) and discussion with A. Mielke (.2) re: proposed resolution of Express 4x4 motion for admin claim, and review motion (.1) re: same	B007	0.50	312.50
07/01/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: Ohio CAT issues and counteroffer (.2); Review documents re: same (.5); Work with A. Mielke re: same (.2)	B007	0.90	706.50
07/01/19	SBEAC	Call from Charles Kelley re: lien claim and critical vendor issues (.3); Review documents re: same (.5)	B007	0.80	628.00
07/02/19	AMIEL	Confer with T. Snyder re: expert retention in connection with Central States claim (0.1); email re: same (0.1)	B007	0.20	83.00
07/02/19	AMIEL	Review C. States withdrawal liability settlement in connection with J. Lucian's inquiry re: same (0.2); emails with S. Beach and J. Lucian re: same (0.1)	B007	0.30	124.50
07/02/19	AMIEL	Research withdrawal liability issues in preparation for meeting with S. Beach (1.1); draft agenda for same (0.2)	B007	1.30	539.50
07/02/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: C. States Pension claim	B 007	0.20	83.00
07/02/19	AMIEL	Email from A. Ralph re: surety claims status	B007	0.10	41.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 27 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P.

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:

Invoice Number:

50007805

Matter Number:

076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/02/19	BFELD	Review settlement proposal re: MacAllister/Michigan CAT administrative expense claim and rejection damages claim	B007	0.10	34.00
07/02/19	BFELD	Prepare settlement proposal re: Yak Mat administrative expense claim and rejection damages claim	B007	1.00	340.00
07/02/19	BFELD	Emails with A. Ralph (AlixPartners) and R. Poppiti re: upcoming claim objections	B007	0.10	34.00
07/02/19	RFPOP	Call with client's OSHA counsel (Bill Myers) and counsel for DOL re: proposed resolution of DOL OSHA claims (.3), and review draft proposed settlement agreement in preparation for same (.2)	B007	0.50	312.50
07/02/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from and call to Zolfo (Frank Pometti) (.3), emails to and from counsel for Gopher (Vanessa Power) and counsel for TransCanada (Charles Kelley and Andrew Elkhoury) (.3), and call with Vanessa Power (.4) re: comments from counsel for TransCanada to proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes, and review comments from counsel for TransCanada (.4) re: same	B007	1.40	875.00
07/02/19	SBEAC	Work with A. Mielke re: Ohio CAT issues (.6); Review and revise documents re: same (.5); Calls with F. Pometti, A. Ralph and A. Mielke re: same (1.3)	B007	2.40	1,884.00
07/02/19	SBEAC	Emails with S. Poteet and B. Feldman re: Ohio CAT issues	B007	0.10	78.50
07/02/19	SBEAC	Call with P. Mallos re: Central States diligence issues (.1); Call with A. Mielke re: same (.1); Multiple emails with A. Mielke, J. Lucian and T. Snyder re: Central States withdrawal liability issues (.2); Review documents re: same (.7)	B007	1.10	863.50
07/02/19	SBEAC	Read email from Mielke, Allison: Welded- Central States Claim	B007	0.10	78.50
07/02/19	SBEAC	Work with T. Snyder and A. Mielke re Central States strategy issues (.4); Review and revise documents re: same (.7)	B007	1.10	863.50
07/02/19	SBEAC	Emails with J. Spoonster and B. Feldman re: lien claim issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.4)	B007	0.50	392.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2

Filed 08/21/19 Page 28 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
50007805 Welded Construction, L.P. 076850.1001 Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/03/19	AMIEL	Draft outline of Central States claim objection (.8); research issues in connection with same (1.8); review documents in connection with drafting same (1.9)	B007	4.50	1,867.50
07/03/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: claims objection	B007	0.10	41.50
07/03/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: expert retention in connection with central states claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/03/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: information requests in connection with central states claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/03/19	AMIEL	Emails with L. Monroy re: claim reconciliation status	B007	0.10	41.50
07/03/19	BFELD	Call with claimants' counsel re: inquiry about second omnibus claim objection (.1); follow-up email with A. Ralph re: same (.1)	B007	0.20	68.00
07/03/19	BFELD	Email with counsel to Yak Mat re: resolution of rejection damages claim and administrative expense claim	B007	0.50	170.00
07/03/19	BFELD	Review and circulate to counsel proposed resolution re: Michigan CAT/MacAllister rejection damages claims and administrative expense claims	B007	0.80	272.00
07/03/19	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach (.6) and call with Zolfo (Frank Pometti) (.2) re: draft proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes	B007	0.80	500.00
07/03/19	SBEAC	Call with R. Poppiti re: UCC investigation, Gopher settlement and case strategy issues (.7); Review and revise documents re: same (1.1)	B007	1.80	1,413.00
07/03/19	SBEAC	Call with B. Feldman re: Sunoco closeout issues	B007	0.10	78.50
07/03/19	SBEAC	Email with T. Snyder re: Central States partial withdrawal settlement, Engagement Letter and Project Scope Document with Dexter Hofing (.1); Review documents re: same (.6)	B007	0.70	549.50
07/05/19	AMIEL	Emails with D. McDowell re: diligence information in connection with Central States Pension Fund claim (.1); confer with B. Feldman re: same (.1)	B007	0.20	83.00
07/05/19	AMIEL	Emails with P. Mallos re: Central States claim diligence	B007	0.10	41.50

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P.

Page 29 of 102

August 12, 2019

50007805 Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/05/19	AMIEL	Emails from R. Poppiti re: claims resolution	B007	0.10	41.50
07/05/19	AMIEL	Review diligence information in connection with Central States Pension Fund claim (1.1); research issues in connection with same (6.8)	B007	7.90	3,278.50
07/05/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft proposed settlement agreement resolving DOL OSHA claims and draft proposed order for same, and email to client (Steve Hawkins) and client's OSHA counsel (Bill Myers) re: same	B007	1.10	687.50
07/05/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman re: 84 Lumber informal response to second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.10	62.50
07/05/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and F. Pometti re: Ohio CAT global settlement (.2); Review documents re: same (.6); Review lien documents re: Multiple other claimants re: Columbia Gas project (.6)	B007	1.40	1,099.00
07/05/19	SBEAC	Emails with M. Kelsey, M. Rosenthal and P. Mallos re: Central states claim issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.5)	B007	0.60	471.00
07/06/19	AMIEL	Review diligence information in connection with drafting objection to Central States claim	B007	4.60	1,909.00
07/06/19	BFELD	Review claims re: third omnibus claims objection	B007	0.50	170.00
07/07/19	AMIEL	Review Central States pension fund diligence information (2.4); draft claim objection in connection with same (4.5); review precedent in connection with same (1.6)	B007	8.50	3,527.50
07/07/19	BFELD	Review claims re: third omnibus claims objection	B007	1.30	442.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: Central States	B007	0.50	207.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Hawkins, D. McDowell, and J. Krzysztofik re: diligence materials for the C. States claim	B007	0.40	166.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Emails with P. Mallos re: C. States claim information	B007	0.20	83.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: information request in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach and T. Snyder re: central states claim strategy	B007	0.30	124.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 30 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019

Telded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

 Date:
 August 12, 2019

 Number:
 50007805

 Number:
 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with T. Snyder re: Central States	B007	0.40	166.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: labor agreements in connection with C. States claim (0.2); review labor agreements and diligence materials in connection with same (0.7); email to T. Snyder re: same (0.1)	B007	1.00	415.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with R. Poppiti, and L. Lichtman re: Express 4x4 motion for administrative claim (0.4); follow up with R. Poppiti re: same (0.1); emails re: same (0.1)	B007	0.60	249.00
07/08/19	BFELD	Emails with A. Mielke and R. Poppiti and S. Cherian re: Barco claims	B007	0.20	68.00
07/08/19	BFELD	Review claims re: third and fourth omnibus claims objection (6.8); confer with R. Poppiti re: same (.3); call with A. Ralph re: same (1.0); finalize same for filing (.3)	B007	8.40	2,856.00
07/08/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 4th omnibus objection to claims	B007	0.40	114.00
07/08/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 3rd omnibus objection to claims	B007	0.40	114.00
07/08/19	BOLIV	Assist in anticipation of filing of 3rd and 4th omnibus objection to claims	B007	1.50	427.50
07/08/19	RFPOP	Call with client (Steve Hawkins and Dean McDowell), Zolfo (Frank Pometti) and client's OSHA counsel (Bill Myers) (.5), emails to and from Steve Hawkins and Bill Myers (.2), and email to and from M. Neiburg (.1) re: draft proposed stipulation resolving DOL OSHA claims	B007	0.80	500.00
07/08/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from counsel for Express 4x4 (Todd Sable and Larry Lichtman), call with A. Mielke, Todd Sable and Larry Lichtman and follow-up call with A. Mielke re: Express 4x4 motion for admin claim	B007	0.60	375.00
07/08/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft third (.4) and fourth (.8) omnibus claims objections, and emails to and from (.3), meet with (.2 and .2) and calls to (.1) B. Feldman resame	B007	2.00	1,250.00
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Central States claim strategy (.1); Review documents re: same (.4)	В007	0.50	392.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 31 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/08/19	SBEAC	Call with M. Kelsey and A. Mielke recentral states	B007	0.60	471.00
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with M. Kelsey re: central states	B007	0.10	78.50
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Snyder re: Central States Pension Fund claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/09/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach, P. Mallos, I. Golub, B. Haynes, M. Kelsey, and M. Rosenthal re: withdrawal liability claim (0.5); follow up with S. Beach re: same (0.3)	B007	0.80	332.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with L. Lichtman and R. Poppiti re: Express 4x4 settlement offer and deadline to respond to related motion for admin claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/09/19	AMIEL	Revise Central States claim objection (3.1); research issues in connection with same (2.3)	B007	5.40	2,241.00
07/09/19	BFELD	Draft notice of satisfaction re: claims and scheduled amounts	B007	0.40	136.00
07/09/19	BFELD	Review response re: second/fourth omnibus claim objection (.1); emails with AlixPartners and Welded teams re: same (.1)	B007	0.20	68.00
07/09/19	BFELD	Research re: Barco claims (.5); emails (.2) and call (.2) with S. Cherian re: same	B007	0.90	306.00
07/09/19	BFELD	Review_claims and scheduled amounts resecond notice of satisfaction	B007	2.80	952.00
07/09/19	RFPOP	Email to and from counsel for Express 4x4 (Larry Lichtman) and email to committee counsel (Joe Mintz) re: Express 4x4 motion for admin claim	B007	0.20	125.00
07/09/19	RFPOP	Review Mosely response to second and fourth omnibus claims objections, and emails to and from B. Feldman and client (Jackie Krzysztofik) re: same	B007	0.30	187.50
07/09/19	RFPOP	Meet with M. Neiburg (.4), call with M. Neiburg, client (Steve Hawkins and Dean McDowell), client's OSHA counsel (Bill Myers) and Ken O'Reilly (.5) and email from Bill Myers (.1) re: proposed settlement agreement resolving DOL OSHA claims	B007	1.00	625.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2

Filed 08/21/19 Page 32 of 102

August 12, 2019

50007805 Welded Construction, L.P. 076850.1001 Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/09/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: claims reconciliation issues (.2), and review and analyze summary from Andrew Ralph and related proofs of claim (.8) re: same	B007	1.00	625.00
07/09/19	RFPOP	Call from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: proposed settlement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes	B007	0.20	125.00
07/09/19	SBEAC	Attend conference call with T. Snyder, A. Mielke and Bechtel re: CSPF (.6); Review documents re: preparation re: same (.9)	B007	1.50	1,177.50
07/09/19	SBEAC	Review Central States documents, retention of expert consultant, and review actuarial issues	B007	0.70	549.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Confer with J. Krzytofik re: Central States (0.3); emails with P. Mallos re: same (0.1)	B007	0.40	166.00
07/10/19	AMIEL	Revise reservation of language in connection with central states claim and request for review	B007	0.30	124.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails from L. Murley re: omnibus claim objection	B007	0.10	41.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Snyder re: request for review in connection with C. States claim (0.2); review PBGC opinion in connection with same (0.1)	B007	0.30	124.50
07/10/19	BFELD	Calls with counsel to 84 Lumber re: resolution of response to claim objection (.2); follow-up research (.2) and confer with A. Ralph and N. Jabin (AlixPartners) (.2) re: same	B007	0.60	204.00
07/10/19	BFELD	Review claims and scheduled amounts re: second notice of satisfaction	В007	3.90	1,326.00
07/10/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: proposed resolution of 84 Lumber informal response to second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.20	125.00
07/10/19	RFPOP	Email from counsel for Yak Mats (Sarah Ennis) (.2), email-to and call to B. Feldman (.2), and call with B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian) (.4) re: proposed resolution of Yak Mats motion for admin claim	B007	0.80	500.00
07/10/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from and call from potential counsel for RWDY re: second omnibus claims objection	В007	0.30	187.50

Page 33 of 102
August 12, 2019
50007805 Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/10/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Ohio Cat Settlement documents	B007	1.20	942.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Ohio Cat (.1); Review documents re: same (.5)	B007	0.60	471.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with B. Feldman re: Lowe's claim	B007	0.10	78.50
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with T. Snyder re: PBGC Opinion	B007	0.20	157.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with M. Neiburg re: post-petition reconciliation	B007	0.10	78.50
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with J. Stiff and A. Mielke re: Global Settlement (.1); Review documents re: same (.3)	B007	0.40	314.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with L. Murley re: second omnibus claim objection - request for extension	B007	0.10	78.50
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke and T. Snyder re: Central States claim	B007	0.20	157.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Review Williams completion agreements and post-petition claims reconciliation issues	B007	0.60	471.00
07/11/19	AMIEL	Email to counsel for Bechtel re: C. States claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Confer with F. Pometti re: retention of ERISA consultant in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Emails with P. Mallos re: C. States claim information	B007	0.20	83.00
07/11/19	AMIEL	Confer with M. Levan re: Ohio Cat payment	B007	0.30	124.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: C. States claim diligence information	B007	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: status of Chubb payment	B007	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	BFELD	Review claims and scheduled amounts resecond notice of satisfaction	B007	0.10	34.00
07/11/19	BOLIV	Review claims register; request all claims 638 through 815 from claims agent	B007	0.10	28.50
07/11/19	RFPOP	Email to and from and call to counsel for RWDY (Brya Keilson) re: second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.20	125.00
07/11/19	RFPOP	Email from and call to counsel for Gopher (Vanessa Power) re: proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim	В007	0.30	187.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 34 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

					0,000011001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/11/19	RFPOP	Call to and email to and from (.1) and meet with (.3 and .3) S. Beach, call with S. Beach and counsel for TransCanada (Charles Kelly) (.7), and email to Charlies Kelly (.1) re: proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes and other outstanding issues re: TransCanada, and review draft proposed settlement agreement (.4) re: same	В007	1.90	1,187.50
07/11/19	RFPOP	Email from B. Feldman re: second notice of satisfied claims, and review related proofs of claim re: same	B007	0.50	312.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Review Gopher Settlement Agreement	B007	0.30	235.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Ohio Cat Settlement Agreement (.1); Review and revise documents re: same (1.2)	B007	1.30	1,020.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke, F. Pometti, and A. Ralph re: Global Settlement Terms (Ohio CAT)	B007	0.10	78.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Central states issues (.1); Review and revise documents re: same (.4)	B007	0.50	392.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Emails with M. Rosenthal re: Central States	B007	0.10	78.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Attend call with F. Pometti, A. Ralph, A. Mielke re: Ohio Cat Counterproposal/Williams post-petition reconciliation	B007	1.10	863.50
07/11/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Ohio Cat (.1); Review documents re: same (.5)	B007	0.60	471.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Review draft Request for Review in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.30	124.50
07/12/19	AMIEL	Revise Central States claim objection (2.5); review case law and research notes in connection with same (1.7)	B007	4.20	1,743.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Email to T. Snyder and S. Beach re: ERISA research in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.40	166.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Review S. Beach's comments to reservation of rights language (0.1); incorporate same into claim objection (0.1)	B007	0.20	83.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Review actuarial analysis in connection with C. States pension claim	B007	0.40	166.00

Welded Construction	Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:	Page 35 of 102 August 12, 2019
			Invoice Number:	50007805
			Matter Number:	076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/12/19	AMIEL	Confer with T. Snyder and S. Beach re: C. States claim strategy	B007	0.30	124.50
07/12/19	AMIEL	Confer with P. Mallos re: Central States Claim	B007	0.60	249.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: Ohio Cat Settlement (0.5); emails with F. Pometti re: same (0.1); revise settlement agreement in connection with same (0.8)	B007	1.40	581.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Snyder re: C. States claim strategy (0.1); review documents in connection with same (0.3)	B007	0.40	166.00
07/12/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: notice of satisfaction	B007	0.20	68.00
07/12/19	BFELD	Participate in call with A. Ralph and N. Jabin (AlixPartners), D. McDowell (Welded), and R. Poppiti re: claims reconciliation and notices of satisfaction	B007	0.70	238.00
07/12/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: proposed settlement of various rejection damages claims (.3); revise exhibits re: same (.7); call with S. Cherian (AlixPartners) and emails with A. Ralph (AlixPartners) re: same (.7); draft proposed order re: same (0.8)	B007	2.50	850.00
07/12/19	BFELD	Draft proposed order (.5) and settlement offer (.6) re: administrative expense claims of Yak Mat	B007	1.10	374.00
07/12/19	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman, client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Nishat Jabin) (.6) and call to B. Feldman (.2) re: claims reconciliation issues, and review and analyze materials from Andrew Ralph and Nishat Jabin (1.6) re: same	B007	2.40	1,500.00
07/12/19	RFPOP	Review McCrory response to second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.10	62.50
07/12/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from S. Beach, counsel for TransCanada (Charles Kelly) and counsel for Gopher (Vanessa Power) and call from S. Beach re: proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes	B007	0.40	250.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Elkhoury, C. Kelley, R. Poppiti, and B. Feldman re: Gopher settlement (.1); Review documents re: same (.3)	B007	0.40	314.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 36 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 36 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				0,000011001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/12/19	SBEAC	Emails with T. Snyder and A. Mielke re: Bechtel and Welded Central states issues (.2); Review and revise documents re: same (.5)	B007	0.70	549.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Review and revise COC re: Order Approving Ohio Cat Agreement (.2); email A. Mielke re: same (.1)	B007	0.30	235.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Emails with S. Hawkins and F. Pometti re: Gopher settlement	B007	0.10	78.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Ohio Cat Settlement Agreement (.1); Review and revise same (.7)	B007	0.80	628.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Emails with T. Snyder re: Central States issues (.1); Review documents re; same (.3)	B007	0.40	314.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Email with T. Snyder and A. Mielke re: Central States Reservation of Rights Language	B007	0.20	157.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Review Central States affidavit and request for review issues	B007	0.70	549.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke and T. Snyder re: Central States	B007	0.10	78.50
07/13/19	BFELD	Review claims and scheduled amounts resecond notice of satisfaction	B007	3.30	1,122.00
07/13/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft proposed order resolving Yak Mat motion for admin claim (.8), and emails to and from B. Feldman (.2) re: same	B007	1.00	625.00
07/13/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with A. Mielke and T. Snyder re: request for review of Central States claim (.1); Review documents re: same (.3)	B007	0.40	314.00
07/14/19	AMIEL	Revise draft request for review in connection with C. States claim	B007	1.40	581.00
07/15/19	AMIEL	Revise request for review in connection with C. States claim (2.1); emails with S. Beach and T. Snyder re: same (0.2); emails with R. Kramer in connection with same (0.1)	B007	2.40	996.00
07/15/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with R. Kramer, S. Beach, T. Snyder, M. Kelsey, M. Rosenthal, P. Mallos, and B. Haynes re: C. States claim issues	B007	0.60	249.00
07/15/19	AMIEL	Review teamster contribution analysis in connection with C. States pension fund claim	B007	0.20	83.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 37 of 102 August 12, 2019 50007805 Invoice Number: 076850.1001 Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/15/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with R. Kramer, S. Beach, and T. Snyder re: C. States claim strategy	B007	0.50	207.50
07/15/19	AMIEL	Review records for common interest agreement in connection with defense of C. States claim (0.3); review common interest agreement and provide comments to S. Beach (0.2)	B007	0.50	207.50
07/15/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: timing of filing for notice of satisfaction and upcoming claim objections	B007	0.20	68.00
07/15/19	BFELD	Review claims and scheduled amounts resecond notice of satisfaction	B007	1.50	510.00
07/15/19	RFPOP	Call with (.4) and emails to and from (.2) committee counsel (Joe Mintz), counsel for Gopher (Vanessa Power) and counsel for TransCanada (Andrew Elkhoury), emails to and from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) (.2), and call from Joe Mintz (.2) re: proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes, and revise settlement agreement (.2) and review and revise draft proposed motion to approve agreement (.6) re: same	B007	1.80	1,125.00
07/15/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and counsel for Yak Mat (Sarah Ennis) and call to B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of Yak Mat motion for admin claim and response to first rejection motion, and review and comment on redline of revised draft proposed order re: same	B007	0.40	250.00
07/15/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Nishat Jabin) and call to B. Feldman re: second notice of satisfied claims and schedules amounts (.4), and review materials from B. Feldman and Nishat Jabin (.4) re: same	B007	0.80	500.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and review Earth Pipeline litigation transfer documents (.3); Attend call with R. Kramer, T. Snyder and A. Mielke re: Central States claim (partial) (.3)	B007	0.60	471.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Call with S. Soule re: Williams adequate protection and motion to compel (.3); Followup emails with-S. Soule and T. Buchanan re: same (.2)	B007	0.50	392.50
07/15/19	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti and R. Poppiti re: Gopher settlement (.1); Review documents re: same (.2)	B007	0.30	235.50

Welded Co		Case 18-12378-KG , L.P.	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	Page 38 of :	102 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>		<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/15/19	SBEAG		tiff and A. Mielk		0.60	471.00

<u>Date</u> 07/15/19	<u>Initials</u> SBEAC	Description Email with J. Stiff and A. Mielke re: (OHIO CAT) Agreement (.1); Work with A. Mielke re: same (.1); Review documents re: same (.4)	Task B007	<u>Hours</u> 0.60	<u>Amount</u> 471.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Attend Call with T. Snyder, A. Mielke, R. Kramer, M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey and others re: Central States Claim	B007	0.70	549.50
07/15/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Request for Review of Central States Assessment (1.3); Multiple emails with T. Snyder, R. Kramer, M. Hofing, M. Rosenthal and A. Mielke re: same (.3); Review auditor report, diligence documents, case law and applicable statutes re: same (1.1)	B007	2.70	2,119.50
07/15/19	SBEAC	Emails with T. Snyder and A. Mielke re: Request for Review	B007	0.20	157.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails to S. Beach and T. Snyder re: F. Pometti's comments to request for review (0.1); review request for review to incorporate same (0.2)	B007	0.30	124.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Bondy and B. Feldman re: teleconference in connection with surety claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Review R. Kramer's comments to draft request for review (0.2); incorporate same (0.2); emails with R. Kramer re: same (0.1)	B007	0.50	207.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Snyder re: status of C. States request for review	B007	0.10	41.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Kramer re: withdrawal liability strategy (0.5); draft email summary and analysis for S. Beach re: same (0.5)	B007	1.00	415.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Draft email summary of C. States strategy and analysis of request for review (0.3); send same to S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, D. McDowell and J. Krzysztofik (0.1)	B007	0.40	166.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Email from R. Kramer re: withdrawal liability defenses (0.1); review attachments to same (0.1)	B007	0.20	83.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Confer with F. Pometti re: C. States request for review	B007	0.20	83.00
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer re: C. States request for review	B007	0.10	41.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: collective bargaining agreements in connection with C. States claim diligence	B007	0.10	41.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 39 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/16/19	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman re: claim reconciliation	B007	0.30	124.50
07/16/19	BFELD	Call with N. Jabin (.4) and finalize for filing (1.4) re: notice of satisfaction	B007	1.80	612.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Call with A. Mielke and emails with J. Bondy (counsel to Berkshire) re: claims filed	B007	0.10	34.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Call with M. Talmo (counsel to Barco) re: admin claim	B007	0.20	68.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Call with M. Gocksch (counsel to Bechtel) re: claims reconciliation	B007	0.10	34.00
07/16/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman, committee counsel (Joe Mintz), counsel for TransCanada (Charles Kelley and Andrew Elkhoury) and counsel for Gopher (Vanessa Power) re: draft proposed settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related draft motion to approve same	B007	0.30	187.50
07/16/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and counsel for Yak Mat (Mike Busenkell) re: draft proposed order resolving Yak Mat motion for admin claim and objection to first rejection motion	B007	0.10	62.50
07/16/19	RFPOP	Review revised draft of second notice of satisfied claims and scheduled amounts, and emails to and from and call to B. Feldman re: same	B007	0.40	250.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Review Sunoco release issues and documents	B007	0.60	471.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Review and revise request for review and related documents re: Central States claim issues	B007	1.60	1,256.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: Central States strategy issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.7)	В007	0.80	628.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Sunoco release agreement	B007	0.40	314.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: Ohio CAT issues	B007	0.10	78.50
07/16/19	TBOLL	Finalize for filing second notice of satisfaction of claims, and coordinate service of same with the claims agent	B007	0.40	114.00
07/17/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Poppiti re: Express 4x4 settlement offer to resolve administrative claim	B007	0.10	41.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 40 of 102 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 40 of 102 Aug

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

Page 40 of 102 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/17/19	BFELD	Call with Welded, AlixPartners, R. Poppiti, and counsel for Barco and Barco re: claims reconciliation for administrative claim	B007	0.50	170.00
07/17/19	BFELD	Discussion with M. Lunn re: CFSC claims in light of releases in Agency Agreement	B007	0.10	34.00
07/17/19	MLUNN	Work with R. Poppiti re: claim issues	B007	0.10	74.50
07/17/19	MLUNN	Review CAT claim analysis and meeting with B. Feldman	B007	0.30	223.50
07/17/19	RFPOP	Review revised draft of motion to approve settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes, and email to and from B. Feldman re: same	B007	0.40	250.00
07/17/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman re: resolution of Yak Mat motion for admin claim and objection to first rejection motion	B007	0.20	125.00
07/17/19	RFPOP	Email from counsel for Express 4x4 (Todd Sable) and email to Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: proposed resolution of Express 4x4 motion for admin claim	B007	0.20	125.00
07/17/19	SBEAC	Call with B. Ryniker re: claims issues (.2); Emails with B. Ryniker re: same (.1)	B007	0.30	235.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: common interest agreement in connection with C. States claim (0.1); emails with P. Mallos, M. Kelsey, and M. Rosenthal Re: same (0.1)	B007	0.20	83.00
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Wondwosen re: Beaver Valley Slag insurance claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with B. Feldman and J. Bondy re: surety claim	B007	0.30	124.50
07/18/19	BFELD	Calls with F. Pometti (.1) and responding employee-claimants (.2) re: responses to second and fourth omnibus claim objection	B007	0.30	102.00
07/18/19	BFELD	Revise disclosure statement re: revisions to plan (.3); emails with V. Thomas re: tax disclosures in disclosure statement	B007	-0.40	136.00
07/18/19	BFELD	Review claims re: upcoming objections	B007	0.40	136.00
07/18/19	BFELD	Review claims and agency agreement (.1) and call with B. Rapp (counsel to CFSC) re: same	B007	0.20	68.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 41 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 41 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/18/19	BFELD	Review claims (.2) and call with J. Bondy (counsel to Berkshire) (.3) re: project surety bond	B007	0.50	170.00
07/18/19	BFELD	Emails with A. Ralph re: claims reconciliation	B007	0.50	170.00
07/18/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Nishat Jabin) re: additional omnibus claims objections (.2), and review materials from Andrew Ralph and Nishat Jabin (.6) re: same	B007	0.80	500.00
07/18/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke re: Express 4x4 motion for admin claim	B007	0.10	62.50
07/18/19	SBEAC	Review Ohio CAT settlement documents and open issues (.6); Review Schmid claim issues (.3)	B007	0.90	706.50
07/18/19	SBEAC	Review and revise task list (.3); Emails with A. Mielke re: same (.1); Meeting with K. Guerke re: consulting agreement and Earth Pipeline issues (.4); Call with M. Neiburg re: same (.2); Work with K. Enos re: same (.1); Review and revise consulting agreement and Earth Pipeline claim documents (.8)	B007	1.90	1,491.50
07/19/19	BFELD	Meet with R. Poppiti re: fifth and sixth omnibus claim objections (.6); call with A. Ralph, D. McDowell (Welded), and R. Poppiti re: same (.6); review claims for same (.8)	B007	2.00	680.00
07/19/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti and M. Harvey (counsel for Barco) re: claims reconciliation	B007	0.50	170.00
07/19/19	BOLIV	Download all DE district court pleadings from the Earth Pipeline vs. Columbia Gas matter [19-1210]	B007	0.40	114.00
07/19/19	KENOS	Review pleadings and limited research re: EPS claim objection considerations	B007	1.00	645.00
07/19/19	KENOS	Meet with S. Beach, A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: Pipeline Services Claim	B007	0.50	322.50
07/19/19	RFPOP	Email to and from counsel for RWDY (Brya Keilson) re: second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.20	125.00
07/19/19	RFPOP	Meet with B. Feldman (.6) and call with B. Feldman, client (Dean McDowell and Kelly Colborn) (.6) and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Nishat Jabin) re: claims reconciliation issues	B007	1.20	750.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 42 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 50007805 Invoice Number: Matter Number: 076850.1001

Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/19/19	RFPOP	Review revised draft exhibits for additional omnibus claims objections, and emails to and from B. Feldman re: same	B007	0.70	437.50
07/19/19	RFPOP	Email to and from counsel for Express 4x4 (Todd Sable) re: proposed resolution of Express 4x4 motion for admin claim	B007	0.20	125.00
07/19/19	SBEAC	Emails with K. Enos and A. Mielke re: Earth Pipeline claim issues	B007	0.20	157.00
07/19/19	SBEAC	Meeting with K. Guerke, K. Enos and A. Mielke re: Earth Pipeline claims, objection and lien issues (.5); Review and revise documents re: same (.9); Review lien removal pleadings re: same (.5)	B007	1.90	1,491.50
07/19/19	SBEAC	Emails with T. Buchanan RE: Williams ASR Post-Petition Reconciliation	B007	0.10	78.50
07/20/19	BFELD	Review responses re: second and fourth omnibus claim objection	B007	0.30	102.00
07/20/19	BFELD	Review re: CFSC and Bechtel claims	B007	0.90	306.00
07/21/19	BFELD	Review claims register re: possible claim objections	B007	3.00	1,020.00
07/21/19	BFELD	Review exhibits re: fifth and sixth omnibus claim objections	B007	1.30	442.00
07/21/19	RFPOP	Review comments from B. Feldman to revised draft exhibits for additional omnibus claims objections, and emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Nishat Jabin) re: same	B007	0.40	250.00
07/22/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: status of Central States request for review	B007	0.10	41.50
07/22/19	AMIEL	Review Bechtel's request for review in connection with C. States claim	B007	1.00	415.00
07/22/19	AMIEL	Confer with F. Pometti re: request for review (0.1); emails with F. Pometti re: same (0.1); emails with R. Kramer re: same (0.2); emails with P. Mallos re: same (0.1); emails with C. Schulty re: same (0.1); draft affidavit in support of same (0.5); review information request (0.7); send email to R. Kramer re: same (0.2)	B007	2.00	830.00
07/22/19	AMIEL	Emails with C. McNulty re: request for review delivery	B007	0.10	41.50
07/22/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: Beaver Valley Claim	B007	0.10	41.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 43 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

-		iviatier is	tumber.		0/0850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/22/19	AMIEL	Emails with P. Mallos, S. Beach, and R. Kramer re: common interest agreement in connection with request for review	B007	0.20	83.00
07/22/19	BFELD	Review exhibits re: fifth and sixth omnibus claim objections (3.4); call with R. Poppiti re: same (.6)	B007	4.00	1,360.00
07/22/19	BFELD	Calls with respondents to claim objections (second and fourth omnibus)	B007	0.60	204.00
07/22/19	RFPOP	Emails from (.1) and call to (.6) B. Feldman re: additional omnibus claims objections	B007	0.70	437.50
07/22/19	SBEAC	Call with P. Mallos re: Central States claim issues	B007	0.20	157.00
07/22/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and T. Snyder re: Central States request for review, including comments from Committee and others (.2); Review and revise documents re: same (.4)	B007	0.60	471.00
07/23/19	AMIEL	Emails from S. Beach and B. Feldman re: claim objection	B007	0.10	41.50
07/23/19	AMIEL	Confer with B. Olivere re: C. States claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/23/19	AMIEL	Email with S. Edison re: Beaver Valley Claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/23/19	AMIEL	Revise/review request for review in connection with Central States claim (1.7); emails with R. Kramer and T. Snyder re: same (0.3); emails with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins re: same (0.1); emails with C. McNulty re: same (0.1); emails with B. Olivere and P. Mallos re: same (0.1)	B007	2.30	954.50
07/23/19	BFELD	Draft objections re: fifth and sixth omnibus claim objections (1.4); review exhibits re: same (4.1); participate in call with R. Poppiti and A. Ralph (AlixPartners) re: same (.8); follow-up calls with A. Ralph (.1) and R. Poppiti re: same (.1)	B007	6.50	2,210.00
07/23/19	BFELD	Call with A. Ralph re: Boger Concrete response to notice of satisfaction	B007	0.20	68.00
07/23/19	BFELD	Research re: McCrory and Mosley responses to omnibus claim objections (.4); prepare replies re: same (.2)	B007	0.60	204.00
07/23/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 6th omnibus objection to claims	B007	0.40	114.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 44 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 44 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/23/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of CNO re third objection to claims; upload order; send proposed order and related pleadings to chambers	B007	0.30	85.50
07/23/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 5th omnibus objection to claims	B007	0.40	114.00
07/23/19	BOLIV	Draft CNO re third omnibus objection to claims	B007	0.20	57.00
07/23/19	BOLIV	Send response to second notice of satisfaction of claims to B. Feldman for her review	B007	0.10	28.50
07/23/19	RFPOP	Review comments from DOL to draft proposed stipulation resolving OSHA claims, and email from DOL (Bertha Astorga) and emails to and from M. Neiburg, client (Steve Hawkins), client's OSHA counsel (Bill Myers) and Ken O'Reilly re: same	B007	0.30	187.50
07/23/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from S. Beach, B. Feldman and counsel for Bechtel (Matt Kelsey) re: Bechtel claims	B007	0.10	62.50
07/23/19	RFPOP	Review Boger Construction response to second notice of satisfied claims and scheduled amounts	B007	0.20	125.00
07/23/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft fifth (.4) and sixth (.7) omnibus claims objections, and emails to (.1) and from (.2) and call with (.8) B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph), call with B. Feldman (.1) and review materials from Andrew Ralph (.2) re: same	B007	2.50	1,562.50
07/23/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with M. Kelsey, M. Rosenthal, R. Poppiti, B. Feldman, F. Pometti, A. Ralph and others re: claims and claim objection issues (.4); Review documents re: same (.5)	B007	0.90	706.50
07/23/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with A. Mielke, T. Snyder, P. Mallos, C. McNulty and others re: Central States claim issues	B007	0.50	392.50
07/23/19	SBEAC	Emails with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti and R. Poppiti re: Central States, KEIP and other issues	B007	0.20	157.00
07/24/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Edison re: Beaver Valley claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/24/19	BFELD	Call with M. Kelsey (counsel to Bechtel) re: claim reconciliation	B007	0.10	34.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 45 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Took	Нопре	Amount
<u>Date</u> 07/24/19	BFELD	Email with L. Beslow (counsel to MacAllister Rental) re: resolution of rejection damages claims	Task B007	<u>Hours</u> 0.10	<u>Amount</u> 34.00
07/24/19	BFELD	Call with S. Miller (counsel to various creditors) re: rejection damages resolution	B007	0.40	136.00
07/24/19	BFELD	Emails with claimant re: responses to second and fourth omnibus claim objections	B007	0.30	102.00
07/24/19	BFELD	Emails with claim agent re: claims transferred to surety	B007	0.10	34.00
07/24/19	BOLIV	Circulate order re third omnibus objection to claims	B007	0.10	28.50
07/24/19	MLUNN	Review Boger response to NOS	B007	0.10	74.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Review draft proposed stipulation resolving DOL OSHA claims, and emails to and from client's OSHA counsel (Bill Myers) and Ken O'Reilly and email to and from UST re: same	B007	0.30	187.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Call to M. Neiburg re: settlement agreement resolving Gopher motion for admin claim and related issues and disputes (.3), and review materials in preparation for same (.2)	B007	0.50	312.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman re: responses to second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.30	187.50
07/25/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with B. Feldman, A. Ralph, and S. Cherian re: claims reconciliation	B007	0.40	166.00
07/25/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Kelsey re: common interest agreement in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/25/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Bellner re: Beaver Valley claim (0.1); review documentation provided from counsel in support of same (0.4)	B007	0.50	207.50
07/25/19	BFELD	Participate in advisor call re: claims reconciliation	B007	0.50	170.00
07/25/19	BFELD	Calls with F. Pometti and A. Mielke re: effect of insurance on claims resolution	B007	0.40	136.00
07/25/19	RFPOP	Email from Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: various claims reconciliation issues	B007	0.10	62.50
07/25/19	RFPOP	Email from counsel for RWDY (Brya Keilson) re: second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.10	62.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 46 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/25/19	RFPOP	Emails from A. Mielke and counsel for Beaver Valley (Sally Edison) re: equipment insurance claims	B007	0.10	62.50
07/26/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: contribution analysis in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/26/19	AMIEL	Confer with M. Hofing re: C. States contribution history analysis	B007	0.60	249.00
07/26/19	AMIEL	Review Bechtel's supplemental common interest agreement in connection with C. States claim (0.3); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B007	0.40	166.00
07/26/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Poppiti and M. Neiburg re: notice of claims withdrawal (0.1); draft notice of claim withdrawal (0.3); emails with J. Nigrini re: claim withdrawal (0.1); emails with J. Krzysztofik re: subpoena request in connection with same (0.1)	B007	0.60	249.00
07/26/19	AMIEL	Emails from B. Feldman and M. Neiburg re: claim settlement resolution	B007	0.10	41.50
07/26/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Kramer re: engagement letter and conflict search in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.20	83.00
07/26/19	BFELD	Draft COC re: second omnibus claim objection in light of responses received	B007	0.60	204.00
07/26/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: employee responses to omnibus claim objections	B007	0.20	68.00
07/26/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of withdrawal of proof of claim re [Frederic Kofke]	B007	0.20	57.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Ralph, F. Pometti and A. Mielke re: resolution of Kofke claim	B007	0.20	120.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Nigrini and A. Mielke re: withdrawal of Kofke claim	B007	0.20	120.00
07/26/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from and call from counsel for RWDY (Brya Keilson), email to and from B. Feldman, and emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) re: second omnibus claims objection re: RWDY claim	B007	0.40	250.00
07/26/19	RFPOP	Emails from M. Neiburg, B. Feldman and counsel for Williams (Steve Soule) re: motion to approve settlement agreement with Gopher, and analyze related issues re: same	B007	0.40	250.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 47 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001 Description Date **Initials** Task Hours Amount 07/26/19 **RFPOP** Call with B. Feldman re: various claims B007 0.40 250.00 reconciliation issues (.2), and review related proofs of claim (.2) re: same Emails to and from committee counsel B007 0.30 187.50 07/26/19 **RFPOP** (Joe Mintz) and counsel for DOL (Bertha Astorga) re: draft proposed stipulation resolving DOL OSHA claims, and review comments from Joe Mintz to draft stipulation re: same Emails with A. Mielke re: Central States B007 0.80 628.00 07/26/19 **SBEAC** proof of claim objection issues (.2); Emails with S. Soule and A. Mielke re: Gopher settlement issues (.2); Review documents re: same (.3); Multiple emails with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke and B. Feldman re: opposition brief and motion to compel issues (.1) Emails to and from M. Neiburg, client 07/28/19 **RFPOP** B007 0.10 62.50 (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) re: Williams request for additional detail re: motion to approve settlement agreement with Gopher 07/29/19 **AMIEL** Emails with T. Collins and B. Walters re: B007 0.10 41.50 data room in connection with equipment claim 07/29/19 **AMIEL** Review/revise common interest B007 0.20 83.00 agreement in connection with C. States claim objection Confer with counsel for Sunbelt Rentals 0.40 166.00 07/29/19 **AMIEL** B007 re: mechanics' lien action (0.2); draft

> email summary to counsel re: same (0.2) Confer with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat claim

(0.1); emails with B. Feldman re: same

Email with KCC re: second notice of

satisfaction in light of Boger Concrete

Call with counsel to Barco re: claims

of satisfaction for Ohio CAT affiliate

Confer with A. Mielke re: second notice

07/29/19

07/29/19

07/29/19

07/29/19

AMIEL

BFELD

BFELD

BFELD

(0.1)

response

reconciliation

B007

B007

B007

B007

83.00

34.00

34.00

68.00

0.20

0.10

0.10

Filed 08/21/19 Page 48 of 102

Thereice Date: August 12, 2019

50007805 Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. 076850.1001 Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/29/19	BFELD	Draft COC re: fourth omnibus claim objection (.2); revise COC re: second omnibus claim objection (.2); review and revise exhibits re: second and fourth omnibus claim objections in light of responses received from claimants (.8); finalize same for filing (.2)	B007	1.40	476.00
07/29/19	BFELD	Emails with counsel to CFSC re: claims reconciliation	B007-	0.10	34.00
07/29/19	BWALT	Emails with A. Mielke (.1); emails with M. Fratticci, confer with Ml Fratticci (.2); set-up access to Beaver Valley Claim data room for T. Collins (.3)	B007	0.60	177.00
07/29/19	BWALT	File certification of counsel regarding order sustaining second omnibus substantive claims objection, upload order and exhibits, and submit to Court	B007	1.20	354.00
07/29/19	RFPOP	Call with M. Neiburg, B. Feldman, client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: Williams request for additional detail re: motion to approve settlement agreement with Gopher (.6), and review Williams commitment letter materials and pleadings (1.1) re: same	B007	1.70	1,062.50
07/29/19	RFPOP	Email from B. Feldman re: second notice of satisfied claims and scheduled amounts re: Northern Ohio Peterbilt	B007	0.10	62.50
07/29/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft-proposed certifications of counsel and draft revised proposed orders for second and fourth omnibus claims objections, and emails to and from B. Feldman re: same	B007	0.50	312.50
07/29/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and counsel for RWDY (Brya Keilson) and from Brya Keilson re: limited objection to second omnibus claims objection, and review objection re: same	B007	0.30	187.50
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: surety claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/30/19	AMIEL	Revise common interest agreement in connection with C. States claim (0.2); send to F. Pometti for review (0.1)	B007	0.30	124.50
07/30/19	BFELD	Call with counsel to Barco re: claims reconciliation	B007	0.10	34.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Revise COC re: fourth omnibus claim objection (.2); finalize same for filing (.4)	B007	0.60	204.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Call with A. Ralph re: revisions to second omnibus claim objection exhibits	B007	0.10	34.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 49 of 102 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/30/19	CCORA	Email from and to claims agent re: service of Order Sustaining Second Omnibus (Substantive) Objection to Claims		0.10	28.50
07/30/19	CCORA	Prepare and file Certification of Counsel re: Fourth Omnibus (Substantive) Objection to Claims	B007	0.40	114.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Email to and from counsel for Gopher (Jenna Slocum) (.2), emails to and from counsel for Williams (Steve Soule and Luke Murley) (.3), emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) (.3), and call from Luke Murley (.1) re: motion to approve settlement agreement with Gopher	B007	0.90	562.50
07/30/19	RFPOP	Email to and from B. Feldman re: adjourned responses to second and fourth omnibus claims objections	B007	0.10	62.50
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails with P. Mallos re: common interest agreement in connection with C. States claim (0.1); compile OCP agreement with signature page (0.1)	B007	0.20	83.00
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Poppiti re: Express 4x4 administrative claim	B007	0.10	41.50
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: signature pages to the OCP and common interest agreements	B007	0.10	41.50
07/31/19	BWALT	Coordinate service of order sustaining fourth omnibus claims objection, and confirm with C. Corazza the service of the order sustaining second omnibus claims objection	B007	0.20	59.00
07/31/19	KENOS	Call with Committee Counsel re: EPS Claim (.3) and follow up meeting with K. Guerke and T. Pakrouh re: same (.2)	B007	0.50	322.50
07/31/19	KENOS	Review documentation/analysis re: EPS Claim and meet with K. Guerke re: preparations for Committee Call	B007	0.80	516.00
07/31/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke and B. Feldman re: proposed settlement agreement with Ohio CAT	B007	0.10	62.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 50 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/31/19	RFPOP	Emails to (.2) and from (.2) B. Feldman, Zolfo (Frank Pometti), counsel for TransCanada (Charles Kelley), counsel for Gopher (Vanessa Power), and counsel for Williams (Luke Murley) re: proposed resolution of Williams informal response to motion to approve Gopher settlement agreement	B007	0.40	250.00
07/01/19	AMIEL	Draft agenda for committee call (0.1); confer with R. Poppiti re: same (0.1); emails with M. Lunn, S. Beach, and F. Pometti re: same (0.1)	B008	0.30	124.50
07/01/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: misc. open case issues	B008	0.50	207.50
07/01/19	JMULV	Meeting with Williams litigation team recase strategy	B008	0.70	322.00
07/01/19	MLUNN	Review proposed agenda re: committee update call	B008	0.10	74.50
07/01/19	SBEAC	Review and revise committee call agenda	B008	0.10	78.50
07/02/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: misc. open case issues	B008	2.00	830.00
07/02/19	AMIEL	Confer with committee advisors (J. Lucian and Teneo team, M. Lunn, S. Beach, and R. Poppiti re: misc. case issues (0.4); Follow up M. Lunn, S. Beach, and F. Pometti re: same (0.2)	B008	0.60	249.00
07/02/19	MLUNN	Update call with UCC and related follow- up with S. Beach, A. Mielke, and F. Pometti	B008	0.70	521.50
07/02/19	MLUNN	Board update call	B008	1.00	745.00
07/02/19	MLUNN	Call with Blank Rome and Gibson Dunn re: claims investigation and related issues and related follow-up with S. Beach and R. Poppiti	B008	1.30	968.50
07/02/19	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph), committee counsel (John Lucian and Joe Mintz) and Teneo re: case update	B008	0.40	250.00
07/02/19	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, client (Steve Hawkins and Dean McDowell), Zolfo (Frank Pometti) and board re: sale and case update	B008	1.00	625.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Page 51 of 102 August 12, 2019 Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/02/19	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins re: plan strategy issues and TC Energy closeout issues (.4); Attend call with Committee and Debtor advisors (.4); Followup meeting with M. Lunn and B. Feldman re: same (.3); Review Board Dec and other materials in preparation for board meeting (.6); Attend board update call re: sale (1.0); Attend call and followup meeting with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, J. Lucian, J. Mintz, M. Lunn and R. Poppiti re: committee investigation (1.3); Emails with C. Kelley, A. Elkhoury, R. Poppiti and F. Pometti re: Gopher issues (.2); Review documents re: same (.4)	B008	4.60	3,611.00
07/03/19	PKRAM	Meeting with K. Guerke re: retention of consultant	B008	0.50	265.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach and M. Kelsey re: misc. open case matters	B008	0.60	249.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman re: misc. open case issues	B008	0.20	83.00
07/08/19	MLUNN	Meeting with S. Beach and R. Poppiti re: various issues, including plan and committee investigation	B008	0.80	596.00
07/08/19	RFPOP	Meet with S. Beach and M. Lunn re: committee investigation and plan and disclosure statement issues	B008	0.80	500.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Draft agenda for advisor call (0.1); confer with S. Beach re: same (0.1); confer with R. Poppiti re: same (0.1)	B008	0.30	124.50
07/09/19	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph), committee counsel (John Lucian and Joe Mintz), and Teneo re: case update	B008	0.80	500.00
07/09/19	SBEAC	Attend advisor strategy call (.7); Preparation re: same (.4)	B008	1.10	863.50
07/09/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Advisor Call	B008	0.10	78.50
07/09/19	SBEAC	Call with M. Kelsey re: UCC investigation and central states claim	B008	0.30	235.50
07/09/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and M. Lunn re: Advisor Call Agenda (.1); Review and revise same (.3)	B008	0.40	314.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Call with F. Pometti re: case strategy issues	B008	0.20	157.00
07/11/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach, F. Pometti and D. McDowell re: misc. open case issues	B008	1.00	415.00

Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 52 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date:	August 12, 2019

Welded Construction, L.P.

07/16/19

SBEAC

50007805 Invoice Number: 076850.1001 Matter Number: **Initials Description** Task Hours Amount **Date** 07/11/19 Teleconference with S. Beach, B. B008 1.00 415.00 **AMIEL** Feldman, F. Pometti, R. Wondwosen, and S. Hawkins re: misc. open matters 408.00 Participate in advisor call with YCST and B008 1.20 07/11/19 **BFELD** AlixPartners re: various workstreams Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, B008 1.10 687.50 07/11/19 **RFPOP** B. Feldman, client (Steve Hawkins and Dean McDowell), and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) re: case update and upcoming deadlines and tasks Calls with F. Pometti re: case strategy 471.00 07/11/19 **SBEAC** B008 0.60 issues 07/11/19 **SBEAC** Call with S. Hawkins re: litigation and B008 0.30 235.50 case strategy issues **SBEAC** Attend call with K. Cushing and J. Carol B008 0.30 235.50 07/11/19 re: Ohio Cat Global Settlement Attend Welded advisor call with YCST, B008 1.00 400.00 07/11/19 **TPAKR** AlixPartners, and the client re: misc. open case issues (1.0) Call to S. Hawkins re: employee and B008 0.10 78.50 07/12/19 **SBEAC** witness issues B008 0.50 392.50 07/12/19 **SBEAC** Email with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, A. Ralph, R. Wondwosen, and R. Poppiti re: Proposed TC Energy Meeting Agenda (.2); Call with S. Hawkins re same (.3) Draft agenda for weekly committee B008 41.50 07/15/19 **AMIEL** 0.10teleconference re: misc. case issues 07/15/19 **SBEAC** Call with F. Pometti re: TC Energy, B008 0.40 314.00 Williams, Earth Pipeline and Sunoco issues 539.50 07/16/19 **AMIEL** Teleconference with S. Beach, F. Pometti, B008 1.30 J. Lucian, and M. Schaedle re: misc. open case issues (0.7); follow up with S. Beach re: same (0.5); email agenda to participants re: same (0.1) 07/16/19 **AMIEL** Emails with S. Beach, M. Lunn, R. B008 0.20 83.00 Poppiti, E. Edwards, M. Neiburg, T. Buchanan, J. Mulvihill, T. Pakrouh, and B. Feldman re: meeting to discuss misc. open case issues 07/16/19 **MLUNN** Call with S. Beach and S. Hawkins re: B008 0.40 298.00 various claim issues and case strategy 07/16/19 **MNEIB** Emails with A. Mielke re: case strategy B008 0.10 -60.00 meeting

Attend Advisor call with committee and

debtor professionals (.6); Prepare for

meeting re: same (.2)

B008

0.80

Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 53 of 102
------------------	-----------	----------------	----------------

f 102 August 12, 2019 50007805 Invoice Date: Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/16/19	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins re: case strategy issues.	B008	0.30	235.50
07/16/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: advisor call	B008	0.10	78.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with B. Feldman, M. Lunn, S. Beach, F. Pometti, and A. Ralph re: misc. open case matters	B008	0.40	166.00
07/18/19	AMIEL	Meeting with S. Beach, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: misc. open case matters	B008	1.70	705.50
07/18/19	BFELD	Meeting with S. Beach, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, A. Mielke, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: miscellaneous open case matters	B008	1.70	578.00
07/18/19	EEDWA	Meeting with S. Beach, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, A. Mielke, T. Pakrouh, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: miscellaneous open case matters	B008	1.70	1,113.50
07/18/19	JMULV	Prepare for and attend YCST team meeting	B008	1.00	460.00
07/18/19	MLUNN	Update call with company and advisors	B008	0.50	372.50
07/18/19	MNEIB	Meeting (partial attendance) w/ S. Beach, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: misc. open case matters	B008	1.10	660.00
07/18/19	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, E. Edwards and YCST team re: case update and strategy and upcoming deadlines and tasks	B008	1.70	1,062.50
07/18/19	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, B. Feldman, client (Steve Hawkins and Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) re: case update and strategy and coming deadlines and tasks	B008	0.50	312.50
07/18/19	SBEAC	Meeting with A. Mielke, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: miscellaneous open case matters	B008	1.70	1,334.50
07/18/19	SBEAC	Attend advisor call with debtor and professionals	B008	0.50	392.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 54 of 102 August 12, 2019

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/18/19	TBUCH	Meeting w/S. Beach, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: misc. open case matters	B008	1.70	<u>Amount</u> 901.00
07/18/19	TPAKR	Meeting w/ S. Beach, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, A. Mielke, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: misc. open case matters (1.7)	B008	1.70	680.00
07/18/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with A. Mielke, B. Feldman, and S. Beach re: advisor call	B008	0.10	40.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Poppiti and M. Lunn re: committee meeting (0.1); draft agenda in preparation for same (0.1)	B008	0.20	83.00
07/30/19	BFELD	Meeting with M. Neiburg, R. Poppiti, E. Edwards, K. Guerke, and J. Mulvihill recommittee diligence requests and related document review	B008	0.60	204.00
07/30/19	JMULV	Attend document review meeting	B008	0.80	368.00
07/30/19	MLUNN	Review proposed agenda and status of open items re: UCC call and related correspondence with YCST team	B008	0.20	149.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Meeting with B. Feldman, E. Edwards, K. Guerke, J. Mulvihill and R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence requests and related issues	B008	0.50	300.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Meet with E. Edwards, M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, J. Mulvihill and B. Feldman re: committee informal discovery in connection with committee investigation (.5), and review materials in preparation for same (.2)	B008	0.70	437.50
07/05/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: motions for relief from stay (.1); confer with D. Candeub re: motions for relief from stay (.1); review motions for relief from stay (.2)	B009	0.40	166.00
07/05/19	RFPOP	Email from S. Beach re: anticipated Sunbelt stay relief motion	B009-	0.10	62.50
07/05/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and D. Candueb re: lien claim and stay relief issues (.2); Review documents re: same (.3)	B009	0.50	392.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Review proposed motions in connection with motions for stay relief (0.3); confer with R. Poppiti re: same (0.1)	B009	0.40	166.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 55 of 102 August 12, 2019

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/08/19	RFPOP	Review Sunbelt and T&C stay relief motions (3x), and email to and from A. Mielke re: same	B009	0.40	250.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with D. Candeub re: motions for relief from stay	B009	0.10	41.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails from A. Elkhoury and D. Candeub re: motions for relief from stay (0.1); review/revise proposed orders in connection with same (0.3)	B009	0.40	166.00
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: motions for relief from stay	B009	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Emails with counsel for Sunbelt rentals in connection with request for relief from stay (0.1); confer with D. Candeub re: same (0.1); confer with B. Olivere re: same (0.1); review agenda in connection with same (0.1)	B009	0.40	166.00
07/11/19	AMIEL	Review agenda for second hearing (T&C Rentals) in connection with motion for relief from stay	B009	0.10	41.50
07/11/19	AMIEL	Review proposed orders in connection with T&C Rentals' request for relief from stay	B009	0.10	41.50
07/12/19	RFPOP	Email from counsel for subcontractor (Evan Miller) re: request for relief from stay	B009	0.10	62.50
07/18/19	RFPOP	Email from client (Jackie Krzysztofik) re: Jeremy Keith stay relief motion	B009	0.10	62.50
07/19/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Poppiti re: Keith motion for stay relief (0.2); emails from R. Poppiti and J. Mintz re: same (0.2)	B009	0.40	166.00
07/19/19	RFPOP	Meet with A. Mielke re: Kofke subpoena	B009	0.30	187.50
07/19/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Dean McDowell and Jackie Krzysztofik) (.1), call with A. Mielke and counsel for Jeremy Keith (Mark Million and Michael Fiorillo) (.2), call from committee counsel (Joe Mintz) (.3), call to PA Human Relations Commission (.1) and emails to and from Mark Billion and Joe Mintz (.2) re: Jeremy Keith stay relief motion, and review materials from Jackie Krzysztofik (.3) re: same	B009	1.20	750.00
07/23/19	RFPOP	Call with counsel for Kofke (Jay Nigrini) (.2) and call with A. Mielke (.1) re: subpoena from Kofke in connection with non-bankruptcy litigation	B009	0.30	187.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 56 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

		Matter N	umber:		0/6850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/23/19	RFPOP	Call to and emails to and from counsel for Jeremy Keith (Mark Billion) (.1) and call to PA Human Relations Commission (Jeffrey Hoover) (.2) re: Jeremy Keith stay relief motion	B009	0.30	187.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Call with and email to and from counsel for Jeremy Keith (Mark Billion) re: proposed resolution of Jeremy Keith stay relief motion	B009	0.40	250.00
07/26/19	RFPOP	Call to counsel for subcontractor (Evan Miller) re: request for stay relief	B009	0.20	125.00
07/26/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke, Zolfo (Frank Pometti) and counsel for Kofke (Jay Nigrini) re: subpoena from Kofke in connection with non-bankruptcy litigation, and review draft proposed notice of withdrawal of related proof of claim re: same	B009	0.40	250.00
07/29/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke re: subpoena from Kofke in connection with non-bankruptcy litigation, and review proposed production re: same	B009	0.40	250.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Neiburg and A. Mielke re: subpoena from Kofke in connection with non-bankruptcy litigation	B009	0.20	125.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from A. Mielke and counsel for Bechtel (Michael Rosenthal) re: Sunbelt litigation	B009	0.20	125.00
07/01/19	AMIEL	Confer with counsel for F. Kofke re: subpoena	B011	0.20	83.00
07/01/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Horan and M. Neiburg re: Schmid lien enforcement action	B011	0.10	41.50
07/01/19	AMIEL	Confer with M. Neiburg re: strategy for responding to subpoena	B011	0.10	41.50
07/01/19	BFELD	Participate in meeting with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, J. Mulvihill, and A. Mielke re: responsive pleadings in Williams adversary(.6); follow-up emails with YCST team re: memo on same (.2)	B011	0.80	272.00
07/01/19	BOLIV	Draft notice of service re Welded Construction's first set of requests for production of documents from Prime NDT Services	B011	0.20	57.00
07/01/19	BOLIV	Circulate order re confidentiality stipulation and protective order	B011	0.10	28.50
07/01/19	BOLIV	Review stipulation and protective order for content	B011	0.20	57.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 57 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 076850.1001 Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/01/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of Notice of Service re Welded's first set of requests for production of documents to Prime NDT	B011	0.20	57.00
07/01/19	EEDWA	Review draft notice of service of Plaintiffs' first document request (.1); telephone to M. Heyden re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	131.00
07/01/19	SBEAC	Review order approving Prime NDT confidentiality agreement and related documents	B011	0.10	78.50
07/02/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: Schmid lien enforcement action	B011	0.20	83.00
07/02/19	BOLIV	Respond to email inquiry re deadline for Welded to respond to Prime's first set of requests for documents	B011	0.10	28.50
07/02/19	EEDWA	Emails with/telephone to S. Beach (.1); emails with M. Heyden re: scheduling oral argument (.1); teleconference with S. Scruzzi (x2) re: same (.2)	B011	0.40	262.00
07/02/19	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, committee counsel (John Lucian and Joe Mintz) and counsel for Bechtel (Michael Rosenthal and Matt Kelsey) re: committee investigation (.8), and follow-up meeting with S. Beach and M. Lunn (.5) re: same	B011	1.30	812.50
07/02/19	SBEAC	Emails with E. Edwards re: Prime litigation strategy	B011	0.10	78.50
07/03/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Scaruzzi and E. Edwards re: scheduling oral argument for Prime NDT litigation (.1); confer with S. Scaruzzi re: same (.2)	B011	0.30	124.50
07/03/19	EEDWA	Telephone from S. Beach re: status (.1); emails with M. Heyden re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	131.00
07/03/19	MLUNN	Review Williams motion to dismiss/transfer venue / abstention	B011	0.60	447.00
07/03/19	SBEAC	Call with E. Edwards re: Prime NDT issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.5); Draft notes re: litigation strategy re: same (.4); Review reimbursement issues re: same (.1)	B011	1.10	863.50
07/05/19	BFELD	Review motion to dismiss re: Williams adversary	B011	0.50	170.00
07/06/19	RFPOP	Email to M. Neiburg and B. Feldman re: committee investigation	B011	0.10	62.50
07/07/19	JMULV	Review motion to dismiss	B011	3.10	1,426.00

	Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 58 of 102
Welded Construction	, L.P.		Invoice Date:	August 12, 2019
			Invoice Number:	50007805
			Matter Number:	076850.1001

Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/08/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Nigrini and M. Neiburg resubpoena	B011	0.10	41.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Draft quarterly status report in connection with Brunner litigation (0.7); emails to B. Olivere and M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	B011	0.80	332.00
07/08/19	BFELD	Participate in planning meeting with M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Buchanan, A. Mielke, and J. Mulvihill re: response to Williams reply brief	B011	0.60	204.00
07/08/19	BFELD	Participate in meeting with R. Poppiti and M. Neiburg re: upcoming discovery for Committee diligence	B011	0.20	68.00
07/08/19	BOLIV	Prepares quarterly status report [Assad Brunner v. Welded Construction] for filing via federal express to the US District Court for the Middle District of PA; federal express service to D. Horowitz of Swartz Swidler LLC; prepare original and one copy for return service of same		0.90	256.50
07/08/19	EEDWA	Telephone from S. Scarruzi re: scheduling oral argument (.1); emails with M. Heyden re: same (.1); meet with S. Beach re: same (.2); email to J. Lucian and J. Mintz re: same (.1); emails with S. Hawkin, F. Pometti, and S. Beach re: same (.1)	B011	0.60	393.00
07/08/19	JMULV	Draft response to motion to dismiss	B011	2.30	1,058.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: Kofke subpoena	B011	0.10	60.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Emails with R. Poppiti, S. Hawkins, and K. O'Reilly re: OSHA issues	B011	0.30	180.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: Transco motion to compel	B011	0.20	120.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Review draft quarterly status report for MD Pa action (.1); emails with A. Mielke re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	120.00
07/08/19	RFPOP	Meet with M. Neiburg (.2), meet with B. Feldman (.2), and email to client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) (.3) re: informal discovery from committee in connection with committee investigation		0.70	437.50
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with M. Neiburg, R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, B. Feldman, and M. Lunn re: UCC investigation (.1); Review documents re: same (.2)	B011	0.30	235.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 59 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 50007805 Invoice Number: Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Nigrini re: subpoena	B011	0.10	41.50
07/09/19	BFELD	Meeting with M. Neiburg, S. Beach, T. Buchanan, and A. Mielke re: response planning for Williams motion to compel and request for adequate protection in light of adversary proceeding	B011	1.20	408.00
07/09/19	EEDWA	Draft responses and objections to Prime's discovery requests	B011	3.10	2,030.50
07/09/19	MLUNN	Working with R. Poppiti re: Williams motion to compel and adequate protection issues	B011	.0.30	223.50
07/09/19	MLUNN	Review motion to compel and motion for adequate protection filed by Williams	B011	0.80	596.00
07/09/19	MNEIB	Email from J. Nigrini re: Kofke subpoena	B011	0.10	60.00
07/09/19	MNEIB	Discussion with R. Poppiti re: OSHA issues	B011	0.40	240.00
07/09/19	MNEIB	Analysis re: Transco motion to compel and motion for adequate assurance	B011	1.20	720.00
07/09/19	MNEIB	Call with B. Myers, R. Poppiti, K. O'Reilly and S. Hawkins re: OSHA issues	B011	0.50	300.00
07/09/19	MNEIB	Review draft agreement re: OSHA claims	B011	0.30	180.00
07/10/19	AMIEL	Confer with M. Neiburg re: subpoena response (0.1); teleconference with M. Neiburg and J. Nigrini re: same (0.2); follow up with Neiburg re: same (0.1); follow up with J. Krztofik re: same (0.1)	B011	0.50	207.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails with D. McDowell re: response to subpoena	B011	0.10	41.50
07/10/19	BFELD	Draft stipulation and order re: briefing schedule in Williams adversary proceeding	B011	1.00	340.00
07/10/19	BFELD	Emails with YCST team re: opposition brief to Williams motion to dismiss	B011	0.20	68.00
07/10/19	BOLIV	Call with E. Edwards re binder preparations for oral argument in Prime NDT	B011	0.10	28.50
07/10/19	BOLIV	Review Prime NDT's motion to dismiss, our objection and Prime's response to identify all research citations in anticipation of preparing research binder	B011	0.40	114.00
07/10/19	BOLIV	Westlaw research for all citations found in Prime NDT's motion to dismiss	B011	1.90	541.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 60 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/10/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman and A. Ralph re: post-petition reconciliation related to motion to compel	B011	0.20	120.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Emails with D. McDowell and A. Mielke re: Kofke subpoena and related issues	B011	0.20	120.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Discussion with A. Mielke re: Kofke subpoena (.2); call with counsel to Kofke and A. Mielke re: subpoena (.2)	B011	0.40	240.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Discussion with A. Mielke re: Kofke subpoena (.2); call with A. Mielke and plaintiff's counsel re: Kofke subpoena (.3)	B011	0.50	300.00
07/10/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: informal discovery in connection with committee investigation	B011	0.10	62.50
07/11/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, D. McDowell, and F. Pometti re: Committee diligence (.7) follow-up meeting with R. Poppiti and M. Neiburg re: same (.1); follow-up research re: email addresses for discovery (.4); emails with YCST ediscovery team re: same (.1)	B011	1.30	442.00
07/11/19	BFELD	Finalize for filing re: stipulation with Williams on briefing schedule	B011	0.10	34.00
07/11/19	BOLIV	Research for all citations found in reply in support of motion to dismiss	B011	0.30	85.50
07/11/19	BOLIV	Westlaw research for all citations found in debtors opposition to motion to dismiss	B011	0.90	256.50
07/11/19	BOLIV	Review docket of middle district of PA re Assad Brunner for status report sent via fed ex for docketing; download as filed version and circulate	B011	0.20	57.00
07/11/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Olivere re: status report for MD Pa action	B011	0.10	60.00
07/11/19	MNEIB	Email from R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence issues	B011	0.10	60.00
07/11/19	RFPOP	Call with (.7) and emails to and from (.2) M. Neiburg, B. Feldman, client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti), meet with M. Neiburg and B. Feldman (.1), and email to committee counsel (John Lucian and Joe Mintz) (.2) re: informal discovery issues re: committee investigation	B011	1.20	750.00
07/11/19	SBEAC	Call with R. Poppiti re: UCC investigation issues	B011	0.10	78.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 61 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

-		17101001 1	tuilloci.		070050.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/11/19	SBEAC	Email with R. Poppiti re: Committee Diligence/Information Requests (.1); Review documents re: same (.5)	B011	0.60	471.00
07/12/19	BFELD	Call with T. Buchanan, M. Neiburg, A. Ralph and N. Jabin (AlixPartners), and D. McDowell re: Count X of Transco complaint	B011	0.40	136.00
07/12/19	BOLIV	Assemble, review, revise binder of all citations found in motion to dismiss, objection and reply in support of motion to dismiss for E. Edwards	B011	1.80	513.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Call with R. Poppiti re: Gopher and UCC investigation issues	B011	0.10	78.50
07/15/19	AMIEL	Review pleadings in connection with transfer of Earth Pipeline Services litigation	B011	0.20	83.00
07/15/19	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards and M. Heyden re: notice of hearing on Prime NTD matter	B011	0.10	41.50
07/15/19	BFELD	Confer with A. Mielke re: Earth Pipeline adversary proceeding transferred to Bankr. D. Del.	B011	0.10	34.00
07/15/19	BOLIV	Download and circulate all West Virginia pleadings submitted to DE for change of venue per order from West Virginia court re Earth Pipeline Services litigation	B011	0.30	85.50
07/15/19	MNEIB	Email from R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence requests	B011	0.10	60.00
07/15/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and T. Pakrouh recommon interest issues	B011	0.20	120.00
07/15/19	MNEIB	Emails from A. Mielke re: transfer of Earth Pipeline action to bankruptcy court	B011	0.10	60.00
07/15/19	MNEIB	Email from J. Moan re: data storage issues	B011	0.10	60.00
07/15/19	RFPOP	Email to and from committee counsel (Joe Mintz), discussion with M. Neiburg, email to and from S. Beach, and email to and from counsel for Bechtel (Michael Rosenthal) re: committee investigation issues	B011	0.20	125.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal re: Supplemental Questions from UCC (.1); Review documents re: same (.2); Emails with R. Poppiti re: Welded response to UCC discovery requests (.1)	B011	0.40	314.00
07/15/19	SBEAC	Call with M. Rosenthal re: UCC investigation and Central States claim	B011	0.20	157.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 62 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/15/19	SBEAC	Call with R. Poppiti re: common interest and UCC discovery	B011	0.10	78.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails from S. Beach and R. Poppiti re: committee investigation	B011	0.10	41.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Email to A. Elkhoury and C. Kelley re: Earth Pipeline Services pleadings	B011	0.10	41.50
07/16/19	EEDWA	Emails with K. O'Reilly and T. Pakrouh re: objections to Prime's first request for production	B011	0.20	131.00
07/16/19	MFRAT	Correspondences with iDS regarding terminating the hosted data contract; delete data from iDS network	B011	0.20	35.00
07/16/19	MNEIB	Emails with R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence requests	B011	0.20	120.00
07/16/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from S. Beach and M. Neiburg re: informal discovery issues re: committee investigation	B011	0.20	125.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Review Prime NDT issues re: fee reimbursement and oral argument	B011	0.30	235.50
07/16/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and R. Poppiti re: Committee Diligence/Information Requests (.1); Review documents re: same (.3)	B011	0.40	314.00
07/16/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with E. Edwards re: Debtors' response to Prime's RFPS	B011	0.10	40.00
07/17/19	AMIEL	Email from C. Kelley re: Earth Pipeline pleadings	B011	0.10	41.50
07/17/19	BFELD	Emails with M. Neiburg, M. Fratticci and J. Moan (Welded) re: e-discovery for committee diligence	B011	0.30	102.00
07/17/19	BOLIV	Circulate notice of oral argument to E. Edwards re Prime NDT	B011	0.10	28.50
07/17/19	MFRAT	Downloaded produced data from vendor iDS ftp site	B011	0.30	52.50
07/17/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman re: e-discovery vendor and related issues	B011	0.20	120.00
07/17/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Ralph, T. Buchanan and B. Feldman re: Transco motion to compel	B01-1	0.20	120.00
07/17/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman and J. Moan re: data collection issues	B011	0.20	120.00
07/17/19	MNEIB	Emails with D. McDowell and R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence requests	B011	0.20	120.00
07/17/19	MNEIB	Emails and call with J. Lucian and R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence requests	B011	0.40	240.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 63 of 102 August 12, 2019 50007805 Invoice Number: Matter Number: 076850.1001

		Iviatio 1	vuiiioci.		070830.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/17/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Neiburg, B. Feldman and client (Dean McDowell) (.3) and call with M. Neiburg and committee counsel (Joe Mintz) (.2) re: informal discovery re: committee investigation	B011	0.50	312.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: employment records in connection with subpoena response	B011	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: Earth Pipeline Services lien enforcement action pleadings	B011	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Poppiti re: Kofke subpoena response	B011	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti and R. Wondwosen re: lien actions	B011	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	EEDWA	Prepare for call with K. O'Reilly re: case planning and discovery objections (.4); teleconference with K. O'Reilly and T. Pakrouh re: same (1.5)	B011	1.90	1,244.50
07/18/19	SBEAC	Review common interest agreement with Bechtel (.2); Emails with A. Mielke, M. Rosenthal and M. Kelsey re: same (.2)	B011	0.40	314.00
07/18/19	TPAKR	Attend call and E. Edwards and K. O'Reilly re: Debtors' response to Prime's RFPs (1.5); confer with E. Edwards re: same (.2)	B011	1.70	680.00
07/18/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with E. Edwards re: revisions to Debtors responses to Prime's RFPs	B011	0.20	80.00
07/18/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with E. Edwards re: K. O'Reilly's comments to Debtors response to Prime's RFPs	B011	0.10	40.00
07/19/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Poppiti and J. Nigrini re: deadline to respond to subpoena	B011	0.10	41.50
07/19/19	AMIEL	Review Earth Pipeline Services diligence information (0.8); draft summary of same in preparation for meeting (0.4); review docket in connection with same (0.4); confer with D. Laskin and B. Olivere re: same (0.3); confer with K. Enos re: same (0.1); confer with T. Pakrouh re: same (0.3)	B011	2.30	954.50
07/19/19	AMIEL	Emails with K. Enos and S. Beach re: Earth Pipeline Services in connection with lien enforcement action	B011	0.10	41.50
07/19/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach, K. Guerke, and K. Enos re: mechanics' lien litigation	B011	0.50	207.50

 Case 18-12378-KG
 Doc 957-2
 Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:
 Page 64 of 102 August 12, 2019

 Welded Construction, L.P.
 Invoice Date:
 August 12, 2019

 Invoice Number:
 50007805

 Matter Number:
 076850.1001

		Widter	vullioci.	070030.1001	
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/19/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Poppiti re: Kofke subpoena	B011	0.30	124.50
07/19/19	BFELD	Meet with M. Fratticci re: committee diligence document review (.2); call with M. Fratticci, J. Moan and D. McDowell (Welded) re: document production for same (.5)	B011	0.70	238.00
07/19/19	EEDWA	Multiple emails with T Pakrouh and K. O'Reilly re: objections to Prime's first request for production	B011	0.20	131.00
07/19/19	KGUER	Review Earth Pipeline claim summary, POC, and contract documents	B011	0.50	362.50
07/19/19	MFRAT	Meeting with B. Feldman re: data collection; teleconference with client IT Tech person to coordinate data collection	B011	0.50	87.50
07/19/19	MLUNN	Meeting with R. Poppiti (.1); and call with M. Rosenthal re: UCC investigation and documents (.4)	B011	0.50	372.50
07/19/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Nigrini and A. Mielke re: Kofke subpoena	B011	0.20	120.00
07/19/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman re: e-discovery issues	B011	0.20	120.00
07/19/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from (.1) and call with (.4) M. Lunn and counsel for Bechtel (Michael Rosenthal and Shireen Barday) re: informal discovery issues re: committee investigation	B011	0.50	312.50
07/19/19	SBEAC	Emails with R. Poppiti re: committee investigation issues	B011	0.10	78.50
07/19/19	TPAKR	Confer with A. Mielke re: Earth Services issues (.2); correspondence with A. Mielke re: same (.1)	B011	0.30	120.00
07/19/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with K. O'Reilly and E. Edwards re: responses to Prime's RFPS	B011	0.20	80.00
07/20/19	KGUER	Emails with S. Beach and M. Rosenthal re: consulting agreement	B011	0.10	72.50
07/20/19	KGUER	Review draft answering brief re: motion to dismiss	B011	1.00	725.00
07/20/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with S. Beach re: EPS claim	B011	0.10	72.50
07/21/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg and S. Beach re: edits/comments to draft answering brief	B011	0.20	145.00
07/21/19	KGUER	Review opening brief on motion to dismiss. (1.0); review and draft redline edits to draft answering brief. (3.3)	B011	4.30	3,117.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 65 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/21/19	TPAKR	Review, revise and draft debtors' response to Prime's RFPS	B011	1.60	640.00
07/22/19	EEDWA	Emails with T. Pakrouh and K. O'Reilly re: objections to Prime's first document requests	B011	0.60	393.00
07/22/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with litigation team re: background	B011	0.10	72.50
07/22/19	TPAKR	Review, revise and draft debtors' response to Prime's RFPs (2.4); correspondence with E. Edwards and K. O'Reilly re: revisions to same (.2)	B011	2.60	1,040.00
07/22/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with K. Guerke and K. Enos re: earth services	B011	0.10	40.00
07/23/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Poppiti re: Kofke subpoena response	B011	0.10	41.50
07/23/19	AMIEL	Call with R. Poppiti and counsel for Kofke re: subpoena response	B011	0.20	83.00
07/23/19	EEDWA	Review and revise objections to Prime's first document requests (.8); emails with T. Pakrouh and K. O'Reilly re: same (.2); review/revise draft transmittal letter (.2); draft letter to Prime NTD re: fees and expenses for Motion to Compel Escrow Payment (.2)	B011	1.40	917.00
07/23/19	MNEIB	Review revised draft stipulation with OSHA (.2); emails with R. Poppiti and S. Hawkins re: same (.2)	B011	0.40	240.00
07/23/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with E. Edwards and K. O'Reilly re: revisions to Debtors' responses to Prime's RFPS (.2); revise accordingly (1.0);	B011	1.20	480.00
07/23/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with E. Edwards re: drafting Prime transmittal letter (.1); draft same (.5); correspondence with E. Edwards re: revisions to same (.1); revise accordingly (.2)	B011	0.90	360.00
07/23/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with B. Olivere re: drafting NOS for Debtors response to Prime's RFPS	B011	0.10	40.00
07/24/19	BFELD	Emails with J. Moan (Welded) and M. Fratticci re: committee diligence requests	B011	0.20	68.00
07/24/19	BOLIV	Review draft Objections and Responses to Defendant Prime NDT Services, Inc.s First Set of Requests for Production of Documents	B011	0.20	57.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 66 of 102 August 12, 2019

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/24/19	BOLIV	Draft notice of service for objection/response to Prime NDT's first set of requests for production of documents	B011	0.20	57.00
07/24/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of Notice of Service	B011	0.20	57.00
07/24/19	EEDWA	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: finalizing objections to RFPs and transmittal to Prime	B011	0.10	65.50
07/24/19	MFRAT	Committee Diligence - correspondence with B. Feldman and S. Woolsey re: 1TB encrypted hard drive to send to client for data collection	B011	0.20	35.00
07/24/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Myers, R. Poppiti and K. O'Reilly re: OSHA stipulation	B011	0.20	120.00
07/24/19	MNEIB	Emails with M. Fratticci, B. Feldman and R. Poppiti re: data collection and processing issues	B011	0.40	240.00
07/24/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Neiburg and B. Feldman re: committee informal discovery re: committee investigation	B011	0.20	125.00
07/24/19	SBEAC	Review response and objection to discovery requests re: Prime NDT litigation	B011	0.30	235.50
07/24/19	TPAKR	Coordinate transmission of discovery documents to Prime's counsel	B011	0.20	80.00
07/24/19	TPAKR	Confer with K. Enos re: Earth Pipeline Services issues (.2); correspondence with K. Enos re: same (.1)	B011	0.30	120.00
07/24/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with E. Edwards re: revisions to discovery documents (.1); incorporate E. Edwards's revisions to same (.4); correspondence with E. Edwards and K. O'Reilly re: same (.1)	B011	0.60	240.00
07/24/19	TPAKR	Draft notice and revise OCP report (.2); correspondence with R. Poppiti re: same (.1)	B011	0.30	120.00
07/24/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with B. Olivere re: NOS for discovery documents	B011	0.10	40.00
07/24/19	TPAKR	Review correspondence from Prime counsel, K. O'Reilly and E. Edwards remeet and confer issues	B011	0.10	40.00
07/25/19	AMIEL	Confer with C. Kelley and A. Elkhoury re: mechanic's lien actions	B011	0.40	166.00
07/25/19	EEDWA	Emails with M. Heyden and K. O'Reilly re: meet and confer on Debtors Objections to Prime's RFPs	B011	0.20	131.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2

Page 67 of 102

August 12, 2019

50007805 Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Number: 076850.1001 Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/25/19	MFRAT	Correspondences and teleconferences with vendors re: quote for eDiscovery services and prepare encrypted hard drive to be sent to J. Moan at Welded	B011	1.50	262.50
07/25/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Moan re: data collection issues	B011	0.10	60.00
07/25/19	MNEIB	Emails with E. Edwards and M. Fratticci re: e-discovery vendor and data collection issues	B011	0.40	240.00
07/25/19	TPAKR	Review correspondence from Prime counsel, E. Edwards and K. O'Reilly re: meet and confer issues	B011	0.10	40.00
07/26/19	AMIEL	Emails with C. Kelley re: lien enforcement actions	B011	0.10	41.50
07/26/19	AMIEL	Confer with D. Candeub re: lien enforcement action (0.1); emails with D. Candeube and J. Horden re: same (0.10	B011	0.20	83.00
07/26/19	EEDWA	Emails with M. Fratticci and M. Neiburg re: e-discovery vendors and planning	B011	0.10	65.50
07/26/19	MFRAT	Correspondences with DLS, Modus and Consilio eDiscovery vendors; reviewed the quotes	B011	2.00	350.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and R. Poppiti re: resolution of Kofke subpoena and claim	B011	0.40	240.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Soule, B. Feldman and R. Poppiti re: Gopher settlement	B011	0.20	120.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: draft agreement	B011	0.10	60.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Moan, B. Feldman and M. Fratticci re: data collection issues	B011	0.40	240.00
07/26/19	TPAKR	Review Earth Pipeline pleadings	B011	0.50	200.00
07/28/19	EEDWA	Emails with M. Heyden re: meet and confer	B011	0.10	65.50
07/28/19	EEDWA	Emails with M Neiburg re: UCC diligence requests	B011	0.10	65.50
07/28/19	MNEIB	Emails with R. Poppiti and F. Pometti re: Gopher settlement and related issues	B011	0.20	120.00
07/28/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman, A. Mielke, and J. Mulvihill re: document review project	B011	0.20	120.00
07/28/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Neiburg re: committee informal discovery re: committee investigation	B011	0.20	125.00
07/28/19	TPAKR	Review correspondence from E. Edwards and Prime counsel re: meet and confer issues	B011	0.10	40.00

Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 68 of 102

August 12, 2019 50007805 Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/29/19	AMIEL	Review materials provided by S. Stanger re: Earth Pipeline Services litigation	B011	0.10	41.50
07/29/19	AMIEL	Emails with A. Bryan re: Kofke discovery request (0.1); review safety plan in connection with same (0.4); review discovery materials for confidentiality (0.3); emails with R. Poppiti and M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	B011	0.90	373.50
07/29/19	AMIEL	Emails with C. Kelley re: lien enforcement actions	B011	0.20	83.00
07/29/19	BFELD	Draft doc review memo re: Committee diligence requests	B011	1.50	510.00
07/29/19	BFELD	Call with M. Neiburg, R. Poppiti, and D. McDowell (Welded) re: custodians for committee diligence document review	B011	0.20	68.00
07/29/19	EEDWA	Review e-discovery quotes and emails with M. Neiburg and M. Fratticci re: same	B011	0.20	131.00
07/29/19	EEDWA	Prepare for meet and confer (.4); telephone to K. O'Reilly re: same (.1); telephonic meet and confer with M. Heyden and K. O'Reilly re: Debtors' Objections to Prime's First Request for Production (.9); emails with K. O'Reilly re: custodians (.1)	B011	1.50	982.50
07/29/19	MFRAT	Meeting with M. Neiburg; review the content of the hard drive and coordinate with vendor hard drive pick up	B011	1.30	227.50
07/29/19	MFRAT	Set up access to data room; correspondence with B. Walters	B011	0.20	35.00
07/29/19	MNEIB	Emails and discussion with B. Feldman re: document review project issues	B011	0.40	240.00
07/29/19	MNEIB	Emails with M. Fratticci and E. Edwards re: e-discovery vendor	B011	0.30	180.00
07/29/19	MNEIB	Call with R. Poppiti, F. Pometti and A. Ralph re: Gopher settlement and related issues	B011	0.60	360.00
07/29/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman and D. McDowell re: UCC due diligence requests	B011	0.20	120.00
07/29/19	MNEIB	Review documents to be produced to Kofke (.3); emails with A. Mielke and R. Poppiti re: same (.2)	B011	0.50	300:00
07/29/19	MNEIB	Analysis relating to UCC due diligence requests	B011	0.40	240.00
07/29/19	TPAKR	Review correspondence from Prime counsel re: Prime's responses to Debtors' RFPs (.1); review same (.1)	B011	0.20	80.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 69 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. August 12, 2019

Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/30/19	AMIEL	Send documents to J. Nigrini in response to subpoena (compile, send, set up FTP site, and send again)	B011	0.40	166.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Confer with counsel for Sunbelt rentals re: lien enforcement action (0.3); emails re: same (0.1)	B011	0.40	166.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Email with J. Mintz re: Earth Pipeline Services litigation (0.1); emails with T. Pakrouh, K. Enos, and K. Guerke re: same (0.1); review summaries of materials and send same to K. Guerke (0.3); review T. Pakrouh's charts of claims, contract provisions, and defenses (0.3)	B011	0.80	332.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Poppiti re: lien enforcement action (0.1); emails with M. Rosenthal re: same (0.2); review complaint in connection with same (0.1)	B011	0.40	166.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: discovery materials in connection with Kofke request (0.1); emails with R. Poppiti and M. Neiburg re: same (0.1); review materials for confidentiality issues in connection with same (0.3)	B011	0.50	207.50
07/30/19	EEDWA	Meet with M. Fratticci and M. Neiburg re: e-discovery planning (.4); email to F. Pometti and M. Neiburg re: same (.2); meet with M. Neiburg, R. Poppiti, K. Guerke, J. Mulvihill, and B. Feldman re: UCC diligence requests and document review (.5)	B011	1.10	720.50
07/30/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with committee re: status	B011	0.10	72.50
07/30/19	KGUER	Review federal removal documents	B011	0.40	290.00
07/30/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with K. Enos and A. Mielke re: EPS claim and defenses	B011	0.20	145.00
07/30/19	MFRAT	Meeting with E. Edwards and M. Neiburg re: review the eDiscovery vendors' quotes	B011	0.50	87.50
07/30/19	MFRAT	Create FTP site and share documents with opposing counsel; correspondence with A. Mielke	B011	0.20	35.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman re: document review project	B011	0.20	120.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: adequate protection issues	B011	0.10	60.00

50007805 076850.1001 Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 70 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails with R. Poppiti and A. Mielke re: Kofke subpoena	B011	0.20	120.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails with F. Pometti and M. Fratticci re: e-discovery vendor	B011	0.20	120.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails from R. Poppiti and L. Murley re: Gopher settlement and related issues	B 011	0.20	120.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Meeting and emails with M. Fratticci and E. Edwards re: e-discovery issues	B011	0.40	240.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Neiburg and committee counsel (Joe Mintz) re: committee informal discovery in connection with committee investigation	B011	0.10	62.50
07/30/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with K. Enos, A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: Earth Pipeline documents review issues (.2); review and research claims re: same (4.6); correspondence re: results of same (.1)	B011	4.90	1,960.00
07/30/19	TPAKR	Review correspondence from M. Neiburg re: document review issues	B011	0.10	40.00
07/31/19	AMIEL	Confer with C. Hughes re: mechanic's lien litigation (0.4); emails with C. Hughes re: same (0.1); email with R. Poppiti re: same (0.1)	B011	0.60	249.00
07/31/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with K. Enos, K. Geurke, T. Pakrouh, and J. Mintz re: Earth Pipeline Services litigation (0.2); review contract documents in preparation for same (0.4)	B011	0.60	249.00
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Nigrini re: subpoena response	B011	0.10	41.50
07/31/19	BFELD	Confer with M. Neiburg re: document review memo for committee diligence requests	B011	0.30	102.00
07/31/19	BFELD	Revise document review memo re: document production for Committee diligence requests	B011	1.40	476.00
07/31/19	EEDWA	Work on discovery-related issues (1.3) and emails to S. Hawkins and K. O'Reilly re: same (.4)	B011	1.70	1,113.50
07/31/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with T. Pakrouh, A. Mielke, K. Enos re: affirmative claims and strategy call	B011	0.30	217.50
07/31/19	MFRAT	Correspondence with M. Neiburg and A. McClary re: search terms documents to apply to collected data	B011	0.20	35.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2

Filed 08/21/19 Page 71 of 102

Lessoice Date: August 12, 2019

50007805 Welded Construction, L.P. 076850.1001 Matter Number:

		Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/31/19	MFRAT	Provide executed eDiscovery services agreement to DLS; correspondence with M. Neiburg	B011	0.10	17.50
07/31/19	MNEIB	Emails and call with J. Mintz and R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence requests	B011	0.40	240.00
07/31/19	MNEIB	Emails from F. Pometti and R. Poppiti re: Gopher settlement and related issues	B011	0.20	120.00
07/31/19	MNEIB	Emails and discussion with B. Feldman re: document review project	B 011	0.30	180.00
07/31/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman and A. Mielke re: UCC due diligence requests and related issues	B011	0.30	180.00
07/31/19	RFPOP	Call with M. Neiburg and committee counsel (Joe Mintz) (.2) and emails from M. Neiburg and B. Feldman (.1) re: committee informal discovery in connection with committee investigation	B011	0.30	187.50
07/31/19	TBUCH	Confer with T. Pakrouh re: strategy and open issues related to Earth litigation	B011	0.50	265.00
07/31/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with S. Hawkins and K. Guerke re: Earth Pipeline issues	B011	0.10	40.00
07/31/19	TPAKR	Attend call with K. Enos, K. Guerke, A. Mielke and Committee counsel re: Earth Pipeline issues (.5); confer with K. Enos and K. Guerke re: same (.3)	B011	0.80	320.00
07/31/19	TPAKR	Review, research and draft memo on Earth proof of claim issues (2.5); correspondence with K. Enos, A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: same (.1)	B011	2.60	1,040.00
07/31/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with K. Enos, A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: Earth Pipeline and Committee issues	B011	0.20	80.00
07/31/19	TPAKR	Draft complaint re: Earth Pipeline (4.3); confer with T. Buchanan re: same (.5)	В011	4.80	1,920.00
07/31/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with B. Walters re: Earth incorporation issues (.1); confer re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	80.00
07/01/19	BFELD	Meet with J. Mulvihill (.2) and call with A. Mielke (.1) re: revisions to draft plan of liquidation; revise disclosure statement re: same (.4)	B012	0.70	238.00
07/01/19	BFELD	Call with A. Ralph (AlixPartners) (.2) and emails with D. McDowell and S. Hawkins (Welded) (.2) re: draft disclosure statement	B012	0.40	136.00
07/01/19	BFELD	Emails with V. Thomas re: tax sections for disclosure statement	B012	0.10	34.00

Filed 08/21/19 Page 72 of 102 Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2

Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001 Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/01/19	BFELD	Revise disclosure statement re: chapter 11 plan of liquidation	B012	0.30	102.00
07/01/19	JMULV	Prepare for and attend meeting with B. Feldman re: Plan and DS	B012	0.60	276.00
07/01/19	MLUNN	Review / analyze plan issues, including review of revised memo and related research and call with S. Beach	B012	2.10	1,564.50
07/01/19	RFPOP	Begin to review and comment on draft proposed disclosure statement	B012	0.80	500.00
07/01/19	TPAKR	Teleconference with M. Lunn re: claims analysis research	B012	0.10	40.00
07/02/19	MLUNN	Analyze plan issues and review related research and correspondence with T. Pakrouh re: same	B012	0.40	298.00
07/02/19	RFPOP	Further comment on draft disclosure statement	B012	0.70	437.50
07/02/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with M. Lunn re: claim research results (.1); correspondence with M. Lunn re: revisions to same (.1); research and revise accordingly (1.0)	B012	1.20	480.00
07/02/19	TPAKR	Research claim issues in connection with plan	B012	2.00	800.00
07/03/19	MLUNN	Research plan and claim issues, including review of memo	B012	0.90	670.50
07/07/19	RFPOP	Further review and comment on draft disclosure statement	B012	0.90	562.50
07/07/19	TPAKR	Research and draft memo on claims analysis (5.5); correspondence with M. Lunn re: same (.1)	B012	5.60	2,240.00
07/08/19	BFELD	Review R. Poppiti's comments re: draft disclosure statement	B012	0.20	68.00
07/08/19	MLUNN	Meeting with R. Poppiti re: disclosure statement	B012	0.20	149.00
07/08/19	RFPOP	Further review and comment on draft proposed disclosure statement, and email to and from B. Feldman re: same	B012	0.90	562.50
07/08/19	RFPOP	Discussion with M. Lunn re: disclosure statement issues	B012	0.20	125.00
07/10/19	AMIEL	Review R. Poppiti's comments to draft plan (0.3); confer with R. Poppiti re: same (0.1); emails with B. Feldman, R. Poppiti, and B. Feldman re: same (0.1); confer with B. Feldman re: same (0.1)	B012	0.60	249.00
07/10/19	BFELD	Emails with R. Poppiti and S. Beach re: classifying surety claims under the plan	B012	0.30	102.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 73 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/10/19	BFELD	Revise draft of disclosure statement re: R. Poppiti's comments	B012	2.20	748.00
07/10/19	MLUNN	Review memo and analyze issues re: plan and claims	B012	0.70	521.50
07/10/19	MLUNN	Review various comments and issues re: plan and disclosure statement	B012	0.20	149.00
07/10/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and client (Dean McDowell) re: tax issues for disclosure statement	B012	0.30	187.50
07/10/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft chapter 11 plan (3.1), and emails to (.2) and from (.2) S. Beach, J. Mulvihill and B. Feldman resame	B012	3.50	2,187.50
07/10/19	SBEAC	Emails with B. Feldman, R. Poppiti, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, and J. Mulvihill re: Draft - Disclosure Statement for Chapter 11 Plan (.2); Review and revise DS and Plan re: same (2.1)	B012	2.30	1,805.50
07/12/19	BFELD	Revise draft of disclosure statement re: R. Poppiti's comments	B012	0.30	102.00
07/15/19	TPAKR	Research and draft memo on claims analysis (2.0); confer with A. Mielke re same (.1)	B012	2.10	840.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Revise disclosure statement re: R. Poppiti's comments on draft plan	B012	2.40	816.00
07/16/19	JMULV	Revise plan	B012	3.40	1,564.00
07/17/19	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti and J. Mulvihill (.8) re: draft disclosure statement and plan; follow-up meeting with J. Mulvihill (.1) re: same	B012	0.90	306.00
07/17/19	JMULV	Conference call with B. Feldman and R. Poppiti re: plan and disclosure statement	B012	0.50	230.00
07/17/19	RFPOP	Meet with J. Mulvihill and B. Feldman re: plan and disclosure statement issues (.8), and review materials in preparation for same (.3)	B012	1.10	687.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Email to F. Pometti re: board minutes	B012	0.10	41.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Email to and from B. Feldman re: disclosure statement issues	B012	0.10	62.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from J. Mulvihill re: plan release and exculpation sections, and review and comment on revised draft of same	B012	0.60	375.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 74 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

		Tylattol 1	tuilloci.		070050.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/26/19	TPAKR	Research and draft memo on claim issues (3.0); correspondence with M. Lunn re: same (.1)	B012	3.10	1,240.00
07/28/19	JMULV	Drafting plan	B012	1.10	506.00
07/28/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from J. Mulvihill and B. Feldman re: draft plan and disclosure statement	B012	0.10	62.50
07/29/19	BFELD	Revise disclosure statement re: comments thereto and to draft plan	B012	2.00	680.00
07/29/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on revised draft disclosure statement (2.1), and email to and from B. Feldman (.1) re: same	B012	2.20	1,375.00
07/29/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with M. Lunn re: claim research issues	B012	0.10	40.00
07/30/19	JMULV	Drafting chapter 11 plan	B012	1.20	552.00
07/30/19	MLUNN	Review and provide comments to portion of disclosure statement	B012	1.60	1,192.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Email to and from B. Feldman re: draft disclosure statement	B012	0.20	125.00
07/30/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on revised draft plan	B012	2.30	1,437.50
07/31/19	JMULV	Revising Plan and reviewing disclosure statement	B012	3.10	1,426.00
07/31/19	MLUNN	Continued review of disclosure statement	B012	1.70	1,266.50
07/31/19	MLUNN	Review and provide comments on portion of draft chapter 11 plan	B012	1.20	894.00
07/31/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from J. Mulvihill and B. Feldman re: draft plan and disclosure statement	B012	0.10	62.50
07/09/19	SBEAC	Call with Barco counsel re: creditor inquiry	B013	0.10	78.50
07/15/19	SBEAC	Email with B. Feldman re: lien claimant inquiry (.1); Review Sunoco settlement closeout issues (.6)	B013	0.70	549.50
07/31/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and M. Neiburg re: document review memorandum in connection with committee diligence requests	B013	0.10	41.50
07/01/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and F. Pometti re: board minutes	B014	0.10	41.50
07/01/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: board minutes	B014	0.10	78.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 75 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/02/19	AMIEL	Telephonic board meeting (attend and draft minutes)	B014	1.00	415.00
07/02/19	MLUNN	Review draft board presentation and correspondence with F. Pometti re: same	B014	0.40	298.00
07/02/19	SBEAC	Emails with F. Pometti re: Board and Committee update calls (.1); Review documents re: same (.5)	B014	0.60	471.00
07/08/19	MLUNN	Review status of D&O insurance renewal and correspondence with D. McDowell	B014	0.20	149.00
07/11/19	MLUNN	Call with insurance broker and company re: D&O insurance renewal	B014	0.40	298.00
07/15/19	MLUNN	Review and call with R. Poppiti re: D&O insurance	B014	0.20	149.00
07/16/19	MLUNN	Revise D&O policy rider and related correspondence	B014	0.30	223.50
07/18/19	MLUNN	Attend portion of meeting with S. Beach, K. Guerke, A. Mielke, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: miscellaneous open case matters	B014	1.50	1,117.50
07/22/19	MLUNN	Work with R. Poppiti re: D&O insurance and equipment insurance claims/issues	B014	0.20	149.00
07/26/19	MLUNN	Attention to D&O insurance status, including correspondence with company and broker	B014	0.40	298.00
07/29/19	MLUNN	Attention to D&O insurance renewal and correspondence with broker and D. McDowell	B014	0.40	298.00
07/31/19	MLUNN	Correspondence with D. McDowell re: D&O insurance	B014	0.10	74.50
07/02/19	RFPOP	Meet with T. Buchanan re: employee issues	B015	0.20	125.00
07/02/19	TSNYD	Composed email to M. Hofing, S. Beach, and A. Mielke re: documents to review Central States Assessment; signed engagement letter and project scope document.	B015	0.20	110.00
07/02/19	TSNYD	T/C with M. Hofing re: retaining him as actuarial expert	B015	0.40	220.00
07/02/19	TSNYD	File review for proof of claim; notice and demand for withdrawal liability; settlement agreement for partial withdrawal liability	B015	0.30	165.00
07/02/19	TSNYD	Email from A. Mielke re: retention of actuarial expert by YCST	B015	0.10	55.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 76 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

Filed 08/21/19 Page 76 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/08/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Lunn, client (Dean McDowell) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: D&O insurance issues	B015	0.20	125.00
07/08/19	TSNYD	Email from A. Mielke re: documents gathered on N Drive for Welded/Central States matter; review and revise documents re: same	B015	0.20	110.00
07/08/19	TSNYD	Consult with A. Mielke re: strategy for claim objection and document required for objection to proof of claim.	B015	0.50	275.00
07/08/19	TSNYD	Review Central States Related Documents on N Drive	B015	0.50	275.00
07/08/19	TSNYD	Consult with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: request for review	B015	0.20	110.00
07/09/19	TSNYD	Drafting Request for Review	B015	0.50	275.00
07/10/19	AMIEL	Confer with T. Buchanan re: employment agreements (0.1); review documents in connection with same (0.1)	B015	0.20	83.00
07/10/19	TSNYD	Drafting Request for Review of Central States Assessment.	B015	1.20	660.00
07/11/19	TSNYD	Drafting Request for Review of Central States Assessment	B015	1.10	605.00
07/12/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from S. Beach and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) (.2), call to B. Feldman (.1) and call from Frank Pometti (.2) re: key employee incentive and retention plan issues, and review order approving plans (.2) re: same	B015	0.70	437.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Call with K. Guerke re: consulting agreement (.1); Review documents re: same (.2)	B015	0.30	235.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti and R. Poppiti re: KEIP (.1); Review documents re: same (.3)	B015	0.40	314.00
07/12/19	TSNYD	Review Fund Documents; review draft objection to proof of claim and continue drafting Request for review	B015	3.00	1,650.00
07/12/19	TSNYD	Reviewed Declaration of Disinterestedness.; forward to Ron Kramer	B015	0.20	110.00
07/12/19	TSNYD	Westlaw research regarding Construction Industry Exception and liquidation limitation.	B015	2.10	1,155.00
07/12/19	TSNYD	Call from R. Kramer re: Request for Review	B015	0.10	55.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 77 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

O76850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/13/19	TSNYD	Email from A. Mielke re: Central States research	B015	0.10	55.00
07/13/19	TSNYD	Further review of caselaw re: Central States claim	B015	0.40	220.00
07/13/19	TSNYD	Further review of caselaw re: Central States claim	B015	0.60	330.00
07/13/19	TSNYD	Composed email to Mielke, Allison, Beach, Sean: Welded - Draft Request for Review of Central States Assessment	B015	0.10	55.00
07/13/19	TSNYD	Revisions to Request for Review of Central States Assessment.	B015	1.50	825.00
07/14/19	AMIEL	Review emails and documents for employment agreement (0.3); send same to T. Buchanan (0.1)	B015	0.40	166.00
07/14/19	TSNYD	Emails from R. Kramer of Seyfarth re: comments to Request for Review	B015	0.30	165.00
07/15/19	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Jackie Krzysztofik) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: key employee retention plan issues	B015	0.10	62.50
07/15/19	TSNYD	Email from R. Kramer with comments to Request for Review; forward to A. Mielke	B015	0.20	110.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Emails from/to R. Kramer and A. Mielke re: information request for request for review	B015	0.40	220.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Teleconference with S. Beach and A. Mielke to prep for call with Bechtel and its Counsel	B015	0.50	275.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Reviewed Request for Review of Central States Assessment -	B015	0.70	385.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Teleconference with R. Kramer; Bechtel and its counsel; S. Beach and A. Mielke re: Central States Withdrawal Liability	B015	0.60	330.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Compose email to A. Mielke re: comments on Request for Review	B015	0.10	55.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Teleconference with R. Kramer re: request for review	B015	0.50	275.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Email from J. Krzysztifik with spreadsheet re: contributions to Teamsters Funds; review spreadsheet.	B015	0.20	110.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Emails to/from R. Kramer re: timing of t/c	B015	0.20	110.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Emails with A. Mielke, S. Beach and R. Kramer re: Joint Defense Agreement with Welded	B015	0.40	220.00
07/15/19	TSNYD	Emails from A. Mielke and R. Kramer re: affidavit to attach to Request for Review	B015	0.20	110.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 78 of 102

Invoice Date: Welded Construction, L.P. August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/16/19	TSNYD	Emails from R. Kramer and A. Mielke re: insolvency exception	B015	0.20	110.00
07/16/19	TSNYD	Email to/from M. Hofing re: any documents needed for Request for Review.	B015	0.20	110.00
07/16/19	TSNYD	Email to A. Rudolph re: retention of Dexter Hofing and R. Kramer; email from S. Beach and A Mielke re: providing Committee copy of draft Request for Review; forward copy of Request for Review to A. Rudolph	B015	0.30	165.00
07/18/19	TSNYD	Email from A. Mielke re: Affidavit of disinterestedness	B015	0.10	55.00
07/18/19	TSNYD	Email from A. Mielke re: Common Interest Agreement	B015	0.10	55.00
07/19/19	SBEAC	Review and revise employee consulting agreement (.4); Emails with M. Kelsey, M. Rosenthal, and K Guerke re: same (.1)	B015	0.50	392.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Email to and from Zolfo (Frank Pometti) (.1) and call with client (Steve Hawkins) and Frank Pometti (.2) re: key employee incentive and retention plan issues, and review materials in preparation for same (.1)	B015	0.40	250.00°
07/29/19	TSNYD	Email from A. Mielke re: changes to Common Interest Agreement	B015	0.10	55.00
07/08/19	BOLIV	Review fee application issues; Email B. Feldman information	B017	0.10	28.50-
07/09/19	AMIEL	Email to T. Snyder re: ordinary course professional retention	B017	0.20	83.00
07/09/19	BOLIV	Draft CNO re 7th fee application of YCST	B017	0.20	57.00
07/09/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of CNO re YCST's 7th fee application	B017	0.20	57.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Snyder re: retention of OCP ERISA consultant (0.1); review R. Kramer's correspondence in connection with same (0.2); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.2)	B017	0.50	207.50
07/12/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Snyder and S. Beach re: ERISA consultant retention	B017	0.10	41.50
07/15/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with N. Jabin re: OCP report	B017	0.10	40.00
07/15/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with A. Mielke Re: OCP report	B 017	0.10	40.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 79 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

Invoice Date:August 12, 2019Invoice Number:50007805Matter Number:076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/16/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with N. Jabin re: OCP report	B017	0.10	40.00
07/19/19	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer re: OCP retention	B017	0.20	83.00
07/23/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with N. Jabin re: revisions to OCP Report	B017	0.10	40.00
07/23/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with N. Jabin re: revised OCP report	B017	0.10	40.00
07/24/19	BOLIV	Request LEDES file for June 2019 invoice	B017	0.10	28.50
07/24/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft fees and expenses report for ordinary course professionals for Q2 2019, and emails to and from T. Pakrouh re: same	B017	0.20	125.00
07/25/19	AMIEL	Review Seyfarth Shaw engagement letter and OCP declaration (0.3); emails with R. Kramer re: same (0.1); draft email to S. Beach re: same (0.2)	B017	0.60	249.00
07/25/19	AMIEL	Draft notices for OCP supplement and declaration	B017	0.50	207.50
07/25/19	BOLIV	Send LEDES file for YCST's June 2019 fee application to the US Trustee	B017	0.10	28.50
07/25/19	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and T. Snyder re Seyfarth OCP retention issues (.1); Emails with A. Mielke re: waiver issues (.1); Review documents re: Seyfarth engagement issues (.2)	B017	0.40	314.00
07/26/19	AMIEL	Confer with F. Pometti re: Seyfarth Shaw retention (0.1); email re: same (0.1)	B017	0.20	83.00
07/26/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Poppiti re: OCP declarations	B017	0.10	41.50
07/26/19	AMIEL	Confer with R. Kramer re: OCP declaration (0.2); review same (0.2); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1); emails with B. Olivere re: same (0.1)	B017	0.60	249.00
07/26/19	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft notice of filing of supplemental ordinary course professional list and related declaration, and email to and from A. Mielke re: same	B017	0.20	125.00
07/26/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with B. Olivere and B. Walters re: OCP report issues	B017	0.10	40.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: Seyfarth engagement letter	B017	0.10	41.50
07/30/19	BFELD	Review (.1) and finalize for filing (.1) Zolfo Cooper staffing report re: June reporting period	B017	0.20	68.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 80 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/30/19	BWALT	Multiple emails with T. Pakrouh and C. Corazza re: OCP report for period from April 2019 through June 2019	B017	0.40	118.00
07/30/19	BWALT	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of Zolfo Cooper staffing report for June 2019	B017	0.80	236.00
07/30/19	CCORA	Emails from and to T. Pakrouh and B. Walters re: filing and service of quarterly OCP fee statement	B017	0.20	57.00
07/30/19	CCORA	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of Notice re: Quarterly OCP Fee Statement for the Period April 1, 2019 through June 30, 2019	B017	0.30	85.50
07/30/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with B. Walters re: finalized OCP report (.1); correspondence with R. Poppiti re: same (.1); coordinate filing same with B. Walters and C. Corazza (.2)	B017	0.40	160.00
07/31/19	AMIEL	Revise OCP declaration and supplemental notice (0.2); email with R. Kramer re: same (0.1)	B017	0.30	124.50
07/31/19	BWALT	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of filing of Seyfarth Shaw OCP declaration, and first supplement to the OCP list	B017	0.80	236.00
07/08/19	RFPOP	Review invoice for YCST June 2019 monthly fee application re: confidentiality and local rule compliance	B018	0.80	500.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Review/revise CNO re: YCST fee application	B018	0.10	41.50
07/09/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: YCST Fee App	B018	0.10	78.50
07/19/19	BOLIV	Begin draft of 8th fee application of YCST	B018	0.40	114.00
07/22/19	BOLIV	Draft eighth fee application of YCST for June 2019	B018	0.70	199.50
07/22/19	RFPOP	Review and finalize for filing YCST June 2019 monthly fee application	B018	0.20	125.00
07/23/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 8th fee application of YCST for June 2019	B018	0.50	142.50_
07/01/19	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman, E. Edwards, J. Mulvihill, M. Neiburg, and K. Geurke relitigation strategy (0.6); review memorandum analysis in preparation for same (0.4)	B768	1.00	415.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 81 of 102 August 12, 2019

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/01/19	AMIEL	Research Texas contract law and draft section re: same for litigation analysis (0.6); confer with B. Feldman re: same (0.1)	B768	0.70	290.50
07/01/19	EEDWA	Team meeting re: research and case strategy	B768	0.60	393.00
07/01/19	KGUER	Meeting with litigation team re: response to complaint	B768	0.60	435.00
07/01/19	KGUER	Multiple email communications with litigation team re: assignments	B768	0.20	145.00
07/01/19	KGUER	Reviewed response memo	B768	1.00	725.00
07/01/19	SBEAC	Work with M. Neiburg re: Williams litigation strategy issues (.2); Review documents re: same (1.1)	B768	1.30	1,020.50
07/01/19	TBUCH	Research strategy and open issues re: Williams litigation	B768	0.40	212.00
07/01/19	TKABE	Research Litigation Strategy related to Williams Litigation	B768	6.90	1,518.00
07/02/19	KGUER	Research expert issue	B768	0.40	290.00
07/02/19	KGUER	Reviewed research	B768	0.30	217.50
07/02/19	KGUER	Email communications with T. Buchanan re: experts	B768	0.10	72.50
07/02/19	KGUER	Multiple email communications with client re: document requests	B768	0.20	145.00
07/02/19	KGUER	Reviewed fixed fee documents	B768	0.40	290.00
07/02/19	TBUCH	Research strategy and open issues re: Williams litigation	B768	0.80	424.00
07/02/19	TKABE	Draft memo re: Williams Litigation	B768	3.90	858.00
07/03/19	AMIEL	Review motion to dismiss adversary proceeding (1.0); emails with M. Neiburg re: same (.1)	B768	1.10	456.50
07/03/19	BOLIV	Circulate motion to dismiss/change venue and brief in support of same to Williams distribution group	B768	0.10	28.50
07/03/19	BOLIV	Draft scheduling order	B768	0.50	142.50
07/03/19	KGUER	Teleconference with P. Kramer re: experts	B768	0.50	362.50
07/03/19	KGUER	Reviewed and researched expert issues	B768	0.90	652.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 82 of 102

 Welded Construction, L.P.
 Invoice Date:
 August 12, 2019

 Invoice Number:
 50007805

 Matter Number:
 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/03/19	SBEAC	Email with S. Hawkins, M. Neiburg, F. Pometti, D. McDowell, and J. Krzysztofik re: Williams response (.1); Review and revise diligence and response documents re: same (1.3)	B768	1.40	1,099.00
07/03/19	TBUCH	Research strategy and open issues re: Williams litigation	B768	0.60	318.00
07/03/19	TKABE	Finalize and send memo re: Williams Litigation	B768	1.80	396.00
07/04/19	KGUER	Reviewed Opening brief in support of motion to dismiss	B768	0.70	507.50
07/04/19	KGUER	Multiple email communications with litigation team re: motion to dismiss	B768	0.20	145.00
07/04/19	TBUCH	Review Transco's motion to abstain or transfer	B768	0.50	265.00
07/07/19	KGUER	Multiple email communication with litigation team re: responsive brief	B768	0.20	145.00
07/07/19	SBEAC	Emails with M. Neiburg re: strategy to respond to motion to dismiss (.2); Review documents re: same (.4)	B768	0.60	471.00
07/07/19	TBUCH	Research re: Transco's motion to abstain or transfer	B768	0.10	53.00
07/08/19	AMIEL	Review case law in connection with drafting a response to Williams' motion to dismiss	B768	0.50	207.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Review Williams' motions to compel and for adequate protection (1.0); emails with M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	B768	1.10	456.50
07/08/19	AMIEL	Confer with M. Neiburg, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, E. Edwards, and J. Mulvihill re: response to Williams' motion to dismiss	B768	0.50	207.50
07/08/19	EEDWA	Review Defendant's motion to abstain, transfer venue or partial motion to dismiss (1.1); meet with M. Neiburg, T. Buchanan, A. Mielke, J. Mulvihill, and B. Feldman re: same (.5)	B768	1.60	1,048.00
07/08/19	JMULV	Meeting re: Williams litigation	B768	0.60	276.00
07/08/19	KGUER	Review motion to abstain	B768	0.30	217.50
07/08/19	KGUER	Review expert issue	B768	0.30	217.50
07/08/19	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg re: motion	B768	0.10	72.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 83 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 83 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

07/08/19	Initials KGUER MNEIB	<u>Description</u> Meet with M. Neiburg re: answering brief	Task B768	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/08/19	MNIFIR		2700	0.30	217.50
	MINITID	Analysis re: Transco motion to transfer or dismiss	B768	1.30	780.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Emails with L. Murley re: briefing and scheduling issues	B768	0.20	120.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: Transco motion	B768	0.10	60.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Prepare for and participate in meeting with T. Buchanan, J. Mulvihill, A. Mielke, and B. Feldman re: opposition to Transco motion	B768	1.30	780.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Discussion with R. Poppiti re: UCC due diligence requests and related issues	B768	0.30	180.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Poteet and M. Collins re: case status update	B768	0.20	120.00
07/08/19	MNEIB	Discussion with A. Mielke re: Transco motion to transfer or dismiss	B768	0.20	120.00
07/08/19	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, M. Neiburg, A. Mielke, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, B. Feldman, and R. Poppiti re: Williams Litigation Status	B768	0.10	78.50
07/08/19	TBUCH	Research re: Transco's motion to abstain or transfer (1.3); meet with M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, J. Mulvihill, B. Feldman, and A. Mielke re: same (.5)	B768	1.80	954.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and T. Buchanan re: response to Williams' motion to dismiss (0.1); review draft of same (0.1)	B768	0.20	83.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach, M. Neiburg, B. Feldman, and T. Buchanan re: response to Williams' motions to compel and for adequate protection	B768	1.00	415.00
07/09/19	AMIEL	Review diligence information in connection with motion to dismiss	B768	0.20	83.00
07/09/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	1.70	578.00
07/09/19	JMULV	Drafting Williams response	B768-	1.70	782.00
07/09/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with litigation team re: brief strategy	B768	0.10	72.50
07/09/19	MNEIB	Meeting with S. Beach, T. Buchanan, A. Mielke and B. Feldman re: responding to defendants' motion and Transco motion to compel	B768	1.00	600.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 84 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 84 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/09/19	MNEIB	Emails with L. Murley re: scheduling and briefing issues	B768	0.10	60.00
07/09/19	SBEAC	Email with B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, A. Mielke, and M. Neiburg re: Williams' Motions to Compel/for Adequate Protection (.1); Review documents and prepare strategy re: same (1.3)	B768	1.40	1,099.00
07/09/19	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke and M. Neiburg re: Williams briefing schedule (.1); Review documents re: same (.3)	B768	0.40	314.00
07/09/19	TBUCH	Research related to Transco's motion re: commitment letters (2.3); meet with M. Neiburg, S. Beach, B. Feldman, and A. Mielke re: same (1.4)	B768	3.70	1,961.00
07/10/19	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach, M. Neiburg, and counsel for Williams/Transco re: scheduling (0.4); follow up with S. Beach, M. Neiburg re: same (0.3)	B768	0.70	290.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Draft section of response to Williams' motion to dismiss	B768	0.50	207.50
07/10/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: proposed scheduling order for Williams litigation	B768	0.10	41.50
07/10/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	0.10	34.00
07/10/19	BOLIV	Draft notice of rescheduled pre trial conference re Williams adversary	B768	0.30	85.50
07/10/19	JMULV	Drafting motion for summary judgment	B768	1.60	736.00
07/10/19	KGUER	Teleconference with committee re: litigation issues	B768	0.50	362.50
07/10/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with T. Buchanan re: expert issues	B768	0.20	145.00
07/10/19	KGUER	Meet with S. Beach, T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: litigation issues and motion to dismiss	B768	0.50	362.50
07/10/19-	MNEIB	Emails and call with S. Beach, A. Mielke, S. Soule and L. Murley re: scheduling and motion to compel issues	B768	0.50	300.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Discussion with S. Beach, K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: litigation strategy issues	B768	0.30	180.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman re: stipulation extending briefing schedule	B768	0.20	120.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Page 85 of 102 August 12, 2019 Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/10/19	MNEIB	Analysis relating to defendants' motion to abstain/transfer venue or dismiss certain counts	B768	0.80	480.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Call with J. Lucian, S. Poteet, S. Beach, K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: litigation strategy issues (.8); follow-up discussion with T. Buchanan re: same (.1)	B768	0.90	540.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Emails with chambers and L. Murley re: pretrial scheduling conference	B768	0.20	120.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Emails with R. Poppiti, D. McDowell and F. Pometti re: UCC due diligence requests	B768	0.30	180.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Olivere re: rescheduling pretrial conference	B768	0.10	60.00
07/10/19	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: opposition brief to motion to abstain or transfer venue	B768	0.20	120.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Email with T. Buchanan, M. Neiburg, and K. Guerke re: Transco strategy issues (.1); Review and revise scheduling order, response to MTD and related documents re: same (1.1)	B768	1.20	942.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Work with M. Neiburg re: Transco MTD, Scheduling order and related issues (.3); Review documents re: same (.3)	B768	0.60	471.00
07/10/19	SBEAC	Attend Welded v Transco/Williams update call with surety and committee (.8); Work with M. Neiburg, T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: same (.4); Review and revise documents re: same (.8)	B768	2.00	1,570.00
07/10/19	TBUCH	Research strategy and open issues related to adversary proceeding (1.7); meet (2x) with M. Neiburg, S. Beach, and K. Guerke re: same (.4); teleconference with M. Neiburg, S. Beach, K. Guerke, S. Poteet, M. Collins, and J. Lucian re: same (.8)	B768	2.90	1,537.00
07/11/19	AMIEL	Review pleadings in connection with Williams commitment letters/motion for adequate protection/motion to compel (0.3); send same to S. Beach (0.1)	B768	0.40	166.00
07/11/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	1.40	476.00
07/11/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of COC re stipulation re briefing schedule	B768	0.40	114.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 86 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 86 of 102
Invoice Date: August 12, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007805
Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	Hours	Amount
07/11/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of further rescheduled pretrial conference	B768	0.20	57.00
07/11/19	JMULV	Drafting response to motion to dismiss	B768	1.20	552.00
07/11/19	KGUER	Review notice re: pre-trial conference	B768	0.10	72.50
07/11/19	KGUER	Draft consulting agreement and research for same	B768	0.50	362.50
07/11/19	KGUER	Draft expert consulting agreement	B768	0.60	435.00
07/11/19	MNEIB	Prepare draft scheduling order	B768	0.80	480.00
07/11/19	MNEIB	Review stipulation extending briefing schedule (.1); emails with B. Feldman and L. Murley re: same (.2)	B768	0.30	180.00
07/11/19	MNEIB	Review notice of rescheduled pretrial conference (.1); emails with B. Olivere resame (.1)	B768	0.20	120.00
07/11/19	MNEIB	Analysis re: litigation strategy and related issues	B768	1.30	780.00
07/11/19	TBUCH	Research strategy and open issues related to adversary proceeding	B768	0.30	159.00
07/12/19	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and M. Neiburg re: litigation scheduling	B768	0.10	41.50
07/12/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	1.90	646.00
07/12/19	BOLIV	Circulate order re stipulation re briefing schedule	B768	0.10	28.50
07/12/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with co-counsel re: proposed scheduling order	B768	0.20	145.00
07/12/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with T. Buchanan re: expert issues and agreement	B768	0.10	72.50
07/12/19	KGUER	Emails and teleconference with S. Beach re: expert consultant	B768	0.20	145.00
07/12/19-	KGUER	Review briefing schedule stipulation	B768	0.20	145.00
07/12/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Olivere re: order setting briefing schedule	B768	0.10	60.00
07/12/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach and T. Buchanan re: draft scheduling order	B768	0.20	120.00
07/12/19	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: expert discovery issues	B768	0.10	60.00

Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 87 of 102
	D00 001 Z	1 1100 00/21/10	1 440 01 01 102

W 11 10		2 10-12370-NG DUC 957-2 Fileu 00		Paye of UI	
Welded Co	nstruction, L.P.	Invoice	Date: Number:	A	Sugust 12, 2019 50007805
		Matter N			076850.1001
Data	Tuitiala	Description	Toslz	Шомма	Amount
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	Task	Hours	Amount
07/12/19	MNEIB	Analysis relating to motion to abstain, transfer venue or dismiss certain counts	B768	1.70	1,020.00
07/12/19	SBEAC	Call with M. Neiburg re: Williams litigation strategy issues (.1); Review and revise scheduling order re; same (.4)	B768	0.50	392.50
07/12/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Scheduling Order - Transco-Williams (.2); email with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, A. Mielke, T. Buchanan, and M. Neiburg re: same (.1)	B768	0.30	235.50
07/12/19	TBUCH	Teleconference with D. McDowell, A. Ralph, M. Neiburg, and B. Feldman re: litigation strategy and open issues (.5); research related to same (.2)	B768	0.70	371.00
07/13/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	1.00	340.00
07/13/19	JMULV	Drafting response to motion to dismiss	B768	1.20	552.00
07/14/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	0.50	170.00
07/14/19	JMULV	Research re: response to motion to dismiss	B768	1.20	552.00
07/14/19	KGUER	Review motions re: compelling payment	B768	0.30	217.50
07/14/19	TBUCH	Research related to litigation strategy and open issues	B768	0.10	53.00
07/15/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: litigation budget	B768	0.10	41.50
07/15/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	6.30	2,142.00
07/15/19	JMULV	Drafting motion for summary judgment	B768	2.10	966.00
07/15/19	KGUER	Emails with client re: scheduling order	B768	0.10	72.50
07/15/19	KGUER	Review draft scheduling order	B768	0.30	217.50
07/15/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Soule, S. Beach and T. Buchanan re: draft scheduling order	B768	0.20	120.00
07/15/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: draft budget	B768	0.10	60.00
07/15/19	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and F. Pometti re: draft scheduling order	B768	0.20	120.00
07/15/19	TBUCH	Research related to litigation strategy and open issues	B768	0.10	53.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 88 of 102

Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Number: 50007805 076850.1001 Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/16/19	AMIEL	Emails with J. Lucian, T. Buchanan, and M. Neiburg re: Williams litigation scheduling order	B768	0.10	41.50
07/16/19	AMIEL	Review precedent in connection with response to motion to dismiss (2.1); draft section of response to motion to dismiss (1.1)	B768	3.20	1,328.00
07/16/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	6.60	2,244.00
07/16/19	JMULV	Draft motion for summary judgment	B768	1.10	506.00
07/16/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Lucian and T. Buchanan re: draft scheduling order	B768	0.20	120.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Emails with K. Guerke re: Williams litigation and witness issues (.1); Review documents re: same (.5)	B768	0.60	471.00
07/16/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Williams litigation documents and response to MTD	B768	1.10	863.50
07/16/19	TBUCH	Research and draft response to Transco's motion to abstain or transfer	B768	0.70	371.00
07/17/19	AMIEL	Research/review transfer precedent and analyze same (3.8); draft section of response to motion to dismiss (6.1); confer with M. Neiburg and T. Buchanan re: same (0.4); confer with B. Feldman re: same (0.1)	B768	10.40	4,316.00
07/17/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss (9.8); confer with T. Buchanan (.2) and A. Mielke (.1) re: same	B768	10.10	3,434.00
07/17/19	JMULV	Finalize section of response to motion to dismiss	B768	2.20	1,012.00
07/17/19	JMULV	Draft motion to dismiss	B768	1.30	598.00
07/17/19	KGUER	Emails with S. Beach re: expert agreement	B768	0.10	72.50
07/17/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with Blank Rome re: draft scheduling order	B768	0.10	72.50
07/17/19	KGUER	Review and revise expert consulting agreement	B768	0.30	217.50
07/17/19	MNEIB	Emails and discussion with A. Mielke re: draft opposition brief	B768	0.20	120.00
07/17/19	MNEIB	Analysis relating to Transco abstention, venue transfer and partial dismissal motion	B768	1.30	780.00

Case 18-12378	KG Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19	Page 89 of 102
Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date:	August 12, 2
		Lauraina Miranala ana	50007

oz ngust 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001 Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/17/19	SBEAC	Review and revise response to motion to dismiss	B768	0.60	471.00
07/17/19	SBEAC	Review and revise Transco scheduling order, adequate protection settlement issues and motion to compel issues (.7); Review motion to dismiss and related documents re: response strategy issues (1.4)	B768	2.10	1,648.50
07/17/19	TBUCH	Meet with B. Feldman re: response to Transco's motion to abstain or transfer (.3); research related to same (.3)	B768	0.60	318.00
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg and S. Beach re: litigation budget	B768	0.10	41.50
07/18/19	AMIEL	Emails with T. Buchanan, B. Feldman, and M. Neiburg re: comments to response to motion to dismiss (0.4); review pleadings in connection with venue analysis (0.5); draft summary of venue transfer argument in connection with same (0.2); review transfer section to include comments re: same (0.8); review response and revise for nits (1.4)	B768	3.30	1,369.50
07/18/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss	B768	3.10	1,054.00
07/18/19	JMULV	Draft motion for summary judgment	B768	0.70	322.00
07/18/19	JMULV	Draft preliminary statement	B768	1.40	644.00
07/18/19	KGUER	Teleconference with S. Beach re: expert consultants	B768	0.10	72.50
07/18/19	KGUER	Review draft agreement and expert consultant rules	B768	0.50	362.50
07/18/19	KGUER	Meet with S. Beach, K. Guerke, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, B. Feldman, T. Buchanan, and J. Mulvihill re: misc. open case matters	B768	1.80	1,305.00
07/18/19	KGUER	Teleconference with S. Beach re: expert consultants	B768	0.40	290.00
07/18/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: draft budget	B768	0.20	120.00
07/18/19	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: litigation strategy issues	B768	0.10	60.00
07/18/19	MNEIB	Call with S. Beach and K. Guerke re: case strategy issues	B768	0.30	180.00
07/18/19	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: draft answering brief	B768	0.20	120.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 90 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 12, 2019

Invoice Number: 50007805

Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/18/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: draft answering brief and related issues	B768	0.20	120.00
07/18/19	SBEAC	Draft Williams litigation budget (.7); Review and revise documents re: same (.3); Review response documents re: Williams Motion to Dismiss (.6)	B768	1.60	1,256.00
07/18/19	TBUCH	Review and revise response to Transco's motion to abstain or transfer (9.1); meet with J. Mulvihill re: same (.1)	B768	9.20	4,876.00
07/19/19	AMIEL	Review M. Neiburg's comments to response to motion to dismiss (0.3); revise response in connection with same (0.5)	B768	0.80	332.00
07/19/19	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: Williams litigation budget (0.1); review budget (0.2); emails with S. Beach and M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	B768	0.40	166.00
07/19/19	BFELD	Research and draft opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue, or dismiss (1.8); confer with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: same (.1)	B768	1.90	646.00
07/19/19	DLASK	Update Schmid litigation docket and Earth Pipeline docket from WV Circuit Court	B768	1.00	295.00
07/19/19	DLASK	Update electronic dockets for Sunbelt cases in WV Circuit Court	B768	0.40	118.00
07/19/19	JMULV	Review revised brief	B768	0.70	322.00
07/19/19	KGUER	Review Earth Pipeline claim information and pleadings	B768	0.40	290.00
07/19/19	KGUER	Meet with S. Beach, K. Enos, and A. Mielke re: Earth Pipeline and Trans Canada litigation	B768	0.50	362.50
07/19/19	KGUER	Draft consulting agreement	B768	0.50	362.50
07/19/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with A. Mielke re: Transcanada claim info.	B768	0.20	145.00
07/19/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and S. Beach re: budget	B768	0.10	60.00
07/19/19	MNEIB	Work on draft answering brief	B768	2.30	1,380.00
07/19/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Mulvihill, T. Buchanan, A. Mielke and B. Feldman re: draft answering brief	B768	0.70	420.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 91 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/19/19	SBEAC	Call with S. Soule re: Williams adequate protection motion, motion to compel and scheduling order (.2); Emails with S. Soule, T. Buchanan, M. Neiburg and B. Feldman re: same and response to Motion to Dismiss/abstain (.2); Work with T. Buchanan re: same (.2); Review and revise documents re: same (1.6)	B768	2.20	1,727.00
07/19/19	TBUCH	Review and revise response to Transco's motion to abstain or transfer (7.3); teleconference with D. McDowell, A. Ralph, and B. Feldman re: Transco's motions re: commitment letters (.5)	B768	7.80	4,134.00
07/20/19	SBEAC	Emails with M Rosenthal and K Guerke re employee consulting agreement issues (.1); Review and revise documents re same (.3)	B768	0.40	314.00
07/20/19	SBEAC	Review and revise response to motion to dismiss, abstain and transfer venue (2.1); Review diligence and other documents re same (2.2)	B768	4.30	3,375.50
07/21/19	BFELD	Review comments re: brief in opposition to Transco motion to abstain	B768	0.20	68.00
07/21/19	JMULV	Draft motion to dismiss	B768	1.30	598.00
07/21/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach, B. Feldman, J. Mulvihill and A. Mielke re: draft answering brief	B768	0.30	180.00
07/21/19	MNEIB	Work on draft answering brief	B768	0.80	480.00
07/21/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg, B. Feldman, K. Guerke and A. Mielke re: Williams opposition brief	B768	0.20	157.00
07/21/19	TBUCH	Review response to Transco's motion to abstain or transfer	B768	0.60	318.00
07/22/19	AMIEL	Confer with T. Buchanan, M. Neiburg, J. Mulvihill, and B. Feldman re: comments to response to motion to dismiss	В768	0.60	249.00
07/22/19	AMIEL	Incorporate comments to response to motion to dismiss	B768	1.40	581.00
07/22/19	BFELD	Meeting with YCST team re: Transco opposition brief regarding abstention, venue transfer	B768	0.70	238.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Page 92 of 102 August 12, 2019 50007805 Invoice Number: 076850.1001

Matter Number:

		Watter 1	070030.1001		
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/22/19	BFELD	Revise re: brief in opposition to Transco motion to abstain (3.5); meet with M. Neiburg re: abstention claim for same (.2) and with T. Buchanan re: turnover claim for same (.2)	B768	3.90	1,326.00
07/22/19	JMULV	Prepare for and attend meeting re: Williams litigation	B768	1.10	506.00
07/22/19	JMULV	Drafting response to motion to dismiss	B768	1.80	828.00
07/22/19	JMULV	Drafting motion to dismiss	B768	0.80	368.00
07/22/19	KGUER	Emails with litigation team re: answering brief	B768	0.10	72.50
07/22/19	MNEIB	Emails with surety and UCC counsel re: opposition brief	B768	0.20	120.00
07/22/19	MNEIB	Analysis relating to opposition brief	B768	1.20	720.00
07/22/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Mulvihill re: revised draft opposition brief (.2); work on draft opposition brief (.9)	B768	1.10	660.00
07/22/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg, B. Feldman, A. Mielke, K. Guerke, and surety, committee and shareholder counsel re: Opposition brief, Scheduling order, motion to compel and motion for adequate protection (.2); Further review and revise documents re: same (1.2)	B768	1.40	1,099.00
07/22/19	TBUCH	Review and revise response to Transco's motion for abstention or transfer (.2); prepare for and meet with M. Neiburg, A. Mielke, J. Mulvihill, and B. Feldman re: same (.7)	B768	0.90	477.00
07/23/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: response to motion to dismiss	B768	0.10	41.50
07/23/19	BFELD	Research for brief in opposition to Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue or dismiss	B768	0.50	170.00
07/23/19	JMULV	Revise response to motion to dismiss	B768	1.20	552.00
07/23/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with client and litigation team re: answering brief	B768	0.10	72.50
07/23/19	MNEIB	Analysis re: venue transfer issues	B768	0.70	420.00
07/23/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Hawkins re: draft opposition brief	B768	0.10	60.00

Welded Construction	Case 18-12378-KG	Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:	Page 93 of 102 August 12, 2019
Weided Combination	.,		Invoice Number:	50007805
	·		Matter Number:	076850.1001

		iviation intiliber. 0/0830.10				
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
07/23/19	MNEIB	Work on draft opposition brief	B768	1.10	660.00	
07/23/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Poteet re: draft opposition brief	B768	0.10	60.00	
07/23/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman, A. Mielke and J. Mulvihill re: draft opposition brief	B768	0.30	180.00	
07/23/19	TBUCH	Review response to Transco's motion for abstention or transfer	B768	0.20	106.00	
07/24/19	AMIEL	Review case law in connection with transfer argument for response to motion to dismiss (0.4); revise response (1.6); confer with B. Feldman re: same (0.1); confer with T. Buchanan re: same (0.1); emails with M. Neiburg re: same (0.1); review M. Neiburg and B. Feldman's comments to draft of same (0.5)	B768	2.80	1,162.00	
07/24/19	BFELD	Revise brief in opposition re: Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue or dismiss	B768	4.10	1,394.00	
07/24/19	JMULV	Drafting motion for summary judgment	B768	1.10	506.00	
07/24/19	JMULV	Revise Plan and correspondence with B. Feldman re: same	B768	1.30	598.00	
07/24/19	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and B. Feldman re: draft opposition brief	B768	0.40	240.00	
07/24/19	MNEIB	Emails with S. Poteet re: draft opposition brief	B768	0.10	60.00	
07/24/19	MNEIB	Work on opposition brief	B768	1.70	1,020.00	
07/24/19	SBEAC	Multiple emails with surety counsel, Committee counsel, M. Neiburg, B. Feldman and T. Buchanan re: Opposition brief (.2); Further review and revise same (.7)	B768	0.90	706.50	
07/24/19	TBUCH	Review and revise response to Transco's motion for abstention or transfer	B768	2.80	1,484.00	
07/25/19	AMIEL	Review revisions to response to motion to dismiss (0.8); emails with M. Neiburg and B. Feldman re: same (0.2)	B768	1.00	415.00	
07/25/19	BFELD	Revise brief in opposition re: Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue or dismiss	B768	3.60	1,224.00	
07/25/19	JMULV	Drafting motion for summary judgment	B768	2.70	1,242.00	
07/25/19	MNEIB	Review and revise draft opposition brief	B768	1.10	660.00	

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 94 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

		iviation is	tuinoer.		070650.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/25/19	MNEIB	Emails with J. Mintz re: opposition brief	B768	0.10	60.00
07/25/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman re: draft opposition brief	B768	0.30	180.00
07/25/19	SBEAC	Review final version of opposition brief (.5); Multiple emails with M. Neiburg, B. Feldman, S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, and K. O'Reilly re: same (.1)	B768	0.60	471.00
07/26/19	AMIEL	Review/revise response to motion to dismiss (1.6); research case law in connection with same (0.5)	B768	2.10	871.50
07/26/19	BFELD	Research (.7) and revise (.5) brief in opposition re: Transco's motion to abstain, transfer venue or dismiss; emails with various constituencies re: same (.2)	B768	1.40	476.00
07/26/19	BOLIV	Draft affidavit of service re brief in opposition re Williams adversary	B768	0.20	57.00
07/26/19	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of brief in opposition re Williams adversary matter	B768	0.50	142.50
07/26/19	BOLIV	Prepare for filing brief in opposition re Williams adversary matter	B768	0.40	114.00
07/26/19	JMULV	Drafting motion for summary judgment	B768	2.10	966.00
07/26/19	JMULV	Review and finalize response to motion to dismiss	B768	1.10	506.00
07/26/19	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg re: consulting agreement	B768	0.10	72.50
07/26/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with litigation team re: brief and arguments	B768	0.20	145.00
07/26/19	KGUER	Review updated draft answering brief	B768	0.80	580.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Emails with B. Feldman, A. Mielke and T. Buchanan re: opposition brief	B768	0.80	480.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Review UCC statement in support of opposition brief (.1); emails with J, Mintz and B. Feldman re: same (.1)	B768	0.20	120.00
07/26/19	MNEIB	Review opposition brief	B768	0.90	540.00
07/26/19	SBEAC	Emails with M. Neiburg and L. Murley re: draft scheduling order (.1); Review and revise same (.2); Review committee statement opposing Williams motion to dismiss (.2); Emails with J. Mintz and M. Neiburg re: same (.1)	B768	0.60	471.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 95 of 102 Invoice Date: August 12, 2019 Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/26/19	TBUCH	Review response to Transco's motion to abstain or transfer	B768	0.50	265.00
07/29/19	KGUER	Review and revise consulting agreement	B768	0.30	217.50
07/29/19	KGUER	Multiple emails with litigation team re: doc review and UCC due diligence	B768	0.20	145.00
07/29/19	KGUER	Emails with Gibson Dunn re: consulting agreement	B768	0.20	145.00
07/29/19	KGUER	Email with S. Beach re: consulting agreement	B768	0.10	72.50
07/29/19	MROMA	Finalize and file affidavit of service re: brief in opposition defendants' motion to abstain or transfer venue	B768	0.20	57.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Confer with M. Neiburg re: litigation funding agreement (0.1); review/revise budget for litigation funding agreement and budget (0.3); email with A. Ralph re: same (0.1); email with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B768	0.60	249.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: status of Williams litigation matters (0.1); review docket to provide status update of matters scheduled for hearing on 8/22 (0.2); email to M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	B768	0.40	166.00
07/30/19	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: document review	B768	0.10	41.50
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails with L. Murley and chambers re: argument on defendants' motion	B768	0.30	180.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails and call with A. Mielke re: litigation budget issues	B768	0.20	120.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Analysis re: case strategy issues	B768	1.10	660.00
07/30/19	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: case status	B768	0.20	120.00
07/30/19	TBUCH	Research strategy and open issues re: Williams litigation	B768	0.60	318.00
07/31/19	AMIEL	Confer with A. Ralph re: Williams litigation budget	B768	0.20	83.00
07/31/19	JMULV	Drafting motion for summary judgment	B768	1.30	598.00
07/31/19	KGUER	Teleconference with committee re: status of POC	B768	0.30	217.50
07/31/19	KGUER	Meet with T. Pakrouh and K. Enos re: claims	B768	0.20	145.00

Welded Cor	Casenstruction, L.P.	Invo	08/21/19 ice Date: ice Number: ter Number:	Page 96 of 1	02 ugust 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/31/19	KGUER	Reviewed defense and claims chart, contract provisions, contract and project documents, and pleadings	B768	1.90	1,377.50
07/31/19	KGUER	Meet with K. Enos re: POC	B768	0.30	217.50
07/31/19	MNEIB	Emails with chambers, L. Murley and Feldman re: argument on defendants' motion	В. В768	0.30	180.00
07/31/19	MNEIB	Analysis re: case strategy issues	B768	1.30	780.00
07/31/19	MNEIB	Email to J. Mintz re: draft scheduling order	B768	0.10	60.00
07/31/19	TBUCH	Research related to litigation strategy a open issues	and B768	3.10	1,643.00

Total

906.80

\$459,922.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Page 97 of 102

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	<u>Amount</u>
AMIEL	Allison S. Mielke	Associate	163.50	415.00	67,852.50
AKIM	Andrew Kim	Summer Associate	1.10	220.00	242.00
BOLIV	Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	34.60	285.00	9,861.00
BFELD	Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	171.70	340.00	58,378.00
BWALT	Brenda Walters	Paralegal	8.20	295.00	2,419.00
CCORA	Chad A. Corazza	Paralegal	1.00	285.00	285.00
DLASK	Debbie Laskin	Paralegal	1.40	295.00	413.00
EEDWA	Erin D. Edwards	Partner	17.80	655.00	11,659.00
JMULV	Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	53.00	460.00	24,380.00
KENOS	Kenneth J. Enos	Partner	2.80	645.00	1,806.00
KGUER	Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	27.60	725.00	20,010.00
MLUNN	Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	29.70	745.00	22,126.50
MROMA	Melissa Romano	Paralegal	0.20	285.00	57.00
MNEIB	Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	51.60	600.00	30,960.00
MFRAT	Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	7.20	175.00	1,260.00
PKRAM	Pilar G. Kraman	Partner	0.50	530.00	265.00
RFPOP	Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	93.80	625.00	58,625.00
SBEAC	Sean M. Beach	Partner	122.60	785.00	96,241.00
TPAKR	Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	44.40	400.00	17,760.00
TSNYD	Timothy J. Snyder	Partner	18.60	550.00	10,230.00
TKABE	Titus Kabega	Summer Associate	12.60	220.00	2,772.00
TBUCH	Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	41.20	530.00	21,836.00
TBOLL	Troy Bollman	Paralegal	1.70	285.00	484.50
Total			906.8	0	\$459,922.50

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:

Page 98 of 102

August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Task	Summary
------	---------

Name

rask Summary				
Task Code:B001	Case Administration			
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	0.60	745.00	447.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.20	625.00	125.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.10	785.00	78.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	2.10	415.00	871.50
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	5.10	340.00	1,734.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	8.00	285.00	2,280.00
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	2.90	295.00	855.50
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.10	285.00	28.50
Total		19.10		6,420.00
Task Code:B002	Court Hearings			
Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	0.20	$74\overline{5.00}$	149.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	0.30	600.00	180.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.20	625.00	125.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.30	785.00	235.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	3.90	415.00	1,618.50
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.10	340.00	34.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	7.20	285.00	2,052.00
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	1.00	295.00	295.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.40	285.00	114.00
Total		13.60		4,803.00
Task Code:B003	Cash Collateral/DIP Fina	ncing		
Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.30	785.00	235.50
Total		0.30		235.50
Task Code:B004	Schedules & Statements,	U.S. Trustee Report	t <u>s</u>	
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	1.10	625.00	687.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.10	785.00	78.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.20	415.00	83.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	3.20	340.00	1,088.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.40	285.00	114.00
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	0.30	295.00	88.50
Total		5.30		2,139.50
Task Code:B005	Lease/Executory Contrac	t Issues		

Timekeeper Title

Hours

Amount

Rate

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Filed 08/21/19 Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 99 of 102

August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Task Code:B005	Lease/Executory Contract Issues

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	0.20	745.00	149.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	15.40	625.00	9,625.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.60	415.00	249.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	4.00	340.00	1,360.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.70	285.00	199.50
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.80	285.00	228.00

Total 21.70 11,810.50

Use, Sale or Lease of Property (363 issues) Task Code: B006

Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	7.90	745.00	5,885.50
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	4.60	625.00	2,875.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	28.20	785.00	22,137.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	19.10	415.00	7,926.50
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	22.70	340.00	7,718.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	2.40	460.00	1,104.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	1.10	400.00	440.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.50	285.00	142.50

Total 86.50 48,228.50

Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions Task Code:B007

Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth J. Enos	Partner	2.80	645.00	1,806.00
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	0.50	745.00	372.50
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	0.40	600.00	240.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	38.10	625.00	23,812.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	44.20	785.00	34,697.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	70.20	415.00	29,133.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	63.10	340.00	21,454.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	4.50	285.00	1,282.50
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	2.00	295.00	590.00
Chad A. Corazza	Paralegal	0.50	285.00	142.50
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.40	285.00	114.00
Andrew Kim	Summer Associate	1.10	220.00	242.00

113,886.00 Total 227.80

Meetings Task Code:B008

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	Hours	Rate	Amount
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	1.70	655.00	1,113.50
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	5.00	745.00	3,725.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	1.70	600.00	1,020.00
Pilar G. Kraman	Partner	0.50	530.00	265.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	7.00	625.00	4,375.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	12.40	785.00	9,734.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:

Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 100 of 102 August 12, 2019

50007805 076850.1001

				0.0020.100
Task Code:B008	Meetings			
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	10.40	$4\overline{15.00}$	4,316.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	3.50	340.00	1,190.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	2.50	460.00	1,150.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	2.80	400.00	1,120.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	1.70	530.00	901.00
Total		49.20		28,909.50
Task Code:B009	Stay Relief Matters			
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	4.60	625.00	2,875.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.50	785.00	392.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	2.40	415.00	996.00
Total		7.50		4,263.50
Task Code:B011	Other Adversary Procee	edings		
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	<u>Rate</u>	Amount
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	13.90	655.00	9,104.50
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	7.30	725.00	5,292.50
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	2.20	745.00	1,639.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	15.00	600.00	9,000.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	5.60	625.00	3,500.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	4.60	785.00	3,611.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	12.80	415.00	5,312.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	11.00	340.00	3,740.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	5.40	460.00	2,484.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	25.30	400.00	10,120.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	0.50	530.00	265.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	8.30	285.00	2,365.50
Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	7.20	175.00	1,260.00
Total		119.10		57,693.50
Task Code:B012	Plan and Disclosure Stat	<u>tement</u>		
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	9.00	745.00	6,705.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	14.00	625.00	8,750.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	2.30	785.00	1,805.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.70	415.00	290.50
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	9.80	340.00	3,332.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	9.90	460.00	4,554.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	14.20	400.00	5,680.00
Total		59.90		31,117.00

Creditor Inquiries

Task Code:B013

Case 18-12 Welded Construction, L.P.	378-KG Doc 957-2	Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	Page 101 of	102 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001
Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.80	785.00	628.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.10	415.00	41.50
Total		0.90		669.50
Task Code:B014	General Corporate Matt	ters		
Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	4.10	$74\overline{5.00}$	3,054.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.70	785.00	549.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	1.10	415.00	456.50
Total		5.90		4,060.50
Task Code:B015	Employee Matters			
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	1.60	625.00	1,000.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	1.20	785.00	942.00
Timothy J. Snyder	Partner	18.60	550.00	10,230.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.60	415.00	249.00
Total		22.00		12,421.00
Task Code:B017	Retention of Professiona	lls/Fee Issues		
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.40	625.00	250.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.40	785.00	314.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	3.40	415.00	1,411.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.20	340.00	68.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	1.00	400.00	400.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.70	285.00	199.50
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	2.00	295.00	590.00
Chad A. Corazza	Paralegal	0.50	285.00	142.50
Total		8.60		3,375.00
Task Code:B018	Fee Application Prepara	ation		
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	1.00	625.00	625.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.10	785.00	78.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.10	415.00	41.50
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	1.60	285.00	456.00
Total		2.80		1,201.00

Williams Litigation

<u>Timekeeper Title</u>

Hours

Task Code:B768

<u>Name</u>

Page Number 100

Amount

Rate

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-2 Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19

Page 102 of 102

August 12, 2019

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

50007805 076850.1001

Williams Litigation Task Code: B768

Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	2.20	655.00	1,441.00
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	20.30	725.00	14,717.50
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	34.20	600.00	20,520.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	26.40	785.00	20,724.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	35.80	415.00	14,857.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	49.00	340.00	16,660.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	32.80	460.00	15,088.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	39.00	530.00	20,670.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	2.70	285.00	769.50
Debbie Laskin	Paralegal	1.40	295.00	413.00
Melissa Romano	Paralegal	0.20	285.00	57.00
Titus Kabega	Summer Associate	12.60	220.00	2,772.00
Total		256.60		128,689.00

EXHIBIT B

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3

Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 2 of 27

August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Cost Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	Quantity	Amount
04/08/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	2.00	2.94
04/08/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	7.00	10.29
04/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	80.00	117.60
04/12/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	20.00	29.40
04/12/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	17.00	24.99
04/14/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(1.53)
04/14/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	0.80
04/14/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	18.00	26.46
04/15/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	28.00	41.16
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(6.11)
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(10.29)
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(2.34)
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.22
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.19
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(18.85)
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.84
04/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.37
04/15/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	14.00	20.58
04/16/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(25.27)
04/16/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	13.19
04/16/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	37.00	54.39
04/16/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	48.00	70.56
04/16/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MERCER, TAMMY L	10.00	14.70
04/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(16.00)
04/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.35
04/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(1.63)
04/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(8.46)
04/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	0.85
04/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.41

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Page 3 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	Quantity	Amount
04/17/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	49.00	72.03
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(13.35)
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(13.45)
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(7.54)
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.02
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.26
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(17.73)
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.97
04/18/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.94
04/18/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	45.00	66.15
04/19/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(14.16)
04/19/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.39
04/19/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	8.00	11.76
04/21/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	34.00	49.98
04/22/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	21.00	30.87
04/22/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(11.31)
04/22/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.90
04/23/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(2.65)
04/23/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(20.68)
04/23/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	10.80
04/23/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.38
04/23/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	11.00	16.17
04/24/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	4.00	5.88
04/24/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: LUNN,MATTHEW B	7.00	10.29
04/25/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	37.00	54.39
04/25/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	20.00	29.40
04/25/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(5.09)
04/25/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.66
04/26/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(8.25)
04/26/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(13.14)
04/26/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.86
04/26/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.31

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: Page 4 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Date	Description	Quantity	Amount
04/26/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	85.00	124.95
04/26/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	17.00	24.99
04/27/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	19.00	27.93
04/27/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	47.00	69.09
04/28/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	122.00	179.34
04/28/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(11.41)
04/28/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.96
04/28/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	68.00	99.96
04/29/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(7.74)
04/29/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(40.45)
04/29/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.04
04/29/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	21.12
04/30/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(2.55)
04/30/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	(1.00)	(31.58)
04/30/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	(1.00)	(5.50)
04/30/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.33
04/30/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	16.49
04/30/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	2.87
05/01/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.85
05/01/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(11.21)
05/01/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/02/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	3.00	4.83
05/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(14.47)
05/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(9.07)
05/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(9.88)
05/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.73
05/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.16
05/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath-Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.55
05/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/02/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	3.00	4.83
05/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: Page 5 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
05/03/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(13.04)
05/03/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	12.82
05/03/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.81
05/03/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	13.56
05/03/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(25.98)
05/03/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(24.55)
05/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	28.00	2.80
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/06/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	18.00	28.98
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/06/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	29.00	46.69
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/07/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(20.48)
05/07/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.78
05/07/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	10.69
05/07/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(16.81)
05/07/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	25.00-	40.25
05/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	13.00	1.30
05/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
05/08/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	23.00	37.03
05/08/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(30.06)

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Page 6 of 27
August 12, 2019
50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
05/08/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(31.07)
05/08/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	16.22
05/08/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(6.11)
05/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/08/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	15.69
05/08/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.19
05/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	27.00	2.70
05/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/09/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	44.00	70.84
05/09/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(32.30)
05/09/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(9.37)
05/09/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.89
05/09/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	16.86
05/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	10.00	1.00
05/10/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	(1.00)	(17.12)
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/10/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.94
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	18.00	28.98
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	21.00	2.10
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	21.00	2.10
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	10.00	1.00
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/13/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	27.00	43.47

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3

Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: Page 7 of 27

August 12, 2019

50007805

076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	<u>Amount</u>
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	21.00	2.10
05/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/14/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	12.03
05/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.88
05/15/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.44
05/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
05/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/15/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	22.00	35.42
05/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/16/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	6.64
05/16/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.34
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.56
05/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.64
05/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	18.73
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3

Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: Page 8 of 27
August 12, 2019
50007805
076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/21/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.06
05/21/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	12.00	19.32
05/21/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.66
05/21/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	5.84
05/22/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.86
05/22/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.70
05/22/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.05
05/22/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	13.00	20.93
05/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
05/23/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	14.00	22.54
05/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/28/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	81.00	130.40
05/28/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/28/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.36
05/28/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/28/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
05/29/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.31
05/29/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	12.99
05/29/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	14.00	22.54
05/29/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BLACK,JACOB	37.00	59.57
05/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/29/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: LUNN,MATTHEW B	3.00	4.83
05/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	20.00	2.00
05/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
05/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Page 9 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
05/30/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.41
05/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
05/30/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	14.00	22.54
05/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	20.00	2.00
05/31/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BLACK, JACOB	7.00	11.27
05/31/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	12.00	19.32
05/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	10.00	1.00
05/31/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.08
05/31/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.29
05/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/03/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.99
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	14.00	1.40
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
06/04/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	3.00	6.78
06/04/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: RHEAUME, DANIELLE	43.00	97.22
06/04/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	3.32
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/04/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	38.00	85.92
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	23.00	2.30
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	19.00	1.90
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
06/04/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/05/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.08

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Filed 08/21/19 Page 10 of 27

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
50007805
Matter Number:
076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	<u>Amount</u>
06/05/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	24.00	54.26
06/05/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	9.00	20.35
06/06/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C	24.00	54.26
06/06/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.32
06/06/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	15.20
06/06/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	5.00	11.30
06/07/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.56
06/07/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	14.10
06/07/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.12
06/07/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
06/07/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	3.00	6.78
06/07/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
06/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/10/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	10.32
06/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/10/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.29
06/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	22.00	49.74
06/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MULVIHILL, JOSEPH M	8.00	18.09
06/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/11/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.52
06/12/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	27.00	61.05
06/12/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	17.82
06/12/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	4.13
06/12/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	8.00	18.09
06/12/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	7.00	15.83
06/13/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.16
06/13/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.92
06/13/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	11.00	24.87
06/14/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/14/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Filed 08/21/19

Page 11 of 27
August 12, 2019 Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Date	Description	Quantity	Amount
06/14/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/14/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.86
06/14/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.71
06/14/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	11.14
06/14/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	1.00	2.26
06/14/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/14/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	19.00	1.90
06/14/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/14/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: LUNN,MATTHEW B	2.00	4.52
06/15/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	11.00	24.87
06/16/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	22.00	49.74
06/17/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: RYAN, CHELSEA	45.00	101.74
06/17/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	28.00	63.31
06/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.19
06/17/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.27
06/17/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	36.00	81.39
06/18/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	43.00	97.22
06/18/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	13.00	29.39
06/19/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	46.00	104.00
06/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/19/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.06
06/19/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.35
06/19/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.04
06/19/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.13
06/19/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	13.02
06/19/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	27.00	61.05
06/19/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	11.00	24.87
06/20/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	9.00	20.35
06/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30

50007805 076850.1001

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19 Page 12 of 27 Invoice Date: Aug August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001 Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
06/20/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.26
06/20/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.46
06/20/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	17.00	38.44
06/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/21/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	6.00	13.57
06/21/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	12.00	27.13
06/21/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.77
06/21/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	13.52
06/22/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	24.00	54.26
06/24/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.56
06/24/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	26.69
06/24/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	3.00	6.78
06/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/25/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BLACK, JACOB	11.00	24.87
06/25/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	38.18
06/25/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	11.19
06/25/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	10.84
06/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
06/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/25/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	10.00	22.61
06/25/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	9.00	20.35
06/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	16.00	1.60
-06/25/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	6.00	13.57
06/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/26/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	10.35
06/26/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	15.05
06/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/27/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
06/27/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 13 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
06/27/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	34.00	76.87
06/28/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	52.00	117.57
06/28/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	17.00	1.70
06/28/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	5.00	11.30
06/29/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	26.00	58.78
06/29/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	43.00	97.22
07/01/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	67.00	6.70
07/01/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	18.22
07/01/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	17.00	1.70
07/01/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	67.00	6.70
07/01/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	34.00	3.40
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW Willaims litigation strategy	11.00	1.10
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	30.00	3.00
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.59
07/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	14.46
07/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.03
07/02/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.18
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1.00	0.10
07/02/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	9.00	7.20
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	20.00	2.00
07/02/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	53.00	5.30
07/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	49.00	4.90
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	85.00	8.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 14 of 27

August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	49.00	4.90
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	33.00	3.30
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	56.00	5.60
07/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	38.00	3.80
07/03/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	56.00	5.60
07/05/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/05/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	15.00	1.50
07/05/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	42.00	4.20
07/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/05/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/05/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
07/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/05/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/05/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	19.00	1.90
07/07/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	31.00	3.10
07/07/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/07/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	14.00	1.40
07/07/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	47.00	4.70
07/07/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/07/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	17.00	1.70
07/07/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	17.00	1.70
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/08/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	38.00	30.40
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	51.00	5.10
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	25.00	2.50
07/08/19	RITCHIE BROS. AUCTIONEERS INC. (AMERICA) 200 RITCHIE DRIVE SOUTH VIENNA, OH 45369	1.00	21.01
07/08/19	DANIEL A. HOROWITZ SWARTZ SWIDLER 1101 KINGS HWY CHERRY HILL, NJ 8034	1.00	11.58

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P. Filed 08/21/19

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Page 15 of 27
August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/08/19	US DISTRICT COURT RONALD REAGAN FED BLDG & U.S. 228 WALNUT ST HARRISBURG, PA 17101	1.00	11.58
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	25.00	2.50
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	68.00	6.80
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	51.00	5.10
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	51.00	5.10
07/08/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	1.00	0.10
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/08/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	17.00	1.70
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/08/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	42.00	4.20
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	45.00	4.50
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	37.00	3.70
07/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/09/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	12.87
07/09/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.82_
07/09/19	Cost of parking 6/27 - 6/28 for Auction for Sean Beach	1.00-	26.24
07/09/19	Hotel stay 6/27 - 6/28 for Auction for Sean Beach	1.00	330.42
07/09/19	Car/Bus/Subway Travel Travel to/from dinner for R. Poppiti and Alix Partners team related to Welded Auction	1.00	20.28
07/09/19	Round-trip Airfare ticket to/from Columbus, Ohio for Auction for Sean Beach	1.00	968.60
07/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00

Filed 08/21/19

Page 16 of 27
August 12, 2019 Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: Invoice Number: 50007805 Matter Number: 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	<u>Amount</u>
07/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search Various docket pulls from Luzerne County	1.00	220.30
07/09/19	Court Reporter Expedited 33 page original transcript from Hearing on January 15, 2019	1.00	160.05
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	26.00	2.60
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	26.00	2.60
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	50.00	5.00
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	21.00	2.10
07/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/09/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1.00	0.10
07/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	170.00	17.00
07/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
07/10/19	YCST Judge Gross Courtroom 828503	1.00	17.50
07/10/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.31
07/10/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	0.99
07/10/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.16
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	74.00	7.40
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/10/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3

Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19

Invoice Date:

Matter Number:

Invoice Number:

Page 17 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	20.00	2.00
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/11/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	550.00	55.00
07/11/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.52
07/11/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.34
07/11/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	25.10
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4-00	-0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4 . 00	0.40
07/11/19-	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	49.00	4.90
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	26.00	2.60
07/12/19	YCST Judge Gross Courtroom 828886	1.00	17.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 18 of 27 August 12, 2019

50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/12/19	Teleconference / Video Conference	1.00	8.47
07/12/19	Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.64
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	106.00	10.60
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/12/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	32.00	3.20
07/13/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	53.00	5.30
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/15/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	19.00	1.90
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/15/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	21.00	2.10
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	20.00	2.00
07/15/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/15/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/16/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 19 of 27
August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 9.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 2.00 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/16/19 Docker Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 0.30 07/16/19 Docker Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 8.00 6.40 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.00 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	45.00	4.50
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 0.30 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.0	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40
07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 0.20 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 6.40 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 33.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 31.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.0	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 0.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 6.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 8.00 6.40 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/16/19 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 8.00 6.40 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
07/16/19 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.0	07/16/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.0 1.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW <t< td=""><td>07/16/19</td><td>Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color</td><td>8.00</td><td>6.40</td></t<>	07/16/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	8.00	6.40
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	21.00	2.10
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 30.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 11.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 2	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	21.00	2.10
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90 07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/16/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 19.00 1.90 07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW <t< td=""><td>07/16/19</td><td>Docket Retrieval / Search</td><td>2.00</td><td>0.20</td></t<>	07/16/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/16/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	49.00	4.90
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	19.00	1.90
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/16/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 <td>07/17/19</td> <td>Photocopy Charges Duplication BW</td> <td>15.00</td> <td>1.50</td>	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1.00 1.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1.00	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00<	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 <td>07/17/19</td> <td>Photocopy Charges Duplication BW</td> <td>20.00</td> <td>2.0θ</td>	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	20.00	2.0θ
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90 07/17/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/17/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Working Meals 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 0.80 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 0.80 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 3.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 3.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 3.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Working Meals 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 3.00 0.80 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Working Meals	1.00	10.00
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 135.00 13.50 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	28.00	2.80
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70 07/17/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 12.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/17/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	135.00	13.50
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 129.00 12.90 07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/17/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	129.00	12.90
07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10 07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/17/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	20.00	2.00
07/18/19 Working Meals 1.00 10.00 07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20 07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/18/19 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80	07/18/19	Working Meals	1.00	10.00
	07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/18/19 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50	07/18/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
	07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P. Page 20 of 27 August 12, 2019 Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Data	Dogovintion	Orondita	A 0
<u>Date</u> 07/18/19	<u>Description</u> Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	<u>Quantity</u> 5.00	<u>Amount</u> 0.50
07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	50.00	5.00
07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	50.00	5.00
07/18/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.20
07/19/19		5.00	0.10
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW Docket Retrieval / Search	16.00	1.60
		3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	35.00	3.50
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	16.00	1.60
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	24.00	2.40
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	27.00	2.70
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	21.00	2.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	15.00	1.50
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30

50007805

076850.1001

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Filed 08/21/19 Page 21 of 2

Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

Page 21 of 27
August 12, 2019
50007805
076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	16.00	1.60
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	11.00	1.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	34.00	3.40
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19.	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	14.00	1.40
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/21/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	35.00	3.50
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	23.00	2.30
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	35.00	3.50
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication-BW	35.00	3.50
07/22/19	Working Meals Reimburse Betsy Feldman for dinner while working on matter 6/26/19	1.00	28.50
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	22.00	2.20
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	35.00	3.50
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	35.00	3.50
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	23.00	2.30
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Filed 08/21/19 Page 2 Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date:

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: Page 22 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	23.00	2.30
07/22/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	37.00	3.70
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	1.00	0.10
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
07/23/19	caitlin mcnulty esq & andrew s central states se & sw areas p 9377 west higgins rd DES PLAINES, IL 600184938	1.00	18.97
07/23/19	CAITLIN MCNULTY ESQ/ANDREW SP CENTRAL STATES FUND 8647 WEST HIGGINS ROAD CHICAGO, IL 60631	1.00	18.97
07/23/19	Hotel/Lodging Reimburse M. Lunn for two nights' lodging re: 6/27/19 auction in Ohio	1.00	401.81
07/23/19	Car/Bus/Subway Travel Reimburse M. Lunn for car rental re: 6/27/19 auction in Ohio	1.00	269.56
07/23/19	Car/Bus/Subway Travel Reimburse M. Lunn for Uber transportation following client dinner on 6/26/19 re: 6/27/19 auction in Ohio	1.00	15.72
07/23/19	Working Meals Reimburse M. Lunn for 6/26/19 dinner re: 6/27/19 auction in Ohio, including M. Lunn, F. Pometti, A. Ralph, R. Poppiti, S. Cherian, R. Wondwosen, X. Tyler	1.00	276.81
07/23/19	Car/Bus/Subway Travel Reimburse M. Lunn for transportation on 6/26/19 to PHL Airport re: 6/27/19 auction in Ohio	1.00	101.28
07/23/19	Car/Bus/Subway Travel Reimburse M. Lunn for Uber transportation to client dinner on 6/26/19 re: 6/27/19 auction in Ohio	1.00	10.81
07/23/19	Car/Bus/Subway Travel Reimburse M. Lunn for transportation on 6/28/19 from PHL Airport to Home following 6/27/19 auction in Ohio	1.00	101.28
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	2.00	0.20
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	1.00	0.10
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	94.00	9.40
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	1.00	0.10
07/23/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	1.00	0.80

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 23 of 27 August 12, 2019

50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	<u>Amount</u>
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	19.00	1.90
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	13.00	1.30
07/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	12.00	1.20
07/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/23/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	1.00	0.80
07/23/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	1.00	0.10
07/24/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	2.00	0.20
07/24/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/24/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	3.00	0.30
07/24/19	Scanning Charges SCAN	2.00	0.20
07/24/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	37.00	3.70
07/24/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	19.00	1.90
07/24/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	2.00	0.20
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/25/19	JASON MOAN WELDED CONSTRUCTION L.P. 26933 ECKEL ROAD PERRYSBURG, OH 43551	1.00	30.14
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/25/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	43.00	4.30
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/25/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	98.00	9.80
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	714.00	71.40
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/26/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	6.00	4.80
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	182.00	18.20
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	416.00	41.60

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date: Invoice Number:

Matter Number:

Page 24 of 27 August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
07/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	308.00	30.80
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	76.00	7.60
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	47.00	4.70
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
07/26/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	51.00	40.80
07/26/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/28/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	31.00	3.10
07/29/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/29/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	24.00	2.40
07/29/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
07/29/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/29/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	25.00	2.50
07/29/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
07/30/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/30/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	34.00	3.40
07/30/19	Working Meals Working lunch at Chelsea Tavern for 6 people on June 25, 2019	1.00	102.50
07/30/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	29.00	2.90
07/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/30/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	41.00	32.80
07/30/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
07/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	12.00	1.20
07/30/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	25.00	2.50
07/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
07/31/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
07/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	18.00	1.80
07/31/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	35.00	3.50

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Welded Construction, L.P.

Filed 08/21/19 Invoice Date:

Page 25 of 27
August 12, 2019
50007805 076850.1001

Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Qua</u>	ntity Amount
07/31/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1	14.00 1.40
07/31/19	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	3	33.00 26.40
07/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3	30.00 3.00
07/31/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	3	35.00 3.50
07/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00 0.20
07/31/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00 0.20
07/31/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00 0.80
07/31/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1	10.00 1.00
		Total	\$8,298.95

Case 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Filed 08/21/19 Page 26 of 27 Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 18-12378-KG Doc 957-3 Filed 08/21/19 Page 26 of 27

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Cost Summary

<u>Description</u>		<u>Amount</u>
Air/Rail Travel		968.60
Car/Bus/Subway Travel		518.93
Computerized Legal Research		3,733.40
Court Reporter		160.05
Delivery / Courier		35.00
Docket Retrieval / Search		412.60
Federal Express		112.25
Hotel/Lodging		732.23
Parking		26.24
Reproduction Charges		852.10
Teleconference / Video Conference		319.74
Working Meals		427.81
	Total	\$8,298.95

YOUNG CONAWA POSTAR CHAIR PREDOR, LLP

RODNEY SQUARE 1000 NORTH KING STREET WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391 WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600 (800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial (302) 571-6621

Writer's E-Mail sbeach@ycst.com

Stephen Hawkins 26933 Eckel Rd. Perrysburg, OH 43551 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 12, 2019 50007805 076850.1001

Re: Debtor Representation

CURRENT INVOICE

Professional Services	\$	459,922.50
Disbursements	\$	8,298.95
Total Due This Invoice	\$	468,221.45
Previous Balance Due	\$	701,215.62
Amount Due	\$	1,169,437.07

This invoice is payable upon receipt. Please return this page with your remittance.

OR

WIRE (ACH) FUNDS TO:

WSFS Bank 500 Delaware Ave., Wilmington, DE 19801 ABA# 031100102

Account# 211136742

Account Name: Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP Attorney Business Account

Please include your Invoice # 50007805 and/or File # 076850.1001 for identification.