Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226 Filed 02/17/20 Page 1 of 12 Docket #1226 Date Filed: 02/14/2020

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

)

)

In re:

WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,1

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)

(Jointly Administered)

Objection Deadline: March 5, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SUMMARY OF FIFTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2020

Name of Applicant:	Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	Debtors and Debtors in Possession
Effective Date of Retention:	October 22, 2018
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	January 1, 2020 through January 31, 2020
Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$525,886.00
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$10,148.02

This is an: X monthly final application

This monthly application includes 2.30 hours with a value of \$990.50.00 incurred in connection with the preparation of Fee Applications.

¹ The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.



Prior applications:

		Requested		Approved	
Date Filed; Docket No.	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses
12/20/18 D.I. 347	10/22/18-11/30/18	\$629,570.50	\$5,815.10	\$629,570.50	\$5,815.10
1/15/19 D.I. 420	12/1/18-12/31/18	\$443,598.00	\$14,545.93	\$443,598.00	\$14,545.93
2/21/19 D.I. 513	1/1/19–1/31/19	\$530,368,50	\$13,191.07	\$424,294.80	\$13,191.07
3/18/16 D.I. 566	2/1/19-2/28/19	\$493,838.50	\$6,472.15	\$395,070.80	\$6,472.15
4/18/19 D.I. 656	3/1/19-3/31/19	\$477,160.50	\$1,962.33	\$376,541.40 ¹	\$1,962.33
5/23/19 D.I. 746	4/1/19-4/30/19	\$486,070.00	\$4,101.19	\$486,070.00	\$4,101.19
6/17/19 D.I. 799	5/1/19 - 5/31/19	\$381,814.50	\$3,315.52	\$381,814.50	\$3,315.52
7/23/19 D.I. 885	6/1/19 - 6/30/19	\$511,859.00	\$10,592.72	\$511,859.00	\$10,592.72
8/21/19 D.I. 957	7/1/19 – 7/31/19	\$459,922.50	\$8,298.95	\$459,922.50	\$8,298.95
9/17/19 D.I. 1004	8/1/19 - 8/31/19	\$568,448.00	\$5,563.21	\$568,448.00	\$5,563.21
10/21/19 D.I. 1061	9/1/19 - 9/30/19	\$580,684.00	\$12,216.57	\$580,684.00	\$12,216.57
11/22/19 D.I. 1120	10/1/19 - 10/31/19	\$560,539.50	\$11,934.73	\$448,431.60	\$11,934.73
12/30/19 D.I. 1171	11/1/19 – 11/31/19	\$483,150.00	\$20,283.17	\$386,520.00	\$20,283.17
1.21.20 D.I. 1191	12/1/19 - 12/31/19	\$395,395.50	\$19,816.70	\$316,316.40	\$19,816.70
	Total	\$7,002,468.50	\$138,109.34	\$6,409,141.50	\$138,109.34

¹ This amount reflects an agreed to reduction between Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP and the Office of the United States Trustee in the amount of \$5,187.00 for fees for the second interim period [see order D.I. 785].

COMPENSATION BY INDIVIDUAL

Name of Professional Person	Position of the Applicant, Number of Years in that Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate (including changes)	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
Sean M. Beach	Partner since 2009. Joined firm as an associate in 2000. Member of DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar since 2007.	\$835.00	109.30	\$91,265.50
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner since 2010. Joined firm as an associate in 2001. Member of DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar since 2009.	\$795.00	39.10	\$31,084.50
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner since 2019. Joined firm in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2001	\$775.00	101.90	\$78,972.50
Erin D. Edwards	Partner since 2014. Joined firm as an associate in 2003. Member of DE Bar since 2003.	\$715.00	79.80	\$57,057.00
Kenneth J. Enos	Partner since 2015. Joined firm as an associate in 2004. Member of DE Bar since 2004.	\$700.00	2.60	\$1,820.00
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr.	Partner since 2018. Joined firm as associate in 2007. Member of DE Bar since 2007 and NY Bar since 2015.	\$685.00	43.60	\$29,866.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Counsel since 2019. Joined firm as an associate in 2008. Member of DE Bar since 2009.	\$675.00	29.40	\$19,845.00
Timothy J. Snyder	Partner since 1991. Joined firm as an associate in 1985. Member of DE Bar since 1985.	\$575.00	0.60	\$345.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Joined firm as an associate in 2011. Member of DE Bar since 2011.	\$595.00	20.20	\$12,019.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Joined the firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2014 and PA Bar since 2015.	\$525.00	20.30	\$10,657.50
Jaclyn Marasco	Joined the firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2017.	\$525.00	0.20	\$105.00
Allison S. Mielke	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2013.	\$490.00	160.50	\$78,645.00
Allison S. Mielke	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2013.	\$415.00	1.90	\$788.50

Blended Rate:		\$583.08		
Grand Total:			901.90	\$525,886.00
Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	\$175.00	4.30	\$752.50
Beth Olivere	Paralegal	\$295.00	67.70	\$19,971.50
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	\$305.00	15.00	\$4,575.00
Debbie Laskin	Paralegal	\$305.00	1.60	\$488.00
Malak S. Doss	Joined firm as an associate in 2019.	\$375.00	27.90	\$10,462.50
Matthew Milana	Joined firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2019.	\$400.00	4.70	\$1,880.00
Jacob D. Morton	Joined firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2019.	\$375.00	0.40	\$150.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2017 and NY Bar since 2019.	\$415.00	50.40	\$20,916.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2015.	\$400.00	0.10	\$40.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2015.	\$450.00	120.40	\$54,180.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226 Filed 02/14/20 Page 5 of 12

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Case Administration (B001)	9.80	\$4,066.00
Court Hearings (B002)	4.30	\$2,145.00
Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports (B004)	2.10	\$919.50
Lease/Executory Contract Issues (B005)	0.20	\$137.00
Use, Sale or Lease Property (363 Issues) (B006)	57.00	\$45,066.00
Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions (B007)	80.10	\$48,260.00
Meetings (B008)	25.30	\$16,405.00
Stay Relief Matters (B009)	1.00	\$685.00
Other Adversary Proceedings (B011)	483.30	\$270,079.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement (B012)	92.70	\$60,543.00
Creditor Inquiries (B013)	0.40	\$149.50
General Corporate Matters (B014)	2.90	\$2,348.50
Employee Matters (B015)	2.80	\$1,798.00
Asset Analysis (B016)	0.20	\$90.00
Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues (B017)	12.60	\$4,969.50
Fee Application Preparation (B018)	2.30	\$990.50
Williams Litigation (B768)	124.90	\$67,234.50
TOTALS	901.90	\$525,886.00

EXPENSE SUMMARY

Expenses Category (Examples)	Total Expenses
Car/Bus/Subway Travel	\$234.00
Computerized Legal Research	\$3,481.94
Court Costs	\$49.92
Delivery/Courier	\$65.00
Deposition/Transcript	\$1,825.95
Docket Retrieval/Search	\$75.50
Federal Express	\$66.27
Reproduction Charges	\$3,689.40
Teleconference/Video Conference	\$160.19
Working Meals	\$499.85
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$10,148.02

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

)

)

In re:

WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,1

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)

(Jointly Administered)

Objection Deadline: March 5, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

FIFTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2020

Pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101 <u>et seq</u>. (the "**Bankruptcy Code**"), and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and in accordance with that certain Order Pursuant to Section 327(a) of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2014, and Local Rule 2014-1, Authorizing the Retention of Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP as Counsel for the Debtors, Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [Docket No. 234] (the "**Retention Order**") and that certain Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals [Docket No. 230] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (hereinafter "YCS&T") hereby moves this Court for reasonable compensation for professional legal services rendered as counsel to the abovecaptioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors") in the amount of \$525,886.00, together with reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred in the

¹ The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226 Filed 02/14/20 Page 8 of 12

amount of \$10,148.02 for the period commencing January 1, 2020 through and including January 31, 2020 (the "**Fee Period**"). In support of its Application, YCS&T respectfully represents as follows:

1. Pursuant to the Retention Order, YCS&T was employed to represent the Debtors as bankruptcy counsel in connection with these chapter 11 cases, *nunc pro tunc* to October 22, 2018. The Retention Order authorized YCS&T to be compensated on an hourly basis and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses.

2. All services for which compensation is requested by YCS&T were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

3. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is a detailed statement of fees incurred during the Fee Period showing the amount of \$525,886.00 due for fees.

4. The services rendered by YCS&T during the Fee Period are grouped into the categories set forth in <u>Exhibit A</u>. The attorneys and paralegals who rendered services relating to each category are identified, along with the number of hours for each individual and the total compensation sought for each category, in the attachments hereto.

DISBURSEMENTS

5. YCS&T has incurred out-of-pocket disbursements during the Fee Period in the amount of \$10,148.02. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit B</u> is a detailed statement of expenses paid during the Fee Period. This disbursement sum is broken down into categories of charges, including, among other things, telephone and telecopier toll and other charges, mail and express mail charges, special or hand delivery charges, document processing, photocopying charges, charges for mailing supplies (including, without limitation, envelopes and labels) provided by the

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226 Filed 02/14/20 Page 9 of 12

Firm to outside copying services for use in mass mailings, travel expenses, expenses for "working meals," computerized research, transcription costs, as well as non-ordinary overhead expenses such as secretarial and other overtime. A complete review by category of the expenses incurred for the Fee Period may be found attached hereto as <u>Exhibit B</u>. To the extent such itemization is insufficient to satisfy the requirements of Rule 2016-2(e)(ii) of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the "Local Rules"), YCS&T respectfully requests that the Court waive strict compliance with such Local Rule.

6. Costs incurred for overtime and computer assisted research are not included in YCS&T's normal hourly billing rates and, therefore, are itemized and included in YCS&T's disbursements. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-2, YCS&T represents that its rate for duplication is \$.10 per page, its rate for outgoing telecopier transmissions is \$.25 per page (excluding related long distance transmission charges), there is no charge for incoming telecopier transmissions and there is no surcharge for computerized research.

VALUATION OF SERVICES

Attorneys and paraprofessionals of YCS&T have expended a total of
 901.90 hours in connection with this matter during the Fee Period.

8. The amount of time spent by each of these persons providing services to the Debtors for the Fee Period is fully set forth in the detail attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u>. These are YCS&T's normal hourly rates of compensation for work of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by YCS&T for the Fee Period as counsel for the Debtors in these cases is \$525,866.00.

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226 Filed 02/14/20 Page 10 of 12

9. YCS&T believes that the time entries included in <u>Exhibit A</u> attached hereto and the expense breakdown set forth in <u>Exhibit B</u> hereto are in compliance with the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2.

10. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under chapter 11.

11. This Application covers the Fee Period January 1, 2020 through and including January 31, 2020. YCS&T has and will continue to perform additional necessary services subsequent to January 31, 2020, for which YCS&T will file subsequent fee applications.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, YCS&T requests that allowance be made to it in the sum of \$525,886.00 as compensation for necessary professional services rendered to the Debtors for the Fee Period, and the sum of \$10,148.02 for reimbursement of actual necessary costs and expenses incurred during that period, and further requests such other and further relief as this Court may deem just and proper.

Dated: February 14, 2020 Wilmington, Delaware

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

/s/ Sean M. Beach Sean M. Beach (No. 4070) Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. (No. 5052) Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934) Betsy L. Feldman (No. 6410) Rodney Square 1000 North King Street Wilmington, DE 19801 Telephone: (302) 571-6600 Facsimile: (302) 571-1256

Counsel to the Debtors

VERIFICATION

STATE OF DELAWARE)) SS: NEW CASTLE COUNTY)

Sean M. Beach, Esquire, after being duly sworn according to law, hereby deposes and says:

1. I am a Partner in the applicant firm, Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor,

LLP, and have been admitted to the bar of the Supreme Court of Delaware since 2001.

2. I have personally performed many of the legal services rendered by Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, as counsel for the Debtors, and am familiar with all other work performed on behalf of the Debtors by the lawyers and paraprofessionals in the firm.

3. The facts set forth in the foregoing Application are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief.

SEAN/M./BEACH

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED before me this $\frac{1}{2}$ day of February, 2020.

Notary Public MELISSA L. ROMANO My Commission Expires: NOTARY PUBLIC STATE OF DELAWARE My Commission Expires June 5, 2022

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

)

)

)

)

In re:

WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,¹

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)

(Jointly Administered)

Objection Deadline: March 5, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

NOTICE OF FIFTEENTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION

TO: (I) THE DEBTORS; (II) THE U.S. TRUSTEE; (III) COUNSEL FOR THE DIP LENDER; AND (IV) COUNSEL FOR THE COMMITTEE

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (the "Applicant") has filed its *Fifteenth Monthly Application for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession for Services Rendered for the Period from January 1, 2020 Through January 31, 2020 (the "Application") with the Court. The Application seeks allowance of interim fees in the amount of \$525,886.00 and interim expenses in the amount of \$10,148.02.*

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections to the Application, if any, are required to be filed on or before <u>March 5, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)</u> (the "Objection Deadline") with the Clerk of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 3rd Floor, 824 N. Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801. You must also serve any such objection so as to be received by the following on or before the Objection Deadline: (i) the Debtors, P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470 (Attn: Frank A. Pometti, Chief Restructuring Officer); (ii) counsel to the Debtors, Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801 (Attn: Tara C. Pakrouh, Esq.); (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware, J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, Room 2207, 844 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, (Attn: Jane M. Leamy, Esq.); (iv) counsel for the DIP Lender, Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher LLP, 200 Park Avenue, New York, NY 10166 (Attn: Michael A. Rosenthal, Esq. and Matthew K. Kelsey, Esq.); and (v) counsel for the Committee, Blank Rome LLP, 130 North 18th Street, Philadelphia, PA 19103 (Attn: John E. Lucian, Esq. and Michael B. Schaedle, Esq.).

¹ The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT PURSUANT TO THE ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR RETAINED PROFESSIONALS [DOCKET NO. 230], IF NO OBJECTIONS ARE FILED AND SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES, THE DEBTORS WILL BE AUTHORIZED TO PAY 80% OF REQUESTED INTERIM FEES AND 100% OF REQUESTED INTERIM EXPENSES, WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER OF THE COURT.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT ONLY IF AN OBJECTION IS PROPERLY AND TIMELY FILED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES AND CANNOT BE CONSENSUALLY RESOLVED WILL A HEARING BE HELD ON THE APPLICATION.

Dated: February 14, 2020 Wilmington, Delaware

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

/s/ Sean M. Beach

Sean M. Beach (No. 4070) Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. (No. 5052) Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934) Betsy L. Feldman (No. 6410) Rodney Square 1000 North King Street Wilmington, DE 19801 Telephone: (302) 571-6600 Facsimile: (302) 571-1256

Counsel to the Debtors

EXHIBIT A

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 2 of 86

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

RODNEY SQUARE 1000 NORTH KING STREET WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391 WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600 (800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial (302) 571-6621

Writer's E-Mail sbeach@ycst.com

Stephen Hawkins	Invoice Date:	February 10, 2020
26933 Eckel Rd.	Invoice Number:	50012465
Perrysburg, OH 43551	Matter Number:	076850.1001

Re: Debtor Representation

CURRENT INVOICE

Professional Services	\$ 525,886.00
Disbursements	\$ 10,148.02
Total Due This Invoice	\$ 536,034.02

Welded Construction, L.P.	Invoice Date:	February 10, 2020
	Invoice Number:	50012465
	Matter Number:	076850.1001

Time Detail

Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount
01/02/20	AMIEL	Review and revise critical date memo	B001	0.30	147.00
01/02/20	BOLIV	Review and respond to emails re payments received compared to total through interim order	B001	0.10	29.50
01/02/20	BOLIV	Further edit and update critical dates; circulate to working group	B001	0.40	118.00
01/02/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.20	59.00
01/03/20	BFELD	Draft extension motion re: removal deadline	B001	1.20	498.00
01/03/20	BOLIV	Update users in Beaver Valley ftp site per B. Feldman	B001	0.10	29.50
01/03/20	MLUNN	Review critical dates memo	B001	0.10	79.50
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards re: schedule of client meetings	B001	0.10	49.00
01/06/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B 001	0.20	59.00
01/07/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.10	29.50
01/07/20	BOLIV	Update distribution list	B001	0.10	29.50
01/08/20	BFELD	Confer with R. Poppiti re: J. Moan consulting agreement	B001	0.20	83.00
01/08/20	BFELD	Revise J. Moan agreement and emails with J. Krzysztofik re: same	B001	1.10	456.50
01/08/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: hearing and critical dates issues	B001	0.10	83.50
01/09/20	AMIEL	Send sealed pleadings to committee for review (Prime litigation)	B001	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	BFELD	Revise J. Moan consulting agreement re: comments received from consultant	B001	0.80	332.00
01/10/20	BFELD	Review and revise re: J. Moan consulting agreement	B001	0.20	83.00
01/14/20	BFELD	Finalize for filing extension motion re: removal deadline	B001	0.20	83.00
01/15/20	BOLIV	Update critical dates	B001	0.30	88.50

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: draft board update	B001	0.10	49.00
01/16/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleading and correspondence for distribution to c counsel		0.10	29.50
01/16/20	SBEAC	Review and revise critical dates calenda (.2); Emails with B. Olivere re: same (.1		0.30	250.50
01/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Hawkins re: board updat	e B001	0.10	49.00
01/17/20	BOLIV	Update agenda for 1/23/20 hearing	B001	0.30	88.50
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards and B. Olivere re: Prime scheduling deadlines for critic dates	B001 cal	0.10	49.00
01/23/20	BOLIV	Email A. Mielke regarding need for additional hearing dates as a result of judicial reassignment	B001	0.10	29.50
01/23/20	BOLIV	Circulate order re judicial reassignment	B001	0.10	29.50
01/27/20	AMIEL	Revise case timeline	B001	0.60	294.00
01/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: updated criti dates memo	cal B001	0.10	49.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: closure of bank accounts	B001	0.10	49.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Revise case timeline in connection with receiving comments from S. Beach re: same	B001	0.50	245.00
01/28/20	BFELD	Review task list re: items to resolve prio to confirmation of plan	or B001	0.30	124.50
01/29/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleading and correspondence for distribution to c counsel		0.20	59.00
01/29/20	BOLIV	Prepare 4th removal motion, CNO and proposed order for delivery to chambers	B001	0.20	59.00
01/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Reil re: insurance motion	n B001	0.10	49.00
01/30/20	BOLIV	Coordinate service of notice of OCP fee statement	e B001	0.10	29.50
01/30/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleading and correspondence for distribution to c counsel		0.20	59.00
01/31/20	BOLIV	Research newly transfered case of Sunb Tractor & Equipment Co transfered from Wheeling, West Virginia		0.10	29.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 5 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/31/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of notice of withdrawal by Philadelph Insurance Co	rice B001	0.20	59.00
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: omnibus head date	aring B002	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Scaruzzi re: scheduling omnibus hearing	g an B002	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with A. Mielke re: omnibus hearings	B002	0.10	79.50
01/09/20	BOLIV	Prepare fee hearing binder for KCC's interim fee request on 1/23/20	first B002	0.40	118.00
01/09/20	BOLIV	Draft agenda for 1/23/20 hearing	B002	0.30	88.50
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: Welded omnibus hearings	B002	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Confer with D. Laskin re: hearing preparation	B002	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Update 1/23/20 agenda	B002	0.20	59.00
01/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: agenda (0. emails with S. Scaruzzi re: cancelling hearing (0.1)		0.20	98.00
01/17/20	BFELD	Review agenda re: January 23 hearing	g B002	0.40	166.00
01/17/20	BOLIV	Email to attorneys requesting status updates of outstanding matters for 1/2 hearing	B002 23/20	0.10	29.50
01/17/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of Agenda cancelling 1/23/20 hearing		0.30	88.50
01/17/20	BOLIV	Finalize draft agenda cancelling 1/23/ hearing; send for sign-off	20 B002	0.30	88.50
01/17/20	SBEAC	Review hearing agenda (.1); Review Prime litigation and trial strategy issu (.8)	B002 es	0.90	751.50
01/17/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and S. Scaruzz hearing issues	zi re: B002	0.20	167.00
01/22/20	BFELD	Call with L. Scott (KCC) re: solicitati procedures motion	on B002	0.40	166.00
01/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: hearing dat following case reassignment	tes B002	0.10	49.00
01/02/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of monthly operating report for Nover 2019; coordinate delivery of same to Trusttee	mber	0.30	88.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 6 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Velded Construction, L.P. Invoice I Invoice N Matter N		Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/02/20	RFPOP	Review revised draft November monthly operating report, and emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Sujay Cherian) re: same	y B004	0.20	137.00
01/28/20	BFELD	Review MOR re: December reporting period	B004	0.20	83.00
01/29/20	BFELD	Review revised MOR re: December reporting period	B004	0.20	83.00
01/29/20	BFELD	Call with S. Cherian (AP) re: December MOR (.2); review same (.5)	B004	0.70	290.50
01/29/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft December 2019 monthly operating report, and emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolf (Sujay Cherian) re: same		0.20	137.00
01/31/20	BFELD	Finalize for filing MOR re: December reporting period	B004	0.10	41.50
01/31/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of monthly operating report for Decemb 2020		0.20	59.00
01/03/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and counsel for respondents (Steve Miller) and call to B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of various responses to secon rejection motion and related claims	B005 d	0.20	137.00
01/02/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with P. Sbrolla re: telehandler	B006	0.20	159.00
01/02/20	MLUNN	Calls (x2) with R. Poppiti (.9); review a provide comments to revised plan (3.2)	nd B006	4.10	3,259.50
01/02/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Lunn, client (Ste Hawkins) and client's defense counsel (Phil Sbrolla) re: telehandler	we B006	0.20	137.00
01/02/20	RFPOP	Email to and from S. Beach re: D&O insurance issues	B006	0.20	137.00
01/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Regueiro and B. Feldmar re: insurance claim documentation	n B006	0.10	49.00
01/03/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Kelsey re: plan issues and UCC settlement	B006	0.20	167.00
01/06/20	RFPOP	Emails from Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) and client's insurance broker re: proposed extension of D&O insurance	B006	0.20	137.00
01/07/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: status of vendor payment	B006	0.10	49.00
01/07/20	MLUNN	Attention to issues re: telehandler, including call with P. Sbrolla, F. Pomett R. Poppiti and S. Hawkins	B006 ti,	0.30	238.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 7 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoid	ce Date: ce Number: r Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/07/20	RFPOP	Call with M. Lunn, client (Steve Hawkins), Zolfo (Frank Pometti) and client's defense counsel (Phil Sbrolla) re telehandler	B006	0.30	205.50
01/07/20	SBEAC	Meeting with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti an YCST team re: CGT/Ohio CAT/C. States/Claims Reconciliation	d B006	2.10	1,753.50
01/07/20	SBEAC	Meeting with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti an YCST team re: Plan/DS/UCC Settlemer		1.90	1,586.50
01/07/20	SBEAC	Welded- Advisor Update Call	B006	0.60	501.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Confer with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendor payment	B006	0.40	196.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: status of Ohio Cat vendor payment	B006	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: status of Ohio CAT vendor payment	B006	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Kelsey re: potential settlement issues	B006	0.10	83.50
01/08/20	SBEAC	Review documents re: strategy and preparation on Prime litigation, settleme and dispositive motions, including amending complaint for attorney fees (1.2); Work with K. Guerke, E. Edwards A. Mielke and T. Pakrouh re same (.9); Meetings with S. Hawkins re: Plan, EPS and CGT issues (2.2)	5,	4.30	3,590.50
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Levan re: vendor lien releases	B006	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	MLUNN	Meeting with R. Poppiti (.2) and review/provide comments to revised dra chapter 11 plan (2.3)	B006 .ft	2.50	1,987.50
01/09/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with S. Hawkins re: telehandler and potential sale	B006	0.10	79.50
01/09/20	SBEAC	Review and revise documents re: Prime litigation, CGT and Ohio CAT settlements proposals, Williams discove and plan and disclosure statement	B006 ry	4.20	3,507.00
01/09/20	SBEAC	Work with K. Guerke re: objections to Prime dispositive motions (.3); Emails with T. Pakrouh and K. Guerke re: same (.2)	B006	0.50	417.50
01/09/20	SBEAC	Email with R. Poppiti and M. Lunn re: Revised Plan (.1); Review documents re same (.5); Emails with M. Rosenthal re: Arbitration Demand on Central States (.1); Review documents re: same (.4)		1.10	918.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 8 of 86

Welded Co	nstruction, L.P.	Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number;	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/10/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with S. Hawkins re: telehandler sale/storage issues	B006	0.20	159.00
01/11/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with J. Mintz, A. Mie K. Guerke, T. Pakrouh, F. Pometti, M Neiburg and S. Hawkins re: Prime and other litigation strategy issues (.3); Review discovery documents re same	d	1.10	918.50
01/13/20	MLUNN	Call with S. Hawkins (.2) and call wit Pometti (.2) re: sale of telehandler	hF. B006	0.40	318.00
01/13/20	RFPOP	Email to and from (.1) and call from (counsel for Zurich (Peg Anderson) re- insurance issues, and review materials from Peg Anderson (.3) re: same		1.20	822.00
01/13/20	SBEAC	Review and revise objections to Prime dispositive motions, including further revisions to Pometti Declaration ISO Direct Pay Motion (3.2); email with T Pakrouh and K. Guerke re: same (.3)		3.50	2,922.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Call with E. Edwards re: Prime litigat issues	ion B006	0.40	334.00
01/13/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Schaedle re: UCC settler	ment B006	0.10	83.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, and Lunn re: Bechtel/McCaig Settlement	M. B006	0.10	83.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of fourth removal motion	ice B006	0.40	118.00
01/14/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from client's insurance broker and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: D&O insurance issues	B006	0.10	68.50
01/14/20	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins re: plan and settlement issues (.6); Review third pa release issues (.5)	B006 arty	1.10	918.50
01/14/20	SBEAC	Email with T. Pakrouh, E. Edwards, a K. Guerke re: Prime - Objection to Di Pay Motion (.1); review and revise sa (.3)	rect	0.40	334.00
01/14/20	SBEAC	Emails with R. Poppiti re: D&O insur issues and review same (.3); Review Williams stipulation and discovery iss (.2); Emails with M. Lunn, J. Mulvihi and R. Poppiti re: revised plan (.2); Review and revise same (.9); Emails B. Feldman re: 503b9 research on Ch issue (.2); Emails with F. Pometti, R. Poppiti and S. Hawkins re CGT issue (.1)	sues 11, with ubb	1.90	1,586.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 9 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/14/20	SBEAC	Review and revise Pometti declaration Sunoco settlement		0.20	167.00
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: Ohio CAT vendor payment	B006	0.10	49.00
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: Ohio CAT ver payment	ndor B006	0.10	49.00
01/15/20	MLUNN	Analyze telehandler sale issues and strategy, including correspondence with F. Pometti and S. Cherian	B006 ith	0.50	397.50
01/15/20	RFPOP	Email to and from McGriff re: D&O insurance extension issues	B006	0.10	68.50
01/15/20	SBEAC	Call with F. Pometti re: litigation and planning issues	case B006	0.30	250.50
01/15/20	SBEAC	Review Welded litigation and window budget (.2); Emails with M. Neiburg same (.1)		0.30	250.50
01/16/20	SBEAC	Review documents re: claim and fee reimbursement issues under completie and other agreements	B006 on	0.60	501.00
01/16/20	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins, M. McGuire, R Poppiti, A. Mielke, F. Pometti and A. Ralph re: CGT completion agreement closeout issues (.9); Review and analy documents re: same (.7)	and	1.60	1,336.00
01/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: settlement conference to discuss vendor paymen	B006 t	0.10	49.00
01/17/20	MLUNN	Review correspondence with S. Hawl re: summary of plan/settlement for bo		0.10	79.50
01/21/20	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins re: plan, litigati and case strategy issues	on B006	0.40	334.00
01/22/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with F. Pometti and Hawkins re: sale of telehandler	S. B006	0.20	159.00
01/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Elkhoury and J. Stiff vendor payment settlement conference (0.1); emails with J. Stiff and A. Ralp materials in preparation for same (0.1	e h re:	0.20	98.00
01/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and J. Regue re: insurance claim submission	eiro B006	0.10	49.00
01/23/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with R. Welsh re: telehandler sale	B006	0.30	238.50
01/23/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with F. Pometti and Hawkins re: telehandler and removal issues	S. B006	0.20	159.00
01/23/20	RFPOP	Emails from client (Steve Hawkins) a client's defense counsel (Phil Sbrolla sale of telehandler		0.10	68.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 10 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	roice Date: roice Number: atter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
<u>Date</u> 01/24/20	MLUNN	Call with F. Pometti re: sale of teleha		0.20	159.00	
01/24/20	MLUNN	Draft purchase agreement re: sale of telehandler and related correspondence with R. Welsh	B006 ce	0.80	636.00	
01/24/20	RFPOP	Call from M. Lunn re: sale of telehan	dler B006	0.10	68.50	
01/24/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Collins re: plan and settlement issues	B006	0.40	334.00	
01/24/20	SBEAC	Call with A. Mielke re Central States Claim (.2); Calls with R. Kramer, A. Mielke and S. Hawkins re: same and strategy issues (1.0); Call with M. Eau and A. Mielke re: same (.4); Calls with Hawkins re: same and case strategy is (.6)	ton th S.	2.20	1,837.00	
01/27/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: case timeli and open issues	ne B006	0.10	83.50	
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: settlement conference for resolution of vendor payment issues	B006	0.10	49.00	
01/28/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Schaedle, F. Pometti, Lucian, J. Mintz, and J. Bibiloni re: Advisor Call and settlement (.1); Call with M. Kelsey re: same (.2); Emails M. Kelsey re: same (.1); Review and revise plan documents re: same (1.4)	l	1.80	1,503.00	
01/28/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with B. Olivere, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, F. Pometti and S Hawkins re Prime litigation and settlement issues (.2); Review docum and analyze litigation re: same (1.1)		1.30	1,085.50	
01/28/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke, R. Kramer an Rosenthal re: Central States indemnit agreement (.2); Review documents re same (.3); Emails with A. Mielke re: lien claim issues (.1); Review docume re same (.3); Emails with M. Lunn an Poppiti re: indemnity (.1)	y CGT ents	1.00	835.00	
01/29/20	BFELD	Draft COC and proposed order re: miscellaneous asset sale to Ritchie Br (.3); emails with M. Lunn, R. Poppiti B. Olivere re: same (.3)		0.60	249.00	
01/29/20	BFELD	Prepare and circulate notice re: sale o miscellaneous assets	of B006	0.50	207.50	
01/29/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate served of cno re 4th removal motion	vice B006	0.30	88.50	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 11 of 86

Welded Co	nstruction, L.P.	Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Fet	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/29/20	BOLIV	Draft CNO re 4th removal motion	B006	0.20	59.00
01/29/20	MLUNN	Work with B. Feldman re: telehandle sale and misc. asset sale procedures (review proposed order approving sal	(.3);	0.40	318.00
01/29/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with R. Welsh and correspondence with F. Pometti re: telehandler sale	B006	0.30	238.50
01/29/20	RFPOP	Emails from B. Feldman re: sale of telehandler	B006	0.10	68.50
01/29/20	SBEAC	Call to Stephen Hawkins reL Prime, and related strategy issues	Plan B006	0.20	167.00
01/29/20	SBEAC	Review and revise draft Central State Indemnity Agreement (1.6); Emails v client, M. Rosenthal, R. Kramer, A. Mielke, M. Lunn, M. Eaton and M. Kelsey re same (.3)		1.90	1,586.50
01/29/20	SBEAC	Calls with M Lunn re Central States indemnity and Bechtel settlement (.4 Review documents re same (.3)	B006);	0.70	584.50
01/29/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and A. Ralph CGT lien settlements and impact on global resolution	re: B006	0.20	167.00
01/30/20	AMIEL	Review Columbia Gas response to g claim resolution (0.2); emails with F Pometti, S. Beach, A. Ralph, and S. Hawkins re: same (0.1); confer with Elkhoury re: same (0.1); confer with Stiff re: same (0.2)	A.	0.60	294.00
01/30/20	SBEAC	Emails with B. Feldman re: Berkshin surety settlement issues (.1); Review revise documents re same (.3); Email with A. Mielke re: surety SOL resear (.1); Review documents re same (.4) Review letter from C. Kelley re: CG case resolution issues (.3); Analyze documents re; same (.5); Emails with Hawkins, F. Pometti, A. Ralph and A Mielke re: same (.1); Emails with K. Guerke re: order approving motion to amend Prime complaint (.1); Review same (.2); Emails with C. McNulty r Central States arbitration (.1); Multij emails with M. Eaton, A. Mielke, R. Kramer and other re: same (.2); Review documents re: same (.2)	and ls rch ; T n S. A. o y e: ple	2.60	2,171.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 12 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Ided Construction, L.P. Invoice D Invoice N Matter N		Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	Hours	<u>Amount</u>	
12/19/19	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: term sheet in preparation for teleconference re: same (0.2); teleconference re: term sheet (1.	B007	1.90	788.50	
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: insurance policy provisions in connection with Beaver Valley claim settlement (0.1); review insurance policy in connection with same (0.2)	B007	0.30	147.00	
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Eaton re: C. States strategy	B007	0.10	49.00	
01/02/20	SBEAC	Review documents re: strategy for Cer States claim litigation and arbitration demand issues (.9); Emails with A. Mielke, M. Eaton, M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey and others re same (.2)	ntral B007	1.10	918.50	
01/03/20	BFELD	Research re: insurance claims asserted various claimants	by B007	2.30	954.50	
01/03/20	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: preference exposure of various claimants (.1); em with counsel to claimants re: same (.4)		0.50	207.50	
01/03/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Schaedle re: UCC settler issues	nent B007	0.30	250.50	
01/03/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal and M. Kels re: Bechtel/McCaig	ey B007	0.10	83.50	
01/04/20	SBEAC	Emails with R. Poppiti and F. Pometti insurance issues	re: B007	0.10	83.50	
01/05/20	SBEAC	Emails with E. Edwards re: Prime litigation issues (.1); Review and revis settlement documents and draft 9019 motion re UCC settlement (1.1); Emai with B. Feldman re: same (.1)		1.30	1,085.50	
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Enos re: Earth Pipeline Services claim	e B007	0.10	49.00	
01/06/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with M. Eaton, S. Bea M. Kelsey, M. Rosenthal, P. Mallos, C Rankin, E. Miller re: C. States claim strategy		0.50	245.00	
01/06/20	KENOS	Call with T. Cunio re: MXP damages discussion	B007	0.50	350.00	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, M. Lunn and R. Poppiti re: UCC settleme issues (.5); Call with M. Schaedle, Te: M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, M. Lunn an Poppiti re: same (.4); Call with M. Rosenthal re same (.2); Review and re documents re: same (1.1)	ent neo, d R.	2.20	1,837.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 13 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Telded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		imber: 50		
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	Amount	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Kelsey and M. Rosen re: Bechtel/McCaig		0.20	167.00	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Read email from Mielke, Allison: RE Welded- Advisor Update Call	: B007	0.10	83.50	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: committee and settlement issues	call B007	0.20	167.00	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Call with P. Mallos, C. Rankin, M. Rosenthal, Jones Day, M. Kelsey re: Central States claim issues (.5); Revie documents and prepare for call re: sar (.3)		0.80	668.00	
01/07/20	AMIEL	Meeting with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, Poppiti, B. Feldman, S. Beach, and M Lunn re: misc. Claims issues		2.00	980.00	
01/07/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: demand for arbitration of C. States claim	B007	0.10	49.00	
01/07/20	BFELD	Prepare for (.2) and participate in mee (2.0) re: claims analysis	eting B007	2.20	913.00	
01/07/20	BFELD	Research re: Berkshire claims (.1); ca with counsel thereto (.1) and emails v S. Beach and F. Pometti (.1) re: same	vith	0.30	124.50	
01/07/20	KENOS	Update call with Committee Counsel litigation update	re: B007	0.50	350.00	
01/07/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Motion to Amend Complaint (.1); Review and re same (.3)	B007 evise	0.40	334.00	
01/07/20	SBEAC	Email with S. Hawkins re: plan and C issues (.1); Call with S. Hawkins re: s (.1)		0.20	167.00	
01/07/20	SBEAC	Call from Michael Rosenthal re UCC settlement and plan issues	B007	0.20	167.00	
01/08/20	AMIEL	Meeting with S. Beach, S. Hawkins, I Enos, and K. Guerke re: Earth Pipelin claim analysis and damages (0.5); rev analysis in preparation for same (0.3) draft summary of litigation damages (ne view ;	0.90	441.00	
01/08/20	AMIEL	Confer with R. Kramer re: request for arbitration of C. States claim (0.3); re request form in connection with same (0.1); emails with R. Kramer re: same (0.1)	view	0.50	245.00	
01/08/20	BFELD	Draft settlement proposal to E. McNa re: resolution of response to tenth omnibus claim objection	lly B007	0.20	83.00	
01/08/20	KENOS	Meet with client and YCST Team re: MXP Claim litigation	B007	0.60	420.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 14 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/08/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Ohio CAT issues	B007	0.10	83.50
01/08/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, Lunn, and R. Poppiti re: settlement is:		0.20	167.00
01/08/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with A. Mielke, T. Pakrouh, K. Guerke, E. Edwards and Enos re: EPS, Prime, CGT, Ohio CAT and other open issues (.3); Emails wit Hawkins re: steep slope issues (.1); Review documents re same (.4); Initia review of Prime dispositive motions (Г hS. al	1.90	1,586.50
01/08/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Collins re: plan settleme issues	nt B007	0.30	250.50
01/08/20	SBEAC	Call with A. Mielke re: EPS, CGT and Ohio CAT issues	d B007	0.20	167.00
01/08/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Kelsey re: UCC settleme and plan issues	ent B007	0.70	584.50
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Lucian re: earth pipelin services claim	ne B007	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer re: demand fo arbitration documents in connection v C. States claim (0.1); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1); review AAA website for info re: online filing and payment processing (0.3)		0.50	245.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: Earth Pipelin Service claim	ne B007	0.20	98.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with J. Lucian re: Ear Pipeline Services claim	th B007	0.40	196.00
01/09/20	BFELD	Research re: classification of fuel for purposes of claim objection	B007	0.20	83.00
01/09/20	MLUNN	Review correspondence from M. Rosenthal re: central states claim	B007	0.10	79.50
01/10/20	KENOS	Meet with S. Gray re: MXP claims analysis (.5) and follow up (.3) re: sar	B007 ne	0.80	560.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: demand fo arbitration of C. States claim	r B007	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Hawkins re: status of discussions to resolve claims with T.C. Energy	B007 C.	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and S. Ediso claim settlement	n re: B007	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Lucian and S. Beach re Earth Pipeline Services claim	e: B007	0.10	49.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 15 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoic	e Date: e Number: Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/13/20	AMIEL	Review demand for arbitration (0.2); dra letter to AAA and pension plan in connection with same (0.1); confer with S. Beach re: same (0.1); email M. Kelsey re: same (0.1)	ft B007	0.50	245.00
01/13/20	BFELD	Calls with R. Poppiti re: revised disclosure statement (.1) and status of admin claims resolution with various creditors (.1)	B007	0.20	83.00
01/13/20	BFELD	Confer with A. Mielke re: claims researc and removal extension motion	h B007	0.10	41.50
01/13/20	RFPOP	Call to and email from B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of various responses to second rejection motion and related claims	B007	0.10	68.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Schaedle and J. Lucian re UCC settlement	: B007	0.10	83.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Demand for Arbitration (.1); Review documents re same (.2)	B007	0.30	250.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with T. Pakrouh re: Direct Pay Motion and Declaration	B007	0.10	83.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with S. Hawkins, M. McGuire, F. Pometti, A. Ralph, and A. Mielke re: proposed completion term sheet	B007	0.10	83.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: EPS document (.1); Review documents re same (.1)	s B007	0.20	167.00
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal and M. Kelsey re: UCC Implementation Issues	B007	0.10	83.50
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer re: filing demand for arbitration of C. States claim	B007	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: contact at teamsters for service of demand for arbitration (0.1); confer with R. Kramer re: same (0.2)	B007	0.30	147.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: payment of arbitration fee in connection with C. States claim	B007	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: insurance claim submission (0.1); emails with R. Fetchick re: same (0.1); emails with J. Regueiro re: same (0.1)	B007	0.30	147.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Kelsey re: demand for arbitration of C. States claim	B007	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	BFELD	Research re: HERC Rental admin claims (.2); emails with R. Fetchik (Welded) an counsel to claimant re: same (.1)		0.30	124.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 16 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	bice Date: bice Number: ter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	Description	Task	Hours	Amount
01/14/20	BFELD	Emails with counsel to Beaver Valley Slag (.1), insurance broker (.1), and R. Fetchik (.1) re: settlement proposal for administrative claims	B007	0.30	124.50
01/14/20	BFELD	Review updated claims register	B007	0.30	124.50
01/14/20	BFELD	Research re: whether fuel is entitled to 503(b)(9) priority status	B 007	1.80	747.00
01/14/20	RFPOP	Email from B. Feldman re: 503(b)(9) claims	B007	0.10	68.50
01/14/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal re: Bechtel/McCaig settlement Matters	B007	0.10	83.50
01/14/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Kelsey re: UCC settleme issues (.2); Review current version of p re settlement and release issues (.7)		0.90	751.50
01/14/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Rosenthal re: UCC settlement and plan	B007	0.20	167.00
01/14/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti re: proposed completion term sheet (.1); Review documents re same (.2)	B007	0.30	250.50
01/14/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Prime Respo to MSJ	onse B007	0.10	83.50
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Kelsey re: filing dema for arbitration of C. States claim (0.1); emails with R. Kramer re: same (0.1)		0.20	98.00
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer re: filing dema for arbitration of C. States claim	nd B007	0.10	49.00
01/15/20	BFELD	Emails with counsel to Whiteford Kenworth (.1) and call with S. Cheriar (.1) re: order on 10th omnibus claim objection	B007 1	0.20	83.00
01/15/20	BFELD	Call with collections agency re: HERC Rentals admin claim (.2); follow-up ca and email with counsel thereto re: sam (.3)	all	0.50	207.50
01/15/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Demand for Arbitration (.1); Review and revise documents re same (1.2)	B007	1.30	1,085.50
01/16/20	AMIEL	Confer with J. Krzysztofik re: service demand for arbitration related to Centr States claim		0.10	49.00
01/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer re: service of demand for arbitration of C. States cla (0.1) ; review union documents in connection with same (0.3)	B007 im	0.40	196.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 17 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		In	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/16/20	AMIEL	Review Earth Services Complaint ar claims analysis (0.2); draft email to s Beach re: same (0.2)		0.40	196.00
01/16/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re Central Sta arbitration demand (.1); Review documents re same (.3)	ates B007	0.40	334.00
01/16/20	SBEAC	Call from B. Feldman re: claim issue	es B007	0.10	83.50
01/16/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: Earth Pipe Services Inc. Claims Analysis (.1); Review and revise complaint and me re: same (1.1)		1.20	1,002.00
01/16/20	SBEAC	Emails with C. Rankin and S. Hawk Welded Project Records on Carroll County (.1); Review documents re: s (.3)		0.40	334.00
01/16/20	SBEAC	Emails with J. Cree and A. Mielke re Ohio CAT motion to compel payment		0.20	167.00
01/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: arbitration process and strategy in connection w States claim	B007 vith C.	0.10	49.00
01/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer re: selection arbitrators in connection with reques arbitration of C. States claim		0.10	49.00
01/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Edison and B. Feldm insurance claim invoices	an re: B007	0.10	49.00
01/17/20	BFELD	Draft notice of withdrawal of claims Philadelphia Insurance Company cla (.1); emails with counsel thereto re: (.1)	uim	0.20	83.00
01/17/20	BFELD	Emails with R. Fetchik re: claims for canceled Verizon lines	r B007	0.10	41.50
01/17/20	BFELD	Call with counsel to Beaver Valley S re: resolution of administrative claim		0.40	166.00
01/17/20	BFELD	Research re: claims for deductible po of insurance proceeds (.8); confer wi Poppiti re: same (.2)		1.00	415.00
01/17/20	RFPOP	Meet with B. Feldman re: Beaver Va Slag claims	alley B007	0.20	137.00
01/17/20	SBEAC	Emails with C. McNulty and A. Mie re: Central States arbitration issues	elke B007	0.30	250.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 18 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/17/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Rosenthal and M. Kel re: board update (.2); Emails with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, M. Lunn and R. Poppiti re: same (.1); Review docume re: same (.4); Emails With J. Holdinsk and A. Mielke re: Central States Arbitration (.2); Review documents R same (.5)	nts ci	1.40	1,169.00	
01/19/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: CGT/Ohio CAT settlement discussions (.1); Ema with M. Eaton, C. Rankin, M. Rosentl and A. Mielke re: Central States claim issues (.1); Review documents re same (.2)	nal,	0.40	334.00	
01/20/20	AMIEL	Confer with J. Stiff re: status of discussions with T.C. Energy	B007	0.20	98.00	
01/20/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with M. Eaton, S. Bea M. Rosenthal, C. Rankin re: arbitratio C. States claim		0.30	147.00	
01/20/20	RFPOP	Email to and from B. Feldman re: Philadelphia Insurance proof of claim	B007	0.10	68.50	
01/20/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re: EPS claims	B007	0.10	83.50	
01/20/20	SBEAC	Review documents re: preparation for Central States arbitration issues (.4); C with M. Eaton, A. Mielke, M. Rosenth and P. Mallos re same (.4)	Call	0.80	668.00	
01/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Eaton re: C. States cla arbitration	im B007	0.10	49.00	
01/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: Earth Pipelir Services claim analysis (0.1); send em to M. Schaedle and J. Lucian re: same (0.1)	ail	0.20	98.00	
01/21/20	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti re: resolution of various administrative claims	B007	0.10	41.50	
01/21/20	BFELD	Confer with A. Ralph and S. Cherian Verizon bills	re: B007	0.20	83.00	
01/21/20	RFPOP	Call from B. Feldman and email from counsel for various respondents (Steve Miller) re: proposed resolution of responses to second rejection motion a related claims	e	0.20	137.00	
01/21/20	SBEAC	Review and revise EPS memo and complaint (1.6); Emails with A. Mielk and committee counsel re same (.2)	B007 ce	1.80	1,503.00	
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with C. McNulty re: arbitration C. States claim	n of B007	0.10	49.00	

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001		
Date	Initials	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: R. Kramer's invoice for fees related to claim objec	B007	0.10	49.00	
01/22/20	BFELD	Email with S. Miller re: resolution of admin claims for various claimants	B007	0.90	373.50	
01/22/20	RFPOP	Email from B. Feldman re: proposed resolution of responses to second rejection motion and related claims	B007	0.10	68.50	
01/22/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with M. Eaton, C. McNulty, A. Mielke, T. Snyder and or re: Central States arbitration and relate issues (.2); Review documents re sam (.4)	ed	0.60	501.00	
01/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Eaton and S. Beach re- response to C. States' request to withd demand for arbitration (0.1) ; emails to Kramer re: same (0.2)	raw	0.30	147.00	
01/23/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach, M. Eat and C. McNulty re: arbitration of C. States claim (0.3); follow up re: same (0.2)		0.50	245.00	
01/23/20	SBEAC	Review judicial reassignment order (. Emails with A. Mielke, A. Elkhoury a J. Stiff re: Ohio CAT settlement conference (.1)		0.20	167.00	
01/23/20	SBEAC	Prepare for call with Central States an Bechtel re: arbitration and related issu (.4); Attend call re: same (.3); Follow with A. Mielke re same (.1); Emails w C. McNulty, M. Eaton, A. Mielke and Kramer and analyze proposal re: same (.3)	ues up vith I R.	1.10	918.50	
01/23/20	SBEAC	Call from Dean McDowell re: case up and inquiries	odate B007	0.50	417.50	
01/24/20	AMIEL	Confer with M. Eaton and S. Beach re States claim arbitration	e: C. B007	0.20	98.00	
01/24/20	AMIEL	Confer with R. Kramer and S. Beach C. States claim arbitration	re: B007	0.30	147.00	
01/24/20	AMIEL	Research statute of limitations period surety claims (1.6); draft summary of same (0.5); confer with T. Buchanan I same (0.3); confer with M. Doss re: sa (0.4); confer with S. Beach re: same (0 draft notes for M. Doss research in connection with same (0.2)	re: ame	3.10	1,519.00	
01/24/20	BFELD	Emails with E. McNally re: settlemen offer to resolve administrative claim	t B007	0.10	41.50	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 20 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/24/20	BFELD	Calls with R. Poppiti re: S. Miller settlement offer (.3); draft settlement of re: administrative claims for same (1.2) call with S. Miller re: same (.2)	B007 fer	1.70	705.50
01/24/20	RFPOP	Calls with B. Feldman (.3) and emails t and from B. Feldman and counsel for various respondents to second rejection motion (Steve Miller) (.2) re: proposed resolution of responses to second rejection motion		0.50	342.50
01/24/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re bond claim Se issues (.2); Review documents re same (.3)	OL B007	0.50	417.50
01/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Edison and B. Feldman insurance claim invoices	re: B007	0.10	49.00
01/27/20	AMIEL	Confer with M. Doss re: choice of law analysis in connection with research of claim statute of limitations (0.1); resear same (1.5)	B007	1.60	784.00
01/27/20	BFELD	Call with counsel to committee (J. Mint re: settlement proposal to resolve variou admin claims		0.30	124.50
01/27/20	RFPOP	Emails from B. Feldman and counsel for various respondents (James Hordern) re proposed resolution of various response to second rejection motion and related claims	•	0.10	68.50
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Enos, K. Guerke, S. Gra and S. Beach re: discussion of damages for objection of claim	•	0.10	49.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: settlement of surety claim	of B007	0.10	49.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Review conflict of law research analysi in connection with surety claims (0.3); confer with M. Doss re: same (0.1)	s B007	0.40	196.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Revise indemnity agreement to resolve States claim	C. B007	0.60	294.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and M. Eaton re: arbitration of C. States claim (0.2); ema with R. Kramer re: same (0.1)	B007 ils	0.30	147.00
01/28/20	BFELD	Emails with counsel to CFSC re: resolving various admin and rejection damages claims	B007	0.10	41.50
01/28/20	BFELD	Confer with R. Poppiti re: resolution of various admin claims (.1 and .2); call w counsel to claimants re: same (.3); follo up emails with R. Poppiti re: same (.4)	ith	1.00	415.00

Welded Construction, L.P.		In	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Feb	bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/28/20	KENOS	Review and comment on case resolu timeline		0.20	140.00	
01/28/20	MLUNN	Review/analyze draft indemnity agreement re: Central States claim	B007	0.40	318.00	
01/28/20	RFPOP	Emails from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph) re: resolution of T& lien claim litigation	B007 cC	0.10	68.50	
01/28/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and counsel for various respondents (Ste Miller) and discussions with B. Feld re: proposed resolution of responses second rejection motion	man	0.40	274.00	
01/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Kramer and S. Beach revisions to indemnity agreement (0. review draft indemnity agreement in connection with same (0.1)	.1);	0.20	98.00	
01/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Doss re: statute of limitations research	B007	0.30	147.00	
01/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Gray re: scheduling a status call re: claim damages	B007	0.10	49.00	
01/29/20	AMIEL	Research/draft SOL memo	B007	4.90	2,401.00	
01/29/20	MLUNN	Review draft indemnity agreement (and work with S. Beach re: same (.4		0.80	636.00	
01/29/20	RFPOP	Review settlement agreement betwee TransCanada and T&C resolving lies claim		0.10	68.50	
01/29/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re Earth Pipe Services claim issues	line B007	0.20	167.00	
01/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with C. McNulty re: arbitrati C. States claim (0.1); emails with M. Eaton re: same (0.1); emails with R. Kramer and S. Beach re: same (0.2)		0.40	196.00	
01/30/20	AMIEL	Research/draft statute of limitations analysis	B007	3.90	1,911.00	
01/30/20	BFELD	Draft COC and proposed order re: resolution of Berkshire claims	B007	0.60	249.00	
01/30/20	BFELD	Prepare for call with S. Miller and J. Hordern re: resolution of administrat claims (.3); follow-up research re: sa (.4)	tive	0.70	290.50	
01/30/20	BFELD	Call with R. Poppiti, S. Miller, J. Hordern, and S. Cherian re: resolution administrative claims of various clai		0.60	249.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 22 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	Description	Task	Hours	Amount
01/30/20	RFPOP	Call with B. Feldman and counsel for various respondents (Steve Miller and J Hordern) re: proposed resolution of responses to second rejection motion an related claims (.6), and review materials in preparation for same (.1)	ıd	0.70	479.50
01/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with AAA re: extension of time submit arbitrators in connection with C. States claim		0.10	49.00
01/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Eaton re: C. States clain strategy (0.1); emails with R. Kramer re same (0.1); emails with S. Beach re: san (0.1)		0.30	147.00
01/31/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with R. Kramer and C. McNulty re: Central States arbitration (0.2); follow up with R. Kramer re: sam (0.1)	B007	0.30	147.00
01/31/20	RFPOP	Emails from B. Feldman and client (Jackie Krzysztofik) re: proposed resolution of McNally claim	B007	0.10	68.50
01/31/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with A. Mielke, M. Eaton, C. McNulty and R. Kramer re: Central States arbitration and claim issu (.2); Review documents re same (.3); Review and analyze CGT response to global settlement offer and related documents (.9)	B007	1.40	1,169.00
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: client meeting	B008	0.10	49.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: agenda for committee call	B008	0.20	98.00
01/06/20	JMULV	Conference with YCST team re: plan documents	B008	2.80	1,470.00
01/06/20	RFPOP	Meet with S. Beach, M. Lunn, J. Mulvihill, A. Mielke, and B. Feldman r plan and wind-down issues (2.8), and review materials in preparation for sam (.4)		3.20	2,192.00
01/07/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, R. Poppiti, S. Beach, and M. Lunn and committee professionals re: misc. case issues	B008	0.40	196.00
01/07/20	JMULV	Prepare for and attend conference call with committee	B008	0.90	472.50
01/07/20	JMULV	Prepare for and attend meeting re: plan settlement negotiations	B008	0.60	315.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 23 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/07/20	MLUNN	Attend portions of strategy and update meetings re: various topics, including claims, litigation, plan and settlement	B008	2.60	2,067.00	
01/07/20	RFPOP	Meet with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielk B. Feldman, client (Steve Hawkins) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: various issues including case update and strategy, upcoming deadlines, plan and disclosur statement and tasks and claims reconciliation	l ',	4.10	2,808.50	
01/07/20	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, A. Mielke, Zolfo (Frank Pometti), committee counsel (Mike Schaedle) and Teneo re: case update	B008	0.60	411.00	
01/07/20	SBEAC	Multiple meetings with S. Hawkins and Pometti re: employee, plan, UCC settlement, Williams, CGT and other ca strategy issues (1.1); Review document re same (.5)	se	1.60	1,336.00	
01/07/20	SBEAC	Meeting with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti an YCST team re: Litigation Discussion	nd B008	1.60	1,336.00	
01/08/20	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: misc. case issue	ies B008	0.20	98.00	
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: committee advisor call	B008	0.10	49.00	
01/13/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with committee, company, and company professionals to discuss case strategy and first day relief		2.60	1,274.00	
01/14/20	SBEAC	Attend call with UCC and GDC re plan settlement issues	B008	0.30	250.50	
01/16/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach, R. Popp M. Lunn, F. Pometti, and S. Hawkins re- misc. case issues (0.8); follow up with S Beach re: same (0.2)	e:	1.00	490.00	
01/16/20	MLUNN	Update call with Alix Partners, S. Hawkins, S. Beach, R. Poppiti, A. Miel and M. McGuire	B008 ke	0.90	715.50	
01/24/20	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: response to S. Hawkins' request for a case update (0.1 Confer with S. Beach and S. Hawkins r same (0.5));	0.60	294.00	
01/24/20	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: misc. case iss	ues B008	0.20	98.00	
01/24/20	TBUCH	Confer with A. Mielke re: legal issues related to bond claim	B008	0.40	238.00	
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and M. Schaedle weekly status call	re: B008	0.10	49.00	

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: insurance claim issues and misc. case updates	B008	0.20	98.00
01/06/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft motion to further extend deadline to remove actio (.7), and emails to and from B. Feldman (.1) re: same	ns	0.80	548.00
01/09/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from client (Jackie Krzysztofik) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: Piper and Tibbs litigation	B009	0.20	137.00
01/01/20	KGUER	Review Shumway deposition; outline same	B011	1.00	775.00
01/01/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with client, S. Beach, E Edwards, and M. Neiburg re: expert rebuttal, strategy, deposition, and trial prep	B. B011	0.20	155.00
01/01/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with client and YCST re trial strategy issues	e: B011	0.10	45.00
01/02/20	AMIEL	Confer with K. Guerke re: case strategy	B011	0.20	98.00
01/02/20	AMIEL	Draft quarterly status report for pending litigation (0.2); emails with B. Olivere and M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	g B011	0.30	147.00
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: lien releases	B011	0.10	49.00
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: updated Prin NDT deadlines	ne B011	0.10	49.00
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: expert deposition schedule	B011	0.10	49.00
01/02/20	EEDWA	Prime: Emails with D. Gadsen re: revis trial dates (.1); emails with B. Olivere a T. Pakrouh re: same (.1)		0.20	143.00
01/02/20	KGUER	Teleconference with Mike Heyden re: expert deposition and settlement	B011	0.20	155.00
01/02/20	KGUER	Email with YCST team re: expert depositions and settlement	B011	0.10	77.50
01/02/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team and client re: settlement, trial prep and relat case issues	B011 ed	0.20	155.00
01/02/20	KGUER	Teleconference with A. Mielke re: warranty issue and motion to amend	B011	0.20	155.00
01/02/20	SBEAC	Emails with E. Edwards re: Prime trial (.1); Emails with A. Ralph re: fee issue (.1)	B011 s	0.20	167.00
01/02/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Enos and the client re: document collection issues for expert	B011	0.10	45.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 25 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	roice Date: roice Number: utter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/02/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke and S. Gray re: deposition prep		0.10	45.00
01/03/20	AMIEL	Draft portions of motion to amend complaint (Prime) (2.4); review contr in connection with same (1.0)	B011 ract	3.40	1,666.00
01/03/20	AMIEL	Draft summary of warrant and attorne fees issues in connection with analysi responsive pleadings and motion to amend complaint		0.50	245.00
01/03/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: Prime cas strategy (0.3); confer with K. Guerke same (0.4)		0.70	343.00
01/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with D. Laskin re: status of W Virginia lien actions	est B011	0.20	98.00
01/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: quarterly report in Brunner litigation	B011	0.10	49.00
01/03/20	BOLIV	Prepare letter re status report for Brun civil action matter is middle district o Pennsylvania; prepare status report for federal express service to middle distri of Pennsylvania court and opposing counsel	f or	0.60	177.00
01/03/20	DLASK	Review and update state litigation do	ckets B011	0.50	152.50
01/03/20	EEDWA	Prime: Teleconference with A. Mielk research for motion to amend	e re: B011	0.20	143.00
01/03/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and B. Olivered quarterly report in state court action	e re: B011	0.10	67.50
01/03/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, J. Bell re: J. Bell deposition issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/03/20	TPAKR	Emails with E. Edwards re: Milestone document hit report issues (.1); confe with E. Edwards re: same (.3)		0.40	180.00
01/03/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with A. Mielke re: warranty issues (.3); emails with A. Mielke re: same (.1)	B011	0.40	180.00
01/04/20	EEDWA	Emails with A. Mielke and K. Guerke motion to amend	e re: B011	0.10	71.50
01/04/20	KGUER	Review contract summary and subcontract re: warranty issues	B011	0.60	465.00
01/04/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with A. Mielke and F Edwards re: warranty and motion to amend	E. B011	0.10	77.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 26 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	ice Date: ice Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/05/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: motion for leave to amend complaint in Prime action (0.6) review analysis of basis to amend complaint in preparation for call (0.2); research case law and rules in connection with same (2.4); further revise/draft motion re: san (2.6)	L	5.80	2,842.00
01/05/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review analysis from A. Mielko re: attorneys' fees and warranty (.7); teleconference with K. Guerke and A. Mielke re: same (.6)	e B011	1.30	929.50
01/05/20	KGUER	Emails with expert re: deposition	B011	0.10	77.50
01/05/20	KGUER	Teleconference with A. Mielke and E. Edwards re: summary judgment and motion to amend and related issues	B011	0.60	465.00
01/05/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, A. Mielke, and S. Gray re: deposition scheduling and prep issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards re: comments motion to amend complaint (Prime litigation)	to B011	0.20	98.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: Josh Bell invoices	B011	0.10	49.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Draft email summary of strategy related to motion to amend complaint	d B011	0.30	147.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Research issues related to amending complaint (Prime)	B011	0.70	343.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: comments to motion to amend complaint	B011	0.10	49.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Revise motion to amend complaint (Prime) (0.6); revise complaint (0.2)	B011	0.80	392.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with K. Enos, T. Pakro and T. Cuneo re: damages analysis for Earth Pipeline Services claim (0.4); follow up with K. Enos and T. Pakrouh re: same (0.1)		0.50	245.00
01/06/20	BOLIV	Coordinate court reporter and video- ographer for 1/10/20	B011	0.30	88.50
01/06/20	BOLIV	Coordinate preparation and delivery of materials/binders needed for defense of expert testimony on 1/10/20		1.00	295.00
01/06/20	DLASK	Monitor Newman Tractor state court matters	B011	0.10	30.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 27 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		elded Construction, L.P. Invoid Invoid Matte		Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/06/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review and comment on draf motion to amend complaint (.5); ema with A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: additional revisions to same (.3); telephone to T. Pakrouh re: deposition and trial preparation issues (.4)	ft B011 ails	1.20	858.00	
01/06/20	KGUER	Email with A. Mielke re: motion to amend complaint; review same and f amended complaint; Review multipl- versions of draft motion to amend an proposed amended complaint	e	1.50	1,162.50	
01/06/20	KGUER	Email with E. Edwards and S. Beach experts and client meeting	n re: B011	0.10	77.50	
01/06/20	KGUER	Emails with expert re: deposition	B011	0.10	77.50	
01/06/20	KGUER	Meeting with S. Beach re: amended complaint, experts and settlement	B011	0.70	542.50	
01/06/20	KGUER	Review Shumway deposition; outline same	e B011	1.00	775.00	
01/06/20	KGUER	Emails with client re: trial prep and amended complaint	B011	0.10	77.50	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Work with K. Guerke re: Prime NDT litigation issues	Г В011	0.50	417.50	
01/06/20	TPAKR	Confer with E. Edwards re: Mileston document search issues	nes B011	0.40	180.00	
01/06/20	TPAKR	(Prime) teleconference with Prime counsel re: deposition issues	B011	0.10	45.00	
01/06/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and Client re: trial strategy issues	B011	0.10	45.00	
01/06/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Enos and the client researching document to expert analy (.1); coordinate with DLS re: provide expert with same (.5)	ysis	0.60	270.00	
01/06/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Enos, A. Mielke, K. Guerke and Ankura re: damages ana issues	B011 lysis	0.10	45.00	
01/06/20	TPAKR	(Prime) draft Rapp deposition log (5 emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, A. Mielke re: same (.1)		5.30	2,385.00	
01/06/20	TPAKR	Attend expert damages analysis call K. Enos, A. Mielke, and Anukra	with B011	0.50	225.00	
01/06/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with A. Mielke, YCS and Client re: motion to amend comp (.1); review same (.1)		0.20	90.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 28 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	bice Date: bice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
01/06/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, J. Bell re: J. Bell deposition issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/06/20	TPAKR	(Prime) prepare S. Gray expert deposi preparation materials (.5); emails with Olivere re: same (.1)		0.50	225.00
01/07/20	AMIEL	Meeting with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, Edwards, S. Beach, T. Pakrouh, M. Neiburg, and K. Guerke re: misc. litigation issues	E. B011	1.50	735.00
01/07/20	AMIEL	Review S. Gray's analysis of Prime's rebuttal damages report	B011	0.30	147.00
01/07/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Bibiloni re: amended complaint in Prime litigation (0.1); em with S. Hawkins re: same (0.1)	B011 nails	0.20	98.00
01/07/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate server of motion for leave to file amended complaint	ice B011	0.50	147.50
01/07/20	BOLIV	Coordinate further copies of Rimkus Expert Report and Ankura Expert Rep for defense of deposition of S. Elliott	B011 port	0.20	59.00
01/07/20	BOLIV	Review docket of Assad Brunner re Middle District of PA re status report docketed; email A. Mielke with same information	B011	0.10	29.50
01/07/20	BOLIV	Edit motion for leave to file amended complaint	B011	0.10	29.50
01/07/20	BOLIV	Review local rules re filing guidelines motion for leave to amend the compla re need for notice; hearing date etc		0.20	59.00
01/07/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: client meeting and deposition preparation (.4 meet with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, K. Guerke, T. Pakrouh, A. Mielke, and S Beach re: open litigation issues and strategy (1.1); review analysis from S. Gray (.3); review materials to prepare Gray for deposition (3.6)	!);	5.40	3,861.00
01/07/20	KGUER	Review Rapp deposition log	B011	0.30	232.50
01/07/20	KGUER	Multiple Emails with YCST team re: amended complaint	B011	0.20	155.00
01/07/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: trial prep and expert depositions	B011	0.40	310.00
01/07/20	KGUER	Meeting with client and YCST re: tria strategy, settlement and related case issues	1 B011	1.50	1,162.50

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/07/20	KGUER	Review defense expert summary and expert documents	B011	0.30	232.50
01/07/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: motion for leave to file amended complaint	B011	0.30	202.50
01/07/20	TPAKR	(Prime) attend Welded litigation meetin with YSCT and the client (2.5); emails with A. Mielke re: same (.1)	ng B011	2.60	1,170.00
01/07/20	TPAKR	Emails with Ankura and K. Enos re: documents for analysis	B011	0.10	45.00
01/07/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Enos and the client re: researching document to expert analysi (.1); coordinate with DLS re: providing expert with same (.3)		0.40	180.00
01/07/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Gray re: analysi of Rimkus report (.1); review same (.1)		0.20	90.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Meeting with S. Beach, E. Edwards, K. Guerke, and T. Pakrouh re: pleadings in response to Prime's dispositive motions (1.5); review Prime's dispositive motion in preparation for meeting (0.4)	1	1.90	931.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with D. Laskin re: Newman Tractor complaint	B011	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: settlement discussions	B011	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, a: K .Guerke re: pleadings filed in Prime matter	nd B011	0.30	147.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: escrow agreement in connection with response motion in limine (Prime)	B011 to	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	BFELD	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: ETP settlement and stipulation agreement	B011	0.10	41.50
01/08/20	BOLIV	Download review and circulate Prime NDT filings by defendant re motion in limine	B011	0.30	88.50
01/08/20	BOLIV	Prepare additional sets of expert reports for 1/10 deposition defense	s B011	0.40	118.00
01/08/20	BOLIV	Download sealed documents from secu ftp site re Prime NDT	red B011	0.40	118.00
01/08/20	BOLIV	Prepare binder of all sealed motions in limine and motion for summary judgme and exhibits to same for T. Pakrouh re Prime NDT	B011 ent	1.20	354.00
01/08/20	BOLIV	Deliver and set up all materials/binders and reports to conference room for dep prep		0.70	206.50

Welded Cor	nstruction, L.P.	Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/08/20	DLASK	Monitor Newman Tractor state court matters		0.10	30.50
01/08/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with B. Olivere re: deposition preparation materials (.1); emails with M. Heyden re: sealed versions of motion for summary judg and motion to strike (.2); emails with Mielke, K. Guerke, and T. Pakrouh re responding to same (.3); review Prim case dispositive motions (2.6); meet v A. Mielke, K. Guerke, T. Pakrouh, an Beach re: responses to Prime's summ judgment and motions in limine (1.5) meet with T. Pakrouh re: deposition preparation and materials (.7); review materials and issues to prepare S. Gra deposition (.8)	gment A. e: e's with nd S. hary);	6.20	4,433.00
01/08/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: motion for summary judgment and motion to strike expert opinions	B011	0.30	232.50
01/08/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with S. Beach and T. Pakrouh re: Earth claims analysis	. B011	0.10	77.50
01/08/20	KGUER	Meeting with S. Beach re: status of c	laim B011	0.20	155.00
01/08/20	KGUER	Emails with client re: settlement	B011	0.20	155.00
01/08/20	KGUER	Teleconference with M. Heyden re: settlement	B011	0.30	232.50
01/08/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Heyden re: expert deposition schedule	B011	0.10	77.50
01/08/20	KGUER	Emails and teleconference with medi re: settlement	ator B011	0.30	232.50
01/08/20	KGUER	Review motions to strike experts; rev motion for summary judgment	view B011	1.40	1,085.00
01/08/20	KGUER	Meeting with client re: status and cla analysis	ims B011	0.50	387.50
01/08/20	KGUER	Meeting with YCST team re: respons motions and experts	se to B011	1.50	1,162.50
01/08/20	KGUER	Emails with expert witness re: deposi	ition B011	0.10	77.50
01/08/20	MFRAT	Correspondence with E. Edwards and Pakrouh re: preparing several pleadir and exhibits for attorney review		0.20	35.00
01/08/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: motion in limine to prec expert testimony	lude B011	0.20	135.00
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Emails with Prime counsel re dispositive motion issues	e: B011	0.10	45.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 31 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Fel	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Beach and K. Guerke re: Sunoco settlement documen (.1); emails with M. Milana, B. Feldma and A. Mielke Re: same (.1)	B011 ts	0.20	90.00
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Review/analyze documents for expert deposition preparation (2.5); emails with M. Fratticci and P. Foss re same (.2)	B 011	2.70	1,215.00
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke and the client re: Prime settlement issues	B 011	0.10	45.00
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Multiple emails with S. Beach, YCST, and client re: Litigation issues a damages analyses	B011 nd	0.20	90.00
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) YCST meeting re: strategy for response to Prime dispostive motions (2.4); confer with E. Edwards re: same (.1)	B011	2.50	1,125.00
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards, A. Mielke, and YCST re: Prime cases dispositive motion (.2); review same (2	B011 .5)	2.70	1,215.00
01/08/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with J. Bell and K. Guer re: expert deposition issues	ke B011	0.10	45.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: non-compete agreement	e B011	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: Hawkins deposition outline	B011	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Heyden and J. Bibiloni sealed documents (Prime)	re: B011	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzyztofik re: service of Newman complaint	B011	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: TC Energy negotiations update	B0 11	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Draft response to motion for summary judgment	B011	1.60	784.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Review deposition testimony in connection with drafting response to motion for summary judgment; draft response to motion for summary judgment	B011	3.10	1,519.00
01/09/20	BFELD	Research re: Prime escrow agreement	B011	0.20	83.00
01/09/20	BOLIV	Prepare deposition spiral binders for Bisnett, Elliott, Rapp and Shumway per request of E. Edwards re Prime NDT	B011	0.50	147.50
01/09/20	BOLIV	Research and coordinate video depositi in Alaska re Prime NDT	on B011	0.40	118.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 32 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoic	e Date: e Number: r Number:	Fel	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/09/20	BOLIV	Assist in preparation deposition material expert testimony and exhibits re of defense of deposition re Prime NDT		1.50	442.50
01/09/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with S. Gray, T. Pakrouh, and K. Guerke (partial) re: preparation for S. Gray deposition (5.1); meet with K. Guerke re: additional preparation issues (.3); meet with T. Pakrouh re: response t motion to strike subcontractor expenses (.1); review deposition transcripts re: responding to Prime's summary judgment (1.1)	0	6.60	4,719.00
01/09/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with client re: employee claims	B011	0.10	77.50
01/09/20	KGUER	Emails with S. Beach and T. Pakrouh re- motion to strike issues	B011	0.10	77.50
01/09/20	KGUER	Emails with B. Olivere and E. Edwards re: deposition prep	B011	0.20	155.00
01/09/20	KGUER	Meeting with S. Beach re: response to motions	B011	0.30	232.50
01/09/20	KGUER	Review Shumway deposition; draft outline re: same	B011	1.70	1,317.50
01/09/20	KGUER	Emails with experts re: deposition	B011	0.20	155.00
01/09/20	KGUER	Meeting with Scott Gray, E. Edwards, T Pakrouh re: deposition prep	. B011	2.70	2,092.50
01/09/20	MMILA	Team meeting re: Transco discovery strategy	B011	0.60	240.00
01/09/20	MMILA	Draft discovery tracker memo re: Transc litigation	eo B011	0.80	320.00
01/09/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Confer with E. Edwards re: responses to Prime's dispositive motions (.1); confer with S. Beach re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	90.00
01/09/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Confer with A. Mielke re: responses to Prime's dispositive motions	B011	0.50	225.00
01/09/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Gray and YCST re: damages analysis	B011	0.10	45.00
01/09/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke and A. Mielke re: Hawkins deposition log	B011	0.10	45.00
01/09/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Review/analyze documents for expert deposition preparation (1.0); multiple emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re same (.2)	B011	1.20	540.00
01/09/20	TPAKR	(Prime) prepare S. Gray with E. Edward and K. Guerke for expert witness deposition	s B011	4.00	1,800.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 33 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		lded Construction, L.P. Invoi Invoi Matte		Feb	ebruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/09/20	TPAKR	(Prime) research Sunoco settlement document issues (.2); emails with B. Feldman, A. Mielke, and S. Beach re same (.1)	B011	0.30	135.00	
01/10/20	AMIEL	Review Prime NDT transcripts in connection with drafting response to motion for summary judgment	B011	5.70	2,793.00	
01/10/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: response motion for summary judgment	to B011	0.40	196.00	
01/10/20	BOLIV	Assist with deposition materials for 1/10/20 deposition defense	B011	0.50	147.50	
01/10/20	BOLIV	Coordinate deposition in Alaska for J Bell re Prime NDT	B 011	0.40	118.00	
01/10/20	BOLIV	Email court reporter and Veritext to inform same of extension for Errata f Renee Bisnett	B011 For	0.30	88.50	
01/10/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review pleadings related to warranty arguments (1.4); email to R Bisnett re: errata (.1); email to B. Oli re: deadline extension for same (.1); review Josh Bell's report and related motion to strike for deposition prepar issues (.9); meet with M. Neiburg re: evidentiary issues (.4); meet with A. Mielke re: objection to summary judgment motion (.4); meet with T. Pakrouh re: motion to preclude subcontractor expenses (.4); meet with Guerke re: direct payment objection a evidence (.3)	vere ration th K.	4.00	2,860.00	
01/10/20	KGUER	Review Shumway deposition; draft outline re: same	B011	1.30	1,007.50	
01/10/20	KGUER	Prepare for Scott Gray deposition; deposition of Scott Gray	B011	6.70	5,192.50	
01/10/20	KGUER	Meeting with K. Enos and consultant EPS claim	tre: B011	0.20	155.00	
01/10/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: motion strike; review rules and research re: s		0.40	310.00	
01/10/20	SBEAC	Work with T. Pakrouh re: objection t Prime direct pay and other dispositive motions (1.1); Review and revise documents re; same (2.1)		3.20	2,672.00	
01/10/20	TPAKR	(Prime) research and draft objection Prime's Motion in Limine to preclude subcontractor direct pay		5.90	2,655.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 34 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoic	e Date: e Number: Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/10/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Confer with E. Edwards re: Prim Motion in Limine issues (.4); emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: same (.1)		0.50	225.00
01/10/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Confer with S. Beach re: stratege and response to Prime's direct pay motion		1.00	450.00
01/10/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Beach re: Prime dispositive motions	B011	0.10	45.00
01/10/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke re: S. Gra deposition issues (.1); confer with S. Gra and K. Guerke re: same (.1)		0.20	90.00
01/10/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with A .Ralph re: Sunoco settlement issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/11/20	AMIEL	Research case law in connection with drafting motion for summary judgment (1.1); review deposition testimony and documentary evidence in connection wit drafting response to motion for summary judgment (10.3)		11.40	5,586.00
01/11/20	EEDWA	Prime: Emails with A. Mielke re: summary judgment issues	B011	0.30	214.50
01/11/20	KGUER	Emails with E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, S. Beach, A. Mielke re: responses to motion	B011 ns	0.30	232.50
01/11/20	KGUER	Review Shumway deposition; draft outline re: same	B011	1.60	1,240.00
01/11/20	KGUER	Review pleadings, docket, and research re: pretrial issues and response to motion	B011 s	0.60	465.00
01/11/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with A. Mielke re: response to MSJ issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/11/20	TPAKR	(Prime) research and draft objection to Prime's Motion in Limine to preclude subcontractor direct pay	B011	5.10	2,295.00
01/11/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, and YCST re: strategy re: objection to direct pay motion (.1); revis objection accordingly (2.4)	B011 e	2.50	1,125.00
01/11/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards re: draft objection to Prime's Motion in Limine to preclude subcontractor direct pay		0.10	45.00
01/11/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, and J. Bell re: expert depositio issues	B011 n	0.10	45.00
01/11/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Emails with R. Ralph and T. Xu re: Sunoco settlement issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/11/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, and A. Mielke Re: Shumway deposition log	B011	0.10	45.00

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	ice Date: ice Number: ter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/12/20	AMIEL	Draft response to motion for summary judgment	B011	11.90	5,831.00
01/12/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review and provide comments draft objection/affidavit to motion in limine to exclude subcontractors exper		0.80	572.00
01/12/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke and E. Edwards response to motion for summary judgment; review background summar re: same		0.30	232.50
01/12/20	KGUER	Teleconference with Josh Bell re: expe report	ert B011	0.10	77.50
01/12/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: response to motion to strike; review same	B011	0.70	542.50
01/12/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards re: revisions to the Prime direct pay object (.1); revise accordingly (2.0)	B011 tion	2.10	945.00
01/12/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke re: objection to motion in limine precludin Bell's testimony (.1); research and draf objection re: same (4.1)		4.20	1,890.00
01/12/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with A. Mielke re: Prin dispositive motion issues	ne B011	0.10	45.00
01/12/20	TPAKR	(Prime) email with S. Beach re: draft objection to Prime's motion to preclude subcontractor direct pay	B011 e	0.10	45.00
01/12/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with A. Mielke, B. Oliv and E. Edwards re: Prime dispositive motion filing issues	vere B011	0.10	45.00
01/12/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Research case law re: direct pa objection	ay B011	5.20	2,340.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, M. Fratticci re: invoice for discovery processing (0.1); review invoice re: san (0.1)		0.20	98.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards re: Prime litigation strategy	B 011	0.20	98.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti and S. Hawkin re: response to motion for summary judgment (0.2); emails with committee counsel and K. O'Reilly re: same (0.1)	e	0.30	147.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. O'Reilly re: comments response to motion for summary judgment (0.1); review comments re: same (0.1)	to B011	0.20	98.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: comments to responsive pleadings in Prime litigatio		0.10	49.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 36 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	vice Date: vice Number: ter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/13/20	AMIEL	Confer with B. Olivere re: exhibits to response to motion for summary judgment (0.3); confer with T. Pakroul re: same (0.2)	B011	0.50	245.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: lien release	B011	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Neuroth re: lien enforcement action	B011	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: response to motion for summary judgment	o B011	0.20	98.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with T. Pakrouh and S. Beach is status of responsive pleadings (0.1); confer with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	re: B011	0.20	98 .00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards re: comments response to motion for summary judgment	to B011	0.30	147.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Revise response to motion for summar judgment	y B011	4.40	2,156.00
01/13/20	BOLIV	Multiple phone calls with IT, Veritext Northern Lights Real Time and Report in Anchorage Alaska re coordinating video deposition for J. Bell		1.50	442.50
01/13/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with A. Mielke re exh production for response to motion Prin NDT's motion for partial summary judgment		0.20	59.00
01/13/20	BOLIV	Research, collect and compile all porti of deposition exhibits referenced in response to motion for summary judgment re Prime NDT	ons B011	3.40	1,003.00
01/13/20	BWALT	Confer with B. Olivere, prepare index deposition designations referenced in brief in opposition to Prime's motion for partial summary judgment		2.40	732.00
01/13/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review and provide comments opposition to motion for summary judgment (1.7); multiple emails with A Mielke and T. Pakrouh re: additional record cites for same (.4); review and provide comment to objection to exclu Bell testimony (.4)	λ.	2.50	1,787.50
01/13/20	JMORT	Research and draft email memo re: meaning of "good" in the 503(b)(9) context	B011	0.40	150.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 37 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/13/20	KGUER	Review motions in limine; review exp report; review and revise response to motion in limine; Review draft answe brief for summary judgment motion		3.00	2,325.00
01/13/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: responsive pleadings, motions, and strategy	B011	0.20	155.00
01/13/20	KGUER	Emails with UCC re: response to mot in limine and summary judgment	ions B011	0.10	77.50
01/13/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with B. Olivere re: B deposition	ell B011	0.10	77.50
01/13/20	KGUER	Meeting with B. Olivere re: Bell deposition	B011	0.20	155.00
01/13/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with E. Edwards re: expert depositions	B011	0.20	155.00
01/13/20	KGUER	Meeting with S. Beach re; response to motion to strike	B011	0.20	155.00
01/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and E. Edward discovery issues	ds re: B011	0.20	135.00
01/13/20	SBEAC	Review and revise Objection to Direc Pay Motion and Pometti declaration (email with T. Pakrouh re: same (.1); Work with T. Pakrouh re same (.2)		3.00	2,505.00
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with T. Pakrouh, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, and A. Mielke re: Prime Pleadings	. B011	0.10	83.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with T. Pakrouh re: Prime litig issues	ation B011	0.10	83.50
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with YCST, and the c the committee and Lewis Brisbois re: objection to Prime's motion to preclue subcontractor direct pay		0.10	45.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Beach and K. Guerke re: declaration ISO objection Prime's motion to preclude subcontra direct pay (.1); revise accordingly (.3)	ctor	0.40	180.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and I Guerke re: revisions to objection to Prime's motion in limine re: Bell's testimony (.1); incorporate same (.8)	K. B011	0.90	405.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Beach re: revise to objection to Prime's motion to precession subcontractor direct pay (.1); incorposisame (1.3)	lude	1.40	630.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 38 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Beach re: revis to declaration ISO objection to Prime' motion to preclude subcontractor dire pay (.1); incorporate same (1.4)	sions B011 's	1.50	675.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and A Mielke re: Prime MSJ document issue and deposition testimony issues		0.20	90.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with YCST, and the cl the committee and Lewis Brisbois re: draft responses to Prime's dispositive motions		0.10	45.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with A .Ralph re: Sund settlement issues	oco B011	0.10	45.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with A. Mielke, B. Oli and E. Edwards, re: Prime dispositive motion filing issues		0.10	45.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	(Prime) research case law re: direct pa objection (4.9); confer with A. Mielko same (.1)		5.00	2,250.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: deposition transcript excerpts in connection with compiling exhibits for response to mo for summary judgment (0.1); review transcripts re: same (0.2)	L	0.30	147.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Review/revise objection to motion in limine	B011	2.10	1,029.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: comments response to motion for summary judgment	s to B011	0.20	98.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Review motion to seal objection and related pleadings (0.3); review redact documents in connection with same (0.80	392.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Review deposition transcripts and pul excerpts for response to motion for summary judgment	ll B011	0.50	245.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Review/revise response to motion for summary judgment	B011	2.20	1,078.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Review/revise response to motion for summary judgment	B011	2.20	1,078.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: declaration support of objection to Prime's motion limine		0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards and S. Beach response to motion to exclude direct pevidence		0.70	343.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 39 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: exhibits to objection to motion in limine (0.1); review supporting documents in connection with same (0.1)		0.20	98.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. O'Reilly re: comments objection to Prime's motion in limine	s to B011	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti and S. Hawkin re: comments to response to motion for summary judgment		0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Hawkins re: comments objection to Prime's motion in limine	s to B011	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: exhibits to response to motion for summary judgment	B011	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: comments objection to motion in limine (0.1); er with E. Edwards and S. Beach re: sam (0.1); emails with E. Edwards re: sam (0.1)	nails ne	0.30	147.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Assist in anticipation of filing of vario briefs and objections re Prime NDT	ous B011	2.70	796.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Review local rules re motion to seal in adversary matter	n B011	0.20	59.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Review, extract and assemble all deposition transcript references re Shumway re response to motion for summary judgment	B011	0.70	206.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of seal motion re objection to motion limine		0.40	118.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Phone call with deposition company i Alaska, Northern Lights, re set up for 1/15/20 J. Bell deposition		0.20	59.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Prepare exhibit to objection to direct protion in anticipation of filing	pay B011	0.90	265.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Update and compile all exhibits in fin order re response to Prime's motion for summary judgment		0.70	206.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of Welded's objection to exclusion of Bell testimony re Prime NDT		0.40	118.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Phone call with IT re Alaskan deposit details (.1); follow-up emails with IT same (.2)		0.30	88.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of Welded's response to Prime's motion for summary judgment re Prime NDT	on	1.00	295.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 40 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Welded Construction, L.P. Inv Inv Ma		Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/14/20	BOLIV	Email K. Guerke and E. Edwards confirming details of deposition of J. in Alaska	B011 Bell	0.10	29.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Compile EX C to objection to direct motion	pay B011	0.20	59.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate served of [Sealed] objection to Prime's Moti Limine to Preclude Evidence of Subcontractor		0.40	118.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate served of [Redacted] objection to Prime's M in Limine to Preclude Evidence of Subcontractor		0.50	147.50
01/14/20	DLASK	Monitor electronic docket regarding Newman Tractor litigation	B011	0.30	91.50
01/14/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: open issues/strategy (.5); review draft objections/opposition re: same (1.6); with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: objections to Prime's motion for sum judgment and motions in limine (.9); teleconference with J. Bell re: deposi preparation (2.0); meet with K. Guerf same (.5); meet with T. Pakrouh re: c pay objection (.2); meet with A. Miel re: further revisions to opposition to summary judgment (.3); review and r direct pay objection (2.7); multiple ca with T. Pakrouh and A. Mielke re: sa (.4); multiple emails with S. Beach an Mielke re: revisions to same (.3); furt revise direct pay objection (1.1); furt revise and finalize objection to motion limine to exlude Bell testimony (.5); review and provide comments to motion to file under seal (.2); telephone to T. Pakrouh re: same (.1)	meet mary ition ke re: lirect lke revise alls me nd A. ther her on in	11.30	8,079.50
01/14/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: Trial pr and Bell deposition	ep B011	0.40	310.00
01/14/20	KGUER	Teleconference and Emails with M. Heyden re: depositions	B011	0.30	232.50
01/14/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with SBEAC, EEDV AMEIL, TPAKR re: responses to SJI and motions in limine, strategy, and t prep	М	0.30	232.50
01/14/20	KGUER	Emails with Josh Bell re: deposition	B011	0.10	77.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 41 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/14/20	KGUER	Review and revise response to SJM as motions in limine; review edits to sam	nd B011	1.00	775.00
01/14/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: briefing responses and trial strategy and depositions	B011	0.20	155.00
01/14/20	SBEAC	Emails with T. Pakrouh, K. Guerke, E Edwards, and A. Mielke re: Sunoco Termination Letter and Prime damage issues (.2); Review and revise docume re: response to multiple Prime disposi motions (2.4); Review and revise mul objections re: same (3.6)	es ents tive	6.20	5,177.00
01/14/20	SBEAC	Email with E. Edwards re: Prime Responsive Pleadings	B011	0.10	83.50
01/14/20	SBEAC	Meeting with E. Edwards and A. Mie re: Prime objections to dispositive motions and litigation strategy	lke B011	0.80	668.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, and S. Beach re: revisions to objection to direct pay motion (.2); incorporate same (.4)	B011 o	0.60	270.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Emails with B. Olivere re: preparing objection to direct pay moti exhibits	B011 on	0.10	45.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) finalize and file sealing motion re: objection to Prime's direct pay motion in limine (.5); emails with E. Edwards B. Olivere re: same (.1)	tion	0.60	270.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Finalize and file objection to Prime's direct pay motion in limine (.4 emails with E. Edwards and B. Oliver same (.2); confer with A. Mielke re: s (.2)	e re:	0.80	360.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Finalize and file objection to Bell's motion in limine (.4); emails wi E. Edwards and B. Olivere re: same (.		0.60	270.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) apply redactions to objection Prime's direct pay motion in limine	to B011	1.00	450.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) teleconferences with F. Pome re: declaration ISO objection to Prime direct pay motion in limine (.3); multi emails with the client and YCST re: summary of same (.2)	e's	0.50	225.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) teleconferences with B. Olive re: responses to Prime's dispositive motions issues	ere B011	0.40	180.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 42 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ice Date: ice Number: er Number:	e Number:	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with YCST and the Lew Brisbois re: revisions to objection to Prime's direct pay motion in limine (.1) incorporate same (.1)		0.20	90.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with YCST and the clien re: draft responses to Prime's dispositiv motions		0.10	45.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with YCST and the committee re: committee revisions to objection to Prime's direct pay motion i limine (.1); incorporate same (.1)	B011	0.20	90.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with S. Beach re: researce case law for objection to direct pay motion (.1); research and revise objection to include same (3.1)		3.20	1,440.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) conferences with E. Edwards (. and A. Mielke (.6) re: revisions to objection to Prime's direct pay motion i limine and multiple emails with E. Edwards and A. Mielke re: same (.2)		1.40	630.00
01/14/20	TPAKR	(Prime) draft sealing motion re: objective to Prime's direct pay motion in limine (1.0); emails with A. Mielke and E. Edwards re: same (.2);	on B011	1.20	540.00
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Leamy re: service of pleadings in Prime adversary proceedin (0.1); emails with J. Bibiloni re: same (0.1)	B011 ng	0.20	98.00
01/15/20	BOLIV	Monitor completion of J. Bell deposition to retrieve equipment and return to IT r Prime NDT		0.70	206.50
01/15/20	BOLIV	Assist with deposition materials needed during the course of J. Bell deposition	B011	0.50	147.50
01/15/20	BOLIV	Assist in coordination details and communications between IT and Alask deposition company re J. Bell deposition re Prime NDT		0.40	118.00
01/15/20	BOLIV	Read and respond to email re extended deadline for Errata for R. Bisnett	B011	0.10	29.50
01/15/20	BOLIV	Research, locate and forward Errata she re R. Bisnett	eet B011	0.20	59.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 43 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	ice Date: ice Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/15/20	EEDWA	Prime: Telephone to T. Pakrouh re: pretrial stipulation (.1); meet with B. Olivere re: deposition preparation (.1); telephone to J. Bell re: deposition (.1); meet with K. Guerke re: Bell depositio and other case planning (.4); defend Jo Bell deposition (5.2); telephone to K. Guerke re: same (.2); telephone to J. B re: same (.1); emails with T. Pakrouh r Bisnett errata (.2)	sh ell	6.40	4,576.00
01/15/20	KGUER	Prepare for Defense expert deposition; review outline re: same	B011	1.00	775.00
01/15/20	KGUER	Teleconference with E. Edwards re: Be Deposition	ell B011	0.20	155.00
01/15/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: Bell deposition	B011	0.20	155.00
01/15/20	KGUER	Review notice of Bell deposition	B011	0.10	77.50
01/15/20	KGUER	Teleconference with T. Pakrouh re: deposition issues	B011	0.20	155.00
01/15/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: trial prep and expert witnesses	B011	0.40	310.00
01/15/20	KGUER	Review errata sheet	B011	0.20	155.00
01/15/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and M. Fratticc re: e-discovery issues	i B011	0.20	135.00
01/15/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti re: Prime Respo to MSJ	nse B011	0.10	83.50
01/15/20	TPAKR	Email with K. Enos re: litigation issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/15/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with E. Edwards re: drafting joint pretrial memorandum (.1 research same (3.4); emails with E. Edwards re: summary of same (.1)	B011);	3.60	1,620.00
01/15/20	TPAKR	(Prime) draft Bisnet errata sheet (1.0); emails with E. Edwards re: same (.1)	B011	1.10	495.00
01/15/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with YCST, UST and t committee re: responses to Prime's dispositive motions	he B011	0.10	45.00
01/15/20	TPAKR	(Prime) Confer with K. Guerke re: Bis errata sheet issues (.2); research same (1.0); emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: summary of same (.1)	nett B011	1.30	585.00
01/15/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and R Bisnett re: erratta sheet issues (.1); ema with E. Edwards and B. Olivere re: sar (.1)	ails	0.20	90.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 44 of 86

Welded Co	nstruction, L.P.	Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Fel	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/16/20	BOLIV	Contact Veritext re changing turn-arc time of J. Bell deposition to "next day		0.10	29.50
01/16/20	BOLIV	Compile a condensed version of S. Elliott's deposition without exhibits f Guerke	B011 For K.	0.30	88.50
01/16/20	BOLIV	Research, locate and forward transcrift from 11/6 and 11/18 Prime NDT hea		0.10	29.50
01/16/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with T. Pakrouh re t exhibit prep	rial B011	0.20	59.00
01/16/20	BWALT	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: proposed pretrial order	joint B011	0.30	91.50
01/16/20	EEDWA	Prime: Work on trial preparation issu (.9); meet with T. Pakrouh and K. Gure: same (1.2)		2.10	1,501.50
01/16/20	KGUER	Prepare for defense expert deposition	n B011	0.50	387.50
01/16/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with opposing couns defense expert deposition	sel re: B011	0.10	77.50
01/16/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: defense e deposition	expert B011	0.20	155.00
01/16/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards and T. Pak re: trial prep and pretrial stipulation	rouh B011	1.50	1,162.50
01/16/20	MFRAT	Williams litigation - Correspondence A. Mielke re: case budget preparation information needed related to cost of services	n and	0.10	17.50
01/16/20	MMILA	Revise and update Transco discovery tracker and timeline	y B011	0.20	80.00
01/16/20	MMILA	Meeting with Litigation team re: Tra strategy	nsco B011	0.70	280.00
01/16/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and Guerke re: trial planning issues (.1); confer with E. Edwards and K. Guer same (1.0)		1.10	495.00
01/16/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke re: analyzing S. Gray's analysis of Rimk report and drafting deposition question (.1); analyze and draft same (2.0)		2.10	945.00
01/17/20	BOLIV	Copy all deposition exhibits for Parc coordinate printing of same for trial		0.50	147.50
01/17/20	BOLIV	Research, locate and collect previous deposition exhibit binders in anticipa of trial prep needs		0.30	88.50
01/17/20	BOLIV	Emails to S. Gray and J. Bell re trial accommodations	B011	0.20	59.00

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/17/20	BOLIV	Call with T. Pakrouh re trail prep for Prime NDT	B011	0.10	29.50
01/17/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with B. Walters re tr prep oraganization and planning re Pr NDT		1.00	295.00
01/17/20	BOLIV	Emails with Veritext requesting expen- turn-around time for 1/10/20 depo of Greyre Prime NDT		0.20	59.00
01/17/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with E. Edwards re t prep	rial B011	0.40	118.00
01/17/20	BWALT	Confer with B. Olivere re: trial preparation (1.0); prepare excel sheet trial exhibits, and enter deposition exhibits (4.2)	B011 for	5.20	1,586.00
01/17/20	DLASK	Review and update Newman Tractor litigation dockets	B011	0.30	91.50
01/17/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: with planning (.3); email to J, Bell re: trial planning (.2); email to S. Gray re: tria planning (.2); emails with T. Pakrouh K. Guerke re: pretrial conference and memo (.2); meet with B. Olivere re: t planning (.3)	ıl and	1.20	858.00
01/17/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re; prep trial issues	p B011	0.10	77.50
01/17/20	KGUER	Review Elliott deposition; outline san	ne B011	2.40	1,860.00
01/17/20	KGUER	Teleconference (x2) with opposing counsel re: expert report and deposition	B011 on	0.20	155.00
01/17/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with T. Pakrouh and Edwards re: pretrial stipulation and pretrial conference	E. B011	0.20	155.00
01/17/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: experts trial prep	and B011	0.20	155.00
01/17/20	KGUER	Emails with experts re: trial schedulir	ng B011	0.10	77.50
01/17/20	KGUER	Prepare for defense expert deposition	B011	0.50	387.50
01/17/20	KGUER	Review draft pre-trial stipulation	B011	0.30	232.50
01/17/20	MFRAT	Williams litigation - data analysis to prepare budget for attorney review ar reviewed vendor quote for eDiscover services		1.00	175.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 46 of 86

Welded Co	nstruction, L.P.	Inve	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/17/20	TPAKR	(Prime) research joint pretrial memo issues (1.0); emails with YCST (.2) ar B. Olivere (.1) re: same	B 011	1.30	585.00
01/17/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and K Guerke re: pretrial conference issues (confer with E. Edwards re: same (.4)		0.50	225.00
01/17/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails from E. Edwards, K. Guerke and experts re: trial preparatio	B011	0.10	45.00
01/18/20	BWALT	Prepare speadsheet/index of all deposi exhibits re Prime adversary	ition B011	4.50	1,372.50
01/18/20	KGUER	Review Scott Elliott transcript; draft outline re: same; prepare for trial	B011	2.50	1,937.50
01/19/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review Shumway/Hakins deposition transcripts for trial preparat (2.2); work on S. Gray direct preparat (.9)		3.10	2,216.50
01/20/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: Earth Pipelir Services materials	ne B011	0.10	49.00
01/20/20	BOLIV	Trial preparations: exhibit binders; de binders and spread sheet of exhibits re Prime NDT		2.80	826.00
01/20/20	BOLIV	Download and circulate S. Gray deposition re Prime NDT	B011	0.20	59.00
01/20/20	EEDWA	Prime: Work on direct of Scott Gray	B011	1.60	1,144.00
01/20/20	KGUER	Emails with B. Olivere re: Gray deposition	B011	0.10	77.50
01/20/20	KGUER	Review defense expert reports and summaries; review Ankura report; dra deposition outline	B011 .ft	2.10	1,627.50
01/20/20	MMILA	Research and drafting insert for Willia discovery memo	ams B011	1.10	440.00
01/20/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with B. Olivere, E. Edwards, and K. Guerke re: S. Gray deposition transcript and exhibit issue	B011 s	0.10	45.00
01/20/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with B. Olivere re: dra trial exhibit list	ft B011	0.10	45.00
01/20/20	TPAKR	(Prime) draft joint pretrial memo	B011	5.10	2,295.00
01/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Fratticci re: discovery invoices (0.1); emails with A. Ralph r same (0.1)		0.20	98.00
01/21/20	BOLIV	Confer with E. Edwards re status of deponents exhibit binders; excel sheet all exhibits and forthcoming expert testimony exhibits re Prime NDT	B011 a of	0.10	29.50

Welded Construction, L.P.		Ided Construction, L.P. Invoice I Invoice N Invoice N Matter N Internet		Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/21/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with T. Pakrouh re statu of exhibit list; items needed from expert report re Prime NDT	us B011	0.20	59.00
01/21/20	BOLIV	Finalize first set of full exhibit binders of all deponents	B011	0.40	118.00
01/21/20	BOLIV	Download and circulate J. Bell depositio and exhibit to working group re Prime NDT	n B011	0.10	29.50
01/21/20	BOLIV	Review schedules in supplemental exper report of S. Gray [Ankura] for insertion into exhibit list	t B011	0.50	147.50
01/21/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: planning (.2); meet with B. Olivere re: potential exhibits (.1); emails with M. Heyden re: pretrial date (.1); emails with T. Pakrouh and K. Guerke re: draft pretrial order (.2) teleconference with T. Pakrouh re: exhibits list planning (.2));	0.80	572.00
01/21/20	KGUER	Email with counsel re: pretrial stipulation	n B011	0.10	77.50
01/21/20	KGUER	Review expert materials; Meeting with T Pakrouh re: expert depositions	. B011	0.80	620.00
01/21/20	MFRAT	Review billing from DLS and organizing charges per adversary proceeding	g B011	1.50	262.50
01/21/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with B. Olivere and B. Walters re: trial exhibit issues (.2); email with B. Olivere and B. Walters re: same (.1)	B011 s	0.30	135.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with B. Walters re: draft trial exhibit list	B011	0.10	45.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke re: Weiland deposition strategy	B011	0.10	45.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	Correspondence with A. Mielke, S. Beach, K. Enos and committee counsel r litigation issues	B011 e:	0.10	45.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: Prime joint pretrial Memo (.1); revise accordingly (1.5)	B011	1.60	720.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: trial strategy issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with B. Olivere re: Welde trial issues	ed B011	0.20	90.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with K. Guerke re: Weiland deposition strategy (.5); researc documents re: same (.5)	B011 h	1.00	450.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 48 of 86

Welded Co	nstruction, L.P.	In	voice Date: voice Number: latter Number:	Fet	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Fratticci re: discover costs analysis		0.10	49.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Review Prime's objection to motion amend the complaint	to B011	0.40	196.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Confer with T. Pakrouh re: Prime's objection to motion to amend	B011	0.20	98.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: reply to Prime's objection to Welded's motion amend the complaint	B011 n to	1.30	637.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Stiff re: scheduling a settlement conference	B011	0.10	49.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: discovery of for litigation	costs B011	0.20	98.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Fetchik re: status of Newman tractor complaint	B011	0.10	49.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Analyze discovery costs (0.3) and se summary to A. Ralph (0.1)	end B011	0.40	196.00
01/22/20	BOLIV	Draft notice of pretrial conference for 2/6/20 re Prime NDT	or B011	0.30	88.50
01/22/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with T. Pakrouh and Walters re exhibit list	d B. B011	0.20	59.00
01/22/20	BOLIV	Continued preparation of exhibits, schedules, and various other binders trial prep in anticipation of Prime NI trial		2.70	796.50
01/22/20	BOLIV	Continue to update exhibit list for inclusion into joint pretrial memo re Prime NDT	B011	2.20	649.00
01/22/20	BOLIV	Circulate objection by Prime NDT to motion to amend complaint	o B011	0.10	29.50
01/22/20	BWALT	Emails with B. Olivere, T. Pakrouh (confer with B. Olivere (.2); add expe materials to draft exhibit list (1.8)		2.30	701.50
01/22/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review objection to motion t amend (.5); meet with A. Mielke re: response to same (1.4)	o B011	1.90	1,358.50
01/22/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with E. Edwards and Pakrouh re: response to motion to an pre-trial stipulation, exhibits		0.20	155.00
01/22/20	KGUER	Review response to motion to amend	d B011	0.30	232.50
01/22/20	KGUER	Emails with expert re: invoice	B011	0.10	77.50
01/22/20	MFRAT	Analyzing data for billing and sent roto A. Mielke	eport B011	1.00	175.00

Welded Construction, L.P.		Ided Construction, L.P. Invoice I Invoice N Invoice N Matter N Internet		Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/22/20	MMILA	Revise Transco litigation and discovery tracker	B011	0.20	80.00
01/22/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: objection to motion for leav to amend	ve B011	0.30	202.50
01/22/20	SBEAC	Emails with T. Buchanan and S. Hawkin re: coating expert retention	ns B011	0.20	167.00
01/22/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with Prime counsel, E. Edwards, and K. Guerke re: pretrial conference and Wieland deposition	B01 1	0.10	45.00
01/22/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, B. Olivere and B. Walters re: joint pretrial memorandum and trial exhibit list	B011	0.10	45.00
01/22/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails (.1) and conferences (.2) with B. Olivere and B. Walters re: Prime trial exhibit list		0.30	135.00
01/23/20	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: reply to Prime' objection to motion to amend complaint		0.20	98.00
01/23/20	AMIEL	Research case law in support of reply to Prime's objection to motion to amend th complaint		2.10	1,029.00
01/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: expert deposition invoice	B011	0.10	49.00
01/23/20	BOLIV	Review with T. Pakrouh all exhibits in trial prep room for Prime NDT trial	B011	0.40	118.00
01/23/20	BOLIV	Review and respond to emails re locatio of all exhibits and transferring of same r Prime NDT		0.10	29.50
01/23/20	BOLIV	Further preparation of additional materia for trial re Prime NDT	als B011	1.20	354.00
01/23/20	BOLIV	Research, locate and circulate J. Bell deposition in condensed version	B011	0.10	29.50
01/23/20	BOLIV	Coordinate court reporter/video deposition for 1/27/20 re Gary Wieland Prime NDT	B011 re	0.20	59.00
01/23/20	BOLIV	Draft notice of deposition of G. Wieland for 1/27/20 re Prime NDT	B011	0.30	88.50
01/23/20	BOLIV	Additional trial prep re Prime NDT re depositions without exhibits	B011	0.80	236.00
01/23/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of deposition re Gary Wieland on 1/27/20 re Prime NDT		0.20	59.00
01/23/20	BOLIV	Coordinate scheduling of conference room for deposition of G. Wieland on 1/27/20 re Prime NDT	B011	0.10	29.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 50 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/23/20	BOLIV	Draft email to P. Null of Precise Inc [tri experts] requesting services for 2/18 through 2/21 for Prime NDT trial [.1]; phone call from P. Null re same [.1]	al B011	0.20	59.00
01/23/20	BWALT	Confer with B. Olivere re: vendor for tr	ial B011	0.30	91.50
01/23/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with B. Olivere re: Wieland deposition and deposition transcripts	B011	0.20	155.00
01/23/20	KGUER	Review exhibit list	B011	0.30	232.50
01/23/20	KGUER	Review notice of Wieland deposition	B011	0.10	77.50
01/23/20	KGUER	Review draft pre-trial stipulation	B0 11	0.40	310.00
01/23/20	KGUER	Review expert reports; prepare for Wieland deposition	B011	2.00	1,550.00
01/23/20	MNEIB	Review order reassigning cases and adversary to Judge Sontchi	B011	0.10	67.50
01/23/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke re: researching consulting expert issues (.1) research and draft memo on same (2.1)	B011);	2.20	990.00
01/23/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with B. Olivere re: Prime trial exhibits (.1); emails with B. Oliver re: same (.1)		0.20	90.00
01/24/20	AMIEL	Continue researching case law in suppo of reply to Prime's objection to amend complaint (1.6); draft portions of reply (1.2)	rt B011	2.80	1,372.00
01/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach, S. Hawkins, K. Guerke, and E. Edwards re: Prime statu update	B011 s	0.10	49.00
01/24/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate servic of affidavit of service re filings from 1/14/20	e B011	0.20	59.00
01/24/20	BOLIV	Draft affidavit of service re multiple filings from 1/14/20	B011	0.20	59.00
01/24/20	BOLIV	Consult with K. Guerke re trial expert contract and various other trial needs re Prime NDT	B011	0.20	59.00
01/24/20	BOLIV	Phone call from Veritext to finalize details re deposition of G. Wieland on 1/27/20	B011	0.10	29.50
01/24/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with T. Pakrouh re: exhibi (1.5); meet with T. Pakrouh and K. Guerke re: trial preparation and PTO (2		4.30	3,074.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 51 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	Description	Task	Hours	Amount
01/24/20	KGUER	Emails with E. Edwards re: PTO and Exhibits	B011	0.10	77.50
01/24/20	KGUER	Meetings with E. Edwards and T. Pakro re: PTO, exhibit list, and trial prep	ouh B011	1.60	1,240.00
01/24/20	KGUER	Review trial vendor contract	B011	0.30	232.50
01/24/20	KGUER	Prepare for Wieland expert deposition	B011	0.70	542.50
01/24/20	MMILA	Revise Transco litigation and discovery tracker	B011	0.20	80.00
01/24/20	SBEAC	Emails and work with K. Guerke re: Prime litigation strategy issues	B011	0.30	250.50
01/24/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke, YCST, and the Client re: Prime trial strategy issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/24/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: case strategy issues	B011	1.50	675.00
01/24/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with E. Edwards re: join pretrial memo revisions (.6); case strate (1.5); and trial exhibit (.6) issues; multi emails with E. Edwards re: same (.2)	gy	1.70	765.00
01/25/20	AMIEL	Draft reply to motion to amend compla (4.1); research and analyze case law in support of same (2.2)	int B011	6.30	3,087.00
01/25/20	EEDWA	Prime: Email from/telephone from A. Mielke re: reply in support of motion to amend	B011	0.90	643.50
01/25/20	KGUER	Review research from T. Pakrouh re: expert issues and witness outline	B011	0.40	310.00
01/25/20	KGUER	Prepare for expert deposition; Review expert reports; draft expert outline; revi research for same	B011 iew	4.40	3,410.00
01/25/20	KGUER	Review and prepare PTO	B011	0.30	232.50
01/25/20	KGUER	Review reply brief re: motion to amend	B011	0.40	310.00
01/25/20	TPAKR	(Prime) research and draft memo re: consulting expert issues (3.0); emails w K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: same (.1		3.10	1,395.00
01/26/20	AMIEL	Revise reply to motion to amend complaint	B011	1.90	931.00
01/26/20	EEDWA	Prime: Review and provide comments draft reply in support of motion to ame complaint (1.1); work on trial preparati (1.7)	nd	2.80	2,002.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 52 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/26/20	KGUER	Prepare for expert deposition; Review expert reports; draft expert outline; re- research for same	B011	4.40	3,410.00
01/26/20	KGUER	Review reply brief re: motion to amer	nd B011	0.40	310.00
01/26/20	KGUER	Review research from T. Pakrouh re: expert issues and witness outline	B011	0.40	310.00
01/26/20	KGUER	Review and prepare PTO	B011	0.30	232.50
01/26/20	KGUER	Prepare for expert deposition; Review expert reports; draft expert outline; re- research for same		4.40	3,410.00
01/26/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke re: researching documents issues (.1); research same (.2)	B011	0.30	135.00
01/26/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, A. Mielke re: motion to amer issues	B011 nd	0.10	45.00
01/26/20	TPAKR	(Prime) revise joint pretrial memo (1.0 and exhibit list (4.5); emails with B. Olivere, B. Walters, E. Edwards and F Guerke re: same (.2)		5.70	2,565.00
01/26/20	TPAKR	(Prime) teleconference with S. Gray red document issues (.1); emails with S. C re: same (.1)		0.20	90.00
01/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards, F. Pometti, a S. Hawkins re: reply to Prime's object to motion to amend complaint		0.10	49.00
01/27/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: Prime tria preparation	l B011	0.60	294.00
01/27/20	BOLIV	Format excel spread sheet containing proposed exhibits for joint pretrial summary motion	all B011	0.40	118.00
01/27/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with T. Pakrouh re jo exhibit for Prime NDT and breaking down bates numbers for supplemental Ankura exhibit		0.40	118.00
01/27/20	BOLIV	Confer with T. Pakrouh re check list i for joint pretrial motion and pre trial conference	tems B011	0.20	59.00
01/27/20	BOLIV	Enter all bates numbers [start/stop] fo ACG supplemental expert report re Pr NDT		0.80	236.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 53 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/27/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with A. Mielke re: reply a related trial evidence issues (.6); meet with T. Pakrouh re: exhibits and pretria memo (.6); review and revise pretrial memo (1.1); review exhibit list (.9); me with K. Guerke and T. Pakrouh re: PTC and other trial preparation issues (1.4); telephone to T. Pakrouh re: revisions to exhibit list (.2); review and revise transmittal email of pretrial memo (.1)	l et)	4.90	3,503.50
01/27/20	KGUER	Deposition of Gary Wieland	B011	6.00	4,650.00
01/27/20	KGUER	Review and revise PTO; Meeting with Edwards and T. Pakrouh re: same and trial planning	E. B011	1.40	1,085.00
01/27/20	KGUER	Review and revise expert deposition outline; prepare exhibits; prepare for Wieland deposition	B011	1.70	1,317.50
01/27/20	KGUER	Emails with E. Edwards and T. Pakroul re: PTO and Exhibit list	n B011	0.20	155.00
01/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: written discovery	B011	0.20	135.00
01/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B011	0.20	135.00
01/27/20	MNEIB	Review case timeline memo	B011	0.20	135.00
01/27/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke, F. Pometti and Hawkins re: response to objection to motion to amend complaint (.1); Review and revise same (.4)		0.50	417.50
01/27/20	TPAKR	(Prime) correspondence with Prime counsel, E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: Joint pretrial memo and exhibit list	B011	0.10	45.00
01/27/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with E. Edwards re: tria exhibit list issues	l B011	0.20	90.00
01/27/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with B. Olivere re: trial exhibit list preparation issues	B011	0.20	90.00
01/27/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards re: revision to joint pretrial memorandum (.1); incorporate same (.3)	B011	0.40	180.00
01/27/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with S. Gray re: docume analysis issues (.1); teleconference with E. Edwards and S. Gray re: same (.2)		0.30	135.00
01/27/20	TPAKR	(Prime) revise trial exhibit list (1.1); emails with B. Olivere, E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: same (.1)	B011 I	1.20	540.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 54 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Ir	avoice Date: avoice Number: latter Number:	Feb	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
01/27/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with E. Edwards and Guerke re: trial strategy issues	K. B011	0.60	270.00	
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with D. Laskin re: Newman tractor litigation	B011	0.10	49.00	
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: Prime settlement offer	B011	0.10	49.00	
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: settlement lien litigation (0.1); review settleme agreements re: same (0.3)		0.40	196.00	
01/28/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: Prime litigation strategy (0.2); review reply Prime's objection to Welded's motio amend the complaint in preparation (0.7); confer with B. Olivere re: sam (0.1)	n to to file	1.00	490.00	
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards and F. Pom re: status call to discuss Prime litiga		0.10	49.00	
01/28/20	BOLIV	Meet and confer with T. Pakrouh re coordinating travel plans for various witnesses re trial with Prime NDT		0.20	59.00	
01/28/20	BOLIV	Draft affidavit of service re Welded reply brief re Prime's objection to m to amend complaint		0.10	29.50	
01/28/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate se of notice of pre-trial conference on February 6, 2020	rvice B011	0.20	59.00	
01/28/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate se of Welded's reply brief in support of motion for leave to amend the comp	f its	0.40	118.00	
01/28/20	BOLIV	Update notice of pretrial conference	B011	0.10	29.50	
01/28/20	BOLIV	Read and respond to email re timing filing of response to Prime's objection motion to amend complaint		0.10	29.50	
01/28/20	DLASK	Update electronic dockets for Newn Tractor litigation	nan B011	0.30	91.50	

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoic	e Date: e Number: · Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/28/20	EEDWA	Prime: Telephone to T. Pakrouh re: completion of briefing and related items (.2); emails with B. Olivere re: notice of pretrial (.1); meet with K. Guerke re: ope issues and planning (.3); revise draft emails to M. Heyden and D. Gadsen re: completion of briefing and any argument (.3)l emails with K. Guerke re: same (.1) work on direct for S. Gray (2.1); emails with K. Guerke re: settlement offer (.1); telephone from T. Pakrouh re: draft email about completion of briefing (.1); review and sign off on reply in support of motion to amend complaint (.3)	en t ;	3.60	2,574.00	
01/28/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: pre trial pre and pending motions	ep B011	0.40	310.00	
01/28/20	KGUER	Prepare for trial; draft witness outlines	B011	1.60	1,240.00	
01/28/20	KGUER	Email with expert witness re: trial schedule	B011	0.10	77.50	
01/28/20	KGUER	Teleconference with Mr. Heyden re: settlement and damages	B011	0.20	155.00	
01/28/20	KGUER	Review docket	B011	0.20	155.00	
01/28/20	KGUER	Meeting S. Beach re: settlement	B011	0.20	155.00	
01/28/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with client re: settlemen	t B011	0.20	155.00	
01/28/20	KGUER	Email with opposing counsel re: PTO an trial exhibit list	d B011	0.10	77.50	
01/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: case status issues	B011	0.20	135.00	
01/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B011	0.20	135.00	
01/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery issues	B011	0.10	67.50	
01/28/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with E. Edwards re: Rene Bisnet errata sheet (.1); emails with EE and R. Bisnet re: errata sheet (.1)	e B011	0.20	90.00	
01/28/20	TPAKR	(Prime) research Rimkus document issue (.3); emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: summary of same (.1)	es B011	0.40	180.00	
01/28/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with J. Bell, E. Edwards, K. Guerke, and B. Olivere re: J. Bell tria testimony		0.10	45.00	
01/28/20	TPAKR	Emails with YCST and the client re: Prime settlement issues	B011	0.10	45.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 56 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/28/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with Prime counsel re: correspondence with Court re: pretrial conference issues (.1); correspondence with Court, Prime counsel, E. Edward and K. Guerke re: same (.1)		0.20	90.00
01/28/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with E. Edwards re: correspondence with Court re: pretrial conference issues (.2); emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: same (.1)	B011	0.30	135.00
01/29/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach, F. Pom E. Edwards, K. Guerke re: Prime litigation strategy	etti, B011	1.10	539.00
01/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with E. Edwards re: Prime ND pleadings and motion practice	T B011	0.10	49.00
01/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with L. Murley re: meet and confer to discuss electronic discovery	B011	0.10	49.00
01/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: lien settleme (0.1); review lien settlements (0.1)	nts B011	0.20	98.00
01/29/20	AMIEL	Confer with E. Edwards re: telephonic status conference and court questions Prime litigation		0.10	49.00
01/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with D. Laskin re: Newman Tractor lien litigation	B011	0.10	49.00
01/29/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate servi of notice of telephonic status conferen on 2/3/20		0.20	59.00
01/29/20	BOLIV	Prepare 2 binders regarding motion fo leave to amend the complaint to cham		0.70	206.50
01/29/20	BOLIV	Download and circulate G. Weiland deposition transcript	B011	0.10	29.50
01/29/20	BOLIV	Circulate notice of completion of brief	ing B011	0.10	29.50
01/29/20	BOLIV	Coordinate preparation of Weiland deposition for trial preparations re Prin NDT	B011 ne	0.10	29.50
01/29/20	BOLIV	Draft notice of telephonic status conference for 2/3/20 re Prime NDT pretrial conference	B011	0.30	88.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 57 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	ice Date: ice Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/29/20	EEDWA	Prime: Telephone from R. Werkheiser recent adversary pleadings (.2); email t M. Heyden re: same (.1); email from D Gadsen re: telephonic status conference (.1); review and sign notice of same (.1 teleconference with S. Hawkin, F. Pometti, S. Beach, K. Guerke, and A. Mielke re: same (1.1); telephone to A. Mielke re: motion to amend (.4); work S. Gray direct issues (.9)	o ;	2.90	2,073.50
01/29/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Heyden re: notice of completion of briefing and communications with the court	B011	0.20	155.00
01/29/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke and client re: El claim status	PS B011	0.10	77.50
01/29/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: expert repo back up documents	rt B011	0.10	77.50
01/29/20	KGUER	Prepare for trial; draft witness outlines	B011	1.70	1,317.50
01/29/20	KGUER	Review notice of completion of briefin	g B011	0.10	77.50
01/29/20	KGUER	Meeting and Teleconference with YCS team and client re: trial prep and settlement	T B011	1.50	1,162.50
01/29/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: litigation strategy and discovery issues	B011	1.30	877.50
01/29/20	SBEAC	Emails with K. Guerke and J. Marasco Williams litigation (.1); Review documents re same (.5)	re: B011	0.60	501.00
01/29/20	SBEAC	Emails with B. Olivere re Prime - Notion of Telephonic Status Conference and review same (.1); Review Prime litigat and settlement issues re: preparation for client strategy call (.7)	ion	0.80	668.00
01/29/20	SBEAC	Call with K. Guerke, F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, E. Edwards and A. Mielke re Prime Update, settlement and litigation strategy (1.1); Work with K. Guerke pr to and after call re; same (.5)	L	1.60	1,336.00
01/29/20	TPAKR	(Prime) confer with B. Olivere re: statu conference issues	ıs B011	0.10	45.00
01/29/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with B. Olivere re: Prin completion of briefing issues (.1); ema with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: san (.1)	ils	0.20	90.00
01/29/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with E. Edwards and K re: Reimkus documents analysis	G B011	0.10	45.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 58 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/29/20	TPAKR	(Prime) correspondence with Court re telephonic-status conference		0.10	45.00
01/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: order grant Welded leave to amend complaint (0.7 review and summarize same (0.3)	•	0.40	196.00
01/30/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of Affidavit of Service re reply brief	ice B011	0.20	59.00
01/30/20	BOLIV	Download and circulate exhibits to G. Weiland deposition re Prime NDT	B011	0.10	29.50
01/30/20	EEDWA	Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: status conference and trial preparation (.4); review order granting plaintiffs' motio amend complaint (.1); review pleading re: pending motions (.4)	on to	0.90	643.50
01/30/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: status conference, motions, and trial prep	B011	0.40	310.00
01/30/20	KGUER	Review and prepare trial exhibits; pre- for trial; review Bell deposition transc draft witness outlines	-	1.90	1,472.50
01/30/20	KGUER	Review and prepare trial exhibits; pre- for trial; review Bell deposition transc draft witness outlines		0.20	155.00
01/30/20	MMILA	Revise discovery and litigation tracker	r B011	0.60	240.00
01/30/20	MMILA	Confer with T. Buchanan and A. Miel re: litigation strategy	ke B011	0.30	120.00
01/30/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with Prime counsel re: joint pretrial memo	B011	0.10	45.00
01/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: folder for l action pleadings	ien B011	0.10	49.00
01/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, S Beach, and S. Hawkins re: Prime settlement proposal and mediation	S. B011	0.20	98.00
01/31/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with M. Neiburg, L. Murley, and other defense counsel re: electronic discovery	B011	0.40	196.00
01/31/20	BOLIV	Coordinate court call for E.Edwards a K. Guerke re telephonic status confere on 2/3/20 re Prime NDT		0.30	88.50
01/31/20	BOLIV	Prepare binders of all pending motion and responses; index for same in anticipation of 2/3/20 status conference		1.50	442.50
01/31/20	BOLIV	Respond to email from Veritext re missing discs from various deposition Prime NDT	B011 s re	0.20	59.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 59 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/31/20	BOLIV	Prepare excel sheet of all depositions receive, date, location, whether videotaped or not and if disc of same received (.3); email Veritext asking for those not received.	was	0.40	118.00
01/31/20	EEDWA	Prime: Telephone to T. Pakrouh re: tr preparation issues (.2); meet with K. Guerke re: same (.3); telephone to T. Pakrouh re: Gray direct (.2); email to Gray re: direct preparation (.1); teleph from R, Werkheiser re: briefing quest (.1); teleconference with M. Heyden a K. Guerke re: mediation (.1); meet w K. Guerke re: same (.2); multiple ema with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, and S. Beach re: same (.1); telephone to B. Olivere re: binder for status conference (.1); review same (.1); emails from T. Pakrouh re: outstanding pretrial mem from Prime (.1)	S. hone tion and ith ails ce	1.60	1,144.00
01/31/20	KGUER	Teleconference with expert re: trial testimony	B011	0.20	155.00
01/31/20	KGUER	Review Bell deposition transcript; dra witness outlines; prepare for trial	aft B011	1.60	1,240.00
01/31/20	KGUER	Teleconferences (x3) with opposing counsel re: settlement	B011	0.40	310.00
01/31/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with client and YCS mediation issues	Г re: В011	0.30	232.50
01/31/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with opposing couns mediation	el re: B011	0.30	232.50
01/31/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: settleme and mediation issues	ent B011	0.30	232.50
01/31/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with expert re: trial testimony	B011	0.20	155.00
01/31/20	KGUER	Meeting with E. Edwards re: trial pre	p B011	0.40	310.00
01/31/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: discovery issues	B011	0.80	540.00
01/31/20	TPAKR	Confer with E. Edwards re: Prime tria strategy issues	al B011	0.20	90.00
01/31/20	TPAKR	Emails with YCST and client re: Prin settlement issues	ne B011	0.10	45.00
01/31/20	TPAKR	(Prime) emails with K. Guerke re: document production issues	B011	0.10	45.00
01/02/20	BFELD	Revise draft 9019 motion re: plan settlement agreement	B012	1.20	498.00

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/02/20	BFELD	Review critical dates re: upcoming ca deadlines		0.10	41.50
01/02/20	BFELD	Research (.1) and confer with R. Pop and M. Lunn (.6) re: plan settlement agreement	piti B012	0.70	290.50
01/02/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: plan issues	B012	0.10	67.50
01/02/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on revised draf solicitation procedures motion	ft B012	1.40	959.00
01/02/20	RFPOP	Meet with B. Feldman and call to M. Lunn re: plan issues	B012	0.60	411.00
01/02/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on revised draft chapter 11 plan (3.4), and call to M. I (.1) re: same		3.50	2,397.50
01/03/20	BFELD	Review R. Poppiti's comments re: solicitation procedures motion	B012	0.30	124.50
01/03/20	BFELD	Revise 9019 motion re: global plan settlement agreement	B012	2.00	830.00
01/03/20	MLUNN	Review solicitation motion	B012	1.70	1,351.50
01/03/20	MLUNN	Meeting with R. Poppiti re: plan revis and issues	sions B012	1.80	1,431.00
01/03/20	RFPOP	Meet with M. Lunn re: plan issues, including review revised draft plan	B012	1.80	1,233.00
01/03/20	RFPOP	Prepare for meeting to discuss plan is	ssues B012	0.70	479.50
01/03/20	RFPOP	Revise and revise draft solicitation procedures motion, and email to and B. Feldman re: same	B012 from	2.40	1,644.00
01/03/20	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins re: plan issues (Review and revise documents re sam (1.1)	• • •	1.20	1,002.00
01/04/20	BFELD	Revise plan settlement agreement and related 9019 motion re: global resolu of Committee's potential claims		1.40	581.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Meeting with S. Beach, R. Poppiti, N Lunn, B. Feldman, and J. Mulvihill re plan strategy		2.80	1,372.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman re: plan documents	B012	0.20	98.00
01/06/20	BFELD	Meet with S. Beach, M. Lunn, R. Pop J. Mulvihill, and A. Mielke re: plan a global plan settlement (1.6, partial attendance); follow-up with A. Mielk same (.2)	ind	1.80	747.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 61 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoio	ce Date: ce Number: or Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	Initials	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/06/20	MLUNN	Further review and provide comments to solicitation motion		0.70	556.50	
01/06/20	MLUNN	Call with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, S. Beach and R. Poppiti re: plan/settlement issues (.5); call with Blank Rome and Gibson re: plan/settlement issues, including related follow-up (.6)	B012 t	1.10	874.50	
01/06/20	MLUNN	Work with S. Beach, R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, J. Mulvihill and B. Feldman re: plan issues, settlement issues and case strategy	B012	2.80	2,226.00	
01/06/20	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn and counse for Bechtel (Michael Rosenthal and Mar Kelsey (.5) and call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, Michael Rosenthal, Matt Kelsey, and committee counsel (Michael Schaec and John Lucian) and follow-up call wit S. Beach, M. Lunn and Michael Rosenthal and follow-up meeting with S Beach and M. Lunn (.6) re: plan issues	tt ile ih	1.10	753.50	
01/06/20	RFPOP	Research re: recent precedent re: plan governance and settlement issues	B012	0.60	411.00	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Email with J. Mulvihill, M. Rosenthal, I Kelsey, M. Lunn, and R. Poppiti re: plan issues		0.20	167.00	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Meetings with M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, J. Mulvihill, and B. Feldman re plan, disclosure statement, settlement ar case strategy issues		2.80	2,338.00	
01/06/20	SBEAC	Review and revise Welded Plan documents and settlement documents	B012	1.60	1,336.00	
01/07/20	AMIEL	Draft provision in plan to address C. States claim settlement	B012	0.60	294.00	
01/07/20	JMULV	Drafting plan	B012	1.60	840.00	
01/07/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Rosenthal re: UCC settlement issues (.2); Review and revis plan and term sheet re; same (.7)	B012 e	0.90	751.50	
01/08/20	JMULV	Revising plan	B012	1.90	997.50	
01/08/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with S. Beach and M. Rosenthal re: settlement and plan issue	B012	0.20	159.00	
01/08/20	RFPOP	Emails from S. Beach and counsel for Bechtel (Michael Rosenthal) re: plan issues	B012	0.10	68.50	
01/08/20	RFPOP	Research re: recent precedent re: plan issues re: insurance	B012	0.30	205.50	

Welded Construction, L.P.		d Construction, L.P. Invoice Invoice Matter		Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	Hours	Amount	
01/08/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Collins re: Welded Plar		0.10	83.50	
01/09/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on revised draft plan (2.3), and discussion with M. Lun and emails to and from S. Beach and M Lunn (.2) re: same	n	2.50	1,712.50	
01/10/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mulvihill re: plan comments	B012	0.10	49.00	
01/10/20	AMIEL	Review comments to plan	B012	0.20	98.00	
01/10/20	BFELD	Revise solicitation procedures motion revisions to plan and ballots	re: B012	1.40	581.00	
01/10/20	MLUNN	Correspondence with M. Schaedle and Gibson re: plan and settlement	B012	0.10	79.50	
01/10/20	MLUNN	Work with S. Beach and R. Poppiti re: plan issues and revisions	B012	2.10	1,669.50	
01/10/20	RFPOP	Call from B. Feldman re: solicitation procedures motion	B012	0.10	68.50	
01/10/20	RFPOP	Review and revise draft plan (2.9), and meet with S. Beach and M. Lunn (2.2) meet with S. Beach (.3) and email to a from J. Mulvihill (.2) re: same	,	5.60	3,836.00	
01/10/20	SBEAC	Meeting with M. Lunn and R. Poppiti Plan review and revise	re: B012	2.20	1,837.00	
01/10/20	SBEAC	Review and revise modified Documen Welded - Plan Global Deal	t B012	0.60	501.00	
01/10/20	SBEAC	Email with R. Poppiti re: Revised Plan	n B012	0.10	83.50	
01/10/20	SBEAC	Call from Poppiti, Robert re plan issue	es B012	0.10	83.50	
01/11/20	JMULV	Drafting Plan	B012	0.80	420.00	
01/12/20	JMULV	Revising Plan	B012	0.90	472.50	
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mulvihill re: plan revisi	ions B012	0.10	49.00	
01/13/20	AMIEL	Review M. Lunn's comments to plan	B012	0.20	98.00	
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mulvihill re: letters of credit in connection with plan	B012	0.10	49.00	
01/13/20	JMULV	Revising plan	B012	0.60	315.00	
01/13/20	MLUNN	Review revised chapter 11 plan and re chapter 11 plan	vise B012	2.20	1,749.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 63 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/13/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on revised draft plan (1.4), and call with M. Lunn (.1), c from J. Mulvihill (.1) and emails to and from M. Lunn, J. Mulvihill and A. Miel (.2) re: same		1.80	1,233.00	
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Lunn re: comments to the plan	he B012	0.10	49.00	
01/14/20	BFELD	Revise solicitation procedures motion recomments from R. Poppiti on form ball		2.50	1,037.50	
01/14/20	JMULV	Revising plan and correspondence with Poppiti re: same	R. B012	0.30	157.50	
01/14/20	MLUNN	Review/revise/draft solicitation motion, including order, ballots and related exhibits	B012	2.40	1,908.00	
01/14/20	MLUNN	Call with M. Schaedle, M. Kelsey, M. Rosenthal, S. Beach and R. Poppiti re: settlement and plan issues (.2); follow-u call with S. Beach and R. Poppiti (.2) ar follow-up call with M. Kelsey, S. Beach and R. Poppiti (.1)	nd	0.50	397.50	
01/14/20	MLUNN	Call with R. Poppiti re: various issues, including plan and settlement	B012	0.30	238.50	
01/14/20	MLUNN	Review revised chapter 11 plan and related correspondence	B012	0.60	477.00	
01/14/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from M. Lunn and J. Mulvihill (.1), meet with S. Beach (.4), call to M. Lunn (.3), email to counsel for Bechtel (Michael Rosenthal and Matt Kelsey) (.1), and call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, committee counsel (Mike Schaedle), Michael Rosenthal and Matt Kelsey and follow-up call with S. Beach M. Lunn and Matt Kelsey (.5) re: plan issues		1.40	959.00	
01/14/20	SBEAC	Meeting with R Poppiti re plan issues.	B012	0.40	334.00	
01/16/20	BFELD	Revise solicitation procedures motion reglobal plan settlement and other comments from M. Lunn	e: B012	0.30	124.50	
01/16/20	BFELD	Review draft board update email re: sta of plan filing and various adversary proceedings	tus B012	0.30	124.50	
01/16/20	BFELD	Revise disclosure statement re: global settlement version of plan	B012	4.10	1,701.50	
01/16/20	MLUNN	Further review, revise and draft solicitation procedures motion, order, ballots and notices	B012	1.60	1,272.00	

Welded Construction, L.P.		elded Construction, L.P. Invoice D Invoice N Matter Nu		Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
01/16/20	MLUNN	Review/revise summary to board re: pl		0.20	159.00
01/16/20	RFPOP	Review comments from M. Lunn to revised draft solicitation procedures motion	B012	0.10	68.50
01/16/20	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielk client (Steve Hawkins), Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) and Matt McGuire (.9), emails from S. Beach an M. Lunn (.1) and email to Frank Pome and Andrew Ralph (.1) re: plan issues	d	1.10	753.50
01/16/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Kelsey, M Rosenthal a R. Poppiti re: plan and settlement issue		0.10	83.50
01/17/20	BFELD	Revise disclosure statement re: global plan settlement	B012	1.00	415.00
01/17/20	BFELD	Call with L. Scott (KCC) re: solicitatio procedures motion	n B012	0.10	41.50
01/17/20	SBEAC	Calls with S. Hawkins re: plan and UC settlement issues (.3); Review and revi plan documents re: same (.7)		1.00	835.00
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: defined ter in plan	rms B012	0.10	49.00
01/22/20	BFELD	Revise disclosure statement re: global plan settlement	B012	1.50	622.50
01/22/20	SBEAC	Emails with B. Feldman re: plan issue	B012	0.10	83.50
01/23/20	SBEAC	Read email from Feldman, Betsy L.: re Revised Plan	e B012	0.10	83.50
01/25/20	BFELD	Revise draft disclosure statement re: global plan settlement	B012	0.90	373.50
01/26/20	BFELD	Revise solicitation procedures motion comments from KCC	re: B012	0.70	290.50
01/27/20	BFELD	Emails with YCST team (S. Beach, M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, J. Mulvih re: revised disclosure statement		0.10	41.50
01/27/20	MLUNN	Analyze plan and settlement issues and related correspondence	B012	0.90	715.50
01/27/20	RFPOP	Emails from S. Beach and M. Lunn reaplan issues	B012	0.10	68.50
01/27/20	SBEAC	Emails with B. Feldman re revised DS	B012	0.10	83.50
01/27/20	SBEAC	Review Committee preference analysis plan modifications	s re: B012	0.40	334.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 65 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ice Date: ice Number: er Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Initials	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/27/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with R. Poppiti and M. Lunn re: revised plan and DS, settlemen preference and Chubb issues (.2); Call with M. Lunn re: same (.2); Review and revise plan re same (.5)	B012 nt,	0.90	751.50
01/28/20	BFELD	Confer with M. Lunn re: KCC comments to solicitation procedures motion	nts B012	0.30	124.50
01/28/20	MLUNN	Review and revise portion of draft disclosure statement	B012	1.70	1,351.50
01/28/20	MLUNN	Review issues/comments from KCC to solicitation motion/order and meeting with B. Feldman re: same	B012	0.50	397.50
01/28/20	MLUNN	Review plan task list timeline and open issues	B012	0.20	159.00
01/30/20	MLUNN	Review revised disclosure statement an provide comments to same	nd B012	1.60	1,272.00
01/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Levan re: Ohio CAT liv release	en B013	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	BOLIV	Take call from representative from Her Rental re payment of claim	rc B013	0.20	59.00
01/14/20	BFELD	Emails with creditors re: inquiries on p distributions	lan B013	0.10	41.50
01/14/20	MLUNN	Attention to D&O tail extension	B014	0.10	79.50
01/16/20	SBEAC	Review documents and Draft case and plan update for Board of Directors (1.1 Emails with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, M Lunn, A. Ralph and R. Poppiti re: same (.2)	ĺ.	1.30	1,085.50
01/17/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Lunn and S. Hawkins r board update	re: B014	0.20	167.00
01/18/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Rosenthal re: board updat (.1); Review and revise documents re: same (.3); Emails with M. Kelsey re: same (.1)	e B014	0.50	417.50
01/20/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti and S. Beach re board status update	e: B014	0.10	49.00
01/20/20	AMIEL	Review board status update	B014	0.10	49.00
01/20/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, and F. Pometti re: board update (.2); Review and revise re: same (.4)		0.60	501.00
01/07/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman and cli (Jackie Krzysztofik) re: draft consultin agreement for former IT employee (.3) and review draft agreement (.2) re: san	g ,	0.50	342.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 66 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoi	ce Date: ce Number: er Number:	Feb	bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/08/20	RFPOP	Meet with B. Feldman re: draft consult agreement for former IT employee (.2), and prepare for same (.1)	ing B015	0.30	205.50	
01/09/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman, client (Jackie Krzysztofik) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: revised draft consulting agreement for former IT employee, and review draft re: same	B015	0.30	205.50	
01/10/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from B. Feldman, client (Jackie Krzysztofik) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: revised draft consulting agreement for former IT employee (.2), and review and comment on revised dra (.2) re: same		0.40	274.00	
01/13/20	BFELD	Revise consulting agreement re: J. Moa IT services	in B015	0.20	83.00	
01/13/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from T. Snyder and Zolf (Frank Pometti) re: 401(k) wind-down issues	b B015	0.20	137.00	
01/13/20	RFPOP	Emails from B. Feldman, client (Jackie Krzysztofik) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: revised draft consulting agreement f former IT employee, and review revise draft of same) Tor	0.20	137.00	
01/13/20	TSNYD	Review 401(k) Plan Questionnaire requested to be signed by Third Party Administrator and compare to prior yea questionnaire	B015 ur's	0.20	115.00	
01/13/20	TSNYD	Email from R. Poppiti re: 401(k) Plan Administration questionnaire to be sigr	B015 ned	0.10	57.50	
01/13/20	TSNYD	Compose email to R. Poppiti re: signin questionnaire and advising of Form 550 due date.		0.10	57.50	
01/14/20	RFPOP	Emails from client (Jackie Krzysztofik) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: revised draft consulting agreement for former I employee, and review revised draft of same		0.10	68.50	
01/23/20	TSNYD	T/C with Central States, Jones Day, S. Beach and A. Mielke re: separation of arbitrations	B015	0.20	115.00	
01/09/20	TPAKR	Emails with YCST re: case strategy iss	ues B016	0.20	90.00	
12/16/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with E. Edwards and I Poppiti re: OCP issues	R. B017	0.10	40.00	
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and J. Martinez r payment of fees	e: B017	0.10	49.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 67 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	voice Date: voice Number: latter Number:		oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Cherian re: YCST bu	dget B017	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	BOLIV	Draft index to first interim fee binder KCC	for B017	0.20	59.00
01/13/20	TPAKR	Emails with S. Cherian re: OCP repo issues	rt B017	0.10	45.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with D. Grottini re: the court' comments to the KCC fee application		0.10	49.00
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Cherian re: YCST bupprojections		0.10	49.00
01/14/20	BFELD	Emails with E. Gershbein and L. Sco KCC first monthly fee application	tt re: B017	0.20	83.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Review, revise and assemble all final exhibits contained in to response in opposition to Prime NDT Services m for partial summary judgment		2.70	796.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate ser of CNO re first fee application of KO		0.20	59.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate ser of December 2019 staffing report for Zolfo Cooper	vice B017	0.50	147.50
01/14/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate ser of CNO re first fee application of KO		0.20	59.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Draft COC re first interim fee reques KCC		0.40	118.00
01/14/20	BOLIV	Draft CNO re first fee application of Kurtzman Carson Consultants	B017	0.20	59.00
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and M. Neibur professional fee forecast (0.2); review forecast (0.2); compare forecast to re fee applications (0.2); confer with A. Ralph re: same (0.1); emails with S. Cherian re: same (0.1)	w ecent	0.80	392.00
01/15/20	BFELD	Review and research re: COC for first interim fee request of KCC	st B017	0.70	290.50
01/15/20	BOLIV	Edit, review, revise and send for comments the draft COC re KCC's fi interim fee request	B017 irst	0.30	88.50
01/15/20	TPAKR	Emails with AlixPartners re: OCP re issues	port B017	0.10	45.00
01/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: KCC int fee application	erim B017	0.10	49.00
01/16/20	BFELD	Confer with R. Poppiti re: COC and proposed order for KCC first interim request	B017 fee	0.10	41.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 68 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/16/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate ser of COC re order approving KCC's fin interim fee request	vice B017	0.40	118.00
01/17/20	BOLIV	Circulate fee order re KCC first inter fee request	im B017	0.10	29.50
01/21/20	AMIEL	Review/revise certificate of no objec for YCST fee application (0.1); emai with A. Ralph re: same (0.1)		0.20	98.00
01/21/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate ser of CNO re 13th fee application of YO		0.20	59.00
01/21/20	BOLIV	Request LEDES file from accounting delivery to US Trustee re 14th fee application	g for B017	0.10	29.50
01/21/20	BOLIV	Forward to US Trustee LEDES file f YCST's 14th/December 2019 fee application	for B017	0.10	29.50
01/21/20	BOLIV	Draft CNO re 13th fee application of YCST	B017	0.20	59.00
01/21/20	RFPOP	Emails from and discussion with T. Pakrouh re: ordinary course profession issues	B017 onal	0.20	137.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	Teleconference with K. O'Reilly re: I Brisbois invoices (.1); emails with R Poppiti; E. Edwards; M. Neiburg re: (.1)		0.20	90.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	Correspondence with AlixPartners re Lewis Brisbois invoice issues	e: B017	0.10	45.00
01/21/20	TPAKR	Confer with R. Poppiti (.1); E. Edwa (.1); M. Neiburg (.2) re: OCP cap iss re: Lewis Brisbois; emails re: same (ues	0.50	225.00
01/22/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. O'Reilly re: Lewis invoicing issues	B017	0.10	45.00
01/22/20	TPAKR	Emails with R. Poppiti, E. Edwards, M. Neiburg re: OCP cap issues	and B017	0.10	45.00
01/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: OCP issu	les B017	0.20	135.00
01/24/20	TPAKR	Emails with R. Poppiti, E. Edwards, M. Neiburg re: OCP cap issues	and B017	0.10	45.00
01/26/20	TPAKR	Emails with AlixPartners re: OCP re issues	port B017	0.10	45.00
01/27/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from T. Pakrouh re: ordinary course professional issues	B017	0.20	137.00
01/27/20	TPAKR	Emails with R. Poppiti re: OCP cap increases issues	B017	0.10	45.00
01/27/20	TPAKR	Emails with AlixPartners re: OCP re issues	port B017	0.10	45.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 69 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/27/20	TPAKR	Teleconference with UST re: increasin OCP cap for Lewis Brisbois (.1); conf with Committee counsel re: same (.1)	ng $\overline{B017}$	0.20	90.00	
01/28/20	TPAKR	Teleconference with Committee couns re: OCP cap issues (.1); correspondence with R. Poppiti re: summary of same (ce	0.20	90.00	
01/29/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft indemn agreement from counsel for Bechtel re proposed global settlement with committee		0.10	68.50	
01/29/20	RFPOP	Email from T. Pakrouh re: ordinary course professional issues	B017	0.10	68.50	
01/29/20	TPAKR	Draft COC/order re: increasing OCP of for Lewis Brisbois (.5); emails with R Poppiti re: same (.1)		0.60	270.00	
01/29/20	TPAKR	Teleconference with Committee count re: OCP cap issues (.1); correspondent with R. Poppiti re: summary of same (ce	0.20	90.00	
01/30/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of notice of filing of OCP fees and expenses for October through Decemb 2019		0.20	59.00	
01/30/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft quarter report for ordinary course professiona and email to and from T. Pakrouh re: same		0.10	68.50	
01/30/20	TPAKR	Emails with R. Poppiti and B. Olivere filing and serving OCP notice	ere: B017	0.10	45.00	
01/30/20	TPAKR	Confer with Committee counsel re: O cap increase (.1); correspondence with Poppiti re: summary of same (.1)		0.20	90.00	
01/11/20	RFPOP	Review and finalize invoice for YCST December 2019 monthly fee applicati re: confidentiality and local rule compliance		0.80	548.00	
01/17/20	BOLIV	Draft 14th fee application of YCST for December 2019	or B018	1.00	295.00	
01/21/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of 14th fee application [December] fo YCST		0.50	147.50	
01/01/20	TBUCH	Email correspondence from S. Beach, Neiburg re: litigation strategy and ope issues		0.10	59.50	
01/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: billing entr in connection with request for paymer		0.10	49.00	
01/02/20	AMIEL	Confer with M. Neiburg re: requests f production	for B768	0.10	49.00	

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	bice Date: bice Number: tter Number:	Fet	bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	Initials	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
01/02/20	BOLIV	Draft notice of completion of briefing motion for partial summary judgment		0.80	236.00	
01/02/20	JMULV	Correspondence with A. Mielke and E Feldman re: discovery	B. B768	0.50	262.50	
01/02/20	MDOSS	Research and draft memo re: contract dispute with Williams	B768	1.40	525.00	
01/02/20	SBEAC	Review and revise requests for produc and other discovery requests (1.2); En with A. Mielke re: same (.1)		1.30	1,085.50	
01/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: compiling request for payment	B768	0.10	49.00	
01/03/20	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman and J. Mulvil re: drafting document review memo (0 draft portions of an outline of the document review memo in preparation meeting discussing same (0.5)).2);	0.70	343.00	
01/03/20	AMIEL	Review invoices in connection with compiling a request for payment	B768	0.30	147.00	
01/03/20	BFELD	Confer with A. Mielke and J. Mulvihi re: document review memo in prepara for discovery requests		0.30	124.50	
01/03/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serve of affidavit of service re notice of completion of briefing re Williams Adversary	ice B768	0.20	59.00	
01/03/20	BOLIV	Draft affidavit of service re notice of completion of briefing	B768	0.20	59.00	
01/03/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serve of notice of completion of briefing re motion for partial summary judgment	ice B768	0.30	88.50	
01/03/20	BOLIV	Prepare all pleadings for notice of completion of briefing binder re motic for partial summary judgment; coordin delivery of same to chambers		1.50	442.50	
01/03/20	JMULV	Revise notice of completion of briefin for filing	g B768	0.30	157.50	
01/03/20	JMULV	Meeting with B. Feldman and A. Miel re: discovery memo	lke B768	0.30	157.50	
01/03/20	MDOSS	Research and draft memo re: contract dispute with Williams	B768	1.30	487.50	
01/03/20	MDOSS	Meet with T. Buchanan to discuss me re: contract dispute with Williams	mo B768	0.20	75.00	
01/03/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Mulvihill and B. Oliver re: notice of completion of briefing relating to summary judgment motion		0.10	67.50	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 71 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Initials	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/03/20	SBEAC	Review notice of completion of briefing and related litigation strategy issues		0.40	334.00
01/03/20	TBUCH	Review and revise memo on issues rela to damage	ted B768	2.00	1,190.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg and T. Buchar re: requests for production	an B768	0.10	49.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Review/revise requests for production	B768	2.10	1,029.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg and L. Mann r coating experts	e: B768	0.20	98.00
01/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: comments from the committee and Chubb re: requests for production	B768	0.10	49.00
01/06/20	KGUER	Meeting with M. Neiburg re: discover a claims issues	and B768	0.30	232.50
01/06/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg and E. Edward re: expert consultant	ls B768	0.10	77.50
01/06/20	MDOSS	Research and draft memo re: contract dispute with Williams	B768	3.20	1,200.00
01/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Mann re: discovery issu	les B768	0.10	67.50
01/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Mintz and A. Mielke re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
01/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with E. Edwards re: expert discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
01/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: draft RFPs	B768	0.20	135.00
01/06/20	MNEIB	Review and revise draft RFPs	B768	0.60	405.00
01/06/20	MNEIB	Call to L. Murley re: discovery	B768	0.20	135.00
01/06/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: litigation strategy and discovery	B768	1.40	945.00
01/06/20	MNEIB	Email to B. Chang re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
01/06/20	MNEIB	Discussion with T. Buchanan re: draft RFPs	B768	0.10	67.50
01/06/20	TBUCH	Review and comment on requests for production (2.4); research related to sat (.6); confer with M. Doss re: research related to damages (.1)	B768 me	3.10	1,844.50
01/07/20	AMIEL	Draft outline and certain factual section of document review memo	ns B768	2.40	1,176.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 72 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	bice Date: bice Number: ter Number:	Feb	ruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/07/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Cherian re: request for payment of professional expenses (0.1 confer with M. Neiburg and S. Beach same (0.1); review actuals budget and send to M. Neiburg and S. Beach for review (0.1)	B768);	0.30	147.00
01/07/20	AMIEL	Email with M. Neiburg re: Williams litigation process	B768	0.10	49.00
01/07/20	AMIEL	Revise requests for production to inclu comments from the creditors' committ (1.7); confer with M. Neiburg re: same (0.5); emails with J. Mintz re: same (0	ee e	2.30	1,127.00
01/07/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg re: action iter and discovery	ns B768	0.20	155.00
01/07/20	MDOSS	Research and draft memo re: contract dispute with Williams	B768	2.90	1,087.50
01/07/20	MDOSS	Meet with T. Buchanan to discuss mer re: contract dispute with Welded	mo B768	0.10	37.50
01/07/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: draft RFPs to each defend	lant B768	0.60	405.00
01/07/20	MNEIB	Emails and discussion with A. Mielke draft RFPs	re: B768	0.30	202.50
01/07/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and J. Mintz re discovery issues	:: B768	0.20	135.00
01/07/20	MNEIB	Emails with B. Chang re: discovery is	sues B768	0.20	135.00
01/07/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke, T. Buchanan, Mulvihill, M. Doss and M. Milana re: litigation strategy issues		0.30	202.50
01/07/20	MNEIB	Confer with F. Pometti and S. Hawkin re: case status and strategy	ns B768	0.60	405.00
01/07/20	MNEIB	Emails and confer with A. Mielke re: litigation budget and summary	B768	0.20	135.00
01/07/20	TBUCH	Review and comment on memo relate damages	d to B768	2.00	1,190.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Draft interrogatories for Williams defendants	B768	0.50	245.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Revise notice of services in connection with request for production	n B768	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: requests for production (0.1); review requests prior sending to defendants (0.1)		0.20	98.00
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti and A. Ralph ESI for Williams litigation	re: B768	0.10	49.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 73 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inve	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
01/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, a K. O'Reilly re: draft interrogatories directed to Williams defendants	and B768	0.10	49.00
01/08/20	BFELD	Draft document review memo re: Williams litigation	B768	0.80	332.00
01/08/20	BOLIV	Draft notice of service re first RFP's to Transco	b B768	0.20	59.00
01/08/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of notice of service of discovery	ice B768	0.20	59.00
01/08/20	MDOSS	Research and draft memo re: contract dispute with Williams	B768	2.20	825.00
01/08/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: e-discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
01/08/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and B. Olivere RFPs to defendants	ere: B768	0.40	270.00
01/08/20	MNEIB	Review and revise final draft RFPs to each defendant	B768	0.90	607.50
01/08/20	MNEIB	Draft interrogatories directed to Trans	sco B768	1.60	1,080.00
01/08/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: draft interrogatories	B768	0.20	135.00
01/08/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: Transco claims	B768	1.30	877.50
01/08/20	TBUCH	Review discovery requests to Transco	B768	0.30	178.50
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mulvihill re: productio invoice and documents	n of B768	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. O'Reilly re: interrogat (0.1); revise interrogatories re: same (0.30	147.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Revise interrogatories to include comments from M. Neiburg	B768	0.50	245.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and J. Mulvil re: document review memo	hill B768	0.10	49.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Confer with B. Feldman, M. Neiburg, Buchanan, J. Mulvihill, and M. Milan Williams discovery plan (0.6); follow with M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	a re:	0.70	343.00
01/09/20	AMIEL	Confer with A. Ralph re: custodians f Williams litigation	or B768	0.60	294.00
01/09/20	BFELD	Emails with A. Mielke re: document review memo	B768	0.10	41.50
01/09/20	BFELD	Initial discovery meeting re: tasks for Williams adversary proceeding	B768	0.50	207.50
01/09/20	JMULV	Call with J. Krzystofik and M. Hood n discovery request	re: B768	0.70	367.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 74 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		In	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Fet	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
01/09/20	JMULV	Litigation team meeting re: discover	y B768	0.80	420.00	
01/09/20	KGUER	Meeting with M. Neiburg re: discove plan	ery B768	0.20	155.00	
01/09/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg re: claims a strategy	nd B768	0.10	77.50	
01/09/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke and client re: discovery	B768	0.10	77.50	
01/09/20	MDOSS	Research and draft memo re: contrac dispute with Williams	et B768	2.90	1,087.50	
01/09/20	MNEIB	Review draft interrogatories (.2); em with A. Mielke re: same (.2)	ails B768	0.40	270.00	
01/09/20	MNEIB	Confer w/ B. Feldman, A. Mielke, T Buchanan, J. Mulvihill, and M. Mila Williams discovery plan (.6); follow w/ Mielke re: same (.1)	na re:	0.70	472.50	
01/09/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: litigation strategy and discovery issues	B768	1.60	1,080.00	
01/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: status upo	late B768	0.10	67.50	
01/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: e-discover issues	ry B768	0.10	67.50	
01/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Mulvihill re: discover issues	y B768	0.10	67.50	
01/09/20	TBUCH	Review and revise memo related to damages (5.0); confer with M. Doss same (.2); prepare for and attend me with M. Neiburg, A. Mielke, J. Muly B. Feldman, and M. Milana re: litiga strategy and open issues (.7)	eting ⁄ihill,	5.90	3,510.50	
01/10/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: stipulatient extend discovery deadlines (0.1); em with F. Pometti and S. Hawkins re: s (0.1); emails with J. Mintz re: same	ails same	0.30	147.00	
01/10/20	JMULV	Drafting discovery memo	B768	1.50	787.50	
01/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti A. Mielke re: amended discovery schedule	and B768	0.20	135.00	
01/10/20	MNEIB	Discussion with S. Beach re: propos discovery extension	ed B768	0.20	135.00	
01/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with P. Singh re: discovery is	ssues B768	0.10	67.50	
01/10/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: discovery issues	B768	0.80	540.00	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 75 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/10/20	MNEIB	Review proposed stipulation extendin discovery deadlines (.2); emails with Murley re: same (.1)		0.30	202.50
01/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with B. Chang re: discovery i	ssues B768	0.20	135.00
01/10/20	MNEIB	Emails and discussion with A. Mielk proposed stipulation extending disco		0.20	135.00
01/10/20	TBUCH	Review email correspondence from N Neiburg re: claims analysis	M. B768	0.10	59.50
01/11/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: scheduling discovery issues	g and B768	0.30	202.50
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: stipulatic extend schedule	on to B768	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with counsel for Chubb re: comments to interrogatories	B768	0.10	49.00
01/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery stipulation	B768	0.10	67.50
01/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: draft interrogatories	B768	0.10	67.50
01/13/20	SBEAC	Email with J. Mintz re: Williams/Tra Requests for Production	nsco B768	0.10	83.50
01/14/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: extension scheduling order	n of B768	0.10	49.00
01/14/20	MDOSS	Draft and exchange emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: call wi potential expert	B768 th	0.30	112.50
01/14/20	MDOSS	Meet with T. Buchanan to prepare fo phone call with expert	r B768	0.10	37.50
01/14/20	MDOSS	Call with T. Buchanan and potential expert	B768	0.40	150.00
01/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and J. Mintz r draft stipulation	e: B768	0.20	135.00
01/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Murley re: draft stipulation	B768	0.10	67.50
01/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: case status related issues	s and B768	0.10	67.50
01/14/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: discovery and litigation strategy	B768	1.10	742.50
01/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: discove issues	ry B768	0.20	135.00
01/14/20	TBUCH	Research related to Transco claim for damages re: pipeline coating	r B768	1.40	833.00
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: service o interrogatories	of B768	0.10	49.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 76 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		In	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/15/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Fratticci re: discover costs in connection with Williams litigation budget		0.10	49.00	
01/15/20	AMIEL	Draft summary of invoices and anticipated work in connection with request for payment of fees (0.5); en with M. Neiburg and S. Beach re: sa (0.1)		0.60	294.00	
01/15/20	BOLIV	Circulate order extending discovery deadlines	B768	0.10	29.50	
01/15/20	KGUER	Reviewed order extending deadlines	B768	0.20	155.00	
01/15/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: interrogat	ories B768	0.10	67.50	
01/15/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: case statu	is B768	0.10	67.50	
01/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Milana re: drafting document review memo	B768	0.10	49.00	
01/16/20	AMIEL	Confer with M. Fratticci re: document production for Williams litigation	nt B768	0.30	147.00	
01/16/20	AMIEL	Meeting with K. Guerke, E. Edwards Mulvihill, M. Milana, T. Buchanan a Feldman re: Williams discovery issu (0.7); follow up with M. Milana re: document review memo (0.2)	and B.	0.90	441.00	
01/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: drafting document review memo	B768	0.10	49.00	
01/16/20	BFELD	Call with S. Beach re: YCST custod of emails and documents relating to petition commitment letters and negotiations (.1); confer with MFRA same (.3)	post-	0.40	166.00	
01/16/20	BFELD	Meet with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, A Mielke, J. Mulvihill, and M. Milana status of discovery preparation		0.70	290.50	
01/16/20	EEDWA	Meet with litigation team re: discove planning	ery B768	0.70	500.50	
01/16/20	JMULV	Correspondence with J. Krzysztofik discovery requests	re: B768	0.40	210.00	
01/16/20	JMULV	Prepare for and attend litigation tean meeting	n B768	0.60	315.00	
01/16/20	KGUER	Review discovery directed to defend and defense declarations	lants B768	0.80	620.00	
01/16/20	KGUER	Meeting with YCST team re: discov planning	ery B768	0.70	542.50	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 77 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
01/16/20	KGUER	Review documents re: expert discove		0.20	155.00	
01/16/20	TBUCH	Meet with A. Mielke, B. Feldman, E. Edwards, M. Milana, J. Mulvihill, and Guerke re: litigation strategy and ope issues (.7); email correspondence with Hood and M. Neiburg re: same (.2)	d K. n	0.90	535.50	
01/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: serving interrogatories (0.1); draft notice of service of same (0.3)	B768	0.40	196.00	
01/17/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate serv of notice of service of interrogatories Williams defendants		0.20	59.00	
01/17/20	JMULV	Drafting document review memo	B768	2.10	1,102.50	
01/17/20	KGUER	Review discovery issues and claims	B768	0.20	155.00	
01/17/20	MFRAT	Meeting with B. Feldman re: data collection for S. Beach and J. Rucky prepare for William litigation	B768 to	0.50	87.50	
01/17/20	MNEIB	Review final draft interrogatories (.3) emails with A. Mielke and B. Olivere same (.2)		0.50	337.50	
01/17/20	MNEIB	Call with M. Hood and T. Buchanan expert discovery issues	re: B768	0.10	67.50	
01/17/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: discovery and other litigative strategy issues	ation B768	1.20	810.00	
01/17/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke (.1) and review draft discovery requests (.4)	w B768	0.50	417.50	
01/17/20	TBUCH	Prepare for and attend teleconference M. Neiburg and M. Hood re: issues related to litigation strategy (.1); conf with M. Neiburg re: same (.1); resear related to same (.3)	fer	0.50	297.50	
01/20/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph and F. Pometti ESI for Williams litigation	re: B768	0.10	49.00	
01/20/20	AMIEL	Review J. Mulvihill's sections to document review memo (0.1); review Milana's section of document review memo (0.1)	B768 v M.	0.20	98.00	
01/20/20	JMULV	Finalizing document review memo	B768	1.10	577.50	
01/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: responses Williams' requests for production (0.7 review requests for production (0.2)		0.30	147.00	

Welded Construction, L.P.			e Date: Number: Number:	Feb	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	Initials	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
01/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: November Request for Payment invoices	B768	0.10	49.00	
01/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with T. Buchanan re: credentials of potential coating consulting expert	B768	0.10	49.00	
01/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: Alix Partners electronically stored information for Williams litigation	' B768	0.10	49.00	
01/21/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: consultants	B768	0.10	77.50	
01/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50	
01/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery schedule	B768	0.10	67.50	
01/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Fratticci and E. Edwards re: e-discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00	
01/21/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: first set of discovery request directed to Welded	s B768	0.40	270.00	
01/21/20	MNEIB	Emails and discussion with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00	
01/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke (.1) and review Debtor and Transco discovery requests and related documents (.8)	B768	0.90	751.50	
01/21/20	SBEAC	Review email and documents from T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: Coating defects expert (.4); Emails with T. Buchanan re same (.1)	B768	0.50	417.50	
01/21/20	TBUCH	Email correspondence with S. Beach re: litigation strategy	B768	0.10	59.50	
01/22/20	AMIEL	Draft document review memo	B768	2.50	1,225.00	
01/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: AlixPartners electronically store information	B768	0.10	49.00	
01/22/20	BOLIV	Request delimited spread sheet of task code B768 [Williams Adversary] for November 2019	B768	0.10	29.50	
01/22/20	BOLIV	Create pdf doc of all B768 task code entries from November invoice	B768	0.10	29.50	
01/22/20	JMULV	Correspondence with J. Krzysztofik re: discovery requests	B768	0.30	157.50	
01/22/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg, S. Beach, and T. Buchanan re: discovery an strategy	B768 d	0.10	77.50	
01/22/20	MNEIB	Call with T. Buchanan and consultant re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	202.50	

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 79 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	oice Date: oice Number: tter Number:	Feb	oruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/22/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: e-discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
01/22/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: discover issues	y B768	0.10	67.50
01/22/20	TBUCH	Research related to litigation strategy evidentiary issues	re: B768	0.70	416.50
01/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: discovery preparation meeting	B768	0.10	49.00
01/23/20	AMIEL	Review YCST fee entries in connection with compiling request for reimburser (0.3); emails with A. Ralph and S. Cherian re: same (0.1)		0.40	196.00
01/23/20	JMULV	Reviewing discovery production from Krzystofik	J. B768	1.30	682.50
01/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Mulvihill re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
01/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg and T. Bucha re: coating expert retention	anan B768	0.10	49.00
01/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: meetings potential witness	with B768	0.10	49.00
01/24/20	KGUER	Meeting with S. Beach, T. Buchanan, M. Neiburg re: discovery, case planni and strategy; review scheduling order same	ng,	1.30	1,007.50
01/24/20	MDOSS	Call with A. Mielke re: research re: conflicts of laws	B768	0.10	37.50
01/24/20	MDOSS	Meet with A. Mielke re: research re: conflicts of laws	B768	0.20	75.00
01/24/20	MDOSS	Research re: conflicts of laws	B768	0.20	75.00
01/24/20	MNEIB	Prepare for and participate in litigatio strategy meeting with S. Beach, K. Guerke and T. Buchanan	n B768	1.30	877.50
01/24/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: discovery and litigation strategy issues (1.3); email to P. Singl same (.1)	B768 h re:	1.40	945.00
01/24/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Hawkins and M. Hood strategy issues	l re: B768	0.20	135.00
01/24/20	SBEAC	Strategy and discovery preparation meeting re Transco with M. Neiburg, Guerke and T. Buchanan (1.0); Prepa for meeting re: same (.4)		1.40	1,169.00
01/24/20	TBUCH	Meet with S. Beach, M. Neiburg, and Guerke re: litigation strategy and oper issues (1.2); research related to same	n	1.60	952.00

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invo	bice Date: bice Number: ter Number:	February 10, 202 5001246 076850.100	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/25/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team and client re: background information	B768	0.10	77.50
01/26/20	BFELD	Review summary judgment briefs re: search terms for discovery	B768	0.80	332.00
01/26/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team and client re: background information	B768	0.10	77.50
01/26/20	TBUCH	Email correspondence from B. Feldma re: discovery issues	an B768	0.10	59.50
01/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: Williams' discovery requests	B768	0.10	49.00
01/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neib re: coating defect issue witnesses	ourg B768	0.10	49.00
01/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: response t Williams' discovery requests	o B768	0.10	49.00
01/27/20	MDOSS	Research re: conflicts of laws	B768	3.90	1,462.50
01/27/20	MDOSS	Calls with A. Mielke re: research re: conflicts of laws	B768	0.40	150.00
01/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with P. Singh re: discovery issues	ues B768	0.20	135.00
01/27/20	TBUCH	Research issues related to discovery	B768	0.20	119.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neib re: witnesses for Williams litigation	ourg B768	0.10	49.00
01/28/20	AMIEL	Draft responses to Williams' request for discovery	or B768	2.60	1,274.00
01/28/20	MDOSS	Research re: conflicts of laws	B768	3.10	1,162.50
01/28/20	TBUCH	Research issues related to discovery	B768	0.30	178.50
01/29/20	BOLIV	Research, locate and forward Schmid motion for reconsideration to M. Neib	B768 urg	0.10	29.50
01/29/20	JMARA	Confer with S. Beach (.1) and C. Grea (.1) re: clearance for Williams Litigati		0.20	105.00
01/29/20	MDOSS	Call with A. Mielke re: research re: conflicts of laws	B768	0.10	37.50
01/29/20	MDOSS	Research re: conflicts of laws	B768	2.00	750.00
01/30/20	AMIEL	Teleconference re: status of discovery Williams litigation (0.3); emails with Neiburg and B. Feldman re: same (0.1	M.	0.40	196.00
01/30/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re: mee and confer	t B768	0.10	77.50
01/30/20	MDOSS	Calls with A. Mielke re: research re: conflicts of laws	B768	0.30	112.50

Welded Construction, L.P.		Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	Fe	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
01/30/20	MDOSS	Research re: conflicts of laws	B768	2.60	975.00	
01/30/20	TBUCH	Meet with A. Mielke and M. Milana litigation status and strategy (.3); con with A. Mielke re: claim analysis rela to same (.2)	fer	0.50	297.50	
01/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, M. Hood re: search terms (0.1); emai with M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)		0.20	98.00	
01/31/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re: me and confer and search terms; review search term criteria	et B768	0.30	232.50	
01/31/20	KGUER	Teleconference meet and confer with counsel re: discovery	B768	0.30	232.50	
01/31/20	MNEIB	Meet and confer call with A, Mielke L. Murley re: e-discovery issues	and B768	0.40	270.00	
			Total	901.90	\$525,886.00	

Welded Construction, L.P.	Invoice Date:	February 10, 2020
	Invoice Number:	50012465
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Matter Number:	076850.1001

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
AMIEL	Allison S. Mielke	Associate	1.90	415.00	788.50
AMIEL	Allison S. Mielke	Associate	160.50	490.00	78,645.00
BOLIV	Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	67.70	295.00	19,971.50
BFELD	Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	50.40	415.00	20,916.00
BWALT	Brenda Walters	Paralegal	15.00	305.00	4,575.00
DLASK	Debbie Laskin	Paralegal	1.60	305.00	488.00
EEDWA	Erin D. Edwards	Partner	79.80	715.00	57,057.00
JMARA	Jaclyn Marasco	Associate	0.20	525.00	105.00
JMORT	Jacob D. Morton	Associate	0.40	375.00	150.00
JMULV	Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	20.30	525.00	10,657.50
KENOS	Kenneth J. Enos	Partner	2.60	700.00	1,820.00
KGUER	Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	101.90	775.00	78,972.50
MDOSS	Malak S. Doss	Associate	27.90	375.00	10,462.50
MLUNN	Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	39.10	795.00	31,084.50
MMILA	Matthew Milana	Associate	4.70	400.00	1,880.00
MNEIB	Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	29.40	675.00	19,845.00
MFRAT	Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	4.30	175.00	752.50
RFPOP	Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	43.60	685.00	29,866.00
SBEAC	Sean M. Beach	Partner	109.30	835.00	91,265.50
TPAKR	Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	120.40	450.00	54,180.00
TPAKR	Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	0.10	400.00	40.00
TSNYD	Timothy J. Snyder	Partner	0.60	575.00	345.00
TBUCH	Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	20.20	595.00	12,019.00

Total

901.90

\$525,886.00

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date: Invoice Number:	Fe	bruary 10, 2020 50012465
		Matter Number:		076850.1001
Task Summary				
Task Code:B001	Case Administration			
Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	0.10	795.00	79.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.40	835.00	334.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	2.20	490.00	1,078.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	4.00	415.00	1,660.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	3.10	295.00	914.50
Total		9.80		4,066.00
Task Code:B002	Court Hearings			
Name	Timekeeper Title	Полис	Data	Amount
Matthew B, Lunn	Partner	<u>Hours</u> 0.10	<u>Rate</u> 795.00	<u>Amount</u> 79.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	1.10	835.00	918.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.70	490.00	343.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.80	415.00	332.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	1.60	295.00	472.00
	U U			
Total		4.30		2,145.00
Task Code:B004	Schedules & Statements,	U.S. Trustee Reports		
Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.40	685.00	274.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	1.20	415.00	498.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.50	295.00	147.50
		• • •		
Total		2.10		919.50
Task Code:B005	Lease/Executory Contra	<u>ct Issues</u>		
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.20	685.00	137.00
Total		0.20		137.00
Task Code:B006	<u>Use, Sale or Lease of Pro</u>	operty (363 issues)		
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	<u>Rate</u>	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	10.80	795.00	8,586.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	2.60	685.00	1,781.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	39.40	835.00	32,899.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	2.20	490.00	1,078.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	1.10	415.00	456.50
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.90	295.00	265.50
		0.20		200.00
Total		57.00		45,066.00
Task Code:B007	<u>Claims Analysis, Objecti</u>	ons and Resolutions		

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 84 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	Fε	bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Name</u> Kenneth J. Enos Matthew B. Lunn	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Partner Partner	<u>Hours</u> 2.60 1.30	<u>Rate</u> 700.00 795.00	<u>Amount</u> 1,820.00 1,033.50
Robert F. Poppiti Sean M. Beach	Partner Partner	2.80 26.00	685.00 835.00	1,918.00 21,710.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	1.90	415.00	788.50
Allison S. Mielke Betsy L. Feldman	Associate Associate	28.10 17.40	490.00 415.00	13,769.00 7,221.00
Total		80.10		48,260.00
Task Code:B008	Meetings			
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	Hours	Rate	Amount
Matthew B. Lunn Robert F. Poppiti	Partner Partner	3.50 7.90	795.00 685.00	2,782.50 5,411.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	3.50	835.00	2,922.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	5.70	490.00	2,793.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	4.30	525.00	2,257.50
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	0.40	595.00	238.00
Total		25.30		16,405.00
Task Code:B009	Stay Relief Matters			
<u>Name</u> Robert F. Poppiti	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Partner	<u>Hours</u> 1.00	<u>Rate</u> 685.00	<u>Amount</u> 685.00
Total		1.00		685.00
<u>Task Code:B011</u>	Other Adversary Proceeding	igs		
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	79.10	715.00	56,556.50
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	96.40	775.00	74,710.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	4.60	675.00	3,105.00
Sean M. Beach Allison S. Mielke	Partner Associate	18.30 92.10	835.00	15,280.50
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.30	490.00 415.00	45,129.00 124.50
Jacob D. Morton	Associate	0.40	375.00	150.00
Matthew Milana	Associate	4.70	400.00	1,880.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	117.10	450.00	52,695.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	49.90	295.00	14,720.50
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	15.00	305.00	4,575.00
Debbie Laskin	Paralegal	1.60	305.00	488.00
Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	3.80	175.00	665.00
Total		483.30		270,079.00
Task Code:B012	Plan and Disclosure Statem	ient		
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	Hours	Rate	<u>Amount</u>

Page Number 83

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	Fe	bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Task Code:B012	Plan and Disclosure Sta	tement		
<u>Name</u> Matthew B. Lunn Michael S. Neiburg	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Partner Partner	<u>Hours</u> 23.20 0.10	<u>Rate</u> 795.00 675.00	<u>Amount</u> 18,444.00 67.50
Robert F. Poppiti Sean M. Beach Allison S. Mielke Betsy L. Feldman	Partner Partner Associate Associate	25.20 12.90 4.50 20.70	685.00 835.00 490.00 415.00	17,262.00 10,771.50 2,205.00 8,590.50
Joseph M. Mulvihill Total	Associate	6.10 92.70	525.00	3,202.50 60,543.00
Task Code:B013	Creditor Inquiries			
<u>Name</u> Allison S. Mielke Betsy L. Feldman Beth A. Olivere	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Associate Associate Paralegal	<u>Hours</u> 0.10 0.10 0.20	<u>Rate</u> 490.00 415.00 295.00	<u>Amount</u> 49.00 41.50 59.00
Total		0.40		149.50
Task Code:B014	General Corporate Mat	ters		
<u>Name</u> Matthew B. Lunn Sean M. Beach Allison S. Mielke	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Partner Partner Associate	<u>Hours</u> 0.10 2.60 0.20	<u>Rate</u> 795.00 835.00 490.00	<u>Amount</u> 79.50 2,171.00 98.00
Total		2.90		2,348.50
Task Code:B015	Employee Matters			
<u>Name</u> Robert F. Poppiti Timothy J. Snyder Betsy L. Feldman	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Partner Partner Associate	<u>Hours</u> 2.00 0.60 0.20	<u>Rate</u> 685.00 575.00 415.00	<u>Amount</u> 1,370.00 345.00 83.00
Total		2.80		1,798.00
Task Code:B016	Asset Analysis			
<u>Name</u> Tara C. Pakrouh	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Associate	<u>Hours</u> 0.20	<u>Rate</u> 450.00	<u>Amount</u> 90.00
Total		0.20		90.00
<u>Task Code:B017</u>	Retention of Profession	als/Fee Issues		
<u>Name</u> Michael S. Neiburg Robert F. Poppiti Allison S. Mielke	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Partner Partner Associate	<u>Hours</u> 0.20 0.70 1.50	<u>Rate</u> 675.00 685.00 490.00	<u>Amount</u> 135.00 479.50 735.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-2 Filed 02/14/20 Page 86 of 86

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	Fe	bruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Task Code:B017	Retention of Profession	als/Fee Issues		
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	1.00	415.00	415.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	0.10	400.00	40.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	3.10	450.00	1,395.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	6.00	295.00	1,770.00
Total		12.60		4,969.50
Task Code:B018	Fee Application Prepar	ration		
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	Hours	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.80	685.00	548.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	1.50	295.00	442.50
Total		2.30		990.50
Task Code:B768	Williams Litigation			
Name	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	0.70	715.00	500.50
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	5.50	775.00	4,262.50
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	24.50	675.00	16,537.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	5.10	835.00	4,258.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	23.20	490.00	11,368.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	3.60	415.00	1,494.00
Jaclyn Marasco	Associate	0.20	525.00	105.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	9.90	525.00	5,197.50
Malak S. Doss	Associate	27.90	375.00	10,462.50
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	19.80	595.00	11,781.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	4.00	295.00	1,180.00
Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	0.50	175.00	87.50
Total		124.90		67,234.50

EXHIBIT B

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-3 Filed 02/14/20 Page 2 of 18

Welded Construction, L.P.	Invoice Date:	February 10, 2020
	Invoice Number:	50012465
	Matter Number:	076850.1001

Cost Detail

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
11/15/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.58
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	19.00	1.90
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/02/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
12/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/03/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/04/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	5.00	12.98
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/05/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	16.00	41.53
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/05/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C	29.00	75.27
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/05/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	23.00	59.70
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/05/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	12.00	1.20
12/06/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	8.00	20.76
12/06/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	6.00	15.57
12/06/19	Parcels, Inc YCST Judge Gross Courtroom 852604	1.00	7.50

Welded Con	struction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	F	ebruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		6.00	0.60
12/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		8.00	0.80
12/06/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		7.00	0.70
12/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		4.00	0.40
12/09/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MORTON, JACOB	by:	9.00	23.36
12/09/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		4.00	0.40
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		23.00	2.30
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		7.00	0.70
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		3.00	0.30
12/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search BUCHANAN, TRAVIS G	by:	5.00	12.98
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		19.00	1.90
12/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search DOSS,MALAK	by:	53.00	137.56
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		30.00	3.00
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		10.00	1.00
12/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MIELKE, ALLISON S	by:	4.00	10.38
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		9.00	0.90
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		19.00	1.90
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		20.00	2.00
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/10/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MORTON, JACOB	by:	26.00	67.48
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		8.00	0.80
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		4.00	0.40
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		3.00	0.30
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		7.00	0.70
12/10/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		3.00	0.30
12/11/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MORTON, JACOB	by:	17.00	44.12
12/11/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		10.00	1.00
12/11/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search DOSS,MALAK	by:	56.00	145.35
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		10.00	1.00
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		13.00	1.30
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		3.00	0.30
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-3 Filed 02/14/20 Page 4 of 18

Welded Con	struction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Fo Invoice Number: Matter Number:	ebruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	<u>Amount</u>
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	13.00	1.30
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	17.00	1.70
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	25.00	2.50
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	11.00	1.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	12.00	1.20
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	10.00	1.00
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	27.00	2.70
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/12/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30

Welded Con	struction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	F	ebruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	Amount
12/13/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	ee:	1.00	7.21
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		4.00	0.40
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		8.00	0.80
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		11.00	1.10
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		30.00	3.00
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		11.00	1.10
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		3.00	0.30
12/13/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10
12/16/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	ree:	1.00	1.13
12/16/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	ree:	1.00	19.72
12/16/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	vee:	1.00	6.26
12/16/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MORTON, JACOB	by:	3.00	7.79
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/17/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	/ee:	1.00	2.95
12/17/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	/ee:	1.00	1.43
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		3.00	0.30
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/17/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search FELDMAN, BETSY	by:	35.00	90.84
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10
12/17/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MORTON, JACOB	by:	33.00	85.65
12/17/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10
12/18/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		1.00	0.10
12/18/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/18/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20
12/18/19	Docket Retrieval / Search		2.00	0.20

Welded Con	I	nvoice Date: nvoice Number: Aatter Number:	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description	Quanti	ity <u>Amount</u>
12/18/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/18/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/19/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.	00 0.50
12/19/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e: 1.	00 18.51
12/19/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	: 1.	00 4.13
12/19/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payer Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e: 1.	00 2.56
12/19/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by PAKROUH, TARA C	: 8.	00 20.76
12/20/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e: 1.	6.39
12/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/20/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/21/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by MIELKE, ALLISON S	: 5.	00 12.98
12/23/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payer Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e: 1.	6.91
12/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.	00 0.30
12/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.	00 0.40
12/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.	00 0.30
12/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/26/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/27/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/27/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by MIELKE, ALLISON S	: 11.	00 28.55
12/27/19	Parcels, Inc YCST Judge Gross Courtroom 856	037 1.	00 17.50
12/27/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payer Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	2: 1.	00 10.38
12/27/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/27/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.	00 0.40
12/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.	00 0.10
12/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.	00 0.30
12/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.	00 0.20
12/30/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payer Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	2: 1.	00 1.52
12/30/19	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payer Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e: 1.	00 2.26

Welded Con	Inv	voice Date: voice Number: atter Number:	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
12/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
12/30/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
12/31/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	16.00	41.53
12/31/19	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	9.00	23.36
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
01/02/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	40.00	32.00
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	48.00	4.80
01/02/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	6.00	13.68
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	805.00	80.50
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	50.00	5.00
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	88.00	8.80
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
01/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	346.00	34.60
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	34.00	3.40
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	33.00	3.30
01/03/20	Scanning Charges SCAN	3.00	0.30
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	53.00	5.30
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
01/03/20	Parcels, Inc YCST Judge Gross Courtroom 85668	1.00	12.50
01/03/20	Federal Express Corporation - U.S. DISTRICT COU MIDDLE DISTRICT OF PENNSYLVANI 228 WA STREET HARRISBURG, PA 17101		11.55
01/03/20	Federal Express Corporation - DANIEL A. HOROV ESQ. SWARTZ SWILDER LLC 1101 KINGS HIG NORTH CHERRY HILL, NJ 8034		11.55
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	87.00	8.70
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	7.00	0.70
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
01/03/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	14.00	31.92
01/03/20	Scanning Charges SCAN	3.00	0.30
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00

Welded Con	struction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	F	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		15.00	1.50
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		65.00	6.50
01/03/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b DOSS,MALAK	ру:	11.00	25.08
01/03/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b FELDMAN,BETSY	by:	5.00	11.40
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		6.00	0.60
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		24.00	2.40
01/03/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		151.00	15.10
01/05/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/05/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	ee:	1.00	4.95
01/05/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		13.00	1.30
01/05/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b MIELKE, ALLISON S	ру:	14.00	31.92
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		12.00	1.20
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		127.00	12.70
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		48.00	4.80
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		25.00	2.50
01/06/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	ee:	1.00	1.78
01/06/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	ee:	1.00	6.69
01/06/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Pay Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	ee:	1.00	4.17
01/06/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		96.00	76.80
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/06/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		40.00	32.00
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		7.00	0.70
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		40.00	4.00
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		20.00	2.00
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		100.00	10.00
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/06/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search I DOSS,MALAK	ру:	25.00	57.00
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		88.00	8.80
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		46.00	4.60
01/06/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search I MIELKE, ALLISON S	ру:	3.00	6.84

Welded Con		Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Date	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		144.00	14.40
01/06/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		39.00	31.20
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		68.00	6.80
01/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/07/20	Parcels, Inc Purebread Deli 857177		1.00	17.50
01/07/20	Parcels, Inc Purebread Deli 857177		1.00	70.00
01/07/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Paye Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e:	1.00	26.32
01/07/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Paye Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e:	1.00	3.00
01/07/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Paye Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	e:	1.00	7.56
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		26.00	2.60
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		5.00	0.50
01/07/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		48.00	38.40
01/07/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b DOSS,MALAK	y:	43.00	98.04
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		7.00	0.70
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		32.00	3.20
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		202.00	20.20
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		34.00	3.40
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		26.00	2.60
01/07/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		39.00	31.20
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		16.00	1.60
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		127.00	12.70
01/07/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		26.00	2.60
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		5.00	0.50
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		1.00	0.10
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		844.00	84.40
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		808.00	80.80
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		7.00	0.70
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		21.00	2.10
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		18.00	1.80
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		15.00	1.50
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		19.00	1.90
01/08/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b DOSS,MALAK	y:	8.00	18.24
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		17.00	1.70

Welded Con	Invo	ice Date: Fe ice Number: ter Number:	ebruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/08/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	6.00	4.80
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	114.00	11.40
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	328.00	32.80
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
01/08/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	276.00	220.80
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	32.00	3.20
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	31.00	3.10
01/08/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	260.00	208.00
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	196.00	19.60
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	21.00	2.10
01/08/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	4.00	9.12
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
01/08/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	282.00	225.60
01/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	21.00	2.10
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	54.00	5.40
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	84.00	8.40
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
01/09/20	Veritext - Deposition/Transcript Cost of Transcript ar of delivery during deposition of Douglas Sutton on D 17, 2019		853.05
01/09/20	Parcels, Inc YCST Judge Gross Courtroom 857618	1.00	17.50
01/09/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.13
01/09/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.65
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	28.00	2.80
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
01/09/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	16.00	36.48
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	13.00	1.30
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	38.00	3.80
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	227.00	22.70
01/09/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY	12.00	27.36
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	82.00	8.20

Welded Con	struction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:		February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	Amount
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		48.00	4.80
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		62.00	6.20
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		54.00	5.40
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		59.00	5.90
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		42.00	4.20
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		12.00	1.20
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		14.00	1.40
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		28.00	2.80
01/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		21.00	2.10
01/10/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Se PAKROUH,TARA C	arch by:	20.00	45.60
01/10/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Se MIELKE,ALLISON S	arch by:	10.00	22.80
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		88.00	8.80
01/10/20	Parcels, Inc Bankruptcy Court YCST 85	6813	1.00	5.00
01/10/20	Parcels, Inc Bankruptcy Court (Lobby) Y	7CST 857299	1.00	5.00
01/10/20	Parcels, Inc Purebread Deli 857878 Brea deposition	kfast for1/10	1.00	88.00
01/10/20	Parcels, Inc Purebread Deli 857878		1.00	17.50
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		114.00	11.40
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		84.00	8.40
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		80.00	8.00
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		48.00	4.80
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		5.00	0.50
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/10/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		93.00	9.30
01/11/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Se PAKROUH, TARA C	arch by:	65.00	148.20
01/11/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Se MIELKE,ALLISON S	arch by:	17.00	38.76
01/12/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Se PAKROUH,TARA C	arch by:	86.00	196.08
01/12/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		38.00	3.80
01/12/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Se MIELKE, ALLISON S	arch by:	33.00	75.24
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		3.00	0.30

Welded Con	istruction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	F	ebruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	Amount
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		9.00	0.90
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/13/20	Veritext - Deposition/Transcript Charges various deposition charges (video services 12/13 deposition of T. Rapp		1.00	972.90
01/13/20	Roadrunner Express, Inc Car/Bus/Subw Transportation (round trip) for E. Edward airport re: 12/11-12/13/19 depositions in 0	s to Philadelphia	1.00	234.00
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		9.00	0.90
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		56.00	5.60
01/13/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Co	lor	48.00	38.40
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		42.00	4.20
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		13.00	1.30
01/13/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw S PAKROUH, TARA C	earch by:	67.00	152.76
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		42.00	4.20
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		29.00	2.90
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		14.00	1.40
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		51.00	5.10
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		14.00	1.40
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		6.00	0.60
01/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		42.00	4.20
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		14.00	1.40
01/14/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		26.00	2.60
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		14.00	1.40
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		16.00	1.60
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		57.00	5.70
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		7.00	0.70
01/14/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		3.00	0.30
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		92.00	9.20
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		17.00	1.70
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		29.00	2.90
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		9.00	0.90
01/14/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw S PAKROUH,TARA C	earch by:	4.00	9.12
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		5.00	0.50
01/14/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		37.00	3.70
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		408.00	40.80
01/14/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		14.00	1.40

DateDescriptionQuantity01/14/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: FELDMAN,BETSY27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW14.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW17.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN33.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN60.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW16.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Char	<u>Amount</u> 61.56
FELDMAN,BETSY01/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW14.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW17.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN60.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN60.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW16.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20	61.56
01/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW17.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN13.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN60.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW16.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW<	
01/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW17.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN13.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN60.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW16.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW <t< td=""><td>1.40</td></t<>	1.40
01/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN13.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN60.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW16.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW<	1.00
01/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN60.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW16.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1.70
01/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW16.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/	1.30
01/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW27.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.0001	6.00
11121301/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW44.0001/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	1.60
01/14/20Scanning Charges SCAN5.0001/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH, TARA C10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	2.70
01/14/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW9.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	4.40
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.50
01/15/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: PAKROUH,TARA C10.00 PAKROUH,TARA C01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.90
PAKROUH,TARA C01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW11.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.60
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	22.80
01/15/20Lady Liberty Restaurant Group, LLC (Cosi) - Working Meals Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition1.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW11.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.60
Lunch for 8 from Cosi on 1/10 for deposition01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW7.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW11.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.60
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW5.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW11.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	170.00
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW11.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.70
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW11.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.50
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW6.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.60
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW10.0001/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	1.10
01/15/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW18.0001/16/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW80.00	0.60
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 80.00	1.00
	1.80
01/16/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 14.00	8.00
	11.20
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 54.00	5.40
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00	0.80
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00	0.50
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 85.00	8.50
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 37.00	3.70
01/16/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 85.00	8.50
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00	0.60
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00	1.00
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00	0.60
01/16/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 87.00	8.70
01/17/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00	0.50
01/17/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1,409.00	140.90

Welded Construction, L.P.		Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001	
<u>Date</u>	Description	<u>Quantity</u>	Amount	
01/17/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1.00	0.10	
01/17/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	68.00	6.80	
01/17/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	98.00	9.80	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	40.00	4.00	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	220.00	22.00	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	220.00	22.00	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1,263.00	126.30	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	218.00	21.80	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	60.00	6.00	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	85.00	8.50	
01/20/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	85.00	8.50	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	68.00	6.80	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	166.00	16.60	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	164.00	16.40	
01/21/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	42.00	33.60	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	132.00	13.20	
01/21/20	Scanning Charges SCAN	2.00	0.20	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	166.00	16.60	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	202.00	20.20	
01/21/20	Scanning Charges SCAN	74.00	7.40	
01/21/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color	96.00	76.80	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	102.00	10.20	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	68.00	6.80	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	408.00	40.80	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60	
01/21/20	Scanning Charges SCAN	12.00	1.20	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	32.00	3.20	
01/21/20	Scanning Charges SCAN	19.00	1.90	
01/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	296.00	29.60	
01/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10	
01/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20	
01/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	1,107.00	110.70	
01/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	160.00	16.00	
01/22/20	Sean Beach - Working Meals S. Beach Lunch with Hawkins, F. Pometti, and R. Poppiti during meeti January 7, 2020		62.00	

January 7, 2020

Welded Con	struction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:]	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		12.00	1.20
01/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		22.00	2.20
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		7.00	0.70
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		12.00	1.20
01/23/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MIELKE, ALLISON S	ру:	19.00	43.32
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		3,996.00	399.60
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/23/20	Cardmember Service - Court Costs Cost of mon court actions	itoring state	1.00	49.92
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		7.00	0.70
01/23/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search PAKROUH, TARA C	by:	37.00	84.36
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		17.00	1.70
01/23/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		7.00	5.60
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		12.00	1.20
01/23/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/24/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MIELKE, ALLISON S	by:	48.00	109.44
01/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		36.00	3.60
01/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		6.00	0.60
01/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/24/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		4.00	0.40
01/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		81.00	8.10
01/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		22.00	2.20
01/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		6.00	0.60
01/25/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		1.00	0.10
01/25/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search PAKROUH, TARA C	by:	12.00	27.36
01/25/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		16.00	1.60
01/25/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search MIELKE, ALLISON S	by:	14.00	31.92
01/25/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		2.00	0.20
01/25/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		1.00	0.10
01/26/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		7.00	0.70
01/26/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		20.00	2.00
01/26/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/26/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		13.00	1.30

Welded Con		Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	F	ebruary 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
<u>Date</u>	Description		<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/26/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		13.00	1.30
01/26/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b MIELKE, ALLISON S	y:	13.00	29.64
01/26/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		5.00	0.50
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		10.00	1.00
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		68.00	6.80
01/27/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		96.00	76.80
01/27/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b MIELKE, ALLISON S	у:	25.00	57.00
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		30.00	3.00
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		5.00	0.50
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		24.00	2.40
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		74.00	7.40
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		24.00	2.40
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		82.00	8.20
01/27/20	Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color		28.00	22.40
01/27/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/27/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b DOSS,MALAK	у:	83.00	189.24
01/27/20	Scanning Charges SCAN		4.00	0.40
01/28/20	Rodney Grille, Inc Working Meals Lunch for 5 Rodney Grille on 1/9 for deposition prep	5 from	1.00	74.85
01/28/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b DOSS,MALAK	у:	76.00	173.28
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		41.00	4.10
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		88.00	8.80
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		6.00	0.60
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		83.00	8.30
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		41.00	4.10
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		11.00	1.10
01/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		42.00	4.20
01/29/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search b MIELKE, ALLISON S	y:	90.00	205.20
01/29/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		160.00	16.00
01/29/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		202.00	20.20
01/29/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		8.00	0.80

DateDescription01/29/20Federal Express Corporation - JANE M. LEAMY ESC OFFICE OF US TRUSTEE FOR DIST 844 KING ST ROOM 2207 WILMINGTON, DE 1980101/29/20Federal Express Corporation - M.SCHAEDLE J. LUC BIBLI J MINTZ ESQ. BLANK ROME LLP ONE LC SQUARE PHILADELPHIA, PA 1910301/29/20Federal Express Corporation - MICHAEL E. COLLIN MANIER & hEROD PC 1201 DEMONBREUN STRUSUITE 9 NASHVILLE, TN 3720301/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Dup	REET IAN J 1.00 OGAN S ESQ. 1.00	11.96 11.96 19.25 19.25 1.30 2.80 46.20 2.40 91.20
OFFICE OF US TRUSTEE FOR DIST 844 KING ST ROOM 2207 WILMINGTON, DE 1980101/29/20Federal Express Corporation - M.SCHAEDLE J. LUC BIBLI J MINTZ ESQ. BLANK ROME LLP ONE LC SQUARE PHILADELPHIA, PA 1910301/29/20Federal Express Corporation - MICHAEL E. COLLIN MANIER & hEROD PC 1201 DEMONBREUN STRI SUITE 9 NASHVILLE, TN 3720301/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS, MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20 <th>REET IAN J 1.00 GAN 1.00 S ESQ. 1.00 ET 13.00 28.00 462.00 24.00 40.00</th> <th> 11.96 19.25 1.30 2.80 46.20 2.40 91.20 </th>	REET IAN J 1.00 GAN 1.00 S ESQ. 1.00 ET 13.00 28.00 462.00 24.00 40.00	 11.96 19.25 1.30 2.80 46.20 2.40 91.20
BIBLI J MINTZ ESQ. BLANK ROME LLP ONE LC SQUARE PHILADELPHIA, PA 1910301/29/20Federal Express Corporation - MICHAEL E. COLLIN MANIER & hEROD PC 1201 DEMONBREUN STRI SUITE 9 NASHVILLE, TN 3720301/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS, MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Dupli	PGAN S ESQ. 1.00 EET 13.00 28.00 462.00 24.00 40.00	19.25 1.30 2.80 46.20 2.40 91.20
MANIER & hEROD PC 1201 DEMONBREUN STRI SUITE 9 NASHVILLE, TN 3720301/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW </td <td>EET 13.00 28.00 462.00 24.00 40.00</td> <td>1.30 2.80 46.20 2.40 91.20</td>	EET 13.00 28.00 462.00 24.00 40.00	1.30 2.80 46.20 2.40 91.20
01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	28.00 462.00 24.00 40.00	2.80 46.20 2.40 91.20
01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	462.00 24.00 40.00	46.20 2.40 91.20
01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	24.00 40.00	2.40 91.20
01/29/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	40.00	91.20
DOSS,MALAK01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		
01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
01/29/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	88.00	8.80
01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS, MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE,ALLISON S01/30/20Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	5.00	0.50
MIELKE,ALLISON S 01/30/20 Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK 01/30/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 01/30/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 01/30/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 01/30/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	21.00	2.10
DOSS,MALAK01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	64.00	145.92
01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	77.00	175.56
01/30/20Scanning Charges SCAN01/30/20Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
01/30/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	8.00	0.80
	2.00	0.20
01/30/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	88.00	8.80
	7.00	0.70
01/30/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
01/30/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
01/31/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	22.00	2.20
01/31/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	204.00	20.40
01/31/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
01/31/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	3.40
01/31/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	34.00	29.20
01/31/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW		225.40

Total

\$10,148.02

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1226-3 Filed 02/14/20 Page 18 of 18

Welded Construction, L.P.	Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:	February 10, 2020 50012465 076850.1001
Cost Summary		
Description		Amount
Car/Bus/Subway Travel		234.00
Computerized Legal Research		3,481.94
Court Costs		49.92
Delivery / Courier		65.00
Deposition/Transcript		1,825.95
Docket Retrieval / Search		75.50
Federal Express		66.27
Reproduction Charges		3,689.40
Teleconference / Video Conference		160.19
Working Meals		499.85

Total

\$10,148.02