
IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

)
In re: ) Chapter 11

)
WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,1 ) Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)

)
Debtors. ) (Jointly Administered)

)
Objection Deadline: March 31,2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

______________________________________________  )

SUMMARY OF SIXTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY 
STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION 
FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES 

AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR 
THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1.2020 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29.2020

Name of Applicant:

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:

Effective Date of Retention:

Period for which compensation and 
reimbursement is sought:

Amount of Compensation sought as 
actual, reasonable and necessary:

Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as 
actual, reasonable and necessary:

This is an: X monthly__ final application

This monthly application includes 8.70 hours i 
with the preparation of Fee Applications.

Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP 

Debtors and Debtors in Possession 

October 22, 2018

February 1, 2020 through February 29, 2020

$431,008.50

$7,116.48

i a value of $2,800.50 incurred in connection

1 The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification 
number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing 
address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.
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Prior applications:

Requested Approved
Date Filed;
Docket No.

Period Covered Fees Expenses Fees Expenses

12/20/18
D.I. 347 10/22/18-11/30/18 $629,570.50 $5,815.10 $629,570.50 $5,815.10

1/15/19
D.I. 420 12/1/18-12/31/18 $443,598.00 $14,545.93 $443,598.00 $14,545.93

2/21/19
D.I. 513 1/1/19-1/31/19 $530,368.50 $13,191.07 $424,294.80 $13,191.07

3/18/16
D.I. 566 2/1/19-2/28/19 $493,838.50 $6,472.15 $395,070.80 $6,472.15

4/18/19
D.I. 656 3/1/19-3/31/19 $477,160.50 $1,962.33 $376,541.40! $1,962.33

5/23/19
D.I. 746 4/1/19-4/30/19 $486,070.00 $4,101.19 $486,070.00 $4,101.19

6/17/19
D.I. 799 5/1/19-5/31/19 $381,814.50 $3,315.52 $381,814.50 $3,315.52

7/23/19
D.I. 885 6/1/19-6/30/19 $511,859.00 $10,592.72 $511,859.00 $10,592.72

8/21/19
D.I. 957 7/1/19-7/31/19 $459,922.50 $8,298.95 $459,922.50 $8,298.95

9/17/19
D.I. 1004 8/1/19-8/31/19 $568,448.00 $5,563.21 $568,448.00 $5,563.21

10/21/19
D.I. 1061 9/1/19 - 9/30/19 $580,684.00 $12,216.57 $580,684.00 $12,216.57

11/22/19
D.I. 1120 10/1/19-10/31/19 $560,539.50 $11,934.73 $560,539.50 $11,934.73

12/30/19
D.I. 1171 11/1/19-11/31/19 $483,150.00 $20,283.17 $483,150.00 $20,283.17

1/21/20
D.I. 1191 12/1/19-12/31/19 $395,395.50 $19,816.70 $395,395.50 $19,816.70

2/14/20
D.I. 1226 1/1/20-1/31/20 $525,886.00 $10,148.02 $420,708.80 $10,148.02

1 otal $7,528,305.00 $148,257.36 $7,117,667.30 $148,257.36

1 This amount reflects an agreed to reduction between Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP and the Office of 
the United States Trustee in the amount of $5,187.00 for fees for the second interim period [see order D.I. 785], 
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COMPENSATION BY INDIVIDUAL

Name of Professional 
Person

Position of the Applicant, 
Number of Years in that
Position, Prior
Relevant Experience, Year of 
Obtaining License to Practice, 
Area of Expertise

Hourly 
Billing Rate
(including
changes)

Total
Billed
Hours

Total
Compensation

Sean M. Beach Partner since 2009. Joined firm as 
an associate in 2000. Member of 
DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar 
since 2007.

$835.00 132.40 $110,554.00

Matthew B. Lunn Partner since 2010. Joined firm as 
an associate in 2001. Member of 
DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar 
since 2009.

$795.00 24.40 $19,398.00

Kevin A. Guerke Partner since 2019. Joined firm in 
2019. Member of DE Bar since 
2001

$775.00 112.20 $86,955.00

Kevin A. Guerke Partner since 2019. Joined firm in 
2019. Member of DE Bar since 
2001

$725.00 0.70 $507.50

Erin D. Edwards Partner since 2014. Joined firm as 
an associate in 2003. Member of 
DE Bar since 2003.

$715.00 68.30 $48,834.50

Kenneth J. Enos Partner since 2015. Joined firm as 
an associate in 2004. Member of 
DE Bar since 2004.

$700.00 1.70 $1,190.00

Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. Partner since 2018. Joined firm as 
associate in 2007. Member of DE 
Bar since 2007 and NY Bar since 
2015.

$685.00 3.20 $2,192.00

Michael S. Neiburg Counsel since 2019. Joined firm 
as an associate in 2008. Member 
of DE Bar since 2009.

$675.00 25.10 $16,942.50

Travis G. Buchanan Joined firm as an associate in
2011, Member of DE Bar since 
2011.

$595.00 46.10 $27,429.50

Joseph M. Mulvihill Joined the firm as an associate in 
2019. Member of DE Bar since 
2014 and PA Bar since 2015.

$525.00 0.70 $367.50

Jaclyn Marasco Joined the firm as an associate in 
2019. Member of DE Bar since 
2017.

$525.00 17.00 $8,925.00

Allison S. Mielke Joined firm as an associate in
2017. Member of DE Bar since 
2013.

$490.00 80.50 $39,445.00

Tara C. Pakrouh Joined firm as an associate in
2017. Member of DE Bar since 
2015.

$450.00 79.80 $35,910.00
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Betsy L. Feldman Joined firm as an associate in
2017. Member of DE Bar since 
2017 and NY Bar since 2019.

$415.00 17.60 $7,304.00

Ryan D. Hart Joined firm as an associate in
2017. Member of DE Bar since 
2017.

$415.00 1.30 $539.50

Matthew Milana Joined firm as an associate in
2019. Member of DE Bar since 
2019.

$400.00 1.20 $480.00

Debbie Laskin Paralegal $305.00 1.90 $579.50

Brenda Walters Paralegal $305.00 22.80 $6,954.00

Beth Olivere Paralegal $295.00 53.80 $15,871.00

Monica Fratticci Paralegal $175.00 3.60 $630.00

Grand Total: 694.30 $431,008.50
Blended Rate: $620.78

26138525.1
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COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category Total Hours Total Fees

Case Administration (B001) 13.00 $4,784.00
Court Hearings (B002) 19.20 $10,938.00
Cash Collateral/DIP Financing (B003) 0.10 $49.00
Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports (B004) 1.30 $565.00
Lease/Executory Contract Issues (B005) 0.80 $668.00
Use, Sale or Lease Property (363 Issues) (B006) 51.50 $41,201.50
Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions (B007) 52.90 $37,932.00
Meetings (B008) 5.30 $3,535.00
Other Adversary Proceedings (B011) 341.70 $200,819.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement (BO 12) 68.30 $46,964.50
General Corporate Matters (BOM) 2.50 $1,570.00
Employee Matters (B015) 1.70 $911.00
Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues (BO 17) 7.10 $3,084.00
Fee Application Preparation (BO 18) 8.70 $2,800.50
Travel (BO 19) 6.60 $5,511.00
Williams Litigation (B768) 113.60 $69,676.00

TOTALS 694.30 $431,008.50
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EXPENSE SUMMARY

Expenses Category (Examples) Total Expenses
AP Outside Duplication Services $656.34
Car/Bus/Subway Travel $204.00
Deposition/Transcript $3,182.08
Docket Retrieval/Search $66.99
Hotel/Lodging $713.54
Reproduction Charges $1,598.90
Teleconference/Video Conference $88.81
Working Meals $605.82

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $7,116.48

26138525.1
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

)
) Chapter 11
)
) Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)
)
) (Jointly Administered)
)̂
 Objection Deadline: March 31, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

)

SIXTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY 
STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION 
FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES 

AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR 
THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1. 2020 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29. 2020

Pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C.

§§ 101 et seq. (the “Bankruptcy Code”), and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy

Procedure, and in accordance with that certain Order Pursuant to Section 327(a) of the

Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2014, and Local Rule 2014-1, Authorizing the Retention of

Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP as Counsel for the Debtors, Nunc Pro Tunc to the

Petition Date [Docket No. 234] (the “Retention Order”) and that certain Order Establishing

Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained

In re:

WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,1 

Debtors.

Professionals [Docket No. 230] (the “Interim Compensation Order”), the law firm of Young 

Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (hereinafter “YCS&T”) hereby moves this Court for 

reasonable compensation for professional legal services rendered as counsel to the above- 

captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “Debtors”) in the amount of 

$431,008.50, together with reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred in the

1 The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification 
number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing 
address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.
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amount of $7,116.48 for the period commencing February 1, 2020 through and including 

February 29, 2020 (the “Fee Period”). In support of its Application, YCS&T respectfully 

represents as follows:

1. Pursuant to the Retention Order, YCS&T was employed to represent the 

Debtors as bankruptcy counsel in connection with these chapter 11 cases, nunc pro tunc to 

October 22, 2018. The Retention Order authorized YCS&T to be compensated on an hourly 

basis and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses.

2. All services for which compensation is requested by YCS&T were 

performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a detailed statement of fees incurred 

during the Fee Period showing the amount of $431,008.50 due for fees.

4. The services rendered by YCS&T during the Fee Period are grouped into 

the categories set forth in Exhibit A. The attorneys and paralegals who rendered services relating 

to each category are identified, along with the number of hours for each individual and the total 

compensation sought for each category, in the attachments hereto.

DISBURSEMENTS

5. YCS&T has incurred out-of-pocket disbursements during the Fee Period 

in the amount of $7,116.48. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a detailed statement of expenses 

paid during the Fee Period. This disbursement sum is broken down into categories of charges, 

including, among other things, telephone and telecopier toll and other charges, mail and express 

mail charges, special or hand delivery charges, document processing, photocopying charges, 

charges for mailing supplies (including, without limitation, envelopes and labels) provided by the

26138525.1
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Firm to outside copying services for use in mass mailings, travel expenses, expenses for 

“working meals,” computerized research, transcription costs, as well as non-ordinary overhead 

expenses such as secretarial and other overtime. A complete review by category of the expenses 

incurred for the Fee Period may be found attached hereto as Exhibit B. To the extent such 

itemization is insufficient to satisfy the requirements of Rule 2016-2(e)(ii) of the Local Rules of 

Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of 

Delaware (the “Local Rules”), YCS&T respectfully requests that the Court waive strict 

compliance with such Local Rule.

6. Costs incurred for overtime and computer assisted research are not 

included in YCS&T’s normal hourly billing rates and, therefore, are itemized and included in 

YCS&T’s disbursements. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-2, YCS&T represents that its rate for 

duplication is $.10 per page, its rate for outgoing telecopier transmissions is $.25 per page 

(excluding related long distance transmission charges), there is no charge for incoming telecopier 

transmissions and there is no surcharge for computerized research.

VALUATION OF SERVICES

7. Attorneys and paraprofessionals of YCS&T have expended a total of 

694.30 hours in connection with this matter during the Fee Period.

8. The amount of time spent by each of these persons providing services to 

the Debtors for the Fee Period is fully set forth in the detail attached hereto as Exhibit A. These 

are YCS&T’s normal hourly rates of compensation for work of this character. The reasonable 

value of the services rendered by YCS&T for the Fee Period as counsel for the Debtors in these 

cases is $431,008.50.

26138525.1
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9. YCS&T believes that the time entries included in Exhibit A attached

hereto and the expense breakdown set forth in Exhibit B hereto are in compliance with the 

requirements of Local Rule 2016-2.

10. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the 

Bankruptcy Code, the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these 

cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of 

such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under chapter 11.

11. This Application covers the Fee Period February 1, 2020 through and 

including February 29, 2020. YCS&T has and will continue to perform additional necessary 

services subsequent to February 29, 2020, for which YCS&T will file subsequent fee 

applications.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]
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CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, YCS&T requests that allowance be made to it in the sum of 

$431,008.50 as compensation for necessary professional services rendered to the Debtors for the 

Fee Period, and the sum of $7,116.48 for reimbursement of actual necessary costs and expenses 

incurred during that period, and further requests such other and further relief as this Court may 

deem just and proper.

Dated: March 11, 2020
Wilmington, Delaware

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

/s/ Sean M. Beach_____________________________
Sean M. Beach (No. 4070)
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. (No. 5052)
Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934)
Betsy L. Feldman (No. 6410)
Rodney Square 
1000 North King Street 
Wilmington, DE 19801 
Telephone: (302) 571-6600 
Facsimile: (302) 571-1256

Counsel to the Debtors

26138525.1
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VERIFICATION

STATE OF DELAWARE )
) SS:

NEW CASTLE COUNTY )

Sean M. Beach, Esquire, after being duly sworn according to law, hereby deposes and

says:

1. I am a Partner in the applicant firm, Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, 

LLP, and have been admitted to the bar of the Supreme Court of Delaware since 2001.

2. I have personally performed many of the legal services rendered by Young 

Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, as counsel for the Debtors, and am familiar with all other 

work performed on behalf of the Debtors by the lawyers and paraprofessionals in the firm.

3. The facts set forth in the foregoing Application are true and correct to the 

best of my knowledge, information and belief.

o

Notary Public 
My Commission Expires

ERICA A. STEELE 
NOTARY PUBLIC 

STATE OF DELAWARE
My Commission Expires July 10,2021

26138525.1
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

)
) Chapter 11
)
) Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)
)
) (Jointly Administered)
)̂
 Objection Deadline: March 31, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

)

NOTICE OF SIXTEENTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION

TO: (I) THE DEBTORS; (II) THE U.S. TRUSTEE; (III) COUNSEL FOR THE DIP 
LENDER; AND (IV) COUNSEL FOR THE COMMITTEE

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (the 
“Applicant”) has filed its Sixteenth Monthly Application for Allowance of Compensation and 
Reimbursement of Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession for Services 
Rendered for the Period from February 1, 2020 Through February 29, 2020 (the “Application”) 
with the Court. The Application seeks allowance of interim fees in the amount of 
$431,008.50.00 and interim expenses in the amount of $7,116.48.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections to the Application, if any, 
are required to be filed on or before March 31, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) (the “Objection 
Deadline”) with the Clerk of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 
3rd Floor, 824 N. Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801. You must also serve any such 
objection so as to be received by the following on or before the Objection Deadline: (i) the 
Debtors, P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470 (Attn: Frank A. Pometti, Chief 
Restructuring Officer); (ii) counsel to the Debtors, Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, 
Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801 (Attn: Tara C. Pakrouh, Esq.); 
(iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware, J. Caleb Boggs Federal 
Building, Room 2207, 844 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, (Attn: Jane M. Leamy, 
Esq.); (iv) counsel for the DIP Lender, Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher LLP, 200 Park Avenue, New 
York, NY 10166 (Attn: Michael A. Rosenthal, Esq. and Matthew K. Kelsey, Esq.); and (v) 
counsel for the Committee, Blank Rome LLP, 130 North 18th Street, Philadelphia, PA 19103 
(Attn: John E. Lucian, Esq. and Michael B. Schaedle, Esq.).

In re:

WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,1 

Debtors.

1 The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification 
number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing 
address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.
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PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT PURSUANT TO THE ORDER 
ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND 
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR RETAINED PROFESSIONALS [DOCKET NO. 
230], IF NO OBJECTIONS ARE FILED AND SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE 
ABOVE PROCEDURES, THE DEBTORS WILL BE AUTHORIZED TO PAY 80% OF 
REQUESTED INTERIM FEES AND 100% OF REQUESTED INTERIM EXPENSES, 
WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER OF THE COURT.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT ONLY IF AN OBJECTION 
IS PROPERLY AND TIMELY FILED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE 
PROCEDURES AND CANNOT BE CONSENSUALLY RESOLVED WILL A HEARING 
BE HELD ON THE APPLICATION.

Dated: March 11, 2020
Wilmington, Delaware

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

/s/ Sean M Beach________________________________
Sean M. Beach (No. 4070)
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. (No. 5052)
Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934)
Betsy L. Feldman (No. 6410)
Rodney Square 
1000 North King Street 
Wilmington, DE 19801 
Telephone: (302) 571-6600 
Facsimile: (302) 571-1256

Counsel to the Debtors

26138525.1
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EXHIBIT A
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YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP
RODNEY SQUARE 

1000 NORTH KING STREET 
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600 (302) 571-1253 FAX
(800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY) TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644 www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial Writer's E-Mail
(302) 571-6621 sbeach@ycst.com

Stephen Hawkins 
26933 Eckel Rd. 
Perrysburg, OH 43551

Invoice Date: March 6, 2020
Invoice Number: 50013026
Matter Number: 076850.1001

Re: Debtor Representation

CURRENT INVOICE

Professional Services 

Disbursements

$ 431,008.50

$_________7,116.48

Total Due This Invoice $ 438,124.98

Case 18-12378-CSS    Doc 1265-2    Filed 03/11/20    Page 2 of 72
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Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

March 6, 2020
50013026

076850.1001

Time Detail

Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/03/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and S. Hawkins re: 

updated case timeline
B001 0.10 49.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Prepare COC [Richie Bros Sale] and 
proposed order for delivery to chambers

B001 0.20 59.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.20 59.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Update critical dates B001 0.70 206.50

02/05/20 AMIEL Confer with E. Healy re: logistics for 
mediation and pre-trial conference

B001 0.10 49.00

02/05/20 AMIEL Review critical dates (0.1); and revise 
same (0.1)

B001 0.20 98.00

02/05/20 BFELD Review and revise critical dates calendar 
re: upcoming case deadlines

B001 1.20 498.00

02/05/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 . 0.20 59.00

02/05/20 BOLIV Update dockets of multiple cases 
transferred from West Virginia and DE. 
District Court

B001 0.60 177.00

02/05/20 BOLIV Further edits to critical dates; circulate to 
working group

B001 0.60 177.00

02/06/20 BOLIV Finalize downloading of pleadings 
transferred from West VA courts re
CADD Enterprises

B001 0.40 118.00

02/06/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.10 29.50

02/06/20 MLUNN Review critical dates memo B001 0.10 79.50

02/07/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Olivere re: notice of status 
conference (0.1); confer with court re: 
same (0.2)

B001 0.30 147.00

02/07/20 BOLIV Draft notice of status conference for
March 4, 2020

B001 0.30 88.50

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: scheduling 
committee status call and proposed 
agenda

B001 0.10 49.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of notices of status conference in main 
case and all open adversary matters

B001 0.50 147.50

Page Number 2
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Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

March 6, 2020
50013026

076850.1001

Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount

02/10/20 BOLIV Draft multiple notices of status 
conference covering all open cases in 
Welded for March 4th status conference

B001 0.80 236.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.10 29.50

02/11/20 BOLIV Download affidavits of service B001 0.10 29.50

02/12/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.20 59.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Draft COC re omnibus hearing date for 
March 2020

B001 0.20 59.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of COC re omnibus hearing date

B001 0.30 88.50

02/13/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.20 59.00

02/13/20 SBEAC Email with S. Soule re: Williams 
litigation discovery issues

B001 0.10 83.50

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Olivere re: exclusivity 
deadline

B001 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.20 59.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: committee status 
call

B001 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Review critical dates B001 0.50 245.00

02/17/20 BOLIV Update critical dates B001 1.30 383.50

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Olivere and B. Feldman 
re: critical dates

B001 0.10 49.00

02/18/20 BFELD Review critical dates calendar re: 
upcoming case deadlines

B001 0.10 41.50

02/18/20 BFELD Revise consultant agreement re: R.
Fetchik

B001 0.80 332.00

02/18/20 BOLIV Finalize critical dates and circulate to 
working group

B001 0.30 88.50

02/18/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.10 29.50

02/18/20 KGUER Review critical dates calendar B001 0.10 77.50
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02/18/20 KGUER Review amended scheduling order B001 0.20 155.00

02/21/20 MLUNN Review critical dates memo B001 0.10 79.50

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti re: ETP audit B001 0.10 49.00

02/26/20 BFELD Emails with S. Beach and F. Pometti re: 
ETP review of relationship (.1); review 
re: request for information (.2)

B001 0.30 124.50

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and F. Pometti re: 
ETP relationship audit

B001 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 BFELD Emails with S. Cherian and J. Krzysztofik 
on title of Hoffman Ford truck

B001 0.10 41.50

02/28/20 BOLIV Meet and confer with A. Mielke re status 
conference, agenda for same and report 
related thereto

B001 0.20 59.00

02/28/20 BOLIV Review and evaluate incoming pleadings 
and correspondence for distribution to co­
counsel

B001 0.20 59.00

02/28/20 BOLIV Coordinate service of order re: claim no. 
593

B001 0.10 29.50

02/03/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and R. Poppiti re: 
omnibus hearing scheduling

B002 0.10 49.00

02/03/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re: hearing issues B002 0.10 83.50

02/04/20 BFELD Emails with R. Fetchik re: checks 
received on account of insurance invoices

B002 0.20 83.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with counsel for the committee re: 
notice of status conference

B002 0.10 49.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with chambers re: notices of status 
conference

B002 0.10 49.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Review notices of status conference (0.3), 
compare to docket (0.2), and provide 
comments to B. Olivere re: same (0.1)

B002 0.60 294.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service B002 0.60 177.00
of (7) notices of status conference for 
March 4, 2020 status conference in all 
active Welded cases

02/10/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re general case 
status conference (.1); Work with A. 
Mielke re: same (.2)

B002 0.30 250.50

02/10/20 SBEAC Review documents and prepare notes re: 
Prime NDT trial preparation

B002 3.30 2,755.50

02/12/20 AMIEL Emails with court re: scheduling 
omnibus/fee hearing

B002 0.10 49.00
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02/13/20 AMIEL Emails with D. Gadson re: scheduling 

hearing
B002 0.10 49.00

02/13/20 SBEAC Email with A. Mielke and R. Poppiti re: 
Omnibus/Fee Hearing

B002 0.10 83.50

02/16/20 SBEAC Emails with E. Edwards re: Prime 
settlement issues

B002 0.10 83.50

02/17/20 BOL1V Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of notice of amended agenda canceling 
hearing 2/18/20

B002 0.30 88.50

02/21/20 AMIEL Review transcript in connection with 
drafting status report

B002 0.10 49.00

02/26/20 BOLIV Prepare binders for E. Edwards re 
Williams: complaint, answer and all 
summary judgment briefing

B002 1.40 413.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with D. Laskin re: status report B002 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Olivere re: agenda for 
status conference

B002 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Draft status report in advance of status 
conference

B002 3.80 1,862.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Confer with D. Laskin re: status report 
format

B002 0.20 98.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and M. Neiburg re: 
status report

B002 0.10 49.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Confer with B. Olivere re: status report 
and agenda for status conference

B002 0.30 147.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Revise status report B002 2.60 1,274.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Teleconference M. Neiburg and S. Beach 
re: status report and status conference 
strategy

B002 0.70 343.00

02/28/20 BOLIV Draft agenda for March 4, 2020 status 
conference

B002 1.10 324.50

02/28/20 SBEAC Call with M. Neiburg and A. Mielke re: 
preparation of status report and 
preparation for hearing (.7); Review and 
revise documents re preparation for same 
(L6)

B002 2.30 1,920.50

02/28/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke and M. Neiburg 
re: hearing agenda and status report issues

B002 0.20 167.00

02/29/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Olivere re: notice of status 
conference

B002 0.10 49.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Revise request for payment of 
professional fees

B003 0.10 49.00
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02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Feldman re: UST fees B004 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 BFELD Review MOR re: January reporting period B004 0.40 166.00

02/27/20 BFELD Call with S. Cherian re: quarterly UST 
fees for November through January

B004 0.20 83.00

02/28/20 BFELD Finalize for filing MOR re: January 
reporting period

B004 0.10 41.50

02/28/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of monthly operating report for January 
2020; send to US Trustee

B004 0.30 88.50

02/28/20 RFPOP Review and comment on draft January 
2020 monthly operating report, and 
emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo 
(Sujay Cherian) re: same

B004 0.20 137.00

02/12/20 SBEAC Calls with M. Kelsey (.1) and S. Hawkins 
(. 1) re Plan issues; Review statute of 
limitations research and revise documents 
re: same (.5); Emails with A. Mielke re: 
same (.1)

B005 0.80 668.00

02/03/20 BFELD Finalize for filing COC re: miscellaneous 
asset sale to Ritchie Bros.

B006 0.20 83.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Coordinate service of 4th removal motion B006 0.10 29.50

02/03/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of COC re sale of miscellaneous assets re 
Richie Brothers

B006 0.40 118.00

02/03/20 MLUNN Review COC and order; correspondence 
with Richie Bros and correspondence 
with B. Feldman re: sale of telehandler

B006 0.30 238.50

02/03/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke and S. Hawkins re: 
updated case open issues and timeline 
(.1); Review documents re same (.2)

B006 0.30 250.50

02/03/20 SBEAC Call with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, A. 
Mielke, M. McGuire and A. Ralph re
CGT Settlement Strategy Discussion 
(1.4); Prepare for call re: same (.6);
Emails with C. Kelley and M. McGuire 
re: same (.1)

B006 2.10 1,753.50

02/03/20 SBEAC Review order authorizing sale of 
miscellaneous assets

B006 0.10 83.50

02/03/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke and M. Schaedle 
re: plan settlement, advisor call and 
related issues

B006 0.10 83.50

02/03/20 SBEAC Multiple calls to M. Kelsey, M. Schaedle 
and F. Pometti re: settlement and plan

B006 0.20 167.00

issues
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02/04/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Cherian re: compiling 

invoices for request for payment
B006 0.10 49.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Review misc. asset sale order B006 0.10 49.00

02/04/20 BOLIV Circulate order re miscellaneous assets 
sale re Richie Bros

B006 0.10 29.50

02/04/20 MLUNN Correspondence with B. Feldman re: 
telehandler sale order

B006 0.10 79.50

02/04/20 SBEAC Emails with C. Kelley, M, McGuire, S. 
Hawkins and F. Pometti re: CGT open 
issues

B006 0.20 167.00

02/05/20 SBEAC Emails with K. Guerke re; preparation for 
Prime mediation (.1); Emails with S. 
Hawkins and F. Pometti re same (.1); 
Review opinion and orders on dispositive 
motions re same (.5); Review documents 
and strategy planning re mediation (1.3)

B006 2.00 1,670.00

02/05/20 SBEAC Multiple emails with T. Pakrouh, A. 
Mielke, E. Edwards, J. Biblioni and K. 
Guerke re: pretrial motions and trial 
preparation

B006 0.30 250.50

02/06/20 SBEAC Prepare for Prime mediation, including 
meetings with F. Pometti and S. Hawkins 
(1.1); Attend mediation re; same (5.2); 
Followup meetings with client and 
professionals re; same and Plan issues (.6)

B006 6.90 5,761.50

02/06/20 SBEAC Emails with M. Neiburg re: case status 
conference (.1); Review correspondence 
from Court re same (.2)

B006 0.30 250.50

02/06/20 SBEAC Call with F. Pometti re: Prime litigation 
and CGT issues

B006 0.20 167.00

02/06/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re: Order Denying 
Motion to Preclude Evidence of Damages 
and other pretrial orders and opinions (.2); 
Review same (.7)

B006 0.90 751.50

02/06/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re status 
conference report

B006 0.10 83.50

02/06/20 SBEAC Review CGT claim documents (.3); Call 
with M. McGuire re same (.4)

B006 0.70 584.50

02/06/20 SBEAC Email with M. McGuire and B. Feldman 
re: CGT issues

B006 0.20 167.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Stiff re: critical vendor 
documentation

B006 0.10 49.00
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02/07/20 SBEAC Call with M. McGuire re: CGT discussion 

(.2); Work with A. Mielke re: same and 
Plan issues (.3); Call with B. Feldman re 
plan and DS issues (.1); Work with S. 
Hawkins re: same (1.1); Call with S. 
Hawkins re: same and EPS (.2); Attend 
EPS conference call with A. Mielke, K. 
Enos, T. Pakrouh, S. Hawkins and others 
re: EPS litigation issues (1.1)

B006 3.00 2,505.00

02/07/20 SBEAC Emails with K. Guerke re trial vendor B006 0.10 83.50

02/10/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Stiff re: Ohio Cat vendor 
payments

B006 0.20 98.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Review Request for Payment (0.3).
Provide comments to Sujay re: same 
(0.1); draft summary of fees (0.3)

B006 0.70 343.00

02/11/20 SBEAC Review and further revise plan re: 
Followup to call with M. Collins and A. 
Mielke re: Chapter 11 plan

B006 0.50 417.50

02/12/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Stiff re: conference with 
Columbia Gas

B006 0.10 49.00

02/13/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Stiff re: Ohio CAT 
payment

B006 0.20 98.00

02/13/20 AMIEL Confer with B. Olivere and accounting re: 
request for payment (0.3); review invoices 
in connection with same (0.3)

B006 0.60 294.00

02/13/20 AMIEL Review request for payment and confer 
with S. Cherian re: same

B006 0.30 147.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Respond to inquiry from A. Mielke and
AP Services re Chubb request for 
payment

B006 0.10 29.50

02/13/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re: Hawkins 
consulting agreement (.1); Review same 
(•2)

B006 0.30 250.50

02/14/20 SBEAC Emails with C. Kelley, A. Elkhoury, J. 
Wilson, M. McGuire, S. Hawkins and F. 
Pometti re: CGT open issues (.1); Review 
documents re: same in preparation for 
further negotiations (.3)

B006 0.40 334.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Emails with R. Fetchick re: insurance 
checks

B006 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 SBEAC Emails with B. Feldman re: employee and 
transition issues (.1); Multiple emails with 
S. Hawkins and M. Neiburg re: Williams 
discoveiy and litigation strategy issues 
(.1); Review and revise documents re 
same (1.2)

B006 1.40 1,169.00
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02/17/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re: committee 

meeting, plan settlement and related 
issues

B006 0.10 83.50

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Feldman re: insurance 
checks

B006 0.10 49.00

02/18/20 SBEAC Call with S. Hawkins re: Prime, Plan and 
Williams issues

B006 0.60 501.00

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, T. 
Pakrouh, S. Hawkins and F. Pometti re: 
Prime Settlement Agreement (.1); Review 
and revise documents re; same (.5)

B006 0.60 501.00

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re indemnity 
agreement

B006 0.10 83.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with C. Kelley, S. Hawkins, M. 
McGuire and A. Elkhoury re CGT open 
issues

B006 0.10 83.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Review documents and draft settlement 
term sheet re: customer completion 
settlement issues

B006 2.10 1,753.50

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with creditor re: equipment return B006 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Collins and D. Wills re: 
payment of professional fees

B006 0.10 49.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Stiff re: vendor invoices B006 0.40 196.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Teleconference with counsel for Kane 
Kessler re: IP

B006 0.30 147.00

02/20/20 SBEAC Attend meeting with C. Kelley, J. Wilson, 
M. McGuire, F. Pometti and S. Hawkins 
re CGT open issues and resolution (3.7); 
Followup with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti 
and M. McGuire re: same (.5); Call with
M. Rosenthal re: plan settlement (.2); Call 
with M. Schaedle, M. Rosenthal, M. Lunn 
and others re: same (.3); Call with M. 
Collins and S. Poteet re: same and surety 
issues (.4); Call with S. Hawkins re same
(.3)

B006 5.40 4,509.00

02/21/20 SBEAC Calls with A. Mielke re: Plan, CGT B006 5.40 4,509.00
discussions, Central states and related 
issues (.6); Calls with S. Hawkins re: 
same (.2); Review and revise plan, 
disclosure statement, Plan settlement 
agreement central states indemnity and 
central states stay stipulation (4.6)
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02/22/20 SBEAC Call with S. Hawkins re: plan and 

customer issues (.2); Review documents 
re same (.3)

B006 0.50 417.50

02/24/20 SBEAC Emails with C. Kelley and A. Mielke re: 
lien claim issues

B006 0.20 167.00

02/24/20 SBEAC Review and revise plan and plan 
settlement documents

B006 1.80 1,503.00

02/24/20 SBEAC Emails with B. Feldman re liquidation 
analysis (.1); Review and revise 
documents re: same (.2)

B006 0.30 250.50

02/26/20 SBEAC Attend call with Committee and parent 
counsel re Plan Settlement and Indemnity

B006 3.40 2,839.00

Agreements (.6); Review and revise plan 
and settlement documents re preparation 
for same (.4); Followup call with M. 
Rosenthal, M. Porcelli and C. Rankin re: 
same (.3); Followup call with M.
Schaedle re: same (.3); Emails with M. 
Neiburg and F. Pometti re: objections and 
responses to Transco discovery requests 
(.1); Review and revise same (.3); Emails 
with B. Feldman and A. Ralph re: UST 
quarterly payments (.1); Multiple emails 
with A. Ralph, M. Lunn, F. Pometti and 
S. Hawkins re: recovery analysis and 
board resolutions (.2); Review and revise 
same (.4); Emails with S. Hawkins and F. 
Pometti re: board meeting preparation 
(.1); Emails with C. Kelley, A. Mielke 
and A. Elkhoury re: removal and transfer 
of certain lien actions and applicability of 
stay (.2); Review documents re: same (.3); 
Emails with M. Rosenthal re plan 
settlement agreement (.1)

02/26/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Feldman and S. Beach re: 
ETP settlement agreement issues

B006 0.10 45.00

02/26/20 TPAKR Emails with YCST and Alix partners re: 
recovery analysis issues

B006 0.10 45.00
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March 6, 2020
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02/27/20 SBEAC Calls with S. Hawkins re: plan, plan B006 5.50

settlement and customer issues (.4);
Review and revise documents re same 
(.3); Call from and to K. Guerke re:
Transco expert witness issues (.1); Call 
with M. Kelsey re plan and plan 
settlement issues (.3); Call with J. Lucian 
re EPS litigation and settlement issues 
(.3); Review and analyze documents and 
claims re same (.5); Call with B. Feldman 
re: Berkshire claim issue (.1); Review 
order resolving same re: additional release 
request (.2); Attend call with S. Hawkins,
F. Pometti, M. Lunn, A. Ralph and A.
Mielke re board preparation meeting (.3);
Review documents and draft notes re 
preparation for board Meeting (1.1);
Attend board meeting re case update, plan 
and disclosure statement approval (.8);
Call with M. Rosenthal re: same (.2);
Emails with E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh and 
K. Guerke re finalizing Prime NDT 
settlement for filing (.1); Review final 
documents re same (.3); Emails with M.
McGuire, F. Pometti and C. Kelley re: 
claim discussions and update to the 
committee (.1); Emails with M. Eaton and 
A. Mielke re CC stay stipulation (.1);
Emails with B. Feldman, F. Pometti and 
A. Ralph re: ETP letter and open issues 
(.2); Emails with M. Neiburg re status 
report (.1)

02/27/20 TPAKR Emails with S. Beach and Alix partners 
re: ETP settlement issues

B006 0.10

02/03/20 AMIEL Emails with T. Pakrouh re: Earth Pipeline 
Services claim

B007 0.10

02/03/20 AMIEL Review claim statute of limitations 
analysis (0.3); revise same (0.4)

B007 0.70

02/04/20 BFELD Review and revise settlement offer to 
resolve admin claims of various claimants 
re: availability of insurance proceeds

B007 0.50

02/05/20 BFELD Review offer re: settlement of various 
admin claims in light of insurance 
proceeds

B007 0.10

02/06/20 BFELD Analyze recently filed claims re: need for 
additional omnibus claim objections

B007 0.40

Amount
4,592.50

45.00

49.00

343.00

207.50

41.50

166.00
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02/06/20 BFELD Emails with S. Beach and F. Pometti (.2), 

J. Bondy (counsel to Berkshire) (.1), and
J. Mintz (UCC counsel) (.2) re: resolution 
of Berkshire's administrative expense 
claim

B007 0.50 207.50

02/06/20 BFELD Emails with counsel to Beaver Valley
Slag re: insurance proceeds (.2); revise 
settlement offer re: same (.2)

B007 0.40 166.00

02/06/20 SBEAC Review and revise Order Resolving
Claims Berkshire (.3); Emails with B. 
Feldman, J. Mintz, F. Pometti and S. 
Hawkins re same (.1)

B007 0.40 334.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Emails with C. McNulty re: status of 
claim arbitration

B007 0.10 49.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Confer with T. Pakrouh re: call to discuss 
EPS damages analysis

B007 0.10 49.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Teleconference with T. Pakrouh, K. Enos, 
S. Hawkins, and S. Beach re: Earth 
Pipeline Services claim

B007 1.10 539.00

02/07/20 BFELD Review revised plan re: S. Beach 
comments on Chubb issues

B007 0.20 83.00

02/07/20 BFELD Confer with R. Poppiti re: resolution of 
McNally claim objection

B007 0.40 166.00

02/07/20 KENOS Call with S. Gray and S. Hawkins (and 
YCST Team) re: MXP Damages analysis 
(1.1) and preparations for same (.4)

B007 1.50 1,050.00

02/07/20 ICENOS Meet with T. Pakrouh re: MXP claim 
damages analysis

B007 0.20 140.00

02/07/20 RFPOP Meet with B. Feldman re: McNally claim B007 0.30 205.50

02/07/20 SBEAC Emails with S. Hawkins re: EPS slope 
issues and change order issues

B007 0.20 167.00

02/07/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke and C. McNulty 
re: Central States arbitration

B007 0.10 83.50

02/10/20 BFELD Review settlement proposal for various 
claimants' administrative claims re: 
available insurance proceeds

B007 0.30 124.50

02/10/20 SBEAC Email with A. Elkhoury re: Pending Lien 
Litigation (.1); Review documents re 
same (.2)

B007 0.30 250.50

02/11/20 RFPOP Email to and from counsel for Zurich 
(Peg Anderson) re: insurance claims

B007 0.10 68.50

02/11/20 SBEAC Emails with S. Hawkins and A. Mielke re: B007 0.80 668.00
Schmid lien claims (.1); Review and 
revise documents and analysis re same
(•7)
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02/11/20 SBEAC Emails with T. Buchanan re: Hood, 

Hawkins and Wall interviews in 
connection with Williams litigation

B007 0.10 83.50

02/11/20 SBEAC Prepare for (.5) and attend call with A. 
Mielke, A. Elkhoury and C. Kelley re:
Lien Litigation (.8)

B007 1.30 1,085.50

02/12/20 SBEAC Review documents and prepare for Prime 
NDT trial

B007 3.50 2,922.50

02/12/20 SBEAC Emails with S. Hawkins re: Schmid 
document review (.1); Review documents 
re same (.6)

B007 0.70 584.50

02/13/20 SBEAC Email with A. Mielke and S. Hawkins re: B007 1.30 1,085.50
Lien Actions (.1); Call with S. Hawkins 
re: same and preparation for Prime trial 
(.3); Work with T. Pakrouh re: 
preparation re Prim trial (.2); Emails with 
E. Edwards, S. Hawkins, F. Pometti and 
K. Guerke re: same and settlement 
counteroffer (.4); Consider Prime 
settlement responses (.3)

02/14/20 MLUNN Correspondence with Alix team re: claims 
issues in connection with Plan

B007 0.10 79.50

02/14/20 SBEAC Emails with C. McNulty, A. Mielke and 
Jones Day re: Central States claim, 
arbitration and stay issues

B007 0.20 167.00

02/14/20 SBEAC Attend call with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, B007 3.80 3,173.00
K. Guerke, E. Edwards and T. Pakrouh re 
Prime Settlement negotiations and 
litigation preparation (1.0); Review 
documents re: preparation re: same (.5); 
Review documents re: direct testimony of 
F. Pometti and S. Hawkins re: Sunoco 
direct pay issue (2.3)

02/14/20 SBEAC Emails with T. Pakrouh, K. Guerke and 
client re Prime settlement terms (.2); 
Review same (.1)

B007 0.30 250.50

02/14/20 SBEAC Emails with S. Cherian, F. Pometti and S. 
Hawkins re: administrative claim and 
Completion agreement issues (.1);
Review and Revise claim And plan 
documents re Same (.5)

B007 0.60 501.00

02/14/20 SBEAC Work with A. Mielke re Plan estimation 
language re Central States

B007 0.20 167.00

02/14/20 SBEAC Review and revise plan re: Central States 
claim estimation (.7); Emails with A. 
Mielke re same (. 1)

B007 0.80 668.00

02/14/20 SBEAC Review EPS and Schmid lien issues B007 0.20 167.00
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Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/17/20 AMIEL Revise agreement to stay arbitration of C. 

States claim
B007 0.40 196.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Hawkins and S. Beach re: 
meeting with creditor to discuss claims

B007 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and client 
(Rachel Fetchik) re: insurance claims

B007 0.10 68.50

02/17/20 SBEAC Review and revise Prime settlement 
agreement and 9019 motion (1.4); Emails 
with T. Pakrouh re same (.1)

B007 1.50 1,252.50

02/17/20 SBEAC Review Central States, Lien and Miller 
claim issues

B007 0.70 584.50

02/18/20 AMIEL Revise indemnity agreement in 
connection with claim resolution (0.6); 
confer with S. Beach re: same (0.2)

B007 0.80 392.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Review materials in preparation for 
meeting with vendor re: claim resolution 
(0.8); draft summary of same (0.3)

B007 1.10 539.00

02/18/20 BFELD Research (.2) and emails with R. Fetchik 
(.1) re: insurance proceeds for various 
claimants

B007 0.30 124.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re: indemnity and 
tolling agreement issues

B007 0.10 83.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Review and revise Bechtel indemnity 
stipulation re: Central States (.3); Emails 
with A. Mielke re same (.1)

B007 0.40 334.00

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke and C. McNulty 
re: Central States stay stipulation

B007 0.10 83.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re Central States 
Pension Fund Assessment

B007 0.10 83.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Further review and revise Bechtel 
settlement agreement and Central States 
stay and indemnity documents

B007 1.40 1,169.00

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, A. 
Ralph, R. Poppiti, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, B. 
Feldman, and M. Rosenthal re: Draft 
Bechtel/McCaig Settlement Agreement 
and Indemnity Agreement (.2); Review 
and revise documents re: same (.7)

B007 0.90 751.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with T. Buchanan re Discovery 
related to coating issues (.1); Review 
documents re same (.3)

B007 0.40 334.00

02/18/20 SBEAC Further review and revise Prime
Settlement Agreement

B007 0.70 584.50

02/18/20 SBEAC Review LRC analysis re: affirmative 
customer claims

B007 0.50 417.50
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Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

March 6, 2020
50013026

076850.1001

Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/18/20 SBEAC Review and revise Central States 

Withdrawal liability tolling stipulation
B007 0.40 334.00

02/19/20 BFELD Emails with counsel to Beaver Valley 
Slag re: insurance proceeds (.2); emails 
with insurance adjuster re: same (.1)

B007 0.30 124.50

02/19/20 SBEAC Multiple meetings with F. Pometti, A. B007 5.20 4,342.00
Ralph, S. Cherian, S. Hawkins and M. 
McGuire re: CGT open issues and 
resolution strategy (1.7); Review and 
revise documents re: same (2.6); Review 
and revise plan settlement documents (.7); 
Emails with M. Rosenthal, M. Eaton and 
A. Mielke re same (.2)

02/19/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re lien claims and 
CADD settlement (.1); Emails with A. 
Mielke re: CGT issues (.1)

B007 0.20 167.00

02/19/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke and R. Kramer re: 
stay and indemnity stipulations (.2); 
Review modified documents re same (.2); 
Emails with Bechtel and committee re 
same (.1)

B007 0.50 417.50

02/20/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: status of claim 
settlement

B007 0.10 49.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: status of claim 
settlement discussion

B007 0.10 49.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: 
construction work in connection with 
claim analysis (0.2) review materials in 
connection with same (0.3)

B007 0.50 245.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Confer with B. Feldman re: insurance 
claims

B007 0.10 49.00

02/20/20 BFELD Review Beaver Valley invoices re: 
available insurance proceeds

B007 2.50 1,037.50

02/20/20 BFELD Emails with J. Mintz and J. Bondy re: 
resolution of Berkshire Hathaway claims

B007 0.10 41.50

02/21/20 AMIEL Call with J. Stiff re: vendor claim B007 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 SBEAC Review and revise draft Schmid rework 
and set off claim analysis (.7); Call with

B007 2.10 1,753.50

S. Hawkins re same (.1); Emails with C. 
Kelly, J. Wilson, M. McGuire, F. Pometti 
and S. Hawkins re: same (.2); Review 
EPS lien claim issues (.7); Emails with M. 
Schaedle and M. Rosenthal re Plan issues 
(. 1); Review documents re Sunbelt issues 
(-3)
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02/21/20 SBEAC Emails with T. Buchanan re: coating 

discovery issues
B007 0.10 83.50

02/21/20 SBEAC Emails with M. Eaton re: Central States 
stay stipulation

B007 0.10 83.50

02/24/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Stiff re: claim settlement B007 0.20 98.00

02/24/20 BFELD Call with S. Cherian re: status of various 
claims matters

B007 0.30 124.50

02/24/20 BFELD Emails with counsel to various claimants 
re: status of resolution of review of claims

B007 0.10 41.50

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Stiff re: claim settlement B007 0.10 49.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with vendor re: claim resolution B007 0.10 49.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and S. Hawkins re: 
claim analysis

B007 0.20 98.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Teleconference with S. Beach, M.
Maguire, S. Hawkins, F. Pometti re: TC 
Energy claims

B007 0.70 343.00

02/25/20 SBEAC Attend call with M. McGuire, S.
Hawkins, F. Pometti, A. Ralph and A.

B007 4.10 3,423.50

Mielke re: TC Energy Claims (1.1); 
Review, revise and analyze documents re 
same (.7); Call with M. Lunn re: Plan 
issues (.6); Review and Revise documents 
re same (.6); Call with S. Hawkins re: 
same (.3); Attend call with M. Lunn, S. 
Hawkins, F. Pometti, A. Ralph, A.
Mielke, B. Feldman, T. Pakrouh re: plan 
revisions, board meeting and plan 
settlement documents (.8)

02/25/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Ralph and A. Mielke re: B007 
Chubb payments

0.10 83.50

02/25/20 SBEAC Multiple emails with M. Lunn, A. Mielke, B007 0.50 417.50
B. Feldman and client re: revisions to plan 
and DS (.2); Emails with A. Elkhoury (.1) 
and review CADD lien release settlement 
(.2)

02/26/20 AMIEL Teleconference with counsel for Ohio
CAT re: settlement of claims

B007 0.50 245.00

02/26/20 BFELD Review settlement offer re: Hoffman Ford 
claim resolution

B007 0.10 41.50

02/26/20 BFELD Review re: CFSC rejection damages 
claim (.2); emails with S. Cherian and A. 
Ralph re: same (.1)

B007 0.30 124.50

02/26/20 SBEAC Emails with J. Lucian re EPS issues B007 0.10 83.50
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02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with K. Enos and T. Pakrouh re: 

consulting expert's invoice
B007 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with M. McGuire and S. Beach re: 
claim analysis

B007 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 BFELD Review master leases re: CFSC 
equipment (.1); emails with M. Lunn re: 
same (.1)

B007 0.20 83.00

02/27/20 BFELD Call with S. Beach re: resolution of 
Berkshire administrative expense claim 
(.1); follow-up emails with J. Bondy re: 
same (.2)

B007 0.30 124.50

02/27/20 MLUNN Review CAT financial rejection claim 
issues and correspondence with B.
Feldman

B007 0.30 238.50

02/28/20 BFELD Emails with counsel to Berkshire, F. 
Pometti, and S. Beach re: resolution of 
Berkshire administrative claim (.1); call 
with counsel to Berkshire re: same (.1)

B007 0.20 83.00

02/28/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of certification of counsel re Berkshire 
Hathaway Specialty Insurance Co. Claim

B007 0.40 118.00

02/03/20 AMIEL Emails with committee counsel re: status 
conference

B008 0.10 49.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Confer with S. Beach re: case strategy B008 0.50 245.00

02/10/20 SBEAC Email with R. Poppiti, M. Lunn, and A. 
Mielke re: Committee Meeting

B008 0.10 83.50

02/10/20 SBEAC Email with A. Mielke re: Committee 
advisor call (.1); Prepare agenda re same 
(.2)

B008 0.30 250.50

02/11/20 AMIEL Teleconference with YCST, committee, 
Teneo, and AlixPartners teams to discuss 
misc. case issues and updates (0.5); 
follow up with S. Beach and M. Lunn re: 
same (0.2)

B008 0.70 343.00

02/11/20 MLUNN Update call with UCC (.5); and related 
follow-up with S. Beach and A. Mielke 
(•2)

B008 0.70 556.50

02/11/20 SBEAC Attend Advisor Update Call (.5); Review 
and revise chapter 11 plan documents (.6)

B008 1.10 918.50

02/14/20 SBEAC Call to Frank Pometti re: Prime 
settlement, CGT issues and plan 
settlement (.2); Review documents re 
same (.2)

B008 0.40 334.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Confer with S. Beach re: misc. case issues B008 0.60 294.00
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02/18/20 SBEAC Call with F. Pometti re: CGT meeting B008 0.20 167.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Confer with S. Beach re: misc. case issues B008 0.60 294.00

12/05/19 KGUER Review document production re: 
subcontractor work and Mear documents

B011 0.70 507.50

01/08/20 AMIEL Emails to F. Pometti, S. Hawkins, and K. 
O'Reilly re: requests for production

B011 0.10 49.00

01/16/20 KGUER Review deposition documents and 
outlines; prepare for trial. Emails with 
client re: contracts

B011 1.60 1,240.00

02/01/20 EEDWA Prime: Draft direct of S. Gray B011 2.80 2,002.00

02/01/20 KGUER Prepare for trial; review deposition 
transcript; draft witness outlines for trial

B011 1.60 1,240.00

02/01/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel re: joint 
pretrial memo

B011 0.10 45.00

02/02/20 EEDWA Prime: Draft direct of S. Gray (5.9); email 
to K. Guerke and T. Pakrouh re: same (.2)

B011 6.10 4,361.50

02/02/20 KGUER Review deposition transcripts; draft 
witness outlines; prepare for trial

B011 2.50 1,937.50

02/02/20 KGUER Multiple emails with T. Pakrouh and E. 
Edwards re: page and line designations 
and pre-trial issues

B011 0.20 155.00

02/02/20 TPAKR (Prime) emails with E. Edwards and K. 
Guerke re: drafting deposition logs

B011 0.10 45.00

02/02/20 TPAKR (Prime) emails with E. Edwards and K. 
Guerke re S. Gray direct

B011 0.10 45.00

02/03/20 AMIEL Review data room for Welded 
electronically stored infonnation

B011 0.10 49.00

02/03/20 AMIEL Emails with E. Edwards re: status of 
mediation in Prime matter

B011 0.10 49.00

02/03/20 AMIEL Confer with T. Pakrouh re: teleconference 
for Prime litigation

B011 0.20 98.00

02/03/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: statute of 
limitations research (0.4); review bond 
and contract documents in connection 
with same (0.3)

B011 0.70 343.00

02/03/20 AMIEL Review Columbia Gas's response to 
Welded's request for payment of claims in 
preparation for meeting re: same (0.3); 
review insurance policy in connection 
with same (0.2)

B011 0.50 245.00

02/03/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Hawkins, E. Edwards, and 
K. Guerke re: scheduling mediation

B011 0.10 49.00
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Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/03/20 AMIEL Teleconference with S. Beach, F. Pometti, 

S. Hawkins, A. Ralph, and M. Maguire re: 
Columbia Gas vendor payments

B011 1.40 686.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Call with T. Pakrouh re mediation 
scheduled on 2/6/20 and mediation prep 
for same re Prime NDT

B011 0.20 59.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of joint pre-trial memorandum

B011 0.30 88.50

02/03/20 BOLIV Prepare for filing joint pretrial 
memorandum; send for final sign off

B011 0.20 59.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Per Judge Sontchi's pre-trial procedures 
order prepare two copies of joint pre-trial 
memorandum for delivery to chambers

B011 0.20 59.00

02/03/20 BOLIV Attend telephonic status conference 
regarding upcoming pretrial conference

B011 0.40 118.00

02/03/20 EEDWA Prime: Telephone to J. Biblioni re: case B011 3.10 2,216.50
update (.1); review materials in advance 
of status conference (.2); attend 
telephonic status conference (.2); meet 
with K Guerke in advance of status 
conference re: open issues (.3); meet with 
T. Pakrouh and K Guerke re: Prime’s 
revisions to Pretrial Memo (.6); review 
materials related to David Runte (.3); 
multiple emails with T. Pakrouh and K 
Guerke re: same (.1); review revised PTO 
(.2); email from K. Guerke re: scheduling 
mediation (.1); teleconference with T. 
Pakrouh re: materials and preparation for 
pretrial conference and mediation (.4); 
review and finalize to file pretrial memo 
(.3); telephone to T. Pakrouh re: changes 
to same (.1); email to F. Pometti, S. 
Hawkins, and S. Beach re: update on 
status conference and mediation (.2)

02/03/20 KGUER Multiple emails with opposing counsel re: 
pre-trial order

B011 0.20 155.00

02/03/20 KGUER Status conference with court B011 0.40 310.00

02/03/20 KGUER Teleconferences with opposing counsel 
re: trial issues

B011 0.20 155.00

02/03/20 KGUER Review consulting agreement; emails 
with M. Neiburg re: same

B011 0.40 310.00

02/03/20 KGUER Review Wieland deposition; draft outline 
re: same; prepare for trial

B011 2.00 1,550.00

02/03/20 KGUER Multiple emails with client re: mediation B011 0.10 77.50
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02/03/20 KGUER Emails with S. Beach and E. Edwards re: 

mediation and settlement
B011 0.20 155.00

02/03/20 KGUER Meeting with E. Edwards and T. Pakrouh 
re: trial prep and pre-trial issues

B011 0.60 465.00

02/03/20 KGUER Review Prime’s edits to pre-trial stip; 
Revise same; review exhibits and 
production

B011 1.40 1,085.00

02/03/20 SBEAC Review joint pretrial memorandum, 
expert reports and related documents re: 
preparation for Prime trial and mediation 
issues (2.6); Emails with K. Guerke and 
others re: same (.1)

B011 2.70 2,254.50

02/03/20 SBEAC Emails with T. Buchanan, F. Pometti and
S. Hawkins re: retention of consultant 
(.1); Review and revise documents re 
same (.2)

B011 0.30 250.50

02/03/20 TPAKR Attend teleconference with E. Edwards,
K. Guerke, B. Olivere, Prime counsel, and 
Court (.3); internally confer with YCST 
re: same (.2)

B011 0.50 225.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel re: joint 
pretrial memo and exhibit list

B011 0.10 45.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Teleconference with DLS and M. Fratticci 
re: IB document issues

B011 0.30 135.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, S. 
Beach, and the client re: Prime mediation

B011 0.10 45.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: Prime's revisions to joint pretrial 
memo (.6); research rebuttal witness re: 
same (.3); emails with E. Edwards and K. 
Guerke re: same (.1)

B011 1.00 450.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Confer with M. Fratticci and J. Morton re: 
IB document issues (.2); emails with J. 
Morton, M. Fratticci and DLS re: same 
(•1)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Olivere re: filing and 
service of joint pretrial memo (.1); confer 
with B. Olivere re: same (.2)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Olivere re: video 
deposition issues (.1); emails with K. 
Guerke and E. Edwards re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/03/20 TPAKR Email with A. Mielke re: litigation issues B011 0.10 45.00
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02/03/20 TPAKR Review and revise joint pretrial memo 

(.7); emails with E. Edwards and K.
Guerke re: same (.1 ); emails with Prime 
counsel, E. Edwards, and K. Guerke re: 
same (.1)

B011 0.90 405.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Review complaint in mechanic's lien 
action in connection with S. Hawkins' 
inquiiy re: same

B011 0.30 147.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: protective 
order

B011 0.10 49.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg and T. Buchanan 
re: litigation road map

B011 0.10 49.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Stiff re: Ohio CAT 
settlement payments

B011 0.20 98.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Review order denying defendant's request 
to withdraw the reference

B011 0.10 49.00

02/04/20 BOLIV Prepare hard copy of CNO, related 
motion and proposed order for delivery to 
chambers re Prime NDT

B011 0.20 59.00

02/04/20 BOLIV Prepare mediator materials per T. Pakrouh 
re Prime NDT mediation on 2/6/20

B011 0.50 147.50

02/04/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of CNO re seal motion re Prime NDT

B011 0.20 59.00

02/04/20 BOLIV Circulate order from district court re 
denying motion to withdraw the reference

B011 0.10 29.50

02/04/20 DLASK Update litigation dockets - state court B011 0.30 91.50

02/04/20 EEDWA Prime: Telephone from and to R. B011 1.10 786.50
Werkheiser re: additional sealed pleadings 
issues (.1); multiple emails from R. 
Werkheiser and M. Heyden re: same (.3); 
telephone to T. Pakrouh re: addressing 
same (.3); teleconference with K Guerke 
and T. Pakrouh re: same (.1); emails re: 
finalizing mediation date (.1); emails from 
and telephone to K. Guerke re: materials 
for the new mediator (.2)

02/04/20 KGUER Multiple emails with E. Edwards and T. 
Pakrouh and Court re: sealing issues

B011 0.30 232.50

02/04/20 KGUER Teleconference with mediator re: 
mediation

B011 0.40 310.00

02/04/20 KGUER Email with client re: status, mediation, 
and pre-trial conference

B011 0.20 155.00

02/04/20 KGUER Review decision on motion to withdraw 
reference

B011 0.10 77.50
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02/04/20 KGUER Review deposition transcripts; draft 

witness outlines; prepare for trial
B011 4.10 3,177.50

02/04/20 KGUER Meeting with T. Pakrouh re: pending 
motions and sealing issues

B011 0.60 465.00

02/04/20 MMILA Email to Frank Pometti and Andrew
Ralph re: discovery parameters and 
logistics

B011 0.20 80.00

02/04/20 SBEAC Review order denying Prime motion to 
withdraw the reference

B011 0.20 167.00

02/04/20 SBEAC Review documents re: Ohio CAT lien suit 
(.2); Emails with S. Hawkins and A. 
Mielke re: same (.1); Work with F.
Pometti re: same (.1)

B011 0.40 334.00

02/04/20 TBUCH Prepare analysis of litigation strategy and 
open issues

B011 4.10 2,439.50

02/04/20 TPAKR Conferences with K. Guerke (.4) and E. 
Edwards and K. Guerke (.2) re: Court 
correspondence on Prime motion in 
limine issues

B011 0.60 270.00

02/04/20 TPAKR Confer with M. Fratticci re: Prime 
mediation document issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/04/20 TPAKR Emails with mediator re: Prime 
documents

B011 0.10 45.00

02/04/20 TPAKR Email correspondence with the Court, E. 
Edwards, K. Guerke and Prime re: Prime 
motion in limine issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/04/20 TPAKR Draft CNO re: objection to Prime direct 
pay motion (.2); emails with B. Olivere 
and E. Edwards re: same (.1)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/04/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: Court 
correspondence on Prime motion in 
limine issues (.3); multiple emails with E. 
Edwards and K. Guerke re: same (.2); 
research same (1.1)

B011 1.60 720.00

02/05/20 AMIEL Review opinion denying defendant's 
motion for partial summaiy judgment 
(0.3); confer with T. Pakrouh re: same 
(0.1); confer with K. Guerke re: same 
(0.1)

B011 0.50 245.00

02/05/20 AMIEL Review order denying defendant's motion 
to withdraw the reference

B011 0.10 49.00

02/05/20 AMIEL Emails with K. Guerke re: status of 
mediation

B011 0.10 49.00

02/05/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Olivere re: adversary B011 0.20 98.00
dockets (0.1); confer with B. Olivere re: 
same (0.1)
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02/05/20 BOLIV Prepare chart of all fees billed in Prime 

NDT matter from 3/1/19 to 2/5/20 for
B011 0.50 147.50

mediation preparation re Prime NDT
02/05/20 BOLIV Read and respond to email from T.

Pakrouh re final details of mediation for
B011 0.10 29.50

2/6/20
02/05/20 BOLIV Meeting with K. Guerke and T. Pakrouh 

re mediation and pre-trial conference prep 
re Prime NDT

B011 0.50 147.50

02/05/20 DLASK Review invoices, prepare charts of March 
and April fees for Prime litigation

B011 1.20 366.00

02/05/20 EEDWA Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: mediation B011 1.10 786.50
strategy (.3); email to J. Biblioni re: 
mediation date and location (.1); email 
from/telephone form T. Pakrouh re: 
mediation, pre-trial conference, and trial 
preparation (.5); telephone to J. Biblioni 
re: mediation (.1); email to S. Beach and 
K Guerke re: same (.1)

02/05/20 KGUER Email with opposing counsel re: meet and 
confer

B011 0.10 77.50

02/05/20 KGUER Emails with client re: mediation B011 0.20 155.00

02/05/20 KGUER Meeting with T. Pakrouh re: trial prep, 
exhibits, pre-trial conference and trial 
prep

B011 0.50 387.50

02/05/20 KGUER Meeting with E. Edwards re: pre-trial 
conference and settlement

B011 0.30 232.50

02/05/20 KGUER Review Court’s opinion on SJM B011 0.30 232.50

02/05/20 KGUER Email with mediator re: mediation 
materials

B011 0.10 77.50

02/05/20 KGUER Emails with B. Olivere re: costs; review 
docket re: same

B011 0.20 155.00

02/05/20 KGUER Prepare for pre-trial conference; Prepare B011 4.50 3,487.50
for trial; Review deposition transcripts; 
draft witness and trial outlines; Review 
documents and trial exhibits

02/05/20 MLUNN Review/analyze Opinion re: Prime motion 
to dismiss

B011 0.40 318.00

02/05/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, S. 
Beach, client, and B. Olivere re: 
mediation issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/05/20 TPAKR Confer with K. Guerke and B. Olivere re: 
mediation preparation and Prime motion

B011 0.60 270.00

in limine issues
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02/05/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: Prime motion 

in limine issues (.3); emails with E. 
Edwards re: same (.1)

B011 0.40 180.00

02/05/20 TPAKR Emails with mediator, K. Guerke and E. 
Edwards re: opinion on Prime MSJ

B011 0.10 45.00

02/06/20 AMIEL Draft summary of order denying motion 
in limine

B011 0.10 49.00

02/06/20 AMIEL Teleconference with A. Elkhoury re: 
Schmid Pipeline lien litigation

B011 0.10 49.00

02/06/20 AMIEL Teleconference with J. Talbot re: Schmid 
lien action

B011 0.10 49.00

02/06/20 AMIEL Emails with T. Pakrouh re: status of 
mediation

B011 0.10 49.00

02/06/20 BOLIV Phone call with T. Pakrouh re subpoenas 
needed for trial re Prime NDT

B011 0.10 29.50

02/06/20 BOLIV Circulate order denying motion in limine 
to preclude evidence of damages re Prime 
NDT

B011 0.10 29.50

02/06/20 BOLIV Assist with mediation needs and pretrial 
conference needs

B011 0.50 147.50

02/06/20 BOLIV Circulate order re motion in limine to 
strike Josh Bell testimony

B011 0.10 29.50

02/06/20 EEDWA Prime: Meet with K. Guerke, S. Beach, F. B011 2.90 2,073.50
Pometti, and S. Hawkins re: mediation 
strategy (1.0); attend part of mediation 
(.5); attend pre-trial conference (.6); meet 
with K. Guerke re: trial planning (.6); 
review order denying motion in limine re: 
subcontractor costs (.1); review order 
granting in part motion in limine re: Josh 
Bell (.1)

02/06/20 KGUER Pre-trial conference with Judge Sontchi B011 0.80 620.00

02/06/20 KGUER Prepare for mediation; Meeting with 
clients re: mediation prep

B011 1.00 775.00

02/06/20 KGUER Mediation with mediator Dave White B011 5.50 4,262.50

02/06/20 KGUER Prepare for trial; Prepare for pre-trial 
conference

B011 0.60 465.00

02/06/20 SBEAC Email with F. Pometti re: Prime 
settlement issues

B011 0.10 83.50

02/06/20 TPAKR Email with R. Poppiti re: OCP cap 
increase

B011 0.10 45.00

02/06/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 
re: mediation preparation

B011 0.10 45.00
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02/06/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, and

B. Olivere re: mediation issues
B011 0.10 45.00

02/06/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: court orders on motions in limine (.1); 
confer with A. Mielke re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/06/20 TPAKR Prepare for (.2) and attend pretrial 
conference with E. Edwards, K. Guerke 
and Prime counsel (.6); confer with E. 
Edwards and K. Guerke re: same (.3)

B011 1.10 495.00

02/06/20 TPAKR Email with R. Bisnett re: errata sheet B011 0.10 45.00

02/06/20 TPAKR Analyze and log T. Rapp deposition (2.0) B011 2.00 900.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Marasco re: Williams 
discovery issues

B011 0.50 245.00

02/07/20 BOLIV Confer with T. Pakrouh re subpoenas 
needed for trial [.2]; review Federal Rules 
of Civil Procedures re Trials for trial prep 
(.8); draft subpoenas for T. Rapp, D. 
Shumway and S. Elliott re trial (.7) re 
Prime NDT

B011 1.70 501.50

02/07/20 BOLIV Review Judge Sontchi's trial procedures 
(.1); emails with T. Pakrouh re exhibits 
for trial (.2)

B011 0.30 88.50

02/07/20 BOLIV Trial prep: organization of depositions for 
designations (.4); further sorting of 
potential exhibits for trial (1.3)

B011 1.70 501.50

02/07/20 BOLIV Draft notice of status conference for 
Schmid Pipeline adversary for March 4, 
2020

B011 0.30 88.50

02/07/20 BWALT Email from/to B. Olivere re: deposition 
designations from response to MSJ 
motion

B011 0.30 91.50

02/07/20 BWALT Confer with B. Olivere re: Rule 45 
subpoenas to testify (Prime adversary)

B011 0.40 122.00

02/07/20 EEDWA Prime: meet with S. Hawkins and K. 
Guerke re: trial preparation (2.5); prepare 
for trial (2.2); telephone to T. Pakrouh re: 
same (.2)

B011 4.90 3,503.50

02/07/20 JMARA Confer with A. Mielke re: factual 
background, case status and next steps 
(.5); emails/call with A. Mielke re: 
scheduling diligence call with company 
(•1)

B011 0.60 315.00

02/07/20 KGUER Review transcript summaries B011 0.70 542.50
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02/07/20 KGUER Prepare for trial; review and prepare 

exhibits and witness outlines
B011 1.30 1,007.50

02/07/20 KGUER Meeting with client re: trial prep B011 3.10 2,402.50

02/07/20 KGUER Emails with T. Pakrouh and E. Edwards 
re: deposition designations and trial issues

B011 0.30 232.50

02/07/20 KGUER Teleconference with IT trial vendor B011 0.20 155.00

02/07/20 TPAKR Attend teleconference with A. Mielke, K. 
Enos, S. Beach, and client (1.1); confer 
with K. Enos re: same (.1)

B011 1.20 540.00

02/07/20 TPAKR Emails with R. Poppiti re: revisions to 
COC re: OCP cap increase (.1); emails 
with AlixPartners re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/07/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: revisions to 
deposition logs (.3); emails with E. 
Edwards re: same (.1)

B011 0.40 180.00

02/07/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke and
B. Olivere re: subpoenas for T. Rapp, S. 
Elliot, and D. Shumway

B011 0.10 45.00

02/07/20 TPAKR (Prime) analyze and draft comparison 
chart of D. Sutton and S. Hawkins 
testimony (5.4); emails with E. Edwards 
and K. Guerke re: same (.1)

B011 5.50 2,475.00

02/08/20 KGUER Teleconference with T. Pakrouh re: page 
and line designation and trial prep and 
exhibits

B011 0.60 465.00

02/08/20 KGUER Prepare for trial; review documents; 
review deposition transcripts; draft trial 
outlines

B011 2.50 1,937.50

02/08/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke re: revisions to 
deposition logs (.1); confer with K.
Guerke re: same (.5); revise Sutton 
deposition log accordingly (3.1)

B011 3.70 1,665.00

02/09/20 EEDWA Prime: Review summary of D. Sutton 
deposition testimony (.5); work on cross 
preparation for trial (2.3); review report of 
J. Bell re: direct preparation (.6)

B011 3.40 2,431.00

02/09/20 KGUER Review deposition summaries and page 
and line designations

B011 0.40 310.00

02/09/20 KGUER Prepare for trial; review documents; 
review deposition transcripts; draft trial 
outlines

B011 3.60 2,790.00

02/09/20 MFRAT Prime litigation: Upload Large video files 
of July Flyover to sharefile and provide 
download link to T. Pakrouh and K.
Guerke

B011 0.50 87.50
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02/09/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 

re: revisions to deposition logs (.1); draft 
Cote deposition log accordingly (2.4)

B011 2.50 1,125.00

02/09/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards and 
client re: video and director pay affidavit 
(.1); confer with M. Fratticci re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Review contract documents and analysis 
of lien claim to provide S. Hawkins with 
analysis of same

B011 1.70 833.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti, S. Beach, S. 
Hawkins, and A. Ralph re: Schmid 
litigation

B011 0.10 49.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Review memorandum re: Schmid lien 
analysis

B011 0.30 147.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: Schmid lien 
claim analysis

B011 0.10 49.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with A. Elkhoury and S. Beach re: 
Schmid lien litigation (0.1); confer with
A. Elkhoury re: same (0.1)

B011 0.20 98.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Hawkins re: Schmid 
litigation

B011 0.30 147.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Apply designations to R. Bisnett 
deposition

B011 0.40 118.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Apply Andy Mack deposition 
designations

B011 0.70 206.50

02/10/20 BOLIV Apply designations to Brad Brittig 
deposition

B011 0.60 177.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Send completed Errata sheet of R. Bisnett 
to Veritext.

B011 0.20 59.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Confer with B. Walters re trial prep and 
exhibit list for Prime NDT trial

B011 0.20 59.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Meet and confer with T. Pakrouh and B. 
Walters re deposition designations

B011 0.20 59.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Meet and confer with K. Guerke re trial 
expert, deadline for exhibit list, subpoenas 
re Prime NDT

B011 0.20 59.00

02/10/20 BWALT Prepare Sutton deposition with Welded's 
designations

B011 1.20 366.00

02/10/20 BWALT Emails from/to T. Pakrouh re: trial B011 0.30 91.50
logistics (.2); email to Court re electronics 
(•1)
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02/10/20 EEDWA Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: trial 

preparations (.4); meet with T. Pakrouh 
re: same (.6); teleconference with B. 
Olivere and T. Pakrouh re: same (.2); 
emails with J. Forbes re: same (.2); meet 
with T. Pakrouh and K. Guerke (partial) 
re: trial exhibits, designations, and 
demonstratives (1.8); review Prime’s 
exhibit list (.6); meet with T. Pakrouh re: 
working draft presentation for S. Gray 
direct (.4); emails with S. Gray re: 
potential exhibits for same (.3); emails 
from K. Guerke and M. Heyden re: pre­
trial exchanges deadlines (.1); work on 
cross preparations for Rapp and Elliot 
(1.7)

B011 6.30 4,504.50

02/10/20 KGUER Emails with expert re: testimony B011 0.10 77.50

02/10/20 ICGUER Teleconference with Heyden re; trial 
issues

B011 0.20 155.00

02/10/20 KGUER Review deposition summaries B011 0.50 387.50

02/10/20 KGUER Prepare cross examination for trial; 
review exhibits/documents for trial

B011 1.70 1,317.50

02/10/20 KGUER Emails with Heyden re: trial and exhibit 
issues

B011 0.10 77.50

02/10/20 KGUER Meeting with E. Edwards re: trial prep B011 0.50 387.50

02/10/20 KGUER Meeting with E. Edwards and T. Pakrouh 
re: exhibits and trial prep

B011 0.60 465.00

02/10/20 KGUER Meeting with B. Olivere re: trial exhibits 
and logistics

B011 0.20 155.00

02/10/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Correspondence with 
M. Neiburg and A. Mielke and DLS re: 
prepare F. Pometti and A. Ralph data for 
attorney review

B011 0.40 70.00

02/10/20 SBEAC Emails from A. Mielke re Schmid 
Litigation

B011 0.10 83.50

02/10/20 SBEAC Email with J. Mulvihill and A. Mielke re: 
Schmid Litigation

B011 0.20 167.00

02/10/20 SBEAC Email with A. Mielke and S. Hawkins re: 
Schmid Litigation

B011 0.20 167.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Draft PPT demonstrative for trial opening 
(.5); emails (.1) and conferences (.2) with 
P. Silver re: same

B011 0.80 360.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: trial exhibit coordination issues

B011 0.10 45.00
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02/10/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: PPT 

demonstrative issues
B011 0.20 90.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, B. 
Walters, B. Olivere, E. Healy, and J. 
Forbes re: litigation calendar

B011 0.10 45.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Multiple emails with B. Olivere and B. B011 0.40 180.00
Walters re: deposition designations (.2); 
conferences with B. Olivere and B. 
Walters re: same (.2)

02/10/20 TPAKR Emails with Ankura, E. Edwards and K. B011 
Guerke re: trial document issues

0.10 45.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: open B011
litigation issues (.2); emails with E.
Edwards re: same (.1)

0.30 135.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Draft A. Mack deposition log (2.1); B011
emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re:

2.20 990.00

same (.1)
02/10/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke and B011 

trial tech re: litigation issues (.1); confer 
with trial tech re: same (.2)

0.30 135.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Draft B. Brittig deposition log (2.1); B011
emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re:

2.20 990.00

same (.1)
02/10/20 TPAKR Multiple emails with YCST and DLS re: B011 

exporting exhibit documents
0.20 90.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel, E. Edwards B011 0.20 90.00
and K. Guerke re: revised exhibit list (.1); 
emails with M. Fratticci and P. Foss re: 
same (. 1)

02/11/20 AMIEL Confer with S. Beach re: lien litigation in 
preparation for call with project owner

B011 0.40 196.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Stiff and M. Levan re:
Ohio Cat's lien

B011 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Emails with C. McNulty re: C. States 
arbitration

B011 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Eaton re: C. States 
arbitration

B011 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Review order entered in G. A. West 
matter re: recovery of attorney’s fees and 
CASPA

B011 0.30 147.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Confer with S. Hawkins re: lien claim 
(0.4); review contract documents in 
connection with same (0.5)

B011 0.90 441.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Finalize subpoenas for Shumway and 
Elliott; send for approval

B011 0.40 118.00
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02/11/20 BOLIV Complete deposition designations of A. 

Mack re Prime NDT Trial
B011 0.60 177.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Apply designation to deposition of Brad 
Brittig; edit deposition log - Prime NDT 
trial prep

B011 1.40 413.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Assist with organizing all Prime's exhibits 
as sent for exhibit list

B011 0.70 206.50

02/11/20 BOLIV Coordinate all plaintiffs exhibits and re­
locate to conference rooms for further

B011 0.80 236.00

review
02/11/20 BWALT Emails with T. Pakrouh, trial tech, and 

Court clerk revised time to review 
Courtroom set-up, equipment with trial 
tech and attorneys

B011 0.20 61.00

02/11/20 BWALT Prime NDT adversary trial preparation 
and logistics, including communications 
with T. Pakrouh, and trial tech team, 
review litigation calendar

B011 0.60 183.00

02/11/20 BWALT Prepare additional designations, update 
designation chart and email highlighted 
transcripts, and corresponding index to 
Brittig, Sutton and Cote

B011 2.30 701.50

02/11/20 BWALT Email from T. Pakrouh re: fully compiled 
exhibit list, with Prime’s documents 
(Heyden); review and sort list to de- 
duplicate entries

B011 2.50 762.50

02/11/20 BWALT Prepare deposition designations, and 
designation chart

B011 1.50 457.50

02/11/20 EEDWA Prime: Telephone to and teleconference 
with Committee follow-up production 
questions, S. Beach, A. Mielke and M. 
Lunn re: Prime litigation status update 
(.2); email from M. Heyden re: Prime live 
witnesses (.1); review materials from S. 
Gray (.2); meet with B. Walters re: 
exhibits (.2); telephone from K. Guerke 
(x2) re: designations and subpoenas (.4); 
designate Elliot deposition (2.4 )

B011 3.50 2,502.50

02/11/20 JMARA Prepare responses to discovery requests 
(6.8); confer with R. Vrana and A. Mielke 
re: interrogatory response (.2); send draft 
responses to A. Mielke and confer with A. 
Mielke re: same (.2)

B011 7.20 3,780.00

02/11/20 KGUER Review litigation calendar B011 0.20 155.00

02/11/20 KGUER Review deposition transcripts and B011 1.30 1,007.50
summaries for same; review page and line 
designations
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02/11/20 KGUER Review deposition summaries; draft 

witness outlines; review exhibits and 
exhibit lists; prepare for trial

B011 4.30 3,332.50

02/11/20 KGUER UCC status call B011 0.50 387.50

02/11/20 KGUER Teleconference with expert re: trial B011 0.30 232.50

02/11/20 KGUER Review trial subpoenas; finalize and serve 
same

B011 0.30 232.50

02/11/20 KGUER Review defense exhibit list B011 0.30 232.50

02/11/20 KGUER Multiple emails with E. Edwards and T. 
Pakrouh re: trial prep, scheduling, page 
and line designations, and trial vendor

B011 0.40 310.00

02/11/20 KGUER Teleconference (x2) with E. Edwards re: 
witnesses and trial strategy

B011 0.50 387.50

02/11/20 KGUER Emails with trial vendor; review 
agreement for same

B011 0.30 232.50

02/11/20 SBEAC Review documents and prepare for Prime 
Trial re: direct of Hawkins and Pometti

B011 0.70 584.50

02/11/20 TPAKR Confer with K. Guerke re: trial subpoenas 
(.1); emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke 
and Prime counsel re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Multiple emails with M. Fratticci and
DLS re: exhibit list export issues

B011 0.20 90.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with YCST and trial tech re: video 
demonstrative

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: open 
litigation issues (.4); emails with B.
Walters re: same (.1)

B011 0.50 225.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Email with Prime counsel E. Edwards and 
K. Guerke re: amended stipulation and 
COC

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Olivere, B. Walters, E. 
Edwards and K. Guerke re: coordinating 
technology with court

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Revise Cote deposition log (.8); emails 
with B. Olivere and B. Walters re: same 
(•1)

B011 0.90 405.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke and 
Prime counsel re: revised exhibit list (.1); 
multiple emails with M. Fratticci and
DLS re: exporting same (.2)

B011 0.30 135.00
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02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 

re: revisions to amended complaint stip 
(. 1); revise accordingly and draft COC 
and order re: same (1.2)

B011 1.30 585.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 
re: drafting amended complaint 
stipulation^); draft same (2.0)

B011 2.10 945.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards and 
Prime counsel re: live witnesses

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with J. Bell, E. Edwards, and K. 
Guerke re: deposition transcript

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with P. Foss re: researching expert 
trial docs

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 
re: preparing video demonstratives

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel re: exhibit list 
issues (.1); confer with B. Walters re: 
same (.2)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Olivere, B. Walters, E. 
Healy and J. Forbes re: litigation calendar 
issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/11/20 TPAKR Email with K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: 
finalizing Shumway and Elliot subpoenas 
(.1); finalize same (.2)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/12/20 BOLIV Prepare electronic designations to 
Shumway deposition

B011 0.80 236.00

02/12/20 BOLIV Prepare electronic designations to S.
Elliott deposition

B011 1.30 383.50

02/12/20 BOLIV Update deposition designations of A.
Mack re Prime NDT Trial

B011 0.40 118.00

02/12/20 BOLIV Read pretrial conference transcript for 
information pertaining to trial re Prime 
NDT

B011 0.40 118.00

02/12/20 BOLIV Compare Shumway designations to 
designation chart for accuracy

B011 0.20 59.00

02/12/20 BOLIV Update B. Brittig deposition Designations B011 0.20 59.00

02/12/20 BOLIV Email Veritext for condensed S. Elliott 
deposition

B011 0.10 29.50

02/12/20 BOLIV Apply T. Rapp designations re Prime
NDT

B011 0.50 147.50

02/12/20 BOLIV Contact chambers requesting permission B011 0.10 29.50
to submit double sided binders for 
exhibits only re Prime NDT trial
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02/12/20 BWALT Emails with E. Edwards, T. Pakrouh, K. 

Guerke; finalize final deposition 
designation chart to send to Prime counsel

B011 0.80 244.00

02/12/20 BWALT Additional trial preparation including 
multiple emails from T. Pakrouh, E.
Healy, B. Olivere, trial tech, courtroom 
technology, assist with preparation for 
meeting to review trial exhibits

B011 1.20 366.00

02/12/20 BWALT Meet trial tech at Court to test equipment B011 0.70 213.50

02/12/20 BWALT Revise Sutton's designations, update chart B011 0.40 122.00

02/12/20 BWALT Prepare Elliott deposition designations, 
update designations document with 
additional designations, confer with K. 
Guerke re: trial preparation, email to trial 
assistant

B011 2.50 762.50

02/12/20 EEDWA Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: trial 
planning (.5); meet with T. Pakrouh and

B011 4.80 3,432.00

K. Guerke re: objections to exhibits (1.8); 
meet with Precision Technology and test 
run courtroom technology (.3); multiple 
emails with T. Pakrouh and K. Guerke re: 
pretrial memo (.2); telephone from K. 
Guerke re: trial preparations (.2); emails 
with S. Gray re: potential exhibits for 
direct (.4); prepare for meeting with S. 
Gray re: direct preparation (1.4)

02/12/20 JMARA Review internal correspondence re: 
protective order and review draft of same 
(.2); confer with A. Mielke re: discovery 
and email J. Kryzstofik with request for 
update on diligence (.2)

B011 0.40 210.00

02/12/20 KGUER Multiple emails with YCST team re: page 
and line, exhibits, vendor, trial prep and 
trial strategy

B011 0.40 310.00

02/12/20 KGUER Emails with opposing counsel re: exhibit 
list and page and line

B011 0.20 155.00

02/12/20 KGUER Draft witness and trial outlines; prep for 
trial; review documents and trial exhibits

B011 5.50 4,262.50

02/12/20 KGUER Review deposition transcripts; review 
deposition summaries; review and revise 
deposition page and line designations

B011 1.50 1,162.50

02/12/20 KGUER Review exhibits, video, and 
demonstratives

B011 1.50 1,162.50

02/12/20 KGUER Meeting with E. Edwards and T. Pakrouh 
re: trial strategy and review exhibits

B011 1.80 1,395.00
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02/12/20 KGUER Meeting with trial vendor at court B011 0.70 542.50

02/12/20 TPAKR Multiple emails with B. Olivere, B. 
Walters, E. Edwards, and K. Guerke re: 
revisions to deposition designation chart 
issues

B011 0.20 90.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel, E. Edwards 
and K. Guerke re: Welded deposition 
designation

B011 0.10 45.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Olivere and B. Walters re: 
trial tech

B011 0.10 45.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Multiple emails with, K. Guerke, and E. 
Edwards, B. Olivere and B. Walters re: 
designation issues

B011 0.20 90.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Draft Rapp designations (2.0); emails 
with B. Walters, B. Olivere, E. Edwards 
and K. Guerke re: same (.1)

B011 2.10 945.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 
re: Cote deposition designation issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards re: exhibit list B011 0.10 45.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Prepare, review, and analyze defendant's 
exhibits (3.5); emails E. Edwards and K. 
Guerke re: same (.1)

B011 3.60 1,620.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Emails with the client, K. Enos, K.
Guerke, and S. Beach re: litigation issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/12/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: objections to exhibit list issues (3.0); 
coordinate documents for same (.5)

B011 3.50 1,575.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Prepare designations of A. Mack as 
provided by Prime NDT

B011 1.60 472.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Prepare designations to R. Bisnett and B. 
Cote as given by Prime NDT

B011 1.50 442.50

02/13/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of agenda for trial beginning 2/18/20 re 
Prime NDT

B011 0.30 88.50

02/13/20 BOLIV Prepare designations of D. Sutton as 
provided by Prime NDT

B011 1.00 295.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Call chambers re exhibit binders and 
agenda for trial

B011 0.10 29.50

02/13/20 BOLIV Draft agenda for trial 2/18/20 through 
2/21/20

B011 1.00 295.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Prepare additional trial binders with B011 0.70 206.50
respect to complaint, and sealed pleadings 
re Prime NDT
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02/13/20 BOLIV Assist with materials for preparation of 

witness re S. Gray re Prime NDT
B011 0.50 147.50

02/13/20 BWALT Trial preparation (exhibits, transcripts); 
Confer with B. Olivere re: defendant's

B011 3.50 1,067.50

initial designations and adding same to 
deposition transcripts, confer with T. 
Pakrouh re: transcripts, work with 
transcript designations

02/13/20 EEDWA Prime: Work with S. Gray re: direct B011 9.70 6,935.50
examination and demonstratives (7.0); 
review Prime’s exhibits to object (1.8); 
multiple emails with K. Guerke, S. Beach 
and F. Pommeti re: Prime settlement 
proposal (.2); analyze litigation settlement 
factors (.6) emails with K. Guerke re: 
same (.1)

02/13/20 KGUER Email and teleconference with mediator 
re: settlement

B011 0.30 232.50

02/13/20 KGUER Emails with client re: trial testimony B011 0.20 155.00

02/13/20 KGUER Review depositions; prepare witness B011 6.50 5,037.50
outlines; draft trial outlines; review and 
revise exhibit list; review exhibits and 
pleadings

02/13/20 KGUER Meeting with E. Edwards re: trial issues 
and settlement

B011 0.20 155.00

02/13/20 KGUER Multiple emails with client re: settlement B011 0.20 155.00

02/13/20 KGUER Meeting with expert re: trial prep B011 1.20 930.00

02/13/20 KGUER Review DX exhibits B011 1.30 1,007.50

02/13/20 KGUER Multiple emails with E. Edwards and T. 
Pakrouh re: trial exhibits and exhibit list, 
trial prep and related issues

B011 0.40 310.00

02/13/20 KGUER Review page and line transcript 
designations

B011 0.30 232.50

02/13/20 SBEAC Call with E. Edwards re: Prime trial B011 0.10 83.50

02/13/20 SBEAC Review documents and prepare for direct 
examination of S. Hawkins and F. Pometti 
re: Prime trial

B011 4.10 3,423.50

02/13/20 SBEAC Emails with K. Guerke re: Prime trial 
preparation

B011 0.10 83.50

02/13/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards re: researching 
documents for trial (.1); research same

B011 0.30 135.00

(•2)
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02/13/20 TPAKR Prepare, review, and analyze defendant's 

exhibits (6.7); multiple emails (.2) and 
conferences (.2) E. Edwards and K.
Guerke re: same

B011 7.10 3,195.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel re: Hawkins 
subpoena

B011 0.10 45.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Confer with S. Gray and E. Edwards re: 
trial preparation issues

B011 0.30 135.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: researching 
trial document issues (.2); emails with E. 
Edwards and S. Gray re: same (.1)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Confer with DLS re: exhibit list export 
issues

B011 0.20 90.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Confer with S. Beach re: researching 
documents from Hawkins/Pometti direct 
(.1); research documents for same (.5)

B011 0.60 270.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, B. 
Olivere, and B. Walters re: counter 
designations

B011 0.10 45.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke, S. Beach, E. 
Edwards, and the client re: Prime 
settlement offer

B011 0.10 45.00

02/13/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke re: trial issues (.1); 
confer with K. Guerke re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Krystofik re: lien claim 
diligence

B011 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Confer with A. Elkhoury re: Schmid lien 
action

B011 0.20 98.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with AAA re: list of arbitrators B011 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with C. McNulty re: arbitration B011 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with T. Pakrouh re: settlement of 
Prime matter

B011 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 BOLIV Prepare counter-designations to Cote, 
Mack and Sutton

B011 0.70 206.50

02/14/20 BOLIV Meet and confer with B. Walters re trial 
planning re exhibit production and 
counter-designations

B011 0.30 88.50

02/14/20 BOLIV Prepare counter-designations to R. Bisnett 
deposition

B011 0.30 88.50

02/14/20 BWALT Email from B. Oliver re: counter­
designations; review logistics for counter 
designating transcripts

B011 0.90 274.50

02/14/20 BWALT Emails with trial tech regarding trial 
preparation

B011 0.20 61.00
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02/14/20 BWALT Review daily litigation calendar B011 0.10 30.50

02/14/20 BWALT Confer with T. Pakrouh re: Welded's 
deposition counterdesignations, plaintiffs 
trial exhibits, confer with B. Olivere re: 
deposition counterdesignations

B011 0.90 274.50

02/14/20 EEDWA Prime: Teleconference with S. Hawkins,
F. Pometti, S. Beach, and K. Guerke re:

B011 7.30 5,219.50

settlement (1.0); review Prime’s exhibits 
for objections (2.1); counter-designate 
Sutton and Mack transcripts (1.1); 
multiple meetings with K. Guerke re: trial 
preparations (.5); draft cross questions for 
S. Elliot (1.9); work with K. Guerke re: 
finalizing settlement terms (.3); review 
and revise draft email to Court re: 
cancellation of trial (.2); emails with T. 
Pakrouh re: drafting settlement agreement 
(■2)

02/14/20 KGUER Prepare for trial; draft trial witness 
outlines; prepare opening statement, 
review PX and DX exhibits

B011 2.40 1,860.00

02/14/20 KGUER Review DX trial exhibits B011 1.10 852.50

02/14/20 KGUER Teleconference and emails with opposing 
counsel re: settlement

B0U 0.30 232.50

02/14/20 KGUER Teleconference with YCST and client re: 
settlement

B011 0.90 697.50

02/14/20 KGUER Review page and line designations; 
prepare counter designations

B011 0.80 620.00

02/14/20 KGUER Emails and teleconferences with mediator 
re: settlement

B011 0.50 387.50

02/14/20 KGUER Meetings with E. Edwards and T. Pakrouh 
re: settlement issues

B011 0.40 310.00

02/14/20 KGUER Email with court re: settlement B011 0.10 77.50

02/14/20 KGUER Multiple emails with YCST re: page and 
line counter designations

B011 0.40 310.00

02/14/20 KGUER Emails with expert re: trial prep B011 0.20 155.00

02/14/20 KGUER Emails with A. Mielke re: protective 
order

B011 0.10 77.50

02/14/20 SBEAC Review and revise memo re: Williams 
litigation strategy and discovery issues

B011 1.90 1,586.50

(.8); Meeting with M. Neiburg and T. 
Buchanan re: same (1.1)
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02/14/20 TBUCH Review and revise analysis of litigation 

strategy and open issues (4.2); meet with
S. Beach and M. Neiburg re: same (1.0)

B011 5.20 3,094.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards and S. Gray re: 
trial document issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Research litigation settlement precedent 
(.2); emails with E. Edwards and K. 
Guerke re: same (.1)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Prepare trial documents (1.0); emails with 
DLS re: same (.1)

B011 1.10 495.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards re: Bisnett 
counter designations

B011 0.10 45.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Attend teleconference with E. Edwards,
K. Guerke, S. Beach, and the client re: 
trial strategy and Prime settlement

B011 1.00 450.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Confer with S. Gray and E. Edwards re: 
trial preparation issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: objections to exhibit list issues

B011 0.20 90.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Email with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, B. 
Olivere, and B. Walters re: litigation 
calendar update

B011 0.10 45.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Confer with E. Edwards, K. Guerke, and 
mediator re: Prime settlement

B011 0.50 225.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Analyze Bisnett designation and draft 
counter designations for same (1.0); 
emails with B, Olivere and B. Walters re: 
same (.1)

B011 1.10 495.00

02/14/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel and the court 
re: settlement

B011 0.10 45.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Emails with T. Pakrouh re: Prime 
settlement

B011 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 BFELD Call with M. Hurford re: status 
conference in Earth Pipeline Services 
adversary matters

B011 0.10 41.50

02/17/20 BOLIV Draft amended agenda cancelling trial re 
Prime NDT

B011 0.20 59.00

02/17/20 KGUER Emails with T. Pakrouh and E. Edwards 
re; settlement agreement

B011 0.10 77.50

02/17/20 KGUER Review draft settlement agreement B011 0.60 465.00

02/17/20 KGUER Review notice from court re: trial B011 0.10 77.50

02/17/20 KGUER Email with S. Beach and E. Edwards re: 
UCC and settlement

B011 0.10 77.50
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02/17/20 MFRAT William Litigation - review data report 

and correspondence with A. Mielke
B011 0.30 52.50

02/17/20 TBUCH Review and revise analysis of litigation 
strategy and open issues

B011 5.50 3,272.50

02/17/20 TPAKR Confer with DLS re: litigation documents 
for Ankura analysis (.1); teleconference 
with Ankura re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/17/20 TPAKR Draft Prime settlement agreement (3.0); 
emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke re: 
same (.1)

B011 3.10 1,395.00

02/17/20 TPAKR Review litigation documents for Ankura 
analysis (.2); emails with DLS re: same 
(■1)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/17/20 TPAKR Confer with A. Mielke re: Prime 
settlement agreement

B011 0.10 45.00

02/17/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Olivere and E. Edwards 
re: amended Prime agenda (.1); finalize 
and file same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with C. McNulty re: stay of 
arbitration agreement

B011 0.10 49.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: lien claim 
documents

B011 0.20 98.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with A. Ralph and S. Cherian re: 
request for payment

B011 0.10 49.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with R. Kramer re: agreement to 
stay arbitration (0.1); review R. Kramer's 
comments to same (0.1)

B011 0.20 98.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Cherian re: outstanding fee 
reimbursement invoices

B011 0.10 49.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Revise request for payment B011 0.20 98.00

02/18/20 BOLIV Prepare pdf for A. Mielke re: request 
delimited file from accounting

B011 0.20 59.00

02/18/20 EEDWA Prime: Meet with K. Guerke re: 
settlement agreement

B011 0.10 71.50

02/18/20 KGUER Review and revise draft settlement 
agreement

B011 0.30 232.50

02/18/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Correspondence with 
DLS and sent link to collect date for
Jackie Krzysztofik

B011 0.10 17.50

02/18/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Correspondence and 
teleconference with J. Martinez re: Jackie 
Krzysztofik data to be sent to DLS

B011 0.20 35.00
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02/18/20 SBEAC Emails with M. Collins, T. Buchanan, M. 

Neiburg and K. Guerke re: Williams 
subpoena to Federal (.1); Review 
subpoena re: same (.2)

B011 0.30 250.50

02/18/20 TBUCH Review and revise analysis of litigation 
strategy and open issues

B011 4.80 2,856.00

02/18/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel, E. Edwards 
and K. Guerke re: Prime settlement 
agreement

B011 0.10 45.00

02/18/20 TPAKR Emails with S. Beach, E. Edwards and K. 
Guerke re: settlement agreement (.1); 
emails with the client re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/18/20 TPAKR Confer with K. Guerke re: revisions to 
Prime settlement agreement (.2)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/18/20 TPAKR Draft Prime 9019 motion B011 2.50 1,125.00

02/18/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: revisions to settlement agreements(.l); 
revise accordingly (.4)

B011 0.50 225.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with A. Elkhoury re: lien litigation 
diligence

B011 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 AM1EL Emails with S. Beach re: stay of 
arbitration agreement (0.1); revise 
agreement in connection with same (0.2)

B011 0.30 147.00

02/19/20 BOLIV Edit, review and revise notice, motion and 
proposed order re settlement agreement re 
Prime NDT per T. Pakrouh

B011 0.40 118.00

02/19/20 BOLIV Research adversaiy procedures for 
settlement motions re Prime NDT

B011 0.20 59.00

02/19/20 KGUER Review draft 9019 motion B011 0.50 387.50

02/19/20 KGUER Emails with expert re: invoices B011 0.10 77.50

02/19/20 KGUER Emails with client re: settlement 
agreement

B011 0.10 77.50

02/19/20 KGUER Emails with T. Pakrouh re: 9019 motion B011 0.10 77.50

02/19/20 KGUER Meeting with T. Pakrouh re: settlement 
agreement

B011 0.10 77.50

02/19/20 SBEAC Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg 
re litigation analysis

B011 0.20 167.00

02/19/20 TPAKR Review, revise, and draft 9019 motion 
(1.0); emails with B. Olivere re: same (.1)

B011 1.10 495.00

02/19/20 TPAKR Confer with K. Guerke re: 9019 Motion 
(.1); emails with K. Guerke and E.

B011 0.20 90.00

Edwards re: draft of same (.1)
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02/20/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and M. Eaton re: 

comments to draft stay agreement
B011 0.10 49.00

02/20/20 KGUER Review settlement agreement draft B011 0.20 155.00

02/20/20 KGUER Emails with Prime’s counsel re: edits to 
settlement agreement; email with YCST 
re: same

B011 0.20 155.00

02/20/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel, E. Edwards 
and K. Guerke re: settlement agreement 
(.1); review Prime revisions to same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/20/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards re: Prime 9019 
Motion

B011 0.10 45.00

02/21/20 EEDWA Prime: Review and provide comments to 
draft 9019 to approve settlement with 
Prime (.4); multiple emails from T. 
Pakrouh and K. Guerke re: finalizing 
same (.1)

B011 0.50 357.50

02/21/20 KGUER Review UCC comments and edits to 
settlement agreement and 9019 motion

B011 0.30 232.50

02/21/20 KGUER Emails with S. Beach re: settlement 
agreement

B011 0.20 155.00

02/21/20 KGUER Review edits to settlement agreement 
from opposing counsel

B011 0.20 155.00

02/21/20 KGUER Emails with YCST and clients re: 
settlement agreement and 9019 motion

B011 0.20 155.00

02/21/20 KGUER Review and revise 9019 motion B011 0.40 310.00

02/21/20 KGUER Emails with opposing counsel re: 
settlement agreement

B011 0.20 155.00

02/21/20 KGUER Emails with UCC and YCST re: 
settlement agreement and 9019 motion

B011 0.10 77.50

02/21/20 KGUER Review case documents re: settlement and 
9019 motion

B011 0.40 310.00

02/21/20 TPAKR Emails with Committee counsel, E. 
Edwards, K. Guerke, and S. Beach re: 
draft 9019 motion and Prime settlement 
agreement (.1); emails with client, E. 
Edwards, K. Guerke, and S. Beach re: 
same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/21/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 
re: revisions to the 9019 motion (.1); 
revise accordingly (.3)

B011 0.40 180.00

02/21/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke, E. Edwards, and 
Prime counsel re: Prime's revisions to 
settlement agreement

B011 0.10 45.00
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02/21/20 TPAKR Emails (.1) and teleconferences (.1) with

B. Olivere re: 9019 motion and Prime 
settlement agreement

B011 0.20 90.00

02/21/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 
re: further revisions to Prime settlement 
agreement (.1); revise accordingly (.3)

B011 0.40 180.00

02/21/20 TPAKR Revise Prime 9019 motion and settlement 
agreement per Committee revisions (.2); 
emails with Prime counsel, E. Edwards 
and K. Guerke re: same (.1)

B011 0.30 135.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Review analysis of claim settlement B011 0.40 196.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Hawkins re: vendor 
settlement discussions

B011 0.10 49.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Emails with counsel for Bechtel re: 
agreement to stay arbitration

B011 0.10 49.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Emails with C. Kelley re: removal of lien 
actions

B011 0.10 49.00

02/24/20 KGUER Multiple emails with YCST and client re: 
settlement agreement and 9019 motion

B011 0.20 155.00

02/24/20 KGUER Email with opposing counsel re: 
settlement and agreement

B011 0.10 77.50

02/24/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Correspondence with 
A. Mielke re: hard drive and password to 
access encrypted data sent by J. Moan in 
connection with Williams document 
review and production

B011 0.10 17.50

02/24/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Correspondence with 
DLS and A. Mielke re: date restriction to 
apply to data in preparation for document 
review

B011 0.20 35.00

02/24/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Sent to DLS FTP site 
information and passwords to access Alex 
Partners data and prepare data to be 
searched

B011 0.30 52.50

02/24/20 SBEAC Multiple emails with T. Pakrouh, F. 
Pometti, S. Hawkins and K. Guerke re: 
Prime settlement agreement and 9019 
motion (.2); Review and revise documents 
re same (.6)

B011 0.80 668.00

02/24/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel re: settlement 
agreement (.1); emails with YCST and the 
client re: same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Review revised settlement proposal B011 0.20 98.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and T. Pakrouh re: 
settlement motion status

B011 0.10 49.00
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02/25/20 EEDWA (Prime) review updated disclosure 

statement re: Prime litigation (.1) confer 
with T. Pakrouh re: same and 9019 (.1)

B011 0.20 143.00

02/25/20 KGUER Emails with opposing counsel re: 
settlement

B011 0.10 77.50

02/25/20 KGUER Multiple emails with YCST re: plan, 
confirmation, and Prime settlement issues

B011 0.20 155.00

02/25/20 KGUER Review plan and insert re: Prime litigation B011 0.40 310.00

02/25/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Correspondence with 
J. Chapman re: IP names list

B011 1.00 175.00

02/25/20 TPAKR Confer with Prime counsel re settlement 
agreement (.1); emails with E. Edwards 
and K. Guerke re: summary of same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Eaton re: stay of 
arbitration

B011 0.10 49.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with C. Kelley, A. Elkhoury, and
S. Beach re: removal of lien actions

B011 0.20 98.00

02/26/20 KGUER Review pleadings and briefing; draft 
outline re: claims analysis and discovery

B011 2.90 2,247.50

02/26/20 MFRAT Williams litigation - Coordinate hard 
drive with client data pick up by DLS to 
prepare data for attorney review

B011 0.50 87.50

02/26/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: settlement agreement issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Eaton re: stay agreement B011 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 DLASK Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of 9019 settlement motion in Prime 
adversary and main debtor case

B011 0.40 122.00

02/27/20 EEDWA (Prime) Telephone call with T. Pakrouh 
re: executed settlement agreement (.1); 
review/finalize to file 9019 motion (.2); 
confer with T. Pakrouh re: same (.1)

B011 0.40 286.00

02/27/20 KGUER Emails with T. Pakrouh re: filing of 9019 
motion

B011 0.10 77.50

02/27/20 KGUER Emails with T. Pakrouh and E. Edwards 
re: settlement agreement

B011 0.20 155.00

02/27/20 KGUER Review final 9019 motion B011 0.30 232.50

02/27/20 KGUER Emails with opposing counsel re: 
settlement agreement

B011 0.10 77.50

02/27/20 MMILA Meeting re: status of discovery and 
litigation in the Williams litigation matter

B011 1.00 400.00
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02/27/20 MNEIB Emails with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: 

status report
B011 0.20 135.00

02/27/20 MNEIB Email from A. Mielke re: draft status 
report

B011 0.10 67.50

02/27/20 TPAKR Emails with K. Enos and A. Mielke re: 
Ankura analysis issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/27/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel re: settlement 
agreement (.1); emails with YCST re: 
same (.1)

B011 0.20 90.00

02/27/20 TPAKR Emails with Prime counsel, E. Edwards, 
and K. Guerke re: compiled 9019 motion

B011 0.10 45.00

02/27/20 TPAKR Emails with E. Edwards and K. Guerke 
re: settlement agreement issues

B011 0.10 45.00

02/27/20 TPAKR Emails with B. Olivere and D. Laskin re: B011 0.40 180.00
filing 9019 motion (.1); finalize and file 
same (.2); emails with KCC and D. 
Laskin re: service of same (.1)

02/28/20 AMIEL Emails with C. McNulty and AAA re: 
arbitrator list deadline

B011 0.20 98.00

02/28/20 BOLIV Research invoice payment or non­
payment of Precise Trial services re 
retainer for Prime NDT trial

B011 0.10 29.50

02/28/20 BOLIV Review all adversary matters to confirm B011 0.70 206.50
n.drive and dockets are up to date re 
status conference re all adversaries; 
prepare email to A. Mielke re same

02/28/20 MNEIB Emails and call with S. Beach and A. 
Mielke re: status conference and related

B011 0.90 607.50

issues
02/28/20 MNEIB Work on draft status report B011 0.70 472.50

02/29/20 AMIEL Emails with counsel for Earth Pipeline 
Services re: status conference

B011 0.10 49.00

02/03/20 SBEAC Review and revise surety bond statute of B012 3.40 2,839.00
limitation issues and analysis (.6); Emails 
with A. Mielke re same (.2); Review and 
revise plan re: surety, preference and 
other issues (2.6)

02/04/20 MLUNN Review/revise portion of motion to 
approve disclosure statement and 
solicitation procedures

B012 0.70 556.50

02/06/20 AMIEL Review revisions to plan B012 0.10 49.00

02/06/20 MLUNN Review/revise/draft solicitation 
procedures motion

B012 2.30 1,828.50
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02/06/20 SBEAC Email with M. Collins re: Plan Global

Deal
B012 0.10 83.50

02/06/20 SBEAC Review and revise Plan Global Deal (2.6); 
email with M. Lunn, R. Poppiti, A.
Mielke, B. Feldman, and J. Mulvihill re: 
same (.2)

B012 2.80 2,338.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Mulvihill re: plan B012 0.10 49.00

02/07/20 BFELD Confer with S. Beach re: status of plan, 
disclosure statement, and solicitation 
procedures motion

B012 0.10 41.50

02/07/20 JMULV Revising Plan B012 0.70 367.50

02/07/20 MLUNN Review revisions to draft plan B012 0.40 318.00

02/07/20 SBEAC Emails with M. Collins, S. Poteet and A. 
Mielke re chapter 11 plan issues related to 
surety (.2); Further review and revise plan 
and DS re same (1.3); Emails with F. 
Pometti, S. Hawkins and A. Ralph re 
same (.1); Emails With M. Schaedle, M. 
Kelsey, M. Rosenthal and others re: plan 
settlement issues (. 1)

B012 1.70 1,419.50

02/10/20 MLUNN Revise/draft disclosure statement B012 1.40 1,113.00

02/10/20 SBEAC Review and revise Disclosure Statement 
for Chapter 11 Plan Global Settlement 
(.1); Review and revise documents re 
same (1.2)

B012 1.30 1,085.50

02/11/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Cherian re: draft plan 
comments

B012 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Draft statute of limitation summary in 
connection with plan settlement 
discussions (0.5); emails with S. Beach re: 
same (0.1)

B012 0.60 294.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Teleconference with S. Beach and M. 
Collins re: plan and claim issues

B012 0.50 245.00

02/11/20 SBEAC Review and revise Plan Global Deal B012 0.10 83.50

02/11/20 SBEAC Email with S. Poteet, M. Collins, and A. 
Mielke re: Chapter 11 Plan Discussion

B012 0.10 83.50

02/11/20 SBEAC Prepare for (.5) and attend call with M. 
Collins, S. Poteet and A. Mielke re
Chapter 11 Plan Discussion (.6)

B012 1.10 918.50

02/12/20 AMIEL Draft section of plan re: estimation of C. 
States claim (0.5); review/research 
precedent re: same (1.0)

B012 1.50 735.00
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02/12/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: statute of 

limitations of claims in connection with 
plan discussions (0.1); revise summary 
analysis re: same (0.1)

B012 0.20 98.00

02/12/20 MLUNN Review responses to open Plan/DS issues 
from Alix Partners

B012 0.20 159.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Confer with S. Beach re: treatment of 
claims in plan

B012 0.40 196.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Review precedent for claim estimation in 
connection with plan (1.4); confer with S. 
Beach re: same (0.1)

B012 1.50 735.00

02/14/20 SBEAC Emails with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, F. 
Pometti, M. Schaedle and others re case 
timeline and settlement issues

B012 0.20 167.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Review draft settlement and indemnity 
agreements

B012 0.50 245.00

02/18/20 MLUNN Work with S. Beach re: plan issues and 
Committee/Bechtel settlement agreement

B012 0.30 238.50

02/18/20 MLUNN Review draft settlement agreement with 
Bechtel and Committee re: plan 
settlement and review related draft 
indemnification agreement (.6); 
correspondence with YCST team re: plan 
issues/approvals and scheduling of board 
meeting (.2)

B012 0.80 636.00

02/18/20 SBEAC Work with R. Poppiti re: plan issues (.1); 
Work with M. Lunn re: same (.2); Review 
plan settlement and pension claim stay 
documents re: same (.2); Further review 
and revise disclosure statement (1.1)

B012 1.60 1,336.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Schaedle and M.
Rosenthal re: plan settlement documents 
status

B012 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: comments to 
indemnity and settlement agreements

B012 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with R. Poppiti re: call to discuss 
status of plan documents

B012 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Feldman re: disclosure 
statement

B012 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 BFELD Revise disclosure statement re: various 
comments and case updates (1.0); revise 
solicitation procedures motion re: various 
comments and plan updates (.6); emails 
with YCST and KCC teams (.1 each)

B012 1.80 747.00

02/19/20 MLUNN Review indemnity agreement and related 
correspondence re: settlement agreement 
and call with Blank Rome and Bechtel

B012 0.20 159.00
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02/19/20 RFPOP Review and comment on draft proposed 

global settlement agreement, and emails 
to and from S. Beach and A. Mielke re:
same

B012 0.30 205.50

02/20/20 AMIEL Teleconference with counsel for Bechtel, 
committee counsel, M. Lunn, and S.
Beach re: comments to settlement 
documents

B012 0.30 147.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Review committee comments to draft 
plan settlement documents

B012 0.30 147.00

02/20/20 BFELD Emails with S. Cherian re: liquidation 
analysis

B012 0.10 41.50

02/20/20 BFELD Participate in (partial) call with YCST, 
Blank Rome, and Gibson Dunn teams re: 
plan settlement agreement between 
Debtors, Committee, and Debtors'
Partners

B012 0.20 83.00

02/20/20 MLUNN Review and provide comments to revised 
disclosure statement, including 
correspondence re: liquidation analysis

B012 1.30 1,033.50

02/20/20 MLUNN Revise plan settlement agreement (.4); 
review / provide comments to committee 
comments to plan settlement agreement 
and indemnification agreement (.5); call 
with committee and Bechtel (.3)

B012 1.20 954.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Incorporate M. Lunn's comments to plan 
settlement documents

B012 0.30 147.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Rosenthal re: comments 
to indemnity and settlement agreements

B012 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Review/revise plan (0.5); confer with S. 
Beach re: comments to draft plan (0.2)

B012 0.70 343.00

02/21/20 MLUNN Review/analyze partnership agreement re: 
approval requirements for Plan/DS and 
related correspondence (.6); 
correspondence with S. Hawkins and F. 
Pometti re: board meeting to approve 
plan/DS and requirements under the 
partnership agreement (.4); 
correspondence with R. Hart and S. Beach 
re: resolutions approving plan/DS (.3)

B012 1.30 1,033.50

02/21/20 MLUNN Review revised plan settlement agreement 
and related indemnity and correspondence 
with A. Mielke re: same; correspondence 
with Committee and Betchel re: same

B012 0.30 238.50

02/21/20 RI1ART Emails re: need for board consent re: plan B012 0.10 41.50
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02/24/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Porcelli, M. Lunn, and S. 

Beach re: comments to plan settlement 
agreement

B012 0.20 98.00

02/24/20 BFELD Call with A. Ralph re: plan settlement 
agreement and liquidation analysis

B012 0.20 83.00

02/24/20 BFELD Emails with M. Lunn and R. Poppiti (.1) 
re: status of liquidation analysis; follow­
up emails with A. Ralph re: same (.2)

B012 0.30 124.50

02/24/20 MLUNN Review and provide comments to revised B012 1.10 874.50
plan (.9); correspondence with A. Mielke 
re: plan settlement and plan provisions 
(.1); and correspondence with B. Feldman 
re: liquidation analysis (.1)

02/24/20 SBEAC Review and revise disclosure statement B012 3.70 3,089.50

02/25/20 AMIEL Review recovery analysis in connection 
with finalizing plan

B012 0.20 98.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with T. Pakrouh and B. Feldman 
re: revisions to disclosure statement

B012 0.10 49.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Revise plan (0.3); emails with M. Lunn,
F. Pometti re: same (0.1)

B012 0.40 196.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with counsel to committee and 
Bechtel re: plan settlement

B012 0.10 49.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Teleconference with F. Pometti, S. 
Hawkins, M. Lunn, S. Beach, and T. 
Pakrouh re: plan

B012 0.60 294.00

02/25/20 BFELD Revise disclosure statement re: 
conforming comments in advance of 
board call

B012 0.20 83.00

02/25/20 MLUNN Call with S. Beach re: plan and DS issues 
in preparation for board call

B012 0.60 477.00

02/25/20 MLUNN Review/revise revised DS and 
correspondence with B. Feldman re: same

B012 0.50 397.50

02/25/20 MLUNN Revise plan and work with A. Mielke re: B012 1.50 1,192.50
same (1.0); correspondence with S. Beach 
re: plan issues/strategy (.1); review 
disclosure statement insert and revise 
same (.4)

02/25/20 MLUNN Correspondence with R. Hart re: board 
resolutions for plan and DS

B012 0.10 79.50

02/25/20 MLUNN Call with S. Hawkins, F. Pometti, A. 
Ralph, S. Beach, A. Mielke and B.

B012 0.70 556.50

Feldman re: plan and DS and preparations 
for board meeting
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02/25/20 R11ART Draft consents re: approval of plan, 

disclosure statements (1.1); emails re: 
same (.1)

B012 1.20 498.00

02/25/20 SBEAC Review and revise Prime and other 
litigation descriptions in disclosure 
statement (.3); Emails with T. Pakrouh, A. 
Mielke, and M. Lunn re: same, revisions 
to plan and related issues (.1); Emails 
with C. Kelley and J. Wilson re: Schmid 
issues (.2)

B012 0.60 501.00

02/25/20 TPAKR Multiple emails with S. Beach, YCST, 
and AlixPartners re: Plan/DS issues and 
Prime insert (.2); draft Prime insert (2.2)

B012 2.40 1,080.00

02/25/20 TPAKR Attend plan call with YCST and 
AlixPartners (.7); emails with YCST and 
AlixPartners re: analysis of same (.1)

B012 0.80 360.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Mintz re: request for 
documents in connection with settlement 
agreement (0.1); confer with R. Poppiti 
re: same (0.1); emails with A. Ralph re: 
same; emails with B. Beach and M. Lunn 
re: same (0.1)

B012 0.30 147.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Teleconference with S. Beach, M. Lunn,
M. Schaedle, M. Kelsey, M. Porcelli, C. 
Rankin, and M. Eaton re: settlement and 
indemnity agreement documents

B012 0.50 245.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and M. Lunn re: 
plan settlement and indemnity agreements

B012 0.20 98.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Review committee's comments to 
settlement agreement and indemnity 
agreement

B012 0.20 98.00

02/26/20 MLUNN Review updated recovery analysis B012 0.20 159.00

02/26/20 MLUNN Call with Blank Rome and Gibson re: 
plan settlement (.5); and related follow-up 
call with Gibson (.4)

B012 0.90 715.50

02/26/20 MLUNN Review/revise liquidation analysis exhibit B012 1.10 874.50

02/26/20 MLUNN Correspondence with F. Pometti and S. 
Hawkins re: board meeting for plan and

B012 0.30 238.50

disclosure statement
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02/26/20 MLUNN Review revised plan settlement agreement 

and indemnification agreement and 
related correspondence from Bechtel and 
correspondence with F. Pometti and S. 
Beach re: same (.5); and review UCC's 
comments to revised settlement

B012 0.90 715.50

agreement and indemnity agreement (.3); 
correspondence with A. Mielke re: open 
issues in settlement agreement (.1)

02/26/20 MLUNN Review and revise resolutions for Welded 
LP and unanimous written consent for 
Welded Michigan re: authorization to file 
plan and DS

B012 0.50 397.50

02/26/20 RFPOP Emails from and discussion with A.
Mielke re: plan issues

B012 0.20 137.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Lunn re: resolutions B012 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Mintz re: document request 
(0.1); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1); 
emails with counsel to Bechtel re: same 
(0.1); emails with F. Pometti and S. 
Hawkins re: same (0.1)

B012 0.40 196.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Review settlement agreement and 
indemnity agreement

B012 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Hawkins re: committee 
document request

B012 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 MLUNN Call with F. Pometti, S. Hawkins and S. 
Beach re: preparation for board call re: 
plan and disclosure statement and prepare 
for board call (.5); board call re: plan and 
disclosure statement (.9); finalize 
resolutions approving plan and disclosure 
statement, including correspondence with 
B. Olivere (.5)

B012 1.90 1,510.50

02/28/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach, M. Lunn, M. 
Rosenthal, and F. Pometti re: committee 
document request

B012 0.30 147.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Revise chapter 11 plan B012 0.40 196.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and B. Feldman re: 
plan (0.1); review plan and analyze same 
(0.4)

B012 0.50 245.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Porcelli and S. Beach re: 
revisions to plan

B012 0.10 49.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Emails with B. Feldman re: plan revisions B012 0.10 49.00
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02/28/20 BFELD Prepare for (.2) and participate in call (.3) 

with A. Ralph re: revisions to disclosure
B012 0.50 207.50

statement
02/28/20 BFELD Revise disclosure statement re: 

corresponding changes to plan (2.7); call 
with A. Mielke re: same (.1)

B012 2.80 1,162.00

02/28/20 BOLIV Assemble and revise fully compiled pdfs 
of Welded LP Resolutions and Welded

B012 0.20 59.00

Michigan Resolutions
02/28/20 MLUNN Review revisions from Bechtel to Plan, B012 0.80 636.00

settlement agreement and indemnity 
agreement (.2); and correspondence with 
S. Beach and F. Pometti re: LC issue in 
connection with settlement and plan (.3); 
correspondence with A. Mielke re: plan 
revisions and related issues (.3)

02/28/20 MLUNN Correspondence with Board re: 
resolutions approving filing of Plan and 
DS

B012 0.20 159.00

02/28/20 MLUNN Review revised DS (.3) and related 
correspondence with B. Feldman (.3)

B012 0.60 477.00

02/28/20 RFPOP Review and comment on redlines of 
revised drafts of plan and disclosure

B012 0.30 205.50

statement, and emails to and from S. 
Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, B. Feldman, 
client (Steve Hawkins), Zolfo (Frank 
Pometti), and counsel for Bechtel 
(Michael Rosenthal and Matt Porcelli) re: 
same
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02/28/20 SBEAC Multiple emails with A. Mielke, M. B012 4.30 3,590.50

Porcelli, B. Feldman, S. Hawkins, M.
Lunn, M. Schaedle, M. Rosenthal, M.
Eaton, M. Kelsey, F. Pometti and A.
Ralph re: plan and disclosure statement 
revisions, plan settlement, Central States 
indemnity, LC documentation, and 
Central States stay stipulation (.7);
Review and revise plan and disclosure 
statement re: comments from Bechtel and 
the committee and additional 
modifications (1.1); Review and revise 
draft plan settlement agreement, Central 
States Indemnity and LC documentation 
issues (.9); Review Central States stay 
stipulation (.1); Review and revise 
liquidation analysis issues (.6); Review 
Berkshire claim resolution order (. 1);
Emails with B. Feldman re: same (.1);
Emails with A. Mielke, AAA and C.
McNulty re: Central States arbitration 
stay (.2); Emails with K. Guerke re: 
expert witness issues (.2); Emails with M.
Lunn re: board resolutions (.1); Emails 
with B. Daniels and L. Mann re: Williams 
issues (.1); Emails with A. Mielke re 
status report (.1)

02/29/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Mintz re: settlement 
agreement documents

B012 0.10 49.00

02/16/20 SBEAC Emails with F. Pometti re: board meeting 
and Prime settlement (.1); Review 
documents re: same (.4)

BOM 0.50 417.50

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and M. Lunn re: 
quorum for board meetings

BOM 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti re: board call BOM 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Lunn re: board meeting 
quorum

BOM 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 SBEAC Emails with M. Lunn, R. Hart, J. Duda BOM 0.50 417.50
and client re: board approval of plan, plan 
settlement and related issues (.1); Review 
documents re same (.4)

02/25/20 AMIEL Teleconference with S. Beach, F. Pometti, 
and S. Hawkins re: board update

BOM 0.20 98.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Lunn re: board 
resolutions

BOM 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Attend board call (0.7); prepare draft BOM 0.90 441.00
outline of minutes in advance of same 
(0.2)
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Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/13/20 AMIEL Draft consulting services agreement B015 1.30 637.00

02/17/20 RFPOP Emails to and from B. Feldman and client 
(Jackie Krzysztofik) re: draft consulting 
agreement

B015 0.10 68.50

02/18/20 RFPOP Review and comment on draft consulting 
agreement, and email to and from B. 
Feldman re: same

B015 0.30 205.50

02/07/20 RFPOP Review and comment on draft proposed 
order increasing ordinary course 
professional cap for Lewis Brisbois and 
related draft certification of counsel, and 
emails to and from T. Pakrouh re: same

B017 0.30 205.50

02/10/20 RFPOP Emails to and from T. Pakrouh re: 
proposed increase to ordinary course 
professional cap

B017 0.20 137.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Emails with R. Poppiti re: revisions to 
COC re: OCP cap increase (.1); emails 
with Committee counsel re: same (.1)

B017 0.20 90.00

02/10/20 TPAKR Emails with AlixPartners re: OCP cap 
increase (.1); confer with S. Cherin re: 
same (.2)

B017 0.30 135.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Review certificate of no objection for 
monthly fee application

B017 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Draft CNO re YCST’s 14th fee 
application

B017 0.20 59.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of CNO re 14th fee application of YCST

B017 0.20 59.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of COC re increasing OCP cap for Lewis 
Brisbois Bisgaard & Smith

B017 0.40 118.00

02/12/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach re: increase of OCP 
cap

B017 0.10 49.00

02/12/20 BOLIV Circulate order re OCP cap increase for 
Lewis Brisbois

B017 0.10 29.50

02/12/20 BOLIV Draft notice for Zolfo Cooper's January 
staffing report

B017 0.30 88.50

02/12/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of Zolfo Cooper monthly staffing report

B017 0.50 147.50

02/13/20 AMIEL Revise interim fee application and 
supplement

B017 1.60 784.00

02/13/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Cree re: interim fee 
application

B017 0.10 49.00

02/13/20 RFPOP Review and comment on draft fifth B017 0.20 137.00
interim fee application, and emails to and 
from A. Mielke re: same
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076850.1001

Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/13/20 SBEAC Emails with B. Feldman and A. Mielke re 

OCP issues
B017 0.10 83.50

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Cree re: interim fee 
application (0.2); confer with J. Cree re: 
same (0.2); revise interim fee application 
(0.5); confer with B. Olivere re: same 
(0.2)

B017 1.10 539.00

02/14/20 BOLIV Update Landis Rath and Cobb's portion of 
the 5th interim fee request of debtors' 
professionals to reflect new fee apps filed; 
identity discrepancy; confer with A.
Mielke and add footnote to detail error in 
previous fee application

B017 0.90 265.50

02/14/20 BOLIV Request LEDES file for January 2020 fee 
application for US Trustee

B017 0.10 29.50

02/17/20 BOLIV Send LEDES file for YCST's January fee 
application to US Trustee

B017 0.10 29.50

02/10/20 BOLIV Edit 5th quarterly fee request of debtors 
professionals

B018 0.40 118.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Enter all professional time and fees; all 
project categories time and fees; and 
expenses for 4th interim quarterly fee 
request: October through December 2019 
in anticipation of drafting 5th interim 
quarterly fee request

B018 2.20 649.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Draft 5th interim quarterly fee request of 
debtors professionals

B018 0.80 236.00

02/10/20 BOLIV Draft supplement to YCST's 5th interim 
fee application

B018 0.80 236.00

02/11/20 BOLIV Draft supplement to 5th interim fee 
request of YCST

B018 0.70 206.50

02/11/20 RLPOP Review and finalize invoice for YCST 
January 2020 monthly fee application re: 
confidentiality and local rule compliance

B018 0.60 411.00

02/13/20 BOLIV Begin draft of 15th [January] fee 
application for YCST

B018 0.40 118.00

02/14/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of 15th fee application of YCST

B018 0.50 147.50

02/14/20 BOLIV Draft 15th fee application of YCST for 
January 2020

B018 1.30 383.50

02/14/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of fifth interim fee request of debtors 
professionals

B018 0.50 147.50

02/14/20 BOLIV Finalize for filing and coordinate service 
of supplement to YCST's fifth interim fee 
request

B018 0.50 147.50
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Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount

02/19/20 SBEAC Non-working travel from Delaware to 
Dallas, TX for CGT meetings (billed at 
1/2 time)

B019 3.30 2,755.50

02/19/20 SBEAC Non-working travel (billed at 1/2 time) B019 3.30 2,755.50

02/03/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Mulvihill re: Williams 
discovery status

B768 0.10 49.00

02/03/20 AM 1EL Draft responses to Williams' discovery B768 1.60 784.00
requests (1.2); draft search terms in 
connection with same (0.3); emails with 
M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)

02/03/20 MNEIB Emails and discussion with A. Mielke re: 
discovery issues

B768 0.30 202.50

02/03/20 MNEIB Emails with S. Hawkins and T. Buchanan 
re: discovery issues

B768 0.10 67.50

02/03/20 MNEIB Emails with K. Guerke and T. Buchanan 
re: discovery issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/03/20 TBUCH Research related to dispute over 
discontinuities in pipeline coating

B768 0.50 297.50

02/04/20 AMIEL Confer with M. Neiburg re: discovery 
responses

B768 0.20 98.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Milana re: collection of 
ESI

B768 0.10 49.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti, M. Hood, S. 
Hawkins, and A. Ralph re: search terms 
for discovery

B768 0.10 49.00

02/04/20 AMIEL Draft search terms and identify custodians B768 1.20 588.00
(0.5); review requests for production and 
responses to same (0.3); review 
documents in connection with same (0.4)

02/04/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: e-discovery 
issues

B768 0.10 67.50

02/05/20 AMIEL Review Williams litigation memo and 
provide comments to same

B768 0.20 98.00

02/05/20 AMIEL Confer with M. Neiburg re: search terms 
and custodians (0.1); revise list of 
custodians (0.1)

B768 0.20 98.00

02/05/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: compiling
ESI data

B768 0.10 49.00

02/05/20 MNEIB Analysis re: litigation strategy (.3); emails 
with T. Buchanan re: same (.1)

B768 0.40 270.00

02/05/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: e-discovery 
issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/05/20 TBUCH Prepare analysis of litigation strategy and 
open issues

B768 5.00 2,975.00
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076850.1001

Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount

02/06/20 AMIEL Teleconference with M. Neiburg and 
counsel for Williams re: discovery

B768 0.20 98.00

02/06/20 JMARA Call with A. Mielke re: status of 
discovery and meet and confer call

B768 0.10 52.50

02/06/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: 3/4 status 
conference

B768 0.10 67.50

02/06/20 MNEIB Email from J. Vandermark re: hit report 
(.1); review hit report (.2)

B768 0.30 202.50

02/06/20 MNEIB Prepare for and participate in discovery 
meet and confer

B768 0.40 270.00

02/06/20 TBUCH Email correspondence from M. Neiburg 
re: status conference

B768 0.10 59.50

02/07/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Krzystofik re: status of 
obtaining ESI

B768 0.10 49.00

02/07/20 AMIEL Send J. Marasco access to data site to 
obtain ESI status

B768 0.10 49.00

02/07/20 BOLIV Draft notice of status conference for 
Williams adversaiy for March 4, 2020

B768 0.30 88.50

02/07/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: e-discovery 
issues

B768 0.10 67.50

02/07/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke and B. Olivere re: 
status conference

B768 0.20 135.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Teleconference with J. Marasco and J. 
Krzysztofik re: collection of ESI (0.3); 
follow up with J. Marasco re: same (0.2)

B768 0.50 245.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: finalizing 
notice of status conference in Williams 
matter (0.1); confer with L. Murley's 
office re: same (0.1)

B768 0.20 98.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: Williams 
litigation discoveiy open items

B768 0.10 49.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Teleconference with M. Neiburg and J. 
Marasco re: response to Transco's request 
for discovery (0.5); review documents in 
preparation for same (0.5)

B768 1.00 490.00

02/10/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Fratticci and M. Neiburg 
re: discovery processing

B768 0.10 49.00

02/10/20 JMARA Call with M. Neiburg and A. Mielke re: B768 0.70 367.50
discoveiy responses (.6); confer with A. 
Mielke re: same (.1)
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Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/10/20 JMARA Call with J. Krzysztofik and A. Mielke re: 

discovery due diligence and outstanding 
items (.4); confer with A. Mielke re: same 
(.1); review and print discoveiy requests 
and draft responses (.2); review 
correspondence with E-Litigation team 
regarding document review (.1)

B768 0.80 420.00

02/10/20 KGUER Emails with M. Neiburg, J. Marasco, and 
A. Mielke re: doc review and discovery 
planning

B768 0.20 155.00

02/10/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke and M. Fratticci 
re: e-discovery issues

B768 0.30 202.50

02/10/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke and T. Buchanan 
re: discovery and related case status issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/10/20 SBEAC Review summary of interview with
Marcus Hood re: Williams litigation

B768 0.10 83.50

02/10/20 TBUCH Email correspondence with M. Neiburg 
re: litigation status and open issues

B768 0.10 59.50

02/11/20 AMIEL Review/revise discoveiy responses B768 1.30 637.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Emails with T. Buchanan re: discovery 
responses

B768 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Marasco re: discovery 
(0.3); emails re: same (0.1)

B768 0.40 196.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Fratticci re: electronically 
stored information for discovery

B768 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Confer with S. Cherian re: request for 
payment timing

B768 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Collins re: response to 
discovery

B768 0.10 49.00

02/11/20 BFELD Research (.1) and emails with J. Marasco 
(.1) re: responses to Transco discoveiy 
requests

B768 0.20 83.00

02/11/20 KGUER Emails with counsel re: prep meetings and 
recent rulings re: Williams.(.1); Review 
Williams opinion. (.3)

B768 0.40 310.00

02/11/20 MNEIB Analysis re: litigation strategy issues (.7); 
emails with T. Buchanan re: same (.1)

B768 0.80 540.00

02/11/20 MNEIB Emails with T. Buchanan re: subpoena 
and related issues

B768 0.10 67.50

02/11/20 SBEAC Emails with A. Mielke re: Transco 
interrogatories (.1); Review same (.2)

B768 0.30 250.50

02/11/20 TBUCH Prepare analysis of litigation strategy and 
open issues

B768 2.20 1,309.00

02/12/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti re: collection of 
ESI

B768 0.10 49.00
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02/12/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: status of 

discovery process
B768 0.10 49.00

02/12/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Cherian re: request for 
payment of fees

B768 0.10 49.00

02/12/20 AMIEL Revise protective order for discovery B768 1.80 882.00

02/12/20 MNEIB Emails with T. Buchanan re: case status 
and related issues

B768 0.10 67.50

02/12/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: discoveiy 
issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/12/20 TBUCH Prepare analysis of litigation strategy and 
open issues

B768 0.30 178.50

02/13/20 SBEAC Email with T. Buchanan re: Williams 
litigation overview and roadmap

B768 0.10 83.50

02/13/20 TBUCH Draft requests for production of 
documents

B768 3.20 1,904.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Revise search terms re discovery issues B768 0.40 196.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: ESI B768 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Teleconference with M. Neiburg, J. 
Marasco, and counsel for Defendants re: 
discovery search terms (0.3); follow 
up/M. Neiburg and J. Marasco re: same 
(0.1)

B768 0.40 196.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with counsel for defendants re:
ESI

B768 0.20 98.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti re: ESI B768 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg and T. Buchanan 
re: custodians

B768 0.10 49.00

02/14/20 JMARA Meet and confer call with M. Neiburg, A. 
Mielke and Williams' counsel re: e- 
discoveiy (.4); confer with T. Buchanan 
re: research assignment (.1)

B768 0.50 262.50

02/14/20 KGUER Emails with opposing counsel re: meet 
and confer and search terms

B768 0.10 77.50

02/14/20 MNEIB Emails with S. Hawkins and T. Buchanan 
re: litigation strategy issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/16/20 JMARA Review correspondence re: custodians for 
e-discovery

B768 0.10 52.50

02/16/20 KGUER Emails with opposing counsel re: B768 0.10 77.50
discovery meet and confer and search 
terms
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02/17/20 AMIEL Confer with J. Krzysztofik re: ESI B768 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Revise search terms (0.2); emails with 
opposing counsel re: same (0.1)

B768 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Emails with A. Ralph re: responses to 
discovery

B768 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti re: ESI collection 
(0.1); emails with J. Krzysztofik re: same 
(0.1)

B768 0.20 98.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Confer with M. Neiburg re: responses to 
discovery

B768 0.30 147.00

02/17/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Fratticci re: ESI 
processing

B768 0.10 49.00

02/17/20 JMARA Research re: litigation claim (.3) and B768 1.80 945.00
compose email to T. Buchanan re: same 
(.1); confer with T. Buchanan to discuss 
research (.2); further research re: same 
(1.2)

02/17/20 KGUER Review memo re: claims analysis and 
status

B768 0.40 310.00

02/17/20 KGUER Email with counsel re: meet and confer; 
Review discovery search terms

B768 0.20 155.00

02/17/20 KGUER Email with client re: witnesses and claims B768 0.10 77.50

02/17/20 KGUER Review second set of discovery B768 0.60 465.00

02/17/20 MNEIB Analysis re: e-discovery issues (.2); 
emails with A. Mielke re: same (.1)

B768 0.30 202.50

02/17/20 MNEIB Work on draft responses and objections to 
Transco's discovery requests (.6); emails 
with A. Mielke re: same (.1)

B768 0.70 472.50

02/18/20 AMIEL Confer with M. Neiburg re: discovery 
responses (0.1); review discovery 
responses in connection with same (0.1)

B768 0.20 98.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg and L. Murley 
re: discovery response deadline

B768 0.10 49.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Marasco and M. Fratticci 
re: ESI collection (0.1); confer with J. 
Marasco re: same (0.2)

B768 0.30 147.00

02/18/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: uploading 
ESI

B768 0.10 49.00
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02/18/20 JMARA Emails/confer with A. Mielke re: Welded 

ESI (.2); review prior correspondence, 
review OneDrive and emails/call with M. 
Fratticci re: same (.4); finalize research 
re: litigation claim and email T. Buchanan 
re: same (.3); confer with T. Buchanan re: 
additional research items (.2)

B768 1.10 577.50

02/18/20 KGUER Emails with T. Buchanan re: experts B768 0.20 155.00

02/18/20 KGUER Review subpoena to Federal Insurance 
Company

B768 0.20 155.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti re: collection of 
ESI

B768 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: memorandum 
of litigation summary

B768 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti and S. Hawkins 
re: meeting to discuss discoveiy responses

B768 0.10 49.00

02/19/20 JMARA Research issue re: damages B768 0.10 52.50

02/19/20 TBUCH Research and draft analysis of litigation 
strategy and open issues

B768 3.40 2,023.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Emails with F. Pometti re: collection of 
ESI (0.1); emails with M. Fratticci re: 
same (0.2)

B768 0.30 147.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Emails with A. Moran and M. Neiburg re: 
search terms for ESI

B768 0.20 98.00

02/20/20 AMIEL Meeting with K. Guerke, T. Buchanan, 
and J. Marasco re: discovery diligence

B768 0.80 392.00

02/20/20 JMARA Meeting with K. Guerke, T. Buchanan 
and A. Mielke re: litigation discovery 
status (.8); review correspondence with 
internal e-discovery team re: AlixPartners' 
ESI (.1); review correspondence re: 
search terms (.1)

B768 1.00 525.00

02/20/20 KGUER Emails with T. Buchanan re: research
memo

B768 0.10 77.50

02/20/20 KGUER Meeting with YCST team re: discovery 
and litigation planning

B768 0.80 620.00

02/20/20 KGUER Emails with opposing counsel re: 
discoveiy search terms

B768 0.10 77.50

02/20/20 KGUER Emails with YCST re: discovery scope B768 0.10 77.50

02/20/20 TBUCH Meet with K. Guerke, A. Mielke, and J. 
Marasco re: litigation strategy and open

B768 1.10 654.50

issues (.8); research related to same (.3)
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02/21/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Fratticci re: collection of 

ESI (0.3); emails with F. Pometti re: same 
(0.1)

B768 0.40 196.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Emails with K. Guerke re: discovery 
search terms

B768 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: collection 
of ESI

B768 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 AMIEL Emails with A. Moran re: search terms 
and hit report

B768 0.10 49.00

02/21/20 KGUER Teleconference with consulting expert B768 0.20 155.00

02/21/20 KGUER Review updated discovery to Transco B768 0.60 465.00

02/21/20 KGUER Emails with A. Mielke and M. Neiburg 
re: search terms

B768 0.10 77.50

02/21/20 KGUER Review updated claims analysis memo 
and pleadings

B768 0.90 697.50

02/21/20 KGUER Review updated discovery to Transco B768 0.60 465.00

02/21/20 TBUCH Research issues related to discovery re: 
Transco's claims

B768 0.90 535.50

02/24/20 AMIEL Review search hit report (0.2) and confer 
with M. Neiburg and M. Fratticci re: same 
(0.3)

B768 0.50 245.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: discovery B768 0.40 196.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Hawkins re: discoveiy B768 0.10 49.00

02/24/20 AMIEL Emails with J. Moan re: collection of ESI B768 0.10 49.00

02/24/20 BWALT Multiple communications with T. B768 1.60 488.00
Buchanan, draft notice of intent to serve 
subpoena for documents directed to 
Borusan Mannessmann Pipe, U.S., Inc. 
(.4); prepare subpoena (.6); finalize, file, 
and serve upon opposing counsel via 
email the notice of subpoena, and 
coordinate personal service of same (.6)

02/24/20 JMARA Review correspondence with M. Fratticci 
re: e-discovery results (.1); review 
correspondence re: discovery meeting (.1)

B768 0.20 105.00

02/24/20 KGUER Teleconference with T. Buchanan and 
consultant re: consulting services

B768 0.70 542.50

02/24/20 KGUER Emails with T. Buchanan re: consulting 
services

B768 0.10 77.50

Page Number 61

Case 18-12378-CSS    Doc 1265-2    Filed 03/11/20    Page 62 of 72



Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date:
Invoice Number:
Matter Number:

March 6, 2020
50013026

076850.1001

Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/24/20 MNEIB Analysis re: pleadings and discovery 

requests in preparation for revising draft 
objections and responses to Transco's first 
discoveiy requests to Welded

B768 1.60 1,080.00

02/24/20 MNEIB Emails with M. Fratticci, A. Mielke and
T. Buchanan re: e-discovery issues

B768 0.40 270.00

02/24/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke and T. Buchanan 
re: discovery and related issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/24/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery 
issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/24/20 MNEIB Review draft subpoena and second set of 
RFPs (.2); emails with T. Buchanan re: 
same(.l)

B768 0.30 202.50

02/24/20 MNEIB Emails with M. Hood, J. Krzysztofik, A. 
Mielke and T. Buchanan re: discovery 
issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/24/20 MNEIB Work on responses and objections to 
Transco’s first discovery requests to 
Welded

B768 1.40 945.00

02/24/20 TBUCH Research issues related to claims analysis 
(5.7); coordinate service of discovery (.5)

B768 6.20 3,689.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Collins re: discovery B768 0.10 49.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with E. Edwards re: discoveiy B768 0.10 49.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Further revise requests for production B768 1.40 686.00

02/25/20 AMIEL Emails with T. Buchanan re: discovery 
request

B768 0.20 98.00

02/25/20 BWALT Emails with T. Buchanan, prepare notice 
of service, serve second requests for 
production directed to Transco, and file 
notice of service

B768 0.60 183.00

02/25/20 BWALT Email from process server re: subpoena 
directed to Borusan Mannessmann Pipe, 
U.S. Inc.

B768 0.10 30.50

02/25/20 EEDWA Prepare for meeting re: Williams 
discovery issues and planning (.8); meet 
with A. Mielke and M. Neiburg re: same 
(.8); email to B. Olivere re: pleadings (.1)

B768 1.70 1,215.50

02/25/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery 
issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/25/20 MNEIB Analysis re: litigation strategy and related 
issues

B768 2.30 1,552.50
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Bate Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/25/20 MNEIB Work on responses and objections to 

Transco's first discovery requests to 
Welded

B768 2.70 1,822.50

02/25/20 MNEIB Emails and meeting with E. Edwards and 
A. Mielke re: e-discovery issues

B768 0.50 337.50

02/25/20 MNEIB Emails with T. Buchanan re: discovery 
issues

B768 0.10 67.50

02/25/20 TBUCH Coordinate service of discovery B768 0.30 178.50

02/26/20 AMIEL Teleconference with counsel for surety re: 
response to discovery (0.2); follow up 
with M. Neiburg re: same (0.2)

B768 0.40 196.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Teleconference with M. Neiburg, S. 
Hawkins, and F. Pometti re: discoveiy 
responses

B768 0.40 196.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Draft summary of issues to be discussed 
on call re: discovery

B768 0.40 196.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Revise document review memo B768 0.50 245.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Fratticci re: collection of 
ESI

B768 0.10 49.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with counsel for Transco re: 
discovery deadlines

B768 0.10 49.00

02/26/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: meeting to 
discuss discovery issues

B768 0.10 49.00

02/26/20 EEDWA Review all material pleadings on
Williams litigation re: discovery issues 
(2.9); review and comment draft 
document review memo (1.3); review 
draft responses to Williams discovery 
requests (1.1); telephone call with M. 
Neiburg, T. Buchanan, S. Hawkins, F. 
Pometti and J. Krzsztofik (.8)

B768 6.10 4,361.50

02/26/20 JMARA Review correspondence re: responses to 
discoveiy requests (.1); call with 
AlixPartners and Welded re: discovery 
(.8); confer with M. Neiburg and T. 
Buchanan re: expert discovery and 
document review (.1); confer with A. 
Mielke re: timing for document review

B768 1.10 577.50

(•1)
02/26/20 KGUER Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery B768

responses
0.10 77.50

02/26/20 MNEIB Work on responses and objections to B768
Transco's first discovery requests to
Welded (1.6); email to F. Pometti and S.
Hawkins re: same (.1)

1.70 1,147.50
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Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/26/20 MNEIB Conference call with E. Edwards, T. 

Buchanan, A. Mielke and clients re: 
discovery issues

B768 0.80 540.00

02/26/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke re: document 
collection issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/26/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke and M. Fratticci 
re: e-discovery issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/26/20 MNEIB Emails and call with A. Mielke and M. 
Collins re: discovery issues

B768 0.40 270.00

02/26/20 MNEIB Emails with L. Murley re: discovery 
responses

B768 0.10 67.50

02/26/20 MNEIB Analysis re: e-discovery and related 
issues

B768 0.80 540.00

02/26/20 TBUCH Teleconference with S. Hawkins, F. 
Pometti, M. Hood, J. Krzysztofik, M. 
Neiburg, A. Mielke, and J. Marasco re: 
open issues related to discoveiy (.8); 
confer with M. Neiburg and J. Marasco 
re: same (.2); research related to same (.6)

B768 1.60 952.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Analyze search report B768 0.30 147.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Meeting with M. Milana, K. Guerke, E. 
Edwards, J. Marasco, and T. Buchanan re: 
discovery

B768 1.20 588.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Fratticci and M. Neiburg 
re: search terms (0.1); confer with M. 
Fratticci re: same (0.2)

B768 0.30 147.00

02/27/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Neiburg re: document 
review logistics

B768 0.10 49.00

02/27/20 BOLIV Prepare binder for E. Edwards re all 
discovery re Williams

B768 1.00 295.00

02/27/20 BOLIV File proof of service of subpoena re 
Borusan Mannessmann Pipe US Inc. re 
Williams

B768 0.10 29.50

02/27/20 EEDWA Review search terms and hit report (.3); 
meet with M. Fratticci re: same (.1); meet 
with litigation team re: search terms and 
document review memo (1.0)

B768 1.40 1,001.00

02/27/20 JMARA Review correspondence between A.
Mielke and M. Fratticci re: e-discovery 
initial results (.1); litigation/discovery 
meeting with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, E. 
Edwards, T. Buchanan, A. Mielke and M. 
Milana (1.2)

B768 1.30 682.50

02/27/20 KGUER Review pleadings and briefing; draft 
issues and discoveiy outline

B768 1.30 1,007.50
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02/27/20 KGUER Meeting with YCST team re: discovery, 
doc review and litigation issues

B768 1.10 852.50

02/27/20 KGUER Email with YCST team re: document 
review

B768 0.10 77.50

02/27/20 KGUER Review docket and project documents B768 0.70 542.50

02/27/20 KGUER Emails with M. Neiburg re: responses to 
Transco discovery

B768 0.10 77.50

02/27/20 KGUER Review objections and responses to 
Transco’s discovery

B768 0.60 465.00

02/27/20 KGUER Review consultant information B768 0.30 232.50

02/27/20 KGUER Emails with S. Beach re: experts B768 0.10 77.50

02/27/20 MNEIB Email to YCST team re: document review 
project

B768 0.10 67.50

02/27/20 MNEIB Emails with M. Fratticci and A. Mielke 
re: e-discoveiy issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/27/20 MNEIB Analysis re: e-discovery search 
parameters

B768 0.60 405.00

02/27/20 MNEIB Emails with K. Guerke re: expert 
discovery issues

B768 0.10 67.50

02/27/20 TBUCH Meet with A. Mielke, E. Edwards, K. 
Guerke, M. Milana, M. Neiburg, and J. 
Marasco re: strategy and open issues 
related to discovery

B768 1.10 654.50

02/27/20 TPAKR Emails with YCST re: Williams 
document review

B768 0.10 45.00

02/28/20 AM I EL Meeting with E. Edwards and M. Neiburg 
re: discovery

B768 0.60 294.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Emails with E. Edwards and J.
Krzysztofik re: obtaining ESI

B768 0.10 49.00

02/28/20 AMIEL Draft verification for discovery responses B768 0.10 49.00

02/28/20 EEDWA Meet with K. Guerke re: expert and 
discovery issues (.3); emails with K. 
Guerke, M. Neiburg, and A. Mielke re: 
same (.1); meet with A. Mielke and M. 
Neiburg re: discovery and ESI issues (.5)

B768 0.90 643.50

02/28/20 KGUER Emails with M. Neiburg and T. Buchanan 
re: experts and claims

B768 0.20 155.00

02/28/20 KGUER Emails with S. Beach experts B768 0.20 155.00

02/28/20 KGUER Review claims analysis memo and project 
document

B768 2.30 1,782.50
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Date Initials Description Task Hours Amount
02/28/20 KGUER Meeting with E. Edwards re: consultants 

and doc production
B768 0.20 155.00

02/28/20 KGUER Teleconference with consultant B768 0.30 232.50

02/28/20 MNEIB Analysis re: litigation strategy B768 1.30 877.50

02/28/20 MNEIB Emails with S. Hawkins and F. Pometti 
re: discoveiy responses

B768 0.20 135.00

02/28/20 MNEIB Emails with A. Mielke and A. Moran re: 
e-discoveiy issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/28/20 MNEIB Emails and conference with E. Edwards 
and A. Mielke re: e-discoveiy issues

B768 0.50 337.50

02/28/20 MNEIB Emails with K. Guerke re: discoveiy 
issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/28/20 MNEIB Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards 
re: discovery and claim issues

B768 0.20 135.00

02/28/20 TBUCH Research open issues related to discovery B768 0.30 178.50

02/29/20 AMIEL Emails with S. Beach and M. Neiburg re: 
litigation strategy

B768 0.10 49.00

02/29/20 AMIEL Emails with M. Fratticci re: collection of 
ESI

B768 0.10 49.00

02/29/20 KGUER Multiple emails with YCST team re: 
litigation issues

B768 0.20 155.00

02/29/20 KGUER Review contract and project documents; 
draft issues outline

B768 2.60 2,015.00

02/29/20 TBUCH Email correspondence with S. Beach and 
M. Neiburg re: open issues related to

B768 0.20 119.00

discoveiy

Total 694.30 $431,008.50
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Timekeeper Summary

Initials Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate
AMIEL Allison S. Mielke Associate 80.50 490.00
BOLIV Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 53.80 295.00
BFELD Betsy L. Feldman Associate 17.60 415.00
BWALT Brenda Walters Paralegal 22.80 305.00
DLASK Debbie Laskin Paralegal 1.90 305.00
EEDWA Erin D. Edwards Partner 68.30 715.00
JMARA Jaclyn Marasco Associate 17.00 525.00
JMULV Joseph M. Mulvihill Associate 0.70 525.00
KENOS Kenneth J. Enos Partner 1.70 700.00
KGUER Kevin A. Guerke Partner 112.20 775.00
KGUER Kevin A. Guerke Partner 0.70 725.00
MLUNN Matthew B. Lunn Partner 24.40 795.00
MMILA Matthew Milana Associate 1.20 400.00
MNEIB Michael S. Neiburg Partner 25.10 675.00
MFRAT Monica Fratticci Paralegal 3.60 175.00
RFPOP Robert F. Poppiti Partner 3.20 685.00
RHART Ryan D. Hart Associate 1.30 415.00
SBEAC Sean M. Beach Partner 132.40 835.00
TPAKR Tara C. Pakrouh Associate 79.80 450.00
TBUCH Travis G. Buchanan Associate 46.10 595.00

Total 694.30

Amount
39,445.00
15,871.00
7,304.00
6,954.00

579.50
48.834.50 

8,925.00
367.50 

1,190.00
86,955.00

507.50 
19,398.00

480.00
16.942.50 

630.00
2,192.00

539.50 
110,554.00
35,910.00
27.429.50

$431,008.50
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Task Summary

Task Code:B001 Case Administration

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Kevin A. Guerke Partner 0.30 775.00 232.50
Matthew B. Lunn Partner 0.20 795.00 159.00
Sean M. Beach Partner 0.10 835.00 83.50
Allison S. Mielke Associate 1.80 490.00 882.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 2.50 415.00 1,037.50
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 8.10 295.00 2,389.50

Total 13.00 4,784.00

Task Code:B002 Court Hearings

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Sean M. Beach Partner 6.40 835.00 5,344.00
Allison S. Mielke Associate 9.20 490.00 4,508.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 0.20 415.00 83.00
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 3.40 295.00 1,003.00

Total 19.20 10,938.00

Task Code:B003 Cash Collateral/DEP Financing

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Allison S. Mielke Associate 0.10 490.00 49.00

Total 0.10 49.00

Task Code:B004 Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Robert F. Poppiti Partner 0.20 685.00 137.00
Allison S. Mielke Associate 0.10 490.00 49.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 0.70 415.00 290.50
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 0.30 295.00 88.50

Total 1.30 565.00

Task Code:B005 Lease/Executorv Contract Issues

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Sean M. Beach Partner 0.80 835.00 668.00

Total 0.80 668.00

Task Code:B006 Use, Sale or Lease of Property 1363 issues!

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Matthew B. Lunn Partner 0.40 795.00 318.00
Sean M. Beach Partner 46.40 835.00 38,744.00
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Task Code:B006 Use, Sale or Lease of Property (363 issues)

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Allison S. Mielke Associate 3.50 490.00 1,715.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 0.20 415.00 83.00
Tara C. Pakrouh Associate 0.30 450.00 135.00
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 0.70 295.00 206.50

Total 51.50 41,201.50

Task Code:B007 Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Kenneth J. Enos Partner 1.70 700.00 1,190.00
Matthew B. Lunn Partner 0.40 795.00 318.00
Robert F. Poppiti Partner 0.50 685.00 342.50
Sean M. Beach Partner 35.00 835.00 29,225.00
Allison S. Mielke Associate 7.40 490.00 3,626.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 7.50 415.00 3,112.50
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 0.40 295.00 118.00

Total 52.90 37,932.00

Task Code:B008 Meetings

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Matthew B. Lunn Partner 0.70 795.00 556.50
Sean M. Beach Partner 2.10 835.00 1,753.50
Allison S. Mielke Associate 2.50 490.00 1,225.00

Total 5.30 3,535.00

Task Code:B011 Other Adversary Proceedings

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Erin D. Edwards Partner 58.20 715.00 41,613.00
Kevin A. Guerke Partner 0.70 725.00 507.50
Kevin A. Guerke Partner 94.70 775.00 73,392.50
Matthew B. Lunn Partner 0.40 795.00 318.00
Michael S. Neiburg Partner 1.90 675.00 1,282.50
Sean M. Beach Partner 12.40 835.00 10,354.00
Allison S. Mielke Associate 14.20 490.00 6,958.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 0.10 415.00 41.50
Jaclyn Marasco Associate 8.20 525.00 4,305.00
Matthew Milana Associate 1.20 400.00 480.00
Tara C. Pakrouh Associate 75.70 450.00 34,065.00
Travis G. Buchanan Associate 19.60 595.00 11,662.00
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 28.40 295.00 8,378.00
Brenda Walters Paralegal 20.50 305.00 6,252.50
Debbie Laskin Paralegal 1.90 305.00 579.50
Monica Fratticci Paralegal 3.60 175.00 630.00

Total 341.70 200,819.00
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Task Code:B012 Plan and Disclosure Statement

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Matthew B. Lunn Partner 22.30 795.00 17,728.50
Robert F. Poppiti Partner 0.80 685.00 548.00
Sean M. Beach Partner 21.00 835.00 17,535.00
Allison S. Mielke Associate 12.60 490.00 6,174.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 6.20 415.00 2,573.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill Associate 0.70 525.00 367.50
Ryan D. Hart Associate 1.30 415.00 539.50
Tara C. Pakrouh Associate 3.20 450.00 1,440.00
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 0.20 295.00 59.00

Total 68.30 46,964.50

Task Code:B014 General Corporate Matters

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Sean M. Beach Partner 1.00 835.00 835.00
Allison S. Mielke Associate 1.50 490.00 735.00

Total 2.50 1,570.00

Task Code:B015 Employee Matters

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Robert F. Poppiti Partner 0.40 685.00 274.00
A llison S. Mielke Associate 1.30 490.00 637.00

Total 1.70 911.00

Task Code:B017 Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Robert F. Poppiti Partner 0.70 685.00 479.50
Sean M. Beach Partner 0.10 835.00 83.50
Allison S. Mielke Associate 3.00 490.00 1,470.00
Tara C. Pakrouh Associate 0.50 450.00 225.00
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 2.80 295.00 826.00

Total 7.10 3,084.00

Task Code:B018 Fee Application Preparation

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Robert F. Poppiti Partner 0.60 685.00 411.00
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 8.10 295.00 2,389.50

Total 8.70 2,800.50

Task Code:B019 Travel
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Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Sean M. Beach Partner 6.60 835.00 5,511.00

Total 6.60 5,511.00

Task Code:B768 Williams Litigation

Name Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Erin D. Edwards Partner 10.10 715.00 7,221.50
Kevin A. Guerke Partner 17.20 775.00 13,330.00
Michael S. Neiburg Partner 23.20 675.00 15,660.00
Sean M. Beach Partner 0.50 835.00 417.50
Allison S. Mielke Associate 23.30 490.00 11,417.00
Betsy L. Feldman Associate 0.20 415.00 83.00
Jaclyn Marasco Associate 8.80 525.00 4,620.00
Tara C. Pakrouh Associate 0.10 450.00 45.00
Travis G. Buchanan Associate 26.50 595.00 15,767.50
Beth A. Olivere Paralegal 1.40 295.00 413.00
Brenda Walters Paralegal 2.30 305.00 701.50

Total 113.60 69,676.00
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Cost Detail

Date Description Ouantitv Amount
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search LOO 0.10
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00 0.10
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00 0.10
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/02/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30
01/07/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/08/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/08/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/09/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30
01/10/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30
01/13/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 

Soundpath Confer Services, LLC
1.00 1.36

01/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30
01/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/14/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 

Soundpath Confer Services, LLC
1.00 1.10

01/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/16/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 

Soundpath Confer Services, LLC
1.00 12.04

01/16/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 4.00 0.40
01/16/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/16/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00 0.10
01/16/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00 0.10
01/17/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20
01/17/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 

Soundpath Confer Services, LLC
1.00 0.61

01/22/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 2.23

01/24/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 2.54

01/24/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 5.19

01/24/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30
01/24/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00 0.80
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Date Description Ouantitv Amount

01/29/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20

01/29/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30

01/29/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 10.00 1.00

01/29/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 12.11

01/29/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20

01/29/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00 0.10

01/29/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00 0.30

01/30/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 5.49

01/30/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20

01/31/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 4.00 0.40

01/31/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20

01/31/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 1.85

01/31/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20

01/31/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00 0.10

01/31/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00 0.20

01/31/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00 0.10

02/03/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00

02/03/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 18.36

02/03/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50

02/03/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/03/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/03/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30
02/03/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00

02/03/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/04/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 749.00 74.90
02/04/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/04/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/04/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/04/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 34.00 3.40
02/04/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 767.00 76.70
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 40.00 4.00
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 32.00 3.20
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 32.00 3.20
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
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02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 59.00 5.90
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/05/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 30.00 3.00
02/06/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 8.00 6.40
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 50.00 5.00
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 29.00 2.90
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/06/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 51.00 5.10
02/07/20 Veritext - Deposition/Transcript Cost of Transcript and 

related costs for Deposition of Scott Gray on January 10,
2020

1.00 1,342.68

02/07/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee:
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 14.53

02/07/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 85.00 8.50
02/07/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 18.00 1.80
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/10/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee:

Soundpath Confer Services, LLC
1.00 1.14

02/10/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee:
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 0.30

02/10/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee:
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 1.82

02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 13.00 1.30
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 48.00 4.80
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 18.00 1.80
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50
02/10/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
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02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1.00 0.10
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 18.00 1.80
02/11/20 Parcels, Inc. - 863029 Blowback x 2 from ShareFile d/s b/w 

Separate by slip sheets Insert into binders with cover
1.00 656.34

02/11/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee:
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 1.59

02/11/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee:
Soundpath Confer Services, LLC

1.00 6.55

02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 18.00 1.80
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 41.00 4.10
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50
02/11/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 45.00 4.50
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 24.00 2.40
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 24.00 2.40
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5,580.00 558.00
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 24.00 2.40
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02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 69.00 6.90
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 46.00 4.60
02/12/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 9.00 7.20
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 46.00 4.60
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/12/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 75.00 7.50
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 151.00 15.10
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 47.00 4.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 103.00 10.30
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 44.00 4.40
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 26.00 2.60
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
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02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 50.00 5.00
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1,494.00 149.40
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 30.00 3.00
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 50.00 5.00
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 17.00 1.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 47.00 4.70
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 44.00 4.40
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 20.00 2.00
02/13/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/14/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 35.00 28.00
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 48.00 4.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 48.00 4.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 18.00 1.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 33.00 3.30
02/14/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 36.00 28.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Rodney Grille, Inc. - Working Meals Breakfast for 6 from 

Rodney Grille on 2/6 for meeting
1.00 74.82

02/14/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 2.00 0.20
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10
02/14/20 Veritext - Deposition/Transcript Transcript and related cost 

for deposition of Gary Wieland on January 27, 2020
1.00 1,839.40

02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 48.00 4.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 31.00 3.10
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 39.00 3.90
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02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/14/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 18.00 1.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 12.00 1.20
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/14/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 86.00 8.60
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 31.00 3.10
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 50.00 5.00
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 18.00 1.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 48.00 4.80
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 33.00 3.30
02/14/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 25.00 2.50
02/14/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 12.00 1.20
02/17/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/17/20 Cosi Wilmington - Working Meals Lunch during 1.27.2020 

Welded deposition
1.00 111.00

02/17/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/17/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10
02/17/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/18/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/18/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/18/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/18/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/18/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/19/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/19/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50
02/20/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10
02/20/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90
02/20/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 50.00 5.00
02/20/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10
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02/20/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 10.00 8.00

02/20/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 5.00 4.00

02/20/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10

02/21/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 24.00 2.40

02/21/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 34.00 3.40

02/21/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 154.00 15.40

02/24/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 2.00 0.20

02/24/20 Cardmember Service - Docket Retrieval / Search Cost of 
monitoring state court actions

1.00 57.69

02/24/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 47.00 37.60

02/24/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00

02/24/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60

02/24/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 18.00 1.80

02/26/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 2.00 0.20

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 1,523.00 152.30

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 48.00 4.80

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 28.00 2.80

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 7.00 0.70

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 15.00 1.50

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 16.00 1.60

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 21.00 2.10

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10

02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 48.00 4.80

02/26/20 Color Photocopy Charges Duplication Color 7.00 5.60
02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10
02/26/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 27.00 2.70

02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 9.00 0.90
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 8.00 0.80
02/27/20 Scanning Charges SCAN 9.00 0.90
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 5.00 0.50
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 41.00 4.10
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
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02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 49.00 4.90
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 11.00 1.10
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/27/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 14.00 1.40
02/28/20 Sean Beach - Working Meals S. Beach Lunch with S.

Hawkins, F. Pometti, K. Guerke, and E. Edwards on January
23, 2020

1.00 145.50

02/28/20 Sean Beach - Working Meals S. Beach Lunch with F. Pometti 
on February 11, 2020

1.00 39.00

02/28/20 Sean Beach - Hotel/Lodging S. Beach one night stay at The 
Worthington Renaissance Hotel in TX for Welded Meetings

1.00 270.79

02/28/20 Sean Beach - Working Meals S. Beach Dinner with K.
Guerke, E. Edwards, and T. Pakrouh on February 15, 2020 re: 
Prime settlement

1.00 119.00

02/28/20 Sean Beach - Hotel/Lodging S. Beach cost of Conference 
room reservation at Doubletree hotel on February, 20, 2020

1.00 442.75

02/28/20 Sean Beach - Car/Bus/Subway Travel S. Beach Car service 
to/from PHL airport on February 20 and 21 for TX trip

1.00 204.00

02/28/20 Sean Beach - Working Meals S. Beach Lunch with T.
Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: Williams litigation on Februaiy
14,2020

1.00 116.50

02/28/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 6.00 0.60
02/28/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00
02/28/20 Photocopy Charges Duplication BW 10.00 1.00

Total $7,116.48
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Cost Summary

Description Amount
AP Outside Duplication Svcs 656.34
Car/Bus/Subway Travel 204.00
Deposition/Transcript 3,182.08
Docket Retrieval / Search 66.99
Hotel/Lodging 713.54
Reproduction Charges 1,598.90
Teleconference / Video Conference 88.81
Working Meals 605.82

Total $7,116.48
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