### IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

	<u> </u>
In re:	) Chapter 11
WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,1	) Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)
Debtors.	) (Jointly Administered)
	) ) Hearing Date: ) TBD
	Objection Deadline: September 10, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SUMMARY OF TWENTY-FIRST MONTHLY AND FINAL APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE MONTHLY PERIOD FROM JULY 1, 2020 THROUGH JULY 31, 2020 AND THE FINAL PERIOD FROM **OCTOBER 22, 2018 THROUGH JULY 31, 2020** 

Name of applicant: Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP

Debtors and Debtors in Possession Authorized to provide professional services to:

Effective date of retention: October 22, 2018

Monthly period for which compensation and

reimbursement is sought:

July 1, 2020 through July 31, 2020

Monthly amount of compensation sought as

actual, reasonable and necessary: \$436,897.00

Monthly amount of expense reimbursement sought

as actual, reasonable and necessary: \$3,540.68

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.



### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575 Filed 08/27/20 Page 2 of 24

Final period for which compensation and October 22, 2018 through and including

reimbursement is sought: July 31, 2020

Amount of final compensation sought as actual, \$10,677,520.50 reasonable and necessary:

Amount of final expense reimbursement sought as \$174,643.19

actual, reasonable and necessary:

This is an: X monthly X final application

This monthly application includes 2.50 hours with a value of \$953.50 incurred in connection with the preparation of Fee Applications.

## **Prior applications**:

		Requested		Appr	roved
Date Filed; Docket No.	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses
12/20/18 D.I. 347	10/22/18 - 11/30/18	\$629,570.50	\$5,815.10	\$629,570.50	\$5,815.10
1/15/19 D.I. 420	12/1/18 - 12/31/18	\$443,598.00	\$14,545.93	\$443,598.00	\$14,545.93
2/21/19 D.I. 513	1/1/19 – 1/31/19	\$530,368.50	\$13,191.07	\$530,368.50	\$13,191.07
3/18/16 D.I. 566	2/1/19 – 2/28/19	\$493,838.50	\$6,472.15	\$493,838.50	\$6,472.15
4/18/19 D.I. 656	3/1/19 – 3/31/19	\$477,160.50	\$1,962.33	\$471,973.501	\$1,962.33
5/23/19 D.I. 746	4/1/19 – 4/30/19	\$486,070.00	\$4,101.19	\$486,070.00	\$4,101.19
6/17/19 D.I. 799	5/1/19 - 5/31/19	\$381,814.50	\$3,315.52	\$381,814.50	\$3,315.52
7/23/19 D.I. 885	6/1/19 - 6/30/19	\$511,859.00	\$10,592.72	\$511,859.00	\$10,592.72
8/21/19 D.I. 957	7/1/19 – 7/31/19	\$459,922.50	\$8,298.95	\$459,922.50	\$8,298.95
9/17/19 D.I. 1004	8/1/19 - 8/31/19	\$568,448.00	\$5,563.21	\$568,448.00	\$5,563.21
10/21/19 D.I. 1061	9/1/19 – 9/30/19	\$580,684.00	\$12,216.57	\$580,684.00	\$12,216.57
11/22/19 D.I. 1120	10/1/19 - 10/31/19	\$560,539.50	\$11,934.73	\$560,539.50	\$11,934.73
12/30/19 D.I. 1171	11/1/19 – 11/31/19	\$483,150.00	\$20,283.17	\$483,150.00	\$20,283.17
1/21/20 D.I. 1191	12/1/19 – 12/31/19	\$395,395.50	\$19,816.70	\$395,395.50	\$19,816.70
2/14/20 D.I. 1226	1/1/20 - 1/31/20	\$525,886.00	\$10,148.02	\$525,886.00	\$10,148.02
3/11/20 D.I. 1265	2/1/20 - 2/29/20	\$431,008.50	\$7,116.48	\$431,008.50	\$7,116.48
4/13/20 D.I. 1316	3/1/20 - 3/31/20	\$596,291.50	\$12,068.76	\$596,291.50	\$12,068.76
5/15/20 D.I. 1387	4/1/20 - 4/30/20	\$565,357.50	\$795.04	\$565,357.50	\$795.04
6/26/20 D.I. 1512	5/1/20 - 5/31/20	\$512,018.50	\$2,275.94	\$512,018.50	\$2,275.94
7/15/20 D.I. 1532	6/1/20 - 6/30/20	\$612,829.50	\$588.93	\$612,829.50	\$588.93
Total		\$10,245,810.50	\$171,102.51	10,240,623.50	\$171,102.51

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> This amount includes a reduction of \$5,187.00 from the second interim fee order [see D.I. 785] as agreed to between Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP and the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware.

## MONTHLY COMPENSATION BY INDIVIDUAL

Name of Professional Person	Position of the Applicant, Number of Years in that Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate (including changes)	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
Sean M. Beach	Partner since 2009. Joined firm as an associate in 2000. Member of DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar since 2007.	\$835.00	35.30	\$29,475.50
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner since 2010. Joined firm as an associate in 2001. Member of DE Bar since 2001 and NY Bar since 2009.	\$795.00	3.40	\$2,703.00
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner since 2019. Joined firm in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2001	\$775.00	77.70	\$60,217.50
James L. Higgins	Partner since 2018. Joined firm as an associate in 2007. Member of DE Bar since 2007.	\$725.00	17.80	\$12,905.00
Erin D. Edwards	Partner since 2014. Joined firm as an associate in 2003. Member of DE Bar since 2003.	\$715.00	40.00	\$28,600.00
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr.	Partner since 2018. Joined firm as associate in 2007. Member of DE Bar since 2007. Member of NY Bar since 2015.	\$685.00	4.20	\$2,877.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Counsel since 2019. Joined firm as an associate in 2008. Member of DE Bar since 2009.	\$675.00	84.10	\$56,767.50
Timothy J. Snyder	Partner since 1991. Joined firm as an associate in 1985. Member of DE Bar since 1985.	\$575.00	7.00	\$4,025.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Joined firm as an associate in 2011. Member of DE Bar since 2011.	\$595.00	86.10	\$51,229.50
Jaclyn C. Marasco	Joined the firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2015.	\$525.00	35.60	\$18,690.00
Lauren Dunkle Fortunato	Joined the firm as an associate in 2018. Member of DE Bar since 2014.	\$525.00	99.50	\$52,237.50
Allison S. Mielke	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2013.	\$490.00	47.60	\$23,324.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2015.	\$450.00	9.90	\$4,455.00

Blended Rate:		\$553.03		
Grand Total:		790.00	\$436,897.00	
Anupa Smit	Paralegal	\$295.00	11.70	\$3,451.50
Beth Olivere	Paralegal	\$295.00	21.20	\$6,254.00
Joel W. Glazer	Associate	\$325.00	15.90	\$5,167.50
Joseph F. Ecker	Associate	\$375.00	12.40	\$4,650.00
Steven W. Lee	Joined firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar Since 2019.	\$375.00	21.70	\$8,137.50
Michael E. Neminski	Joined firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2020.	\$375.00	32.10	\$12,037.50
Malak S. Doss	Joined firm as an associate in 2019. Member of the NY Bar since 2020.	\$375.00	67.20	\$25,200.00
Matthew P. Milana	Joined firm as an associate in 2019. Member of DE Bar since 2019.	\$400.00	16.10	\$6,440.00
Caleb G. Johnson	Joined firm as an associate in 2018. Member of DE Bar since 2018.	\$415.00	37.20	\$15,438.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Joined firm as an associate in 2017. Member of DE Bar since 2017 and NY Bar since 2019.	\$415.00	6.30	\$2,614.50

## MONTHLY COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category	Total Hours	<b>Total Fees</b>
Case Administration (B001)	12.00	\$5,475.00
Court Hearings (B002)	0.90	\$441.00
Cash Collateral/DIP Financing (B003)	0.90	\$717.00
Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports (B004)	1.10	\$467.00
Use, Sale or Lease Property (363 Issues) (B006)	7.80	\$6,072.00
Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions (B007)	21.60	\$14,431.00
Meetings (B008)	12.60	\$9,033.00
Other Adversary Proceedings (B011)	50.70	\$29,158.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement (B012)	23.70	\$12,949.50
Creditor Inquiries (B013)	0.10	\$83.50
General Corporate Matters (B014)	0.70	\$446.50
Employee Matters (B015)	8.20	\$4,907.00
Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues (B017)	6.50	\$2,944.50
Fee Application Preparation (B018)	14.50	\$5,790.50
Williams Litigation (B768)	628.70	\$343,981.00
TOTALS	790.00	\$436,897.00

## MONTHLY EXPENSE SUMMARY

Expenses Category (Examples)	<b>Total Expenses</b>
Computerized Legal Research	\$2,303.68
Delivery/Courier	\$7.50
Deposition Transcript	\$310.40
Docket Retrieval/Search	\$192.75
Federal Express	\$23.14
Reproduction Charges	\$67.60
Teleconference/Video Conference	\$635.61
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$3,540.68

SUMMARY OF FINAL FEE	SUMMARY OF FINAL FEE APPLICATION					
Name of applicant	Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP					
Name of client	Debtors					
Time period covered by final application	October 22, 2018 through July 31, 2020					
Total compensation sought during the application period	\$10,677,520.50					
Total expenses sought during the application period	\$174,643.19					
Petition date	October 22, 2018					
Retention date	October 22, 2018					
Date of order approving employment	November 15, 2018					
Total compensation approved by interim order to date	\$10,240,623.50					
Total expenses approved by interim order to date	\$171,102.21					
Total allowed compensation paid to date	\$10,240,623.50					
Total allowed expenses paid to date	\$170,555.40					
Blended rate in the final application for all attorneys	\$549.17					
Blended rate in the final application for all timekeepers	\$534.01					
Compensation sought in the final application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$0.00					
Expenses sought in the final application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$0.00					
Number of professionals included in the final application	78					
If applicable, number of professionals in the final application not included in staffing plan approved by client	65					
If applicable, difference between fees and expenses budgeted and sought during the final application Period	Amt. Budgeted: \$9,986,000.00 Amt. Sought: \$10,677,520.50 Difference: \$691,520.50					
Number of professionals billing fewer than 15 hours to the case during the final application period	30					
Are any rates higher than those approved or disclosed at retention?	Yes <sup>1</sup>					

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> As disclosed in its retention application, Young Conway annually reviews and adjusts its rates on January 1<sup>st</sup> of each year.

### FINAL COMPENSATION BY INDIVIDUAL

Name	Title	Department	Date of First Admission	Fees Billed in the Final Application Period	Hours Billed in the Final Application Period	Hourly Rate Billed in the Final Application Period
John T. Dorsey	Partner	Bankruptcy	1991	\$55,047.00	61.80	\$875.00 \$935.00
Craig D. Grear	Partner	Business and Tax	1996	\$8,022.50	8.10	\$975.00 \$1,025.00
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	Bankruptcy	1996	\$37,378.50	44.10	\$845.00 \$905.00
M. Blake Cleary	Partner	Bankruptcy	1997	\$19,457.00	23.80	\$815.00 \$890.00
John J. Paschetto	Partner	Business and Tax	1998	\$20,400.00	24.00	\$850.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	Bankruptcy	2001	\$2,209,642.50	2806.70	\$715.00 \$785.00 \$835.00
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	Bankruptcy	2001	\$589,853.00	783.60	\$675.00 \$745.00 \$795.00
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	Bankruptcy	2001	\$788,040.00	1044.40	\$725.00 \$775.00
Vincent C. Thomas	Partner	Corporate	2013	\$8,707.50	13.10	\$650.00 \$675.00 \$725.00
James L. Higgins	Partner	Commercial Litigation	2007	\$12,905.00	17.80	\$725.00
Timothy J. Houseal	Partner	Complex and Special Litigation	1990	\$183.00	0.30	\$610.00
Anthony G. Flynn	Partner	Complex and Special Litigation	1977	\$2,820.00	4.70	\$600.00
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	Bankruptcy	2003	\$807,490.50	1196.70	\$595.00 \$655.00 \$715.00
Kenneth J. Enos	Partner	Bankruptcy	2004	\$83,377.00	127.80	\$645.00 \$700.00
Scott A. Holt	Partner	Employment Law	1995	\$4,105.50	6.90	\$595.00
Robert F. Poppiti, Jr.	Partner	Bankruptcy	2007	\$862,255.00	1375.00	\$565.00 \$625.00 \$685.00
Daniel P. Johnson	Partner	Business and Tax	1988	\$11,067.00	21.70	\$530.00

Jaime L. Chapman	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2006	\$2,160.00	3.60	\$600.00
Donald J. Bowman	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2003	\$14,916.00	26.40	\$565.00
William E. Gamgort	Counsel	Employment Law	2008	\$6,080.00	12.80	\$475.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	Bankruptcy	2009	\$579,045.00	926.60	\$555.00 \$600.00 \$675.00
Timothy J. Snyder	Partner	Business Planning and Tax	1985	\$35,910.00	64.70	\$525.00 \$550.00 \$575.00
Brent C. Shaffer	Partner	Commercial Real Estate	1995	\$2,601.00	5.10	\$510.00
John C. Kuffel	Partner	Commercial Real Estate	2004	\$1,428.00	2.80	\$510.00
Justin H. Rucki	Associate	Bankruptcy	2009	\$199,969.00	377.30	\$530.00
Justin P. Duda	Counsel	Business Planning	2010	\$3,263.50	6.70	\$475.00 \$545.00 \$600.00
Lauren M. Russell	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2009	\$135.00	0.30	\$460.00
Curtis J. Crowther	Special Counsel	Bankruptcy	1994	\$3,727.50	7.10	\$525.00
Joseph M. Mulvihill	Associate	Bankruptcy	2015	\$98,052.00	209.20	\$460.00
Ian J. Bambrick	Associate	Bankruptcy	2010	\$1,709.00	3.10	\$545.00 \$610.00
Allurie R. Kephart	Associate	Business Planning	2012	\$3,404.00	7.40	\$460.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	Bankruptcy	2011	\$476,525.50	860.10	\$460.00 \$530.00 \$595.00
Pilar G. Kraman	Associate	Business and Tax	2008	\$265.00	0.50	\$530.00
Lauren Dunkle Fortunato	Associate	Corporate	2014	\$141,487.50	269.50	\$525.00
Elizabeth S. Justison	Associate	Bankruptcy	2013	\$85.00	0.20	\$425.00
Shane M. Reil	Associate	Bankruptcy	2015	\$4,738.00	10.30	\$460.00

Jaclyn C. Marasco	Associate	Bankruptcy	2015	\$62,527.50	119.10	\$525.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	Bankruptcy	2013	\$950,339.00	2184.10	\$360.00 \$415.00 \$490.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	Bankruptcy	2015	\$634,261.00	1564.10	\$360.00 \$400.00 \$450.00
M. Paige Valeski	Associate	Corporate	2016	\$26,317.50	60.50	\$435.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	Bankruptcy	2017	\$756,334.50	2188.10	\$300.00 \$340.00 \$415.00
Jordan E. Sazant	Associate	Bankruptcy	2017	\$7,221.00	17.40	\$415.00
Caleb G. Johnson	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$128,484.00	309.60	\$415.00
Ryan D. Hart	Associate	Business Planning and Tax	2017	\$13,486.00	43.80	\$300.00 \$340.00 \$415.00
Kevin P. Rickert	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$2,158.00	5.20	\$415.00
Catherine C. Lyons	Associate	Bankruptcy	2019	\$72,147.50	196.40	\$325.00 \$400.00
Jared W. Kochenash	Associate	Bankruptcy	2018	\$17,191.00	45.50	\$285.00 \$325.00 \$400.00
Matthew P. Milana	Associate	Bankruptcy	2019	\$112,325.00	348.60	\$275.00 \$325.00 \$400.00
Brittani Gordon	Associate	Bankruptcy	N/A	\$53,176.00	156.40	\$340.00
Nicholas D. Picollelli, Jr.	Associate	Intellectual Property	2016	\$12,806.00	33.70	\$380.00
Jacob D. Morton	Associate	Bankruptcy	2019	\$60,175.00	179.00	\$325.00 \$375.00
Malak S. Doss	Associate	Bankruptcy	2020	\$136,587.50	379.10	\$325.00 \$375.00
Steven W. Lee	Associate	Commercial Litigation	2019	\$45,037.50	120.10	\$375.00

Michael E. Neminski	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$52,312.50	139.50	\$375.00
Shivani H. Patel	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$8,850.00	23.60	\$375.00
Joseph F. Ecker	Associate	Intellectual Property	2020	\$53,100.00	141.60	\$375.00
Mark-Vincent A. Umandap	Associate	Business Planning & Tax	2020	\$735.00	2.10	\$350.00
Joel W. Glazer	Associate	Intellectual Property	2019	\$49,887.50	153.50	\$325.00
Jacob E. Black	Summer Associate	Bankruptcy	-	\$4,202.00	19.10	\$220.00
Kacey E. Jennings	Summer Associate	Bankruptcy	-	\$8,514.00	38.70	\$220.00
Chelsea C. Ryan	Summer Associate	Bankruptcy	-	\$11,704.00	53.20	\$220.00
Danielle Rheaume	Summer Associate	Bankruptcy	-	\$2,618.00	11.90	\$220.00
Titus Kabega	Summer Associate	Bankruptcy	-	\$3,828.00	17.40	\$220.00
Andrew Kim	Summer Associate	Bankruptcy	-	\$242.00	1.10	\$220.00
Debbie Laskin	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$7,301.00	24.60	\$285.00 \$295.00 \$305.00
Brenda Walters	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$23,335.50	77.70	\$285.00 \$295.00 \$305.00
Mike Girello	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$1,416.00	4.80	\$295.00
Michelle Smith	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$1,111.50	3.90	\$285.00
Beth Olivere	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$234,057.50	822.10	\$255.00 \$285.00 \$295.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$6,045.00	22.80	\$255.00 \$285.00 \$295.00
Chad Corazza	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$912.00	3.20	\$285.00
Melissa Romano	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	-	\$342.00	1.20	\$285.00
	1	<u> </u>	l	1		

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575 Filed 08/27/20 Page 13 of 24

Anupa Smit	Paralegal	Commercial Litigation	-	\$3,451.50	11.70	\$295.00
Colleen Stevens	Paralegal	Business Planning	-	\$697.50	3.10	\$225.00
Paul Puszkarczuk	Paralegal	Commercial Real Estate	-	\$60.00	0.30	\$200.00
Monica Fratticci	Paralegal	Litigation Support	-	\$14,157.50	80.90	\$175.00
Patrick Foss	Paralegal	Litigation Support	-	\$6,781.50	41.10	\$165.00
Karen Luongo	Paralegal	Corporate	-	\$175.00	0.70	\$250.00
Ashley Clarke	Paralegal	Commercial Real Estate	-	\$45.00	0.30	\$150.00
	TOTAL			\$10,682,707.50	20005.00	

## FINAL COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees	
Prepetition (B000)	0.10	\$25.00	
Case Administration (B001)	534.00	\$206,628.50	
Court Hearings (B002)	360.60	\$165,734.00	
Cash Collateral/DIP Financing (B003)	406.90	\$230,143.00	
Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports (B004)	119.10	\$49,890.50	
Lease/Executory Contract Issues (B005)	558.60	\$286,044.00	
Use, Sale or Lease Property (363 Issues) (B006)	3048.30	\$1,616,568.00	
Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions (B007)	2202.00	\$1,220,788.50	
Meetings (B008)	913.60	\$601,080.00	
Stay Relief Matters (B009)	133.80	\$72,943.00	
Reclamation and Adversaries (B010)	16.30	\$5,303.50	
Other Adversary Proceedings (B011)	4373.50	\$2,342,139.00	
Plan and Disclosure Statement (B012)	1361.40	\$808,071.00	
Creditor Inquiries (B013)	49.20	\$22,045.50	
General Corporate Matters (B014)	150.50	\$97,346.00	
Employee Matters (B015)	282.60	\$157,938.50	
Asset Analysis (B016)	44.70	\$18,647.00	
Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues (B017)	174.80	\$67,572.00	
Fee Application Preparation (B018)	152.00	\$59,040.50	
Travel (B019)	134.50	\$92,452.50	
Utility Service (B020)	14.10	\$5,304.50	
Business Operations (B708)	6.90	\$3,898.50	
Other Contested Matters (B190)	227.60	\$94,694.50	
Williams Litigation (B768)	4666.50	\$2,430,544.00	
Emergency Motion (B850)	73.40	\$27,866.00	
TOTALS	20005.00	\$10,682,707.50	

## **FINAL EXPENSE SUMMARY**

Air/Rail Travel  AP Outside Duplication Services  Car/Bus/Subway Travel  Certified Court Documents  Client Requested Food and Support  Computerized Legal Research  Court Costs  Court Reporter  Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access  Mediation	\$28,737.29 \$980.14 \$6,941.07 \$33.00 \$845.58 \$20,014.38 \$49.92 \$6,803.53 \$1,543.60
Car/Bus/Subway Travel  Certified Court Documents  Client Requested Food and Support  Computerized Legal Research  Court Costs  Court Reporter  Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	\$6,941.07 \$33.00 \$845.58 \$20,014.38 \$49.92 \$6,803.53 \$1,543.60
Certified Court Documents  Client Requested Food and Support  Computerized Legal Research  Court Costs  Court Reporter  Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	\$33.00 \$845.58 \$20,014.38 \$49.92 \$6,803.53 \$1,543.60
Client Requested Food and Support  Computerized Legal Research  Court Costs  Court Reporter  Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	\$845.58 \$20,014.38 \$49.92 \$6,803.53 \$1,543.60
Computerized Legal Research  Court Costs  Court Reporter  Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	\$20,014.38 \$49.92 \$6,803.53 \$1,543.60
Court Costs  Court Reporter  Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	\$49.92 \$6,803.53 \$1,543.60
Court Reporter  Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	\$6,803.53 \$1,543.60
Delivery/Courier  Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	\$1,543.60
Deposition Transcript  Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	· ·
Docket Retrieval/Search  Expert Fee  Facsimile  Federal Express  Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging  Internet Access	
Expert Fee Facsimile Federal Express Filing Fee Hotel/Lodging Internet Access	\$11,980.15
Facsimile Federal Express Filing Fee Hotel/Lodging Internet Access	\$2,274.01
Federal Express Filing Fee Hotel/Lodging Internet Access	\$7,420.00
Filing Fee  Hotel/Lodging Internet Access	\$101.00
Hotel/Lodging Internet Access	\$1,267.48
Internet Access	\$1,476.00
	\$9,578.50
Mediation	\$75.00
	\$5,062.50
Miscellaneous	\$716.09
Outside Attorney's Fees	\$585.00
Outside Litigation Support	\$11,786.95
Parking	\$363.74
Postage	\$88.88
Prothonotary Charges	\$49.40
Reproduction Charges	\$40,456.10
Service Fee	\$51.68
Secretary of State	\$64.00
Staff Overtime	\$433.88
Teleconference/Video Conference	\$5,536.39

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$174,643.19
Working Meals	\$8,926.46
Travel Meals	\$401.47

## IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:	) Chapter 11
WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al.,1	) Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)
Debtors.	) (Jointly Administered)
	Hearing Date: TBD
	Objection Deadline: September 10, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

TWENTY-FIRST MONTHLY AND FINAL APPLICATION OF YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE MONTHLY PERIOD FROM JULY 1, 2020 THROUGH JULY 31, 2020 AND THE FINAL PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 22, 2018 THROUGH JULY 31, 2020

Pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101 et seq. (the "Bankruptcy Code"), and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and in accordance with that certain Order Pursuant to Section 327(a) of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2014, and Local Rule 2014-1, Authorizing the Retention of Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP as Counsel for the Debtors, Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [Docket No. 234] (the "Retention Order") and that certain Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals [Docket No. 230] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (hereinafter "YCS&T") hereby moves (the "Application")

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.

this Court for reasonable compensation for professional legal services rendered as counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "**Debtors**") in the amount of \$436,897.00, together with reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$3,540.68 for the monthly period commencing July 1, 2020 through and including July 31, 2020 (the "**Monthly Fee Period**"), and in the amount of \$10,677,520.50, together with reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$174,643.19, for the final period commencing October 22, 2018 through and including July 31, 2020 (the "**Final Fee Period**"). In support of its Application, YCS&T respectfully represents as follows:

- 1. Pursuant to the Retention Order, YCS&T was employed to represent the Debtors as bankruptcy counsel in connection with these chapter 11 cases effective as of October 22, 2018. The Retention Order authorized YCS&T to be compensated on an hourly basis and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses.
- 2. All services for which compensation is requested by YCS&T were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.

### SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

- 3. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is a detailed statement of fees incurred during the Monthly Fee Period showing the amount of \$436,897.00 due for fees.
- 4. The services rendered by YCS&T during the Monthly Fee Period are grouped into the categories set forth in Exhibit A. The attorneys and paralegals who rendered services relating to each category are identified, along with the number of hours for each individual and the total compensation sought for each category, in the attachments hereto.

### **DISBURSEMENTS**

- Period in the amount of \$3,540.68. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a detailed statement of expenses paid during the Monthly Fee Period. This disbursement sum is broken down into categories of charges, including, among other things, telephone and telecopier toll and other charges, mail and express mail charges, special or hand delivery charges, document processing, photocopying charges, charges for mailing supplies (including, without limitation, envelopes and labels) provided by YCS&T to outside copying services for use in mass mailings, travel expenses, expenses for "working meals," computerized research, transcription costs, as well as non-ordinary overhead expenses such as secretarial and other overtime. A complete review by category of the expenses incurred for the Monthly Fee Period may be found attached hereto as Exhibit B. To the extent such itemization is insufficient to satisfy the requirements of Rule 2016-2(e)(ii) of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the "Local Rules"), YCS&T respectfully requests that the Court waive strict compliance with such Local Rule.
- 6. Costs incurred for overtime and computer assisted research are not included in YCS&T's normal hourly billing rates and, therefore, are itemized and included in YCS&T's disbursements. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-2, YCS&T represents that its rate for duplication is \$.10 per page, its rate for outgoing telecopier transmissions is \$.25 per page (excluding related long distance transmission charges), there is no charge for incoming telecopier transmissions and there is no surcharge for computerized research.

### **VALUATION OF SERVICES**

- 7. Attorneys and paraprofessionals of YCS&T have expended a total of 790.00 hours in connection with this matter during the Monthly Fee Period.
- 8. The amount of time spent by each of these persons providing services to the Debtors for the Monthly Fee Period is fully set forth in the detail attached hereto as Exhibit A. These are YCS&T's normal hourly rates of compensation for work of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by YCS&T for the Monthly Fee Period as counsel for the Debtors in these cases is \$436,897.00.
- 9. YCS&T believes that the time entries included in <u>Exhibit A</u> attached hereto and the expense breakdown set forth in <u>Exhibit B</u> hereto are in compliance with the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2.
- 10. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under chapter 11.
- 11. The Application covers the Monthly Fee Period July 1, 2020 through and including July 31, 2020.

### REQUEST FOR FINAL APPROVAL OF FEES AND EXPENSES

12. The Application also covers the Final Fee Period of October 22, 2018 through and including July 31, 2020. During the Final Fee Period, YCS&T performed necessary services and incurred out-of-pocket disbursements for the Debtors and their estates. As set forth in prior monthly applications, in accordance with the factors enumerated in 11 U.S.C. § 330,

approval of the fees requested for the Final Fee Period is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title. In addition, the out-of-pocket disbursements for which reimbursement is sought were actual, reasonable and necessary costs incurred while representing the Debtors.

### STATEMENT OF APPLICANT

- 13. The following statements address the questions set forth under section C.5 of the Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under United States Code by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases (the "UST Guidelines"):
  - a) During the Final Fee Period, YCS&T did not agree to any variations from, or alternatives to, its standard or customary billing rates, fees, or terms.
  - b) The fees sought by YCS&T are more than the fees budgeted pursuant to the original budget provided by Young Conaway to the Debtors.
  - c) The professionals included in the Application for the Final Fee Period did not vary their hourly rate based on the geographic location of the bankruptcy case.
  - d) The Application for the Final Fee Period did not include any fees dedicated to revising time records or preparing and revising invoices that would not normally be compensable outside of bankruptcy.
  - e) The time period covered by the Application for the Final Fee Period includes approximately 23.60 hours with a value of \$15,777.00 spent by YCS&T to ensure that the time entries included in the Final Fee Period

comply with the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware and do not disclose privileged or confidential information. This review and any revisions associated therewith are a necessary component of YCS&T preparation of each monthly fee application.

f) The Application included annual rate increases since retention. As disclosed in its retention application, YCS&T annually reviews and adjusts its rates on January 1<sup>st</sup> of each year.

### **BLENDED RATE SCHEDULE**

14. A blended rate schedule, as requested by *Appendix B* to the UST Guideline, is attached hereto as Exhibit C.

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank]

### **CONCLUSION**

WHEREFORE, YCS&T requests that allowance be made to it in the sum of \$436,897.00 as compensation for necessary professional services rendered to the Debtors for the Monthly Fee Period, and the sum of \$3,540.68 for reimbursement of actual necessary costs and expenses incurred during the monthly period, and final allowance be made to it in the sum of \$10,677,520.50 as compensation for necessary professional services rendered to the Debtors for the Final Fee Period, and the sum of \$174,643.19 for reimbursement of actual necessary costs and expenses incurred for the Final Fee Period, and further requests such other and further relief as this Court may deem just and proper.

Dated: August 27, 2020 Wilmington, Delaware YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

/s/ Sean M. Beach

Sean M. Beach (No. 4070) Robert F. Poppiti, Jr. (No. 5052)

Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934)

Betsy L. Feldman (No. 6410)

Rodney Square

1000 North King Street

Wilmington, DE 19801

Telephone: (302) 571-6600

Facsimile: (302) 571-1256

Emails: sbeach@ycst.com

rpoppiti@ycst.com

amielke@ycst.com

bfeldman@ycst.com

Co-Counsel to the Post-Effective Date Debtors

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575 Filed 08/27/20 Page 24 of 24

**VERIFICATION** 

I, Sean M. Beach, declare, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, under penalty of perjury:

1. I am a Partner in the applicant firm, Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor,

LLP, and have been admitted to the bar of the Supreme Court of Delaware since 2001.

2. I have personally performed many of the legal services rendered by Young

Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, as counsel for the Debtors, and am familiar with all other

work performed on behalf of the Debtors by the lawyers and paraprofessionals in the firm.

3. The facts set forth in the foregoing Application are true and correct to the

best of my knowledge, information and belief.

Dated: August 27, 2020

/s/ Sean M. Beach

SEAN M. BEACH

## IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:	) Chapter 11
WELDED CONSTRUCTION, L.P., et al., 1	) Case No. 18-12378 (CSS)
Debtors.	) (Jointly Administered)
	Hearing Date: TBD
	Objection Deadline: September 10, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

### NOTICE OF TWENTY-FIRST MONTHLY AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION

TO: (I) THE DEBTORS; (II) THE U.S. TRUSTEE; (III) COUNSEL FOR THE DIP LENDER; (IV) COUNSEL FOR THE COMMITTEE (V) COUNSEL TO THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR; AND (VI) COUNSEL TO THE POST-EFFECTIVE DATE DEBTORS

**PLEASE TAKE NOTICE** that Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (the "Applicant") has filed its *Twenty-First Monthly and Final Application for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession for Services Rendered for the Monthly Period from July 1, 2020 Through July 31, 2020 and the Final Period from October 22, 2018 through July 31, 2020 (the "Application") with the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the "Court"). The Application seeks allowance of monthly fees in the amount of \$436,897.00 and monthly expenses in the amount of \$3,540.68 and final allowance of fees in the amount of \$10,677,520.50<sup>2</sup> and expenses in the amount of \$174,643.19.* 

**PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE** that objections to the Application, if any, are required to be filed on or before <u>September 10, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)</u> (the "Objection Deadlines") with the Clerk of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 3rd Floor, 824 N. Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801. You must also serve any such objection so as to be received by the following on or before the Objection Deadline: (i) the Debtors, P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470, Attn: Cullen D. Speckhart, Esq (cspeckhart@cooley.com); (ii) counsel to the Post-Effective Date Debtors, (a) Blank Rome LLP,

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are: Welded Construction, L.P. (5008) and Welded Construction Michigan, LLC (9830). The mailing address for each of the Debtors is P.O. Box 470, Perrysburg, OH 43552-0470.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> This amount includes a reduction of \$5,187.00 from the second interim fee order [see D.I. 785] as agreed to between the Applicant and the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware.

130 N. 18<sup>th</sup> Street, Philadelphia, PA 19102, Attn: Michael B. Schaedle, Esq. (schaedle@BlankRome.com) and John E. Lucian, Esq. (lucian@BlankRome.com) and 1201 N. Market Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Josef W. Mintz, Esq. (mintz@BlankRome.com) and (b) Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Sean M. Beach, Esq. (sbeach@ycst.com); and (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware, J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, 844 North King Street, Suite 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Jane M. Leamy, Esq. (jane.m.leamy@usdoj.gov).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT A HEARING TO CONSIDER APPROVAL OF THE FINAL APPLICATION WILL BE HELD BEFORE THE HONORABLE CHRISTOPHER S. SONTCHI IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE, 824 MARKET STREET, 5TH FLOOR, COURTROOM NO. 6, WILMINGTON, DE 19801 ON A DATE AND AT A TIME TO BE DETERMINED.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT ONLY IF AN OBJECTION IS PROPERLY AND TIMELY FILED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES AND CANNOT BE CONSENSUALLY RESOLVED WILL A HEARING BE HELD ON THE APPLICATION.

Dated: August 27, 2020 Wilmington, Delaware YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

### /s/ Sean M. Beach

Co-Counsel to the Post-Effective Date Debtors

## EXHIBIT A

# YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

### RODNEY SQUARE 1000 NORTH KING STREET WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

### P.O. BOX 391 WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600 (800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial (302) 571-6621

Writer's E-Mail sbeach@ycst.com

Frank Pometti Chief Restructuring Officer Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

Re: Debtor Representation

### **CURRENT INVOICE**

 Professional Services
 \$ 436,897.00

 Disbursements
 \$ 3,540.68

 Total Due This Invoice
 \$ 440,437.68

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 3 of 65

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

### **Time Detail**

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/01/20	AMIEL	Draft correspondence to counsel for post- effective date debtors re: transition	B001	0.30	147.00
07/02/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.10	29.50
07/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg re: information for request for reimbursement of litigation fees	B001	0.10	49.00
07/03/20	AMIEL	Review/revise transition memorandum (1.1); emails with YCST team and client re: same (0.1)	B001	1.20	588.00
07/06/20	BOLIV	Circulate transcript from confirmation hearing	B001	0.10	29.50
07/07/20	BOLIV	Update critical dates	B001	0.10	29.50
07/09/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: removal of Welded from LXP permit	B001	0.10	49.00
07/10/20	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, B. Feldman, Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph), committee counsel (John Lucian and Joe Mintz), and Teneo re: case transition and effective date issues	B001	0.80	548.00
07/13/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.10	29.50
07/14/20	BFELD	Emails with A. Mielke re: data room for post-effective date debtors' advisors	B001	0.10	41.50
07/15/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.10	29.50
07/15/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of COC re omnibus hearing dates	B001	0.20	59.00
07/15/20	BOLIV	Draft COC re omnibus hearing dates	B001	0.20	59.00
07/15/20	BOLIV	Email chambers for a hearing date for the week of 8/21/20	B001	0.10	29.50
07/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: critical dates	B001	0.10	49.00
07/17/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.20	59.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 4 of 65

-		1/14/001 1	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		070020:1001
<b>Date</b>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
07/20/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.10	29.50
07/21/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.20	59.00
07/21/20	BOLIV	Delete folder from claims ftp site per request of B. Feldman	B001	0.10	29.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and J. Mintz re final plan administrator agreement and bank account issues (.2); Call with A. Mielke re same (.1)	B001	0.30	250.50
07/22/20	BOLIV	Update critical dates	B001	0.50	147.50
07/23/20	AMIEL	Review/revise critical dates	B001	0.40	196.00
07/23/20	BOLIV	Update critical dates [main and all adversary matters]	B001	1.80	531.00
07/23/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.20	59.00
07/23/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of withdrawal of appearance of Lisa Lansio of LW	B001	0.20	59.00
07/23/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: transition issues	B001	0.10	83.50
07/23/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Ralph, F. Pometti, S. Cherian, and A. Mielke re: KEIP	B001	0.10	83.50
07/23/20	SBEAC	Review and revise KEIP Earnout Tracker re: transition issues	B001	0.10	83.50
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere and B. Feldman re: critical dates	B001	0.10	49.00
07/24/20	BFELD	Review critical dates calendar	B001	0.50	207.50
07/24/20	BOLIV	Circulate finalized critical dates	B001	0.10	29.50
07/24/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel	B001	0.10	29.50
07/27/20	AMIEL	Review/compile board resignations (0.1) and bank account signature pages (0.9); review corporate documents in connection with effective date and officer resignation (0.3)	B001	1.30	637.00
07/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: reimbursement of expenses	B001	0.10	49.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 5 of 65

<u>Date</u>	Initials	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/27/20	BOLIV	Research, locate and forward sealed KEIP/KERP motion for S. Beach	B001	0.10	29.50
07/27/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, and A. Mielke re: Board Update	B001	0.10	83.50
07/27/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Effective Date	B001	0.10	83.50
07/28/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Welded/Committee Member Expenses and Committee Professionals Monthly Fees	B001	0.10	83.50
07/28/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke, R. Gratton, M. Rosenthal, K. Chase, and M. Kelsey re: Effective Date	B001	0.10	83.50
07/28/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti and A. Mielke re: Resignation letter	B001	0.10	83.50
07/29/20	BOLIV	Coordinate establishment of new data room "Central States Arbitration" per request of A. Mielke	B001	0.20	59.00
07/29/20	BOLIV	Add parties to UCC data room	B001	0.10	29.50
07/29/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti, A. Ralph, and A. Mielke re: bank accounts	B001	0.20	167.00
07/29/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal, A. Ralph, J. Krzysztofik, F. Pometti, and A. Mielke re: Effective Date	B001	0.10	83.50
07/30/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel	B001	0.10	29.50
07/30/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal, A. Mielke and K. Chase re: resignation and banking July 2020	B001	0.10	83.50
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and F. Pometti re: resignation letters	B001	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of effective date	B001	0.20	59.00
07/31/20	BOLIV	Email A. Mielke re status of cno/coc for Federal Insurance Settlement motion	B001	0.10	29.50
07/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg and K. Guerke re: omnibus hearing dates	B002	0.20	98.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Emails w/K. Guerke and M. Neiburg re: omnibus hearing dates	B002	0.10	49.00
07/15/20	AMIEL	Emails w/B. Olivere (0.2) and the court (0.1) re: omnibus hearing dates	B002	0.30	147.00
07/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: fee hearing	B002	0.10	49.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 6 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/20/20	AMIEL	Emails with the court re: omnibus hearing (0.1); emails with K. Guerke re: same (0.1)	B002	0.20	98.00
07/29/20	SBEAC	Call with A. Mielke re effective date issues and bank accounts (.1); multiple emails with M. Rosenthal, Bechtel, J. Krzysztofik and others re same (.4); Review documents re same (.2)	B003	0.70	584.50
07/30/20	SBEAC	Email with J. Krzysztofik, A. Ralph, F. Pometti, and A. Mielke re: Bank Accounts	B003	0.10	83.50
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and A. Ralph re: closing of utility account	B003	0.10	49.00
07/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman and A. Ralph re: MOR	B004	0.10	49.00
07/30/20	BFELD	Research and emails with A. Ralph re: post-confirmation quarterly operating reports	B004	0.40	166.00
07/31/20	BFELD	Review MOR re: June reporting period	B004	0.30	124.50
07/31/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of monthly operating report for June 2020; send to US Trustee	B004	0.20	59.00
07/31/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft June 2020 monthly operating report, and emails to and from B. Feldman and Zolfo (Andrew Ralph and Sujay Cherian) re: same	B004	0.10	68.50
07/01/20	SBEAC	Call with F. Pometti re transition issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/02/20	AMIEL	Review committee's request for expense reimbursement (0.2); confer with client and S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B006	0.30	147.00
07/02/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re revisions to transition memo (.1); Review and revise same (.6)	B006	0.70	584.50
07/02/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: case planning and transition issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/03/20	SBEAC	Email with R. Poppiti, B. Feldman, A. Mielke, and M. Lunn re: Transition Memo (.1); Further review and revise same (.3)	B006	0.40	334.00
07/03/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti, A. Ralph, S. Cherian, M. Lunn, and R. Poppiti re: Transition Memo	B006	0.10	83.50
07/06/20	SBEAC	Email with J. Krzysztofik re: 2016 Consumers Project documents (.1); Review same (.5)	B006	0.60	501.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 7 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/08/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: fee app timing (.1); Call with F. Pometti re open and transition issues (.3); Call with S. Hawkins re same (.4)	B006	0.80	668.00
07/10/20	SBEAC	Further review and revise Transition Memo	B006	0.60	501.00
07/14/20	SBEAC	Call with A. Mielke re transition and 503b9 motion issues (.2); Emails with A. Mielke re same (.1); Call with F. Pometti re same (.3); Emails with M. Rosenthal, F. Pometti and J. Mintz re plan settlement and effective date issues (.2)	B006	0.80	668.00
07/14/20	SBEAC	Emails with F. Pometti, M. Rosenthal, M. Schaedle, M. Kelsey and A. Mielke re settlement payment and transition issues (.2); Review documents re same (.2)	B006	0.40	334.00
07/14/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re transition issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/15/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Reserves	B006	0.10	83.50
07/15/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Transition issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/17/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Ralph, A. Mielke, B. Feldman, R. Poppiti, M. Lunn, F. Pometti, S. Cherian, and B. Feldman re: reserve estimates	B006	0.10	83.50
07/17/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Rosenthal re settlement payment and effective date issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/20/20	SBEAC	Email with C. Speckhart, M. Schaedle, J. Lucian, and J. Mintz re: Post-Effective and transition issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/20/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Williams reimbursement (.1) and review documents re same (.1)	B006	0.20	167.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with AlixPartners re: committee advisor success fee	B006	0.10	49.00
07/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with F. Pometti and S. Hawkins re effective date and Bank Accounts	B006	0.10	83.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and A. Ralph re reserves and Transition issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Email with C. Speckhart, M. Schaedle, J. Lucian, J. Mintz, and F. Pometti re: transition issues	B006	0.10	83.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Rosenthal and F. Pometti re director and officer Resignation letters	B006	0.20	167.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 8 of 65

<b>Date</b>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
07/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with J. Mintz, F. Pometti, A. Ralph and other re plan administrator agreement and Related transition issues (.2); Review documents re same (.3); Emails with A. Mielke re same (.1)	B006	0.60	501.00
07/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph and S. Beach re: payment of KEIP	B006	0.10	49.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: YCST fees	B006	0.10	49.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Hall and A. Ralph re: committee fees	B006	0.10	49.00
07/27/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti and A. Mielke re: Domain Name renewals	B006	0.10	83.50
07/30/20	TPAKR	Emails with A. Mielke re: OCP statement (.1); review and finalize same (.1); emails with B. Olivere re: filing same (.1)	B006	0.30	135.00
07/31/20	BFELD	Emails with A. Ralph and J. Leamy re: closure of utility deposit account	B006	0.20	83.00
07/02/20	AMIEL	Review claim materials (0.5) and send to J. Krzysztofik to obtain information about same (0.1)	B007	0.60	294.00
07/02/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti, A. Ralph, and A. Mielke re: Cleveland Bros.	B007	0.10	83.50
07/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and M. Doss re: motion to approve claim resolution	B007	0.10	49.00
07/03/20	AMIEL	Review bond materials in connection with surety claim	B007	0.20	98.00
07/03/20	SBEAC	Review and revise 9019 Motion re Federal Insurance 503(b)(9) Claim (.7); email with R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, and M. Doss re: same (.1)	B007	0.80	668.00
07/06/20	AMIEL	Teleconference (x2) with M. Doss re: claim settlement motion	B007	0.40	196.00
07/06/20	BFELD	Emails with A. Mielke and M. Doss re: Federal Insurance Company claims	B007	0.30	124.50
07/07/20	BFELD	Emails with R. Fetchik re: Beaver Valley Slag settlement terms	B007	0.20	83.00
07/07/20	BFELD	Calls with A. Ralph re: revisions to claims register based on recent orders and notice of satisfaction	B007	0.20	83.00
07/07/20	SBEAC	Review and revise 9019 Motion re: Federal Insurance 503(b)(9) Claim (1.2); email with A. Mielke, R. Poppiti, and M. Doss re: same (.1)	B007	1.30	1,085.50
07/07/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Doss re: 9019 Motion re Federal Insurance 503(b)(9) Claim	B007	0.10	83.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 9 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	Amount
07/14/20	AMIEL	Review/revise motion to settle claim (0.3); confer w/S. Beach re: same (0.2); confer w/M. Doss re: same (0.1)	B007	0.60	294.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Emails w/interested parties re: motion to settle claim	B007	0.10	49.00
07/14/20	SBEAC	Multiple emails with M. Collins, S. Poteet, A. Mielke, M. Doss and committee counsel re 9019 motion to settle Chubb 503b9 claim and transition issues	B007	0.30	250.50
07/15/20	AMIEL	Finalize for filing a motion to settle claim (0.2); review/revise COC for same (0.2)	B007	0.40	196.00
07/15/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 9019 settlement motion with Federal Insurance	B007	0.40	118.00
07/15/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and M. Neiburg re motion to compel and motion to approve Chubb 9019 (.1); Review and revise documents re same (.5)	B007	0.60	501.00
07/15/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Neiburg re: As Bid vs As Performed Presentations (.1); Call with M Neiburg re same (.1)	B007	0.20	167.00
07/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and K. Guerke re: Schmid claim	B007	0.10	49.00
07/20/20	BFELD	Call with counsel to BVS re: endorsed checks in connection with settled claims	B007	0.10	41.50
07/21/20	BFELD	Research re: various transition claims issues	B007	1.10	456.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Neiburg re transition issues	B007	0.20	167.00
07/21/20	SBEAC	Review and revise transition memo	B007	0.30	250.50
07/22/20	AMIEL	Review correspondence from counsel to Williams parties re: information request in connection with claim settlement (0.1); emails about same with client and S. Beach (0.1)	B007	0.20	98.00
07/22/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Collins, S. Poteet, M. Schaedle, J. Mintz, and J. Lucian re: 503b9 and Williams (.1); Review letter from Williams (.2)	B007	0.30	250.50
07/22/20	SBEAC	Email with J. Lucian re: 503b9 motion (.1); Call with S. Hawkins re transition issues (.3)	B007	0.40	334.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 10 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with counsel for the surety (0.1) and client (0.1) regarding claim analysis; draft responsive email to counsel for Williams Parties re: same (0.3)	B007	0.50	245.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: claim analysis	B007	0.10	49.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach re: response to request for information in connection with 9019 motion to settle claims	B007	1.20	588.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Review/revise claim analysis (0.3); emails with S. Beach re: same(0.1)	B007	0.40	196.00
07/24/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Chubb 503(b)(9) Claim Settlement	B007	0.10	83.50
07/24/20	SBEAC	Call with A. Mielke re: effective date issues and responding to Williams 503b9 inquiry (.5); Multiple emails with A. Mielke, F. Pometti, A. Ralph, M. Collins and J. Lucian re same (.3); Review documents re same (.3); Call to M. Collins re same (.1)	B007	1.20	1,002.00
07/24/20	SBEAC	Review and prepare response to Williams counsel re Chubb 503(b)(9) Analysis (.7); Followup calls with A. Mielke and A. Ralph re same (.3)	B007	1.00	835.00
07/27/20	MDOSS	Calls and emails with K. Guerke and T. Pakrouh re: claim objection	B007	0.20	75.00
07/27/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke, J. Kristofik, S. Hawkins, F. Pometti and A. Ralph re Central States Arbitration and discovery requests (.2); Review documents and issues re same (.3)	B007	0.50	417.50
07/27/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Collins and A. Mielke re: 503b9 and Williams issues	B007	0.10	83.50
07/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: discovery request in connection with Central States claim	B007	0.10	49.00
07/28/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Collins and A. Mielke re Response to Williams' Parties Information Request (.6); Review and revise documents re same (.5)	B007	1.10	918.50
07/28/20	SBEAC	Attend CC Diligence Call with A. Mielke and Alix team	B007	0.20	167.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. DeVoll (0.1) and S. Beach (0.1) re: deadline to respond to claim settlement motion	B007	0.20	98.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 11 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: request for documents in connection with claim settlement	B007	0.10	49.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: Central States claim document request	B007	0.10	49.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Collins re: claim settlement/analysis	B007	0.10	49.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: claim analysis	B007	0.10	49.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with M. Collins and S. Beach re: document request in connection with settlement of claim	B007	0.50	245.00
07/29/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Williams / 503(b)(9)	B007	0.10	83.50
07/29/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke, J. Mintz, M. Schaedle, and C. Speckhart re: Documents for Central States Arbitration	B007	0.10	83.50
07/29/20	SBEAC	Call with M. Collins and A. Mielke re Response to Williams (.5); Review and revise documents and response re same (.7); Followup calls with A. Mielke and M. Collins re same (.3)	B007	1.50	1,252.50
07/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Collins and S. Beach resettlement of claims	B007	0.10	49.00
07/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. DeVoll re: deadline to objection to claim settlement motion	B007	0.10	49.00
07/30/20	MDOSS	Calls with K. Guerke and T. Pakrouh re: claim objection	B007	0.60	225.00
07/30/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Collins and A. Mielke re: Response to Williams	B007	0.10	83.50
07/30/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Collins re: 503(b)(9) claim and prosecution of the motion (.1); Call with M. Collins re same (.1); Call with S. Poteet and M. Collins re same (.4); Call with M. Schaedle re same (.3); Followup call with M. Collins re same (.1); Call with A. Mielke re effective date issues, requested Williams extension on the 503b9 claim motion and related issues (.1)	B007	1.10	918.50
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: claim settlement motion	B007	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	RFPOP	Email to and from counsel for Jeremy Keith (Michael Fiorillo) re: distribution on allowed general unsecured claim	B007	0.10	68.50

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 12 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/31/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re Central States issues (.1); Review documents re diligence request issues (.2)	B007	0.30	250.50
07/01/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with YCST and AlixPartners teams re: transition to post-effective date debtors	B008	1.20	588.00
07/01/20	RFPOP	Call with S. Beach, M. Lunn, A. Mielke, and Zolfo (Frank Pometti and Andrew Ralph) re: various effective date and case transitions issues	B008	1.20	822.00
07/01/20	SBEAC	Call with YCST and Alix teams re transition and effective date issues	B008	1.20	1,002.00
07/02/20	AMIEL	Confer with A. Ralph re: misc. case issues	B008	0.10	49.00
07/08/20	AMIEL	Confer with J. Mintz re: misc. case transition issues	B008	0.20	98.00
07/08/20	EEDWA	Meet with K. Guerke and M. Neiburg (partial) re: litigation strategy and planning	B008	1.20	858.00
07/10/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with YCST, AlixPartners, Blank Rome teams and plan administrator re: transition of case	B008	1.40	686.00
07/10/20	MLUNN	Transition call with Blank Rome and Plan Administrator	B008	1.50	1,192.50
07/10/20	SBEAC	Prepare for (.5) and attend Transition/Effective Date Discussion with Committee, Debtor professionals and plan administrator (1.4)	B008	1.90	1,586.50
07/13/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach re: transition and misc. litigation issues	B008	0.30	147.00
07/13/20	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins re: litigation and effective date issues	B008	0.40	334.00
07/13/20	SBEAC	Call to A. Mielke re transition and effective date issues	B008	0.40	334.00
07/17/20	SBEAC	Email with J. Mintz and A. Mielke re: Reserves (.2); Attend transition call with Debtor, Committee and Plan Administrator (.4); Prepare for call re same (.3)	B008	0.90	751.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Call with A. Mielke re: transition issues	B008	0.10	83.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Call with advisors to Discuss Remaining Effective Date Contingencies	B008	0.40	334.00
07/22/20	SBEAC	Call with A. Mielke re case planning issues	B008	0.20	167.00

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 13 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/01/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke and client re: payment of expert invoice	B011	0.10	49.00
07/01/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Neiburg and K. Guerke re: litigation reimbursement	B011	0.10	49.00
07/01/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph re: payment of litigation invoices	B011	0.10	49.00
07/01/20	KGUER	Review and revise draft initial disclosures	B011	0.60	465.00
07/01/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: Earth Pipeline initial disclosures	B011	0.20	155.00
07/01/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Guerke re: revisions to Earth initial disclosures (.1); review and incorporate same (.5); emails with K. Guerke, S. Beach, and K. Enos re same (.1)	B011	0.70	315.00
07/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with D. Wills re: litigation reimbursement	B011	0.10	49.00
07/02/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Elkhoury re: status of litigation	B011	0.10	49.00
07/02/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: initial disclosures	B011	0.20	155.00
07/02/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg and A. Mielke re: litigation summary	B011	0.10	77.50
07/02/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Enos re: Earth initial disclosures	B011	0.10	45.00
07/02/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Guerke re: Earth initial disclosure filing deadlines (.1); research same (.2)	B011	0.30	135.00
07/03/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: adversary proceeding dockets	B011	0.10	49.00
07/03/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: litigation status	B011	0.20	155.00
07/03/20	MDOSS	Emails with S. Beach re: 9019 motion	B011	0.10	37.50
07/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: adversary proceeding status	B011	0.10	49.00
07/06/20	AMIEL	Revise draft summary of litigation work for request for reimbursement	B011	0.20	98.00
07/06/20	AMIEL	Revise invoice for reimbursement of litigation fees	B011	0.40	196.00
07/06/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph and S. Cherian re: reimbursement of litigation fees	B011	0.10	49.00
07/06/20	BOLIV	Draft notice of service re initial disclosures to Earth Pipeline	B011	0.20	59.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 14 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/06/20	BOLIV	Review all adversary dockets for updates	B011	0.10	29.50
07/06/20	KGUER	Emails with counsel re: rule 26(f) summary	B011	0.20	155.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: discovery	B011	0.10	77.50
07/06/20	KGUER	Review litigation summary	B011	0.20	155.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg and A. Mielke re: litigation summary	B011	0.10	77.50
07/06/20	MDOSS	Revise 9019 motion	B011	1.90	712.50
07/06/20	MDOSS	Call with A. Mielke re: 9019 motion	B011	0.50	187.50
07/06/20	TPAKR	Emails with Earth and CGT counsel re: Rule 26(f) Conference issues	B011	0.10	45.00
07/06/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Guerke re: Earth RFPs	B011	0.10	45.00
07/06/20	TPAKR	Emails with B. Olivere re: initial disclosure service issues	B011	0.10	45.00
07/07/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach (0.1) and A. Elkhoury (0.1) re: dismissal of adversary proceeding	B011	0.20	98.00
07/07/20	AMIEL	Review/revise quarterly status report (0.1); emails with B. Olivere and M. Neiburg re: same (0.1)	B011	0.20	98.00
07/07/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Cherian (0.2) and D. Wills (0.1) re: reimbursement of litigation fees	B011	0.30	147.00
07/07/20	AMIEL	Review comments to claim settlement motion (0.1); emails with M. Doss re: same (0.1)	B011	0.20	98.00
07/07/20	BOLIV	Prepare letter to clerk of court re U.S. District Court, Harrisburg, PA re Brunner Quarterly Status Report [.2]; prepare federal express service sheets to counsel for plaintiff and district court [.2]; prepare status report for delivery to same [.2]	B011	0.60	177.00
07/07/20	BOLIV	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co- counsel [Schmid Pipeline matter]	B011	0.20	59.00
07/07/20	MDOSS	Revise and distribute 9019 motion	B011	2.10	787.50
07/07/20	MNEIB	Review draft report for state court action (.1); emails with A. Mielke and B. Olivere re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	135.00

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 15 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/07/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Schmid Adversary Case	B011	0.10	83.50
07/07/20	TPAKR	Revise initial disclosure notice (.1); emails with B. Olivere re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	90.00
07/08/20	AMIEL	Review initial disclosures and send to YCST team	B011	0.10	49.00
07/08/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of service of initial disclosures of Welded	B011	0.20	59.00
07/08/20	BOLIV	Email service of initial disclosures and notice of service to Earth Pipeline and Columbia Gas	B011	0.20	59.00
07/08/20	BOLIV	Update notice of service to include Mayer Brown for discovery service	B011	0.20	59.00
07/08/20	KGUER	Emails with counsel re: initial disclosures and finalize same	B011	0.20	155.00
07/08/20	KGUER	Review Schmid notice of dismissal	B011	0.10	77.50
07/08/20	TPAKR	Emails with YCST re: CGT initial disclosures (Earth)	B011	0.10	45.00
07/08/20	TPAKR	Draft Earth RFP (4.0); emails with K. Guerke re: summary of same (.1)	B011	4.10	1,845.00
07/09/20	AMIEL	Review discovery requests (0.3); confer with K. Guerke re: same (0.1)	B011	0.40	196.00
07/09/20	KGUER	Emails with client re: discovery	B011	0.10	77.50
07/09/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke re: Sunbelt discovery	B011	0.10	77.50
07/09/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Sunbelt Discovery	B011	0.10	83.50
07/10/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Cherian re: reimbursement of litigation fees	B011	0.10	49.00
07/10/20	BFELD	Emails with A. Ralph re: claims asserted in Sunbelt lien actions	B011	0.30	124.50
07/13/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: misc. litigation strategy and discovery issues	B011	0.50	245.00
07/13/20	BOLIV	Circulate Columbia Gas' reply in support of motion to dismiss re Earth Pipeline adversary	B011	0.10	29.50
07/13/20	KGUER	Review Sunbelt discovery requests	B011	0.50	387.50
07/13/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: discovery	B011	0.10	77.50
07/13/20	KGUER	Teleconference with A. Mielke re: Sunbelt discovery	B011	0.50	387.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 16 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/13/20	KGUER	Review CGT reply brief re: EPS	B011	0.30	232.50
07/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: scheduling issues	B011	0.20	135.00
07/13/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Neiburg re Transco motion to compel and hearing issues (.1); Review documents re same (.2)	B011	0.30	250.50
07/13/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Guerke re: Earth RFP issues	B011	0.10	45.00
07/14/20	MDOSS	Revise 9019 motion	B011	0.50	187.50
07/14/20	SBEAC	Work with M. Neiburg re Transco motion to compel	B011	0.20	167.00
07/15/20	AMIEL	Emails w/S. Cherian re: invoice for fee reimbursement	B011	0.10	49.00
07/15/20	AMIEL	Emails w/L. Fortunato and J. Krzysztofik re: litigation issues	B011	0.20	98.00
07/15/20	KGUER	Review discovery requests and background project documents re: same	B011	1.00	775.00
07/15/20	MDOSS	Emails with A. Mielke re: 9019 motion	B011	0.20	75.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: discovery-related motion and procedural issues	B011	0.20	135.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan, S. Hawkins and M. Hood re: discovery issues	B011	0.20	135.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B011	0.50	337.50
07/15/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke, M. Neiburg, and K. Guerke re: Motion to Compel	B011	0.20	167.00
07/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Cherian re: invoice for reimbursement of litigation fees	B011	0.10	49.00
07/16/20	AMIEL	Teleconference w. J. Krzysztofik, M. Hood, and K. Guerke re: adversary proceeding discovery	B011	0.60	294.00
07/16/20	AMIEL	Review discovery information (0.8) and draft responses to discovery requests (1.1)	B011	1.90	931.00
07/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik and M. Hood re: discovery for adversary proceeding	B011	0.10	49.00
07/16/20	KGUER	Review hearing notice	B011	0.10	77.50
07/16/20	KGUER	Teleconference with client re: sunbelt discovery	B011	0.60	465.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 17 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/16/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke re: background on sunbelt	B011	0.60	465.00
07/16/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke re: background on sunbelt	B011	0.10	77.50
07/17/20	AMIEL	Draft responses to discovery requests and review materials in connection with same	B011	2.90	1,421.00
07/17/20	AMIEL	Review/revise invoice and supporting documentation for reimbursement of litigation fees (0.5); emails with S. Cherian re: same (0.1); emails with YCST team re: same (0.1)	B011	0.70	343.00
07/17/20	KGUER	Review project documents	B011	0.40	310.00
07/17/20	KGUER	Draft discovery requests	B011	0.60	465.00
07/17/20	KGUER	Review and revise discovery requests	B011	0.30	232.50
07/17/20	KGUER	Emails with S. Beach and A. Mielke re: schmid status	B011	0.10	77.50
07/18/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: discovery	B011	0.10	77.50
07/18/20	KGUER	Review notice of substitution of counsel and request for oral argument	B011	0.10	77.50
07/18/20	KGUER	Draft discovery	B011	0.90	697.50
07/18/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Guerke re: Earth RFP issues	B011	0.10	45.00
07/19/20	SBEAC	Emails with T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: motion to compel (.1); Review and revise same (.4)	B011	0.50	417.50
07/20/20	AMIEL	Emails with YCST team re: comments to invoice for reimbursement of litigation fees (0.1); compile and send same (0.1)	B011	0.20	98.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Review Columbia Gas' discovery requests	B011	0.40	196.00
07/21/20	KGUER	Email with T. Pakrouh re: discovery	B011	0.10	77.50
07/21/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh and M. Doss re: claims analysis	B011	0.20	155.00
07/21/20	KGUER	Review schmid project docs	B011	0.10	77.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Email with T. Buchanan re: Motion to Compel Production of Audit Documents	B011	0.10	83.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 18 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with J. Lucian, M. Neiburg and K. Guerke re Motion to Compel Production of Audit Documents (.2); Review and revise documents re same (.2); Work with M. Neiburg re same (.1)	B011	0.50	417.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Call with K. Guerke re: EPS and other open litigation issues	B011	0.50	417.50
07/21/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Guerke and M. Doss re: objection to Schmid POC issues	B011	0.10	45.00
07/21/20	TPAKR	Incorporate K. Guerke's comments and further revise/draft Earth RFPS (1.5); emails with K. Guerke re: summary of same (.1)	B011	1.60	720.00
07/22/20	KGUER	Review discovery directed to sunbelt	B011	0.30	232.50
07/22/20	KGUER	Email with A. Mielke re: discovery directed to sunbelt	B011	0.10	77.50
07/23/20	KGUER	Teleconference with YCST team re: planning and strategy	B011	0.60	465.00
07/23/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues and planning	B011	0.30	232.50
07/23/20	KGUER	Review letter from counsel	B011	0.10	77.50
07/23/20	KGUER	Email with counsel re: redactions	B011	0.10	77.50
07/23/20	KGUER	Review document production and discovery issues	B011	2.90	2,247.50
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere re: invoices for reimbursement of litigation fees	B011	0.10	49.00
07/25/20	KGUER	Review critical dates calendar	B011	0.10	77.50
07/25/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery and document production	B011	0.20	155.00
07/25/20	MNEIB	Email from L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B011	0.10	67.50
07/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal (0.1) and J. Krzysztofik (0.1) re: bank account transition	B011	0.20	98.00
07/27/20	AMIEL	Review Bechtel's information request in connection with arbitration of C. States claim (0.2); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B011	0.30	147.00
07/27/20	AMIEL	Review J. Kneeland's correspondence re: settlement motion document request	B011	0.10	49.00
07/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Collins re: response to counsel's discovery request	B011	0.10	49.00

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 19 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/27/20	TPAKR	Teleconference with M. Doss re: Schmid POC issues (.1); emails with K. Guerke re: same (.1)	B011	0.20	90.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach re: C. States claim diligence	B011	0.20	98.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach and M. Collins re: response to discovery request	B011	0.60	294.00
07/28/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Pakrouh and M. Doss re: claims analysis for EPS	B011	0.10	77.50
07/28/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti re: CC Diligence Call	B011	0.10	83.50
07/28/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Geurke and M. Doss re: Schmid POC issues	B011	0.10	45.00
07/28/20	TPAKR	Emails with K. Geurke re: Earth RFP issues	B011	0.10	45.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Draft letter response to request for discovery (1.1); teleconference with S. Beach and M. Collins re: same (0.3); emails with S. Beach, M. Collins and F. Pometti re: same (0.1)	B011	1.50	735.00
07/30/20	KGUER	Review project documents	B011	0.30	232.50
07/30/20	KGUER	Teleconference with T. Pakrouh and M. Doss	B011	0.40	310.00
07/30/20	TPAKR	Teleconference with K. Guerke and M. Doss re: Schmid POC issues (.5); review documents related to same (.2)	B011	0.70	315.00
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with D. Candeub and C. Hughes re: discovery deadline	B011	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere and B. Walters re: notice of hearing date	B011	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with K. Guerke re: discovery in adversary proceeding	B011	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	BOLIV	Circulate incoming opinion and order re Earth Pipeline adversary	B011	0.10	29.50
07/31/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re: sunbelt responses	B011	0.10	77.50
07/31/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke re: sunbelt discovery	B011	0.10	77.50
07/31/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Burwood and T. Schiltz re: OGCS document production issues	B011	0.20	135.00
07/31/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Marasco and K. Guerke re: motion to compel and OGCS document production	B011	0.20	135.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 20 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/31/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Fratticci and P. Foss re: OGCS document production issues	B011	0.20	135.00
07/31/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Schiltz re: OGCS document production	B011	0.20	135.00
07/31/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B011	0.30	202.50
07/31/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: opinion and order denying Mersino motion to intervene	B011	0.30	202.50
07/31/20	MNEIB	Emails with B. Daniels and L. Mann re: state court actions	B011	0.20	135.00
07/01/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal re: plan documents	B012	0.10	49.00
07/01/20	BFELD	Call with A. Mielke re: various transition issues	B012	0.20	83.00
07/01/20	MLUNN	Call with YCST team and Alix team re: transition memo and effective date issues	B012	1.20	954.00
07/03/20	MLUNN	Review revised / updated transition memo and related correspondence	B012	0.40	318.00
07/07/20	SBEAC	Call with F. Pometti re effective date issues	B012	0.10	83.50
07/10/20	BFELD	Participate in call with Blank Rome (J. Mintz and J. Lucian), Teneo, AlixPartners (F. Pometti and A. Ralph), and YCST (S. Beach, R. Poppiti, M. Lunn, and A. Mielke) re: various transition issues in advance of effective date	B012	1.50	622.50
07/13/20	BFELD	Emails with A. Ralph re: convenience class opt-in mechanism	B012	0.10	41.50
07/14/20	AMIEL	Draft transition checklist	B012	0.50	245.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Emails w/A. Ralph re: transition of bank accounts and reserves	B012	0.10	49.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Emails w/M. Rosenthal, S. Beach, and F. Pometti re: plan settlement payment	B012	0.10	49.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Review and upload documents to data room in connection with transition diligence	B012	2.10	1,029.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Emails w/T. Buchanan re: diligence materials for transition	B012	0.10	49.00
07/15/20	AMIEL	Review/comment on committee's transition tracker	B012	1.10	539.00
07/15/20	AMIEL	Confer w/J. Mintz re: transition issues	B012	0.20	98.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 21 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/15/20	AMIEL	Review plan and analyze reserve provisions (0.7); emails w/S. Beach (0.2), A. Ralph (0.1) and J. Mintz (0.1) re: same	B012	1.10	539.00
07/15/20	AMIEL	Confer w/A. Ralph re: transition issues	B012	0.10	49.00
07/15/20	SBEAC	Review and revise Plan Administrator Dashboard	B012	0.30	250.50
07/17/20	AMIEL	Review reserve analysis (0.1); emails with YCST and AlixPartners teams re: same (0.1)	B012	0.20	98.00
07/17/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: transition issues	B012	0.10	49.00
07/17/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with Blank Rome and YCST teams re: plan effective date and transition	B012	0.50	245.00
07/17/20	BFELD	Participate in call with YCST (S. Beach, A. Mielke), AlixPartners (A. Ralph, F. Pometti), Blank Rome (M. Schaedle, J. Lucian, J. Mintz), and Plan Administrator professionals (C. Speckhart, A. Stepanyants) re: various transition items	B012	0.50	207.50
07/17/20	BFELD	Emails with S. Beach and A. Ralph re: utility adequate assurance deposit in regard to plan reserves	B012	0.10	41.50
07/21/20	AMIEL	Confer with S. Beach re: effective date issues	B012	0.20	98.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with YCST, AlixPartners, Teneo, Blank Rome teams and plan administrator re: effective date and transition	B012	0.40	196.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: engagement letter for post-effective date debtors	B012	0.10	49.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Revise plan administrator agreement	B012	0.20	98.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Revise notice of effective date (0.3); emails with M. Doss re: same (0.1)	B012	0.40	196.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal re: corporate governance issues in connection with wind down	B012	0.10	49.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Feldman re: transition diligence	B012	0.10	49.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with AlixPartners team re: bank account transition in advance of effective date	B012	0.10	49.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Review CRO's resignation letter in connection with effective date preparation	B012	0.10	49.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 22 of 65

<u>Date</u> 07/21/20	<u>Initials</u> AMIEL	<u>Description</u> Confer with J. Mintz re: effective date	<u>Task</u> B012	<u>Hours</u> 0.20	<u>Amount</u> 98.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	issues	B012	0.20	98.00
07/21/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz (0.1), F. Pometti (0.1) and S. Beach (0.1) re: plan administrator agreement	B012	0.30	147.00
07/21/20	MDOSS	Draft notice of effective date	B012	1.10	412.50
07/21/20	MLUNN	Review revised plan administrator agreement and related correspondence	B012	0.30	238.50
07/21/20	RFPOP	Review redline of proposed revisions to proposed plan administration agreement, and emails to and from S. Beach, M. Lunn, and A. Mielke re: same	B012	0.20	137.00
07/21/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal, M. Kelsey, and A. Mielke re: Effective Date	B012	0.20	167.00
07/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Kelsey and M. Rosenthal re: effective date issues	B012	0.10	49.00
07/22/20	AMIEL	Confer with J. Krzysztofik re: bank account issues related to effective date transition	B012	0.20	98.00
07/22/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with S. Beach re: effective date issues	B012	0.20	98.00
07/22/20	AMIEL	Confer with J. Mintz re: effective date issues	B012	0.30	147.00
07/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with AlixPartners team (0.1), J. Mintz (0.2) and J. Krzysztofik (0.2) re: effective date issues	B012	0.50	245.00
07/22/20	AMIEL	Review/revise bank account transition forms	B012	0.90	441.00
07/22/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and A. Ralph re: effective date issues	B012	0.10	49.00
07/23/20	AMIEL	Review committee comments to engagement letter in connection with effective date issues	B012	0.10	49.00
07/23/20	AMIEL	Emails with Bank representative about bank account documentation	B012	0.10	49.00
07/23/20	AMIEL	Review/revise bank account documentation (0.2); emails with F. Pometti and J. Krzysztofik re: same (0.1)	B012	0.30	147.00
07/23/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with J. Krzysztofik and bank re: transfer of bank accounts	B012	0.40	196.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal re: bank account transition and signatures	B012	0.20	98.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: effective date	B012	0.10	49.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 23 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/24/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re transferring bank accounts and addressing other effective date issues	B012	0.10	83.50
07/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz (0.1) and A. Ralph (0.1) and F. Pometti (0.1) re: plan effective date issues	B012	0.30	147.00
07/27/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach re: status of effective date action items	B012	0.10	49.00
07/27/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Rosenthal and A. Mielke re: Plan Closing	B012	0.10	83.50
07/27/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re bank account, board resignations and effective date issues	B012	0.20	167.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with R. Gratton re: approval of bank account transition paperwork	B012	0.10	49.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti re: effective date issues	B012	0.10	49.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik re: status of bank account transition	B012	0.10	49.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal re: transition of bank accounts	B012	0.10	49.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: transition issues	B012	0.10	49.00
07/28/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Collins re: effective date issues	B012	0.10	83.50
07/29/20	AMIEL	Confer with J. Krzysztofik re: bank account transition	B012	0.10	49.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal, H. Krzysztofik, S. Beach, A. Ralph re: bank account issues	B012	0.20	98.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal re: bank account transition	B012	0.20	98.00
07/29/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz and F. Pometti re: engagement letter for post-effective date work	B012	0.10	49.00
07/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal re: signatures to bank documents (0.1); revise documents re: same (0.2); emails with J. Krzysztofik and C. Speckhart re: same (0.2); emails with S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B012	0.60	294.00
07/30/20	AMIEL	Revise notice of effective date and send to interested parties (0.1); emails with J. Mintz and F. Pometti re: same (0.1)	B012	0.20	98.00
07/30/20	RFPOP	Email from A. Mielke re: plan effective date issues	B012	0.10	68.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 24 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
07/30/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Notice of Effective Date	B012	0.10	83.50
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Krzysztofik and F. Pometti re: bank account transition	B012	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with F. Pometti and A. Ralph reconference call to discuss effective date	B012	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with M. Rosenthal and M. Kelsey re: effective date	B012	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: plan administrator agreement	B012	0.10	49.00
07/31/20	AMIEL	Teleconference with AlixPartners, Blank Rome, YCST teams and M. Rosenthal re: effective date	B012	0.30	147.00
07/31/20	RFPOP	Email to and from company's insurance broker re: plan effective date issues	B012	0.20	137.00
07/31/20	SBEAC	Emails with M. Rosenthal re Welded Effective Date	B012	0.10	83.50
07/31/20	SBEAC	Call with S. Hawkins re plan effective date and go forward issues	B012	0.20	167.00
07/31/20	SBEAC	Emails with J. Mintz, C. Speckhart and debtor team re effective date, bank accounts and professional engagement letters (.4); Review documents re same (.4)	B012	0.80	668.00
07/31/20	SBEAC	Call with debtor and committee professionals re plan effective date issues (.3); Followup call with A. Mielke re same (.2)	B012	0.50	417.50
07/27/20	SBEAC	Email with Mr. Camson re: Plan Administrator and claim inquiry	B013	0.10	83.50
07/06/20	AMIEL	Review resignation letter	B014	0.10	49.00
07/24/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Beach and M. Rosenthal re: board composition (0.1); revise documents re: same (0.2)	B014	0.30	147.00
07/24/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke and M. Rosenthal re Welded Board Update	B014	0.10	83.50
07/31/20	SBEAC	Emails with F. Pometti and board members re effective date and board/officer resignations; Review same	B014	0.20	167.00
06/02/20	TSNYD	Emails fro/email to R. Poppiti re: testing 401(k) Plan	B015	0.30	172.50
06/05/20	TSNYD	Emails from J. Krzysztofik re: test by TAG	B015	0.20	115.00
06/06/20	TSNYD	Email from/to J. Krzysztofik re: TAG testing	B015	0.20	115.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 25 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
06/19/20	TSNYD	Email from J. Krzysztofik re: follow up to TAG re: testing	B015	0.10	57.50
06/24/20	TSNYD	Email from Shawna Carey-Parker at TAG re: testing	B015	0.10	57.50
06/24/20	TSNYD	Email from J. Krzysztofik re: response from TAG re: testing	B015	0.10	57.50
07/02/20	RFPOP	Email to and from company (Jackie Krzysztofik) re: 401(k) termination issues	B015	0.10	68.50
07/02/20	TSNYD	Email from R. Poppiti re: Testing	B015	0.10	57.50
07/02/20	TSNYD	Email from Jackie Krzysztofik re: 2019 401(k) Plan Testing	B015	0.10	57.50
07/03/20	RFPOP	Email from T. Snyder re: 401(k) plan termination issues	B015	0.10	68.50
07/03/20	TSNYD	EReview 401(k) Trueup Report	B015	0.50	287.50
07/04/20	TSNYD	Email from J. Krzysztofik re: matching contributions	B015	0.10	57.50
07/06/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from T. Snyder and company (Jackie Krzysztofik) re: 401(k) termination issues	B015	0.20	137.00
07/06/20	SBEAC	Review and revise Resignation from Officer Role (.1); Emails with F. Pometti re same (.1)	B015	0.20	167.00
07/06/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti, R. Poppiti, A. Mielke, M. Lunn, and B. Feldman re: CRO Resignation Letter	B015	0.10	83.50
07/06/20	TSNYD	Composed email to J Krzysztofik RE:2019 Compliance Testing Results and Variance Report Welded Construction, L.P	B015	0.30	172.50
07/06/20	TSNYD	Review adoption agreement and excluded compensation listing for 401(k) Plan	B015	0.20	115.00
07/06/20	TSNYD	Email from Jackie Krzysztofik with Adoption Agreement and other documents	B015	0.10	57.50
07/06/20	TSNYD	Emails from/to R. Poppiti re: matching true up	B015	0.30	172.50
07/06/20	TSNYD	Compose email to Jackie Krzysztofik re: definition of compensation for deferrals and matching contributions.	B015	0.10	57.50
07/07/20	RFPOP	Emails from T. Snyder and company (Jackie Krzysztofik) re: 401(k) termination issues	B015	0.20	137.00
07/07/20	SBEAC	Email with F. Pometti re: CRO Resignation Letter	B015	0.10	83.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 26 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/07/20	TSNYD	Email from J. Krzysztofik with missed deferrals spread sheet	B015	0.10	57.50
07/07/20	TSNYD	T/C with J. Krzysztofik re: testing spread sheet	B015	0.30	172.50
07/07/20	TSNYD	Compose detailed email to J. Krzysztofik re: correction of missed deferrals	B015	0.20	115.00
07/07/20	TSNYD	Revise spreadsheet to reflect missed deferrals, true up and additional matching contributions	B015	2.20	1,265.00
07/08/20	TSNYD	Read email from/Composed email to J Krzysztofik; F. Pometti and Poppiti, Robert regarding 2019 Compliance Testing	B015	0.50	287.50
07/09/20	RFPOP	Email to and from T. Snyder re: 401(k) plan termination issues	B015	0.10	68.50
07/09/20	TSNYD	Emails from/to R. Poppiti re 401(k) Plan correction	B015	0.30	172.50
07/16/20	TSNYD	Email from/ to J. Krzysztofik re: call regarding TAG	B015	0.20	115.00
07/16/20	TSNYD	T/C with J. Krzysztofik re: TAG	B015	0.20	115.00
07/17/20	RFPOP	Emails to and from company (Jackie Krzysztofik) and Zolfo (Frank Pometti) re: 401(k) termination issues	B015	0.10	68.50
07/17/20	TSNYD	Email from R. Poppiti regarding match true up and correction	B015	0.10	57.50
07/17/20	TSNYD	Email from F. Pometti re: true up and correction	B015	0.10	57.50
06/05/20	BOLIV	Send draft certificate of no objection re: 18th fee application of YCST to A. Mielke for approval to file	B017	0.10	29.50
07/01/20	BOLIV	Send LEDES file for YCST's May 2020 fee application to the US Trustee	B017	0.10	29.50
07/02/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Committee Expense Reimbursement Application	B017	0.10	83.50
07/07/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz and S. Beach re: fee applications	B017	0.10	49.00
07/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with S. Cherian re: invoice for reimbursement of professional fees	B017	0.10	49.00
07/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Olivere and S. Beach re: fee applications	B017	0.10	49.00
07/08/20	AMIEL	Emails with A. Ralph and S. Beach re: professional fees	B017	0.10	49.00
07/13/20	BFELD	Finalize for filing re: Zolfo Cooper June staffing report	B017	0.20	83.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 27 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/13/20	BOLIV	Draft notice re Zolfo Cooper June staffing report	B017	0.20	59.00
07/13/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of June 2020 monthly staffing report for Zolfo Cooper	B017	0.40	118.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Emails w/B. Olivere re: timing of filing fee applications	B017	0.10	49.00
07/14/20	AMIEL	Emails w/T. Pakrouh re: quarterly statement of ordinary course professional fees	B017	0.10	49.00
07/14/20	TPAKR	Emails with A. Mielke re: OCP notice issues (.1); emails with AlixPartners re: same (.1)	B017	0.20	90.00
07/15/20	AMIEL	Emails w/S. Beach and B. Olivere re: fee application	B017	0.10	49.00
07/15/20	BOLIV	Emails with A. Mielke re timing of filing 7th interim fee request and drafting of same	B017	0.10	29.50
07/16/20	AMIEL	Emails with J. Mintz re: interim fee application	B017	0.10	49.00
07/16/20	AMIEL	Review CNO for monthly fee application	B017	0.10	49.00
07/16/20	BOLIV	Draft CNO re 19th fee application of YCST	B017	0.20	59.00
07/17/20	BOLIV	Email chambers requesting permission for fee hearing on 8/13/20	B017	0.10	29.50
07/17/20	BOLIV	Request LEDES file from accounting for June 2020	B017	0.10	29.50
07/20/20	AMIEL	Review and revise interim fee request and supplement (1.5); emails with B. Olivere re: same (0.2); emails with J. Cree re: same (0.1); emails with R. Poppiti and S. Beach re: same (0.1)	B017	1.90	931.00
07/20/20	RFPOP	Email to and from A. Mielke re: interim fee application	B017	0.10	68.50
07/21/20	BOLIV	Send June 2020 invoice to accounting for creation of LEDES file	B017	0.10	29.50
07/22/20	BOLIV	Send LEDES file to YCST's June 2020 fee application to US Trustee	B017	0.10	29.50
07/22/20	TPAKR	Emails with AlixPartners re: OCP notice issues	B017	0.10	45.00
07/22/20	TPAKR	Emails with AlixPartners re: OCP notice issues	B017	0.10	45.00
07/23/20	SBEAC	Review and revise AlixPartners engagement letter	B017	0.10	83.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 28 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/26/20	TPAKR	Emails with AlixPartners re: OCP notice issues	B017	0.10	45.00
07/27/20	RFPOP	Review and comment on draft Q2 2020 ordinary course professional report, and email to and from T. Pakrouh re: same	B017	0.10	68.50
07/27/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Committee Member Expenses and Committee Professionals Monthly Fees	B017	0.10	83.50
07/27/20	TPAKR	Draft OCP statement (.2); emails with R. Poppiti re: OCP statement (.1)	B017	0.30	135.00
07/28/20	AMIEL	Emails with B. Hall re: payment of monthly fee application	B017	0.10	49.00
07/29/20	SBEAC	Email with J. Mintz re: AlixPartners Post- Effective Draft Engagement Letter	B017	0.10	83.50
07/30/20	AMIEL	Emails with T. Pakrouh re: OCP statement	B017	0.10	49.00
07/30/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of supplemental OCP declaration of Blooster	B017	0.40	118.00
07/07/20	SBEAC	Email with M. Lunn, B. Feldman, A. Mielke, and R. Poppiti re: fee app timing	B018	0.10	83.50
07/08/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: professional fee issues	B018	0.10	83.50
07/11/20	MNEIB	Emails with R. Poppiti and S. Beach re: June invoice and related issues	B018	0.20	135.00
07/11/20	RFPOP	Review invoice for YCST June 2020 monthly fee application re: confidentiality and local rule compliance, and emails to and from S. Beach re: same	B018	0.50	342.50
07/11/20	SBEAC	Review and revise YCST June invoice re privilege, local rule and UST compliance issues (1.2); Emails with R. Poppiti and M Neiburg re same (.2)	B018	1.40	1,169.00
07/15/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of YCST June 2020 fee application	B018	0.50	147.50
07/15/20	BOLIV	Draft June 2020 fee application for YCST	B018	1.60	472.00
07/15/20	SBEAC	Review and revise YCST Twentieth 20th June 20 Monthly Fee Application re confidentiality, privilege and compliance with local rules	B018	0.40	334.00
07/15/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke and B. Olivere re: quarterly fee application	B018	0.10	83.50
07/16/20	BOLIV	Enter all data from April and May fee applications into excel chart for preparations of 7th interim fee request	B018	2.70	796.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 29 of 65

<b>Date</b>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	Amount
07/17/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of CNO re 19th fee application of YCST	B018	0.20	59.00
07/17/20	BOLIV	Draft supplement to YCST's 7th interim fee request	B018	2.00	590.00
07/17/20	BOLIV	Draft 7th interim quarterly fee request of debtors professionals for April through June 2020	B018	0.70	206.50
07/17/20	BOLIV	Further entry of fee information into excel chart in preparation of drafting 7th interim fee request of YCST	B018	0.50	147.50
07/18/20	BOLIV	Draft/finalize supplement to YCST's 7th interim fee request for April 1, 2020 through June 30, 2020	B018	2.00	590.00
07/20/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of supplement to Young Conaway's 7th interim fee request	B018	0.40	118.00
07/20/20	BOLIV	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 7th interim fee request of debtors professionals	B018	0.30	88.50
07/20/20	BOLIV	Update 7th interim fee request of debtor's professionals with new fee app information filed by Landis Rath	B018	0.40	118.00
07/20/20	BOLIV	Emails with AMIEL re supplement to YCST's 7th fee request	B018	0.20	59.00
07/20/20	SBEAC	Email with A. Mielke re: Interim Fee App	B018	0.10	83.50
07/21/20	SBEAC	Emails with A. Mielke re Interim Fee App	B018	0.10	83.50
07/01/20	EEDWA	Multiple emails with K. Guerke, M. Neiburg, and L. Fortunato re: crafting new searches of Transco production (.4); analyze Williams litigation discovery issues (.5); analyze Transco production documents (3.6)	B768	4.50	3,217.50
07/01/20	KGUER	Email A. Mielke re: consultant	B768	0.10	77.50
07/01/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery and document production issues	B768	0.40	310.00
07/01/20	KGUER	Review project documents	B768	0.70	542.50
07/01/20	LFORT	Preparing and transmitting documents to consultant (.5); emails with YCST team and DLS re: same (.1); review emails between YCST team re: upload of documents (.1); emails with YCST and DLS re: search of incoming production, review searches (.4)	B768	1.10	577.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 30 of 65

<b>Date</b> 07/01/20	<u>Initials</u> MDOSS	<u>Description</u> Review documents produced by Transco	<u>Task</u> B768	<u>Hours</u> 4.50	<b>Amount</b> 1,687.50
07/01/20	MDOSS	Research and draft memo re: privilege	B768	6.60	2,475.00
07/01/20	MNEIB	issues Emails with L. Fortunato and K. Guerke re: document review issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/01/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss re: document review issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/01/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: document review and production issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/01/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/01/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: e-discovery issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/01/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke re: case status and discovery next steps	B768	0.10	67.50
07/01/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/01/20	TBUCH	Analysis re: litigation strategy issues (1.4); teleconference with N. Trager re: research issues (.4)	B768	1.80	1,071.00
07/02/20	EEDWA	Multiple emails with K. Guerke and L. Fortunato re: documents for consultants (.2); multiple emails with M. Neiburg and L. Fortunato re: Transco production searches (.2)	B768	0.40	286.00
07/02/20	JMARA	Review correspondence re: discovery and document review issues	B768	0.20	105.00
07/02/20	KGUER	Review document production and discovery file	B768	2.30	1,782.50
07/02/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with J. Marasco and M. Doss re: research memo	B768	0.20	155.00
07/02/20	KGUER	Review memo re: legal research	B768	0.40	310.00
07/02/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg and T. Buchanan re: discovery	B768	0.20	155.00
07/02/20	KGUER	Draft litigation strategy memo	B768	0.50	387.50
07/02/20	KGUER	Emails with OGCS's counsel	B768	0.10	77.50
07/02/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery, doc production, and litigation strategy	B768	0.50	387.50

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/02/20	KGUER	Teleconference with L. Fortunato re: discovery	B768	0.20	155.00
07/02/20	KGUER	Email with consultant	B768	0.10	77.50
07/02/20	KGUER	Teleconference with M. Neiburg re: discovery planning	B768	0.30	232.50
07/02/20	LFORT	Review documents for production, including performing reconciliation searches and documentation of same and emails with YCST team re: review and production of documents (3.6); emails with DLS re: searches, export of data and other discovery issues (1.0); emails with consultants re: documents (.3); compile documents for consultants and preserve copies of same (.5); emails with YCST team re: scheduling call (.1); emails with YCST team re: requested document searches of incoming Transco production (.1); emails with M. Neiburg and E. Edwards re: reconciliation of documents for production (.1); call and email with M. Doss re: review of documents (.2); call with K. Guerke re: compilation of data for consultant and emails with YCST team re: same (.3)	B768	6.20	3,255.00
07/02/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	1.10	412.50
07/02/20	MDOSS	Research re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	37.50
07/02/20	MDOSS	Emails with K. Guerke and J. Marasco re: research	B768	0.10	37.50
07/02/20	MDOSS	Emails and call with L. Fortunato re: review of Transco production	B768	0.20	75.00
07/02/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: discovery status and strategy issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/02/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Schiltz re: subpoena to OGCS	B768	0.10	67.50
07/02/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and others on YCST team re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/02/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss and T. Mercer re: document review issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/02/20	MNEIB	Emails with YCST team re: discovery status and strategy issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/02/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document search and review issues	B768	0.80	540.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 32 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/02/20	MNEIB	Emails with E. Edwards, K. Guerke and L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/02/20	TBUCH	Analysis re: discovery and litigation strategy issues	B768	4.40	2,618.00
07/03/20	EEDWA	Teleconference with M. Neiburg, T. Buchanan, L. Fortunato, and M. Doss re: Transco production analysis	B768	0.40	286.00
07/03/20	KGUER	Emails with consultant	B768	0.10	77.50
07/03/20	KGUER	Review project documents	B768	2.20	1,705.00
07/03/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/03/20	LFORT	Reconcile documents for production, including emails with M. Neiburg re: same (3.2); YCST team call (.4)	B768	3.60	1,890.00
07/03/20	MDOSS	Call with M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, T. Buchanan, and L. Fortunato re: review of Transco production	B768	0.40	150.00
07/03/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	0.20	75.00
07/03/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: case status and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/03/20	MNEIB	Call with litigation team re: discovery status and strategy issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/03/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/03/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/03/20	MNEIB	Email from T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/03/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/03/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, L. Fortunato, and M. Doss re: issues related to discovery (.4); research related to same (.2)	B768	0.60	357.00
07/04/20	JMARA	Emails with K. Guerke re: motion to compel	B768	0.10	52.50
07/04/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: discovery	B768	0.10	77.50
07/04/20	KGUER	Emails with J. Marasco re: legal strategy issues	B768	0.10	77.50

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	Amount
07/04/20	KGUER	Review discovery production	B768	1.40	1,085.00
07/04/20	KGUER	Review project documents	B768	0.50	387.50
07/04/20	LFORT	Review documents for production	B768	2.30	1,207.50
07/05/20	JMARA	Review M. Doss memo re: motion to compel and compose email to K. Guerke re: same	B768	0.40	210.00
07/05/20	KGUER	Review discovery production	B768	1.20	930.00
07/05/20	KGUER	Emails with J. Marasco re: legal research	B768	0.10	77.50
07/05/20	LFORT	Review documents for production, including reconciliation searches	B768	1.60	840.00
07/05/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	0.90	337.50
07/06/20	EEDWA	Teleconference with K. Guerke re: litigation strategy and planning (.4); review ASR Project documents (4.1); multiple emails with L. Fortunato and M. Neiburg re: document production cleanup issues (.1); team emails re: task list updates and call planning (.1); multiple emails with M. Neiburg and L. Fortunato re: privilege log preparation (.1)	B768	4.80	3,432.00
07/06/20	JMARA	Draft motion to compel (2.4); call with K. Guerke re: same (.6); emails with M. Neiburg re: litigation updates and internal correspondence re: call to discuss same (.2)	B768	3.20	1,680.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Teleconference with E. Edwards re: litigation issues	B768	0.40	310.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Review summary of discovery issues	B768	0.40	310.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg re: litigation strategy and status	B768	0.20	155.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: document production and discovery issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Review ASR project documents	B768	1.00	775.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg and T. Buchanan re: consultant	B768	0.20	155.00
07/06/20	KGUER	Teleconference J. Marasco re: discovery issues	B768	0.70	542.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 34 of 65

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	Amount
07/06/20	KGUER	Emails with counsel re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	77.50
07/06/20	KGUER	Emails with J. Marasco re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/06/20	LFORT	Review documents for production, including drafting summary email re: same to YCST team (1.1); emails with YCST team re: case status and outstanding tasks (.1); emails and call with DLS re: privilege log (.3); emails re: privilege log with M. Neiburg and E. Edwards (.1); review Relativity privilege log setup and review documents for privilege (.3); email to B. Feldman and A. Mielke re: discovery issues (.1); emails with M. Neiburg re: DLS searches (.1); review documents for privilege, including review of document review memorandum (1.3)	B768	3.40	1,785.00
07/06/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	1.70	637.50
07/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and B. Olivere re: litigation summary and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with YCST litigation team re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/06/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents in preparation for production to Transco	B768	2.10	1,417.50
07/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with consultant re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/06/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with K. Guerke, consultant and T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/06/20	MNEIB	Review and revise litigation summary document (.4); emails with A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: same (.1)	B768	0.50	337.50
07/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: privilege logs and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/06/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and L. Fortunato re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/06/20	TBUCH	Analysis re: litigation strategy issues	B768	3.00	1,785.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 35 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/07/20	EEDWA	Teleconference with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, T. Buchanan, L. Fortunato, J. Marasco, and M. Doss re: discovery analysis (.9); review ASR project documents (3.4)	B768	4.30	3,074.50
07/07/20	JMARA	Draft motion to compel (4.8); call with internal team re: e-discovery (.6); follow-up call with E. Edwards and M. Doss re: doc review (.2)	B768	5.60	2,940.00
07/07/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: analysis	B768	0.20	155.00
07/07/20	KGUER	Review litigation data	B768	0.30	232.50
07/07/20	KGUER	Review task list and work plan	B768	0.20	155.00
07/07/20	KGUER	Emails with client re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	77.50
07/07/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues and planning	B768	0.20	155.00
07/07/20	KGUER	Teleconference with YCST team re: work plan and litigation	B768	0.70	542.50
07/07/20	KGUER	Review project documents and draft analysis	B768	3.00	2,325.00
07/07/20	KGUER	Teleconference with YCST team re: discovery issues and strategy	B768	0.50	387.50
07/07/20	LFORT	YCST team call re: discovery (.8); emails with DLS re: Transco incoming productions (.2); review documents, including preparing document searches and emails with M. Neiburg re: same (.4); review Transco responses to interrogatories (.2); emails with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: Transco documents (.1)	B768	1.70	892.50
07/07/20	MDOSS	Call with YCST litigation team re: review of Transco production	B768	0.90	337.50
07/07/20	MNEIB	Call with YCST litigation team re: discovery status and strategy issues	B768	0.70	472.50
07/07/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents in preparation for production to Transco	B768	1.30	877.50
07/07/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review and search issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/07/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Hood re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 36 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/07/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, L. Fortunato, J. Marasco, and M. Doss re: discovery and open issues (.7); teleconference with M. Neiburg and K. Guerke re: case strategy and open issues (.5); research related to litigation strategy (.4)	B768	1.60	952.00
07/08/20	JMARA	Draft motion to compel (4.5) and emails with K. Guerke re: same (.1); emails with L. Fortunato and M. Doss re: litigation drivers and task list updates (.2)	B768	4.80	2,520.00
07/08/20	KGUER	Review research on legal issue	B768	0.60	465.00
07/08/20	KGUER	Emails with J. Marasco re: research	B768	0.20	155.00
07/08/20	KGUER	Emails with L. Fortunato re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/08/20	KGUER	Meeting with M. Neiburg and E. Edwards re: litigation planning	B768	1.00	775.00
07/08/20	KGUER	Review document production and project documents	B768	0.60	465.00
07/08/20	LFORT	Emails with K. Guerke re: Transco incoming production (.1); calls with DLS re: running searches (.8); review and update case task list and emails with J. Marasco and M. Doss re: same (2.4); download and review documents sent to consultant (.2); emails with DLS re: documents sent to consultant (.1); email to consultant re: additional documents (.1)	B768	3.70	1,942.50
07/08/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	0.60	225.00
07/08/20	MDOSS	Research re: discovery issues	B768	0.80	300.00
07/08/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/08/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/08/20	MNEIB	Call with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/08/20	MNEIB	Meeting with K. Guerke and E. Edwards re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.80	540.00
07/08/20	MNEIB	Review and revise draft responses and objections to Transco RFPs	B768	0.80	540.00
07/08/20	MNEIB	Email from M. Doss re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 37 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/08/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Hawkins and F. Pometti re: responses and objections to RFPs	B768	0.20	135.00
07/08/20	MNEIB	Emails with E. Edwards re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/08/20	MNEIB	Review ASR project documents	B768	0.70	472.50
07/08/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: Transco second RFPs	B768	0.40	270.00
07/08/20	TBUCH	Email correspondence from M. Neiburg re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	59.50
07/09/20	EEDWA	Teleconference with consultant, M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, and L. Fortunato re: information requests (.3); review ASR project documents (.9)	B768	1.20	858.00
07/09/20	JMARA	Update task list and email L. Fortunato re: same (1.8); incorporate K. Guerke comments to draft motion to compel (1.5); call with M. Neiburg re: upcoming assignment (.1); review correspondence re: document review and DLS directives (.2); call with K. Guerke re: motion to compel and meet and confer (.6)	B768	4.20	2,205.00
07/09/20	KGUER	Teleconference with consultant	B768	0.30	232.50
07/09/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: document production	B768	0.30	232.50
07/09/20	KGUER	Teleconference with J. Marasco re: legal research and related issues	B768	0.70	542.50
07/09/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues and planning	B768	0.20	155.00
07/09/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with client re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	77.50
07/09/20	KGUER	Review legal research memo	B768	0.50	387.50
07/09/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with opposing counsel re: production and discovery issues	B768	0.20	155.00

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

<u>Date</u> 07/09/20	Initials LFORT	Emails with J. Marasco and M. Doss re: litigation strategy document and updating of same (.1); review and update litigation strategy document (.1); review email from J. Marasco to T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: litigation strategy document (.1); review relativity re: Transco production and calls/emails with DLS re: same (.4); analysis document production and review issues and email to M. Neiburg re: same (.2); emails with YCST team re: call with consultant (.1); review emails from T. Buchanan re: onedrive documents (.1); emails with B. Olivere re: privilege logs (.1); call with consultant, M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: documents for consultant (.3); emails with M. Neiburg re: Transco incoming production no. 3 and review of same (.4); email to DLS requesting batching (.1); review and analyze documents sent to consultant (1.6)	<u>Task</u> B768	Hours 3.60	<u>Amount</u> 1,890.00
07/09/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	0.30	112.50
07/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: OGCS document production	B768	0.10	67.50
07/09/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents in preparation for production to Transco	B768	1.20	810.00
07/09/20	MNEIB	Review and revise draft responses to second RFPs	B768	0.60	405.00
07/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: Transco third production and document review issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with F. Pometti and A. Ralph re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: Transco second RFPs	B768	0.10	67.50
07/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/09/20	MNEIB	Call with K. Guerke, consultant and T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald re: Transco second RFPs	B768	0.10	67.50
07/09/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/09/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, and L. Fortunato re: litigation strategy and discovery issues (.3); research related to same (1.2)	B768	1.50	892.50
07/10/20	EEDWA	Multiple emails with L. Fortunato, M. Neiburg, and DLS re: fifth production (.3); multiple emails with team re: documents (.1); emails with M. Neiburg and L. Fortunato re: review of new Transco production searches (.1); review ASR project documents (5.1)	B768	5.60	4,004.00
07/10/20	JMARA	Internal correspondence re: document review (.2); review and incorporate T. Buchanan comments to task list and email M. Neiburg re: same (.3)	B768	0.50	262.50
07/10/20	KGUER	Emails with J. Marasco re: legal research	B768	0.10	77.50
07/10/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	232.50
07/10/20	KGUER	Review ASR project documents	B768	0.60	465.00
07/10/20	KGUER	Review and revise memo re: legal research	B768	1.70	1,317.50
07/10/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg re: meet and confer	B768	0.10	77.50
07/10/20	KGUER	Emails with counsel re: meet and confer	B768	0.10	77.50
07/10/20	LFORT	Emails with document reviewers re: transco production no 3 review (.2); emails with M. Neiburg re: review of Transco third production (.2); review email from DLS re: transco production no. 3 and review same on relativity (.1); review documents sent to consultant and emails with T. Buchanan re: same (1.1); review and prepare for production documents (1.1); emails with YCST team re: review of transco production no 3 (.1); emails with YCST team re: documents for consultants (.1); compile documents for consultant (3.2); call with T. Buchanan re: document for consultant (.1); review and revise litigation task list and emails with M. Neiburg re: same (.2); emails with K. Guerke re: document review platform (.1); emails with T. Buchanan and J. Krzysztofik re: sharepoint access (.1); call with M. Neiburg re review of documents (.1)	B768	6.70	3,517.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 40 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
07/10/20	LFORT	Review Welded production no. 6; send same to opposing counsel	B768	0.40	210.00
07/10/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	3.90	1,462.50
07/10/20	MMILA	Review documents in connection with Williams production	B768	0.40	160.00
07/10/20	MNEIB	Call with A. Ralph, F. Pometti and S. Hawkins re: Transco second RFPs and related discovery issues	B768	0.60	405.00
07/10/20	MNEIB	Review documents in connection with case analysis	B768	2.80	1,890.00
07/10/20	MNEIB	Call with L. Fortunato re: supplemental production to Transco	B768	0.10	67.50
07/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with document review team members re: review project	B768	0.20	135.00
07/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: discovery meet and confer	B768	0.10	67.50
07/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with E. Edwards and L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with F. Pometti re: second RFPs	B768	0.10	67.50
07/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/10/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/10/20	TBUCH	Analysis re: litigation strategy (2.1); teleconference with L. Fortunato re: same (.1); teleconference with N. Trager re: research related to choice-of-law (.3)	B768	2.50	1,487.50
07/11/20	JMARA	Review K. Guerke comments to motion to compel production (.3) and revise motion accordingly (6.7); email T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: same and procedural issues (.3); email B. Olivere re: hearing date (.1)	B768	7.40	3,885.00
07/11/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: document production	B768	0.10	77.50
07/11/20	KGUER	Review and revise legal issue document	B768	1.10	852.50
07/11/20	LFORT	Review Transco production document review memorandum (.8); compile documents for consultant (2.3); email to T. Buchanan re: sharepoint (.1)	B768	3.20	1,680.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 41 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
07/11/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Marasco and T. Buchanan re: draft discovery motion and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/11/20	TBUCH	Email correspondence (2x) with L. Fortunato re: discovery issues (.2); review analysis of privilege issues (.4)	B768	0.60	357.00
07/12/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/12/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re: meet and confer	B768	0.10	77.50
07/12/20	KGUER	Review legal issues and develop plan re: same	B768	0.30	232.50
07/12/20	LFORT	Compile documents for consultant	B768	1.30	682.50
07/12/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: discovery meet and confer	B768	0.10	67.50
07/12/20	TBUCH	Review and revise analysis of privilege issues	B768	8.40	4,998.00
07/13/20	JECKE	Document review team meeting	B768	0.20	75.00
07/13/20	JECKE	Document review: IP_TRANSCO_003 (Batch #1: 1-259)	B768	2.20	825.00
07/13/20	JGLAZ	Team conference call	B768	0.20	65.00
07/13/20	JGLAZ	Transco production 003 document review	B768	5.50	1,787.50
07/13/20	KGUER	Teleconference with counsel re: discovery meet and confer	B768	0.80	620.00
07/13/20	KGUER	Prepare for meet and confer with Transco's counsel, review discovery issues	B768	1.00	775.00
07/13/20	KGUER	Teleconferences with M. Neiburg re: meet and confer	B768	0.80	620.00
07/13/20	KGUER	Review ASR project documents	B768	0.40	310.00
07/13/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: litigation issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/13/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues document production	B768	0.20	155.00
07/13/20	KGUER	Review legal issues memo	B768	1.00	775.00
07/13/20	KGUER	Emails with OGCS counsel re: subpoena	B768	0.10	77.50
07/13/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg and S. Beach re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	77.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 42 of 65

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

<u>Date</u> 07/13/20	<u>Initials</u> LFORT	Description  Emails with DLS re: upload of documents (.2); draft email to YCST team re: documents for consultant and OneDrive (.3); call with YCST document review team re: review of Transco Production No. 3 (.2); emails with DLS re: production of documents to consultants (.3); review Transco incoming production (1.7); email to DLS re: additional documents (.2); emails with M. Neminski re: review of Transco No. 3 production (.1)	<u>Task</u> B768	<u>Hours</u> 3.00	<u>Amount</u> 1,575.00
07/13/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	0.40	150.00
07/13/20	MDOSS	Call with first level review team re: Transco production	B768	0.20	75.00
07/13/20	MDOSS	Research related to motion to compel	B768	2.00	750.00
07/13/20	MMILA	Call with Welded litigation team re: review of Transco incoming document production	B768	0.20	80.00
07/13/20	MMILA	Review Transco document production	B768	1.00	400.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Schiltz and K. Guerke re: OGCS subpoena	B768	0.20	135.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Email from L. Fortunato re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: litigation strategy issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Marasco and B. Olivere re: discovery-related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents in preparation for production to Transco	B768	2.30	1,552.50
07/13/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Call with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Ralph re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Call with K. Guerke re: discovery meet and confer	B768	0.40	270.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Call with A. Ralph re: Transco second RFPs and related issues	B768	0.40	270.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 43 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/13/20	MNEIB	Follow-up call with K. Guerke re: discovery issues and next steps	B768	0.50	337.50
07/13/20	MNEIB	Call with K. Guerke and S. Ewald re: discovery issues	B768	0.80	540.00
07/13/20	MNEIB	Call with L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/13/20	MNEMI	Email L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.20	75.00
07/13/20	MNEMI	Call with YCST team re: additional Transco production	B768	0.20	75.00
07/13/20	MNEMI	Review documents from additional Transco production	B768	5.70	2,137.50
07/13/20	SLEE	Call re: Transco's third production and discovery issues	B768	0.20	75.00
07/13/20	SLEE	Review documents from Transco production	B768	2.30	862.50
07/13/20	TBUCH	Review and revise analysis of legal issues (.9); teleconference with M. Neiburg re: litigation strategy and open issues (.2); review documents re: ASR project issues (3.6)	B768	4.70	2,796.50
07/14/20	CGJOH	Review incoming production review memo in preparation of reviewing additional Transco documents	B768	0.90	373.50
07/14/20	CGJOH	Review documents produced by Transco	B768	3.60	1,494.00
07/14/20	EEDWA	Review documents for potential production (.8); review ASR project documents (.7)	B768	1.50	1,072.50
07/14/20	JECKE	Document review: IP_TRANSCO_003 (Batch #2: 1-200)	B768	2.10	787.50
07/14/20	JECKE	Document review: IP_TRANSCO_003 (Batch #3: 1-201)	B768	1.70	637.50
07/14/20	JGLAZ	Transco production 003 document review	B768	3.40	1,105.00
07/14/20	JMARA	Review internal correspondence re: document review issues	B768	0.10	52.50
07/14/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	232.50
07/14/20	KGUER	Teleconference with M. Neiburg re: discovery	B768	0.20	155.00
07/14/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re: meet and confer follow up	B768	0.10	77.50
07/14/20	KGUER	Teleconference with OGCS's counsel re: subpoena	B768	0.20	155.00

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 44 of 65

<b>Date</b>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/14/20	LFORT	Review Transco production of documents (.6); emails with consultant re: requested documents (.1)	B768	0.70	367.50
07/14/20	LFORT	Review Transco Production No. 3 (.1); emails with DLS re: Transco Production No. 3 (.1); review email from J. Ecker re: review of Transco Production No. 3 (.1); review documents marked by M. Neiburg for production, including emails with M. Neiburg re: same (.4); emails with YCST team re: Transco Production No. 3 and emails with Transco counsel re: same (.5); review documents for production and for privilege and emails with YCST team and DLS re: same (3.3)	B768	4.50	2,362.50
07/14/20	MDOSS	Research related to legal analysis issues	B768	0.80	300.00
07/14/20	MMILA	Review of documents produced in connection with Williams adversary	B768	4.40	1,760.00
07/14/20	MNEIB	Review documents produced by Transco in connection with litigation strategy development	B768	1.20	810.00
07/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with document review team re: Transco production and review issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/14/20	MNEIB	Call with T. Schiltz and K. Guerke re: OGCS subpoena (.2); follow-up call with K. Guerke re: same (.2)	B768	0.40	270.00
07/14/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents in preparation for production to Transco	B768	1.30	877.50
07/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: discovery-related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/14/20	MNEIB	Email from L. Fortunato re: Transco document production issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with consultant and L. Fortunato re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/14/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/14/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan re: contract-related issues (.1); review pertinent documents (.3)	B768	0.40	270.00
07/14/20	MNEMI	Review documents from additional Transco production	B768	5.90	2,212.50
07/14/20	SLEE	Review documents from Transco production	B768	1.70	637.50

## Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 45 of 65

<b>Date</b>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/14/20	TBUCH	Review and revise analysis of legal issues (2.4); teleconference with M. Neiburg re: litigation strategy and open issues (.3); review ASR project documents (4.6)	B768	7.30	4,343.50
07/15/20	CGJOH	Review documents produced by Transco	B768	9.60	3,984.00
07/15/20	EEDWA	Clear additional documents for production (2.2); email to L. Fortunato re: same (.1); review ASR project documents (3.2)	B768	5.50	3,932.50
07/15/20	JECKE	Document review: IP_TRANSCO_003 (Batch #4: 1-204)	B768	2.30	862.50
07/15/20	JECKE	Document review: IP_TRANSCO_003 (Batch #5: 1-200)	B768	2.20	825.00
07/15/20	JGLAZ	Transco production 003 document review	B768	5.30	1,722.50
07/15/20	KGUER	Review ASR project documents	B768	0.30	232.50
07/15/20	KGUER	Emails with client re: legal issues	B768	0.10	77.50
07/15/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues and hearing	B768	0.30	232.50
07/15/20	LFORT	Emails with A. Mielke re document review issues; emails with E. Edwards re review of documents for production; emails with M. Neiburg and DLS re upload of documents to Relativity; prepare production of documents, including performing document searches and emails with YCST team re same	B768	5.60	2,940.00
07/15/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	2.00	750.00
07/15/20	MMILA	Review of documents produced in connection with Williams adversary	B768	2.20	880.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Emails with F. Pometti re: discovery responses and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents in preparation for production to Transco	B768	1.40	945.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Calls with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Ralph re: Transco RFPs and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/15/20	MNEIB	Call with L. Fortunato and T. Buchanan re: document review and production issues	B768	0.30	202.50

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: August 10, 2020 50017330 076850.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/15/20	MNEIB	Review and finalize objections and responses to Transco second RFPs (.7); email to S. Ewald re: same (.1)	B768	0.80	540.00
07/15/20	MNEMI	Review documents from additional Transco production	B768	7.70	2,887.50
07/15/20	SLEE	Review documents from Transco production	B768	2.90	1,087.50
07/15/20	TBUCH	Review and revise analysis of privilege issues (4.3); teleconference with M. Neiburg (2x) re: same (.3); teleconference with M. Neiburg, L. Fortunato re: discovery issues (.3); review documents re: contract issues (.3)	B768	5.20	3,094.00
07/16/20	CGJOH	Review documents produced by Transco	B768	5.60	2,324.00
07/16/20	EEDWA	Review ASR project documents (3.9); multiple team emails re: search and review issues (.2); multiple emails with consultant and L. Fortunato re: review materials (.2)	B768	4.30	3,074.50
07/16/20	KGUER	Teleconference with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: discovery and document production issues	B768	0.50	387.50
07/16/20	KGUER	Emails with L. Fortunato re: doc review issues	B768	0.10	77.50
07/16/20	KGUER	Review and revise legal issues analysis	B768	2.00	1,550.00
07/16/20	KGUER	Review responses to 2nd RFP	B768	0.30	232.50
07/16/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re: responses to 2nd RFP	B768	0.10	77.50
07/16/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	232.50
07/16/20	KGUER	Email with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: legal analysis	B768	0.20	155.00
07/16/20	LFORT	Emails with K. Guerke re: produced documents (.1); emails with DLS re: production of documents (.1); emails with consultant re: requested documents (.3); review documents for production (.6); emails with J. Krzystofik re: discovery and review documents (.4); prepare debtors' seventh production of documents, including emails with DLS re: same (.9); emails with YCST team and DLS re: document searches (.1)	B768	2.50	1,312.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 47 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/16/20	LFORT	Review Transco Production (.7); prepare and review Welded production number 7 (.2)	B768	0.90	472.50
07/16/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	3.70	1,387.50
07/16/20	MDOSS	Emails with T. Buchanan re: motion to compel production	B768	0.10	37.50
07/16/20	MMILA	Review of documents produced in connection with Williams adversary	B768	3.80	1,520.00
07/16/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald re: document production issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/16/20	MNEIB	Review documents produced by Transco	B768	0.80	540.00
07/16/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: draft motion to compel and related legal issues	B768	0.90	607.50
07/16/20	MNEIB	Call with K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.60	405.00
07/16/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/16/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Fratticci re: document processing and review issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/16/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/16/20	MNEMI	Review documents from additional Transco production	B768	8.00	3,000.00
07/16/20	TBUCH	Review documents re: ASR project (3.5); review and revise analysis of legal issues (4.3); teleconference with M. Neiburg and K. Guerke re: litigation strategy and open issues (.7)	B768	8.50	5,057.50
07/17/20	CGJOH	Review documents produced by Transco	B768	9.70	4,025.50
07/17/20	EEDWA	Multiple team emails re: document review issues	B768	0.20	143.00
07/17/20	JECKE	Document review: IP_TRANSCO_003 (Batch #6: 1-209)	B768	0.60	225.00
07/17/20	JECKE	Document review: IP_TRANSCO_003 (Batch #6: 1-208) continued; (Batch #7: 1-9)	B768	1.10	412.50
07/17/20	KGUER	Review and revise legal analysis	B768	1.60	1,240.00
07/17/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: latest document production and discovery	B768	0.30	232.50
07/17/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with M. Neiburg and T. Buchanan re: legal analysis	B768	0.20	155.00

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 48 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/17/20	LFORT	Review Transco production no. 7 (.1); emails with YCST team re: discovery efforts, document searches and team calls (.4); emails with DLS re: documents for consultants (.1)	B768	0.60	315.00
07/17/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	1.70	637.50
07/17/20	MDOSS	Emails with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, L. Fortunato, and J. Marasco re: document review and litigation issues	B768	0.20	75.00
07/17/20	MDOSS	Revise draft motion to compel production	B768	0.80	300.00
07/17/20	MMILA	Review of documents produced in connection with Williams adversary	B768	4.10	1,640.00
07/17/20	MNEIB	Review and revise draft motion to compel (.3); emails with T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: revised draft (.1)	B768	0.40	270.00
07/17/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan, K. Guerke and M. Doss re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.40	270.00
07/17/20	MNEIB	Call with T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/17/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/17/20	MNEIB	Review Transco document productions in connection with litigation strategy analysis	B768	2.40	1,620.00
07/17/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Higgins re: case status and discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/17/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato and T. Buchanan re: document production issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/17/20	MNEMI	Review documents from additional Transco production	B768	4.40	1,650.00
07/17/20	SLEE	Review documents from Transco production	B768	2.30	862.50
07/17/20	TBUCH	Review ASR project documents (2.6); review and revise analysis of privilege issues (3.4)	B768	6.00	3,570.00
07/18/20	KGUER	Review ASR project documents	B768	0.20	155.00
07/18/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: document production and discovery	B768	0.20	155.00
07/18/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: legal issues	B768	0.10	77.50
07/18/20	LFORT	Email to DLS re: documents for consultants	B768	0.10	52.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 49 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/18/20	LFORT	Review of documents and email to T. Buchanan re: discovery issues	B768	0.90	472.50
07/18/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/18/20	SLEE	Review documents from Transco production	B768	0.80	300.00
07/18/20	TBUCH	Review and revise analysis of privilege issues (8.9); teleconference with M. Neiburg re: same (.2)	B768	9.10	5,414.50
07/19/20	KGUER	Emails with counsel re: motion	B768	0.10	77.50
07/19/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: motion	B768	0.20	155.00
07/19/20	KGUER	Review and revise draft motion to compel	B768	2.00	1,550.00
07/19/20	MDOSS	Revise motion to compel production	B768	2.10	787.50
07/19/20	MDOSS	Review documents re: Transco production	B768	0.90	337.50
07/19/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: revisions to draft motion to compel	B768	0.50	337.50
07/19/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: revised draft motion to compel	B768	0.40	270.00
07/19/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach and T. Buchanan re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/19/20	SLEE	Review documents from Transco production	B768	1.10	412.50
07/19/20	TBUCH	Review and revise analysis of privilege issues	B768	4.90	2,915.50
07/20/20	CGJOH	Review documents produced by Transco	B768	7.80	3,237.00
07/20/20	JGLAZ	Transco production 003 document review	B768	1.50	487.50
07/20/20	KGUER	Review project documents	B768	0.50	387.50
07/20/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: motion and discovery	B768	0.30	232.50
07/20/20	KGUER	Review updated motion, revise same, and work on motion	B768	1.80	1,395.00
07/20/20	LFORT	Compile documents for consultants	B768	4.80	2,520.00
07/20/20	MDOSS	Revise motion to compel production	B768	3.80	1,425.00

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 50 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/20/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss and B. Olivere re: motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/20/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan, K. Guerke and M. Doss re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.30	202.50
07/20/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke re: issues relating to draft motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/20/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.80	540.00
07/20/20	MNEIB	Emails with YCST team re: document review issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/20/20	MNEIB	Email from F. Pometti re: draft motion to compel	B768	0.10	67.50
07/20/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B768	0.40	270.00
07/20/20	MNEIB	Review and revise draft motion to compel	B768	0.80	540.00
07/20/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: litigation budget and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/20/20	TBUCH	Review and revise analysis of privilege issues	B768	0.90	535.50
07/21/20	JHIGG	Call with Neiburg re: coating expert work stream	B768	0.80	580.00
07/21/20	JHIGG	Review materials from Neiburg re dispute for consultant	B768	0.40	290.00
07/21/20	JMARA	Review internal correspondence re: privilege log (.2); emails with K. Guerke re: motion to compel (.1)	B768	0.30	157.50
07/21/20	KGUER	Review research on legal issues	B768	0.40	310.00
07/21/20	KGUER	Review and revise motion and exhibits and finalize and file same	B768	2.20	1,705.00
07/21/20	KGUER	Teleconference with M. Neiburg re: litigation planning	B768	1.10	852.50
07/21/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery, motion, and doc production	B768	0.70	542.50
07/21/20	LFORT	Review documents in connection with document production (4.0); prepare privilege log (5.0); emails with YCST team re same (.3)	B768	9.30	4,882.50
07/21/20	MDOSS	Emails with litigation team and B. Olivere re: motion to compel production	B768	1.70	637.50
07/21/20	MDOSS	Revise motion to compel production	B768	2.90	1,087.50
07/21/20	MDOSS	Call with L. Fortunato re: review privilege log	B768	0.30	112.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 51 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/21/20	MDOSS	Review privilege log documents	B768	4.50	1,687.50
07/21/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with K. Guerke and L. Fortunato re: privilege log	B768	0.40	270.00
07/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and L. Fortunato re: document review issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Beach, K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/21/20	MNEIB	Emails and call with J. Higgins re: discovery issues and Transco claims	B768	0.90	607.50
07/21/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with M. Doss, B. Olivere and T. Buchanan re: motion to compel	B768	0.60	405.00
07/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss and L. Fortunato re: privilege logs	B768	0.20	135.00
07/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/21/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald re: privilege logs	B768	0.10	67.50
07/21/20	MNEIB	Call with L. Fortunato re: discovery and privilege logs	B768	0.60	405.00
07/21/20	MNEIB	Call with K. Guerke re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.60	405.00
07/21/20	MNEIB	Email from J. Lucian re: motion to compel	B768	0.10	67.50
07/21/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: Transco claims and related issues	B768	1.30	877.50
07/21/20	MNEIB	Review and revise draft motion to compel (.8); emails with K. Guerke and T. Buchanan re: draft motion (.4)	B768	1.20	810.00
07/21/20	TBUCH	Finalize motion to compel production of audit documents	B768	1.70	1,011.50
07/22/20	JHIGG	Review complaint and claims received from M. Neiburg in connection with coating expert report preparation	B768	1.40	1,015.00
07/22/20	KGUER	Review document production	B768	1.30	1,007.50
07/22/20	KGUER	Email with opposing counsel re: redactions	B768	0.10	77.50
07/22/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: doc production, discovery, redaction, logs	B768	0.40	310.00
07/22/20	KGUER	Review service docs re: motion	B768	0.10	77.50

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 52 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/22/20	LFORT	Prepare privilege log, including emails with YCST team and DLS re: same (5.7); review email from consultant re: information request and compile documents (.3)	B768	6.00	3,150.00
07/22/20	MDOSS	Redact and emails with lit team and Transco's counsel re: motion to compel production	B768	1.60	600.00
07/22/20	MDOSS	Emails with YCST lit team re: review privilege log	B768	0.60	225.00
07/22/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents in preparation for production to Transco and logging	B768	1.20	810.00
07/22/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: document review and production issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/22/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss re: sealed motion to compel and preparation of public version of same	B768	0.30	202.50
07/22/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss and L. Fortunato re: privilege log issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/22/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with L. Fortunato and K. Guerke re: privilege log issues	B768	0.60	405.00
07/22/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato and consultant re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/22/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/22/20	TBUCH	Research related to discovery issues	B768	0.20	119.00
07/23/20	JHIGG	Review materials from M. Neiburg in connection with counterclaim issues	B768	1.10	797.50
07/23/20	JHIGG	Review background memo on case status	B768	0.30	217.50
07/23/20	JMARA	Review correspondence re: privilege log and production (.2); discuss project with M. Neiburg (.1); core group call (.7)	B768	1.00	525.00
07/23/20	LFORT	Compile documents for consultant and email sending document to same (6.2); including emails with YCST team re: documents to send to consultant (.8)	B768	7.00	3,675.00
07/23/20	MDOSS	Emails and calls with M. Neiburg, T. Buchanan, D. Laskin, and B. Olivere re: ASR project documents	B768	0.60	225.00
07/23/20	MDOSS	Emails with lit team and Transco's counsel re: motion to compel production	B768	0.90	337.50
07/23/20	MDOSS	Call with litigation team re: document review	B768	0.60	225.00

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 53 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald and M. Doss re: issues relating to sealed motion to compel	B768	0.30	202.50
07/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato and consultant re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Higgins re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/23/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents for production to Transco and preparation of privilege log	B768	3.10	2,092.50
07/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Doss re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Higgins and M. Fratticci re: discovery and document review issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/23/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato and K. Guerke re: document review and production issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/23/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/23/20	MNEIB	Letter from S. Ewald re: Transco document production	B768	0.10	67.50
07/23/20	MNEIB	Prepare for and participate in call with YCST team re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.60	405.00
07/23/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, L. Fortunato, and M. Doss re: discovery issues (.6); analysis related to same (1.8)	B768	2.40	1,428.00
07/24/20	JHIGG	E-mails re: timing on expert disclosures under scheduling order	B768	0.10	72.50
07/24/20	JMARA	Review correspondence re: Transco document production and document review	B768	0.20	105.00
07/24/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with client re: background	B768	0.10	77.50
07/24/20	KGUER	Teleconference with M. Neiburg re: litigation planning	B768	0.70	542.50
07/24/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery and production issues, consultants, privilege log	B768	0.40	310.00
07/24/20	KGUER	Review ASR project documents and discovery issues	B768	1.30	1,007.50
07/24/20	KGUER	Email with counsel re: Welded 8th production	B768	0.10	77.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 54 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/24/20	LFORT	Emails with YCST team and DLS re: production of documents (.5); review documents for production (.2); review emails between M. Neiburg and consultant (.1)	B768	0.80	420.00
07/24/20	MDOSS	Emails with lit team and Transco's counsel re: motion to compel production	B768	0.20	75.00
07/24/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss re: motion to compel and redaction issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/24/20	MNEIB	Numerous emails with K. Guerke and L. Fortunato re: document review and privilege log issues	B768	0.60	405.00
07/24/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: document production issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/24/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and consultant re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/24/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS and L. Fortunato re: privilege logs	B768	0.30	202.50
07/24/20	MNEIB	Second level review of documents for production to Transco and logging	B768	2.40	1,620.00
07/24/20	MNEIB	Emails with D. Laskin re: ASR production documents and discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/24/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with N. Trager related to research issues (.3); analysis related to same (.4)	B768	0.70	416.50
07/25/20	LFORT	Review Welded production number 9, prepare and send to opposing counsel (.2); revise privilege log (.5)	B768	0.70	367.50
07/25/20	TBUCH	Email correspondence from L. Fortunato re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	59.50
07/26/20	JMARA	Emails with L. Fortunato and M. Doss re: privilege log	B768	0.10	52.50
07/26/20	LFORT	Prepare privilege log	B768	1.90	997.50
07/26/20	MDOSS	Revise privilege log	B768	1.70	637.50
07/26/20	TBUCH	Email correspondence from L. Fortunato re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	59.50
07/27/20	ASMIT	Assist in production of documents	B768	4.60	1,357.00
07/27/20	JHIGG	Review materials from M. Neiburg in connection with Transco counterclaims	B768	0.70	507.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 55 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/27/20	JMARA	Review internal correspondence re: privilege log (.1); emails re: team strategy meeting (.1); draft litigation work plan and emails with M. Neiburg re: same (1.1)	B768	1.30	682.50
07/27/20	KGUER	Review document discovery	B768	0.30	232.50
07/27/20	KGUER	Review privilege log	B768	0.20	155.00
07/27/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues and logging	B768	0.50	387.50
07/27/20	LFORT	Prepare and revise privilege log (8.7); emails with M. Doss re: review of same (.1); emails with YCST team re: privilege log entries (.6), key to log; email log to counsel for Transco (.1)	B768	9.50	4,987.50
07/27/20	MDOSS	Revise privilege log and emails with L. Fortunato re: privilege log	B768	1.70	637.50
07/27/20	MDOSS	Emails and calls with M. Neiburg and B. Olivere re: motion to compel production of documents	B768	0.70	262.50
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Fratticci and DLS re: Transco document productions and related issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with YCST team re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald, L. Fortunato and K. Guerke re: privilege logs	B768	0.30	202.50
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with M. Doss and B. Olivere re: unsealed motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/27/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: draft privilege log (.7); numerous emails with L. Fortunato, M. Doss and K. Guerke re: same (.6)	B768	1.30	877.50
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald and M. Fratticci re: Transco document productions	B768	0.20	135.00
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Marasco re: litigation strategy and case status issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and J. Marasco re: privilege logs	B768	0.20	135.00
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with D. Laskin and A. Smit re: discovery issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/27/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Mielke and K. Guerke re: issues relating to motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/27/20	TBUCH	Analysis of litigation strategy and open issues	B768	1.40	833.00

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 56 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/28/20	ASMIT	Assist in production of documents	B768	1.60	472.00
07/28/20	JHIGG	Call with S. Lee re: preparation of subpoena on Mears	B768	0.10	72.50
07/28/20	JHIGG	Call with M. Neiburg re: counterclaim issues	B768	0.50	362.50
07/28/20	JHIGG	Review background materials on case	B768	1.50	1,087.50
07/28/20	JHIGG	E-mails re: subpoena of Mears	B768	0.40	290.00
07/28/20	JMARA	Email L. Fortunato re: Transco productions (.1); update litigation work plan (2.0)	B768	2.10	1,102.50
07/28/20	KGUER	Emails with counsel re: exchange of privilege logs	B768	0.20	155.00
07/28/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues and scheduling	B768	0.30	232.50
07/28/20	LFORT	Emails with A. Mielke re: discovery issues (.1); email to Welded personnel in connection with discovery (.1); emails with J. Marasco re: Transco productions (.1)	B768	0.30	157.50
07/28/20	MNEIB	Email from consultant re: discovery issues	B768	0.10	67.50
07/28/20	MNEIB	Emails and call with J. Higgins re: discovery and litigation strategy issues	B768	0.70	472.50
07/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and A. Mielke re: motion to compel	B768	0.20	135.00
07/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Higgins and B. Olivere re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald and K. Guerke re: motion to compel	B768	0.10	67.50
07/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Smit and D. Laskin re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/28/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato re: privilege logs	B768	0.20	135.00
07/28/20	SLEE	Review documents in connection with preparing subpoena to Mears	B768	0.40	150.00
07/28/20	TBUCH	Analysis of ASR contract issues	B768	0.40	238.00
07/29/20	ASMIT	Assist in production of documents	B768	2.00	590.00
07/29/20	ASMIT	Assist in production of documents	B768	3.50	1,032.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 57 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/29/20	EEDWA	Review ASR project documents (1.9); review motion to compel (.4); analyze discovery issues (2.3); multiple team emails re: Transco production issues (.1); multiple team emails re: new Transco production (.1)	B768	4.80	3,432.00
07/29/20	JHIGG	Review Transco and Welded documents	B768	2.60	1,885.00
07/29/20	JHIGG	Call with S. Lee re: review of documents	B768	0.10	72.50
07/29/20	JHIGG	Continue review of documents for litigation strategy related issues	B768	1.70	1,232.50
07/29/20	JMARA	Coordinate upload of incoming Transco production with DLS (0.2); emails with T. Buchanan re: litigation work plan (0.1); update same upon production receipt of info from DLS (0.1)	B768	0.40	210.00
07/29/20	KGUER	Emails with M. Neiburg and J. Marasco re: work plan	B768	0.20	155.00
07/29/20	KGUER	Emails with YCST team re: planning and legal issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/29/20	LFORT	Emails with DLS re: document searches (.1); emails with T. Buchanan re same (.1)	B768	0.20	105.00
07/29/20	MNEIB	Emails with A. Smit and D. Laskin re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/29/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and S. Hawkins re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/29/20	MNEIB	Emails with L. Fortunato and T. Buchanan re: document review and discovery issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/29/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Higgins and DLS re: document review issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/29/20	MNEIB	Emails with DLS, M. Fratticci and J. Marasco re: Transco document productions	B768	0.40	270.00
07/29/20	SLEE	Draft subpoena to Mears Inc. and Schedule A attachment	B768	1.60	600.00
07/29/20	SLEE	Review documents in connection with preparing subpoena to Mears	B768	0.60	225.00
07/29/20	SLEE	Analysis re: discovery and litigation strategy issues	B768	3.50	1,312.50
07/29/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with E. Leon re: research (1.0); analysis related to same (1.2); review litigation work plan (.3)	B768	2.50	1,487.50

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 58 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	Task	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
07/30/20	EEDWA	Teleconference with litigation team re: discovery issues and case planning (.9); review draft litigation work plan (.2)	B768	1.10	786.50
07/30/20	JHIGG	Review draft subpoena and propose revisions and e-mails re: same	B768	0.70	507.50
07/30/20	JHIGG	E-mails re: document review and discovery issues	B768	0.10	72.50
07/30/20	JHIGG	Continue review of recent Transco production	B768	0.10	72.50
07/30/20	JHIGG	Review recent Transco production	B768	2.30	1,667.50
07/30/20	JMARA	Confer with T. Buchanan re: litigation work plan (0.9); update work plan accordingly (1.5); core team internal call (1.0.); circulate updated work plan (0.1)	B768	3.50	1,837.50
07/30/20	KGUER	Emails with opposing counsel re: discovery	B768	0.20	155.00
07/30/20	KGUER	Teleconference with YCST team re: legal issues and planning	B768	0.90	697.50
07/30/20	KGUER	Emails with T. Buchanan and M. Neiburg re: status and strategy	B768	0.20	155.00
07/30/20	KGUER	Review discovery documents	B768	0.30	232.50
07/30/20	KGUER	Teleconference with client re: litigation status	B768	0.50	387.50
07/30/20	KGUER	Emails with client re: background questions	B768	0.10	77.50
07/30/20	KGUER	Multiple emails with YCST team re: discovery issues	B768	0.20	155.00
07/30/20	LFORT	Review draft litigation plan (.1); YCST team call re: case updates and strategy (.9); emails with K. Guerke re: document searches (.1)	B768	1.10	577.50
07/30/20	MDOSS	Call with M. Neiburg, E. Edwards, K. Guerke, T. Buchanan, L. Fortunato, and J. Marasco re: litigation strategy	B768	0.90	337.50
07/30/20	MDOSS	Emails with K. Guerke and B. Olivere re: unsealed motion to compel production	B768	0.10	37.50
07/30/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Higgins re: document review issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/30/20	MNEIB	Emails with T. Buchanan and K. Guerke re: document review issues	B768	0.30	202.50
07/30/20	MNEIB	Emails with K. Guerke and M. Doss re: motion to compel and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 59 of 65

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<b>Description</b>	Task	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/30/20	MNEIB	Emails with S. Ewald and K. Guerke re: motion to compel and document production issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/30/20	MNEIB	Analysis re: litigation strategy and discovery issues	B768	0.80	540.00
07/30/20	MNEIB	Emails with J. Marasco re: litigation strategy and status issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/30/20	MNEIB	Review draft subpoena to Mears (.2); emails with S. Lee and T. Buchanan resame (.2)	B768	0.40	270.00
07/30/20	MNEIB	Call with YCST team re: discovery and litigation strategy issues	B768	0.90	607.50
07/30/20	MNEIB	Call with S. Hawkins, M. Hood and K. Guerke re: case status and strategy issues	B768	0.60	405.00
07/30/20	SLEE	Review documents relating to counterclaims	B768	1.80	675.00
07/30/20	SLEE	Continue drafting Schedule A attachment for subpoena to Mears Inc.	B768	0.80	300.00
07/30/20	SLEE	Email J. Higgins re: subpoena to Mears Inc. and associated documents	B768	0.20	75.00
07/30/20	SLEE	Email M. Neiburg, T. Buchanan, and J. Higgins re: subpoena to Mears Inc. and associated documents	B768	0.50	187.50
07/30/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with J. Marasco re: litigation work plan (.9); analysis related to same (.4); teleconference with M. Neiburg, K. Guerke, E. Edwards, L. Fortunato, J. Marasco, and M. Doss re: litigation strategy and open issues (.9); analysis related to same (.7)	B768	2.90	1,725.50
07/31/20	EEDWA	Multiple emails form L. Fortunato and DLS re: additional search requests and results (.1); review search chart from J. Marasco (.1)	B768	0.20	143.00
07/31/20	JHIGG	Continue review of recently produced materials in connection with developing litigation strategy	B768	2.40	1,740.00
07/31/20	JHIGG	Work on draft subpoena to Mears and e-mails re: same	B768	0.50	362.50
07/31/20	JMARA	Internal correspondence re: OGCS production (0.1); review correspondence from Transco counsel re: same (0.1)	B768	0.20	105.00
07/31/20	KGUER	Teleconferences with M. Neiburg re: discovery and strategy	B768	0.40	310.00
07/31/20	KGUER	Review discovery	B768	0.30	232.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 60 of 65

<u>Date</u> 07/31/20	<u>Initials</u> KGUER	<u>Description</u> Multiple emails with YCST team re:	<u>Task</u> B768	<u>Hours</u> 0.40	<u>Amount</u> 310.00
07/31/20	KOULK	discovery issues	D/06	0.40	310.00
07/31/20	KGUER	Review document production	B768	0.40	310.00
07/31/20	KGUER	Emails with OGCS counsel re: production	B768	0.20	155.00
07/31/20	KGUER	Teleconference with opposing counsel re: motion to compel	B768	0.30	232.50
07/31/20	KGUER	Emails with A. Mielke re: hearing dates	B768	0.10	77.50
07/31/20	KGUER	Prepare for call with opposing counsel	B768	0.40	310.00
07/31/20	LFORT	Email to DLS re: searches of Transco productions (.2); review emails re: production from OGCS (.1)	B768	0.30	157.50
07/31/20	MNEIB	Call with S. Ewald and K. Guerke re: motion to compel and related issues (.3); follow-up call with K. Guerke re: same (.2)	B768	0.50	337.50
07/31/20	MNEIB	Call with K. Guerke re: motion to compel and related issues	B768	0.20	135.00
07/31/20	SLEE	Review documents in connection with developing litigation strategy	B768	1.00	375.00
07/31/20	TBUCH	Teleconference with E. Leon re: research related to legal issues (.7); analysis related to discovery issues (1.9)	B768	2.60	1,547.00
		То	tal	790.00	\$436,897.00

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: August 10, 2020 Invoice Number: 50017330 Matter Number: 076850.1001

### **Timekeeper Summary**

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Name</u>	<b>Timekeeper Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
AMIEL	Allison S. Mielke	Associate	47.60	490.00	23,324.00
ASMIT	Anupa Smit	Paralegal	11.70	295.00	3,451.50
BOLIV	Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	21.20	295.00	6,254.00
BFELD	Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	6.30	415.00	2,614.50
CGJOH	Caleb G. Johnson	Associate	37.20	415.00	15,438.00
JECKE	Ecker Joseph F.	Associate	12.40	375.00	4,650.00
EEDWA	Erin D. Edwards	Partner	40.00	715.00	28,600.00
<b>JMARA</b>	Jaclyn Marasco	Associate	35.60	525.00	18,690.00
JHIGG	James Higgins	Partner	17.80	725.00	12,905.00
JGLAZ	Joel W. Glazer	Associate	15.90	325.00	5,167.50
KGUER	Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	77.70	775.00	60,217.50
LFORT	Lauren Dunkle	Associate	99.50	525.00	52,237.50
	Fortunato				
MDOSS	Malak S. Doss	Associate	67.20	375.00	25,200.00
MLUNN	Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	3.40	795.00	2,703.00
MMILA	Matthew Milana	Associate	16.10	400.00	6,440.00
MNEMI	Michael E.	Associate	32.10	375.00	12,037.50
	Neminski				
MNEIB	Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	84.10	675.00	56,767.50
RFPOP	Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	4.20	685.00	2,877.00
SBEAC	Sean M. Beach	Partner	35.30	835.00	29,475.50
SLEE	Steven W. Lee	Associate	21.70	375.00	8,137.50
TPAKR	Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	9.90	450.00	4,455.00
TSNYD	Timothy J. Snyder	Partner	7.00	575.00	4,025.00
TBUCH	Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	86.10	595.00	51,229.50
Total			790.00		\$436,897.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 62 of 65

#### **Task Summary**

Task Code:B001	Case Administration
·	

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.80	685.00	548.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	1.50	835.00	1,252.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	3.80	490.00	1,862.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.60	415.00	249.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	5.30	295.00	1,563.50

Total 12.00 5,475.00

#### Task Code: B002 Court Hearings

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.90	$49\overline{0.00}$	441.00

Total 0.90 441.00

### <u>Task Code:B003</u> <u>Cash Collateral/DIP Financing</u>

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.80	835.00	668.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.10	490.00	49.00

Total 0.90 717.00

#### <u>Task Code:B004</u> <u>Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports</u>

<u>Name</u>	<b>Timekeeper Title</b>	Hours	Rate	<b>Amount</b>
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.10	685.00	68.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.10	490.00	49.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.70	415.00	290.50
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.20	295.00	59.00

Total 1.10 467.00

#### <u>Task Code:B006</u> <u>Use, Sale or Lease of Property (363 issues)</u>

<u>Name</u>	<b>Timekeeper Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	Rate	<b>Amount</b>
Sean M. Beach	Partner	6.60	835.00	5,511.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.70	490.00	343.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.20	415.00	83.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	0.30	450.00	135.00

Total 7.80 6,072.00

#### <u>Task Code:B007</u> <u>Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions</u>

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<b>Hours</b>	Rate	<b>Amount</b>
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.10	685.00	68.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	12.00	835.00	10,020.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 63 of 65

Task Code:R007	Claims Ar	nalysis Ohiectio	ns and Resolutions	
			Matter Number:	076850.1001
			Invoice Number:	50017330
Welded Construction, L.P.			Invoice Date:	August 10, 2020
Case 10-12	370-033	DUC 1373-2	FIIEU 00/2//20	rage 03 01 03

Task Code:B007	Claims Analysis, Objections and	d Resolution	<u>18</u>	
Name	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	6.40	$49\overline{0.00}$	3,136.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	1.90	415.00	788.50
Malak S. Doss	Associate	0.80	375.00	300.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	0.40	295.00	118.00
Total		21.60		14,431.00
Task Code:B008	Meetings			
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<b>Hours</b>	Rate	<b>Amount</b>
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	1.20	715.00	858.00
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	1.50	795.00	1,192.50
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	1.20	685.00	822.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	5.50	835.00	4,592.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	3.20	490.00	1,568.00
Total		12.60		9,033.00
Task Code:B011	Other Adversary Proceedings			
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<b>Hours</b>	Rate	Amount
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	14.80	775.00	11,470.00
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	3.00	675.00	2,025.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	2.60	835.00	2,171.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	14.00	490.00	6,860.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.30	415.00	124.50
Malak S. Doss	Associate	5.30	375.00	1,987.50
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	8.80	450.00	3,960.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	1.90	295.00	560.50
Total		50.70		29,158.50
Task Code:B012	Plan and Disclosure Statement			
<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<b>Hours</b>	Rate	<b>Amount</b>
Matthew B. Lunn	Partner	1.90	795.00	1,510.50
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.50	685.00	342.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	2.80	835.00	2,338.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	15.00	490.00	7,350.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	2.40	415.00	996.00
Malak S. Doss	Associate	1.10	375.00	412.50
Total		23.70		12,949.50
Task Code:B013	<b>Creditor Inquiries</b>			
Name Sean M. Beach	Timekeeper Title Partner	<u>Hours</u> 0.10	<u>Rate</u> 835.00	<b>Amount</b> 83.50
Total		0.10		83.50

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 64 of 65

Task Code:B014	General Corporate Matters			
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.30	835.00	250.50
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	0.40	490.00	196.00
Total		0.70		446.50
Total		0.70		440.30
Task Code:B015	<b>Employee Matters</b>			
Name	Timekeeper Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.80	685.00	548.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.40	835.00	334.00
Timothy J. Snyder	Partner	7.00	575.00	4,025.00
Total		8.20		4,907.00
Task Code:B017	Retention of Professionals/Fee	<u>Issues</u>		
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<b>Hours</b>	Rate	<b>Amount</b>
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.20	685.00	137.00
Sean M. Beach	Partner	0.40	835.00	334.00
Allison S. Mielke	Associate	3.00	490.00	1,470.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.20	415.00	83.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	0.80	450.00	360.00
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	1.90	295.00	560.50
Total		6.50		2,944.50
Task Code:B018	Fee Application Preparation			
Nama	Timelzooner Title	Цопка	Data	Amount
Name Michael S. Neiburg	<u>Timekeeper Title</u> Partner	<u>Hours</u> 0.20	<u>Rate</u> 675.00	<u>Amount</u> 135.00
Robert F. Poppiti	Partner	0.20	685.00	342.50
Sean M. Beach	Partner	2.30	835.00	1,920.50
Beth A. Olivere	Paralegal	11.50	295.00	3,392.50
	8			ŕ
Total		14.50		5,790.50
Task Code:B768	Williams Litigation			
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<b>Hours</b>	Rate	<b>Amount</b>
Erin D. Edwards	Partner	38.80	715.00	27,742.00
James Higgins	Partner	17.80	725.00	12,905.00
Kevin A. Guerke	Partner	62.90	775.00	48,747.50
Michael S. Neiburg	Partner	80.90	675.00	54,607.50
Caleb G. Johnson	Associate	37.20	415.00	15,438.00
Ecker Joseph F.	Associate	12.40	375.00	4,650.00
Jaclyn Marasco	Associate	35.60	525.00	18,690.00
Joel W. Glazer	Associate	15.90	325.00	5,167.50
Lauren Dunkle Fortunato	Associate	99.50	525.00	52,237.50
Malak S. Doss	Associate	60.00	375.00	22,500.00

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-2 Filed 08/27/20 Page 65 of 65

Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 10, 2020
Invoice Number: 50017330

Matter Number: 076850.1001

Task Code:B768	Williams Litigation			
<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
Matthew Milana	Associate	16.10	400.00	6,440.00
Michael E. Neminski	Associate	32.10	375.00	12,037.50
Steven W. Lee	Associate	21.70	375.00	8,137.50
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	86.10	595.00	51,229.50
Anupa Smit	Paralegal	11.70	295.00	3,451.50

Total 628.70 343,981.00

### EXHIBIT B

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date:August 10, 2020Invoice Number:50017330Matter Number:076850.1001

### **Cost Detail**

<u>Date</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Amount</b>
06/01/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/01/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	6.00	10.97
06/02/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	18.00	1.80
06/02/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	13.00	1.30
06/02/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	7.00	12.80
06/04/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/05/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	23.00	2.30
06/05/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/05/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/08/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	13.00	23.77
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	18.00	1.80
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	21.00	2.10
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/10/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	17.00	31.08
06/10/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/10/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 3 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

06/10/20 Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: 8.00 BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	14.63
06/10/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 5.00	0.50
06/11/20 Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: 21.00 BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	38.40
06/12/20 Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: 3.00 MIELKE, ALLISON S	5.49
06/12/20 Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: 19.00 DOSS,MALAK	34.74
06/13/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/13/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00	0.30
06/13/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/13/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 4.00	0.40
06/13/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/13/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00	0.20
06/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00	0.30
06/14/20 Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: 7.00 MIELKE, ALLISON S	12.80
06/14/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00	0.20
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00	0.30
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/15/20 Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: 1.00 Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	5.16
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 3.00	0.30
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00	0.20
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 4.00	0.40
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 5.00	0.50
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 6.00	0.60
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 4.00	0.40
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 19.00	1.90
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 5.00	0.50
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00	0.20
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 2.00	0.20
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 1.00	0.10
06/15/20 Docket Retrieval / Search 8.00	0.80

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 4 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<b>Quantity</b>	Amount
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.02
06/16/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.70
06/16/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.52
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	15.00	1.50
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/16/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	11.00	20.11
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/16/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
06/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	13.00	1.30
06/17/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.17
06/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	10.00	1.00
06/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/17/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	7.00	12.80
06/18/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/18/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 5 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<u>Amount</u>
06/18/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.92
06/18/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.55
06/18/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	15.00	27.43
06/18/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GLAZER, JOEL	150.00	274.27
06/18/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	21.00	38.40
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/19/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	52.00	95.08
06/19/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: MIELKE, ALLISON S	37.00	67.65
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/19/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	7.20
06/19/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.26
06/19/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	14.48
06/19/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.16
06/19/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	26.93
06/19/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GLAZER, JOEL	19.00	34.74
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/19/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	25.00	2.50
06/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
06/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
06/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	26.00	2.60
06/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	0.00	0.00
06/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
06/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	290.00	29.00
06/20/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	142.00	259.64

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 6 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	Amount
06/20/20	Computerized Legal Research Inv 842575440	1.00	122.00
06/21/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.08
06/21/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	15.00	27.43
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/22/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.93
06/22/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	15.38
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/22/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	4.00	7.31
06/22/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/23/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.74
06/23/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.14
06/23/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	4.16
06/24/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	9.89

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 7 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<b>Date</b>	<u>Description</u>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Amount</b>
06/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/25/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	6.28
06/25/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.43
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/26/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.80
06/26/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.39
06/26/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.53
06/26/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.99
06/26/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER, NATHANIEL	19.00	34.74
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
06/26/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: WEISSGERBER, JACLYN	4.00	7.31
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/26/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/28/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: GUERKE, KEVIN	9.00	16.46
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10663756 Appr Atty: Sujay Cherian Court Call	1.00	33.00
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10658139 Appr Atty: Betsy L. Feldman Court Call	1.00	48.75
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10662997 Appr Atty: Matthew Lunn Court Call	1.00	43.50
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10658148 Appr Atty: Stephen Hawkin Court Call	1.00	48.75

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 8 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<b>Quantity</b>	<u>Amount</u>
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10658133 Appr Atty: Allison Mielke Court Call	1.00	48.75
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10658154 Appr Atty: Andrew Henchen Court Call	1.00	48.75
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10658144 Appr Atty: Frank Pometti Court Call	1.00	43.50
06/28/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10658146 Appr Atty: Andrew Ralph Court Call	1.00	43.50
06/29/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/29/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/29/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/29/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	1.90
06/29/20	Parcels, Inc YCST DLS 877897	1.00	7.50
06/29/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/29/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/29/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
06/30/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	80.00	146.28
06/30/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/30/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.95
06/30/20	Docket Retrieval / Search AUDIO	1.00	2.40
06/30/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/30/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
06/30/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
06/30/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
06/30/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/01/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/01/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	11.87
07/01/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/01/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	83.00	166.97
07/02/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER, NATHANIEL	9.00	18.10
07/02/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	117.00	11.70
07/03/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.26

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 9 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	Amount
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/06/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.50
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/06/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/06/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER,NATHANIEL	38.00	76.44
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	21.00	2.10
07/06/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: WEISSGERBER, JACLYN	8.00	16.09
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	15.00	1.50
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	18.00	1.80
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	15.00	1.50
07/06/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/07/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: WEISSGERBER, JACLYN	21.00	42.24
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/07/20	Federal Express Corporation - DANIEL A. HOROWITZ ESQ. SWARTZ SWIDLER LLC 1101 KINGS HIGHWAY NORTH CHERRY HILL, NJ 08034	1.00	11.57
07/07/20	Federal Express Corporation - U.S. DISTRICT COURT MIDDLE DISTRICT OF PA (HARRISB 228 WALNUT STREET HARRISBURG, PA 17101	1.00	11.57
07/07/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	8.94
07/07/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.53
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 10 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<b>Quantity</b>	Amount
07/07/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER, NATHANIEL	64.00	128.74
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/07/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/08/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER,NATHANIEL	25.00	50.29
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/08/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: WEISSGERBER, JACLYN	14.00	28.16
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
07/08/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	10.00	1.00
07/08/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/09/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: WEISSGERBER, JACLYN	31.00	62.36
07/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
07/09/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	3.15
07/09/20	American Express - Docket Retrieval / Search 6/2/2020 to obtain docket entries from West Virginia court for S. Beach by D. Laskin	1.00	42.85
07/09/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	2.45
07/09/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/09/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	14.00	1.40
07/10/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	31.90
07/10/20	Soundpath Conferencing - Teleconference - Payee: Soundpath Confer Services, LLC	1.00	5.35
07/10/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/12/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/12/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/12/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 11 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/12/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/12/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	17.00	1.70
07/12/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/12/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	103.00	10.30
07/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/13/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	16.00	1.60
07/14/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/15/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/15/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
07/15/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	16.00	1.60
07/15/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/16/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	9.00	0.90
07/16/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER, NATHANIEL	23.00	46.27
07/16/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	117.00	11.70
07/16/20	Teleconference / Video Conference Case Num: Welded Construction L.P. / CCID 10658132 Appr Atty: Sean Beach Court Call	1.00	43.50
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	11.00	1.10
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/17/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER, NATHANIEL	51.00	102.59
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/17/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/18/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: BUCHANAN,TRAVIS G	40.00	80.47
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20

# Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 12 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number:

<u>Date</u>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<u>Amount</u>
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	30.00	3.00
07/20/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/21/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/21/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/21/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	29.00	2.90
07/21/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: DOSS,MALAK	27.00	54.31
07/21/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/21/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	15.00	1.50
07/21/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/21/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	11.00	1.10
07/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	14.00	1.40
07/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	25.00	2.50
07/22/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	85.00	8.50
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/23/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
07/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20

Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 13 of 14

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	Quantity	<u>Amount</u>
07/24/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	6.00	0.60
07/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	2.00	0.20
07/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/24/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	1.00	0.10
07/25/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER,NATHANIEL	4.00	8.05
07/27/20	Computerized Legal Research Westlaw Search by: TRAGER,NATHANIEL	23.00	46.27
07/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	12.00	1.20
07/28/20	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	18.00	1.80
07/30/20	Reliable Wilmington - Deposition/Transcript cost of 64 page expedited transcript from hearing on June 24, 2020	1.00	310.40
07/31/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/31/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/31/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
07/31/20	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
	Total		\$3,540.68

### Case 18-12378-CSS Doc 1575-3 Filed 08/27/20 Page 14 of 14

Welded Construction, L.P. Invoice Date: August 10, 2020

Invoice Number: 50017330 Matter Number: 076850.1001

\$3,540.68

### **Cost Summary**

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Computerized Legal Research	2,303.68
Delivery / Courier	7.50
Deposition/Transcript	310.40
Docket Retrieval / Search	192.75
Federal Express	23.14
Reproduction Charges	67.60
Teleconference / Video Conference	635.61

Total

### EXHIBIT C

# CUSTOMARY AND COMPARABLE COMPENSATION DISCLOSURES

Young Conaway's hourly rates for bankruptcy services are comparable to the hourly rates charged in complex chapter 11 cases by comparably skilled bankruptcy attorneys. In addition, Young Conaway's hourly rates for bankruptcy services are comparable to the rates charged by the Firm, and by comparably skilled practitioners in other firms, for complex corporate and litigation matters, whether in court or otherwise, regardless of whether a fee application is required. By way of example, Young Conaway's blended hourly rates for attorneys and paraprofessionals in the Corporate Counseling and Litigation, Business Planning, and Intellectual Property Litigation sections of the Firm for the prior calendar year were as set forth below. Young Conaway believes that the services performed by those three sections of the Firm are comparable to the services performed in the Bankruptcy and Corporate Restructuring section. Also included below is 2019 blended hourly rate information for all sections of the Firm, excluding the Bankruptcy and Corporate Restructuring section and the Personal Injury and Workers' Compensation section.

Category of	Blended Hourly Rate			
Timekeeper	Billed	Billed	Billed	
	In comparable	Firm-wide for	This Application	
	practice areas for	preceding calendar		
	preceding calendar	year <sup>2</sup>		
	year <sup>1</sup>			
Partner	\$782.00	\$670.00	717.31	
Counsel	\$627.00	\$505.00	532.20	
Associate	\$401.00	\$401.00	409.41	
Paralegal	\$253.00	\$208.00	273.02	
Aggregated:	\$542.00	\$497.00	534.10	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> This column reflects the blended 2019 rates charge by the firm for complex corporate and litigation matters in the following sections of the firm: Corporate Counseling and Litigation, Business Planning and Tax, and Intellectual Property Litigation.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> This column excludes blended hourly rates for the Bankruptcy and Corporate Restructuring section and the Personal Injury and Workers' Compensation section.