Steven J. Reisman Shaya Rochester **KATTEN MUCHIN ROSENMAN LLP** 575 Madison Avenue New York, NY 10022 Telephone: (212) 940-8800 Facsimile: (212) 940-8776

Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

WINDSTREAM HOLDINGS, INC., et al.,¹

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 19-22312 (RDD)

(Jointly Administered)

SECOND MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF KATTEN MUCHIN ROSENMAN LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS CONFLICTS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM APRIL 1, 2019 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2019

Name of Applicant:	Katten Muchin Rosenman LLP		
Applicant's Role in Case:	Conflicts Counsel to Windstream Holdings,		
	Inc., et al.		
Date Order of Employment Signed:	April 22, 2019 [Docket No. 369]		
Time Period Covered by this Statement:	Beginning of Period	End of Period ²	
	April 1, 2019	April 30, 2019	

² This statement consists of fees and expenses from April 1, 2019, through April 30, 2019.



¹ The last four digits of Debtor Windstream Holdings, Inc.'s tax identification number are 7717. Due to the large number of Debtors in these Chapter 11 cases, for which joint administration has been granted, a complete list of the debtor entities and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' proposed claims and noticing agent at <u>http://www.kccllc.net/windstream</u>. The location of the Debtors' service address for purposes of these Chapter 11 cases is: 4001 North Rodney Parham Road, Little Rock, Arkansas 72212.

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 2 of 58

Summary of Total Fees and Expenses Requested:				
Total fees requested in this statement:	\$744,861.20			
	(80% of \$931,076.50)			
Total expenses requested in this statement:	\$24,179.17			
Total fees and expenses requested in this statement:	\$769,040.37			
This is a(n): <u>X</u> Monthly Application Int	erim Application Final Application			

Pursuant to sections 327, 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (as amended, the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), and Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the "Local Rules"), the Order Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Katten Muchin Rosenman LLP as Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors Effective Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [Docket No. 369], and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals, entered on April 22, 2019 [Docket No. 374] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Katten Muchin Rosenman LLP ("Katten"), conflicts counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (the "Debtors") hereby submits this Monthly Statement of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred for the Period From April 1, 2019 Through April 30, 2019 (this "Fee Statement").³ Specifically, Katten seeks (i) interim allowance of \$931,076.50 for the reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal services that Katten rendered to the Debtors during the Fee Period; (ii) compensation in the amount of \$744,861.20, which is equal to 80% of the total amount of reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal services that Katten rendered during the Fee Period (i.e.

³ The period from April 1, 2019, through and including April 30, 2019, is referred to herein as the "Fee Period").

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 3 of 58

\$931,076.50); (iii) allowance and payment of \$24,179.17 for the actual, necessary expenses that Katten incurred in connection with such services during the fee Period.

Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred

1. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is a schedule of the number of hours expended and fees incurred (on an aggregate basis) by Katten partners, associates, and paraprofessionals during the Fee Period with respect to each of the project categories Katten established in accordance with its internal billing procedures. As reflected in <u>Exhibit A</u>, Katten incurred \$931,076.50 in fees during the Fee Period. Pursuant to this Fee Statement, Katten seeks payment of 80% of such fees (\$744,861.20 in the aggregate).

2. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit B</u> is a schedule of Katten professionals and paraprofessionals, including the standard hourly rate for each attorney and paraprofessional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these Chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period and the title, hourly rate, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees earned by each professional. The blended hourly billing rate of attorneys for all services provided during the Fee Period is \$787.⁴ The blended hourly billing rate of all paraprofessionals is \$214.⁵

3. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit C</u> is a schedule for the Fee Period setting forth the total amount of payment sought with respect to each category of expenses for which Katten is seeking payment in this Monthly Fee Statement. All of these disbursements comprise the requested sum for Katten's out-of-pocket expenses, which total \$24,179.17.

⁴ The blended hourly rate of \$787 for attorneys is derived by dividing the total fees for attorneys of \$920,352.50 by the total hours of 1,170 for those same attorneys.

⁵ The blended hourly billing rate of \$200 for paraprofessionals is similarly derived by dividing the total fees for paraprofessionals of \$10,721 by the total hours of 50.10 for these same paraprofessionals.

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 4 of 58

4. Attached hereto as **Exhibit D** are the time records of Katten, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Katten professional and paraprofessional during the Fee Period as well as an itemization of expenses by project category.

Representations

5. Although every effort has been made to include all fees and expenses incurred in the Fee Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this Fee Statement due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. Katten reserves the right to make further application to the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York for allowance of such fees and expenses not included herein. Subsequent Fee Statements will be filed in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, Local Rules, and the Interim Compensation Order.

Notice

6. The Debtors will provide notice of this Fee Statement in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order. The Debtors submit that no other or further notice be given.

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank.]

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 5 of 58

WHEREFORE, Katten, in connection with services rendered on behalf of the Debtors, respectfully requests (i) interim allowance of \$931,076.50 for the reasonable and necessary legal services that Katten rendered to the Debtors during the Fee Period; (ii) compensation in the amount of \$744,861.20, which is equal to 80% of the total amount of compensation sought for reasonable and necessary legal services that Katten rendered to the Debtors (i.e. \$931,076.50); and (iii) allowance and payment of \$24,179.17 for the actual and necessary expenses that Katten incurred in connection with such services during the Fee Period

Dated: May 21, 2019 New York, NY By: <u>/s/ Steven J. Reisman</u> Steven J. Reisman Shaya Rochester **KATTEN MUCHIN ROSENMAN LLP** 575 Madison Avenue New York, NY 10022 Telephone: (212) 940-8800 Facsimile: (212) 940-8800 Facsimile: (212) 940-8776 Email: sreisman@katten.com srochester@katten.com

Conflicts Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Exhibit A

In re Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al. Bankruptcy Case No. 19-22312 (RDD) (Jointly Administered)

Summary of Fees and Expenses by Project Category for the Time Period of April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 7 of 58

In re Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al. Bankruptcy Case No. 19-22312 (RDD) (Jointly Administered)

Summary of Fees and Expenses by Project Category for the Time Period of April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

Matter Number	Matter Description	Hours	Fees	Expenses	Total Amount of Fees and Expenses
2	Retention and Fee Applications	15.40	\$ 8,950.50	\$ 0	\$ 8,950.50
8	Charter Litigation	1,204.70	922,126.00	24,197.17	946,323.17
Totals		1,220.10	\$ 931,076.50	\$ 24,197.17	\$ 955,273.67

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 8 of 58

Exhibit B

In re Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al. Bankruptcy Case No. 19-22312 (RDD) (Jointly Administered)

Attorneys' and Paraprofessionals' Information for the Time Period of April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 9 of 58

In re Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al. Bankruptcy Case No. 19-22312 (RDD) (Jointly Administered)

Attorneys' and Paraprofessionals' Information for the Time Period of April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

Attorneys

Attorney	Position with the Applicant	Year Admitted	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
Steven J. Reisman	Partner	1991	Restructuring	\$ 1,220	63.80	\$ 77,836.00
Theresa A. Foudy	Partner	1994	Restructuring	1,050	5.30	5,565.00
Floyd A. Mandell	Partner	1973	IP	1,030	3.10	3,193.00
Terence P. Ross	Partner	1983	IP	985	186.70	183,899.50
Cindi M. Giglio	Partner	2007	Restructuring	965	2.30	2,219.50
Shaya Rochester	Partner	2003	Restructuring	965	202.40	195,316.00
Ryan Larsen	Partner	2000	Litigation	870	44.00	38,280.00
Tami Kameda Sims	Partner	2006	Litigation	845	168.30	142,213.50
Allison J. Arotsky	Associate	2012	Restructuring	730	9.10	6,643.00
Joanna M. Hill	Associate	2014	Litigation	695	59.90	41,630.50
Paul S. Yong	Associate	2015	Litigation	695	4.80	3,336.00
Camille A. Cameron	Associate	2015	Litigation	645	84.70	54,631.50
Kristin Lockhart	Associate	2016	IP	605	72.70	43,983.50
Rachel A. Oplinger	Associate	2017	Litigation	515	19.50	10,042.50
Melissa Velez	Associate	2017	Litigation	515	33.40	17,201.00
Grace Thompson	Associate	2019	Restructuring	450	161.30	72,585.00
Jake Nussbaum	Associate	2019	Litigation	450	14.90	6,705.00
Katherine M.						
Motsinger	Associate	2018	Litigation	450	20.00	9,000.00
Catherine E. O'Brien	Associate	2018	Litigation	440	13.80	6,072.00
Totals for Attorneys					1,170.00	\$ 920,352.50

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 10 of 58

Paraprofessionals

Paraprofessional	Position with the Applicant	Number of Years in that Position	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
	Litigation Support		Litigation			
Adriane Konrath	Specialist	22	Support	\$ 390	2.90	\$ 1,131.00
	Litigation Support		Litigation			
Carl Rossing	Operator	21	Support	330	0.90	297.00
John Greer	Docket Manager	30	Docketing	290	0.40	116.00
Thomas Wang	Paralegal	1	Restructuring	200	22.10	4,420.00
Marie Siena	Paralegal	12	Restructuring	200	23.80	4,760.00
Totals for Parapro	ofessionals				50.10	\$ 10,724.00

Total Fees Requested for Attorneys and Paraprofessionals:¹

<u>\$931,076.50</u>

¹ As a courtesy to the Debtors, in connection with its interim fee application, Katten will write off the time incurred by attorney and paraprofessional timekeepers billing less than three hours during the applicable three-month interim period.

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 11 of 58

Exhibit C

In re Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al. Bankruptcy Case No. 19-22312 (RDD) (Jointly Administered)

Summary of Actual and Necessary Expenses for the Time Period of April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 12 of 58

In re Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al. Bankruptcy Case No. 19-22312 (RDD) (Jointly Administered)

Summary of Actual and Necessary Expenses for the Time Period of April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

Expenses by Categories	Amount
Out of Town Travel and Airfare	\$ 4,285.01
Postage and Telephone Conference Charges	8.59
Color Printing	68.75
Legal Research	19,512.02
PACER/ECF Fees	304.80
Total ¹	\$ 24,179.17

¹ This Expense Summary reflects a voluntary write-off of all expenses related to local transportation and meals.

<u>Exhibit D</u>

In re Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al. Bankruptcy Case No. 19-22312 (RDD) (Jointly Administered)

Detailed Description of Fees, Expenses and Disbursements for the Time Period of April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019¹

¹ The following time records have been redacted to remove privileged and confidential information. To extent there are any inadvertent disclosures of information protected by attorney-client privilege, Katten requests that such inadvertent disclosure not be deemed a waiver of privilege.

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 14 of 58



Direct Billing Inquiries to: Carla Harmon 212-940-6512 carla.harmon@kattenlaw.com 575 Madison Avenue New York, NY 10022-2585

May 17, 2019

Windstream Holdings, Inc. Attn: Kristi Moody, Esq. Senior Vice President, General Counsel & Corporate Secretary	Invoice No. 1301541613 Client No. 392355 Matter No. 00002
4001 Rodney Parham Road Little Rock, AR 72212	
	FEIN: 36-2796532
Re: <u>Retention and Fee Applications</u> (392355.00002)	
For legal services rendered through April 30, 2019	\$8,950.50

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL: \$8,950.50

Disbursements and other charges incurred which have not yet been posted as of the above date will be billed at a later date.

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 15 of 58

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541613 Invoice Date: May 17, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Matter 00002: Retention and Fee Applications

Date 02 Apr 19	Attorney or Assistant Rochester, Shaya J.	Description Call with C. Giglio re retention application (.30)	Hours 0.30
08 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Review the February and March prebills for proper assignment of tasks and privileged and confidential information (1.00)	1.00
09 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to issues re Katten retention application and coordinating with Kirkland regarding Court approval (.40)	0.30
10 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Review Windstream ch. 11 case Motion for Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Motion and Motion for the Retention and Compensation of Professional to ensure Katten compliance and parties objection rules (.50)	0.50
10 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Review Windstream Billing Guidelines and communications with Kirkland regarding same (.20); office conference with S. Reisman re same (.40); attend to issues re DIP reporting (.40); attend to issues re Katten retention order (.30)	1.30
10 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Review Case Management order: re objections and proposed orders and respond to S. Rochester re: same (.20); communications with S. Rochester re: compliance with budget reporting (.50)	0.70
11 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Communications with S. Rochester, A. Arotsky, and Katten's billing department regarding the February- March fee statement (.40)	0.40
12 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Review February and March time records for privileged and confidential information and proper assignment of matters to matter categories (2.50); draft email to team re: compliance with budget-reporting requirements (.20)	2.70
15 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Review the April prebills (to date) for proper assignment of tasks and privileged and confidential information and reconcile with A. Arotsky's comments to same (1.00)	1.00
16 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Correspondence with I. Cheban and S. Rochester re: preparing weekly report and budget (.20)	0.20
16 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Continue to review February, March, and April prebills for proper assignment of tasks and privileged and confidential information (1.20); communications with A. Arotsky and Katten's billing department re: the same (.10)	1.30
17 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to issues re fee estimate to A&M (.20); review and provide comments on February-March invoices to ensure non-disclosure of confidential and privileged information (1.00)	1.20
18 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to issues re February/March Monthly Fee Statement to ensure compliance with UST guidelines (.30)	0.30
18 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Review interim compensation procedures and prepare form of monthly fee statement (.90); prepare email to	1.00

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 16 of 58

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541613 Invoice Date: May 17, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Matter 00002: Retention and Fee Applications

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
		team re: budget compliance (.10)	
18 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Various communications with S. Rochester, A.	1.10
		Arotsky, and other Katten staff re: February-March fee	
		statement (.30); perform spot check of time sheets and	
		follow up related to same (.80)	
19 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Prepare markup of April prebills for S. Rochester (.50);	0.90
Ĩ		follow up conversation with T. Sims re: same and	
		prepare additional markup for her (.40)	
23 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to issues re fee estimate for DIP Budget (.30)	0.30
	Arotsky, Allison	Communications with C. Harmon and S. Rochester	0.50
- 1 -	9 , 1	regarding weekly report and budget (.20); draft and	
		revise email to A. Gasbarra re: estimated fees and	
		expenses (.30)	
26 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Email reminder to team re: weekly budget (.10)	0.10
	Arotsky, Allison	Follow-up with timekeepers re: weekly budget (.10)	0.10
	Arotsky, Allison	Prepare email to Alvarez and Marsal re: weekly budget	0.20
50 mpi 17	7 HOUSKY, 7 HIBOH	reporting (.20)	0.20
		TOTALS:	15.40

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Matter 00002: Retention and Fee Applications

	Attorney or Assistant		Hours	Rate	Amount
44935	Arotsky, Allison		5.50	730.00	\$4,015.00
44845	Rochester, Shaya J.		3.70	965.00	\$3,570.50
44616	Thompson, Grace		0.50	450.00	\$225.00
45083	Wang, Thomas		5.70	200.00	\$1,140.00
	-	TOTAL:	15.40		\$8,950.50

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 17 of 58



Katten Muchin Rosenman LLP

Direct Billing Inquiries to: Carla Harmon 212-940-6512 carla.harmon@kattenlaw.com 575 Madison Avenue New York, NY 10022-2585

May 20, 2019

Windstream Holdings, Inc. Attn: Kristi Moody, Esq. Senior Vice President, General Counsel & Corporate Secretary 4001 Rodney Parham Road	Invoice No. 1301541615 Client No. 392355 Matter No. 00008
Little Rock, AR 72212 Re: <u>Charter Litigation</u> (392355.00008)	FEIN: 36-2796532
For legal services rendered through April 30, 2019	\$922,126.00
Disbursements and other charges	\$24,179.17

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL: \$946,305.17

Disbursements and other charges incurred which have not yet been posted as of the above date will be billed at a later date.

19-22312-rdd Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 18 of 58

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		Water 00000. Charter Engation	
Date 01 Apr 19	Attorney or Assistant Larsen, Ryan	Description Draft (6.00) and revise (2.50) adversary complaint for violation of Lanham Act, state consumer fraud statutes, breach of contract, violation of automatic stay; review and revise TRO papers (.50); conference call with T. Sims and S. Rochester re: complaint, TRO, client affidavit (.50); analyze complaint and Windstream/Spectrum contract for potentially filing under seal (.40)	Hours 9.90
01 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Prepare legal argument section on irreparable harm (.90); revise legal argument section on public interest and balancing of harms (.30); revise order on motion (.20); prepare preliminary statement for motion (.50); strategize regarding finalization of Complaint, motion for temporary restraining order, and order to show cause (.70); analyze information required for supporting affidavit (.50); revise affidavit supporting motion for temporary restraining order and preliminary injunction (1.60); strategize with S. Rochester and R. Larsen regarding exhibits to be included with supporting affidavit (.50); discuss trademark search with K. Lockhart (.10); analyze additional factual background information from client (.60); revise factual background section of motion (.70); review and edit order to show cause (.20); review and edit Complaint (.40); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on injury for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on injury for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on injury for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on injury for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on injury for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on injury for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on injury for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on intreparable harm for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on intreparable harm for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare and revise legal argument section on intreparable harm for motion for temporary restraining order (.20); continue to prepare a	9.80
01 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Draft (3.50) and revise (1.10) declaration in support of motion for injunctive relief; prepare exhibits to declaration in support of motion for injunctive relief (1.30); review client documents for exhibits to declaration in support of motion for injunctive relief (.80)	6.70
01 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Review and analyze draft brief in support of motion (.50); research case law on legal standard for issue in brief (1.60); revise section of brief to incorporate new research on legal standard (1.20); discussion with G. Thompson regarding status of motions and proposed orders (.40); review Trademark Office website and search for trademarks belonging to WINDSTREAM (.30); discuss results of trademark search with T. Sims (.10); perform research on legal theories for complaint (1.10); draft summary to T. Sims regarding same (1.10)	6.30

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date 01 Apr 19	Attorney or Assistant Thompson, Grace	Description Edit Notice of Hearing on TRO (.60); draft Notice of Hearing for Sealing Motion (.50); revise Motion to Seal (1.60); research pleadings precedent in Windstream case filed by Kirkland and Ellis (1.70); attend conference call with S. Rochester, T. Sims and R. Larsen regarding status of pleadings (.50); review First Day Declaration in Windstream case and incorporate applicable details into TRO, Complaint, Affidavits, Motion to Seal, and Notice of Hearing pleadings (.40); edit citations in the same (.30); edit jurisdiction, notice, and introduction sections of the same (1.30); copy edit and format the same (.60); review Critical Vendors Motion (.20); draft Affidavit of T. Thomas (1.50); revise fact section from second Affidavit (.40); review language on relief granted in applicable Windstream pleadings (.30); discussion with K. Lockhart re: status of motions (.40)	Hours 10.30
01 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Various emails and review of proposed pleadings in connection with anticipated filing of order to show cause seeking temporary restraining order and preliminary injunction against Charter for violations of the Lanham Act related to deceptive and false advertising as well as review of recorded messages of discussions between Windstream and customers related to Charter's actions (1.30); emails with client re: proposed pleadings, timing of distribution, update on request for information related to proposed relief and follow up (.40); discussions with S. Rochester and team re: revisions to complaint seeking temporary restraining order and preliminary injunction and matters related to same (.50); continued review of order to show cause and pleadings in support of TRO and related relief as well as markup and comments re:	4.60
01 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	same (2.30); discuss complaint with C. Giglio (.10) Review complaint and TRO motion (.30); call with C. Giglio re same (.20); communications with client regarding facts to support TRO (1.10); review and provide comments on Adversary Complaint (2.90); review Bankruptcy Rules, Local Bankruptcy Rules, Chambers Rules and Case Management Order regarding TROs and Preliminary Injunctions (.60); call with S. Reisman, T. Sims and R. Larsen to discuss next steps (.50); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.60); review and provide comments on Motion for Temporary Restraining Order and Preliminary Injunction (2.60); review and provide comments on Pleadings Checklist (1.70); review and provide comments on sealing motion and order and ensure compliance with applicable Chambers Rules and Case Management Order (.40); review and provide	14.90

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 20 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description further comments on Adversary Complaint (.80); review and provide comments on Affidavit in Support of Motion (1.40); review and provide comments on Motion to Seal and review local rules in connection with same (.60); review and provide comments of Notices of Hearing on the Motion (.30); review and provide comments on the Complaint (.40); review and	Hours
01 Apr 19	Giglio, Cindi	provide comments on the Order to Show Cause (.50) Discuss complaint with S. Reisman (.10); related follow up call with S. Rochester (.20); review and provide comments to draft complaint (1.00)	1.30
02 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Exchange correspondence with P. Anderson regarding background information (.60); analyze new factual information for inclusion into the Complaint (1.50); communications with S. Rochester regarding revisions to the Complaint and motion for temporary restraining order (.80); revise Complaint (2.60); exchange correspondence with K. Smith regarding draft pleading, motion, and supporting documents (.40); exchange emails with K. Lockhart regarding additional	6.10
02 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	legal research for motion (.20) Perform further research on initial interest confusion standards in Second Circuit (1.40); briefly review legal research of affirmative injunctions (.70); review and reply correspondence from T. Sims regarding separate basis for Lanham Act claim (.40); review brief to confirm correct incorporation of legal standard regarding additional basis for claim under the Lanham Act (.70)	3.20
02 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Edit adversary complaint (.20); review Case Management Order for rules related to request to seal pleadings (.40); review Kirkland Windstream pleadings to ensure all appropriate uniformity (.90); revise pleadings (TRO, Complaint, Order to Show Cause, Affidavit, Motion to Seal, Notice of Hearings, and Pro Hac Vice application) incorporating changes from S. Reisman and S. Rochester (3.00); various calls and emails with S. Rochester re: the same (.80); continue drafting second affidavit (.50); research granting of equitable subordination for automatic stay violations (3.20)	9.00
02 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Review and comment on draft of complaint, temporary restraining order motion, related affidavit (3.00); conference with S. Rochester re: comments to TRO motion affidavit and complaint (.80); participation in calls throughout the day with Katten team and Windstream team re: potential Lanham Act claims, claims for violation of the automatic stay and other changes necessary for documentation for TRO complaint and order to show cause (1.20)	5.00

4

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
02 Apr 19	Foudy, Theresa	Review and edit drafts of Complaint against Charter, TRO Motion papers, and accompanying affidavit (3.10)	3.10
02 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	(3.10) Review and provide further comments on TRO Motion (1.80), Affidavit (.80), and Adversary Complaint (1.80); multiple calls/emails with G. Thompson re same (.90); review Case Management Order to confirm compliance (.50) office conference with S. Reisman to discuss his comments on the TRO Motion, Adversary Complaint and Affidavit (.80); turn TRO Motion, Affidavit and Adversary Complaint to reflect S. Reisman changes (1.00); review T. Foudy comments to TRO Motion (.50); review T. Foudy comments to Complaint (.50); update pleadings checklist for TRO Motion (.30); prepare action items list for filing of TRO papers and sealing papers (1.50); call with T. Sims re additional comments to papers and additional call-in information provided by client (.80); research equitable subordination and other claims (1.50)	12.70
03 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Analyze additional factual information provided by client and related communications with S. Rochester (.50); analyze additional legal research findings (.40); continue to revise and prepare Complaint (3.40); continue to revise and prepare motion for TRO and related communications with team (3.50); review and edit proposed letter regarding corrective advertising (.20); review and edit draft letter to the Court (.20); finalize evidence in support of motion for TRO (1.80)	10.00
03 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Perform legal research of case law relating to additional form of equitable relief under the Lanham Act (2.30); perform additional legal research of case law relating to additional form of monetary relief under the Lanham Act (.60)	2.90
03 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Continue researching granting of equitable subordination for automatic stay violations (2.20); review Windstream declarations and Case Management Order for any recent updates (.20); perform initial redactions on Motion for Temporary Restraining Order and Complaint (1.10); review transcript of customer calls (.50); perform redactions of customers' personal information on exhibits (1.00); draft proposed letter from Charter to Windstream customers as Appendix I to the Motion (.30); draft agenda for hearing (.50); draft cover letter to Judge Drain (.50); continue revising and formatting Motion for TRO (1.60); continue revising and formatting Complaint (1.50); continue editing Motion to Seal and Notice of Hearing on Motion for TRO (.50) review federal, local, and Case Management rules on filing,	12.60

19-22312-rdd	Doc 551	Filed 05/21/19	Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10	Main Document
Cliente 202255 Wie	dataaam Haldina	P(g 22 of 58	Invoice No. 1201541615

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

notice, summons, and cover sheets (70); review Windstream pleadings filed by Kirkland and Ellis and revise Katten Windstream pleadings to ensure uniformity (1.00)03 Apr 19Reisman, StevenAttend to review of materials received from client re: Charter's actions and coordination of materials for inclusion in TRO request (.60); discussion with S. Rochester re: same (.30); review and mark up TRO motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO hearing (1.60); review and comment on agenda (.40); review rescarch and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50)0.5003 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50)0.5003 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with Cleint and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply true wand provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply true wand provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on updated Compliant on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on on 	Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
03 Apr 19Reisman, Stevenrevise Kattern WindsTream pleadings to ensure uniformity (1.00)03 Apr 19Reisman, StevenAttend to review of materials received from client re: Charter's actions and coordination of materials for inclusion in TRO request (60); discussion with S. Rochester re: same (.30); review and mark up TRO motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO hearing (1.60); review and comment on agenda (.40); review proposed letter to be attached to TRO which we are requesting that Charter send out (.40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60)03 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50)03 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J. Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with Client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.63); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex 1 to TRO Order (1.10); ratend to issues Affidavit, reflecting client's comments on 104 to Shoy; review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause, (.80); review and provide comments on Cl.10); retriew and provide comments on Order to Show Cause, (.80); prepare Annex 1 to TRO Order (1.10); ratend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare Pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion, Complaint, Sol03 Apr 19Giglio, CindiRev		·	notice, summons, and cover sheets (.70); review	
03 Apr 19Reisman, Stevenuniformity (1.00)Attend to review of materials received from client re: (Charter's actions and coordination of materials for inclusion in TRO request (.60); discussion with S. Rochester re: same (.30); review and mark up TRO motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO heating (1.60); review and motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO heating (1.60); review and motion order to show cause in TRO (.600)03 Apr 19Foudy, Theresa0.5003 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50) Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments (.100); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); review and provide comments (1.60); review and provide comments on Updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)0.5003 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to insuse Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)0.5004 Apr 19<				
03 Apr 19 Reisman, Steven Attend to review of materials received from client re: Charter's actions and coordination of materials for inclusion in TRO request (.60); discussion with S. Rochester re: same (.30); review and mark up TRO motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO hearing (1.60); review and comment on agenda (.40); review proposed letter to be attached to TRO which we are requesting that Charter send out (.40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60) 03 Apr 19 Foudy, Theresa 0.50 03 Apr 19 Rochester, Shaya J. Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare analt to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, diravit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex 1 to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit, reflecting client's, Saling Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 0.50 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and oxec in a SDNY Bantypretycy Court adversary proceeding,			· ·	
 inclusion in TRO request (.60); discussion with S. Rochester re: same (.30); review and mark up TRO motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO hearing (1.60); review and comment on agenda (.40); review proposed letter to be attached to TRO which we are requesting that Charter send out (.40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60) (3 Apr 19 Foudy, Theresa Review research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50) (3 Apr 19 Rochester, Shaya J. Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); repare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare blance and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) (4 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with erspect to higuetion and procedures with instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) (4 Apr 19	03 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Attend to review of materials received from client re:	3.90
Rochester re: same (.30); review and mark up TRO motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO hearing (1.60); review and comment on agenda (.40); review proposed letter to be attached to TRO which we are requesting that Charter send out (.40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60)03 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60)0.5003 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.50); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments (.10); metric and provide comments (.10); review and provide comments (.10); review and request (.70); review and provide comments (.100); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (.100); review and row and conspondence and documents related to TRO order (.1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); repare pleadings for film; including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (.2.80)0.303 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview erailing information and procedu				
 motion order to show cause and related pleadings as well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO bearing (1.60); review and comment on agenda (.40); review proposed letter to be attached to TRO which we are requesting that Chatter send out (.40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60) 03 Apr 19 Foudy, Theresa Review research and cases on claims for equitable 0.50 subordination based upon stay violations (.50) 03 Apr 19 Rochester, Shaya J. Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.100); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); repare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on updated to issues Affidavit, reflecting client's comments on updated to fiftidavit, including Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex 1 to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare placing for filling, including Order to Show Cause. (.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Sima, Tami Kameda 			-	
 well as complaint, sealing motion and other materials in preparation for TRO hearing (1.60); review and comment on agenda (40); review proposed letter to be attached to TRO which we are requesting that Charter send out (40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60) O3 Apr 19 Foudy, Theresa subordination based upon stay violations (.50) O3 Apr 19 Rochester, Shaya J. Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) O4 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) O4 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) O4 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda 				
comment on agenda (.40); review proposed letter to be attached to TRO which we are requesting that Charter send out (.40); discussion sthroughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60)03 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50)0.5003 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments (.0); review and provide comments (.10); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (.180); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit, reflecting client's coments (.180); review and provide complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (.280)0.5003 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)0.4004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Xameda Sins (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Xameda Sins (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaReview for fortemporary groceeding, in diversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 1			· •	
attached to TRO which we are requesting that Charter send out (40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60)0.5003 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50)0.5003 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.10); review and provide comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Causes (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for tiling, including Order to Show Cause (.80); Advise regarding information and procedures with orespect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.40004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)2.0004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaReview motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); review affidavit in support of motion for				
send out (-40); discussions throughout the day with T. Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (-60)03 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (-50)0.5003 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (-60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (-30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (-60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (-70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (-70); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (-80); prepare Annex 1 to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.60); review and provide comments on Show Cause (-80); prepare Annex 1 to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Causes, TRO Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)0.4003 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (-50)0.4004 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.4004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Xameda Sims (80)2.0004 Apr 19Sims, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) <td< td=""><td></td><td></td><td>- · · · · ·</td><td></td></td<>			- · · · · ·	
Sims, S. Rochester and others re: order to show cause in TRO (.60)Sims, S. Rochester and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50)03 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments (.70); review and provide comments (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments (.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); review and provide comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); review and provide comments on updated to charter's actions (.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)0.5003 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and a instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents rel.200); draft comments to T. Xameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adve				
03 Apr 19Foudy, TheresaReview research and cases on claims for equitable subordination based upon stay violations (.50)0.5003 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments (.160); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare peladings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)0.5003 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview engarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents respect (.20); draft comments to T. X.002.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding, for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.5004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.50			· · · ·	
 subordination based upon stay violations (50) O3 Apr 19 Rochester, Shaya J. Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO ((.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments on updated TRO mapplication (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) O3 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50) O4 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Q.00 Kameda Sims (.80) O4 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 O4 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda 				
03 Apr 19Rochester, Shaya J.Communications with client and Katten team regarding new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)0.5003 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)0.4004 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.4004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adver	03 Apr 19	Foudy, Theresa	-	0.50
 new information about customers disconnecting service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on 1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary 	03 Apr 19	Rochester Shava I		12.20
service as a result of Charter's actions (.60); discussion with S. Reisman re: materials for inclusion in TRO (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex 1 to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with 0.40 respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary	0574017	Koenester, Shaya J.		12.20
 (.30); review and provide comments on updated Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with nstructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie 050 Progreeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie 050 Progreeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie 				
Complaint, reflecting client's comments (.70); review and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with 0.40 respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70				
 and provide comments on updated TRO Motion, reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); repeare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with 0.40 respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 				
 reflecting client's comments (1.60); multiple emails with client reply to questions regarding TRO application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with 0.40 respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 				
application (.70); prepare email to chambers re TRO request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleakings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)03 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)04 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)04 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Z.00 Kameda Sims (.80)04 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)04 Apr 19Siena, MarieRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary				
request (.70); review and provide comments on updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with 0.40 respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70				
 updated Affidavit, reflecting client's comments (1.80); review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 				
 review and provide comments on Order to Show Cause (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 				
 (.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to issues Affidavit in Support (1.10); prepare pleadings for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80) 03 Apr 19 Giglio, Cindi Review email correspondence and documents related 0.50 to TRO and complaint (.50) 04 Apr 19 Greer, John Advise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary 0.50 proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 				
for filing, including Order to Show Cause, TRO Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)03 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.4004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70			(.80); prepare Annex I to TRO Order (1.10); attend to	
Motion, Complaint, Affidavit, Sealing Motion, Notices of Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)03 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.4004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70				
03 Apr 19Giglio, Cindiof Motion and Hearing Agenda (2.80)03 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.4004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70				
03 Apr 19Giglio, CindiReview email correspondence and documents related to TRO and complaint (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.4004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70				
04 Apr 19Greer, JohnAdvise regarding information and procedures with respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)0.4004 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70	03 Apr 19	Giglio, Cindi		0.50
 respect to Injunction and OSC in a SDNY Bankruptcy Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. 2.00 Kameda Sims (.80) 04 Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) 04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); 10.70 		a		0.40
Court adversary proceeding, provide forms and instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40)04 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70	04 Apr 19	Greer, John		0.40
 instructions for Summons, and advise regarding signing of documents or e-signature (.40) 04 Apr 19 Mandell, Floyd A. Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80) Apr 19 Siena, Marie Prepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50) Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kameda Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary 				
04 Apr 19Mandell, Floyd A.Review draft TRO papers (1.20); draft comments to T. Kameda Sims (.80)2.0004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70				
04 Apr 19Siena, MarieKameda Sims (.80)0.5004 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary proceeding (.50)0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70				
04 Apr 19Siena, MariePrepare binder of draft pleadings in adversary0.5004 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70	04 Apr 19	Mandell, Floyd A.		2.00
04 Apr 19 Sims, Tami Kamedaproceeding (.50)proceeding (.50)0.70Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70	04 Apr 19	Siena Marie		0.50
04 Apr 19Sims, Tami KamedaRevise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); revise affidavit in support of motion for temporary10.70	J. Pr IJ	~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~	· · · ·	0.00
	04 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Revise motion for temporary restraining order (2.70);	10.70
restraining order (2.50); revise adversary complaint				
			restraining order (2.50); revise adversary complaint	

19-22312-rdd	Doc 551	Filed 05/21/19	Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10	Main Document
Cliente 202255 Wir	dataaam Haldina	P(g 23 of 58	Invoice No. 1201541615

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description (1.60); strategize regarding motion to seal (.40); prepare all documents and exhibits for filing (1.70); strategize regarding discovery to propound on Charter	Hours
		(.60); prepare for call with court regarding request for temporary restraining order (.90); call Court (.20); review correspondence from Judge Drain regarding hearing availability (.10)	
04 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Finalize complaint and motion for temporary restraining order (2.70); review complaint and motion for temporary restraining order (1.30)	4.00
04 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Continue reviewing Federal, Local, Chambers, and Case Management Order rules to ensure filing compliance (.90); revise exhibits in Motion for TRO in preparation for filing (1.00); continue editing the same (2.50); confer with A. Arotsky re: status of same (.30); revise exhibits in Complaint in preparation for filing (1.70) continue editing the same (2.70); revise exhibits in Affidavit (.80); continue editing the same (1.00); continue revising Motion to Seal (1.00); prepare exhibits in Motion to Seal for filing (1.70); meeting with S. Rochester re: status of pleadings (.80)	14.40
04 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Review and revise TRO papers including affidavit, complaint and related documentation (1.30); review emails to chambers re: TRO application and motion to seal and follow up with S. Rochester re: same (.60); participate in various calls with chambers re: filing of TRO and scheduling of hearing and coordination of matters related to hearing (.60); review draft of discovery request in connection with TRO and preliminary injunction related litigation (1.60); review motion to seal (.40); review and comment on final form of pleadings in connection with litigation against charter (.80); review complaint in connection with TRO and related relief (.40); discussion with S. Rochester re: edits to complaint and calling chambers (.80)	6.50
04 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Review redactions to TRO papers (.70); review and provide comments on updated version of Motion for TRO and Preliminary Injunction (1.30); review and provide comments on updated version of Complaint (1.40); email correspondence with client re same (.80); oversee preparations for filing documents under seal and complying with Court protocol (1.40); prepare email to Chambers regarding TRO application and Motion to Seal and discussion with S. Reisman re: same (.80); provide instructions re: Summons (.80); review clients' changes to the Motion for TRO and Preliminary Injunction (1.10); review clients' changes to the Complaint (.90); office conference with S. Reisman regarding calling chambers (.80); stratagize re	13.60

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
		discovery requests (1.20); prepare pleadings for filing including redactions, Chambers copies and service	
		copies for impacted parties (1.60); meeting with G.	
		Thompson re: same (.80)	
04 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Communications with G. Thompson re: status of TRO documents for filing (.30)	0.30
05 Apr 19	Mandell, Floyd A.	Review emails regarding TRO issues and exchange emails with T. Kameda Sims and S. Reisman (.40)	0.40
05 Apr 19	Siena, Marie	Open adversary proceeding via ECF, e-file pleadings and conversations with chambers re same (3.00)	3.00
05 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Exchange correspondence with K. Smith regarding filing (.20); revise redacted Complaint and prepare	4.80
		same for filing (.90); review email from Judge Drain	
		regarding TRO request and prepare correspondence	
		regarding same (.30); strategize with S. Rochester	
		regarding TRO hearing date and proposed schedule	
		(.70); call with Charter's counsel, B. Hockett (.30);	
		strategize regarding discovery to Charter with S.	
		Rochester (.20); prepare and revise document requests	
		to Charter (1.80); strategize regarding deposition notice	
05 4 10	$\mathbf{V}_{1} = \mathbf{V}_{1}$	to Charter (.40)	4 20
05 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Draft and revise discovery requests (3.80); further revise document requests (.50)	4.30
05 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Continue final preparation for filing of Motion for	8.40
05 Apr 17	Thompson, Orace	TRO, Complaint, Affidavit, and Motion to Seal (3.20);	0.40
		prepare unredacted sealed documents for submission to	
		Judge Drain and U.S. Trustee (2.00); revise internal	
		documents in preparation for continued litigation	
		(2.20); coordinate with Katten paralegal T. Wang on	
		preparing binders OP internal materials (1.00)	
05 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Review and final sign off on TRO documentation as	5.10
		well as review final TRO application and complaint	
		and materials in preparation for upcoming TRO	
		hearing (1.40); follow up discussions with S. Rochester re: issues related to redacting confidential information	
		and filing certain documents under seal and next steps	
		(.60); review draft of discovery and strategy re: same	
		(.60); discussions re: timing of serving discovery and	
		obtaining court approval for same (.30); review final	
		affidavit, motion to seal and related documents in	
		connection with upcoming hearing on TRO (1.20);	
05 4 10		prepare for TRO hearing (1.00)	0.00
05 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Oversee filing of Motion for TRO and Preliminary	8.30
		Injunction, Affidavit in Support, Adversary Complaint	
		and Motion to Seal (2.60); communications with Chambers re same (.50); provide telephonic and email	
		notice of TRO application pursuant to Case	
		Management Order (.50); attend to issues re discovery	
		including conference with T. Sims (.50); calls with S.	
		Reisman re status of TRO application (.60); calls with	

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description T. Sims re status of TRO application (.70); prepare for TRO hearing, including scripting arguments and key facts (2.10); review and provide comments on	Hours
05 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	document request (.50); prepare update for client (.30) Respond to G. Thompson and M. Velez re: document requests and notices of deposition samples (.20)	0.20
05 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Assist in preparation of binders of documents relating to Debtors' TRO Application in the Adversary Proceeding against Charter for Judge Drain and the US Trustee (1.10); prepare binders of documents related to the TRO application for internal use, incorporating multiple rounds of attorney review (2.90); various communications with G. Thompson re: coordinating same (1.00); begin pulling statutes, cases, and rules cited in the Complaint, TRO application, and Langston Affidavit (.20)	5.20
06 Apr 19	Mandell, Floyd A.	Exchange emails with S. Reisman regarding TRO Hearing this month (.20)	0.20
06 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Follow up with F. Mandell re: TRO hearing, scheduling and coverage for upcoming TRO argument (.70)	0.70
06 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Review correspondence re: Charter's counsel (.30); reply to client re: TRO hearing (.20); emails re discovery (.20)	0.70
07 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Continue revisions to document requests to Charter (.70); revise deposition notice for Charter (.40)	1.10
07 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Coordinate with Katten paralegal T. Wang on preparing internal materials and revise materials (.80); revise working group list (1.50)	2.30
07 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Review and provide comments on updated document requests (1.50); review and provide comments on working group list (.30)	1.80
07 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Finish pulling statutes, cases, and rules cited in the Complaint, TRO application, and Langston Affidavit (2.80); prepare binder index of same and submit for attorney review (1.00); communications with G. Thompson re: same (.80)	4.60
08 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Strategize with S. Reisman, S. Rochester and T. Ross regarding hearing on temporary restraining order (1.00); prepare additional information required for pro hac vice application (.10); call with Charter's counsel regarding TRO hearing and proposed schedule (.20); exchange correspondence with D. Li, courtroom deputy clerk (.40); review correspondence with Charter's counsel regarding depositions (.10); exchange correspondence with client regarding advertisements (.20); strategize with S. Rochester re: next steps (.70); revise document requests to Charter (.40); revise deposition notice to Charter (.40); exchange correspondence with client regarding preparation for	4.00

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 26 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description TRO hearing (.50)	Hours
08 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Call with S. Reisman, S. Rochester and T. Sims to discuss hearing on Motion for TRO (1.00); read and analyze Declaration in Support of Motion for Temporary Restraining Order and attached exhibits (2.00); read and analyze In re Portrait Corp. case (.50); read and analyze relevant Second Circuit cases on false advertising under the Lanham Act (1.50); read and comment on draft email to Court seeking a hearing date (.30); read and respond to multiple emails from T. Sims and S. Rochester regarding Charter request for deposition (.30); read Complaint including review of exhibits thereto (1.00); read email from K. Smith regarding Comcast advertisement (.30); read key cases on TROs in Second Circuit (1.00); read Motion for Temporary Restraining Order (.30); review and respond to emails from S. Rochester regarding TRO hearing (.30); review and respond to emails from S. Rochester regarding witness preparation (.30)	8.80
08 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Research preliminary injunction and temporary restraining order precedent in this court (2.00); discuss same with S. Rochester (.50); revise working group list and draft correspondence for interested parties (.20)	2.70
08 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Participate in Katten call with T. Ross and T. Sims to go over background and preparation for upcoming TRO hearing (1.00); review matters re: scheduling in connection with Windstream case and next steps (.70); discussions with Chambers re: scheduling of TRO and other matters as well as noticing, objection deadlines and scheduling (.70); discussions with T. Foudy re: same (.10)	2.50
08 Apr 19	Foudy, Theresa	Confer with S. Reisman in regards to preparation for hearing before Judge Drain (.10)	0.10
	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to research on Judge Drain TRO cases (2.10); review research on Judge Drain Lanham Act cases (1.10); strategize re: reply brief (1.30); call with T. Ross and S. Reisman to discuss next steps with litigation, including scheduling (1.00); prepare email to chambers re: scheduling (.50); calls with Charter counsel re: scheduling (.50); call with client regarding scheduling and deposition prep (.50); communications with Chambers re: scheduling (.50); prepare notice of hearing at chambers' request (.80); multiple calls with T. Sims re next steps (.70); office conference with S. Reisman re next steps (.50); meeting with G. Thompson re: research (.50); review and revise discovery requests and deposition request (1.00)	10.60
08 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Arrange for copies of pleadings and authorities binders to be sent to T. Ross in Washington office (.10); prepare and circulate calendar notice for the Pretrial	0.90

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
		Conference in the Charter case and various dates	
		regarding the Debtor's TRO Application (.50); file	
		Notice of Hearing on Debtor's TRO Application on the	
		main case docket [Doc. No. 250] and the Charter	
		adversary proceeding docket [Adv. Doc. No. 6] (.30)	
09 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Call regarding TRO hearing strategy with T. Ross, S.	7.60
		Reisman and S. Rochester (.80); analyze new factual	
		information from client (1.00) ; prepare and revise	
		supplemental declaration in support of TRO and	
		accompanying exhibits (1.80); exchange	
		correspondence with Charter's counsel (.30); exchange	
		correspondence with Judge Drain chambers regarding	
		the TRO hearing (.20); strategize regarding evidence	
		and witnesses for TRO hearing (1.40); analyze legal	
		research findings for legal issues for TRO hearing	
		(.50); continue to revise document requests (.40); strategize with T. Ross, S. Rochester, and T. Foudy re	
		TRO hearing (.40); strategize regarding direct and	
		cross-examinations of Windstream's witness (.50);	
		exchange correspondence with client regarding	
		preparation for TRO hearing (.30)	
09 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Draft and revise supplemental declaration in support of	4.90
		TRO motion (2.20); prepare exhibits to supplemental	
		declaration in support of TRO motion (.20); prepare	
		direct-examination questions for L. Langston (2.50)	
09 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Draft email regarding use of witness at TRO hearing	8.90
_		(.30); edit email to client regarding witness preparation	
		(.30); edit email to Judge Drain inquiring about live	
		witnesses at TRO hearing (.30); edit email to opposing	
		counsel regarding depositions prior to TRO hearing	
		(.30); read cases controlling false advertising issues in	
		Second Circuit (2.50); read cases in Second Circuit on	
		law governing standards for grant of TRO and PI	
		(3.00); read multiple emails from client regarding	
		Charter door-to-door campaign to deceive consumers	
		into switching (.50); telephone conference with S. Reisman, S. Rochester and T. Sims to discuss strategy	
		for TRO hearing (.80); telephone conference with T.	
		Foudy, S. Rochester, and T. Sims re: same (.40);	
		conference with K. Lockhart to discuss door-to-door	
		campaign (.50)	
09 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Teleconference with team regarding preparation for	7.00
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	TRO hearing (.80); discuss with T. Ross regarding new	
		campaign by Spectrum (.50); research evidentiary	
		issues for reply brief and TRO hearing (1.30); review	
		case law cited in opening brief (.50); research case law	
		for support for reply brief and TRO hearing (3.90)	
09 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Continue researching preliminary injunction and	4.50
		temporary restraining order precedent in this court	
		(.80); review local and federal rules on affidavits (.30);	

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 28 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description review docket status for Motion for TRO and accompanying pleadings (.30); research objections filed in Windstream case (.30); research document request and deposition notice precedents (1.50); research discovery service rules in SDNY Bankruptcy Court (.30); research Windstream motions to reject contracts and leases filed thus far (.80); revise working group list (.20)	Hours
09 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Review of discovery request, update re: case law and review notice of hearing re: filing documentation under seal (1.40); call regarding Monday's TRO hearing with T. Ross, S. Rochester, and others (.80); preparation for testimony and coordination for Monday's TRO hearing (2.20)	4.40
09 Apr 19	Foudy, Theresa	Confer with S. Rochester, T. Ross, and T. Sims on preparation for TRO hearing (.40)	0.40
09 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Prepare agenda for team call (.50); attend to emails from client regarding new door to door campaign launched by Charter and how to incorporate into the TRO application (1.40); call with S. Reisman and T. Ross re: Charter deposition request, requirement for live testimony, reply brief and discovery (.80); attend to issues re: depo prep, planning and strategy (1.40); prepare email re: staffing (.30); attend to issues bonding requirement under FRCP (.50); attend to issue re: audio transcriptions and submitting to court (1.10); review and provide comments on supplemental brief in support of TRO application (1.40); review and provide further comments on documents request and deposition notice (1.20); call with T. Foudy and T. Ross re: court issues and attend to follow-up (.40); communications with UCC and DIP Lender re: support for TRO application (.40); multiple emails throughout day with client regarding TRO application (1.20); assist in deposition prep for L. Langston (2.10); research TROs issued by Judge Drain (.80)	13.50
10 Apr 19	Siena, Marie	E-file motion to seal with exhibits and prepare chambers copies (1.00)	1.00
10 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Continue to prepare and revise supplemental declaration in support of TRO (.80); continue preparation of exhibits for supplemental declaration (.70); prepare and revise draft direct examination of Windstream's witness (.50); prepare and revise draft cross examination of Windstream's witness (.90); exchange correspondence with client regarding discovery (.20); revise document requests to Charter (.40); revise deposition notice to Charter (.30); call with S. Rochester re: strategy regarding discovery and depo prep (.80); exchange correspondence with client regarding preparation for TRO hearing (.40); call with	6.50

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description S. Rochester regarding creditors' committee (.30); prepare for TRO hearing (.50); analyze legal research findings for issues relating to reply brief (.40); confer	Hours
10 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	with K. Lockhart regarding draft reply brief (.30) Review TRO filing and exhibits re redactions (.80); prepare direct-examination questions for L. Langston (1.80); prepare cross-examination questions for L. Langston (.90)	3.50
10 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Draft argument for TRO hearing (4.30); draft opening statement for TRO hearing (2.80); read and edit draft Parish Declaration and emails regarding same (1.00); read and exchange emails regarding supplemental declaration related to Charter's door-to-door campaign (.50); read and exchange emails regarding witness preparation (.30); read cases on use of hearsay in TRO proceedings (1.30); read draft cross-exam questions for preparation of L. Langston (1.00); read email from client regarding witness preparation (.30); telephone conference with counsel for Debtor in Possession Funder regarding coordination of strategy on TRO hearing (.50)	12.00
10 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Review and analyze case law relating to potential defense in reply brief (3.30); research case law in support of reply brief (4.00); review and distinguish case law for reply brief (2.00); discussion with T. Sims regarding research of case law for reply brief (.30)	9.60
10 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Review and revise redactions on previous pleadings (2.50); review revised pleadings on docket to ensure proper redaction (1.20); coordinate refiling of pleadings (.40); draft Notice of Hearing on Sealing Motion (.80); review Chambers rules for electronic devices (.30) coordinate internally and draft proposed order on the same (1.10); draft and revise Supplemental Declaration of Lewis Langston including redactions (1.60); coordinate with KCC regarding new pleadings and affidavits of service (.50); update Working Group List as needed (.20)	8.60
10 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Prepare for re: upcoming temporary restraining order hearing and discovery in connection with TRO hearing, need for witness preparation testimony to be given at Monday's TRO hearing and exchange of emails with client re: same (.60); discussions with S. Reisman re: same (.50); review document request and deposition notice in connection with preliminary injunction hearing related to Charter adversary proceeding and note comments and follow up re: same (.80); participate in calls with Judge Drain's chambers re: scheduling, notice, and availability of court and other technical issues in connection with Monday's temporary restraining order hearing (.40); emails and	4.50

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 30 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description follow up re: Debtor in Possession lender and Creditors Committee participation in connection with Windstream vs Charter adversary proceeding related to violations of the automatic stay and request for temporary restraining order (.80); discussions with L. Marinuzzi re: same (.20); discussions with Kirkland & Ellis re: scheduling and general update on facts of Windstream case including Monday's TRO hearing and coordination re: factual background of chapter 11 filing and stability of company (.40); review questions per Lewis direct testimony provide comments (.80)	Hours
10 Apr 19	Foudy, Theresa	Review and respond to email from G. Thompson regarding service of discovery requests (.10); attend to matters regarding redactions of filed documents and replacement of previously-filed documents, including calls with court personnel regarding same (1.10)	1.20
10 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to issues re: re-redacted pleadings (.90); attend to issues re: logistics and strategy for hearing on Monday (.80); call with DIP Lender counsel re: support of TRO application (.50); review communications re: with UCC support of TRO application (.50); call with T. Sims re: same (.30); review and provide comments on Supplemental Lewis Declaration (1.20); review and provide comments on Deposition Notice (.90); review and provide comments on Document Request (1.10); call with T. Sims re: strategy for serving discovery (.30); prepare for depositions preparation sessions (1.20); office conference with S. Reisman re: comments on discovery (.50); attend to issues clawback letters (.90); review and provide comments on direct and cross- examination scripts (1.70); call with T. Sims re: discovery and depo prep (.50); attend to issues re: bonding requirements (.50); coordinate TRO logistics (.80)	12.60
10 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Circulate calendar notices for the hearing preparation sessions for L. Langston (.20)	0.20
11 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Finalize written discovery and serve on Charter's counsel (.40); call S. Rappoport regarding creditors' committee (.10); exchange correspondence with client on witness preparation (.20); prepare correspondence to client regarding discovery and supplemental declaration (.10); analyze legal research findings for reply brief (.50); conduct witness preparation session with client (1.50); analyze opposition and strategize additional legal research issues needed for the reply with team (2.00); strategize regarding additional legal research findings for reply brief issues for reply with K. Lockhart (.50); analyze legal research findings for reply brief and incorporate into reply (1.80); prepare reply brief for	10.50

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 31 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description Motion for TRO (3.40)	Hours
11 Apr 19	Yong, Paul S.	Conduct legal research (3.80); draft email memorandum concerning federal securities law issues in connection with TRO briefing (1.00)	4.80
11 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Prepare cross-examination questions for L. Langston (.20); draft amended complaint (2.00); draft factual background section for reply (.60); draft legal argument sections for reply (1.80); research case law for reply (3.30)	7.90
11 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Legal research for reply in support of temporary restraining order (8.20)	8.20
11 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Analyze Charter opposition to Motion for TRO and consider rebuttal argument (2.00); continue to draft argument for TRO hearing (2.30); edit and revise notes regarding witness cross-examination (.80); read and respond to multiple emails regarding serving discovery on Charter prior to Rule 26(f) Conference (.30); read Charter opposition to Motion for TRO (2.00); read Supplemental Declaration of L. Langston (.50); review and analyze supplemental exhibits filed with Court (.50); telephone conference with S. Reisman regarding obtaining Court permission to serve early discovery (.30); telephone conference with S. Reisman regarding strategy for TRO (.50); telephone conference with S. Rochester and T. Sims regarding rebuttal of 10k argument (.30); telephone conference with S. Rochester regarding witness for TRO (.30); telephone conference with S. Rochester to discuss request to Judge Drain for early service of discovery and edit email regarding same (.50)	10.30
11 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Research and draft standards section for reply brief (2.30); perform further research and draft additional sections for reply brief (2.70); discuss with T. Sims strategy for drafting reply to opposition (.50); review and analyze charter opposition to Windstream' TRO (.80); research case law regarding elements for establishing entitlement to emergency relief (.60); research recent case law and draft sections of reply in support of Windstream motion for emergency relief (4.00)	10.90
11 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Review and revise redactions in Supplemental Langston Declaration (1.00); prepare Supplemental Declaration and exhibits for filing (.20); draft and revise Motion to Seal Supplemental Declaration (1.70); coordinate contact information with client and revise Working Group List (.50); draft cover letters to Chambers and Court Clerk for Thursday 4/11 filings (.50); draft Notice of Hearing on the Motion to Seal the Supplemental Declaration (.50); coordinate formatting and filing of pleadings and submissions to chambers	13.60

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description (1.20); revise agenda for hearing (.40); read and analyze Charter opposition brief (2.00); revise	Hours
		TRO/order to show cause (1.60); draft automatic stay section for Debtors' reply brief (1.20); review Charter's 2009 ch. 11 docket, analyzing company statements on likelihood of successful restructuring (2.50); draft cover letter to Chambers and Court Clerk for 4/12 filings (.30)	
11 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Review and follow up re: matters related to discovery, TRO hearing and complaint and general update on status (1.10); follow up re: reaching out to creditors committee counsel re: joining in with respect to relief requested in TRO and preliminary injunction (.40); coordination re: preparing for opposition by Charter to Windstream TRO and assembling team to address same (.60); discussions with T. Ross re: matters related to serving discovery and next steps (.30); discussion with T. Ross re: strategy for TRO, coverage of TRO hearing and overall TRO/preliminary injunction coverage and strategy (.50); review supplement declaration in connection with upcoming TRO hearing (.40); review emails related to same as well as follow up re: opposition brief by Charter to relief requested and review of same (1.10); coordination re: coverage for TRO hearing by T. Ross and Katten litigation team (.20); correspondence with bankruptcy court re: TRO discovery and discovery related to preliminary	4.80
11 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	injunction (.20) Review Supplemental Langston Affidavit (.90); review and provide comments on direct and cross-examination scripts (1.40); correspondence with Chambers re discovery requests (.50); communications with T. Sims re UCC pleading (.40); call with team regarding discovery issues (.70); finalize and serve discovery (.50); communications with DIP Lender re TRO request (.40); prepare sealing motion for Supplemental Declaration (.50); review news articles regarding Windstream Chapter 11 filing (.50); attend depo prep session with client (.90); review Charter Opposition Brief (.90); prepare detailed summary of Charter Opposition Brief (1.40); call with team to discuss Charter Opposition Brief (.60); update cross- examination script (1.30); update re-direct script (.80); prepare insert for automatic stay section of Reply Brief (1.80); call with R. Zelikoff re securities law issues (.50); prepare notice of hearing on motion to seal supplemental declaration (.50); review Charter 2009 10-K (.80)	15.30
11 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Prepare multiple updates to the TRO/Charter Complaint pleadings binder throughout the day (1.50);	3.00

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
12 4 10		research news articles relating to Windstream's chapter 11 filing, focusing specifically on articles that portray Windstream negatively or refer to "uncertainty" (1.20); arrange live line for 4/16 hearing (.10); file Notice of Hearing for Sealing Motion [Adv. Doc. No. 15] (.20)	10.70
12 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Analyze legal research findings for reply brief and incorporate into reply brief (1.10); analyze Charter's 10K 2009 filing (.30); analyze Windstream's 2018 10K filing (.50); continue to prepare reply brief to Motion for TRO (2.70); telephone conference with team to discuss reply brief (.80); revise reply brief to Motion for TRO to add additional arguments and revise existing arguments (3.10); finalize reply brief and exhibit A for filing (.60); revise cross examination preparation for Windstream's witness (.20); attend preparation session for Windstream's witness (.60); prepare and revise proposed amended complaint (.60); revise order to show cause (.20)	10.70
12 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Research case law for reply (2.40)	2.40
-	Velez, Melissa	Legal research for reply in support of temporary restraining order (3.60)	3.60
12 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Continue to revise draft reply brief in support of motion for TRO (1.30); draft email to K. Smith regarding reply brief (.30); draft revisions to witness preparation (.80); incorporate reply brief arguments into TRO hearing Opening and Closing statements (3.00); make final edits to draft reply brief in support of Motion for TRO (2.00); prepare witness for testimony at TRO hearing (.80); read and edit draft reply brief in support of motion for TRO (1.70); conference with team re: items to address in reply brief (.80); read brief by Creditors in Support of Motion for TRO (1.00); telephone conference with client and S. Rochester regarding response to Charter discovery (.80)	12.50
12 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Research additional case law regarding evidentiary showing for emergency relief (1.40); draft email to T. Sims with results of research and relevant section to include in reply brief (2.60); review and revise reply brief in support of preliminary injunction and temporary restraining order (.80); attend teleconference with S. Rochester, T. Sims, and T. Ross strategizing remaining items to address in reply brief in support of motion for preliminary injunction and TRO (.80); draft footnote for reply brief regarding standard for injunctive relief (.40)	6.00
12 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Coordinate filing of pleadings and submissions to Chambers and the Clerk of Court (1.10); revise agenda for hearing (.20); review rules on revising proposed orders (.30); prepare materials for preparation session	7.00

10 00010 rdd		Filed 0E/21/10	Entarod 05/21/10 20.52.10	Main Dooumont
19-22312-100	D0C 22T	FIIED 02/21/19	Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10	Main Document

Pg 34 of 58

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description with witness (3.00); prepare materials for hearing on Monday 4/15 (2.00); calls with S. Rochester to discuss	Hours
12 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	same (.40) Review and edit reply brief in support of temporary restraining order; continued follow up with respect to reply to brief in support motion for temporary restraining order and note comments to same (1.10); strategize re: discovery in connection with preliminary injunction and service of same (.40); call with S. Rochester re: coordination with first lien lenders and unsecured creditors committee re: joining in relief requested by debtors and attend to matters with respect to UCC's support of relief request with respect to temporary restraining order and next steps with respect to same (.80); review of brief of official committee of unsecured creditors in support of temporary restraining order (.70); prepare for upcoming hearing in	4.10
12 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	connection with TRO (1.10) Review and provide comments on Reply Brief (3.10); call with T. Ross and T. Sims to discuss Reply Brief (.80); call with client and T. Ross re discovery and attend to follow-up (1.00); call with chambers regarding protocol for filings (.30); review Exhibit Binders (.30); review pleading in support from UCC (.30); review and provide comments on updated Reply Brief (2.30); prepare agenda for filing (.50); prepare for depo prep call with client (.50); attend depo prep call with client and attend to follow up (1.00); call with S. Reisman to discuss UCC reply and Debtor Reply (.80); calls with G. Thompson to discuss hearing prep (.40)	11.30
13 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Strategize regarding cross-examination of Charter employee (.40); prepare for TRO hearing (.40); review revised temporary restraining order and order to show cause setting preliminary injunction and prepare correspondence to T. Ross regarding revisions to same (.50); prepare and revise draft cross-examination of Charter representative (.30); analyze new factual information from client (.50); review discovery propounded to Windstream from Charter (.20); revise cross-examination outline for Windstream's witness (.50); strategize regarding evidence to use for TRO hearing and witness examinations (.30); continue to prepare re-direct examination outline for Windstream's witness (.30); travel time from Los Angeles to New York, billed at half time the total amount (2.40)	5.80
13 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Prepare cross-examination outline for Charter representative (3.70)	3.70
13 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Analyze opposition motion exhibits for temporary restraining order hearing (.60)	0.60

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 35 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date 13 Apr 19	Attorney or Assistant Ross, Terence P.	Description Draft cross-examination for potential Charter witness at TRO hearing (1.80); draft email to T. Sims regarding cross of potential Charter witness and calculation of Charter damages (.50); edit and revise draft TRO (3.80); revise argument for TRO hearing to include new facts and to address Charter 10-k argument (4.00); draft email to S. Rochester, T. Sims and S. Reisman explaining edits to draft TRO and respond to follow up re: same (.30)	Hours 10.40
13 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Draft Notice of Revised Proposed Order and revise Order to Show Cause (.80)	0.80
13 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Review outlines for cross examination of Charter representative (1.10); review revised proposed temporary restraining order and order to show cause in connection with same (.70); review edits to TRO (.50); follow up with T. Ross re: same (.20); coordination re: preparation for upcoming hearing (.40)	2.90
13 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Review and revise proposed TRO and Show Cause Order (2.30)	2.30
14 Apr 19	Siena, Marie	Prepare for e-filing and e-file Notice of Filing of Proposed Order (1.20); prepare and file pleadings and submissions to Chambers (2.10); prepare for e-filing and e-file revised agenda for hearing (.40); assemble Charter's exhibits for hearing (1.80); pull cases for hearing (1.60); organize materials related to motions to seal and redactions (2.60); compile and organize documents to be taken to court for hearing (2.50); confirm all logistics for hearing (.50); assist in the compilation of materials for hearing (1.10)	13.80
14 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Prepare for direct witness examination of Windstream's witness (1.20); exchange correspondence with Charter's counsel regarding witnesses and exhibits (.40); analyze Charter's new exhibits (1.80); strategize regarding arguments for TRO hearing (1.30); strategize regarding cross-examination of Charter's witness (.60); continue to prepare re-direct examination of Windstream's witness (3.50); conduct preparation session with Windstream's witness (1.70)	10.50
14 Apr 19 14 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A. Ross, Terence P.	Prepare for cross-examination of L. Langston (2.40) Conference with S. Rochester, T. Sims and G. Thompson to prepare for TRO hearing (2.80); review and analyze cases cited in reply brief in preparation for TRO hearing (1.50); review and analyze cases cited in reply brief in preparation for TRO hearing (1.30); review and analyze exhibits disclosed by Charter for use at TRO hearing (1.00); review and revise re-direct examination to use with Mr. Langston at TRO hearing (1.50); review background information on Charter newly disclosed witness and draft cross-examination (4.00); travel from D.C. to NYC for TRO hearing	2.40 12.60

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 36 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description (billed at 50%) (.50)	Hours
14 Apr 19 14 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin Thompson, Grace	Compile cases for TRO hearing (.40) Revise Notice of Filing of Proposed Order and prepare for filing (1.40); coordinate filing of pleadings and submissions to Chambers (1.00); revise agenda for hearing (.20); analyze Katten retention application (.30); review Charter 2009 bankruptcy docket (1.00); prepare case law materials for hearing (1.20); review and organize materials related to motions to seal and redactions (2.50); review documents related to affidavits and declarations in preparation for argument on TRO (2.60); review and organize materials related to case management, rules, and procedures in preparation for TRO hearing (2.00); oversee compiling of documents by administrative staff (1.10)	0.40 13.30
14 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Attend to review of materials in preparation for tomorrow's hearing including witness exhibits and other materials as well as outline for examination and cross examination and review of materials and emails in preparation for same (2.30); numerous discussions with S. Rochester re: preparation for tomorrow's hearing and coverage of same (.50); follow up re: matters related to TRO hearing and coordination of issues for same including potential for appeal and bonding issues (1.10)	3.90
14 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Make further changes to proposed TRO and proposed Show Cause Order (1.20); revise Notice of Filing of Revised Orders (.80); update Hearing Agenda and file (.40); extensive hearing prep with team (2.10); discuss new cross-examination of Charter witness (1.20); review new Charter exhibits (1.80); multiple calls with S. Reisman re hearing prep (.50); follow-up research (.80); prepare script for hearing (2.20)	11.00
15 Apr 19	Siena, Marie	Attend court hearing on TRO and sealing motions (5.50)	5.50
15 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	(3.50) Revise re-direct examination for Windstream's witness (2.30); travel time from Manhattan hotel to Court hearing in White Plains, billed at half time (.50); prepare for TRO hearing while in Judge Drain's courtroom (3.00); appear at TRO hearing, conduct re- direct of Windstream's witness (2.50); travel from Court in White Plains to Manhattan hotel, billed at half time (1.00); revise temporary restraining order and exchange correspondence with S. Rochester regarding same (.70); review sealing order and prepare correspondence to S. Rochester regarding revisions to same (.20); strategize regarding proposed preliminary injunction schedule and discovery schedule (.50)	10.70
15 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Discuss with client and explain TRO decision, including work to do on PI hearing (1.00); multiple	16.00

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 37 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description emails with S. Rochester, T. Sims and K. Lockhart regarding work on PI and schedule going forward (1.00); multiple telephone conferences with client regarding TRO decision (.50); prepare L. Langston for testimony at TRO hearing (2.00); represent Windstream at TRO hearing (5.50); review and edit revised TRO (1.00); review and revise report on TRO describing parameters of prohibition and work on discovery to be performed (1.00); review draft cross- examination for TRO hearing (1.50); travel from NYC to D.C. return from TRO hearing (2.50)	Hours
15 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Research case law regarding matters for Windstream TRO hearing (2.80);	2.80
15 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Travel to SDNY White Plains Courthouse (billed at half time) (1.00); attend Windstream hearing on TRO (5.50); travel time from SDNY White Plains Courthouse (billed at half time) (1.30); revise Order to Seal to more closely mirror Judge Drain's Order to Seal in Sears case (2.00)	9.80
15 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Participate in portion of court hearing by telephone re: TRO motion request for relief and matters related to sealing motion and entry of TRO order and determination by Judge Drain of matters related to requested relief (2.20); follow up with Katten team re: next steps, summary for client and strategy going forward (.30)	2.50
15 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	While traveling to hearing on TRO Motion, preparing for oral argument and reviewing relevant cases and statutes (1.30); prepare for TRO hearing, including meeting with client and discussions with T. Ross and T. Sims (2.80); attend and participate at TRO hearing (2.50); travel back from hearing (billed at half time) (.50); prepare summary of hearing for client (1.00); revise TRO Order to reflect instructions from Judge (1.20); revise Sealing Order to reflect instructions from Judge (1.00); incorporate further changes to revised TRO (.80); call with S. Reisman re TRO (.30); further changes to TRO based on comments from team (.80); changes to Sealing Order based on comments from team (.30)	12.50
16 Apr 19	Mandell, Floyd A.	Exchange emails with T. Kameda Sims and S. Reisman regarding next step/strategy (.50)	0.50
16 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Strategize regarding discovery propounded to Windstream and additional deposition topics for Charter's 30(b)(6) (.50); strategize with S. Reisman and F. Mandell regarding preliminary injunction hearing and discovery and briefing needed for that hearing (.40); analyze proposed TRO order submitted by Charter (.20); prepare correspondence to Chambers regarding Charter's revisions and Windstream's	4.60

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description objections thereto (.50); exchange correspondence with Chambers and J. Kingston regarding Charter's proposed TRO order (.20); strategize regarding response to Judge Drain on the proposed TRO Order (.10); analyze entered TRO order (.10); travel from New York to Los Angeles, billed at half time (2.60)	Hours
16 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Draft Settlement position memorandum for client to consider in settlement discussions (.80); confer with K. Lockhart on TRO findings that can be used in PI Brief (.80); email exchange with S. Rochester regarding settlement (.30); email exchange with S. Rochester regarding Charter changes to TRO (.30); research law on extension of TRO (1.00); read as issued TRO (.50); telephone conference with S. Rochester regarding how to respond to Charter's TRO edits (.30); email exchange with S. Rochester regarding settlement (.30); compare as issued TRO to proposed TRO to identify Court changes (.50); review draft amended Complaint (1.80); multiple emails with T. Sims regarding PI hearing (.30); review and approve revised TRO for submission to Court (.50); email to opposing counsel regarding PI hearing (.30); telephone conference to Chambers regarding date for PI hearing (.30); review email from opposing counsel regarding TRO as issued (.50); outline settlement potential discovery	10.10
16 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	schedule to submit to opposing counsel (1.30) Discuss with T. Ross regarding TRO findings that can be used in PI brief and attend to follow up research (1.80)	1.80
16 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Review changes between TRO as entered and as submitted to the court (.30); review and coordinate affidavits of service and pro hac vice application (.20); research notice and approval procedures in DIP Credit Agreement and Interim Order Authorizing Post- Petition Financing (1.50)	2.00
	Reisman, Steven	Conversations with S. Rochester and others in connection with next steps for obtaining preliminary injunction, limiting cost to client and discovery necessary in order to obtain preliminary injunction (.80); confer with F. Mandell and T. Sims re: same (.40) review emails related to communications with various Windstream customers re: Charter's efforts to move Windstream customers to Charter platform and listen to recordings re: same and follow up (.80); review TRO issued by bankruptcy court and various discussions with Katten team re: next steps, discovery and potential need for amended complaint (.80)	2.80
16 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Communications with Chambers re entry of proposed	8.80

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description TRO and Sealing Order (.30); call with S. Reisman re discovery and briefing schedule (.30); communications with client regarding status of TRO and recent articles about TRO (.30); attend to issues re discovery and briefing schedule (1.60); attend to issues re potential settlement (.50); communications with Chambers regarding TRO and Sealing Orders (1.20); communications with Charter's counsel re same (.80); prepare update for client regarding TRO, scheduling, Charter discovery and settlement options (.80); ensure service of TRO in accordance with TRO order (.30); communications with client, T. Ross, and Katten team	Hours
16 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	regarding entry of TRO and next steps (.90); review amended complaint (1.80) Update S. Rochester's pleading binder with recent	0.50
17 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	filings and other documents (.50) Strategize with team regarding potential amended Complaint and expedited discovery (.80); call with T. Ross and client regarding discovery and proposed schedule for preliminary injunction hearing (.80); analyze information from client and exchange correspondence with client regarding same (.30); review interrogatory to Windstream propounded by Charter (.10); review information from client regarding request from Charter and exchange correspondence regarding same (.20)	2.20
17 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	regarding same (.20) Telephone conference with S. Rochester regarding PI (.30); review interrogatories propounded by Charter (.80); telephone conference with S. Rochester, T. Sims and K. Lockhart regarding amendment of Complaint, PI hearing and other issues (.80); review options for witness at PI hearing (.90); review case law on extension of TRO (1.00); preparation regarding hearing witnesses (1.50); email from S. Rochester regarding work needed on case (.30); telephone conference with T. Sims and K. Smith regarding production request from Charter (.80); telephone conference with J. Kingston to discuss schedule for discovery and briefing of P.I. (.80)	7.20
17 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Attend telephone conference with T. Sims, T. Ross and S. Rochester regarding amendments to complaint (.80)	0.80
-	Reisman, Steven	Attend to matter related to TRO and potential amended complaint, discovery in connection with preliminary injunction and follow up with S. Rochester re: various work streams, plan of action and moving forward in order to obtain relief on preliminary and permanent injunction and discovery re: additional violations by Charter of law and potential the temporary restraining order issued by Judge Drain (1.80)	1.80
17 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Prepare summary of work-streams related to PI action	5.50

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description against Charter (.40); emails with team re same (.20); calls with S. Reisman re various work-stream re PI actions (.50); communications with client re discovery in connection with PI action against Charter (.50); call with T. Ross and T. Sims re discovery and briefing schedule for PI action against Charter (.80); calls with S. Reisman and T. Ross re case updates in connection with PI action (.30); communications with Chambers regarding scheduling hearing on Preliminary Injunction (.30); attend to issues re Amended Complaint (1.50); attend to issues re revised form of Preliminary Injunction Letter (.50); attend to issues re revised form of Show Cause Order (.40); communications with A. Arotsky re: research (.10)	Hours
-	Arotsky, Allison	Research service on corporations and communications with S. Rochester re: same (2.20)	2.20
	Wang, Thomas	Update S. Rochester's pleadings binder with the Sealing Order and TRO filed yesterday (.30)	0.30
18 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Exchange correspondence with client regarding Charter's interrogatory propounded on Windstream (.30); exchange correspondence with client regarding request from Charter for customer information related to disconnections (.40); confer with S. Rochester regarding responses to request for production of documents and preliminary injunction hearing (.30); strategize regarding preparation for preliminary injunction hearing (.30); exchange correspondence with S. Rochester and T. Ross regarding creditors' committee (.20)	1.50
18 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Email exchange with K. Smith regarding "Last Mile" customers (.30); read email from S. Rochester regarding joinder of Creditors Committee (.30); draft email to opposing counsel regarding "Last Mile" customers (1.00); draft email to opposing counsel reporting improper Charter contact and demanding cease and desist (.50); read cases on creditor committee joinder (.50); telephone conference with K. Smith regarding proposing agreed PI to opposing counsel (.30); telephone conference with S. Rochester regarding Creditors Committee request to intervene (.50); analyze whether Creditor's Committee joinder can be limited to certain functions (.50); analyze cases on joinder against facts of Creditors Committee in this adversary proceeding (1.50); read and analyze proposed response to "Last Mile" customer request prepared by C. Keith (1.00); review questions from K. Smith regarding facts surrounding "Last Mile" customers (.30); email exchange with K. Smith regarding edits to "Last Mile" customer email (.30); review emails relating to improper contact by Charter	10.60

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
	·	business person to J. Dale (.50); edit and transmit email	
		regarding "Last Mile" customers to opposing counsel	
		(.80); read cases on standing for Creditor Committee to	
		join adversary proceeding (2.30)	
18 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Perform legal research viability of potential defenses to	4.50
		be raised by Charter (3.00); revise complaint to include	
		additional claims (1.50)	
18 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Research standard for intervention in adversary	4.60
		proceedings (2.90); multiple discussions re: same with	
		S. Rochester (.60); revise proposed Preliminary	
		Injunction Order to more closely mirror Temporary	
10 4 10		Restraining Order as filed (1.10)	5 10
18 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to issues re business person to business person	5.10
		discovery request from Charter (.60); attend to issues	
		re hearing transcript for TRO hearing $(.40)$; attend to	
		issues re scheduling TRO (.20); preliminary research re	
		legal standards for intervention (.90); call with T. Ross	
		re UCC intervention request (.50); call with S.	
		Reisman re same (.30); attend to issues re new interrogatory served by Charter's counsel (.50); call	
		with T. Sims to discuss discovery and scheduling (.30);	
		analyze UCC intervention issues and calls with G.	
		Thompson re same (1.40)	
18 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Review affidavit of service and respond to S.	0.40
1011pi 15	r notský, r nison	Rochester re: same (.10); locate and review precedent	0.10
		for stipulation allowing Committee to intervene (.30)	
19 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Call with S. Rochester regarding creditors' committee	2.20
I I	·····	(.50); prepare document requests to Charter (1.70)	
19 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Research examples of responses to requests for	5.90
		production (.60); research examples of stipulations for	
		intervention and discuss same with S. Rochester (2.10);	
		research examples of orders where Judge Drain granted	
		or denied requests to intervene (3.20)	
19 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Follow up with S. Rochester re: matters related to UCC	1.70
		intervention, next steps and call with attorneys from	
		Morrison & Foerster law firm re: intervening in	
		adversary proceeding (.50); follow up re: matters	
		related to inquiry from Charter re: prior involvement in	
		Charter bankruptcy case and responding to inquiries	
		related to same (.60); follow up re: discovery and next	
		steps in connection with preliminary injunction hearing	
10 4 10	Dealersten (1) I	(.60)	2 40
19 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Attend to research re UCC intervention and scheduling	2.40
		call re same (.50); call with S. Reisman re UCC	
		intervention and next steps (.50); call with G. Thompson re same (.40); review intervention cases	
		found by G. Thompson (.50); call with T. Sims re UCC	
		intervention (.50)	
21 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Draft email to S. Reisman regarding case management	0.30
21 mpi 17	Sino, rann Kanicua	(.30)	0.50
		()	

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date 21 Apr 19	Attorney or Assistant Cameron, Camille A.	Description Review Charter's requests for production (.30); draft	Hours 0.90
2111p117	Cumeron, Cummern.	objections to Charter's requests for production (.60)	0.70
21 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Review new research on creditor joinder and consider conclusions reached by S. Rochester regarding same	2.50
21 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	(2.50) Review correspondence missed over Passover relating to litigation against Charter (.50)	0.50
22 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Review correspondence regarding discovery response to Charter's request for documents (.20)	0.20
22 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Draft objections and responses to Charter's requests for production (4.30); revise objections and responses to Charter's requests for production (1.10)	5.40
22 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Email exchange with S. Rochester regarding creditor joinder (.30); read email from S. Rochester on creditor joinder (.30); email to J. Kingston regarding PI schedule and hearing (.30); review draft email setting out position of creditor joinder and comment on same (.50); review notice sent out by Charter to purportedly comply with TRO (.50); read email from S. Rochester regarding entry of order on Katten retention and review order (.30); email exchange with S. Rochester regarding PI witness and schedule (.30); draft email to S. Reisman and S. Rochester regarding opposing counsel cancellation of meet and confer (.30); exchange emails with J. Kingston, opposing counsel, regarding PI schedule and motion (.50); read email from S. Sullivan regarding recorded calls and update	3.60
22 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	on confusion reports (.30) Draft stipulation for intervention between Windstream and the UCC (1.00); call with S. Rochester re same (.30)	1.30
22 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Review and respond to emails from T. Ross re UCC intervention, litigation schedule and other issues (.60); call with Mofo re UCC intervention (.30); prepare email to client re same (.30); call with G. Thompson re preparing consensual stipulation re UCC intervention (.30); review and provide comments on intervention stip (1.20)	2.70
23 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Analyze materials from client regarding potential document review (1.80); exchange correspondence with client regarding document production (.40); revise Windstream's response to Charter's document requests (.90); exchange correspondence with Charter's counsel regarding revised Langston declaration exhibits (.10); exchange correspondence with S. Rochester regarding order to show cause (.20); exchange correspondence with T. Ross regarding discovery and witness preparation (.20)	3.60
23 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Revise objections and responses to Charter's requests for production (.70); review Windstream documents in	1.00

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
23 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	preparation for production (.30) Review proposed creditor joinder stipulation (.50); read and respond to email from T. Sims regarding discovery and witness preparation (.30); telephone conference with J. Kingston regarding PI hearing (.30); review record of contacts with opposing counsel (1.00); draft email to S. Rochester and T. Sims regarding call with opposing counsel (.30); telephone conference with K. Smith regarding Rule 30(b)(6) deponent and PI hearing (.50); telephone conference with S. Rochester regarding submission of Show Cause Order to Judge Drain (.30); attend to issues re: joinder of creditors (1.00); review and approve revised Show Cause Order (.50); telephone conference with J. Kingston, opposing counsel, regarding PI hearing and possibility of Agreed injunction (.50); read email by S. Rochester to Deputy Court Clerk (.30); review and edit draft Show Cause Order for PI hearing (.80)	6.30
23 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Revise proposed Show Cause Order (.30); review Show Cause Order as entered (.20)	0.50
23 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Update re: matters related to discovery in connection with upcoming preliminary injunction hearing and coordination re: same (.40)	0.40
23 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Call with T. Ross re submission of Order to Show Cause to Chambers (.30); prepare email to Chambers re: same (.30); review revised Show Cause Order and correspond with T. Sims re: same (.30)	0.90
24 Apr 19	Larsen, Ryan	Call with T. Sims re: 30(b)(6) deposition of Charter (.10); review and analyze complaint, motion, opposition, reply, exhibits to prepare for deposition (3.50)	3.60
24 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Continue to revise Windstream's responses to Charter's request for documents and send to client (.50); exchange correspondence with client regarding discovery responses (.30); analyze information provided by client for potential production (3.20); exchange correspondence with client regarding materials for potential production (.80); exchange correspondence with C. Cameron regarding processing documents for production (.30); call with R. Larsen regarding Charter's 30(b)(6) (.10); strategize regarding review protocol for review of Charter's document production with J. Hill (.20); emails with S. Rochester re: same (.20); exchange correspondence with client regarding deposition preparation (.20); call with T. Ross and S. Rochester regarding discovery and depositions (1.00); exchange correspondence with court reporter regarding instructions for transcriptions of recordings (.30); preparation for defense of Windstream's 30(b)(6) deposition (.20)	7.30

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Pg 44 of 58

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date 24 Apr 19	Attorney or Assistant Hill, Joanna M.	Description Strategize with T. Sims re impending document productions (.20)	Hours 0.20
24 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Review and prepare Windstream documents for production (4.90); emails with T. Sims and S. Rochester re: same (.40)	5.30
24 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Address discovery issues raised by P. Anderson and S. Sullivan (.50); draft email to S. Rochester and T. Sims regarding discovery (.30); draft lengthy email to K. Smith regarding agreement reached with opposing counsel (.80); draft responses and objections to Charter Rule 30 (b)(6) topics (2.30); edit Rule 30(b)(6) topics to comply with Court's Show Cause Order (2.50); email exchange with K. Smith regarding deposition (.30); email exchange with S. Rochester regarding discovery (.30); read email from P. Anderson regarding document production (.30); review and edit draft objections to document production (1.00); review Rule 30(b)(6) topics for L. Langston to prepare on and email to K. Smith regarding same (1.00); review Show Cause Order issued by Judge Drain (.50); telephone conference with S. Rochester and T. Sims regarding discovery (1.00)	10.80
24 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Draft topic guidelines for review of Charter documents and confer with S. Rochester re: same (.70)	0.70
24 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Follow up re: discovery related to Charter preliminary injunction hearing, scheduling of depositions and strategy re: obtaining relief or settlement (.30); update re: Windstream discovery responses and review emails from various people re: same including T. Sims and P. Anderson at Windstream (.30)	0.60
24 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Call with T. Ross and T. Sims re discovery and hearing schedule and attend to follow-up (1.10); communications with G. Thompson and T. Sims re review of Charter documents (.60); attend to issues re UCC intervention (.30); communications with client regarding entry of Order to Show Cause (.30); compare OSC to proposed OSC (.30); review and respond to emails regarding document production (1.20); attend to issues re review of Charter document production (.60); communications with reviewers of Charter documents (.40)	4.80
24 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Circulate internal calendar notices for multiple dates relating to the Preliminary Injunction Request (.90)	0.90
25 Apr 19	Larsen, Ryan	Review transcript of TRO hearing to prepare for 30(b)(6) deposition (4.00); draft deposition outline re same (3.00)	7.00
25 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Analyze additional materials from the client regarding the document production (1.10); exchange correspondence with the client regarding Windstream's document production (1.50); analyze and prepare	6.40

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description documents for Windstream's document production (1.60); call with S. Rochester and review team regarding strategy for document review protocol (.70); exchange correspondence with court reporter vendor regarding transcription of customer call recordings (.50); exchange correspondence with client regarding redactions to transcripts (.30) call with Charter's counsel regarding document productions and depositions (.50); prepare correspondence to Charter's counsel regarding the parties' agreements regarding discourses (.20)	Hours
25 Apr 19	Hill, Joanna M.	discovery (.20) Analyze prior TRO briefing (1.00); conference call with team re upcoming document productions (.60); begin preparations for upcoming document review (.50)	2.10
25 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Continue to review and prepare Windstream documents for production (.80)	0.80
25 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Conference call re: document review (.60); redact customer call transcripts for document production (.90); redact documents for production for privileged content (1.10); review documents for production (1.70); review temporary restraining order filings and hearing transcript for document review (.70)	5.00
25 Apr 19	Oplinger, Rachel A.	Review Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order in preparation for conference to discuss Charter document review (1.40); phone conference with S. Rochester, T. Sims, J. Nussbaum, G. Thompson, J. Hill, and M. Velez to discuss Charter document review (.60); review lists of key topics for Charter document review from G. Thompson and T. Sims (.50); review template for Charter document review notes from G. Thompson (.10)	2.60
25 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Conference with K. Lockhart to discuss drafting Rule 30(6)(b) Notice (.30); develop uniform definitions to use in Rule 30(6)(b) Notice to Charter (1.30); draft lengthy email to T. Sims regarding document production and deposition (.50); draft outline of deposition of Charter representative (1.00); email exchange with S. Rochester regarding Creditor joinder (.30); prepare general objections anticipated for Rule 30(6)(b) topics (1.00); read and respond to multiple emails relating to document production among following team: T. Sims, S. Sullivan, P. Anderson, A. Thompson, J. Nussbaum and J. Hill (3.00); read and respond to question posed by opposing counsel regarding Rule 30(6)(b) depositions (.50); read email from S. Sullivan regarding document production (.30); read email from T. Sims regarding document production (.30); read email from T. Sims regarding document production (.30); read email from T. Sims regarding document production (.30); read email from T. Sims regarding document production (.30); read emails relating to document production and consider how to	10.80

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 46 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
25 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	conduct interview (.80); revise and edit Rule 30(6)(b) Notice to be propounded to Charter (1.50) Discuss with T. Ross regarding objections to Charter 30(6)(b) notice and Windstream's own 30(6)(b) notice of deposition topics (.30); draft email to word processing regarding instruction for creating shells for notices and objections to 30(6)(b) deposition topics (.65); draft revised 30(6)(b) notice of deposition and topics for Charter Communications Operating LLC	2.50
25 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	 (1.70) Research federal, local, Case Management Order, and Chambers rules on notices of presentment (.30); review precedent for notice of presentments on stipulations (.40); draft notice of presentment for stipulation on UCC intervention (.80); attend internal conference call planning review of Charter documents (.60); correspond with Katten attorneys coordinating document review (.50); draft and revise case calendar (.80) 	3.40
25 Apr 19	Nussbaum, Jake	Review motion for TRO papers in preparation of documents review (.60); review TRO opposition papers in preparation of document review (.30); review reply memorandum in support of TRO in preparation of document review (.50); review transcript from TRO hearing in preparation of document review (2.10); attend conference call with S. Rochester and T. Sims to discuss upcoming document production and review	4.10
25 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	(.60) Attend to issues we UCC intervention (.30); attend to issues re review of Charter documents (.50); attend to issues re case calendar (.30); attend call with team re Charter document production and attend to follow-up (1.00); communications with client re UCC intervention (.30)	2.40
25 Apr 19	Arotsky, Allison	Review procedures re: submitting a stipulation for intervention to the Court with G. Thompson (.50)	0.50
26 Apr 19	Konrath, Adriane	Load data and images relating to volume VOL001 to the Charter databases on the network (.50)	0.50
26 Apr 19	Larsen, Ryan	Phone conference with T. Ross re 30(b)(6) deposition (.40); review deposition notice and categories (.40); conduct research re Charter witness, Charter website, and advertising campaigns (1.20); draft deposition outline (2.60)	4.60
26 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Analyze materials from client for document production (.90); call for deposition preparation with client and Windstream's deposition witness (1.60); exchange correspondence with client regarding document production (.80); revise written response to Charter's document requests and prepare same for service (.80); analyze documents and prepare documents for	8.20

Pg 47 of 58

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description Windstream's document production (1.90); exchange correspondence with J. Hill regarding Windstream's document production (.50); exchange correspondence with Charter's counsel regarding Charter's document production (.40); exchange correspondence with Charter's counsel regarding transcripts of customer calls (.20); strategize regarding document review protocol for Charter's document production (.50); exchange correspondence with J. Hill regarding review protocol for Charter's document production (.30); exchange correspondence with C. Cameron regarding production of transcripts of customer calls (.20); exchange correspondence with C. Cameron regarding production (.30);	Hours
26 Apr 19	Hill, Joanna M.	production of transcripts of customer calls (.30) Review documents for production in response to RFP No. 24 (.50); redact privilege material (4.80); strategize with document review team re weekend assignments (.40); prepare review strategy for Charter's first round of document production (1.80); respond to numerous emails from T. Sims and review team re document review questions (2.20); redact transcript of customer phone calls for private information (.70)	10.40
26 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Continue to review and prepare Windstream documents for production (5.80); review and respond to emails from T. Sims re: customer call transcripts (.60)	6.40
26 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Review documents for production for privileged content and emails with J. Hill re same (1.30)	1.30
26 Apr 19	Oplinger, Rachel A.	Review affidavit of L. Langston in support of Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order in preparation for Charter document review (.30); review supplemental affidavit of L. Langston in support of Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order in preparation for Charter document review (.20); review Charter's opposition to Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order in preparation for Charter document review (1.70); review Windstream's reply to Charter's opposition to Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order in preparation for Charter document review (1.70); review transcript from hearing on Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order in preparation for Charter document review (1.10); attend review protocol call with J. Hill (.40); review approximately 20 emails produced by Charter (.80)	5.20
26 Apr 19	O'Brien, Catherine E.	Review Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order, Debtors' reply, Charter's opposition to Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order with exhibits, the transcript from the temporary restraining order hearing, and the affidavit of Lewis Langston in preparation for document review of Charter's documents (2.10); attend phone call with J.	2.50

Client: 392355 – Windstream Holdings, Inc. Pg 48 of 58

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description Hill regarding upcoming document review protocol (.40)	Hours
26 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Address problems with Charter document production (.40); consider objections to Charter Rule 30(b)(6) deposition topics (.50); email exchange with J. Kingston regarding certification of transcripts (.30); email exchange with T. Mogren regarding document review issue (.30); finalize Rule 30(b)(6) Notice of Deposition, including conference with K. Lockhart (1.80); prepare for and conduct preparation of L. Langston for deposition (1.80); read Charter revised 30(b)(6) Notice and email exchange with K. Smith regarding same (.50); review allegations of Charter violation of TRO (.50); telephone conference with J. Glasser regarding Charter deposition (.30); telephone conference with R. Larson to discuss Charter deposition (.40)	7.00
26 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Discuss with T. Ross regarding additional topics to add to 30(6)(b) notice of Charter (.30); revise Rule 30(6)(b) notice of deposition of defendants and serve upon opposing counsel (1.30)	1.60
26 Apr 19	Motsinger, Katherine	Analyze issues pertaining to identification of critical documents in doc review (1.00); review of critical documents to aid in identification of hot documents defendant produced (.40)	1.40
27 Apr 19	Konrath, Adriane	Load data and images relating to volume VOL002 to the Charter2 databases on the network (.50)	0.50
27 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Exchange correspondence with J. Hill regarding review of Charter's documents and review protocol for same (.80); analyze documents from Charter's document production (.60); exchange correspondence with C. Cameron regarding production of transcripts of customer calls (.50)	1.90
27 Apr 19	Hill, Joanna M.	Review documents produced by Charter (2.50); identify and analyze key documents produced by Charter (3.80); summarize key documents (1.10); respond to multiple emails from T. Sims and review team re document production (2.30); multiple calls with members of document review team (1.30); redact transcripts of customer calls for private information (1.40)	12.40
27 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Continue to review and prepare Windstream documents for production (7.60); emails with T. Sims and T. Ross re: issues relating to production (.90)	8.50
27 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Document review and related communications with team (1.10)	1.10
27 Apr 19	Oplinger, Rachel A.	Review approximately 200 emails produced by Charter (3.80); communicate via email with J. Hill re: same (.30); review Windstream's motion for temporary restraining order in preparation to continue reviewing	11.70

19-22312-rdd	Doc 551	Filed 05/21/19	Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10	Main Document
CI: (202255	1. 11.11	, P(g 49 of 58	L ' N 1201541615

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
		documents produced by Charter (.60); review	
		approximately 190 emails produced by Charter (3.70);	
		phone conference with J. Hill re: same (.10); review	
		approximately 300 marketing materials produced by Charter (3.20)	
27 Apr 19	O'Brien, Catherine E.	Review approximately 150 documents produced by	10.20
		Charter and related communications with review team	
		(3.80); review approximately 90 documents produced	
		by Charter and related communications with review	
		team (2.00); review approximately 127 documents	
		produced by Charter and related communications with review team (1.90); review approximately 528	
		documents produced by Charter and related	
		communications with review team (2.50)	
27 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Analyze/strategize re: how newly found Charter	5.20
_,p,	10000, 1010100 11	documents in PI brief (2.30); email exchange with S.	0.20
		Rochester regarding Charter 30(b)(6) deposition (.30);	
		email to C. Cameron regarding progress on	
		transcription of Call Center calls (.30); read multiple	
		emails from document review team of types of	
		documents being found (.30); review "hot" documents	
		uncovered in Charter document production (1.00);	
		review additional "hot" documents from Charter	
27 Apr 10	Matainaan Kathala	production (1.00)	5.00
27 Apr 19	Motsinger, Katherine	Identify and tag critical documents defendant produced (3.00); review of documents defendant produced	5.00
		related to plans to capitalize on Windstream's	
		bankruptcy (1.50); review of relevant pleadings to	
		ascertain which documents defendant produced support	
		Windstream's position (.50)	
27 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Review approximately 450 documents from first batch	9.90
		of Charter document production and communications	
		with review team (2.90); review approximately 200	
		additional documents from first batch of Charter	
		documents and communications with review team	
		(2.10); review approximately 75 "queried" documents	
		from first batch of Charter documents (1.50); review approximately 600 documents from second batch of	
		Charter documents (3.40)	
27 Apr 19	Nussbaum, Jake	Review 466 documents from first Charter production	10.80
_, _, P		for docs re: Windstream and related communications	
		with review team (3.20); review 220 additional	
		documents from first production for docs re:	
		Windstream (1.60); review 42 documents that were	
		marked query in first production for docs re:	
		Windstream (.60); review 684 documents from second	
		Charter production for docs re: Windstream (2.80);	
		review 530 additional documents from second production for documents re: Windstream (2.60)	
27 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Review and respond to missed correspondence,	1.70
2, mpi 19	roonoson, snaya J.	Review and respond to missed correspondence,	1.70

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description including hot docs, Charter objections to Windstream	Hours
27 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	RFP and Charter 30b6 deposition notice (1.70) Circulate updated calendar notices re: Langston deposition (.20)	0.20
28 Apr 19	Konrath, Adriane	Prepare document production data and converting docs to PDFs and prepare tag report for Hot documents (1.50)	1.50
28 Apr 19	Larsen, Ryan	Review and analyze select documents from Charter document production to prepare for 30(b)(6) deposition (1.20)	1.20
28 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Exchange correspondence with J. Hill regarding document review protocol and review of Charter's document production (.70); exchange correspondence with C. Cameron regarding production of transcripts of customer calls (.30); exchange correspondence with Epiq regarding transcription of customer calls (.20); analyze summary of review of Charter's document production and initial review of documents from Charter's production (1.10); prepare correspondence to client regarding Charter's document production (.40); analyze transcripts of Windstream's customers and	3.00
28 Apr 19	Hill, Joanna M.	prepare correspondence to client regarding same (.30) Analyze transcripts of customer service calls (1.50); redact sensitive private information from transcripts (2.80); identify key information in transcripts and draft summary (2.70); identify and analyze key documents produced by Charter (1.60); summarize key documents (1.40); respond to multiple emails from T. Sims and	12.20
28 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	team re document production (2.20) Continue to review and prepare Windstream documents for production (9.90); correspond with T. Sims re: same (.50)	10.40
28 Apr 19	O'Brien, Catherine E.	Review Charter documents tagged "NA" in Concordance by Katten reviewers to find and pull the documents that were corrupt (.30); conduct targeted searches in Concordance to find and pull the corrupt documents produced by Charter (.80)	1.10
28 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Draft initial objections to Charter Rule 30(b)(6) deposition topics (2.50); follow up on possible TRO violation by Charter at Wal-Mart (.30); read multiple emails regarding call center transcript redaction (.30); review newly found Charter "hot" documents indicating intent to deceive customers (1.00); read lengthy email from J. Hill regarding "super hot" documents uncovered during Charter document review (.50)	4.60
28 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	(.50) Review redacted Windstream customer service call transcripts A-1, A-2 and A-3 identifying key exchanges and related communications with J. Hill (1.50); review and redact transcript D1 (1.10); review	3.60

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 51 of 58 19-22312-rdd Doc 551

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
2 0 4 10		and redact transcript B3 (1.00)	0.00
28 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Begin review of hot docs (.90)	0.90
29 Apr 19	Konrath, Adriane	Prepare document production data (.40)	0.40
29 Apr 19	Rossing, Carl	Review documents in Concordance Charter database for technical issues (.90)	0.90
29 Apr 19	Larsen, Ryan	Review Charter produced documents (3.40); prepare	8.20
		deposition examination outline for Charter 30(b)(6)	
		deposition and related emails with T. Ross (3.30); call	
		with T. Ross, T. Sims, and S. Rochester re: same (1.50)	
29 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Analyze documents and prepare deposition exhibits for	8.40
		deposition of Windstream's witness (2.90); call with T.	
		Ross, S. Rochester, and R. Larsen regarding the	
		depositions of Windstream's and Charter's witnesses	
		(1.50) call with client regarding deposition preparation	
		(.60); exchange correspondence with C. Cameron	
		regarding production of Windstream's documents (.40);	
		analyze materials from client (.30); exchange	
		correspondence with client regarding Windstream's	
		document production (.50); prepare correspondence to	
		Windstream's witness regarding deposition (.30);	
		prepare deposition outline of Windstream's witness	
		(1.90)	
29 Apr 19	Hill, Joanna M.	Redact transcripts of calls for production (5.70);	12.10
		strategize with C. Cameron re: document productions	
		(1.20); identify and summarize additional key	
		documents (1.10); prepare for upcoming depositions	
		(1.20); identify and compile deposition exhibits (2.10);	
	_	correspond with clients re: discovery updates (.80)	
29 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Continue to review and prepare Windstream	6.60
		documents for production (4.70); emails with T. Sims	
		and T. Ross re: same (.50); communications with J.	
		Hill re: same (1.20) draft emails to opposing counsel re	
	** 1	Windstream document production (.20)	• • • •
29 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Redact customer call transcripts for personal	3.80
2 0 4 10		information (3.80)	0.00
29 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Draft email to K. Smith describing negotiations on	9.80
		agreed PI (.80); email exchange with C. Cameron	
		regarding transcription of call center calls (.30); email	
		to J. Glasser regarding Rule $30(b)(6)$ deposition of	
		Charter (.30); email to R. Larsen regarding Charter	
		Rule 30(b)(6) deposition (.30); emails to J. Glasser	
		regarding deposition (.30); telephone conference with	
		S. Rochester, T. Sims and R. Larsen regarding	
		intervention, depositions document production and	
		briefing (1.50); telephone conference with S. Rochester	
		regarding UCC joinder (.30); telephone conference	
		with S. Rappaport of UCC and S. Rochester regarding	
		Stipulation of Joinder(.30); telephone conference with	
		opposing counsel, J. Kingston, regarding UCC	
		intervention and deposition (.80); telephone conference	

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description with opposing counsel regarding agreed Preliminary Injunction (.50); review new examples of confusion sent by S. Sullivan (.50); review and edit draft objection to Rule 30(b)(6) Notice from Charter(1.50); read email about problem with document extraction (.30); prepare additional questions for Charter Rule 30(b)(6) deposition (1.00); multiple emails regarding Rule 30(b)(6) depositions (.50); multiple email exchanges with S. Rochester regarding UCC intervention (.30); emails to J. Glasser regarding deposition (.30)	Hours
29 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Attend telephone conference with R. Larsen, T. Sims, T. Ross and S. Rochester regarding strategy for preliminary injunction motion and topics and objections to 30(b)(6) depositions (1.50); draft and revise objections and responses to Defendant's Rule 30(b)(6) amended notice of deposition (3.60); prepare amended Notice of 30(b)(6) deposition and prepare email to opposing counsel (.60); review 30(b)(6) notice of deposition of Windstream Holdings, Inc. (1.30); review Charter Objections to Windstream's 30(b)(6) notice of deposition (.40)	7.40
29 Apr 19	Motsinger, Katherine	Evaluate issues related to redacting Windstream customer calls (.10); prepare repository of key quotes for use in depositions (.20); redact first batches of Windstream customer calls to serve as exhibits (2.80); redact second batch of Windstream customer calls to serve as exhibits (.30)	6.20
29 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Research notice of withdrawal of counsel precedents (.20); draft notice of withdrawal (.20); review and redact Windstream customer service call transcripts volume F1 (1.00); research precedent for intervention via stipulation without motion to intervene (.70); perform second level review of approximately 650 key documents from Charter document production for deposition preparation (3.00); perform second level review of 150 additional key documents from Charter document production (.90); call with S. Rochester re: notice of presentment and sealing motion (.30)	6.30
29 Apr 19	Reisman, Steven	Final coordination and communication re: transitioning of matter to S. Rochester and sign off on disclosure re: no confidential information revealed to Windstream in connection with prior involvement with charter matter (1.10)	1.10
29 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Prepare updated WIP list for team call to discuss (.50); review and provide comments on draft Agreed PI Order (.30); communications with team re UCC intervention (.70); call with UCC re intervention stip and depos (.30); call with T. Ross re: same (.30); attend to issues re logistics for depositions and deposition	6.30

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description prep (.50); review notice of withdrawal (.30); update markup of draft Agreed PI Order (.50); review hot docs produced by Charter in connection with Preliminary Injunction Hearing (.50); review rules for notice of presentment with respect to UCC intervention stipulation (.50); call with T. Ross and T. Sims re depositions and next steps (1.50); call with G. Thompson re notice of presentment and sealing motion (.30); review and provide comments on proposed form of Preliminary Injunction Order (.10)	Hours
29 Apr 19	Wang, Thomas	Circulate calendar notices for K. Atkinson deposition on 5/1 (.10); update pleadings binder re: TRO application for S. Rochester (.50)	0.60
30 Apr 19	Larsen, Ryan	Travel from Los Angeles to Stamford, CT for Charter (30)(b)(6) deposition (10.00); review box of exhibits from Charter production and draft and revise deposition outline for 30(b)(6) deposition (4.50)	9.50
30 Apr 19	Sims, Tami Kameda	Continue to analyze materials and prepare deposition exhibits for Windstream's witness (2.70); continue preparation of deposition outline for Windstream's witness (3.20); prepare for the defense of the deposition of Windstream's witness (.60); analyze new materials from the client (.30); exchange correspondence with C. Cameron and J. Hill regarding additional document production by Windstream (.50); confer with J. Hill regarding privileged documents (.40); travel from Los Angeles to Little Rock billed at	9.70
30 Apr 19	Hill, Joanna M.	half time (2.00) Redact and finalize call transcripts and confer with T. Sims re: same (2.40); identify transcripts with favorable information (1.40); prepare deposition exhibits (3.70); review new SUPER HOT docs and draft summary (1.60); prepare documents for client review (.90); correspondence with T. Sims re: the foregoing (.50)	10.50
30 Apr 19	Cameron, Camille A.	Continue to review and prepare Windstream documents for production (.50); emails with T. Sims re: same (.60) review Windstream documents for depositions (6.80)	7.90
30 Apr 19	Velez, Melissa	Draft deposition objection chart (.60); redact customer call transcripts (.90)	1.50
30 Apr 19	Ross, Terence P.	Draft additional potential questions regarding documents to ask Charter at deposition (1.30); draft email to J. Kingston regarding Langston deposition (.30); review email from opposing counsel regarding K. Dardis of Charter (.30); email to T. Sims regarding potential questions to be posed to L. Langston (.30); multiple email exchanges regarding edits to Creditors Stipulation on intervention to provide protection for documents (.50); prepare possible questions for Charter	6.70

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Pg 54 of 58

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description deposition (1.30); read Creditor's letter to Charter regarding intervention (.30); read email from S. Rochester regarding UCC changes to joinder stipulation and review same (.50); read summary prepared by T. Sims of call with opposing counsel as to discovery agreements resolved (.50); review and approve draft Notice of Withdrawal of S. Reisman (.30); review and comment on edits to draft stipulation of joinder by Creditors (.50); telephone conference with S. Rochester regarding intervention stipulation (.30); read email from Creditors counsel regarding change to Stipulation (.30)	Hours
30 Apr 19	Lockhart, Kristin	Review select documents from Charter document production in preparation for drafting preliminary injunction motion (2.00); review transcript of TRO hearing (3.00)	5.00
30 Apr 19	Motsinger, Katherine	Preparation of chart categorizing key transcripts (1.80); prepare excerpts of "hot" transcripts for use as exhibits (1.50); prepare excerpts of "hot" transcripts for use as exhibits (.20); review of documents produced relating to Spectrum Business and identification of key "hot" documents (2.00); review of documents that need to be prepared as exhibits (.20); revise repository of key transcripts and excerpts to include Bates numbers and key excerpts identified in Langston deposition prep (1.70)	7.40
30 Apr 19	Thompson, Grace	Call with S. Rochester re: outstanding items (.30); continue researching notice of withdrawal of counsel and revise draft (1.20); revise Preliminary Injunction Order and perform redline comparisons on drafts and TRO (.40); draft Motion to Seal Debtors' Memorandum in Support of a Preliminary Injunction (1.00); draft Notice of Hearing for May 14 Preliminary Injunction Hearing (.30); draft agenda for the same (.40); draft Notice of Hearing on the Motion to Seal (.30); draft cover letter to Chambers and U.S. Trustee for May 6 pleadings (.30); draft proposed electronics device order (.30); draft Notice of Filing of Revised Proposed Preliminary Injunction Order (.50); call with S. Rochester re: status of pleadings (.30)	5.30
30 Apr 19	Rochester, Shaya J.	Call with G. Thompson re open work-streams, including sealing motion and revised proposed Preliminary Injunction Order (.30); review and provide comments on Mofo markup of intervention stipulation (.80); call with T. Ross re UCC intervention stip (.30); call with Mofo re UCC intervention stip (.40); update with C. Giglio re Charter litigation (.50); revise notice of withdrawal (.50); proposed Preliminary Injunction Order (.30); call with G. Thompson re work-streams, including case calendar, deadline to amend complaint	3.40

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

Pg 55 of 58

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

Date	Attorney or Assistant	Description	Hours
		and pre-trial conference (.30)	
30 Apr 19	Giglio, Cindi	Discussion with S. Rochester re: status of Committee	0.50
		intervention and related follow up (.50)	
		TOTALS:	1,204.70

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Attorney or Assistant		Hours	Rate	Amount
44935	Arotsky, Allison		3.60	730.00	\$2,628.00
43690	Cameron, Camille A.		84.70	645.00	\$54,631.50
44843	Foudy, Theresa		5.30	1,050.00	\$5,565.00
44904	Giglio, Cindi		2.30	965.00	\$2,219.50
01195	Greer, John		0.40	290.00	\$116.00
43405	Hill, Joanna M.		59.90	695.00	\$41,630.50
32375	Konrath, Adriane		2.90	390.00	\$1,131.00
34231	Larsen, Ryan		44.00	870.00	\$38,280.00
44572	Lockhart, Kristin		72.70	605.00	\$43,983.50
31420	Mandell, Floyd A.		3.10	1,030.00	\$3,193.00
44596	Motsinger, Katherine		20.00	450.00	\$9,000.00
44618	Nussbaum, Jake		14.90	450.00	\$6,705.00
44306	O'Brien, Catherine E.		13.80	440.00	\$6,072.00
44050	Oplinger, Rachel A.		19.50	515.00	\$10,042.50
44842	Reisman, Steven		63.80	1,220.00	\$77,836.00
44845	Rochester, Shaya J.		198.70	965.00	\$191,745.50
44455	Ross, Terence P.		186.70	985.00	\$183,899.50
32379	Rossing, Carl		0.90	330.00	\$297.00
41782	Siena, Marie		23.80	200.00	\$4,760.00
42783	Sims, Tami Kameda		168.30	845.00	\$142,213.50
44616	Thompson, Grace		160.80	450.00	\$72,360.00
43994	Velez, Melissa		33.40	515.00	\$17,201.00
45083	Wang, Thomas		16.40	200.00	\$3,280.00
43403	Yong, Paul S.		4.80	695.00	\$3,336.00
	·	FOTAL:	1,204.70		\$922,126.00

Doc 551 Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 56 of 58

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

19-22312-rdd

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

DISBURSEMENTS

Date 12 Apr 19	Description Color Printing	Amount 28.75
14 Apr 19	SIMS/TAMI KAMEDA 04/13/2019 Los Angeles/New York/Los Angeles Inv#4604 ticket#7346114370	755.48
15 Apr 19	VENDOR: Pacer Service Center; INVOICE#: KM3278-MAR19-WAS; DATE: 4/15/2019 - Acct #KM3278: Pacer Court Cost Incurred in March 2019, Washington.	16.90
16 Apr 19	VENDOR: Pacer Service Center; INVOICE#: KM3280-MAR19-LAX; DATE: 4/15/2019 - Acct #KM3280: Pacer Court Cost Incurred in March 2019, Century City.	12.00
16 Apr 19	VENDOR: Pacer Service Center; INVOICE#: KM3280-MAR19-LAX; DATE: 4/15/2019 - Acct #KM3280: Pacer Court Cost Incurred in March 2019, Century City.	34.80
16 Apr 19	VENDOR: Pacer Service Center; INVOICE#: KM3277-MAR19-NYC; DATE: 4/15/2019 - Acct #KM3277: Pacer Court Cost Incurred in March 2019, New York.	162.10
16 Apr 19	VENDOR: Pacer Service Center; INVOICE#: KM3277-MAR19-NYC; DATE: 4/15/2019 - Acct #KM3277: Pacer Court Cost Incurred in March 2019, New York.	63.10
16 Apr 19	VENDOR: Pacer Service Center; INVOICE#: KM3277-MAR19-NYC; DATE: 4/15/2019 - Acct #KM3277: Pacer Court Cost Incurred in March 2019, New York.	15.90
19 Apr 19	VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Room	661.03
19 Apr 19	charge. Date Incurred: 04/11/19 VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Taxi from	54.50
19 Apr 19	airport to hotel. Date Incurred: 04/14/19 VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Taxi from	14.16
19 Apr 19	hotel to meet witness. Date Incurred: 04/14/19 VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Taxi from hotel to meet witness. Date Incurred: 04/15/19	11.76
19 Apr 19	VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Uber ride back to hotel from meeting with witness. Date Incurred: 04/14/19	10.75
19 Apr 19	VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Parking at airport. Date Incurred: 04/15/19	50.00
19 Apr 19	VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Cash tip for bellman assisting with moving boxes with TRO exhibits. Date Incurred: 04/14/19	5.00
19 Apr 19	VENDOR: Ross, Terence P. INVOICE#: 3257600304191509 DATE: 4/19/2019 Attendance at TRO hearing for client Windstream. Airline ticket to/from TRO hearing in NY. Date Incurred: 04/11/19	984.60
26 Apr 19 28 Apr 19	Postage for 1st class mail pcs 2 Flat (K. Lockhart) entered by SR LARSEN/RYAN 04/30/2019 Los Angeles/New York/Los Angeles	2.30 977.33

Filed 05/21/19 Entered 05/21/19 20:52:10 Main Document Pg 57 of 58 Doc 551

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

19-22312-rdd

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description	Amount
	Inv#4939 ticket#7353404073	
28 Apr 19	SIMS/TAMI KAMEDA 04/30/2019 Los Angeles/Houston/Little Rock	343.60
	Inv#4901 ticket#7353404050	
28 Apr 19	SIMS/TAMI KAMEDA 05/01/2019 Little Rock/Dallas/Los Angeles	416.80
20 Apr 17	Inv#4902 ticket#7353404051	410.00
20 4		C 20
29 Apr 19	PAYEE: Arkadin Inc.; REQUEST#: 812886; DATE: 4/23/2019 To record Arkadin Teleconferencing charges, Inv. No. INUS190300706	6.29
	dated 03/31/2019; Conference call for Cindi Giglio on 3/29/2019	
30 Apr 19	Color Printing	25.00
30 Apr 19	Color Printing	15.00
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: CAMERON, CAMILLE A on 04/12/2019	553.44
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: CAMERON, CAMILLE A on 04/11/2019	246.11
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: SIMS, TAMI on 04/12/2019	88.43
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: VELEZ, MELISSA on 04/11/2019	795.85
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: VELEZ, MELISSA on 04/12/2019	1,004.24
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: AKCHIN, SEAN on 04/16/2019	96.27
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: AKCHIN, SEAN on 04/14/2019	336.96
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: YONG, PAUL on 04/11/2019	44.21
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: YONG, PAUL on 04/12/2019	132.64
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: KELLY, KAREN on 04/09/2019	294.96
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: KELLY, KAREN on 04/11/2019	1,031.06
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: ROSS, TERENCE on 04/09/2019	181.89
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: ROSS, TERENCE on 04/10/2019	121.26
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: ROSS, TERENCE on 04/12/2019	154.36
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: ROSS, TERENCE on 04/23/2019	46.87
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/18/2019	706.93
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/01/2019	1,318.16
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/03/2019	1,212.30
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/09/2019	108.12
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/09/2019	2,040.82
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/10/2019	108.12
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/10/2019	760.68
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/11/2019	889.81
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/12/2019	1,543.97
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/14/2019	1,032.37
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/15/2019	80.30
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: LOCKHART, KRISTIN on 04/16/2019	1,164.78
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/01/2019	144.41
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/02/2019	385.10
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/03/2019	759.77
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/08/2019	26.13
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/08/2019	230.92
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/09/2019	43.56
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/09/2019	301.28
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/11/2019	48.14
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/14/2019	915.29
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: WANG, THOMAS on 04/05/2019	48.14
	41	

Pg 58 of 58

Invoice No. 1301541615 Invoice Date: May 20, 2019

Client: 392355 - Windstream Holdings, Inc.

DISBURSEMENTS

Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

Date	Description	Amount
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/18/2019	178.75
30 Apr 19	Westlaw Legal Research: THOMPSON, GRACE on 04/19/2019	335.62
	TOTAL:	\$24,179.17

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

Matter 00008: Charter Litigation

Out of Town Travel	6	\$807.20
Telephone Charges		\$6.29
Postage		\$2.30
Color Printing		\$68.75
Legal Research		\$19,512.02
Airfare		\$2,493.21
Airfare		\$984.60
Court Costs		\$304.80
	TOTAL:	\$24,179.17

MATTER TOTAL: \$946,305.17