
Hearing Date:  TBD 
Objection Deadline:  September __, 2020 at 12:00 p.m. 

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK 

In re: 

WINDSTREAM HOLDINGS, INC., et  al.,1 

Debtors. 

Chapter 11 

Case No. 19-22312  (RDD) 

(Jointly Administered) 

FOURTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF ALIXPARTNERS, LLP, 
FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF 

UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR 
SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES 

INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020  

Name of Applicant: ALIXPARTNERS, LLC 

Applicant’s Role in Case: Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of 
Unsecured Creditors 

Date Order of Employment Signed: May 16, 2019 [Docket No. 542], Nunc Pro Tunc to 
March 12, 2019 

Time period covered by this Fourth 
Interim Application: 

Beginning of Period End of Period 

March 1, 2020 June 30, 2020 

Summary of Total Fees and Expenses Requested During the Fourth Interim Period: 

Total fees requested in this Fourth Interim 
Application: $755,156.00 

Total expenses requested in this Fourth 
Interim Application: $0.00 

Total fees and expenses requested in this 
Fourth Interim Application: $755,156.00 

1    The last four digits of Debtor Windstream Holdings, Inc.’s tax identification number are 7717. Due to the large 
number of debtor entities in these chapter 11 cases, for which the Debtors have requested joint administration, a 
complete list of the debtor entities and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided 
herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ proposed claims and 
noticing agent at http://www.kccllc.net/windstream. The location of the Debtors’ service address for purposes of these 
chapter 11 cases is: 4001 North Rodney Parham Road, Little Rock, Arkansas 72212. 
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Blended hourly rate for fees incurred 
during the Fourth Interim Period: $843.66 

Summary of Prior Payments & Outstanding Amount 
Due AlixPartners During the Fourth Interim Period: 

Total allowed compensation paid to date 
towards the Fourth Interim Period: $399,702.40 

Total allowed expenses paid to date during 
the Fourth Interim Period: $0.00 

Total Amount of Fourth Interim Fees and 
Expenses Due & Owing to AlixPartners: $355,453.60 

This is a(n):   Monthly Application    X    Interim Application ___ Final Application 
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ALIXPARTNERS, LLP 

SUMMARY OF FEE STATEMENTS  
DURING THE FOURTH INTERIM PERIOD 
MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020 

Requested Paid
Fees Expenses Fees Expenses

4/27/2020
Docket #1711

3/1/2020 - 
3/31/2020 $251,989.50 $0.00 $201,591.60 $0.00 $50,397.90

6/2/2020
Docket #1957

4/1/2020 - 
4/30/2020 $126,150.50 $0.00 $100,920.40 $0.00 $25,230.10

7/1/2020
Docket #2259

5/1/2020 - 
5/31/2020 $121,488.00 $0.00 $97,190.40 $0.00 $24,297.60

7/31/2020
Docket #2360

6/1/2020 - 
6/30/2020 $255,528.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $255,528.00

$755,156.00 $0.00 $399,702.40 $0.00 $355,453.60Total

Date Filed;
Docket No.

Period 
Covered

Amount 
Outstanding
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ALIXPARTNERS, LLP 

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL 
DURING THE FOURTH INTERIM PERIOD 
MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020 

Kevin Nystrom Managing Director $1,150 197.0              $     226,550.00 
David MacGreevey Managing Director $1,090 81.2                         88,508.00 
Kathryn McGlynn Managing Director $1,025 133.7                     137,042.50 
Elizabeth S Kardos Director $710 1.0                710.00 
Jeffrey Wooding Senior Vice President $690 191.0                     131,790.00 
Jon Dutton Senior Vice President $690 104.3                       71,967.00 
Scott Weiner Senior Vice President $645 66.5                         42,892.50 
Paul Windsor Senior Vice President $645 0.3                193.50 
Kaitlyn A Sundt Senior Vice President $510 0.3                153.00 
Anthony Perrella Vice President $470 74.6                         35,062.00 
Lisa Marie Bonito Associate $450 43.7                         19,665.00 
Melanie McCabe Associate $415 1.5                622.50 

895.1              $     755,156.00 

$843.66Average Billing Rate

Total Hours 
During 
Period

Total Fees 
During Period

Total Fees and Hours for Professionals

Professional Title Rate 
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ALIXPARTNERS, LLP 
 

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY MATTER CATEGORY  
DURING THE FOURTH INTERIM PERIOD 
MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020 

 
 

 
 

 

Total Hours 
During Period

Total Fees 
During Period

101 Planning, Coordination and Case Management             28.4  $      25,098.50 

102 Meetings and Communications with UCC and Professionals           301.9        249,796.50 

103
Meetings and Communications with Management and Debtors' 
Professionals             11.6           9,834.00 

104
Meetings and Communications with Lenders, Plan Sponsors and 
Professionals               0.9              922.50 

105 Analysis of DIP Financing and Cash Collateral               1.1           1,223.00 

106 Analysis of Liquidity and Cash Management             40.3          39,198.50 

107 Sale of Business and Assets                 -                      -   

108 Business and Strategic Plan Analysis and Assessment             37.0          22,480.00 

109 Valuation Analysis               1.1           1,199.00 

110 Employee Compensation and Advisor Retention Matters                 -                      -   

111 Financial and Other Diligence             51.1          42,813.00 

112 Litigation Support and Claims Analysis           160.3        143,799.00 

113 RSA, Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization           207.3        189,935.50 

114 Retention Applications and Disclosure Schedules                 -                      -   

115 Engagement Administration                 -                      -   

116 Fee Statements and Fee Applications             54.1          28,856.50 

129 Non-Working Travel Time                 -                      -   

          895.1  $    755,156.00 

Average Billing Rate $843.66

TOTAL

Matter Code

19-22312-rdd    Doc 2391    Filed 08/10/20    Entered 08/10/20 18:05:54    Main Document 
Pg 5 of 136



UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK 

In re: 

WINDSTREAM HOLDINGS, INC., et  al.,1 

Debtors. 

Chapter 11 

Case No. 19-22312  (RDD) 

(Jointly Administered) 

FOURTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF ALIXPARTNERS, LLP, 
FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF 

UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR 
SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES 

INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020  

AlixPartners, LLP (“AlixPartners” or the “Firm”), as financial advisor to the Official 

Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) to Windstream Holdings, Inc. and its 

affiliated debtors and debtors-in-possession in these Chapter 11 Cases (collectively, the 

“Debtors”), hereby submits its fourth interim application (the “Application”), for allowance of 

compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of out of-pocket expenses 

incurred for the period March 1, 2020 through June 30, 2020 (the “Fourth Interim Period”).  By this 

Application, AlixPartners seeks payment of professional fees in the amount of $755,156.00.  

AlixPartners respectfully states as follows: 

1    The last four digits of Debtor Windstream Holdings, Inc.’s tax identification number are 7717. Due to the large 
number of debtor entities in these chapter 11 cases, for which the Debtors have requested joint administration, a 
complete list of the debtor entities and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided 
herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ proposed claims and noticing 
agent at http://www.kccllc.net/windstream. The location of the Debtors’ service address for purposes of these chapter 11 
cases is: 4001 North Rodney Parham Road, Little Rock, Arkansas 72212. 
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Jurisdiction and Venue 

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the

“Court”) has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334.  This is a core 

proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b). 

2. Venue is proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

3. The basis for relief requested herein are Sections 330 and 331 of Title 11 of the

United States Bankruptcy Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of 

Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules for the 

Southern District of New York (the “Local Rules”), the Amended Guidelines for Fees and 

Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York, updated June 17, 2013 (the 

“Local Guidelines”) and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and 

Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals (the “Interim Compensation Order”) [Docket 

No. 374]. 

Background 

4. On February 25, 2019 (the “Petition Date”), each of the Debtors filed a voluntary

petition for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code in this Court. 

5. The Debtors are authorized to continue operating their businesses and managing their

properties as debtors-in-possession pursuant to Sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. 

6. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these Chapter 11 Cases.

7. On March 12, 2019, the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District

of New York (the “UST”) appointed the Committee [Docket No. 136]. 
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Retention of AlixPartners 

8. On April 29, 2019, the Committee filed its Application of the Official Committee of

Unsecured Creditors of Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al., for Entry of an Order Authorizing the 

Employment and Retention of AlixPartners, LLP as its Financial Advisor, Nunc Pro Tunc to March 

12, 2019 (the “Retention Application”) [Docket No. 442]. 

9. On May 16, 2019, the Bankruptcy Court entered the Order Authorizing the Official

Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Windstream Holdings, Inc., et al., to Employ and Retain 

AlixPartners, LLP as its Financial Advisor Nunc Pro Tunc to March 12, 2019 (the “Retention 

Order”) [Docket No. 542].   

10. The Retention Order approved the terms of AlixPartners’ fee and expense structure

set forth in the Engagement Letter and authorized AlixPartners to be compensated pursuant to the 

terms of the Engagement Letter and procedures set forth in the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy 

Rules, the Local Rules, the Administrative Order, and any other applicable orders of this Court. 

AlixPartners’ Application for 
Compensation and for Reimbursement of Expenses 

Monthly Fee Statements During the Fourth Interim Period 

11. AlixPartners’ monthly fee statements (the “Monthly Fee Statements”) covering the

First Interim Period have been filed and served pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order.  The 

Monthly Fee Statements covered by this Application contain detailed daily time logs describing the 

actual and necessary services provided and expenses incurred by AlixPartners during the periods 

covered by such statements.   Detailed descriptions of the services rendered and expenses incurred 

during the Fourth Interim Period were included in the Monthly Fee Statements and are attached as 

Exhibit A.   A detailed analysis of the out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the Fourth Interim 

Period were included in the Monthly Fee Statements and are attached as Exhibit B.    
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12. AlixPartners filed four (4) Monthly Fee Statements as noted below:

Requested Paid
Fees Expenses Fees Expenses

4/27/2020
Docket #1711

3/1/2020 - 
3/31/2020 $251,989.50 $0.00 $201,591.60 $0.00 $50,397.90

6/2/2020
Docket #1957

4/1/2020 - 
4/30/2020 $126,150.50 $0.00 $100,920.40 $0.00 $25,230.10

7/1/2020
Docket #2259

5/1/2020 - 
5/31/2020 $121,488.00 $0.00 $97,190.40 $0.00 $24,297.60

7/31/2020
Docket #2360

6/1/2020 - 
6/30/2020 $255,528.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $255,528.00

$755,156.00 $0.00 $399,702.40 $0.00 $355,453.60Total

Date Filed;
Docket No.

Period 
Covered

Amount 
Outstanding

13. AlixPartners has provided an aggregate of 895.1 hours for professional services,

seeking an interim allowance of compensation in the amount of $755,156.002 during the Fourth 

Interim Period. 

14. During the Fourth Interim Period, AlixPartners received the sum of $399,702.40 for

professional services from the Debtors.  The sum of $355,453.60 remains outstanding pursuant to 

the Fourth Interim Period. 

Summary of Professional Services Rendered During the Fourth Interim Period 

15. During the course of AlixPartners’ engagement in the Fourth Interim Period,

AlixPartners has advised and assisted the Committee with (i) evaluation of Debtor’s proposed 

contract rejections and associated damages, (ii) analyzing the Debtors’ monthly operating reports, 

(iii) analyzing the Debtors’ financial performance and cash management, including but not limited to

preparation and delivery of liquidity reports, analysis of monthly management reporting and 

2     This includes the holdback in the amount of $50,397.90 pursuant to the Twelfth Monthly Fee Statement, the amount 
of $25,230.10 pursuant to the Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement, the amount of $24,297.60 pursuant to the Fourteenth 
Monthly Fee Statement, and the amount of $51,105.60 pursuant to the Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement, for a total 
holdback of $151,031.20. 
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quarterly financial filings (iv) reviewing the interplay of potential restructuring outcomes based on 

the Uniti master lease, separation agreement and credit agreements, (v) review of guarantees provide 

across the corporate structure, (vi) continued preparation and refinement of a legal entity waterfall 

analysis under various recovery scenarios (vii) evaluation of the impact on claims recovery under a 

potential lease recharacterization of the Uniti master lease or under various potential restructuring 

proposals, (viii) continuation of solvency analyses for several dates of interest, (ix) analyzing the 

Debtors’ multiple revised thirteen week cash flow budgets for reasonableness and feasibility and 

held meetings with Debtors’ advisor to discuss various observations and concerns, (x) participation 

in weekly discussions with the Debtors’ advisors regarding various case developments and 

Committee feedback, (xi) coordination with the Committee’s legal advisor, Morrison Forrester LLP 

(“MoFo”) and investment banker, Perella Weinberg Partners (“Perella Weinberg”) to develop case 

strategy, (xii) coordination with MoFo and Perella Weinberg to develop a strategy related to the 

confirmation of a Plan of Reorganizaiton (xiii) determining an estimated range of administrative, 

priority, secured and unsecured claims at each Debtor, (xiv) analyzing revisions to the DIP financing 

and projecting liquidity needs of the Debtors through projected emergence, (xv) reviewing the 

planned objections of proof of claims filed and (xvi) coordination, response and information flow to 

various Committee constituents to ensure all constituents received the information they requested on 

a timely basis. 

16. AlixPartners also reviewed legal entity balance sheets and prepared liquidation and

intercompany analyses to assess a range of potential waterfall scenarios. Based on these analyses, 

AlixPartners assessed the recovery to unsecured creditors of guarantor and non-guarantor 

subsidiaries from the unencumbered assets, ultimately culminating in an analysis of potential 

unsecured creditor returns for each legal entity. Throughout the process AlixPartners conferred with 
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MoFo and Perrella Weinberg on the mechanics of the value waterfall through creditor classes and 

the key assumptions to be used in calculating multiple scenarios of unsecured creditor recoveries for 

presentation to the Committee for their consideration. 

17. AlixPartners thoroughly evaluated the multiple drafts of the Debtors’ disclosure

statement and proposed Plan of Reorganization. In addition to reviewing the supporting analyses 

provided by the Debtors’ advisors, AlixPartners developed and refined its own liquidation analysis 

models, as well as additional models to potentially support a plan objection. Using the outputs of 

these analyses, AlixPartners prepared a declaration regarding recoveries to Obligor General 

Unsecured Claims and developed an expert report related to confirmation of the Plan. In addition to 

testifying to the report at the confirmation hearing, AlixPartners reviewed expert reports provided by 

the Debtors in support of the Plan of Reorganization and related to liquidation analyses and prepared 

question lists related to these reports in collaboration with MoFo and Perrella Weinberg. In the 

period leading up to the confirmation hearing, AlixPartners also reviewed various settlement and 

counterproposal offers provided by the Debtors and various other constituencies.  

18. AlixPartners also continued to closely monitor the Debtors’ performance  versus the

Debtors’ revised 2020 budget and updated five-year business plan. With the onset of COVID-19, 

AlixPartners reassessed the Debtors’ projections for reasonableness and feasibility, reviewed the 

Debtors’ performance at an enterprise and individual business segment level, and sensitized the 

Debtors’ proposed capital spend initiatives. AlixPartners also analyzed the likely impacts of the 

pandemic on the Debtors’ business plan’s assumptions  and detailed and discussed the new risks to 

the business plan. In deriving these views AlixPartners engaged in multiple  discussions with the 

Debtors’ advisors regarding our questions, concerns and observations, and analyzed other related 
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materials in detail. Ultimately, this work yielded a  revised view of the Debtors’ near-term feasibility 

under the Debtors’ proposed business plan. 

Professional Services By Category During the Fourth Interim Period 

19. AlixPartners classified all services performed for which compensation is sought into

separate categories.  Summarized below is a description of the services provided by AlixPartners to 

the Committee during the Fourth Interim Period in each significant service area. 

20. The following summaries are intended only to highlight key services rendered by

AlixPartners during the Fourth Interim Period in certain project billing categories where 

AlixPartners has expended a considerable number of hours on behalf of the Committee, and are not 

meant to be a detailed description of all of the work performed by AlixPartners.  The primary focus 

of AlixPartners was centered around the following areas: 

Matter Code 101:  Planning, Coordination and Case Management   
(28.4 hours; $25,098.50) 
Time spent includes engagement scoping, resource planning, and engagement execution 
strategy. 

Matter Code 102: Meetings and Communications with Committee Members and 
Professionals  (301.9 hours; $249,796.50) 
Time spent includes updating the Committee with regard to status of the Chapter 11 Cases, 
including the preparation of related presentation materials.  In addition, this also includes 
discussion with other professionals representing the Committee. 

Matter Code 103: Meetings and Communications with Management and Debtors’ 
Professionals  (11.6 hours; $9,834.00) 
Time spent includes meetings and discussions held with Management and Debtors’ 
professionals. 

Matter Code 104: Meetings and Communications with Lenders, Plan Sponsors and 
Professionals  (0.9 hours; $922.50) 
Time spent includes meetings, communicating, and coordinating with the Debtors’ 
Lenders, Plan Sponsors and their Professionals. 

Matter Code 105:  Analysis of Debtor in Possession Financing and Cash Collateral  
(1.1 hours; $1,223.00) 
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Time spent includes analysis performed in relation to the Debtor in Possession Credit 
Agreement.  Time spent may include diligence on budgets and schedules produced in 
relation to the Debtor in Possession Credit Agreement, as well as reviewing terms of 
the Agreement itself.  

Matter Code 106: Analysis of Liquidity and Cash Management 
(40.3 hours; $39,198.50) 
Time spent includes analyzing and reviewing weekly cash flow statements and their 
respective variances from budgeted amounts. 

Matter Code 108:  Business and Strategic Plan Analysis and Assessment  
(37.0 hours; $22,480.00) 
Time spent includes analyzing and diligencing the Debtors' business plan, and its 
reasonableness as with respect to a successful emergence from Chapter 11. 

Matter Code 109:  Valuation Analysis   (1.1 hours; $1,199.00) 
Time spent includes research of the operations and financial characteristics of comparable 
public companies, precedent transactions, cost of capital and other issues relating to 
standard valuation methodologies. 

Matter Code 111: Financial and Other Diligence   (51.1 hours; $42,813.00) 
Time spent includes researching and documenting relevant information regarding the 
Debtors' state of affairs from public and non-public sources, including, but not limited to, 
SEC filings, filings on the electronic court docket, press releases, monthly operating 
reports provided by the Debtors, as well as documents and schedules provided in the 
virtual data room.  

Matter Code 112:  Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
(160.3 hours; $143,799.00) 
Time spent includes analyzing claims filed against and by the Debtors and evaluating its 
impact on the expected recovery to the unsecured creditors. 

Matter Code 113:  RSA, Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization 
(207.3 hours; $189,935.50) 
Time spent includes analyzing, reviewing and providing commentary on the Debtors' 
proposed plan of reorganization, disclosure statement, and related restructuring support 
agreement. 

Matter Code 116:  Fee Statements and Fee Applications   (54.1 hours; $28,856.50) 
Time billed under this category was for the necessary time that AlixPartners professionals 
spent managing the fee application process. Appropriate staffing levels were utilized to 
minimize the cost associated with these activities. 
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21. AlixPartners believes that the fees and expenses requested are reasonable, and all

amounts requested are for actual and necessary services rendered on behalf of the Committee. 

22. AlixPartners has not entered into any agreement, express or implied, with any other

party for the purpose of fixing or sharing fees or other compensation to be paid for professional 

services rendered in these cases. No promises have been received by AlixPartners or any member 

thereof as to compensation in connection with these Chapter 11 Cases other than in accordance with 

the provisions of the Bankruptcy Code. 

Certification 

23. A Certification of David MacGreevey is attached hereto as Exhibit B and made part

of this Application. 
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Conclusion 

WHEREFORE, AlixPartners, as Financial Advisor to the Committee, respectfully requests 

that the Court enter an order providing that:   (i) an interim allowance be awarded to AlixPartners for 

the Fourth Interim Period in the amount of $755,156.00 (including the holdback of $151,031.20) as 

compensation for necessary professional services rendered; (ii) the Debtors be authorized and 

directed to pay AlixPartners the outstanding amount of $355,453.60; and (iii) for such other and 

further relief as this Court deems proper.  

Dated:   August 10, 2020 ALIXPARTNERS, LLP 
909 Third Avenue, 28th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 

/s/ David MacGreevey 
By:  David MacGreevey 
        Managing Director 
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ALIXPARTNERS, LLP 

Exhibit A 
Detailed Description of Fees, Hours and Descriptions by Matter Category 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 

Invoice # ******-1 

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  

 909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500 
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344 

alixpartners.com 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/13/20 KM Coordinate team meetings and workstreams while 

working remotely 
0.60 

03/16/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

03/16/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

03/16/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review

0.30 

03/16/20 JW Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, 
K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner and, A. Perrella (all
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review

0.30 

03/16/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review

0.30 

03/16/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review

0.30 

03/16/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/16/20 KN Check in with A. Perrella (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/16/20 KN Check in with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/16/20 KN Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

03/17/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.20 

03/17/20 KN Check in with A. Perrella (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/17/20 KN Listen into the Omnibus hearing 0.20 
03/17/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 

Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/17/20 SW Dial in to Omnibus hearing 0.50 
03/17/20 JW Dial into omnibus hearing update 0.30 
03/17/20 JW Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreeevey, 

K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/17/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey. J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/17/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner  (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/17/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/17/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey. J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/18/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/18/20 KN Check in with A. Perrella (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/20/20 DM WIN engagement planning 0.70 
03/23/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: pre 

committee call discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.10 

03/23/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/24/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/25/20 KN Check in with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

03/25/20 KN Check in with A. Perrella (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/25/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 

team efforts 
0.10 

03/25/20 KN Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.10 

03/25/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.10 

03/25/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, J. 
Wooding, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal 
team workstream review 

0.10 

03/25/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal 
team workstream review 

0.10 

03/25/20 JW Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.10 

03/27/20 KN Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream 

0.20 

03/27/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream 

0.20 

03/30/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/30/20 JW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/30/20 KN Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/30/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

03/30/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/30/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 

Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

04/01/20 DM Attend WIN team call re strategy and planning 0.20 
04/01/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom 

and J. Dutton (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.20 

04/01/20 JD Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
and K. Nystrom (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.20 

04/01/20 KN Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton (all AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream 
review 

0.20 

04/03/20 KN Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
and J. Wooding (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.20 

04/03/20 JW Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey 
and K. McGlynn  (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.20 

04/03/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn and J. 
Wooding (all AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream 
review 

0.20 

04/03/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
and J. Wooding (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.20 

04/06/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.10 

04/06/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.10 

04/06/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, and 
A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream 
review 

0.10 

04/06/20 JW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/06/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, J. 

Wooding and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal 
team workstream review 

0.10 

04/08/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.10 

04/08/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.10 

04/08/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.10 

04/08/20 KN Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.10 

04/08/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.10 

04/10/20 KN Check in with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

04/13/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

04/13/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, J. Dutton and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

04/13/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

04/13/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

04/13/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) 
re: internal team workstream review 

0.20 

04/13/20 KN Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.20 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/14/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 

team efforts 
0.10 

04/14/20 LMB Update fee application status chart 0.20 
04/15/20 KN Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, and S. 

Weiner (all AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream 
review 

0.20 

04/15/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Dutton, and S. Weiner (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.20 

04/15/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, and 
S. Weiner (all AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream 
review 

0.20 

04/15/20 JD Combine 0.00 
04/15/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, and 

J. Dutton (all AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream 
review 

0.20 

04/16/20 KN Check in with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling 
team efforts 

0.10 

04/17/20 DM Telephone call with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: internal 
team workstream review 

0.20 

04/17/20 KM Telephone call with D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.30 

04/20/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.40 

04/20/20 JW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, J. 
Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.40 

04/20/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal 
team workstream review 

0.40 

04/20/20 AP Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, and J. Dutton (all AlixPartners) re: internal 
team workstream review 

0.40 

04/20/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey,J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: internal team 
workstream review 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/22/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) 

re: internal team workstream review 
0.20 

04/22/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

04/23/20 KM Coordinate attendance at upcoming depositions 0.30 
04/24/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) 

re: internal team workstream review 
0.30 

04/24/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.30 

04/29/20 JW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

04/29/20 DM Attend WIN team call re planning and coordination 0.30 
04/29/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 

Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

04/29/20 SW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.30 

04/29/20 JD Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

04/29/20 AP Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/01/20 AP Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.40 

05/01/20 KM Telephone call with D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: WIN 
key issues 

0.30 

05/01/20 SW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.40 

05/01/20 DM Telephone call with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: WIN 
key issues 

0.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
05/01/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 

Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.40 

05/01/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/08/20 SW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.10 

05/08/20 AP Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.10 

05/08/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.10 

05/08/20 KM Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.10 

05/15/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/15/20 PW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/15/20 JW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/15/20 JD Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/15/20 KN Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/15/20 SW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/15/20 DM Attend WIN team call re: strategy and planning 0.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
05/21/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. Mcglynn, K. Nystrom, J. 

Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.20 

05/21/20 AP Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/21/20 JW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/21/20 JD Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/21/20 KN Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/21/20 SW Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

05/21/20 KM Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.30 

06/30/20 JW Internal team meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
K. Nystrom (all AlixPartners) re: to align on post 
confirmation workstreams 

0.50 

06/30/20 KM Internal team meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners) :re: internal 
team workstream review and next steps 

0.50 

06/30/20 KN Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn 
and J. Wooding (all AlixPartners)  re: internal team 
workstream review and next steps 

0.50 

06/30/20 DM Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding (all AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream 
review and next steps 

0.50 

  Total Hours 28.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-1 
 
Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00101  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Lisa Marie Bonito 0.20 450.00  90.00 
Anthony Perrella 2.70 470.00  1,269.00 
Paul Windsor 0.30 645.00  193.50 
Scott Weiner 3.30 645.00  2,128.50 
Jeffrey Wooding 3.20 690.00  2,208.00 
Jon Dutton 2.60 690.00  1,794.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 6.30 1,025.00  6,457.50 
David MacGreevey 5.20 1,090.00  5,668.00 
Kevin Nystrom 4.60 1,150.00  5,290.00 
Total Hours & Fees 28.40   25,098.50 

 
  

19-22312-rdd    Doc 2391    Filed 08/10/20    Entered 08/10/20 18:05:54    Main Document 
Pg 26 of 136



 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/02/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update and plan discussion 

1.00 

03/02/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: plan 
discussion and next steps with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/02/20 AP Develop January MOR slides for weekly committee update 
presentation 

2.20 

03/02/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update and plan discussion 

1.00 

03/02/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: plan 
discussion and next steps with K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/02/20 JW Prepare weekly report to UCC 1.80 
03/02/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update and plan discussion 

1.00 

03/02/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: plan 
discussion and next steps with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/02/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: plan 
discussion and next steps with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 

0.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) 

03/02/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update and plan discussion 

1.00 

03/02/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update and plan discussion 

1.00 

03/02/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: plan 
discussion and next steps with J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/02/20 DM Review emails from L. Marinuzzi and R. Ferraioli (both 
MoFo) re: WIN updates 

0.50 

03/02/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update and plan discussion 

1.00 

03/03/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner and A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: UCC professionals 
coordination 

0.50 

03/03/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner and A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 

0.50 
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4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
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New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
UCC professionals coordination 

03/03/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
03/03/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, K. 

Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner and A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: UCC professionals 
coordination 

0.50 

03/03/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner 
and A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
UCC professionals coordination 

0.50 

03/03/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner and A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: UCC professionals 
coordination 

0.50 

03/03/20 JW Conference call with S. Eghlimi, and F. Mushi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: waterfall analysis 

0.50 

03/03/20 AP Revise weekly Committee update presentation per 
comments from MoFo 

1.10 

03/03/20 AP Review model and development of recovery matrix for 
circulation to Committee's advisors 

0.90 

03/03/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. 
Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/04/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

1.20 
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New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/04/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

1.20 

03/04/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

1.20 

03/04/20 JW Prepare waterfall analysis summary presentation for the 
Committee 

2.20 

03/04/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

1.20 

03/04/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

1.20 

03/04/20 KN Prepare for the UCC meeting and presentation of weekly 
cash, a new 13 week liquidity forecast and the January 
MOR 

0.70 

03/05/20 KN Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, D. 
MacGreevey, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation and 
waterfall analysis review 

0.60 

03/05/20 KM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, D. 
MacGreevey, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation and 
waterfall analysis review 

0.60 

03/05/20 JD Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. 

0.60 
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New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and waterfall analysis review 

03/05/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation and 
waterfall analysis review 

0.60 

03/05/20 SW Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom,D. 
MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and waterfall analysis review 

0.60 

03/05/20 AP Participate in conference call  with K. Nystrom, D. 
MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and waterfall analysis review 

0.60 

03/05/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation and 
waterfall analysis review 

0.60 

03/09/20 JW Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, D. 
MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) re: WIN waterfall analysis 

0.60 

03/09/20 JW Participate in conference call re: waterfall and recovery 
analysis with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) T. Goren (MoFo) H. Denman, B. Bakemeyer 
(both White & Case) and F. Munshi (Perella Weinberg) 

1.00 

03/09/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.70 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/09/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 

McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) re: WIN waterfall analysis 

0.60 

03/09/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) T. Goren (MoFo) H. 
Denman, B. Bakemeyer (both White & Case) and F. 
Munshi (Perella Weinberg) re: waterfall and recovery 
analysis 

1.10 

03/09/20 AP Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) re: WIN waterfall analysis 

0.60 

03/09/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners) T. Goren (MoFo) H. 
Denman, B. Bakemeyer (both White & Case) and F. 
Munshi (Perella Weinberg) re: waterfall and recovery 
analysis 

1.00 

03/09/20 KN Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, D. 
MacGreevey, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) re: WIN waterfall analysis 

0.60 

03/09/20 KN Review the weekly Committee update 0.60 
03/09/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, J. 

Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners),T. Goren (MoFo) H. 
Denman, B. Bakemeyer (both White & Case) and F. 
Munshi (Perella Weinberg) re: waterfall and recovery 
analysis 

1.00 

03/09/20 KM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, D. 
MacGreevey, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) re: WIN waterfall analysis 

0.60 

03/10/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 

0.80 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

03/10/20 KM Call with Zoom Video's counsel re: cure settlement 0.30 
03/10/20 KM Review weekly liquidity update presentation for the 

Committee 
0.30 

03/10/20 DM Review updated deck re: WIN waterfall analysis 0.60 
03/10/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, K. 

Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.80 

03/10/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
03/10/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

Nystrom, J. Wooding, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.80 

03/10/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.80 

03/10/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.80 

03/10/20 JW Amendments to weekly report for UCC 0.70 
03/10/20 JW Consolidate 4x models work product into UCC 

presentation 
2.20 

03/10/20 JW Exchange calls and emails with T. Goren (MoFo) re: 
model assumptions and UCC presentation 

0.60 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/10/20 JW Updates to 5x models to toggle for default interest, 

various emergence dates and Midwest 100% recovery 
3.00 

03/10/20 JW Updates to UCC presentation re: waterfall analysis and 
recovery scenarios 

1.70 

03/10/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.80 

03/11/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.80 

03/11/20 JW Updates to UCC presentation on waterfall analysis and 
recovery scenarios following UCC feedback re: additional 
requests. 

1.60 

03/11/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, J. 
Wooding, (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.80 

03/11/20 JD Participation in the weekly UCC meeting with Committee 
Members, K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, S. 
Weiner, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 

03/11/20 SW Participation in the weekly UCC meeting with Committee 
Members, K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 

03/11/20 DM Participation in the weekly UCC meeting with UCC 
Committee members, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 

0.80 
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Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

03/11/20 KN Prepare for the presentation of the claims values for the 
UCC meeting 

1.20 

03/11/20 KN Participation in the weekly UCC meeting with Committee 
Members, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 

03/11/20 KM Review potential claims recovery presentation for the 
Committee 

1.10 

03/11/20 KM Review Perella Weinberg's valuation presentation for the 
Committee 

1.00 

03/12/20 KN Participate in conference call with J. Wooding 
(AlixPartners), T. Goren (MoFo), H. Denman, and B. 
Bakemeyer (both White & Case) re: waterfall and 
recovery analysis 

0.50 

03/12/20 JW Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom 
(AlixPartners), T. Goren (MoFo), H. Denman, and B. 
Bakemeyer (both White & Case) re: waterfall and 
recovery analysis 

0.40 

03/16/20 KM Call with Zoom Video re: cure settlement 0.20 
03/16/20 JD Emails with MoFo re: Committee Updates 0.30 
03/16/20 JD Participate in meeting with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, 

K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.30 

03/17/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

03/17/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/17/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.40 
03/17/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re; weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

03/17/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 1.10 
03/17/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.40 

03/17/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

03/17/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 1.00 
03/17/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, K. 

Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner and A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

03/17/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

03/18/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.70 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/18/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.70 

03/18/20 JD Emails with MoFo re: court hearing 0.30 
03/18/20 JD Emails with MoFo re: equity committee appointment 0.30 
03/18/20 DM Review emails from B. Mendelsohn (Perella Weinberg), T. 

Goren and L. Marinuzzi (both MoFo) re: WIN updates 
0.30 

03/18/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.70 

03/18/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee update presentation 0.60 
03/18/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.70 

03/18/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.70 

03/18/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.70 

03/18/20 KN Prepare for the UCC call 0.60 
03/18/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
0.70 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

03/19/20 JW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with K. Nystrom, A. Perrella (both 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

03/19/20 DM Review email from J. Wooding (AlixPartners) WIN 
professionals call update 

0.20 

03/19/20 KN Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with J. Wooding, A. Perrella (both 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

03/19/20 AP Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding (both 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

03/20/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew 
(all Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet review 

0.30 

03/20/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew 
(all Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet review 

0.30 

03/20/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew 
(all Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet review 

0.30 

03/20/20 DM Emails with T. Goren, E. Richards and L. Marinuzzi (all 
MoFo) re: WIN settlement term sheet 

0.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/20/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

Nystrom, K. McGlynn, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew 
(all Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet review 

0.30 

03/20/20 JW Updates to timeline regarding treatment and 
quantification of GUCs in board materials and per A&M 
advice per MoFo request 

1.00 

03/20/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew 
(all Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet review 

0.30 

03/23/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.50 
03/23/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: pre 

committee call discussion with  K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, 
J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.10 

03/23/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: pre 
committee call discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.10 

03/23/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet discussion 

0.30 

03/23/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet discussion 

0.30 

03/23/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: pre 
committee call discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all 

0.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

03/23/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
term sheet discussion 

0.30 

03/23/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: pre 
committee call discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.10 

03/23/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet discussion 

0.30 

03/23/20 JW Prepare weekly Committee report 1.10 
03/23/20 JW Finalize UCC report and send to MoFo 0.30 
03/23/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: term sheet discussion 

0.30 

03/23/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.90 
03/23/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: pre 

committee call discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.10 

03/23/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 

0.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
term sheet discussion 

03/24/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Dutton, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.50 

03/24/20 JW Review committee update materials from Perrella 
Weinberg and MoFo 

0.30 

03/24/20 JW Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, D. 
MacGreevey, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.50 

03/24/20 JD Analyze agenda materials for weekly call and review 
Centurylink motion summary 

1.10 

03/24/20 JD Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, D. 
MacGreevey, J. Wooding,  A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.50 

03/24/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.50 

03/24/20 KN Participate in conference call with  D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.50 

03/25/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

03/25/20 KM Prep for weekly update presentation to the Committee 0.60 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/25/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

03/25/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

03/25/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

03/25/20 KN Review the materials for the UCC Committee meeting 0.60 
03/25/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

03/25/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

03/25/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

03/27/20 AP Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 

0.40 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, 
and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) to discuss the next 
steps on the rejection of the settlement proposal from the 
UCC by the 1L lenders 

03/27/20 KN Participate in a call on next steps after the rebuttal of the 
UCC settlement offer from the note holders with L. 
Marinuzzi, T. Goren, K. Richardson (MoFo), B. Mendelson, 
and F. Munshi (Perrella Weinberg) 

0.40 

03/27/20 KN Participate in conference call with A. Perrella, J. Wooding 
(both AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) to discuss 
the next steps on the rejection of the settlement proposal 
from the UCC by the 1L lenders 

0.60 

03/27/20 JW Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, 
and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) to discuss the next 
steps on the rejection of the settlement proposal from the 
UCC by the 1L lenders 

0.40 

03/30/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.60 
03/30/20 JW Updates to UCC presentation following A&M meeting 0.60 
03/30/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
03/31/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/31/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/31/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. 
Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 

0.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) 

03/31/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

03/31/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

03/31/20 JW Finalize UCC presentation 0.40 
03/31/20 JD Review WIN emails and materials for UCC call 0.50 
03/31/20 KM Review and revise weekly update presentation to the 

Committee 
1.10 

03/31/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/01/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

04/01/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

04/01/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

04/01/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.40 

04/01/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee call 0.60 
04/01/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

04/01/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

04/01/20 DM Participate in conference call re: claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/02/20 KM Participate in conference call re: claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/02/20 DM Participate in conference call re: claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 

0.40 
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Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

04/02/20 AP Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/02/20 JW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/02/20 JD Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/02/20 SW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/02/20 KN Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/06/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC presentation 1.50 
04/06/20 DM Review email from R. Ferraioli i (MoFo) re WIN update 0.10 
04/06/20 DM Review email from L. Marinuzzi (MoFo) re WIN update 0.20 
04/06/20 AP Development of MOR slides for weekly Committee update 

presentation 
0.90 

04/07/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
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Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/07/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/07/20 JW Finalize UCC weekly report 0.70 
04/07/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/07/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.90 
04/07/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/07/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Wooding, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/07/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/07/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella, J. Wooding (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/07/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/08/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.90 

04/08/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn, D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.10 

04/08/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.90 

04/08/20 KN Review the UCC meeting materials 0.10 
04/08/20 JD Prepare for meeting with UCC members and review 

materials 
0.40 

04/08/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.90 

04/08/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.90 

04/08/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 

0.60 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update (partial attendance) 

04/08/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee presentation 0.90 
04/08/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.90 

04/08/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.90 

04/10/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners), 
L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) 

0.60 

04/10/20 KN Participate in portion of conference call with professionals 
re: weekly professionals call with J. Wooding 
(AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.20 

04/14/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.20 

04/14/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey,  K. 
McGlynn J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg)  re: weekly professionals call 

0.20 

04/14/20 KM Review and revise weekly updated presentation to the 
Committee 

0.60 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/14/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, J. 

Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg)  re: weekly professionals call 

0.20 

04/14/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
04/14/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, J. 

Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg)  re: weekly professionals call 

0.20 

04/14/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey,K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg)  re: weekly professionals call 

0.20 

04/14/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.20 
04/15/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/15/20 JD Review agenda and materials for weekly UCC update 1.00 
04/15/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/15/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.50 

04/15/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 

0.50 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

04/15/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee call 0.40 
04/15/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/15/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/21/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/21/20 JW Draft weekly report for UCC 1.80 
04/21/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/21/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/21/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.70 
04/21/20 KM Communication with L. Marinuzzi (MoFo) and J. Wooding 

(AlixPartners) re: Committee weekly update presentation 
0.30 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/21/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/21/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
04/21/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/21/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/21/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

04/22/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/22/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/22/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 

0.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

04/22/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/22/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/22/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee update presentation 0.60 
04/22/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/22/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

04/23/20 JD Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/23/20 KM Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

04/23/20 KN Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/23/20 JW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/23/20 SW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/23/20 AP Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/23/20 DM Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/27/20 JW Commence draft of weekly UCC report 0.70 
04/28/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, S. 

Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals call 

0.40 

04/28/20 JW Complete weekly report for Committee 1.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/28/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

04/28/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

04/28/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 1.20 
04/28/20 KM Communication with Debtors and Committee Counsel re: 

PBGC obligation payment 
0.90 

04/28/20 JD Review UCC meeting materials and emails from MoFo 0.80 
04/28/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.30 
04/28/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, J. 

Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

04/28/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

04/28/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
call 

0.40 

04/29/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 

0.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

04/29/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

04/29/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

04/29/20 JD Prepare for UCC meeting and review materials 0.30 
04/29/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

04/29/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee update presentation 0.70 
04/29/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

04/29/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

04/29/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 

0.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

04/30/20 JW Preparing liquidity forecast analysis for PWP 0.80 
04/30/20 DM Participate in conference call re: claims investigation and 

litigation meeting with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Dutton, 
A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/30/20 KM Participate in conference call re: claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/30/20 JD Review emails from MoFo and UCC draft objection to Uniti 
settlement 

1.60 

04/30/20 AP Participate in conference call re: claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.40 

04/30/20 JD Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.40 

05/01/20 JD Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, 
K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: internal team workstream review 

0.40 

05/04/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.70 
05/04/20 JW Draft weekly report to UCC 1.10 
05/05/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals' 
coordination 

05/05/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, 
A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly professionals' coordination 

0.40 

05/05/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals' 
coordination 

0.40 

05/05/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals' 
coordination 

0.40 

05/05/20 KM Calls with E. Richards (MoFo) re: cash burn through 
August 2020 

0.30 

05/05/20 JD Emails with MoFo, AlixPartners, and Perella Weinberg re: 
amended objection declaration 

0.60 

05/05/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
05/05/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 

McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals' 
coordination 

0.40 

05/05/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals' 
coordination 

0.40 

05/05/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, 

0.40 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly professionals' coordination 

05/06/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.40 

05/06/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

05/06/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee presentation 0.50 
05/06/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, and S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

05/06/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

05/06/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

05/06/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 

0.40 
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New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

05/08/20 JD Participate in meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, and S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.10 

05/08/20 KM Call with H. Denman, C. Koster (both White & Case) to 
discuss outstanding questions 

0.20 

05/08/20 KM Follow-up communication with L. Marinuzzi (MoFo) and J. 
Wooding (AlixPartners) re: call with White & Case 

0.20 

05/11/20 JW Prepare weekly report for UCC 1.40 
05/12/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, and J. 
Dutton (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

05/12/20 JD Review materials and prepare for meeting with UCC 0.50 
05/12/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

05/12/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, an F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

05/12/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

05/12/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.70 
05/12/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
0.70 
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Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

05/12/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.30 
05/12/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

05/12/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

05/13/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

05/13/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee update presentation 0.40 
05/13/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

05/13/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

05/13/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 

0.40 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

05/13/20 JW Call with E. Richards (MoFo) regarding scenario analysis 
requests for waterfall analysis. 

0.20 

05/13/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.40 

05/14/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, 
McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/14/20 DM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey and J. 
Wooding (both AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/14/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey and J. 
Wooding (both AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/15/20 JD Emails with MoFo and AlixPartners re: unencumbered 
asset analysis 

0.50 

05/18/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.20 
05/18/20 AP Develop Q1 KEIP results slide for weekly committee 

updated presentation 
0.70 

05/19/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals with D. 
MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly updates 

0.40 
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05/19/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.30 
05/19/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, J. 

Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.40 

05/19/20 JW Prepare presentation on recovery analysis for bonds and 
guarantor GUCs and amendments to waterfall model for 
scenario analysis 

3.10 

05/19/20 JW Finalize UCC report 0.60 
05/19/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

McGlynn, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.40 

05/19/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.40 

05/19/20 KM Review weekly update presentation to the Committee 0.40 
05/19/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.40 

05/19/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

05/20/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

19-22312-rdd    Doc 2391    Filed 08/10/20    Entered 08/10/20 18:05:54    Main Document 
Pg 63 of 136



 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
05/20/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

05/20/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

05/20/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

05/20/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 

05/20/20 KN Prepare for the UCC meetings and review materials 
distributed 

1.40 

05/20/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.30 

05/20/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.30 
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05/21/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/21/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/21/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey,J. 
Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/21/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/21/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/21/20 DM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/25/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.40 
05/26/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 

McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, 
0.80 
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A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly updates 

05/26/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.80 

05/26/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.80 

05/26/20 KM Call with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: Committee update 
presentations 

0.30 

05/26/20 KM Review recovery analysis presentation for the Committee 1.10 
05/26/20 KM Review and revise weekly liquidity update presentation to 

the Committee 
0.90 

05/26/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.80 

05/26/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.80 

05/26/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.80 

05/26/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, 
A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 

0.80 
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Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

05/26/20 JD Emails with MoFo and AlixPartners re: allocation analysis 0.40 
05/26/20 JD Review UCC materials and prepare for meeting 0.50 
05/27/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.80 

05/27/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly updates 

0.80 

05/27/20 KN Prepare for the weekly UCC meeting reading materials to 
be presented and notes to the waterfall scenarios 
presentation 

1.10 

05/27/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.80 

05/27/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee call 0.80 
05/27/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.80 

05/27/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.80 
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05/27/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.80 

05/27/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.80 

05/28/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, 
and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/28/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/28/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/28/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, 
and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and litigation meeting 

0.40 

05/28/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, 
and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and litigation meeting 

05/28/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, 
and M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
investigation and litigation meeting 

0.40 

06/01/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 2.30 
06/01/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.90 
06/02/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

06/02/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
proposal discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/02/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

06/02/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
proposal discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/02/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, 
A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 

0.70 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
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Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

06/02/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

06/02/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
proposal discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/02/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
proposal discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/02/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

06/02/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

06/02/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
proposal discussion with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/02/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/02/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

proposal discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/02/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.70 

06/02/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
proposal discussion with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/03/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.60 

06/03/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.60 

06/03/20 KM Prepare for weekly UCC presentation 0.40 
06/03/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.60 

06/03/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 

0.60 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

06/03/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.60 

06/03/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

0.60 

06/03/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.60 

06/04/20 AP Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner 
(All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
inestigation and litigation meeting 

0.50 

06/04/20 JD Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, A. Perrella 
(All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
inestigation and litigation meeting 

0.50 

06/04/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 

0.50 
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909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims inestigation and 
litigation meeting 

06/04/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
inestigation and litigation meeting 

0.50 

06/04/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims inestigation and 
litigation meeting 

0.50 

06/04/20 SW Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, A. Perrella 
(All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims 
inestigation and litigation meeting 

0.50 

06/04/20 KM Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation and 
litigation meeting 

0.50 

06/05/20 JW Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom 
(AlixPartners), S. Rappoport, J. Greer (All MoFo) re: 
liquidation analysis and intercompany claims 

0.50 

06/05/20 KN Participate in a call with S. Rappoport, J. Greer (MoFo) 
and J. Wooding (AlixPartners) regarding preparation for 
the depositions related to the liquidation analysis and the 
inter company analysis 

0.50 

06/08/20 DM Call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, T. Goren, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards (all MoFo), F. Munshi, and B. Mendelsohn (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: GUC claims and attributable value 

0.40 

06/08/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.90 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/08/20 KM Call with K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners), L. 

Marinuzzi, T. Goren, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards (all MoFo), F. Munshi, and B. Mendelsohn (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: GUC claims and attributable value 

0.40 

06/08/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.80 
06/09/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
coordination update call 

0.40 

06/09/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
coordination update call 

0.40 

06/09/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
coordination update call 

0.40 

06/09/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
coordination update call 

0.40 

06/09/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 

0.40 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
coordination update call 

06/09/20 JW Participate in a call with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) and F. 
Munshi (Perella Weinberg) regarding the valuation 
metrics used in the liquidation analysis 

0.30 

06/09/20 JW Finalize UCC weekly report 0.70 
06/09/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
coordination update call 

0.40 

06/09/20 JD Review WIN agenda and meeting materials for UCC 
meeting 

0.50 

06/09/20 DM Review draft WIN UCC update deck 0.40 
06/09/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) re: weekly professionals 
coordination update call 

0.40 

06/09/20 DM Emails with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) and L. Marinuzzi 
(MoFo) re: WIN claim issue 

0.30 

06/10/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.20 

06/10/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.20 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/10/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.20 

06/10/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.20 

06/10/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.20 

06/10/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.20 

06/10/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee update presentation 0.50 
06/10/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.20 

06/12/20 KM Review case updates from Committee Counsel 0.60 
06/12/20 KM Participate in conference call re: claims investigation and 

litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (All AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all 
Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/12/20 KM Participate in conference call re: confirmation objection 

with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, 
K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. 
Munshi, B. Mendelsohn (both Perella Weinberg) 

1.10 

06/12/20 KN Participate in conference call re: confirmation objection 
with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, 
K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. 
Munshi, B. Mendelsohn (both Perella Weinberg) 

1.10 

06/12/20 KN Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 

06/12/20 JD Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 

06/12/20 JW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 

06/12/20 SW Participate in portion of conference call re: Claims 
investigation and litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, A. 
Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.40 

06/12/20 DM Participate in portion of conference call re: Claims 
investigation and litigation meeting with K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
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4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
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Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/14/20 JW Participate in conference call re: confirmation objection 

with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, 
S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, 
B. Mendelsohn (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.80 

06/14/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals with K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding (bothAlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 
regarding rebuttals to the expert reports on the 
liquidation analysis and support of the Plan from the 
Debtors 

0.80 

06/14/20 KM Participate in conference call re: confirmation objection 
with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding (both AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, B. Mendelsohn (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.80 

06/15/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
confirmation objection with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/15/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
confirmation objection with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, S. 
Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/15/20 JW Prepare supporting documents for K. Nystrom 
(AlixPartners) rebuttal report 

2.80 

06/15/20 JW Prepare weekly UCC report 1.80 
06/15/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

confirmation objection with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.50 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/15/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

confirmation objection with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/15/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
confirmation objection with K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/16/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
confirmation objection with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
K. McGlynn (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/16/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals with K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) regarding rebuttals to the expert reports on 
the liquidation analysis and support of the Plan from the 
Debtors 

0.50 

06/16/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
confirmation objection with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/16/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.60 
06/16/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

confirmation objection with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/17/20 KM Prepare for weekly Committee update presentation 0.40 
06/17/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 

0.50 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

06/17/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

06/17/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

06/17/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

06/17/20 KN Review the materials presented in the weekly UCC 
meeting and prepare for my presentation of the expert 
report 

0.60 

06/17/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

06/17/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update 

0.50 

06/17/20 JW Participate in portion of conference call with Committee 
Members, D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. 

0.40 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) re: weekly update 

06/18/20 JW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/18/20 SW Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/18/20 DM Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/18/20 KN Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/18/20 JD Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/18/20 AP Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/18/20 KM Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 

litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. 
Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. 
Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/19/20 DM Emails with L. Marinuzzi and T. Goren (both MoFo) re: 
WIN settlement 

0.30 

06/19/20 DM Emails with L. Marinuzzi, T. Goren and F. Munshi (both 
MoFo) re: WIN settlement 

0.50 

06/22/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediation settlement proposal with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/22/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. 
Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.50 

06/22/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediation settlement proposal with K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/22/20 DM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.50 

06/22/20 DM Email L. Marinuzzi re: WIN settlement 0.20 
06/22/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

mediation settlement proposal with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 

0.50 
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E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

06/22/20 AP Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. 
Dutton, S. Weiner (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.50 

06/22/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. 
Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.50 

06/22/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediation settlement proposal with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/22/20 JW Draft weekly report to UCC 2.20 
06/22/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

mediation settlement proposal with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/22/20 JW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Dutton, S. Weiner, A. 
Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.50 

06/22/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediation settlement proposal with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 
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06/22/20 SW Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. 
Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.50 

06/23/20 SW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediation counterproposal call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 JW Amend and finalize weekly report to UCC 0.40 
06/23/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

mediation counterproposal call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 AP Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. Weiner (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 JD Review AlixPartners  weekly UCC presentation, Perella 
Weinberg  cap table and email from MoFo 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/23/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediation counterproposal call with K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals re: an 
update on settlement negotiations with D. MacGreevey, 
K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. 
Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with D. MacGreevey, J. 
Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/23/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, A. 
Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation counterproposal 

0.30 

06/23/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 0.60 
06/24/20 KM Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 

D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding (All 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: mediation settlement 
proposal 

0.20 

06/24/20 KM Call with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding (both AlixPartners), F. 
Munshi, B. Mendelsohn (both Perella Weinberg), L. 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Marinuzzi, T. Goren, R. Ferraioli, and K. Richardson (all 
MoFo) re: prep for second day of Confirmation hearing 

06/24/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediators revised proposal review with K. McGlynn, K. 
Nystrom, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.20 

06/24/20 KN Call with K. McGlynn, J. Wooding (both AlixPartners), F. 
Munshi, B. Mendelsohn (both Perella Weinberg), L. 
Marinuzzi, T. Goren, R. Ferraioli, and K. Richardson (all 
MoFo) re: prep for second day of Confirmation hearing 

0.40 

06/24/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.20 

06/24/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
mediators revised proposal review with D. MacGreevey, 
K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) 

0.20 

06/24/20 JW Call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn (both AlixPartners), F. 
Munshi, B. Mendelsohn (both Perella Weinberg), L. 
Marinuzzi, T. Goren, R. Ferraioli, and K. Richardson (all 
MoFo) re: prep for second day of Confirmation hearing 

0.40 

06/24/20 JW Prepare uniti transaction debt exchange and pay down 
information for MoFo 

0.80 

06/25/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals & 
Committee members, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton  (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
settlement proposal post hearing 

0.40 

06/25/20 DM Participate in conference call with professionals & 
Committee members K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton 
(all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, 
E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. 

0.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-2 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: settlement proposal 
post hearing 

06/25/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals & 
Committee members, D. MacGreevey, J. Dutton, J. 
Wooding  (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
settlement proposal post hearing 

0.40 

06/25/20 JD Participate in conference call with professionals & 
Committee members, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding  (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. 
Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. 
Mendelsohn, F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg)  re: 
settlement proposal post hearing 

0.40 

06/25/20 JD Emails with MoFo, Perella Weinberg  and AlixPartners re: 
revised settlement proposals 

0.60 

06/30/20 JD Review WIN UCC meeting agenda, Perella Weinberg cap 
table, and AlixPartners update to prep for Committee call 

0.50 

06/30/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 
weekly professionals call with K. Nystrom, J. Wooding (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

06/30/20 KM Review and revise weekly Committee update presentation 1.10 
06/30/20 KN Participate in conference call with professionals with K. 

McGlynn, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) regarding an update of 
post confirmation hearing settlement potential 

0.30 

06/30/20 JW Prepare weekly report for UCC 1.90 
06/30/20 JW Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

weekly professionals call with K. McGlynn, K. Nystrom (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.30 

  Total Hours 301.90 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 

Invoice # ******-2 

Re: Meetings and Communications with UCC Professionals 
Client/Matter # 012615.00102  

 909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500 
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344 

alixpartners.com 

Fee Recap: 

Consultant Hours Rate Amount 

Anthony Perrella 30.70 470.00 14,429.00 
Scott Weiner 23.40 645.00 15,093.00 
Jon Dutton 36.30 690.00 25,047.00 
Jeffrey Wooding 84.70 690.00 58,443.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 55.10 1,025.00 56,477.50 
David MacGreevey 35.80 1,090.00 39,022.00 
Kevin Nystrom 35.90 1,150.00 41,285.00 
Total Hours & Fees 301.90 249,796.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-3 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with Management and Debtors 
Client/Matter # 012615.00103  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/03/20 JW Conference call with D. Hales (A&M) re: intercompany 

balances 
0.20 

03/16/20 JD Participate in conference call with Debtor professionals re: 
weekly update and variance reporting with K. McGlynn, J. 
Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), D. Hales, N. 
Grossi, J. Schmaltz, and D. Donoghue (all A&M) 

0.20 

03/16/20 AP Participate in conference call with Debtor professionals re: 
weekly update and variance reporting with K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton, J. Wooding (all AlixPartners), D. Hales, N. Grossi, 
J. Schmaltz, and D. Donoghue (all A&M) 

0.20 

03/16/20 KM Participate in conference call with Debtor professionals re: 
weekly update and variance reporting with J. Dutton, J. 
Wooding, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), D. Hales, N. 
Grossi, J. Schmaltz, and D. Donoghue (all A&M) 

0.20 

03/16/20 JW Participate in conference call with Debtor professionals re: 
weekly update and variance reporting with K. McGlynn, J. 
Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), D. Hales, N. Grossi, 
J. Schmaltz, and D. Donoghue (all A&M) 

0.20 

03/25/20 JW Participate in conference call with D. Hales, N. Grossi, and 
D. Donoghue (all A&M) re: Century Link court filing 

0.30 

03/30/20 JW Participate in meeting with D. Hales, A. Gasbara, D. 
Donoghue (all A&M) re: weekly update meeting 

0.30 

04/13/20 KN Participate in a call with representatives from A&M 
regarding the weekly cash flow and the Debtors 
assessment of COVID 19 on the business 

0.30 

05/07/20 KM Listen to hearing re: Uniti settlement and backstop 
agreement 

1.00 

05/07/20 SW Dial in to Uniti Settlement and Backstop Motion hearing 2.30 
05/08/20 KM Listen to hearing re: Uniti settlement and backstop 

agreement 
2.50 

05/08/20 SW Dial in to hearing on backstop motion 2.00 
05/22/20 KN Participate in the Debtor presentation call to unsecured 

creditors 
1.50 

06/29/20 JW Review weekly cash forecasting and email queries to A&M 0.40 
  Total Hours 11.60 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-3 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with Management and Debtors 
Client/Matter # 012615.00103  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Anthony Perrella 0.20 470.00  94.00 
Scott Weiner 4.30 645.00  2,773.50 
Jon Dutton 0.20 690.00  138.00 
Jeffrey Wooding 1.40 690.00  966.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 3.70 1,025.00  3,792.50 
Kevin Nystrom 1.80 1,150.00  2,070.00 
Total Hours & Fees 11.60   9,834.00 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-4 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with Lenders, Plan Sponsors 
Client/Matter # 012615.00104  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/30/20 KM Review settlement offer from 1Ls 0.90 
  Total Hours 0.90 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-4 
 
Re: Meetings and Communications with Lenders, Plan Sponsors 
Client/Matter # 012615.00104  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Kathryn McGlynn 0.90 1,025.00  922.50 
Total Hours & Fees 0.90   922.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-5 
 
Re: Analysis of DIP Financing and Cash Collateral 
Client/Matter # 012615.00105  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/03/20 KN Review the weekly report to the UCC including the update 

to the weekly cash projection and the January MOR 
0.40 

06/12/20 DM Review WIN motion to amend final DIP 0.40 
06/12/20 DM Emails with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: WIN motion to 

amend final DIP 
0.30 

  Total Hours 1.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-5 
 
Re: Analysis of DIP Financing and Cash Collateral 
Client/Matter # 012615.00105  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
David MacGreevey 0.70 1,090.00  763.00 
Kevin Nystrom 0.40 1,150.00  460.00 
Total Hours & Fees 1.10   1,223.00 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-6 
 
Re: Analysis of Liquidity and Cash Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00106  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/03/20 JD Review weekly update deck and MoFo agenda 0.50 
03/04/20 AP Adjust recoveries to unsecured claims presentation for 

circulation to the committee advisors 
2.90 

03/05/20 DM Discussion with S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: WIN liquidity 0.30 
03/05/20 SW Discussion with D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: WIN 

liquidity 
0.30 

03/06/20 AP Review cash flow variance report circulated by the 
Debtors' advisors 

0.60 

03/09/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors' weekly cash flow variance 
report and case updates 

1.10 

03/12/20 KN Review the Windstream liquidity needs through expected 
emergence 

1.20 

03/16/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors' weekly cash flow liquidity 
and other case updates 

1.10 

03/20/20 AP Review weekly cash variance reports circulated by the 
Debtors 

1.30 

03/23/20 KN Review the reporting documents, including 1st day 
reporting, including 1st day reporting, de minimus 
transactions and cash reporting, from the Debtors 

0.30 

03/23/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors' weekly cash flow variance 
report and updates on first day motion relief 

0.90 

03/31/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors’ weekly cash flow variance 
report 

0.90 

03/31/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors’ revised 13 week cash flow 
forecast 

1.10 

03/31/20 KN Review and comment on the weekly liquidity report 
prepared for the UCC meeting 

0.60 

04/01/20 KN Prepare for the presentation to the UCC on liquidity, the 
updated budget and the CenturyLink administrative claim 

0.50 

04/01/20 KN Review the impacts on liquidity of an extension of the 
bankruptcy proceedings 

1.40 

04/06/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.90 
04/06/20 KN Participate in the weekly liquidity call with representatives 

from A&M and J. Wooding (AlixPartners) 
0.30 

04/06/20 KN Prepare a list of questions on the impacts of COVID 19 on 
operations and cash flows of the business 

0.70 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-6 
 
Re: Analysis of Liquidity and Cash Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00106  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/06/20 JW Participate in the weekly liquidity call with representatives 

from A&M and K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) 
0.30 

04/07/20 KN Review and comment on the weekly liquidity presentation 
to the UCC 

0.40 

04/08/20 KM Review and analyze liquidity sensitives through August 
2020 

0.40 

04/13/20 KN Review of the summary of the impact of COVID 19 on the 
business prepared by the Debtor 

0.90 

04/14/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.70 
04/14/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' presentation related to 

COVID impacts on the business 
1.10 

04/15/20 KN Prepare for the presentation on liquidity activity and 
impacts of COVID 19 on the business for the UCC meeting 

1.20 

04/20/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.80 
04/27/20 JW Review weekly variance reporting and new 13 week 

budget 
0.60 

04/28/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.90 
04/28/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' updated 13 week cash flow 

forecast 
1.10 

05/04/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly cash flow variance 
report 

0.70 

05/05/20 KM Calls with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: cash burn through 
August 2020 

0.30 

05/05/20 KM Review liquidity projections and sensitivities through 
August 2020 

0.90 

05/05/20 JW Calls with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: cash burn 
through August 2020 

0.30 

05/08/20 DM Review WIN first day reporting week ended May 1st 0.60 
05/11/20 KM Communication with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: 

Debtors' weekly liquidity update and prep for weekly call 
with A&M re: updates 

0.60 

05/12/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.90 
05/18/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ended May 8th 0.40 
05/19/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.90 
05/19/20 KN Review weekly presentation on liquidity and the quarterly 

financial results 
1.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-6 
 
Re: Analysis of Liquidity and Cash Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00106  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
05/26/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ending May 15th 0.40 
06/01/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.80 
06/01/20 DM Review WIN weekly repeating package week ended May 

22nd 
0.60 

06/05/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ended May 29th 0.60 
06/08/20 KM Analyze and review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.90 
06/15/20 JW Review weekly cash variance reporting and draft queries 

for A&M 
0.40 

06/16/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 1.10 
06/22/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ended June 12th 0.60 
06/23/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly liquidity updates 0.90 
06/29/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ended June 19th 0.50 
06/30/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' weekly liquidity updates and 

revised 13-week cash flow forecast 
1.20 

  Total Hours 40.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-6 
 
Re: Analysis of Liquidity and Cash Management 
Client/Matter # 012615.00106  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Anthony Perrella 4.80 470.00  2,256.00 
Scott Weiner 0.30 645.00  193.50 
Jon Dutton 0.50 690.00  345.00 
Jeffrey Wooding 1.60 690.00  1,104.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 20.20 1,025.00  20,705.00 
David MacGreevey 4.00 1,090.00  4,360.00 
Kevin Nystrom 8.90 1,150.00  10,235.00 
Total Hours & Fees 40.30   39,198.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-7 
 
Re: Business and Strategic Plan Analysis and Assessment 
Client/Matter # 012615.00108  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/02/20 AP Review executed Plan Support Agreement 2.10 
03/03/20 JW Meeting with J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 

AlixPartners) re: plan recovery model review 
2.50 

03/03/20 SW Meeting with J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: plan recovery model review 

2.50 

03/03/20 JD Meeting with J. Wooding, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: plan recovery model review 

2.50 

03/03/20 AP Meeting with J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all 
AlixPartners) re: plan recovery model review 

2.50 

03/09/20 AP Review updated plan support agreement circulated by the 
Debtors 

2.10 

03/20/20 AP Review updated term sheet 2.50 
04/20/20 SW Review January 2020 financial summary presentation 0.70 
04/20/20 SW Review February 2020 financial summary presentation 0.90 
04/22/20 SW Begin to create excel exhibit detailing January and 

February 2020 consolidated cash flow actuals vs plan 
1.30 

04/23/20 SW Complete creating excel exhibit comparing January and 
February 2020 consolidated cash flow actuals vs plan 

1.10 

04/23/20 SW Create excel exhibit comparing January and February 
2020 segment level contribution margin and KPI actuals 
vs plan 

2.40 

04/23/20 SW Begin to create excel exhibit comparing January and 
February 2020 detailed Enterprise segment cash flow and 
KPI actuals vs plan 

0.80 

04/24/20 SW Complete creating excel exhibit comparing January and 
February 2020 Enterprise segment cash flow and KPI 
actuals vs plan 

1.10 

05/18/20 SW Review March 2020 financial presentation 0.80 
05/18/20 SW Add March 2020 financial data in excel exhibits for 1Q20 

financial summary presentation 
2.20 

05/18/20 SW Create cumulative 1Q20 excel exhibits financial summary 
presentation 

1.90 

05/18/20 SW Draft summary overview for financial performance update 1.80 
05/18/20 SW Draft Wholesale and Kinetic segment analysis for financial 

performance update 
1.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-7 
 
Re: Business and Strategic Plan Analysis and Assessment 
Client/Matter # 012615.00108  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
05/19/20 SW Draft Enterprise segment analysis for financial 

performance update 
1.20 

05/19/20 SW Finalize 1Q20 financial update section of UCC 
presentation 

1.10 

05/19/20 SW Process AlixPartners and MoFo edits for UCC presentation 1.90 
  Total Hours 37.00 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-7 
 
Re: Business and Strategic Plan Analysis and Assessment 
Client/Matter # 012615.00108  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 

Anthony Perrella 9.20 470.00  4,324.00 
Scott Weiner 22.80 645.00  14,706.00 
Jon Dutton 2.50 690.00  1,725.00 
Jeffrey Wooding 2.50 690.00  1,725.00 
Total Hours & Fees 37.00   22,480.00 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-8 
 
Re: Valuation Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00109  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/06/20 DM Review WIN indicative value presentation 1.10 
  Total Hours 1.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-8 
 
Re: Valuation Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00109  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
David MacGreevey 1.10 1,090.00  1,199.00 
Total Hours & Fees 1.10   1,199.00 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-9 
 
Re: Financial and Other Diligence 
Client/Matter # 012615.00111  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/02/20 JD Analyze latest legal entity asset allocation model 1.00 
03/02/20 DM Review WIN weekly first days reporting package 0.70 
03/03/20 DM Telephone call with  A&M re: WIN intercos 0.30 
03/04/20 JD Review WIN indicative valuation presentation from PWP 1.40 
03/04/20 JD Analyze revised waterfall recovery model 0.40 
03/04/20 KN Review the summary of the Uniti settlement terms 1.30 
03/05/20 KN Preparation of a presentation for the UCC on the waterfall 

scenarios 
3.00 

03/05/20 JD Review verizon negotiation summary deck 0.60 
03/06/20 DM Review WIN weekly first day reporting package 0.60 
03/06/20 KN Estimate values of the projected settlement request for 

unsecured creditors 
0.90 

03/11/20 JD Review AlixPartners' presentation on alternative recovery 
scenarios 

0.90 

03/13/20 DM Review WIN weekly first days update package 0.60 
03/16/20 KN Review the settlement proposal from select bondholders 

and 2L note holders 
0.60 

03/16/20 KN Review the settlement proposal from White & Case 0.60 
03/16/20 KM Analyze and review backstop agreement 1.10 
03/17/20 KM Review case updates from Committee Counsel 0.20 
03/17/20 KN Review settlement options 0.70 
03/23/20 DM Review WIN weekly reporting documents 0.70 
03/23/20 KM Review Perella Weinberg's updates on indicative value 

related to the Uniti settlement 
0.90 

03/26/20 KN Review the Century Link settlement motion 0.70 
03/30/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ended March 20th 0.60 
04/06/20 KM Review and analyze Debtors' February monthly operating 

report 
1.10 

04/06/20 KM Review diligence questions related to COVID impacts 0.30 
04/06/20 DM Review WIN first day’s reporting week ended March 27th 0.60 
04/10/20 DM Review WIN weekly reporting week ended April 3rd 0.60 
04/17/20 DM Review WIN first days repeating week ended April 13th 0.60 
04/21/20 JD Review materials for UCC call from AlixPartners and 

Perella Weinberg 
0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-9 
 
Re: Financial and Other Diligence 
Client/Matter # 012615.00111  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/27/20 JD Emails with AlixPartners and A&M re; 13 week cash flow 

bridge 
0.30 

04/27/20 DM Review WON first days reporting week ended April 17th 0.60 
05/01/20 JD Emails with MoFo and review of filed versions of Uniti 

objection and backstop motion 
0.80 

05/05/20 JD Analyze materials in preparation for UCC meeting 0.50 
05/12/20 JD Analyze Perella Weinberg discussion materials re: WIN Q1 

performance 
1.20 

05/18/20 JW Build out additional waterfall analysis scenarios and revise 
exit costs and admin claims allocation 

3.60 

05/19/20 JD Review legal entity allocation and waterfall model 
scenarios by AlixPartners' team 

0.60 

05/21/20 JD Review MoFo unencumbered value presentation 1.80 
05/22/20 JD Analyze Debtors presentation on unencumbered value 1.80 
05/22/20 JW Update waterfall analysis and various scenarios re: value 

allocation of proposed Plan 
2.40 

05/25/20 JW Update waterfall recovery analysis and associated 
presentation materials 

2.70 

05/26/20 JD Review AlixPartners' asset value allocation presentation 0.80 
06/01/20 JW Prepare additional work papers and presentation 

materials for UCC re: scenario recoveries for Bonds / 
Obligor GUCs 

2.60 

06/02/20 JD Review WIN unencumbered asset analysis 0.80 
06/05/20 JD Review Perella Weinberg  deck and emails re: illustrative 

settlement proposal 
1.20 

06/05/20 JW Review fixed asset liquidation analysis data from Debtors 0.40 
06/09/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ended May 29th 0.60 
06/12/20 DM Review WIN first days reporting week ended 6.05 0.40 
06/12/20 JD Review settlement proposal plan term sheet 0.50 
06/14/20 JW Prepare cash flow forecast through October for adequate 

protection waivers 
1.60 

06/14/20 JW Prepare waterfall updates for confirmation objection and 
rebuttal scenarios per MoFo and Perella Weinberg  advice 

2.20 

06/15/20 JD Analyze Perella Weinberg  collateral analysis presentation 
draft 

0.60 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-9 
 
Re: Financial and Other Diligence 
Client/Matter # 012615.00111  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/15/20 JD Analyze AlixPartners  unencumbered value analysis 

presentation draft 
0.40 

06/15/20 JD Review UCC settlement counter proposal and emails with 
MoFo /AlixPartners 

0.80 

06/16/20 JD Review Uniti settlement unencumbered asset analysis 0.50 
  Total Hours 51.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-9 
 
Re: Financial and Other Diligence 
Client/Matter # 012615.00111  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Jon Dutton 17.30 690.00  11,937.00 
Jeffrey Wooding 15.50 690.00  10,695.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 3.60 1,025.00  3,690.00 
David MacGreevey 6.90 1,090.00  7,521.00 
Kevin Nystrom 7.80 1,150.00  8,970.00 
Total Hours & Fees 51.10   42,813.00 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/02/20 KN Review waterfall assumption scenarios on issues 

regarding default interest, Uniti stock purchase options, 
unencumbered real estate, etc. 

0.60 

03/02/20 KN Develop alternative waterfall scenarios in consideration of 
the new Uniti settlement terms 

0.70 

03/02/20 AP Adjust claims database for status of debtor entities as 
guarantors 

1.40 

03/02/20 AP Review legal entity allocation model after changes from J. 
Wooding (AlixPartners) 

1.10 

03/02/20 JD Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
K. Nystrom, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
weekly update and plan discussion 

1.00 

03/02/20 KM Analyze and review Uniti settlement 1.30 
03/02/20 JW Prepare schedule of claims filed at non-obligor entities 0.80 
03/03/20 AP Meeting with J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and S. Weiner (all 

AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall analysis by entity 
2.00 

03/03/20 JW Dial into status conference hearing 0.80 
03/03/20 JW Meeting with J. Dutton, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 

AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall analysis by entity 
2.00 

03/03/20 JD Meeting with J. Wooding, S. Weiner, and A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall analysis by entity 

2.00 

03/03/20 JD Dial in to status update hearing 1.10 
03/03/20 KM Dial into status conference hearing 1.10 
03/03/20 DM Attend WIN telephonic court conference re: status 

hearing 
1.10 

03/03/20 AP Development of waterfall scenario matrix for recoveries to 
unsecured creditors 

1.20 

03/03/20 KN Listen to the telephonic court conference regarding the 
cancellation of the re: characterization hearing and 
scheduling of the hearing on the 9019 settlement motion 
for the Uniti settlement 

0.90 

03/03/20 KN Review the comparison of the scenarios of the value 
waterfall calculations 

0.80 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/03/20 KN Participate in conference call regarding the value waterfall 

scenarios with F. Munshi and S. Eghlimi (both Perella 
Weinberg) 

0.70 

03/03/20 KN Review the presentation of projected recoveries by class 
under multiple enterprise value assumptions 

0.30 

03/03/20 SW Dial into status conference hearing 0.80 
03/03/20 SW Meeting with J. Wooding, J. Dutton, and A. Perrella (all 

AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall analysis by entity 
2.00 

03/04/20 AP Development of waterfall summary slide for recovery 
presentation 

1.80 

03/05/20 AP Adjustments to recoveries for unsecured claims 
presentation 

2.20 

03/05/20 AP Adjustments to waterfall summary slides per comments 
from K. Nystrom 

2.10 

03/05/20 AP Review Verizon Negotiation Summary 1.70 
03/05/20 JW Review Verizon settlement updates 0.70 
03/06/20 KN Review and edit of the presentation of unsecured creditor 

recoveries for presentation to the UCC 
3.70 

03/06/20 AP Adjustments to waterfall summary slides per comments 
from K. Nystrom 

2.60 

03/06/20 AP Adjustments to recoveries for unsecured claims 
presentation 

2.20 

03/06/20 AP Review settlement motion between the Debtors and Uniti 1.70 
03/08/20 KM Review and revise presentation on potential recoveries 

based on Uniti Settlement and Plan of Reorganization 
2.10 

03/09/20 KN Review comments to the claims waterfall analysis 
presentation 

0.60 

03/09/20 KN Review an offer to purchase an unsecured claim at the 
request of a unsecured creditor 

0.20 

03/09/20 KN Update the value of the Uniti stock purchase option to 
current prices, combine the recoveries of the 2L and 
bonds and reduce the cash portion of the proposed 
settlement to unsecured creditors 

1.40 

03/09/20 KN Estimation of exit costs attributable to the 1l collateral 0.30 
03/09/20 KN Review the potential challenges to waterfall analysis from 

other creditor groups 
0.70 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/09/20 AP Updates to waterfall recovery presentation 2.10 
03/09/20 AP Adjustments to allocation table for waterfall recovery 

model 
1.10 

03/09/20 AP Review deposition documents circulated by the Debtors 1.20 
03/09/20 KM Review revised potential GUC recovery analysis 1.10 
03/10/20 KN Participate in a call with B. Bakemeyer, H. Denman, J. 

Winters, C. Koster (White & Case), T. Goren (MoFo) and 
J. Wooding (AlixPartners) regarding the waterfall 
scenarios that UCC counsel and bondholder counsel want 
prepared 

0.40 

03/10/20 KN Review and edit the presentation on creditor recovery 
scenarios 

1.80 

03/10/20 KN Prepare a summary of the value allocation methodology 
scenarios and key assumptions for insertion in the 
recovery scenarios presentation 

0.80 

03/10/20 JW Participate in a call with B. Bakemeyer, H. Denman, J. 
Winters, C. Koster (White & Case), T. Goren (MoFo) and 
K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) regarding the waterfall 
scenarios that UCC counsel and bondholder counsel want 
prepared 

0.40 

03/10/20 KM Review information related to Zoom Video's claim 0.60 
03/11/20 KN Identification of positions in our waterfall analysis that 

could be challenged 
2.70 

03/15/20 KM Review updates from Committee Counsel and 1L Counsel 
regarding Uniti settlement 

1.40 

03/16/20 KN Gather information on the range of trade claims in the 
guarantor subs and the non guarantor subs 

0.60 

03/16/20 AP Adjustments to claims database analysis 1.10 
03/16/20 KM Analyze and review White & Case Uniti Settlement 

proposal 
1.20 

03/18/20 JW Review filed claims data base and reconcile to board 
presentation and SOFA/SOAL data re: advice to 
committee on alternative settlement terms 

2.30 

03/18/20 AP Review letter to US Trustee re: equity committee request 1.10 
03/19/20 KN Analysis of the amount of unsecured claims at the non 

guarantor subsidiaries 
0.50 

03/19/20 KM Review updates re: Uniti Settlement 0.60 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/19/20 JW Review 2x board meeting material presentations form 

discovery re: Uniti settlement from February 1-15 
2.40 

03/19/20 JW Review 2x board meeting presentations produced in 
discovery from Feb 15-28 

2.70 

03/19/20 JW Review March 2020 board presentation materials re: Uniti 
settlement negotiations 

1.30 

03/19/20 JW Compile relevant data from board meeting presentations 
for data set requested by MoFo re: admin / exit costs and 
guarantor / non-guarantor trade claim estimates 

1.80 

03/20/20 KM Review updated analysis of general unsecured claims 0.40 
03/20/20 KN Call with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) on scheduling team 

efforts and reconciling updates to the amount of 
estimated unsecured claims in the guarantor and non 
guarantor subsidiaries 

0.20 

03/20/20 KN Review the changes in the Debtors' estimates of 
unsecured claims at the guarantor and non-guarantor 
subsidiaries 

0.80 

03/20/20 JD Review settlement term sheet 0.50 
03/20/20 JW Call with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) on scheduling team 

efforts and reconciling updates to the amount of 
estimated unsecured claims in the guarantor and non 
guarantor subsidiaries 

0.20 

03/23/20 KM Review updates from Committee Counsel related to the 
Uniti settlement 

0.90 

03/24/20 JW Review Zycus rejection analysis from A&M 0.30 
03/25/20 JW Review Century Link motion and draft queries to A&M re: 

treatment of claims 
0.70 

03/25/20 JW Review 3x additional documents provided in production 
request re: formulation of PSA and BCA 

1.20 

03/26/20 KN Review the contract rejection analysis on th Zycus 
contract 

0.20 

03/26/20 AP Participate in conference call with K. McGlynn 
(AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/26/20 KM Participate in conference call with A. Perrella 

(AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

03/27/20 KM Review updates from Committee Counsel related to Uniti 
settlement 

0.60 

03/31/20 KN Review of the CenturyLink administrative claim and the 
rational for treatment as administrative rather than 
unsecured 

1.20 

03/31/20 KN Participate in a call with S. Rochester, S. Reisman 
(Katten), L. Marinuzzi and K. Richardson (both MoFo) to 
discuss the CenturyLink administrative claim motion 

0.40 

04/07/20 KM Review updates related to Uniti Settlement and Backstop 
Motion 

0.50 

04/13/20 DM Review draft objection to WIN exclusivity motion 0.40 
04/21/20 KM Review information related to Charter adversary 

proceeding 
0.40 

04/21/20 KM Review information related to CenturyLink hearing 0.60 
04/23/20 KM Review deposition outlines 1.10 
04/23/20 KN Review of the deposition outlines from MoFo 0.60 
04/24/20 KN Review the summary of the deposition of Alan Wells 0.50 
04/24/20 JD Review WIN deposition recap and emails with MoFo 1.20 
04/27/20 KN Prepare for the deposition of N. Leone (PJT) 0.40 
04/27/20 KN Listen to the N. Leone (PJT) deposition 6.00 
04/27/20 KM Review updates from day one of Charter hearing 0.40 
04/27/20 KM Review updates from N. Leone (PJT) deposition and 

prepare for T. Thomas deposition 
0.30 

04/28/20 KM Review updates from Charter hearing and T. Thomas 
deposition 

0.30 

04/28/20 SW Listen and annotate deposition of Tony Thomas 4.50 
04/29/20 SW Compose and send internal summary email of Tony 

Thomas deposition 
0.80 

04/30/20 KN Participate in conference call re: Claims investigation and 
litigation meeting with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all AlixPartners), L. 

0.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, M. Ballew (all 
Perella Weinberg) 

05/02/20 KN Review draft affidavit 0.40 
05/04/20 KM Review B. Mendelssohn's declaration 0.80 
05/04/20 KN Review the updates to the Mendelsohn declaration on the 

backstop commitment 
0.40 

05/05/20 JD Review and analyze Mendelsohn declaration 1.40 
05/05/20 JD Review filed declarations and motions re: entry of 

backstop commitment and Uniti settlement 
2.40 

05/05/20 KM Review B. Mendelsohn (Perella Weinberg) declaration 0.40 
05/05/20 KM Review UCC's objection to Uniti settlement and backstop 

agreement 
1.30 

05/08/20 KM Review recaps of Uniti settlement and backstop 
agreement hearing day #1 

0.60 

05/12/20 JD Review emails from MoFo team and analyze revised filed 
settlement and backstop order 

1.00 

05/14/20 JW Preparation for claims investigation and litigation meeting 0.20 
05/15/20 KM Review information and requests related to recovery 

analysis scenarios 
1.10 

05/15/20 JW Review legal entity waterfall models and amend for new 
scenarios re: MoFO request 

1.30 

05/16/20 JW Amend waterfall model for revised settlement and plan 
value and new scenarios requested 

1.80 

05/27/20 DM Emails with M. Schmidt and as. O’Conor re: WIN expert 
work 

0.40 

05/28/20 DM Participate in conference call with K. Nystrom, K. 
McGlynn, J. Dutton, J. Wooding, S. Weiner, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), F. Munshi, S. Eghlimi, and 
M. Ballew (all Perella Weinberg) re: claims investigation 
and litigation meeting 

0.40 

06/04/20 DM Participate in a call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, and J. 
Wooding (AlixPartners) regarding the liquidation analysis 
and intercompany analysis from the Debtors 

0.20 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/04/20 JW Participate in a call with K. Nystrom, K. McGlynn, and J. 

Wooding (AlixPartners) regarding the liquidation analysis 
and intercompany analysis from the Debtors 

0.20 

06/05/20 KN Review of the liquidation analysis from the Debtors 2.20 
06/05/20 KN Review of the inter company analysis prepared by A&M 

from the Debtors 
2.50 

06/08/20 KN Prepare a list of deposition questions related to the 
liquidation analysis for MoFo 

2.40 

06/08/20 KN Participate in conference call with D. MacGreevey, K. 
Nystrom, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding (All AlixPartners), L. 
Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. 
Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both 
Perella Weinberg) regarding the administrative and 
priority claims in the Plan and liquidation analysis as well 
as the potential of testifying on the liquidation analysis 

0.40 

06/08/20 KN Review of the inter company analysis prepared by the 
Debtors 

1.50 

06/09/20 KN Participate in a call with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) and F. 
Munshi (Perella Weinberg) regarding the valuation 
metrics used in the liquidation analysis 

0.40 

06/10/20 KN Update the list of deposition questions related to the 
liquidation analysis 

0.80 

06/12/20 SW Participate in meeting with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: 
internal team workstream review 

0.20 

06/12/20 KM Review Debtors' expert reports in support of Confirmation 1.30 
06/12/20 KM Participate in meeting with S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: 

internal team workstream review 
0.20 

06/15/20 KN Review the arguments of an adequate assurance claim by 
the secured lenders 

1.20 

06/15/20 KN Review the estimation of value of the Uniti settlement 1.30 
06/15/20 KM Participate in conference call with professionals re: 

confirmation objection with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, 
J. Wooding, S. Weiner, J. Dutton, A. Perrella (all 
AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. 
Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), B. Mendelsohn, F. Munshi 
(both Perella Weinberg) 

0.50 

06/16/20 KN Review and provide edits to the declaration regarding 
recoveries to Obligor GUCs 

3.80 
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Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/16/20 KN Gather supporting information for the declaration 

regarding recoveries to the Obligor GUCs 
1.90 

06/16/20 KN Research the holder of the unencumbered bank accounts 
and adjust the recoveries to obligor GUCs 

0.70 

06/16/20 KN Research the treatment of administrative and priority 
claims of obligors that do not have adequate assets to 
settle these claims 

0.40 

06/17/20 KN Participate in a call with J. Greer (MoFo) to review 
potential questions in the deposition of N. Grossi (A&M) 

0.50 

06/18/20 KM Review K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) rebuttal expert report 
re: confirmation 

1.10 

06/18/20 KN Participate in a preparation session for the upcoming 
deposition with S. Rappaport, E. Richards, T. Goren and 
K. Richardson (MoFo) 

1.60 

06/19/20 KM Review settlement updates and counter proposals 1.30 
06/19/20 KN Prepare for the deposition on my report 2.50 
06/19/20 KN Review the charter post-trial briefs of the Debtor and UCC 1.20 
06/19/20 KN Participate in a deposition related to my filed report 2.00 
06/21/20 KM Review updates related to settlement and counter 

proposals 
1.10 

06/21/20 KN Review and provide edits to the Nystrom Declaration 1.20 
06/21/20 KN Call with K. Richardson and E. Richards (both MoFo) 

regarding the edits to the Nystrom declaration 
0.20 

06/22/20 KN Prepare a listing of individual obligor unencumbered bank 
accounts 

0.60 

06/22/20 KN Discussion with E. Richards (MoFo) regarding the obligor 
unencumbered cash accounts at the filing date 

0.20 

06/22/20 KM Review settlement updates from Committee Counsel 1.10 
06/23/20 KN Participate in a session preparing for testimony with T. 

Goren, J. Greer, E. Richards and S. Rappaport (all MoFo) 
1.50 

06/23/20 KN Testimony preparation including reviewing the Debtors 
confirmation brief, my deposition transcript, the 
perfection certificate and related filings 

4.30 

06/30/20 KN Review of the Debtors budgeted fees of AlixPartners and 
Perella Weinberg Partners 

0.20 

  Total Hours 160.30 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-10 
 
Re: Litigation Support and Claims Analysis 
Client/Matter # 012615.00112  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Anthony Perrella 27.00 470.00  12,690.00 
Scott Weiner 8.30 645.00  5,353.50 
Jon Dutton 10.60 690.00  7,314.00 
Jeffrey Wooding 21.10 690.00  14,559.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 26.10 1,025.00  26,752.50 
David MacGreevey 2.50 1,090.00  2,725.00 
Kevin Nystrom 64.70 1,150.00  74,405.00 
Total Hours & Fees 160.30   143,799.00 
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New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/02/20 JD Review latest plan support agreement 1.50 
03/02/20 KM Analyze and review Plan of Reorganization 1.30 
03/02/20 DM Review WIN plan support agreement 2.30 
03/02/20 KN Review the Plan Support Agreement following the Uniti 

settlement 
1.40 

03/02/20 JW Review executed plan filed on docket 1.90 
03/03/20 JW Updates to waterfall analysis scenarios for PWP guidance 1.90 
03/04/20 KN Review the allocation methods of the components of 

value of the Uniti settlement 
0.90 

03/04/20 JD Analyze and update WIN plan recovery model based on 
PWP deck 

1.70 

03/04/20 JW Updates to base case waterfall analysis 1.90 
03/04/20 JW Build out downside case on waterfall analysis per MoFo 

request 
2.30 

03/04/20 JW Build out 50-50 split of settlement case per MoFo request 1.30 
03/05/20 JW Updates to various waterfall scenarios and summary 

presentation flow charts for committee 
2.70 

03/05/20 JD Update plan recovery model and emails with AlixPartners' 
team 

1.00 

03/05/20 DM Discussion with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) re: WIN 
waterfall analysis 

0.30 

03/05/20 KN Discussion with D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re WIN 
waterfall analysis 

0.30 

03/06/20 JW Updates to waterfall scenarios for MOFO 2.40 
03/09/20 DM Review draft presentation re: WIN waterfall analysis 0.60 
03/09/20 DM Review WIN motion to approve Uniti settlement 0.90 
03/09/20 JW Build out 2x additional waterfall scenarios per W&C and 

MoFo discussions 
2.80 

03/09/20 JW Revisions to waterfall analysis presentations for 
committee 

2.30 

03/10/20 JW Adjust waterfall flows and security packages per MoFo 
discussions 

2.80 

03/13/20 JW Review updated correspondence from K&E and MoFo re: 
mediation and plan updates. 

0.40 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/16/20 DM Review draft WIN settlement term sheet proposed by 

White & Case 
0.60 

03/16/20 DM Analysis of WIN rights offering and backstop comps from 
PWP 

0.60 

03/16/20 KN Call with T. Goren (MoFo) regarding initial thoughts on 
the settlement offer from certain bondholders 

0.10 

03/16/20 KN Review the rights offering backstop commitment motion 0.70 
03/18/20 KN Review the UCC position on an Equity Committee 0.30 
03/19/20 DM Review WIN document production re: settlement 0.80 
03/20/20 DM Telephone call with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: WIN 

term sheet 
0.50 

03/20/20 JW Review revised term sheet details from MoFo 0.60 
03/20/20 KN Review the draft settlement term sheet 0.90 
03/20/20 KM Telephone call with D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re WIN 

term sheet 
0.50 

03/23/20 JW Review updated term sheet including Committee 
comments 

0.40 

03/23/20 JD Review revised WIN draft settlement/plan term sheet 0.80 
03/24/20 KN Review the term sheet presented to the Debtor and 

lender classes for proposed treatment of unsecured 
creditors in a Plan 

1.90 

03/25/20 JD Review UCC settlement term sheet and emails with 
Debtors 

1.30 

03/26/20 KN Review the comments from Debtors' counsel on the UCC 
proposal of the treatment of unsecured creditors in the 
Plan 

0.30 

03/27/20 JW Review document production re: formulation of plan and 
backstop agreement 

0.80 

03/29/20 KN Review the response from T. Loria (White and Case) to 
counsel to the 1L lenders regarding the initial UCC 
settlement offer 

0.40 

04/01/20 KN Review of the motion to extend the time line of the 
bankruptcy process filed by the Debtors 

0.20 

04/01/20 JD Review filed plan and disclosure statement 1.30 
04/02/20 KN Review the draft Disclosure Statement and Plan filed by 

the Debtors 
2.80 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/02/20 DM Review WIN Plan and Disclosure Statement 1.40 
04/03/20 KN Review of the draft DS and Plan 1.60 
04/07/20 KN Review of the update of the Uniti settlement status 0.30 
04/21/20 KN Listen to the Windstream hearing 0.80 
04/21/20 KN Review the Windstream hearing update 0.20 
04/21/20 DM Attend WIN omnibus hearing 0.50 
04/21/20 KM Listen to Omnibus Hearing 0.60 
04/21/20 SW Dial in to omnibus hearing 0.60 
04/21/20 JW Dial into omnibus hearing 0.50 
04/21/20 JD Review emails and attachments from MoFo re; plan and 

disclosure statement 
1.80 

04/27/20 KN Review the comments to the POR 0.80 
04/27/20 JD Review chapter 11 plan and disclosure statement 1.80 
04/27/20 SW Review counsel comments and disclosure statement filed 

on 4/1/2020 
1.20 

04/27/20 SW Review counsel comments and plan of reorganization filed 
on 4/1/2020 

1.00 

04/30/20 JD Review UCC draft backstop objection and develop 
comments 

1.80 

04/30/20 JD Review convenience class term sheet and emails with 
MoFo 

0.50 

04/30/20 DM Review WIN settlement term sheet 0.30 
05/04/20 JD Review revised plan and disclosure statement 0.80 
05/05/20 KN Review amendments to the Disclosure Statements and 

Plan 
1.10 

05/06/20 JD Analyze MoFo summary of key pleadings and analysis re: 
approval of disclosure statement 

1.20 

05/06/20 JD Analyze MoFo summary of key pleadings and analysis re: 
approval of backstop motion 

1.60 

05/07/20 KN Listen to the hearing on the Uniti settlement and backstop 
agreement 

5.00 

05/08/20 DM Attend WIN hearing re: DS and Uniti settlement 2.50 
05/08/20 KN Listen to the continuation of the hearing on the Uniti 

settlement 
2.00 
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 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
05/26/20 KN Review of the waterfall scenario analysis 2.20 
05/27/20 DM Review draft WIN deck re: potential recoveries 0.60 
05/29/20 JW Review production documents from Debtors re: 

confirmation hearing 
2.60 

06/01/20 DM Review WIN illustrative settlement proposal 0.60 
06/02/20 KN Review the presentation to be presented to the Mediator 1.20 
06/02/20 JW Review Debtors' production documents re: legal entity 

balance sheets and contract rejection damages. Prepare 
notes for discussion with UCC advisors 

2.40 

06/04/20 JW Review disclosure and treatment of admin and priority 
claims in proposed Plan re: confirmation objection 

1.40 

06/04/20 KM Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. Nystrom, and 
J. Wooding (AlixPartners) regarding the liquidation 
analysis and intercompany analysis from the Debtors 

0.20 

06/04/20 KN Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, and 
J. Wooding (AlixPartners) regarding the liquidation 
analysis and intercompany analysis from the Debtors 

0.20 

06/04/20 KN Review of the liquidation analysis from the Debtors 2.70 
06/08/20 JW Review Disclosure Statement 1.30 
06/08/20 JW Call with K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: GUC claims and 

attributable value 
0.70 

06/08/20 KM Call with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: GUC claims and 
attributable value 

0.70 

06/09/20 KN Review of the updates to the Plan and Disclosure 
Statement 

2.30 

06/09/20 JW Review Liquidation Analysis and Disclosure Statement re: 
Uniti vs Non-Uniti valuations and capex spend 

1.90 

06/12/20 JW Refinement of waterfall analysis for Debtors' liquidation 
analysis details and allocation drivers, compare results 
and driver variances from existing model outputs 

2.70 

06/12/20 KN Review the expert report of N. Grossi regarding the 
liquidation analysis for any unsupportable assumptions or 
disputes in conclusions 

4.20 

06/12/20 KN Review the Debtors expert report from N. Leone (PJT) in 
support of the plan and ranges of enterprise value of the 
Estate 

2.10 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/14/20 JW Follow-up call with K. Nystrom and K. McGlynn (both 

AlixPartners) re: next steps 
0.20 

06/14/20 JW Call with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners) and F. Munshi (Perella 
Weinberg) regarding the allocation of value among 
Debtors 

0.20 

06/14/20 KN Prepare an analysis of the recovery to unsecured 
creditors of guarantor subsidiaries from the 
unencumbered assets 

2.80 

06/14/20 KN Review the assessment of the potential adequate 
protection claim of the 1Ls prepared by Perella Weinberg 

0.70 

06/14/20 KN Call with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) and F. Munshi (Perella 
Weinberg) regarding the allocation of value among 
Debtors 

0.20 

06/14/20 KN Call with K. McGlynn and J. Wooding (AlixPartners) 
regarding the allocation of value to unsecured creditors of 
obligor subsidiaries 

0.20 

06/14/20 KN Update the analysis of allocation of value of 
unencumbered assets to unsecured creditors of obligor 
subsidiaries 

1.70 

06/14/20 KM Follow-up call with K. Nystrom and J. Wooding (both 
AlixPartners) re: next steps 

0.20 

06/15/20 JW Meeting with K. Nystrom (AlixPartners), J. Greer, S. 
Rappaport (both MoFo) re: Nystrom rebuttal report 

0.50 

06/15/20 JW Review plan documents, Gross report and liquidation 
analysis re: Grossi deposition questions and preparation 

3.20 

06/15/20 JW Overhaul of waterfall analysis model to simplify for use in 
potential production re: rebuttal report of K. Nystrom 

2.60 

06/15/20 JW Meeting with K.Nystrom (AlixPartners) re: rebuttal report 
presentation and models 

0.50 

06/15/20 DM Review draft WIN deck re: unencumbered assets 0.30 
06/15/20 DM Review WIN 1L counter 0.20 
06/15/20 KN Meeting with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: rebuttal report 

presentation and models 
0.50 

06/15/20 KN Meeting with J. Wooding (AlixPartners), J. Greer, S. 
Rappaport (both MoFo) re: Nystrom rebuttal report 

0.50 

06/15/20 KN Prepare a report on the returns to the Obligor GUCs 6.80 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 

Invoice # ******-11 
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Client/Matter # 012615.00113  

 909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500 
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344 

alixpartners.com 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/16/20 KN Prepare for meeting regarding rebuttals to the expert 

reports 
0.20 

06/16/20 KN Meeting with J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: rebuttal report 
preparation and model review 

0.70 

06/16/20 JD Review Nystrom expert report 1.20 
06/16/20 JD Review emails from MoFo re: WIN rebuttal and Leone 

deposition outline 
0.80 

06/16/20 JW Meeting with K.Nystrom (AlixPartners) re: rebuttal report 
preparation and model review 

0.70 

06/16/20 JW Finalize draft models for plan objection and liquidation 
analysis rebuttal report 

2.60 

06/16/20 JW Review draft rebuttal report and respond to MoFo queries 1.30 
06/16/20 JW Prepare questions for Grossi deposition re: liquidation 

analysis methodology 
0.70 

06/17/20 JW Final review of draft rebuttal report and deposition 
schedule / flow 

1.70 

06/17/20 DM Review draft Nystrom expert report for confirmation 0.50 
06/18/20 DM Review draft UCC objection to WIN POR 1.20 
06/18/20 JW Listen to omnibus hearing 0.30 
06/18/20 JW Listen to Grossi deposition 2.20 
06/18/20 KN Review and comment on the draft objection to the Plan 1.20 
06/18/20 JD Review draft UCC objection confirmation 0.80 
06/19/20 DM Emails with attachments with L. Marinuzzi, T. Goren and 

F. Munshi (all MoFo) re: WIN settlement
0.50 

06/19/20 KN Review of the versions of the draft settlement offer to be 
sent to select 1L holders 

0.70 

06/19/20 KN Review of the Plan vote count 0.10 
06/19/20 JW Review correspondence with MoFo and Perella Weinberg  

re: settlement proposals and construct 
0.60 

06/20/20 DM Emails with attachments from L. Marinuzzi and F. Munshi 
re: WIN settlement 

0.60 

06/21/20 DM Review WIN counter proposal 0.30 
06/22/20 JD Review UCC settlement term sheet and presentation from 

Perella Weinberg 
0.60 

06/22/20 JD Review proposal recovery analysis from Perella Weinberg 0.50 
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Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/22/20 JD Review illustrative proposal recovery analysis and UCC 

update 
0.70 

06/22/20 KN Review of the settlement proposal from the 1Ls and the 
draft counter from the Committee 

0.80 

06/22/20 KN Participate in conference call with Committee Members, 
D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, J. Dutton, S. 
Weiner, A. Perrella (All AlixPartners), L. Marinuzzi, R. 
Ferraioli, K. Richardson, E. Richards, T. Goren (all MoFo), 
B. Mendelsohn, and F. Munshi (both Perella Weinberg) re: 
mediation settlement proposal 

0.50 

06/22/20 KN Review of the updated UCC recovery proposal and 
reconciling unsecured claims of obligors 

0.70 

06/23/20 JD Emails from MoFo and analyze proposal recovery analysis 
from Perella Weinberg 

1.40 

06/23/20 JW Review various settlements and counterproposal 
documents re: confirmation hearing, additional 
correspondence with UCC advisors re: same. 

0.70 

06/24/20 JW Confirmation hearing 3.30 
06/24/20 KM Listen to Confirmation hearing 7.10 
06/24/20 JD Listen into WIN confirmation hearing 5.00 
06/24/20 KN Testimony preparation including reviewing the Debtors 

confirmation brief, my deposition transcript, the 
perfection certificate and related filings 

4.70 

06/24/20 KN Attendance at the confirmation hearing as a witness 4.80 
06/24/20 KN Listen to the confirmation hearing 3.20 
06/24/20 DM Review WIN mediators revised proposal 0.20 
06/24/20 DM Attend WIN confirmation hearing 4.90 
06/25/20 KN Listen to the Windstream confirmation hearing 4.00 
06/25/20 DM Review Debtors closing argument deck for WIN 

confirmation hearing 
0.60 

06/25/20 JD Listen into WIN confirmation hearing 5.00 
06/25/20 KM Listen to second day of Confirmation hearing 4.50 
06/25/20 JW Confirmation hearing day 2 1.70 
06/26/20 JD Review confirmation hearing closing presentation from 

Debtors 
1.20 
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New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/26/20 DM Review email from K. Richardson re: WIN confirmation 

summary 
0.20 

06/30/20 KN Call with L. Marinuzzi (MoFo) regarding the potential UCC 
settlement with the Debtors 

0.20 

  Total Hours 207.30 
 
  

19-22312-rdd    Doc 2391    Filed 08/10/20    Entered 08/10/20 18:05:54    Main Document 
Pg 125 of 136



The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 

Invoice # ******-11 

Re: Disclosure Statement, Plan and RSA 
Client/Matter # 012615.00113  

 909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500 
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344 

alixpartners.com 

Fee Recap: 

Consultant Hours Rate Amount 
Scott Weiner 2.80 645.00 1,806.00 
Jon Dutton 34.30 690.00 23,667.00 
Jeffrey Wooding 61.00 690.00 42,090.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 15.10 1,025.00 15,477.50 
David MacGreevey 22.00 1,090.00 23,980.00 
Kevin Nystrom 72.10 1,150.00 82,915.00 
Total Hours & Fees 207.30 189,935.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-12 
 
Re: Retention Applications and Disclosure Schedules 
Client/Matter # 012615.00114  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
06/30/20 ESK Prepared memo re: disclosure matter and emails re: 

same 
0.50 

  Total Hours 0.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-12 
 
Re: Retention Applications and Disclosure Schedules 
Client/Matter # 012615.00114  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Elizabeth S Kardos 0.50 710.00  355.00 

Total Hours & Fees 0.50   355.00 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-13 
 
Re: Fee Statements and Fee Applications 
Client/Matter # 012615.00116  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
03/02/20 LMB Prepare February 2020 professional fees 0.50 
03/04/20 LMB Prepare professional fees for February 2020 0.60 
03/20/20 LMB Prepare February 2020 professional fees 3.10 
03/23/20 LMB Emails to S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: February 2020 

professional fees 
0.10 

03/23/20 LMB Emails to K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: February 2020 
professional fees 

0.20 

03/23/20 LMB Prepare professional fees for February 2020 monthly fee 
statement 

1.60 

03/23/20 LMB Prepare February 2020 schedule workbook 0.60 
03/23/20 MSM Prepare February 2020 professional fees 1.50 
03/24/20 LMB Prepare February 2020 professional fees 0.50 
03/24/20 LMB Prepare 11th monthly fee statement (February 2020) and 

supporting schedules 
1.70 

03/25/20 LMB Revise 11th monthly fee statement (February 2020), 
schedules and exhibits 

0.70 

03/25/20 KM Review and revise February fee statement 0.60 
03/25/20 DM Review WIN February fee statement 0.60 
03/26/20 KM Prepare interim fee application 0.30 
03/26/20 LMB Finalize 11th monthly fee statement, supporting 

schedules and exhibits for February 2020 
0.20 

03/26/20 LMB Email to R. Ferraioli (MoFo) attaching the 11th monthly 
fee statement for February 2020 for filing on the Court 
docket 

0.20 

03/26/20 ESK Review 11th monthly fee statement, supporting schedules 
and exhibits for February 2020 

0.20 

03/26/20 LMB Email to J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: professional fees 0.20 
03/27/20 LMB Prepare schedule/exhibit workbook for third interim fee 

application 
1.00 

03/27/20 LMB Update fee application status chart 0.30 
03/30/20 LMB Prepare third interim fee application 1.20 
03/30/20 LMB Prepare third interim schedule/exhibit workbook 2.60 
03/31/20 LMB Prepare third interim fee application 2.20 
04/02/20 LMB Prepare exhibits to the third interim fee application 2.40 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-13 
 
Re: Fee Statements and Fee Applications 
Client/Matter # 012615.00116  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
04/02/20 LMB Prepare March 2020 professional fees 0.60 
04/07/20 KN Update the interim fee application narrative 0.80 
04/08/20 LMB Prepare and revise third interim fee application, 

supporting schedules and exhibits 
1.60 

04/08/20 KM Review and revise third interim narrative 0.90 
04/09/20 KAS Review third interim fee application. 0.30 
04/09/20 LMB Prepare March 2020 professional fees 1.50 
04/10/20 DM Review WIN third interim fee application 0.50 
04/13/20 LMB Finalize third interim fee application 0.30 
04/13/20 LMB Email to R. Ferrioli (MoFo) attaching third interim fee 

application for filing on the Court docket 
0.20 

04/17/20 LMB Prepare March 2020 professional fees for monthly fee 
statement 

1.00 

04/20/20 LMB Prepare March 2020 professional fees for monthly fee 
statement 

1.20 

04/20/20 LMB Prepare 12th monthly fee statement and supporting 
schedule workbook 

1.00 

04/23/20 DM Review WIN March fee statement 0.50 
04/23/20 LMB Prepare 12th monthly fee statement, supporting 

schedules and exhibits 
1.60 

04/24/20 DM Review WIN March fee statement 0.40 
04/24/20 LMB Finalize 12th monthly fee statement for March 2020, 

supporting schedules and exhibits 
0.20 

04/24/20 ESK Review Finalize 12th monthly fee statement for March 
2020 

0.20 

04/27/20 LMB Email to R. Ferraioli (MoFo) attaching 12th monthly fee 
statement (March 2020) for filing on the Court docket 

0.20 

05/13/20 LMB Update fee application status chart 0.30 
05/15/20 LMB Prepare professional fees for April 2020 0.80 
05/17/20 LMB Prepare April 2020 professional fees 0.80 
05/18/20 LMB Prepare April 2020 professional fees 1.80 
05/19/20 LMB Prepare 13th monthly fee statement (April 2020) 0.60 
05/26/20 LMB Prepare April 2020 professional fees 1.50 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-13 
 
Re: Fee Statements and Fee Applications 
Client/Matter # 012615.00116  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

Date Consultant Description of Services Hours 
05/27/20 LMB Prepare 13th monthly fee statement, supporting 

schedules and exhibits 
1.80 

06/01/20 ESK Review 13th monthly fee statement (April 2020) 0.30 
06/01/20 LMB Revise 13th monthly fee statement (April 2020) 0.50 
06/01/20 DM Review WIN April 2020 fee statement 0.50 
06/02/20 LMB Finalize 13th monthly fee statement (April 2020), 

supporting exhibits 
0.20 

06/02/20 LMB Email to R. Ferraioli (MoFo) attaching the 13th monthly 
April 2020 fee statement for filing on the Court docket 

0.20 

06/03/20 LMB Prepare May 2020 professional fees 0.80 
06/04/20 LMB Prepare May 2020 professional fees for 14th monthly fee 

statement 
1.00 

06/04/20 LMB Update fee application status chart 0.10 
06/16/20 LMB Prepare professional fees for May 2020 monthly fee 

statement 
0.40 

06/18/20 KM Dial into hearing re: interim fee applications 0.30 
06/23/20 LMB Prepare May 2020 professional fees for 14th monthly fee 

statement 
1.00 

06/23/20 LMB Prepare 14th monthly fee statement, supporting 
schedules and exhibits 

1.60 

06/23/20 SW Review of May 2020 professional fees 1.30 
06/24/20 DM Review WIN May fee statement 0.50 
06/29/20 LMB Update fee application status chart 0.30 
06/30/20 ESK Review 14th Monthly Fee Statement (May 2020) 0.30 
06/30/20 KM Review May 2020 fee statement 0.60 
06/30/20 LMB Finalize the 14th Monthly Fee Statement for the period 

May 1, 2020 through May 31, 2020 
0.30 

06/30/20 LMB Email to R. Ferraioli (MoFo) attaching the 14th Monthly 
Fee Statement (May 2020) for filing on the court docket 

0.20 

  Total Hours 54.10 
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The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Windstream Holdings, Inc. 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road 
Little Rock, AR 72212 
 
 
 
Invoice #  ******-13 
 
Re: Fee Statements and Fee Applications 
Client/Matter # 012615.00116  
 

 
  
 

909 Third Avenue   T 212.490.2500   
New York, NY 10022 F 212.490.1344   
 alixpartners.com  

 

Fee Recap: 
 
Consultant Hours Rate  Amount 
Melanie McCabe 1.50 415.00  622.50 
Lisa Marie Bonito 43.50 450.00  19,575.00 
Kaitlyn A Sundt 0.30 510.00  153.00 
Scott Weiner 1.30 645.00  838.50 
Elizabeth S Kardos 1.00 710.00  710.00 
Kathryn McGlynn 2.70 1,025.00  2,767.50 
David MacGreevey 3.00 1,090.00  3,270.00 
Kevin Nystrom 0.80 1,150.00  920.00 
Total Hours & Fees 54.10   28,856.50 
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 1 

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK 

In re: 

WINDSTREAM HOLDINGS, INC., et  al.,1 

Debtors. 

Chapter 11 

Case No. 19-22312  (RDD) 

(Jointly Administered) 

CERTIFICATION OF DAVID MACGREEVEY 

I, DAVID MACGREEVEY, declare under the penalty of perjury as follows: 

1. I am a Managing Director in the firm of AlixPartners, LLP (“AlixPartners”), with

offices at 909 Third Avenue, 28th Floor, New York, New York 10022.  AlixPartners serves as 

financial advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) to 

Windstream Holdings, Inc. and its affiliated debtors and debtors-in-possession (the “Debtors”) in 

the above-captioned Chapter 11 Cases.  In compliance with the Amended Guidelines for Fees and 

Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases, adopted 

January 25, 2013 (the “Local Guidelines”), and the United States Trustee Guidelines for Reviewing 

Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330, 

adopted June 17, 2013 (the “UST Guidelines”), I hereby certify as follows: 

2. I have reviewed AlixPartners’ Fourth Interim Application as Financial Advisor to

the Official Committee for Unsecured Creditors for Allowance of Compensation for Services 

1    The last four digits of Debtor Windstream Holdings, Inc.’s tax identification number are 7717. Due to the large number 
of debtor entities in these chapter 11 cases, for which the Debtors have requested joint administration, a complete list of 
the debtor entities and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided herein. A complete list 
of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ proposed claims and noticing agent at 
http://www.kccllc.net/windstream. The location of the Debtors’ service address for purposes of these chapter 11 cases is: 
4001 North Rodney Parham Road, Little Rock, Arkansas 72212. 
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 2 

Rendered and for Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period March 1, 2020 Through June 

30, 2020   (the “Application”). 

3. As required by Section A.1 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that:

a) I have read the Application;

b) To the best of my knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inuiry,
the fees and disbursements sought in the Application fall within the Local Guidelines;

c) The fees and disbursements sought are billed at rates and in accordance with practices
customarily employed by AlixPartners and are generally accepted by AlixPartners’s
clients; and

d) In providing reimbursable services, AlixPartners does not make a profit on such
service, whether the service is performed by AlixPartners in-house or through a fourth
party.

4. In accordance with Section B.3 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that copies of the

Application are being provided to (i) Debtors; (ii) the Committee; (ii) the Application Recipients (as 

defined in ¶2(a) of the Interim Compensation Order); and (iv) all parties who have requested and are 

receiving notices in these Chapter 11 Cases through the Court’s electronic filing system. 

5. I have reviewed Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Local Rule 2016(a) and

submit that the Application substantially complies with such Rule.  In accordance with Federal Rule 

of Bankruptcy Procedure 2016(a) and section 504 of the Bankruptcy Code, no agreement or 

understanding exists between me, my firm or any professional thereof, on the one hand, and any 

other person, on the other hand, for the division of such compensation as my firm may receive from 

the Court herein, nor will any division of fees prohibited by section 504 of the Bankruptcy Code be 

made by me, or any attorney of my firm. 

6. To the best of my knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry,

the Application complies UST Guidelines. 
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 3 

7. I certify, under penalty of perjury, that the foregoing statements made by me are true

to the best of my knowledge, information and belief.  

Dated: August 10, 2020 
New York, New York 

/s/ David MacGreevey 
David MacGreevey 
Managing Director         
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